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Bid #07-863-002 Truck Tires & Related Services - West Slope

  

Schedule A: New Tires (Highway Tread)

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

  

Tire Size Load Ply Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended

Range Price Price Price Price

4.80/4.00-8 A 2 1 4.23$              4.23$              12.53$            12.53$            

P195/75R14 B 4 1 31.00$            31.00$            37.80$            37.80$            

P205/75R14 B 4 1 34.00$            34.00$            39.58$            39.58$            

ST205/75R14  C 6 1 36.43$            36.43$            55.06$            55.06$            

ST205/75D14 C 6 10 39.43$            394.30$          46.50$            465.00$          

P205/75R15 B 4 1 35.00$            35.00$            36.54$            36.54$            

ST205/75R15  C 6 1 42.57$            42.57$            32.29$            32.29$            

ST205/75D15 C 6 1 42.57$            42.57$            49.90$            49.90$            

LT215/75R15 C 6 10 62.99$            629.90$          63.19$            631.90$          

ST225/75R15  D 8 6 50.70$            304.20$          39.48$            236.88$          

ST225/75D15 D 8 6 50.70$            304.20$          61.65$            369.90$          

LT235/75R15 C 6 1 68.00$            68.00$            63.65$            63.65$            

7.00-15LT D 8 4 44.00$            176.00$          79.00$            316.00$          

8.25R15TR J 18 1 180.00$          180.00$          199.00$          199.00$          

8.25-15 G 14 1 99.85$            99.85$            120.00$          120.00$          

LT215/85R16 E 10 1 68.00$            68.00$            65.18$            65.18$            

LT225/75R16 D 8 6 67.00$            402.00$          64.53$            387.18$          

235/75R16LT D 8 1 No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

LT245/75R16 E 10 6 69.00$            414.00$          82.00$            492.00$          

LT235/85R16 E 10 16 69.00$            1,104.00$       74.73$            1,195.68$       

LT265/70R17 E 10 4 130.31$          521.24$          140.10$          560.40$          

225/70R19.5 F 12 10 127.30$          1,273.00$       182.00$          1,820.00$       

245/70R19.5  F 12 6 147.35$          884.10$          237.30$          1,423.80$       

265/70R19.5  F 12 6 170.02$          1,020.12$       223.01$          1,338.06$       

7.50R16LT  G 14 1 159.90$          159.90$          106.52$          106.52$          

7.50-16LT G 14 1 73.85$            73.85$            86.23$            86.23$            

10.00-20 F 12 1 120.58$          120.58$          148.17$          148.17$          

10.00R20 G 14 1 175.00$          175.00$          260.09$          260.09$          

10.00R-22.5 G 14 1 189.24$          189.24$          182.51$          182.51$          

385/95R24 N 24 4 454.16$          1,816.64$       1,095.52$       4,382.08$       

385/65R22.5 J 18 1 303.30$          303.30$          277.20$          277.20$          

425/65RL22.5   L 20 4 357.55$          1,430.20$       310.24$          1,240.96$       

255/70R22.5  H 16 1 176.47$          176.47$          167.67$          167.67$          

11R22.5 H 16 40 190.44$          7,617.60$       203.46$          8,138.40$       

11R24.5 H 16 5 200.16$          1,000.80$       196.40$          982.00$          

315/80R 22.5 L 20 20 410.00$          8,200.00$       459.08$          9,181.60$       

315/80R22.5  L 20 20 390.00$          7,800.00$       372.49$          7,449.80$       

315/80R22.5 L 20 1 247.23$          247.23$          284.01$          284.01$          

185R-14 D 8 4 44.68$            178.72$          51.50$            206.00$          

P235/75R16 B 4 1 70.60$            70.60$            89.96$            89.96$            

SCHEDULE A SUBTOTAL 37,628.84$     43,131.53$     

Evaluation*

Brannon Tire
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Bid #07-863-002 Truck Tires & Related Services - West Slope

Evaluation*

Schedule B: New Tires (Mud & Snow Tread, Drilled for Studs)

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

  

Tire Size Load Ply Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended

Range Price Price Price Price

P205/75R15 B 4 1 35.01$            35.01$            33.05$            33.05$            

LT215/75R15 C 6 20 79.50$            1,590.00$       89.54$            1,790.80$       

LT235/75R15 C 6 1 68.00$            68.00$            45.83$            45.83$            

LT215/85R16 E 10 1 68.00$            68.00$            28.21$            28.21$            

LT225/75R16 D 8 1 67.00$            67.00$            53.79$            53.79$            

LT235/75R16 D 8 1 No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

LT235/85R16 E 10 4 69.00$            276.00$          61.69$            246.76$          

LT245/75R16 E 10 16 69.00$            1,104.00$       61.58$            985.28$          

LT265/70R17 E 10 4 125.00$          500.00$          113.82$          455.28$          

P255/70R16 B 4 1 69.20$            69.20$            84.50$            84.50$            

225/70R19.5 F 12 14 127.30$          1,782.20$       146.02$          2,044.28$       

10.00-20 F 12 1 120.58$          120.58$          164.61$          164.61$          

10.00R20 G 12 1 No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

10.00R-22.5 G 12 1 189.24$          189.24$          160.35$          160.35$          

255/70R22.5 H 16 4 176.47$          705.88$          167.67$          670.68$          

315/80R22.5  L 20 1 410.00$          410.00$          418.86$          418.86$          

315/80R22.5  L 20 1 247.23$          247.23$          398.34$          398.34$          

11R22.5 H 16 6 190.44$          1,142.64$       188.70$          1,132.20$       

11R24.5 H 16 1 200.16$          200.16$          206.50$          206.50$          

SCHEDULE B SUBTOTAL 8,575.14$       8,919.32$       

Schedule C: New Tires/Traction Tread

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

  

Tire Size Load Ply Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended

Range Price Price Price Price

14.00-20 (Rotary Plow 

or  Blower) - Alliance L 20 1 No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

14.00-20 (Rotary Plow 

or  Blower)  L 20 1 1,028.00$       1,028.00$       505.22$          505.22$          

385/95R24 (Rotary 

Plow or  Blower)  N 24 1 1,121.00$       1,121.00$       1,095.52$       1,095.52$       

16.9-24 D 8 1 247.91$          247.91$          324.00$          324.00$          

19.5L-24 E 10 1 293.84$          293.84$          368.00$          368.00$          

15.5-25 F 12 4 310.15$          1,240.60$       325.00$          1,300.00$       

17.5-25 F 12 4 404.02$          1,616.08$       398.72$          1,594.88$       

18.4-30 D 8 1 289.67$          289.67$          382.33$          382.33$          

14.00-24 (Rotary Plow 

or  Blower)  L 20 20 435.29$          8,705.80$       299.79$          5,995.80$       

14.00-24 (Motor 

Graders)  F 12 20 340.68$          6,813.60$       378.35$          7,567.00$       

14.00-24 (Motor 

Graders)  F 12 20 269.56$          5,391.20$       279.95$          5,599.00$       

14.00-24 (Motor 

Graders)  F 12 20 270.07$          5,401.40$       289.00$          5,780.00$       

14.00-24 (Motor 

Graders)  F 12 20 261.18$          5,223.60$       299.00$          5,980.00$       

18.4-26 (Paver) E 12 2 861.11$          1,722.22$       382.92$          765.84$          

SCHEDULE C SUBTOTAL 39,094.92$     37,257.59$     

Brannon Tire

Brannon Tire
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Bid #07-863-002 Truck Tires & Related Services - West Slope

Evaluation*

Schedule D: New Tires/Special Equipment

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

  

Tire Size Load Ply Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended

Range Price Price Price Price

145/70-6  A 2 1 16.16$            16.16$            15.21$            15.21$            

4.10/3.50-4  A 2 1 4.57$              4.57$              8.61$              8.61$              

4.10/3.50-6 A 2 1 6.40$              6.40$              9.64$              9.64$              

5.30/4.50-6 C 6 1 9.90$              9.90$              25.68$            25.68$            

6.50-10 (forklift) E 10 1 44.23$            44.23$            55.69$            55.69$            

4.80/4.00-8  A 2 1 4.23$              4.23$              6.21$              6.21$              

4.80-12 B 4 1 17.29$            17.29$            19.80$            19.80$            

7.50-15NHS (smooth) F 12 3 98.62$            295.86$          155.72$          467.16$          

12-16.5 skid steer extra 

reinforced side wall F 12 4 105.14$          420.56$          170.00$          680.00$          

12.5/80-18  E 10 1 170.76$          170.76$          227.68$          227.68$          

11L16 E 10 4 98.08$            392.32$          93.00$            372.00$          

7.00-12 (forklift) E 10 1 64.40$            64.40$            82.20$            82.20$            

8.15-15 (forklift) n/a n/a 1 86.55$            86.55$            125.26$          125.26$          

7.50-15NHS (forklift) n/a n/a 1 92.04$            92.04$            106.88$          106.88$          

SCHEDULE D SUBTOTAL 1,625.27$       2,202.02$       

Schedule E: Recaps Mud & Snow Tread, Drilled for Studs

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

  

Tire Size Load Ply Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended

Range Price Price Price Price

10.00-20 F 12 1 93.60$            93.60$            99.00$            99.00$            

10.00R20 G 14 1 93.60$            93.60$            99.00$            99.00$            

225/70R19.5 F 12 12 84.90$            1,018.80$       113.00$          1,356.00$       

11R22.5 H 16 100 90.60$            9,060.00$       116.00$          11,600.00$     

11R24.5 H 16 40 93.60$            3,744.00$       120.84$          4,833.60$       

315/80R22.5  L 20 1 115.60$          115.60$          124.00$          124.00$          

SCHEDULE E SUBTOTAL 14,125.60$     18,111.60$     

Schedule F: Recap Highway Tread

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

  

Tire Size Load Ply Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended

Range Price Price Price Price

10.00-20 F 12 1 87.60$            87.60$            89.50$            89.50$            

10.00R20 G 14 1 87.60$            87.60$            89.50$            89.50$            

255/70R22.5 H 16 8 79.90$            639.20$          100.49$          803.92$          

11R22.5 H 16 10 87.60$            876.00$          106.22$          1,062.20$       

11R24.5 H 16 10 90.60$            906.00$          109.58$          1,095.80$       

SCHEDULE F SUBTOTAL 2,596.40$       3,140.92$       

Brannon Tire

Brannon Tire

Brannon Tire
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Bid #07-863-002 Truck Tires & Related Services - West Slope

Evaluation*

Schedule G: Recaps/Traction Tread

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

  

Tire Size Load Ply Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended

Range Price Price Price Price

14.00-20 L 20 1 240.00$          240.00$          206.34$          206.34$          

14.00-24 L 20 25 250.00$          6,250.00$       236.34$          5,908.50$       

16.9-24 D 8 1 240.00$          240.00$          245.00$          245.00$          

19.5L-24 E 10 1 270.00$          270.00$          311.89$          311.89$          

15.5-25 F 12 1 260.00$          260.00$          307.00$          307.00$          

17.5-25 F 12 1 290.00$          290.00$          322.00$          322.00$          

18.4-30 D 8 1 No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

SCHEDULE G SUBTOTAL 7,550.00$       7,300.73$       

Schedule H: Recaps/Special Equipment

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

 

Tire Size Load Ply Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended

Range Price Price Price Price

6.50-10 (forklift) E 10 1 49.00$            49.00$            75.65$            75.65$            

7.50-15NHS (smooth) F 12 3 75.00$            225.00$          68.85$            206.55$          

8.15-15 (forklift) F 12 1 75.00$            75.00$            87.35$            87.35$            

7.50-15NHS (forklift) F 12 1 75.00$            75.00$            86.09$            86.09$            

12-16.5skid steer extra 

reinforced side wall F 12 4 75.00$            300.00$          145.00$          580.00$          

11L16 E 10 4 72.50$            290.00$          66.00$            264.00$          

12.5/80-18 E 10 1 No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

7.00-12 (forklift) E 10 1 59.00$            59.00$            79.83$            79.83$            

SCHEDULE H SUBTOTAL 1,073.00$       1,379.47$       

Schedule I: Radial Casings

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

  

Tire Size Load Ply Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended

Range Price Price Price Price

225/70R19.5 F 12 5 25.00$            125.00$          15.00$            75.00$            

11R22.5 H 16 10 75.00$            750.00$          70.00$            700.00$          

11R24.5 H 16 10 95.00$            950.00$          80.00$            800.00$          

SCHEDULE I SUBTOTAL 1,825.00$       1,575.00$       

Brannon Tire

Brannon Tire

Brannon Tire
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Bid #07-863-002 Truck Tires & Related Services - West Slope

Evaluation*

Schedule J:  New Tubes

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

  

                               Tire Size Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended

Price Price Price Price

145/70-6  1 6.00$              6.00$              3.64$              3.64$              

4.10/3.50-4  1 4.99$              4.99$              3.95$              3.95$              

4.10/3.50-6 1 3.02$              3.02$              3.95$              3.95$              

4.80-8  1 2.56$              2.56$              3.95$              3.95$              

5.30/4.50-6 1 4.58$              4.58$              4.99$              4.99$              

6.50-10 1 5.21$              5.21$              7.95$              7.95$              

4.80/4.00-8  1 2.56$              2.56$              3.95$              3.95$              

4.80-12 1 3.21$              3.21$              5.89$              5.89$              

7.00-12 1 5.98$              5.98$              8.95$              8.95$              

7.00-15  1 7.06$              7.06$              8.95$              8.95$              

7.50-15NHS 4 7.88$              31.52$            12.85$            51.40$            

8.15-15 1 7.88$              7.88$              12.85$            12.85$            

7.50-16LT 4 7.25$              29.00$            8.95$              35.80$            

11L16 1 9.52$              9.52$              12.95$            12.95$            

12.5/80-18  1 12.75$            12.75$            15.86$            15.86$            

9.50R16.5LT  1 11.75$            11.75$            11.96$            11.96$            

8.25-15 1 10.73$            10.73$            13.97$            13.97$            

8.25R-15  1 12.73$            12.73$            13.97$            13.97$            

10.00-20 8 12.20$            97.60$            16.87$            134.96$          

14.00-20 1 28.74$            28.74$            37.95$            37.95$            

14.00-24 20 28.20$            564.00$          38.95$            779.00$          

16.9-24 1 26.13$            26.13$            41.66$            41.66$            

19.5L-24 1 29.38$            29.38$            59.81$            59.81$            

15.5-25 1 52.45$            52.45$            65.71$            65.71$            

17.5-25 1 53.50$            53.50$            65.71$            65.71$            

18.4-30 1 34.74$            34.74$            49.80$            49.80$            

SCHEDULE J SUBTOTAL 1,057.59$       1,459.53$       

Brannon Tire
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Bid #07-863-002 Truck Tires & Related Services - West Slope

Evaluation*

Schedule K: Flat/Spot Repairs

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

  

Tire Size Svc. Location Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended

Price Price Price Price

Passenger/Lt Truck 7.5-

16 (each)

Flat 

Repair

Vendor 

Shop 1 10.00$            10.00$            10.00$            10.00$            

Passenger/Lt Truck 7.5-

16 (per hour)

Flat 

Repair

County 

Yard 1 55.00$            55.00$            75.00$            75.00$            

Truck 8.25-20 through 

11.00-24.5 (each)

Flat 

Repair

Vendor 

Shop 50 15.00$            750.00$          20.00$            1,000.00$       

Truck 8.25-20 through 

11.00-24.5 (per hour)

Flat 

Repair

County 

Yard 50 55.00$            2,750.00$       75.00$            3,750.00$       

Equipment 14.00-20 

through 17.5-25 (each)

Flat 

Repair

Vendor 

Shop 30 35.00$            1,050.00$       30.00$            900.00$          

Equipment 14.00-20 

through 17.5-25 (per 

hour)

Flat 

Repair

County 

Yard 30 55.00$            1,650.00$       75.00$            2,250.00$       

Passenger/Lt Truck 7.5-

16 (each)

Spot 

Repair

Vendor 

Shop 1 10.00$            10.00$            0.00$              0.00$              

Passenger/Lt Truck 7.5-

16 (per hour)

Spot 

Repair

County 

Yard 1 No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

Truck 8.25-20 through 

11.00-24.5 (each)

Spot 

Repair

Vendor 

Shop 25 12.50$            312.50$          6.00$              150.00$          

Truck 8.25-20 through 

11.00-24.5 (per hour)

Spot 

Repair

County 

Yard 25 55.00$            1,375.00$       75.00$            1,875.00$       

Equipment 14.00-20 

through 17.5-25 (each)

Spot 

Repair

Vendor 

Shop 50 35.00$            1,750.00$       37.00$            1,850.00$       

Equipment 14.00-20 

through 17.5-25 (per 

hour)

Spot 

Repair

County 

Yard 50 55.00$            2,750.00$       75.00$            3,750.00$       

SCHEDULE K SUBTOTAL 12,462.50$     15,610.00$     

Schedule L: Section Repairs

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

  

Tire Size         Unit of Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended

      Measure Price Price Price Price

10.00-20               each 18 25.00$            450.00$          20.00$            360.00$          

10.00-22.5               each 18 25.00$            450.00$          20.00$            360.00$          

11.00-24.5               each 18 25.00$            450.00$          20.00$            360.00$          

14.00-20               each 18 55.00$            990.00$          55.00$            990.00$          

14.00-24               each 18 55.00$            990.00$          55.00$            990.00$          

16.8-24               each 18 95.00$            1,710.00$       80.00$            1,440.00$       

19.5-24               each 18 100.00$          1,800.00$       80.00$            1,440.00$       

15.5-25               each 18 80.00$            1,440.00$       80.00$            1,440.00$       

17.5-25               each 18 100.00$          1,800.00$       80.00$            1,440.00$       

SCHEDULE L SUBTOTAL 10,080.00$     8,820.00$       

Brannon Tire

Brannon Tire
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Bid #07-863-002 Truck Tires & Related Services - West Slope

Evaluation*

Schedule M:  Dismount/Balance/Mount

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

  

Tire Size         Service Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended

Price Price Price Price

Up to 7.50-16 Bubble Bal. (ea) 1 No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

Up to 7.50-16 Spin Balance (ea) 1 7.50$              7.50$              8.00$              8.00$              

Up to 7.50-16 2 Pc. Rims (ea) 1 7.50$              7.50$              8.00$              8.00$              

Up to 7.50-16 Dismount/Mount  -$                

Vendor Shop (ea) 25 5.00$              125.00$          5.00$              125.00$          

Up to 7.50-16 Dismount/Mount  -$                

Co. Yard (per hr) 25 55.00$            1,375.00$       75.00$            1,875.00$       

8.25-20 to 11.00-24.5 Bubble Bal. (ea) 1 No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

8.25-20 to 11.00-24.5 Spin Balance (ea) 1 20.00$            20.00$            16.00$            16.00$            

8.25-20 to 11.00-24.5 2 Pc. Rims (ea) 1 20.00$            20.00$            16.00$            16.00$            

8.25-20 to 11.00-24.5 Dismount/Mount  -$                

Vendor Shop (ea) 100 10.00$            1,000.00$       10.00$            1,000.00$       

8.25-20 to 11.00-24.5 Dismount/Mount  -$                

Co. Yard (per hr) 100 55.00$            5,500.00$       75.00$            7,500.00$       

14.00-20 to 19.5-25 Bubble Bal. (ea) 1 No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

14.00-20 to 19.5-25 Spin Balance (ea) 1 No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

14.00-20 to 19.5-25 2 Pc. Rims (ea) 1 No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

14.00-20 to 19.5-25 Dismount/Mount  -$                

Vendor Shop (ea) 50 20.00$            1,000.00$       20.00$            1,000.00$       

14.00-20 to 19.5-25 Dismount/Mount  -$                

Co. Yard (per hr) 50 55.00$            2,750.00$       75.00$            3,750.00$       

SCHEDULE M SUBTOTAL 11,805.00$     15,298.00$     

Schedule N:  Install Studs in Snow Tires

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

  

Tire Size  Unit of Measure Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended

Price Price Price Price

Up to 7.50-16               each 1 5.00$              5.00$              15.00$            15.00$            

7.50-16 and up               each 1 10.00$            10.00$            25.00$            25.00$            

SCHEDULE N SUBTOTAL 15.00$            40.00$            

Schedule O:  Install Studs in Snow Tires

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

  

Service  Unit of Measure Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended

Price Price Price Price

Dismount, Mount & 

Repairs        per hour 1 55.00$            55.00$            75.00$            75.00$            

Alignment      per vehicle 1 No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

Toe Set      per vehicle 1 No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

Foam Fill Tires          per lb. 1 0.95$              0.95$              1.20$              1.20$              

Tractor Tire Sealant          per lb. 1 2.00$              2.00$              17.50$            17.50$            

Disposal Fees Light 

Truck Tires

              each

1 2.50$              2.50$              3.00$              3.00$              

Disposal Fees Semi-

Truck Tires

              each

1 7.50$              7.50$              8.00$              8.00$              

Disposal Fees 

Backhoe Tires

              each

1 35.00$            35.00$            20.00$            20.00$            

Disposal Fees Grader 

Tires

              each

1 35.00$            35.00$            20.00$            20.00$            

Disposal Fees Snow-

blower tires

              each

1 35.00$            35.00$            30.00$            30.00$            

Emergency Svc. Calls        per hour 1 55.00$            55.00$            90.00$            90.00$            

SCHEDULE O SUBTOTAL 227.95$          264.70$          

Brannon Tire

Brannon Tire

Brannon Tire
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Bid #07-863-002 Truck Tires & Related Services - West Slope

Evaluation*

SUMMARY - TIRES

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

  

Schedule A: New Tires (Highway Tread) 37,628.84$     43,131.53$     

Schedule B: New Tires (M&S Drilled for Studs) 8,575.14$       8,919.32$       

Schedule C: New Tires/Traction Tread 39,094.92$     37,257.59$     

Schedule D: New Tires/Special Equipment 1,625.27$       2,202.02$       

Schedule E: Recaps M&S, Drilled for Studs 14,125.60$     18,111.60$     

Schedule F: Recap Highway Tread 2,596.40$       3,140.92$       

Schedule G: Recaps/Traction Tread 7,550.00$       7,300.73$       

Schedule H: Recaps/Special Equipment 1,073.00$       1,379.47$       

Schedule I: Radial Casings 1,825.00$       1,575.00$       

Schedule J:  New Tubes 1,057.59$       1,459.53$       

SUBTOTAL 115,151.76$   124,477.71$   

LESS 5% LVP -$                5% 6,223.89$       

LESS TERMS DISCOUNT 1%/20 days 1,151.52$       -$                

TIRES TOTAL 114,000.24$   118,253.82$   

SUMMARY - SERVICES

North State Bandag

Stockton, CA Diamond Springs, CA

   

Schedule K: Flat/Spot Repairs 12,462.50$     15,610.00$     

Schedule L: Section Repairs 10,080.00$     8,820.00$       

Schedule M:  Dismount/Balance/Mount 11,805.00$     15,298.00$     

Schedule N:  Install Studs in Snow Tires 15.00$            40.00$            

Schedule O:  Install Studs in Snow Tires 227.95$          264.70$          

SUBTOTAL 34,590.45$     40,032.70$     

LESS TERMS DISCOUNT 1%/20 days 345.90$          -$                

SERVICES TOTAL 34,244.55$     40,032.70$     

EVALUATED GRAND TOTAL TIRES & SERVICES 148,244.79$   158,286.53$   

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax

No Bid - one or more bidders did not quote this item. 

Brannon Tire

Brannon Tire


