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A ] B I c I D [e] F G IH ] J
| 1] Bid #17-680-037 Ammunition
| 2 | Evaluation*
| 3 |
| 6 (A) San Diego Police
na Equipment Co. (B) Miwall Corporation
8 |Category I: Federal Ammunition San Diego, CA Grass Valley, CA
Bid Description Estinstad ot # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
9 | ltem # Rounds
5.66mm 55 grain, MCBT M193 Ball Ammunition
#XM193AF90 (450 rounds 15,000 34 $1566.07 $5,306.38 No Bid #VALUE!
11 1 per case)
HST .40 cal 180 grain JHP #P40HST1 ; i
7o 2 |(1,000 rounds per case) 41,000 41 $315.90 $12,951.90 No Bid #VALUE!
American Eagle .40 cal. 180 grain FMJ
#AE40R1 201,000 201 $238.74 $47,986.74 No Bid #VALUE!
13 3 [(1,000 rounds per case)
HST .45 ACP cal 230 grain +PJHP #P45HST1 17,000 17 $379.80 $6,456.60 No Bid #VALUE!
14 4 (1,000 rounds per case)
2 3/4" 12 gauge Rifle Slug #F-130-RS " )
- 5 |(250 rounds per case) 1,000 4 $135.70 $542.80 No Bid #VALUE!
.45 ACP, 230 grain FMJ #AE45A100 . |
16 6 |(1,000 rounds per case) 17,000 17 $269.80 $4,586.60 No Bid #VALUE!
.38 Special, +P, 130 grain, FMJ #AE38K . |
17 7_1(1,000 rounds per case) 1,000 1 $324.45 $324.45 No Bid #VALUE!
12 Gauge Classic 12 pellet, OO buckshot # F-
130-00 (250 4,000 16 $132.85 $2,125.60 No Bid #VALUE!
18 8 |rounds per case)
2223 Remington 55 prain, FMJBY #AE223AF 17,400 29 $206.90 $6,000.10 No Bid #VALUE!
19 9 [(600 rounds per case)
Tactical Bonded .223 Remington 55 grain,
Bonded, SP #LE223T1 1,000 5 $225.80 $1,129.00 No Bid #VALUE!
20| 10 [(200 rounds per case)
Tactical Tru .223 Remington, 55 grain, Hi Shok
SP #T223A 3,000 6 $264.20 $1,585.20 No Bid #VALUE!
21] 11 |(500 rounds per case)
Speer Gold DOT 38 Special +P 135 grain GDHP]
SB #53921 (1,000 rounds 1,000 1 $381.24 $381.24 No Bid #VALUE!
22 12 |per case)
Speer, Lawman 38 special +P 158 grain TMJFN
# 53833 (1,000 1,000 1 $279.40 $279.40 No Bid #VALUE!
23| 13 |rounds per case)
.308 Cal. 165 grain Tactical Bonded #LE308T1 10,000 50 $239.55 $11,977.50 No Bid #VALUE!
24| 14 |(200 rounds per case)
Speer Gold DOT .223 Remington 55 grain
GDSP #24446 2,000 4 $261.10 $1,044.40 No Bid #VALUE!
25| 15 |(500 rounds per case)
Tactical '00' Flight Control Buckshot #LE132 00 1,000 4 $131.50 $526.00 No Bid #VALUE!
26| 16 |(250 rounds per case)
9MM, 124 grain, JHP #P9HST1 . |
27| 17 |(1,000 rounds per case) 1,000 1 $284.05 $284.05 No Bid #VALUE!
M, 124 graln FML, #AEGNT 1,000 1 $217.90 $217.90 | NoBid #VALUE!
28| 18 |(1,000 rounds per case)
12 gauge Top Gun Target, 2 3/4"#9  #TGL12 1,000 4 $61.40 $245.60 No Bid #VALUE!
29] 19 |(250 rounds per case)
Pederal BMW; HST 147 gain JHP, #Petion2 18,000 18 $284.05 $5112.90 | NoBid #VALUE!
30| 20 |(1,000 rounds per case)
Federal M, 147 graln. FNL AFFPL(1.000 25,000 25 $202.10 $5,052.50 No Bid #VALUE!
31| 21 |rounds per case)
Federal 9MM, 124 grain FMJ round nose
#AE9AP 5,000 5 $202.10 $1,010.50 No Bid #VALUE!
32| 22 |(1000 rounds per case)
34 Subtotal $115,127.36 No Bid
36 Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 0% #VALUE!
37 Less Terms Discount 0% $0.00 0% #VALUE!
39 Evaluation 115,127.36 No Bid
40 Delivery ARO 30-120 Days ARO N/A
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42
43 | (A) San Diego Police
44 Equipment Co. (B) Miwall Corporation
45 |Category ll: Winchester Ammunition San Diego, CA Grass Valley, CA
Description Estimated # of # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
46 Rounds
Ranger .45 cal ACPSXT 230 grain #RA45T (500 5,000 10 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
48| 23 |rounds per case)
12 gauge AA Trap 1 1/8 oz. load #9 shot #
AASC129 (250 2,250 9 No Bid. #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
49| 24 |rounds per case)
12 gauge AA Trap 1 1/8 oz. load #9 shot #
AAM129 (250 2,250 9 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
50| 25 |rounds per case)
12 Gauge Buckshot, 9 Pellet # RA1200 . .
: ! |
51| 26 [(250 rounds per case) 10,500 42 hEEid PALLIE No Bid #VALUE!
12 Guage Buckshot, 9 pellet #XB1200 (250 ; 1 . |
s2| 27 |rounds per case) 1000 4 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
12 Gauge Slug, 1 oz # RA12RS15 (250 ’ | : |
53| 28 |rounds per case) 8,000 32 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
12 Gauge Slug, 1 oz # X12RS15 ; [ ; i
s4] 20 [(250 rounds per case) 8,000 32 No i WALLEY | NaBo bt
12 Guage Black Powder Blanks #XBP12 . ;
| !
55| 30 |(250 rounds per case) 10,000 40 Ne.Eig #UALLEI Mo Bid FUALUE]
57 Subtotal #VALUE! #VALUE!
58 Less 5% LVP 0% #VALUE! 0% #VALUE!
59 Less Terms Discount 0% #VALUE! 0% #VALUE!
61 Evaluation No Bid #VALUE!
62 Delivery ARO N/A N/A
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64
| 65 (A) San Diego Police
| 66 | Equipment Co. (B) Miwall Corporation
67 |Category lll: Hornady Ammunition San Diego, CA Grass Valley, CA
Description Estimated #of # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
68 Rounds
.223 Rem. 55 grain TAP #83276HP ; |
70| 31 |(200 rounds per case) 12,000 60 No Bid #VALUE! $120.00 $7,200.00
=98 Yilin-A\-Max TAP 168 grain # 80865 (200 10,000 50 No Bid #vALUE!| | $190.00 $9,500.00
71] 32 |[rounds per case)
568 Lapua 250 grain BTHP #8250 (200 1,000 5 No Bid #vALUE!| [ $3.45 $3,450.00
72| 33 |rounds per case)
.338 Lapua 285 grain BTHP Match #82306 (200 1,000 5 No Bid #VALUE! $3.45 $3.450.00
73| 34 [rounds per case)
SUBNG T30 araln ABIAK #6270 {100 2,000 20 No Bid avaLUE!| | s4.50 $9,000.00
74| 35 |rounds per case)
76 Subtotal No Bid $32,600.00
78 Less 5% LVP 0% #VALUE! 0% $0.00
79 Less Terms Discount 0% #VALUE! 0% $0.00
81 Evaluation No Bid $32,600.00
62 Delivery ARO N/A 30 Days
83
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84
| 85 (A) San Diego Police
| 86 | Equipment Co. (B) Miwall Corporation
87 |Category IV: CCI Ammunition San Diego, CA Grass Valley, CA
Description EStimeted # of # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
88 Rounds
Velocitor .22 cal Long rifle 40 grain Copper
36 |Plated Hollow Point (CPHP) #0047 (5,000 5,000 1 $ 31824 $318.24 No Bid #VALUE!
90 rounds per case)
92 Subtotal $318.24 No Bid
94 Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 0% #VALUE!
95 Less Terms Discount 0% $0.00 0% #VALUE!
a7 Evaluation $318.24 No Bid
| 98| Delivery ARO 30-120 Days ARO N/A
99|
100 * Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax
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B16
Eric Van Leeuwen:;
Bidder (A) indicated 500 rounds per case no longer available, now comes in 1,000 rounds per case

:B19
Comment:

Eric Van Leeuwen:
Bidder (A) indacted this is now available in 600 rounds per case,.

A43
Eric Van Lesuwen:
No Bidders submitted a Bid response for Category Il Winchester ammunition.

ABS
Eric Van Leeuwen:

172
Eric Van Leeuwen:
Bidder (B) quoted 3.45 per round, and $69.00 per box. Ammo comes 20 rounds per box, with 10 boxes per case, or $3,450.0 per case

173
Eric Van Leeuwen:
Bidder (B) quoted 3.45 per round, and $69.00 per box. Ammo comes 20 rounds per box, with 10 boxes per case, or $3,450.0 per case
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