
Bid# 17-405-011 - Diesel Fueland Fuel 
Additive 

•Evaluation 

Locationtl.;ategory 

Category I - DOT 
(West Slope Location) 

Equipment I Vehicle Fuel Tanks -
2441 Headington Rd Placerville, CA 
Winterizatlon Fuel Additive 

Sub total 
Local Vendor Preference 
Terms Discount 

Net Total 

ll.;ategory 11- uu 1 

(East Slope - South Shore Location) 

Equipment I Vehicle Fuel Tanks -
1121 Shakori Road, Meyers, CA 
Winterization Fuel Additive 

Sub total 
Local Vendor Preference 
Terms Discount 

Net Total 

OPIS Rack 
Average Price 

(per gal) 
As of 

10/24/2016 

$ 1.7809 

Asal 
10/24/2016 

$ 1.7809 

Quoted 
Price Net Price 

(per gal) (per gal) 
(A) Flyers Energy 

Sparks, NV 

$0.1300 $1 .9109 
$0.0200 $0.0200 

$1 .9309 
5.00% ($0.1 0) 
0.00% $0.0000 

$1 .8344 

(A) Flyers Energy 
Sparks, NV 

0.0750 $1 .8559 
0.0200 $0.0200 

$1 .8759 
5.00% ($0.0938) 
0.00% $0.0000 

$1.7821 

OPIS Rack Quoted 
Average Price Price Net Price 

(per gal) (per gal) (per gal) 
As of (B) Hunt & Sons, Inc. 

10/24/2016 Placerville, CA 

$ 1.7809 $0.0299 $1 .8108 
$0.0250 $0.0250 

$1 .8358 
5.00% ($0.0918) 
0.00% $0.0000 

$1.7440 

As of (B) Hunt & Sons, Inc. 
10/24/2016 Placerville, CA 

$ 1.7809 0.0639 $1.8448 
0.0250 $0.0250 

$1 .8698 
5.00% ($0.0935) 
0.00% $0.0000 

$1.7763 
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Locatront<.;ategory OPIS Rack Quoted 
Average Price Price Net Price 

(per gal) (per gal) (per gal) 

Category Ill - DOT As of (A) Flyers Energy 
(East Slope - West Shore Location) 10/24/2016 Sparks, NV 

Equipment I Vehicle Fuel Tanks -
7101 Wilson Road, Tahoma, CA $ 1.7809 $0.3500 $2.1309 
Winterization Fuel Additive $0.0300 $0.0300 

Sub total $2.1609 
Local Vendor Preference 5.00% ($0.1080) 
Terms Discount 0.00% $0.0000 

Net Total $2.0529 

l.ategory rv - uenerator r-uel I an ks As ot (A) Flyers Energy 
(West Slope Locations) 10/24/2016 Sparks, NV 

Generator Fuel Tanks - Transportation Division 
2441 Headinton Rd. Placerville, CA No Bid #VALUE! 

Generator Fuel Tanks - Building B 
360 Fair Lane, Placerville, CA No Bid #VALUE! 

Generator Fuel Tanks - Building C 
2850 Fair Lane Court, Placerville, CA No Bid #VALUE! 

Generator Fuel Tanks - Placerville Jail 
300 Forni Road, Placerville, CA No Bid #VALUE! 

Generator Fuel Tanks - Sheriffs Office 
300 Fair Lane Placerville, CA No Bid #VALUE! 
Winterization Fuel Additive (All locations) No Bid No Bid 

Sub total No Bid 
Local Vendor Preference 5.00% 
Terms Discount 0.00% 

Net Total No Bid 

OPIS Rack 
Average Price 

(per gal) 

As of 
10/24/2016 

$ 1.7809 

0 

10/24/2016 

$ 1.7809 

$ 1.7809 

$ 1.7809 

$ 1.7809 

$ 1.7809 

Quoted 
Price 

(per gal) 
Net Price 
(per gal) 

(B) Hunt & Sons, Inc. 
Placerville, CA 

$0.2549 $2.0358 
$0.0250 $0.0250 

$2.0608 
5.00% ($0.1030) 
0.00% $0.0000 

$1.9578 

- --- -:r 

$0.3599 $2.1408 

0.3599 $2.1408 

0.3599 $2.1408 

0.3599 $2.1408 

0.3599 $2.1408 
0.025 $0.0250 

$10.7290 
5.00% ($0.54) 
0.00% $0.00 

$10.19 
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Location/Category OPIS Rack Quoted 
Average Price Price Net Price 

(per gal) (per gal) (per gal) 

Category V - CAO Facilities As of (A) Flyers Energy 
(East Slope Locations) 10/24/2016 Sparks, NV 

Generator Fuel Tanks -
1121 Shakori Drive, Meyers, CA No Bid #VALUE! 

Generator Fuel Tanks - So Lake Tahoe Jail 
1051 Al Tahoe Blvd., SLT, CA $ 1.7809 $0.3500 $2.1309 

Generator Fuel Tanks - Juv. Treatment Ctr -
1041 Al Tahoe Blvd., South Lake Tahoe, CA $ 1.7809 $0.3500 $2.1309 

Generator Fuel Tank - SL T Sheriffs Off. 
1360 Johnson Blvd. So. Lake Tahoe, CA $ 1.7809 $0.3500 $2.1309 
Winterization Fuel Additive (All locations) $0.0300 $0.0300 

Sub total $6.4227 
Local Vendor Preference 5.00% ($0.3211) 
Terms Discount 0.00% $0.0000 

Net Total Rejected 

Category VI - Environmental Management As (A) Flyers Energy 
(West Slope Location) of10/24/2016 Sparks, NV 

Equip!. & Gen. Fuel Tank - Union Mine Plant 
5700 Union Mine Rd., El Dorado, CA No Bid No Bid 
Winterization Fuel Additive (All locations) No Bid No Bid 

Sub total No Bid 
Local Vendor Preference 5.00% 
Terms Discount 0.00% 

Net Total No Bid 

OPIS Rack 
Average Price 

(per gal) 

As of 
10/24/2016 

$ 1.7809 

$ 1.7809 

$ 1.7809 

$ 1.7809 

As 
of10/24/2016 

$ 1.7809 

Quoted 
Price 

(per gal) 
Net Price 
(per gal) 

(8) Hunt & Sons, Inc. 
Placerville, CA 

$0.3599 $2.1408 

$0.3099 $2.0908 

$0.3099 $2.0908 

$0.3599 $2.1408 
$0.0250 $0.0250 

$6.3474 
5.00% ($0.3174) 
0.00% $0.0000 

$6.0300 

(B) Hunt & Sons, Inc. 
Placerville, CA 

0.2499 $2.0308 
0.025 $0.0250 

$2.0558 
5.00% ($0.1028) 
0.00% $0.0000 

$1.9530 
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10/2412016 Edcgov.us Mail - OPIS Wholesale Racks with CAR 

- 1.00 195.60 - 1.00 10/21 10:00 Chevron b 1t45c 176.60 - 1.00 185 .60 
Texaco b 1-10 176.60 - 1.00 185 .60 
Vital u N-10 185 . 00d + 1. 00 
LOW RACK 163.75 
HIGH RACK 176. 60 
RACK AVG 170.11 
CAP-AT-THE-RACK 10.37 
LCFS COST 2.840 
OPIS SAN FRANCISCO DELIVERED SPOT 

FOB SACRAMENTO 157.93 
BRO LOW RACK 172.00 
BRO HIGH RACK 176 . 60 
BRO RACK AVG 174.70 
UBD LOW RACK 163.75 
UBD HIGH RACK 166.05 
UBD RACK AVG 164.61 
CONT AVG-10/22 170.11 
CONT LOW-10/22 163.75 
CONT HIGH-10/22 176.60 
d=not in average 

SACRAMENTO, CA 
LOW RETAIL 
AVG RETAIL 
LOW RETAIL EX-TAX 
AVG RETAIL EX-TAX 

228 . 58 
264. 52 
175 .70 
210 .13 

180.00 
188.08 
183.54 
10.35 

2.840 
(SRI) 
169.81 
180.00 
188 .08 
184. 24 
180.75 
185.75 
182.70 
183.54 
180.00 
188.08 

- 1.00 195.60 - 1.00 10/21 10:00 

188.00 
202 .01 
195 .88 

10 .34 
2.840 

187.64 
188.00 
201.72 
194.11 
193.75 
202 . 01 
198. 00 
195.88 
188. 00 
202. 01 

-- -- 10/21 18:00 

SACRAMENTO, CA 2016-10-24 09:01:22 EDT 
**OPIS GROSS CARB ULTRA LOW SULFUR DISTILLATE PRICES WITH CAR COST ** 

No.2 
Terms No2 Move RD Move 

PSX u N-10 174.70 + 1.45 175.20 + 1 . 45 
Shell u N-10 177 .19 + 2.44 177.69 + 2 .44 
IdemitsuA u N-10 177. 25 - 3.25 177.75 - 3.25 
PSX b N-10 177. 28 + . 50 177 .78 + .50 
Valero b N-10 177 .47 + 1.13 
FlyersEn u N-10 177.50 - 2.25 178 .00 - 2.25 
Valero u N-10 177.97 + 1.38 178 .47 + 1.38 
XOM-TSO b 1-10 178.00 - 2.00 
Tesoro u N-10 178.50 + 1.50 179.00 + 1 .50 
Shell b 1-10 178 .97 + 2.45 
Chevron b lt45c 181 . 10 + 3.50 
Texaco b 1t45c 181.10 + 3. 50 
Vital u N-10 206 .25d + 2.00 206.75d + 2.00 
LOW RACK 174.70 175.20 
HIGH RACK 181.10 179.00 
RACK AVG 178.09 177.70 
CAP-AT-THE - RACK 13.18 13.18 
LCFS COST 2.205 2.205 
OPIS SAN FRANCISCO DELIVERED SPOT (SRI) 

FOB SACRAMENTO 160.54 160 .89 
BRO LOW RACK 177 .28 177.78 
BRO HIGH RACK 181 . 10 177 .78 
BRO RACK AVG 178. 99 177 .78 
UBD LOW RACK 174. 70 175.20 
UBD HIGH RACK 178 . 50 179.00 
UBD RACK AVG 177 . 19 177 . 69 
CONT AVG-10/22 178.09 177.70 
CONT LOW-10/22 174.70 175 .20 
CONT HIGH-10/22 181.10 179.00 
d=not in average 
Copyright, Oil Price Information Service 

No.2 
NRLM 

Move 
Move Date Time 

10/21 18 :00 
10/21 18:00 
10/21 19:00 
10/21 18 :00 
10/21 18:00 
10/21 19:01 
10/21 18:00 
10/ 20 18 :00 
10/22 00:03 
10/21 18:00 
10/21 18:00 
10/21 18:00 
10/21 18:00 

Rack prices are adjusted in this report to reflect the wholesale rack prices 
modified to include/exclude the CAR values for California locations. 
Subscriber fully understands that the CAR Adjusted Rack Price files MAY NOT 
match the official standard/terminal OPIS Rack Displays and agrees to fully 
inform those whom the subscriber does business with of the nature of the 
prices and how they may be different from standard/terminal OPIS rack prices. 
Subscriber accepts the risks inherent with using OPIS CAR Adjusted Rack Price 

https://m ail .google.com/m ail/utonui=2&ik= bdecea 1576&view= pt&search= inbox&th= 157f6d76d88df2c5&si ml= 157f6d76d88df2c5 517 

16-1125 A 4 of 4




