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Bid #18-680-035 Ammunition
Evaluation*

Category I: Federal Ammunition

(A) San Diego Police
Equipment Co.
San Diego, CA

(B) Miwall Corporation
Grass Valley, CA

(C) Dooley Enterprises , Inc.
Anaheim, CA

Bid
Item #

Description

Estimated # of
Rounds

# of Cases

Unit Price Extension

Unit Price Extension

Unit Price

Extension

11

5.56mm 55 grain, MCBT M193 Ball Ammunition
#XM193AF90
(450 rounds per case)

16,000

35

$159.90 $5,596.50

No Bid #VALUE!

No Bid

#VALUE!

12

HST .40 cal 180 grain JHP
#P40HST1
(1,000 rounds per case)

42,000

42

$315.90 $13,267.80

No Bid #VALUE!

No Bid

#VALUE!

American Eagle .40 cal. 180 grain FMJ #AE40R1
(1,000 rounds per case)

152,000

152

$244.86 $37,218.72

No Bid #VALUE!

No Bid

#VALUE!

14

HST .45 ACP cal 230 grain +PJHP
#P45HST1
(1,000 rounds per case)

15,000

15

$388.59 $5,828.85

No Bid #VALUE!

No Bid

#VALUE!

15

.45 ACP, 230 grain
FMJ #AE45A
(1,000 rounds per case)

15,000

15

$283.21 $4,248.15

No Bid #VALUE!

No Bid

#VALUE!

16

.38 Special, +P, 130 grain, FMJ
#AE38K
(1,000 rounds per case)

1,000

$331.96 $331.96

No Bid #VALUE!

No Bid

#VALUE!

17

.223 Remington 55 grain, FMJBT
#AE223AF
(900 rounds per case)

19,800

22

$319.80 $7,035.60

No Bid #VALUE!

No Bid

#VALUE!

18

Tactical Bonded .223 Remington 55 grain,
Bonded, SP

#LE223T1

(200 rounds per case)

1,000

$231.02 $1,155.10

No Bid #VALUE!

No Bid

#VALUE!

19

Tactical Tru .223 Remington, 55 grain, Hi Shok
SP #T223A
(500 rounds per case)

2,000

$270.31 $1,621.86

No Bid #VALUE!

No Bid

#VALUE!

20

10

Speer Gold DOT 38 Special +P 135 grain GDHP-
SB

#53921

(1,000 rounds per case)

1,000

$390.06 $390.06

No Bid #VALUE!

No Bid

#VALUE!

21

1

Speer , Lawman 38 special +P 158 grain TMJFN
# 53833 (1,000
rounds per case)

1,000

$289.84 $289.84

No Bid #VALUE!

No Bid

#VALUE!

22

12

.308 Cal. 165 grain Tactical Bonded
#LE308T1
(200 rounds per case)

10,000

50

$246.01 $12,300.50

No Bid #VALUE!

No Bid

#VALUE!

23

13

Federal 9MM, HST 147 grain JHP,
#P9HST2
(1,000 rounds per case)

29,000

29

$290.63 $8,428.27

No Bid #VALUE!

No Bid

#VALUE!

24

Federal 9MM, 147 grain, FMJ,
#AEIFP

(1,000 rounds per case)

69,000

69

$206.86 $14,273.34

No Bid #VALUE!

No Bid

#VALUE!
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Federal Preimum 12 gauge 7.5 shot, 2 3/4"

#GMT11375 1,000 $87.72 $350.88 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
25| 15 [(250 rounds per case)

Federal Premium 12 gauge Rifled Slug, 2 3/4" #

LEB127LRS 1,000 $129.48 $517.92 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
26| 16 [(250 rounds per case)
28 Subtotal $112,855.35 No Bid No Bid
30 Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 0% #VALUE! 0% #VALUE!
31 Less Terms Discount 2% ($2,257.11) 0% #VALUE! 0% #VALUE!
33 Evaluation 110,598.24 No Bid No Bid
34 Delivery ARO 30-120 Days ARO N/A N/A
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36
s (A) San Diego Police (B) Miwall Corporation
| 38| Equipment Co. Grass Valley, CA (C) Dooley Enterprises, Inc.
39 Category Il: Winchester Ammunition San Diego, CA Anaheim, CA
Description Estimated # of # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
40 Rounds
12 gauge AA Trap 1 1/8 oz. load #9 shot
#AASC129 2,000 8 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! 77.61 620.88
42| 17 |(250 rounds per case)
12 gauge AA Trap 1 1/8 oz. load #9 shot
# AAM129 2,000 8 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! 77.61 620.88
43| 18 |(250 rounds per case)
12 Gauge Slug, 1 oz. Low Recoil
#RA12RS15 8,000 32 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! 134.29 4,297.28
44| 19 [(250 rounds per case)
12 Gauge 1 oz. Super-X Slug
# X12RS15 1,000 4 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! 129.09 516.36
45| 20 |(250 rounds per case)
12 Guage Black Powder Blanks, Super-X
#XBP12 10,000 40 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! 197.51 7,900.40
46| 21 |(250 rounds per case)
9MM, 115 grain FMJ round nose
#Q4172 2,000 2 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! 91.83 183.66
47| 22 {(1,000 rounds per case)
49 Subtotal #VALUE! #VALUE! $14,139.46
50 Less 5% LVP 0% #VALUE! 0% #VALUE! 0% $0.00
51 Less Terms Discount 2% #VALUE! 0% #VALUE! 0% $0.00
53 Evaluation No Bid #VALUE! $14,139.46
| 54] Delivery ARO N/A N/A 3-60 Days ARO
55
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56
| 57| (A) San Diego Police 7 4
| 58| Equipment Co. (B)(l;l:z:llvca:ﬁ;so;alt\lon (C) Dooley Enterprises , Inc.
59 |[Category lll: Hornady Ammunition San Diego, CA ’ Anaheim, CA
—_— Estimated # of o s 3 T g . 2
Description # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
60 Rounds
.223 Rem. 55 grain TAP
#83276HP 12,000 60 No Bid #VALUE! $120.00 $7,200.00 No Bid #VALUE!
62| 23 |(200 rounds per case)
.308 Win-A-Max TAP 168 grain
# 80965 10,000 50 No Bid #VALUE! $190.00 $9,500.00 No Bid #VALUE!
63| 24 [(200 rounds per case)
50BMG 750 grain AMAX
#8270 2,000 20 No Bid #VALUE! $450.00 $9,000.00 No Bid #VALUE!
64| 25 [(100 rounds per case)
66 Subtotal No Bid $25,700.00 #VALUE!
68 Less 5% LVP 0% #VALUE! 0% $0.00 0% #VALUE!
69 Less Terms Discount 2% #VALUE! 0% $0.00 0% #VALUE!
71 Evaluation No Bid $25,700.00 #VALUE!
[ 72 Delivery ARO N/A 30 Days ARO N/A
73
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74
75 (A) San Diego Police . .
—— B Ic
| 76 | Equipment Co. ( )GN:_QASIZ Va:;poz:a:on (C) Dooley Enterprises, Inc.
77 Category IV: CCl Ammunition San Diego, CA ¥ Anaheim, CA
D - Estimated # of e . s i 4 g %
escription # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
78 Rounds
Velocitor .22 cal Long rifle 40 grain Copper
26 [raed Hollow FRE{CRHF) 10,000 2 $ 32563 $651.26 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
80 (5,000 rounds per case)
Copper - 22 .22LR 21 grain Copper Hollow Point
27 |#925CC 5,000 1 $ 674.46 $674.46 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
81 (5,000 rounds per case)
83 Subtotal $1,325.72 No Bid No Bid
85 Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 0% #VALUE! 0% #VALUE!
86 Less Terms Discount 2% ($26.51) 0% #VALUE! 0% #VALUE!
88 Evaluation $1,299.21 No Bid No Bid
89| Delivery ARO 30-120 Days ARO N/A N/A
90
E_- * Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax
92
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Comment:

Cell:
Comment:

Cell:
Comment:

Cell:
Comment:

Cell:
Comment:

B15
Eric Van Leeuwen:
Bidder (A) indicated 500 rounds per case no longer available, now comes in 1,000 rounds per case

B17
Eric Van Leeuwen:
Bidder (A) indacted this is now available in 900 rounds per case and new #AE223AF

B26
Eric Van Leeuwen:
Bidder #1 indicated Part # PB127LRS is commercial verion, Law enforment version is Part # LEB127LRS and is the same price.

A37
Eric Van Leeuwen:
No Bidders submitted a Bid response for Category Ill Winchester ammunition.

A57
Eric Van Leeuwen:





