
Evaluation *

Bid Item 
# Description

Unit of 
Measure

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

1
V-Neck Shirts - (#'s TOS, TPBS, 
TKS, TYS) Each 586

(Small - Large) 201 $4.64 $932.64 No Bid #VALUE! $4.69 $942.69
(X-Large) 108 $4.64 $501.12 No Bid #VALUE! $4.69 $506.52
(2X-Large) 138 $4.64 $640.32 No Bid #VALUE! $4.82 $665.16
(3X-Large) 78 $4.64 $361.92 No Bid #VALUE! $5.03 $392.34
(4X-Large) 30 $5.87 $176.10 No Bid #VALUE! $5.19 $155.70
(5X-Large) 18 $5.87 $105.66 No Bid #VALUE! $5.19 $93.42
(6X-Large) 12 $5.87 $70.44 No Bid #VALUE! $5.19 $62.28
(8X-Large) 1 $5.87 $5.87 No Bid #VALUE! $7.43 $7.43

Sub-total $2,794.07 #VALUE! $2,825.54

2
Pull-on Trousers (#'s TOT, TPBT, 
TGT, TYT, TKT) Each 1225

(Small - Large) 437 $4.97 $2,171.89 No Bid #VALUE! $6.12 $2,674.44
(X-Large) 346 $4.97 $1,719.62 No Bid #VALUE! $6.12 $2,117.52
(2X-Large) 263 $4.97 $1,307.11 No Bid #VALUE! $6.39 $1,680.57
(3X-Large) 108 $4.97 $536.76 No Bid #VALUE! $6.39 $690.12
(4X-Large) 57 $5.87 $334.59 No Bid #VALUE! $6.39 $364.23
(5X-Large) 12 $5.87 $70.44 No Bid #VALUE! $6.57 $78.84
(6X-Large) 1 $5.87 $5.87 No Bid #VALUE! $6.57 $6.57
(8X-Large) 1 $5.87 $5.87 No Bid #VALUE! $8.93 $8.93

Sub-total $6,152.15 $7,621.22

3
Crew-Neck Pullover Sweat Shirt  
(# SSGY) Each 64

(Small - Large) 1 $4.97 $4.97 No Bid #VALUE! $5.49 $5.49
(X-Large) 36 $4.97 $178.92 No Bid #VALUE! $6.34 $228.24
(2X-Large) 24 $5.97 $143.28 No Bid #VALUE! $7.12 $170.88
(3X-4X -Large) 1 $6.97 $6.97 No Bid #VALUE! $7.12 $7.12
(5X-Large) 1 $6.97 $6.97 No Bid #VALUE! $7.12 $7.12
(6X-Large) 1 $7.44 $7.44 No Bid #VALUE! $7.42 $7.42
(8X-Large) 1 $7.44 $7.44 No Bid #VALUE! $11.12 $11.12

Sub-total $355.99 #VALUE! $437.39

4
Crew-Neck Pullover Sweat Shirt  
(# ZZSPU) Each 52

(Small -XLarge) 13 $5.85 $76.05 No Bid #VALUE! $7.96 $103.48
(2XLarge) 36 $6.92 $249.12 No Bid #VALUE! $9.19 $330.84

(3XLarge - 4XLarge) 1 $7.44 $7.44 No Bid #VALUE! $11.72 $11.72
(5X-Large) 1 $7.74 No Bid $12.64 $12.64
(6X-Large) 1 $11.24 $11.24 No Bid #VALUE! $14.62 $14.62
(8X-Large) 1 $13.24 $13.24 No Bid #VALUE! $16.12 $16.12

Sub-total $357.09 #VALUE! $489.42

Category A - Clothing

Bid # 19-200-011 - Institutional Clothing, Bedding and Toiletries

(B) Tabb Textiles Co., Inc
Opelika, AL

(C) Bob Barker Company, Inc
Fuquay-Varina, NC

(A) Victory Supply, LLC      Mount
Pleasant, TN
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Bid Item 
# Description

Unit of 
Measure

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

Category A - Clothing

Bid # 19-200-011 - Institutional Clothing, Bedding and Toiletries

(B)  Tabb Textiles Co., Inc     
Opelika, AL

(C)  Bob Barker Company, Inc    
Fuquay-Varina, NC

(A)  Victory Supply, LLC      Mount 
Pleasant, TN

5 Thermal Top (# 63) Dozen 52
                     (Small - X-Large) 1 $28.74 $28.74 No Bid #VALUE! $29.00 $29.00
                     (2X-Large) 7 $29.74 $208.18 No Bid #VALUE! $31.00 $217.00
                     (3X-Large) 11 $29.74 $327.14 No Bid #VALUE! $33.00 $363.00
                     (4X-Large) 14 $31.97 $447.58 No Bid #VALUE! $34.00 $476.00
                     (6X-Large) 19 $35.54 $675.26 No Bid #VALUE! $37.00 $703.00
Sub-total $1,686.90 #VALUE! $1,788.00

6 Blue Jeans (# Z9393V) Each 21  
                     (28" - 42" waist) 18 $14.44 $259.92 No Bid #VALUE! $13.59 $244.62
                     (44" - 50" waist) 2 $16.44 $32.88 No Bid #VALUE! $14.55 $29.10
                     (52" - 56" waist) 1 $18.11 $18.11 No Bid #VALUE! $16.22 $16.22
Sub-total $310.91 #VALUE! $289.94

7 Men's Gym Shorts (# 918) Each 455
                     (Small - Large) 171 $2.99 $511.29 No Bid #VALUE! $3.42 $584.82
                     (X-Large) 147 $2.99 439.53 No Bid #VALUE! $3.42 $502.74
                     (2X-Large) 111 $3.44 381.84 No Bid #VALUE! $3.63 $402.93
                     (3X-Large) 24 $3.44 82.56 No Bid #VALUE! $3.63 $87.12
                     (4X-Large) 1 $3.44 3.44 No Bid #VALUE! $4.01 $4.01
                     (5X-Large) 1 $4.24 4.24 No Bid #VALUE! $5.42 $5.42
Sub-total $1,422.90 #VALUE! $1,587.04

8 Knee Length Walking Short (# 618) Each 48
                     (Med -  XLarge) 48 $3.71 $178.08 No Bid #VALUE! $4.22 $202.56
                     (2-XLarge) 1 $3.71 $3.71 No Bid #VALUE! $4.82 $4.82
                     (3-XLarge) 1 $4.64 $4.64 No Bid #VALUE! $4.99 $4.99
                     (4X-Large) 1 $5.44 $5.44 No Bid #VALUE! $5.75 $5.75
                     (5X-Large) 1 $5.44 $5.44 No Bid #VALUE! $5.75 $5.75
                     (6X-Large) 1 $5.44 $5.44 No Bid #VALUE! $5.75 $5.75
Sub-total $202.75 #VALUE! $229.62

9 Disposable Coveralls (# 3575-3XL) Case 6 $57.99 $347.94 No Bid #VALUE! $35.96 $215.76
Sub-total $347.94 #VALUE! $215.76

10
Multi-Purpose Nightshirt (# 
NWNGR/P) Case 81

Regular Size 39 $5.44 $212.16 No Bid #VALUE! $4.30 $167.70
Plus Size 42 $6.94 $291.48 No Bid #VALUE! $4.92 $206.64

Sub-total $503.64 #VALUE! $374.34

11
Men's Boxer Shorts (# EBXLSQ 
White) Dozen 200
                     (Small - Large) 1 $11.54 $11.54 No Bid #VALUE! $13.12 $13.12
                     (X-Large) 157 $11.77 $1,847.89 No Bid #VALUE! $13.36 $2,097.52
                     (2X-Large) 20 $12.52 $250.40 No Bid #VALUE! $13.84 $276.80
                     (3X-Large) 15 $12.52 $187.80 No Bid #VALUE! $14.44 $216.60
                     (4X-Large) 5 $13.97 $69.85 No Bid #VALUE! $15.12 $75.60
                     (5X-Large) 1 $16.24 $16.24 No Bid #VALUE! $16.34 $16.34
                     (6X-Large) 1 $16.24 $16.24 No Bid #VALUE! $16.34 $16.34
Sub-total $2,399.96 #VALUE! $2,712.32
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Bid Item 
# Description

Unit of 
Measure

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

Category A - Clothing

Bid # 19-200-011 - Institutional Clothing, Bedding and Toiletries

(B)  Tabb Textiles Co., Inc     
Opelika, AL

(C)  Bob Barker Company, Inc    
Fuquay-Varina, NC

(A)  Victory Supply, LLC      Mount 
Pleasant, TN

12 Men's Brief's (# EBRLS) Dozen 10
                     (Small - Large) 2 $9.44 $18.88 No Bid #VALUE! $10.98 $21.96
                     (X-Large) 2 $9.44 $18.88 No Bid #VALUE! $11.74 $23.48
                     (2X-Large) 2 $10.74 $21.48 No Bid #VALUE! $11.74 $23.48
                     (3X-Large) 1 $11.17 $11.17 No Bid #VALUE! $13.41 $13.41
                     (4X-Large) 1 $11.71 $11.71 No Bid #VALUE! $13.41 $13.41
                     (5X-Large) 1 $11.82 $11.82 No Bid #VALUE! $15.72 $15.72
                     (6X-Large) 1 $11.82 $11.82 No Bid #VALUE! $15.72 $15.72
Sub-total $105.76 #VALUE! $127.18

13
Men's Boxer Shorts (# EBXBR / 
BXBR Brown) Dozen 23
                     (Small -XLarge) 20 $14.66 $293.20 No Bid #VALUE! $15.62 $312.40
                     (2XLarge- 3XLarge) 2 $15.71 $31.42 No Bid #VALUE! $16.10 $32.20
                     (4XLarge - 6XLarge) 1 $17.99 $17.99 No Bid #VALUE! $19.94 $19.94
Sub-total $342.61 #VALUE! $364.54

14 Sports Bra (# EBASPLS) Dozen 84
                     (Size 32) 15 $15.69 $235.35 No Bid #VALUE! $16.79 $251.85
                     (Size 34) 29 $15.69 $455.01 No Bid #VALUE! $16.79 $486.91
                     (Size 36) 14 $15.69 $219.66 No Bid #VALUE! $16.79 $235.06
                     (Size 38) 13 $15.69 $203.97 No Bid #VALUE! $16.79 $218.27
                     (Size 40) 7 $15.69 $109.83 No Bid #VALUE! $16.79 $117.53
                     (Size 42) 1 $15.69 $15.69 No Bid #VALUE! $16.79 $16.79
                     (Size 44) 1 $15.69 $15.69 No Bid #VALUE! $18.12 $18.12
                     (Size 46) 1 $15.69 $15.69 No Bid #VALUE! $18.12 $18.12
                     (Size 48) 1 $17.61 $17.61 No Bid #VALUE! $18.12 $18.12
                     (Size 50) 1 $17.61 $17.61 No Bid #VALUE! $19.86 $19.86
                     (Size 52) 1 $17.61 $17.61 No Bid #VALUE! $19.86 $19.86
Sub-total $1,323.72 #VALUE! $1,420.49

15 Girls' Panties (# ELBLCTN) Dozen 192
                     (Small Size: 5 - 7) 108 $6.11 $659.88 No Bid #VALUE! $6.79 $733.32
                     (Medium Size: 8 - 10)) 73 $6.34 $462.82 No Bid #VALUE! $8.12 $592.76
                     (Large Size: 11 - 14) 10 $6.97 $69.70 No Bid #VALUE! $9.84 $98.40
                     (XLarge Size: 15-18) 1 $7.11 $7.11 No Bid #VALUE! $11.12 $11.12
Sub-total $1,199.51 #VALUE! $1,435.60

16 Women's Panties ( ELBLS) Dozen 51
                     (Small Size: 5 - 7) 45 $6.11 $274.95 No Bid #VALUE! $7.46 $335.70
                     (Medium Size: 8 - 10)) 3 $6.34 $19.02 No Bid #VALUE! $8.96 $26.88
                     (Large Size: 11 - 14) 2 $6.97 $13.94 No Bid #VALUE! $10.23 $20.46
                     (XLarge Size: 15-18) 1 $7.11 $7.11 No Bid #VALUE! $11.26 $11.26
Sub-total $315.02 #VALUE! $394.30

17 Girls' Panties (# 351BN - Brown) Dozen 11
                     (Small Size: 5 - 7) 8 $7.44 $59.52 No Bid #VALUE! $11.58 $92.64
                     (Medium Size: 8 - 10)) 1 $7.84 $7.84 No Bid #VALUE! $11.58 $11.58
                     (Large Size: 11 - 14) 1 $8.24 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $14.67 $14.67
                     (XLarge Size: 15-18) 1 $10.99 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $14.67 $14.67
Sub-total $67.36 #VALUE! $133.56
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Bid Item 
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Unit of 
Measure

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

Category A - Clothing

Bid # 19-200-011 - Institutional Clothing, Bedding and Toiletries

(B)  Tabb Textiles Co., Inc     
Opelika, AL

(C)  Bob Barker Company, Inc    
Fuquay-Varina, NC

(A)  Victory Supply, LLC      Mount 
Pleasant, TN

18
T-Shirt - 100% Preshrunk Cotton 
(#683TF) Dozen 122  

(Small- XLarge) 85 $22.79 $1,937.15 No Bid #VALUE! $28.64 $2,434.40
2XL - 4XL 36 $29.74 $1,070.64 No Bid #VALUE! $31.12 $1,120.32
5XL - 8XL 1 $32.14 $32.14 No Bid #VALUE! $42.63 $42.63

Sub-total $3,039.93 #VALUE! $3,597.35
19 T-Shirt  (# ZPC61 colors) Each 232

                     (Med-Large) 72 $2.34 $168.48 No Bid #VALUE! $2.42 $174.24
                     (XLarge) 144 $2.34 $336.96 No Bid #VALUE! $2.42 $348.48
                     (2XLarge) 12 $3.41 $40.92 No Bid #VALUE! $4.02 $48.24
                     (3X-Large) 1 $3.74 $3.74 No Bid #VALUE! $5.67 $5.67
                     (4X-Large) 1 $4.99 $4.99 No Bid #VALUE! $5.67 $5.67
                     (5X-Large) 1 $4.99 $4.99 No Bid #VALUE! $6.04 $6.04
                     (6X-Large) 1 $4.99 $4.99 No Bid #VALUE! $6.04 $6.04
Sub-total $565.07 #VALUE! $594.38

20 T-Shirt (# TSWH1 White) Dozen 69
                     (Medium - Large) 10 $19.64 $196.40 No Bid #VALUE! $27.22 $272.20
                     (X-Large) 40 $19.64 $785.60 No Bid #VALUE! $27.22 $1,088.80
                     (2X-Large) 6 $27.44 $164.64 No Bid #VALUE! $34.69 $208.14
                     (3X-Large) 10 $27.44 $274.40 No Bid #VALUE! $44.12 $441.20
                     (4X-Large) 1 $29.71 $29.71 No Bid #VALUE! $44.12 $44.12
                     (5X-Large) 1 $31.11 $31.11 No Bid #VALUE! $46.35 $46.35
                     (6X-Large) 1 $31.11 $31.11 No Bid #VALUE! $60.67 $60.67
Sub-total $1,512.97 #VALUE! $2,161.48

21 T-Shirt (# 5993 & 321) Each 18
                     (Medium - Large) 12 $3.00 $36.00 No Bid #VALUE! $2.36 $28.32
                     (X-Large) 1 $3.00 $3.00 No Bid #VALUE! $3.02 $3.02
                     (2X-Large) 1 $4.00 $4.00 No Bid #VALUE! $3.20 $3.20
                     (3X-Large) 1 $4.00 $4.00 No Bid #VALUE! $3.49 $3.49
                     (4X-Large) 1 $6.00 $6.00 No Bid #VALUE! $3.82 $3.82
                     (5X-Large) 1 $6.00 $6.00 No Bid $0.00 $3.82 $3.82
                     (6X-Large) 1 $6.00 $6.00 No Bid #VALUE! $3.82 $3.82
Sub-total $65.00 #VALUE! $45.67

22 T-Shirt (# TS8000) Dozen 55
Small - XLarge 30 $19.64 $589.20 No Bid #VALUE! $30.42 $912.60

2-4XLarge 1 $27.44 $27.44 No Bid #VALUE! $66.35 $66.35
5XLarge 24 $29.71 $713.04 No Bid #VALUE! $66.35 $1,592.40
6Xlarge 1 $31.11 $31.11 No Bid N/A $0.00

Sub-total $713.04 #VALUE! $1,592.40

23
Terry Sport Sock (#M4595 or 
A4595) Dozen 49 $4.67 $228.83 No Bid #VALUE! $5.12 $250.88
Sub-total $228.83 #VALUE! $250.88

24 Sock - Over-The-Calf (# SKTW22) Dozen 442
One Size Fits All 442 $5.68 $2,510.56 No Bid #VALUE! $6.56 $2,899.52

Sub-total $2,510.56 #VALUE! $2,899.52
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Bid Item 
# Description

Unit of 
Measure

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

Category A - Clothing

Bid # 19-200-011 - Institutional Clothing, Bedding and Toiletries

(B)  Tabb Textiles Co., Inc     
Opelika, AL

(C)  Bob Barker Company, Inc    
Fuquay-Varina, NC

(A)  Victory Supply, LLC      Mount 
Pleasant, TN

25 Blanket Work Coat (# 652-KH) Each 32
38 & 40 (MED) 5 $22.11 $110.55 No Bid #VALUE! $18.88 $94.40

42 & 44 (LARGE) 10 $22.11 $221.10 No Bid #VALUE! $18.88 $188.80
46 & 48 (XLARGE) 10 $22.11 $221.10 No Bid #VALUE! $18.88 $188.80

50 & 52 (2XLARGE) 5 $24.11 $120.55 No Bid #VALUE! $22.44 $112.20
54 & 56 ( 3XLARGE) 1 $24.11 $24.11 No Bid #VALUE! $22.44 $22.44
58 & 60 (4XLARGE) 1 $24.11 $0.00 No Bid #VALUE! $26.75 $26.75

Sub-total $697.41 #VALUE! $633.39

Category A Sub-totals $29,221.09 #VALUE! $34,221.33
Additional Purchases Discount  $1,500.00 10.00% $1,350.00 $1,500.00 10.00% $1,350.00
Local Vendor preference 0.00% $0.00 0.00% #VALUE! 0.00% $0.00
Discount Payment Terms 0.00% $0.00 0.00% #VALUE! 0.00% $0.00
Category A Total $30,571.09 #VALUE! $35,571.33
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Unit of 

Measure

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
26 Thong (# 5114X) Dozen 26

(Small = Sizes 6 - 7) 1 $7.99 $7.99 No Bid #VALUE! $8.64 $8.64 No Bid #VALUE!
(Medium: Sizes 8 - 9) 1 $7.99 $7.99 No Bid #VALUE! $8.64 $8.64 No Bid #VALUE!
(Large: Sizes 10 - 11) 1 $7.99 $7.99 No Bid #VALUE! $8.64 $8.64 No Bid #VALUE!
(Xlarge) = Sizes 12 - 13) 1 $7.99 $7.99 No Bid #VALUE! $8.64 $8.64 No Bid #VALUE!
(2Xlarge = Sizes 14 - 15) 22 $7.99 $175.78 No Bid #VALUE! $8.64 $190.08 No Bid #VALUE!

Sub-total $207.74 #VALUE! $224.64 #VALUE!

27
Heavy Duty Canvas Step-Ins w. 
Toe Cap ( #355OR / 355NV) Pair 43

(Whole Sizes: 4 - 17) 43 $4.87 $209.41 No Bid #VALUE! $5.98 $257.14 No Bid #VALUE!
(Half sizes: 5.5 - 11.5) 1 $4.87 $4.87 No Bid #VALUE! $5.95 $5.95 No Bid #VALUE!

Sub-total $214.28 #VALUE! $263.09 #VALUE!
28 EVA Step-Ins (# EVASTPN-OR Pair 709

S - 3XL 709 $3.11 $2,204.99 No Bid #VALUE! $3.15 $2,233.35 No Bid #VALUE!
Sub-Total $2,204.99 #VALUE! $2,233.35 #VALUE!

29 All Purpose PVC Sandals (#SATN) Pair 36
S - 3XL 36 $2.99 $107.64 No Bid #VALUE! $1.98 $71.28 No Bid #VALUE!

Sub-total $107.64 #VALUE! $71.28 #VALUE!

30
Durable Canvas Deck Step-Ins 
(#255OR OR 255NV) Pair 12

(Whole Sizes 3 - 16) 12 $3.77 $45.24 No Bid #VALUE! $4.67 $56.04 No Bid #VALUE!
(Half Sizes: 5-1/2 - 11-1/2 1 $3.77 $3.77 No Bid #VALUE! $4.67 $4.67 No Bid #VALUE!

Sub-total $49.01 #VALUE! $56.04 #VALUE!

31
Versatile PVC Sandals (# 80302 
OR BB888) Pair 255
Wholes Sizes 6 - 14 255 $2.34 $596.70 No Bid #VALUE! $2.12 $540.60 No Bid #VALUE!

$596.70 #VALUE! $540.60 #VALUE!

32
Leather Low-Top Velcro (# 
SHLAVBD) Pair 963
Whole Sizes: 3 - 17 963 $14.97 $14,416.11 No Bid #VALUE! $14.82 $14,271.66 No Bid #VALUE!
Half Sizes: 3-1/2 - 11-1/2 1 $14.97 $14.97 No Bid #VALUE! $14.82 $14.82 No Bid #VALUE!
Sub-total $14,431.08 #VALUE! $14,286.48 #VALUE!

33 Anti-Skid PVC Knee Boot (# KBP) Pair 29
Whole Sizes: 4 - 15 29 $13.11 $380.19 No Bid $14.26 $413.54 No Bid #VALUE!
Sub-total $380.19 $0.00 $413.54 #VALUE!

34 Clear Sole Tennis Shoe (# B72D/E) Pair 96
Wholes Sizes 3 - 16 96 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $14.82 $1,422.72 No bid #VALUE!
Half Sizes: 3-1/2 - 11-1/2 0 No Bid
Sub-total $0.00 #VALUE! $1,422.72 #VALUE!

Categpry B Totals $18,191.63 #VALUE! $18,089.02 #VALUE!
Additional Purchases Discount $500.00 10.00% $450.00 $500.00 10.00% $450.00 $500.00
Local Vendor preference 0.00% $0.00 0.00% #VALUE! 0.00% $0.00 0.00% #VALUE!
Discount Payment Terms 0.00% $0.00 0.00% #VALUE! 0.00% $0.00 0.00% #VALUE!
Category B Total $18,641.63 No Bid $18,539.02 No Bid

Bid # 19-200-011 - Institutional Clothing, Bedding and Toiletries

(D) O. D. Taragin & Bros,
Baltimore, MD

(B) Tabb Textiles Co., Inc
Opelika, AL

(C) Bob Barker Company, Inc
Fuquay-Varina, NCCategory B: Footware

(A) Victory Supply, LLC      Mount
Pleasant, TN
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E40Cell:
Eric Van Leeuwen:Comment:
Bidder indicated this is a proprietary product to another bidder, unable to bid on it.

J44Cell:
Eric Van Leeuwen:Comment:
Bid Item # 34 removed for comparison of like-for-like tiems only,  Proprietary item to Barker
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Item # Description
Unit of 

Measure

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

35
Clear Scrim Sealed Seam Poly 
Mattress Each 340 No Bid $0.00 No Bid #VALUE! $57.69 $19,614.60 No Bid #VALUE!

36 Flame-Check Mattress - (25"x75"x4") Each 40 No Bid $0.00 No Bid #VALUE! $34.60 $1,384.00 No Bid #VALUE!

37 Flame-Check Mattress - (30"x75"x4") Each 32 No Bid $0.00 No Bid #VALUE! $48.56 $1,553.92 No Bid #VALUE!
38 Blanket (poly/acrylic/cotton blend) Each 4 $6.0900 $24.36 $9.00 $36.00 $6.55 $26.20 No Bid #VALUE!
39 Pillowcase (T-130 thread count) Dozen 32 No Bid $0.00 $21.00 $672.00 $8.64 $276.48 No Bid #VALUE!
40 Sheet (white T-130 thread - flat) Dozen 50 $25.92 $1,296.00 $39.00 $1,950.00 $28.34 $1,417.00 No Bid #VALUE!

41 Towel (white - regular grade 25"x50") Dozen 79 $23.72 $1,873.88 $29.00 $2,291.00 $24.85 $1,963.15 No Bid #VALUE!
42 Towel (white-regular grade 22"x44") Dozen 149 $15.44 $2,300.56 $19.75 $2,942.75 $18.24 $2,717.76 No Bid #VALUE!

43
Towel (White - regular grade)              
24" x 48" Dozen 22 $19.11 $420.42 $27.00 $594.00 $18.24 $401.28 No Bid #VALUE!

44
Washcloths (white regular grade 
12x12 Dozen 15 $2.44 $36.60 $4.70 $70.50 $2.90 $43.50 No Bid #VALUE!
Sub-total $5,951.82 #VALUE! $6,568.89 No Bid

Additional Purchases Discount $500.00 10.00% $450.00 $500.00 10.00% $450.00 $450.00
Local Vendor preference 0.00% $0.00 0.00% #VALUE! 0.00% $0.00 0.00% #VALUE!
Discount Payment Terms 0.00% $0.00 0.00% #VALUE! 0.00% $0.00 0.00% #VALUE!
Category A Total $6,401.82 #VALUE! $7,018.89 #VALUE!

(B) Tabb Textiles Co., Inc
Opelika, AL

Category C: Matresses, Covers, Pillows, Pillowcases, 
Linens & Towels

Bid # 19-200-011 - Institutional Clothing, Bedding and Toiletries

(D) O. D. Taragin & Bros,
Baltimore, MD

(C) Bob Barker Company, Inc
Fuquay-Varina, NC

(A) Victory Supply, LLC      Mount 
Pleasant, TN
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I11Cell:
Eric Van Leeuwen:Comment:
Bidder quoted $98.25 as a unit price.  Confirmed with bidder the $98.25 is a case of 15 each price, and the each price is $6.55

J18Cell:
Eric Van Leeuwen:Comment:
Bid Items: #35, #36, #37, and #39 removed from total for comaprison purposes to determine low bidder on like-for-like items
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Item # Description
Unit of 

Measure

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
45 Toothbrush - super shorty Case 49 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $5.18 $253.82 No Bid #VALUE!
46 Toothbrsuh - nylon bristle Case 2 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $9.34 $18.68 No Bid #VALUE!
47 Toothpaste - Nature Mint 6.4 oz Case 2 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $36.72 $73.44 No Bid #VALUE!
48 Toothpaste - Nature Mint .85 oz Case 34 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $19.12 $650.08 No Bid #VALUE!
49 Sanitary Toothbrush Caps Case 6 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $7.61 $45.66 No Bid #VALUE!
50 Deodorant - alcohol free 1.6 oz Case 4 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $6.08 $24.32 No Bid #VALUE!
51 Comb 5" black Case 5 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $3.87 $19.35 No Bid #VALUE!
52 Toe Nail Clipper - no file Case 8 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $6.12 $48.96 No Bid #VALUE!
53 Finger Nail Clipper - no file Case 2 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $7.39 $14.78 No Bid #VALUE!
54 Maxi-Pad - beltless, powder free Case 11 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $36.71 $403.81 No Bid #VALUE!
55 Lip therapy Vaseline .35 oz Case 4 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $74.50 $298.00 No Bid #VALUE!

56
Tampons - individually wrapped - plastic 
applicators Case 18 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $32.73 $589.14 No Bid #VALUE!

57
Tampons - individually wrapped - 
cardboard applicators Case 9 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $40.94 $368.46 No Bid #VALUE!

58 Sta-Rite Ponytail holder Cards 2 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $6.99 $13.98 No Bid #VALUE!
59 Shampoo Total Body Case 11 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $54.61 $600.71 No Bid #VALUE!
60 Razor - twin blade dosposable Case 1 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $38.92 $38.92 No Bid #VALUE!
61 Shampoo - individual .34 oz Case 15 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $39.56 $593.40 No Bid #VALUE!
62 Barbicide - EPA registred Case 22 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $92.46 $2,034.12 No Bid #VALUE!
63 Soap, wrapped antibacterial / deodorant Case 13 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $60.31 $784.03 No Bid #VALUE!
64 Antacid Calcium Carbonate 420mg Case 207 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $4.82 $997.74 No Bid #VALUE!
65 Non-Asprin Reg Strength, 325mg Case 2 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $6.25 $12.50 No Bid #VALUE!
66 Ibuprofen - 200 mg Case 12 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $15.99 $191.88 No Bid #VALUE!
67 Golf Pencil - 3" no eraser Case 74 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $3.41 $252.34 No Bid #VALUE!
68 Toothpaste - flouride .6 oz Case 12 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $18.52 $222.24 No Bid #VALUE!
69 Soap - antibacterial deodorant .5 oz Case 1 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $52.30 $52.30 No Bid #VALUE!
70 Deodorant - freshscent gel pack .12 oz Case 2 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $40.16 $80.32 No Bid #VALUE!

71
Deodorant Stick maximum security .5 
oz. Case 12 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $35.20 $422.40 No Bid #VALUE!

72 Tampons - w/ cardboard applicators Case 1 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $40.99 $40.99 No Bid #VALUE!
73 Laundry Bags - biodegradable 26x33 Case 1 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $57.04 $57.04 No Bid #VALUE!
74 Soap - Dial basic liquid Case 13 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $84.60 $1,099.80 No Bid #VALUE!

75 Lotion - Suave cocoa butter skin therapy Case 2 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $16.12 $32.24 No Bid #VALUE!
76 Extra Strength Non-Aspirin 500mg Case 28 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $6.40 $179.20 No Bid #VALUE!
77 Freshmint Toothpaste, 1.5 oz tube Case 6 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $55.04 $330.24 No Bid #VALUE!
78 Vitamin A & D Ointment 4 oz. tube Case 7 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $8.31 $58.17 No Bid #VALUE!

79
Single blade razors, stainless, single 
blade Case 2 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $26.52 $53.04 No Bid #VALUE!

80 Custom Kits Kit 4400 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $1.24 $5,456.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Sub-total No Bid No Bid $16,412.10 #VALUE!

Additional Purchases Discount $500.00 0.00% $500.00 0.00% $500.00 10.00% $450.00 0.00% $500.00
Local Vendor preference 0.00% 0.00% #VALUE! 0.00% $0.00 0.00% #VALUE!
Discount Payment Terms 0.00% 0.00% #VALUE! 0.00% $0.00 0.00% #VALUE!
Category A Total No Bid No Bid $16,862.10 No Bid

Bid # 19-200-011 - Institutional Clothing and Bedding and Toiletries

(D) O. D. Taragin & Bros,
Baltimore, MDCategory D: Toiletries

(A) Victory Supply, LLC      Mount
Pleasant, TN

(B) Tabb Textiles Co., Inc
Opelika, AL

(C) Bob Barker Company, Inc
Fuquay-Varina, NC
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