Bid #19-863-074 Truck Tires & Related Services - East Slope

Evaluation

Schedule A: New Tires (Highway Tread)

(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra
Nevada Tire & Wheel

(B) GCR Tires and Service

(C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.

(D) The Goodye

ar Tire & Rubber Compan

Load Bid
Iltem # Tire Size MFG / Model Range | Required Qty Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number
1 8.25R15TR Hercules G X 1 $0.00|Exception $0.00|{No Bid $233.70|Hercules / 95466 $0.00|Exception
2 8.25R15TR Equivalent: G 1 $165.00|DStone D902 / DS9802 $250.92|Ironman 1190 / 95466 $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
D
3 ST205/75R15 Hercules Power ST2 X 1 $69.00|Hercules Power ST2 / 94753 $0.00|No Bid $66.40|Hercules Power ST2 / 94753 $70.74|Hercules Power ST2 /94753
Equivalent: D 1
4 ST205/75R15 $59.00|Dstone D622 / DS7678 $64.37 [Primewell ST500 / 003469 $0.00|No Bid $103.96|Goodyear Endurance ST/ ?
5 ST215/75R15 Hercules Power ST2 D X 1 $0.00|Exception $0.00|{No Bid $0.00|No Bid $0.00|Exception
6 ST215/75R15 Equivalent: D 1 $0.00|Exception $64.10(Primewell PS850 / 095911 $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
7 ST225/75R15 Hercules Power ST2 D X 1 $76.00|Hercules Power ST2 / 94755 $0.00|No Bid $73.34|Hercules Power ST2 / 94755 $78.60|Hercules Power ST2 / 94755
8 ST225/75R15 Equivalent: D 1 $65.00|Cargo Max YT301 / CMSTO07 $76.90 | Primewell ST500 / 003503 $0.00|No Bid $103.96|Goodyear Endurance ST/ ?
9 225/70R19.5 Goodyear 622 F X 1 $250.81|Goodyear 622 / 139418205 $24.00|Goodyear 622 / ? $367.19|Goodyear 622 / 139418205 $260.84|Goodyear 622/ ?
Continental HDR /
10 |225/70R19.5 Equivalent: F 1 $220.00|Hercules H803 / 73464 $249.52|Bridgestone M724F / 272876 $289.06/05221460000 $0.00|No Bid
11 |385/95R24 Samson GL904 N X 1 $0.00|Exception $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid $0.00|Exception
12 |385/95R24 Equivalent: N 1 $1,195.00|Advance TLB04 / 41430G $1,510.01|Bridgestone V-STL / 421790 $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
13 |385/65R22.5 Michelin XZY-3 J X 1 $844.00|Michelin XZY-3 /53779 $0.00|No Bid $1,026.13|Michelin XZY-3 /53779 $948.44|Michelin XZY-3/?
Continental HTC1 /
14 |385/65R22.5 Equivalent: J 1 $450.00|Dynatrac MA440 / 96019 $641.61|Bridgestone R244 / 009031 $621.00/05350090000 $455.00|Dunlop SP231A/?
15 |425/65RL22.5 Hercules H-402 L X 1 $620.00|Hercules H-402 / 59980 $0.00|No Bid $574.74|Hercules H-402 / 59980 $661.55|Hercules H-402 / 59990
Continental HTC1 /
16 |425/65RL22.5 Equivalent: L 1 $580.00] Ironman 1402 / 91920 $560.00|Dayton D640M . 003323 $676.20/05350100000 $505.00|Dunlop SP281/?
Goodyear Endurance / Goodyear Endurance /
17 |11R225 Goodyear Endurance H X 1 $417.68|138161753 $0.00|No Bid $747.59|138179674 $370.00|Goodyear Endurance / ?
Continental HSR2 /
18 [11R22.5 Equivalent: H 1 $295.00|Ironman 1109 / 90302 $292.54 | Firestone FS560 / 156558 $393.36/05686310000 $290.00|Goodyear Marathon RSA / ?
19 |[315/80R22.5 Michelin L X 1 $992.00|Michelin XZY-3 / 40200 $0.00|No Bid $1,042.79|Michelin XZA2 / 76184 $948.44|Michelin / ?
Continental HSR2 SA /
20 |315/80R22.5 Equivalent: L 1 $380.00|Hercules HRD / 95332 $440.00|Firestone FS860 / 244465 $554.07|05120980000 $395.00|Goodyear G289 WHA / ?
Michelin X Line Energy Z /
21 |12R22.5 Michelin H X 1 $580.00|Michelin / 11073 $0.00|No Bid $742.51|03363 $948.44|Michelin / ?
12R22.5 H 1 Continental HSR2 /
22 $420.00|Ironman 1181 / 95987 $341.55|Firestone T819 / 157341 $415.00/05120880000 $345.00|Goodyear Marathon RSA / ?
SCHEDULE A SUBTOTAL $7,678.49 $4,515.52 $7,823.08 $6,484.97
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule B: New Tires (Mud & Snow Tread, Drilled for Studs) Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Load Bid
Tire Size MFG / Model Range | Required Qty Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number
Goodyear Duratrac / Goodyear Duratrac /
23 |LT235/85R16 Goodyear Duratrac E X 1 $155.31|312036142 $0.00|No Bid $195.58|312036142 $151.87|Goodyear Duratrac / ?
Mastercraft MSR / Firestone Transforce AT2 / General Grabber A/ITX /
24 |LT235/85R16 Equivalent: E 1 $150.00/90000005737 $124.75|000179 $126.48|04508440000 $118.48|Goodyear Trail Runner AT / ?
Goodyear Duratrac / Goodyear Duratrac /
25 |LT245/75R16 Goodyear Duratrac E X 1 $159.44|312249027 $0.00|No Bid $193.21|312249027 $151.87|Goodyear Duratrac / ?
Firestone Transforce AT2 / General Grabber A/ITX /
26 |LT245/75R16 Equivalent: E 1 $150.00|Hercules Avalanche / 01038 $120.58{000181 $130.56|04508460000 $120.71|Goodyear Trail Runner AT / ?
Michelin XZY-3 All Position /
27 |315/80R22.5 Michelin XZY-3 All Position L X 1 $0.00|Exception $0.00|No Bid $1,153.21|40200 $0.00|Exception
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Continental HA3 City /

28 |315/80R22.5 Equivalent: L 1 $696.00|Michelin XWORKSZ / 64204 $440.00|Firestone FS860 / 244465 $520.95|05140590000 $395.00|Goodyear G289 / ?
Continental HDC1 / Continental HDC1 / Continental HDC1 /
29 |11R22.5 Continental HDC1 H X 1 $412.16|05250950000 $441.15|05687040000 $434.84|05687040000 $0.00|Exception
Continental HDR1 / Continental HDR1 / Continental HDR1 /
30 |[11R22.5 Continental HDR1 H X 1 $391.93|05686880000 $415.69|05220420000 $409.75|05686880000 $0.00|Exception
31 |[11R22.5 Equivalent: H 1 $300.00|Ironman 1370 / 86221 $355.86 | Firestone FD711 /011473 $0.00|No Bid $305.00|Goodyear Marathon RTD / ?
32 |12R22.5 Continental HDC1 H X 1 $0.00|Exception $0.00|{No Bid $0.00|Exception $0.00|Exception
12R22.5 Goodyear G622 RSD H Goodyear G622 RSD / Goodyear G622 RSD /
33 X 1 $474.24|138302265 $0.00|No Bid $953.93|138302265 $375.00|Goodyear G622 RSD / ?
Continental HDR /
34 |12R22.5 Continental HDR1 H X 1 $0.00|Exception $0.00|No Bid $514.04|05220210000 $0.00|Exception
35 |12R22.5 Equivalent: H 1 $510.10|Goodyear G282 / 138302668 $341.55|Firestone FST819 / 157341 $0.00|No Bid $365.00|Goodyear G182 RSD / ?
SCHEDULE B SUBTOTAL $3,399.18 $2,239.58 $4,632.55 $1,982.93
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule C: New Tires (Traction Tread) Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Load Bid
Tire Size MFG / Model Range | Required Qty Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number
36 [14.00-20 Rotary Plow (Bias) Alliance 228 N X 1 $1,300.00]Alliance / 22807102 $0.00|No Bid $918.24 | Alliance 228 / 007617 $1,320.00|Alliance 228 / ?
37 |14.00-20 Rotary Plow (Radial) Advance GL0734 N 1 $700.00]Alliance GLO734 / 87305G $0.00|No Bid $638.38|Advance GL0734 / 87305G $995.00|Advance GL0734 /?
Bridgestone VSTL NLUG
38 |14.00-20 Equivalent: N 1 $1,500.00]Alliance / 22807404 $1,559.13|DZA / 157376 $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
Bridgestone VHS E-2 / Bridgestone VHS E-2 / Bridgestone VHS E-2 /
39 |385/95R24 (Blower) Bridgestone VHS E-2 N X 1 $2,200.00{421790 $1,510.01|421790 $2,803.10{421790 $0.00|Exception
Bridgestone V-STL H-SERV
40 |385/95R24 (Blower) Radial Equivalent: N 1 $550.00|Hercules Telehandler / 94723 $1,510.01 |Highspeed / 421790 $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
Firestone All-Traction Utility / Goodyear American
41 ]19.5L-24 Backhoe E 1 $535.00|Hercules Superlug / 94707 $513.07|359343 $0.00|No Bid $500.00|Backhoe / ?
Loader Dawg / Firestone Super Ground Grip
42 |15.5-25 Loader Dawg / EB15525FL22 F X 1 $600.00|EB15525FL22 $570.00|/ 425248 $573.16|Hercules L2 Loader / 94715 $626.18|Hercules 12 / 94715
Firestone Super Ground Grip Power King Industrial /
43 |15.5-25 Rock Rock Dawg / EB155258E32 H X 1 $750.00|Rock Dawg / EB155258E32 $570.00|LD / 425248 $748.79|PLR43 $0.00|No Bid
Bridgestone V-STL V Trac
44 |15.5R25 Rock Dawg / EB155R25RDR F X 1 $900.00|Rock Dawg / EB155R25RDR $1,157.95|DG2 / 422606 $545.99|Galaxy MPC G2/L2 / 287451 $1,296.95|Goodyear GP2B / ?
Firestone Super Ground Grip Power King 12/
45 |17.5-25 Rock Dawg / EB17525HE32 F X 1 $900.00|Rock Dawg / EB17525HE32 $588.74|/ 425129 $640.74|Hercules L2 Loader / 94716 $729.67| PWKGPLR45
Firestone Super Alltrac 11 /
46 |18.4-30 D 1 $700.00|Farm Dawg / 32417604 $574.00|372626 $0.00|No Bid $613.08| Carlisle AL 29 R1 / 6A06232
14.00-24 (Highway Snow Blower)
47 |Bias Top Dawg / EB140024FG22 L X 1 $800.00| Top Dawg / EB140024FG22 $890.00|Galaxy EXR /344418 $865.24 | Titan Motor Grader / 367344 $1,715.54|Goodyear American Miner / ?
14.00-24 (Highway Snow Blower) Titan TGZ G-2/
48 |Radial Titan TGZ G-2 /| PGW1RATTF L X 1 $1,400.00|PGW1RA4TTF $1,653.75|Bridgestone STMS / 263303 $1,664.30|Bridgestone VUT / 293954 $0.00|No Bid
14.00-24 (Highway Snow Blower)
49 |Radial Equivalent: L 1 $2,000.00|Michelin Snow Plus /53173 $1,653.75|Bridgestone STMS / 263303 $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
Eastbay Top Dawg /
50 |14.00-24 (Motor Grader) Bias Eastbay Top Gawg / EB140024FG22 F X 1 $800.00|EB140024FG22 $0.00|No Bid $0.00|Exception $619.00|Eastbay Top Dawg / ?
Hercules L2 Telehandler /
51 |14.00-24 (Motor Grader) Bias Equivalent: F 1 $550.00|Hercules Telehandler / 94723 $480.00|Carlisle E3/L3 / 6A06612 $533.83|94723 $1,715.54|Goodyear American Miner / ?
52 |14.00R-24 (Motor Grader) Radial Michelin X-Snow 1* X 1 $0.00|Exception $0.00|No Bid $2,012.52|Michelin X-Snow / 53173 $1,795.00|Michelin X-Snow / ?
Goodyear AS-3A / Goodyear AS-3A /
53 |14.00R-24 (Motor Grader) Radial Goodyear AS-3A 1* X 1 $2,200.00{152475283 $0.00|No Bid $2,681.91|152445052 $1,551.70|Goodyear AS-3A / ?
Carisle Loader/Grader / Firestone Versabuilt AT GZA
54 |14.00R-24 (Motor Grader) Radial Equivalent: 1* 1 $480.00|GA06612 $834.51|/ 005639 $0.00|No Bid $0.00(No Bid

19-0907 A 2 of 14




[SCHEDULE C SUBTOTAL

$18,865.00]

| $14,064.92

| $14,626.20

| $13,477.66

(A) ELDOB En

terprises, LLC dba Sierra

(B) GCR Tires and Service

(C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.

Schedule D: New Tires (Traction Tread) Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Load Bid
Tire Size MFG / Model Range | Required Qty Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFEG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number
EBT / Rock Dawg /
55 ]14.00-24 (Motor Grader) EBT / Rock Dawg H X 1 $820.00|EB1424HG32 $0.00|No Bid $0.00|Exception $699.59|EBT / Rock Dawg / ?
14.00-24 (Motor Grader) Titan G3 Titan G3 / 367344 Firestone Super Ground Grip
56 H 1 $650.00 $543.75|RBTG / 425384 $1,629.24|ContiMine Underground / ? $710.02|Hercules G3/L3 /94725
14.00R-24 (Motor Grader) Radial Firestone Versabuilt AT /
57 Equivalent: H 1 $0.00|Exception $834.51|005639 $0.00 $0.00|No Bid
SCHEDULE D SUBTOTAL $1,470.00 $1,378.26 $1,629.24 $1,409.61
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule E: Recaps (Mud & Snow Tread, Drilled for Studs) Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Load Bid
Tire Size MFG / Model Range | Required Qty Unit Price MFEG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFEG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number
225/70R19.5 Goodyear G622 Recap / Goodyear PC G622 / 254-
58 G X 1 $190.00{254337471 $99.10|Bandag BDLT / 283DLTC $131.45|Conti HDR1-16 / 1830365 $98.52|337410
11R22.5 Goodyear G177 Recap / Goodyear PC G622 / 254-
59 H X 1 $220.00{254086072 $150.00|Bandag DR4.3 / 006842 $191.10|Conti HDR1-22 / 1831594 $127.99|337410
315/80R22.5 Goodyear G177 Recap / Goodyear PC G622 / 254-
60 L X 1 $300.00{254096072 $275.00|BDM (280mm) / 224405 $223.88|Conti HDR1-22 / 1831594 $143.27|337410
12R22.5 Goodyear G167 Recap / Goodyear PC G622 / 254-
61 H X 1 $300.00(254087702 $160.00|Bandag DR4.3 / 006844 $202.76|Conti HDR1-22 / 1831594 $141.17|337410
SCHEDULE E SUBTOTAL $1,010.00 $684.10 $749.19 $510.95
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule F: Flat / Spot Repairs Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Load Bid
Tire Size Range | Required | Qty Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
Flat
Repair-
Passenger and Light Truck sizes up Vendor
62 |to and including 7.5-16 Shop X 1 $20.00 $20.00 $20.00 $20.00 $18.50 $18.50 $35.00 $35.00
Flat
Repair-
Passenger and Light Truck sizes up County
63 |to and including 7.5-16 Yard X 1 $170.00 $170.00 $110.00 $110.00 $95.00 $95.00 $85.00 $85.00
Vendor
Spot Repair Shop X 1 $20.00 $20.00 $23.00 $23.00 $26.00 $26.00 $35.00 $35.00
64 |STEMS X 1 $5.00 $5.00 $3.00 $3.00 $5.95 $5.95 $7.95 $7.95
65 |PATCHES X 1 $5.00 $5.00 $0.00 $0.00 $6.00 $6.00 $7.95 $7.95
Flat
Repair-
Truck sizes 8.25-20 through Vendor
66 |12.00-24.5 Shop X 1 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $45.00 $45.00 $50.00 $50.00
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Flat
Repair-
Truck sizes 8.25-20 through County
67 [12.00-24.5 Yard X 1 $170.00 $170.00 $110.00 $110.00 $95.00 $95.00 $85.00 $85.00
Vendor
Spot Repair Shop X 1 $40.00 $40.00 $30.00 $30.00 $26.00 $26.00 $35.00 $35.00
68 |STEMS X 1 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $7.95 $7.95 $7.95 $7.95
69 |PATCHES X 1 $5.00 $5.00 $0.00 $0.00 $7.00 $7.00 $7.95 $7.95
) . Flat
Equipment sizes 14.00-20 through Repair-
17.5-25 Vendor
70 Shop X 1 $100.00 $100.00 $80.00 $80.00 $50.00 $50.00 $65.00 $65.00
Equipment sizes 14.00-20 through
17.5-25 Flat
Repair -
County
71 Yard X 1 $170.00 $170.00 $120.00 $120.00 $95.00 $95.00 $105.00 $105.00
Vendor
Spot Repair Shop X 1 $40.00 $40.00 $30.00 $30.00 $393.12 $393.12 $35.00 $35.00
72 |O-RINGS X 1 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $16.00 $16.00 $15.00 $15.00
73 |STEMS X 1 $10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.00 $13.50 $13.50 $14.00 $14.00
74 |PATCHES X 1 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $9.00 $9.00 $15.00 $15.00
75 |HD Boot X 1 $25.00 $25.00 $28.00 $28.00 $9.00 $9.00 $15.00 $15.00
76 |Tire Foam Fill Material / Ib X 1 $3.00 $3.00 $1.70 $1.70 $1.85 $1.85 $1.75 $1.75
77 _|Tractor Tire Sealant / Ib X 1 $3.00 $3.00 $1.95 $1.95 $28.50 $28.50 $29.95 $29.95
SCHEDULE F SUBTOTAL $851.00 $628.65 $948.37 $652.50
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule G: Section Repairs Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Tire Size Qty Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
78 [10.00-22.5 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $29.00 $29.00 $48.92 $48.92 $50.00 $50.00
79 |11R22.5 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $29.00 $29.00 $48.92 $48.92 $50.00 $50.00
80 |12R22.5 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $29.00 $29.00 $48.92 $48.92 $50.00 $50.00
81 |[14.00-20 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $68.00 $68.00 $0.00 $0.00 $150.00 $150.00
82 [14.00-24 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $68.00 $68.00 $0.00 $0.00 $150.00 $150.00
83 |15.5-25 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $100.00 $100.00 $0.00 $0.00 $200.00 $200.00
84 |16.8-24 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $100.00 $100.00 $546.75 $546.75 $200.00 $200.00
85 |17.5-25 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $100.00 $100.00 $0.00 $0.00 $250.00 $250.00
86 [19.5-24 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $75.00 $75.00 $546.75 $546.75 $250.00 $250.00
SCHEDULE G SUBTOTAL $270.00 $598.00 $1,240.26 $1,350.00
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule H: Dismount / Mount Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Tire Size Bid Required Qty Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Light Truck & Small Trailer Tires - X 1
87 |Single Piece Rim - Vendor Shop $20.00 $20.00 $18.00 $18.00 $16.00 $16.00 $35.00 $35.00
Light Truck & Small Trailer Tires - X 1
88 |Single Piece Rim - County Yard $170.00 $170.00 $110.00 $110.00 $95.00 $95.00 $85.00 $85.00
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Light Truck & Small Trailer Tires - X 1

89 |Two Piece Rim - Vendor Shop $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $16.00 $16.00 $50.00 $50.00
Light Truck & Small Trailer Tires - X 1

90 |Two Piece Rim - County Yard $170.00 $170.00 $110.00 $110.00 $95.00 $95.00 $85.00 $85.00
225/70R-19.5 - Single Piece Rim - X 1

91 |Vendor Shop $30.00 $30.00 $22.00 $22.00 $28.50 $28.50 $35.00 $35.00
225/70R-19.5 - Single Piece Rim - X 1

92 |County Yard $170.00 $170.00 $110.00 $110.00 $95.00 $95.00 $85.00 $85.00
225/70R-19.5 - Two Piece Rim - X 1

93 |Vendor Shop $30.00 $30.00 $25.00 $25.00 $28.50 $28.50 $50.00 $50.00
225/70R-19.5 - Two Piece Rim - X 1

94 |County Yard $170.00 $170.00 $110.00 $110.00 $95.00 $95.00 $85.00 $85.00
11.00-22.5 thru 12.00-24.5 Single X 1

95 |Piece Rim - Vendor Shop $50.00 $50.00 $40.00 $40.00 $28.50 $28.50 $50.00 $50.00
11.00-22.5 thru 12.00-24.5 Two X 1

96 |Piece Rim - County Yard $170.00 $170.00 $110.00 $110.00 $95.00 $95.00 $85.00 $85.00
11.00-22.5 thru 12.00-24.5 Two X 1

97 |Piece Rim - Vendor Shop $50.00 $50.00 $45.00 $45.00 $28.50 $28.50 $50.00 $50.00
11.00-22.5 thru 12.00-24.5 Two X 1

98 |Piece Rim - County Yard $170.00 $170.00 $110.00 $110.00 $95.00 $95.00 $85.00 $85.00
14.00-20.00 thru 19.5-25 Single X 1

99 |Piece Rim - Vendor Shop $100.00 $100.00 $80.00 $80.00 $57.50 $57.50 $100.00 $100.00
14.00-22.00 thru 19.5-25 Single X 1

100 |Piece Rim - County Yard $170.00 $170.00 $110.00 $110.00 $95.00 $95.00 $85.00 $85.00
14.00-22.00 thru 19.5-25 Two Piece X 1

101 |Rim - Vendor Shop $100.00 $100.00 $80.00 $80.00 $57.50 $57.50 $50.00 $50.00
14.00-22.00 thru 19.5-25 Two Piece X 1

102 |Rim - County Yard $170.00 $170.00 $110.00 $110.00 $95.00 $95.00 $105.00 $105.00
SCHEDULE H SUBTOTAL $1,770.00 $1,220.00 $1,021.00 $1,120.00

(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule |: Balance Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Tire Size Bid Required Qty Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

Light Truck Small Trailer Tires - each 1

103 |Bubble Blance $0.00 No Bid $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
Light Truck Small Trailer Tires - Spin each 1

104 |Blance $20.00 $20.00 $18.00 $18.00 $17.00 $17.00 $35.00 $35.00

105 |225/70R-19.5 - Bubble Balance each 1 $0.00 No Bid $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid

106 |225/70R-19.5 - Spin Balance each 1 $20.00 $20.00 $25.00 $25.00 $29.50 $29.50 $40.00 $40.00
11-22.5 thru 12.00-24.5 - each 1

107 |Bubble Balance $0.00 No Bid $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
11-22.5 thru 12.00-24.5 - each 1

108 |Spin Balance $20.00 $20.00 $30.00 $30.00 $29.50 $29.50 $45.00 $45.00
14.00-20.00 thru 19.5-25 - each 1

109 |Bubble Balance $0.00 No Bid $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
14.00-20.00 thru 19.5-25 - each 1

110 |Spin Balance $20.00 $20.00 $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid $55.00 $55.00

111 |Balance Beads / Sand Material 6 0z Bag each 1 $15.00 $15.00 $8.00 $8.00 $0.00|No Bid $20.00 $20.00
SCHEDULE | SUBTOTAL $95.00 $81.00 $76.00 $195.00

(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule O1: Labor Install Studs in Snow Tires (Includes studs) Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Rim Size Unit of Measure Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
112 |LT245/ up to 19.5 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $65.00 $65.00
113 [20" and up each 1 $60.00 $60.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $75.00 $75.00
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[SCHEDULE 01 SUBTOTAL | [ | $90.00] | | $80.00] | [ $80.00] | | $140.00]
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule O2: Labor To Drill Non-Pinned Tire For Studding (Includes Studs) Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Rim Size Unit of Measure Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
114 |LT245/ up to 19.5 each 1 $50.00 $50.00 $30.00 $30.00 $100.00 $100.00 $65.00 $65.00
115 |20" and up each 1 $60.00 $60.00 $50.00 $50.00 $120.00 $120.00 $75.00 $75.00
SCHEDULE O2 SUBTOTAL $110.00 $80.00 $220.00 $140.00
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule J: Services Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Service Unit of Measure Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Dismount, Mount & Repairs (hourly)
116 per hour 1 $170.00 $170.00 $110.00 $110.00 $95.00 $95.00 $85.00 $85.00
Front End Alignment: Light Truck (per
117 [Vehicle) per vehicle 1 $59.95 $59.95 $0.00[No Bid $0.00{No Bid $95.00 $95.00
Front End Toe Set Medium to Heavy
118 |Duty (per vehicle) per vehicle 1 $0.00 Exception $130.00 $130.00 $0.00|No Bid $160.00 $160.00
SCHEDULE J SUBTOTAL $229.95 $240.00 $95.00 $340.00
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule K: Disposal Fees: Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Description Unit of Measure Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
119 |Light truck (Up to 19.5") each 1 $5.00 $5.00 $6.00 $6.00 $5.50 $5.50 $12.00 $12.00
Light truck (Up to 19.5") Calif State
120 |Tire Fee each 1 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75
121 |Semi-Truck Tires (20" to 24") each 1 $10.00 $10.00 $11.00 $11.00 $12.50 $12.50 $12.00 $12.00
Semi-Truck Tires (20" to 24") Calif
122 |State Tire Fee each 1 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75
123 |Backhoe (25" and up) each 1 $40.00 $40.00 $20.00 $20.00 $50.00 $50.00 $25.00 $25.00
Backhoe (25" and up) Calif State Tire
124 |Fee each 1 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75
125 |Grader (14.00-24) each 1 $40.00 $40.00 $20.00 $20.00 $25.00 $25.00 $25.00 $25.00
Grader (14.00-24) Calif State Tire
126 |Fee each 1 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75
127 |Snow-Blower (20" and up) each 1 $40.00 $40.00 $20.00 $20.00 $25.00 $25.00 $25.00 $25.00
Snow-Blower (20" and up) Calif State
128 |Tire Fee each 1 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75
SCHEDULE K SUBTOTAL $143.75 $85.75 $126.75 $107.75
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule L: Emergency Service Calls: Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Description Unit of Measure Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Emergency Service Call at locations
129 |other than County Yard (per hour) per hour 1 $200.00 $200.00 $140.00 $140.00 $142.50 $142.50 $125.00 $125.00
Emergency Service Call at County
130 |Yard (per hour) per hour 1 $200.00 $200.00 $115.00 $115.00 $142.50 $142.50 $85.00 $85.00
SCHEDULE L SUBTOTAL $400.00 $255.00 $285.00 $210.00
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SUMMARY - TIRES

(A) ELDOB En

terprises, LLC dba Sierra

Nevada Tire & Wheel

(B) GCR Tires and Service

(C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.

(D) The Goodye

ar Tire & Rubber Compan

Totals Totals Totals Totals
Schedule A: New Tires - Highway Tread $7,678.49 $4,515.52 $7,823.08 $6,484.97
Schedule B: New Tires - Mud & Snow Tread (Drilled for Studs) $3,399.18 $2,239.58 $4,632.55 $1,982.93
Schedule C: New Tires - Traction Tread (Mud and Snow rated) $18,865.00 $14,064.92 $14,626.20 $13,477.66
Schedule D: New Tires - Traction Tread $1,470.00 $1,378.26 $1,629.24 $1,409.61
Schedule E: Recaps - Mud & Snow Tread (Drilled for Studs) $1,010.00 $684.10 $749.19 $510.95
SUBTOTAL $32,422.67 $22,882.38 $29,460.26 $23,866.12
LESS 5% LVP 5% ($1,621.13) 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
LESS TERMS DISCOUNT 2% ($648.45) 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
TOTAL - TIRES $30,153.08 $22,882.38 $29,460.26 $23,866.12
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
SUMMARY - SERVICES Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Totals Totals Totals Totals
Schedule F: Flat/Spot Repairs $851.00 $628.65 $948.37 $652.50
Schedule G: Section Repairs $270.00 $598.00 $1,240.26 $1,350.00
Schedule H: Dismount/Mount $1,770.00 $1,220.00 $1,021.00 $1,120.00
Schedule I: Balance $95.00 $81.00 $76.00 $195.00
Schedule O1: Labor to Install Studs in Snow Tires (Includes Studs) $90.00 $80.00 $80.00 $140.00
Schedule 02: Labor to To Drill Non-Pinned Tire for Studding (includes studs) $110.00 $80.00 $220.00 $140.00
Schedule J: Services $229.95 $240.00 $95.00 $340.00
Schedule K: Disposal Fees $143.75 $85.75 $126.75 $107.75
Schedule L: Emergency Service Calls $400.00 $255.00 $285.00 $210.00
SUBTOTAL $3,959.70 $3,268.40 $4,092.38 $4,255.25
LESS 5% LVP 5% ($197.99) 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
LESS TERMS DISCOUNT 2% ($79.19) 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
TOTAL - SERVICES $3,682.52 $3,268.40 $4,092.38 $4,255.25
Less Items NOT REQUIRED and NOT BID by all vendors $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EVALUATED GRAND TOTAL TIRES & SERVICES* $37,795.30 $29.419.18 $37,645.02 $32.376.62
REJECTED REJECTED REJECTED

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax

[ NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE
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Bid #19-863-074 Truck Tires & Related Services - West Slope

Evaluation

Schedule A: New Tires (Highway Tread)

(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra
Nevada Tire & Wheel

(B) GCR Tires and Service

(C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.

(D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan

Item #

10

11

12

13

14

15

17

18

19

20

21
22

23
24

30

32

33

Load Bid
Tire Size Range | Required Qty Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number
ST225/75R15 Hercules D X 1 $0.00|Exception $82.99[Hercules / 68146 $160.49 |Hercules / 68146 $78.60|Hercules / 94755
ST225/75R15 Equivalent: D 1 $76.00|Hercules ST2 / 94755 $76.90|Primewell ST500 / 003503 $73.34|Hercules Power ST2 / 94755 $103.96|Goodyear Endurance ST/ ?
ST225/75D15 E X 1 $0.00|Exception $59.99[Hirun / LZ1007 $88.67|Carlisle Trail HD / 6H04621 $0.00|No Bid
ST225/75D15 Equivalent: D 1 $0.00|Exception $59.99[Hirun / LZ1007 $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
Hercules X-Wall Skidsteer /
7.00-15LT D X 1 $100.00|Samson RB233 / ST12021-2 $98.99[Samson / ST120122 $140.03|94686 $107.42|Power King ET / ?
Power King EXT /
7.00-15LT Equivalent: D 1 $95.00 PWKGAUD36 $98.99[Samson / ST120122 $0.00 $0.00|No Bid
8.25R15TR Power King; Low Power King: Low Platform Power King Low Platform Power King Low Platform
Platform Trailer J X 1 $165.20| Trailer / PWKGAQP41 $0.00|No Bid $233.92|Trailer / AQP41 $180.78|Trailer / ?
Triagle TR693 /
8.25R15TR Equivalent: J 1 $190.00{10156930010 $174.99|Samson Trailer / 11203-Z $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
LT225/75R16 Firestone HT / 189752 D X 1 $0.00|Exception $116.00|Firestone HT / 189752 $0.00|Exception $0.00|Exception
Firestone Transforce HT2 /
LT225/75R16 Equivalent: D 1 $112.46|Goodyear HT / 744830900 $116.00{002760 $116.00|Firestone HT2 / 002760 $109.65|Goodyear Wrangler HT / ?
Goodyear Wrangler HT / Goodyear Wrangler HT / Goodyear Wrangler HT / Goodyear Wrangler HT /
LT245/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler HT / 744395900 E X 1 $121.49|744395900 $151.00|744395900 $156.54|744395900 $117.30|744395900
Firestone Transforce HT2 /
LT245/75R16 Equivalent: E 1 $110.00|Hurcules HTS / 91586 $114.50{002761 $116.79|Firestone HT2 / 002761 $0.00|No Bid
Goodyear Wrangler HT / Goodyear Wrangler HT /
LT235/85R16 Goodyear Wrangler HT E X 1 $115.01|744725502 $0.00|No Bid $145.37|744725502 $124.49|Goodyear Wrangler HT / ?
Firestone Transforce HT2 /
LT235/85R16 Equivalent: E 1 $100.00|Hercules HTS /91603 $119.39|002759 $119.39|Firestone HT2 / 002759 $0.00|No Bid
LT245/85R16 G X 1 $0.00|Exception $0.00|Exception $0.00|Exception $0.00|{No Bid
LT245/85R16 Equivalent: G 1 $0.00|Exception $0.00|Exception $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
Firestone Transforce HT2 /
LT245/75R17 E X 1 $135.00|Hercules HTS / 91594 $125.96|002777 $125.96|Firestone HT2 / 002777 $132.60|Goodyear Wrangler SRA / ?
Firestone Transforce HT2 /
LT245/75R17 Equivalent: E 1 $150.00|Hercules CH4 / 96439 $125.96|002777 $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
Continental HTR2 /
235/75R17.5 H 1 $180.00|Ironman 1109 / 86202 $197.12|Ironman 1109 / 86205 $254.47|04920110000 $350.68|Goodyear Regional RHS / ?
225/70R19.5 Goodyear 159A / 139755205 F X 1 $0.00|Exception $288.00|Goodyear 159A / 139755205 $0.00|Exception $252.11|Goodyear G647 / ?
Continental Hybrid HS3 /
225/70R19.5 F 1 $180.00|Ironman 1109 / 86203 $248.00|Firestone FS560+ / 1607016 $296.05|05111140000 $0.00|No Bid
245/70R19.5 Goodyear 159A F X 1 $0.00|Exception $0.00|{No Bid $0.00|Exception $274.54|Goodyear G647 / ?
Continental Hybrid HS3 /
245/70R19.5 Equivalent: F 1 $210.00|Ironman 1109 / 86206 $258.00|Firestone FS560+ / 169981 $307.84|05122970000 $0.00|No Bid
265/70R19.5 Goodyear 159A F X 1 $0.00|Exception $0.00|{No Bid $0.00|Exception $368.25|Goodyear 159A/ ?
Continental Hybrid HS3 /
265/70R19.5 Equivalent: F 1 $185.00|Hercules H902 / 92640 $253.99|Dynatrak / 96048 $370.84|05121160000 $0.00|No Bid
7.50R16LT G X 1 $150.00|Hercules H901 / 92875 $195.00|Ironman / 93354 $156.01|Ironman 1109 / 93354 $204.36|Iron Highway AP / 93354
7.50R16LT Equivalent: G 1 $160.00|Ironman 1109 / 93354 $195.00]|Ironman / 93354 $0.00|No Bid $221.37|Hercules H702 / 92437
425/65R22.5 (Vactor Steer) Michelin XZY3 L X 1 $728.00|Michelin XZY3 /40321 $0.00|No Bid $1,169.12|Michelin XZY3 / 40321 $0.00|Exception
Continental HTR2 /
425/65R22.5 (Vactor Steer) Equivalent: L 1 $650.00|Hercules H402 / 59980 $581.13|Firestone FS818 / 241235 $679.65|05320260000 $608.37|Dunlop SP281/?
Continental HSR2 /
255/70R22.5 H X 1 $320.00| Toyo M122 / 548150 $247.99|Ironman / 86211 $340.16|05122460000 $250.00|Goodyear Marathon RSS / ?
255/70R22.5 Equivalent: H 1 $250.00|Ironman 1181 / 86211 $247.99|Ironman / 86211 $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
11R22.5 Hercules H-301 / 72062 H X 1 $380.00|Hercules H-301 / 72062 $333.00|Hercules H-301 / 72062 $364.34|Hercules H-301 / 72062 $398.24|Hercules H-301 / 72062
11R22.5 Dunlop SP160 /271108673 H X 1 $288.40|Dunlop SP160 /271108673 $311.75|Dunlop SP160 / 271108673 $317.99|Dunlop SP160 /271108673 $265.00|Goodyear Marathon RSS / ?
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34 |12R22.5 Goodyear 661 / 138577337 H X 1 $0.00|Exception $562.00|Goodyear 661 / 138577337 $815.91|Goodyear 661 / 138577337 $345.00|Goodyear Marathon RSA / ?
35 |12R22.5 Samson / 87408-2 H 1 $0.00|Exception $0.00|Exception $0.00|Samson / 87408-2 $0.00|{No Bid
36 |12R22.5 Michelin XZY3 H X 1 $0.00|Exception $0.00|No Bid $884.40|Michelin XZY3 / 47947 $0.00|No Bid
Continental HA3 City /
37 |315/80R22.5 Equivalent: L 1 $380.00|Hercules HRD / 95332 $440.00|Firestone FS860 / 244465 $520.95|05140590000 $395.00|Goodyear G289 / ?
38 |315/80R22.5 Michelin XZY3 / 40200 L X 1 $0.00|Exception $880.00|Michelin XZY3 / 40200 $985.17|Michelin XZY3 / 40200 $0.00|No Bid
39 |[11R24.5 H X 1 $320.00|Ironman 1109 / 90304 $333.00|Firestone FS560+ / 156582 $377.29|General RA / 05122930000 $299.59|Goodyear Marathon RSS / ?
40 |11R24.5 Equivalent: H 1 $320.00|Dynatrac RA200 / 96039 $333.00|Firestone FS560+ / 156582 $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
SCHEDULE A SUBTOTAL $6,171.56 $7,426.62 $9,316.69 $5,187.31
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule B: New Tires (Mud & Snow Tread, Drilled for Studs) Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Load Bid
Tire Size Range | Required Qty Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number
Goodyear Duratrac / Goodyear Duratrac /
41 |LT235/85R16 Goodyear Duratrac E X 1 $155.31|312036142 $0.00| No Bid $195.58|312036142 $151.87|Goodyear Duratrac / ?
Hercules Avalanche Xtremelt Firestone Transforce ATZ / General Grabber A/ITX /
42 |LT235/85R16 Equivalent: E 1 $140.00|/ 01032 $124.75|000179 $126.48|04508440000 $118.48|Goodyear Trailrunner AT / ?
43 |225/70R19.5 Goodyear 622 F X 1 $250.81|Goodyear 622 / 139418205 $0.00| No Bid $499.10|Goodyear 622 / 139418205 $260.84|Goodyear 622 / ?
Continental HDR /
44 |225/70R19.5 Equivalent: F 1 $200.00|Ironman 1604 / 87354 $252.00|Bridgestone M724F / 272876 $289.06/05221460000 $0.00|No Bid
45 |245/70R19.5 Goodyear 622 F X 1 $274.76|Goodyear 622 / 139913205 $0.00| No Bid $418.79|Goodyear 622 / 139418205 $240.00|Dunlop SP 461/ ?
Continental HDR /
46 |245/70R19.5 Equivalent: F 1 $220.00|Ironman 1604 / 86234 $244.92|Firestone FD690+ / 006510 $302.93|05220200000 $274.54|Goodyear G647 RSS / ?
47 |265/70R19.5 Goodyear 622 H X 1 $0.00|Exception $0.00| No Bid $540.25|Goodyear 622 / 756921265 $0.00|No Bid
Continental HDR /
48 |265/70R19.5 Equivalent: H 1 $425.00| Toyo M608Z / 556190 $253.99|Dynatrak / 96038 $356.25|05221660000 $368.25|Goodyear 159A / ?
49 |11R22.5 HE-703 H X 1 $343.00|HE-703 / 89297 $0.00| No Bid $329.57|HE-703 / 89297 $360.25|HE-703 /?
Continental HSL2 / Continental HSRZ / Continental HDR2/
50 |[11R22.5 Continental H 1 $383.94|05110660000 $399.06|05686310000 $409.75|05220420000 $0.00|No Bid
Continental HDR2 /
51 |12R22.5 H X 1 $474.24|Goodyear G622 / 138302265 $341.55|Firestone T819 / 157341 $445.00/05221270000 $305.00|Goodyear G622 RSD / ?
52 |12R22.5 Equivalent: H 1 $550.00| Toyo M320Z / 549060 $341.55|Firestone T819 / 157341 $0.00|No Bid $475.00|Goodyear G282 MSD / ?
SCHEDULE B SUBTOTAL $3,417.06 $1,957.82 $3,912.76 $2,554.23
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule C: New Tires/Traction Tread (Do not include dismount, balance or mount) Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Load Bid
Tire Size Range | Required Qty Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number
Firestone Supertrac Duplex /
53 |19.5L-24 E 1 $535.00|Hercules Superlug / 94707 $423.05|416517 $509.23|Hercules Superlug / 94707 $500.00|Goodyear American Miner / ?
Loader Dawg / Firestone Super Ground Grip
54 |15.5-25 F X 1 $600.00|EB15525FL22 $570.00|/ 425248 $573.16|Hercules L2 Loader / 94715 $1,296.95|Goodyear GP2B / ?
Firestone Super Ground Grip
55 |17.5-25 F X 1 $900.00|Rockdawg / EB17525HE32 $588.74|/ 425129 $640.74|Hercules L2 Loader / 94716 $650.00|Goodyear GRL3A / ?
1 star Firestone Versa Alltrac / Goodyear 1X GP2B 6S TL /
56 |20.5R-25 rating X 1 $1,300.00|Hercules HDR325 / 94646 $1,243.46|005508 $1,313.63|Hercules HDR 325 / 94646 $2,778.60|?
20 ply Firestone Super Rock Grip /
57 |20.5-25 rating X 1 $995.00|Hercules L3 Loader / 94717 $1,141.09|408476 $1,298.38|Power King Grip / APL205A $0.00|No Bid
Firestone All-Traction Il / Firestone Super Alltrac 11 /
58 |18.4-30 D 1 $650.00|372626 $574.00|372626 $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
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East Bay Tire /

East Bay Tire /

East Bay Tire /

59 ]14.00-24 (Motor Graders) East Bay Tire / EB140024FG22 F X 1 $600.00|EB140024FG22 $530.00| EB140024FG22 $0.00|Exception $619.00| EB140024FG22
Titan TG2 G-2/ Firestone Super Ground Grip Hercules L2 Telehandler /
60 |14.00-24 (Motor Graders) Equivalent: F 1 $1,400.00| PGW1RATTF $523.25|RBTG / 425214 $533.82|94723 $1,715.54|Goodyear American Miner / ?
Firestone Versabuilt AT /
61 [14.00-R24 (Motor Graders) F X 1 $550.00|Hercules Telehandler / 94723 $834.51|005639 $1,664.30|Bridgestone VUT / 293954 $0.00|No Bid
Carlisle Loader/Grader / Firestone Versabuilt AT /
62 |14.00-R24 (Motor Graders) Equivalent: F 1 $480.00|6A06612 $834.51|005639 $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid
63 |18.4-26 (Paver) Goodyear R-3 F X 1 $1,000.00|Goodyear R-3 / 1488966 $0.00[No Bid $1,251.51|Goodyear R-3 / 4AW156 $0.00|No Bid
SCHEDULE C SUBTOTAL $9,010.00 $7,262.61 $7,784.77 $7,560.09
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule D: New Tires/Special Equipment Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Load Bid
Tire Size Range | Required Qty Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number
12-16.5 skid steer extra reinforced
64 |side wall Samson L-4A, H/D Samson L-4 H/D / 16160-2 F X 1 $0.00|Exception $197.20|Samson L-4 H/D / 16160-2 $0.00|Exception $0.00|Exception
12-16.5 skid steer extra reinforced Hercules Hauler Skidsteer /
65 |side wall Equivalent: F 1 $169.00|Carlisle Chief XT /570141 $132.30|RE Skidsteer / 378712 $276.50|94693 $0.00|No Bid
East Bay Tire Lead Dawg / East Bay Tire Lead Dawg / East Bay Tire Lead Dawg /
66 |12.5/80-18 East Bay Tire Lead Dawg [EB125818GTC2 E X 1 $295.00|EB125818GTC2 $270.00|EB125818GTC2 $0.00|Exception $0.00|No Bid
SCHEDULE D SUBTOTAL $464.00 $599.50 $276.50 $0.00
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule E: Recaps Mud & Snow Tread, Drilled for Studs Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Load Bid
Tire Size Range | Required Qty Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number Unit Price MFG / Part Number
Continental HDR1-22 / Goodyear G622 RSD /
67 |11R22.5 H X 1 $250.00|Goodyear G622 / 254086471 $152.00|DR 4.3 / 388DRLK $191.10|1831594 $141.17|254085410
SCHEDULE E SUBTOTAL $250.00 $152.00 $191.10 $141.17
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule F: Flat/Spot Repairs (Carry In Services at Vendor shop) Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Type of Bid
Tire Size Service | Required Qty Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
Passenger and Lt Truck sizes up to Flat X
and including 19.5" rims (Vendor Repair-
Shop each) Vendor
68 Shop 1 $25.00 $25.00 $20.00 $20.00 $18.50 $18.50 $35.00 $35.00
Passenger and Lt Truck sizes up to Spot X
and including 19.5" rims (Vendor Repair -
Shop each) Vendor
69 shop 1 $30.00 $30.00 $23.00 $23.00 $26.00 $26.00 $15.00 $15.00
70 |[Stems X 1 $5.00 $5.00 $3.00 $3.00 $5.95 $5.95 $7.95 $7.95
71 |Patches X 1 $5.00 $5.00 $0.00 $0.00 $6.00 $6.00 $7.95 $7.95
Truck sizes up to and including 24.5" Flat X
rims Repair-
Vendor
72 Shop 1 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $45.00 $45.00 $50.00 $50.00
Truck sizes up to and including 24.5" Spot X
rims Repair -
Vendor
73 shop 1 $40.00 $40.00 $30.00 $30.00 $26.00 $26.00 $15.00 $15.00
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Flat X
Repair-
STEMS Vendor
74 Shop 1 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $7.95 $7.95 $7.95 $7.95
Flat X
Repair-
PATCHES Vendor
75 Shop 1 $5.00 $5.00 $0.00 $0.00 $7.00 $7.00 $7.95 $7.95
Equipment sizes 14.00-20 through Flat X
17.5-25 Repair-
Vendor
76 Shop 1 $100.00 $100.00 $80.00 $80.00 $50.00 $50.00 $65.00 $65.00
Equipment sizes 14.00-20 through Spot X
17.5-25 Repair -
Vendor
77 shop 1 $40.00 $40.00 $30.00 $30.00 $393.12 $393.12 $35.00 $35.00
78 |O-RINGS X 1 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $16.00 $16.00 $15.00 $15.00
79 |STEMS X 1 $10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.00 $13.50 $13.50 $14.00 $14.00
80 |PATCHES X 1 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $9.00 $9.00 $15.00 $15.00
81 |[HD Boot X 1 $25.00 $25.00 $28.00 $28.00 $9.00 $9.00 $15.00 $15.00
82 _|Foam Fill Material /ib X 1 $3.00 $3.00 $1.95 $1.95 $1.85 $1.85 $1.75 $1.75
SCHEDULE F SUBTOTAL $353.00 $286.95 $634.87 $307.55
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule G: Section Repairs Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Tire Size Qty Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
83 [14.00-20 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $68.00 $68.00 $0.00|No Bid $150.00 $150.00
84 [14.00-24 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $68.00 $68.00 $546.75 $546.75 $150.00 $150.00
85 |16.9-24 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $100.00 $100.00 $546.75 $546.75 $95.00 $95.00
86 |19.5-24 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $75.00 $75.00 $546.75 $546.75 $95.00 $95.00
87 |15.5-25 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $100.00 $100.00 $0.00 $150.00 $150.00
88 [17.5-25 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $100.00 $100.00 $0.00 $150.00 $150.00
SCHEDULE G SUBTOTAL $180.00 $511.00 $1,640.25 $790.00
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule H Dismount/Mount / Balance (Carry In Services at Vendor Shop) Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Tire Size Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Bid Required Qty Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Up to 19.5" (Single Piece Rim) X 1
89 $25.00 $25.00 $20.00 $20.00 $0.00|No Bid $35.00 $35.00
Up to 19.5" (Two-Piece Rim) X 1
90 $35.00 $35.00 $30.00 $30.00 $0.00|No Bid $35.00 $35.00
8.25-20 to 11.00-24.5 (Single Piece X 1
91 |Rim) $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $0.00|No Bid $45.00 $45.00
8.25-20 to 11.00-24.5 (Two-Piece X 1
92 |Rim) $50.00 $50.00 $45.00 $45.00 $0.00|No Bid $65.00 $65.00
14.00-20 to 19.5-25 (Single Piece X 1
93 |Rim) $100.00 $100.00 $80.00 $80.00 $0.00|No Bid $45.00 $45.00
14.00-20 to 19.5-25 (Two-Piece Rim) X 1
94 $100.00 $100.00 $80.00 $80.00 $0.00|No Bid $65.00 $65.00
Balance Beads 6 oz. Bags (Single X 1
95 |Piece Rim) $15.00 $15.00 $8.00 $8.00 $0.00|No Bid $20.00 $20.00
Balance Beads 6 oz. Bags (Two- X 1
96 |Piece Rim) $15.00 $15.00 $8.00 $8.00 $0.00|No Bid $20.00 $20.00
Wheel Weights (Single Piece Rims) X 1
97 $5.00 $5.00 $10.00 $10.00 $0.00|No Bid $5.00 $5.00
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Wheel Weights (Two-Piece Rims) X 1
98 $5.00 $5.00 $10.00 $10.00 $0.00{No Bid $5.00 $5.00
SCHEDULE H SUBTOTAL $390.00 $331.00 $0.00 $340.00
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule I: _Labor - Installation Studs in Snow Tires (Includes studs) Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Tire Size Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Unit of Measure Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
99 |Up to and including 7.50-16 each 1 $30.00 $30.00 $25.00 $25.00 $30.00 $30.00 $65.00 $65.00
100 |Sizes greater than 7.50-16 each 1 $40.00 $40.00 $30.00 $30.00 $50.00 $50.00 $65.00 $65.00
Drill for Studs on Non-Pinned Tires 1
(Up to and Including sizes 7.50-16) each
101 $50.00 $50.00 $30.00 $30.00 $100.00 $100.00 $65.00 $65.00
Drill for Studs on Non-Pinned Tires each 1
102 |(Sizes greater then 7.50-16 $60.00 $60.00 $40.00 $40.00 $120.00 $120.00 $65.00 $65.00
SCHEDULE | SUBTOTAL $180.00 $125.00 $300.00 $260.00
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule J: WHEELS AND RIMS (All wheels and rims are to be new steel mfr.) Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Wheel / Rim Size Bid Required Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
103 |14" Heavy Duty Trailer 1 $70.00 $70.00 $45.00 $45.00 $0.00 No Bid $85.00 $85.00
104 |15" Heavy Duty Trailer 1 $70.00 $70.00 $54.00 $54.00 $0.00 No Bid $85.00 $85.00
105 |[17.5" Heavy Duty Trailer 1 $0.00|Exception $90.00 $90.00 $0.00 No Bid $250.00 $250.00
106 |24.5" Heavy Duty Trailer 1 $200.00 $200.00 $112.00 $112.00 $0.00 No Bid $180.00 $180.00
107 |16" Light Truck X 1 $180.00 $180.00 $118.00 $118.00 $80.00 $80.00 $290.00 $290.00
108 |19.5" Medium Duty Truck 1 $0.00|Exception $180.00 $180.00 $0.00 No Bid $275.00 $275.00
22.5" Heavy duty Truck (Hub Pilot or
109 |Budd) X 1 $150.00 $150.00 $100.00 $100.00 $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $110.00
SCHEDULE J SUBTOTAL $670.00 $699.00 $190.00 $1,275.00
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
Schedule K: Services (Service Call at County Yard and Field Locations Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan
Service Unit of Measure Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Dismount, Mount & Repairs (hourly)
110 per hour 300 $120.00 $36,000.00 $110.00 $33,000.00 $95.00 $28,500.00 $85.00 $25,500.00
111 |Alignment (per vehicle) per vehicle 1 $0.00|Exception $130.00 $130.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00|Exception
112 |Toe Set (per vehicle) per vehicle 1 $0.00|Exception $130.00 $130.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00|Exception
Foam Fill Tires (per pound, includes per Ib. 1
113 |foam) $3.00 $3.00 $1.75 $1.75 $1.85 $1.85 $0.00|Exception
114 |Cut Off Foam Filled Tires each 1 $40.00 $40.00 $50.00 $50.00 $45.00 $45.00 $0.00|Exception
115 |[Tractor Tire Sealant per Ib. 1 $2.00 $2.00 $0.00 $0.00 $28.50 $28.50 $29.95 $29.95
116 |Disposal Fees: Light truck each 10 $5.00 $50.00 $6.00 $60.00 $5.50 $55.00 $12.00 $120.00
117 Semi-Truck each 40 $10.00 $400.00 $11.00 $440.00 $12.50 $500.00 $12.00 $480.00
118 Backhoe each 10 $40.00 $400.00 $20.00 $200.00 $50.00 $500.00 $25.00 $250.00
119 Grader each 40 $40.00 $1,600.00 $20.00 $800.00 $25.00 $1,000.00 $25.00 $1,000.00
120 Snow-blower each 10 $50.00 $500.00 $20.00 $200.00 $25.00 $250.00 $25.00 $250.00
Emergency service Call - County per hour 1
121 |yard $180.00 $180.00 $115.00 $115.00 $142.50 $142.50 $125.00 $125.00
Emergency service Call - Field per hour 1
122 |locations other than County yard $180.00 $180.00 $140.00 $140.00 $142.50 $142.50 $85.00 $85.00
SCHEDULE K SUBTOTAL $39,355.00 $35,266.75 $31,165.35 $27,839.95

(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra

(B) GCR Tires and Service

(C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.
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Schedule L: Disposal Fees:

Nevada Tire & Wheel

(D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company

Description Unit of Measure Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

Light truck (Up to 19.5") each 1 $5.00 $5.00 $6.00 $6.00 $5.50 $5.50 $12.00 $12.00

Light truck (Up to 19.5") Calif State

Tire Fee each 1 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75

Semi-Truck Tires (20" to 24") each 1 $10.00 $10.00 $11.00 $11.00 $12.50 $12.50 $12.00 $12.00

Semi-Truck Tires (20" to 24") Calif

State Tire Fee each 1 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75

Backhoe (25" and up) each 1 $40.00 $40.00 $20.00 $20.00 $50.00 $50.00 $25.00 $25.00

Backhoe (25" and up) Calif State Tire

Fee each 1 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75

Grader (14.00-24) each 1 $40.00 $40.00 $20.00 $20.00 $25.00 $25.00 $25.00 $25.00

Grader (14.00-24) Calif State Tire

Fee each 1 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75

Snow-Blower (20" and up) each 1 $50.00 $50.00 $20.00 $20.00 $25.00 $25.00 $25.00 $25.00

Snow-Blower (20" and up) Calif State

Tire Fee each 1 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75

SCHEDULE L SUBTOTAL $153.75 $85.75 $126.75 $107.75
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.

Schedule M: Emergency Service Calls: Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan

Description Unit of Measure Qty Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

Emergency Service Call at locations

other than County Yard (per hour) per hour 1 $180.00 $180.00 $140.00 $140.00 $142.50 $142.50 $125.00 $125.00

Emergency Service Call at County

Yard (per hour) per hour 1 $180.00 $180.00 $115.00 $115.00 $142.50 $142.50 $85.00 $85.00

SCHEDULE M SUBTOTAL $360.00 $255.00 $285.00 $210.00
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.

SUMMARY - TIRES Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan

Totals Totals Totals Totals

Schedule A: New Tires (Highway Tread) $6,171.56 $7,426.62 $9,316.69 $5,187.31

Schedule B: New Tires (Mud & Snow Drilled for Studs) $3,417.06 $1,957.82 $3,912.76 $2,554.23

Schedule C: New Tires (Traction Tread) $9,010.00 $7,262.61 $7,784.77 $7,560.09

Schedule D: New Tires/ Special Equipment $464.00 $599.50 $276.50 $0.00

Schedule E: Recaps Mud and Snow Tread, Drilled for Studs $250.00 $152.00 $191.10 $141.17

SUBTOTAL $19,312.62 $17,398.55 $21,481.82 $15,442.80

LESS 5% LVP 5% ($965.63) 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00

LESS TERMS DISCOUNT 2% ($386.25) 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00

TOTAL - TIRES $17,960.74 $17,398.55 $21,481.82 $15,442.80
(A) ELDOB Enterprises, LLC dba Sierra (B) GCR Tires and Service (C) Morgan Tire of Sacramento, Inc.

SUMMARY -SERVICES Nevada Tire & Wheel (D) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Compan

Totals Totals Totals Totals

Schedule F: Flat/Spot Repairs (Vendor's Shop) $353.00 $286.95 $634.87 $307.55

Schedule G: Section Repairs $180.00 $511.00 $1,640.25 $790.00

Schedule H: Dismount/Mount (Vendor's Shop) $390.00 $331.00 $0.00 $340.00

Schedule I: Labor to Install Studs in Snow Tires (Includes Studs) $180.00 $125.00 $300.00 $260.00

Schedule J: Wheels And Rims $670.00 $699.00 $190.00 $1,275.00

Schedule K: Services & Disposal Fees $39,355.00 $35,266.75 $31,165.35 $27,839.95

Schedule L: Disposal Fees $153.75 $85.75 $126.75 $107.75

Schedule M: Emergency Service Calls $360.00 $255.00 $285.00 $210.00

19-0907 A 13 of 14



SUBTOTAL $41,641.75 $37,560.45 $34,342.22 $31,130.25
LESS 5% LVP 5% ($2,082.09) 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
LESS TERMS DISCOUNT 2% ($832.84) 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
TOTAL - SERVICES $38,726.83 $37,560.45 $34,342.22 $31,130.25
Less Items NOT REQUIRED and NOT BID by all vendors $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EVALUATED GRAND TOTAL TIRES & SERVICES $56,687.56 $54.959.00 $55.824.04 $46,573.05
REJECTED REJECTED REJECTED
*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE
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