
RESOLUTION NO. XXX-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 014-2017) 

 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is 
updated by the State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are 
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, 
Chapter l, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to 
the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her 
authorized representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of 
the fire authority, or the chief’s authorized representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a 
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection 
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on November 19, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Cameron Park Community Services 
District adopted Ordinance #2019.11.20, which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with amendments 
the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El 
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019.11.20 of the Cameron Park Community Services District and 
delegates the enforcement of the ordinance to the Cameron Park Fire Department Chief, or his or 
her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following 
sections: 

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 
(a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 
including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 907.2.a through 
907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 
5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 through 6112.3, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 
13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6, 
Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table B105.1 (1), Appendix B: Table 
Bl05.2, Appendix D103.l through D103.3, Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix D103.6.1, Appendix 
D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4.  

  20-0203 C Page 1 of 41



Resolution No. XXX-2020 
Page 2 of 2 

The Cameron Park Community Services District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 
24, Part 9, in its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the 
International Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403.4, 
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12, 
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808, 
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, 
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception), D107.1 
(Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, 
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said 
Board, held the _____ day of _____________________, 20__, by the following vote of said Board: 

Ayes: 
Attest: Noes: 
Kim Dawson Absent: 
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors 

By: _____________________________________ _____________________________________ 
Deputy Clerk Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Board of Supervisors 

  20-0203 C Page 2 of 41



Cameron Park Fire Department 
.. -.... ..... IOIItI". 

California Department of F= and Fire Protection 

Fl,.. St.tion 811 
3200 Country Club Drive 
c.m.1Or'I Park, CA 95682 

(530) en~190 
(530) en-22A8 FAX 

December II, 2019 

Don AJbton, Chid' Adminittmive Otr_ 
E! Dor.oo County Bocd of SupeM __ 

llOFair '--
Placerville. CA 9S661 

Fn galion 88 
29t11 AIhaIn'tIr. OrNe 
c.tneron Pan.:. CA 95&2 

(530) 572·7350 
(530) m-7352 FAX 

Subject: Rnol.rio. Rlltif)"le. 0""".1111 No. 20)',11.20 . r ttl, C._rotI P,rk C . ..... 11y 
~"'ket Db'~ IC_.ero" r.rtt fln lHtIan.eal, ,,'1I1e1l aoopl. tIM 10., C.II~ ... '- FIR 
Code "idl •• no.tllts rdtoled It toe.l cll.allc, ,",npllie •• d lopocnpllk: tODdltlOilI. 

Dear Mr. Ashton; 

The Cameron Put Commllnity Services DiItrict (CPCSD) I. requcstina!be BoW orsupervitofS (80S) 
rw.lify its Ordinance No. 2019.11 .20 which acioptlthe 2019 Ca!ifomlro Fire Code .. 1NIlCtIdod due 10 
specifie local climatic, aeoaraphic aDd topopphic conditions. CaltfomUo HClIth Ind Safety Cede StctiofI 
13869.7 requires the 1eiill.li~ body of the dty or county wben the orditIarIoe will tpply to JIlIfy, modi~ 
Of deny the adopted Ofdinanee. The 80s mllJl alto delepte enfoocunent .fthe ordi_ 10 cllber the 
rIM Disttict (or its rq>re5entlltive) Of the Chief Blilidina Official. 

Thmfore, _ request the County Boatd ofSl.Lpl:noisors I1Itify Ordinance No. 2019.1 1.20 'Nilh amendments 
10 the 2019 California Fire Code, and deltl'le the enforcemenl oflhlt Ordinance to the Cameron PItt 
Fire Deputmenl Chief. A proposed 80S raolulion II enel<*(! for Y'OID" ~view and ute on thiI topic. 

This raolution t. !XI direct fiu implld 10 the County, 

;i~ 
JedGaines 
Fire OIief 

  20-0203 C Page 3 of 41



Cameron Park Fire Department 
In cooperation with the 

California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection 

Fire Station 89 
3200 Country Club Drive 
Cameron Park, CA 95682 

(530) 677-6190 
(530) 672-2248 FAX 

ATTACHMENTS: 

Fire Station 88 
2961 Alhambra Drive 
Cameron Park, CA 95682 

(530) 672-7350 
(530) 672-7352 FAX 

1. Cameron Park Community Services District Ordinance No. 2019.11.20 
2. Cameron Park Community Services District Finding of Fact Resolution No. 2019-22 
3. Draft El Dorado County BOS Resolution 

  20-0203 C Page 4 of 41



Cameron Park Fire Department 

California 

Fire Stillion 89 
3200 Country Club Drive 
Cameron Pa/1l; , CA 95682 

(530) 677~190 
(530) 672-2248 FAX 

Forestry and Fire Protection 
FIRE 

Fire Station 88 
2961 Alhambra Orive 
Cameron Pario: , CA 95682 

(530) 672-7350 
(530) 672-7352 FAX 

Attachment No.1 

Cameron Park Community Services District 

Ordinance No. 2019.11.20 

  20-0203 C Page 5 of 41



CAM ERON PARK COMMUNITY S ERVICES DISTRICT 

ORDI NANCE NO. 201'.11.20 

BE IT ORDAINED BYllIE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE CA MERON PARK 

COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS: 

An on!in.noce ofthl:C.....,..,., PwI< Com ....... ity Servi(:co D;'trict MI~in. tile 20t9 Edition aftlle California 

F", Codt, ;'1COi poo .unllbe 201' Editioo of the }m"."QliDnaI Fin Cadi, ~"unl.nd IOvemini the ukllulrdinll 

of life and pmpcny I'mm fin: and apIosion tIazan10 .ns"", from the ~. ""ndlinll Ind .... of haDrdous 

subsunces. fNllerWs and devices. .... fmm anllllOllS hoounIouIlO lire or property in the ~u~rw;y ofbuildinp 

and premises ift the Cameron Pwt. Community Senites District; provodln& for 1M ' ..... lII:e afpcrmiIJ .I'd wllfcllon 

offecs lherefor, Rqoal inl Ordin....,. No. 20 16.10.19 orlM c.memn Palt CommuniI)' SenKcS Oistrid ,lid I II ocher 

ordin.noes nod pIrts of the ordinonces in _noct 1Io ........ ,th. 

Be it ORDAINED by the ao.rd ar Din:c1Or1 o f tho Uo!T1ft'OOl PIII1; Communi'>' Seniou Dilllrici 

Sedion I : fINDI",·t;;S Of fACTS 

SectOOfl 2: AOOmON Of COPE WITH EXCL US IONS 

Sedion): LOCALAMENDMEr.TS 

Sccliooo~ : CONfLIC T 

Section S. SEVERABILITY 

S«uon 6: Efft:CTIVE OAT[ ANO rUBkiCAI I9 N 

s£c n ON I: F1r<lnNGS Of fACTS 

The Clmeron Poork Community Seo-I~eI Dostnel ....... es o::en.in chan"" (hSled below) to the Ctilfono;o 

Pi,., Codt, 2019 Ediu"",. purwlnl 10 H«w~ .t .'i4fory CoM SK,Iofu 1)869 '. 17'1J1.1 .18941,' durin. Ihll 

~ode I<.laplion process. Such tllln,e$ "'" M«$SIUy bec.usc 01 wi ch .... l~ ~I and/or lIIpOJfaphic.ol 

COfId ll ion$. The C.onCI'OU Poork Community Senll;es Oistriel haa ~, punuIIIt 10 SftoIio.. Iml' of II .. 

Col/jontia Hm"', .t Saftty eodl, lhe (,nd,"P of fKll n:ll"~ teo t~ CXJ<tdition. b)' Rnalul"'" 2019-22 or lhe 

Cameron Plrk Comnlu~;ly Ser-iccs Distnc1df,ted Oc tOber !6. 2019 

SECTION 2: A!)OI'TION m' COOt: WITt! F:XqUSIONS 

The C"nemn P.rk Conlmunily S<:rvi<:C1 P istricl adopt. the 20 I Q t'altfomia Fin CIItit, r"'t U, Parr 'I. i. 

its ~nllrsty. inell>dillil Appelodi<:.,. illl:OI'poolItlnQ Iho .. otCI""," of the 1'''tlrttulH1IIa/ F;,., Clltit. 2011 edition not 

.<.IapIN b)' tile IlI.te, with tho: ... clUlion. hued below, 

Qrdinal_ 20 19,1 1.20 Califo<n;' Fi~ Code I'ooce I of 17 

  20-0203 C Page 6 of 41



" 

Exclusion.. 105.6.11-105.6.19, 105.6.39, )0' 1.4, )09. } II S, 111.6, ) II, (0) I. 403.2.1-4032 4. 403.1, 

403.4. 403.6, 403.7, 403.1 (t6c>pIml 40) .1.1-4(13 '.1 .7), 4()l.9, 403.10.2, 40].10.3, 403.11, 40).12. <404.1-404.4, 

4(15. 1-405.4. 405.(;-40H. 406, 1<15-807 (..;opt;". 107.S.2), 101, 904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1101.).1103.6, 110).9 

(Idoplin. 1103.9.1). 1103 10, 11().6.1106, Chi"' .. 25, CNopler 26. 1M UcepllOnS under DHM 2 (E:ttq:JIoon). 

0106.1 (Exception), 0107.1 (Exc~ioft) ..... ppendl~ A. "'ppend;~ E. App"ndl~ F, Appenchx G, Appendi. I, 

Apptnd,x K, Appen(hx L., "'wend'. M. 

Appendices IlOl MlO!lIed c:.on be used f~ ",(cfellCe in en(on:in& OI:her oections of the 2019 C<iifonllo Fin 

C .. 

SECTION J: L.OCAL A~H;rmMENTS 

The follow;nl SeehO'" lf1! he",by .mcndal or added: 

Ch.plt-r I 

StsUO. 101 Scope ud Genen' Begu;rt",.n" 

I o !.I TIils "",II be omcnded u follows: Add It<JMK o!j,..;.oictiotr (Cameron Pari< Communi1), Se ... ice$ 

O' .... iclJ 

Scsli" '25 Ptnnil! 
IOS.' ,27 LPG_,., """II be .......oed as follo_: Add 10 !he CKccplion: ", or.t>ove ',000 feel of 

elev., ion, • pernoi! is IlOl rtqui.od for ind,vidu.! <:On,.incl"1 ....;111. 125-.. 11011 ""'ho, Clp.cily or lea, 

Of mul"plc COfu.inu 'YJ«!ms .... viJ\i an '8iJl'P" qu.mi.y IlOl ucec<hna 12' .. 110<1. """illl 

<xcupancies in Groop R-l. 

Sc:C!Io. I iii Em 
' 1)6.6 P.,."II. PI .. Rcvicw.ad '. '!>KIN- Em sh.1I be.sdcd IS follows A ~I# 0/,"1 

adopmJ by 1M di5frlc1 botJNJ "I d,r«lot"s fM pItm rnWw. iflSpKfbu owJ ,I. w .......... JW, .... s 6y 

1M diSlriel IHlIJI III fo,md lit 1M ..."p CtIt'I'tttl d!SIrIC1ju .K/wduk (He,l/Iit .t SDfol)1 C .... I79JI) 

106.6.1 CoS! Recovery FlH ,,,,"II be t6dcd as follows: Fit'f .... 1« jius -,. M cltnrrrllO Oft)' 

I~r.wlt. firM. CQf"poraIinn ~ bUS/Ms.. I/tal 1/trooq(II lW6iitrctfB, -.Ho/fJf_ of 1M 1_. or o:r a ra"u of 
ran!le~lWss. is rtspo<uible}iN 1M wIt. of'M dlslricf 1'0 Ntsponrl", 1M _ ... of ... "",Ilk", A 

dislr/cl board may cloorge IJ J« 10 c" ..... r 1M roll of flit)' .,..,I~ w/rk/r I. dm"CI pnwi<*s or ,Iv <WI 

of~ltforc;"8 OIIyNtt-:ullJlioltforw/rklr IM,/in IH~(lIrollll" ~Iy Codr IJ'J16). T1tefn Mall 

not ucnd 1M «I"'" ro.<l of S"I~$.'iltJll"" fi"" ~ ""S!)<»Id,~ /u 1M .tee_ '1 011 '1tC1<~"1 

! %. 7 Admln '"C1! . lve COlli sh,1I be ~<.kICd .s folloW1: I+'M~ ° ws/ tit" IIt'P"clion Is Jrlotdulrd. IIItd 

1M ronIroclOr fiJils 10 ,xrjiJ,.,,, /0 1M "'l/i~ICI~'" o/IM (>lIIl1ol'lly it"'''1JI 111'1$<1,("/_ (AIU). 1M AIU 

Ordirlllll:e 20 19.11.20 C.llfomill Fire Coo:le Pa~2ofll 

  20-0203 C Page 7 of 41



",ay bill 1M COI'IlraCIC>r for DCtlJilltl~ Sptlll 1r(IWIiMg 10 tmd from t~ IU/flnsptclioM /oc<uioM OM 

1M tI~ JPtMl ailN ItSlliMsptclwn silt a$ _II <2$ admiMistrative cosls. 

W lioQ LQ9 DOliN o(Appu l, 

S«tlOQ 109.4 AnPfal Prooed u ru and Tim.rog slulll be added .s follows, All)' ptr$l)lll)l" ,,,,Iry who 

INlkWis 1M)' 1Ikl)' IN acNe".I), a/focted by an arcltr. dtdsion, or cieterml1lQtioM mode tJ,- IN fin codt 

oJ!lcio/lhro~gh a ""illell noll"" mD)' appeallhi. /IUIller Wilhill 15 t:Q1~nd<lt" day. (}f ,''' pO$lmork 0/1 

1M _ice. AI/ sllCh nppt(}/.J sholl hi filed in wriling wllh 1M &C'~lary of 1M Goverlling &ardfor 

1M dlstricl. A Ilmely Ilppelll shDl/ ml)' forlMr DClilln by 1M fin code offici(}1 ~1tI1lIh, mallcr Is 

dtlermmed b)' 1M Apptlll Boord <2$ o~t/lned III &clion 109.:1, ~lIltlS 1M /ssw poRS Illlimm'Mlllfin 

01" lifo safely hazard 10 "' .. mlNrs oflhl J'l'Mc. T1w fin codt official sholl notify I'" appeJlIln/ by 

cUlified mail of 1M dalt 0"" 11_ of IlK'h Maring T1w MariNg 4ho1l b<t sd"dr,ltd I<> /Db p10Ct1 110 

3OO"'r than :10 co/tlldllr doy.t from 1M dtIIe show" Oil 1M ami/led IOIDi/. 1M Qppt/l(}," JJtalIIoaW! 1M 

rlghllO apptar i" persall ar b)' age," at 1M Maring and preH," aroJ . ..,rilte" nndlOI" plr<>l<>1Jraphic 

evitkna 10 1M Appeal BoorcJ. 

Seol'on 110 Vi .. lalion . 

/10 .4 Violatio n rfD~ hiu sIuoll be amended ... Follows, PerMlnS who wll violate. provi,ion oflhi! 

code or shaU f.it to comply wilt. Illy of the requj~men,s lhereof or who sholl em:!, instoll •• !ler. 

repair or do wort< in viol.lion of the approved conSiruction doc~mems 01 directive orlbe lire code 

offici.l, or of a permi, or ce"ifocate used under provisions of this code, shall be gu ilty of a 

mlsdtmeanqr or i"/roc""". at I'" diU"tioll of 1M prosuullrtg al/<It"lIr)' or ag<l"q, pUnishable by a 

fine not exceeding S IO(H)() for Q firsl vio/Dliot!: :1. A fi ... t/O/ ucuding 1500.00 for 0 SUOIIdvwlaliot! 

of 1M JlNIIt provisio" '0'11"'1'1 0", ye(#': J. A fi ... I'IQl n~udl"g S/()(J().I)() for foch uddlll"",,1 violation 

of 1M .on_ pro_lsipn w/lh/none )'tar, or by imprisoomem nOt exceeding 180 dQy:<. orboth such fine 

.nd imprisoomcnt. Each dl.y WI • ~ioll1t ion continues after due notice Iuo. been scr>ed sh.1I be 

deemed a separate ofFen.e. (Heallh & Snfoty Codt &ctlotU JJJ-I5 and 1199.5). 

110.4.1 Cl talionl shall ba odded as rollows : T1w Fin Chief. 0/' hiJIM, d!4y aWhorizui 

repnstnIQII .... WUJ)' is:tW cilOllons for i'!fraclions 01" q,isdtntean<H" .i<JIlllions oflhis Mdt pursualll/a 

SUllo" I J871 of 1M Heal/h & Snfory Codt of 1M Stale of Calf/amio ond CIrnP't~ 5c (ro"''''~'''''ng 

",ilh Section 85J. 6) of Title J of PrlI1 10f/M I'tttal CtXk W 1M Sl<>l~ of California. 

Si:r!lo~ 111 SlOP Work Ordor 

1 I }.4. hih, r(O 10 C9"'Oll" shall be .mended as rollows, Any p"ISOIl who shall eOl1li" ... any worit 

.ner Iuoving been serwd wilh • SIOp·\IIorl< order, except such work as that p"ISOIl ;1 directed to 

Ordin. nee 2(119.1 1.20 Califom;' fin: Code Page 3 on 7 

  20-0203 C Page 8 of 41



.' 
'. 

perfonn to rem~ I vpoillion Or unsere condition •• tv.1l be p"tllJlIabJI by "jltN or i"'pr~'" or 

boll! as descri~d;" !i«liotr 110.<1 rHeallll <I S4ftI)'Crx* Suti<HII IJllj QN/ /199Jj 

OIapler 2 

5«ljon 292 Genera! Ildini!lonl 

"dddefinit ion for CamDlirt -SIoaIlmeQIIQ[1rT .. hlclllsl4nljiw~pu~ _h. IiPHIL 

or Mnloellc pUfpoUS. This ;""Iutksfl.." l;()1IIatMd "'lImn (Hillloot' ftnpl~8 ONJ enrhnui_s 

wilh jlu.s or C"I"'MY,. 110"'" us;", #IINd, '''1uid, or soIidfwls, ptNlabk btJrlxc"" pit$. imvln7. or 

,poet htolitljJ dtvl~s which an und OM/silk of mry SfnICfUn. -"ill ~. or .,..,.. /""", 

ac""",/fIOJmion ",,,,mica om Q ..,hid • . 

Add d.r,nit ioo> for Db!rkl _ SIooII _an 1M <listric/ .. M all allotr <reM wi/hili'. UMr"", booo...u;u 

/htrwf ""w or htrtofltr fSlab/'sItM. 

Add definition for prinwu - SIooIf _""" ... hlnJa.- QC«.U ,/tal M~ ............. IJto",..., /""k/inp 

wilh "" ~ IN;Jn thin .J-,w11l"J( tW/S "" If '. P"'"I . ...a any .. ~ of ocuuory bulk/i'''JP. 

Add delinilloo for [,« ulj'" Dod y - SIIaII_,N B«rdof~ofllw DistTkt. 

Add definllion for fla C' kf - SItoII _ 1M e lM! Eu,:"".., Fin Off~ of II. Fin 

dtporl...,Nldlsrrlc, MI"W"1lIM jwi4dfc'/(M or .. duly _,horind IYpn.ItIQ/fN 

Add ddinition for Tnlan! Cn .. d Mluzsc - SIraII_ ~"""by t-Nt>mWI . .....-'~ Q $rOlrlry 

1"'l1'li",. ..,~~ ,.~_I . ..,hQ _'M/".,d /" ,Ie JIrOPI.r ~ fQ n/l ~~ fr-" MnI",. Oiler 

pJou of p~bJtC ,","",bJ<Igf /" 1M onkrly ttnd nJ_ fosh-t I" ,,. ~WM of "" ~-rpffC)', 

C hapler J 

Sullo. 302 Ild in illoni 

302.1 Ddlal!joas .... 11 be; Imended as follows Ad<IIocI Clmpf,~ definl!ion, .. shown .boYe tn 

Chap!cr 2. 

>07.4,4 C.mpll rt RnlrK!1911 shill be; Itdded as rollows: 

>07.4.4.1 I, is t",l __ fiJfor c.ry perm#l1<> I'8N. _'111 ...... or _ Q t_Rfi,.. IIpOft or _WU' MOUn­

tOwrnll<>...J. p-tUf«>w,..d IDNI, Of' juNJ'-tu1'lll'Wi IDNI dttrl"lf'" 11_ ..,,.~ b~r"; ... ,,.nnl'3 ....... 

3uspt'NWd by ," D",mOl' of',. Dltp-t_1fI of F....wry....d Fw. 1'roI1lt11OIt. ,Ie CAL FIRE Ultll 

Cltwf,'" ,'''' AHJ 

£X''fflli.,.., C __ rrinl cotM"'g ~rrJJ>olfJ ..,;,1, "",...,ot,! <>/''''' AH./, 

.lOl.~ .,q W,. .. ruMpjiIY' DIY WHY-d. it .""",Id /)f .. tfI,,,,,fol fr ""1 ~r~" If> liJ"'. 1H1J111I01 ... IN ". 

Q ~ .... tJptJIf ""'Y I>r .. ~ ...... d /oItd . • rrw<>,,~,..J 1.-1 ", " .. v,-...,"""" I""" "ItIU.f I~ 

foIlow"'r ",,,,i,..,,,,, ""I"' ..... 1fI3 '"' tooIplit'J ..,iII,_ 

Ordi",,1U 2019.1 1.20 CalilOmil F'on: Cede ... ~. of 17 

  20-0203 C Page 9 of 41



307.4.4.2 (a) 7'11e area wilhill 5(e"l 01' Ihe peripilerv 01' Ihe call/I,!ire is cleored oj ,,1/ jlall/Jllable 

material and vegelllliol1. 

307.4.4.2 (b) One serviceable shove/wilh a handle a/lit leas! 12 inches is ready jill' lise aI/he 

immediate area qflhe COlI1I?/ire . 

307.4.4.2 (c) Campfires shall be limifecl 10 a I fOOl by Iji:JOllIrell, nnles.\' in al1 approved m(/m~j(/( . .'/If/'ed 

cooking device or/ire ring. 

307.4.4.2 (d) fVrillen permission qf the landowner must be obfained prior to the ignition of the 

C</II/fllire and sholl be 011 sile. 

Chapter 5 

Section 503 Fire Appa"atlls Access Roads 

503.2.1 Dimensiolls shall he amended as follows: Fire apparatus access roads shall have an 

unobstructed width of not less than 10 feet. exclusive of shoulders. as lI/easlired/i'om!iICe o/'c/lr" 10 

jilce oj cur/), except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and unobstructed 

vertical clearance ornot less than 15jeel. All driveways ill/he districl shallnvl be less Ih((n 12jeel 

wide . 

503.2.5 DC41d Ends shall be amended as follows: Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and drivew(~)Js 

in excess or I SO feet in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around fire 

apparatus, 

503.2.6 Il"idges alld Elevated SIII'fllces shall be amended as follows: Where a !>ridge or an elevated 

surface is part of a tire apparatus access road . the bridge shall he constructed and maintained ill 

accordance lvillt lite CIfITel1l EI Dorado COUWl' Trollspor/al;ol1 Dipisiol1 Bridge Slallc/ord or Appendix 

f) l?llite c..'lIl'r('11I ral{lhrnia Fire Code, H'hiclre\'(!I' ,:,. /IIure res/riclirc. Bridges and elevated surfaces 

shall be designed for a live loud suflicicnt tu carTY the il1lposl!d loads of fire nppnratlls. Vehicle load 

limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when required by the Fire Code Official. Where 

elcvntcd surfaces designed for emergency vehicle usc are adjacent to surfaces which are not designed 

for such lISC. approved barriers, approved signs. 01' hoth shall be instlllled Ilnd l1laillillincd when 

required by the fire code ollicial. 

503.4,2 No PU"king in Fire Lanes shall be added as follows: No pel'so" s!tal/ Slop. pork. or leave 

slanding (II~V vehicle, \l'ltelhel' al/entieel or IIIwllclUled excel'l lI'hen lIecpssOl), 10 ovoid (,OJ?//icl willi 

other I,.({tlic or in compliance with Ihe directiuns <d' the Fire ('hief or hislher dll~1' w"horized 

rel1l'C,'iI!11Ialil'{" Peace (?tficer 01' (~f'iciall/'(~tlh' ('(mlral tierice alon,!!. 111(' e{(~e (~l(/f~\ ' hi~hll'(/y. al W~\' 

curl>. or in ony I()Caliol1 il1 a Imhlic(l' or IJI'ivolc(\' Oll'lIet/ 01' OI1(J raleti (~tl:slreC!1 parking /iJdli~v, 

desigl10led liS a/ire lal1(, hy the dislricl Irilltjllris£iicliol1 O\'CI' lite! area in lrhicl"hc I"oc(' is IO{'lIled, 

The dcsigmllic>l1 sll<1l1 he intiicalee! (I) by a si,!!.11 IJOsled illlllletiicllefl' (u!jllcenl 10, lIIU/ \'isihie./hJlII. Ihe 

designated place dearly slating in leifer,,' 1101 Jess Ihall mft' IIIC/1 ill Iwiglf/ IIuf/ lite I'/an' is a/ire lalle, 

Ordinance 20 I 9.11.20 California Fire Code Puge 5 or 17 

 20-0203 C Page 10 of 41



(1) by oUII",lng or PO"'''''' Ihf pill« I" t"fd and. i" colflrMling W()I'. 1tUIrHng Ihf ~ willt 1M 

-ru "FIRE LANE ". wlticlt Of"t dtOl'ly ~IJlblt Ji't>m 0 ""hid •• ()I' (J) by a t"fd curb or t"fd poittl "" 

1M utg.f oJlhf roodway Upotl w/ticlt iI cl"arly ..,,,,ud 1M OW)rlD "FIRE UNE". 

S9J.:t,J No r. rkl~1 Ip ftogl of H_!,In nl, wI! be added liS folloW1 : No JHrj(",~1taI1 ~oP. p<7!. DI' 

__ mmd"'ll Otr)' ""ltld. wllhi" Jj Jul oj a jlt"f /tydt'cmI uc.pI aJ follows. (a) IfIIN ""ltld, I~ 

all.ndId by 0 lialUNi tlrMr who U MOlw i" 1M jro.ft MI1I and who CDlt i", ,,,.diol./y ""'" Ili<:It 

""hick 'If ~ oj "''''''''/1)'. (b) Iftlv wltle/' U "",,..d Dl'optrallld by 0 fit"f drporl_nI ON! IJ d.arly 

"""ud ... ojit"f drporl""m .... ltich 

S!!J.4A flt"f Lues DlmI u ROld Width shal! be added II follows: Flt"f la ... ~ dttzIl II. baNd on 

rood ",alt ... "''Iund /Jf Apprnd/:r D ... a_lWkd by 1M diJIrl(l. 

' 03.5,3 FI.e "nna .... , . .. MHg GI'01 shall be added liS follows: All OUI_11I1( and ...... 'uolgDl •• 

IlISkJlkd 0...,. jit"f opptII'DIlU~'" rootb doll co"'fJIy "'I/It 11M dUlrklgOl' ~",ndonl ... "I",",w<l 

by lIMp...""'" of!k"" 

m l Ad d ..... ' Idn tifklljo !l shell h ..... the fin! hne of U," ""rqr.p/1 Imcnded II fOllows; 

AdJnuuPr ,..", and uwl", bulld",p moll roII!pIy willi 11M dulrkl I1ddras SIandJ:nJ aJ "PfJ'O'NId 

by 1M fit"f ""'" off>ciDI 

m!lon SIP f irs " rot«!!" W.'crSMpn'Ir' 

W7,5. 1 Where Rljluiml lh.n be .mended II follows; 400 fee! slIali be.mctIded 10 HOjilfl 

Sutton 5O!.J fiet Coni ,,?! HU ft! 

S92.J f irs: Coni rot S !)!! n, FIrw 1'1'OIm"'" """ Utilily EillipINltI kklll'.fkot_ ond A<YUJ. II MNtby 

""",ncI«I by addi", 1M fiJI_IIfg 10 IWI<I Flt"f ~fI""'1k" riHts, '" 01_ COOI,rtJ/ pomls. mlar 

~o'iOllok ~ ~Y""" rapid $ltuIoJ! SW'ff""'. and 01 .... p.. dr/f(fiolt. ~.,.,.-.w/olo. or silftU ... 

c"mrolswltclH!s JIIaI II. 100000N flu"" ''''fi''f/Nt """'1'GI ....... Jar ,"" blllldtlfg. n. fin <O<II1'GI_ 

sltaillo(r."" ... ;,,/"'''''' t1i_o<s/:ol!s offi .... /«1 &y ........ /ftt "'iI~ WNII 0 10loI ""wbI~ """" of-hn ""'" 

Jj Iq_~ Jul. 17M rooM .""" 1M l(}OJIw wi/10m 1M bu,/d'''R "" '" _,Idr .... 1 aI 0 Iocaiott "PI" .. """ 

by lire FiNt Coth OJ!Idol """ lloai/ 1M ~,sj6l~ frl-IM Ulrrlor A. ~~_ ~n dtJor willt 0 dfltr 

wld/h if _ hUlhan J1 //ot:Ire. and .. IwIX'" 'I« Ius "- 80 ;".,Ion ,1dI 1M fI'D"'kJnJ P """".., iIIN> 

,''''''''''''' A "",'010/" sip ~1IaI1 W uffi~.J Iv I"" ulltr_ tJf 1M '*-' willi 1M -m "FlU CON17KJL 

ROOM" hi 1.11", "'" hi.., llotm J /""MI ,,, lNiJ(ht "kfY 6o;t ro ... pIyolt}{ wilit ~/01/ 5IM sIovIl 1M 

""mlltd (Itf lilt ".Url, ... lidr tJf tIM f/Nt allll"J ,.,."" ~ "fIt"j"g 1lot __ "'" "" (OfIObh or 

"",I""'tn/~If v ",i"'.'~N' I~.~><:rt.""'" of 40 ,It_. F"",",""" "cl~ 0/ 11 NrcJw~ ~ 1M 

prov/d.J jroIrIlM fiNt ~pt'illl<ler ru.,., fa <lily (ldj""""O< OINJils. r1Iis,..,.,. """ 1M sItarn/..,illl otlwr 

On:Iinlnct 2<1 I 9. I 1.20 Califomll Fire Code Pa&t6ofl7 

 20-0203 C Page 11 of 41



h"ild,"IJ utili/in 01' fiN pr-oltclicn ~quip"~'" /1oQI Is cOIIlp<Jtil>le. All approwd ~M/ OI'COIIta_ IIhaII 

1M pro<rltkd 10 MOI'f ~ plmJ oflINfI,., spridle, system, OIMr fI,., prOI",Iion ~ui~nI, rmd lile 

pllHI$. T1tu """'" shall_1M .... cd for my Ollie; Sl~ 

Cllap l~ r 9 

Srt.!9_ 993 fl" Spn.klt" 

!l9JJ WheA RtglliRd shall be amended as followi' "n Ipproved III.omalic spr;nklcrIY$lcm sholl 

1M "qlli"d Dttd ,nuolled in MW blli/di'W' and sl,,,,,,I,,"s J600 sqllt1n "tI" 01' rQ/llr ""IN .. 

CQltJInK/ed 01' ,..ffKQ/~d willtm lIN J",iWiclio" lIS dcocribed in Sections 903.2.1 lhrooah 903.2.12. 

Euepfio. : "sri<:lIhunol buildinp 1>01 under I lp<'Cill usc: permit "ted for commercill JlUrpose$. 

293 ,1 .• Whscs Rtg .. I'!d shill be added as followt: Stat", of cz/st''W hi/dings g'!(Jltr lita" J,6OO 

sq~ fen I" fILII'ng hll,/dmll' J,6OO 1II000000./tel Dr grwIer, OIitt, IlranoM and 1Wo-/"""/Y ~/}",g 
"niu. (INJ ~icll/lwulh"lIdi"ll trot IIItdttr s~ciof..,. ~rmil P CDmIfN""iu/ p"'poRJ . .. IN" lIN 

floor t1I'fO of ,''' hllildi", 01' 'f1"W:11I1"f Is Incr,lISw by 0" odJIIIO" of _ ,hatt III/,ty ~rct'" (J~ 

01' I ,()()() sq~ /HI wllie", .... u lUI, n.cll bUlldmll 01' slrl«:'"", JhalllM ...... 10 cwo"",, 10 $«1_ 

90J 1. 

lIOJ.l,b Wloea S".iml wll be ..tdcd IS (DHows SUII .... of esuli'W h,,'idl"llJ Ius tllmo J,6OO 

sq~ ,"I. /11 u.1$I/"Il bill/drngs J,6OO IIIwrf '", 01"' t.~ ",lie, IItmt o .... -<m<l fWt}./uml/J' ~ml1g 

"";0. and QgrinHlwoi hIlIlJt"8J _ ,,"'r IIMcial_ fM,,, .1I fOI' rom .... ""101 ""'",>RI, ..,1Ie", lIN 

floor _u of lite bllfldl"3 01' IIrllCl .... 'r/ffCrruRd "" 0 IOIQ/ 1qWN"tl footage 0 ... , J,6QO IIIIIIlI"f jul, 

IIytm oOdlllo..of_ IItaIIIIHrtyfMN;,m (J(}HJ 01"' I,(J()() 111_' /NI, ",Mclle ... , Is '-44, II/Ch buildi.., 

01' I/nIN .... 1IhaI11M'- fO CO<f!or .. fO 5«1_ 9QJ,1, 

993,1, 1 GrollP A .... 11 t. ImmOed Q follo_ for".",.,pI 0'·1 Lhrou&/l " .... : 903.2.1.1 ( 1) The fi ... 

__ CXC«dI J, 6(JO~./tfl 

?(!l,l J GIll'D E shill be Imended IS follows: 901,2,1 (I) Throu&hooL III Group E fill: lrClslI .... ,cr 

IlI40n J,6(IO Iq~ pi in __ 

lIOJ,U CrUP t'- I shill be amendoId M follows' 9(1)2. Group F. 90) ,2,. (I)" Group F fi ........ 

CIl~ J,600J<qWrIpl , 

203,1,7 <iI'll!!' M shall be lmended Is (ollows; 903.2' Group 8 and M, 901.2,1 (I) A Group 8 Ind 

M rIAl _ ex«t>ds J,600",-./HI. 

"3,2",2 "'U¥fULV "'" Il omn wll bo odded IS (0110_ All ""tlJltKJlic fin sprint/f' I'yJlt'" sholl 

1M Tfq~I",d In 011 ....... _lIpllflWl ""-s and .. 111""","11, _Nfoclum ItotrwJ ''''tntkd for our 

as Q _otmd fWO<.fo-,/y ~II'ng T1w Je'Wn """ iNlullalio#I of Judi JysJ~/fU slDl H m trC'f»'doltcf 

",It II CoIifontiD CDdt ufR~$: .. llNioN. rHt.1J, i 4JOO. 

Onl,nlntt 2019.1 l.lOCalifom" fire Code: l'lge 7 of 17 

 20-0203 C Page 12 of 41



ExcqIII,,"I.' 

I M""ujIKII«WI ~, loctIltd ... II~/Jr ,III ,¥ls11"II -'MIt~ ,... ~'''B ... "It 

C""foNtkJ Healiit tPtdSofo'Y C ..... DMsitNI IJ. PaH 1.1 oF 1.J. 

1 MlImIPI,,--.d ~II""I do "'" urnd 1.100 ~/HI in ltu tnI_ • .., 

trreuory dwtIlling ""II. <U dif/Md I" GooenPIKfIi Code StN"", 65/1501 . ... Iw" u.. 
ul$llrrg 1"'1"""" NlJitk"u "" /M ~,.". U "'" re,uiN!d /0 cmnpIy ... "It CdIjOmOo 

ReJlck",;(l/ Co<k 5«1"'" IfJI J .1 

J. Man.;fo<.'lw-,d /tomelllttN do "'" excnd JI0 3>IIUtIn Jul /Jr sin 

293.1 ,' Group 5_1 "'III be Im"ooe<! I. follows: 903,2.9 Group 5. 903.2.9 (I) '" Group S fire IOU 

u~cc:dJ J.6()(liqllOn foe'. 

211).1. 10 Got. Q $.1 ll!tloNs! ruk!", Ol! "'@t! sh.1I be .",eooed IS follows: 9Ol.2.1 0 (I) wt.a-. 

.he fire. Ire. .. r.he cnclofal plrkinlt praS" exceed. J.600 sqll<lNl jul. 

Sullo. 291 firs Alarm and 0.,..., . 10 .. SUI.," , 

207.101 Wbm KC9Mlrtsl- New Bu!ldi~gt 9rStruc' Uft' If» thin 3.600 IQU!I[S ru, .... JI be..:lded 

IS folio .. ,,: A" apprtJW!d ~ tJ,,"';d;uc/H>n :tYJlem .J1IoI1 be Insla/l. d /" ,,/I b~lldi"81 "'lilt" j/O«' 

Ina ItSf I""" J,600sq.......,jul 

ExUfHionJ: 

I OM· aNI rwo./_"Iy u-III~ (R-J On:llfI<>ItCiel and DlMr t1CC"fJ'In"iel "'''''ifod 

QS 'U-) 

1 Agri<'>JIUf'tJ buildll/fel _ ..... r .<p«101 """ IN,.,.,II DIfWi/.". _ UN<I fot' < __ rcool 

pwpt>Ms (L, .• N/Qjb soI .... jDoJ ..... ice. md' .... spn:/QI ~W!"'.) 

J BuildiltgS willt a fh- tlN/a Itss IIwM j()(} "......., /HI ~ boI Uf/IfI"" Q;I ~If,.".i~ 

by 1M FiN Cit",/. .... ltisllrt, duly tJljlM/Ud re,x'u'lf/tJliW!, ~ "" "",MUltI 

COIUlnK'fiDn _riot -a foatuns. ,_-. O«"P""')' typ.. """ dlSfonct ItJ 

-~. 
?97J,b SWUM of E.i •• i .! Buildi.", shall be..:ldeo:! u ,....10 ... flO ullll"" hild/tV "'''haw/ .... 
apprr1l'td ,,~IQtfl(J/K; q>r",iJ~~ J)'SI""'. lHJ¥r l/tan """ • .". _/oM11y dwotlllltl .... 1tJ, '¢"j~"'"Jral 

b,,;Jd;~ "'" IUlder sperl'" _. IN""i' fix" """_,,to! f1"'11<'#1 wIw--. of"" ~ .. ~_~_ 

th,u not Uisl ami 1M j/ooI- tJN/tI of I~ b~J1d""B .". SfNlCffll"t Is int;,..u •• d or tHOdij...J /Iy _ IIIan 

tltlr'YIJfrcem (J~ or 1.000 sqlk1n ,"I, wlt.cIo.:Vf''' u ku. swelt bulldilOf or ." ...... 1 ..... sIItlll bw ..... 

If) ~""for'" 10 SNlion 907 wit." ,..qulred by 1M Fin Cit",/. .". 1t11l1tf, tMyowltol"led "'PUM""Il'-W 

Buildings wilit "j/Q(J' _a ItS$//tott '00 sq-. ft.11fUI)' M ~u"'pI. <U d;~,.".iMJ IJy I. Firt C~f 

.... Itis/M, d,,/y u"'''''''iuu ""1""#""'''''. /.roanJ OIl h"i/dmx rot\J,., .. .".", ""He,iflls ..J foat~ 

locatio", UCCII/JUI>CY 1'yfW, cmd dis/,m« I<J f!X1""''''''~ 

Ordinaroc:c 2019.11.20 C.lirom" Fin: Coo.: 

 20-0203 C Page 13 of 41



• 

907,1., Mqni ro.;u shell be lddod IS followt; All /11'1 tJlOI'mltktulio;t sy.mms slttllllN f'OItIt«~d 

d..-«I/)' Ilwlugir and "",m'Dt"td by" U.L opproved CflmrnJ. prof'r'tllN')' Or,.,_ uatl_ .nlia. 

wllk" gMU oudlblt attd ~isuol s;gNJis tJI Q ronslrmr/y O/~mkd IOCallfNI. AlIspr/niJ,,,,d /nIUdmgs 

IltoII IN _itond. 

~itMs: 

I . awl and rwoft-d» dw/II"IS (R-J (kc"P""C~s """ 01"", 1Xt"fJO"Llu c/(JM'fwd 

OS "U~) 

1. AgrICuilUNI bWlidt"ls _ """ spulal_ pt.tn;' antII<w _ _ dp c_ .... >tJI 

pUrplJUl (,.,., nlDlI1 ",1,1, food H ... iCfl, .....v.".. spICa ~1Wl) 

297,l Td Jy llt I !loge! ' M,. llot!om ,h.1I be added at follows: 17tr rw,II,,.,_ltI of ilwaliOlIOll, Dr 

rfp!au .... m. of" ~ / Hood Sy,l'''' shDlI IVI'luin ofi,.. alonn/¥"im:lu _";/01'1"" ~'" 10 be 

IIIS/aI/,d, ",-jar 1M Iro<Jd 1yI1'~' ItJ N co",,",wd to an aisri"gji ... alarmlspr",kI,T monitor.", S)UI.". 

for lid Nllidirrg. 

?ol.'.2.! Scsud.ry r QWI[ S_pptr wll be added" (ollows I" Qu."..da~ willt NFPA 72, 1M 

xCOlldolry fJDW" swppIy J1"O"I<i"" Q "'/"/"',, .. }Ut()III' powv copt>ell)l ..... , '''~J«ft( load (sysl .... 

opt""';ng 'n Q 1fINNII ...... N>ttdh/on) MallIN __ d to Q ",inl", .... 71.100 .... ptJ_. coptKil)i. 

£XUpl/fHf n. ulJl,,," of ... ,_~ bock • ..,,~, SlIppIy I _ _ IS IN faUN ,_ 

ntlql/iNurN"" ojCDlifornHJ Fi .. Cot* Cltapter 11 

Cha pIn 12 

Secl;on IlQ3 E",ultnn IDd S!udby rower Sylloml 

IlOJ. l.J ' "''It!!! II'' .... 1I br: lmended u rollows: ErncrJc!ncy powa"systems.nd SWldby pow.­

sySlenll .... 11 be ;n,lalled in ..:cordanu willi tho California Buildinll Code, the C.I; fom;. Electri<: 

Code, NfPA 110 and NFPA 111. All bl.ildi"8" DlMr dJo" OM- and two1_lly ct-1li"'K ~ltIrl, QItd 

"JriclilrllNll IHIIId,"F _ .. Rdjor c_lMrCiDI ~., willi "<iI>dby po_r, JlttJtIItow Q sll .. ", 'rip 

dr~;c., IItQt dil«)ftMCII 011 ptl'WU M>WCU '" /,. bildi"1f, OfJP'T'""d by I" IllY codt ol/idol. &1111"8 

m.uollQlHHu Mullb. ...m"'DI-wd /" ~ willi IIw 0<1&'..01 ~, 

ChM p!cr 33 

Sse!in., JJ 10 Msw for flrdlghlin g 

J,BO.! rUm!" ldulinul lo ' .slt.oll br: added AI foil...... rrltJr /0 ond dllt"l'III, CQIUIrucri<>n an 

CIpfJ'YJ""d ~SJ lip Pdf bot ,....,.i<kd aI ttl(!11 fi .. and u,cr~..." ",,/tid. a<nu --'."'rJI /11/0 

1M pn>j«'1 

wHqa JJ ' 1 WrIt' Supply fq, fi", !' rylrc:lia. 

Ordin.ncc 2019,1 1.l(I ulifomitr Fi~ Code hF90f17 

 20-0203 C Page 14 of 41



3312.1 When Required shalt be amended as follows: Prior (0 comlws(ih/e maferial,\' arriving Oil 

sire, (he .lire hydranl waleI' ~ys((,111 shull be installeel and maintained il1 collliJ11fOlfS operation. The 

amount (~lwater supplied shall meet/he reqlfired/irejloll'/hr the pl'(~ie':I, 

Chapter 49 

Sectioll 4903 Plans 

4903.1 Where Regllil'ed shall be added as follows: Thefire code oj/iciol ollhe CPFD I//{/)' req/lire 

dellelopment projects localed in Moderate , High and VeIJ)-1 ft).?,h Fire Hozard Severily ZOlles 10 submit 

fire proleclion pial/. INs plall shall he oppmved hy hOlh Ihe fire ('Ode o/ficiol and Ihe (I/lihorized 

represen""ive .!',r Ihe lu",d CAL FIRE Unil Chi~l(illo('{/Ietl in Ihe Sltlle Responsibi!ilY Area [Sfl.Aj) 

prior (0 the /'ecording o/the/inalmopjur the projecl by the COllnty (?lEI Dorado, 

Section 4905 Wildfire Protection Building Construction 

4905.4 Roof Construction Rcguil'cments shall be added as follows: All nell' ('{)nslmclion. incl/lding 

additiol1s, requires (I Class A ro(~( covering or assembly, A II re-I'oq/ing requires Class A roo/covering 

or assemhly as a minimulII. Re-"(}(Hin,f!. in excess (?f 50% (?rlll1 (!xisilill,f!. s/rIlC/llI"e within anyone year 

period lI'il/ necessilO/C! that the entire roq( be (/ Class A J'oqr covering 0,. (Issemh/y as 1I minimum. 

Class /J or C.lire ,'etarileant trealed lIlId 01' non-treated wuod shake 01' shingles ore not approved as 

a I'O(~rcove"ing material fiJr Class A assembly, 

Chapter 50 

Section 5001 GenerAl 

5001.7 Liability for ])amnges shall be ridded as follows: Any dOll/oges or cost resultingji'o/}} Ihe 

careless IUll1dling, spill or discharge (~raI1Y Iwzardolls lIfat("'ials shall constituen! debt against any 

such person, ./il'lII or corporation causing sfU.:h ,spill OJ' d/~\'d1(lIxe, This debt is co//c.'('lible by the Fire 

Chief or his/her duly Cluthorized reIW(!Selllali\I(!, ill the sOllie manner as in tlte case (lan oh/(f.!,Oliol1 

ullder col1/raC/, expressed or implied. 

Chapter S6 

Section 5601 Genel'lll 

5601.2 Permit Requil'cd shall be amended as follows : Permits shall be required as sel rorth ill 

Section 105,6 and regu lated in i1cl'ordanl'l' with this section, /,VIIe.'I'(, ('XI,losiv('s permits are rC'quired, 

(hey sholl be isslfed hy (he Fire ('hie:/." O/' his/I,,!/, dlf~I ' cUlflwrized represt'llIo(I\'e, lind (lte I~'I /)orado 

('Olfl1ly Sher!l(s DeportlllC!l1I. ' ,Vhere lirc I I'orks 1}('l'Il1ifS are required Ih<,,\' "hall he issued hy the Fire 

('!tiel or his/hcl' £IlifF alllhurizecll'eIJl'(,Sl'lIIl1li1-'l', ({nellhe EI Do/'(/(Io ( 'Olllfly lJoarel o/SII/"'I'viso/'s. 

Ordillallce 2019.11.20Calirol'l1ia Fire Code Page 10 or 17 

 20-0203 C Page 15 of 41



5§OU.I O!!j:um cn t.t!ou shan be "'de<! IS follows: no, AHJ sltQl/ ""'" I~ QUfhorlty I<> 1Y'IIIII~ 

doeu_ruOlion regardi>tg all Q'PUIS of 1M fire"""", pi'fRNIOIion_ 

5§0J.2 .1 prgprit tary 1 n (o r !!!! liop wll be Idded u follows: no,. A HJ ... ill proi~ all ",-op;""" 
Inf.,..mali<m_ 

C hMptt r 57 

S«IIo. 5704 S!Q .... u 

5ZQ.f,l .' .6.! LontjoD' WI!{f$ Abon: (jrgud Inks art rro~ibi!rd wll be amended .. fD110ws 

Ston~ofClan lind Cllss II n.mmable IiquidJ in above-S"O"nd tIIIUoolSide ofbuild,ngo is pmhibilcd 

1m/,n Q~ &y lIN FW'r Cit/if..,.. 1t1JAt,t, dM/y "ulllOt',ud 1Yp"RnNl(iw Whm ,-.,llIm by I~ 

FI,., Chi,/. Dr /tit/Iou duly a",ltD<"iud "'pnRn/aii"" 011 <Iht1I'f ground lotvM ar ~ iioualll1liolu 

for lIN II~ of CI<w I. If ar III j1"lttmobl~ ...J ~f,&lf "'1uMb slta/I cottIpIy willi lhou 

rvqulrtwlt!ruJ "' Itl fonlt &1 1M CQ/i}Jnt/Q Art Cl1Ik. 7lN C0I1fontIa FIrv C«k sIraIl 111M> apply to 

IrtJlallOIio<u OIM, Iltan _ .,.,ltkk [wI dupouing s/Q/iMl ... ~ ~vo-d 81</ragf b rvquind 

Srslion !lot SPU I.! Qpc .... !lont 

$706,2 ,1,1 " R<ltkln' WhIrS Abp,C-Gr1IMUd Tanks l a PrRhl bi lcd $hIJi be _nded .. (oIlow1: 

Sionoae of CI". r II'Id C.u If n"",moble liquid. in oOo'll!:VOUnd s.nb """MX 0( buiklinp is 

prohibited """M oppt'O",J by lIN Flrt CIt .. t '" ItbIhtr Ny a~lltoriHd rtprtHnlatl'" Wlwn 

p'""III,d by llot FIr't Cltwt ",1usIItff dwIy "U/IIOt'lltd tVpt'fJrt_iw, 1111.,.",..,. vawnd 1-*(1) '" 

IlQU/llrtJla/iai/Q,ts fat' I'" uorap ofChw /. II 01' lIIj1altttfla/il, ...J rombtmibl, liqwldJ JItaII cOl'llply 

... 111t IItoJrt ",qtd,.,1IIt!nll as III fanlt by llot CoIljontiD F.,. Cad. TIot Coif/ontiQ Fin C ..... slrall aI,.. 

ilfJfJIJ' .., 1'IS,u1lDl/o<rs f)JJt,~ 1/ttM _ IItItitI# [wI diSpf'lS'''t SlDlio<ol- ..Iwn abo", • .,.,.."" ,,~ 

;llYqllIrtJ, 

C hapIn 511 

S.S!;"ft $896 f! ... moblt Cryocuk FlMI,b 

$8*.2 L.il!ill!jpll' $hill be amended .. follows S!_1t &( fl.."m.bk cryoaeftk. flutds ;., SIII!ionuy 

<;OIIto,ners; QUI,ide of ooild,"&I i, prohibited ""'~U ..""..,....d by ,''' Fi,., Clt~f. 01' IliYlwr tioJly 

tlUlltOI'iud Npt'tMnlQlM W ..... II ,. ..... IIIM by 1M F,n Cit ... ) : .,.. lI,sI/>t, tioJl)' <I",h.".;z.<I 

N~R"'DlIW, Q/J SlDllOIIOf)'conIQilllllnJ;w I ..... ~ ofJl",,,,,,uillt c,.".",.",r j1l1idJ sIIoll ronrply 

... ,11t 1110. fWI"'NIttr"U as .ffat'11I byl ..... CQ/rfomi" F.,. Codt T1tt CuliP"ia F,rt C ..... sltQlI mm 
apply /Q ItWoIla"~u- OIltttr I""" _ ""ltic/~ fo-I dl$ptfU,"1. >I,",,"', wMn uiJ,,'w·tlrowttl3/""'~ 

uU'l"iud, 

Oni'fUU'lCe 2019,1 1.20 Cl1ifomilt Fi~ Code 

 20-0203 C Page 16 of 41



Chaplu 61 

S.c!io. filM koulj!!p ofLP=Gaa Co n .. l!m 

fi IO .. '-2 Muimum C,p.oity ",jib!! Emblllbrd Lim!!. wll be IImmdc<l II folio""" TM SIO<'<IfJf' 

ofliqwfi~d ~Iroku", gtu I" UttU ofl'" 1liJI .... lJolt ofl,fJ()()·galJo,r _~r capo';ty ..,/w" I"",,,udal 

kCU1 __ hoIf (111) ",1/, fro'" pro~rly IO>Wd 01" dtsig...ntd for .... sidtltliol u" and at kos' o..e-holf 

(111) ",,'" jroltux/slll1f( .... s/dt"'Iai dt ..... l~m ..,1,11 " """"ty greaunhtJ" at .. (1) dwrlli", wril ~r 

"",n ond Q/ ItaJt """.Ito(j (In) ""k jrfwt ""y htJltl IN' _ul U ol/o_d WM" AIIJ approwd. DItd 0 

Sf1«,,,lkond,lioruIl« ~r",111.J Isswd by 1M County of £J Dorado. 

~1U1", .,illli" ,"ab1ill .. d 11",111 Willli" 1M I/",ils .SlobIUMd by /"", .... Jlrkling 1M disptrs lo" of 

/iqwfod ".Irok""' .... for 1M J1"OfUI'O>t ofMavi/y populol.d 01" nmgtll.d arttu. ,''' au"gal. 

"'P""'tIJI of """_ iNIollal;o".U _ UCftd a _IT "'P""',ty ofl.000 gaI/ons. n. di'f"'",i"S 

ofliqwjicd ~lroI~_ ps hi u«u of .... "fIrtfOU af1JJ()(j.·goJlon wal~r capacity wM" !""OIM 

aI ItllSl _-ItaI/ (111) ",II. from IJ""tIprrty _tJ IN' dtsig1tOUd for .... sidlltllalllSl and at ""Sl !>IV­

/tQif (111) ",iI. fro",,"'Si"W rtsKk",ioI dt ... /optM1tI .,illl a dtrulty gnat'" l/to .. """ (I) <I..'/"ng ",,1, 

pn- ....... ond <III/~I _-half (112) ",iIe.rn- .... y haI.1 01" _I is allowtItJ.,1om AIIJ oppt'Owd DItd 

,,~t/(JJ/ro<Kh,-' _ pI .... flls w..,tJ by 1"- eoultlJ' of £I CJo,-ado. 

!laW wll be ~ as fullows, 

ti l l,! RCI<,I!I!oQ wI! be.clded as follows' 

~,~ nll.ulDiar <ySI.", sltDll 1M ilUlalltd /" ~ ",,1110 ~,,"r 1Tq"Irt __ 

r--Slax' "'llulQ/or S),SI''''1 slto/I bt Inslall.d on all LI'O 'rut.2l'alit;HI$. 

~ jlr&l &I. <'flulolM shtJlIlM inslall.d lIIOder 1M lIittgf!d ~ ...,...,. .~pp/kd ,.11" tIw ftlllk. ~ 

OIMOSplotrr/c ~U~rt DlJtmun of 1M .... 6:~IDlor slto/I bt poiffl.d tIo.,,,won/ n.. jlrll ,J/ar "6:"'_ 
.halllM pI~mbtd 10 1M ,lur of/M yord pip"'8 willi soft OOf.'IJtr luMffg to all"., f/u''''IItys~ld ,.",1-

."1ft"'8 «nr 1M rlur Jrr- 1M yard plpi'lg s/tall 1M /«okd _ tmJrt Iltan J 1",,1.. (IrorIZOlHaI/y) 

froM 1M wdlroflM ,anl.. 

n...wco..J Sl~ rq~IOIOI" tmd rlxr pI"..mu1l 1M "'sl<JlI~d u",*r,ire to ... of 1M bulhh~f(., ... clDStI 

/U prot:lttablf 10 IIw b~i1di.., woll Thi. rl,., sholl btt Sf~~ .... ly So;pporlfd/bl'OCN 10 1M wall 

<rpprOJ:_ly 10 i1fC"hu IMlow 1M .-qulolor $I} 0.1 m ~ ... '" I>c .. ,j,ng of 1M plPf by blrol JffUwll~ ..... 
A ,.,.-c';'" ....... ' ...... " .. d by 1M flaJ s"pp/ifr DNi 8"i"''''~ Ollidlll. shall btt , .. s/(rlk,low,. IIw 

#rond &I~ "/t"laIOI' Oitd Jftllrt/y suppakd ,., llor ptJ«",lor d~ly 10 1M wall 

n.. ..u.r pipn far'_ yard PI"'", s/rl/II _ 1M fmlMJded hi n~'" C.,.,...,...'" pI" .... ,1 11<"",,1 fIlCh 

ri#r PtalIIw Mid burl. <111 ktuI / iltt:II}"roItf 'il pdu of IIw PI~ 

Qrdin.,," 2(l19.1 I.20Califomiro File Code Prr~ 12 of I 1 

 20-0203 C Page 17 of 41



At the tillle! o/applicatiollJiJr any building penllit. which involves the installatiol1 (~ran LPG ~ystelll. 

the applicant shall SlIblllit an {.PG ,\)'stem plot plan ill 3 copies (or d;git(f/~).' CIS PDf) , The LPG 1'101 

plan sholl inc/ude. hilt not he limitecl to. the tank location. propo.w!d {((17k copocity il1 U.S. gallons. 

route q(y ord pllJing. location (?lthe riser pljJe at the hllilcling, property bOllndaries. {/lui ml outline (?l 

all eXistillg/tJ1'oposed Iwildillg,\' 011 the lot and (f depicthm 0/ 'he ridgelil7l' (~/' ony Imildil1,!!. to he 

supplied with LPG. This slwll also be/i)l'll'(frded to the appl'opriale/1re district to serve as a localol' 

map in event alall emergency. 

Location o/tlie cenlerline afLPG tanks shall be permanently marked by the lise (?/,SI101l' stakes. OI1l! 

al each end Such Slakes shall be (~r.\·/~tficienl height to he visihle through wllicipated I/lCfxillllllll SHOll ' 

depth at the respectiv!' 10catiol1. Instal/at ion (lnd lI1aintenance of these snow slakes are the 

re~pol1sibilily o/tlte LP(i liseI'. 

Propane aplJ/iances and accessories sl1(l1l not he perll1illed in any new inslal!arioll below the first 

floor 01' be/ow grade. whichever is more restrictive. 

6112.2 Vertical Riser Piping shall be added as follows: 

A1il1imuI1I o/Sc/7edule 80 - iron piping. 

The riser shall he lvilhin 3 inches horizontally (?/,the tonk. 

SlI'ingjuinls shall be inslal/cd abovc and belo\\! lank level tv prop;dc for Ihe IlInk /}/ovell/enl (SIred 

elbows shall nol be used). 

A IisledJlexible riser cOIlSlrlfcted qlcopper or stainless-sleel tubing and protected by steel covered 

sheathed JI/(/leriClllJwy he used instead o(slI'illgjoinls. Theflexihle a/tel'l1lltive sll"I1I}/'O\'ide SI!tlic:iCllt 

slack 10 ClI!OI\' .{rW lank /}(ovelllenl. 

6112.3 Morking and Locations shall be added as follows: 

An approved si~1I sllall he located direct/.." above Ihe riser shill qlrva/l'e on tIle Imildillg ill 0 visibie 

Im'olioll. 

'lite lil/lle/ied petroleulII gas supplier shal/ {{tlix CI II 'eatllel'lJI'(}(?(ident(ficaliol1 tag to lite inside of the 

tank valve protecting cOI'er. This tag shal! cOl1toin the supplier's nOllle and emergcIlC:\, telephone 

nlllllh('/,. 

'{link illstalla/ion shall he IJel'l1llll1ently /I1arked by a metal 01' wood material snow /II(/rker. l1'ilh ({ 

minimulII dimellsioll (~f' 2 i/l(:hes hy 2 ilU.:hes. 711t~ SilO It· mal'ker shall be (?/'s/~tlh'ieltl 11i!(~ht to rise 

ohm'C! Ille a11l1ll01.\'l1o\l' dt'IJIII alld shall hl' (/ lIIill;1II11111 (?lIO/eet ill IIe(rtht. Tlte .\'11011' II/orkel's sltall 

he pail1led yello\!' (//1(llocliled 011 Opposile ends (~llh{' lank. 

Scctioll 6113 1I11dcI'gl'ollnd LPG Tanli.s Installntions and Ownershiu shall he <Hided as I'ollows : 

6113.1 Pcrmits nnt! Plnns sh'lll he added as follo ws: Pel'm;I.\· shal/ he reilf/ired. w1c1IJlolIs sltull he' 

slIhmillc!d/i)r a/llllulergroltllCl tllnk insw/lllt;ol/S (is 1IIJIJro,,<'d hy lite A l/.l. 

Ordinancc 2019.11 ."0 Calilornia Fire Code Page 13 of 17 

 20-0203 C Page 18 of 41



61 1JJ u,dcarQ"nd LeG T .nk Q".,mblg shalll>< added at follows; I/n;krgrownd LPG IOIOh 

MIDII be prohlbll.d fro", being ",Id 10 end'I'M,'J and ,!toll be nlo'Md by 1M LPG """P""Y "Itdu a 

I._~ JysJ~"'la ~1U1in pro~~ aMINII mailll.,","'" rtquin .... nt. an _land ,.,conhd. 

C hlpln 80 

Su!Io" 80. NI'PA. 131>· 16 - Studlnl (or I~e l" flln.ljoP or SDrinkkr Snlsml i" Ope-ud Two 

Family p .. rmaCs , lid Muur"clum! !12m"" .mudt4 903,).1'). 9!pJ.5 

NFPA !31>, Ameltdec! Secl jons IS '<>I'_s; 
R ..... 1Ie Secllo. 5.1.1 J to ,.,ad .. rolla .... ; 

ChiDtH 8/1. Nn 'A qp. 5.1.!.l A supply of'" htul ""'" of..., .... tn- r-Il'''''''''''_Ipr...u~.-d 

",1,/rIn 1M prtmiJu ,hall be IItQlnlo/nf(/ on ,''' ~ Q/ QII appmllWlIOl'(l{Ion. SlOI'l: ~,MJ.,., sJroJl 

H uplln a _unlttl and accoulblo cobin., 

Revise s.c.iooo 1-' to rtad u rouo ... : 

C~apte[ 80 .• "FP A I ll). 7.6 A I«..t _, jlo'" a/anI.1taI1 H pro.id«/ CHI all f/I"f sprlntkr J,.Ioms in 

ItoIIttS at "" appro...a Iocatlotr "" I'" UIfflor of 11M dwllilfg. 

Revise Se<:tio. 1 I.U . I to""d at ro"~; 

Ch.plrc 89. NFPA UI>. I! .J. 1.1 When: a fin: dep,,1menl pumper _.-" .... is nat ptOVI(Ieod. \he 

.y.l.m .hlll be hydro$laticlUy l.lIed .1 a ",inl/llu," prus_ of "0 po.mdI (Mrlqwrt ItrcII Iltll#p for ~ 
/u.t IIKm a )IJ.",inulr d/U"Q/lon ",ilho", .vidmer ofl~. Sw.1t lUI s/tall H ",IIMUM brIM {In codtt 

offlCid. 

OrdiNlncc 2019.11.20 California Fi", Cock ""ae 14 or 17 

 20-0203 C Page 19 of 41



'. 

~ 
I "" e_ it ::='J. ~ •. 

'IM£-I'LOW AUTOMATI C M l f'l IM U'" .... W 

CALCULATION SPRINKLt;M rlltl- DUItATION 

"'" 
SVSTEM 'LOW ( .... ,,) 

("' ..... -, ID.o •• (plio •• per 
S ....... "") .. In ,,) 

o - J,600 ~ 
_ .. 

''''' I ........ .,-
).601 __ 

~ .', ••• • ...... I, --- ,- ,-
IIIO! 1('1 BIO' 1(2) • 

~ -"" ..... -
O_ JAOO _ 9OJ.l-I .l - , 

....... CA ,.., '''' 
, 

~.-
IIlJ ., ... CA 

'--ielc-
),601_"- 5oco .... 'IOllt.J In _ 

" • 
........ CA I'lnI ,... , 
~ ... 50<1.". III~ 'I!) 
lllJ ........ CA - ,-
R_.c.. a, .. 

1I~1s IUl!~,2 Beglla!! Ela Elg .. [ItE /!ylIIlIUl gl~S[ Ihl gil:: .Ist IWI:EII!I!lI 
p .. ~lIius. Group RY. Iftd R-i Byild!"" lid Tgw.~9yHt .1I be _ndcd .. fIMIow$; 

AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER M INIM UM n.ow DURATION 

SYSTEM FIRE· FLOw ,_nl 
(ooit_ SI .. d.",) t,·lloo. ~. 

",In,.) 

~ --- .- • ,- ...... • ,-BIO,-,(2, 11105.1(2) 

_ 9Ol.J..t ' 01 .. CA - __ or ... _ ...... • ,-,- "T_ IU~ I ll)' 1111».112, ..... -. --__ 'IDUt.J ...... C"A 'ft 
__ 01 .. _ ...... • ,-,- -- • , IooT_II II».I(1, 511».Im"""'_ 

..... J-.,w. ... , --
Ordi...,.;e lO1'II.lOCaIi~ F"1I't Codr 

 20-0203 C Page 20 of 41



" .. 

Appendix 0 - Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

Section DI03 Minimum Specifications 

D103.1 Access Road Width with 1\ Hydrant shall be amended as follows , adding the exception: 

ExceptiOll: lJrivr!ways 

D103.2 Grade shall be amended as follows: rire apparatus access road, and driveways shall not 

exceed j 5. 9%1 in grade IIlIless a/lpl'o"cd by Ihe Afl.J or by 1/7(' l::J Doradu CutlJ71Y amended Ca/{/iwnill 

Public Resource Code Til/e J -I / Design and Improvement Standards Manual. 

£.,ceplioll: Eleva! iun above 5.000 f ee! shall 110! exceed 12%. 

DI03.3 Turning Radius shall be amended as follows: The 1ll1l111111l1ll turning radius shall he 

determined by the tire code officifll~ and s/1alll1o/ inclllde curb lind glllle/" . 

0103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates shall he amended as tollows: SlIbsec!ion (I): Where {/ 

single gate is pruvided. (he gale width shall be nol less l/1al1 20.leel (6096 111111). Where (f .fire 

apparatus rOlld ('onsists ola divided roadway, 'he gale widlh shu/lnol be les!J' 1/7(1n 15 jel'l (-1572 

111111) . 

0103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 fect in width shall be amended as follows: rire lane s igns as specified in 

Section 0 I 03 .6 shall be posted on both side of tire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 19 reet wide 

(6096 to 8534.4 nlln) . 

En'ept;oll: t:JeFClliol1s above 5. UUUji. (/s determined hy (he A HI. 

0103.6.2 Roads mot·c than 29 fcct in Width shall he amendcd as follows : Fire lane signs as 

specified ill Section D I 03.6 shall be puslc:d on one side or firt apparatus access roads mort: thun 29 

reet wide (8534.4 mm) and less thun 36 feet widc (10972.8 ml11). 

Exceptioll: Elevati<ms ahove 5.0{)O/i. as determined by tile Allf. 

DI04.4 Circumfcrcntial Firc Api'"rntIlS Access Ronds shall be added as follows : WiI,," /"("/lIir"d 

by (/tejire ("ode (~llicial . aJirc apparatlls access road slllt/llu.! constructed 10 encolllpass tire (' IlIire(\ ' 

ql a strllcIUr(' and shol/ provide a continllulls means (~lemergel1(:\ ' H!hide access. 

Ordinance 2019.11.20 Calilllrnia Fire Code Pugc 16 II r I 7 

 20-0203 C Page 21 of 41



.' 

SECTION.: CONF'Llcr 

T'hf,. Ordinance No. 2016.10_19 orlM Cameron PI'" Community ~rvic:es DiSlnct, ...d .11 OIMt ordinances or 

pArtS Qr ordinances herewith ore hereby rqlUled. 

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY 

If any Ordinance, l"ide. subsection or ",bdiv;,ion thcftof, provision, smlenCC, d_ or phn5'! ofllli. cocIe. or 

any application (hereof, ;1 for any reux. held \0 be invalid by • coun of C<Jml'l'ttrll JurisdOClion, tue.h decision 

.h,1I nOl affect the remaininll provl.1OrI1 onhi. code, whict1 o:.n be li¥ell effccl Wllhoul (he i ...... lid ponions Ind, 

therefore, such involid ponion. Ire cleelared 10 be ~venoble, n.e Clmeron Put Community Seri"'el Dismct 

he.eOy declares lilal il would have enKled Illi. Ordin.nce and ~eh of ilS Iruck .. _lIonl, oubsec:rion., or 

... bd;v;.iDn$ thereof, provisions, wn'e~u. dauMS or phrases i~pc<'l lve orllle fact !MIone or more oflhem 1S 

dcclatcd inV1llid. 

SECTION 6: EFF'EC nVE PATE AND rUBklCAl'ION 

Th" oro,,,,,nee wll uke ef1«;1 thirty (10) dlys after its adopIion TlM: C ..... ron P..tc COInmunily So1viees District 

Board s...:.-erary il directed to publish Ihi. ordinan« in I MWSpep(r of pncnl ci~ul'lion in the District In lieu 

of publicolion ofthl: (uliIUI ofllle ordioancc, I summary ohhe ordinance m.y be publiohed by the by the Bo.rd 

S«retary w!thin fitloen (I S) ~ .tler iu pHWlII" IIId • .,..,iroed copy lhell be potled .. ,he offICe of the ComerD<l 

P.rk CommunII)' Services l)'Slrict p" ........ t to GoWlI'I"ItMIII CoJtt SuI"", J69JJ(c) (I). 

The lbovc Ordin.nce WI' introduced .t. meeting of the Bo.rd ofOlrec1On of the Cameron PvIt CommunI!) 

Strvices DistrICt on October 16, 2019, ud il WIS Ihcn I"eId for the fim time. A ""blk hearing wu SCI for the 

Ordln.l~ 10 be rwd For lhII _and lime on November 20, 2019 Illd 'JlI)fOved by the followin, >'Ok: 

PASSED AND AOOPTED by the Board oFDirwonoFthe 01_ Plrt. Community Services DIstrict mi, 20'" 

dlY of November, 2019 

AYES: m<).I~' Fe.,£tJ, Eft 

NOES· N()vI./L 
ABSENT; N<7V1tL 

ABSTAIN: NOvIJ-

AnCST: 

Ordin.nee ~19.II.20Callramia F""~ Code 

Jill iI7.mln. Denalll M'!lIger 

SeemOf)' 10 lhe Board 

 20-0203 C Page 22 of 41



· .. 

I-:ESOLUTION NO. 2019-22 

OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

Or THE CAMERON PARK COMMUNITY SERVICES DlSTRICT 

RESOLUTION ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO THE 

CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

A resolution of the Cameron Park Community Services District (District) setting forth findings with 

respect to local conditions vvithin the District which mClke certClin modificCltions and chClnges to the 

C<lliforni<l Fire Code re<lsonably necessary for preserving fire and life safety in the Cameron Park 

Community Services District. 

The Governing Board of the C<lmeron PClJ'k Community Services District finds and resolves as follows: 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Codl::' Section 17958.5 permits a Fire ProlL'ction District tu adopt an 

ol'dinClnce which changes or modifies the State Housing regul<ltions Cldopted pursuant to Health & 

S<lfety Code Section ]7922 upon determination that slIch changes or modifications me necessary due to 

lncal conditions thClt pertain regulations governing conditions huzClrdolls to life, properly und the 

environment from fire, explosion, hazClrdous materiClls and hazardous lIses; and 

WHEREAS, Heulth & Surety Code Section 17958. 7 rE'quires that <l District's Board of Directors 

making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 shall make 

express finding that such chilllges or modifications are needed; and shall file a copy of such changes or 

modifications with the Department of Hlllising and Community Development. 

WHEREAS, the uniquE' ILK," climatic, geological, (lnd topographical conditions existing within 

the boundaries of the Distrid make it reClsonably necessary for the District to impose more stringent 

requirements than set forth in the California fire Code Clnd pursllClnt to California Health ,md Safety 

Code sl'l'lions 13869.7 and 17958.7, thc District desires to make express findin~s to that effect. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board o( Directors of the Cameron Park 

Community Services District, after having .1 duly Iloticed and held public meeting, hereby ildopts the 

following findings concerning current uniquc local conditions th(lt together l11C1kc c(lch modification to 

11ll' Cllifornia. Fire Calk, rC'(lstm,lbly Ill'Cl'SSMY to provide (ldequ(ltl' ilild dfC'dive prott>clion o( life, 

property and the ellvironment more spccific(llly set forth as follows: 

Page I 01'4 

 20-0203 C Page 23 of 41



CAM&GEO 
} Significant Locally adopted / SFM adopted / 

Fire1Code# 
change? 

What Is the Change? 
Amended 

Why Is There a Local Change? 

101.1 N Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Administrative need 

LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than 

Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate 
air and can easily be trapped under a home, if ignited it can 

105.6.27 y quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving Locally adopted and amended 
lead to an explosion. At elevations above 5000 feet there is 
an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire 

occupancies in Group R-3. 
activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional 
attention. 

Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance 

106.6 N Add section Locally created and adopted 
of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines 
permits, plan checks, and inspections as allowed in Health 
&Safety Code 17951. 

106.6.1 N Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to 
the Fire District. 

106.7 y Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspections by contractors. 

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District 
is added to read as follows: 
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this 
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an 

109.4 y Added section 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals 
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County of EI Dorado's 
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals 
timeline. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 
Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that 

portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 
protects life and property. Fees have been updated to 

110.4 N 
belter left to localities to determine the 

Locally adopted and amended match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the 

fees/penalties for their respective areas. 
District Attorney's Office. The change to the language to 
include the term infractions. 

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief or hislher duly authorized representative (s), 

110.4.2 N 
Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before 

Locally created and adopted 
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 

but under a different number) violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health and Safety Code of the State of California and 
Chapter 5c (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 

112.4 N 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. ltis 

Locally adopted and amended 
All violations of the code have been consolidated under 

belter left to localities to determine the Section 110.4 to include the penalties for violations. 
fess/penalties for their respective areas. 

Added definitions for. Campfire, Driveway, District, 

202 N Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopted 
Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd 
Manager. Definition of campfire shall not include LPG or 
Propane fueled appliances. 

302.1 N Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for clarity 

307.4.4 through 
Due to the high fire danger that exists in EI Dorado County 

y Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopted we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires 
307.4.4.2 (d) 

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas. 

 20-0203 C Page 24 of 41



r--
Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical 
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for 
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus 
components. It also allows an extended time frame before 

Changed vertical clearances to 15 feet and road 
having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional 

503.2.1 N Locally adopted and amended height for vegetation clearances acts as an increased buffer 
widths to 20 feet. for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of 

shoulders, as measured face of curb to face of curb is 
needed. These structures can be difficult to navigate with 
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the total 
drivable road surface 

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the 
Fire apparatus require areas for tuming around when 
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This 

503.2.5 N 
Fire Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations to 

Locally adopted and amended includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides 
match as they require turnarounds for fire apparatus 

better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum 
access roads and driveways. around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated 
Surfaces of EI Dorado County and Appendix D of the 
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be 

503.2.6 N Surfaces to state and match EI Dorado County Locally adopted and amended 
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an 

Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17. 
altemate means & methods that is not less restrictive than 
the Fire Code. 

503.4.2 N Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes Locally created and adopted 
This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes' 
rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle Code. 

Added section regarding no parking in front of 
This section clearly defines the 'No Parking in front of fire 

503.4.3 N Locally created and adopted hydrants" rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicle 
hydrants 

Code. 

Added section regarding fire lanes based on road 
This section clearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D 

503.4.4 N width 
Locally created and adopted as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire 

lanes. 

Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on 

503.5.3 N 
emergency access and consistency through all 

Locally created and adopted 
roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing 

roadway gates in EI Dorado County, referring to the the best possible emergency access to maintain fast 
gate standards adopted by the FPO's. response times. 

505.1 N 
Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of 

Locally adopted and amended 
Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing 

buildings based on the District's addressing standards. 

Added more conservative standard for the 
Commercial properties are required to install hydrants at 

507.5.1 N placement of hydrant and their relationship to Locally adopted and amended 
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150 
feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in 

commercial buildings 
between). 

Buildings are getting more sizable in the county. It is more 
common to have new buildings with solar arrays that 
continue to generate power even when the buildings 

Added verbiage to bring all of the necessary fire 
general utilities have been shut off. When there is an 

509.3 y Locally created and adopted emergency, it is vital that we have rapid access to all of the 
controls for a building to one location. controls in one location for public evacuation and firefighter 

safety. Due to the fire danger present in EI Dorado County 
throughout most of the year, this change is appropriate and 
advisable. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2 N in new buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

greater within the district. to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

 20-0203 C Page 25 of 41



Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.a N 
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they 

Locally created and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
structure, whichever is less. feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 

spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds occupant protection for existing buildings less 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.b N 
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they 

Locally created and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
structure, whichever is less. feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 

spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

903.2.1, 903.2.3, 
These sections were created to give specific increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.4, 903.2.7 
N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Manufactured Homes - The intent of this code section is to 
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two 
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in 
eRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar 

This section was created to include manufactured 
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban 

903.2.8.2 y residential single family R-3 in the residential Locally created and adopted 
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption 

sprinkler program 
due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The 
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a 
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk 
successfully in many California communities. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

These sections were created to give specific increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2.9, 903.2.10 N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Added occupant protection for fire alarms in 
buildings with a floor area less than 3,600, except 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
R3, AG buildings not used for commercial 

907.2.a N 
purposes, and buildings with a floor area of less 

Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

official. 

Added occupant protection for existing buildings 
Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.b N 
without automatic sprinkler systems to install a fire 

Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
alarm if they add more than 30% or 1,000 square 

the event of a fire or smoke. 
feet to the structure, whichever is less. 

Added occupant protection by stating all fire alarm 
detection systems installed shall be connected to a Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.c N monitOring service that notifies the fire department Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
upon activation and is installed per Section 907 of the event of a fire or smoke. 
the fire code. 

Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
907.2.d N systems to be connected to a monitored fire alarm Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

system when installed or replaced. the event of a fire or smoke. 

 20-0203 C Page 26 of 41



907.6.2.1 Y 
Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply 

Locally created and adopted 
Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E 

Modification safety related power outages. 

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to 
1203.1.3 N Shunt trip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up 

power supplies 

3310.3 N Address requirements for construction sites Locally created and adopted 
Addressing for construction sites is important to assist 
responding emergency crews. 

3312.1 N 
Water supplies at construction sites with 

Locally adopted and amended 
Water must be on site prior to combustible material being 

combustible materials on-site stored or vertical construction commencing. 

EI Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout 
This section was created to include Fire Protection 

4903.1 y Locally created and adopted 
the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire 

Plan for all fire hazard severity zones. Protection Plan due to climatic, geological, and 
topographical conditions. 

This section clarifies that within the boundaries of EI Dorado 

4905.4 y Added a section to clarify roof construction 
County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are 

requirements 
Locally created and adopted wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 

covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be 
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly. 

Any damages or costs from negligent practices that 
Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate. 

5001.7 y cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally created and adopted 
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 

cost recovery fee. 
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the 
negligent parties. 

Added safety protection with permits being issued 
Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and 

5601.2 N 
by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for 

Locally adopted and amended 
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of 

fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding 

Supervisors for fireworks. 
of the applications they will be used for. 

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any 

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make 
documentation including timing and proprietary information 

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 N available all requested documentation pertaining to Locally created and adopted 
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they 

the firework presentation 
deem necessary. This information is understood to be 
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as 
such. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5704.2.9.6.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5706.2.4.4 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid special 
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval 
and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County. 

Administrative need to add District name. Established limits 

5806.2 N 
Administrative addition of District name. 

as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable 

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code 
Locally adopted and amended Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ 

approval and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the 
County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code Official for 

5806.2.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted and amended locally 
Flammable Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. 
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

Establishes distances between LPG storage and 
dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential 

6104.2 N 
Established limits for LPG storage and dispensing 

Locally adopted and amended 
developments and high-density hotels, motel, apartments, 

near or adjacent to residential development 
etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would 
have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death. 
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

 20-0203 C Page 27 of 41



Establishes propane regulator requirement for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. Including requirements for two-
stage regulator use and location of first and second stage 

Establishes propane regulator requirements for 
regulators. Additional requirements are outlined for 

6112.1 N 
locations above 5000 foot elevation 

Locally created and adopted protective covers, riser pipe installation requirements, 
building permit submittal and review, tank center~ine 
marking, and grade requirements. These requirements are 
based on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feel 

Establishes vertical propane rise requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. Pipe schedule location, swing 

6112.2 N 
Establishes propane vertical riser pipe requirements 

Locally created and adopted 
joint requirements, and the use of flexible riser piping as 

above 5000 foot elevation well as swing jOints. These requirements are based on 
Significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather 
conditions encountered above 5000 feel. 

Establishes marking and location requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. This section addresses signage 

6112.3 N 
Establishes propane marking and location 

Locally created and adopted 
location, emergency contact information, and snow related 

requirements above 5000 foot elevation tank marking requirements. These requirements are based 
on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feel. 

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground 
tanks: 

6113.1 N 
Permits and plans shall be submitted and approved 

Locally created and adopted 
Allows us to require plans be submitted for review prior to 

by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction). installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks 
require substantial maintenance including inspection and 
anode replacement at regular intervals. 

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without 

6113.2 N 
Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the 

Locally created and adopted 
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when 

property of the LPG company sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground 
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected. 

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on-
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow 
alarm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in the 

NFPA 130-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the event of water activation in a vacant structure, and 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 

Y 
District has been amended to update various 

SFM Adopted and amended locally 
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 130 

130-16 provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water 
systems in one-and two-family dwellings damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements 

were also added to ensure water circulation through the 
system, reducing stagnant water and backflow concerns 
(EIO encourages this type of system). 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system 

130-16 Section Y 
system minimizing damage 

SFM adopted and amended locally 
must be available on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet 

5.1.1.2 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
An audible alarm system is added to notify occupants and 

130-16 Section 7.6 
y Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation SFM adopted and amended locally in the activation of the system when the building is not 

occupied allow for detection minimizing damage. 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and 

130-16 Section Y System test to a ptessure of 150 p.s.i. SFM adopted and amended locally 
failures and assures proper gluing of system components. 

11.2.1.1 

Appendix 8: Table 
Changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 

8105.1(1) 
N elevation, to match fire flow precedents used in Locally adopted and amended to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 

EOC for years used for over a decade in EOC. 

Appendix 8: Table 
Established a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM, Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 

8105.2 
N below 5000 foot elevation, for all commercial Locally adopted and amended to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 

projects used for over a decade in EOC. 

 20-0203 C Page 28 of 41



...---. 

Appendix D: D103.1 N Made an exception for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended 
It is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to 
construct a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant. 

Title 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways. 
Appendix D: D103.2 N State law requires no greater than 16% grade Locally adopted and amended In our EI Dorado County Title 14 adoption we allow greater 

than 16% grade with AHJ approval and hard surface. 

Appendix D: D103.3 N Text to include curbs and gutters Locally adopted and amended 
20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutters due 
to potential access issues and tuming radius concems. 

Appendix D: D103.5 § 
Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided 

N Fire apparatus access road gates Locally adopted and amended roadway the gate width shall not be less than 15 feet due to 
1 

radius issues. 

No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet 

Appendix D: D103.6.1 N Roads widths 20 to 29 feet Locally adopted and amended 
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does 
not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire 
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all other elevations. 

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet 

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36 
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of 

Appendix D: D103.6.2 N 
feet in width 

Locally adopted and amended elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The 
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D 
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations. 

Appendix D: D104.2 
Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

N building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 
Exception 

have only one approved fire apparatus access road. residents and first responders. 

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 

Appendix D: Dl04.4 N 
Added to require circumferential fire apparatus 

Locally created and adopted 
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire 

access roads structure and shall provide a continuous means of 
emergency vehicle access. 

Appendix D: D106.1 
For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Exception 
N Removed Exception in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

residents and first responders. 

Appendix D: D 1 07.1 
For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

N Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 
Exception 

residents and first responders. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.2 through 101.5 N 

Adopted to establish scope, intent, severability and 
Locally adopted Administrative clarity 

validity 

102.6 through 102.8 N References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

102.10 through 102.12 N 
Conflicting provisions, Other Laws, Application of 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
references 

103.1 through 104.1 N 
Definition of the Fire Prevention Division and ability 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
to enforce the code 

104.3 through 104.4 N Right of Entry, Warrants, and Identification Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.6 through 104.6.4 N Record retention Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.8 through 104.9.2 N 
Modifications, alternate means and methods, and 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
test 

104.11 through 
N 

Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of 
Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.11.2 systems 

104.11.3 N Authority of systems and devices inoperable Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.2.3 N Time limitation of application Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.3.1 through 
N Operational permits Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.3.2 

105.6.12 N 
Dry cleaning operational permits required for 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
hazardous cleaning solvent use 

 20-0203 C Page 29 of 41



;---

Permits for various business operations for: Magnesium, 

105.6.2.28 through Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation 

N Locally Adopted vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing facilities, open buming, 
105.6.35 fire and life safety inspections 

open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and 
organic coatings 

105.6.37 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Permits for places of assembly 
fire and life safety inspections 

105.6.39 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Permits for private fire hydrants 
fire and life safety inspections 

Permits for pyroxylin plastics, refrigeration equipment, repair 
105.6.41 through 

N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
garages and motor fuel-dispensing facilities, rooftop 

105.6.46 fire and life safety inspections heliports, spraying or dipping, storage of scrap tires and tire 
by-products 

105.6.48 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Permit for tire-rebuilding plants 
fire and life safety inspections 

105.6.50 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
Permit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material, 

fire and life safety inspections lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 cubic feet) 

106.1 through 106.3 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Fee schedules for permits 
fire and life safety inspections 

107.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Inspection authority 
fire and life safety inspections 

Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
equipment, re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping, 

108.1 through 109.3 N 
fire and life safety inspections 

Locally Adopted supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding, 
Board of Appeals established, limitations on authority, and 
qualifications 

110.3.2 through 
N 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Locally Adopted 

Compliance with orders and notices, prosecution of 
110.3.4 fire and life safety inspections violations, and unauthorized tampering 

110.4.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally Adopted Abatement of violation 
fire and life safety inspections 

113.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally Adopted Authority to disconnect service utilities 
fire and life safety inspections 

Asphalt kettles contain highly flammable substances and 
303.1 through 303.9 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical) 

Managing ignition sources through responsible application 
305.1 through 305.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted of standards will reduce the number of fires in various 

settings (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY 
306.1 through 306.2 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted flammable and require special handling (Climatic, 

geological, and topographical) 

307.1 through 307.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Open buming, recreational fire, and portable outdoor 
fireplaces, (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Open flame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

308.1.2 through 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 

Throwing or placing of ignition sources, torches for 
308.1.3 removing paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Locations near combustible, open flame devices, signals 
and markers, portable fuel open-flame devices, sky-

308.1.5 through 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 

lantems, religious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming 
308.1.8.5 food and beverage preparation, dispensing, containers not 

in use, serving of flaming food, location, fire protection 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.2 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Permits are required for above section (Climatic, geological, 
and topographical) 

 20-0203 C Page 30 of 41



_. 
Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices, 

308.3 through 308.4.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted theatrical performances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 
dormitories (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

310.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to smoking (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

310.3 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
'No Smoking' signs (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with 'No Smoking' 
310.4 through 310.8 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted signs, ash trays, buming objects, hazardous environmental 

conditions. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Vacant premises condition and safety requirements, 
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant 

311.1 through 311.4 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted premises, security, fire protection, fire separation, removal 
of combustibles, removal of hazardous materials. (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

319.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to mobile food preparation 
vehicles. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

319.2 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
Permits for mobile food preparation vehicles (Climatic, 

fire and life safety inspections geological, and topographical) 

Exhaust hood, fire protection, fire protection for cooking 
equipment fire extinguisher, appliance connection to fuel 
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, metallic 
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking oil 
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting, 
normal vents, emergency vents, LPilas systems, maximum 

319.3 through 
aggregate Volume, protection of container, LPilaS container 

319.10.3 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted construction, protection of system piping, LPilas alarms, 

CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel, 
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG 
container construction, CNG containers supplying 
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping, 
methane aiarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire 
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems. 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

403.8.1 through 
Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1 

403.B.t7 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted (residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and 

fire safety plans. 

403.10 through 
Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancy 

403.10.1.3 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic, 

geological, and topographical) 

405.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

510.3 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems 

fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a 
B07.5.2 through 

N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in 

807.5.2.3 fire and life safety inspections educational facilities (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-S 

g03.aS N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers) 

fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000 
square feet (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

 20-0203 C Page 31 of 41



r-
Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders 
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from 
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time 

Adopted this section in existing buildings for the 
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by 

1103.2 Y safety of firefighters and other emergency Locally Adopted 
the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind 

responders. 
this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury 
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0101.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads 
through 0102.1 firefighters, and other emergency responders. including loads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Oead end fire apparatus acoess road requirements for a 

Appendix 0: 0103.4 N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. 

Locally Adopted tum around at 150 feet. (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0103.6 N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
"No Parking, Fire Lane" signs requirements. (Climatic, 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0104.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus 

through 0104.3 N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. 

Locally Adopted 
acoess roads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

(excluding exception) 

Appendix 0: 0105.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

Requirements for aerial fire apparatus access roads 
through 0105.4 firefighters, and other emergency responders. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential 

through 0106.3 N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. 

Locally Adopted 
developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

(excluding exceptions) 

Appendix 0: 0107.1 
One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire 
(excluding exceptions) N 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. 
Locally Adopted 

apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 
through 0107.2 climatic conditions. 

Appendix 0: 0108 N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle, 

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

 20-0203 C Page 32 of 41



Cameron Park Fire Department 
lit cooperatiotl with /tie 

California 'epa"m,," and Fire Protection 

Fire Station 89 
3200 Country Club Drive 
Cameron Par1\., CA 95682 

(530) Sn-6190 
(530) 672-2248 FAX 

To whom it may concern, 

Fire Station 88 
2961 Alhambra Drive 
Cameron Pari!.. CA 95682 

(530) 672-7350 
(530) 672-7352 FAX 

For the Cameron Put Fire Department 2019 Fire Code Iidoption. public notiQe was achievro tbrouah 
posting OUT Notice of Intent in the following three locatiollll: 

• On the board located in the front of Fire Station 89 at 3200 Country Club Dr. 

• Packets placed in the front offICe &I Fire Station 89, and available for the p\.lbJic to view. 

• On the Districts website, detailing the location and time ofthc moeting where the adoption was 

going 10 take place. 

"The district was always forthcoming with the information of proposed changes and had it readily available 
for review by the public. Additionally, the: District gave enough time for public comment and viewing. 

led Gaines 
Fire Chief 

 20-0203 C Page 33 of 41



Cameron Park Fire Department 
In cooperation with the 

California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection 

Fire Station 89 
3200 Country Club Drive 
Cameron Park, CA 95682 

(530) 677-6190 
(530) 672-2248 FAX 

Fire Station 88 
2961 Alhambra Drive 
Cameron Park, CA 95682 

(530) 672-7350 
(530) 672-7352 FAX 

Attachment No. 2 

Cameron Park Community Services District 

Resolution No. 2019-22 

 20-0203 C Page 34 of 41



• 

RESOLUTION NO. 2019-22 

OFTHE BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

OF THE CAMERON PARK COMMUNnY SERVICES DISTRICt 

RESO l t.mON ADOPTI NG FI NDINGS SUPPORTING AM ENDMENTS TO DIE 

CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

A .-.lutian of the Cam~ron P .. k Community Strvlca District (District) letting forth lindinp with 

~spKt to local conditions within the District which INJu:o certain modlfkaticns and ch.an&es to the 

Califomi~ Fj~ Cod01 ru:oon.bly necessary for preservmg fi~ and life A/tty in tho! Cameron PnJ,; 
Communlty Servicn District. 

~ Governing Board ol the Cameron p.,J,; Community !Mot\l~ rmtric1 fin<h and re!IOlva as foIlowl: 

WHEREAS, Health", Saff'ly Code 5edlon 17958.5 pmnlts I Fire PtOkction District to .dopt an 

ordinan~ which dIiInges or modiOes the Stale Houli"3 ~ul.ti0n5 ;odopl~ pursuant to Health .. 

Safety Cod01 Sectioro 17922 upon detm'fll"IIIorI that such changes Of modific.tioos an ~ry due to 

L~.l conditiON tNt pert.1n ~ul.lions SO~InS con,hliono: hnardou. 10 Hfe. property .nd the 

environment from fi~ ~plofJo<l. h~rdoul INben..ls.nd hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, Health .. Stoftty Co<Ie Section 17958. 7IWJuire that a DiSlrict'1 Board of Directorl 

making my mangel Of m<KllfiClHON p"1W.nt to Hnlth 6: S.1~ty Cod~ ~ion 17958.5 sh.1I m.ke 

e~pl'elS fll'Kling that sud! chMlgt5 or modiflCltions Ire r'ftded; .nd ",.11 Ii"" copy of such manges Or 

modifiations with the Dtplrtment of HOI.IRng I,I\d Community Oev~lopment. 

WHEREAS, tht: unlq~ local ehll\ltic, geologk.t .ncl topognphicnt conditions e~isting within 

tht: bouOO"ries of tht: District mike it l"u5On.bly n«HSllry for th~ District to impose more stringent 

requirtments Ihan .1 forth in the c"moml. Fire Code and pursuant to C. tifomi. Heillth and s.~ty 

Code sections 13869.7 and 179~,7, the DiJlrltt desire. to m.ke exp~ lindings: to lhaldfect. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED thlt the IIoird of Directors of the Cameron P.r],; 

Community Services District after h.vlng. duly nol~ Ind held public mft'ling. Jow:reby .dopts the 

following findings concemlng eurrent unique loe.l eondltlOfll that together m.ke eld! modil1callOO 10 

the C.lifomia Fire Code, rclllOn,bly ne<:efl.lry to proYlde !td"'lu,~ ,00 .. I~ti~ p'oteaion of H~, 

property Ind the myi roo mcnt mOre spectfic.lly al forth II follow.: 

 20-0203 C Page 35 of 41



rr .. I . ~ 

FI NDINGS OF PACT 

fOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO ruE STATE BUILDING STANDARDS 
CODE (TITLE 24 PART 9) BECAUSE Of LOCAL CONDITIONS 

A G .. neral. 
After du .. consid .... riOO1, 1M brd of 01.-«10., of the Cameron Park CommunIty Services 
DistrKt}Cameron Park Fire OoI.".. tmmt ~reby find. that due to ~l dimatic. geologic and 
topographic rondihons. .. lIated wilhm this dOC\lmm~ there Is. ~ t<:> provide the modiHations 

and changes contained In thor ~op'lve Ordinance of the California Fin' Cod". Such changes are 
d~med reasonably n«Hary to provide adequate and effect"'" protection of lif .. , properly and the 

ft'IvironnvnL 

The Cameron Park Communl'Y ~fYices OiSlrlctJCameron Park Fi ... Department provides fire 
protection, emt ' 6"'OCY rNdk1ll_vic:es.nd ~Ii~ resc:u .. servi""" to approximately twenty-th reoe 
thOliund people in an 11 tqUln! mile 11ft. The DIstrict is located on the western ,lope of El Dorado 
County. llIe topography 01 the Dislrid ('()OS~1lI of. , .... mol vaJ~ along th .. ~r Crwk d.aiNl~, 

approKim.tely \'j mil .. wid .. with. narthWHI/-..thNsl orWentalion. Cameron Park', ,rn of the Pine 
Hi(( Preser~ is.ppro.i ..... teiy 425 IiCIft of INtu", stands 01 Manuni la and CMrT\l.W brush.nd dftIR 
OfIk woodland lolftll in tht' wesl "The weathe-r conditions v.ry from IMnin& tempellltura witt. 
ocrasional.now In Winter, 10 ,ummel" ~mperlltural th.t ro-gularly e.~ 100 cM.g~. 

The Districl Cln ~ divided Into four d,stinc1 .",.: "The~, soutnem .",., eneompuaes It.- Hwy 50. 
Cameron P.rk .nd C.mbrldge Ro.d rorndors. The ~ .",. is urban and .:antli ... mott 01 ~ 
District', "Isdng rommen:,.llnd ralidnotll i devdopmmts. The north Ind !'aS1 art .. typK".lIy conl.ln 
small ,ubdiv;'lon., goll roUrK, .irport .nd I 40 ICTe I.ke. The w"'~ .",. contlinl tht' PInt! Hili 

Preserve. 

The Cameron r.rk Community Services DistncVC:.meron Plri; Fi", ~rtmmt is In -.U·';';k" 

.gency, The District pnrtidpa tel in a sophistic:akld automa tIC lid progrllm and i. disfY~ through 

Igl'floernent by Ihe Callfoml. Department of Forestry and Firt rro~ion (CAL·FIRE), II Camino. 1lIe 
rtIOUlUS ol the District will rP.Ipond 10, and deal With, any type of emergency, The \Ie"" - Firt 

Prot«tion" (n this document i. broad and includes responses to all typH of fil'ft, smoke and odor 
uwelig<ltions. II.rIM, public assist eall., haurdous materials incid"nts, m~lc.J lid Ind spec ... lized 

~. 

The District has established two. fufHime .• taff~ Ii", statioru to provide emergero(')l .,rvl"", to the 
<;()mmunlty Fi", Station 89 15 loafed In Itw southern put of ~ unil'lCorporal~ .. ell of Cameron Plrk, 

" 3200 Country Club Drive. Fi", Station 88 Is loc3fed In the northern part of the unlnrorporated I",a 

of C.JnC'f'()n Plrk. It 2961 Alhambra Drive. "The DIStrict hIol 18 lutHIint'. CI~r ~rsonMI. along with 
twenty-five fYrt-lime Volun~ Resi<:k'flt firclighk-rs..nd two p<'Irt time Firt P",v.mlion Sp«ialills lor 
lhedistoo'. weed .Nlemerot progrllm, 

 20-0203 C Page 36 of 41



~ I " . . 

B. Climatic. 
The Cameron Park Community Services DistrictJCameron Park Fire Department Is located within a 
foothill region_ The District is subject to four Sl'asons, with an annual ave .... g ... snowfall in tile winter 
months of 1-2 Inches. in addition to In average rainfall of 40 inch~ P'" yen. These adverse wealher 

condition. ~a~ ","~re hazardO\ls road conditions and flooding as well as rock slide hazards along the 
main access roads WIthin, as well M into. the District from the surrounding areas. Due to period. 01 
tainfa l~ along with repeated road dosure!, the ability of the Fire Protection District 10 provide 
Immediate emerg~ncy ,..,.ponse is at tirn~ delayed. 1Mse same &dverse climatic cond itions often 
result in a large number of vehirota. accidents that place ext~e restraints on the availability of 
emergeney response to perform emerg\'1'\C)' rescue, first aid. haurdous materials control Ind 
ftrefigh ting_ The climatic conditions olten result in a lubstantial or lotal lack of ability of the Fin: 

Protection District to respond immediately to other types 01 emergencies thlt occur. 

E~amples 01 these emergencies include structure fires. vehicle fires, wildland (gra .... brush. timber). 
fires, flooding.. huardous material5 incidents. emergency medical calls. vehicle accidents and vertical 
rescues. The mutual.id agreements established with adjoining fire ag .. ncles might not be possible due 

to ad"".,... climatic conditions, restricting or totally blocking access into the District. 

Summary: 
Th~ locil climatic conditions affect the acceleration. intensity. and $iZl! of fires in the District. Times of 
little or no rainfall. low humidity and high temperatures create "~tremely hazardous condi tIons, 
particularly 115 they relate to the wild land· urban int"rl~ (WUJ). Winds npet ienC4'd in this are. can 

hive. significant impact upon structure fires. e5f"'Cially in bui ldings in dOH pro~imlty to (1ne another. 
and 10 wildlands comm<>nly found in the Cameron Pltk Community SeT\lkes Oist"cI . Structures built 
within the ClIme,...,n Park Community SeT\lices Dislrict must be built with these variable in mind. 

C. G.ological. 
Th. Cameron Park Community ScT\lices Districl is located within modera te activity Itel5mic Zone 3. 
The se ismic. geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires. major breakage of water mains, 

multip le el«trical power fai lu res. multiple collapsed slructures and a large number of calls f<.tr 
emergency medical aid. all of which may occur simultaneously during. seismic evmt. The water 

district has nume1"(1llS water-pumping ,y.tems used for fire suppression water dcliv~. as well as 
water storage tanks providing water sy,tem pressure. Most of the pumping sy.tems are dependent on 

el«trical power for operation. Such electrical power may not be available during a !leismic event. 
Water storage tanks used lor the storage of nequ ir...:! fire suppression water may .1,..., ooItapse in such 
an event forcing the additional need to transport water via additional pieces of fire apparatus, which 

will place. significant .... tra;nt on the abil ity of the Disldcl to p rovide the required emergency 

5eT\lICCS. 

Summary: 
local geographic Dnd geological features and pl'<.t«"SSCS e>;sl withit' the boundnries oItlte distt1ct IMt 
may hamper the ~b;lity of the Came...,n P<trk Community s"T\lices OistrictJCamcron Park Fire 

Deparlment to po!rform Its SwOrn duties. Fire following an earthquake has Ihe ~ntial of causing 

g~a ter loss of lile ~nd damaSe than the earthquake itself. 

 20-0203 C Page 37 of 41



• 

D. Topognphic, •. 
The District is primarily ('Qmpo$N of '~H that are ronsld<:-red by the State to be hipl fire h.zard 
sev~rity won, Mud! of ~ 0i5trin i.locatl/d wIthin foothill m-noin, ~ with highly rombu~lible 

"~el " l jon, Induding the pl'ftel1t'e of many mature ,land, 01 bru5tl. and dMse oak woodland·fotested 
.re ... The elevation within the District r.n&es from.t 1.000 feet 10 over 1,600 feet" tIw highHl poinL 

Slopes within the District ranses from 1S'IIo.~ up 10 thIo ndS" tops. ~ structur'leS within tho:-.,"" 01 
foothill. terrlin h ...... vey Jimj~ fire a«HI. due 10 narrow roadways and driY~,ys with steep 
gtadn and poor lurf.~ ronditiQl'l$. ~ p~ of many e'lrislinl! slructurn witt"" the hi", fire 
hu.td ",vemy wne .re •• provldH for • "PrY high ~""'11lI1 of • structure fire s~.dlng into • 

wildland or forest fire conditioI'! .. well .. the pol"",liaJ /or. wild1",'" Or lornt fire sprudm& 10 
strucl\ln'I. 

Summary: 
The .lignmMt of mnrons. valley. and slopes into ;nhabite<l areas. rombi~ with the .... n.ble "I",re 
of the temun. yield I potential for increaSOl'd rore risk. Mosistructures. both residHlh.l.nd rommoerd.L 

.re in. or .re surrouNled by areas that contain a Significant grass, brush. mixed <HIk woodland, .nd 
mlx~ conifer fuel l<HId. Due 10 drought conditions, beel!!. inlestaticms, .nd I..:k of vegelation 
m.n.gement, much of the ,rea i5 populated with either dead or dying trees, conlribu llnll to lOTI extf"l'!T1e 

fire dangu. 

E. Conclusion: 
Loal d"""Iic". g~raphlc .nd topographic co.xlltio.)! described above increase 1M lrequmc:y, 
inlens'ry, .nd slU' 01 fires involving buIldings in the Flff Dislrict Fu.tMr. Ih_ conditions Impact 

po~tial d'rnllge to structures from an orthquah and subR-quenl firr. 11lereforo, II is reasonably 
~ry lluot the Colifonua FR C~ M mod,rled 10 millgalt the elfecu of Ihe.~ """dilio .... 

California Health" Safety Code Section 17958.7 requi,"" th.t modifications to t~ Fire Code M 
expressly marked and ident,f..-d as to whim am finding refen to which Code modlflcalion. The 
,tllched Appendix A provide5 this connection 

PASSED AND ADOPTED.t. regu;'r meeting of the Board of DIr«\Qr$ of the C.meron Park 
Communlry SMvkn District on Cktober I~. 2019 by the follow;"'! roll nil v~; 

AYES: VV\~ I \+\'1'\, K., fW I ~A 
NOES: ho""-'!.... 

ABSTAIN: I"lO-n.L 

ABSENT: .., """-
A."",,, 

Director M uc Scobey, Vice President 
Board of Direclors 

 20-0203 C Page 38 of 41



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
101.1 X Admin 

105.6.27 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.6 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra phica I 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

505.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

509.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

 20-0203 C Page 39 of 41



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

6112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

Appendix B: Table B105.1(1) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix B: Table B105.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0104.4 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

101.2 through 101.5 X Admin 

102.6 through 102.8 X Admin 

102.10 through 102.12 X Admin 

103.1 through 104.1 X Admin 

104.3 through 104.4 X Admin 

104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin 

104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin 

104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin 

104.11.3 X Admin 

105.2.3 X Admin 

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin 

105.6.12 X Admin 

105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin 

105.6.37 X Admin 

105.6.39 X Admin 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin 

105.6.48 X Admin 

105.6.50 X Admin 

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin 

107.1 X Admin 

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin 

110.4.1 X Admin 

113.1 X Admin 

 20-0203 C Page 40 of 41



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 

303.1 through 303.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

305.1 through 305.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

306.1 through 306.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

307.1 through 307.5 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

308.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

308.2 X Admin 

308.3 through 308.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.4 through 310.8 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

311.1 through 311.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topograph ical 

319.1 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ica I 

319.2 X Admin 

319.3 through 319.10.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

403.10 through 403.10.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

405.5 X Admin 

510.3 X Admin 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1.5 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

1103.2 X Topographical 

Appendix D: Dl01.1 through 

D102.1 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: Dl03.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.6 X CI i matic/Geologica I/T 0 pogra p h ica I 

Appendix D: Dl04.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

D104.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: Dl05.1 through 

Dl05.4 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D106.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Dl06.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: Dl07.1 (excluding 
X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

exceptions) 

Appendix D: Dl08 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

 20-0203 C Page 41 of 41


	Resolution_Cameron Park
	Reso Cameron Park 2-25-20



