
/ 

RESOLUTION NO. XXX-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 015-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is 
updated by the State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958 .7 and 18941.5 
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines 
are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, 
Chapter 1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety 
regulations to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building 
official, or his or her authorized representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or 
her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the 
chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and 
maintain a memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining 
to the inspection of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on November 21, 2019, the Board of Directors of the El Dorado County Fire 
Protection District adopted Ordinance No. 2019-02, which adopted the 2019 California Fire 
Code with amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or 
topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El 
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-02 of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District and 
delegates the enforcement of the ordinance to the El Dorado County Fire Protection District 
Chief, or his or her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following 
sections: 

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106 .7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4 through 
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1. 
507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 
903.2.9, 903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 9 07.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 
4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 
through 6112.3, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 130-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 
Section 4.7, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D -2016 Section 5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 
7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table Bl05.1 (1), Appendix B: 
Table B105.2, Appendix D103.1 through D103 .3, Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix 
D103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4.  

  20-0203 E Page 1 of 39



Resolution No. XXX-2020 
Page 2 of 2 

 
 
 

The El Dorado County Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, 
Part 9, in its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International 
Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

 
105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403.4, 
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12, 
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808, 
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, 
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception), 
D107.1 (Exceptions  1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, 
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M. 

 
Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 

 
 
 
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of 
said Board, held the _____ day of _____________________, 20__, by the following vote of said Board: 
 
 Ayes: 
Attest: Noes: 
Kim Dawson Absent: 
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors  
 
By: _____________________________________ _____________________________________ 
 Deputy Clerk Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Board of Supervisors 

 

  20-0203 E Page 2 of 39



De«mOer la, 2019 

"'We are ;klllelilalll ..J"U"fIiintlll..J""f!fusfmuU Il1fIf 
cQll1"teous uryu:e 10 our atunu 6NI communtlU!J wi,1i 

7"ndL, Tnul <f Inlwtty. w 

Don Milton, Chief Administrative Offic~r 
El Dorado COImty Board ofSupervilOB 
)30 Fait Lane 
PIKttViJ~. CA 95667 

Subject: RaoluriGo IUtifyiol Ordioanu No. 2019-112 of the £ 1 Dorado CO Mnly Fire 
Protection Dlitrici. " 'hkb adopts the 1019 CalifornIa f1re Code wllh 
I mendm(nlJ n:latrolo 1ac.1 dimatic.IlWlraphk and lopoaraphic fondllknu .. 

Dear Mr. Ashton: 

The El Dorado County Fire Protection District (ECF) is ~ucstJ'"" the Board of Supcrvison 
(BOS) rat ify its Ordinance No. 2019~2. which adopts the 2019 CllIi(OftUI, F~ Code as ~ 
due to sp«ific local climatic, geoiflphk and topographic conditiOOI. CllIifomia Health and 
Sllfcty Codc ~ction 13869.7 ~uires the legislative bod)' of 1M city or oowny when: the 
ordinance win apply 10 ratify, modify or deny the ildoplo:d ordinance. The 80S must 1lI1O 
delesate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fin: District (or its reprexntatiw) Of !be 
Cbief BuildiMj Official. 

"Therefore, we ~ual the County Board of Supcn,ilOrs rati fy Ordinance No. 2019--02 with 
IIIllCOdmmts to !be 2019 California Fin: Code. and delepte the enforec-ment of that Ordinance to 
the El Dorado County Fire ProIeCtJon Disaict Chief. A proposo:d BOS resolution is enclosed for 
your revi~w and use on this topic. 

This resolution has no dir«1 fillCll impac:t to the County. 

Lloyd 0&111 
Fire Chief 

AlTACHMENTS: 
I. EI Dorado County Fin: Pmlection District Ordinance: No. 2019.(12 
2. EI Dando County Fire Prtl'Iection District Findinl ofFKt Raolu~iOf1 No. 2019-0' 
), DrIft EI Dorado COWlI)' DOS Resolution 

Et D<ndo CounIJ ".. P,_. CIioIrId • oI(WO c..on RDIiII I PO Sa> 101 • c.nIno, CA ~TOII 
53011 " ge)(l . '30 au 8nll~ 

  20-0203 E Page 3 of 39



Attachment No. 1 

EI Dorado County Fire Protection District 

Ordinance No. 2019-02 

  20-0203 E Page 4 of 39



. ' •• • 

£ 1 DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DiSTRiCT 

ORDL-'ANC£ 10"-01 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE OOARO OF DrRECTORS OF THE EL OORADO 

COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS . 

... onti ...... of .. £1 Dor.do c..:...,. Fino PtoI..aioll DlItriet (£erPOI .... in& .. 2019 Wirio- 0/_ 

QW~Jthc .... io ..... pooMin ... 2011 Editiaaoftho "'_1oftaI Fh Cc*, .......... _F.uaio"_ 

.repaard"" oIlir. .. "opo" froII!I rlN MCI t.qIIoIioII IlaUtdl arili!\l fn)m 1M...,..., handlIII Md _ 01 

~ ... bIr I, _1Irab _ dro .... ...:I &va. a)ndllluu IIuanIauI WI ld'l or P"'I*'Y .. lilt ere', ICy of 

.ildinp Ad pr.-ita .. h EI Dondo CoooMy f""" P'I-'on OIt1riQ, prOVid1lll tor l1li ~ af pen1lillllld 

coIJeaion 01_ dlefd'or. a..p..l ... 0nI_ No. 2016-02 01 the EI Oondo Coom\y Fino ~_ 0;.....,. ... 

til 0Ihw ord'lIIoIICCIlA(I pMS 0(II1II 00II_ .. -'lie! dwwwidl 

Be it ORDAINED by eM s-d ot 0,,_. 01-. f.CfPO, ..... boo- u .... EI DondoCoulry Fire 

""-iOOI DostritI; 

Section l : fltl DlNGS Q f lACJS 

Settiool 2: ADOPTION Of COPE WIT" UCbUSIONS 

Section J: LOCAL AMENPMENTS 

Section 4: CONUICI 

Section s: SEVERABILITY 

~ion 6: f:FFECIlVE DAn; AND PUBLICATION 

S£CflON I: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

The EI Oondo County Fino J'ro(ection Oistriet "' .... -W" ch.npa (1isMd _ low) 10" C4II1foo"" 

Fin CooN, 20]9 Ediliorl, pUfNIIIl to H ... /I" .. $tJftry CrxJ. $«tllw IJfd97, /"''''' N>d Im/.J duma !bill 

oocI8 adopt;a.. proc.a:a. Suth c.lwtJa are __ ry boo:allM or low.l cl~~ ~I lIIIMr1I ...... itaI 

conditiool.. The EI Dondo County Fino ProIection Dillricl hal adopted. ~ 10 Sm_ 11ff/.S 01 .. 

C«ijonUa IhobJt d SGfdy CodtI, the filIdillll or *11 rel.'i .... to theM conditions by RaoIuc;o.. no l~ or 

the El DondoCounty Fire I'IOIeC:tiol, OiJIOOdUId Oc.obe r 17,201'. 

SECTION 1: ADQPIIOf'l Of CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

The EI Dando Cooanty fin ,..,--." Di$Irict 1IdopU!be 201' ~ Fh C ... , 1Wr 11, hIf', II. 
!Sa ntintr, iDcludinc AjIpendka. iltwt ..... orina tltoee I<diaIs «It. 1M ..... Fh Codr, 201Iedmo. DOl 

ad ,.. ... by ....... willi .. ucl ....... 1iIIId _low: 

.... ' 
  20-0203 E Page 5 of 39



• . . 
Exdumn., 10S.6. 11·10H. l~. lOS.6J9, )01.1.4, 109. 111.S. 11 1.6, JII, ~.I, 4Ol~ 1-4112_4. 4OlJ, 

.oM. 403.6, 40} .7, 40U (.oo,cma 40) .' .1-403.1.1 .7), 403.9, 403 .10.2. 4OJ.LOJ, 403.1 L, 411) 11,tD4. 1..04 4, 

4OS . I~.4. 4OS.6-4GU. 4(16, 101-101 ( .... 1D1107..s2), 101, 904.1.1. 1101. 1100.1. 11033-110,6,. 11113.9 

(adoJIIII\I1101.9 .1), 1103.10, 1104.1106, ~ 25, Chajlw 26, 1M exceplion, under DIOU~ ..... ), 

0106.1 (Exoepc.cn). DIO'.! (EIg;~phl.). A$P h A. Appe<IdUl E. ~ix F. AppMtdix a. ~ J, 

AppendIX Ie. ""penchl( 1.. Appendix M. 

Cok 

SECTION 3: LOCAL AMENpMFNTS 

n. klllow!.. Sea_ .... hereb)' ~ or ldr:Ieot 

Ch. pltr 1 

5«1!tr 111 !imp ltd CtlMAI "".!net.1I 

If' ,! TiIk shall \Ie &llW!ncSaI Q follows.: AdtI_ '" j _1MJid1tM (£1 DtwodD c_'1 Fh .... ""'l",," 

t:IiUncf. £CFPD] 

S!<'tIotlOS ftmlll 

115.t.l7 I..PG=t;M abaU be Imtnded u I'oIIows: Add 10 1M aUption; At or.bow ,"000 r.. of 

ele¥lhOCl, I pennlt it IlOl required for IndiY\duI.1 COIIUI~ with. 12S-pllon .... ~i.,. or I ..... 

M ... lIltipk _ .... ,~ hav" on ......... ~tiry IlOl UClMdlnc 125 .......... ~ 

CIIlCUpMC_ in 0...., It.). 

&s .... IM ". 

IOU f't[!llb PIn Brl •• " . ' ''W!Ig. fa. aho,U be ~ .. follows: A .... 1. qfjlu 

±. it.,.. .. ""'""" ~ tf dhclon JW ,.,. nritw, 1 ..... _ .. tIM W- fI/ p"-ils 

II}I'" "k'"" kfr-ttJ Irt 1M -n n" .. ",dulr .. ,/K x ...... (lkohlt. ~()o'Cocir 17951). 

IN.,,! eM' RU!!f" fHf IMl1 b. ~ as follows: F ____ jlu...,. .. dwrtd-....,. 
p«'_ jfr-. ClllJiO' ./cIOt ~ _"" .... dtoI ',,",,«II ....,;,,-:. . .,w ......... '-. ~. OI"UlliI of 
"'"~ II ,..,.. riM« /III' l1li _ of /Jw dWrkl '" ...,.. '" • _ ... t!/ _ 1M'" ,j 

dUirkt '*"' '"""II' ~ 0". • _ lito _ of 4WO' M'¥Ia ....... l1li diMPkf,. ' . ~ "" 

tMl of .l'jotTbtc....,. ~Jor "'ldllIw". u cJtorrH (Ntttllll" ¥O' c.. 11914/. n. 
je ... ,., -" .. .,.,. toIIt tif ......... ...,.., lIw /h tIPdb> "9' £,. _ ....... t!/­
itf€idrlll. 

10fJ Ad.i_Wn lt? Cttu lid buckled _ fi:lliowl. W1wu _ .. j.. " I..... +' .. -, 
lIN CUi'" "'lOY /fib 1(1 ,.ifotr- '" .. ~lio#I of lIN tIIIIltorii)c ........... jwbdicriM (AJU). tilt 

.... , 
  20-0203 E Page 6 of 39



, ' " 
AHJ .-,. bil/IM _IX_ P ocfWII 11_ ~1fI """"'"" 10 fMd J-t tJw IcsIiIllSPfdiim /ouI/tNr 

_ /1. ,i".. ''-'" til ,,. ~JU",spttliO" Ilk as >wI/ ill """""l4rr",,,,," co.w. 

SnUo. 109 B6ani of Appulo 

M OD 10M Appeal Pr!ftd" g lad Tlmelion shall t.. added u follows: 11".1' pmtm 01' tfllily 

",Iw> ~I""" ,Iwy....,. be adwrMIy q/fiH:tfd by "" 0I'dw, dtci4iott, Of' .. __ .", _edt by dte 

fin codr offlClol Ihroltglt " ..".i/l." ..oI;c. "'''>' appealil'/J _kr ... lIhi" I j c(Jk.w ~ of 1M 

ptUtJtIarl .,.. ,Itt. ""',", All #'«11 ~oU sItdI boo ji/ul lit -III,. ""111 filii s.crrtary of 1M 

0,-"","1 &>ard /Dr 'M dUtrra A n-/y..",." .., Mtty fwtlwr..moo. by ,I. jft code ojfIciDl 

II1II11 tIw _k, IJ drrr,m/ned by ,!til. A~allkKrd QI ow"mtd Irr S«Ii"" /(19.1 . ....... 1M law 

poas _ i_ I""", fin (Ii" lifo -/tIry ItazonIIO _",bnt af IIw ptdJik. :n. jh code QjJicitJlshDJl 

ltOfify dw opptllDrlf by cmifod _II oj II. dmr f110d n- of nidi M<ri..:. 71w Iw ..... IItDJJ IN 

KIwduI#d 10 ,. pi"" "".JODIWr lhim 10 ctll.ndar ~ from rlw _ ,/oow" (lit IIw rmlf/td _II. 

:nw QppfIlQltl Pta/J Mw 1M ,p 10 tJPPft' b! ~,_ 01' .,. QIfI'" til IN Iturl", trtrtJ ptYMW ONII, 

""i(U" Q/WVtJI' pItoI~ic ........... If> tJw Ap/xtM /kNIrJ. 

Sectio.1I 0 Viob!lou 

110 .• Vk> •• 11011 fellillm ..... 11 be Il/Ilended u foiIoWl: Persons ",ho lhall vioWe. pIOvWon of 

Ibis coo. Of' Ihall fall to comply widllIIY of the requin:menu thereof or who nil net, inocall, 

liter, repllr or do ""'011< in viollotion of the approved C(lnSlrUClion docwromu 01' direct ... of dle m 

code offICial. or of. permit or c:eniilClllo used under provision. of III;' oMe. nil lit luilly of • 

...... __ or ~Iimo, • tit. ~,kJII of 11M pt'W«t'tilf(f lJIIonwt>, or """'Y. ~e by • 

fine not uo:eedin. 1100.00 p Q /inI ,,/Q/."": Z. A fow _ euftdi"l UOO.oo", Q IKOItII 

~iokM"" of tIw. _ f't'OvlskJII willtm _ ~ ... ; J. II fi,., lOOt u«~dl", SlDOO.OO p I«iI 

<MidilioNll rioIDtitNI of IItt _ ",.",ubi wldtbt _ ". .... crt by imp OOoV!lellI DCIt a<eedinl 180 

•• or both well fine.no:! imprisonment. EaI:h day 1hIt. viol.rinn oanlinuos.ftIr duo notice_ 
beta tened nil b8 dftme<!. aepanlle oITetl-Se. (Hwlllo" &(cryCtJdf Sulloru BUS tad /1991). 

1l0.4J Chario., shall b8 Idded u follows: n. Firt Cloitt/. or JrUnwr 6JtJy Q"'lotJriud 

"'I"H"'tJ/iw, """ taw c/lmltNu ftx irrfroclIDN (JI' ",Udt __ WoItJfiDtv of lloil cook fIIfT­

.., SuI.... J W / of tit. H.Dldt .. St/Itry eo. of dw SltJU of CrJifD'nltJ -' C~r X 

(~IOCin;J willt Set'//ofIIJJ.d) olTil16 J of I'fft 1 <>flltt I'~_ eo. OIIM ~ ofc.J1fonria. 

Sudol lU S.9P Wtrk Onl., 

Ordinana: 2019-«2 

  20-0203 E Page 7 of 39



, , .' 

10.4. [.Unt '0 Ct"pl. lhall be Imendcd IS follows: Any penon who ,hall contiue any wof1c 

after ha_inj bem IerV'IId with • SII,lp-.-t. onStr, eJlccplsuch -"'- u 111M p8I'JOtI i directed 10 

pctform to remove. viol .. ion or...uafe condi1ion, shill bepwUlrobit byQjI,.. .... u..prisoto_O' 

Ilol10 (If ducr/IxJ '" S«rion 110.4 (II."',,, .. Saftty Codl S«fionl l J/ 45 tutd / 7995) 

Ckapter 1 

Stslla. 101 e n enl Den,' lIul 

Add definition for Clrnpfio - Shtlll "",<lit /I Jh wllk!! Is "",, for rooki",. ,... __ 1 _10, 

lig""",, .... ocSt/wrk P"'11(U'4- ~ ;"<:I"d,, ft~1 conI(J/'lCd wft/lbo , .. "daor frtploas and 

,OtC/o#d ,_, wi,ltft_ art:ltilrtMYI. _, ... ingjdlkd. liq.ld. 01' lCIidfwb, fJOt'f<ibh buolNe'" 

pili. brtulf". tJI' spa« Iota,;,., droicu ... 1IkII.".. tuflJ Olll.i'* "1-,. ""W:huy • ... 1to.I, .,.. 

""y 1M,. O«OmllfOdation _ell Of! /I ..,lUck 

Add definition fur D!t!riC:1 - SItaIl _aw 1M dUuiCf I»td all ",/w, ""QI .....,. tJ. al,,,*,, 

/wJ"..a...w"IwTNj _ 01' IwmJ/l" UlablWttd. 

Add definifi,ooo> for pdveway • SJtDIJ _ II w/uctJDr QCCIU /lrtIIsvws ttp /0 r- {2J ptre,l, ""Ift "" 

~ ,""" two (2) .."ldnllol ..,Icr _...,. ~umbu cf ~lM1'Cid '" Ittd!uIril;1J ~ 011 fadr 

--,. 
Add definition for £1"",,1; •• Bt'h - SItoII ....... '1o, Boardofl»«1Cn oj,. ~I 
Add ddin,tlon for fin CIllIt' - SItGII ~" I. C'*j £%cell"" Fire 0fIi«r f{ dw Fitw 

.por, .... ..ttlinrlt;t .""int It. j o;;nu,lilH/ ar II "'9' arA/toI'iud npnU" IQlfW'. 

Add doofinitiOl'l far Tnl.eeI Cro .... Mugu . SltaJI_ IlOndby ~,._I . ........,." s«~rity 

pard or NSIN, ~ .. _1. .. /00 "" fTrJi..a hi lIN fN'OI1" pt'OC.m.n 10 all J»Opkjwl" u. or 

DlIm plQCf of pwbI/c _ ",blQp lit "" ONIIrly __ CQI_ fosh/oif lit u.. 'Will of"" '-""'" 

CIa.pler3 

Smjo. Wi ptHD jljo!! 

301,1 p,n. llioft' dlall boo uneD<lcd u foI ...... : Added Campfire definition, u ohOlOfl IIbove in 

0..-' 

Seclloa 307 Ope. BUaIAl, RUruUoMI fir!!. ted O.ldO?r flrepluu 

ltU,t C.mpnre Rglris1loAl m.n boo DIal u follows : 

197,4{U 11 " tUtI_foIliJn.'Y /Nr_ 10 IftItI, _1nI1J/", or..,." ctJmpji.., ....,.. 01' ..... ....,.1IrooJh. 

cowrwlltmd. ~..,d 1<II1II( 01' forui--- bod drm", lIN m. .. 11111 II ....... JlllnflliJ ... 

~M.Jp''''d by dw DirfcIOl' tl/dw Dt~* of F~'" Fw ProIICl .... u.. cu. FlU UNJ 

CItf4 01' u.. AHJ. 

ExrqtkHI: C-.-cid coo.tuc <IpUtIf/olts .. itJr .... otIQ/ of/III AHl 

Ordinance 2019-02 

  20-0203 E Page 8 of 39



, .. 

307..4.4.1 W/wn co"'PflN!s _ tJJl~_d, it ~ ~ ~N_fiJ P "'tI' "..-- to 116111, _,1IIOi1l, or 

aN <I CtJmpft .... 1IptJII any bnd~d Ia..t. K"fJU<ow..,d I.-( or jOI'~/l-ct'lw,..d IIlIIII ~nlus ,'" 

foIlowu., "'''''''' ..... rwtMInIMnl.J <In to...plied willi. 

307.4.1.2 t)) The tlTfl> w/tIJi" J fori of dw fMr/phf:ry of dw cQmpjln .. c1.~d of III flolMltlbl. 

_ .. /ttl tmd """'Qllan, 

)01 ,01.4,2 fbI ON urvic.obk sJwr,.e/ ",/11. I> Nmdl, of DI 1_ f 2 iltchu .. nar6- }It IIH at IItt 

;m_dia,_aofllw~ 

)17,1,4.1 CsI c-.pjlrt' Utall II<r IlmilM 10 " I foot by I to« _Q, amku In .. approwd 

~IUTed C40Idng dnl« or jh "",. 

307AAJ (d) W,jl/,,, p"nrow/on of ,It. Iandow.w, ",11$1 be o/)tni,.d prioI' to Iitt ipiIiorr of IIw 

campfi .... <»ttJ Mall IN on ~I,.. 

Chplt r 5 

Sec ljoG 503 tl n APDII''''' AucH Ro .... 

503.1.1 Dlmta,jo .. ..... 11 be IImeIIded. III followf;; Fi", lIlI*"tIIS ...un ro.ds aboU ""-VI: .., 
unoblttvcted widdt of nDI ,_ lIoan :zo foec. excl",.i .... of JIIouJders, Q4 _<UWtdjrom fo« of cwb ,., 

Joe- ofcwb, UoepI foropp o.ed KCurity """ in aecotOance with Section 5O) ,6,..wi ~ 

~ical clearanee of no( 1_ dIUI I J /Pl. All ~I hi IIw dUwicl sItall_ 1M lui tNJII 121m .... 
S9JJ.5 pud bd, ,hall be amended _ follows' o-d-end fire ~ KCeJI ro.do -a 
"'I~ in DOW of 1 50 fOCI in Icntlll ahall be provided with In apJIrOVtId_ for rumina .round 

fiftoppan.t .... 

S93.U 8lidu, ... tln.ltd 5ufacet ..... 11 be .".eIIdocI III follows: Where • bridF or an 

elevalod 1IIff_ it pt.r1 of. fire .~ ..:ell road, !be bridae sh.n be COftIlrU«ed ..... 

m.intained In ~ ..,III! IIw cwr.N EJ Dorado CoWl/)' T''QIISpon oriott t:IMJIo" Br~ 

Slandord Of' ~,.,j~ D of m. , ......... CoJjfomifJ Fin QIdr, ..,I!k,,"-, 11_ rulrittM Bridges 

Mel elcvMed sunK ... Ih.u be dIIIigncd fer • live load ,ufflcient to cany the impoMd Iof.ds of !'itt 

I.pJ*1I1w.. Vchiclc.1oed limitlnll be posted at bod! enlnI1ces to bOdies when mlUirec!by the Fire 

CodeOffocial. WIIer$ clevaled I~ o;Ia.ia:ned forcmerrncr ~hiclc. \l1li .. IdjacalllO IIIIfaces 

which are noI desianed for """" .... oppnIowd bInicr'a, ...... o.ed .i ..... III bod! shall be installed 

and mlilltained when required by tho flTt! co.s.offocill 

593.4.2 No Yuki .. I. fin Lug wU be edded u roiloWl: No fM'-' slltlllllOp. ptri;. Of' __ 

slandi", OIl)' -..1tkI, . ..,,..,Itt,, QlI,wkd Of' _uwk,( UDlJII .. 1w1l MC'utrf 10 aoold COt!/fkf ..,Id! 

otJw, troffic Of' III eompllll'J« wi/lt tJw rllnCliolt$ 0/1_ Fh ClWt Of' IIWMr Ny olll/w;wUd 

,.,prnclllatM. P_ 0fI/cIr Of' ojJid« troffic colllrOJ "'b 010lI:l_ ,d,tI qf any iIIp..ay, III ...,. 
"ri. Of' III ...,. locoIiOll III <I pulJik/y Of' prlwUly """'" or optl"Oktl 06-1 ptri/Irs foci/ii)', 

OnIinance 2019-02 

  20-0203 E Page 9 of 39



" 

duipol~d /U .. fin Im¥ by'" d41riN ""i,1! }lII'rsJicflmf owr l~ _ .. ilf .. lrich ,,. pIrft is locattd. 

1M duit_io" ,1tQl1 Of Iltdicaud (/) by {J .It" pMud i.lf'ffd;ort/y actOUP\l /(). a"blsU. /rom. 
'1M dtl'gnMtd ~ ~I,ar/y "atm, ht Imer, _Ius 11Iim0M _It bt /wlgNI!tQt do. fill« is 1Ij/N 

1_, (]) by o~/Ii"1I1I ar ptlillli"f 1M pion in nd..".( iii «111"<>.<11", cokJ" "'orki"1l . plDtIl wi/it 

1M wwdr "FIRE t.ANE", wlrkll an c/,DrIy ...uUJJ./roIIl .. w/tiek. or (Jj by .. nd cllt'b or r'fd painl 

.,., dtt ,tip of 1M roadway IIpMI wlut;" is c/,arIy 1fI • ..t,d ,''' -= ~FlRE LANE ~. 

'Old} No fJ rk!ac II! ['0.1 prJl vd cu .. shall be .cIcIed '" follows: No~,..". Utail4 p<ri. (JI' 

ktIW ./,,,,6. '"")' wllk/t .. kIWI /J}HI of II fin hydrtm/""pt <ufo/low" (0) If- wlt;';h iI 

tHurdui by Q IiCflltUd drlvtJr ... 110 is _/!/ted in 1M /roIIf _ and ... Ito can ,,,,_diDu/f_ swlr 

willel, III CQH cf Me",i.". (II) if ," "irick Is _".d or ~ro",J by ,,/iN .. ~ ..... It 

c"'* _t.d '" "fi" "par"'''' ... "ide, 
593.4.4 fin Lug B.ped U Road Wid'. JboJI be addtd as ("lIows: F .... ~ llIaIIbc ~ Oft 

rood width ar ,,",~ind ;11 A~..JU 0 lIS a_"''' by /1. d"tria 

SO).!!,) FiN ADPart'a' Mug G'!H l1li11 be ~ed as folio",,: AII_1c and _wi pI> 

wfDl/,d ow' fin t>pp<lN#JU «CflU 1"CJOtb Ihall towyJIy wid! 1M dimicl FI' uQIt(bod,. ~ 

by tIw fin roM ojfkiIJI. 

Sectlo. 50S Pa!!iH IdultnCltj9! 

SOU AShlrm I!hll llr",.du ah,tl M" the (om tine of thil "" ...... .mended u fOllows: 

Addt'fun far _ and ulJl,,,, bMildinp IhJII C'OMpIy .. /I~ tIw dlJfTicf ....ton", tw~ GJ 

GpfII'O .. d by II .. fh codr qfficid. 

Stttloll S!!7 Flf'! P tlI 'K 'ion Waler S.poUn 

SOl.! .• Wllef'! Rt9lirtd &halt be amended u follows: 400 feet shall be amended to Jj(Jjnt. 

ScctIGa 509.3 fiR Cta.rot Roo!!! 

599.3 ria Comol Roo9! Fh /'rrwct;o" <md Utmry Eq,.;p-"f 1""",fiwlloN IUJd A«US. II 

Iwnb]! "",,"lkd b]! oddi,., tIw joIhlwl"f 10 nod; Fh lpriMler .uws, fir- aJ.. ~ fJOI'Wls. 

JOkr pItoIgYoIfllic pqoH • .I)<S"'" rapid IJ.Iojf ""Itclwl, and tNlwr fh ""diM, l ....... uiotI, QIT 

" ",UOI' ct;JIItrO/ ""lklwllltol bf locoI,d flU'" II ,I,.S. fire ~ __ for IIw hihMJ. TIw fh 
CONrY;JI _ .hall ".... """I,""," di_tuio#tt 01 ftw /NI by .""}iN1 ill • wllit " _I _IIbI, 

....,,, ofllOllcu Ilron JJ ~J"'. TIw __ .hall /w /octItff ... /I/IJII11w b .. iIdi,. 011 .... tItIlJWr 

Wf{I/J «II I_iott "fIP'O",d by IIw Fh C"" O/fici(JI oIfIl sJooJl/W tlC«U/~ fro. tIw ~r'or . .hi 

/U/qior O«U;$ dot, "ItA /I tic"" wict~ qf _ INs "- J1 iltclru _ • -itN _ lou ,-. MJ 

irtdw, shall /w ~d /Of' OCCUI iNo tIw _ . A dwWIc .ip 1It/Il1/w ttfiud 10 ,., ,xtcrit)1r 0( 

IIw __ wh~ tIw wwcb "FIRE. CO/'IT'ROL ROOM" ill "',"". _ b"- 4 11rcIw,. lteipt A 

Ordinanot 2019-02 

 20-0203 E Page 10 of 39



.,. !wor comp/fotf ... idr Soena. S06 slrtIJJ IN /tvlplltd OIl 1M uttrlor d:ir of 1M I" alIItrol room 

.."". opII"''''' 77w 1"001II ",KIt IN Npabt. or l/IQiltlQillhw" .. /nJ",~", It"'Pfl"""'"' t 40 dqrtu 

F,,/rnrrlotll. A c1ta1"fUJC"t of 11 IntllU .rhdI1 IN provided fr<- tIw jh spriItA:k ...... rs II> ...,. 

ocJ« ... ' wall.J. 71U..- tori N,..d ... llh DIM' b~iId"", utllil",' (It" fin proUCI/I1II #9~i~1tI 

1/wW II co"'POliblt A .. <JfJP""O""td cobi,., or conlimtt, J1tal11N prO"Vidtd "".non ruoNpi"N oflM 

fW spt"illkltr 9"""'. t>I/wr /ft prouctitHI eq~ipmt"'. <mtJ.aM platU. 1ltb __ 1ItaI_ IN _d 

jtIt" (JrI)' t>lM' 1f0l"QP. 

a._pin' 
Sttlioll W Firs Spd-"'m 
903.1 Wlout Rtaui .... d shall be .mmded u folio ..... : An _ppiOoed ... _ Iie $prinkIersystem NIl 

1M f"ttIMiud IINI ,_lItd Irr ...... bMildi'W' <mtJ Itrw:lllrtl 3600 sq--.. jut (It" ,..attr ... 1. .. 

~ud or ,.Iocow/ ""*" dtt jwi.rtbClit).o Qf duaibcd in Sectioftt 903.2.1 Ihroup 903.2.12. 

[.«plio.: Alricultural builclirlp.,. under. JPCCiaJ lise pmn~ 111M roroom_1 purposes. 

m.2 .. WlooU Rrgulnd IIhIIi be added Il$ rollo_: SllJltlS c{ullft./f kildi'IP ~ IItan 3,600 

~ jHt. I" a/.lt,", bwildl",3 3,600 II(WOJr' jul <N" grtllltr. odttr 1 __ .. two-f-tIIJ' 
tlw:1lf7t& ...." .... • kttll ...... hmdinp,., .... , _cloI ..... "."..ilp c:<> ..... ,mM~ . 

... /w" l/w ~ __ of /Itt 6MiIdf", (It" _nn II tnO"fl>Xd by on lIIIdiliD .. of _ 1_ Ihirfy 

".rct'fl (JIItf,I (It" 1.000 ~ ju, wItidttw, is Iu&. nd bMIldhtr or _rw. JIwI .. __ II> 

COIIfo ..... "" SocllOII 9O.J. 2. 

"3.l.b Wiler. RW.irnl ...... be..:lcled .. fOllows; sra.u of aUII", b/lIIdirrp I,,, Ilion J,600 

'fw.e jHt. In uLmrw" .. fldhcr 3,1SOO ~ /ltl or k#, t>lM' Iltan oc-and ,....,;' '')0 dwtlli", 

~1Ii11, <mtJ .,iadtwal bill/dUel'" 1Iftdr, Ip«id ... ptr .. 1t for _reid ~ ..mu. dtt 

/I«N """ "I'M h lldlntl 0.- _'1II'f & illCt"fQSW I(J " 'DId l1li--jioot~ 0 .... ' J.fi()fJ.q __ jNt 

by 1M oddidool of __ doon rJoirr)' ".,.,.,'" (J(IHJ or 1.()(J()""I1It1rt foI~ "'hk/w .... ' Ir II#, lid 

bMllrIitrf or.-no:,..... sJrd1 k ... ", ~ to SrctioIt 1/(IJ.l. 

903.1.1 Groll' c\ sball be amended as follow, ror It. iJIO'IP5 A·I IhnN&bA-4: 9O)~1.I (l)The fire 

.... ~ l,600sq .... J«t. 
ttJJ.3 Cra" E shall be ......oed u fOllows: 903.2.3 (I) Thl"Ollahou! all ~ £ fn ..... 

.... tet 1hu J.600~jftl in ..... 

?OJJ .• C rUD Y. l shtJl be Imendod as fOllows: 9O).H Gro\Ip t . '0J.l .• (I) It. 0..:." t In.­

""o;eed. J,600""I_ fut. 

HJJ,7 Crup M shall be _it*! U fOlio-: 903.2.7 Group e IIICI M. 903.2.7 (l)1t. GIO\ifI B 

eu>d M lin _ exaM. J.600",-.jHt. 

?9J.l.8.2 Ma •• la«IRCl HoplY .... 1 be lidded u follows: All ,,_i( fin J{1IrlMIn" 1)U .... ,Jw/I 

/of f"ttIlliruJ Irr 411 ..... -..jitct.nd ~l ...... ~Iti-fomriJy --t«rwrd '-ws irIr ' d fOr _ 

On:Iimonoe 2019-0'2 

 20-0203 E Page 11 of 39



. ' . 
• 

<u " _-<>"q ~fo ... il)l dowll,"8 1M dwX" and IlUfallalion of lIIell 1)'" . .... Ihdl " I .. 

~IO« witlt Clllifonti(J ~ of R..p/mi<>/tS, Tille JJ. ; d{J(). 

~pllo"s: 

J. M(J"Ii~",,.d ~s /ocaIN willi' " ... awl", 1/fObI,.,."", part eoopyloof ",lilt 

California H.altll OIIdSqfoty Codf. DMs_ I', PWlll fir 1.'. 

1 M<JItUj<JCtltnd Jw:>-s flw do _ uc.'" 1.1oo lqliQro /'" lit ,~, QIfIi.,.... (IS "" 

«tfS#l')l "'-iii", .... If . ... dtfotitd III OowrlDlWrI{ Cod. SUlitHo 6J8502, wn.~ 1M 

a ilfi", prl...." rvf(k1O« "" ,,., f""1PH/y f$ _ ~,"ind to c-.pIy willi Ctll/forrtIo 

lU,idf1ltitJI C .... ~C/i<Ho RJJJ.l 

J MO""fac''''''d Itoww, IIIDt do IlOl uN,d J10 111"..,.,,,,1 mllH. 

903.U C .... p 5-1 shall be.metIded .. follows: 903.2.9 Group S. 903.2.9 (l) A GI'OIII' S fu._ 

elCCftdt J,6fJD _}HI 

:MI3.1.11 Gro~p So! E.cloHd Plrkl n Gl n nl wI! be &meeded U follows: 90).2.10 (I) "''ben! 

1M nre lrea orm.. cnocloted put.i"l ...... emoeds J,600 .,.... jm. 

5«1;0, ?O7 tlr, AlAr .... d PUretjon Symms 

?07.J .• W~ue Rc"lrH - Nt .. Buildilll or Sln.'~rH ~" Ihl 3,609 !Qu .... reet INlI be 

oddod u folio ..... : No approwdfin """"./<*f«rioIt s,uu .. 4h>J1 N /It.utJIkJ / .. all /No i16'W, .. flll" 

j10tJr lJr'fa /.U rhm 3,600 ~ /int. 
£Jt«ptlOIU: 

I . Ow- trItd rwo-juttlily dwlll"" (R' ) QcCllptNlC/fl mtd OI/ttr occlfP'l"Clll' dllSllfled 

.., -U M
) . 

1. AgtictJ/IINJI hlldirrp _ .dr, JpUiai _ ".,..", ~'" _ I<ffd ftx ro_ck>l 

J'INPOSf8 ( •• , .... UIil.J soIu, /t1od . rna . ..."jf", ~1aI rwInl8). 

J. Blllldi"p willt aj/oar .... o /uJ IIwt SOO Ml_w/H' ->' '- at'""'" •• -. .. fltftl 
~ dw Fh CIIiIlJ. '" ItWlru dilly awll!orizwd "'pNu"""fivc. baMJ .. kIWI.., 

_iaoI _iaI fAIl jtaNru. locali<»t, ,,"""'/00)' f)pI:. and dl.8la_ /10 --2Q7J,b SPIllS or £J1,U •• Buildi'Q NIl M.&Ied .. follows: III oUting lNi/diltaf "'/1'-' all 

appro""d tniI()IfIQlic sprmAle, Il)'Sfe".. ""_ IIttm aIW- '" ~I/y <lwelli,. 0ftI4 ¢"kllhir12/ 

wlJJi,.. _ ,.,.,., l/Mclal_ 1",.,/1 for ~_,clal P"rpoul wlw,. a fh aI_ • ..,/ca qI'/u, 

dou _ UUf and toW /fool' __ at fIw biof14.., M ,,,,,,,/11,. II IIt.:,._d ()I' ".~d &, _ "-' 

IIIIny ptne", (J()'N .... /,()()() ~ Jnl wlticltn>u gin., IVCllbwildi,., " Mrvt/_ tlta/IIM 

"'. III> """"""" III> SufKNI !I07 "' .... 11 1YftIhd by • Fin Citiq. M Iobnwr tlMIy crwltcrlud 

"p"'s,nlal/w. Bwtldi,.., willt Q.fIoor _a "U than XIO ~ 1m :N)IIM CUIIIpf. •• " .. j,.,j 

Ordil'lllnce 2019-02 "'" . 
 20-0203 E Page 12 of 39



by 1M Fin c~t (W ,,~, dilly QUlltMiud ..rpn34nlQINc. ~ on building ",mt/'lICtiorI 

1fIQ/~'kJU and fo<lhlnl. lfINtiotr. oa:'>IpIM<)' ,",", • ...d """mat It> upo.IlUtIIs. 

to7.l.c Mo.llo, I., .... 11 be added as fOIIo-..s: AUjn alanIfI'dtlK/ion.f}'#f:-S JItdI. CO._.-clfd 

din~lly IMoul" and moni-.d /loy" U.L. t1pptY)wd Cf/1IIr'rJI. ~UII')1 '" __ ,...., 1V\'iCf/. 

""Ioielo giw4 audib/. and vullO! .sgnoJl til Q ctHUlQ1IIIy arl . .... d loctMiMI. Alllpl'inkhmi bllildi"ls 

sltDJl k _i/Ol'fll 

~" 
I . OM- attd rwo-t-J/y a.·.IIi..,' fR-J ~_ and Qdwr """ ........ ' chmlfwd 

lOS "U~). 

2. AgriCJj/",a/ blilidinp _ tutd..-~M/II" /X.mll QntVor flQl IUfd fat M",rwrcid 

pwptUl.s ( • • , .. ..... iU uB,. food 34"'0 . .....v""/WC/Q/.WnI,). 

mol.!! 1)9' I Hood b m ll.rIo • • thal' be added as follows: 1'- 1'ftj'1I1,.._", oj"iMfIIlarioll, (W 

..rplCla_nl. of Q J»:>t J Hood SyfI . ... '!taI1 ~OIin "fin tJanIfI'¥riMltr -w.-;,. 'l,lt", ... lit 

'mfa/I.d, fir" jtJI' 1M hood I)ISlfm 10 lit con",,,lfd t(I "" uirling fIrt dQrlfl/I['w;w ~ 

J)<U'''' jtJI' IIG hiJdillg 

907.'.l.l Sts9ldla r9W~r s..PRly JbaJJ be added .. foi l"",,: /", <JCCOr"dafIC. ""Ith NfPA 72. 1M 

J~ powu l¥'f1Iy "".....a,. " ... /ooUoI..... 14_"'-' pawn- CDpQClt)I IPIdrr ,~,., /QQd 

(I)IS/ffft opt.t"Q/i"l lit Q ~'" MndilfonJ 1!taIi IH _1flitd ... " ",ilti _ _ 72.11f1..,. ptTWtr 

cQp acfty 

~: 1'- "",lsI.1OCfI of an .1Mrpncy b«t-llp purn. noppIy float _II or ucud 1M 

1'ftj'00n __ oj"CdifontM Fh Codr C/qJtn' 12 

Chlpter 11 

SeeM' 1193 l mont . ey n d S!udby Po ... ., Srolt m, 

! IV. I J 1.1' llluKI. sftaIi be amended • 1bI\owI: EmerplC)' POWW 5)'5lemS and --.db)' power 

.J)'1ta:N IbaIJ be instilled in acc:ordanc.e wid! the C.lifornia BIIildina Code, 'die C.lif~iI. EJoctric 

Code. NFPA 110 and NfPA 111. Alllnnldm,s. tIllwr U- __ Mil ~ily""'UMr IUIiIz, Mil 

... k ll l /lll'al bllildi"l' _ IIMd for COIIIIMrckli pwrposu.. .... Ith :utlftllby ptJ'Wf'. DwIII ..... " ~ 

... tkW« tItaI ~cu 1111 ptTWt. "''''"' If} dot bOl;ldlrl& fIPII"O'oWd by 1M fIN tt1th officid. 

E:dJli", irtsIailtIl __ PtaJIIH IffaIlftailWd in 1I«fIf'da1lC' .... ltlo tIw l1l1i1Il0l appra!IOI, 

Ch'pte.r JJ 

&olio. 3JI0 A«eg for f l .. n,~!ln, 

J"y Pre .. 1M Idt. IlIk.!Io. Woll be lidded u foliOWl: /'rl(W 10 """ tlwrf"l ~ion, <III 

~ ~ lip PtaJI '- pnnldtd QI ,«Iofire Mil '''rpncy 'oWhkl. «m# 1'f»Il 'fIt1'JI iIWo 

1M prt>jfct. 

..... 
 20-0203 E Page 13 of 39



• 

Sullo! 3JIl W'lt~ S .. ,atr for )'!" ProlKlion 

JJIl.! Wlot . Rcq ujrtd nil be amended II follows: ITIo.- 10 combM.Jtlbl. _~ru. ""M,,, 0tI 

l i/f, 11M fin hydrtJIII woUr 9'/01" lila/lIM IrufDIled 'mtl /JtQUtlou .. d in coltli_ .'''1;0.,. n. 
_Ill of MIme. sllppl .. d .ItoJIIfIU( /_ ,.,quindfin flow for 11M proj«I. 

Chapter 49 

Sutlo. HOJ Pl .... 

• 203.1 Wilen NegM1rtd l1'li11 be addod II followt : T1w fin coAl ojJi&ilJl of llot El [lQn.do Cwnty 

fin: Protocdon Oisuict ""'" "'<pi" dnotlop<rte'" proj,m /OoCQI,d In MoMrQU, Hit"" Very-1J1fI! 

Fin Hazard s.writy z."..,s 10 ,odImit fh proucli()ff tH- T1t/s plwr INIlI 1M ~ by bot" 1M 

fI,., cod. officUII Qnd ,''' _~utd f'fp"'u,."aliwjo. u..locd CAL FIRE u,.;, Clt"/(i/loawd in 

/'" Slau RUf'O'U0ility An" [SRAj) p'w Ie> ,,., nCQl"di"l of /M fotd """ P 1M ,ojtCl by rho 

C.....wy cf £I Dorado. 

Se<:tlog 4995 WiIdO .. P!]!leet!o ••• [leIia! CUlinctio. 

4995,4 Roof CUllrJClio! Requlr ...... " shall be oddecI II rO)liows: All ",.. O/Ift.rtnorl/4ll, 

incllMifng addiriofts, ",q",,.,, II a.w A roof ~ri"l 01' 4fulfObly All ,.,·roofi .. nqms Cbu A 

roof _ring or __ INy /11"" """boo ...... h.~ in UcfU of j09(, if QrI uiflrioJ .trllChn 

wltill .. 11'''1)' OM )/'I'" puiod w/U ,.CUljl_ d/lJt 1M ,,,,in roof IN .. a- A roof cowrilfe 01' 

IUXmb/y tv II "'IN"'" .... CI_ 8 ... C fin rfllDrdN"t ".."wi DttII 01' ..rm-trnntd """'" RtGh fJI' 

s/Mg/tl '" _ ~,., a rvaf DQ..,rl/lg mar~rial p Class A 4fU'M6/y. 

Chpler 50 

Sullo. SOOl Gteml 

SOOl.7 Llab'UhI for D •• .,. wll be added as foUows: AII)' dtmtag<es fJI' ant~;-o...'" 

CfJl'ti.u """'illg. lpi/I or dixJwrtc of 1liiy ~ Irlattrioh sIoall ctNUtitwN .., DgQIIISI ..,.. 

~CIt p'rMHI.jtnft fJI' ~fXJlVlJo,r CQ1I.I/"f1ldt spill fJl'dllcloat-p. n.;,./lt I.J coIlutjlJt ~ tIw FIn 

CII'./. fJI' 1rW/tc .. dIdy ~ "'pnse_M, ill /,. __ r ,., Itt ". __ of ... obI/ttMJo,r 

........ co-. apt"U#d fJI' ;¥Hd. 

Ch.pler 56 

Stella. S60! Gum! 

*'!.l PsT!!1! Rtg.lm lhtIl be amendod u folio",,: Permits 1htJ] be ~ind • 101 fortb in 

Section IOMillld reJ<llMed in ~ with thuleClion. WM", uplWMS pvtNu ... nqwind. 

/My s/toll M &swd by /11. F"" CIti./. 01" IlUllwr duly QfjfNrised ",""oN""" ..... Mil t1rI E1 /)Qn;otIo 

COOlIN)' SM.I/r, D.pOI'1,",,1l fJI' dw P~rvil" PoJltfI lAparfIMN. WM,... /1",-0 ,..""iu 01"1' 

Pue10 

 20-0203 E Page 14 of 39



~qU"d, l/wy J/wJIIIH Isswd by 1M Firo Clowt fI' ~ thJy _b_d ~pn#""" -" 1M 

£1 [){)~ado County &xudo!SJqwl"llUOrl. 

560 1.2. 1 DOUIIIUIIoIIOI wll be added IS follows ; T1tI AHJ J/,,1I1 Jtav. 1M OUI",", 10 "'qwsl 

~"'alio" ,..pd,,,,. "U tDJI«U oftM ji,..worti" pn.",alioll. 

560I.l.l Proprietary l.rU!!IIII" shall be Ioddod IS follo ... -s: T1tI AIU will p'Olut ~ P'Of'W'tr}' 

i""",,",tiOll. 

Chlp l~ r 57 

Sfctlol 5704 SlonlS 

570...1.9.'.1 Lonllo., Wkre Abon.gro ... d Tuks .. , Pryblblted shill be II11mded u 

rollows: S~ 0( ClaN I lind Clui II nanunabJe liquids in .baYe-J1tIUnd !lAb outsido of buiklinp 

is prohibited Im/,u QPProwd by 1M FIn Clokt or Iris/Itn dN/;1 _Itorizcd ,..pn_lw . ...,.." 

~r"';lI«i by 1M Fh ChI,t 01" hlllMr liMy o .. '~iz~d rtpnHNQrlw. 011 ohow vo-I roM(s) or 

-U iMf./lIl/ltioftl P 1M J/Or'OV of Cl<w l 1/ 01" 111 ji __ IH, ,,,ttI COIftblUlibl~ Iiq .. 1Ib tltDIl comply 

witlt /Jrtln rTq,,/nt_nU "" ut /tNt" I1y /,. CDlifontio Fin CM. nw Califi>mkl Fh C" J/wJJ1 0114 

apply 10 iMId/tniofu 01_ 1'--. wllklf jwJ ~i"I JU/lfioftJ ..... ahqw.f1"OIIId sll;lNp U 

"'""'" 
Sfcliog 5706 Special Opu .. tlou 

P06J.4.4 Los.IIG", Where Abovt=CflI ... d Tanks !f' fr9hlbile!! _h.1I be .mended as follows: 

Storqe of Class [ NId Clui U IWnmM>lo liquids in .bo_pound tanks OIItside of buildin&s is 

prohibilt>d tmI'JI OJIP'"Owd by I" Fh Ow/. or ItWlw, Q\Jy tlNdtoriud ~p"J'_tw. WItt" 

~""irr,d by IN Fh CllJlf. or IrWlwr dody QtIiIroriu:d n".."""'fw, all tIbvoot VO-IDN:(I) or 

Wlldl "ISloIlollOllS for 1M 1101"..,.. of CIAu 1. /I or 11I fI-..tIblc and COIfIblUl ill4 1it,,1dI1JraIJ 

comply wlllr t/tau ~quinl",!ltIJ "" slIplll 6y tIN Collpmo Fin Cod!. n. CDI/fontrf Fh Cedi: 

~I 040 gppIy 10 wtoJlQ/KNU odw. 111M _ w lticl, /WI tII.s~Ni", ~"'iotu "M~ ~. 

,.-oI/Itd -,.,.. is "''1~irod. 

C hapl er 58 

Sflo lloa 5806 flammablt Cn91ulc Fly!ds 

5!!!6.1 !,'!I!!!!!iollS sh.n be emended IS rollows; SlOf-.&e of fl.mmable crro& ... ic fluid! in 

...uonuy ClOOIWnen OIIUidc ofbuildinp is prohibill:d lUfI,u """"wd by tIN FiN CIrIq, 01' 1tJ.JIIw~ 

tbJIy ottfhoriad ~pn#ntoflW """" pttnrtif/fd 6y u. Jilrr Ow/. fI' hl.JlMr <iIJy DI4~1zId 

I'fpn","'QlM, 1111 ~lIIioMr)1 ttJItIDiMrJ fir u.llOI"QfI '" fI--»I, tr>'OI"'lUt flu sltaU COIItpIy 

wltlo tho« requi"'~"'s "" HI forllr by tIN CalifontiOI Fh CM. nr CAlijOnllcr Fin ~ s/tDJI 

 20-0203 E Page 15 of 39



'. 

QUo appiylO inssalltllfo,u 0/'" /JwM _ wIri~. /wI diJpc"'''''' sl(lliolu "wrY ""' ..... ,........,. 

lIOnlIt' is -,vjnd 

:mIlo .. 6!!1 I.oa il io. o(LP£" C .... I .... 

610 • . Z Mulm .. m C.plotllJ wi. II'. r..lllbilshd LI .. l" &ball be amended as follows. n. ~ 
01 Jiqwj1fd p'troJn", p ." UfflS r$ _ DU"g<>ie ofl,(}(}().pI1on _, ~iry .... 10000ed.:/l 

/'1111 o ... ·half (/12) lit,!. fr- ~rry zonN or duipHedjOr ruidurlio/ .,.. aNI til /nut --ItoIf 
(1/1) ",/1. frrpN «IS/i", nsuxNiDllIn>e/oplMN .... ilh a OelUity gn<H~' Ib.- (I) h.1I ........ 

pu acn aNi at 111411 _-hal! (111) "'ik frr- ""Y /rotIt/or _I i:J..u.r-d .. Itt .. AHJ QppU....t 

(1M a sp'ciailCQltdilio>ooi lin """,if is iuwd hy 1/tIt Co .. "", rQ EJ Don>do IN ,Itt Cilyqf/Q«r¥ilk. 

Di~"'I"g .. Ifill" es,,,bllslwd 1;",;11. Willtilt /IN Ihlriu Ula/>IWw<J by /uw ,..,m1ctm, '*' d~_ 
of/lq.p.d ",troJ.lim gru joI- IItt proIulioll of ""'(Nily pop..i(JHd fW CfHWUlU _'"'. IIr '41"'''' 
CQPOCI'Y of oily ~ flU lollo/ion s/oQllltOl UCfed Q waf" ctipQCity of1.()()() ,allollS. 7lII dlJlXMfrtr 

of Iiqwf~d PltroinM gw III uct&J of an aggrIgIW of 1.(J()()..caJ1on _, mp<>eity ... /ttJo I~ 

(Ii /HlJI_-Ita/f (Ill) ... iI, frowt ~rcy ~ or Msl' .... /fdjOr rrsidrflfiDI_ ._1.,.._. 
1td[(l11) ",/I, fro ... LOlSli..,. ,<siMn/lm ,*wt/opm.,,' ... IIIt a deftJ/ty gnOl., t'- """ (/) dwell .. 

Wllil pu ocn attd at kaf/ OM-ltaJj (112) ",iI. fro'" <WI)' Itotd M' _d is alklwH W/wll AHJ 

tJPPf"'wd..wl 0 spcc/QI/condil.mol "" ~rmil u luwd by /lle COl"'/), of £I Don>do (r ,''' C/ly of 
PlDCUVilJ. 

Se<;!lo, 6111 Hie" t:1e~.IioD Lig"died Petrole"", C., III.l.lI.lioaJ (5,tOO-(oo1 t!MIIOII!!" 

!.l!:!m:l shtJl be Iddad u fuilows: 

6111.1 Renl. lon thall be.sdcd u follows; 

TWo-.uQP npolar qJt_ ,1toI1 k IfUloIJ.d fit 0tX0NiIn« w/llt _"If/OClllrtr nq"ln_nII. 

7'wo-.JtotI' nrtJaror qJt ...... Ito/! ,. ifumlled 0/'1 011 U'G INlallolloN. 

n.. finl ~ npt_ sholl '" WNMId ....... /M Iti"r'd ,.,..,. cow~ '1Ipp11n1 willi l/w I_ 

n.. Qf~rk pru.1WW ~rl"" of. npl_ #1011 boo poiNU dow_........ 7lIt fint .,. 

... pIotorlltolJ '" Jll-bed 10 tIw ..u. of l/w y<If'd plp/ItJ willt IqjI :opp.~ ",bl", 10 "'.., }lulblli/)' 

.hoot/d IQJOI: .llt(ftiftr Qft'W 7Jw"'~ ;- IIw )O'd pIpbc #101/ ,. ~ ___ IIwf J IM/w! 

~oIly) fro- IIw woIls ofl/w 111M. 

7Jw Hcond liar npIa10r _"'" pIpf sholl k IlulQ/kd""'" • law of lile iHlu.g, 0$ do. 

~ pr«licohk 10 tIw /I.ildUW woIL ];\Is rUt~ ,wI boo #fe...,l)' JoqIpOrt.dlbracd 10 ". woI/ 

~Iy 10 m.:Itu boolo<w IIw rqtJ<IIOr 10 os 10 pt'fWrIl btltdUit of IIw pIpI by Ilnrol 

""""'" ,.... 

 20-0203 E Page 16 of 39



.' 

A proiu/;\I/l COW", tJPPI'OWld /ty t1w fIlS ~uppI~r ond B~/Jding OfficiDI, sMll k IN_ d 0""'. 

HCONi Slap ngu/rnor IIItli 'ffll1'tly s~f'f'O'Ud /0 IhIt 'T'OIind or diDgonaJly 10 l/w wall. 

11w rUer pipu for'.)IQN1 piping ,/taU flO! k , ,,,kddtd in COnct"fIf. COnct"f/c pkcd_"d 

noel!,/SV ,/tall be /Wld.i til/HUff Irf(:ltfrom all lid., ojlM plpt. 

AI flw flww of gppIlt:«ioft for ...,. bw11di'C pm"/I, wllielt llIYOh>t, /,., wloJla/ion of QI/ lJ>G .$)!flf .... 

,,. appI/«mI1lwH1 MIft;,an LPGS)'IUMpkM pbt bo J ~s (or dlpllily .... PDF) 1'- LfG pIDl 

pImt s/tQI/ll'lClwk. ".., _ 1M liM/lid 10, IIv uN- /txQlitHt, propo#d I .... c~ily in ll£ pI/oIu, 

rotdr of yard plpiJtg. IocmiMt oft" rfur pq. at In. bill/dill' . JI'"OPfrf)l bo .... darws. -' on _If,. 
q{ all aiu,~d bwlldl"" 0tI ,l1li 101 aNi " dlpIc/lon of /,. ridpUM of ""Y !,.dd,,,. II) he 

SIq1f)IIId wfrlo LPG n.u rltaJJ • boo forwonItd 10 1M CIf1II'"OP"/QU fin diJtricl ... If,.... <U Q 

Ioutor ..... '" row.., qf "" '-.-,rotC)' 
Location of/Ire CflfI/,rll* tJj LPG u.nb IIIdI k Pf'-""Y _W ~ 1M 11K ,q _ ,ttMq, ..... 

til roe" ,rid. S1KIt IfllU' IItt;J// bt oflJljficwntlwight 10 IH Wsft>l, {No..". tmtidpaltltl ___ 

_ tIIpt" QlW "'JPKfiWl Iocatioro. Il'SllollUlilm tntd "",1"1'_ of IIw.n ...."...a, '" /'" 
",~,biliry ofl" LPG _'0 
f>roptJM appIimtnllllflllllC«ssoriu lito/I_IN pmr<illfd ill..,. _ imtoJlOfIoIt bd:Jw u. /11'# 
jIo<>I-",. 1Miq",..... "',.,,~,. '" .....-e ,..Mriclfw 

,up Vertlca! !list' PlpJa,1lIaJ1 be.oded AI fol~: 

MI"~ 0/ Sclwmu. 80 -I>'0Il piphtf. 

1Jw rl#r IitQlI k within J btclru Joo,/zoNQIIy Q[IM IQnk.. 

Swi1l/f ioiotU thalllM iNlaIl~d .... <WIlMkrw I<W: kwllO "",,,/de for 1M 1,,1Ik _ ..... m (Sm~1 

elbows .-1 _lie t<N«I. 
A listed jluibl. rise,. COMtniC~d of ~ w 61"P!ku~I"IIItbi. <WI pt"Ol«-a 6y _ I CfNf'WI 

sM",lwd """erWI ""'Y IN ,..,.d ItUl~"" of _i1l/f jol/tU. no. jluUik dl.rntJ#Yc *II pt"tJw_ 

niflkNfII Ik>d. 10 tJiJow for 10M _ .. ",em 

' Illd Marki .. nd Lontioa, shin be added u follows! 

All CfVO'Ied ..... s/ttlJ11Ic /ocoud Melly ",,",w 1M ....... slult tJjf wHw "" rJw hti/di", lit" vlslbi. 

k"",,'" 
no.l~d petrol, .... "" ro.ppIler ~/wJI1 qffiz" _"'1wrproof/tJe",~ "" 10 11M Ios_ of 1M 

laM WI#w fJ"f*Cliotg cow'. ,..,.., frat sltall CONQIII 11M n.ppIiu'~ _ mwJ ,......,."" ~/,phaM 

-"'. 
T .... /Mtdklf_ sWIM p'..-1IIIy -ud by" _1aI '" wood "",,,.1<>1_ -tJ,,., wltll" 

.. Irti .. _ m-/lS;"" ofl btdtu by 1 btcJru. no. __ 0,. s/ttlJ11Ic of n4kNfII Mlzlu 10 rW 

.... dw ___ .PlOW .p'" """ zIttlII60 " ",//IboIoI", of IO}tt1 III M!p. ,..,. _ -.,/Illn rIttIII 

lie pllilllfti )1<11/" .. ond Ioca/fd 01\" oppoIl/f ,/Itb of 1M 1_ 

 20-0203 E Page 17 of 39



• 

S«tiO! IIIl UM!n('O.'" LPG Ink.! 1,ltfo'Llllo.,ud Ow.U • •• 1I wll t..adcIed. follows 

H IM P, .. !" .... plu'''' blldcIed .10110 ... , p,,.,./lII1tt111b,r rq .... « 1IfWi/fllilm,1tQI1 H 

I MII ... ,,"d ~ ~/"""'", ~ •• ,. iIuIQillJliofts (IS Q{1(1tV"d.,. ,.. AlU 

'1 13,1 V!d_[Jn,!d t.rG tuk o..ur1~ip WIll be tdded .. follow.: ~'J'-" UG-u 

IWl IN ,..oItlb,wr- .!oorl,.. »Id 10 .nd-l'Strs artd ,MIl,.. .."uDMd.,. ,1M LJI(') ; oy ....... 

t.a.~ '>"'-_ 10 __ propn -.01 MQ/lfIt_ rflqllil'f..,,,,, _ "", IIIWI.-.a.rltd 

s...!Iot 19. NFl", PD." - 51'den! eu II" ' ........ ,'" If Sod,khr 5,"., i. Qec ..... d T ... 

r .. litt o..t!II!CI.ad j>hu(uIMrtd 11 .... 0 U ... uHf !9J.J.I,J.toJ.J,5 
HFPA 1.30, A_lOdtd ~iMf u rotlowJ: 

A.u SeetiN .. , 1O.....s AI followl, 

f 4 ,. ~wr«I ItoIIW ltuldltd. lUlU _ t1ppI owd 6y IIw CtJIffonoiD 0.,..' II ttl 
~",..wC_",,1I)o ~" 'W. 
~ Soctloow :U,I.lIO ....... rou...: 
Ckpl" to. rnA Up. s.!,1,l A l>fIPIy o{., ..... _ of _A ~ -' "' ......... .,wm __ 
wUIIb! lit. INU'"'' .NII/IN .-t·ri ........ tIw reF '")'." appoNd,.,.,.. .. .s:...:.t +' It s r/tdI 

.. .", ., (I -..1IIIIftI_ --.u!bl, NI> .... . 

R....tIe s.<:&. 7.6 ....... It re.llowo: 

guluM, NJ1'A. IJD, l,fA I«d _jIow ...... '1tDI1 H pro Irht ... iIII/h".,wltr I)'SH"" to 

~ .... .... Q~ .......... dw IDIICPW ttldwdwll~ 

R ....... Se<.t\o. 11.1..1.1 ......... c ......... 
ell.RUt H . NFPA pp. ILl.!.! Where. fift dcpartmm. ""'III*' "",._, iI_lIO"idood. !he 

IyslenlIhalI be ~~ty IeIIecI • /I .... lmll'" puu"" of 150 /IOf"dI JW ..,.... ...... ,..... for 

--

.... " 
 20-0203 E Page 18 of 39



AppndiJ B - Fire Flo", Rtquln1ntalS ror U~IIdI .. ,. 

. fib" ill~I/1l Rn .. ir'H n ... Flow rOf 0 ........ T"o-t)mll~ DwtU"DQ. Corno ~-3 ...... R .. 
B.Udlm .... r ...... boe_ dWl bo: amended u folIowop .Inorioou IMI_ 'JXJO}«r 

0 MINIM UM ""W 
SI'RIl'i KLER I'IR£. DURATION 
SYSTEM FLOW 

(Dot •• ~ ~~' 
No " 0 

'" ~ ~ • 
"""" .... 1)' ..... 8)0'1(1) 

0 0 ~ -
~ tell.) I I - • 
~N '-' , .. '''' , 
"'" • ... ~ 
lill 01 .... CA 

• II l ie-

.- - Ion ._ • 
~k '-' ~ , .. , 
"'" • .- ~(l\1/OI:I IIU of ... OA 

, , I 

Iablt 8105.1 pegMlred fir! flow ror Bu"ldl." otbr 'h. Oat- ud r ..... r •• u¥ 
p .. "t!!jgu, G .... up RS .... d R=i Bulldl." ud r ..... h ..... $ball be "",endod u 
folioWI-: 

SVSTEM rlRE-FLOW 

(Dall" 5 ••• d ..... ) 11.1 ..... . .... 
Co1Io ... _ 

 20-0203 E Page 19 of 39



" 
, 

Appudi. D - Fil"l AppoIntll" AHeM Roach 

SttIioli PIOJ MI. i!!~", Spedlk.t!oll 

0103.1 Accty Rod Wkl'~ wi., .11~d[!II' shall be amended u fol~ addin, theuceptiDn. 

Exception ' Drtwwi1)iS 

Dl03.l Cadt sh.all be .mended II follows: Fire 'pp'ra,us ICCCSS 1'I)ti,\1.ne! drive~s nil noI 

exaed /j~ III grtIIie omWI ~ by /M AHJ tW by 1M EI DoN>do COt#!IIy Q",,"'*d 

Q>JijOntia Pllbllc RuollrCC Co« 1'fl1c 141 Dtsip OItIIIMprOW_'" SI<MdardJ M~ 

bupl/(HI: EJ.vaIion abc>w J,OOO lui shall_ acud J 2'K 

DIOl,} THaiu R.dlll, Jball be amended as follows: The minimllm UlI!Iin& rU~' shall be 

det£rmined by the fift code offotial; and ,1oaI1_ inclwk c!Vb and gltlMr 

DIOJ.:~ fir! Aopa,..l!!! ftc"" Road G.Ia .... 1I be.mended as tol"""" : Stlru~CI/ofo(l) : Jf\,,. Q 

lintl' fOU u ~ fIN ,.". wltklt "I ,. _ lu~ dwm JO /H' (6096 -;. florA .. /h 
tlI'f'lI'"tlhII rwd COJ1SiJfJ % dividt:d~. /1.,... walt ,IttJII _ N ku 1'-' /J luI (1572 -, 
PI"' ,'" 8014,10 10)9 r.." ill "!dl~ shall be wnended as follows: Fire llne IjJIII •• padflod in 

Sect;".. 010).6 sball be polled on boch •• of fIN app-mus ..... ro.d.J that Ite l(/ to 19 foe! 

wide (609610 IS]'U ram). 

~io,,: £k'Wlf/otu <Ibuvc 5,000 jt flS ,*NNlrli,.,d by IIw AH/, 

DIQ,J.6.1 Rods ",nl"ll Ibn l' rOe! In Wld l_ ahall be _mended II follows: Fin:"e II&ns 1:1 

IpKlfied ill Section DIOO.6111a.11 be ~'od on OM side of fire 'PIM"'M access roads lIOn than 19 

r_ wick (.S).4.4 ...... ' and lea thaa J6 Feet wor:Ie ( l09n.& mm). 

~pIIoIt EhVQfiotu aIooH .1,000 Jl ... dt_iMd hy,l-. AH.I. 

D104.4 Clrcumfere,!!tl PI? ftp ...... tus"rugROIId' ... lIbeaddedasfoilows: 1Dt" ,.,.,Mlnd 

." ,I-. fW cod. offICio!. l/ fin appon>"" IX"IS 1'f>ad """I "" CONIrW:'" /() t~'M ... /nry 

of l/ #nICrwtl fINi sMlI proll/dll/ tOIIIlnwoou ___ of •• rptIC)J wltkl, QlXUI. 

SECTION 4: CONFLICT 

ThIll Ordin~ No. 2Q]6-{)2 oflhe EI Dondo CoIlnt)' Fire ~ioa ~ IIKI all odie, on!i_ 01" I*nI 

of oniinmlCeS ........ ith IR hereby tepelled . 

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY 

If-.y Ordin_ article, IIIIbs.:1:ion or IlIbdivlSion \hereof, provision, -. clauaor phrMe offll. oock. or 

any application thertIof, Is for M)' reuon held 10 be in'l&lid by I coun of compellOnt jwisdiction, Kh dc<:Won 

$hili not It'lla the remainin. proviJions of thit coda. Which can be .i ....... ffioot without the In¥llid portiona 

trId, 1IwRfote, IIIdI invalid poniont are declond 10 be teYef1lble. The EJ DoncIo County FiR Protection District 

hereby dec~ tIw if _Ill ....... _~ tills Ord ......... and eKtI of its IIticle!., _tioN, IIIbIoctions, 01" 

Ordin.nee 2019-02 

 20-0203 E Page 20 of 39



'. 

sub<!j,.jllOnS thereof, pIO¥islOllJ, senlmtal, tllouse5 or phrues imspcd,~ ofthc 110:1 dw. _ or.ore 01 ...... 

is dedllted invalid. 

SEcrIO,~ 6: I)t"FECfI VI{ DAT E AND PUBLICATION 

This Qrd,.......,. shall take effect tIIirty (lO) dly •• nor its ~oon. The EJ Dando Coo.an!y f"n PrumctK)fl 

~ Bovd Soctetary i. directed 10 publish llIi. ordinance in • ""~ of ....... l dmolotion .. !he 

DIstrict. In 1; .... of publie.tion of !he full ~XI of the ordi...uoce, • SUnlIMf)' of the ordInance IN)' .. published 

by the by tho Board Secrcur)o .,..;tIIin fifte«l (I~) days.n. ils possap MId I oenifood cop)' Pli. poSlCd 1ft 

the offlC. of the EI Ilorado County fn Pmtection Odlriet ponu.ant 10 a.. ... ,_ .. Codr S«f;"'" lMll(c) (I). 

The ,bow Qrdinal'lCC was introduced It • meeting of the eo..:! of Dio_. of the EI Dorodo Councy F'..., 

Proa:ction Dutria on Oc,ober 17, 20 19. IlIId it was tMn I"OIId lOr 11M: first time. It. public hearinl _ set lOr !he 

Ordinanu to be.- for the 5ocOOd lime on No""""bcf 21, 2019 NId approved by the foIlowi.., .... 

PASSED AND AOOPTEO by !he Board ofDirecIOl'll ordw EI Ocndo CouMy Fin> I'roleI;tion 0...:, this,:W 

dlyofNovembe.. 2019. 

AYES:~l ..... ,,"<.0'< ".,. .(.- 'r,;.. •• ~ ....... , c.. 1,: r-- :.,{.,< ...... ;v"'., ',"'L.;t " II , .. ....-',..-. ~ 

NOES: t .{,, __ 

ABSENL v '" L 

ABSTAIN: ,-l.e'-'''-

ArrEST: 

, . 
-X "Lit' U I, d 

Ord._ 2019-02 

 20-0203 E Page 21 of 39



DSP, ECF, & GRV 

Fire Code# 
Significant 

What Is the Change? 
Locally adopted I SFM adopted I 

Why Is There a Local Change? 
change? Amended 

101.1 N Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Administrative need 

LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than 

Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate 
air and can easily be trapped under a home, if ignited it can 

105.6.27 y quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving Locally adopted and amended 
lead to an explosion. At elevations above 5000 feet there is 

occupancies in Group R-3. 
an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire 
activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional 
attention. 

Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance 

106.6 N Add section Locally created and adopted 
of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines 
permits, plan checks, and inspections as allowed in Health 
&Safety Code 17951. 

106.6.1 N Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to 
the Fire District. 

106.7 y Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspections by contractors. 

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District 
is added to read as follows: 
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this 
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an 

109.4 y Added section 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals 
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County of EI Dorado's 
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals 
timeline. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 
Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that 

portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 
protects life and property. Fees have been updated to 

110.4 N 
better left to localities to determine the 

Locally adopted and amended match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the 

fees/penalties for their respective areas. 
District Attomey's Office. The change to the language to 
include the term infractions. 

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s), 

110.4.2 N 
Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before 

Locally created and adopted 
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 

but under a different number) violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health and Safety Code of the State of Califomia and 
Chapter 5c (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Califomia. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 

112.4 N 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 

Locally adopted and amended 
All violations of the code have been consolidated under 

better left to localities to determine the Section 110.4 to include the penalties for violations. 
fess/penalties for their respective areas. 

Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District. 

202 N Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopted 
Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd 
Manager. Definition of campfire shall not include LPG or 
Propane fueled appliances. 

302.1 N Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for clarity 

307.4.4 through 
Due to the high fire danger that exists in EI Dorado County 

307.4.4.2 (d) 
Y Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopted we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires 

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas. 

 20-0203 E Page 22 of 39



r-', 

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical 
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for 
apparatus 10 pass under without damaging apparatus 
components. II also allows an exlended time frame before 

Changed vertical clearances to 15 feet and road 
having to recut the growth of Ihe vegetation. Additional 

503.2.1 N Locally adopted and amended height for vegetation clearances acts as an increased buffer 
widths to 20 feel 

for the spread of fire. A road widlh of 20 feet exclusive of 
shoulders, as measured face of curb to face of curb is 
needed. These structures can be difficuilio navigate with 
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the lotal 
drivable road surface 

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the 
Fire apparatus require areas for turning around when 

Fire Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations to 
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This 

503.2.5 N 
match as they require turnarounds for fire apparatus 

Locally adopted and amended includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides 
better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds turn 

access roads and driveways. 
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated 
Surfaces of EI Dorado County and Appendix D of the 
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be 

503.2.6 N Surfaces to state and match EI Dorado County Locally adopted and amended 
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an 

Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17. 
alternate means & methods that is not less restrictive than 
the Fire Code. 

503.4.2 N Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes Locally created and adopted 
This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes" 
rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle Code. 

Added section regarding no parking in front of 
This section clearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire 

503.4.3 N 
hydrants 

Locally created and adopted hydrants' rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle 
Code. 

Added section regarding fire lanes based on road 
This section clearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D 

503.4.4 N 
width 

Locally created and adopted as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire 
lanes. 

Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on 

503.5.3 N 
emergency access and consistency through all 

Locally created and adopted 
roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing 

roadway gates in EI Dorado County, referring to the the best possible emergency access to maintain fast 
gate standards adopted by the FPO's. response times. 

505.1 N 
Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of 

Locally adopted and amended 
Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing 

buildings based on the District's addressing standards. 

Added more conservative standard for the 
Commercial properties are required to install hydrants at 

507.5.1 N placement of hydrant and their relationship to Locally adopted and amended 
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150 

commercial buildings 
feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in 
between). 

Buildings are getting more sizable in the county. It is more 
common to have new buildings with solar arrays that 
continue to generate power even when the buildings 

Added verbiage to bring all of the necessary fire 
general utilities have been shut off. When there is an 

509.3 y 
controls for a building to one location. 

Locally created and adopted emergency, it is vital that we have rapid access to all of the 
controls in one location for public evacuation and firefighter 
safety. Due to the fire danger present in EI Dorado County 
throughout most of the year, this change is appropriate and 
advisable. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2 N in new buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

greater within the district. to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spreed. 

 20-0203 E Page 23 of 39



-
Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.a N 
than 3,600 square feel to install sprinklers if they 

Locally created and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 

to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
structure, whichever is less. 

feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds occupant protection for existing buildings less 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.b N 
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they 

Locally created and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 

to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
structure, whichever is less. 

feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

903.2.1, 903.2.3, 
These sections were created to give specific increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.4, 903.2.7 
N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Manufactured Homes - The intent of this code section is to 
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two 
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar 

This section was created to include manufactured 
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban 

903.2.8.2 y residential single family R-3 in the residential Locally created and adopted 
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption 

sprinkler program 
due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The 
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a 
Significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk 
successfully in many California communities. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

These sections were created to give specific increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2.9, 903.2.10 N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Added occupant protection for fire alarms in 
buildings with a floor area less than 3,600, except 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
R3, AG buildings not used for commercial 

907.2.a N 
purposes, and buildings with a floor area of less 

Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

official. 

Added occupant protection for existing buildings 
Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.b N 
without automatic sprinkler systems to install a fire 

Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
alarm if they add more than 30% or 1,000 square 

the event of a fire or smoke. 
feet to the structure, whichever is less. 

Added occupant protection by stating all fire alarm 
detection systems installed shall be connected to a Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.c N monitoring service that notifies the fire department Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
upon activation and is installed per Section 907 of the event of a fire or smoke. 
the fire code. 

Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
907.2.d N systems to be connected to a monitored fire alarm Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

system when installed or replaced. the event of a fire or smoke. 

 20-0203 E Page 24 of 39



-
907.6.21 Y 

Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply 
Locally created and adopted 

Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E 
Modification safety related power outages. 

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to 
1203.1.3 N Shunt trip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up 

power supplies 

3310.3 N Address requirements for construction sites Locally created and adopted 
Addressing for construction sites is important to assist 
responding emergency crews. 

3312.1 N Water supplies at construction sites with 
Locally adopted and amended 

Water must be on site prior to combustible material being 
combustible materials on-site stored or vertical construction commencing. 

EI Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout 
This section was created to include Fire Protection 

4903.1 y Locally created and adopted 
the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire 

Plan for all fire hazard severity zones. Protection Plan due to climatic, geological, and 
topographical conditions. 

This section clarifies that within the boundaries of EI Dorado 

4905.4 y Added a section to clarify roof construction 
Locally created and adopted 

County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are 

requirements 
wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be 
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly. 

Any damages or costs from negligent practices that Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate. 

5001.7 y cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally created and adopted 
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 

cost recovery fee. 
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the 
negligent parties. 

Added safety protection with permits being issued 
Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and 

5601.2 N 
by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for 

Locally adopted and amended 
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of 

fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding 

Supervisors for fireworks. 
of the applications they will be used for. 

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any 

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make 
documentation including timing and proprietary information 

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 N available all requested documentation pertaining to Locally created and adopted 
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they 

the firework presentation 
deem necessary. This information is understood to be 
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as 
such. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5704.2.9.6.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class" combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5706.2.4.4 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended flammable and Class" combustible liquid special 
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval 
and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County. 

Administrative need to add District name. Established limits 

5806.2 N Administrative addition of District name. 
as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable 

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code 
Locally adopted and amended Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ 

approval and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the 
County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code Official for 

5806.2.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted and amended locally 
Flammable Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. 
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

Establishes distances between LPG storage and 
dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential 

6104.2 N 
Established limits for LPG storage and dispensing 

Locally adopted and amended 
developments and high-density hotels, motel, apartments, 

near or adjacent to residential development etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would 
have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death. 
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

 20-0203 E Page 25 of 39



-

Establishes propane regulator requirement for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. Including requirements for two-
stage regulator use and location of first and second stage 

Establishes propane regulator requirements for 
regulators. Additional requirements are outlined for 

6112.1 N Locally created and adopted protective covers, riser pipe installation requirements, 
locations above 5000 foot elevation building permit submittal and review, tank center-line 

marking, and grade requirements. These requirements are 
based on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet. 

Establishes vertical propane rise requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. Pipe schedule location, swing 

6112.2 N 
Establishes propane vertical riser pipe requirements 

Locally created and adopted 
joint requirements, and the use of flexible riser piping as 

above 5000 foot elevation well as swing joints. These requirements are based on 
significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather 
conditions encountered above 5000 feet. 

Establishes marking and location requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. This section addresses signage 

6112.3 N 
Establishes propane marking and location Locally created and adopted 

location, emergency contact information, and snow related 
requirements above 5000 foot elevation tank marking requirements. These requirements are based 

on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet. 

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground 
tanks: 

6113.1 N 
Permits and plans shall be submitted and approved 

Locally created and adopted 
Allows us to require plans be submitted for review prior to 

by the AHJ (AuthOrity Having Jurisdiction). installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks 
require substantial maintenance including inspection and 
anode replacement at regular intervals. 

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without 

6113.2 N 
Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the 

Locally created and adopted 
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when 

property of the LPG company sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground 
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected. 

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on-
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow 
alarm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in the 

NFPA 130-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the event of water activation in a vacant structure, and 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 

Y 
Oistrict has been amended to update various 

SFM Adopted and amended locally 
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 130 

130-16 provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water 
systems in one-and two-family dwellings damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements 

were also added to ensure water circulation through the 
system, reducing stagnant water and backflow concems 
(EIO encourages this type of system). 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
Amends the current code set to include the addition of a 

y Correction of a system quality issue SFM Adopted and amended locally passive purge system to keep the water in the sprinkler 
130-16 Section 4.7 piping system from being stagnant. 

Chapter 80, NFPA, To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system 
130-16 Section Y 

system minimizing damage 
SFM adopted and amended locally 

must be available on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet 
5.1.1.2 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
An audible alarm system is added to notify occupants and 

y Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation SFM adopted and amended locally in the activation of the system when the building is not 
130-16 Section 7.6 occupied allow for detection minimizing damage. 

Chapter 80, NFPA, A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and 
130-16 Section Y System test to a pressure of 150 p.s.i. SFM adopted and amended locally 

failures and assures proper gluing of system components. 
11.2.1.1 

Appendix B: Table 
Changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 

N elevation, to match fire flow precedents used in Locally adopted and amended to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 
B105.1(1) 

EOC for years used for over a decade in EOC. 

 20-0203 E Page 26 of 39



-
Appendix B: Table 

Established a minimum requiremenl of 1,500 GPM, Allows us to match whal developers and residents are used 

B105.2 
N below 5000 fool elevation, for all commercial Locally adopted and amended 10 in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 

projects used for over a decade in EDC. 

Appendix D: D103.1 N Made an exception for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended 
II is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to 
construct a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant. 

Title 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways. 
Appendix D: Dl03.2 N State law requires no greater than 16% grade Locally adopted and amended In our EI Dorado County Title 14 adoption we allow greater 

than 16% grade with AHJ approval and hard surface. 

Appendix D: D103.3 N Text to include curbs and gutters Locally adopted and amended 
20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutters due 
to potential access issues and turning radius concerns. 

Appendix D: Dl03.5 § 
Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided 

1 
N Fire apparatus access road gates Locally adopled and amended roadway the gale width shall not be less than 15 feet due to 

radius issues. 

No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet 

Appendix D: D103.6.1 N Roads widths 20 to 29 feet Locally adopted and amended in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does 
not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire 
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all other elevations. 

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet 

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36 allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of 
Appendix D: D103.6.2 N 

feet in width Locally adopted and amended elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The 
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D 
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations. 

Appendix D: D104.2 
Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Exception 
N building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

have only one approved fire apparatus access road. residents and first responders. 

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 

Appendix D: D104.4 N Added to require circumferential fire apparatus 
Locally created and adopted access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire 

access roads structure and shall provide a continuous means of 
emergency vehicle access. 

Appendix D: Dl06.1 For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Exception 
N Removed Exception in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

residents and first responders. 

Appendix D: Dl07.1 For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Exception 
N Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

residents and first responders. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.2 through 101.5 N 

Adopted to establish scope, intent severability and 
Locally adopted Administrative clarity 

validity 

102.6 through 102.8 N References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopled Administrative clarity 

102.10 through 102.12 N Conflicting provisions, Other Laws, Application of 
Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

references 

103.1 through 104.1 N Definition of the Fire Prevention Division and ability 
Locally Adopted Administrative clarity to enforce the code 

104.3 through 104.4 N Right of Entry, Warrants, and Identification Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.6 through 104.6.4 N Record retention Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.8 through 104.9.2 N 
Modifications, altemate means and methods, and 

Locally Adopled Administrative clarity test 

104.11 through 
N 

Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of 
Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.11.2 systems 

104.11.3 N Authority of systems and devices inoperable Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
105.2.3 N Time limitation of application Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.3.1 through 
N Operational permits Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.3.2 

 20-0203 E Page 27 of 39



-
105.6.12 N Dry cleaning operational permits required for 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
hazardous cleaning solvent use 

Permits for various business operations for: Magnesium, 

105.6.2.28 through Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation 

105.6.35 
N 

fire and life safety inspections 
Locally Adopted vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing facilities, open buming, 

open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and 
organic coatings 

105.6.37 N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Locally Adopted Permits for places of assembly fire and life safety inspections 

105.6.39 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

locally Adopted Permits for private fire hydrants 
fire and life safety inspections 

Permits for pyroxylin plastics, refrigeration equipment, repair 
105.6.41 through 

N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

locally Adopted 
garages and motor fuel-dispensing facilities, rooftop 

105.6.46 fire and life safety inspections heliports, spraying or dipping, storage of scrap tires and tire 
by-products 

105.6.48 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

locally Adopted Permit for tire-rebuilding plants 
fire and life safety inspections 

105.6.50 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

locally Adopted 
Permit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material, 

fire and life safety inspections lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 cubic feet) 

106.1 through 106.3 N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Locally Adopted Fee schedules for permits 

fire and life safety inspections 

107.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

locally Adopted Inspection authority 
fire and life safety inspections 

Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and equipment, re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping, 
108.1 through 109.3 N 

fire and life safety inspections Locally Adopted supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding, 
Board of Appeals established, limitations on authority, and 
qualifications 

110.3.2 through 
N 

Adopted this section For administrative clarity and 
Locally Adopted 

Compliance with orders and notices, prosecution of 
110.3.4 fire and life safety inspections violations, and unauthorized tampering 

110.4.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Abaternent of violation 
fire and liFe safety inspections 

113.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Authority to disconnect service utilities 
fire and life safety inspections 

Asphalt kettles contain highly flammable substances and 
303.1 through 303.9 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological. and 

topographical) 

Managing ignition sources through responsible application 
305.1 through 305.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted of standards will reduce the number of fires in various 

settings (Climatic, geological. and topographical) 

Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY 
306.1 through 306.2 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted flammable and require special handling (Climatic, 

geological, and topographical) 

307.1 through 307.5 N Adopted this section for fire and liFe safety locally Adopted 
Open burning, recreational fire, and portable outdoor 
fireplaces, (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted Open flame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

308.1.2 through 
N Adopted this seqion for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 

Throwing or placing of ignition sources, torches for 
308.1.3 removing paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Locations near combustible, open flame devices, signals 
and markers, portable fuel open-flame devices, sky-

308.1.5 through 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 

lanterns, religious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming 
308.1.8.5 food and beverage preparation, dispensing, containers not 

in use, serving of flaming food, location, fire protection 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.2 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
Permits are required for above section (Climatic, geological, 
and topographical) 

 20-0203 E Page 28 of 39



-' 
Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices, 

308.3 through 308.4.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted theatrical performances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 
dormitories (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

310.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to smoking (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

310.3 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
"No Smoking' signs (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with 'No Smoking' 
31Q.4 through 310.8 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted signs, ash trays, buming objects, hazardous environmental 

conditions. (Climatic, geological. and topographical) 

Vacant premises condition and safety requirements, 
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant 

311.1 through 311.4 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted premises, security, fire protection, fire separation, removal 
of combustibles, removal of hazardous materials. (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

319.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to mobile food preparation 
vehicles. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

319.2 N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Locally Adopted 

Permits for mobile food preparation vehicles (Climatic, 
fire and life safety inspections geological, and topographical) 

Exhaust hood, fire protection, fire protection for cooking 
equipment, fire extinguisher, appliance connection to fuel 
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, metallic 
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking oil 
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting, 
normal vents, emergency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum 

319.3 through 
aggregate volume, protection of container, LP-gas container 

319.10.3 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted construction, protection of system piping, LP-gas alarms, 

CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel, 
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG 
container construction, CNG containers supplying 
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping, 
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire 
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems. 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

403.8.1 through 
Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1 

403.8.1.7 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted (residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and 

fire safety plans. 

403.10 through 
Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancy 

403.10.1.3 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic, 

geological, and topographical) 

405.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

510.3 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems 

fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a 
807.5.2 through 

N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in 

807.5.2.3 fire and life safety inspections educational facilities (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5 

903.2.1.5 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers) 

fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000 
square feet. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

 20-0203 E Page 29 of 39



-' 

Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders 
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from 
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time 

Adopted this section in existing buildings for the 
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 

1103.2 y safety of firefighters and other emergency Locally Adopted 
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by 

responders. the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind 
this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury 
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0101.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads 
through 0102.1 firefighters, and other emergency responders. including loads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Dead end fire apparatus access road requirements for a 

Appendix 0: 0103.4 N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. Locally Adopted tum around at 150 feet. (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0103.6 N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
'No Parking, Fire Lane' signs requirements. (Climatic, 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0104.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus through 0104.3 N Locally Adopted 

(excluding exception) firefighters, and other emergency responders. access roads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0105.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

Requirements for aerial fire apparatus access roads 
through 0105.4 firefighters, and other emergency responders. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential through 0106.3 N Locally Adopted 

(excluding exceptions) firefighters, and other emergency responders. developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0107.1 One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be 

(excluding exceptions) N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire 

through 0107.2 firefighters, and other emergency responders. apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 
climatic conditions. 

Appendix 0: 0108 N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle. 

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

 20-0203 E Page 30 of 39



;fflountatn 11Bemocrat 

www.mtdemocrat.com 
FAX # 530-344-5092 

LEGAL 
AD Proof 

Ad Re Allison Size: 6.0" 

Artist: 

Chan es: 

Start Date: 1019/19 

File Name: 7011 

graphics lLegalslAdsIMountaln Demo 

NOTICES OF INTENT 

First Notice 

Notice of Intent to Adopt a 
Fire Code Ordinance 

Notice Is hereby given of the Intention 
of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection 
District to adopt a Fire Code Ordinance. 
The District shall hold Its flrst public 
hearing at 1:00 P.M. on October 17, 2019 
at 2850 Fainane Ct., Building C, Placervile, 
CA. regarding the adoption of the Fire 
Code Ordinance pursuant to Health and 
Safety Code Sections 13869 and 13869.7. 
Copies of the code section refenred to and 
any secondary code sections referred to, 
adopted by reference. are on file with the 
Secretary of the District and are open to 
public Inspection. Adoption of the Fire 
Code Ordinance will adopt the California 
Fire Code as cunrently published In Title 
24, Part 9, of the California Code of 
Regulations, governing fire prevention 
and building standards related to fire and 
penlc safety with some amendments. In 
some instances the EI Dorado Coooty Fire 
Protection Distr1ct's proposed Fire Code 
Ordinance proposes building standards 
more stringent than those minimum 
building standards adopted by the 
State Fire Marshal and contained In the 
California Building Standards Code. 

Second Notice 

Notice of Intent to Adopt a 
Fire Code Ordinance 

Notice is hereby given of the intention 
of the B Dorado County Are Protection 
Distr1ct to adopt a Fire Code Ordinance. 
The Distr1ct shall hold its second public 
hear1ng at 1:00 P.M. on November 21, 2019 
at 2850 Fainane Ct, Building C, PlaceNiile, 
CA. regarding the adoption of the Fire 
Code Ordinance pursuant to Health and 
Safety Code Sections 13869 and 13869.7. 
Copies of the code section refenred to and 
any secondary code sections referred to. 
adopted by reference. are on file with the 
Secretary of the District and are open to 
public Inspection. Adoption of the Fire 
Code Ordinance will adopt the California 
Fire Code as cunrently published in Title 
24, Part 9, of the California Code of 
Regulations, governing fire prevention 
and building standards related to fire and 
panic safety with sorne amendments. In 
some instances the EI Dorado County Fire 
Protection District's proposed Fire Code 
Ordinance proposes building standards 
more stringent than those minimum 
building standards adopted by the 
State Fire Marshal and contalned In the 
California Building Standards Code. 
1019 7011 

ADVERTISERS: PLEASE READ CAREFULLY! 
A proof is provided to avoid printing errors & to 
show the arrangement of composition. Mark all 
corrections with a pen. We cannot be responsible 
for printing errors not corrected on the proof. 
Our deadline schedule does not allow 
copy changes or additions. 

Unless we hear from you 
by on 

AD WILL RUN A'..,.S"'S .... HnoO'"W""'NT"".--' 

Contact your advertising representative at ________________ _ 

 20-0203 E Page 31 of 39



. . , 

Attachment No. 2 

EI Dorado County Fire Protection District 

Resolution No. 2019-08 

 20-0203 E Page 32 of 39



• • '. 

FL I)OKAOOCOU"n, t"IRF. I'ROn:CnON IlISTRICl 

IU~OI.l·T ION 21'9..oH 

A IU;SOUITIO'" m'TIiE HOARD OF OIIU:crORS OFTIII; EL DORAI>O COU"TY FIRE 
I'ROT[CTlO.'l DISTlu rr 

AOOPT, roG Fl i'oDiNGS SIiPPORTING "I'>U: NI)\U: r-.TS TO TilE 
CALlt'OAA IA FUn: ('Oll~: 

A I'eS()lu!ion for the EI Dorado County Fin: " rol«tion District Kuing forth findinp ",tb ~ to local 
conditions within the Fire DiSlnC\ which make certain modifiealiolll and cl\""lIe5 10 the Colifomi. Fi.., 
Cook reM<lnably ne(C'''''1' for pre;t'rvil'lll: fire and life safety in the EI 00..:10 County F~ I'rolCCIKm 

District. 

The: G.weming Board of the El Dorado County Fire Proccction District fin,b lind resolves as ~IQW5: 

WHEREAS, Ilcalm &; Safety Code Section 17958.S permits a Fire !'rocKlion Oistncllo.oopt an 
ordilW'lU which changes or modlr~ !he: Stille Jlousina rcgulatiOllS adopted pursuant 10 Hea~h &. Safely 
Code St..:tion 17922 upon IkImnilWlllon tt..t ~uch cllange$ Of modifications _ necessary .... 10 local 

condilions that peruill regulations lO~min& eonditiool haurdous 10 life. l"OPCUj" and IDe tllvironmc:nI 
from fire, explosion. hazarOOus m,tcrials and hu.anloos uses: and 

WIIEREAS, Health It. Wety Code Section 17958. 1 ~uires that. !listriet's Board rL Dim.:lors 
nwang.oy ~haI\ges Of modifications pursuanl to Health It. S.fely Code Secuon 179585 shall make 
express fiooina that sud! clwi&n Of modifications ~ needed: and $MIl file I c:opy of such ehan~ or 
mO<Jifications With the Ikpanmenl of Housing and Community Developmen1. 

WIIERfAS, the unique local climatic. geoloa;ieal, and topogn.phicil conditions exi"ina within 
the boundaries or the District make it rcuonably necenary for the District to impose mOn.' stringent 
n.:qUtmnmts than set forth in tile CalifomIA Firt Code and pursuant to Cllifomia II<~alth and Safety Code 
sections iJ86\l.7 and I79SI.7, the District desires 10 mike ex~ findin&!, 10 that effect. 

NOW, TIIEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED IlIat tile Board ofDiTtt1Or!i of tile EI 00r.;I0 Counly 
Fire I'rotc<.:tion District, after hlvina du.ly no\ic~"tl and held publ ic hearinlS. ~by adopts Ihf following 
futdings concern1"1 cum::nt unique: Io:tQI condi tions that together make etoCh modific"l00 10 the 
Cal ifomi. Firc Code. rca5OI\IIbly IW«s.'lary 10 pOlvidc MieqUII.te and cff..cuve prolc<:uon of life. propeny 
and the cnvil"llMlCT1\ more speelfK:llly ~ forth as follows: 

. I . 

 20-0203 E Page 33 of 39



, 
f1N01~GS or FACT 

FOR C HANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TQ THE STATE DUII. I>ING STANOAilDS 
COilE (TITLE 24PART 9) Hr.CAII."!'; OF l.OCAL CONDITIONS 

A. Genenl. 
After due C(Iflsitkralion. the Bo.n:I of Di=ton of the EI Do<aOO Count)' Fi~ f'mIection DiSlnC'!. hereby 
lind:! tIIat due 10 local chmatic. geologic and lopognophic conditKlns, .., staled within !his document, 
there is • n=I to pn:wllk the roodiftcation, -.d change'l contained in the .ooptive OniilllllCf of the 
Cahforni. F~ Code: Such changes all' dttmed 10 be rc_bly ne«ssary 10 provide adequate and 
dfcctn'c procl!'Ction of tife, propeny and !Iv: nMronmcnt. 

The Et Dorado County Fire Protection District provides flJ'l: proto:<.:tion, emergency medi(:aI Slerw:n UId 
5p«,alized K:KlIC ..erviccs 10 .pproxima.tely !!evcnIY-four thousand people in a 281 !lqlllltC mile __ 
The Districi is I~to:d on the WC5tem slQpe of EII>orw.Io County. The topoeraphy of the District ranaes 
from rolling lIilLs ofgrau and oU woodland in the ~ and oak-timiJer ill. the ~ dnlinagesoflhe east 
pQrtion. The WClllho:r wodillOns vuy &om f,";(.lng lempc11llUl'ell with ~iolWll snow ill wimer, 10 
sum.mer temperatures Ih8I ~ul.ty exo;ttd 100 degm-s. 

The O\.s1ncl is divided inro fhe distnl(:l ~: Gold Hill , City Qf Placerville, Pleasant Valley, !'oUod:, 
P'neslSua .... -berry, and Shinak SpnnQs. Most of the commercial and ind~strial arus arc located along 
the eomoor of flighway 50 and lOOn: rurnl comn\unih~ With ~ sites on 'arser r-n:<:ls alonll the 
outer areas of the distria 

The EI D • .mdo County Fire Protection Di~tricl is 1ft ~aJl-nsk~ agency in....tUch \be o.lV1Ct participekS 
in a sopI\istic.o.lw automatic aid ~ with 0Ibet aaen<:1CS ""thin the county. The R:SOUI"CeS of the 
DlStric! will respond 10, mel dm with. ... y type: of emergency. The tf';Jm '"FiR Protection'· in this 
cIoewt'Ient IS broed .00 indudes rnplIlI5eS to fire$, smoke and odor in~estigalions. alarms.. public II$$i$t 
calls. hal.an;Ious INllel"ials i""Klmu. medical aid, fire 'n~sligatiom and sp«i. li:«:d rescues. 

The Distncl tw six; fUl l-time. staffed nre stations ,,·hicli pro~idc emergency servic~ 10 the community. 
Fire Station 17 is Iocatro in the Ullinoorponlted town or Pollod: Pines It bUO ro.,y EKpre:ss Trail. Fir~ 
Swion ]9 is located in the uninc:OI"pOnIted _ ofPlacerv,lIe known as Pleasant VlIIky at 4429 P~ 
Valley Road. Fire Station 21 is louted \he urnncorponted town oiCarniM.I1 4(14() Car300 Ro.d. fiR 
Station 25 is located in the City nfPt..:erville &13034 s.:r..tnenw SIfett. Fino Station 28 is located in the 
Ullll"loorponoted town of Shin~1e Sprinas .II. li60 Poodn-osa Ro.:!. Fir!: Stlltlon n is located in the 
UIIinoofponolnl town ofCnoI .II. noo Saint Florin Court. The District tt.s n full_tunc, ~r pe~l. 
~ with thrR support stIIff pt;Isilions. 

8. Climatic. 
The EI Dorado County Fire PrmfCuon D,smo;l is located ""thin a foothill ~on.. The o.stria \I subject 
10 four RaiIQnJ. with an l1li11111 .,,~ II/lOW r.n in the Win!" month5 of 2 inches. in ..tdillon to .. 
a~erage rainfall of 45 inches per )'Hr. 1"hc:x .J,.~ weather oond,tiOl'lS ctet.'" ill:VU'C ha7.ardntB I'OIId 
cond.tions IIJd flood"" as well as rod: !lido:: har..vds alon& the main IICCeSS roads "'ithin. u _U u iDle. 
the District from the SW"roUndinc atta.. ~ 10 period~ of nmfall, .101\11 with. repealc\l fOld closures.. 
the ability of the FiR l'nKecuon DtstnC! 10 provide irrunc-di,.le erntr"lIency rtSpOOK is often dc.-1.yecI. 
These samc: -.lvm:c: dilNltic CQf\dJtiollS often resWt in. IUle number of vehicular .ec:idenlS u..t place 
extreme reSlnlinlf, on the .,·" Iability of emerttncy response 10 perrOI'm em"¥~y rex., fint aid. 
hazardous mal~rials control and fire- li.hung. The climatic C(lI1ditioos often result in I subscantial Of 

total Laclr. of abilit), of the FiR Proteclion Distri<:t 10 ",spond immediatel), II,) octa types of e:n~leency 
situations that occur. Examples of 0- emergency situations Include struc!un: fires, wildland and 
fOft5l fires, /loodina. hazardous makrials incidents, efTICTitIIC) medlCll calls. vdlicic aocickna md 

, ,. 

 20-0203 E Page 34 of 39



• , 
~enlcal re$aIeS. Tbc mutual aid ogretmcnl, established with adjoirung fin: agencies might not be 
possibk due 10 ~v_ dllnaLlc eono.inlons, ' nuXlillg or IOtally blodcing ~CSI into the District. 

Summary: 
These local dimalk condiliolls .ffn:t the a«:deration. 'flimsily. and siu of fires in doe Fin: DI.Slria. 
Times of little or 110 nunral!. low humidity and high tempenll"",' create c><ln:mciy l\:uaIdous eondluons.. 
poIrtieularly.s they relalc to tho; wildland· urban interface. Winds expcriencw in thi~.,.". CIIII hllve • 
significant lmp<Kl upQl\ structUIT fira. espo;;,ally In buildings In close proximity 10 one u..thcr, and 10 
... ildlands commonly found in the EI Dorado CoullI)' fire ProIC'ttion Dmncl. Structures built within !he 
EI DonIdo COIInt) Fin: J>rot~on DIstrict mUSt be buih wilh Ih:x variables In mInd. 

C. GealogiclL. The EI Dorado County Fire l'lol«lioo DistrICt is located ,.·jlltin l'I'IOIlo:nlle acti,-iry 5elSmic 

Zone rtu~ Tbe sciMni<:, lteolOjICIII conditions present. potential for mulupk fires, RWtOI break. of 
WMer maIllS. multiple electrical powtr failures. mulhple I;Qllapsed structures and I large number of .:alls 
for CIlKr&CflCY rmdical aid, all of "hid may (Iof;I;ur sim ... ttaneow;ly dwing y x ismic e,en!. 1M. waIer 

districl has ntllllCf1)us "'~tOl"-pwnpinll S),stClTl5 u.scd for fire ~"'I'P'"cssion wlter delivery. IS _II as ...... Ier 
storage WIb providing water systcm pressure. Most of the pumpi", $)"Stef!lS art dtpc:lldem on 
electrical power for opc:no\ion. Sooh eleclrical po"'er may not be availlble dOMing I xismic cvad. 
Waler slor'lIe tlnks ... m:! for the stOlli<' of mjuircd fire suppression WIler may 1150 c:oIap$c in such ... 
e~nl forc irljj the addiuonal n«d 10 tl"llnspon waler vii IIdditional piec<s of fire appanll.l$ wIIlc:h will 
place I si8l1ificanl restraint on the lbility oftbe l>iwict 10 provide the re<.j ... ircd ~rgenc~~. 

Summary' 
Local g~ic and grojotic.al fcatum; and processes exisc Wlthm the boundari<i::!! ofm.: diStrict thd 
may hamper the Ib,lIty of the F.I Oorado County Fire Protec1ion Di5lrK:tlO perfOrm its SIOIOm dubcs. fire 
followinlllll carthqlLllkc hIlS the potenual of c .... s,'" grealet" 10$$ of life and dam,oge \hID 1M canbq ...... ~ 
ilxlf. 

D Topoln phica l. The Dtscnd is primarily compoad of areas that are cunsideml by 1M SUite 10 be high 
lire twuanI K"erily ZOOl"S. Mud! of the Dosuict is located within foothill lmain. oo~ wido t\it:hly 
combustible v~tation. tocludi", the pre5Cn« of lTIIIny conifero\l5 fOR3tcd areas.. The .,'.00.. within 
the District ranges from II 1,400 feet 10 ~r 6.000 fed at the highest poinL Slope willl;n doe Disuict 
no.ngcs from 0 dtgree~ 10 90 dcglttS. 1M. structun:s within the IfUS offoouulls temin ~'ICr)" limited 
fire llCcess. duc to narrow roadways with st~p g.-..des and poor ro.d ,urface ronditions. 1"be Dis:aiet is 
lICCes5ible only from the O\Itsidc by ooe Sl&te Il ighway and 0I\e U.S. Highway. The Highway SO 
c,,"",dor aoes dim:tly lhroUih lhc El Dorado County Fire District .rid at times lTIIIy be clo.sed by snoWOf 
mudsliOes This can mike ICCCSS 10 many pwu uf the: EI Dondo County Fire District di ffICult The 
~senee of many exiscl", Itruc:tures within !be hip fire huarU xvcrity zon£ areas P'O'.idt:s f« a ¥U)" 

high potenti.) of a 5tr\Ielure fire sprudinl inlO a ",i ld lilltd Of forest fi re condition lIS _II as !be peXmtiai 
for . wildland or forest fire spreading to structures. 

Summlry: 
The IlilJllllmt of canyorlJ .. valle-y$ and slopes into inhabited ___ combined with !be vwiable nIIltIre of 
!he temin, yield I poImIial foI- increased lire risk. Most strocl\ll"C$, both resid..'Ilual and cotnmefcial • .-e 
in. or au SWTOIIndcd by areas tNt contain I significant &rus. brosh. mi~ed oak ....-oodlmtl ..d mixed 
conifer fuel load. DI>e 10 drou&ht eooditions. bcflle infestations. and IKk of ""1jeUI000t ~ 
much of doe area is populated with either deJid Of dying uees. contributing to Nt exllane en dIngef . 

. ) . 

 20-0203 E Page 35 of 39



• 
E. Conclusion: 

Local climatic, 8WIIl'1lphic and IOP'.>8f1lPi'tic candilions described above Il'lCrtllSe the fmjuency, intenSIty. 
and site of fires involving buildirt&S in the Fi~ District. Funho:r, tbc:se conditions impact poImlial 
danwge 10 structures &om an eanhquate and substqum\ rIM. Tlw:rrfore, it b rnsooably ~SS8Iy thaI 
the California Fire Code bt modified 10 mitigate IN: dfectl oflbe above conditions. 
California H«hh &. Safety Code Section INS'.7 requires thaI modifiulions to the Fire Code be 
upreuly marked and identified as 10 "'flich ,*11 finding refen to which Code modification. The 
at\.JO.:hed Appendi" A provide3 this connection. 

II\'TRODUCED III regular mttllna of\he Board of DirectO!1l of the EI Dorado County Fire Prottttion 
Dislrict on OclObo:r 17th, 2019. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED at I regular m«tUl, of the Bolrd of Dim:ton of the EI Donodo County Fire 
Pn>Iectioo n.5tnC1 on O<;tober 17th, 20 191))' the following roll call VQle: 

-~.~-

ABSTAIN; /..1 _,r ::-

ATruT 

• • • 

 20-0203 E Page 36 of 39



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 

101.1 X Admin 

105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.6 X Climatic/Geologica I/T 0 pogra p h ica I 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
503.4.4 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

505.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

509.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
903.2.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geologica lIT opogra ph ica I 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4903.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

 20-0203 E Page 37 of 39



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 

6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

6112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 X Cli matic/ Geo logica I/T 0 pogra ph ica I 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 4.7 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra phica I 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix B: Table Bl05.1(1) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix B: Table Bl05.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Appendix 0: 0103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Appendix 0: 0103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 
Appendix 0: 0103.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

101.2 through 101.5 X Admin 

102.6 through 102.8 X Admin 

102.10 through 102.12 X Admin 

103.1 through 104.1 X Admin 

104.3 through 104.4 X Admin 

104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin 

104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin 

104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin 

104.11.3 X Admin 

105.2.3 X Admin 

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin 

105.6.12 X Admin 

105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin 

105.6.37 X Admin 

105.6.39 X Admin 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin 

105.6.48 X Admin 

105.6.50 X Admin 

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin 

107.1 X Admin 

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin 

110.4.1 X Admin 

113.1 X Admin 

 20-0203 E Page 38 of 39



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
303.1 through 303.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

305.1 through 305.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

306.1 through 306.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
307.1 through 307.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra phica I 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
308.2 X Admin 

308.3 through 308.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
310.4 through 310.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
311.1 through 311.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

319.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
319.2 X Admin 

319.3 through 319.10.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

403.10 through 403.10.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
405.5 X Admin 

S10.3 X Admin 

807.5.2 through 807.S.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
903.2.1.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1103.2 X Topographical 

Appendix D: Dl01.1 through 
X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Dl02.1 

Appendix D: D103.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Appendix D: D103.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: Dl04.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Dl04.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: DlOS.1 through 

DlOS.4 
X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

Appendix D: Dl06.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Dl06.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: Dl07.1 (excluding 
X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

exceptions) 

Appendix D: Dl08 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

 20-0203 E Page 39 of 39


	Resolution_El Dorado County
	Reso El Dorado County 2-25-20



