
RESOLUTION NO. XXX-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 011-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is 
updated by the State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines 
are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, 
Chapter 1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety 
regulations to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building 
official, or his or her authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his 
or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the 
chief of the fire authority, or the chief’s authorized representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and 
maintain a memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities 
pertaining to the inspection of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on November 21st, 2019, the Board of Directors of the El Dorado Hills County 
Water District adopted Ordinance No. 2019-01 which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code 
with amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or 
topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El 
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the El Dorado Hills County Water District and 
delegates enforcement of the ordinance to the El Dorado Hills County Water District Fire 
Chief, or his or her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following 
sections: 

101.1, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4, 307.4.4.1, 
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1. 
507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 
903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 
5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 
NFPA 13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 4.7, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 
5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1,  
Appendix B: Table B105.l (1), Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D103.1 through D103.3, 
Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix D103.6.l, Appendix D103.6.2, and Appendix D104.4. 

20-0203 F Page 1 of 36



Resolution No. XXX-2020 
Page 2 of 2 

 
 
 

The El Dorado Hills County Water District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 
9, in its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire 
Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

 
105.6.17-105.6.19, 105.6.39, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 
403.4, 403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 
403.12, 404.1-404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2), 808, 904.1.1, 
1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, 
Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception), D107.1 (Exception 1 
and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, 
Appendix L, Appendix M. 

 
Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 
 

 
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of 
said Board, held the _____ day of _____________________, 20__, by the following vote of said Board: 
 
 Ayes: 
Attest: Noes: 
Kim Dawson Absent: 
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors  
 
By: _____________________________________ _____________________________________ 
 Deputy Clerk Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Board of Supervisors 

 

  20-0203 F Page 2 of 36



EL DORADO HIIJIS 

FIRE DEPARTMENT 
"Serving tlie Communities of C£,{ (])oraao Jri{{s, <J{escue ana Latr06e JJ 

December 18,2019 

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer 
EI Dorado County Board of Supervisors 
330 Fair Lane 
Placerville, CA 95667 

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the EI Dorado Hills County Water 
District, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code with amendments related to 
local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. 

Dear Mr. Ashton: 

The EI Dorado Hills County Water District (EDHCWD) is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS) 
ratify its Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code as amended due to specific 
local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 
requires the legislative body of the city or county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny 
the adopted ordinance. The BOS must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District 
(or its representative) or the Chief Building Official. 

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2019-01 with amendments 
to the 2019 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the EDHCWD Fire 
Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for your review and use on this topic. 

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County. 

Fire Chief 

ATTACHMENTS: 

1. EDHCWD Ordinance No. 2019-01 
2. EDHCWD Resolution No. 2019-10 
3. Draft EI Dorado County BOS Resolution 

/050 Wilson Boulevard • EI Dorado Hills, California 95 762 • Telephone (9/6) 933-6623 • Fax (916) 933-5983 • ..,..,..,. edhfire. com 

  20-0203 F Page 3 of 36



Attachment No. 1 

EDHCWD Ordinance No. 2019-01 

  20-0203 F Page 4 of 36



EL DORADO HILLS WATER IllSTUJCT 

EL Don 

N 

BElT 

An ordinance of the El Dorado Hills \AI ater District the 20] 9 Edition of the 

Fire the 2018 Edition the International Fire and C7n"PrnlnC7 the 

of life and n""""""l"'lu from fire and PV1"\lAC'lAT'\ hazards from the use of 

hazardous materials and and hazardous to Hfe or property in the occupancy 

I.HA. ... u.ul .. '" and in the for the issuance of and collection of fees tl'l""1"""'t,,,.r" 

.l ....... ~, ...... ,jJ::. Ordinance 2016-37 of the EDHCWD and a1l other ordinances and of the ordinances conflict 

therewith. 

Be it ORDAINED the Board of Directors of the also known as the El Dorado Hills Fire 

U~'J<'~'H4: ~~~~~ 

Section 5: =;....;...;;=..;==;;;;;.;;;...;;.....;;;.. 

Section 6: ~~~~~~~.!..=~~~~~~~~~ 

1: ____ ~~~~~~~ 

The EDHCWD makes certain to the Fire 20]9 

pursuant to Health & Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.7 and 18941. 5 this code "' .... " ... ..-,"'.... process. 

Such are necessary because of local and/or conditlons, The 

EDHCWD has to Section 18941.5 of the Health & the of 

facts relative to these conditions Resolution #2019-10 of the EDHCWD dated ~el)telmoer 19 l 2019. 

The EDHCWD the 2019 

\PJ)enal(~es. mCOn.onltmlg those sections of the International Fire 

with the exclusions listed below: 

)rClUllanl:.:e 2019-01 

Title Part 9, =-~--::;;';:==.I..' IIlIClUlOUllg 

2018 edition not ElQ(rou~Q 

1 

  20-0203 F Page 5 of 36



Exclusions: 105.6.17-105.6.19, I 308.1.4,309,311 311.6, 318, 403.1,403.2.1-403.2.4, 

403.4,403.6,403.7,403.8 403.8.1-403.8.1.7),403.9,403.1 403. 403.11,403.12,404.1-404.4, 

405.1-405.4,405.6-405.9, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2), 808, 904.1.1,1101,1103.1,1103.3-1103.6,1103.9 

(adopting 1103.9. J), J 103.1 0, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the 1; .... \.·I;IJ'.Vll under D104.2 (Exception), 

".IJ~'''WUJl\ F, Appendix G, Appendix J, Dl 06.1 (Exception), Dl 07.1 (Exception), Appendix A, Appendix 

Appendix Appendix Appendix M. 

Appendices not <ll1r.nt~·t1 can be used for reference in enforcing other 

Code. 

of the 2019 California Fire 

SECTION 3: 

The following Sections are 

Chapter 1 

amended or added: 

Ordinance 

Section 101 Scope and General Requirements 

.!..::..~..:....:= shall be amended as follows: Add name 

':"';;:"=-'::"'':;'::''::;';';'';;",-",'':'==''''';;;'';;'';;'''':''':;';:;;'';'';''''';:=:::'''''':::'=:::.J==;'';;;;''';;''';;;'= shall be added as follows: A schedule of fees 

adopted by the district board of directors for plan review, inspections and the issuance of permits by 

the dis/riel may in the most current district fee (Heallh & Safety Code 17951). 

~=:.::.-=.;;;;.;;...==.;...;;..;;'-'--.;;...;:;.= shall be added as follows: Fire sen'ice may be charged to a~ 

of the law, or as a result of 

carelessness. is "'.',VUTL.H for the cause of the district to rp"nf')~ln to the scene of an incident. A 

district hoard may a fee to cover the cost the provides or the cost 

of enforcing any regulation for which is rl1.rJre,pri & Safety Code 13916). shall 

not the actual cost of suppressing 10 the scene of an Inl".,np:nf 

106.7 Administrative Costs shall be added as follows: When a test or inspection is <11"1'117'1'11111"17 and 

the to perform to the satisfaction authority having jurisdiction the AHJ 

may hill the contractor for actual time spent to and from the test/inspection location and 

the time at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs. 

rlHEr'lI'n through a written notice may appeal this matter 

added as follows: Any person or entity who 

or determination made by the fire 

15 calendar days of the postmark on 

2 

  20-0203 F Page 6 of 36



the notice. AI! slIch ilppeuls shal! he filed in writmg with the Secretary ojthe Governing Board jrJr 

the district. A timely appeal shall stay further acrion by the fire code official until the matter is 

determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in ,'-;'cc(ioll 109.2, unless (he issue poses an imminent fire 

or life sa(ely hazard to memhers of the jJublic. the fire code ufficial shall 110tifj' the appellant by 

certified mail of the dale and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be scheduled to take place no 

sooner thall 20 calendar days/i'om the dale showlI olllhe certified mail. Thl! appel/ant shall have the 

riRht to appear in person III" hy agent at the hearing and present oral, wriften and/or photographic 

eridence (0 the Appeal Buard 

Section] ] 0 Violations 

] lOA Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows: Persons who shall violate a provision of this 

code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, 

repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code 

official, or of a pennit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of II 

misdemeanor or inji-action, at the discretion of the prosecuting attorney or agency, punishable by a 

fine not exceeding $100. ()() fi.Jr afirst violation; 2. Afine not exceeding $500. 00 for a second violalion 

of the same provision within one year; 3. A fine nol exceeding $1000.00 for each additional violation 

ufthe same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 180 days, or both such fine 

and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be 

deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995). 

110.4.2 Citations shall be added as follows: The Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized 

representative, may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations o:fthis code pursuant to 

Section 13871 of the Health & Safety Code of the Slare of California and Chapter 5c (commencing 

wilh Section 853.6) of Title 3 o/Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State a/California 

Section 112 Stop Work Order 

1 ]2.4. Failure to Comply shall be amended as follows: Any person who shall continue any work 

after having been served with a stop-work order, except such work as that person is directed to 

perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or 

both as described in Section 110.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995). 

Chapter 2 

Section 202 General Definitions 

Add definition for Campfire - Shall mean a/ire which is usedfor cooking, personal warmth, lighting, 

or aesthetic purposes. This includes fires contained within outdoor fireplaces and enclosed slaves 

with flues or chimneys, stoves usingjellied, liquid, or solidfuels, portable barbecue pits, braziers, or 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 3 

  20-0203 F Page 7 of 36



space healing devices which are used outside of any structure, mobile home, or any living 

accommodation mounted on a vehicle. 

Add definition for District - Shall mean the district and all other areas within the exterior boundaries 

thereofnow or hereafter established. 

Add definition for Driveway - Shall meun a vehicular access thar serves up TO two (2) parcels with 

no more than two (2) residential units and any number C!.(non-commercial or industrial buildings on 

each parcel. 

Add definition for Executh:e Bod" - Shall mean the Board of Directors of the District. 

Add definition for Fire Chief - .<..,'hall mean the Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire 

department/district serving the jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative. 

Add definition for Trained Crowd Manael.'r - Sh.all mean standby personnel, usually a security 

guard or usher personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other 

place of public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency. 

Chapter 3 

Section 302 Definitions 

302.1 Definitions shall be amended as follows: Added Campfire definition, as shown above m 

Chapter 2. 

Section 307 Open Burning, Recreational Fires, and Outdoor Fireplaces 

307.4.4 Campfire Restrictions shall be added as follows: 

307.4.4.] 11 is unlawfill for any person to light. maintain, or use a campfire IIpon or near any brush­

covered land, grass-covered land, orforest-covered land during the time when bllrning permits are 

suspended by the Director of the Department of Forestry and Fire Protection, the CAL FIRE Unit 

Chief, or the AHJ. 

Exception: Commercial cooking operations with approval of the AHJ. 

307.4.4.2 When campfires are allowed, it should be unlaufulfor any person to light. maintain, or lise 

a campfire upon any brush-covered land. grass-covered land, or forest-col'ered land unless the 

following minimum requirements are complied with. 

307.4.4.2 (a) The urea within 5 feet C!.( the periphery C!.( the campfire is cleared of all flammable 

material and vegetation. 

307.4.4.2 lb) One serviceable shovel with a handle of at least J 2 inches is ready for use at the 

immediate area of the campfire. 

307.4.4.2 (el Campfires shall be limited to a J foot by 1 foot area, unless in an approved mam~factured 

cooking device or fire ring. 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 4 

  20-0203 F Page 8 of 36



307.4.4.2 (d) Written permission oj the landowner must be obtained prior t() the ignitiull of Ihe 

campfire and shall be 011 sitt' 

Chapter 5 

Section 503 Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

503.2.1 Dimensions shall be umended as lollows: Fire apparatus access roads shall have an 

unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet, exclusive of shoulders, as measuredfl'omface of curb to 

(ace of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503,6, and unobstructed 

vertical clearance of not less than 15 feet. All driveways in the district shall not be less than 12 jeet 

wide. 

503.2.5 Dead Ends shall be amended as follows: Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways 

in excess of 150 feet in leng1h shall be provided with an approved area tor turning around fire 

apparatus. 

503.2,6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces shall be amended as follows: Where a bridge or an elevated 

surface is part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in 

accordance with the current EI Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge Standard or Appendix 

D of the current California Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive. Bridges and elevated surfaces 

shall be designed for a live load sufficient 10 carry thc imposed loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load 

limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when required by the Fire Code Official. Where 

elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces which are not designed 

for such use, approved barriers, approved signs, or both shall be installed and maintained when 

requircd by the fire code official. 

=::;;.:..::..:=:...:..;.;~.=.=:::a.':':::''':''':::.::...L'';::;:':::'::'::':::; shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, 01" leave 

standing any vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary 10 avoid conflict with 

other traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized 

representative, Peace Officer or officia/traffic control device along the edge of any hig/nvay, at any 

curh, or in any location il1 a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking facility, 

designated as afire lane by the district with jurisdiction over the area in which the place is located 

The designatioll shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to, and visible from, the 

designated place clearly stating in letters not less than one inch in height that the place is afire lane, 

(2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, ill contrasting color, marking the place with the 

words "FiRE LANE", which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) by u red curb or red painJ on 

the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words "FIRE LANE". 

==:.:.:::..~~=-=~=-:..:.=::...::::.::..::..::u..::::.:..:::=shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, or 

leave standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) if the vehicle is 

attended by a licensed driver who is seated in the front seat and who can immediately move such 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 5 

  20-0203 F Page 9 of 36



lIPll1r"p in case fb} lfthe is or operated by afire department and is 

marked as a fire department 

added as follows: Fire lanes be 

road width as required in nn.PM,7;y D as amended by the district. 

~:::!..:..i::~.£l.!..£..J:!Jl!J!!~!'!"!!!!""!~£~!!!'!:.El shall be added as follows: All automatic and manual 

on 

installed over fire apparatus access roads shall comply with the district 

by the fire code official. 

~lanal'1ra as approved 

the first line of this amended as follows: 

Addressesfor new and existing U·U,ltU',!rJJ;;::.) shall comply with the district address standard as approved 

code UfI,'(;lt.-ll. 

507.5.1 Where Required shall be amended as follows: 400 feet shall be amended to 150 feet, 

509.3 Fire Control Room shall be added as follows: Fire sprinkler fire alarm control panels, 

solar photovoltaic power system shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression or 

similar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The fire 

control room shall have minimum dimensions offirefeet by sevenfeet in size with a total usable area 

of not less than 35 square feet. room be located within the on an outside wall at a 

location approved the Fire and shall be from the exterior. An exterior 

access door with a clear width qf not less 32 inches and of not less than 80 inches shall 

be provided for access into the room. A durable sign shall be to the exterior of the door u'ith 

the words "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters not less than 4 in height. A key box complying 

Wilh Section 506 shall on the exterior side of the fire room door opening, 

The room must be of maintaining a minimum of 40 degrees Fahrenheit. A 

clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers to any adjacent walls. This 

room can be a shared with other building utilities or protection equipment that is nol 

incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the fire 

sprinkler system and other protection equipment. This room shall not be used for any other 

storage. 

Exception: One-and dwellings, ml1'nUlaC'HI.1'p.G or similar uses defined as 

a Group R-3, R3. /, or R-4 occupancy, 

Ordinance 2019-01 6 

  20-0203 F Page 10 of 36



Chaptt.'T 9 

903.2 When Required shaH be amended as follows: An approved automatic sprinkler system shall 

be required and installed in new bllildings and structures 3600 square feet or when 

constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction as described in Sections 903.2. I through 903.2.12. 

buildings not under a use permit used (or commercial purposes . 

.;;:;...;;:;.;::...:.:::..:..:::;:;....;...;...;=~:...:::.;:;..:::L.;::;:.=.:::-=-= shall be added as follows: Status of existing bUildings than 3,6UO 

1n existing bui/dings 3,600 squarefeet or u/he}' than une and tv.'o-family dwelling 

units, and agricultural buildings not under use permit for commercial purposes, where the 

floor area of/he building or structure is increased by an addition of more than (30%) 

or 1, 000 square/eel whichever is less. such building or structure shall be made fa conform 10 Section 

903.2. 

=-=-=-=:':"="--:"';;'''='';;;;;'';;;'''';;;;'-::''';;;;=.::JL.='::''::'''::'= shall be added as follows: Status of existing buildings less than 3,600 

square feet. In existing buildings 3,600 square feel or other than one-and hvo-fami(v dwelling 

units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, where the 

floor area of the building or structure is increased 10 a lotal square footage over 3,600 square feel, 

by an addition of more Ihu!1lhirly percel1T (30%) or 1.000 square feet, whichever is less, such building 

or structure shall be made to conform fo Section 903.2. 

be as follows for A groups A-l through A-4: 903.2.1.] (l) The fire 

area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

~::!,:,::~~;!,!;!J~sha]l be amended as follows: 903.2.3 (1) Throughout an E fire areas greater 

than 3, 60U square feet in area. 

ZJ!!::!..:.:.::::!....:~~I!....!:...:..!:.. shall be amended as follows: 903.2.4 F. 903.2.4 (1) A Group F fire area 

exceeds 3,600 square feet . 

.-:::...==:..:......::~:..:::::...t:::~ shall be amended as foHows: 903.2.7 Group Band M. 903.2.7 (1) A Group Band 

M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feel. 

~~~~~l!!]!!!~~~t!Q.!!!!~ shaH be added as foHows: An Qutomatic fire jprinkJer shall 

be required in all new manufactured homes and multi-family manufactured homes intended/or use 

us a one-and two-family dwelling. The design and installation o/such systems shall be in accordance 

with California Code Title 25, §4300. 

1. Manufaclured homes localed within an exisling mobilehome park complying with 

Health and Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3. 

Ull •. <:.unJ ..... 201 7 

  20-0203 F Page 11 of 36



2, Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an 

Section . when the accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government 

existing primary residence on the properly is not 

Residential Code Section R313.2. 

to comply with California 

3, Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size, 

"-,,,,=,",,--,c..::..::...:~:....:;;:;....:::. shall be amended as follows: 903.2.9 Group S. 903.2.9 (I) A Group S fire area 

exceeds 3,600 square feel . 

.::..:::.:=!..!..:;!:...;;;:..:..=~.:::::...:::....::;:==;:;;.;:;:,...::....::;:.::..=:.:.:.a-=::::.::...:::..ooo.;:;;.:;shall be amended as follows: 903.2.10 (1) Where 

"'-"'-.:...:.:=-"-'-""""'-;::;...::.;==..=.::::--"...:..::..;:.:.....:::==""""''-=-=.;;;..::;.;=~;...;..;;;;.=-'=.;;;;...;;;;->=:...;;;;...:;'''-1..:::.;:;:.:...;:;..:.;::;.;::;.:. shall be added 

area 

alarm/detection system shall be installed in all hu,rifi,rno'." with 

than 3,600 square/eel, 

1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other oc(~w:;'anCle, 

as "U"). 

2. OTl'i"'UH1JJ"nl bUildings not under special use permit and/or not commercial 

purposes retails sales, food service, andlor special 

3. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be as determined 

by {he Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, based 0/1 building 

construction material and features. location, occupancy 

exposures. 

and UI:?'IUf"lCe to 

='!"'u::'!'!;!'~=:::::"~-===R....:==:,!:!Jj":::' shall be added as follows: In existing UU.fCU.IIH!'S HlIIUUUI an 

approved automatic sprinkler system, other than one- or m;oj'amily dwelling units, agricultural 

building not under use permitfor commercial purposes where afire alarm flOIO"I"' ... 

does not exist and area of the building or structure is increased or modified more than 

net"eel'll (30%) or },OOO whichever is less, such building or structure shall be made 

to conform to Section 907 when the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized rp'~r,,~p~'lnl 

JJutlcJimrs with area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as by 

or his/her authorized rp'lrp~p)1'UI11VP based on building construction materials 

luc,UHun, occupancy distance to exposures . 

.;::..:;:...:..:.:~..:.:.:.==~_ shall be added as follows: All fire alarm/detection systems connected 

a UL. approved central, proprietary or remote station .""T'II,ef':. 

which and at a constantly attended location. All sprinklered buildings 

shall monitored 

Ordinance 2019"()1 8 

  20-0203 F Page 12 of 36



I One- ond rW/')-7j'lJnll 

as "[l 

dwellings (R-3 and other nr,~1i'~/"U' 

:} Agricllililral buildings nol Imdl.'r llnd/or nol commercial 

purposes , retails sales, food service, special evenfsj. 

907.2.d Type 1 Hood Installations shall be added as follows' The requirement of installation, or 

of u Type J System shall require a alarm/sprinkler monitoring system to be 

Ihe to be connected to an alarm/sprinkler system 

that building 

2!!U!d,L1~~!ru!.!l:..K~!!1!!!I!Illl shall be added as follows 111 accordance with NFPA thl.' 

se(~OtUuln.'po·wer supply providing a minimum 24-170Ilr power capacity under load (system 

operating in a non-alarm condition) shall be amended to a minimum 72-hour power 

Exception: The existence of an emergency power supply that meets or exceed the 

requirements Fire Code Chapter 12, 

12 

power systems and standby power 

shall be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the Electric 

NFPA 110 and NFPA 111. All buildings, than one- and two-jamily dwelling units, and 

buildings 1101 

device lhal disconnects 

commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a !.'hunt trip 

sources to the by code E¥:isting 

installations shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval. 

33 

:::::;.!..:!::::..~~=~~::.::.:===::. shall be added as follows: Prior In and during construction, an 

,Ihall be provided al each fire and emergency vehicle access road enfly into 

the TlrI",""r", 

3312.1 When Required shall be amended as follows: Prior to combustible materials arriving on 

site, the fire hydrant water system shall be installed and maintained in continuous operation The 

amount of waleI' supplied shall meet the requiredfireflowfor the project. 

IfOllt1an(;e 2019-01 Page 9 

  20-0203 F Page 13 of 36



Chapter 49 

Section 4903 Plans 

4903.1 Where Required shall be added as follows: The fire code official of the EDHCWD may 

require development projects located in Moderate, High and Very-High Fire Hazard Severity Zones 

to submit fire protection plan This plan shall be approved by both the fire code official and the 

authorized representative for the local CAL FIRE Unit Chief (if located in the Stare Responsibility 

Area [SRA}) prior to the recording afthe final mapfor the project by the County ofEI Dorado. 

Section 49U5 Wildfire Protection Buildin!! Construction 

4905.4 Roof Construction Reg uircments sha II be added as follows: All new construction, including 

additions, requires a Class A roof covering or assembly. All re-roofing requires Class A roof covering 

or assembly as a minimum. Re-roofillg in excess of 50% of an exisiting slructure lvithin anyone year 

period will necessitate that the entire roo/be a Class A roof covering or assembly as a minimum. 

Class B or Cjire retardeant treated and or non-treated wood shake or shingles are not approved us 

a roojcovering material for Class A assembly. 

Chapter 50 

Section 50Ul General 

5001.7 Liability for Damages shall be added as follows: Any damages or cost resulting from the 

careless handling. spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall constituent debt against any 

such person, jirm O/' corporation causing such ~pill or discharge, This debt is collectible by the Fire 

Chief or his/her duly authorized representative, in the same manner as in the case of an obligatio/1 

under contract. expressed or implied. 

Chapter 56 

Section 5601 General 

5601.2 Permit Required shall be amended as follows: Penn its shall be required as set forth in 

Section 105.6 and regulated in accordance with this section. Where explosives permits are required, 

they shall be issued by the Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado 

County Sheriff's Department. Where fireworks permits are reqUired, they shall be issued by the Fire 

Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County Board of Supervisors. 

5601.2.1 Documentation shall be added as follows: The AHJ shall have the authorily 10 request 

documentation regarding all aspects of the fireworks presentation. 

5601.2.2 Proprietary Information shall be added as follows: The AHJ will protect all proprietary 

information. 

Ordinance 20]9-01 Page 10 

  20-0203 F Page 14 of 36



Chapter 57 

Storage of Class J and Class 11 flammable liquids in nn'l'p_UTl\IIIU' tanks outside is prohibited 

unless approved by the Fire Chief; or his/her duly authorized representative. When permitted by the 

Fire or his/her duly authorized representative, all above ground tank(s) or vault instullation~ 

Jo" the storage Class ], lJ or flammable and liquid~ shall comply with those 

as set Jorth the Fire Code. The Fire Code shall also to 

installations other than motor dispensing stations where above-ground is required. 

:.:-=-=:.::.:..:..:....:.-=====:......:..:....::.;::..:...::...:..:=..:....::.-="-",-==--..c=-=="--=.::...:::...:::...::-,,,,,== shall be amended as follows: 

of Class 1 and Class n flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is 

unless approved the Fire Chief, or his/her authorized When 

the Fire or his/her duly authorized representative, all above tank(s) or 

valilt installationsJor the 1, 11 or Illflammable and combuslible shall comply 

with Ihose requirements as setJorth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall also 

apply to instal/alions other than motor vehicle fuel 'fJ~'n',"w stations where storage 

is 

Chapter 

==~====::;:.shall be amended as follows: offlammable fluids in stationary 

containers outside of build is prohibited unless or his/her duly 

representative. fJ'hen the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized 

oil containers for the storage offlammable shall ,','''>In.,,, 

with those requirements as sel Jorth the Fire Code. The Fire Code shall also 

apply to installations other than motor vehicle Juel dispensing stations where above-ground ..,n)"n(70 

is 

,:,:;.:..~~:.:.:.::===-::;:.==~..:;.:..::=:.::;:..====~==:.;;:; shall be amended as fo lIows' The .',,)"neu> 

o/liquefied petroleum gas in excess oj an oj 2, OOO-gallon water capacity when located at 

least one-half(l/2) mileJrom property zoned or designatedJor residential use and at least one-half 

2019-01 11 

  20-0203 F Page 15 of 36



acre ami at least ,-"' ... 0_;-:.rYI7 

unit per 

and a any hOlel or motel is allowed when AHJ nn,rn'/',u&1'fl 

is issued the Dorado. 

JJl:menSlnQ' within established limits. f;Vithin the limits established law I'O(·, .. ,'r>ti""rr 

gas for the Dr()te(;tlcm 

one installation shall not exceed a water caJ:Jac.~lfV 

gas in excess ,-,.,)",17/,·.1'">1 when located 

01 least onjf:-nun mile property zoned or residential use and at least one-

unit 

per acre and 01 is when 

a Sl)IO!CI,all,COJ'1aJllOnaJ Dorado, 

~~~~~==~==~~~ 
shaH be added as follows: Permits shall be I~D"'J1"O/ 

HVI.nOlr"D'J"rltJnd lank installations as nnnl"""tn,rl theAHJ 

shall be to end-users and shall retained by the LPG company under a 

10"''''0_,'''''''0 system fa ensure proper annual maintenance P"PtlU,r&1I'MPI"T{' are met and recorded. 

~FPA Amended Sections as follows: 

Add Section 4.7 to read as follows: 

.=.:;;::..::::..II:=;.....;;;..;;;..;;...;~..;;;.....;;..;....;;;.= __ ;.;.. Residemial fire ,'nl'TtHI"IP}" inslalled in all new one-and lVV(O-Tiam.ll 

A .. ",.tI .. ,,, .. ,, shall ulilize a "Passive the Fire Code 

mS.Tauea, tested and the 

Re\'ise Section 5.1.1.2 to read as follows: 

least one and used 

within the shall be maintained on (he nrrlnornl at an nn ... ·/'H;t>n location. Slock shall 

be and cabinet, 

Re\ise Section 7.6 to read as follo'ws: 

shall be M .... '''I.'IDrl on 

homes at an f"1MJi"ly,'\1".;,'fl location on the exterior 

Revise Section 1 1.2.1.1 to read as follows: 

12 

  20-0203 F Page 16 of 36



Chapter 80. j\FPA 13D. ] 1.2.1.1 \\'lJell (j fire deptll1l11i.:nt pUlllpCr c.onnectiuJl IS Hot provlded, tht 

~ystem shall he )lydroSlfllic(llly tested oj () minimllTIl pressure of 150 pounds per squar(' inch f.JJuflJ>for no 

less than a 30-minule duration with()ut evidence afleakage. Such lest shall be 'H'itncssed by the fire code 

ojjrcial. 

Apprndu B - Fh'c }-jow IhquirenH.'nl!i for RuildiIlg~ 

Fire Flow for Onl'- and Two-FamilY I)weHinl!s, Group R-3. and R-4 
~!.!!!:~~.!!!!.!!-~!.!..!!:.!!.!::~.::...:! shan be amended as follows: 

,-

F1RE-FLO\V AUTOMATIC MINIMllM FLOW 

CALCULATION SPRJNKLER FIRE- DllRATION 

AREA SYSTEM FLO\\' (hou 

(square (nt'Si~H per 

S~and41nl) 
-- - ----- ---- --

(J - 3,600 No 1.0UO I 

sprinkJer systern 

3.601 and g[~ate[ No automatic Value In Dllr<ltion In 

sprinkler sy~krn Tahle Table 

H 105, 1(2) 131051(2) ill 

the rcqulft:d 

fIrc- flow rate 

0- 3,600 ~l'ctlOll 90L113 ~ ¥, 

of the C'A !-in: 1, (lno / 
Code (lJ ."eel it\l\ 

I 

313.3 of the CA I 

Residential Code 

3,601 and grcl:!tcr ScCI;on 1.3 1/2 vi:.IlulO' ()f .J-

of the CA Fire T;]ble 2 
Code or Section BIOS.l(2) 

313.3 of the CA (min. 1000 

AUTOMATIC 

SPRINKLER SYSTEM 

(Design 

No automat ic .<;prinkler 

system 

Section 903.3. J . J of the CA 

Fire 

Section 903.3.12 nfthe CA 

~,'_<::irlpnli;~1 01'M) 
--

FIRE-

per minute) 

Value 

Bl05.1(2) 

Table 

~ 50% of the "aluc in 

Table BI05.l(2)b 

~ 50% of the ,'ollie in 

:ode Tl:!blc BI05.1(2) 

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1 gpm 

Ordinance 2019-01 

FI,OW DURATION 

(hours) 

Duration in Table B10S.I(2) 

Duration in Table B 105.1 (2) 

8t the reduced flow rate 

Duration in Tahle B I 05.1 (2) 

at the reduced !low r~tc 

--

-~ 

13 

  20-0203 F Page 17 of 36



'Appendh n - Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

DiU3 .• Access Road \Vidth 'wHh a Hydran. shall be amended as follows, the exception: 

Exception: 

DI03.2 Grade shall be amended as follows: apparatus access roads and driveways shall not 

exceed 15.9% in approved by the AHJ or the El Dorado County amended California 

Public Resource Code Title 14 and Improvement Standards Manual. 

D103.3 Turning Radius shall be amended as follows: The minimum turning radius shall be 

determined the fire code official; and shall not curb and gutter. 

DI03.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates shall be amended as follows: Subsection OJ.' Where a 

gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm). Jif'here a fire 

apparalus road consists of a divided roadway, the width shall nol be less than 15 

mmJ. 

;::;..;::==.;:....:==::....:::.;;;:...;;.""-":..::.....;=.;...::.::.:....:.;..;.::;:= shall be amended as follows: lane signs as in 

on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide 

(6096 to 8534.4 mOl). 

D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Widtb shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as 

specified in Section Dl 03.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 

feet wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm) . 

.;:;;::..:~~=.:.::..::::.;==~::.:.=.:~~~=~'-==...:...:.;=~..:..;::.;:='-" ~hall be added as follows: When required 

by the fire code official, a fire apparatus access shall be constructed to encompass the 

of a structure and .shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access. 

SECTION 4: 

That Ordinance No. 2016-37 

repealed. 

EDHC\VD, and an other ordinances or parts of ordinances herewith are hereby 

SECTION 5: 

If any or subdivision provIsion, sentence, clause or ofthis code, or 

any application is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such decision 

shall not affect the provisions of this code, which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, 

therefore, such invalid portions are declared to be severable. The EDHCWD hereby declares that it would have 

enacted this Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions provisions, 

clauses or phrases of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid. 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 14 

  20-0203 F Page 18 of 36



, , 
• • · . SECTION 6: £ff£CJlYE DATE AND PUBLICATlOi'" 

11>;" Ordinance ahlol1take effa:llhirty (30)days after hudopllon. The EDHCWD Boron! Secrdary is direcTed 10 

publw,thi, ord'narKC In. ~w.paper of FMJ&] c,rculMion In ihr Dirtticl. In lieu of pUblicI' ion ohhe full In! 

ofllw OIdirwg, llIUITImary oftbe ordinance may be pUblishe<l by the by the Board Seueury wilh," fifteen (IS) 

do)'llitter ii' "... ... e and. certified copy .... 11 be potted h. the ot!\oe of the EDHCWD plUSUIId 10 GorrI ....... 

Code &ell"" J69JJ(c) (1). 

The .bon Ordinance was inlrOduud .t • mcetin& oftl>e &o.td of OirecIon oftht EDHCWD on Oa:obcr 17, 

2019, ..,.j it _!hen rud for tbe fim lime.. A public heario& Win XI for the Ordinance 10 be read fOrlM ~ 

time on NOYf:mbrs 21, 2019 and "Pfl'O"Cd by the followina ~ote. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the ao.rd ofDirecl(m oflhe £D1ICWD Illis. ;:u day of Novety".W 2019. 

AYES: 

NOES: 

ABSENT: 

ABSTA[N: 

ATIllS'1"; 

'f'M 'c4, 14 J)id( 
Jesoica Braddock. BooItd Sec:reury 

faae 15 

  20-0203 F Page 19 of 36



Fire Code Amendment What Is the Change? Locally adopted' SFM adopted I Amended Why Is There a Local Change? 
101.1 Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adoplad and amended Adminislrative need 

Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance 

106,6 Add section Locally created and adopted 
of fees to cover actual costs, Section 106,6 defines 
permits, plan checks, and inspections as allowed in Health 
&SafetyCode 17951, 

106,6,1 Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106,6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to 
the Fire District 

106,7 Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspections by contractors. 

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District 
is added 10 read as follows: 
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this 
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an 

109.4 Added section 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity 10 file an appeal 10 the Board of Appeals 
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County of EI Dorado's 
Vegetation Managment Ordinance Board of Appeals 
timeline. 

Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that 
Completed the section by filling in the blank portions that were protects life and property. Fees have been updated to match 

110.4 not completed by the SFM. It is better left to localities to Locally adopted and amended the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the District 
determine the fees/penalties for their respective areas. Attomey's Office, The change to the language to include the 

term infractions. 

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief or hisiher duly authorized representative (s), 

11M2 
Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before but under 

Locally adopted and amended 
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 

a different number) violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health and Safety Code of the State of Califomia and 
Chapter 5c (commencing with section 853.6) ofTiUe 3 of 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Califomia. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank portions that were 
All violations of the code have been consiladated under 

112.4 not completed by the SFM. It is better left to localities to SFM adopted and amended locally Section 110.4 
determine the fess/penalties for their respective areas. 

Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District, 

202 Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopted 
Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd 
Manager. Defintion of campfire shall not include LPG or 
Propane fueled appliances. 

302,1 Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally adopted and amended Added for clarity 

Due to the high fire danger that exists in EI Dorado County 
307.4.4 through 307.4.2.2 (d) Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally adopted and amended we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires 

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas. 

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical 
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for 
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus 
components. It also allows an extended time frame before 

Changed vertical clearances to 15 feet and road widths to 20 
having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional 

503.2.1 Locally adopted and amended height for vegetation clearances acts as an increased buffer 
feet for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of 

shoulders, as measured face of curb to face of curb is 
needed. These structures can be difficult to navigate with 
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the total 
drivable road surface 

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the Fire 
Fire apparatus require areas for tuming around when 

Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations to match as they 
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This 

503.2.5 
require turnarounds for fire apparatus access roads and 

Locally adopted and amended includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides 

driveways. 
better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum 
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

  20-0203 F Page 20 of 36



Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated Surfaces to 
Surfaces of EI Dorado County and Appendix D of the 

503.2.6 state and match EI Dorado County Transportation Division Locally adopted and amended 
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be 

instead of AASHTO HB-17. 
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an 
altemate means & methods that is not less restrictive than 
the Fire Code. 

503.4.2 Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes Locally created and adopted 
This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes' 
rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicle Code. 

This section clearly defines the 'No Parking in front of fire 
503.4.3 Added section regarding no parking in front of hydrants Locally created and adopted hydrants' rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicle 

Code. 

This section clearly defines Califomia Fire Code Appendix 
503.4.4 Added section regarding fire lanes besed on road width Locally created and adopted D as the reference for road lane width and their relation to 

fire lanes. 

Created and adopted 503.4.5 to malntain emergency access 
Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on 

503.5.3 and conSistency through all roadway gates in EI Dorado Locelly created and adopted 
roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing 

County, referring to the gate standards adopted by the FPO's. 
the best possible emergency access to maintaln fast 
response times. 

505.1 Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of buildings Locally adopted and amended 
Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing 
based on the Districfs addressing standards. 

Commercial properties are required to install hydrants at 
Added more conservative standard for the placement of 

507.5.1 Locally amended 
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150 

hydrant and their relationship to commercial buildings feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in 
between). 

Buildings are getting more sizable in the county. It is more 
common to have new buildings with solar arrays that 
continue to generate power even when the buildings general 

Added verbiage to bring all of the necessary fire controls for a 
509.3 Locally added 

utillities have been shut off. When there is an emergency, it 
building to one location. is vital that we have rapid access to all of the controls in one 

location for public evacuation and firefighter safety. Due to 
the fire danger present in EI Dorado County throughout 
most of the year, this change is appropriate and advisable. 

Due to the topographic, Climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation in new 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

903.2 buildings and sbuctures 3,600 square feet or greaterwithin the Locally amended 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

district 
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater than 3,600 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

903.2.a square feet to install sprinklers if they add more than 30% or Locally created and adopted 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

1,000 square feet to the structure, whichever is less. 
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
to be installed in sbuctures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds occupant protection for existing buildings less than 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

903.2.b 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they add more than Locally created and adopted 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

30% or 1,000 square feet to the sbucture, whichever is less. 
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
to be installed in sbuctures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7 
These sections were created to give specific direction on the 

of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

sprinkler requirements based on occupancy and square Locally adopted and amended 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

footage 
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of spread. 

  20-0203 F Page 21 of 36



Manufaclured Homes - The Intent of this code section is to 
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two-
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar 
nalure. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland·urban 

903.2.8.2 
This section was created to include manufactured residential 

Locally created and adopted 
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption 

single family R·3 in the residential sprinkler program due to the light·weight nature of their construction. The 
rapid fire spread throughout these struclures presents a 
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk 
sucessfully in many Ca~omia communities. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

These sections were created to give specifiC direction on the 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.9,903.2.10 sprinkler requirements based on occupancy and square Locally edopted and amended 
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of spread. 

Added occupant protection for fire alarms in buildings with a 
Provides proper emergency notificetion for occupancies that 

907.2.a 
floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG buildings not used 

Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Rre Department notification in 
for commercial purposes, and buildings with a floor area of 

the event of a fire or smoke. 
less than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code official. 

Added occupant protection for existing buildings without Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
907.2.b 

automatic sprinkler systems to install a fire alarm IT they add 
Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Rre Department notification in 

more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the structure, 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

whichever is less. 

Added occupant protection by stating all fire alarm detection 
Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.c 
systems installed shell be connected to a monitoring service 

Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
that notifies the fire department upon activation and is 

the event of a fire or smoke. 
installed per Section 907 of the fire code. 

Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood systems to be Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
907.2.d connected to a monitored fire alarm system when installed or Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notifICation in 

replaced. the event of a fire or smoke. 

907.6.2.1 Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply Modification Locally created and adopled 
Amend to 72 hour capacity for back·up power due to PG&E 
safety related power outages. 

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to 
1203.1.3 Shunt trip power safety devices SFM adopted and amended locally ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back·up 

power supplies 

3310.3 Address requirements for construction siles Locally created and adopted 
Addressing for construction sites is important to assist 
responding emergency crews. 

3312.1 
Water supplies at construction sites with combustible SFM adopted and amended locally 

Water must be on site prior to combustible material being 
materials on·site stored or vertical construction commencing. 

EI Dorado County has a siginifcant fire danger throughout 

4903.1 
This section was created to include Fire Proctection Plan for 

Locally created and adopted 
the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire 

all fire hazard severity zones. Protection Plan due to climatic, geological, and 
topographical 

This section clarifies that within the boundaries of EI Dorado 
County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are 

4905.4 Added a section to clarify roof construction requirements Locally Created and adopted wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be 
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly. 

Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate. 

5001.7 
Any damages or costs from negligent practices that cause a 

Locally created and adopted 
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 

hazardous materials incident will cause a cost recovery fee. process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the 
negligent Parties. 

Added safety protection with permits being issued by both the Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and 
5601.2 Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for explosives, and by the SFM adopted and amended locally fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding 

Rre Chief and the Board of Supervisors for fireworks. of the appiications they will be used for. 

  20-0203 F Page 22 of 36



The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any 

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make available all 
documentation including timing and proprietary information 

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 requested documentation pertaining to the firework Locally created and adopted 
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they 

presentation deem necessary. This information is understood to be 
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as 
such. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5704.2.9.6.1 Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted and amended locally 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
SpeciallConditional Use Permit from the County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5706.2.4.4 Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted and amended locally 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid special 
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval 
and a SpeciaVConditional Use Permit from the County. 

5806.2 Administrative addition of District name Locally adopted and amended Administrative need to add District name 

limits as required by the Fire Code Official for 

5806.2.1 Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted and amended locally 
Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. 

Requires AHJ approval and a SpeciaUConditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

Establishas distances between LPG storage and 
dispensaries that are directly related to salety for residential 

Established limits for LPG storage and dispensing near or 
developments and high-density hole Is, motel, apartments, 

6104.2 
adjacent to residential development 

SFM adopted and amended locally etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would 
have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death. 
Requires AHJ approval and a SpeciallConditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground 
tanks: 

6113.1 
Permits and plans shall be submitted and approved by the 

Locally created and adopted 
Allows us to require plans be submitted for review prior to 

AHJ (AuthOlity Having Jurisdiction). installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks 
require substantiaf maintenance including inspection and 
anode replacement at regular intervals. 

Underground tanks conrode easily and can leak without 

6113.2 
Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the property of 

Locally created and adopted 
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when 

the LPG company sold to the end user. This doas not apply to above ground 
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected. 

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench 
on-site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water 

Chapter 80, NFPA,130-16 NFPA 130-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the District flow alarm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in 

Sections 4.7,5.1.1.2,7.6, has bean amended to update various provisions pertaining to 
Locally amended 

the event of water activation in a vacant structure, and 
and 11.2.1.1 the installation of sprinkler systems in one-and two-family hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 13D 

dwellings. sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water 
damage from pipe failure, and the addition of a passive-
purge system. 

We changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 
Appendix B: Table B105.1(1) 

elevation, to match fire flow precedents used in EDC for years SFM adopted and amended locally to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 
used for over a decade in EDC. 

We made a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM, below 5000 Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 
Appendix B: Table B105.2 

foot elevation, for all commercial projects 
SFM adopted and amended locally to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 

used for over a decade In EDC. 

Appendix D: D103.1 Made an exception for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended 
It is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to 
construcl a 26 foot wide space for accass to a hydrant. 

Title 14 requires for us to only accapt up to 16% driveways. 
Appendix D: Dl03.2 Stale law requires no greater than 16% grade Locally adopted and amended In our EI Dorado County Trtle 14 adoption we allow greater 

than 16% grade with AHJ approval and hard surface. 

Appendix D: Dl03.3 Text to include curbs and gutters Locally adopted and amendad 
20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutters due 
to potential access issues and tuming radius concems. 

Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided 
Appendix D: D103.5 § 1 Rre apparatus accass road gates Locally adopted and amended roadway the gate width shall not be less than 15 feet due to 

radius issues. 

  20-0203 F Page 23 of 36



No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet 

Appendix D: Dl03.6.1 Roads widths 20 to 29 feet Locally adopted and amendad 
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does 
not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire 
Gode Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all other elevations. 

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet 
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of 

Appendix D: Dl03.6.2 Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36 feet in width locally adopted and amended elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The 
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D 
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations. 

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 

Appendix D: Dl04.4 Added to require circumferential fire apparatus access roads Locally created and adopted 
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire 
structure and shall provide a continuous means of 
emergency vehicle access. 

Removed the wording that limited the section to 30 dwelling 
For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Appendix D: Dl06.1 
units. Locally adopted and amended .I;:;~:~~ r:;:oo to ensure the safety of the 

nders. 

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 
Appendix D: Dl07.1 Adopted Dl07.2 Remoteness in this section. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

residents and first responders. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.2 through 101.5 Adopted to establish scope, intent, severability and validity Locally adopted Administrative clarity 

102.6 through 102.8 References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

102.10 through 102.12 Conflicting provisions, Other Laws, Application of references Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

103.1 through 103.4.1 Definition of the Fire Prevention Division Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
104.1 Ability to enforce the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
104.3 through 104.4 Right of Entry, Warrants, and Identification Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
104.6 through 104.6.4 Record retention Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
104.8 through 104.9.2 Modifications, alternate means end methods, and test Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.11 through 104.11.2 Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of systems Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.11.3 Authority of systems end devices inoperable Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
105.2.3 TIme limitation of application Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
105.3.1 through 105.3.2 Operational permits Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.6.12 
Dry cleaning operational permits required for hazardous 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
cleaning solvent use 

Permits for various business operations for. Magnesium, 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life miscellaneous combustible storage, moblie food 
. 105.6.2.28 through 105.6.35 

safety inspections Locally Adopted preparation vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing facilities, open 
buming, open flames and torches, open flames and 
candles, and organic coatings 

105.6.37 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and I~e 

Locally Adopted Permits for places of assembly 
safety inspections 

105.6.39 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life 

Locally Adopted Permits for private fire hydrants 
safety inspections 

Permits for pyroxylline plastics, refrigeration equipment 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and I~e 

Locally Adopted 
repair garages and motor tuel-dispensing facilities, rooftop 

safety inspections heliports, spraying or dipping, storage of scrap tires and 
tire by-products 

105.6.48 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and I~e 

Locally Adopted Permit for tire-rebuilding plents safety inspections 

105.6.50 
this section for administrative clarity and fire and I~e 

Locally Adopted 
Permit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material, 

pections lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 cubic feeQ 

106.1 through 106.3 Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and I~e 
Locally Adopted Fee schedules for permits 

safety inspections 

107.1 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life 

Locally Adopted Inpection authority safety inspections 

Mentenance of safeguards, testing and operation of 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life equipment re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping, 
106.1 through 109.3 

safety inspeclions Locally Adopted supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding, 
Board of Appeals established, limitations on authority, and 
qualifications 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and I~e 

Locally Adopted 
Compliance with orders and notices, prosecution of 

safety inspections violations, and unauthorized tampering 

  20-0203 F Page 24 of 36



110.4.1 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and fife 

Locally Adopted Abatement of violation 
safety inspections 

113.1 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and Ine 

Locally Adopted Authority to disconnect service utifities 
safety inspections 

Asphalt kettles contain highly flammable substances and 
303.1 through 303.9 Adopted this section for fire and fife safety Locally Adopted require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical) 

Managing ignition sources through responsible application 
305.1 throuogh 305.5 Adopted this section for fire and Ine safety Locally Adopted of standards will reduce the number of fires in various 

settings (Cfimatic, geological, and topographical) 

Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY 
306.1 through 306.2 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted flammable and require special handling (Climatic, 

geological, and topographical) 

307.1 through 307.5 Adopted this section for fire and lITe safety Locally Adopted 
Open buming, recreational fire, and portable outdoor 
fireplaces, (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.1 Adopted this section for fire and me safety Locally Adopted 
Open flama general requirements (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Throwing or placing of ignition sources, torches for 
removing paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Locations near combustible, open flame devices, signals 
and markers, portable fuel open-flame devices, sky-

308.1.5 through 308.1.8 (excluding 
Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 

lantems, religious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming 
308.1.4) food and beverage preparation, dispensing, containers not 

in use, serving of flaming food, location, fire protection 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.2 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Pennits are required for above section (Climatic, geological, 
and topographical) 

Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices, 
308.3 through 306.4.1 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted theatrical performances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 

donnatories (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

310.1 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to smoking (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

310.3 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
'No Smoking' signs (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with 'No Smoking' 
31Q.4 through 310.8 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted Signs, esh trays, buming objects, hazardoous environmental 

conditions. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Vacant premises condition and safety requirements, 
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safegaurding vacant 

311.1 through 311.4 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted premises, security, fire protection, fire seperation, removal 
of combustibles, removal of hazardous materials. (Climatic, 
geological, and topographicai) 

319.1 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to mobile food preparation 
vehicles. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

319.2 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and Ine 

Locally Adopted 
Pennits for mobile food preperation vehicles (Climatic, 

safety InspectionS geological, and topographical) 

  20-0203 F Page 25 of 36



Exhaust hood, fire protection, fire protection for cooking 
equpiment, fire extinguisher, appliance connecticn to fuel 
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, metallic 
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking oil 
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting, 
nonnal vents, emergency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum 
aggragate volume, protection of container, LP-gas container 

319.3 through 319.10.3 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted construction, protection of system piping, LP-gas alanns, 
CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel, 
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG 
container construction, CNG containers supplying 
ansporation and cooking fuel, protection of system piping, 

alanns, maintenance, exhuast system, fire 
systems and devices and fuel gas systems. 

(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Emergency planning and prepanedness in group R-2.1 
403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted (residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and 

fire safety plans. 

Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancied 
403.10 through 403.10.1.3 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted Evacuaticns, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic, 

geological, and topographical) 

405.5 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

510.3 Adopted this section for edministrative clarity and fire and life 
Locally Adopted A pannit is required for emergency responder radio systems 

safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 
is section for edministrative clarity and fire and life 

Locally Adopted maximunm amount of flernmable wall coverings in 
inspections educational facilities (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical) 

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5 

903.2.1.5 
Adopted this section for edministrative clarity and fire and life 

Locally Adopted 
(sporting arenas, amusement pali< structures, bleachers) 

safety inspecticns (Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000 
square feet (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Emargency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders 

and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from 
and the emergency dispatch center. TIme 

frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 

1103.2 
Adopted this section for the safety of firefighters and other 

Locally Adopted phasing in of a system over a period of time, detennined by 
emergency responders. the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind 

this section is that on almost atl emergency responder injury 
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected with the eddition of redio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0101.1 through Adopted this section for the safety of the public, firefighters, 
Locally Adopted Ganeral requirements for fire apparatus access roeds 

0102.1 and other emergency responders. including ioeds. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, firefighters, Dead end fire apparatus access road requirements for a 
Appendix 0: 0103.4 Locally Adopted tum around at 150 feet (Climatic, geological, and and other emergency responders. 

topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0103.6 Adopted this section for the safety of the public, firefighters, 
Locally Adopted 'No PaI1<ing, Fire Lane' signs requirements. (Climatic, 

and other emergency responders. geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0104.1 through Adopted this section for the safety of the public, firefighters, 
Locally Adopted Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus 

0104.3 (excluding exception) and other emergency responders. access roads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0105.1 through Adopted this section for the safety of the public, firefighters, 
Locally Adopted Requirements for arial fire apparatus access roads 

0105.4 and other emergency responders. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 through Adopted this section for the safety of the public, firefighters, 
Locally Adopted Rre apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential 

0106.3 (excluding exceptions) and other emergency responders. developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

One- or two-dwelling residenital developments shall be 
Appendix 0: 0107.1 through Adopted this section for the safety of the public, firefighters, 

Locally Adopted equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire 
0107.2 (excluding exception) and other emergency responders. apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 

climatic conditions. 

  20-0203 F Page 26 of 36



Appendix 0: 0108 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, firefighters, Locally Adopted 

Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction 
and other emergency responders. standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Grey cells are previously 
amended, adopted, or 
changed code sections that 
are being adopted again in 
this code cycle. 
White cells are newly 
amended, adopted, or 
changed code sections that 
differ from previous code 
adoptions. 

  20-0203 F Page 27 of 36



sc~~ 
~, Octobe< 28, 2019 10:13 AM 

~" .. 
FW; Confirmation of 5<:tIeduIed Public.otion: Notice of Public Hearing . NOliee of Intent 10 Adopt 
2019 Firw Code 

Fro.: leI:i/s dq"ls.mtdemoaat.net> 
s.tIC Frkby, Octobe< 25, 2019 11:31 AM 
To: Jesslao 8riddod< <jbrad<Iod<fIedhll .... mm:> 

Cc: ~teph_ lal'lon <>I.Iyton.edhfire.com> 
SubJe<t: ConIlnNtion oISd>edu1ed PubiQ!:Ion: NotIa of Public Hur .... . Noll« 01 Intent to Adopt 2019 fire Code 

Confirmation of Scheduled Publication' Notice of Public Hearing - Notice of Intent 10 Adopt 
2019 Fire Code 

~eW$paper: Mountain Oemoaat 
~ub date(s): l*:1 0130/19, 1111/19 
Ref adl:: ~7076 
Charges: $ ~..IiIJi175.00 

Thank you for publ ishing in our newspaper, 

Allison Rains - Public 
Mountain Democrat 

I 

On Oct 24, 2019, it 8:06 AM, j.euiQI nr"ddock <ibriddod!!!cdhnrt ,om~ MOil : 

Good mornln&. 

CIOn \'OU pleise pubHsh the "t"ched notice In the Min. DemcK'11 the two earl.", cUtes pouibld 

ThInk youl 

JtSlicll Brlllldocli 
Dirulor "f Fimmctl&mrd s..UfIIl". 
<irn"pOOl .pn.~ 

£1 Dorado llills Fir~ Deportment 
"&n'ing 1M COlll",unlliu of £1 /Jw,KIo lillis, 1."lrolH and Rn cw " 
.... d .. loIlsl .. tln omce: 10SO Wil_ Boul.vard, 1>1 Dor.do Hills, CA 95762 
Pbo_e: (916)9n -6623 rxt. 1020 
I'u: (916) 9H.S913 

, 

  20-0203 F Page 28 of 36



, , . 

Attachment No. 2 

EDHCWD Resolution No. 2019-10 

  20-0203 F Page 29 of 36



Drt~SCll1b1lng Vp:,'''IQI.IVJ..~ rr,"''\''',,",,1Ino conditions k ... '" ...... ,rl"""~ 

eXIJIO:SIUlrI. n·(;I'7.:l,"'rI~"\·nl:' materials 

climatic, Ji'...""'J ... Jj"""'''''', ....... 

of the District 

to 1tT\'t'V'\(~P. more I::'T1""InlT,,,""T r~11HT·~'pntC' than set 

,...''' .. ''''13..,,1' to ......,. ..... 4" ... ' ........ , .... 

ae!;ln~s to 

reasonably lH. .... "-'I,;;i:)~(U protection 

1. ........,.I-' ......... t..Ly'.u. ranges to 

area 

more occur 

the on 

  20-0203 F Page 30 of 36



, , . , 

2. Relative Humidity. During the summer months (May through September), 

daily ranges around occasionally drops to low 

teens. 

3. Temperatures. the summer months (May through September), daily 

temperatures commonly exceed 90 ............. ..""',, with temperatures 

having been recorded as high as 115 rlP(:trPl"~ 

4. Winds. summer prevailing south and o.>v ...... ,un 

However, north occur during the (April and May), the fall 

(September and October), and occasionally during the summer months (June, 

July Ve10cities are in the range of five to miles 

per hour, §i; .... ~ .. ~".F. to 30 miles per hour the summer months. 

These local _ .... " ..... conditions affect the aCCleleratllon. intensity and 

the community. Times oflittle or no high temperatures extremely 

hazardous conditions, particularly as they to residential roof fires and wildfire 

conflagrations. The climatic conditions are one of the greatest to 

behavior major emergency events to their uncontrollable nature. 

1. Geographic Location. EI Dorado Hills is located in the foothiHs of the Sierra at 

an range of approximately feet to 1,500 feet sea level. 

  20-0203 F Page 31 of 36



and Population. The EDHCWD (Fire Department) encompasses 

approximately to eighty (70-80) square and has a current 

population of approximately 50,000 residents. 

3. Seismic Location. The nearest identified fault zone running through the District 

is the Mountain Fault. This fault zone is split into several which 

transect the area between Folsom and Shingle Springs. The closest branch 

passes through the middle of the District along the western edge of Browns 

Ravine. The next nearest extension of this fault system is located immediately at 

the north end of the District, and extends from the southeast arm of Folsom 

Lake, north to the City of Auburn. No recent geologic activity has been observed 

along this fault. However, studies of the east branch of the fault zone, conducted 

by Woodward-Clyde Associates for the Auburn Darn, and by Tierra Engineering 

Consultants near Folsom Lake, indicate that the fault may be reactivating based 

on recent tectonic trends and should be considered potentially active. 

4. Topography_ The topography of the District varies from level 0% slope to 

terrain with over a 40% slope. The valley floor is re]atively flat with gentle 

slopes consists of grassland and trees. east and west of the valley 

floor to 40% slopes and consist brush and 

covered range land. The greatest degree occurs in the northern end 

the District and extends northeast from there. Hilly terrain throughout the area 

provides gullies or areas referred to as "chimneys" which ac(~el€~ral:e 

offire. 

spread 

5. Roads and Streets. The District has seen an accelerated degree of urban and 

comniercial development within the 15 years. With this development comes 

  20-0203 F Page 32 of 36



can a on 

6. to occur 

one to onr .. th~ .. 1" 

L 

2. 

Ie'"" ... ",.r vote: 

o 

  20-0203 F Page 33 of 36



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
101.1 X Admin 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.6 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra phical 

503.5.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

507.5.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

509.3 X Cli mat ic/ Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

  20-0203 F Page 34 of 36



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 

6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 4.7 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix B: Table BI05.1(1) X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra phica I 
Appendix B: Table BI05.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 
Appendix 0: 0103.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 
Appendix 0: 0104.4 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 
101.2 through 101.5 X Admin 

102.6 through 102.8 X Admin 

102.10 through 102.12 X Admin 

103.1 through 104.1 X Admin 

104.3 through 104.4 X Admin 

104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin 

104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin 

104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin 

104.11.3 X Admin 

105.2.3 X Admin 

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin 

105.6.12 X Admin 

105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin 

105.6.37 X Admin 

105.6.39 X Admin 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin 

105.6.48 X Admin 

105.6.50 X Admin 

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin 

107.1 X Admin 

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin 

110.4.1 X Admin 

113.1 X Admin 

  20-0203 F Page 35 of 36



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 

303.1 through 303.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

305.1 through 305.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

306.1 through 306.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

307.1 through 307.5 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

308.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5 X Climatic/Geologica I/T 0 pogra ph ical 

308.2 X Admin 

308.3 through 308.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.4 through 310.8 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

311.1 through 311.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

319.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

319.2 X Admin 

319.3 through 319.10.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

403.10 through 403.10.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

405.5 X Admin 

510.3 X Admin 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 X CI i matic/ Geologica I/T opogra p h ica I 

903.2.1.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1103.2 X Topographical 

Appendix D: 0101.1 through 

DI02.1 
X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ical 

Appendix D: 0103.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: DI03.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: DI04.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

DI04.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: DI05.1 through 

DI05.4 
X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix D: 0106.1 through 
X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

DI06.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix 0: 0107.1 (excluding 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

exceptions) 

Appendix D: 0108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

  20-0203 F Page 36 of 36


	Resolution_El Dorado Hills
	Reso El Dorado Hills 2-25-20



