RESOLUTION NO. XXX-2020

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the
State every three years; and,

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a
county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably necessary
because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1,
Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulations to the local level
and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized
representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the fire
protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, on November 26™ 2019, the Board of Directors of the Garden Valley Fire Protection District
adopted Ordinance No. 2019-08 which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code

with amendments, the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological, or topographical
conditions.

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection of
certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado
ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-08 of the Garden Valley Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement
of the ordinance to the Garden Valley Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections:

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4 through

307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1.

507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 903.2.10,
907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2,
5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 through 6112.3, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016,
Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 4.7, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-
2016 Section 7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table BI05.1 (1), Appendix B:
Table BI05.2, Appendix D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix D103.6.1, Appendix
D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4.

20-0203 G 1 of 40



Resolution No. XXX-2020
Page 2 of 2

The Garden Valley Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title
24, Part 9, in_its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the
International Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed
below:

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403.4,
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12,
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808,
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106,
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception),

D107.1 (Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G,
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019
California Fire Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of EI Dorado at a regular

meeting of said Board, held the day of , 20__, by the following vote of
said Board:
Ayes:
Altest: Noes:
Kim Dawson Absent:

Clerk of the Board of Supervisors

By:

Deputy Clerk Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Board of Supervisors

20-0203 G 2 of 40



Garden Valley Fire Protection District

December 19, 2019

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors
330 Fair Lane

Placerville, CA 95667

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019-08 of the Garden Valley Fire
Protection District, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code with
amendments related to local climatic, geographic and topographic
conditions.

Dear Mr. Ashton:

The Garden Valley Fire Protection District (GRV) is requesting the Board of Supervisors
(BOS) ratify its Ordinance No. 2019-08, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code as
amended due to specific local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. California
Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of the city or
county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance.
The BOS must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District (or
its representative) or the Chief Building Official.

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2019-08
with amendments to the 2019 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that
Ordinance to the Garden Valley Fire Protection District Chief. A proposed BOS
resolution is enclosed for your review and use on this topic.

This resotution has no direct fiscal impact to the County.

Sincerely,

St

Clive Savacool

Fire Chief

ATTACHMENTS:

1. Garden Valley Fire Protection District Ordinance No. 2019-08

2. Garden Valley Fire Protection District Finding of Fact Resolution No. 2019-07
3. Draft El Dorado County BOS Resolution

20-0203 G 3 of 40



Attachment No. 1
Garden Valley Fire Protection District

Ordinance No. 2019-08

20-0203 G 4 of 40



GARDEN VAT TEY FIRE PROTECTION DISFRICT
ORDINANCE NO. 2019.08

BF IT ORDAINLLD BY THF BOARD O DIRECTORS OF THE GARDEN VALLEY
FIRL PROTECTTON DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS:

An urdinance of the Clarden Valley Fire Protestion Dhistrict (GR V)Y adopting the 2019 Edition of vhe Callfornu:
Fire Code, mcorpomting the 2018 Edition of the hvverautional Fire Code. regulating and governing the safeguarding
af iife and property from fire and cxplvswm hazards ansing from the siorage, hendimg and use of hazsrdous
suhsgances, matenials and devices, and lrom condittons hazardous to hife or property in the cccupancy of buildings
and premises in the GRV: providing (or the issuance of permits and collection of fees therelor, Repealing Ondinnes
Me 2016-17 of the GRY and all other ondinances apd parts of the ardinances in conflict therewith

HBe #t ORDAINGD by the Board of Dwectors of the GRV, also known as the Garden Valley Fire
P'rotection Distrct
Section | FINDINGS OF FACTS
Seviion 2 APTION OF CODE WITH EXCL L SIONS
Sestion ] LOCAL AMENDMENTS
Scetron 4. CONFLICT
Section 5. SEVERABILITY
Section & LEFECTIVE DATE AND PUBL ICATION

SECTIHON | FINDINGS OF FACTS

the GRY makes cenain chanpes tlistod below) o the Culiforsmie e Code, 2019 Bditon, pursuant 1o
Hecdth & Sofen ode Sections JI8GY 7 17955 7 and 89413 duting this code sdoplion process Such changes
ane meveasaty  because of Jocal chimac. geologieal and/or topographical conditions.  The GR'V has adopied,
pursuant o Section 18940 5 ol the Cofiformta Health & Sufety Code. the findings of lacts relative o these

conditionms by Kesoiuton 2201940 of the GRV dated Seprember 19, 219

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH FACLUSIONS
The GRV adopts the 2019 Callfornia Fire Coxde, Title 24, Pare 9, in_its eptirety. including Appendices
wmcorporsting those sechiony of the Internationad Fire Code 2018 edition nod adopied Iy the state. with the

enclusrons histed below

Ordinunce 201908 l'age 1

20-0203 G 5 of 40



[ xclosions 1056 17-1056 19 105.6.39 30810, 109, 3105 3116, 318, 403 1, 403 21403 2 4. 403 1,
403.4, 403.6. 403 7 403 8 radopting 4038 11038 1 7), 4039, 403 10.2, 403 103, 403,11, 40312, 404 |-404 4,
A05 1403 4, 405 6-408 6. 406 BO3-ROT (adopung 807 5.2) RO, 9041 |, 1101, 11030, 1103.3-1103.6, 11039
tadopting 1103910 1103106, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception),
1061 (Exception), D107 1 (Exception), Appendin A, Appendix - Appendin F. Appendix G Appendiy ).
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendin M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 Cultfornta Fire

{onde

SECTION 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS
the following Sections are hereby amended or added,

Chapter 1

- Section 101 Scope and Cenernl Requirements
- 101.1 Titbe shall be amended as follows: Ak namie of jurisdicrion [GRY]

108.6.27 1L.P(-gas shall be amended as follows: Add to the exception Ar or above $.000 feet of
clevalion, a permit is not requincd for individual contamers with & | 23-gallon water capacity of bess,
or muluple contamer systems having an aggregare quanniry not exceeding 125 gallons senving

ovcupancies in Group R-3

Section 106 Fees
106,60 Permit, Plan Review and Inspection Fees shall be added as follows 4 schednle of fees

addopted by the disirict board of direciors for plan review mspections and the isswance of permus by
the districe may be found i the most current disirict fee sehedule (Health & Safery Code 17951
106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees shall be added us follows. Fire service fees moy be charged (o any
person, firm. corporation or husmess that through neghgence. violation of the low or as a result o}
varelessness, is responsihle for the cause af the drsras to respond (o the scene of un wmcidens A
district board may charge a fee 10 cover the cose of uny service which the diserict provides ar the cos
of enforcing uny repulation for which the jee v charged (Health & Safery Code 13916, The fee vhall
noi exceed the aotua! cosi of suppressing the fire and or respanding 1o the scene of an incident
106.7 Administratise Costy shall be added ay follows, When a test or ipection is scheduled, and
the compracior fails o prerform o the satisfac ion of the authoriny having purisdiction (AHS). the AL
miiv bill the contractar for actual tme spest rravelimyg o and from the test impection locarion and

the time apeni al the test ADCCTION SHé v W ell s admumistrstive costy

Cirdinance 201908 Page 2

20-0203 G 6 of 40



Section 109 Board of Appeals
- Section 109.4 Appeal Procedures sad Timelines shall be added as follows: Amy person ar entity who

believes they may be adversely affecied by an arder. dectsion. or determnation made by the fire code
officral through u written notice may appeat this matter wathin {5 calendar davs of the postmark on
the notice. ANl such appeats shall be filed in writing with the Secreiary of the Governing Board for
the district. A timely appeul shall stav further action by the fire code official wntid the matrer is
determined by the Appeul Board as owlined in Section 109.2 unfess the issue poses an imminent fire
or life safery hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify the appellant by
certified mail of the dute and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be scheduled to take place no
souner them 20 calendar davs from the date shown an the certified mail. The uppellant shall kave the
right to uppear in person or by agem at the hearing und present vrad. written und: or photographic

evidence (o the Appeal Bourd

- 110.4 Violatiog Penaltics shall be amended as follows Persons who shall vielate a provision of this

code ur shall fail 1o comply with anmy of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install. alter.
repair or do work in swlanon of the approved construction documenis or directive of the fire code
official. or of a permit or cenificate used under provisions af this code, shall be guily of a
misdemeumor or infraction. at the discretion of the prosecuting attorney or agency, pumishable by a
fine not exceeding SHN.00 for a firsi vivlonon: 2 A fine not exceeding Y300 00 for o second violation
of the samv provision within ane vear, 3. A fine not excecding S1000.00 for each additional violation
af the wime provision within oite vear, of by imprisonment not exceeding /80 days, or both such fine
and imprisonment  Tach day that o violation conunues aller due ootice has been senved shall be
deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safen (Code Sections 13145 and | 7995).
110.4.2 Citations shall be added as follows  The Fire Chief or his her duly authorized
represenialive may issue crutions for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this eode pursuant to
Section 13871 of the Health & Safery ( ode of the State of California and Chapier Sc (commencing
with Section 853.0j of Lule 3 of Part 7 of the Penal  ade of the Staie of California

Section 112 Stop Work Order

112.4. Fallure to Comply shall be amended as follows: Any person who shall continue any work
- after having been served with a stop-work order, except such work as that person 15 directed 1o

perform 1o remove a violaton or unsale condinon, shall be purishable by u fine vr imprisonment or

hoth as deseribed in Section 1104 1 Health & Safen Code Sections 13145 amd {°V95)

Ordinance 201908 Page 3

20-0203 G 7 of 40



Chapter 2
h! ' nitions
Add definivon for Campfire - Shall mean a fire which i used for cooking, personal warmih. lighting.
or desthetic purposes  This mcludes fires comtuined within owidoor fireplaces and enclosed stoves
with flues or chimneys. stoves using pellied, lquid. or solid fuels. poriahle barbecue pits, bruziers. ur
space heating devices which are used outside of anv structure. mohile home. or uny living
accommodation mowted on a vehicle.

- Add definition for District - Shatl mean the district and il other wreas within the exterior boundaries
thereof now or hereafier established

- Add delimton for Deivewny - Shall mean a vehicular uccess thut serves up to two (2) parcels with

no maore than two (2 ressdenind units and any number of non-vommercial or industrial on each

parcel.
- Add definition for Execuative Body - Shall mean the Board of Directors of the District
- Add defnition for Fiee Chief - Shall wmean the Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire

department disirict serving the jurisdiction or o duly anthorized representative
- Add definition for Lruined Crowd Mansger - Sholl mean siandby personnel, uswolly o security
guard or usher personnel, wha are irained in the proper procedure to exil people from u tens ar ather

place of public assemblage in an vrderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency

Chapter 3
- 302.1 Definitions shall be amended av follows: Added Cempfire defininon. ay shown above in
Chapter 2

Section 307 Open Burning, Recreutionnt Fires, nnd Outdoor Fireplaces
307,4.4 Cumpflire Resirictions shall be added as follows

307 41 s unlawful for uny person o fighs, matmain, or use o campfire upon or near any brush-
covered land. grass-covered land. vr forest<overed land during the time when burmng permitis are
sispended by the Director of the Depariment of Foresiry und Fire Protection. the CAL FIRE Unit
Chief or the 44HJ,
Exception: Commercidl covking operatimns with approval of the 1H.J,

307 4.4.2 When campfires ure allowed, 1t showld be umlawful for uny persan to light. mainiain, ar use
o conipfire upon any hrshecovered land, grass—covered land  or forestcovered land unless the
follav v1¢ munimum requirements ure complied with

307.4.4.2 (4) The arva within 3 feet of the periphery of the campfire is cleared af all flummable

murteriol amd vegelution

Ordinance 2019 08 Page 4

20-0203 G 8 of 40



J07.4.4.2 (b) (e verviceuble shovel wath u handle of w least [2 mches by ready for wie ai the
imimveduate arvi of the campfire

J02.4.4.2 () Cumpfires shall be Limued 10 a | foor by [-foot area. wnlexs i am approved
mmufaciured conking device or fire rmg

307.4.4.2 (d) Wraten perminsion of the Tundowner must ke oblsned peior to the gnitton of the
campfire ond shall be on e

Chapter §
Appara s
503.2.1 Dimensions shall be amended as (ollows Fire apparatus access roads shall have an
unubstructed width of not less than 20 feet, exclusive of shoulders. s meusured from foce of curd 1o
foce of curb_except for approved secunty gates in accardance with Section 303.6, and unobstructed
vertuical clearance of not less than 15 feer Al deevewans in the diserics shall not be less than 12 feet
wiefr

40).2.5 Dead Ends shall be amended as follows Dead-end fire apparatus access roads vad drivewavs

mn cxcess of 150 feet i length shall be provided with an approved area for wming around fire

apparatus

$03.2.6 Bridges und Eles ated Surfaces shall be amended as follows Where a bridge or an eles ated

<urfacc s part of a fire apparatus access road. the badyge shall be constructed and maintamed in
accordance with the current ! Darado (Cownty Framportation Division Bradge Standard or Appendiy
D of the current ( altformia Fire Code. whichever o moee reateictive. Bridges and cley ated surtaces
shall be designed for a live land sutficient to carny the imposed loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load
limits shall be posted a1 both entmnces 1 bodyes when reguinad by the Fire Code Offical. Where
clevated surfaces designed for emergencs vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces which are not designed
for such use. approsed harneey. approsed signs, o both shall be maaticd and mamtaned when
required by the fire code official

- 503.4.2 No Parking in Fire Lupes shall be added as follows No person shall stop. purk. or feave

standing any vehucle. whether attended or unartended except when necessary to avord conflict with

other traffic or in compliance with the dirccions of the Eire Chief or hicher duly auhorized
representative. Peace ficer or offical ieaffic control device ulonyg the edyge of any lughway at om
curh. or an wmy focanon g pablich or privately owned or aperated off-strect parking facilin

devignared ax a fire fone by the district with jurisdiction oyver the area in which the place s locored
The designanon sholl be indicated (1) by o sign posted smmediarely adyacent to. and visible from the
designated place cleariy stating in letters not less thars one inch ip height the the place s a fiee lune

120 by owtlinung or pamtog the pluce 10 red amd in contrasting color, marking the ploce with the

Ordinance 201908 Page 5

20-0203 G 9 of 40



s

words “FIRE LANE” which ore clearly visible from o vehicle, or (3) by u red curl or red paint on
the edge of the roadwoay wpon which s clearly marked the words "FIRFE FANE”.

503.4.3 No Parkiong is Front of Hydraats shall be added as follows: Mo person shall stop, park. or
leave standing auy vehicle wabin |5 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle i
attended by a licensed driver who 1< seated in the front seal and who can immediately move such
vehiole in case of necessity. by If the vehicle is owned or vperated by a fire department and is cleariy

murked as a fire department vehicle

- 4.4 Fire Lan Width shall be added as follows: Fire lanes shall be bused un
road width ay requived in Appendix D ws amended by the district,
583.5.3 Fire Appurutus Access Gates shall be added as follows: Al amomatie and munwol gotes

installed over fire apparatus access roads shall comply with the district gate standard as approved

by the fire code official

- Section 3US Premise Identification

- 505.1 Address ldentification shall have the first hine of this paragraph amended as follows;
Addresses for new and exisiing buldings shall conply with the disirict address standard as upproved
by the fire code officul.

Section 807 Fire Protection Water Supplies
507.5.1 Where Required shall be amended as follows: 400 feet shall be smended 10 150 feer

Section $0%,3 Fire Contrul Rovm
509.3 Fire Control Room #ire Protection and Urility Equipment Mdentification and Access. is hereby

amended by adding the following o read  Fure sprmkler risers, fire ulurm control pancls. solur
photovoliaic power system rupid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression, or simifar
control witches shull he focated mside u single fire control room for the building  The fire comrol
roum shall have mmimum dimensions of five feel by seven feer in yize with u toral useable area of not
less than 35 square feer. The room shall be log ored within the huilding on an cuiside wull at ulocation
approved by the Fire Code Official and sholl be accessible from the exierior. An exierior accexs door
with a clear width of nor less than 32 mehes and a height not less than 80 inches sholl be provided
for access o the raom A durable sign shall be affixed to the exterior of the door with the words
FIRE CONTROL ROCIM " in letiers not less than 4 inches in height A key box complving with
Section 306 shall be wstalled on the extertor side of the fire control room door opening  T'he room
mast be capuble or maintaining o nimiaum temperadure of S0 degrees Fahremheit. A clearance of
12 anches vhall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers o uny adjacent walls. I room can be

shared with viker building wiilities or fire protection equipment that is compatible.  An approved

Ordinance 2019.08 Page 6

20-0203 G 10 of 40



-

cabinet or comtamer shull be provided 1o store recard plans of the fire sprinkler system, other fire

protection equipmeni. amd site plans. This room shall not be used for any other siorage.

Chapter 9

Sectivn 903 Fire Sprinklers
903.2 Where Reguired shall be amended as follows: Ao approved automatic sprinkler system shall
be required and invalled in new buildings und structures 3608 square feet or greater when
constructed or refocated within the jurisdiction as described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12,
Exception: Agricultural buildings not under 2 special use permnt used for commercial purposes
903.2.4 Where Required shail be added as follows: Statux of existing buildings greater thun 3.600
square feel. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or greater. other than one and two-family dweiling
unids. and agricultural buildings not under special use permit or commercial purposes, where the
floor urea of the building or structure 15 increased by an addition of mare than thirty percent (30%;
ar 1,000 square feet whichever s less, such hulding or structure yhall be made to conform 1o Section
32
903.2.b Where Reguired shall be added as follows® Starus of existing buldings less tham 3,600
square feet. fn existing buildings 3.6iK1 square feer or less, other twan one-and rwo-family dwelling
units. and agriculural buildings not under special use permir for commercial purposes. where the
floor area of the hullding or siructure is increased to a 1otal square faotage over 3600 square feet,
by an addition of more than thirdy percent (30%) or 1,000 square feet, whichever is less. such building
or structure shall he made to canform to Section 9103 2.
903.2.1 Group A shall be amended as [ liows for A groups A- 1 through A-4: 903.2.0.1 (1) The fire
area exceeds 3 AN square feer
903.2.3 Group E shall be amended as follows: 903,23 (1) Throughout sll Group E fire areas greater
than 3.6 square feet \n arca
903.2.4 Group F-1 shall be amended as tollows: 13 2.4 Group F. 903.2.4 (1) A Group F tire area
exceeds J. 600 squure feet
903.2.7 Group M shall be amended as follows: 901 2 7 Group [ aed M. 903.2.7 (1) A Group B and
M fire area exceeds J.600 square feet
903.2.8.2 Manufacturcd Homes shall be added as tollows: Am autumuiti fire sprinkfer system sholl
be required in ali new manufactwred homes and multi-family monutactured homes intended for use
s @ one-grd rwo-family dwelling  The design and instalte o of vicd systems shall be i accordance
with California Code of Regulations {1'e 25, 33300
Excepiions:
| Manufactured Fontes located within on existing wobile home park complving wih

Caltfornia Health and Safen (Code. [iviston 15, Part 21 or 2.3

Ordinance 201908 Page 7

20-0203 G 11 of 40



o Manufactured homes thae do wor exceed | 2000 square feet wn size amd serve as an
e ssary dwelling s, oy deflaed i Gaverneteni Code Section 658502 swhen the
exeiing primaey cesidence an the propeen s mot required o comply with Californio
Resudential (ode Section K313 2
3 Manufaciured homes tha do net cvveed 120 wquare feet in sice
$03.2.9 Group 8.1 whail be amended as follows. 903,29 Group §. 903 2.9 (1) A Group § [fire orea
exceeds 3,600 syuare feel

. (;ronp S-2 ng {;a shall be amended as follows: 903 2 10 (1) Where

the fire arcn of the eaclosed parking garmpe excveds 3,000 square feet

Section M7 Fire Alaym and Detection Systems

T.laW d -~ New Buildin Structpres less than ware shall be added
as follows. dn approved fire alarm detection system shall be mstalled in all buildings with o floor
arva lexs thun 1.0600 square fee

Exceptivay:
I e and twa-family i effings (R-3 Occupuncies and other occupancies claxsified

s T

‘e

Agricutiural buildings not under special ise permit umd.ov wof wsed for commercial
purpuses (€., retails sales, foad service. und or special evenrs)
T Buildings with o floor area less than SO0 square feef may be exempt. oy determined
b the Fire Chief or hix ker duly wwthorized representanive baved on bailding
conusmruction material ond features. focation, occupancy tspe ond disiance 1o
EXPOSUrED
907.2.b Status of Existing Baildings shall be added as follows I exicing bubtdingy wichour an
approved gwomaric sprinkier sysiem, other than owe- or mwo-family dwelling wons, agrivculoral
huilding ot under special use perm for commercial purposes whwre o fire alurm detection ewvxiem
dires mot exest and the floor urea of the building or vicwcture W mcevaed or modifued by mare than
thirry percent ( 30%) or )00 square feet whichever is fess vuch bulding or sreusture shall be nule
wy comfarm 1o Section Y07 w hen requared by the Fiee Chuef or bicher duly aihor ized represeniative.
Rusldings wnk u floor arva fess than Y00 square feet won be vxempt v determined by the Fire € hief,
or fis her duly wwthorized represemtative. bused on I*m-ldinu construction niderials and featwres,
lavsation, v cugaaney tvpe ond distance 1o expasares
907.2.¢ Monitoring shall be added as follosss 1 free wlarm detection systema shall be connected
directly through and montored by o L appeoved contead peopeictary vre remole sialion service.,
which gives amdthe wmd vovwal sigaals W o constantly aitemded location AN sprinkiered bulldings

vhiddl e monitored

Ocdinance 2019.08 Page 8

20-0203 G 12 of 40



Exceptions:
{0 e und twosfomily dwellings (R-3 ¢docupancres and wther occupancies classified
as 0T
D Agricultural bulldingy wr weder speciol use permit ond or nor used for commercial
purposes te g ety soles fuod service and or speciad evenis)
907.2.d Type | Hood Installntiony shall be sdded as follows.  The requirement of imstallation or
veplovement, vf o Type | Hood System shall require o fire alarm sprinkder monitoring system o be
imtatled. or for the hand system e be connecied 1o on exisiing fire ulurmvsprinkier monioring sysiem
for ther butiding
7 Sceon i 3 shill be added as lollows.  {n vccordance with NFPA 72 the
wecondary power wupply providing a minymum 24-howr pawer capacity under guiescent (vad (s vsterm
wperading i non-afarm condittony viall be amepded 1o a mimimum "2-hour power capaciiy.
Exception. The eviatence of an emergency buck-up power supply that meers or erceed the

requarements of Califarnta Fire Coudy Chaper 12,

Chapter 12

Section 1203 Emergency und Sinadby Power Svatems

1203.1.3 Installation shall be amended as follows. bmergency power systems and standby power
systems shall be instalied i acconlance with the California Building Code, the Californua Electric
Code, NFPA 110 and NFPA 111 4! huildiogs wther thur one- oml two-family dwelling wwis, wmld
agricultural buildings not uved for commercial purposes. with stondby power, shall have a st g
device thet discoaierty all poier sowrces 1a the Auilding approved by the fire code officiad - Exivting

wnstallations shall he mamtamed i gecordance with the origmal approval

Chapter 33
Section 3310 Access for Fircfighting
3310.3 Premise ldeatification shall be added as (ollows. Prior i umd during consiewction, on
upproved address sign shall he provided at cuch five usd emergency vebicle vocess poud eniry mio

the project

Se 12 Wate ) rotect
33121 Whep Reguired shall he anended as fallows Prior we combusiible moterials vrriving un

site, the fire livdrany water system sl e osiglled wnd mamtamed in conpumons operation The

amownt of water sapplled shall mecet the rogueed Jire flow for the projece

Ordinance 2019.08 Page &

20-0203 G 13 of 40



Chapter 49

Sectign 4903 Pinoy

4 W Regu shall be added as follows: Fhe fire code official of the GRY may require
develupamen projects located in Moderase Hugh and Yery-High Fire Hozard Severity Zones to submit
fire protectron plan  Thiv plun shall be upproved by both the fire code official ind the awiborized
represeniairve for the local CAL FIRE Umi Chivf (ff tocated in the State Responsibility Arva [SRAJ)
prioe o the recarding of the fimad map for the profect by the Counry of £ Dorado

S 4905 W on fu

4995.4 Roef Consiruction Requirgments shall be added as follows: AN wew comutreciion (mcluling
whdintons. requires u Class A roof covermg or assembly. Ml re-roofing requires Clan A roof covering
ar asiembly us o mimimum. Re-roofing in excess of 0% of @ existing rwciere within gy ome - year
perisd will necesviiate thal the entire roct be o Ulars 4 roof cavering or ustemblt i o mintemem
Clasy Bor C fire retardunt treaied and ar son-mreated wond ihade or shingles wre ma approved o o

roof covering mwatecial for ¢ laer 4 avsembiy

Chapter 50

Ssctlon 5001 Genernl

017 Liability for Damages shail b added as follows  dny damages or <ost resndilng friom the
curelons ol \padi or discharge of amy hazardoss materials sholl constitient debi against wuny
swch peesom, firm oo corposation cowsing swch aptll wr dischurge. This debi &5 collectible by the Fire

Chief ow s her duly authorced cepeeseniaive n the same wianner gy i the cave of an abligation

sepedey Comtr v vper st or inipriled

Chupter 56

Section $601 Genvral

5601.2 Permit Required shall he amended as follows:  Permits shall be required as set forth in
Section 105 A and regulatud i sccordanve with thes secton, Where explosives permity are required
they shall be s by the Fire Chtef, or his her duly avthorized represemiative. wmd the El Dordo
Caomney Sherif) '« Dopartment Wiwey firesworks peemits are regiired, they shall be issued by the Fire
Chief, or his her duly wuthorized representotive. und the E] Dorado Cownty Board of Supervitor
So0i.2.1 Dogumeatatiog shall be added as tollows  The /LT shall have the auehority o reguest
dorwmeniaiion regording all aspecits of the fieyworks peesemiation

260122 Proprietan Ieformation sl te sdded a follows  The AHS will prorect ull proprictory

information

Ordinance 201908 Page 10

20-0203 G 14 of 40



Chspter 57

Section 5704 Storage
7 .9.6. ana W ve-Ground Tanks are P shall be amended as follows

Storage of Class | and Class [ Nammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings s prohibited
unless approved hy the Fire Chief. or s her duly awthorized represeniative. When perminted by the
Fire Chief, or his her duly authorized representative. all ubove growmd tankis) or vault installations
Jor the storuge of Class @, I or I flummuble and combustible liquids <holl comply with thuse
requirements as ser forth by the Culifornia Fire Code. The Cafiformia Fire Code shall also apphy to

installations other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above-ground storage is reyuired

Section 87 i crations

- 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks ure Prohibited shall be amended as follows:
Storage of Class | and Class i1 Nammable liquids i sbove-ground tanks outside of buildings is
protibued unless appraved by the Fire Chief or his her duly auhorized representative. When
permitted by the Fire (hief. or hix her duly amhorized represemanve, oll abave ground tank/s) or
vawlt installatiuny for the storage of Class I, I ar 11 flammable and combusnble liquids shall comply
with those requirements as sei forth by the California Fire Code. Phe California Fire Code shali also
upply to installarions other than motor vehcle fuel dispensing stationy where shove-ground storuge

iy required

Chapter 58
5806.2 Limitationy shall be amended as fallows Siorage of Nammable cryogenic fuds in stationan
comminers outade of butldings s probited unless appraved by the Fire Chief. or his her duly
autharized represeatative. When permunted by the Fire Chief. or hisher duly authorized
representative, oll siationary contatners for the sioruge of flammable cryogenic fluids shall comply
with those requirements as set forth by the Caltfurnio Fire Code  The California Fire Code shall alse
apply to installations other thun mutor vehicle fuel dispensing stuttons where above-ground storuye

i3 required

Chapter 61
6104.2 Muszimum Capacity within_Established Limits shall be amended as (ollows. The sioragr

of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of un uggrepate of 2.000-gallon water capaciry when located at

least one-half (1 2) mile from property zoned vr designated for residential use and at least one-hulf

Ordinance 2019.08 Page 11

20-0203 G 15 0of 40



(1 2) mule from existing residennial develnpment with a densiry greater than ane (1) dwelling unit per
aere and at least one-half t1 2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed wien AHJ gpproved. und o
spectal conditional use permu is issued by the County of El Dorwdo

Dispensing within extablished timits. Within the ltmus established by law restricting the dispersion
of liquefied petroleum gus for the protection of heavily populated or congested ureas, the aggregate
capaocity of any vne instullation shall not exceed a woter capacity of 2.000 gallons.  The dispensing
of liquefird petroleum gas in excess of un uggregute of J.00G-gallon water capacity when lucuted

ar least one-half (1 2y mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-
half (1 2) mile from existing residential development with a densin, greater than one (1) dwelling unit
per acre and at least one-half (1 2; mile from any hotel or motel 1s sllowed when AH) approved ond

a special conditionad use permir is issued by the Coumy of El Dorado,

iug 0112 High ation Li
shove) shall be added as follows:
6112.1 Regulators shall be added as follows
Twa-stage regulutor system shall be instailed in accordance with manufocturer requirements.
Two-stage regulator syseems shail be wmstedled on ofl LPG installatons.

- The first stage regulator shall be instolled under the hinged gauge cover supplted with the tank. The
atmospheric pressure aperiure of the regulator shail he pointed downward. The first stage regulator
shall be plumbed to the riser of the vard piping with saft copper tubing 1o allow flexibilicy should rank
shifting accur  The river from the yard piping shall be locared not more than 3 inches thorizontaliy
from the walls of the tank.

The second stuge regulator and riser pipe shall be installed under the eve of the building. as close as
practicuble io the building wall.  This riser thall be securely supported'braced to the wall
approximately 11 inchet below the regulutor so as to prevent bending of the pipe by luteral snow ice
Towads

A protective cover, approved by the gas supplier and Buidding Ufficial. shall be installed aver the
vecond stage regulator und securely supported 1o the ground or diagonolly o the wall

The riser pipes for the yard piping shall not be embedded in concrete, Concrete placed around such
river shall be held back at least | imch from all sides of the pipe

At the time of application for uny hutlding permit, which involves the tnstallation of an LPG system.
the applicam il submir on LPG wysiem plos plun in 3 copres for digiteliv as PDE). The LPG plot
plan shall include but wot be limited 1o, the wnk Jocativn, proposed tunk capacity tn US gallons,
ronte of vard piping. locanon of the riser pipe ut the building. property bownsdaries. and an outfine of

all exisping‘praposed buldings on the lot and o depiction of the ridgeline of any huilding 10 he

Ordinance 2019.08 Page 12

20-0203 G 16 of 40



supplied with I.PG This shall also be forwarded (o the uppropriare fire diserict o serve as a locator
map in event of un emergency
{ocation of the centerline of LPG tunks shall he permonenily marked by the use of wnow stakes. one
at each emd. Such siakes chatl be of suffictent heigitt 10 be visible through anticipared masimum snow
depth ar the respective location  Ingallotion and muintenance of these wnow siakes are the
respansibility of the LPG user
Propune applianees and accessories shall noi be permitted in any new mstollation below the firse
foar or helow grade whichever is more resiricnve

- 61122 Verticul Riser Piping shall be added as tallows

- Mingmem of Schedule S0 - ivon piping
The riser shall be within 3 inches horizantally of the tank

~ Swing jomnes vhall be mstalled above and below tunk level 1o provide for the tank movement (Street
elberws shull not be uted)
A listed flexible riser comsiructed of copper or sunniess-sieel mbung and protected by sieel covered
sheathed material may be used instead of swing jounts  [he flexible aiternative shall provide sufficient
tluck to allow for tank moyement

- 6112.3 Marking and Locativas shall be added a< follows:

- An approved sign shall be Incated directhy above the riser shu off valve on the building in o visible
Towutien.

< The liquefied petroleum gay supplier shall affix o weatherproof identificotion 1ag to the inside of the
tank valve protecting cover  This tag shall contarn the supplier's name and emergency relephone
nuntber
Tank imstallatton shall be permanentty marked by o metal ar wood materid snow marker. with
murimum dimension of 2 inches iy 2 tnches  The s marker shall he of sufficiem height 1o rise
above the annual viow depth ond sholl be a minimume of 10 feet tt hesght - Fhe snow markers shall

he pamnted vellow und located on apposite ends of the nk

crground LP( Tanks i w ip shall be added as follows
6113.1 Permits and Plany shall be added as follows: Permits shall be required. and plans shall be

swhmted for wll underground tank imvallations as approved by the AHJ.
61132 Enderground §. PO " shall be added as follows  Lndergronnd LPG tunks
shall be prohibited from being sold to end-wers und shall be retained by the LPG company wnder v

lease-type system to ensure proper annwal puuntenance requicements are mel and recorded

Chapter 80

Ordinance 2019.08 Page 13

20-0203 G 17 of 40



Section 80, NFPA, 13D-16 ~ Standard for the Installation of Spriakler Syatems  One-and I'no-
Family Dweilings and Manufactured Homes as amended 903.3.1.3, 903.3.8

NEFA 13D, Amended Sections as follows:

Add Section 4.7 1o read as follows:

Chapter 80, NFPA 13D 4.7 Revidentiul fire sprimkler systeemy imstadled m cdl mew one-condd ewer- famnly
dhevllings shall wilize o Pussive Purge svvtem design wundess otherwise upproved by the Fire Cods
€ )ffic il

Exception: Menufoctured Bome mstalled, tested and approved by the Caltfornia Department of Howung
and Commumity Development

Revise Section 5.1.1.2 to read as follows:

Chapter 80. NFPA 13D, §.1.1.2 .1 supply of at leaxt one of cach rvpe and remperature sprinkler wed
within the premuoes skall be mamamed an the propecns ob un approved ocanion Siock sprinklers shail
be kepr m a maumed and accessible cabinet

Revise Section 7.6 to read as (ollows:

Chapter 80. NFPA 13D. 7.6 A local warer flow alarm shall be provided oo all Jire sprinkler sysiems n

humes al an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling
Revise Seetion 11.2.1.1 to read a9 follows:
Chapter 830. NFPA 13D, 11.2.1.1 Where a fire depanment pumper connuction 15 not provaded, the

sy siermn shall be hydrostancalhy tested at o snemmum precsury of 130 poundy per wgeare inch gauge for no

less than a 3-minute durstion withow evidewce of lechage Swch rest shall be witnesswd by the fire cude

ooffecral

Appendis B - Fire Flow Requirements for Boildings

08, i Fire Flaw for ©) w v Dw G . R4

Buildings aad Townhouses shall be amended as follows for elevanons below 5 000 feer

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC CMINIMUM FLOW

CALCULATION SPRINKLER | FIRE- DURATION
AREA SYSTEM FLOW | (hours)
(square fret) (Devign tgallans per !
. Sandard) | mingkc)

Orndinance 2019 08 Page 14

20-0203 G 18 of 40



0 1600 [No  autamstic 1 000 !
peinkler sy stem | |
e T ————— - S ..;h.‘-———-—- — e |

r 1601 and greater | o automulis | Value in Dunstion in |
| sprinkler syalem . Tablg tahle {
| BIOS. D) | 0%y wm {

[ the  reguired
 firc-flow ratg
1

0 Lado Section 901 313 s | %
of the (4 tue ]
{omde o Sewhun
33 of the LA
Hondenul Cod

1601 and grester Sectsan WL 10 12 salue of I
of e CA i Tahlc
Code a1 Scaion IS 12
3113 of the UA | rmin o |
Residential ¢ oxle | Gpay ‘ ‘

Table B105.2 Required Fire Flow for Buildings other than One- and Two-Family
Dwellings, Group R-3, and R4 Buildings snd Townhouses shall be amended as follows:

AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER MINIMUM FLOW DURATION
SYSTEM FIRE-FLOW (hours)
(Design Standard) tgallons per
minuic)
Ma musomaric sprinkler sysiem Vaive m  Table | Dhration  in Table
B1Os i BLOS 112y
Seation 903111 of the OV Fire Ha, o of e value Durmtion in | able
Cinde n lable B1OS (24" [ BI03 12 at the reduced
hiw rate
- . |
Secnon WY 112 of e (A Hee 2oa S Gf the vatuc Durntion W Table
Code 1 applir w wions n Tabic BIO%.1(2 BI0S 112y a1 the reduccd
i V(MWL foet clevarm: fhow s

b The reduced fire flow shall not be fess than 1500 gpm

Appendin D - Fire Apparatus Acceas Ronds
on D103 Minimam Specifications

D103.1 Acccas Road Width with a Hydrant shall be amended as follows, sdding the exception

Exception Droven o

03.2 Grade shall be amended as follows Fiee apparatus access rosds and drveways shall not
exceed (5. 99 i grade wnlexs approved by the 4100 or by the FI Daorado County amended € alifornia

Public Resource Code Title 14 Destgn and Improvememnt Standards Manvai

Ordinance 2009.08 Page 15

20-0203 G 19 of 40



Exception: Llevanon above § (000 feet shall not exceed 12%
D103.3 Turning Radius shall be amended m follows  [he minimum wrning radius shall be
determined by the fire code official. and shall not tnclwde curb and gutier
01035 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates <hall be amended as follows  Subsecnion (/) Where o
ngle gate is provided. the gute width shull be noi less than 20 feer (6096 mp; Where u fire
appurdatus rood cunsists of o divided rowdway. the gate with shall not be less than 15 feet (4572
mem
D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet i width shall be amended as follows' Fire lane sgns as specified in
Section D103.6 shall be posted on both <ide of fire apparatus sccess roads that are 20 10 29 feet wide
{6096 10 85144 man).
Exception: Lievations above 5000 f as determimed by the AHJ
more 9 W shall be amended as follows:  Fire lane signs as
specified i Scotion D103.6 shall be posted nn one side of fire apparatus avgesy roads more than 29
feet wide (8534 & mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm)
Excepiion Elevations above 5.000 fi as determined by the AHS
- .4 Cirel inl Fi . shall be added as follows: When required
by the fire code official. a fire apparanss access road shall be construcied 10 encompass the entirety

uf o structure and thall provide u conunsows means of emergency vehicle access

SECTION 4: CONFLICT
That Ordinance No. 2016-37 of the GRV, and all other ondinances or parts of vrdinances herewith are hereby

repealed.

SECTIONS: SEVERABILITY

It any Ordinance. article, subscction or subdivision thereof, provision, semence. clause or phrase of this code. or
any application thereof, 1s for any reavon held to be invabid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such decision
shall not afTect the remaining provisions of this code. which can be given effect without the mvalid portions and.
therefore. such invalid portions are declarcd to be severable. The GRV herely declares thar it would have enacted
this Ordinance and cach of s articles, sections, subsections. or subdivisions thereof, provisions, sentences

clauscs or phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them s declared ins alid

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AMND PLBLICATION
I'his Ordinance shall take effect thiry (30) days atter us adopnion  The GRV Noard Sccretary s directed 1o
publish this ordimance in a newspaper of general circulation w the sty In hew of publicanon of the full text

of the ondinance. a summany of the ordinance may be pubiished by the by the Board Secrctan within fifteen (15)

Ordinance 2019 08 "age 16

20-0203 G 20 of 40



-

days alter its passage and a cenified copy shall be posted in the office of the GRV pursuant to Government (Code

Necrion 3693 3c) 111
The above Ordinance was intreduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the Garden Valley Fire Protection
Whstrict on October 17, 2019, and 1 was then read for the first time, A public hearing was set for the Ordinance

to be read for the second time on November 26, 2019 and approved by the following vote

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the GRV 1his, 26 day of November, 2019.

AYES: D
NOES: |
ABSENT: |

Ed Hawkins, Board President

Al 1EST

I is2 Howard, Board Sccretan

Ordinance 2019.08 Page 17

20-0203 G 21 of 40



Fire Code #

Significant
change?

What Is the Change?

Amend with the name of the jurisdiction

DSP, ECF, & GRV

Locally adopted / SFM adopted /
Amended

Locally adopted and amended

Why Is There a Local Change?

Administrative need

Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate

LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than
air and can easily be trapped under a home, if ignited it can
lead to an explosion. At elevations above 5000 feet there is

105.6.27 i i i
" ggs:h;:i&;lseizc;:;ngégﬁ pllon seniing Lol opled and amende an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire
P pR-S. activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional
attention.
Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance
106.6 n of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines
" A ppction Lixally crseleat e aciopled permits, plan checks, and inspections as allowed in Health
&Safety Code 17951.
g Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to
106.6.1 N A
dd section Locally created and adopted the Fire District
106.7 Y Add section Locally ereated and adopted S?Cllop 106.7. To recover the actual costs of avoidable
failed inspections by contractors.
Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District
is added to read as follows:
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an
109.4 Y Added section 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire
Code Official. Based on the County of El Dorado's
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals
timeline.
" . Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that
Corr.xpleted the seclion by filing in the blank ) protects life and property. Fees have been updated to
portions that were not completed by the SFM. Itis . -
110.4 N - . Locally adopted and amended match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the
better left to localities to determine the oy
. . N District Attomey’s Office. The change to the language to
fees/penalties for their respective areas. ; s ¢
include the term infractions.
110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2
Citations
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s),
1104.2 N Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before Uocli eredted and adonted may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor
o but under a different number) y n P violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the
Health and Safety Code of the State of Califomia and
Chapter 5¢ (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Califomia.
Completed the section by filling in the blank
rtions that were not completed by the SFM. Itis All violations of the code have been consolidated under
124 po ! . " Consol
N better left to localities to determine the Lok} Sdopted aniseieiisd Section 110.4 to include the penalties for violations.
fess/penalties for their respective areas.
Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District,
- ' Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd
202
N Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopted Manager. Definition of campfire shall notinclude LPG or
Propane fueled appliances.
302.1 N Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for clarity
307.4.4 through Due to the high fire danger that exists in El Dorado County
30'7 '4 42(d) Y Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopted we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas.

20-0203 G 22 of 40




503.2.1

Changed vertical clearances to 15 feet and road
widths to 20 feet.

Locally adopted and amended

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus
components. It also allows an extended time frame before
having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional
height for vegetation clearances acts as an increased buffer
for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of
shoulders, as measured face of curb to face of curb is
needed. These structures can be difficult to navigate with
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the total
drivable road surface

§03.2.5

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the
Fire Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations to
match as they require tumarounds for fire apparatus
access roads and driveways.

Locally adopted and amended

Fire apparatus require areas for tuming around when
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This
includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides
better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum
around for apparalus in driveways greater than 150'.

503.2.6

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated
Surfaces to state and match El Dorado County
Transportation Division inslead of AASHTO HB-17.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated
Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendix D of the
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an
altemate means & methods that is not less restrictive than
the Fire Code.

503.4.2

Added seclion regarding no parking in fire lanes

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes"
rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicle Code.

503.4.3

Added section regarding no parking in front of
hydrants

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire
hydrants” rules and is consistent with the Califoria Vehicle
Code.

503.4.4

Added section regarding fire lanes based on road
width

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines Califomia Fire Code Appendix D|
as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire
lanes.

503.5.3

Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain
emergency access and consistency through all
roadway gates in El Dorado County, referring to the
gate standards adopted by the FPO's.

Locally created and adopted

Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on
roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing
the best possible emergency access to maintain fast
response times.

505.1

Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of
buildings

Locally adopted and amended

Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing
based on the Dislrict's addressing standards.

507.5.1

Added more conservative standard for the
placement of hydrant and their relationship to
commercial buildings

Locally adopted and amended

Commercial properties are required to install hydrants at
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150
feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in
between).

509.3

Added verbiage to bring all of the necessary fire
controls for a building to one location.

Locally created and adopted

Buildings are getting more sizable in the county. Itis more
common to have new buildings with solar arrays that
cantinue to generate power even when the buildings
general utilities have been shut off. When there is an
emergency, it is vital that we have rapid access to all of the
controls in one location for public evacuation and firefighter
safety. Due lo the fire danger present in El Dorado County
throughout most of the year, this change is appropriate and
advisable.

903.2

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation

greater within the district.

in new buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or ;

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square

feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

20-0203 G 23 of 40




903.2.a

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the
structure, whichever is less.

Locally created and adopted

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

903.2b

Adds occupant protection for existing buildings less
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the
structure, whichever is less:

Locally created and adopted

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of EI Dorado County and-their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

903.2.1,903.2.3,
903.2.4, 903.2.7

These sections were created to give specific
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on
occupancy and square footage

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic; climatic, and geographic conditions
of EI Dorado County and their contribuling factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feetin size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

903.2.8.2

This section was created to include manufactured

|residential single family R-3 in the residential

sprinkler program

Locally created and adopted

Manufactured Homes — The intent of this code section is to
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption
due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a
significant risk to their occupants., Residential sprinkler

ystems have been incorporated to decrease this risk
successfully in many Califomia communities.

903.2.9,903.2.10

These sections were created to give specific
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on

|occupancy and square footage

Locally adopted and amended

|spread.

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of

907.2.a

Added occupant protection for fire alamms in
buildings with a fioor area less than 3,600, except
R3, AG buildings not used for commercial
purposes, and buildings with a floor area of less
than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code
official.

Locally created and adopted

Provides proper emergency nolification for occupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of a fire or smoke.

907.2.b

Added occupant protection for existing buildings
without automalic sprinkler systems to install a fire
alarm if they add more than 30% or 1,000 square
feet to the structure, whichever is less.

Locally created and adopted

Provides proper emergency notificalion for occupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of a fire or smoke.

907.2.c

Added occupant protection by stating all fire alarm

detection systems installed shall be connected to a
monitoring service that notifies the fire department

upon activation and is installed per Section 307 of

the fire code.

Locally created and adopted

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of a fire or smoke.

907.2.d

Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood

systems to be connected to a monitored fire alam
system when installed or replaced.

Locally created and adopted

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that

allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of a fire or smoke.

20-0203 G 24 of 40



907.6.2.1

Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply
Modification

Locally created and adopted

Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due lo PGS8E
safety related power outages.

1203.1.3

Shunt trip power safety devices

Locally adopted and amended

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to
ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up
power supplies

33103

Address requirements for construction sites

Locally created and adopted

Addressing for construction sites is important to assist
responding emergency crews:

33121

Water supplies at construction sites with
combustible materials on-site

Locally adopted and amended

Water must be on site prior to combustible material being
stored or vertical construction commencing.

4903.1

This section was created to include Fire Protection
Plan for all fire hazard severity zones.

Locally created and adopted

El Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout
the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire
Protection Plan due to climatic, geological, and
topographical conditions.

4905.4

Added a section to clarify roof construction
requirements

Locally created and adopted

This section dlarifies that within the boundaries of Ef Dorado
County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are
wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly.

5001.7

Any damages or costs from negligent practices that
cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a
cost recovery fee.

Locally created and adopted

Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate.
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the
negligent parties.

5§601.2

Added safety protection with permits being issued
by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of
Supervisors for fireworks.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and
fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding
of the applications they will be used for.

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make
available all requested documentation pertaining to
the firework presentation

Locally created and adopted

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any
documentation including timing and proprietary information
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they
deem necessary. This informalion is understood to be
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as
such.

5704.2.9.6.1

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class I combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a
Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County.

5706.2.4.4

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class Il combustible liquid special
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval
and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County.

5806.2

Administrative addition of District name.
Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Administrative need to add District name. Established limits
as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable
Cryogenic fluids in'stationary containers. Requires AHJ
approval and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the -
County:

5806.2.1

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

SFM adopted and amended locally

Established limits as required by the Fire Code Official for
Flammable Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers.
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use
Permit from the County.

6104.2

Established limils for LPG storage and dispensing
near or adjacent to residential development

Locally adopted and amended

Establishes distances between LPG storage and
dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential
developments and high-density hotels, motel, apartments,
etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would
have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death:
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use
Permit from the County.

20-0203 G 25 of 40




6112.1

Establishes propane regulator requirements for
locations above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes propane regulator requirement for locations
above 5000 foot elevation. Including requirements for two-
stage regulator use and location of first and second stage
regulators. Additional requirements are outlined for

|protective covers, riser pipe installation requirements,

building permit submittal and review, tank center-line
marking, and grade requirements. These requirements are
based on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet.

6112.2

Establishes propane vertical riser pipe requirements
above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes vertical propane rise requirements for focations
above 5000 foot elevation. Pipe schedule location, swing
joint requirements; and the use of flexible riser piping as
well as swing joints. These requirements are based on
significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather
conditions encountered above 5000 feet.

6112.3

Establishes propane marking and location
requirements above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes marking and location requirements for locations
above 5000 foot elevation. This section addresses signage
location, emergency contact information, and snow related
tank marking requirements. These requirements are based
on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet.

6113.1

Permits and plans shall be submitted and approved
by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction).

Locally created and adopted

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground
tanks:

Allows us to require plans be submitted for review prior to
installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks
require substantial maintenance including inspection and
anode replacement at regular intervals.

6113.2

Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the
property of the LPG company

Locally created and adopted

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when
sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground
tanks where corosion and leaks are more easily detected.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16

NFPA 13D-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the
District has been amended to update various
provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler
systems in one-and two-family dwellings

SFM Adopted and amended locally

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on-
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow
alarm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in the
event of water activalion in a vacant structure, and
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 13D

|sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water

damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements
were also added to ensure water circulation through the

+

y , reducing stagnant water and backfiow concems
(EID encourages this type of system).

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section 4.7

Correction of a system quality issue

SFM Adopted and amended locally

Amends the cument code set to include the addition of a
passive purge system to keep the water in the sprinkler
piping system from being stagnant.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section.
§.1.1.2

To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler
system minimizing damage

SFM adopted and amended locally

A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system
must be available on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section 7.6

Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation

SFM adopted and amended locally

An audible alarm system is added to notify occupants and
in the activation of the system when the building is not
occupied allow for detection minimizing damage.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section
11.211

System test to a pressure of 150 p.s.i.

SFM adopted and amended locally

A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and
failures and assures proper gluing of system components.

Appendix B: Table
B105.1(1)

Changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot
elevation, to match fire flow precedents used in
EDC for years

Locally adopted and amended

Allows us to match what developers and residents are used
foin regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been
used for over a decade in EDC.

20-0203 G 26 of 40




Appendix B: Table

Established a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM,

Allows us to match what developers and residents are used

B105.2 N below 5000 foot elevation, for all commercial Locally adopted and amended to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been
) projects used for over a decade in EDC.
i D " L Itis unreasonable to require a residential driveway to
Appendix D: D103.1 N Made an exception for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended conslruct a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant.
Title 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways.
Appendix D: D103.2 N State law requires no greater than 16% grade Locally adopted and amended In our El Dorado County Title 14 adoption we allow greater
than 16% grade with AHJ approval and hard surface.
Appendix D: D103.3 N Text to include curbs and gutters Locally adopted and amended aiifoet rqad widths‘shall not mclud_e curbs_ sl gules dije
to potential access issues and tuming radius concems.
Appendix D: D103.5 § Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided
1' ’ N Fire apparatus access road gates Locally adopted and amended roadway the gate width shall not be less than 15 feet due to
radius issues. C
No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet
i D) ; in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does
Appendix D: D103.6.1 N Roads widths 20 to 29 feet Locally adopted and amended ot apply, This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all olher elevalions.
Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet
. allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of
Appendix D: D103.6.2 N fReZ??: z‘glt:s mars o 28 ek s oy 56 Locally adopted and amended elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The
seclion is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations.
Appendix D: D104.2 Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
PP " ’ N building with a square foolage of 124,000 or less to Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
Exception -
have only one approved fire apparatus access road. Iresidents and first responders.
When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus
. Added to require circumferential fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the enlire
ApemIL DT L access roads Localy created and adopled structure and shall provide a continuous means of
emergency vehicle access.
Appendix D: D106.1 For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
PP E M ’ N Removed Exception in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
xception ]
residents and first responders.
Appendix D: D107.1 For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
P peg " ’ N Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
xception .
residents and first responders.
Adopted with no Amendments
101.2 through 101.5 N c;:’d‘::;’d to establish scope, ntent, severability and Locally adopted Administrative clarity
102.6 through 102.8 N References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
Wilotmghfoziz] n  |Conficling provisioos; OtherLaws, Applicaionof Locally Adopted Administrative dlarity
references ”
L Definition of the Fire Prevention Division and ability o ;
103.1 through 104.1 N ko enforce the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.3 lﬁrough 104.4 N Right of Entry, Warants, and Identification Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.6 through 104.6.4 N Record retention Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
1048 through 10492 |~ N :"es"f'ﬁ“"s' Sierele e ad Tethad, Locally Adopted Administrative carity
104.11 through Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of b o ;
104.41.2 N systems ‘ Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.11.3: N Authority of systems and devices inoperable Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
105.2.3 N Time limitation of application Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
1gg.g,;through N |Operational pemits Locally Adopted Administrative dlarity

20-0203 G 27 of 40




Dry cleaning operational permits required for

105.6.12 hazardous cleaning solvent use Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
Permits for various business operations for. Magnesium,
105.6.2.28 th ; . s ; miscellaneous combustible s'lorage_,br.nobife food pre;parahon
105.6.35 gl ;?r?z :‘zd"tg::fz i;c;:gfoﬁr:ﬂﬂ;mstrabve dlni At Locally Adopted vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing facilities, open burning,
- P open flames and torches, open fiames and candles, and
organic coalings
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and ;
105.6.37 fire and life safety inspecions ; Locally Adopted Pemmits for places of assembly
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and ] 2
105.6.39 fire and lfe safety inspections Locally Adopted Permits for private fire hydrants
“|Permits for pyroxylin plastics, refrigeration equipment, repair
105.6.41 through Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally Adopted garages and motor fuel-dispensing facilities, rooftop
105.6.46 fire and life safety inspections y Adop heliports, spraying or dipping, storage of scrap tires and tire
by-products
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and e o
105.6.48 fie aiid lfe safety inspections Locally Adopted Permit for tire-rebuilding plants
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Permit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material,
10 fire and life safety inspections Locally Adopted lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 cubic feet)
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and :
106.1 through 106.3 fire and ffs safely inspections Locally Adopted Fee schedules for permits
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and . .
107.1 fire and ffe safely inspections Locally Adopted Inspection authority
Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of
. N S : equipment, re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping,
108.1 through 109.3 :riosrl:ﬂi‘fteuzsg t:?:sfo;;i:;mstrahve iy and Locally Adopted supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding,
P Board of Appeals established, limitations on authority, and
qualifications
110.3.2 through Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally Adopted Compliance with orders and notices, prosecution of
11034 fire and life safety inspections ¥ Adop violations, and unauthorized tampering
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and —
110.4.1 fre and ife safety inspeciions Locally Adopted Abatement of violation
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and . " R
1131 e and life salety inspections Locally Adopted Authority to disconnect service ulilities
Asphalt kettles contain highly lammable substances and
303.1 through 303.9 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and
topographical)
Managing ignition sources through responsible application
305.1 through 305.5 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted of standards will reduce the number of fires in various
settings (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY
306.1 through 306.2 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted flammable and require special handling (Climatic;
geological, and topographical)
; J . : Open buming, recreational fire, and portable outdoor
307.1 through 307.5 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted freplaces, (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
308.1 Adopted tis section for fire and ife safety Locally Adopted CPBERURSER el v EERSIS oS (g Il
. ; topographical)
308.1.2 through 3 . ; Throwing or placing of ignition sources, torches for
30843 Adopted this sectfon for fire and life safety Locally Adopted removing paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Locations near combustible, open flame devices, signals
and markers, portable fuel open-flame devices; sky-
308.1.5 through : b . lantems, religious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming
308.1.8.5 ioptid fisastion forise and e aately Kocaly Avioprid food and beverage preparation, dispensing, containers not
in use, serving of flaming food, location, fire protection
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)
308.2 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted el are fucael for chaive ssclion: (el geologieal

and topographical)

20-0203 G 28 of 40




308.3 through 308.4.1

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices,
theatrical performances, Group R eccupancies, Group R-2
dormitories (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

310.1

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopled

General requirements relating to smoking (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

310.3

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

"No Smoking" signs (Climatic, geological, and
topographical)

310.4 through 310.8

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with "No Smoking”
signs, ash trays, buming objécts, hazardous environmental
conditions. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

311.1 through 311.4

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Vacant premises condition and safety requirements,
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant
premises, security, fire protection, fire separation, removal
of combustibles, removal of hazardous materials. (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

319.1

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

General requirements relating to mobile food preparation
vehicles. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

319.2

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

Permits for mobile food preparation vehicles (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

319.3 through
319.10.3

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Exhaust hood, fire protection, fire protection for cooking
equipment, fire extinguisher, appliance connection to fuel
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, metallic
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking oil
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting,
normal vents, emergency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum
aggregate volume, protection of container, LP-gas container
construction, protection of system piping, LP-gas alarms,

CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel,
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG
container construction, CNG containers supplying
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping,
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems.
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)

403.8.1 through
403.8.1.7

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1
(residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and
fire safety plans.

403.10 through
403.10.1.3

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancy
Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

405.5

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

510.3

Adopted this section for administralive clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)

807.5.2 through
807.5.2.3

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a
maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in
educalional facilities (Climatic, geological, and
topographical)

903.2.1.5

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

An automalic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers)
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000
square feet. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

20-0203 G 29 of 40




1103.2

Adopted this section in existing buildings for the
Y salety of firefighters and other emergency
responders.

Locally Adopted

Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings.
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by
the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind
this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have

strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Appendix D: D101.1

Adopted this section for the safety of the public,

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads

firefighters, and other emergency responders.

through D102.1 L firefighters, and other emergency responders. Faealirdogied including loads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
’ : " Dead end fire apparatus access road requirements for a

e Adopted this section for the safety of the public, s A

Appendix D: D103.4 N frefighters, and other emergency responders. Locally Adopted tum aroun.d at 150 feet. (Climalic, geological, and
topographical)

. Adopted this section for the safety of the public, "No Parking, Fire Lane" signs requirements. (Climatic,
fAppendxD: D106 N firefighters, and other emergency responders. Locally Adopled geological, and topographical)
ARERXDIDINE] Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus
through D104.3 N firefighters, and other emergency responders Locally Acplet access roads. (Climalic, geological, and topographical)
(excluding exception) gniers, emergency responders. - (G » geological, pograp
Appendix D: D105.1 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adoted Requirements for aerial fire apparatus access roads
through D105.4 ’ firefighters, and other emergency responders. y Adop (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Anpendic:D106.1 Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential
through (1068 N lfrefighters, and other respond i developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical
(excluding exceptions) irefighters, and other emergency responders. levelopments (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Appendix D: D107.1 One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be

RN Adopted this section for the safety of the public, equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire
(excluding exceptions) N Locally Adopted : p

firefighters, and other emergency responders. apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and
through D107.2 S -
climatic conditions.

Appendix D: D108 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopted Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction

standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle.

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions.

20-0203 G 30 of 40




Garden Valley Fire Protection District

To Whom It May Concern,

For the Garden Valley Fire Protection District 2019 Fire Code Adoption, public notice was

achieved through posting our Notice of Intent in the following three locations:

- On the board located in front of Station 51 at 4860 Marshall Road,
- Packets were placed in the front office, and were available for the public to view.
- On the District’s website, detailing the location and time of the meeting where the adoption was

going to take place.

The District was forthcoming with the information of proposed changes and had it readily available
for review by the public at all times. Additionally, the District gave sufficient time for public comment

and viewing.

Sincerely,

(o

Clive Savacool
Fire Chief

20-0203 G 31 of 40



Attachment No. 2
Garden Valley Fire Protection District

Resolution No. 2019-07

20-0203 G 32 of 40



RESOLUTION 2019-07

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE GARDEN
VALLEY FIRL PROTECTION DISTRICT
ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO THE
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

A resofution for the Cunden Valley 1 Protesnon Disinet setting forth lindings with
respect W focal condiiona withio the bire [astrict wiuch make cortain modilcations and
changes o the Californis | ire Code reasonable necessary for preserving fire and Hie
safery in the Garden Valley Fire Protection District

Ihe Governing Board of the Gurden Valley |ire Protecthion Disirict finds and resolves as
follows:

WHERFAS, |ealih & Safery Code Secton | 7958 § permits a Fire Protection
Distnict 10 adopt an ordinance which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations
sdopied pursuant 1o 1 lealth & Satety Code Section | 7922 upon determination that such
chasiges of modifications ure pevessany due 1o local conditions thai periasn regulahions
governing condinons hazardous 1o ife. property and the environment from fire.
explasion, hazardous matenals and hasprdous uses. and

WHERFAS, Health & Safery Code Scctinn 17958 7 requires that o Mistrict’s
Board of Mrectors muking any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Salety
Code Seenion 1 798K, 5 shall make express finding that such changes or modifications are
meeded. und shall flle a copy of ssch changes or modifications with the Depanment of
Housing and Comemunity Des elopment

WIHEREAS, the unigue lowal climatic, geological. and topographical candstions
existing within the boundaries ol the Diginet make # reasonably necessary for the District
to impasc more sinngend requirements than st forth o the Califorma Fire Code und
pursuan 1o Californw Health and Safety Code sectons 11869 7 and 17958.7. the District
destres wo make express findings w that lfon

NOW, THEREFORE, BF IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the
Crarden Valley Fire Protection Distnet, after has ing duly noticed and held public
heanings. hercty adops the (ollowing (indings concermng current unique local conditions
that together make cach moditication 1o the Califorma 1 e Code, reasonably necessany 1o
provide adequate und effective protection of hity, property and the enviroament mare
specifically set [orth as [ullows

20-0203 G 33 of 40



FINDINGS OF FACT
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE S1ATE BUILDING
STANDARDS CODE (TITLE 24 PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL
CONDITIONS

(General.

Aller dur consideration. the Board of Direciors of the Garden Valley Fire Protection
District. hereby finds that due 1o local climutic, geologic and topographic conditions, as
stated within this document, there is a need to provide the modifications and Change
contained in the edoptive Ordinance of the Calitorma Fire Code Such chunges are
deemed 10 be reasonsbly necessany w provide adequaie and efTective protection of life
property. and the cavironment.

e Garden Valley Fire Protection Disiriet provides fire protection, emergeney madcal
services, and specialized rescue services o approximately 7,500 peuple in w 60 suare
mile arca 1 he District is focated op the Western slope of Bl Dorado County The
topography of the District ranges from rolling hills of grass, onk woodland, large
quaniities of brush, and steep drainages. The weather conditions vary (rom freesing
temperatures with occasional snow in winter. (o summer lemperatures that regularly
exceed 10 Jegrees

The District van be divided into three disting arcas: Garden Valley, Creenwoud, aml
Kelwey . These areas typically contain small groupings of residential developrients and
iwslited residential developments, with cormmercial businesses spread throughout the
district, Fhese arcas are characteristic of the wildland-urban intertace cnvironment.

The Grarden Valles Fire Protection Distact is an “all-risk” agency. The District
participates in o sophisticated automatic sid program and s dispaiched through
agrecment hy the Califorma Department of Foresiry and Fire Protechion (Cal-Fire) at
Camino. The resources of the [Disinet will respond 1o, and deal withe any type of
emergency. The term “Fire Protection ™ in this document s broad and includes responses
o fires. smoke, and odor investigations, alarms, public assist calls, hazardous materials
meidents, medical wid and speealized rescucy

Ihe Enstoct hus one. full tme, swlled (iee station and 2 unstaffed satellite fire sations o
provide emergency wrvice 1o the conumunity, Fire Station §1 is focated in the
umncorporated town of Garden Valley . ut ARG Marshall Rd. Fire Station 53 is located in
the unineorporated fown of Greenwood, a1 3813 Highway 193, Fire Stavion 52 {s located
in the unincorporated town af Kelsey, at 9762 Georgetown Rd. The District has 6 full-
time, career perwnnel, along with one part time management position, one administralive
aupport positions, und these ure supplemented with volunteer Chief Officers, Firelightery,
and Frre Prevenuon Officers

20-0203 G 34 of 40



€.

Climutic.

The Gurden Valley Fire Protection Disirict s located within a foothill region. The Disirct
1% subject 10 tour seasons. with an annual snow fall in the winter months of 2 inches. in
addition o un sverage rainfall of 39 inches per vear. These adverse weather conditions
create severe hazardows road conditions and flooding as well as rock shide hazards along
the main acoess roads within, as well as into, the Distnct from the surrounding areas. Due
to periods of minfall. alony with repeated road closures, the ahility of the Fire Protection
District to provide immediate emergency response is often delayed | hese same adverse
climatic condstions often result in a large number of vehicular aceidents that place
cxtreme restranty on the svailability of emergency response 1o perform emergency
rescue, lirst wd, hwzardous materials control, and five-Aghting. The climatic conditions
often resule 11 o substanual or ol Jack of ability of the Fire Protection District o
respond vnincdiately 1o other types of emergency situations that ocour, Examples of these
emergency situations include structure fircs, wildland and forest fires, flooding,
harardous matenals incidents, cmergency medical calls, vehicle accidents, and verncal
rescucs Phe mutual aid agrecments established with sdjoining fire agencies might not he
possible due w adverse climsine conditions, restricting of 1owlly blocking scoews i the
sty

Summary:

T hese tocu! climatic comditions affect the acceleranion. miemsity. and size of fires ) the
Fire District. Limes of lirde or no minfall. low humidity, and high wemperatures crene
cxtremely hazardows conditions. pasticularly as they relate to the wildland -urban
interface. Winds expericnced in this arca can have 2 significant impacl upon structuse
fires. especially o buildings in close proxuminy to one another, und 10 wildlands
commonty found in the Garden Valley Frre Protection District, Structures built within the
Ciarden Valley Tire Protection District must be built with these vanahles in mind

Geological.

The Garden Valley Fire Protection Distict w located within moderate seismie Zone
Three The seismic. geological conditions present u potential for multiple fires, major
brcakage of water mains, multiple electrical power failures, multiple collapsed structures
and o Jarge number of calls for emergency medical aid, all of whic mey oecur
simultancously during a seismic event The water district has aumerots water-pumping
systems used tor fire suppression water delivery, as well os wates storage tanks providing
water svstem pressure. Most of the pumping sy stlems are dependent on clectrical power
for operation. Such electrical power may oot b asilable duning o setsmic event Water
sorage tinks used for storage of required fire suppression water may also collapse in
wuch an event forcine the addinonal need W tranapart water vis additinal pieces of fire
apparamus which will oinoe a significant resteamt on the ab by of the Dhstnet 1o provide
the required emergency services '

20-0203 G 35 of 40



Summary:

Focal geographic and ceological features and processes exist within the boundarics of the
Districts that may hamper the ability of the Garden Valley Lire Pre tection Distriet o
pertorm s sworn duties Tire tollowing an carthquake has the potential of causing
ereater loss ol e and damagze than the carthguahe itselt )

Topographical.

Fhe Districtis primanily composed of areas that are considered by the State to he high
tire hazard severinn zones. Much ol the hill is focated within foothill terram. covered with
Aighly combustible seectation. including the presence of many coniterons forested areds
The elevation within the District ranges from SO0 feet to over 2300 feet at the highest
puint. Slope within the Distriet ranges from 0t 90 degrees. The structures within the
arcas of the Toothills terrain have very limited Tire aceess. dae o narrow roadway s with
steep zrades and poor road surfaee condivons. The presences of many existing structures
within the high tire severity zone areas provides toravers high potential ot a structure
fre spreading e asildland or forest fire condition as well as the potential tor a
wildland or forest fire spreading 1o structares

Summary:

The alignment ol cany ons valley s, and slopes mto mhabited arcas. combined with the
variable nature of the rerraing vield potential tor increased tire risk. Most structures. both
restdential and commercial, are in orare sarrounded by areas that contaim sierilicant
criss, brushy mined oah woodland, and mixed conirer fuel load Due o droucht
cenditions, beetle intestations, and Lack of vezetation management, much ol the area is
populated with cither dead or dyving reess contrbuting to extremie tire dareer.,

Conclusion

Cocal chmaties ceocraphicsand topocraphic conditions described above mcrease the
frequency L irtensityand size o fres ivelving butldings in the Fire Distnet. Further,
these conditons impact potential damage to stractures trom an carthyguahe and
stibsequent fires Pheretore, itis reasonably neeessars that the Caditornia Five Code be
moditied o miigate the errects o the above condivons: Calitornig Health & Satets Code
Section FTOSKR 7 requires that moditications to the Lire Code he expressly marked and
rdentitied as towhieh cach findimz reters toadiech Code moditication: The atached
Appendin A provides this commection

20-0203 G 36 of 40



wd

INTRODUCED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the Garden Valiey
Fire Protection District on October 220 2019

PASSED AND ADOPTED w u regular meziing of the Board of Directors of the
Gurden Yalley Fire Protection District on Oetober 2299 2049 by the following roll call

VL
AYES: «-k
NOES: (_17
ABSENT |
ABSTAIN: q>
ATTEST:

.

Lisa Howard, Doard Secretary

By:

Lot [Tt —
o Hawkoins, Pressdeam

20-0203 G 37 of 40



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted | Adopted as Amended Finding
101.1 X |Admin
105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
106.6 X Admin
106.6.1 X Admin
106.7 X Admin
109.4 X Admin
110.4 X Admin
110.4.2 X Admin
1124 X Admin
202 X Admin
302.1 X Admin
307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
509.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
3310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5001.7 X Admin
5601.2 X Admin
5601.2.1 X Admin
5601.2.2 X Admin
5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 G 38 of 40




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section

Adopted

Adopted as Amended

Finding

6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

6113.1 X Admin
6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 4.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 11.2.1.1] X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix B: Table B105.1(1) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix B: Table B105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.5§ 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

101.2 through 101.5

Admin

X
102.6 through 102.8 X Admin
102.10 through 102.12 X Admin
103.1 through 104.1 X Admin
104.3 through 104.4 X Admin
104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin
104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin
104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin
104.11.3 X Admin
105.2.3 X Admin
105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin
105.6.12 X Admin
105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin
105.6.37 X Admin
105.6.39 X Admin
105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin
105.6.48 X Admin
105.6.50 X Admin
106.1 through 106.3 X Admin
107.1 X Admin
108.1 through 109.3 X Admin
110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin
1104.1 X Admin
113.1 X Admin

20-0203 G 39 of 40




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section

Adopted

Adopted as Amended

Finding

303.1 through 303.9

X

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

305.1 through 305.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

306.1 through 306.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

307.1 through 307.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.2 through 308.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.2 Admin

308.3 through 308.4.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical

310.4 through 310.8

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

311.1 through 311.4

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

319.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

319.2

Admin

319.3 through 319.10.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.10 through 403.10.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

405.5 Admin
510.3 Admin
807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1.5 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1103.2 Topographical
Appendix %1%120111 through Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.4

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.6

XX X XX IXIX|IX|XIX[X[X|X|X]|X|X|X|X|X|<|><]|X]|X|x<]|x

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.1 through

X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D104.3 (excluding exception) / izl Tapograp
Appendix D: D105.1 th h
eI roug X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D105.4
Appendix D: D106.1 through N . .
| 1 hical
D106.3 {exeluding exception] X Climatic/Geological/Topographica
Appendix D: D107.1 (excluding:
HE exceptions§ xcluding X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 G 40 of 40






