
RESOLUTION NO. XXX-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 016-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is 
updated by the State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are 
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 
1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulations to the 
local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her 
authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of 
the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a 
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection 
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on November 14, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Georgetown Fire Protection 
District adopted Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with 
amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical 
conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado 
ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Georgetown Fire Protection District and delegates enforcement 
of the ordinance to the Georgetown Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections: 

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4 through 
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1. 507.5.1, 
509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 
907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 
5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 through 6112.3, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 
NFPA 13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 
7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table B105.1 (1), Appendix B: 
Table Bl05.2, Appendix Dl03.l through Dl03.3, Appendix Dl03.5 Section 1, Appendix Dl03.6.l , 
Appendix Dl03.6.2, Appendix Dl04.4.  

  20-0203 H Page 1 of 41



Resolution No. XXX-2020 
Page 2 of 2 

 
 
 
The Georgetown Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its 
entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2018 edition 
not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

 
105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403.4, 
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12, 
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808, 
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, 
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception), D107.1 
(Exceptions  1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, 
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M. 

 
Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 California 
Fire Code. 

 
 
 
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said 
Board, held the _____ day of _____________________, 20__, by the following vote of said Board: 
 
 Ayes: 
Attest: Noes: 
Kim Dawson Absent: 
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors  
 
By: _____________________________________ _____________________________________ 
 Deputy Clerk Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Board of Supervisors 
 

  20-0203 H Page 2 of 41



• 

GEORGtTOvnl FIRE DISTRICT 

0IIIce lhone: 131333~1l1 
Facsimile: m 3334020 
www.qi1orqetownfirt!~£partmenlcom 

IX«mbtr II, 2019 

Don A$hlOu. Chief Aoimiru5ltal;v<: OffIOO" 
El Dorado County Baud of Supcrvuon 
no F.ir I..anc 
Pl..:erville, CA 9S667 

lest allice lex lID 
,213 II.1in lire. 

c.W~<1CWII. caJi1crnia 111341410 

s"bje-o:t' RHOIulioo RlIlif)in& OrdlDJllct No. 201941 1 of 1M ~IO"'D fl.t J'ro(Kno.. Oiltrict, 
wllich ,doplS the 2019 California Fir, Cod, ...;t11 amend....,ntl relattd 10 IoeaI dlmatic. 

ltI'oaraphk Ind topograpllk condition .. 

Dear Mr. MIlton: 
-

The Georgetown fire Procechon Di SUlCt (GOO) w ~\leS".n, tile 80Ird of Supct""IIOI'I (80S) tUllY ib 
QrdiJ\lJ\<c No. 20 111-01, winch adopts !be 2019 Clliforrua Fire Code as omendod d\Ie 10 tpeC.fic local cJimMle, 
teogaphK: lind 10p0gruphic conditions. C.l ifornia Hnlt" IIld S.fd y Code Section 13&69,' reqUII'e the 
Iqlislauv<: body orlbe city or county where the ordinanct "", II apply 10 r.ufy, modify or deny the ~«I 
ordinance. The 80S must ,1110 dele8o'ic en forcement of the ord .... nce 10 ei!hcr !he Fire DiJlOCI (or lU 
~~vc) or the Chief Bllildin& Official 

Tberefon:,""" request tbeCO\lllIy Board ofSupnvilOfS rltify OrdiI\allU No. 2019-01 with Nllendinmu 10 the 
20] \I C.lifornia Fire Cock, and dol e:gMC thc: ~fQlccmcnl of!Nn Onlinance 10 the Ge(lr'Je"' '''''' F~ l'roIcc:tion 
Distnct ctuef. A propoIC'd 80S ~llIuQfl ill mclo3ed for yow reY1cW ond II!II: on thillOpic: . 

Tbis rcsoIvtion Iws no di_1 {i_I impkl to the eo.,.,ty. 

Suoccn:ly, 

~-< <ZL/ ?t _ _ _ _ 
Glenn W Brown 
Fin:OMef 

I Ge ...... B Ford'! I 1OO o.w. Clr<:bnonoo No.. lO lt-O i 
1. a... ....... F,"PI,*"IIOG 0....;.0 r .... off ... ~ No.1019.Oo1 
l . DftIt EI Dondo c-y 80S R-oIw_ 

  20-0203 H Page 3 of 41



Attachment No. 1 

Georgetown Fire Protection District 

Ordinance No. 2019-01 

  20-0203 H Page 4 of 41



GEORGfTOWN FIRE pRon:CTlOI'ro' DI STRICT 

ORDJ .... Al'.CE NO, 2019.01 

BE IT ORDAlNI::D BY Til[: BOARD Of DI RECTO RS OF GlOKGFTO WN FIRE 

PROT ECTION DlSTRJCT AS FOLLOWS. 

A"- otd.nonce fill GEOrJe1own Fire PtoI~hOfl [)iftnc, ({jED) 8doptulc tho 2019 Editiool ~ Iho Col*",,-

1ft CO«, iI'OO'lH:Ulm, !hI 2(l l llldkion of the {..tor_",-,,- Fin C.,., r-fJ ..... '" IIId pcmlfll!he .~!Il& 

of Uc """ propm)I tom n~ and eq,~ hIarda ..uin& fiom Iho -.. ""'""ilII MOl _ 01 ..... 

JIIbsIanea. rnMerials """ okvicts, IIId l'roaI con,tidol. hIlIroIow 10 Iii, or popel1) ill .... Ott I oq 01 bullcIorcI 
ond pmoIlJft In Oro, provIdmc for 1ht '-ofpmllitl ond coIlfa;o. fIIl_ .,ro.. kepcIoI~ 00 d!ow :e No, 

2016-0 I orcoo oncI all oilier ordiMnas .... ports of IIIr otdi....ca ill e>cdlitl "'cw1dL 

SeeIIGa I D'PlIIoG S or fACTS 

SecGan 1 AUOrrIOJ\' Of CODE" mt EXC LL'SIO,"-S 

~ 1 LOCA1. AMtl'iDMlm 

SeeriM 4 COl'ifl.lCT 

s..:o. $: S£YfBAlJUTY 

Seaoon 6, UfECIlvr; pm 6/'101) n l",lCATlON 

SECTION I : fiNDINGS Of fACTS 

QEO .... -w. tlwI&oo II""~) 10 the CoIf{ohoi" Fin:C<l<k. 201 9 E.<!;tM., ~ 10 ~A 

of SIjitty Codr S«noou IJI6' 7. 119M' and 1/t14/ J dUfln,lhil code ~..,xea. Such ....... _ 

.. H) hKIuH of IoceI ~h''''hC. poIo&iuIl aIlO'Of lopo&rIfIIIlGal DOIloIIiticns. GEO ... ~, ~ ... 

s.mo.. I~I J ~!hI CuII/Jo '" HtoIJJr of S#/f1J' CoM, ,he findIngs of r- rNCIw: 10 1lIesIr ocn:tjla. by 

knoIlOUon 2019-01 ofOEO daHd Ocll'lber 10. 2(119 

sEeno, .... 1: At)OrTION Of COI)& WITII EXCLUSIQNS 

CEO odopls the 20 lQ c.''''!1<»'~''' F"., C<>do. Tillt U. " ... P, " 111 ftllmy. ,nclOJdirll " ..... ,odio:e.. 

Ino:utpon"", \hose !le<110IIJ of 1110 /"' __ 1ft C<>do, 201' echhOfl _ odoped by !he -. wrllo tho 

,.elusions 1i5oe<i b<:low 

Onl,nan« 2019,01 

  20-0203 H Page 5 of 41



-

E.cl_. IOS.6.17·IOH.l9. IOHJ9. )()I I ., )09, ) 11.5, J 11.6. 111, 4(J] I, 401 2. I-'lOJ ,2', 4(l)1. 

(()U • .01-6. 40),7, 4(JU (aiopcu" <I(IU '-'IOJ.I. 1.1).. .oj 9, 4001 10.l, ;4(Jl.I01. 403.11. 401.12. <104. l.-ot 4, 

4(lS.l-40U. 4OS . ..oS9. 406. IOS·101 (lOOpIi .. 807..5.1 ~ lOt, 9004.1 ,I, I 10J, I 101.1, I IOU·' 10M. IIOl.9 

(..t.apIin& 1103.9. I), IIO} 10. 110'-1106, CMpI ... 2$. ChajII ... 26, tho ~ ..",. .. 01 (101.2 (Ex<:q)tionl. 

0106.' (~pIIO<Ol. DJ07.1 (&.«peoon). Append .. A. "'ppo"chx E. Appondix F, A~ix 0, A~nd;. J. 

App<1OIlilc K. Appo!>d,. L. App ... ,n. M 

SEcno,,,, J: LOCAL MUNI)Mt:NTS 

'"'" IQIk>win& Sect;"",.", Ixret>y om<ndoJ or added 

Chpter I 

sn:tjOl III ScoDt ud Gum! Ih'l!lliamuu 

101.1 Tilk shall be am ..... od ."1011, ... ,,, ,jtld_ r;(j~bo {GEeI 

Sn-tIon 1115 Ft.-ie! 

I O~,!!,27 LPG-pf oha.Il be amended II folio ... AdellO the.~ AI or ..... ...., HIOO feet of 

.""'lIion, • permi, it n(IC f8j ........ for ond,~odual oontaoncn with. !ls.pn.;., w.cc c:ap.;ity or ... 

or mul"pk _ncr .y>lenlS "",-'''II ........... Q\IIIII'11 noI uC«d .... 12S pliOI'd servin& 

OCC"f*'Cics in 0.00., ".j 

SUliR' lOt Em 
'ot .• r,,.!t. MIl !lr!c ..... "'mllo' fsn shall be odded. follows A ."1WoJ,, c{ fou 
~~ by /M dfsIrlCf '-rd uf d;rr':'orl p ~ nv,"w. ~/(WU -' /'- iuwonc. of pm .. ;" by 

IIw dutrk,.,ay be f-td I" lire _ aRT>t1W dUfT/ct jtuclrcd..l. (IIM,h .. ¥'1 CoM HPJ1) 

IOU, ! CM' RfSm·,rr Em shall be .dded u follows: Fi" I~ fifo l1l<I)' M c~ I" "">' 

,.-- jinfI, ... ".... ... IM '" /njJj""" rhat '/rol<gh rvglig.""". vloiii//QIo of llof /"",. '" IV " .... 1111 af 
",,,1 ... ,,,,01. U: ~lbI. for ,hi CQKI' of 1M d"'ITJCj (t, ~~ IO'/w _ of 1M '''''Idt .... iI 

d/.JITk, ~ -:rc-,. o.jU ,,, cowr'/w COl' of"",,'U!Ii« whJclo'M tIIIlrieI J""U"/du '" 'Iw ...... 

of • .(."..-1"1( ""Y ~pallO#rfOr ,.,hieh /Ire fit II <1tax..J (11-""" .Wfoty C,,* 1)916). .",. fou"..1 

"'" .NHd lilt «twa{ COl/ of '''f'P'"U<irw 'M jfn aIId/", r~, ... 10 IIw ICf.M IJ( 1M 1",,/dt1W 

liMp Adm.,htn!"« CIIII! shall be added .. foll<>",s: "'/w" 0. lUi '" ilOSp«r1olO II ~1wdoII~-.J 

llof ~I'" !"./S m ~ I" ,Iw 'liIujflcti"" ofrlw "1II1tority ~ jwUJicriofl (illU). l/w AHJ 

""'Y b,1I ,/w """'_for flCI...,,[ rt_ Ipml /TaW/,OW I" """"... dot um,IUPf"'iotI local,,,.. flItd 

IhI ,,_ IPfIOl allhI ,atflfUptCllon I • ... wdl ....... ~ ........ 

Ord,~201901 f'aae 1 of 16 

  20-0203 H Page 6 of 41



Se!:ti<>. I !!II lIoud of ApJ!!!L, 

!i«!io. !!!II.4 Mp .. ! t'ry<fl! " m odd ·nmt~n.! shall be oddrd as follow1' A",. pt .. ,,,, (H' elf"'y """" 

h,di,wI ,My ........ ' It. tJdvy,ely <ljfoeltd by <PI ",tkr. Melj;"". '" tkttn.';""U"" ......u by 1M fitV cock 

ojficioJ IItrot.gII II "'.ill~" /tOIlet! "*II)' DppeoJ l/oil ",lIlIg wU/oi" I j CIII~ttdar d<IyJ II/'M poJ,,,,,,,t "" 

IN ft(Jr/«. All l..clt opptllissltllJllt. filtd I" .... "i"8' .... ir!r ,''' Secwary II{IN Go> .. ",lrtg 1kxud for 
IN diStrict, A liJoHly "P/XoJ sltllJlslay fimM' actio>o by 1M fi ... eodt IIffidoJ omtili/w ""'" ... Is 

MI •• ", illed by ,It< A~ Board (B "",11-.11" S«IIM 109.1, ""ku IN U ..... pous "" i"""",,,,,' ~ 
(H' lifo wfery hownJ 10 "',,,,""" II{ tJv ""biil: TIll: ~ cod# ojJIcu" shall WJlify tIw appelu,1ll by 

etrlifi.d trWI/ 0{ ,''' dd, and 1,_ of .""It lttari"8'. TM M <I1';"8' shall ~ ICIwdtl/td '0 taU pJan .., 

-.. Ih.:vIlO CIII,"""" dap from 1M d<>U slwowt <HI 1M et!rtifini "",Ii TIll: DpfHIi<mt sh.:./I ~ 1M 

righlla appear I" INTI"" (H' by IIpIll ... ,Ite /warit/K and prce,,' ",aI, writ/'If <Utdior p/>cHagrapltie 

rNk""e 10 1M AppN/ Board, 

Sullo, 110 VIolt1k>B I 

I 10,4 Vlola\!o' Ptul!in shall be amm<!ed 0$ f~low.: Perwn. who IIh!lI ~iol~ • provision of this 

code or shall fail 10 comply with any of the requ"emenu thereof or who ~""'I ere«. i ...... II. aller. 

repair or do wuk In violauon of!he approved COMlnICIion d()C\lmenl$ or direeli ... of the fi~ code 

om t;.I, or of • pnrni\ Of «rt;nt&te used under provi.io .... of thi. code, shall be iIIil')' of. 

",rnkm.ana or Ilf/Taclio'l. ... 1M djscl'tllM of 1M prl»«lIling allomtyor og'''''Y, puni<IJable by • 

fine no! ex<:ecd ing J 100.00 for a/iFJI vioJalio".- 1, Aft ... _ ,xce.ding UOO.OO fora leco..J vioU>tlon 

of tIw """. prrYI'l.!io>o willtlll OM,....-, J Aft ... "'" Uct!nii"f, J /000.00 for .<>clt addi,lonal V,%tIOfO 

ofillt ...... ?ClYiriol! "",it," <>M year. or by impri"""","n! IlOl exceed;n. 180 ""Y>, or boIh IlUCh r. ... 
and ;mprioonment Eaooh d.y thll • vio"tion oontinues .ncr due notice Iw been served shall be 

deemed •• epatate ,,/Tense. (H.a/ilt of Safoty Cock Soc'ioN I JUj and 17995). 

110,4.2 QI!IIo • • shall be added IS folio ... : n. Fin Cltitf "" Itisllwr tbdy alllJoiJ,i:ni 

rqrt~'IfI"'lw. may w ... cl'Q//oou for infr<>ctiotv or misdemt<JltOf' ..toIQ/iOItJ afllt/.! «>th fJ'UJ""'" 10 

Slcfiooo 11871 af,IIt H,IIiI~ of Sof'", C",* oftlw SICII. ofCoJ/fonr;a .:.td Cltapte. 5c (com"" ..,,,,, 

wir!r S«IIM 8JJ6) afTill. 3 ajParll oflho P.1tal C"'* oflltt Sl .... II{Califomia 

Sn:liog 112 Stnn Wgrk Otdt r 

IU,i . fai lure I .. Co mply shall be ammded IS follows: Any per$OI1 w\>o .ho)1 COOIt inue any W""' 

ofte-t ha¥;nit been >ero'ed with. Slop'work order. ueept S\ICII work IS !hat po""n i. d;n>e!ed to 

prrform to remove a violat ion or unsafe conditi"". 'hall be P1".isllabi. by aft ... 0/' impruo"",utl .,.. 

boilt as M.cribtd itt SocI;OIt 1/0,4 (lI,oJ,h .. Saltty Codt Steti"", Hid a..J l799j! 

Ordinance 20190) 

  20-0203 H Page 7 of 41



-
03"I~r 2 

SWiot 2112 Gural Drn.i!;"" 

A<Id .... f,nil;"" for C. mpOn • SItdJI "'eaIIQ {tre "'Ilk"" ... a for ro<,j,'''X. PCTumDJ "",",,1Ir, liglrtiltg, 

(I' ou,Itt,u, "....".,... n.;, ".c:IlMk. jlru Ct>"I(.I,,", ",1./tI" _door {"."Iuc", and '''''/OKd ./tNU 

-.,itir j1IIU or ""1",_-,. . • _1 1H1"Ilj.lliu. Ilq~"'. or lOloJ /wI., ""..,uN. burl>« ... pU., hrazINI. or 

I~ Itt.ot;.,g thvi«, >o>JUc1r _ MUd I>fIlflik cf '""Y " • ...:,"'"", -",,/. 110M, fW <My Ilvme 

~ ...... ",,,,,mod,,,, .. ",,/tid. 

Add defi nillon for Db! rkl • SItDlI"WM lIN dutrlct IlItd all Of"" __ .. lilt/;, .Itt UltJrlor botwi.1u 

""'rwi ""'" or Jot,~" ... alJIIJIt6i 

Add d~n;non for Ilrlvt"'u . ShaJI ..- Q Wimc~l" <JCNJIIU I~ ... -c:w IIIooot """ btoilJil!tc •. 

",/lit "" ....".. ,Ita" tltru "",,111"8. ",,'IS "" ".IngI. parctl. arJ...,....-bfr 0{ ~ /NUd,'C, 

Add deDnilion for ')'!lI;vc Body - SItaII _ ,''' &.II of I» ." ... cf UrI ()Q1rla. 

Add definiTion fa" fin: qid . SItdJI _ .M au.! ~"'I.., Fh Off"'" .. ,"" Fin 

dtpon_fIIIdiJ,rid n M10g .Iw j ... iMliNIi;M '" "d!JY _IIaUN npnntflQl"., 

Add definition for T n ;RS<! e rn .. " I\o"," ",«t • Shall _ ,,""'*" pel¥) •• 1 WUtJIy. HeWIIy 

r-d or ",Iwr pwlONWi ,..,., "'" trdiMJ ... "'" P"'P" ~ 10 all PftJIIl.ft- "NIft fII' (11_ 
pkp c(poJ;iic _~ /If an onkrl, -.I CDht flultlolo lit 1M,...,. fI/ .. ''''l!0cy 

Ch. p, • • 3 

Stttiol Wi !)d\!ltloll 

.191.1 1)0[0. 11.."" shoJI be ornendN .. fullOW'! Added c""",fl ... "din;'oon, • IIhoWl\ II>c!n In 

ChoplCl' 2. 

&sIlo' Jt1 Opq 8u.!u. Kttm!io"t fjm.l!!sI O,ldw r nm!sm 

Jtt u C..pOB BaIrk1Iot. JNl! be 8ddcd. follow>: 

Jt1d.4.! h 1# ..JtzwfoI '" ""Y p""- 10 1iPf, -u.Q;~. ~ lUe ,,~.., Itp<>'I .". Mar ""y }ww~. 

rowud bU. ~fil bwJ. .". ftwut_""r-cd Iatd tb;;ng lite I'-,w"," 1ninri"K p<'III;" ~ 

,.r-J«I by ,/w o..."/(W of"'- o..r-r-"" of F..-e,,.,, DIfIi Fin hoiff/iO#o. 11M CAL FIRE fmiJ 

C/tItf. .". "- AHJ 

~, C_rdaI <'OOIi1"lf <,,-,1>1;"" ",;/1, approN/ ofllM AHJ 

JO'M.i,l Wlwll row.." ~ u{/qwft( ,,1horIId ~ _,Jaw!W for arry perron 10 light. "",,,.Will, or "" 

" "_PI'''' ..".,.. ""Y br...}'~r-cd I....J. grau..:(}Wt"M fund. .". fi,.·ut-roV<T;J kwI M,Jeu tIw 

foil_,"8 "'''';'''~''' "''1~h_Jt/1 .... mtRpIkJ ..,Im 
39' .•. 4, 2 I.! n. ...... ~ "i/}"" j lUI of ,'''' p<rlpll~ry of''''' Mmpfir< " "'~ 0( aJJ f/" ... Mabk 

"""D"ID/ <JMI ~'<IIiato 

Ordina""" 20! 9.01 P ..... ofI6 

  20-0203 H Page 8 of 41



301.4." .2 Ib! 0Iw ,~ .... ~I>k ,"'-I with" Irofldie of as kaJr 11 iN:1oa iJ rNdy for kU at IN 

1-.JJt>U arev tI{ IN CilIIIpf_ 

jQ7 1 U lsi C-,{ITU ./tall be II"'U"/ /0 .. I foot by J fOOl <lI'C<L ~nlcu I" "" appro"'" _>ifi>c,!Jnd 
cooIci<lg «OIU." firc 'uw 
J97.4.U ( eI) Wri""~ f'CNIIW_ of lit, 1-'-"", ",,,,I be obI .. I"'" prj." '" II,. igrtil/on of 1M 

COItI/II'''"c ottd sIroIl be .... • ilc 

Chpltr S 

ml- S!J fiN: Ap!I!!nl,. Att!!S Roads 

mol. 1 DjMnW., shall be amended a follows """ 'pP.>nIllI> IICCeII ro.ds Ihlll hne on 

""""tn.o:lCd w;ctdI ofnGII Ic$s !han 21) feel. UClusift 01 shouldon. 4I_,.,d frOMfou of c,.,b If> 

p:c of C'IIri, ac:cp: for ~ seeo.rity pleI in 1CCORIanc. willi SectIOn 5(JU. IIld UnobsllllC,t<! 

vatlcaI <1evwIce of IlOIIts1Ihin " forI. AU dr~ Itt dttr diltrier sltall _ b.ltu littIn 11 fm ..... 
SJ.lS Ond !':!1b Jha,ll be_a rot ....... Dead-mclfire 1IppOIfal .. lItlCoss.....". """~ 

In aces of ISO fOd In Iencth ....u be .,..,..Ided widI an appro",,., area for 1umi"8 ~ fire ........ 
m~6 Bridc""d EMI!!! S. rJam wll be _ as follows WIMft lbOd", or ... _10_ 

SIriia ;. part of I rn IpponIl,IJ _ ....... Iho bnd,. ohaIl be cor-..:lod and m.in";nec! In 

.ocordan<_ willi ~t:wT_ E1 DroraJoC.-." TTfJftJPO"at/ .... {)foil"'" .kIp SllJItdcwd." AppMdU 

D oflN ctt ___ CoJifonUa "" Code. _""_ is -.. -.JII'1<"fIw Bridaa and elnartd~" 

shall be dnlanod for • Ii ... toed ",,1Ii~ta"IIlO~!he ImpoK<l ..... otflre .ppat'lI .... Vdtlc:~ IoIId 

limits shill be pIIIIIeII • bod! tnnnc .. 10 bndp when req .. mI "" .. Fire eo.to OIYlc • . Where 

.1o~JICII .urflCCl dni&nod for ~ ¥d\oek _ ""' ~ 10 -r1US .. hIdt .,e not dnliJ*! 

(or JlXh ... "PP"""" btnion, 1pprO¥tG .. .,... or boIh ...... be installed Md maintained ",hom 

required by \lie Ii .. oodo otrlCio.l 

SlM,l No flrkl" I. tltt .... n ..... , be IddaI u fol lows 1io,--.JtaIl6l<lp. ptri., ." 1 __ 

11.-1,"1 .. "" wMclc, ... IteIW. _...Jed ." _fuo:kd, UICtpI "'M~ ~ '" aw»d a>Itjl>et ... u/I 

III/rv traJlk. <r lit tnorpIkMcc w/lh IN dirrclIQIII of.,. Fh C/dt:f. .". IIbII- JtJ,. _1ttY1Ud 

~nnJ"""", PcacII O/fbr ." of!kod tro/foc ~ tMwIot"".,. .,. ..... tJf 1lIIY Npway. III ....,. 

cwr~, ." III UII)' II.CI>I;"" ho " pwNlc/y ." pt1wJU1y t)IIMttbJ ." opwtI6~ off- ptJtibtc jirilil)'. 

lk.ilf'lOiN '" "fin ~ b)' lite dWrleI wll~J"'isdkt;o" .,...,. I1w "'"" III wIIic~ IIv place iJ Ioa.eti 

TMlksiflllOll<", sJooll Itt i",bcuiod (/) by" 11K" palIN i-.&i~/y"djawtl ~ aNI .... 1hI~ fi'u-. ..... 
Ik.ili""'''/ pion cI_ly Ifllll/llll" /.tIIU' _ /.t •• ""'" D#W IIIC~ ill NitlItt Iltaillv pIDn is ajh bw, 

(1) by (»dU"/"Il'" poilll;", 1M pi,," ho rrd aNI. III ~1'<Ig rolqr, _ti<lg I1w pIoa with 1M 

OrdInance 2fl1901 PageSofl6 

  20-0203 H Page 9 of 41



.....w FIRE UN£ ,.,Ju,,11 ~ (/~ yQlbI~rr- a wlrl"k "" (J) bya.-cd c .... b "" <Wi pai'" "" 

1M +c(11w ~ "P""..4ric~ II ck<X1y-uJ,/w -."cnh "FIRE L4N£" 

!!QJ.i.,J /'Ii' t'.I rkju I. [ ro.1 of UnlrulllolWl be odcIed as followl: No pm"" .Mll '1Op. P<ri. "" 
1_ U~"'Il any ..,Iotd~ ",II/ti .. I' Jftl of aJW /wdrant ~pI a.J /oJlmoo., (aJ Ifllv wllkl~ II 

,.,~-.J IIy a IwouH drf_ ",110 II ""ted /ft IIw fr<w Hal ",.,; who """ /",_dID/.ly _ ,,,,,II 

.....w.rlf lit CGI. c(....:u.I/)>. 11» II tIN o;M;cK Is ""',...!", optralM 1Iy" fIro tkpan ..... a"'; II <kar/y 

_bJ ... "JW -".., ... '" ..,Ir(d. 
$OJ."" ert La'd Hand R. Road Widl' ,hall be added. foil ....... , Fh 1mtu.1taIi H baud "" 

rood wIdtIo '" '"'I~;,..,d III App«..JiJt D at "",.rttkd byllw diJlTicl 

MB.J fin ApD.OIM' Awy G.ld sh&Il be..tded as foliowL AU _'" tutti __ .-, 

IJalallu ow.. fIro "I'f'<JhJh" aa:"cU ..-b ,/taU ~y wlllt 1M diItft« CON " 1 .d .. _o_ 
Ily tIN fh C'OIM oIfirlo/. 

Stt.jo. W~ 1'[JPlIs Id,,!!lin lkt. 

m.1 6ddm. '''tlll!Ic!ljot UIoJI ha~~ W lint ~,.,. or \hIS ~ amended .. follow. 

Adtiras'.p ...... iMd U""'W' b~,/d,"IP JtalJ .,...,xy .w. ... dLu.-in adJnu sttndanl ... '.¢ 0_ 
by IIw fh ....... (JjfIcid 

SuDo. 59' tin rrolm19. W.!u s.ppllg 

S!!7.}1 Whtt !!!GM'ad .... 1 be ..... _. f .......... 400 r- $hell be amended t(I HOjWI 

5t!,J fin Cotl'" 8 0911 Fn F>-t;JI«I/O'IDftd tJrtItl]1 £.q~"""."lldrIIlifo:alIO'l and ACCW • .. lterd~ 

,did by adtIfnt ".. foIIowt'W' 10 __ Fh .prl~ rlHr6, fIro aI""" ctWroI. paNt.. JaJir 

~/ak ~ IJI'I- ,."M .-off .wlr<:1tu. """ <JIM' fin dtttclion, 1"Pf"'UJ~ "" .iMlJDto 

CDIIITOI ............ 6haJ ... locatwll<ttftH " 'i1ICk fIro rot/troI mow< P 1M buiJtiiltg. :nw fin ~ 
_,1taIi Ioao. .1 .. __ di_ioou c(p... 1m by ...... " fulln .I/tl 'NiI1t" /Old w.wabk trN c(­

ku tNm JJ..-..fut TAt 1'fKIIII,IIoU "" /ocalttl ",~IrI"t. b",/djltg """" OOthitSt wdl <II a ~ 

_"ttl IIy /Jw FIN C,,* Off,clal and ,1oaJ/ N <z«ul/)I. rr- I. u:s.".". A .. aurb 4CcoI door 

",lilt" c'- -'*11 bJ'Ml "'1 "- J] 1~1tu IJItd " /wJt/lt d ItII IMIt lJ(J (1ICha JorJI ". prowdnl 

"" """at iIIl<t IIw """'" A dwabl.,/zoo I/tal/IN qfJIud "'"" aur"" o{'tlw door...w. 1M..".",... 

"FIRE CONTROL ROOM I" I~"," .o)t ku I""" 4 IIfC/tu hi Iw,gltl A ~ """ ..-pI"..;.., ",it" 

Stelion roo .1Ia/1 N I ... ,allu QOt IIw utuior ,1ft oflMIh COItIPOI_ door..-u.g n._ 
"' .... , "" capo/JI. 01' "",1 .. m""'R a ",/"1",,,,,, I~,.."., .... <J( 10 a.vus f"tilw..ivil. A (/ ...... 0:. 0{' 

I] 'lfClw. ,1taI11J.I P"f1"Itkd rr- I. fIN ",~w ~ ". ...,. ~ -lis.. T1tb...- C<IOI "" 

sltand "'Ith OIMr bWjld'ltg wililla "" /h prOI«1_ oq"''''''''' t¥ /$ ca.patlhl~ A" _0_ 

OnIinance 20]9.01 Pete6ofl6 

 20-0203 H Page 10 of 41



-
• 

C<IbUw. Of _ JIttJII k proWdW 10 ,"", ,tt:on/ pi"", of ~ fin spri/tkl., Jysl~"', PiM, f""c 

proIW_ ~...".."'. DNI .11. pi"", TItU,....... sltoJl _ k IfUd fa, ""JI <lfIM, 1Iurag<! 

a..pler ' 
Su!!Q, !OJ n<t SpnOltn 

!OJ.l ~"B Mtg.jrrcl shall be arnenduI as folio ..... : An approved autorn'Ut Iprinkler system I/oall 

t.. "'I~ftd __ IN III _ In.ddutp _ 1ITWtIIn. J600 MIlIaN fwr or [lNQI<T .... /wN 

MItJ~Nar,~wtlltUo fIwJ~'" dl:><:ribed In Sections 903.2. 1 1hrou&h 90).2.12. 

[ ... ~pticNl : A&ricuInnI bUlldinp noIlnIer. ~iaI...., pennI! used furcomrncrci.1 purposes. 

m ,b Wkrt 8!9.joo! shall be.ddcd .. folknn ~ of uUfi"lt 1MiJd11fg'~' dIeM J.fJoo 
.,--jHI /"aUt ... w'/duIgJ J,600 ~ fw< or ~." "'Iwr ..... __ .-f_ 11) ~"'''lt 

jIou ...... "'. &..ildilC ... Ntvclwn a ; .......... rJ by "" addintM of _ dtQn dt;riy ","III (J~ 

or 1,000 1lf"tF<P-.. Irld __ .. IrM . .rd booM"" Of >InIt:tIIn IIttJII bt .ad. IO~ 10 Stell"" 

"" !!Q3.l. b W~~" BN.jml shall be oddcd .. follo .... _ ~ of u""" b..ildl~ Iu. Ib J,600 

sqllOn fo. f fl. aUling Intlldllfgs j , 6()() MIlIaN JHI or Ins. odou ... Ill. _ r-oJc-uly ~11,,"If 

Mm/S, eutd ~twd bwi/J,"fi' _ wwkr 1f1«/QI ..,.. "'""'It fa ~od ~. ,."",.. dw 

f/«Y -., ofllM ""tiding "" Sfn.ctlln tJ illCTfOUd "'" ,,,,,. ~ ~ _ UOQ.aq-..jiNr 

byo .. addu_oj ___ ,,,-dUry~ .. (JfJ'J') or I,OOO.,-../«t. .,.."._ "lui. .0INr ""1Id"w 
or~JIoaII b<t ",ado I<> ~ IflSectw.. 90J 1 

!!O3,1, ] Grp'p t\ sholl be __ IS fbllow. for A IVOIIpI A-lll1rou&/1 " .. 90).2 1 I ( I )The ~ 

.... no.,..!. 3,6()()~jHI, 

9Q3,1.J Got.R); shall be MIendcd .. fOllo",' 9OU.J (I) 'J'lwou&IIoul1ltl Group E A",_ FUIC'" 

than 1,600 """",~jHf In aru 

\lilJ.4 Gnt.p t"· l shall be ..... ndecI u foliaWI" 903.2,' GtOIIp f . 9OJ.2,' (1) A G"""" P fire""" 

cxc~1,600~fwf. 

m .l.7 Gro.p M .""ll be lmended U 10110 ... · 9OJ.2' Group 8 and M. 9OJ.2.7 (1) A Group D ond 

hoi f'''' aru n coeds 1,600 $'1'1"" ,tef 

poJ.1.I.l Muvr.c!ym! liMn .haI1 be Idded u folluwt: "'" __ kjIH SprWJ" ~ sltall 

M MI,,{m III all """ "'OIIII/acfWffll ~, QIt(/ IIIlIIti-folfl l/y _lIf«twtJ Ito-a 1>rtNtd«i "" ..... 

"" 11 __ ..-1 rwt:>-fi-I/v.JooHIIi"1: TIltl<Julg>l IIi>d 1"""II/l1/o1f o'J..c/uyslelfU JItaJI h.t "" ~ 

willo LQJI{<>mkt CBdt of 1I~~~I(J(i""', rill. lJ, fdOO 

uup';""t: 

I 1f .. ".jat:fWcd .......... 1«"lUd .. {,/tm "" U;";1(g 1IMh,le ........ ,--4 ~"fi .... 111< 

Culi{onoll> 11".1,1< -' sq./y CBdt, l)fvIJIOI1 IJ. Pon 2. J .... 2.3 

0nI1IWI« 2019.01 Page 7 of 16 

 20-0203 H Page 11 of 41



• 

1 M,,,,.,,,u lwImu ,1taJ do I>OI.ICUd I.]()() "1_' fur irI Jiu OIIJ UNO <U on 

dC'UJ''''Y <MellIng ""il. QJ defilWd ilf Go>,,,,,,,,,,tf Cod. S«tial 658501. ",Iv" 1M 

aftfllf1{ P"'''''''Y 'Vide""", OIl I~ prop .. ry Is _ fWl~iTed 1rJ ro"'l'ly 'Ni/h CuJ~ 

lU,id_UJ eM ~tioft RJ IJ 1 

J ~hJnd "'-s I/0oI do_ tx«ed JlO"I"""'ftn /".12. 

!OJ.!. ~ Cro.r s_ , shall be ornended as follow,: 903.2.9 G<OUJ) S. 9OJ.l.9 (I ) A Group S tire oteII 

""teeds J,6OQJq~I«I_ 

!!!JJ, I I GfO!P S-2 Eed"e1 r.dt!. ~ r;nUH wll be "",ended as follow", 9O} 2.10 (I) WI\m 

1M r"" ara oflhe enclosed parkins gvqe e><co:ed. ),6006<1_'/'« 

S«dot'" fiR AIa"'ad PslfStjo. S,-,t ••• 

m.l .. wuu Rn!.jml - r;,.. Blildim Of SIA(IIm lot ,_ .. 3m 'gila [ul .haIl be added 

es foJloWI: All "f'Po.«I Jh aI......t.t«licJ#o J)'S ....... • 1ttJJ1 lie i1lJlai1.J 110 Ill' hiM",. INUit ~ floor 

__ ku /Jut J,600", ___ f«', 
&uptjt>tu: 

I Oooo-..ttI "'-fa-II., tJo.-dl"'6> (JI:.J Ocntpw.clu.-l 01'-' oc."'1"'''''iu di>u/fltd 

<If 'U"), 

1. Agri<.'WrwuI b .. ild/",. _ w.Mr ~lQI IOU PC""" -vr _ ued fix C!t)mm~ 
fJtI1IOM6 (~~. rftJlb _a.focd ~ -"'or .,,-:101 ~.) 

J BIIIIdf"P willo ,,11 _ _ ,_ ""'" jot) ~ jHI ""'I)' k u"'PI . ... M''''''1owJ 

by II. Fin CINq. or /Irbn- dwIy "",Ioanud 'fprun1lal'''' bdud "" b"lIdillg 

_ .... _ •• taI -' J-wu. 1<rIM""" ~ typt. o.td dl$t-. ,., 

,.,..1.11 Silly at '"lal!., B,!HI" ...... n be odded .. foI'-': t.. «<u,l.., ""1IdI>op W/11too.i "" 

~ _oc ~ 1yIH ... ""- m... _ tN _1'-1Ir dtwUl"ll .... Iu, "flNC..JlwoJ 

""'ldv., _ --"1{IfI<'k>i "" !'"Mil", !OO .... ,..,b/ ~ ""IWIY <> fIN __ tk/1Cf1nto I)'SI­

<Iou _ •• dJt IMd l/w I'- _ of'''' /ltn1Jing '" _on .. uterf(UM'" MOdIfIMI by IIIfDn .hatt 

IhIrty~ .. (.JOH) or 1.(1()()".,-.. /HI .... 1I1r~' II leu socii kild .. '" 4/n11:, ..... Utdl be __ 

I(> <01'('01 " It> $«Il<>oo 901 ..... " ,...,odrwl by .... FIrt Clu({. fW Irb/Jocr dIq_Wi:flI 'qlnM",<>l1wt 

8i.ilJ'''t. willi <>fl"'" _Ius fflIM $/10,.,-., /ftt .qII be G-"t .., ~inH by f'" ru. CII/If 

'" /oun.., J..q ..... /tori:'" ~~. 1NJud ... hodl4l,.. <Oft.f""""bt JrIOluiolJ f1IItII fo<Jtt<'fI, 
1oMf_. ~ 1J1W. f1IItIIJ~,., apMW"U 

207.2., MOIl!qdll wll.,......, .. f<)llowo; ~lIjIn ___ :k. ___ Iysl..u 6JtolJ". ~.td 

J;'«.1y .1rroMgIo UtWJ __ ,,<wed by .. u.L. .. ,_ GO • .: ~ fJft1f1rlt"'? '" _. Jt_ InvWv. 

""lIic/o gIw. -"hi. UtWJ ",SMJ1 .~ <II tJ "",,_Iy <IIkltd.J t.x..,_ All ~tnd btnJd,. 
#ttJJ1 be """"","" 

Oni" .. nce 2(119.0 I Page'of]6 

 20-0203 H Page 12 of 41



I 0.- """ ~J-I/II ~/."P (It-) ~1fJ alld OI~ ~16 cw./IW 
,, "U-I 

1 ~-.J ~~I/JJ •• _ --.. sp«/QI _ /W"'IlIlMdIor _1IHfl for Co ="" 
~. f • • ' ,.,tao/J 1<11.,. fot;>d Hn.k., altdlor JfH"fa/ • .., ... } 

to7J.d InK IlIwd " "gll.ciQ" "'-II blldded IU tulle ... '. 1Jor 1Wl~1"''''''' q;",'aJJ~ ~ 

,.,~ .. of II 1)pt I H<1OII5)o'tu, JItaII roq~I'" II fh akK"';'j>lI .. k, _'1OriooI '}W'" iIO H 

;"./QIJ"'; or f..,,'" ~ ()II,-.. Ia H ""","PCIN 10"" ulJII".ftrf __ t.prlClt. _"" .... ".... 

for lital .. 11di". 

!O7 t,l. I Swtld'a 1'0" ... hooh lhall be Iddtd as r<>llowi I" """"""-" wll/l NFPIl 11. "., 

JK'O ....... ~ .~ppIy (I<'O.,jJ.". a mW ",_ 1 4-Joow flOW" ~iIy --. i~ I<O<Od (')'1"" 

.",.....,1118 '" a ftO...a- COtWillbV .1ttIl1 N ~ '" 0 .. w..- n.J.ow ~ "..".,Ity 

.:xcqodMo. 1Jor u/J'->tCf of ... ' .. ....,.....". /ld<t-. pvw. ,...... .... _ ., UCH<J ..... 

"'q~/"''''''''. qfCllltfontkI FIN CcM CIo<OpIn 11 

Chpltr 11 

SutIo. 119J '.ulua 'td St .. d lty Pes' Sut ... 

URJ. i.lII ... lbtlqt ... 1 be 11, ... _ • rol/o<lo> Ell .... "" ~ ."lIcmf.n<l fIandby power 

1)/_ fIIIIl bllnlttlled .. ~ .. iIlI It. Cahfomo. e..ldint Code. 1hc C.hfomil ElKtric 

Code. Nf1>" 110 _ NF'" 111 1111 ... ~ Of_ u.... /lOW,""; twof-Uydwtlll,. ..... """ 

~. If. OJ _ -.I for, ""'W ~. w/fll"""'" fI<1"'I'". JIo<OU '-- II ,Ittw./". 

........ = •• I:i<Oll,...~J/Q ..... boo'J.:I"., OF ,wtlbyllwfh""""tJ/ftciIIII 8.,,1<W 

h un .-.0""- ' I tI "'_~"""wff'\ rIw"'"......,~ 

CUpl" lJ 

SWIM )ll' "'«m '" tluOd lin 

»19.,1 'rrwjK Id"!lflgOOI wI! k N<kd '" (0I1ow. ,.,." Ie _ oIori.w _0 .......... 

Ii dial ........ JipIlttJlI H ptVVIJ;J_fGCItfh _ , "'0441 ~G4DtV.I,.,..-,_ 

Srt~ W 1 WI ' " SlQpb ttr tlo 'UJ,udot 

)lll, IWhI8ft1, ludsIWl bc-w.dat l"ollo;)o,o,. I'rltr ... , '.w, "IaU""/I,C" 

,Iff, IIv "" ~ _" ~ ,MI'''' h"O"W'" r .. ......,. • ....... _ 7\r 

_ "'_" ...,.pial pW/ _ w, oq""'fh ~" _11"'Ii-=f 

QnI".MCIO 2019.01 ,...901 16 

 20-0203 H Page 13 of 41



Clu plf, 4, 

1m,! Whrt NttI.l"" $hal! be odMd .. folio .... n.. fin eoth tfjriol. ifGW ""'l' uq .. 1n 

dewl,_ ... "'''j .... IocakJ lit .VotJ.~. Higil <MJ Vory-llip. Fin H=-d Mwnt)' z.-. 10 .~booll 

/h protrefioll pI_ n.u ""'" JIwJIl IN ..",.".U: ">' /Iotlt I. /h cado ~/QJ and 1._1torind 

~pt"U''''<Jf;'' jQ, dw IocoI CAL FIRE u..;, CIM[ (1f~ uo tIw sa... 1Wpotu'~it)' AN<> ISRA1) 

prla 10 dw 1«0 ..... of. fotd .... pr dw pn)J«1 by dw c-y c{ El DonJd<> 

490,,1 B99f C''''!!'!IOi<>o BfiI.! r l'mf'ts UJalI k oddf:d .. follows. All _.-..:r ..... lItdodi. 

tIdtJ'lioN. ~iF"4" CIau A roq_ "'* or",-,,",y. AU~ .. ac{1>c "'Ion a.u. A roo[OUW>"hC 

or ,..,.",hly.., .. .. I ....... , ~urg lit .~ c{ J~ cf"" ualt" .. "'." .. w/fhbr...,..". J'd' 

".rlod wm .vcusilaH d>at lit< _ roof H .. CI<Iu A roof ~ or ..... _b(, ...... / ......... 

CIm, B ~ C flu ... ,,,>rk_ InJIUd and ~ ~ WO<1d ,1ta/oI ~ .1tfIwh • ..... _ ..,. .. ocd ... 

" roof co..,.;,., """~,roI for CI.us A tuHlf'hIy 

Ch'l'itr 50 

SWla':5001 Guu.! 

SKI/,7 U.blltty for p.",.,., shall be I<kk<I as falN)w$. A",. rhrt<I:gu or tori ~J.JI',. fro- tJw 

rorrir.<J 1tDnd1u,g. $pili or diM:ulI' if any """""**' _ ...... II.1t<IJl MfUI' ....... dclx.-.....,. 
swclt [lnJaft. j/nfI..,. rorp<>raIlM ""NJlrrg .1IC1t .",/1 fJ[ d~ n. dcl>ll$ roIlref;/JU /1)''''' F/rf 

CIrUf fJ[ It/s/lwr Ny "wJror;:fd rYP'Y"",<Jfi.., {II lit< ........ _ ... lit IIw c .... 0[ .... obI/t.tJI_ 

~CM/t"Qt:I, ~""lmplIM. 

a.,l'Iu 56 

Srstjog *' Gaml 
m q Psrwl! N ... uiml oh.Il be orn...-.:;lod .. ("lIow. I'ennitl sholl be NQUI1W .. set forth in 

Se<tion 10'.6 ..... rquLMcd 'ft a.:cotdance willi ttI'l _lion. ~ uplwlYu ". ..... /1 ..... rtq .. I,~ 

IlwT.JtaI1 H IMwd by IIw Fin CItOt/. ~ ItLolIw •• Iy dWS/ocr/uJ r'p' ... ",,,,I.,.,, mod lit< t:1 ihodt> 

C<HR'II)' SI_iJr' Dtp<r_. WIw ... j!o h(lf b {*'Mit, .... • ~q~lnJ. ,Ioty $11411 '" wwd by lit< F/T. 

CIWf. ~1tuI7wrd.Jy-'-"N.tprU."""IW. """ ,Iw t:1 /)o),-aJo C""III)I&-dif~ 

$1.2.1 !)os.!!U" t!o • .,...1 be odd«! .. foil" ... , 1M ItHJ .11411 114.., lit< a~I"""lly 10 "'I~a/ 

do.-w_ ... ",/(><I '<pdf"" 011 "'(1«1' c{ dw firrwwb P'~H"atIoot. 
:<t!IU,l frltRritl!ry !!C9 .... 'k\. ,holl k 1ddeI:I .. foIk> .... ' n.. AI/J wl/J prof«' all proprul.ry 

Ord,_201901 Page 10 of16 

 20-0203 H Page 14 of 41



-

Ch~plu 51 

Srcljoa V'i Sloon 

5194,2,9,6,1 bog!!!!!" Whrs Abon:Cjroud Tt.y If! Pro'ibtltjl shall be _,0001 .. fuI~: 
SIOAiC ofClw I _ClaM II nammabk liquid. ;., ~ **' ourskle of"b.l1lc1U\&S • prohibiled 

""'us <lpfInJwJ by 1M Fit. ClUj; or IrI.tIItn /hly Illilloalnd "preHn"",,,,,, ww.. pn.itml b, Iitt 

FJ,.. CItJif, or 1Ib/M, dJJy lJwhorl .. " npnmtllJllw. all <rIloM (p1lt<Ifd /DIlk(J) or -.II "...aI/(JIiotq 

fi1' tItt J"""t' .. CIo:IP r. II or I/J jIam",ahle and comb ... llbl. /lqoUdl MDI/ ~ WI! dtoM. 

,.,., ... ,.._ ... HI forth by tJw Call/omiD Fint Ct>dt 77v ,allfonti" FIn C. Jitall also apply 10 

i ... ,alkJliMs otIwr ,"'" _ ... JUc/~ /wI dupttUing ,,,"/ofu ...... ,.. "ba .. "f"'- JI"'"'lI" Is '~Mnd 

SullOl 57" Sml!! Opm.!ot. 
~'!l6,l ,U Los""'" W),ttt Aboyt-Gm.d Till!.!! us fro.!hl1td ohall be 1lIn<'nCIed .. foil""", 

s.o~ 0( Class I and 0- II fl.ammab.., liquido in '''''''",pound .u.s ow.ido of buildings i. 

!'J"Ohibued -'-~ by 1M FIN elM! or ~ d!Jy ,.,,,lrnnzerJ rtpn.c_rm, 1f'1w" 

pnY<Ilrt.J by rlN Frn CIW{ or ItUIIwt dWy~iud ~UlItI"'~. 011 '""'- gr<NrJ 1tJItk(.) or 

_II j ... ,alltJIiMu ",nJv -/f'I .CI .... I. II '" IIIf1<--abtt """ ~tibltt liq~.a. VtoII ~ 

.,illt,w- ''''I_ IMIIU ... HI forrlr by IIw Cdlfornw. fh Cod< 7Jw C~ Fin C'»'1IIaI1 f/bo 

apply 10 Uu/ai/ariOlU Of. ,,- 1JI<If0l'" .dlcl. fwl d/JpMJJtot .,"'_ ....... ~~ ..",... 

uNqkind 

Chpltr58 

Srsljo. Mot ruM •• "" Conuls flVhh 

_.2 LI .. il!liou .. 'I tt..romled IS followl. StOrlg" orn_mable cry<I&enic: f1~ldlln itltit:lNry 

_ """ ~ of build; .... ptOhibilld woigl UU#owJ b)' tIo~ FIA CItKf, or IIbIIwr """y 

~ ~llItw W/w" I't'",im</ ~ 1M F~ Chief. or hls.flw, """ " ",IoQrl.;J 

~~ ,,1/ -""-7 .,.,...<IiIwrJ for 11M ''''''''IP' 0{ fo"'''''QbI~ ",.,. .. i,;jI"klI ,1wII/ rowtply 

>4,Jth drow rftl"~""1U H'forlh by tJv C<JIifantuJ F.,. Codit ~ C<JIf/i>miiJ F/Iy Codtt Jh<til <>iw 

apply /IC1 ilul<JIi«bv ...-, , __ wlttcl. jwI d"fN>uing __ w ....... --..~ '''''''II< 

" .-rq" ;,-;J 

C hapluC;1 

Ssdjop "0,, LyflllOl pC LP· G .. CpDyj llf rJ 

610~.2 ... ,., 'mym Cl AAr" ! .. j!.il! [ ... b~.~fd !.I .. its ohall bo: omnds<! .. fotiQ.,., TIlt 11_ 
0{ Uqwfi~ ".tr(Jlc_ "" I" UC~ 0{ QII QW~g<IU of 2. OOQ..g<>IIOft _ a.ptM:il)' ..., .. Joc.,rrd. 

IUD' OIW-IuI/ (lfl) ",11. fro- ~r()' %0Md 01' <hs/g>I<JI~ for ra/tk",kJ} .,.. ~. kf>II_.JtoJf 

OrdiM""" 2019.01 P"i£lloft6 

 20-0203 H Page 15 of 41



-

(1 /1) ""I~frowo uUl1"/t ""t/tkfll/aloMwl"P'*'" ",ifI." dtoufty gntnr ,IIoto ..... (I) dwUittg ~,,;t _ 

~,.,.d (lilt'" _-IttJIf(II1) ",U.frt- ... ,lIoul DO' aofn if ailoowd ....... AHJ .... ,,-.<. _" 
J/>«tUllrotod.,/o)fU/ III. ",. .. ,,11 ww./ by'lv Coo;...,. 0/ £1 Doorodo 

DiI".,"""tI ",I'~I .. ",:>M1l1vd 11 ... 11, WirlIbIIIw /,,,,;a ~l<IbIuJwd by jq., ~trictlng dv JUpcnIOfO if' 
liqwfitd ptrro/h.'" PIP tiN pnMC,;o" of "'tn'I/y JIOPI'IaHd '" ~lcJ _ . 11M <>gnp. 

~DpO<:(ry cf"'I)' "'" / ... ,<>IIQ/Io<! ,MII_ -m .. wgtc, ~Iry of l,()(J() g<>J/oIu 1M ~"'IJ'II' 

c{llqlllf/«d "."1'0/..,,., p Do _ of "" ,,~. afJ,ooo-plott _~ capo.:ity ... _rtJ 

... I_I QN'/tuif (112) ", /I, fr- proputy IOMd or del/patN for ~idDrliai _ '"' .. I, ... , """. 

Itolf(ll1) ",J/.fro- cdl/O"S ""odt",/al rI_loptMltl ",,,II(' dt",;ty gnaw ,,-,,,. (I) dwllr"8 ....., 

/NT ~ DNJ 111 1_, QIIt:./ttJJ! on) ",Ik""'" ""y haul or .. oul is /lJlcweti 1IIIw".uu ~onI""" 
a :<p«iullc<>nJil/olful ..... fH"" il U lu.-l by II. Co~"'Y af F1 Dorado. 

Sccljol 61 11 "IRb Or""" Llq ysn ss! r " ro!ru,. en I .. !!IIIOO •• f5JMl!Hj!9' .'enl!?! , I.d 

~ wll be odded III folio .. , 

61' 1. ' !!.tu llion .hall be .dded .. folio .. ", 

To.tNlap NgoJtMor ~f_ IIIaII i>I ilUllllltd lit accord<lI1C' .. ifh ~Io;w >'C<f .......... "", 

~"t' NpIQIor I)'S""" JltDI1 1M " ,I/ollttl"., 011 LPG /""ulIQl/olu 

7Jw fiTsl ~ ",goJ<Ji(W ,1oD1l H j ... ,alltd rutth, ,,,,,- Jo i"~ ga~ caw, ",ppll"" ... fllt 1101 /alit 77w 

on.o.pJwric fITUJ .. u ~,.,_ ofllw ""poter ./toI1 N poi1JlN dow""""". 7JN /In' '1IIIl • .-.pJatw 

oJotMl be pi_bed 10 lito ,ug of. ycrd pipitrg .. flit MIt _r hibi"K '01111".., /Iu/Mllt)' ,ltoMId I ..... 

• Itt.{Ihq """"'" 77w riMr fr- 1101 ycrd""'..,. ,haJl bc lo<;atnI _ _ lho" J I1tCIwJ (IoorlzoNo/ly) 

tr-.IwW<JJh<{'" I ..... 

no. -.-J .,. np/otor dIttI ..-pipe ,Ito/I N i"'IUUN wtder I'" _ 0{ IIv bolld,,,,, <u elOH 

... ptOCfiNbk Jo l/w btI/Jdiltg woIl. 11ris riuT ,1tOJI be HCtIrYIy RIfIPO'"/N-'bmt:«IIO /Ito wall 

,.",.-ot:-ty 10 iItdta bri_11w nplotor so ... 10 I'fW'" bcltdlng <{tIM pYM "" kJunII ,-'''''' 

""'" A prOI«:fiw _ . "1'1'00",1 by w P • ..ppIlu tmd ihllld" .. OIf/dlll. ,1wI1 bc I>ulUllN owr'Ito 

,«O«J,1Op .-.pJator dIttIl«OInly IJIfIPO'fN It> ,Iw ~ or ~11y It> ,''' woIJ. 

77w ,ug *' for w ycrd PfIHItIl ,1wI1_ be .006. *1«1;.. nlltCm.. C.-.-.I. ploJUd arowtd ."",It 

nnr ,Ito/IIN Ito/d bock <If kAr' 111tC1tJr- tJl ,Ju c(1'" pIpf. 

A/lito Ii_ of appIlcoliofr for...,. bwlJdltl/f ".-11. ""*" Iwvd_ lito ifafIQ/1utbo if"" LI'G ".. .. "" 

lite appl/CiHJI ,Ita/J ,"'-II "" lJ'G".._ pi« pbt .. J copIa (II'" digilaIJy ... f'DF) 77w U'G plot 

plOII ,holill.dlllk. ~ _ 1M /mobd 10, ".,. toroI /ocot/olo. pmpou.td 10IIi. NpIrily 11! Us. tttM~ 

rord. of""" pipf",. locoNon ofllv rlMr pIpo • I'" /wOld,..,. "."". • .,~. 11tMd.." _11M of 
0/1 ul,II"g/pn>p<.oI.J bollJInp Off ,Ito ,. I1tMd .. Jt,*""" of ,Iv rldrl,- <{...,. boWdI,.. '0 ". 

Ordinance 2019.01 ~l101'6 

 20-0203 H Page 16 of 41



J"PfJIW willi U'G. nw ./tall 0/40 IH. ~d 10 the "IV'Ojfi;a/e fi.-c dU/ricl to serw m 0 iOCQ/M 

Map I" ew .. if"" e ... e'l(r"'J' 

LocatI<NI aftlw """, .. 11M of LPG 14M; ,1Ia/11H JH, ..... 1Otltlly IOJaTW by II. uu of IIIOW slabu. ON 

Q/ .,.,II.1td. Sucll JlaU •• 1Ia/11H of Jli/FlCiflll Migiu ro IH. .is/bI, tllr<Ngll olllic/palro "'a.rim~'" .. " ... 

d#:plil al I~ "'''fHC'iw /OCalion b.,tallali<NI <md ..... illl.""""'. of tile ... SItOW staM. QT. IIIe 

.. sptHtSibililyoftlw LPG uur 

PropuM app/I"""'''' <md aIXUJ<>ri •• slla/I_IH. ~iltd;" QtI)' ..... 1 .... '01/"""" IHluw II. ji'" 

f1~ M btl_ gI"QIk . .. lIlcll .. " iJ mor. "J/ricl;. '. 

6111.2 V,nioal Ri..,. Pipi.g shall be odded u follow. 

MIIt/mwm afScItNM/. 80 . inm pipi'fg. 

n.. rlsv ,/tall IH. willll" J 1..cIr<-, ""'Iz_ally afl/v /OM. 

s...I"K joillfr sltt>ll ". I .... /O/lro aro... """ btlow r.voI: 14w1 10 f1'"O"/d# /of" lhe t _ _ "" .. (SIrul 

./bows IlIallllOllH. ~U«I. 

A l/slfd flulbl. rlsn fOft.ttn..otro of <'Of'P" M "alnJ./J-JIf. / """'" UNI pNJUCIW by $lui ro .. rt:d 

.IIN, Md mot .. lo/ ""9' IH. uud ''''I'od of ro' IllS joiJI/S n.. flU ibll o/UNfOIiw s/tall provi;h s>tfic/(:1II 

JiDck 10 oJ/ow /of" larM maw,",111 

6112.3 Markjllg.cd I.&c!tiopl.hlll be added .. folloWl'-

A~ approwd """ sltt>lllH. /OCQIro dorttl/y abo .. I'" run sirlll off"""" .,.. 1M btu'IdI"8 Ilf 0 ./Slbi. 

lacalion. 

n.. Iiqw4!.d pW"oI."", gas .wpplo., Jlla/I <lffix 0 _otllfrproo! id#:III/f1CQ(iQ,r log 10 tilt buld#: of I'" 
101/1; WJIw pnK«Ilwg coYn ThIs wg JItaJI c_al~ t/w .lI{JpIin's ........ .."d '''''' IJ''''J' tel.pIKww 

_N' 
T_ IlfJloJlall<NI .1tt>I11H. ,......"".1II1y _W by" .... ,al",. wood """te,iQl._ ""'""'. willi 0 

",Ilt/ ... "", di ... _I"" of 11w:hu by 11"""'. n.. ,,'0" "..."" ~IIH. of .~fficl.1tI MlgJlt 10 rill 

aItow 1M llIIII>«JJ ...". MpdI UNI """IIH " "'I .. '''' ..... of 10 jHt ;" "'ig"'. 1M ",ow _kers ,1Ia/1 

1M paillle )1f1l<Ytll fI1IIIlocatw "" apposiJ •• Nb oft. ""'" 

Sect jog 6I1J U.duground I..PG Tub IUIllII.llo •• .ad (h .. onbtp ,haH be Jdded os foUow. 

6' 13.1 f'rmllll ud fla,,< ,hili be added .. follows; PI''''',", sllaJl 1M nq~/,td. """ pJOItI Jh,.i/1H 

.,J,,,dtrw for .. I omchrgrmmd i<IIIlllfJwI/aI/"'" <JS 0fJPN'¥'d by t/w AHJ. 

6113.2 Under. mud !.I'C T .... Ow.~nhjR .... 1I be .:Ided.as fot lows: UnderRNJIU!<i LPG lanL 

JIIaJI 1M prablb,ltd from bol..g .oJd 10 mtl-IlJ"J "ltd ,1IaJI IH r~lolNd by lIN LPG c"",~y ~""~, 0 

/eaJ~-{JIpf '}"I~'" 10 trlS"'. PffJPt, annwal _i>ll .... "". ffI["i~_>IIJ an "'~I and , .. 'O'dtd 

Ord lJIance 20 19,0 1 Page t 3 of 16 

 20-0203 H Page 17 of 41



Chapter 80 

S«1;Ofl 89, ,'liUA, 1Jf), 16 ~ Slud.nI [or 110. III'lall. lion u[ Spli.kln SWt'ml In Q'r-ud Two 

F .... lly Owt'lliul and ,\houra.IMrN 110 ..... oJ Imrgdf'jl 903.3.1 .3, 9OJ.J.~ 

Nt'PA 1J1), A ... ad<4 S«.ioos .. folio ... : 

~~ Sttti<>. 5.1.1.1 10 Iud .. fOliO ... : 

Cb.mrr 110, NFPA Ill). S.U,: A slJ(Jpiy '1/ at kalr ~ of "r~ f}fJ't and ,~",p"at"'" ,prl,,*I~. !<Sod 

.. ';'~in ,~ pnml ... JItoII ~ _"'"i~ "" I~ pr~"'" (If..., ~d Incal.ion Stock Jprj";'[", ,hall 

Iv ktp' ;~ " ",,,,,,.IN <JItd ~ibl~ cab ..... 

Re>'iJe S. .. ioo 7.6 to I'Hd II fuM_I: 

C\amcr 89, NffA Up, 7.6 A Ioc"i "'at~, flo .. aiM'" .1toI1 N prowdtd "" aUf". Jpri;,i,/ .. ,yw...., I~ 

~J at "" apr:rami locali"" "" 1M HI~dO<' of'N dwelling 

Itn'Iot Seedoa 11.2.1.1 to read lIS follow>: 

Chut •• 8l!. NFI'A 13D. II ,!.!.I When. fire depanment pumpel' COfIIIOC1ioo i. not pro~ided, tho 

.,..tem :.hall be hydnWaticaily leSIod II II minim"'" pr£ ... u~ of i 50 powoh per "IMan inell ga>lgI' for "" 
ku l/Jan " JO_" ... a"u/iOfl ,..illootM £.i<k~ "f I.~kaxt S""h , .. " Mil b« wi'IUIu.d by IJw fi~ codt 

offjellli. 

=' ., ,"" .. ~ 0. 'N:"~'~· 
" ,., 

" " 
flRE·now MITO:YIAllC MI~L'IUJ :YI "-Ow 

C ALCULATION SPRINKLER FIRE· DURATION 

AR!:A S VSTf.!II 'WW (h ...... ) 

t ... ~· ... '''') 
(Dt..ip (1. 11 .... po. 

su. ••• nI) .. iD~") 

O_l.600 ~ - ,.~ , --l.60 I -.I,...._ " 
_. ,,- • ~ • .............. ~*'" ,- ,-

8101.1(21 8/05.111) • 
~ "-, .. d 

~--• ,." _ '10)) I.) ~ • 
of .... CA r .. ,- , 
l'cdo '" _ 

)1).1 of ""' CA 
~"''''(".oo. 

1.601 orwl "' ... , s.....,. 9(1).).1.1 ,12 ... '" ., • 
a! Ih< ('A fa. ,- , 
('00c '" ~"'" 0'Oj . I(21 

)1).3 Qf "" l 'A '". ,~ 

~M GP.'.I, 

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 14 of 16 

 20-0203 H Page 18 of 41



I,Itk 81MJ RN~lrrd fin flo" fllr "wildi'" oiM. Ibn 0 ... ltd h ...... Ky 

!l .. dl"., Gropp S -J, ud S=i !luildina u d Ty .. p"WW ..... 1I be amended .. follow" 

... UTO ....... Tl C SI'il. INKU:R MINI\lU\I FLOW DUIlATION 

SYSTEM FIRE-FLOW (-"I 
(o..iK" S ••• d.rd) (1. 11 ..... ~, 

.. i .. lo) 
!<c ..........;. oprinkI.- _ .- • ,- -- - ,-

BIOl.I(1) BIDH(2) 

-~ IlCJJ,ll "~~ C~ .... 1-"'''' ......... ~ - ,-
,~ joT_DIllS Ill)' .1115.1(.1) .... _ --Soot ... "'U.I.l of ... C ... ,- _jilMollloo_ ""- - ,-
,~ -- • ~ .. TobldltllS.I(J) BIH.I(2) ..... _ 

• It>. J,IJOO.p,._-J --b, n.. ..du<od r ... ""'" .... n _ be _ diu I 

ApjI<".dh D _ Fin AppanIMI"'NU5 R ..... 

Sullo' DIOJ Mlnlmu" ~p«.ftaUk>a' 

QJOj, 1 Asnu Ko.d "MIt" "in I Ihdn.I ..... 1 be -.dod ... fori....., adoj;n& tho: "'~""lkIft: 

e. .. ~_ ()r,~ 

010,1,2 G rds IMII be ... lfndfd .. f6l10~ Fil't ~ ao.,.,.,. roecIs..:l drl""",.y. shill not 

t.oe«Il J "' M vo&t IdtJS appP'O'-nJ by /Iv AHJ., by ,let £J []o,aJo C""",,> ~1I<Jtd Colifontiu 

I'wbilC IW,-"",« CM nil. 1# D.mlf>l<l1WlI",I''''w_" SI...JanJs ~, 

£o'«pt/Mt,' Eln«t<JIO ........ ,.000jHi .1taI1_ a«~ I~ 

PlO),J T.n!" Rtdiv wI! be ..... ~ .. 101...... ~ minimum luminS ..w ...... 11 be 

datrmlnrd by the Ii~ code otroc.lrI; <I1WI JIoa/I _ ;",,1. arb """ pttO' 

p!9M Oa lutg.nl" "Stt" 8m Gllp ~I be ...... ,>dotd .. follow.: St0Jn:11OIt (I)' Wht"..,c 

...,.. ".. Is P' o'/MoJ, ,,., ,.., • .. Jdtlt ,lIeU 1M _ Iu> th.:m 10 fod (60116 ",1If) , If'Iwfrt" fin 

_ .... ro«/.,..,...iltt 1/(0 dloOtkd ~ IIw "" • ... odrJI.JIaIl _ "" ~D shan l'lul (d71 

_J 

DIOHd 89m 10 10 l! rUt I. " Id l. lhIJl be.~ lIS rollowJ: F;~ lane li,nl" 'p.<;ified in 

Section DIOl 6 ~I lit pUI!td 01> both 1* fA fl~ Ij)pAnOIUI IO:CHI II*ls that are 20 to 29 feel .. id< 

(6Ci96 '" IS34 4 mm), 

f:xt>qItItM, l1-.Io<tTGbow ',000/1 ,., dI'l""iNd byl'" AIU, 

DIIIJ ,6,l !loHI .. "a I." Z9 lUI I. "'hll' shill be _"\ended lIS f~lI<lwS; F;~ lane IiI"" II 

specIfied ... Sect"'" OIOl.6 .... 11 be po:o$~ on ooe lid< offi~ lppfoI'IM acce .. 11*1. mon: than 19 

feet wid< (IH .. U mm) _ leu 111M J6 feet wid< (1097H mm). 

fJ:crpt,- £~""ION abo ... ',000 fI "" dt"""i1lfd by ,''' A IU 

PeaeiS ofl6 

 20-0203 H Page 19 of 41



DIOH Cjrum(,"al l. I Firs "PpuI IN' " tttH Roadt ,"'11 too I<k\&od .. follows: WIwotuqwhJ 

by /", flU roJt: oJfi~"". afln "f1P<J'<I"" tJ«oUJ rO<Id ,1toI1 ~ """"frVClW /0 ~'""~ ,,,, _iTny 

of" JIr..m.n ond Jhall iJ"O'ikk a """I"_J ........ Q/ ~~"'" ... lud~ ~. 

SECTION .. : COl' FLICT 

n.. Ordir>ancc No. 2016.41 01 OEO . ....:I oJl ocII« ordlnancn or p&IU o( ontinanca horewilh .., h<'fdIy 

-'" 
SECTION S: SfVJ:BAHlI ,ITY 

If any 0I'dinuI<>e, 1II'Iide. ~ <l' .... bdl.,.;on thereof. pro~i,ion.. sentence. eI ...... <l' phrase orllli. code. or 

any oppIicIUan Ibonof. I. fur III)' rason hdd 10 M invalid by. <OWl of eompetenl juri><iicOOn, such dot"ion 

shill not affioa !he raMi ................ 0I1hiI c.ode ... hith .... be ti_ dfeo:! withoul!he In~oIid pc:wtion, ....:I. 

lhc:oefooc. IUdI invalid pottIoo .... dec:1¥ed 10 ~ """cr.bk. 000 hereby dot ............ illO'OUld ""VI IOIICted lhis 

Ord.1IIf'U M>d eato 01 iIt ~~ IIeCt,Oftf,~ ....... <l' tubdivioiord Ihcru!f. proviJions. senlcllCeI, cl ....... <l' 

pInses 1mspoet~0I1he ~ 1IoiII .... Of """" 0I1hmo is clcclarcd irwaJid 

SECTIOS ,: EFfECTIVE PATE AND rUB!.JCATION 

This Orduwu shill lake dfecI tlIift)' (lO)day' ,fter iIt IdopOon. GF.o ao.rd CIak;, d,~ 10 publi.h fils 

DrIII_ in • IleWSf)lpcf 01 eeneral cimllllion in !he DiSlricl. In lieu of publicMion 0I1he fuU Ic~1 01 IN 

ordiOWlU •• summAI)' of 1bI onj,_ .... y ~ pubhohrd b)' u.. by Iht ao.rd CIak within liftom (15) doIy, Iller 

ill pIIIIp Ind I .;enifled ~ shIJl be posted in Ihe olrK:e 01 OED punuanllO ~ C. $oa/ool 

J/WJJ(c) (/). 

The IIbovc Qnj,IW>CI:"u introduced". mee1illj oflhe Board ofOi~ of OED"" CkIObeo' I" 201'. Md il 

... then rail far the tlnl time" A publk hc.-ina:". on for \lie Ordlnaooe IIJ ~ ~Id lOr tho -'" lime on 

No.....mbH 14, 20" Md ~ by !he (allowing vOle: 

PASSED AND "DOi'fEO by !he _ ofo.rec\Or1 ofOEO llIi" 14" day "fN",ember, 10/9 

AYF.5 b~ ..... ~,~a..:..t.~ • ...,.W40015. 

M>ES .. .,. 

-
Rod \IIi,., ....... Boud Pn:socIeooo: 

Ord,nanc<:lOl,.o1 

A8SF.NT- l)'oQ;COOl 1'"I>CC 

A8S1"AIN l.Io.oJ[ 

l'a&e 16 or 16 

 20-0203 H Page 20 of 41



CAM&GEO 

Fire Code # Significant 
What Is the Change? 

Locally adopted I SFM adopted I 
Why Is There a Local Change? 

change? Amended 

101.1 N Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Administrative need 

LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than 

Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate 
air and can easily be trapped under a home, if ignited it can 

105.6.27 y quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving Locally adopted and amended 
lead to an explosion. At elevations above 5000 feet there is 
an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire 

occupancies in Group R-3. 
activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional 
attention. 

Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance 

106.6 N Add section Locally created and adopted 
of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines 
pemnits, plan checks, and inspections as allowed in Health 
&Safety Code 17951. 

106.6.1 N Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to 
the Fire District. 

106.7 y Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspections by contractors. 

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District 
is added to read as follows: 
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this 
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an 

109.4 y Added section 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals 
regarding an order, decision, or detemnination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County of EI Dorado's 
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals 
timeline. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 
Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that 
protects life and property. Fees have been updated to 

110.4 N 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 

Locally adopted and amended match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the 
better left to localities to detemnine the 
fees/penalties for their respective areas. 

District Attorney's Office. The change to the language to 
include the term infractions. 

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s), 

110.4.2 N 
Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before 

Locally created and adopted 
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 

but under a different number) violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health and Safety Code of the State of California and 
Chapter 5c (commencing with section 853.6) of TiUe 3 of 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 

112.4 N 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. ltis 

Locally adopted and amended 
All violations of the code have been consolidated under 

better left to localities to detemnine the Section 110.4 to include the penalties for violations. 
fess/penalties for their respective areas. 

Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District, 

202 N Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopted 
ExecUtive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd 
Manager. Definition of campfire shall not include LPG or 
Propane fueled appliances. 

302.1 N Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for clarity 

307.4.4 through 
Due to the high fire danger that exists in EI Dorado County 

307.4.4.2 (d) 
Y Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopted we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires 

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas. 

 20-0203 H Page 21 of 41



Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical 
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for 
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus 
components. It also allows an extended time frame before 

Changed vertical clearances to 15 feet and road 
having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional 

503.2.1 N locally adopted and amended height for vegetation clearances acts as an increased buffer 
widths to 20 feet. 

for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of 
shoulders, as measured face of curb to face of curb is 
needed. These structures can be difficult to navigate with 
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the total 
drivable road surface 

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the 
Fire apparatus require areas for turning around when 
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This 

503.2.5 N 
Fire Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations to 

locally adopted and amended includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides 
match as they require tumarounds for fire apparatus 

belter access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds turn 
access roads and driveways. 

around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated Surfaces of EI Dorado County and Appendix D of the 
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be 

503.2.6 N Surfaces to state and match EI Dorado County Locally adopted and amended 
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an 

Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17. 
altemate means & methods that is not less restrictive than 
the Fire Code. 

503.4.2 N Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes Locally created and adopted 
This section clearly defines the 'No Parking in Fire lanes' 
rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicle Code. 

Added section regarding no parking in front of 
This section clearly defines the 'No Parking in front of fire 

503.4.3 N Locally created and adopted hydrants' rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicle hydrants 
Code. 

Added section regarding fire lanes based on road 
This section clearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D 

503.4.4 N locally created and adopted as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire 
width 

lanes. 

Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on 

503.5.3 N 
emergency access and consistency through all 

locally created and adopted 
roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing 

roadway gates in EI Dorado County, referring to the the best possible emergency access to maintain fast 
gate standards adopted by the FPO's. response times. 

505.1 N 
Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of 

Locally adopted and amended 
Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing 

buildings based on the District's addressing standards. 

Added more conservative standard for the 
Commercial properties are required to install hydrants at 

507.5.1 N placement of hydrant and their relationship to locally adopted and amended 
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150 
feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in 

commercial buildings 
between). 

Buildings are getting more sizable in the county. It is more 
common to have new buildings with solar arrays that 
continue to generate power even when the buildings 

Added verbiage to bring all of the necessary fire 
general utilities have been shut off. When there is an 

509.3 y Locally created and adopted emergency, it is vital that we have rapid access to all of the 
controls for a building to one location. 

controls in one location for public evacuation and firefighter 
safety. Due to the fire danger present in EI Dorado County 
throughout most of the year, this change is appropriate and 
advisable. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2 N in new buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

greater within the district. to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

 20-0203 H Page 22 of 41



Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.a N Locally created and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 

to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
structure, whichever is less. 

feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds occupant protection for existing buildings less 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.b N 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 

Locally created and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

structure, whichever is less. 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

903.2.1, 903.2.3, These sections were created to give specific increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.4, 903.2.7 
N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Manufactured Homes - The intent of this code section is to 
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two 
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar 

This section was created to include manufactured nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban 

903.2.8.2 y residential single family R-3 in the residential Locally created and adopted 
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption 

sprinkler program due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The 
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a 
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk 
successfully in many California communities. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

These sections were created to give specific increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2.9, 903.2.10 N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Added occupant proteclion for fire alarms in 
buildings with a floor area less than 3,600, except 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that R3, AG buildings not used for commercial 
907.2.a N 

purposes, and buildings with a floor area of less 
Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code the event of a fire or smoke. 

official. 

Added occupant protection for existing buildings 
Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.b N 
without automatic sprinkler systems to install a fire 

Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in alarm if they add more than 30% or 1,000 square 
feet to the structure, whichever is less. 

the event of a fire or smoke. 

Added occupant protection by stating all fire alarm 
deteclion systems installed shall be connecled to a Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.c N monitoring service that notifies the fire department Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
upon activation and is installed per Section 907 of the event of a fire or smoke. 
the fire code. 

Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
907.2.d N systems to be connected to a monitored fire alarm Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

system when installed or replaced. the event of a fire or smoke. 

 20-0203 H Page 23 of 41



907.6.2.1 Y 
Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply 

Locally created and adopted 
Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E 

Modification safety related power outages. 

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to 
1203.1.3 N Shunt trip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up 

power supplies 

3310.3 N Address requirements for construction sites Locally created and adopted 
Addressing for construction sites is important to assist 
responding emergency crews. 

3312.1 N 
Water supplies at construction sites with 

Locally adopted and amended 
Water must be on site prior to combustible material being 

combustible materials on-site stored or vertical construction commencing. 

EI Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout 

4903.1 y This section was created to include Fire Protection 
Locally created and adopted 

the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire 
Plan for all fire hazard severity zones. Protection Plan due to climatic, geological, and 

topographical conditions. 

This section clarifies that within the boundaries of EI Dorado 

Added a section to clarify roof construction 
County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are 

4905.4 y 
requirements 

Locally created and adopted wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be 
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly. 

Any damages or costs from negligent practices that 
Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate. 

5001.7 y cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally created and adopted 
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 

cost recovery fee. 
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the 
negligent parties. 

Added safety protection with permits being issued 
Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and 

by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for 
5601.2 N 

explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of 
Locally adopted and amended fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding 

Supervisors for fireworks. 
of the applications they will be used for. 

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any 

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make 
documentation including timing and proprietary information 

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 N available all requested documentation pertaining to Locally created and adopted 
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they 

the firework presentation 
deem necessary. This information is understood to be 
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as 
such. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5704.2.9.6.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5706.2.4.4 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid special 
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval 

I and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County. 

Administrative need to add District name. Established limits 

Administrative addition of District name. 
as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable 

5806.2 N 
Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code 

Locally adopted and amended Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ 
approval and a Spectal/Conditional Use Permit from the 
County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code Official for 

5806.2.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted and amended locally 
Flammable Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. 
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

Establishes distances between LPG storage and 
dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential 

Established limits for LPG storage and dispensing 
developments and high-density hotels, motel, apartments, 

6104.2 N 
near or adjacent to residential development 

Locally adopted and amended etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would 
have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death. 
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

 20-0203 H Page 24 of 41



Establishes propane regulator requirement for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. Including requirements for two-
stage regulator use and location of first and second stage 

Establishes propane regulator requirements for 
regulators. Additional requirements are outlined for 

6112.1 N 
locations above 5000 foot elevation 

Locally created and adopted protective covers, riser pipe installation requirements, 
building permit submittal and review, tank center·line 
marking, and grade requirements. These requirements are 
based on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet 

Establishes vertical propane rise requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. Pipe schedule location, swing 

6112.2 N 
Establishes propane vertical riser pipe requirements 

Locally created and adopted 
joint requirements, and the use of flexible riser piping as 

above 5000 foot elevation well as swing joints. These requirements are based on 
significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather 
conditions encountered above 5000 feet 

Establishes marking and location requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. This section addresses signage 

6112.3 N 
Establishes propane marking and location 

Locally created and adopted location, emergency contact information, and snow related 
requirements above 5000 foot elevation tank marking requirements. These requirements are based 

on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feat 

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground 
tanks: 

6113.1 N 
Permits and plans shall be submitted and approved 

Locally created and adopted Allows us to require plans be submitted for review prior to 
by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction). installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks 

require substantial maintenance including inspection and 
anode replacement at regular intervals. 

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without 

6113.2 N 
Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the 

Locally created and adopted 
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when 

property of the LPG company sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground 
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected. 

Amended to include on·site sprinkler heads and wrench on· 
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow 
alarm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in the 

NFPA 13D·16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the event of water activation in a vacant structure, and 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 

Y 
District has been amended to update various 

SFM Adopted and amended locally 
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 13D 

13D·16 provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water 
systems in one·and two-family dwellings damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements 

were also added to ensure water circulation through the 
system, reducing stagnant water and back flow concems 
(EID encourages this type of system). 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system 13D·16 Section Y SFM adopted and amended locally 

5.1.1.2 
system minimizing damage must be available on·site in an accessible mounted cabinet 

Chapter 80, NFPA, An audible alarm system is added to notify oocupants and 

13D·16 Section 7.6 
y Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation SFM adopted and amended locally in the activation of the system when the building is not 

occupied allow for detection minimizing damage. 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and 

13D·16 Section Y System test to a pressure of 150 p.s.i. SFM adopted and amended locally 
11.2.1.1 failures and assures proper gluing of system components. 

Appendix B: Table Changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 

B105.1(1) 
N elevation, to match fire flow precedents used in Locally adopted and amended to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 

EDC for years used for over a decade in EDC. 

Appendix B: Table 
Established a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM, Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 

B105.2 N below 5000 foot elevation, for all commercial Locally adopted and amended to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 
projects used for over a decade in EDC. 

 20-0203 H Page 25 of 41



Appendix D: D103.1 N Made an exception for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended 
It is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to 
construct a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant. 

Title 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways. 
Appendix D: D103.2 N State law requires no greater than 16% grade Locally adopted and amended In our EI Dorado County Title 14 adoption we allow greater 

than 16% grade with AHJ approval and hard surface. 

Appendix D: D103.3 N Texl to include curbs and gutters Locelly adopted and amended 
20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutters due 
to potential access issues and turning radius concerns. 

Appendix D: D103.5 § 
Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided 

N Fire apparatus access road gates Locally adopted and amended roadway the gate width shall not be less than 15 feet due to 
1 

radius issues. 

No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet 

Appendix D: D103.6.1 N Roads widths 20 to 29 feet Locally adopted and amended 
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does 
not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire 
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all other elevations. 

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet 

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36 
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of 

Appendix D: D103.6.2 N 
feet in width 

Locally adopted and amended elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The 
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D 
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations. 

Appendix D: D104.2 
Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

N building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 
Exception 

have only one approved fire apparatus access road. residents and first responders. 

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 

Appendix D: D104.4 N 
Added to require circumferential fire apparatus 

Locally created and adopted 
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire 

access roads structure and shall provide a continuous means of 
emergency vehicle access. 

Appendix D: D106.1 
For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

N Removed Exception in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 
Exception 

residents and first responders. 

Appendix D: D 1 07.1 
For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Exception 
N Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

residents and first responders. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.2 through 101.5 N 

Adopted to establish scope, intent, severability and 
Locally adopted Administrative clarity 

validity 

102.6 through 102.8 N References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

102.10 through 102.12 N 
Conflicting proviSions, Other Laws, Application of 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
references 

103.1 through 104.1 N 
Definition of the Fire Prevention Division and ability 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
to enforce the code 

104.3 through 104.4 N Right of Entry, Warrants, and Identification Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.6 through 104.6.4 N Record retention Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.8 through 104.9.2 N 
Modifications, altemate means and methods, and 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
test 

104.11 through 
N 

Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of 
Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.11.2 systems 

104.11.3 N Authority of systems and devices inoperable Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
105.2.3 N Time limitation of application Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.3.1 through 
N Operational permits Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.3.2 

105.6.12 N 
Dry cleaning operational permits required for 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
hazardous cleaning solvent use 

 20-0203 H Page 26 of 41



Permits for various business operations for: Magnesium, 

105.6.2.28 through Adopted this section for administrative darity and 
miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation 

105.6.35 
N 

fire and life safety inspections 
Locally Adopted vehides, motor fuel-dispensing facilities, open burning, 

open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and 
organic coatings 

105.6.37 N 
Adopted this section for administrative darity and 

Locally Adopted Permits for places of assembly 
fire and life safety inspections 

105.6.39 N 
Adopted this section for administrative darity and 

Locally Adopted Permits for private fire hydrants 
fire and life safety inspections 

Permits for pyroxylin plastics, refrigeration equipment, repair 
105.6.41 through N Adopted this section for administrative darity and Locally Adopted 

garages and motor fuel-dispensing facilities, rooftop 
105.6.46 fire and life safety inspections heliports, spraying or dipping, storage of scrap tires and tire 

by-products 

105.6.48 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Permit for tire-rebuilding plants 
fire and life safety inspections 

105.6.50 N 
Adopted this section for administrative darity and 

locally Adopted 
Permit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material, 

fire and life safety inspections lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 cubic feet) 

106.1 through 106.3 N 
Adopted this section for administrative darity and 

Locally Adopted Fee schedules for permits 
fire and life safety inspections 

107.1 N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Locally Adopted Inspection authority 

fire and life safety inspections 

Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
equipment, re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping, 

108.1 through 109.3 N 
fire and life safety inspections 

locally Adopted supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding, 
Board of Appeals established, limitations on authority, and 
qualifications 

110.3.2 through 
N 

Adopted this section for administrative darity and 
Locally Adopted 

Compliance with orders and notices, prosecution of 
110.3.4 fire and life safety inspections violations, and unauthorized tampering 

110.4.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Abatement of violation 
fire and life safety inspections 

113.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative darity and 

Locally Adopted Authority to disconnect service utilities 
fire and life safety inspections 

Asphalt kettles contain highly flammable substances and 
303.1 through 303.9 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical) 

Managing ignition sources through responsible application 
305.1 through 305.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted of standards will reduce the number of fires in various 

settings (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY 
306.1 through 306.2 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted flammable and require special handling (Climatic, 

geological, and topographical) 

307.1 through 307.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Open buming, recreational fire, and portable outdoor 
fireplaces, (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Open flame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

308.1.2 through 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 

Throwing or placing of ignition sources, torches for 
308.1.3 removing paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Locations near combustible, open flame devices, signals 
and markers, portable fuel open-flame devices, sky-

308.1.5 through 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 

lanterns, religious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming 
308.1.8.5 food and beverage preparation, dispensing, containers not 

in use, serving of flaming food, location, fire protection 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.2 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Permits are required for above section (Climatic, geological, 
and topographical) 

 20-0203 H Page 27 of 41



Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices, 
308.3 through 308.4.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted theatrical performances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 

dormitories (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

310.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to smoking (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

310.3 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
"No Smoking" signs (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with "No Smoking" 
31Q.4 through 310.8 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted signs, ash trays, buming objects, hazardous environmental 

conditions. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Vacant premises condition and safety requirements, 
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant 

311.1 through 311.4 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted premises, security, fire protection, fire separation, removal 
of combustibles, removal of hazardous materials. (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

319.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to mobile food preparation 
vehides. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

319.2 N 
Adopted this section for administrative darity and 

Locally Adopted 
Permits for mobile food preparation vehicles (Climatic, 

fire and life safety inspections geological, and topographical) 

Exhaust hood, fire protection, fire protection for cooking 
equipment, fire extinguisher, appliance connection to fuel 
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, metallic 
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking oil 
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting, 
normal vents, emergency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum 

319.3 through 
aggregate volume, protection of container, LP-gas container 

319.10.3 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted construction, protection of system piping, LP-gas alarms, 

CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel, 
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG 
container construction, CNG containers supplying 
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping, 
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire 
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems. 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

403.8.1 through 
Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1 

N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted (residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and 
403.8.1.7 fire safety plans. 

403.10 through 
Group R-l (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancy 

N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic, 
403.10.1.3 geological, and topographical) 

405.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

510.3 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally Adopted 

A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems 
fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological. and topographical) 

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a 
807.5.2 through 

N 
Adopted this section for administrative darity and 

Locally Adopted 
maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in 

807.5.2.3 fire and life safety inspections educational facilities (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5 

903.2.1.5 N 
Adopted this section for administrative darity and 

Locally Adopted 
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers) 

fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000 
square feet. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

 20-0203 H Page 28 of 41



Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders 
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from 
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time 

Adopted this section in existing buildings for the 
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by 

11032 Y safety of firefighters and other emergency Locally Adopted 
the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind 

responders. 
this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury 
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0101.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads 
through 0102.1 firefighters, and other emergency responders. including loads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Oead end fire apparatus access road requirements for a 

Appendix 0: 0103.4 N Locally Adopted tum around at 150 feel (Climatic, geological, and 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. 

topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0103.6 N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
"No Parking, Fire Lane" signs requirements. (Climatic, 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0104.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus 

through 0104.3 N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. 

Locally Adopted 
access roads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

(excluding exception) 

Appendix 0: 0105.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

Requirements for aerial fire apparatus access roads 
through 0105.4 firefighters, and other emergency responders. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential 

through 0106.3 N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. 

Locally Adopted 
developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

(excluding exceptions) 

Appendix 0: 0107.1 
One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire 
(excluding exceptions) N 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. 
Locally Adopted 

apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 
through 0107.2 

climatic conditions. 

Appendix 0: 0108 N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle. 

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

 20-0203 H Page 29 of 41



From: Diana Sampson 
Sent: Monday, December 23, 2019 3:13 PM 
To: Casey Ransdell 
Subject: FW: Public Notice: Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code 

Hi Casey! 

Here's the one for the First Reading of Ordinance 2019-01 

Administrative Assistant 
Georgetown Fire Protection District 

r:Q:J~9~.4.?Q,.§~9rg~!9W.r:tJ.f::~ .. ~?~~~ 
0: L~~Q)}~}-.4JU; F: .l~~QP~.~.-.4.Q.?Q 

~~~mp'~9.1).@g~9fj!.~:9!g 

From: Legal Ads <!~g~!~@r0..!~~r0..9.c;:!.~~:ng~.> 
Sent: Monday, October 7,20193:53 PM 

To: Diana J. Sampson <~~.~mp'~.9.I).@g~9fj!.~:9!g> 
Subject: Re: Public Notice: Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code 

Confirmation of Scheduled Publication: 
NTCE INTENT ADOPT - FIRE CODE 2019 

Newspaper: Mountain Democrat 
Pubdate(s) : .HU9.?/19,10/14/19 
Ref ad#: #6875 
Charges: $35.00 

Thank you for publishing in our newspaper, 

Allison Rains - Public Notices 
Mountain Democrat - Georgetown Gazette Newspapers 

legals@mtdemocrat.net - legals@gtgazette.com 

!~~Q}~4.4.:~.Q.~~ - fax LQ~Q}~4.4.:~.Q.~~ 

On 10/2/20199:56 AM, Diana J. Sampson wrote: 

Please publish in the next two editions. 

 20-0203 H Page 30 of 41



Thank you! 

"Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code 

Notice is hereby given to the intention of the Georgetown Fire Protection 
District to adopt the 2019 California Fire Code. The District shall hold its first 

public hearing at 9:00 A.M. on October 18, 2019, located at 9283 .. Main...S.tr~~t, 
G~Qrg~~.Q.w:n •. C!:!Hf9.m.i.'i.l, regarding the adoption of the 2019 California Fire Code 
pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13869. Copies of the code section 
referred to and any secondary code sections referred to, adopted by reference, 
are on file with the Secretary of the District and are open to public 
inspection. Adoption of the 2019 California Fire Code will enable all District 
personnel to follow one set of rules and regulations with regard to the health 
and safety of the public and the District's response thereto." 

D[ClV\,ClJ. SCl~;pS.OV\, 
Administrative Assistant 

Georgetown Fire Protection District 
6281 Main Street, P.O. Box 420 - Georgetown, CA 95634 

Main 5.~.Q;~~~:1.LlJ. - Fax 5.~.Q;~~.~AQA9. 

 20-0203 H Page 31 of 41



From: Diana Sampson 
Sent: Monday, December 23, 2019 3:13 PM 
To: Casey Ransdell 
Subject: FW: SECOND Public Notice: Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code 

Hi again Casey, 

And here's the second notice, for the Second Reading. 

Administrative Assistant 
Georgetown Fire Protection District 

P.:9.· .. ~~x.4.?g,.§~~rg~~~w.I)J.~~ .. Q~~}:4 
0: t~~QU~.~.-.4JU; F: .l~~Q}}~}::4.Q.?Q 
~~.~.rnp.~9.1).@g~~f.if.~:~rg 

From: Legal Ads <!~g~!~.@r!'!~~~r!l.9.~r.~~:n~~.> 
Sent: Monday, October 21,20199:35 AM 
To: Diana J. Sampson <~~_~_rnp'~.9_~_@g~~fjr_~:~rg> 
Subject: Re: SECOND Public Notice: Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code 

Confirmation of Scheduled Publication: 
NOTICE INTENT ADOPT 2019 CA FIRE CODE-2ND PUB HRG 

Newspaper: Mountain Democrat 
Pub date(s): Ua_3/19 , 11/30/19 
Refad#: #6894 
Charges: $35.00 

Thank you for publishing in our newspaper, 

Allison Rains - Public Notices 
Mountain Democrat - Georgetown Gazelle Newspapers 

legals@mtdemocrat.net - legals@gtgazelle.com 
L!;i~Q)~4.4_:9_9J~~ - fax L!;i~Q)~4.4_:9_9J)~ 

On 10/18/20192:30 PM, Diana J. Sampson wrote: 

Please publish in this Wednesday the 23rd edition, and the following 

Wednesday the 30th edition. 

 20-0203 H Page 32 of 41



Thank you! 

Notice of Intent 
to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code 

Notice is hereby given to the intention of the Georgetown Fire Protection District to 
adopt the 2019 California Fire Code. The District shall hold its second public hearing at 
9:00 A.M. on November 14, 2019, at ~~~~.M~.in.?~r~~!I.~~~rg~~~WDJ.~~!i.(9Xnl~J 
regarding the adoption of the 2019 California Fire Code pursuant to Health and Safety 
Code Section 13869. Copies of the code section referred to and any secondary code 
sections referred to, adopted by reference, are on file with the Secretary of the District 
and are open to public inspection. Adoption of the 2019 California Fire Code will enable 
all District personnel to follow one set of rules and regulations with regard to the health 
and safety of the public and the District's response thereto. 

Diana J. Sampson 
Administrative Assistant 

Georgetown Fire Protection District 
6281 Main Street, P.O. Box 420 - Georgetown, CA 95634 

Main 5.3.Q,3..3.3,~.LU. - Fax 5.3.Q,3.3.3,1Q~9. 

 20-0203 H Page 33 of 41



Attachment No. 2 

Georgetown Fire Protection District 

Resolution No. 2019-04 

 20-0203 H Page 34 of 41



· .­, -

, .­
r. 

GEORGCTOWN FIRE DISTIlICT 

0lIl" rhona: S3D33Hlll 
FaCSimile: 5303334020 
WVlW.georgetownme~epartmcnt.ccm 

RESOU],I10N No. 2019-04 

Post Office BCIl 420 
1m IIa:n Sire. 

GlOrq_own. C:Iilornla 15534 MID 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF TIlE GEORGF('()WN fiRE PROTECfION 
DlSTRICf ADOPTING FINDING" SI fPPORTING AMI"NDM£NTS TO TIlF. 

CAUFORNIA FIRE CODE 

A ,ooolution for tho Georgetown "r~ ProtKtKln Diftn:t ..rung fonh lindtngo with respect '" Io<al , o .. dnioru withiD lhe 

Fi:re Dianct which rna« Cm.Dn roodific ... ,.,,.. ond changes UI the Call1om;'' Fire Cod< I'fttOI\Ibly ........ ry foT 

preoe<Vin, Iirf: ond lik.J.ty in u.. Georse<own Fire Pro<ecUon lMtrict. 

WlfEREAS. Health Il s.My e:.l. Sectio<o 1?9S8,~ ponai ... Fin Pt'<II«<ion DIana '" """"" an ocd_ 
which chang .. 01 """,i6 .. u.. Stote H_int! rqulotiono odopo.ed pum1ltU 10 Helh" I: s.r.ty Cod< Se<tion 179n IIpOII 

d"",rmi ... tion that ",<I. chan,. or mo,hlic_ ore ~ due ,0 l<x ll condiliotu ,h .. pm"'" ~t>oIU govrrnins 
cOIlditions hourd_ to lift. prop<ny and <he .."vircJnm ..... £rom fire, HpIooi.on. huudous .... ,.,.. .. and haurdow \lOS; .,., 

WHEREAS, H .. lth lit Safety Cod. Scrti<m 1?958.7 m<"'"" that. Dirt"",', Soud of Di=ton mAking . "Y 
dunB<" or modi/kruoN punuant 10 Health ... Saf..,. Code Section 179S8.5 .haII mob e:q>rea Iirtdi..!lg that NCb ch",,11'" 

or m",hlicotioru or • .....o.d: and ahalllile • copy of Ncb cba""" 01 modifications with tho Depo""", .. of Il_~ and 

Commumty IXvdopment. 

WHEREAS. ,It., uniqu< Ioc:aI dim.tic. ~~cal. ,1><1 ,opogrophk.l condiuons ~ within tho boundari.. 01 

the Diocria .... k it roo<lDllbly _ .... ry for tho DiIuia to ' '''f''O'' more "ringon, "'Iwnmonu tIuon ... !Onh in th. 

eaw;,nu.. Fi.., Co<Ir ODd punuont to Cahfomia Health .nd Sok<y Cod • ..ruoru 13869.7 ond \J'95II.7. <he District deo.in:o 

.0 make oxpnoo findings to that offort. 

NOW. THEIUJ'OiU':. 6£ IT Rt:SOL vrn that <he brd at [)Uocton of tho c-B"'own Fir. ProtoctioD District. 
./tor havin& duly notic..!. ond held public~. I>om:by odopts tho !i:>L\ow1nS fir>dinga concoming ""<Tal, tutique local 

conditions that """,,,or mob .. cb rnodtlk .. Oon to tht: C.hJ;,mio Fire Oldo . .......-bly -...ory to J>tO"'ido .d"'lu", 

ond oiJocti ... ~ of life. property ond tho ..,vironmonI m(IrO . pocific.Jly"" forth .. follow>; 

 20-0203 H Page 35 of 41



, '"""'" 

nNDlNGS Of fACT 
FOR 0iANG£S OR r.tODtnCATIONSTOrnE STAT! BU1LDINGSTANDARDS 

000f: (TTT1.E 14 PART 9) BECAUSR OF lOCAL CONDmONS 

A_ d ... 'oru.>d .... M>n. oM brd tJi Duorton of tho Gcoq..., .. n fin P<o<O<1ion Di>trict. h<Hby find. ,h .. due \0 

Ioal ohman<. ,,,1. ODd 'o>poJr>ploc COt>d.,tIOnI. .... .,ed within this docum.",. oMr~ ;. • r>«<i <0 Pt'(lYido tho 

IDOdtlinu" ......... <.haitI"" <entaut.ed iD tho adopn ... W, ... ,,« tJi 1M C.hfomill Fin Cod •. Sw:h <han, ..... dHmed 

III b. ",-.obly DKftNI)' <0 p<O>'lcIt ~ ODd cffect;"., p.oc«.ion oflif •. p<0p""'. ond oM <"_"<>IUIl<n' 

1M ~--. fin """~ Dwtnct ~ fin pmtKtion ........... ncr medical ~rvk ... """ .~>&Ii,ed """"" 
____ CO .ppoun .... ,<Iy ....,. ,,,,,, ... M ...od<ou '" I .1&h1J-.... ..., (87l IQUI'" .w. ...... T'bc Di>tric< .. lo<oted on ,he 

_.,." aIop< ol El 000-"'" CouDly. Tho ,opc:v.pb, ollhe DiAri<t r.....,. from 't>Ilin& bill> 0( ...... nd ""k woodllnd 

... tbo .. _ w o.oi limb« ... t:Iw 1ltql dnoin.ol"" 0( tbo ."~. The ..... bo, condi' ....... ary hom h.nlnl 
,_,............ wtth _ .. -..1 ... _ itt _ft ........ -. , .... p.-......... ""' ..,..wl,- .. <ft'd 100 d ..... .... 

n... "-"ow:! "'" Proo .... _ Diotri<I io OIl -,11·","- "JftK)'. n.. Oiocrict poni<il"',a In' ooph'Kio:llN ... 'o .... ic 

ad !'"'V.'" .Dd .. dupat<hed ,"""'P ............. by oM c...J,fomla Dol"'n.tIl .... of fomuy ,rod n... P,e .. C'lioft (c.I. 
f"""~. e·m, ... n.....-.,.. 01. tbo Doorna...u ~ 10, ODd d .. l WIth. ony.,.,. 01 • .., ...... 11<)' The ,e",,-fIre 
Proo_- ... <his __ II br..d ODd utdo.da ta!""'- \0 Ii_.-.b Ind odoo- h'y ...... elOn •• ,I, .... public: 

_ a&. ~ .... ,erioh dICidoeau • ....t;.;:oJ .id. ..... p<cl.Wzed .--

1M Diomt>; h.oo "'blBbed ceo. Ml "me. ...rJed 6t-o _ w 1000. _1btc lite __ co P"""'" ....... ...,. 

~ co .he _tmlfy f" .... ~ 61 .. Io<ooed ... "'" ~Dit_ "'" ed cow. 0( GootJ<cown ... 62a1 M .... s..-. 
f" .... S<ouon til" 1o<at<oI_ 7l3l WoaowonbSpriotp loed. ~ r ... St __ 6J .. 10<-..1 .. 4900 VoIcuovUloo 

...... C-~ ,1ft s.._ 64 .. Itx.ed ... ., lO6'5 SIi&n M .... 1Iood. G ... nwood. f"lft Su,lO" 65 10 I .. e ... d •• 

I~I Saad r.tooonWD Buulo-v.nI. ~n no. 0I0triC'I 10.0 I fuU Ii_. CO'- poe.--...I, """" wi.k ..... 

admituotr." ... """""" """'_. 

B. Ojm ..... 

no.c.o...,~ r .... p..,....-- o..m.:. ........... """ .1Ooo1alJ1 ~ n.. Durntt .... b,..-t \0 low _ "'fIlII 

... "", ... 1 .ft ..... JOOwfal1 III tbe .......... _,. 0( 1 il>cw.. ... odd,."" .. '" .~ '-. taillfall ol15 co 12 iD<:boa ~l 
yeu 'llto:oe..t..:no _au... cond,1JOM c..-. -.. hou.nlow "'"'" eoood __ W IIooduI& .... 011 .. _k .lido 

ho ..... 010". lbo .. ,h. ocu. "'""'" """'i .... ~l ........ ,he DIotnco fro..he _DdiB, UHO. 0...10 ponodo 01 
n.ittf.U .• Iona.....w. ........... d ..... , .. , II .. ohIlky 0( doe F, .. P, ........... ' o.n.. co,...... ;'1IM'<ho .... ~"'" 

fBI""'""" "floe dflay«l. no- ............. duDoo:" +._ ~ ~ iot, Jar., ."",bet 01 ".,Ioicu.la • ...,...ou 
<hot ploco _teaM ........ nu on .ho ... i\.oloJuy 01 ...... "'" fBpolIM to ,....ro.-..... 'V"<)' '-"t. Ii,.. ,wi. hour ...... 

mlt"-;.t. """,..-01. IttId A .... liP..... n... cIuo>ouc ................. """" ~ Ut .... 1>otonnoI .. roul lock 0( oloiIXy tJi .Iot 

Fi ... PtooorttOll Oioorict '" ~ ........... .-Iy.o «boa IJPI'l 0( ... .........,. ............ rIoao l1«li1. Elwotplot 01 m-
..... ,."'" ",u.ltOnt Ibdude 0lNC'nU'C ...... WIldland .Dd k>rnt fins I\oodina. ..... nI_ ... ,oriAl. m<tdmu. 

........ noy ..,toLe,1 .. .II •••• IIk .. o<e;,;..." ....... ~..-. 1"M....raal ad.- .... bloolted with ~ 

Ii •• "-8.",,1 .. mi&h' noc b. _b~ d ... to """""" cbmotic ,,,,",,,nooN-, --.". o •• ntaUy blotlta, _ UtIO the 

''',,, .. 
St, ..... rr: 

Resolution 2019-()4 Page20fS 

 20-0203 H Page 36 of 41



These local climatic conditions afti:Clthe acceleration. intensity, and 5ize of fires in the Fire District. Times of little or no 

rJinfal1. low humiJity . and high temperatures create extremel) hazardous condition~. particularly as they re late to the 

wildland urban interfdce. Winds e'perienLl!J in this arl!d Lan have J signiticant impau upon structure fires . especiallv in 

buildings in close proximity to one another. and tn wildlands commonly found in the GeorgetClwn Fire Protection 

District. Strucrurcs built within the Ceorgetown Fin' Prutection District must be built with these varia hies in mind. 

C. Geological. The Ceorgetown Fire Protection District is located within moderate activity setsmtc Zone Three. The 

seismic. geological conditions present a potential for multiple tires. major breakage of water mains. multiple electrical 

power failures. multiple collapsed structures and a large numher of calls for emergency medical aid. all of v"hich may 

occur simultaneously Juring a seismic <"vent. The water distrin has numerous water-pumping systems used for fire 

suppression water delivery, as well dS water sturagt' tanks providing water system pressure. Most of the pumping 

systems are dt'pendent on electrical power for operation Such electrical power may not be available during a seismic 

event. \Vater stordge tanks used for the storage of required fire suppression water may also collap5e in such an event 

forcing the additional need to transport water \ ia additional pieces of fire apparatus which will place a significant 

restraint on the dbility of the District to provide the required emergency service~. 

Summary: 

Local geographic and geological features and processes exist within the boundanes of the district that may hamper the 

ability of the Ceorgcrown Fire Protection District to perform its sworn duties. Fire following an earthquake has the 

potential of tausing greater loss of life dl1d damage than the earthquake itself. 

D. Topographical. The District is primarilv composed of areas that are considered by the State to be high fire hazard 

severity zones. Much of the DisrriCf is located within foothill terrain. covered with highly combustible vegetation. 

including the presence of many coniferou< furested areas. The elevation within the District ranges from at 1.000 feet to 

over \.800 feet dt the highest point Siopt' within tht> Distrtct ranges from 0 degrees (090 degrees. The structures within 

:he areas ()f fu()thills terrain hdve \en limited tire access. due to narrow roadwavs with steep grade~ dnd poor road 

surface cO l1ditiom . The presence llf man v existing ~tru( lures within the high tire hdlard severity zone areas provides for 

a veT) high potential of a structure fire spreading into a wildland or forest fire LOndilion as well as the potential for a 

wildland or forest fire spreading to qructurcs. 

Summary: 

The alignment of canyons. valleys . ,md slope~ inll' Inhabited areas. combined with the variable nature of the terrain. 

)i1eld potential for increased fire risk. \1ost strucrures. bot h residential and commercial. are in or are surrounded hy 

..treas that contain ,ignificant grass. brush. mixed oak \""odland. and mixed Lonifer fuel load. Due to drought conditions. 

beetle infestations . and lack of vegetation management, milch of the area is populated with t'ither dead or dying trees. 

contributing lo extreme fire danger 

E. Conclusion: 

Rl'~olution 201 9-04 Page J of 5 

 20-0203 H Page 37 of 41



Loul <lim.tic g""'Sl"ophic. ond t"P"l'~phic conditKmi deocribcd.bovc in«.,. .. 1M !Hquency. lnt<mlty. 1M";.., of 

fir .. inv<>lving bu~din" in Ih. Fi..., District. Fum..., th ... conditio ... implCt poI.ntiol damag<' 10 .lJUCtu..." from." 
.arthquoh and .ub<equent fi, •. Tho~o...,. it .. ~uorW,ly noceury that the California fir. coo. be modified 10 

mitiglt. tM effort< of tM abov. conditio", 

CaWbmi. Heallh &: S&f«y coo. Section 17958.7 ~";",,, !hat modiJiclltioru \0 ~ Fir< Cod. II< """rftIly marked and 

idontiMd .. to which .och findin3 ...r ... to which Cod. modrlication. The anoched AppendiJ; II prnYidor tlW 

ron ... ,,"on. 

INTRODUCED ... ,egoJ"' .... eting of the b,d of Dil«toro of tho GM" .. own Fir. Prot«tion Districl on 

Octobe, 10th. 1019. 

P!lSSW AND ADOPTED at. 'OBU"'r mot1in& of the &.rd of (hrecton <>f,h. Georgetown Fir. Prnt«:tion 

Diotri<:t on O<tob<r IOJ>. 2019 by the roU<>wing roll aU v<>U' 

IIBSENT }}1t2..t--e:rOQ.S 1)AU\~ lOti\,) 

ABSTAIN, t.J,ouE. 

ATIEST: BY 

Resolution 2019 .. h4 Page'; of S 

 20-0203 H Page 38 of 41



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 

101.1 X Admin 

105.6.27 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ical 

503.2.5 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

503.2.6 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.4 X Cli ma tic/Geologica I/T 0 pogra ph ica I 

503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

509.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra ph ica I 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra ph ica I 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra ph ica I 

4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra ph ica I 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

 20-0203 H Page 39 of 41



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 

6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

6112.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix B: Table B105.1{1} X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix B: Table B105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0104.4 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

101.2 through 101.5 X Admin 

102.6 through 102.8 X Admin 

102.10 through 102.12 X Admin 

103.1 through 104.1 X Admin 

104.3 through 104.4 X Admin 

104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin 

104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin 

104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin 

104.11.3 X Admin 

105.2.3 X Admin 

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin 

105.6.12 X Admin 

105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin 

105.6.37 X Admin 

105.6.39 X Admin 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin 

105.6.48 X Admin 

105.6.50 X Admin 

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin 

107.1 X Admin 

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin 

110.4.1 X Admin 

113.1 X Admin 

 20-0203 H Page 40 of 41



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
303.1 through 303.9 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

305.1 through 305.5 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

306.1 through 306.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

307.1 through 307.5 X Cli matic/ Geologica I/T 0 pogra p h ica I 

308.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.2 X Admin 

308.3 through 308.4.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

310.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.3 X Cli matic/ Geologica I/T 0 pogra p h ica I 

310.4 through 310.8 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

311.1 through 311.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

319.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

319.2 X Admin 

319.3 through 319.10.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

403.10 through 403.10.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

405.5 X Admin 

510.3 X Admin 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1.5 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

1103.2 X Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0101.1 through 
X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra phica I 

0102.1 

Appendix 0: 0103.4 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0104.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

0104.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix 0: 0105.1 through 

0105.4 
X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

0106.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix 0: 0107.1 (excluding 
X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

exceptions) 

Appendix 0: 0108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

 20-0203 H Page 41 of 41


	Resolution_Georgetown
	Reso Georgetown 2-25-20



