RESOLUTION NO. XXX-2020
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF ELDORADO
(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 017-2017)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is
updated by the State every three years; and,

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January I, 2020; and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part
2, Chapter I, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety
regulations to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building
official, or his or her authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or
his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of EI Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the
chief of the Lake Valley fire protection district, or hisor her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and
maintain a memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities
pertaining to the inspection of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on 12th of December 2019, the Board of Directors of the Lake Valley Fire
Protection District adopted Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopted the 2019 California Fire
Code with amendments the Districtdeemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or
topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District and
delegates enforcement of the ordinance to the Lake Valley Fire Protection District Chief, or his
or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following
sections:

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 114.1, 114.2, 202, 302.1,307.1.1
307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4,
503.6, 503.6.1, 505.1, 505.1.1, 506.1.1, 506.1.3, 507.5.4.1, 507.5.7,604.1.2, 901.4.7, 901.11,
901.12,901.13,901.14, 902, 903.1, 90 3.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4,
903.2.7,903.2.8, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.4.4, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3,
3310.3, 3312.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2,
6102, 6104.2, 6112, 6112 (1) a,b,c,d,e,f, 6112 (2), 6112 (3), 6112 (4), 6112 (5), 6112 (6),6112
(7), 6112(8), 6112(9), 6112(10), 6112(11), 6112(12), 6113.1, 6113.2, 6114, 6115.1, 6115.2,
Appendix D103.1 through DI03.3, Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix D104.2, Appendix

D104.3, Appendix D104.4, Appendix D 105. I, Appendix D105.2.

20-0203 | Page 1 of 50



Resolution No. XXX-2020
Page 2 of 2

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24,
Part 9, in its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International
Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403.4,
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12,
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808,
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106,
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception),

D107.1 (Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G,
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019
California Fire Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of EI Dorado at a regular meeting of

said Board, held the day of , 20__, by the following vote of said Board:
Ayes:

Attest: Noes:

Kim Dawson Absent:

Clerk of the Board of Supervisors

By:

Deputy Clerk Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Board of Supervisors

20-0203 | Page 2 of 50



 LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

“Serving the Community Since 1947”
Tim Alameda, Fire Chief

Beand of $hirectans

teona Allen A
Robert Bettenconrt "57:

Jaho Rage ' ¢

Hran Hogan
tars Maoore

December 18,2019

Don Ashton. Chiel” Administrative Officer
1 Dorado County Board of Supervisors
330 Fair Lane

Placerville. CA 95667

Subject:  Resofution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District,
which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code with amendments related to local climatie,
geographic and topographic conditions.

Pear Mr. Ashton:

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District is requesting the Board ol Supervisors (BOS) ratify its
Ordinance No. 2019-01 which adopts the 2019 Calilfornia Fire Code as amended due to specitic local
climatic. geographic and topographic conditions. Calitornia lHealth and Safety Code Section 13869.7
requires the legislative body of the city or county where the ordinance will apply 10 ratify, modily or
deny the adopied ordinance. The BOS must also delegate enlforecement of the ordinance 1o either the Fire
District (or its representative) or the Chiel Building Olhcial.

Therelore. we request the County Board of Supervisors ratity Ordinance No. 2019-01 with amendments
to the 2019 California Fire Code. and delegate the enforeement of that Ordinance 1o the Lake Valley
Fire Protection District Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed lor your review and use on this

lopic.
This resolution has no direet fiscal impact to the County.
Sincerely.
f
— " ('/.A;‘ Mcr/(:x./\

Tim Alameda
[“ire Chiel

ATTACHMENTS:

1. Lake Valley Fire Protection District Ordinance No. 2019-01

2. Lake Valley Fire Protection District Finding of Fact Resolution No. 2019-08
3. Draft €l Dorado County BOS Resolution

Respect. Integrity, Dedication, Positive Aditude and Teamwork

22 heetth oS Take fahoe U8 9ATI0 @ (330) 37728737 @ Fiay 3TT-A730 0w FakeValleybire oy

20-0203 | Page 3 of 50

A




Attachment No. 1

LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT,
ORDINANCE NO. 2019-01

20-0203 | Page 4 of 50



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION BISTRICT
ORDINANCE NO, 2019-01

NUE POR THE LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTCUTION DISTRICT

AN URGENMUY ORDIN.
AMENTHNG THE FIRECODE OF THE DISTRICT PERTAINING TOTHE AMENDMENT AND
ADOPTION OF THE U9 EDITION OF THE CALIFPORNIA BUILDING STAMDARDS CODE
(TITLE 24 CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS), PART 9 20M9CALITORMA FIRE
COURY INCLUDING APPENDICES 8, CL B ML L Mand O, AND AEPEALING ORIIMNAMCE
NUMBER 2006-00 OF THE LARKE YALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT AND ALL
OTHER ORDINANCES AMD PARTS OF THE ORIMNANCES IN COMNFLICT THERTWITH.

WIHEREAS, fire protection districts are generally required to adopt the State Building Stundards,

and

WHEREAS, Hee protection distriels are allowed to make amendmienis (o those state standards when
pustitied by local wopographienl, elimatic and geographica! conditions. und

WIHEREAS. contemparanconsly herewith e Soard of Dreectors bas owmde such Hindings and
directed that they be subinitted o the State forthaith

NOW U THERDVOR BLITORDAINED BY THE LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION
DISTRICT, AR THE GOVERMNING BOARD OF THE DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS

sectiems b FINBINGS OF FACT:

Section 2 ADOPTION OF CORE WIFH EXCLUSIONS:

section B LOCAL AMENDMENTS:

Septuon 4 CONFLICT:
mectnon S SEVERABILITY.
Seetioon & EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

20-0203 | Page 5 of 50



SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FAC
The Lake Valley Fire Protection District (LVF?I)) makes cerlain changes (listed
below} to the California Fire Code, 2019 Editlon, pursuant to Health and Safety Code Sections
128697, 179587 and 18941.5 during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary
because of local climatic, geological and/or topographic conditions. The LVFPD has adopted,
pursuant 10 Section 18941.5 of the California Heslth and Safety Code, the findings of facty relative o
these conditions by Resolution #2019-08 of the LVFPD dated November 14, 2019,

SECTION 7: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
The LVFPD adopis the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Pant 9, jn its entirety, mncluding
Appendices, incorporating those sections of the Internstional Fire Code, 2018 edition not sdopted by
the state, with the exclusions listed below:

Exclusions: 105.6.17-105.6.19, 105.6,39, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 3116, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-
403.2.4, 403.3, 403 .4, 4036, 401.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8,1.7}, 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3,
403.11, 403.12, 404.1-404 4, 405.1-405.4, 403.6-405 9, 406, 305-307 (adopting 807.5.2), 808, 904.1.1,
1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9 (sdopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1 104-1106, Chapter 25, Chapter
26, the exceptions under D104.2, DI06.1, DIO7.1 {1}, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appeadix G,
Appendix §, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopled cen be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019
Califoraia Fire Code.
SECTION 3: LOCAL AME
The following Sections sre hereby amended or added:
Chapter |
Section 101 Scope snd Genersnd Requirements
1811 Tige shall be amended as follows: add name of jurisdiction [Lake Valley Fire
Protection District]

- Section 183 Permin
198.6.27 LPG-gas shail be amended as follows: Add 1o the sxcaption: At or sbove 5,000
ot @? slevation, 8 permit is not required for individual containers with 2 125-gallon water

capacity or jess, or multiple container systems having an aggregate quantity not excesding
125 gallons serving occupancies in group R-1,

2

20-0203 | Page 6 of 50



Section 106 Fees

syien inspection Fees shall be sdded as follows: A schedule
of fees ndmpmd by the Fire District Board of Directors for Plan Review, Inspections and
the issuance of Permits by the Fire District may be found in the most curvent District fee
schedule (Health and Salety Code 179313

86.6.1 Cost Recoverv Fees shall be added as follows: Fire service foes may be charged
10 any person, fiem, corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law,

or a5 a rzsult of carelessness, i3 responsible for the cause of the Fire Distriet to respond 1
the scens of an incident. A district bosrd may charge 8 fee to cover the cost of aay service
which the district provides or the cost of enforcing any regulstion for which the fes is
charged. (Health snd Safety Code 139168} The fee shall not exceed the actus] comt of
m;msxmg&w fire and/or responding: o the seene of an incident.

06,7 Administrative Costs shall be added 25 follows: When 2 test or inspection i
scheduled and the contractor Fails to perform o the satisfaction of the authority having
jurisdiction, the suthority having jurisdiction may bill the comiractor for actual time spent
traveling 0 snd from the est/inspection location and the time speat 81 the test/inspection

sitm az well a3 administrative sosis.

Section 118 Violations
ntlon Penalties shall be amended as follows: Persons who shall violate a
provision of this code or shall fail 1o comply with sny of the requiremants thereof or who

shali erect, install, elter, repair or do work in violstion of the approved construction
documents or directive of the fire code official, or of 8 permit or cartificate used under
provisions of this code, shall be guilty of s misdemesncr or Infraction, 8l the discretion of
the prosecuting sttorney o7 agency, punishsble by 2 fne not exceeding 3100.00 for s first
vielation, 2. A fise not axcesding $500.00 for & second violation of the same provision
within one yesr; 3. A Tine not exceeding §1000.00 for each additional violation of the
same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 180 days, or both such
fine and imprisonment. Each day that # violation continues after due notics hes been
served shsll be deemed 8 ssparate offense. (Health snd Safety Code Section 13145 and
1765

20-0203 | Page 7 of 50



- 110.4.2 Citations shall be added as follows: The Chief| or histher duly suthorized
representative, may issue citations for infractions or misdemeancr violations of this code
pursuant to Section 13871 of the Health and Safety Code of the State of California and
Chapter 5¢ (commencing with Section B33.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the
State of California.

- Section 112 Stop Work Order

- 112.4. Failure to Comply shall be amended as follows: Any person who shall continue
any work after having been served with 8 stop work order, excepl such work as that person
is directed to perform 1o remove & violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable 10 & fine of
not less than one hundred (3100} dollars or more than one thousand {($1,000) dollars.
{Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995).

- Section 114 Reserving of Rights

- 114.1 Geperal, There is reserved, to the Board of Directors of the District, the right to
amend, madify, supplement, revoke in whole, or in pan, any of the provisions contained or
incorporated herein, at any time and from time 1o time,

- 114.2 Limitation of Rights, Mothing herein contained shall be deemed to limit or restrict the
rights, duties or obligations given, granted or opposed upon this District by the lsws of the
State of California now in effect or hereinafier adopted.

Chagpter 2

- Section 202 General Definitions

- Add definition for Approved shall mean - as accepted by the Fire Chief of said District or
their authorized representative, or as approved pursuant to the standards now existing or
hereafter adopted by the District.

- Add definition for Campfice shall mean - a fire which is used for cooking, personal
warmith, lighting, or aesthetic purposes. This includes fires contained within outdeor
fireplaces and enclosed stoves with flues or chimneys, stoves using jellied, liquid, 20iid, or
gaseous fuels, porable barbecue pits, braziers, or space heating devices which are used
outside of any structure, mobile home, or any living sccommodation mounted on 2
vehicle.

- Add definition for Corporation or Dis
District.

yunsel shall mean - the anomey for the

20-0203 | Page 8 of 50



Add definition for District shall mean - the District and sll ather sreas within the exterior
boundaries thereol 88 now or hereafler established.

Add definition for Drivewsy shall mean - & vehiculsr scoess that serves no more than
thres dwelling units on & smg%e parcel, and any number of sccessory buildings.

Add daﬁnmfm for Exseutive Body shall mean - the board of direstors of the Districn,
Add definition for Fire Chiel shall mean - the Chiel Executive Officer of the Fire
Department/District serving the jurisdiction, or a duly authorized represeniative,

Add definition for Jurisidiction

Add definition Tor Persunds) shall mean - all persons, firms, associates, organizations,
corporations, individuals or ather agency.

Add definition for Shall shall mean - mandatory .

Add definition for May shall mean - permm;ﬁwc
Add definition for Tralned Crowy ger shall mean - standby personnel, usually 8

security guard or usher p:momai who are trained in the proper procedure 1o exit people
from a tent or other place of public sssemblage in &n orderly and calm fashion in the event
of an emergency.

Chapter 3

Section 302 Definiticas

383.1 Deflinitions shall be amended as follows: Added Campfire definition as shown
ehove in ﬂ?&gvm 2

Section 387 C}pw Burning, Recreational Fires and Porfable Outdoor Fireplaces

367.5.1 Open bumm& campﬁm& WHF ires, ;:@mh%e outdoor fireplaces and recregtiona) fires,
shall be prohibited when atmospheric conditions or local circumstances make such fires
hazardous including when. in the judgment of the Fire Chief or his designes, the menace of
destruction by fire to life, improved propeny, or nstural resources i, or is forecast @ become,
extreme due to critical fire weather, fire suppression forces being heavily commitiad 1o
control fires already burning, scwte dryness of the vegetation, or other factors that may sause
the rapid spread of fire such as high winds, low fuel moistures, fire weather or Red Flag
Warnings, severs threat of wildland fire, or ssuance of Fire Restrictions on lands adjacent to
the District by the United Siates Forest Servics or Ca iFire,

Exceptions:

i, Prescribed buming for the purpose of reducing the impact of wildland fire when
authorized by the fire code official.

20-0203 | Page 9 of 50



2. Gae (LPG, NG) outdoor fire pils and barbeques, pellet grills/smokers. Except during
Red Flag conditions. All Open Burning, Campfives, Bonfires, Portable Gutdoor
Fireplaces and Recrentional Fires are prohibited during Red Flag Wamings.
3. Campfires and charcoal barbeques in » designated campground andlor picnic area
located on Stae of Federal lnnds,
4. Charcoal barbeques for & commercial restaurant, catering operation or special event,
with additional restrictions as permitted by the District.

j strictions shall be added as follows:
- 307.4.4.1 It is unlawiul for any person o light, maintain, or use & campfire upon or near

any brush-covered land, grass-covered land, or forest-covered land during the time when
burning permits are suspended by the Director of the Depaniment of Forestry, the
CALFIRE Unit Chief, or the suthority having jurisdiction.

- 307.4.4.2 When camplires sre sllowed, it should be unlawiul for any person o Hght,
maintain, or use & campfire upon any brush-covered land, grass-covered land, or forem
covered land uniess the following minimum requirements are complisd with,
307.4.4.2 {a) The area within 5 feet of the periphery of the compfiee s cleared of 8l
flammable material and vegetation

- 37.4.4.2 (b) One servicesble shovel with s handle of @ least 12 inches is ready for use ot
the immediate area of the camplive,
307.4.4.2 {¢} Campfires shall be limited 50 1"z 1" foot, unless in an approved manufactursd
covking device or fire ring.
37.4.4.2 {d} Wrinen permission of the landowner must bes obiained prior to the ignition
of the camplire snd shall be on site,

Chapter 5

Section 503 Fire Apparatus Access Roads:

503.2. 1 Dimeosions shall be amended as follows: Fire apparatus acoass rouds shall have
an unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet, exclusive of shoulders, curbs snd gutters,
except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 303.6, aad unobstructed
vertical clearance of not less than 15 feet. Al driveways in the District shall not be less
than 12 feet wide,

503.2.5 Dead Ends shall be amended a5 follows: Dead-end fire spparsius access roads
mﬂ drwmsys in excess of 150 feet in length shall be provided with an spproved ares for

turning sround fire apparatus.

20-0203 | Page 10 of 50




Bri d El faces shall be samended as follows: Where a bridge or
sn elevated surface is part of s fire apparatus scoess road, the bridge shall be constructed
and maintained in accordance with any current County Bridge Standard. Bridges and
aelevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed loads of
fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when
required by the fire code official. Whers clevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle
use are adjacent 1o surfaces which are not designed for such use, approved barriers,
approved signs or both shall be installed and maintained when required by the fire code
official.

503.4.2 No Parking in Fire Lanes shail be added as follows: No person shall stop, park,
or leave standing any vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary to
avoid conflict with other traffic or in compliance with the directions of & fire code official,
peace officer or officiel traffic control device along the edge of any highway, et any curb,
or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or opersted off-street parking facility,
designated as a fire lane by the fire department or fire district with jurisdiction over the
area in which the plece is located. The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted
immediately adjacent to, and visible from, the designated place clearly mtating in lotters
not less then one inch in height that the place is & fire lane, (2) by outlining or painting the
place in red and, in contrasting color, marking the place with the words “FIRE LANE",
which are clearly visible from s vehicle, or (3) by a red curb or red paint on the edge of the
mmfway upon which is ciaariy marked the words “FIRE LANE".

o Parking in Front of Hydrants shall be edded es follows: No person shall
stop, p&rk or leave mnémg sny vehicle within 15 feet of & fire hydrant except as follows:
{a) If the vehicle is attended by & licensed driver who is seated in the front seat and who
can immediately move such vehicle in case of necessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or

operated %)y a fire depmrtmcm and is clearly marked a5 a fire department vehicle,

: Lanes Based pn Road Width shall be added as follows: Fire Lanes shall be
based on road width as mqumd in Appendix [ s adopted locally.
503.6 Security Gates, Add the following to Section 503.6 of the California Fire Code:
Private road gated entrance:
i. Gate openings to be 2' wider than the roadway served.
2. Emergency vehicle access shall be provided by both & “Knox™ over-ride switch and an

approved emergency radio frequency gate opening device (Click2Enter type) or other
device approved by the authority having jurisdiction.

20-0203 | Page 11 of 50



3. An approved hammerhesd, tam-around bulb or other means of tum-around shall be
provided on the entry side of the gate.

4. Geates chall sutomatically open from the interior without use of a special code or
devies. {Magnetic strip or pressure pad sssemblies are acceplable}.

5. All eleciric gaies sheil fail in the open position, L2, loss of power, battery failure. All
gates shail be cquipped, &1 2 minimuem, with 12-hour battery backup.

& Vertical clearances shall be no leas than 15

7. Gate shall be loceted no closer than 307 From the intersecting rosdway ultimate sdge of
pavement.

8. Provide a separate personne! gate or opening sized and surfaced 1o allow for

pedesirian snd sccessibility access.
9. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and
rep%awd or mpaxmd when defective.

X gtes fo shdential driveways shall be added a3 follows: Gated
residential drwamys shalf have 2 key opaated override switeh installed for fire
department acoess. The swilch shall be & Knox System type key switch with "Fie
Department” decal.

Section 305 Premise Ideatification
ication shall have the first line of this paragraph replaced as

follows: Addresses ﬁ:)r new and existing buildings shall comply with the loca! district
address standard a3 apmwd by the fire code official.

503 on, Location aw il ddresses shall be added a5 follows
i Al% %}m!ﬂmg& s&ai! awe E pemamt%y paamd ssﬁdsms which shall be g&amd al each
driveway entrance and visible from both directions of travel slong the road. In ail
cases, the sddress shell be posted at the beginning of construction srd shall be
maintained thereafter, and the address shall be visible and legible from the road on
which the address is located.

3. Address signs along one-way roads shall be visible from both the intended direction of
wavel and the oppesite direction,

3. Whaere multiple addr
single post.

4. Where 8 roadway provides ecoess solely 1o # single commercial or indusirial business, the
address sign shall be placed st the nearest road intersection providing access 1o that site,

esses are required &t 8 single driveway, they shall be mounted on s

20-0203 | Page 12 of 50



- Bection 506 Key Boxes

< 306.1.1 Locks shall be amended as follows: Any structure which has sccess controlled
by an elgeiric gate shall have a kay operated override switch installed for fire departmen
access, The switch shall be & Knox System type key switch with "Fire Department™

ey boxes » sprinkder systems shall be sdded as
f‘al!a% Any buﬂdmg or comp!ax m“ bu;ldmgx, in which an automatic sprinkler system
is installed, shall be provided with 2 Knox Box®@, mounted in an approved locstion,
containing appropriate keys for fire department sceess. This section applies o il new
installations and existing installations, 83 required by the Fire Chief,

- Bection 587 Fire Protection Water Supplies
meyval shall be added as follows: No person shall place, push or dump

snow uﬁwmmmﬁmy fire hydrant oc fire department connection, and 2 minimum of fifleen
{15) foot clear space shall be maintained to the front and sides of any hydrant or fire
department connection.

hereby adopts & public mwms mm%;s fund infrastructure and capital
improvements (Pantnership Fund) 1o receive contributions of cash or property qualifying
under Internal Reveave Code Section 170 sy s charitable contribution if the contribution or
gift is made for exclusively public purposes. Contributions to the Partnership Fund shall be
muintained and sdministered 83 8 wparsie wust fund subject to investment restrictions
applicable to the district in the management of itz fund and administered o permit
expenditures of sccrued principal and interest after deductions of reasonable costs of
sdministration, for infrastructure snd capital improvement scquisitions. Operations and
maintenance, including but not limited to mobile water supply apparatus such a3 fire boai(s),
andior waler tender(s).

Chapter §

Section 604 ~ Electrical Equipment, Wiring and Haxards:

: 604,11 1 lations shall be added as follows: Emergency power systems and
mﬂdby pawer systems shall be installed in scoordance with this code, MFPA 110 and NFPA
P11, Al buildings with stand-by power shall have a shunt irip devies that disconnects sl
power sources o the building, spproved by the Fire Code Oificial. Existing installations shall
be maintained in scoordance with the original approval.

20-0203 | Page 13 of 50



Chapter 9
- Bection 901 ~ Genersh:

1 AT o8 ew and Existing Struciures shall be added ss follows: The
District assumes no responsibility for installation, maintenance, operation or monitoring of

the system the same being solely that of the owner of the structure, The provisions of this
Chapter, and, or those requirements in the Californis Fire Code relating to sutomatic
sprinkler systems shall apply 10 8 structure, and the entive structure shall be mads 10
comply with these provisions, under any of the following circumsiances:

1. When a building permit is issued for 2 new structure, or 2 new structure where no
permit is required uniess plans were previously approved by the Distries prior 1o the
effective date of this chapter, or any structure found o have been constructed after the
effective date of this chapter, without a permit when & permit would havs been required;
or

Z. When there is 2 change in use in sli, or & portion, of an existing structure which would
cause occupancy classification wchange o e Group A, E, H, | B-1, B2 o

3. When 2 building permit is issued to sllow additions 1o be made 10 an existing structure
30 83 to: {1} increase the Totel Firs Area of the original structure greater than ffty percent
(50%) and {2) the sggregate square footage of the existing building and the addition
exceeds the sguare footage threshold in section 9903.2 of the District Fire Code or 3600
squars fest For B3 occupancies including stusched garage.

31,11 Fire Alarms Beauired shall be added as follows: All valves controlling the water
mgrgay for sutomatic mﬁ&w systems anad water-fow switches on all sprinkler sysiems
shall be electrically supervised. Yalve supervision and water-flow alarm and trouble
signals shall be distinaly different and shall be avtomatically transmitted 1o an approved
central smtion, including ®-3 ocoupancies when a

sprinkler systern of more than 100 hesds is inatalled.

981.11 Fire Alarms BRegulated shall be added as follows: Al fire slarm systems installed
o maintained in the District shall be installed and maintained in sccordance with the

requirements of this anicle.

1. All devices and equiproent shall be constructed, installed and maimained in conformity
with National Fire Protection Association Stendard 72 fur central station signaling
systemns. All smoke detectors as required in the California Building Code for residential

6

20-0203 | Page 14 of 50



structures shall be imterconnecied o as W sound an alarm throughoul the entire strusture
should 8 single delestor be activated.

2. When & fire alarm is required, shop drawinga a3 required by NFPA 72 are required 1o be
submitted for review prior to instaliation of such systems.

3. Al fire elarm systems shall be supervised in 8 manner accepiable to the Firs Chief.

4. Upan recommendation of the Fire Chief| the Board of Directors may sdopt by
resolution such additional rules and regulations relating to the installation, maintenance,
and use of fire alarm systems as are congistent with good practices.

5. Every required fire alarm system shall be maintained in good working order end shall
s repaired andfor restored to such within twenty-four {24} hours after sctivation or
fatlure,

6. Any building or complex of buildings with an avtomatic fire alarm system shall be
provided with 2 Knox Box, mounted in an approved location, containing appropriste keys
for fire depariment access. This section spplies to sl new installations end existing
installations a3 required by the Fire Chiefl

ions shall be added as follows: Fire alasrm vendors

1. Upon demand, sach vendor shall provide the Fire Chief with the address of asch
building, place, or premises within the District for which the perminse sells or installs a
fire alarm system.

i. Each vendor who installs or services a fire slarm system shall clearly instruet the
subseriber in parson, aad in writing, in the proper use and operation of the fire alarm
systern, especially those factors which could ceuse false alarms.

1. A vendor at all times shall maintain its equipment in good stals of repair st no cost to
the Department,

4. Any person, firm o corporation providing service under the authority of this article
shall provide repaic service 1 its subscribers within vwenty four (24) hours afler
netiflcation that thers is trouble with the fire alarm system, or the system has
maifunctioned.

5. Esch vendor shall display 1o the Firs Chief, upon request, the permities's records of
inspection and repair of any fire alarm system,

&. Each vendor shall notify the monitoring center whenever s subscriber's fire alarm

system iz under service or repair,

11

20-0203 | Page 15 of 50



903141 s Alnrms shall be added as foliows: Any fire alarm of which continuous
sctivation is determined by the Fire Chiel 1o be & nuisance alarm will subject the owner of
such fire alarm (0 8 one hundred dollar (3100.00) fine.

i : The following definitions shall be added:

mmﬁma any business operated by a person, firm, or corporation who engages in
the setivity of elerting, installing, leasing. maintaining, repairing, replacing, seiling or
servicing fire elarm svstems.

Approved shall mean scoepted by the Firs Chiel and in scoordance with the reguirements of
the Underwriters Laboratories, Inc., the Factory Mutual Engineering Corporation, The
Mational Buresu of Standards, the MNationa! Fire Protection Association, of the State Fire
Marshal,

Audible Alarm shall mean an slarm system, which when activated genermies an sudible
sound on the premises.

False Alarm shell mean an alaom signal, sither silent or audible, prompting 2 response o be
made by the Fire Departmen! when an emergency situstion for which the alarm system was
lmﬂdﬁd does not exist.

i vatem shall mean any manual or sutomatic mesns of detecting fire, and
zmns;mumg sinmxs of fire from privale premises and shall include 2l types of interior fire
alsrms systems and saxalmy fire alarm systems approved by the Districs.

Syatem shall mean sny fire alarm system designed solely to provide an
aiwm 4:»1‘ f e w:&%&m the protected premises.
Sabscriber shall mean & person who owns or leases property or premises on which an slarm
gystem has been installed or s proposed to be installed or who contracts or proposss ©
contract with an alarm business for the leasing, servicing, or maintaining of an alarm system,
and who has or will have the suthority 10 cause the alarm system 1o be serviced, repaired, or
removed after the system is installed.

12

20-0203 | Page 16 of 50



- Bection 903 Fire Sprinklers;
ing shall be added as follows: All sutomatic fire sprinkler sysiems shall

be of the anti-freeze type or other approved non-freezing (including sir fitled) vpe of

system,

303,2.8 Where Required shall be added as follows: Status of existing buildings grester
than 3 6{}(} square feet. In existing buildings 3600 square fest or greater, other than one

and two-family dwelling units, and agricultural buildings not under Special Use Permit for
commercial purposes, where the loor area of the building or structure is increased by an
addition of more than thirty percent (30%) or 1,000 square feet whichever is less, such
huilding or structure shall be made 1o conform to Section 903.2.

03.2.b Where Reguired shall be added as follows: Status of existing buildings less than
3@%’.‘9 square feet. In existing buildings 3,600 sgusre foet or Jess, other than one-and two-
family dwelling units, and agricultural buildings not under Special Use Permit for
commercial purposes, where the floor ama of the building or structure is incressed to 2
tstal sguare footage over 3,600 squars foot, by an addition of more than thirty percent
{3096 or 1,000 square fest, whichever is tess, such building or structure shall be made 1o
conform 1o Section 903.2.

983,21 Group A shall be smended as follows for A groups A-1 through A4 503.2.11
{;}m fire grea excesds 3,600 square foet,
03.2.3 Gropp E shall be amended as follows: 903.2.3 {1} Throughowt sl Group E fire
arses greater than 1,600 squsre fest in area,

43.2.4 Grogp F-1 shall be amended s follows: 903.2.4 Group F. 903.24 {1} A Group ¥
ﬁm Brea cacoeds 3 SO0 squars et

903,27 Group M shell be amended as follows: 903,27 Group Band M. 9032.7(1) A
ﬁmwg} am&s fire wres exceeds 3,600 squars fost,

3,28 Group R shall be amended as follows: 903.2.8.1 shall have the following
nga added 1o the end of the paragraph: Firs sprinkler systems shall be installed in sew
manufsciured homes (HSU sections 18007 & 18009) and multiple family manufactured
homes with two dwelling units (HSC 13008.7) in sccordance with Title 25 of the
California Code of Regulations.

903.2.9 Group $-1 shell be amended as follows: 903.2.9 Group 5. 90329 (1) A Group §
ﬁm area exceeds 3,800 square fost.

13

20-0203 | Page 17 of 50



) Group 5-2 Eaciosed Parking Garages shall be amended as follows: $01.2.10
{1} %ﬁhm the Tire ares of the enclosed psmmg garege excesds 3,600 squars fest.

Ml 44 ¢ cies shaill be sdded as follows: All residential cecupancies
require audible notification in ali sleeping rooms of 8 sprinkler waterflow alarm. This
motification must be ot leam 73db &1 pitlow height.

Section $07 Fire Alsem and Detection Systems:

shall be added as ﬁ:llom An kppmvc:d fire nlarm/detection system shall be snsmiéed in ail
buildings with a floor ares less than 3,600 square feer.
o Exceptions:
*  One- and two- family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies
classified as “LP).
®  Agricultursl bulldings not under Special Use Permit andior not used for
commercial purposes (e.g. retails ssles, food service, and/or special
avents}.
< Buildings with & floor ares less than 500 squsrs feet may be exempt, as
determined by the Fire Chief, besed on building construction material and
festurss, lncation, occupancy type, and distance 1o exposures.

37.2.b Switus of Existine Buildings shall be added as foliows: In existing buildings
withoast an approved sutomatic wmﬁ!&r system, other than ones o two-family dwelling
uniiz, agricultural building not under Special Use permit for commircial purposes where s
fire alarm detection system does not exist and the floor srss of the bullding or structure is
increased or modified by more than thirty percent {30%) or 1,000 square feet, whichever iz
iess, such building or structure shall be made o conform to Section B07 when required by
the Fire Chisl. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square Tost may be exempt, as
determined by the Fire Chief, based on building construction materials and features,
lncation, ococupancy typs, 8nd distance to exposures,

[0 | be added as follows: All fire alarm/detection systems shall be
connecied dumct%y :hmugﬁ and monitored by & U.L. approved central, proprietary or
remote station service, which gives audible and visual signals 8! 8 constantly attended
Jocation, All sprinklered buildings shall be monitored.

14

20-0203 | Page 18 of 50



¢ Exceptions:
= One- and two- family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies
clagsified ag “L™).
= Agricultural buildings not under Special Use Permit and/or not used for
commercial purposes (e.g. retails sales, food servics, andior special
events).

- 9087.2.d Type | Hood Instaliations shall be added ss follows: The requirement of
instaliation, or replacement, of a Type 1 Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinkler
monitoring system 1o be installed, or for the hood system to be connected to an existing
fire alarm/sprinkier monitoring system for that building.

- 507.6.2.1 Secondary Power Supply shall be sdded as follows: In accordance NFPA 72,
the secondary power supply providing & minimum 24-hour power capacity under
quisscent load (system operating in 8 non-alarm condition) shall be amended v e
minimum 72-hour power capacity.

Exception: The existence of an emergency backup power supply that mests or excesds
the requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12,

Chapter 12

- Section 1203 Emergency and Standby Power Systems

- 1203,1.3 Instaliation shall be amended as follows: Emergency power systems and
standby power systems shall be insialied in accordance with the California Building Code,
the Californis Electric Code, NFPA 110 and NFPA 111, All buildings, other then one- and
two-family dwelling units, and agriculturs buildings not used for commercial purposes,
with stand-by power shall have s shunt wip device that disconnects all power sources to
the building, approved by the Fire Code Official. Existing installations shall be
maintained in accordance with the original approval.

Chapter 33
- Section 3310 Access for Firefighting

33103 F ise Identification shall be added as follows: Prior to and during
construction, &n a;xpmvcd address sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency

vehicle sccess road eniry into the project.

15

20-0203 | Page 19 of 50



- Section 3312 Water Supply for Fire Protection
-~ 33121 When requived shall be amended as follows: Required fire hydrants shall be
installed and approved for comtinuous servics prior to combustible materials arriving on
site or vertical construction commencing.
Chapter 49
Section 4905 - Wildfire Protection Building Coastruction
; standurd shall be added as follows: All new construction,

im:iuding additions, requires a Class A roof covering or assembly. All re~roofing requires
Class A roof covering or assembly as & minimum. Re-roofing in excess of fifty (50}
percent of an existing structure within any one-year period will necessitate that the entire
roof be a Class A roof covering or assembly as & minimum. Class B or C fire retardant
treated and/or non-treated wood shake or shingles are not approved as & roof covering

material for Class A assembly.

Chapter 50

- Section 5601 General
- 5001.7 Lisbility for Damages shall be added as follows: Any damages or cost resulting
from the careless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall constituent

debt against any such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge. This
debt is cotlectible by the fire chief in the same manner a3 in the case of an obligation under
contract, expressed or implied.

Chapter 56

- Section 5601 General

gL equired shall be amended as follows: Permits shall be required as set
forth in Section 105.6 and regulated in accordance with this section. Where explosives

permits are required, thoy shall be issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her representative, and
the County Sheriffs Department. Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be
issued by the Fire Chief and the County Board of Supervisars.

5601.2.1 Documentation shall be added as follows: The AHJ shall have the authority to
requast documentation n:gm‘dmg all aspects of the Nreworks presentation,

jon shall be added as follows: The AHJ will protect ali

proprietary information.

16

20-0203 | Page 20 of 50



Chapler 57
Section 5704 Starﬁge

34.2.9.6. ] stions Where Abuve-Ground Tas Prohibited shall be amended
# follows: Smgt @fﬁm f mvd Class H flammable %mmﬁ; in sbove ground tanks cwtside
of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the fee chiell When perminted by the fire chisf,
all shove ground tank{s) or vault instaliations for the storage of Class §, 1 or 11l Nammable
snd combustible liguids shell comply with those reguirements as set forth by the California
Firs Code. The Califomia Fire Code shall aiso apply to installations other than metor vehicle
fuel dispensing stations whare sbove ground storage s required.

Section 3706 .‘L)pecm Operations

06.2.4.4 Locations Where Abg sround ks are Prohibited shall be amended as
follows: Stmg@ of Cim i am% Class 1l ﬁmm&b&c s;;md& in sbove ground tenks oulside
of buildings is prohibited unless spproved by the Fire Chief. When permitted by the Fire
Chief, all gbove ground wnk(s) or vaull installations for the storage of Class §, U oe 11}
farmmable snd combustible liquids shall comply with those requirements s set forth by
the California Firs Code. The California Fire Code shall alzo apply o installations other
than motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where sbove ground storage is required.

Chapter 38

Section 5806 Flammabie Cryogenic Finids
350 ions shatl be amended as follows: Storage of flammable cryogenic Nuids

in stationary containers outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the Fire chief.
When permitted by the fire chief, sll stationary containers for the storage of flammable
cryogenic fluids shall comply with those requirements 23 set forth by the Californis Fire
Code. The California Fire Code shall sleo apply t© installations other then molor vehicle
fuel dispensing stations where above ground storage is required.

Chapter §1

g 6107 Definitioas the following definitions shall be added:
8 sissii maan & storage tank designed for the containment of liquelied petroleum
w or meter assembly ragulsting nstural ges, for use by & customer for residential,

17

20-0203 | Page 21 of 50



commersal, or indukina! purposes, together with appurtenant pipes, risers, gauges, and
;@ﬁ &,aqwé" ied wmiwm fos.

r shall mean any person of business, which sells, ot retall, LPG, or any company,
wim%a wﬁm natural gns, for residentisl, commercial or indusirial use.

ey f Bervier (shall oaly spply o LPG installstions) shall mean the service shaill

m mfﬁamﬁ iz be interrupted whensver service i3 discontinued because of hazardous
condition, change in sime or type of service, whenever the taak, meter, regulston(s), valve or
other exigrior service supply componenis are removed, repleced, or repaired, whensver the
servics is relocated, whenever the bullding, mak piping or components are damaged w the
extent that the servicing utility, fire or building department considers the service o be
petentially hazardous. Normal refilling of sn empty or pastinlly empty tank, and routine
maintenance of interior applisnces, shall not be considered as an interruption of service.

Section 6104 Location of LP-Gas Containers

4 timum Lape ; Limits shall be smended as Pollows:

T‘h&s storage of hf;msﬁw pem:a!ﬁmss gas in axcess of an aggregate of 2,000-galion water
capacity when locsted st least one-half {1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for
residential use and 8t least one-half (1/2) mile from existing residential development with
8 densily gresier than ons {1} dwelling unll por acre aned 82 least one-hall (172) mile Fom
sny hotel or motel is sliowed when A agproved and 8 Special/Conditional Use Permit is
issued by the County

[Hzpensing within established lmits. Within the limits established by lsw resiricting the
dispersion of tguefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested
arsgs, the sggregete capacity of any one installation shall not exceed & water capacity of
3,000 gellons. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of
2.6 gallon water capacity when loceted

#t least one-half (172} mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and &t
femat ooe- hall {113) mile from existing residential development with & density grester
than one {1} dwelling wnit per sors and 8t lasst one-hall (1/2) mile from sny hote! or mote!
is allowed when A spproved and & SpecialConditional Use Permit Is lesusd by the
County.

Sective 6112 High Elevation Liguefied Petrolenm Ga lnstaflations (3008 font
glevations and above) shall be added us follows:
Any new LPG insntiation shall comply with the Bilowing:

ig

20-0203 | Page 22 of 50



{. A permit is required by this Code for individual LPG containers of 125 galloss or gresier
Al the time of application by sny petson for 8 permit to install an LPO sysiem a3 required
bry this Code, the applicant shall submit an LPG plot plan 1o the District for approval and
shall contain the following;

8. Stamp of approval of the prospective LPG supplier.

b. Tank location showing distances 1o structure end edge 1o edge of pavement or othey
idemtifying mark.

. Tank capacity in US gallons,
d. Location of riser pipe &1 building.
e. Property boundaries.

f. An outline of sll existing/proposed buildings on the lot #nd a depiction of the roof ridge
ting of any building 10 b supplied with LPG,

2. Two stage regulstor systems shall be installed on all LPG installations in scoordunce with
manufsciure's instructions, Al firsl sege regulators snd connecting pigiails shall be
instatied under » protective valve cover on tank. All regulators installed under this cover
shall be Hated swd approved for this use snd position of mounting. A connecior providing
flexibility zhall be used w0 connect the first stage regulator 1o the main service valve on the
wnk. All copper pigtails ghall be imternally taned snd use oaly Torged flare nuts.

3. The riser from the veed piping shall be & minimam of Scheduly 80 and shall be located ant
more than 3 inches horizontally from the walls of the tank, and swing joints will be ased
above snd below mak level o provide for tank movement (sirest elbows shall not be used).
An approved flexible alternative is prefemed in Heu of rigid neal pige for the tank riser. This
shall include but not be lenited 1o plastic (PE), copper tubing, stainless steel, ALL
FLEXIBLE MATERIAL USED FOR THE TANK RISER SHALL BE SHEATHED IN AN
APPROVED STEEL COVER FOR PROTECTION. As swing joints are eliminated in an
spproved flexible alermative, sufficient slack must be maintained w allow for tank
movement andfor expansion and contraction of the alternative material. All plastic pips shail
be buried st least 15° below finished grade. An slectrically cominuous corrosion resistam
tracer wive {min. AWG 14} or tape shall be buried with the plastic pipe 1o facilitate locating.
One end shall be brought shove ground at the building wall or riser and the other end shall
be brought above ground o the tank.

19

20-0203 | Page 23 of 50



w

. The second stage regulator and riser pipe shall be installed on the gable and of the building,

&3 close a3 practical to the building wall, unless this is not feasible due 1o structural or
tepographical constraints. An approved gas shutofT valve rated for & minimem of 123 PSY
shall be installed immediately prior to the second stage regulstor. An spproved gas shut off
sign or other identifier shall be instalted directly above the ges shut off valve, on the
building in a visible locetion within three (3) feet of the eaves of the roof or roof line i no
eaves are present. [T the second stage regulator or 8 combination first/second gage regulstor
is used &t the tank, then an approved gas shut off valve shall be located a1 the building.

A protective cover shall be installed over the second stage regulator and mater (if installed)
at the building. The minimum design for the protective cover shell be squal o, or greater
than, the Building Design Load (determined by the building department), snd shall be
securely supported to the ground or diagonally 1o the building well, When supported o the
ground, the footing for the supports shall be founded 6 inches below finished grade. Pro-cast
concrete piers may be used in liss of poursd footings, provided they are placed on stable
soil. If second stage regulator/meter assemblies could be sublect to vehicle damage, then
minimum of 17 stes] crash post filled with concrete shall be instslied for protection. Cragh
posts shall bave & minimum depth in the ground of 24%, embedded in concrete,

Ohwervation and inspection, if eny, by the District shall not constitule an approval of the
weork of installation of the aforementioned profective cover, nor shall it be deemed 1o create
any liability or responsibility on the pert of the District for the design or construction of the
profective cover, noe o any thind party or entity whatsosver.

The rizer pipes for the yurd piping shail not be embedded in concrete, asphalt or other rigld
substance. Such substance placed around & riser shall be heid back at least 3 inches from ali
sides of the pipe. All exposed exterior gus piping ussd for runs along walls or roofs shall be
minimum schedule 80 stoel plpe suppontsd and secuved by approved straps ot intervals not to
excend four (4} feer

LPG wnks shail be permanently marked by & sguare or other approved equal stake of wood
or other material with & minimum dimension of 2° X 1" or a cross sectional width of 2°,
nominal lomber.

Such sakes shall be of sufTicient height 1o rise above the anticipated snow depth, with the
minimum height being 10 feet. The snow stakies shall be veliow in color and will be placed
on the cpposite side of the tank from the riser, and directly opposite the tank valves, The top
twelve iches of the stake shall be painted orange. The side of the stake adjacent to the tank
shall continue with the orange color 3 minimum of 18 inches from the top of the stake.

N

20-0203 | Page 24 of 50



10, Installstion and maimznance of all tank stakes shall be the responsibility of the LPG
supplier, Mo tank shall be filled or serviced unless staked as provided in this chapter.

1. Any supplier supplying propene 1o 8 tenk must &fTix 2 label or other means of identification
o the inside of the wnk valve protective cover. The label or ciher device must be waterprool
and contain the supplier's name and emergency telephone number,

12, All LPG mnks shall be placed oa approved concrete supports. Acceptable tank suppors
shall include, but not be limited 10 Pre-cast reinforced concrete pads, reinforced concrete
siab, or pre-cast reinforced concrete saddies. Use of un-reinforced cinder building blocks is
specifically prohibited. If saddles are used they shall contact & minimum of 110 degrees of
the tank circumference. Asphalt impregnated fislt of not less than 3/8" thickness shall be
installed between the container and the concrete saddle. Supports may by poured in plaoe in
lieu of prefabricated supports. If poured in place it shall b2 & minimum of 4 inches thick and
reinforced with not less than WWF X 12, Wi6 by W26 or 4 #3 rebar in each direction. In
sreas where tank may be subject 1o shifting snow, unstable ground or other hazasdous
condition, the Fire Chief may require sdditional tank supporting, securing or protection.

Section 6113 Undergroand LPG Tanks Instalintions snd Owsership shall be added as
follows:

51131 Permits and Plans. Permits shall be required, and plans shsll be submined for ail
;mdergmmﬁ iank mﬁaimmm as a;:gmm by the AMI

§113.2 Underground LPG Tay gership. Underground LPG tanks shail be
mm@ from bemg soid o end-users and shall be retained by the LPG company under a
lease-type system 1o easure proper annual maintznance requirements are met and
neeorded.

Section 6114 Natural Gas shall be added ss follows:
Existing naturs! gas installations shall comply with the following:

t.  The meter assembly shall be installed on the gable end of the building, 63 close as
practical to the building wall, unless this is not feasible due to structursl or topographical
consiraints,

2. A protective cover, designed to be egual to or grester than the Building Design Load
{determined by the building department), approved by the supplier, shall be installed over
the meter assembly, securely supported to the ground or diagonally to the building wall,

i

20-0203 | Page 25 of 50



When supporied 1o e ground, the footing for the supports shall be founded & inches
below finished grade. Pre-cast concrete piers may be used in lieu poured footings,
provided they are placed on stable s0il,

- Section 115 YViolatioas shall be added a3 follows:
~  §115.1 Violations, 1t shall be unlawiul for an LPG supplier 1o provide seevices 1o 2 LPG
instatlation, which does not comply with the provisions in section 6112 o7 6113

.2 Failure | ovide Cover, Fallure by the customer to provide a cover gs required
fm Y mmml gas meter mmbly ig a violation of thiz code and will subleet the customer o
a one hundred dollar (3100.00) fine.

APPENDIX D - FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS

Section 183 Minievum Swiﬁa&au

cess Rogd W drass shail be smended a8 follows: Exception:
Dﬂw:ways
< P103.2 Grade shall be amended 53 follows:

Fire apparatus access roads shall not excesd 10 porcent in grade.

Exception {: In aress above 5,000 A. clevation, driveways of B3 Ocoupancies shall not exceed
{2 percent in grade, unless otherwise suthorized by the Fire Chief, If approved, the driveway
slope may exceed 12% {12 vertical feet 10 one hundred horizontal feet), provided the driveway
mests or excesds the prescribed minimum width, and is no longer in length than the maximum
permissible height of the structure within such jurisdiction, bt i no case more than 35 fest, and
has the sppropriate transitional slopes ai the edge of pavement to property ling, and has no
significant articulation greater than 43% angle in its entire length).

133 Turning Radius shall be amended as follows: The minimum turning radios shall be
m:m by sfm: fire cods official; and shall not include curb and gutier.

183,35 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates shall be amended as follows: Where & single
Q,ﬁsgﬁgmwﬂm&wwaw@d&sm!wmo:mﬁmnzﬁfm(%m} Where 1 fire
apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall not be less than 15 fest
{4572 mumn).

&cﬁw D4 - ium&mm aaﬂ !sdw:'iat Developments

2104 g e g 62000 5 e feet in area shall be amended sz follows:
Bmldmgs or fmihim %mvmg & gmss bmédmg ares of more than 62,000 square feet shall be
provided with two separate and approved fire apparatus ancess mads. Delets exception.

a2

20-0203 | Page 26 of 50



smanded 8t follows: Whers two scoess rmads are requined, they
M§%M§MMa§me@§%mmwmwfﬁﬁw%ﬂgﬂmf@mm;mm
oversll disgooal dimension of the property or avs 1o be served, measured in & straight line

Exception: Fire spparstus rosds cannol be insalled because of location on property,
wepography, walerways, nonnegstiable grades or similar condition, and an spproved
slwenative means of fie protection is provided.

4.4 Lo e Fire Apps s Rowds shall be sdded s follows When
mqmmﬂ by the Flre {‘?Ma Qﬁ‘mms 8 ﬁ’m awmx wenesy road shall be constructed 10
encompass the sntirety of & structure and shall provide & continuous reeans of emergency
vehicle sovess,

«  Section D183 - Aerial Fire Apparaius Access Ronds
DINSI W ired shall be amended as follows: Buildings or portions of buildings or

t‘m lities w:wdmg 30 feat in height above the lowaest level of fire depaniment vehicls scesss
shall be provided with approved fire spparstus scosss roads capable of sccommodating fire
department serisl spparstus. Overhead utility and power lines shall not be located within the
wﬁa? fire apparstys svoess rondway.

43,2 Width shail be smended a3 follows: Accial Bre sppamiys scoess rouds shell heve s
minimum unobstructed width of 26 Beet, snchisive of shoulders, in the immediate vicinity of
any huilding or portion of buliding more than 30 fest in height.

stﬁw ﬁi% Muﬁiﬁ&@amﬁy M Developments

06 Droject A han 190 | snits shall be amended as lollows:
Mu&%fm}ﬁ? resichential mﬁg@m %swmg more r;kam 160 dwelling units shall be squipped
throughout with two seperate snxl approved fire apperatus acosss roads. Delete exception.

. Miam m&w Oue w”ﬁ'wﬁ»ﬁfaﬂy Residential wﬁamm&

f’a}i&}m mwhmnﬁ qaf o OF T ﬁmsiy dw@ﬁ;ﬂgﬁ shall %m provided with separsts and
spproved fire apparanis scoess roads and shall meet the requirements of D107.2 Remateness,
when required by the Fire Chinfl. Delete exceplions.
BSECTION 4: (1 ‘
That Ovdlaance Mo, 201601 of the LVFPD, and all other ordinances or parts of ardinances herewith

are hereby vepesied.

i3

20-0203 | Page 27 of 50



VEHRARILITY

o stbadivision therep!

SECTTHON 80 8

v Oimdhainee, artiche, subsecios

provessa sentence clause o phesss of

wation thereat, o f

thes conde, g any app reason beld o be avvehdd by 8 court of vempoiem

sych deciswon shall e affect the remaming proveioms of thes code, which can be given

ot werthont the mvalid postons snd, there fore, such invalid postions are dechared 1w be severable
The LYFPD heeeby declires that it wouddd have enacted this Ordinsnce aud cech of s articles,

st s, sibsectioms, or subdivisions thereol. provisions, sentenees. chivies or phrases irespectog

o

the fact thar one or more of therm s declgred ova

SECTION & EFFECTIVE DATE aND PUBLICATION

s alter us adoption The LYFPD Hoard Secrstary

Orinsnce shall
dirceied 1o publish the ondinance oo newspaper of general ciraulation 1o the District, o Hew of
pubtication of the Tull toxt af the srdinance, 2 suninrary of the ordinance may be pablished by the by

we sod g certilied copy shall be posted i the

the Boped Seceotry within fiffeen €15 days alier ity pass

oftice of the LVYFPRL pursuant to Gonvermmen! Code Secton 691003 015

ave Ordinance was miraduced at 8 moening of the Board of Dwectnes of the LVEPD on

Fior the frs vz, The Ordinancs was coad Tor the second

Sovember P4, 2089 angd o was

e o Deeember 1 2019 and approved by the follosang voue

PASSED aND AUDGPTRD by the Board of Director ol ihe LYFP b, 12th day of Darcmber

e

ATTEST.

i

20-0203 | Page 28 of 50



Fire Code #

What Is the Change?

Amend with the name of the jurisdiction

LVF

Locally adopted and amended

Why Is There a Local Change?

Adopting this section addresses Climatic conditions: LPG
gas shall be amended as follows: Add to the exception: At
or above 5,000 feet of elevation, a permit is not required for

better left to localities to determine the
fess/penalties for their respective areas.

105.6.27 Add section Locally adopted and amended individual containers with a 125 gallon water capacity or
less, or multiple conlainer systems having an aggregate
quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving occupancies in
group R 3.

Adopling this section to allow for the creation and issuance
. of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines
1066 Add section Locally oreated and adopled permits, plan checks, and inspections as allowed in Health
&Safety Code 17851,
. Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to
106.6.1 Add section Locally created and adopted the Fire District.
106.7 Add section Locally created and adopted Sgcuo_n 106.{ To recover the actual costs of avoidable
failed inspections by conlractors.
. - Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that
C:gg;z‘f:a"h:;?:z? Cl;)('nﬁl::;ge;nblh;l::r;:kM is protects life and property. Fees have been updated to
110.4 P - pleted by ) Locally adopted and amended malch the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the
better left to localities to determine the L
fees/penaliies for Iheir respective areas District Attorney’s Office. The change to the language to
P ) include the term infractions.
110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2
Citations
The Fire Chief or hisfher duly authorized representative (s),
Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor

042 but under a different number) Locally created and adopted violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the
Health and Safety Code of the State of Califomia and
Chapter 5¢c (commencing with section 853.6) of Tile 3 of
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California.

Completed the section by filling in the blank
112.4 portions that were not completed by the SFM. Itis Locally adopted and amended All violations of the code have been consolidated under

Section 110.4 to include the penalties for violations.

114.1 through 114.2

Allows Limitation and Reserving of Rights

Locally adopled and amended

Added the ability for the Board of Directors of the District,
the right to amend, modify, supplement, revoke in whole, or
in part, any of the provisions contained or incorporated
herein, at any time and from lime to time.

Added definitions for: Campfire, District, Executive Body,
Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd Manager.

22 Added definiions for clarity Locally created and adopted Definition of campfire shall not include LPG or Propane
fueled appliances.
302.1 Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for clanity
307.1.1 Added restrictions due to weather/Red Flag Locally created and adopted Increase risk of catastrophic wild fire.
307 4.4 through Due to the high fire danger that exists in £1 Dorado County
30'7 4 42 ds; Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopted we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas.

20-0203 | Page 29 of 50



503.2.1

Changed vertical clearances to 15 feet and road
widths to 20 feet.

Locally adopted and amended

Fire apparalus are becoming larger and laller. A vertical
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for
apparalus to pass under without damaging apparatus
components. it also allows an extended time frame before
having lo recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional
height for vegetation clearances acls as an increased buffer
for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of
shoulders, as measured face of curb to face of curb is
needed. These structures can be difficult to navigate with
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the total
drivable road surface

503.2.5

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the
Fire Code and Tile 14 Fire Safe Regulations to
match as they require turnarounds for fire apparatus
access roads and driveways.

Locally adopted and amended

Fire apparatus require areas for tuming around when
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This
includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles, Provides
better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150",

§03.2.6

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevaled
Surfaces to state and match El Dorado County
Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated
Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendix D of the
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an
allernate means & methods that is not less restrictive than
the Fire Code.

503.4.2

Added section regarding o parking in fire lanes

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes"
rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicle Code.

503.4.3

Added section regarding no parking in front of
hydrants

Locally created and adopled

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire
hydrants® rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle
Code.

503.4.4

Added section regarding fire lanes based on road
width

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D
as the reference for road lane width and their refation to fire
lanes.

503.6 through 503.6.1

Crealed and adopted to maintain emergency
access and consistency through all roadway gates
in EI Dorado County, referring to the gate standards
adopled by the FPO's.

Locally created and adopted

Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on

oadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing
the best possible emergency access to maintain fast
response times.

505.1

Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of
buildings.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing
based on the District's addressing standards.

505.1.1

Added additional addressing requirements

Locally created and adopted

Establishes installation, location, and visibility requirements.

505.1.1 (1)

Added additional addressing requirements

Locally created and adopted

Establishes requirements for permanent posting and
visibility requirements from construction through completion.

505.1.1(2)

Added additional addressing requirements

Locally created and adopted

Establishes requirements for address signs along one way
roads assuring visibility from both directions

505.1.1 (3)

Added additional addressing requirements

Locally created and adopted

Establishes requirements for multiple addresses accessed
from a single driveway shall be moounted on a single post.

506.1.1(4)

Added additional addressing requirements

Locally created and adopted

Eslablishes requirements for where a roadway provides
access to a single commercial or industrial buliding the
addess shall be placed at the nearest road intersection
providing access.

506.1.1 through
506.1.3

Created and adopted to maintain key boxes and
locks for buildings with gates and/or sprinkler
systems.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows Fire Dislrict to require key boxes for emergency
access.

507.5.4.1

Crealed and adopted to address snow removal and

|snow storage.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows Fire District to maintain emergency access without
impedance by snow removal or storage.

20-0203 | Page 30 of 50



§07.5.7

Created and added Public Private Partnership Fund
for Infrastructure and Capital Improvements

Locally created and adopted

Allows the Fire District to adopt a public private partnership
fund infrastructure and capital improvements (Partnership
Fund} to receive contributions of cash or property qualifying
under Internal Revenue Code Section 170 lo fund
operations and maintenance, including but not limited to
mobile water supply apparatus such as fire boal(s), and/or
water lender(s).

604.1.2

Created and added to impose the requirements of
NFPA 110 and NFPA 111 for emergency and
standby power systems.

Locally adopted and amended

Aligns the installation of emergency and standby power
systems with NFPA.

901.4.7

Created and added to address sprinkler systems
and fire alams

Locally adopted and amended

dieineates the requirements for sprinklers and fire alram on
existing and new buildings

901.11 through 901.14

Created and added to address fire alanm systems

Locally adopted and amended

Added definition for clarity

902

Added definitions for clarity

Locally created and adopted

Added definitions for. Vendor, Approved, Audible Alam,
False Alanm, Fire Alarm System, Local Fire Alamm System,
Subscriber

903.1

Adds a requirement for all sprinkler systems to be
anti-freeze or non-freezing type.

Locally created and adopted

Due to the climatic conditions of the District all sprinkler
|systems must be of the anti-freeze or non-freezing type to
function properly.

90323

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater
than 3,600 square feet to instalf sprinkiers if they
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the
structure, whichever is less.

Locally created and adopted

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinkiers
lo be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feel in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
|spread.

903.2b

Adds occupant protection for existing buildings less
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet lo the
structure, whichever is less.

Locally created and adopted

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread,

903.2.1,903.2.3,
903.2.4,903.2.7

These sections were created to give specific
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on
occupancy and square footage

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

903.2.8

This section was created to include manufactured
residential single family R-3 in the residential
sprinkler program

Locally created and adopted

Manufactured Homes ~ The intent of this code section is to
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two.
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption
due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk
successfully in many California communities.

20-0203 | Page 31 of 50



903.2.9, 903.2.10

These sections were created to give specific
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on
occupancy and square footage

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

903.4.4

~ |Adds audible notification in all sleeping rooms of a

sprinkler water flow alamm in residential
joccupancies.

Locally created and adopted

Allows Distirct to require audible of a sprinkler water flow
alarm.

907.2.a

Added occupant protection for fire alams in
buildings with a fioor area less than 3,600, except
R3, AG buildings not used for commercial
purposes, and buildings with a fioor area of less
than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code
official.

Locally created and adopted

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of a fire or smoke.

907.2b

Added occupant protection for existing buildings
without automatic sprinkier systems fo install a fire
alarm if they add more than 30% or 1,000 square
feet to the structure, whichever is less.

Locally created and adopted

Provides proper emergency nofification for occupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of a fire or smoke.

807.2.c

Added occupant protection by stating all fire alarm

delection systems installed shall be connected toa
moniloring service that notifies the fire department

upon activation and is installed per Section 907 of

the fire code.

Locally created and adopted

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of a fire or smoke.

907.2.4

Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood
systems (o be connected to a manitored fire alarm
system when installed or replaced.

Locally created and adopled

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of a fire or smoke.

907.6.2.1

Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply
Modification

Locally created and adopted

Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E
safety related power outages.

1203.1.3

Shunt trip power safety devices

Locally adopted and amended

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices lo
ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up
power supplies

33103

Address requirements for construction sites

Locally created and adopted

Addressing for construction sites is important to assist
responding emergency crews.

33121

Water supplies at construction sites with
combustible materials on-site

Locally adopted and amended

Water must be on site prior to combustible material being
slored or verlical construction commencing.

4905.4

Added a section to clarify roof construction

{requirements

Locally created and adopted

This section clarifies that within the boundaries of £} Dorado
County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are
wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly.

5001.7

Any damages or costs from negligent practices that
cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a
cost recovery fee.

Locally created and adopted

Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate.
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business
process or practice the actual cost wilf be passed on to the
negligent parties.

5601.2

Added safety protection with permits being issued
by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of
Supervisors for fireworks.

Locally adopted and amended

|fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding

Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and

of the applications they will be used for.

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make
available all requested documentation pertaining to
the firework presentation

Locally created and adopted

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any
documentation including timing and proprietary information
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they
deem necessary. This information is understood to be
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as
such.

20-0203 | Page 32 of 50



§704.2.9.6.1

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class It combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a
Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County.

§706.2.4.4

Established fimits as set forth in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class 1l combustible liquid special
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval
and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County.

5806.2

Administrative addition of District name.
Established limits as set forih in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Administrative need to add District name. Established limits
as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable
Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ
approval and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the
County,

6102

Added definitions for clarity

Locally created and adopted

Added definitions for: Instaliation, LPG, Supplier,
Interruption of Service

6104.2

Established limits for LPG storage and dispensing
near or adjacent to residential development

Locally adopted and amended

Establishes distances between LPG storage and
dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential
developments and high-density hotels, motel, apartments,
efc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would
have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death.
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use
Permit from the County.

6112

Establishes propane regulator requirements for
locations above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopled

Establishes procedures for the safe handling of propane
abave 500 feet. There are special requirements above
5000 feet due to snow loads and sheer the made propane a
significant ignition source and danger during the winter
months. This section requires certain rules for regulators,
vertical riser piping, markings and locations, and permit and
plan requirements.

6112 (1)ab,cdef

Establishes propane regulator requirements for
locations above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopled

Establishes permit requirements for propane tanks grealer
than 126 Gallons. There is a requirement for a plot plan for
all new installations signed-by a Ipg supplier that contains
building locations, fot lines, capacities, fiser pipe location,
roof ridge line depiction.

§112(2)

Establishes propane regulator requirements for
locations above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes requirements for regulators. installation of
regulators shall meet manufacturers instructions, st stage
regulators to be located under a cover, all regulators must
be listed and approved, flexible connectors shall be used
between first stage regulator and main service valve.

6112(3)

Establishes propane vertical riser pipe requirements
above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes vertical propane fise requirements for locations
for the District. Pipe schedule localion, swing joint
qui ts, and the use of flexible riser piping as well as

swing joints. These requirements are based on significant
fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather conditions
encountered above 5000 feet.

6112 (4)

Establishes propane shut off valve requirements
above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes shut off valve requirements including locations
at the gable end of the building and visibility requirements.

6112(5)

Establishes propane protective covers for second
stage regulators and meters requirements above
5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes construction requirements for protective covers
for second stage regulators and meters including concrete
piers and foolings.

6112 (6)

Establishes propane endemnity clause
requirements above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes observational and inspection protections for the
District

6112(7)

Establishes propane vertical yard riser pipe
requirements above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes propane yard riser pipe requirement clearances
for concrete inslallations and the use of schedule 80 steel
piping as a minumum requrement.

20-0203 | Page 33 of 50



6112 (8)

Establishes propane LPG tank markings
requirements above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes minimums of a 2'x2" wooden stake to
permanently mark tank locations,

6112 ()

Establishes propane LPG tank markings
requirements above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopled

Establishes height requirements for stakes.

6112 (10)

Establishes propane installation and maintenance
requirements above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes requirements for the stakes to be installed by
the LPG supplier.

6112 (1)

Establishes propane marking and location
requirements above 5000 foot elevalion

Locally created and adopted

Establishes marking and location requirements for locations
for the District. This section addresses signage focation,
emergency contact information, and snow related tank
marking requirements. These requirements are based on
significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather
conditions encountered above 5000 feet.

6112 (12)

Establishes propane tank support requirements
above 5000 foot elevation

Locally crealed and adopled

Establishes approved propane tank supports such as pre-
cast reinforced concrele pads, slabs, or saddles

6113.1

Permits and plans shall be submitted and approved
by the AHJ {Authority Having Jurisdiction).

Locally created and adopted

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground
tanks:

Allows us {o require plans be submitted for review prior to
installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks
require substantial maintenance including inspection and
anode replacement at regular intervals.

6113.2

Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the
property of the LPG company

Locally created and adopted

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when
sold fo the end user. This does not apply to above ground
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected.

6114

Establishes requirements for natural gas
installations, meter locations, and protective covers
over meters.

Locally crealed and adopted

Establishes requirements for natural gas installations to
protect the meter on struclures. These requirements are
based on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet.

6115.1

Adds a violation process if an LPG Supplier
provides service to a LPG installation that does not
comply with Sections 6112 or 6113.

Locally crealed and adopted

Establishes a violation process for LPG installation that
encounter high snow loads and do not meet Sections 6112
or 6113. These requirements are based on significant fire
history in heavy snow and extreme weather conditions
encountered above 5000 feet.

6115.2

Adds a violation process if a customer does provide
cover for a natural gas meter assembly.

Locally created and adopted

Establishes a violation process for LPG installation that
encounter high snow loads and do not meet Sections 6112
or 6113. These requirements are based on significant fire
history in heavy snow and extreme weather conditions
encountered above 5000 feet.

Appendix D; D103.1

Made an exception for residential driveways

Locally adopted and amended

Itis unreasonable to require a residential driveway to
construct a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant.

Appendix D: D103.2

Establishes requirements for fire apparatus access
roads fo not exceed 10 percent grade and in areas
above 5,000 Feet elevation driveways of R-3
occupancies shall not exceed 12 percent grade.

Locally adopted and amended

|extreme weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet

Due to the significant fire history in heavy snow and

these requirements will allow apparatus to access
occupancies when heavy snow limits traction.

Appendix D: D103.3

Text to include curbs and gutters

Locally adopted and amended

20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutters due
to potential access issues and turning radius concems.

Appendix D: D103.5 §
1

Fire apparatus access road gates

Locally adopted and amended

Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided
roadway the gate width shall not be less than 15 feet due to
radius issues.

Appendix D: D104.2
to D104.3

Added to require two equally spaced two fire

apparatus access roads on buildings that exceed
62,000 square feet.

Locally created and adopted

Where buildings exceed 62,000 square feet two equally
spaced fire apparatus access roads will be required to allow

access in fire emergencies.

20-0203 | Page 34 of 50



When required by the fire code official, a fire apparalus
Appendix D: D104.4 N Added to require circumferential fire apparatus Locally created and adopled access road shall be co.nslmcled Ito encompass the entire
access roads structure and shall provide a continuous means of
emergency vehicle access.
Amended to require fire apparatus access roads on . Lo
Appendix D: D105, buildings that exceed 30 feet in height that are For the safely of the communifes we five in, ingress/egress
N : . Locally adopted and amended is required for fire department aerial apparatus to ensure
D105.1, D105.2 capable of accomodating fire department aerial ¥
the safety of the residents and first responders.
apparatus.
For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
Appendix D: D106.1 N Removed Exception in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
residents and first responders.
For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
Appendix D: D107.1 N Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
residents and first responders.
Adopted with no Amendments
101.2 through 101.5 N C;;ﬁ:;" to establish scope, inten!, severabilty and Locally adopted Administrative dirity
102.6 through 102.8 N References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administralive dlarity
10210 trough 10242~ n [Conficting provisions, Other Laws, Application of Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
references
103.1 through 103.4.1 N Definition of the Fire Prevention Division Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.1 N Ability to enforce the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.3 through 104.4 N Right of Entry, Warants, and identification Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.6 through 104.6.4 N Record retention Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
1048 through 10492 N [Modifcatons, atemale means and mefhads, and Locally Adopted Administrative darity
104.11 through Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of N .
108412 N systems Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.11.3 N Authority of systems and devices inoperable Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
105.2.3 N Time limitation of application Locally Adopted Adminisirative clarity
oo tough N [Operational permits Locally Adopted Administiative dlarty
Dry cleaning operational permits required for N .
105.6.12 N hazardous cleaning Solvent use Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
Permits for various business operations for. Magnesium,
} . N . miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation
}ggg;ga through N Qrdeo:;i‘dulfl:ss:;ﬁq;sfo;;%:?|strahve dclaity and Locally Adopted vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing facilities, open buming,
- P open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and
organic coatings
Adopled this section for administrative clarity and .
105.6.37 N fire and life safely inspeclions Locally Adopted Permits for places of assembly
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and ' .
105.6.39 N fire and Hfe safety inspections Locally Adopted Permits for private fire hydrants
Permits for pyroxylin plastics, refrigeration equipment, repair|
105.6.41 through N Adopled this section for administrative clarity and Locally Adopted garages and molor fuel-dispensing facilities, rooftop
105.6.46 fire and life safety inspections Y Adop! hefiports, spraying or dipping, storage of scrap tires and tire
by-products )
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and I wn
105.6.48 N fire and life safety inspections Locally Adopted Permit for tire-rebuilding plants
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Permit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material,
105650 N fire and life safety inspections Locally Adopted lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 cubic feet)
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and )
106.1 through 106.3 N fire and lfe safely inspections Locally Adopted Fee schedules for permits
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and ’ .
107.1 N fre and ife safely inspections Locally Adopted Inspection authority

20-0203 | Page 35 of 50



Adopted this section for administrative clarity and

Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of
equipment, re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping,

fire and life safety inspections

108.1 through 109.3 ) . ) Locally Adopted supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding,
fre and ffe safety inspections Board of Appeals established, fimitations on authority, and
qualifications
110.3.2 through Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally Adopted Compliance with orders and notices, prosecution of
110.3.4 fire and fife safely inspections ¥ Adop |violations, and unauthorized tampering
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and i .
110.4.1 fire and Hfe salety inspections Locally Adopted Abatement of violation
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and . " R
113.1 fire and lfe salety inspections Locally Adopted Authority o disconnect service utilities
Asphalt kettles contain highly flammable substances and
303.1 through 303.9 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and
topographical)
Managing ignition sources through responsible application
305.1 through 305.5 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted of standards will reduce the number of fires in various
settings (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY
306.1 through 306.2 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopled flammable and require specia! handling (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)
. . y Open burning, recreational fire, and portable cutdoor
307.1 through 307.5 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted fireplaces, (Climatic, geological, and lopographical)
. . " Open flame general requirements (Climalic, geological, and
308.1 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted topographical)
308.1.2 through . . . Throwing or placing of ignition sources, torches for
308.1.3 Adopted this section for fire and ffe safety Locally Adopted removing paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Locations near combustible, open flame devices, signals
308,15 brough e eitoscremonies, st and o, tpi
ggg.:.i)(exdudmg Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted food and beverage preparation, dispensing, containers fot
o in use, serving of flaming food, location, fire protection
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)
] " " Permits are required for above section (Climatic, geological,
308.2 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted and topographical)
Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices,
308.3 through 308.4.1 Adopled this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted theatrical performances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2
dormitories (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
] ! ) General requirements relating to smoking (Climatic,
310.1 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted geological, and topographical)
) . ’ *No Smoking" signs (Climatic, geological, and
3103 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted topographical)
Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with *No Smoking™
310.4 through 310.8 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted signs, ash trays, buming objecls, hazardous environmental
conditions. (Climatic, geclogical, and topographical)
Vacant premises condition and safety requirements,
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant
311.1 through 311.4 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted premises, secunity, fire protection, fire separation, removal
of combustibles, removal of hazardous materials. (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)
. " . General requirements relating fo mobile food preparation
319.1 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted vehicles. {Climatic, geological, and topographical)
1192 Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally Adopted Permits.for mobile food preparation vehicles (Climatic,

|geological, and topographical)

20-0203 | Page 36 of 50



319.3 through
319.10.3

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Exhaust hood, fire protection, fire protection for cooking
equipment, fire extinguisher, appliance connection to fuel
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, metallic
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking oil
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting,
{normal vents, emergency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum
aggregate volume, protection of container, LP-gas container
construction, protection of system piping, LP-gas alarms,
CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel,
maximurn aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG
container construction, CNG containers supplying
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping,
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems.
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)

403.8.1 through
403.8.1.7

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1
{residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and
fire safety plans.

403.10 through
403.10.1.3

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Group R-1 {Boarding house, hotel, mote!) occupancy
Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

405.5

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

510.3

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safely inspections

Locally Adopted

A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)

807.5.2 through
807.5.2.3

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a
Imaximum amount of flammable wall coverings in
educational facilities (Climatic, geological, and
topographical)

903.2.1.5

Adopled this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers)
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000
square feet. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

1103.2

Adopted this section in existing buildings for the
safety of firefighters and other emergency
responders.

Locally Adopted

Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings.
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the
|phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by
the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind
this section is tha! on almost all emergency responder injury
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This
situation can be correcled with the addition of radio
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Appendix D: D101.1
through D102.1

Adopted this section for the safety of the public,
firefighters, and other emergency responders.

Locally Adopted

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads
including loads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Appendix D: D103.4

Adopted this section for the safety of the public,
firefighters, and other emergency responders.

Locally Adopted

Dead end fire apparatus access road requirements for a
tum around at 150 feet. {Climatic, geological, and
topographical)

Appendix D: D103.6

Adopted this section for the safety of the public,
firefighters, and other emergency responders.

Locally Adopted

"No Parking, Fire Lane" signs requirements. {Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

Appendix D; D104.1
through D104.3
(excluding exception)

Adopted this section for the safety of the public,
firefighters, and other emergency responders.

Locally Adopted

Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus
laccess roads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

20-0203 | Page 37 of 50



Appendix D; D105.1 N Adopted this secion for the safety of the public, Locally Adopted Requirements for aerial fire apparatus access roads
through D105.4 firefighters, and other emergency responders. ¥ Adop (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
appendrx D: D106.1 Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential

rough D106.3 N " y Locally Adopted devel Climatic geological. and ical
(excluding exceptions) firefighters, and other emergency responders. evelopments (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Appendix D: D107.1 One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be

pet . ’ Adopted this section for the safety of the public, equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire
through D107.2 N frefiaht g Locally Adopted duetol . i
(excluding exception) refighters, and other emergency responders. aypargtus ac.c%s roads due to topographic, geographic and
climatic conditions.
o Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction

Appendix D: D108 N firefighters, and other emergency responders. Locally Adopted standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle.

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions.

20-0203 | Page 38 of 50



el d Pt e slyr

Wowssy 3 hy - [

BLTO

ERARARE

Gustomer Account # 1080732

Legat Accound
¥ FIRE PROTECT!

OM DIST

1Y E H ST
SOUTH LAKE TAHOE CA 98150
At Kissgh Labrade

Balles Lizton says;

That {sine s 2 legal clerk of the
Tahoe Oaily Tribuns,

& nEWSDEDBT gx:;é@“m Friday

at South Lake Tatoe o the Siste

Copy Line
Maotice Moy 14 Adopd Fire Dode

P

Ad #: 0000505350-01

2 firme]s) wmm@m TG On W%zms
and ending on THBIZ01S, all deys ndlusve

vpkie fodun

Sigred
Oate  YVOBIZ19 Siste of Mevaga, arson Cily

Thin is an Orgingl Electronic Afidavit
Price. § 8700

Proof and Statement of Publication
fd # DOOGEOB3B0.01

Notice of Intent to
Adopt the 2019
California Fire Code

Notice is hereby given (o
the intention of the Lake
Valley Fire Protection
District to adopt the 2019
California Fire Code.
The District shall hold its
first public hearing at
4:00 PM. on Nov 14
2019, at 2211 Keetak St.
South Lake Tahoe,
California, regarding the
adoption of the 2019
California Fire Code pur-

suant to Health and
Safety Code  Section
13869. Copies of the

code section referred to
and any secondary code
sections referred to,
adopted by reference,
are on file with the
Secretary of the District
and are open to public
inspection. Adoption ol
the 2019 California Fire
Code will enable all
District personnel to fol-
low one set of rules and
regulations with regard
to the health and safety
of the g}utﬁm and the
District's response there-
to.

Pub: November 1, 8,
2019 Ad#0000505390

20-0203 | Page 39 of 50



Balles Liston says

Thst (sihe 5 3 lagel clerk of the

Tahoe Dally Tribuns,

a newspaper published Frday

# South Lake Tanos (n the Siale of Calilorma

Sogy Line
sotice Dec 12 Adopt Fire Code

BOE:

B Simte of Mevade Casnn Dy

Thin is an Origingl Electronic Afdavit
Price: § A5 80

Froof and Statement of Publication
fAg & DOOUBOEIEE.01

Notice of Intent 1o
Adopt the 2019
California Fire Code

Notice is hereby given to
the intention of the Lake
Valley Fire  Protection
District adopt the 2019
California Fire Code.
The District shall hold its
second public hearing at
4:00 P.M. on Decembe:
12, 2018, at 2211 Keetal
St., South Lake Tahoe,
California, regarding the
adoption of the 2019
California Fire Code pur-
suant to Health and
Safety Code Section
13889, Copies of the
code section referred to
and any secondary code
sections referred to,
adopted by reference.
are on file with the
Secretary of the District
and are open to public
inspection. Adoption of
the 2019 California Fire
Code will enable all
District personnel to fol-
low one set of rules and
regulations with regard
to the heailth and safety
of the public and the
District’'s response there-
to.

Pub: November 29,

December 6, 2019
Ad#0000505396

20-0203 | Page 40 of 50



Attachment No. 2

LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
RESOLUTION NO. 2019-08

20-0203 | Page 41 of 50



RESOLUTION NO. I019-88
Lake Valley Five Protection District, El Dorads County, California
Adapting Findings Supporting Amendments ta the 2009 California Fire Cade

E iim Fire Pro
tabrict i

ection Disteict senting forth Bndings with respect 1o
tain modiogions and clunges o the

and e satety i the District. The Governing
e Profection [istrict finds and resobves as ollow:

WHEREAS, H: 45 permiits o Biee Protection Disinet o adopt
ar ardinance which changes or mm}, i > Housmy regulstions adopted pursusnt 1o
Hlealth & Satery Uode Secnton 17922 upon determunation that such changes or modifications are

necessary due to local conditions: and

V&’i??" 8 hm‘mjv Phre giui nuking
TSRS shall mahe
saenpy of such

g oand, £ v e

changes of modiications wi el

MOW, THEREFORE, BE T RESOLVED AND OQHDERED, that the Bourd ol the [a

Yalley 5551-*‘ Protechion Fhaing,

?”
£

cuad and § w»z? public bearing. owpressts

{inds tha I w v omdi i atons are recerabhy necessarny Bevause of ocsl wsaai;v'

rthy ag

i s

W30 St

FINDBERGR OF FALT
FORCHANGES DR MODIFICATION'S TO THE STATE BUILDING STANDARDS
CODFTITLE 24 PART 9 BECALSE OF LOCAL CONBITIONS

CHANGES 05 MUMNFIUATHINS: Pur
Cultiprras Health & Suten € ode the Hoard
Pyateiet, i its onboanee adopts

Piorg 4 onle,

woared gremding the v
Stasndands Code ¢ bitke 24 Part 93, a5 6 ponams

mmééil' eerlam o ons o the 2019 Bl

by

§lor Bumuae Babeiston and othar o of sirgaciares

s the regwl

atton of buddgs peneead

rudes for !w- siluty

PSS 3 of the THealth & Safeny
1t Ehsirset has dotersined and o
srvs Burdding Stoda
Hecal chimatn, peoyraphie ang

FINDINGS: Pursuan to Sectons 17938 2
the Howed of Drrector of the fake Vall
the attached changes or modilications 1 i
Part 9 are needed sad are reasonably e
tapograplue conditions . Such changes are deen
adeguite and olfective protection o B propen s and the enveromment

iy Bwoatiw «

swrd ge B peasettably pecessary o peode

20-0203 | Page 42 of 50



FINDING NO, ONE - Private properties lving within the Lake Valley Fire Protection District
are classilied as very high wildland fire hazard,

FINDING NO. TWO - The menace of destruction by fire 1o life, improved property, or natural
resources may be, or be forecast to become, extreme due to critical flre weather, fire suppression
forces being heavily committed to control. fires already burning, scute dryness of the
vegetation, or other factors that may cause the rapid spread of fire such a5 high winds, low fus!
moisiures, Fire Weather or Red Flag Warnings, or severe threat of wildland fics.

FINDING MO, THREE - Cooperating federal or state agencies address the threat of wildland fire
on lands adjacent to the District by issuance of Fire Restrictions which restrict or ban spen
buming, including recreational fires.

LOCAL CONDITIONS: Local conditions have an adverse effect on the prevention of (1)
major loss fires, (2) major eanthquake damage, and (3) the potential for life and property loss,
making changes or modifications o the aforsmentioned codes necessary 1© provide a reasonable
degree of property security as well as fire and life safety in this jurisdiction.

Below are listed adverse local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions found in
the Lake Valley Fire Protection District;

L Climatic

8. Precipitation.

Annual precipitation fluciustes greatly. Approximately 50 - 95 percent of the precipiation occurs
during the months of November through April, and § - 10 percent ocours from May through
October. This area has experienced major droughits in the recent past; one in 1977 - 1978, one
which started in 1989 and lasted into 1994, others from [999-2004, and 2006-2009, Droughts
continue o cycle 1o this day. Electrical slorms are frequent end sre usually accompanied by linle
rainfall, potentially creating numerous lightening caused fires.

Snow storms and loss of sceess and avalanche are routine. Heavy winter snows are responsible
for delays in response and access to buildings and patients sl emergency scenes, Winter snow
storms along with heavy tourist traffic routinely bring all community teaffic to & standstill during
weekends and holidays,

b. Relative Humidity.

During the months of June through Seplember, the daily humidity ranges around 30 percent, and
often drops 1o the low teens. Low relative humidity have allowed for grester spread of wildfires
and caused siructure fires 10 readily spread 1o the wildiand interface.

¢ Temperatures.

During the months of June through September, daily temperatures exceed 70 degrees 10 90
degrees Fahrenhelt, Winter temperatures can drop (o below 0 degrees Fahrenheit. The highest
recorded temperature was 9% degrees Fahwenheit in 1988 with the lowest being negative 13

degrees Fahrenheit February of 2019,

20-0203 | Page 43 of 50



4. Wiads.

Prevailing winds are out of the south and southwesl. However, north and sast winds oceur during
the spring (May through June}, the fall (late September and October), and oceasionelly during
the summer months. Wind velocities generally range from flve 1o fifteen miles per hour, gusting
to thirty miles per hour during the summer months.

Given the increased risk of wildland fire in California’s mountsin regions, electric utility
companies have begun a policy shutting off power 10 entire regions and counties. This practice
tias been responsible for a recent fire in the District and will increase risk for communities in one
respect while limiting risk of powerline initiated wildland fires,

¢. Summary.

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the Lake
Valley Fire Protection District. Times of little or no rainfall, low humidity and high temperatures
greate exiremely hazardous conditions, particularly as they relate o the wildland - whan
interface. Conversely, heavy winter snows bring a host of flood, avalanche, response and
structure fire challenges to the community. Winds experienced in this area can have 8 significant
impact upon structure fires, especially in buildings in close proximity 10 one another, and 1o wild
lands commonly found in the Lake Valley Fire Prowection District.

The fire environment of a community is primarily a combination of two factors: the physical
geographic characteristics of the area and the historic pattern of development. These two faciors
creste & mixture of environments that ultimately determines the area’s fire protection needs.

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District provides fire prevention, fire protection, advanced
sraergency medical and rescue services for unincorporated E! Dorado and Alpine County
areas within the Lake Tahoe Basin.

The Leke Valley Fire Protection District serves 83 square miles vie Station 7, located 81 221§
Keeiak, Station 6, located &t 1286 Golden Bear Trail, Siation § located &t 1609 Boulder
Mountain Court is staffed by Calfire via a lease agreement with the District.

The Leke Valley Fire Protection District service ares includes: California State Highway 50
from Camp Sscramento to the City of South Lake Tahoe boundary; California State Highway
&9 South from Alpine County Willow Creek Road 1o California State Highway 30 in Meyers.

Extending along Californis Siate Highway 89 North, the Fire District extends from the Northern
boundary of the City of South Lake Tahoe (West Way) 1o Eagle Creek in Emerald Bay,

The service area has & varied topography and vegetative cover. It has relatively flat areas along
the shoreline, of Lake Tahoe along Pope and Baldwin Beach areas (6225 feet at Lake level).
Steep hills and mountain peaks over 10,000 feet are part of the Tahoe Basin. The most
prominent pesk in the fire District is Mount Tallac at 9735, Vegetative cover ranges from
stands of manzanita 1o dense forests of fir and pine tress.

20-0203 | Page 44 of 50



The main commercial sreas are in Meyers and Tahoe Paradise along the highway 50 corridor.
Businesses a3 well a8 the California Agricultura! Station, the Meyers Elementary School, two
golf courses and the local Tahoe Paradise Park are in this area.

Meighborhoods in vicinity of Pioneer Trail include: Elks Club, Golden Bear, Cold Creek, High
Meadow, Black Bart, Kokanes Trail, Montgomery Estates, Washoan, This corridor also
includes the Sierra House School and the South Tshoe Public Utilities District work sites,

The neighborhoods of North Upper Truckes, Echo View Estates, Mountain Yiew Esiates, ard
Tahoe Mountain were affected by the Angora Fire of 2006 with the loss of 254 homss. The
srea sees significant traffic delays due 1o tourist travel and is highly prone io heavy snows.

The neighborhoods of South Upper Truckes and Christmas Valley off of both State Highway
50 at Echo Summit and State Highway 89 to Alpine County also suffer waific delays from
tourist travel and heavy snows, Echo Summil, vis State Highway 50, is & funpel for traffic
congestion and highly prone to winter avalanches.

The State Highway 89 corridor, north to Emerald Bay, is the most heavily traveled rosd the
Lake Tahoe Basin. (f the estimated 20 million tourist visiting the Tehos Basin annual,
roughly 4.9 million stop to tske & picture of Emerld Bay. This busy highway runs through
Camp Richardson Resort, Pope, Kiva and Baldwin Besches and USFS historic sites,
Traveling north the Mount Tallac trsil head, sceess 1o Fallen Leaf Lake, the Cascade Lake and
residential ares, the Spring Creck summer residential arces are passed along the way 1o
Inspiration Point and Emerald Bay, Vikings Holen and the Eagle Fails Creek.

The Fire District extends along State Highway 50, over Bcho Summit on the west side of the
Sierra crest o the Echo Snow Park- Adventure Mountain and Sierra at Tahoe Ski Resort.
Additionally the Disteict serves the hamiets of Linle Norway, the, Mount Ralston Subdivision,
Echo Lakes, Philips, Sierra Pines, Bryan Creek, Tamarack Park, Sayles Canyon and Camp
Sscramento.

Due 1o the remoteness of the communities and recreational areas of Strawberry, Twin Bridges,
Horse Tail Falls, Lover's Leap and the 3% mile wact, Lake Valley Fire Disteict personnel are
called 10 serve these areas within the El Dorado County Fire Protection District,

& Seismic Location,
The relatively young geological processes that created the Tahoe Bagin is still active. The
Districts entire land surface i3 in the high-lo-moderate seismic hazard zones,

b. Size and Population.

The District covers 85 square miles with a population of 13,000, swelling to over 100,000
during the summer months, The District has 3 fire stations; two stalTed by 22 safety personnel
and one (1) fire station via Cal fire contract. The District has four (4) Chief Officers, including
the Fire Chief, one (1) Fire Prevention Technician, one (1) Mechanic/Fleet Manager and one (1)
Administrative Manager. Overall, there 29 fire total District personnel. The District oversite is
via the five (3) members of the Fire Board of Directors.

20-0203 | Page 45 of 50



¢. Roads and Streets.

Many roads are sub-standard; narrow widths, on-sireet parking, less then 20 feet of unobstructed
pavement and ingress and egress issues during peak population fluciuations. Some ureas are
served by single lane roads, severely restricting emergency vehicle.

d. Topography.

The topography of the District varies from nesr level to termain in excess of a 40 percent slope.
Az & rule of thumb, the rate of fire spread doubles as the slope percentage doubles, all other
factors remaining the same.

Most residential and commercial structures, are in, or are surrounded by foresied areas, Due to
drought, bestie infestations, and heavy vegetalion, many the ares have dead or dying trees,
contributing o fire danger. Elevation ranges from sbout 6200 feet at lake lavel 10 over 7200
fest on mountain pass roads with peaks exceeding 9000 feet in elevalion.

2. Vegetation.
YVegetation in the Fire District varies from sub-alpine forests of aspen and pine to pine and cedar
forests, with substantial brush felds of manzanits, snow brush, and white thom.

Residential development in the Fire District is generally concentrated in heavily forested areas.
This situstion allows fre to avel casily rom home 10 home, forest o home, or home to forest
by radiation, convected heat andior fying embers Ofien dwellings are completely surrounded by
highly combustible vegeiation, compounding the fire problem,

f. Summary.
Local geographic and topographic conditions increase the fire hazand presented in the Districr,

Other variables that tend to intensify the fire danger include:
1) damage to the piped water system infrastructure
2} isolation due to bridge collapse
3) roadway damage and/or amount of
debris blocking roadways
4) availability of timely mutual aid
agsistance
5} the presence of dwellings with wood
shingle or shake roof coverings

g. Conclusion:

Local climatie, geographic and

topographic conditions described above increase the frequency,

intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, these conditions
impact potential damage to structures fom an sarthquake and subsequent fire, Therefore, it is
reasonably necessary that the California Fire Code be modified 1o mitigate the effects of the
above conditions.

20-0203 | Page 46 of 50




sbe Sevhienr 179

B 7 reaquires that modilications o the Fire Code b

vesch by cefors o which Code modilication The

expressls imar vl wdenhiied 85 o ow

felbwang table provedes thes conmestion

Code Secion ) Finding
Chapter Administrative

Chapter £ Adusinisiralive
Uhapior 3 Ay
Chapter & ic)
Chapter & qey Haay
hapter 4 dun ey

!

i

Chapler |
f

S eed =
Wt

Tian Biel 1habs i

Adminisirativg

U hapter 4%
Chapier
Chaplar
Clyaprter
Chaper 58
Chapter 61

b4

S 1y

it
d

Appendis T3
Phis Hosodal shiadl teke effoct and b foree from aad afier s approval o rogulred bs faw

o d o € F Gapoortongne cof thtgw B ool a0 % Foos e ESpeae o
ool Phrectors of the Lake Valley Firg Prosecuen Disteny

e

20-0203 | Page 47 of 50



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted as Amended Finding
101.1 X Admin
105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
106.6 X Admin
106.6.1 X Admin
106.7 X Admin
109.4 X Admin
110.4 X Admin
110.4.2 X Admin
112.4 X Admin
114.1 X Admin
114.2 X Admin
202 X Admin
302.1 X Admin
307.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
505.1 X Climatic/Geological
505.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
506.1.1 X Climatic/Geological
506.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
507.5.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
507.5.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
604.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
901.4.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
901.11 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
901.12 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
901.13 X Admin
901.14 X Admin
902 X Admin
903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.4.4 X Geological/Topographical

20-0203 | Page 48 of 50




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

907.2.a through 907.2.d

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.5§1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.4

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: 105.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

X
907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
33103 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5001.7 X Admin
5601.2 X Admin
5601.2.1 X Admin
5601.2.2 X Admin
5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6102 X Admin
6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (1) a,b,c.d.e,f X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (2) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (3} X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (4) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (5) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (6) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (7) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (8) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (9) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (10) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (11) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (12) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6113.1 X Admin
6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6114 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6115.1 X Admin
6115.2 X Admin
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X

Appendix D: 105.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 | Page 49 of 50




20-0203 | Page 50 of 50



	Resolution_Lake Valley
	Reso Lake Valley 2-25-20



