
RESOLUTION NO. XXX-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 019-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is 
updated by the State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958. 7 and 18941.5 
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are 
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, 
Chapter 1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety 
regulations to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building 
official, or his or her authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his 
or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the 
chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and 
maintain a memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining 
to the inspection of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on 14th of November 2019, the Board of Directors of the Mosquito Fire Protection 
District adopted Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with 
amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical 
conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El 
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Mosquito Fire Protection District and delegates 
the enforcement of the ordinance to the Mosquito Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her 
representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following 
sections: 

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4 through 
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1. 
507.5.1, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 
903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 
5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 through 6112.3, 
6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 
5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 
11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table B105.l (1), Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D103.1 
through D103.3, Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix D103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, 
Appendix D104.4.  

  20-0203 K Page 1 of 40



Resolution No. XXX-2020 
Page 2 of 2 

 
 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in 
its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 
2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

 
105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403.4, 
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12, 
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808, 
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, 
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception), 
D107.1 (Exceptions  1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, 
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M. 

 
Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 

 
 
 
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of 
said Board, held the _____ day of _____________________, 20__, by the following vote of said Board: 
 
 Ayes: 
Attest: Noes: 
Kim Dawson Absent: 
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors  
 
By: _____________________________________ _____________________________________ 
 Deputy Clerk Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Board of Supervisors 

 

  20-0203 K Page 2 of 40



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
880] ROCK CREEK ROAD 
PLACERVILLE, CA 95667 

Don Ashton. Chief Administrative Officer 
EI Dorado County Board of Supervisors 
330 Fair Lane 
Placerville. CA 95667 

(530) 626-9017 
Fax (530)626-3240 

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 20)9-06 of tbe Mosquito Fire .Protection District which 
adopts tbe 20) 9 California Fire Code with amendments related to local climatic, geographic and 
topographic conditions. 

Dear Mr. Ashton: 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is requcsti ng the Boan.! of Supervisors (BOS) ratify its Ordi nance No. 2019-
01 which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code as amended due to specific local climatic. geographic and 
topographic conditions. California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of the 
city or county where the ordinaJ.lce will apply to ratify . modity or deny the adopted ordinance. The BOS must 
also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District (or its representative) or the Chief Building 
Official . 

Theretore. wc request the County Hoard of Supervisors ratily Ordinance No. 2019-0 I with amendments to the 
2019 Cali [oruia Fire Code. and deleg.ate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the Mosquito Fire Protection 
District Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for your review and usc on this topic. 

This resnlulion has no direct fiscal impact to the County. 

Edward Dwyer 
fire Chiet' 

ATTACHMENTS: 

I. MFPD Ordinance No. 2019-01 
MFPD finding of Fact Resolution No. 19-06 

3. Draft £1 Dorado County BOS Resolution 

------ - - -

  20-0203 K Page 3 of 40



Attachment No. 1 

Mosquito Fire Protection District 

Ordinance No. 2019-01 

  20-0203 K Page 4 of 40



• 

MOSQUITO fiRE PROTECTION DISTRJCT 

ORDINANCE NO. 1019--01 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE MOSQUITO FIRE 

PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS, 

An ordinance orllle Mosquito Fn /'ro(ec:tion District (MFI'O) .dopfinlJ tlHt 2019 Edition or1he C<IIifomiG 

Fh Cod.. incorporw:inalfle lOll Edition oftbc IfIl~mtJlkwJI Fil'I CoM, I'tguill inl and 1000emi", the 1a~luard;n, 

of lil'& and proper!)' Iiun fIrt and e>q)losion hazards ariJin. from die lton. •• handlin, and _ of huanIous 

iIlIbsIu>ca, IMI1IriIIs and cIMces. and from conditions haatdow 110 lif" or propnty in the o<x:upaney of buildings 

..... prcmi_ in lhe MfPO; providinl tor the issuInce of pennies and rollection !lff_ tllt rcfor. Repeali", Ord ill.lnce 

No. 2016- oftlw MFPD and all other otdinanus IIICI pwII oflfle onlilWlCGJ in connict dIerc .... ith . 

Be it OIWAINED by die 80ud of DiloclOl, orlile MFPD, _Ito known .. 1he Motqui«l Fire Protection 

District: 

Sed;.,n I: F1NDINCS OF lArn 

Section 2: APOUION OF COPE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

Soc:tion 1: LOCAL AMENpMUfI'S 

So<:Iion 4, CONFLICT 

Section S: SEvt:MBIYJ)' 

Section 6: tHECIm; DATE AND ",8L1e ADON 

SECTION 1; f lNplNGS Of FherS 

The MFPO makes certain chan .... (liSllld below) 1CI the c.~ F ... eM, 2019 EdiOan, punuaM 10 

HNIlIl ... St/e'Y Codf S«t1oM IJU9,7, 119J&,1 and J894U durin, lIIiI code t6opDon proceu. SIICII ch&n&". 

Ire , "')' bcea..se of local climatic, polo, ieIo\ and/or !OpOpI;phical conditions. The MFPO hat wInJ*d. 
pw$\I&M 10 S«lioft /894/.J of 1M CDlIfom/Q HHiIII .t StIfoly Codor, the fmdinp 01 fIICts ~Iati"" 10 II>ete 

(:(IIIdiIiom by ReIOIltioIIlIlOI9-16 ortlll MrpO uted ND¥tlllbtr 14 , ~'l', 

SECTION 2: AoomON Of CODE w ml EXo.USIONS 

The MFPO Idopts the 2019 CQ/1fonUtJ Fh CM, 1JlI' U, Pan~, I, III .. limy, includ in, Appero;liccs, 

illcO' jIOi_i .. , 1hoM ....woo .. of tho IN_ioMI FIN CM, lOll edition 1101 adopIed by the.-. wiItIllle 

CKius..,.,. liUId below: 

  20-0203 K Page 5 of 40



EKlusiona: 10U.I7.IOU.lII, I ~.6J9, 301.1.4, )(Ill, ) I 1.3, 311.6.. J I" "<1).1, 4OU.I ""'J .H, 4OU . 

• OlA, 40).6" olOJ .7, 403 .' (idop:in& olOJ.l.1-403.I.1.7), olOJ .II, ~) I G.l. "<13.1 OJ, 40) I I, 403 12, 400t I~"', 

4O$. I-40H, 40S.6-40S.II, -406, 8ll5·'07 (idop:in, 101.$.2), 101, \I0Il.1.1, 110 I, I I0l.l , 1103.).1 103.6" L 1 0) .11 

(adopti", 1 103.11.1)" 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chal*' 25, 0\apIer U, !hi ~ ullder Dl0U (Eacq.riooI), 

0106.1 (~ion), DlOl.1 (Exceplion), Append;'. A. Append;'" E, A~I. " App +- G, AppendUt. I, 

Appendi. K. AppendiJIl.., Append •• M. 

Appendiul _1dopIed can be IIIOd for f'tference in .fOR:1II1 ochw .mo.. 0(" 20111 Cdi/orltkl Fh 

c ... 

SECTION 1: LOCAL AMF.NP;\-JF.NTS 

n.. foUowm, Secriom ... MmIy ommdal or..tdtd: 

O l p(tr I 

Sun" 1, 1 &ow I'" GtMnl Rn. IIDI .. b 

Stet", 105 hlWllg 

1Q5.i.27 l.PG-IM ",-U be _.dod • ~Iooo-t: Add 10 ~ '"""option; AI or lbootc s,ooo r..t of 

elnltion, I permit illIOI ""lui..:! !'or individlal_1Mn willi I 12S·.1I011"'_ ""!*,Ry or lea, or 

mulriplt conlli_1)'IIem1 ...... 1"' ........... qUMUIy _ ucoodifta 125 ........ MrV;'" 00;0;"1*1"_ 

In Group R· ) . 

$te l'" 11M Em 

IOU h[J!!!, PI .. Rnicw .. 4 '""dol fm Ih&II beldOod. foIlooo-t: .... ~ offtuodopHd 

by 1M dblria "-d ~ dil"ffltllS /Dr,... N ....... ~ .. 1M Iu_ fI/ perwtio by_ dIurlcI 

..,. It. Jo-I iii 1M _I anw..I diJrrld jH a:""" (fIfllil lo .. Sitf«1 C.,.,7\lJJ) . 

l ot,6.1 c..t Rtt9YUJ Em NIall blldOod M follows: '" _""'" ftu ..,. H dltliINIG..,.,--. 

/fnII, -JIOI"" .... or b ... IIi_ ..... 1"'-1" 1NJI(pIocw. -«11 .. ~_ ...... fI' .. " ........ CfI'fi'. __ • 
II ....-Ibk for _ ""'" '" _ diJlrlcf 10 r-apoM 10 to\II _,.. fI/ ... ~ .... dIurlcI6G.rI..,. 

c.....,. "jH 10 _r to\II COlt of ~ """'" wItkII ,... <IIItricI prooridu fI' to\II COlt fI/ ~ ~ 
,.. .... jor WrldlllwjH II .,., (HfIIi'lo .t ~ Code/JII/6) 7JwjH IItoIJ _U£8lIto\II 

fICIWI_tf"."....,.,." IMI" ....... rvP .... IOIM _ of"'~, 

IMJ A1I"lhltldn Caeg ...... be IdOod • fbliows' "",""" _ .". ilup«lioIo II ",w d.d, .. d. 
.... _j:IIb ,.pufoo_ ,.tIw_~ fl/to\II _loortIy~jwWkt;o" (AlU), d..uu..,. 

WI ,., ..-w:fuo Jar «IIIIIJ 1_...,,,.,..,iItt IG -Jr- IIw IQIF"wp«liOOI1ocaf;... .. 1M ... 

..., •• ~ioIo""."'. ' .. odw-. 

  20-0203 K Page 6 of 40



S«1Io' '09 Soan! pfApwl' 

Scsliop ,ot .. Appal Pmal1ra'wI TI.,II'n w.n ... addId II fol~ AIt)! pfl'l~ orntliq .. "", 

btll._ I,.", OOA)' H i>dOf.wy Il/f«IU by .... t:Jt'fW. did.;"", or ... ...-iotI __ by • jh ..... 

a{fIdaIllrrowglt" ..,.111,,, ~ .ora)' QPP«llIItb _ • .. III .. I' CIIhtIdi7 Ga)o: of. ~ ..... 

1tOt~. AIl.1iCIt <rppGI.I JlooIIIM fIlM It< .."HI"g wf/II./w s,,<nW)I of l/w Go..,,,,,,,, Bo.d /or IIw 

dUlria. A li_/y tl(.fJNI ,""'II ~ ",,,ltv tICIbr by tJw i" codtI ojJiciai WItiI "'" _. Is dI,,1'MiNd 

by l/w "ppeaI B-.J cu oUlIiMd It< s.c""" J09.1. WII," l/w iuw f108U "'" ..",iN", Jr. or /iJll# 
ItawrrlIO 1JW",IM,., iflltt p~61Ic. n.. fi,., codtt offocl<rl.MlIItOtID- ,Itt Df1PIII- I1y ClrfijiU __ <r{ • 

.sa. <rttd II .... of ncIo /wari,.. TIM IwtrbtK #w1IJ IH xlwdtJu If} ,.. phIct ... _, .... 10 ~ 

dayljroIH 1/w",,1tt;wm 0fI1'" CfmijiN 1fIDII. nw apptllant Mto/I "-e ,''' riglrllO "f'P'<>"" P'Tft1II 

or by "I'''' at /I", """Ittg tlftd ?U"" _I . .."i"," Q>tdIor p/IotogropItic t~1tktJcr '" tJtr AppIaI Boord. 

&SQo. 110 V ..... Iio., 
11M Y'dt'lo' P,yltln .hal! b. omended II follows, hnon • ..,ho shan vio!Qe I provi.ion ofilli. 

cocII or IIIIll fail .. ",,",ply wiill VI)' ofllle requirernenlS Ihereof or ...no .... 11 erect, inslal~ Iller. repair 

01" do won ill ~iot.1ioft ohhl approooood <:ORI1ruetiooo doc~lI'Ienli or dim:tivw of !hi r .. cock offici.l. 01' 

of, pemtit 01" oenirgte ""'" Il!Ido:r provisiorls of!h;" code, IhIJI .. luHty of I MI.Jdt_tmOr or 

iItfroct_ III 11M di.lcflt/ow of dill proHCl/IiJIf _Y or "t'''''1. punilhable by I r;IIt IlOl ucoedinl 

1/0000/01" ojtru ~ 1. "JiM _ UlCHdi.rg SJOO.OO/tN" IfCOItd W%iiofJ "II'" _ pn1>'il101J 

.. Ir,v" _)'«'; 1. "f/Iw _ ~ 11000.00 /or ..,.,. t>dditi-' .kHotiotl qj 1l1li I....., 1""'/s101J 

.. /lIUIt _".. ... by irn~ IlOl uceodinl JI6.,....orboth ~ r_and ill'lpriJonment. EecII 

~ 1M: • vioI.tion contin_ after duo natic>c hao been lCI"<od lllal! boa doemod I lIpUIIIe offense. 

(Hedl'" ~ Co&. S«/Ioou I JUJ .. / 7991). 

"0.",1 Ckadou sbaIl "lidded II followJ: nw r_ CIW,{. or ItbIItn dtJIy ~ '"'fI'"'U_i..,. 
-:y iuwcilatiofu/Ol" iIofractiau or I"im- ""iau qjlltaC(dr fIWI_I"S-ioIt IJ'?/ <r{ 

,'" /hQJdt " Stfdy CoM <r{ • .Sl'GN ofCdIfontio .. CJtQpM .fc ('-ItCI"f .. Ir' $<<1i00i &$J.6) ,. 

Tlt/, J oll'orl 1 <r{. pfltOJ C .... "I'''' sa- afCdIjontJa. 

Sts119, III SlOp Work Order 

I n.~. f'Y.1! to Comply w.!! boa omended u folio ... " Any petSOII ... ho w.ll_ ..... AllY work.ftw 

having been servod with Iitop-work 0I'der, ""pt'~ work. tlIaI ~ is di/'OCled .. perform 10 

remove. viol'lion or unser.. c:ol>dition, ,h.!! be ptl'tuW/, by Of jWf or """u~_1tI or bot. '" 

ducrlbN Ito S«t/on I IIU (HNltI, " SqfiNy Coth SffliIMIl J I ~S ..... I ?99J). 

  20-0203 K Page 7 of 40



Clu pler 1 

Set!!" 1!!2 Gtpel'll/ Dfn, tIio .. 

Acid derlllilion for C"pn'! . S1taII_ Q/in,..1ridI b wtdp- c«IIt.hg. P"'~ _II. lit"' .... 

~ _IMIit: p"rpostJ_ 71tu ilJclwlu /Ins CQIII~ ",ltlol1l t>WdtJor flnfll ___ loud _ "'ltlo 

flwl Qr ~Io;~s. II\n'a ... llIg jftlWd, liq.ud. (JJI' #GIld!wb. ptJI'fObk .No,oW pJb. 1Irot ..... or IpQCf 

IwDIlttg tkOlku ,../dd (1fW .... "",JkIt of "".l' #nICIIW, 1ItObI1, ,.,.." Qr <IIf)' I~.. ' -+iooI 

~ "" " whlel,_ 

Add dtfonition for Pistrict ' S/tDII _ 1M dUI.icl <ltd 011 0I1wr __ ",111dIt II .. nltrior ~ 

Ilw,.q _ (JJI' Ittrn¢' ,. al<>blil!t«J. 

Acid dtfinibon rot pm,...! - SJ>Q/I _ " wlrlcuJQf' """*' lid II"'" "" __ ,IttJIf 1>000 I>MIId. 

""111",, ~ Ib l/ww dwtllillg .... its "" ",ing/. flD"Ctl, r.td <IIf)' IIUIIf/K. of"""'UOI)' buildinp. 

Add definitioa for [untty, Bob . S"",I_ I'" 8ODI"d of 011'«1", of I'" DlJlr/ct 

Add dermition fer flu ellie ' • SlkIIl _ ,'" CItI'1 !::I«lI/iW Fin Offa. of tM Fft 

do". ........ 'dWrit:t u "";"g ,''' jwrlIdkliool Qr 0 thJy atllloorlnd rflf"G'lIlallw_ 

Add dtronibon f(O" Tn!"", C[9!!'d M'''vr ' SItoII_'~ ~'_lId. "''''''1)1 Q I«:lirily ptJr-ti 

Qr 111101,.".-'. "',.., .... f1"tJfted .. "" ~ ~ '" ulf p«JpI. Ji'owt Q /ell'",. 01"''' pJQCf! of 
""1>1,, _MblDgf Itt _ ortkrly .... ~QIIfI~ IPi ,''' __ r;f _ ."..rpttcy. 

Oapter ] 

Sutl91 )91 Milliou 

301.1 PlPa/tioN dial! t.. omendod as follows: Added Campfi ... ddi..mon., .. "'-'" aboYe in 

ChI""'. 2. 

Sudol J07 Opel 8!nl!, . Resmdo,,1 fI,.. ... 1I o.l4oor flBP!"," 

W ..... CI"'pDf! Rnlrls"tIolllhIli be addle! as foIlowt : 

JOM ..... II is lillta..fo/ for <My pIn(JIt 10 I""'. """""0110. '" "" Q ""'PfirI ..,... or _ <IIf)' ...... h. 

cowrcJ I...J. grrwceowrtd Iatd, (JJI' jJnJleCOWrcJ btd dwttt lIW "- ..... bwtIlIIs".rwti14 ... 

$Kfpmtkd by ,1tI Dinc_ r#tItIlMpmtWMIII if Forutry '"' F/,.. PI'OI«tIool. IIw CAL FIRE. Urtit Citiq. 

'" I'" AIU. 
£zNpdtM: C_rcUi ~ t1pffl>Ilotu .. ult ~ 0/1'" ,.flU. 

J07.U,l w-. ~ '" oIlowN. It IItoWd _ IMlgwfo/ for ""y".._ ., 1ifN. Iftl1btlDi1I, 01" _ 0 

CQMP./irt..,......, IHwlwowrcJ Iarrd, "...._rtd bid; ",. ~1I_rtd bod ... 1eu rlwjol/Qwillg 

....... "'" ..,.."''''flle ... CQMPIi#d .. lIlt. 

3OM,U t i l J'Iw ........ It#lh 'foil of ,''' fMripMryoftltl C<JMPfU'l fultond of oHjI_lftD6l, _,rlo/ 
.... "'P''''''''''-

  20-0203 K Page 8 of 40



• 

lt1 .•. UI")()o,,~ •• I' ~ ... h/ttll"Ht{."-'Jltdu"...,/or_ •• '" .. 
_ ~ IIrI Dlll¥fow 
Jt7d,U (cl C4E:pfiIilllwllk"...,." 1/OOf"" __ .......... 0 at_v t «I 

rooUof....a or~"" 
Jf7,iA.l ldl W"_,-.,w ... ",.locodo ,= _"H'*rt""".ipIdM~.ee""", 
_ ~11Hr "" , • . 

e ll' pln 5 

Sm!tt Sl fln AlrptONl A U!!! ftD!dJ 
",,2,,1 9'w,.- lhall be ...... odIDcI.l'ollows: fire ~UI KlC_1'OIdI1hIl1 MVl'IUI~ 

widlh or ... _!bin 20 .... ~ .. iYt "MIouIIlm, <If _wNJr-Jt- r:(con 1OJt- c{e.e. 

~ bapplo,.t~ ... iI'I-.sa- widlSoctlool ~3.6, 1M unobslnoclcd ~Ic~ 

01_", tMn ,,/Nt . .u .. i"_)IJ lit" dbl,*:ultoll_1Hr 1111.11. 11jiH1 ... /tk. 

5OJ.l's Pt,d 'd .... ' bo _ .. ' • 101'-'; o-kncI rn ' ppu1In. _.-- _ ~ 

In _ of I so r.t illlenJIh .. II be provided .. iIh an .ppo>ted _for rumi.,. uound fiN tppatlllIII. 

SUA BrM- .ad fJm!"" s.d'I!cw"" bo _!did. follows: wt.il't I bridp or an e~.!ed 

sum.:. II pili of. fire IfIPII'IIIII _ told, eM bridee IhIJI be <:OIIswcled and .... 'MI;nfld III 

ICCOrdInu willi tIw CWMII £J DtH't>tIo COOOOIy ~ioit Dn>iIkIII ~ St-wd or ApfHltdiz 

D oft. CW1'f!'*' Clliijonlu. Fh CodI . .. WC.....,~ II __ nstrlcIlH Brid, • ..-.I elevt:ted llll'f'lcellhall 

be desltr.ed for. live Io.t ... rr"'ienllO...y ... lmpooecl .. offinl appu1It ... Vehicle Ioed Ilmlca 

wli be pomd • bodI _ 10 brIodt- ...... required b)' !he Fift Codt otrICNI. WMn ,an_ 
l~rfacM "-iped far .... crJCftCY YChiclc .. _1djKcnt 10 IUI'f'IceI whidI ... _ dMiped Ibr-" 

.... , opprovod burien, lfIPI'O"Cd ..... Dr boctI shall be "'11ed UId maiMllMd ...... NqUind by U­

r ... oode oIYki.l. 

59,).4.1 Np radii. " fiB I em .... 11 be IddecI • follows; No,... ...... pIri, or '-­
,kft/btf I>II'Y .. Jokk . ... MIlrtr _otdttI or _1tdH. ..,.,. ....... ~ • .wM t:tIIIjlIa ..... Ao __ 

tl'fJ/!li.:or .. CtHrIpI~wll,.tlwtlhctbu ofIIwFh CNt/. orIfil//tnNy_\4l ! ' ,..,....' m.. 
,_ qIbr or ~ffidd '""IJIc ~ '*"'" ."", tIw ..".. • ..,,1IrP .... ., .,. -" or ill ..,. 

*-*'" IItI> p!fIbI~ or pft-.IyQWlWf/ or oputftd fl:6-rtrfll port..,/«iJlIy,.," ' 1. -/h ... 
6:r 1lw diJlna .,idJjwU<IIa _ ___ 110 1OItkII".. piau" ~ ~ .'iV'UD .... 

IMIio , (l) by _ .. ,.,. i I £rrtly ""'~«"'III, tJNJ ..... l6Jorjro.. u..~ piau ~ 

--._'"-'" _ ...... _ td tI"flIw dWtlwplau &I>jh obw, (1)"'-'....,or""'''' 
... ,..,. tI .. ...( _~ calor, _ .... pI"" .. 1tA I. __ "FlU L4N£". ""'*,._ 
rkwIf ..... fro- " odrick. or (.\I .,. _ .. -' or .. ,... _ ,''' .... of.,. oocohoy ... ...Io/gIj 

"drorty ___ tIw __ -FlU I.AN£" 

  20-0203 K Page 9 of 40



• 

!OJ •• .] NO) h.kI .. Ia '1"0<11 of Hydrnllwll be.cldod u foll~: "0 pn3O#I .1ttJl1.tcIf!. J1'ri. Ol' 

t-MeN.., otry ... ltk/r wJtIlht H /ffl of tljilw Ityt/rfllll ucrpHujollow,: (Q) (ftJ. w/tic/, II onMlkd 

bJla li«tued drtwr .. /to if Hf:Md .. 110. fraN _ and ",Ito eM I"'~ialdy _ ... SI/Co\ ..,,1tit;I. II, CQI' 

• ~. (10) Q'" .... Itfd. " 0-.1 0#' opooIed by "fin thpanlMlll tad Is cl""of)' -ad <II Qj/N 

"par-IN wllkk. 

503'.'" FiN LooHO 8!Hd "" Rod W1dtb shall be lidded as follows: FIN Ifltta ,1IaI1 ". ""'iii 011 rood 

.. all. ,tqod'o ad ... A~fttfu 0 <II _ttihd bJlllw di$1ricl 

$OJ» fit! AD!!! .. I .. I A0C!!! GIla shall be Iddod as follow,: AI/ QJj/ontQ/ic QItd _..01 plu 

IlUlDIJed """" '" """"' ..... accur roa:b ,WI c""'P9 with I. <llstricl ,..,. ,U.tdanJ <II Q{lPf"Owd 6)' 

dol jft aJ. of/iciaI. 

Std"" 50S P!'ft!ioe 14"lIngllo' 

5tS.1 Add ..... , •• tilk2t1o, thall"w tIM: fll1t li ... orChi, ~ omel\decl u follow! : Addnuu 

p ..... -' uilliIIg ~ ,Il0l1 ~ with ,. diJrrict tIdthcs.J ,1OIIdanJ <II' QPPf'OoU 6, /I" fIN --
Sut!os:!07 f1rs I'rp!tt'!ne WINt StP. 

(10741 W)ut Rcq!!lml .... 11 be .... nded. follows: olOO .... shall be ommcIed 10 /jOiNt. 

a..pta' , 

SuM!!J flrs Spri.kkn 

KJJ Wits" JUgUm! JlWI be omenckd. follows: An lfIPIO'I'aI aut"", .... !ri ..... 1er I)'S- JldI". 

,..",...~ -' iIIllGIJ,. II, ..... 6.ikliltp -' ~ J6OO...-. 1M" ".-, ...... COtOJtnctNtH' 

",/oct1Udri"',_jwVdkrioto <If dacrit!ed in SedIOlll901.1.1 1hrou&J! 903.2.12. 

b..., .... : AJricuItlnI "",kI;I'II' noc IIIIdef I specitl Ide penn;t\llOd for commen:iaJ putpOMl. 

mol .. W)m Rea,,"" IIIIaU be lidded u follows: saan.s ~ ~ lJoJkIiItgJ ~ 10 1.600 

~.r-. I" uIR"" btdId/ltp J.600 If .... 1«' fir ~r. oM.r 1 _ _ (JIIIt/ ~/r»tily d.wUiIlg 

.. u.. ..., f4rlctJ1wd 611i/dbtt,1IOI ...... sp«101 _ twrMiI /fir _101 ptMpoICJ . ........ ~ 

_ qI_ bMIId/ttfflrsn_,1r """fQW/ by.-..JditiuH qI_l_ tJWry~ (J~ Of' 1.Q(J() 

"1_ /HI ~ .. ~ Is Ius. sd 6oJJdj", fir sn lie"', ,1tdI be .... 10 -Yo- 10 S«riooI 9OJ.2. 

SUb Witt" Rtg,irsd shall t. odded 1$ foiJowa: Sl_ ,,~ 6MIdiItgI leu dtao! J.6t/O..-. 

J-t. ". uiI'lfIIa' 1nll1di"P J.6t/O .rqoa"t.r- fir ku.. 0*, "'-~ _J-iIy dwftliJlt ..a. QItI/ 

QgPhIIWQ/ 6MiJdbtp _ -xr JP«ioI "'.Pf....wj<H_--aat f1W1IOSU • ...... IIw fttJor- oj'" 

/J,1IiM1", /lI"~ Ir '--ud 10 II /(}fill ,....,~ II .. ' J.600...-. ""'. q.- addilitM 0/ _ 1_ IItII'f)I Pf,"~1 (J"".) Dr 1.000 S9""'" /Nt. w~"""1r Ius. .nd hjldUoll Of' ~. ,WI 

k .... III ~ III s.ctlo#l lIOU. 

 20-0203 K Page 10 of 40



9!p J I Gm" A ~I beMllClldod .. follows far A ifOUpi A-IIhrouah 1.--4: 903.2.1 .1 (I) ThI II ........ 

uceedsJ.600~~foa. 

m .p GCOI D [ Mall be wended .. follows: 901.l.J (I) ~.11 Gl"OIIp E fIR _ put ... 

Ihan J,6«1 ~ /HI in _ . 

m.2.i GrpwD [ -I lhall be amended .. follows: 90].1 .• Gn;up f . 903.2.4 (I) A Gl"OIIp F fil't.,.. 

e. ",..... J,600ut_fod. 

m~7GroMQ M Mall be .... ended .. follows: 901.2.7 Group B and M. 903.2.1 (I) A Gn;up B and M 

fino _ "rWOt J,600sq.n/Hf. 

!OJ.l.l!.l Ma.H .... I ...... UpM ...... 1 be.clded .. foIloors; .4" .. _;';Jh IprlJIl:J,. ~Y'I,,,,1ItD/I1Hr 

....,,,,nd;" all .... _>faa •• d ~ _ ".w/li-J-oIy _4x1WftJ ~ -.dtdp 11# o.s /I 

_......d '-""""ill tlrwllhrg. 1Jw flair tJttd ~ltJIfDtiM q{ nod! sysMIrU JItoIIIHr .. oa:u;wdoaoc:, .,ilil 

CgJijio ... ", CedI of RApi/IIOottI. rw. 2J. J4Jf}(J -, 
I . MatujirIWfti ~ It:K.-I wit"" <lit ulS/ilor ~ ""'- ptri ~ .,1IIt 

CgJ~ &<11111 _$iJfnyCotk. DtoUIo« IJ, ''''' 2. 1 "" 2 J. 

2 Mlmv{<lclllrftlltoau IIttJI do _ u«td / .100,.-.. /Hi ;" .... tJttd ",..,. ... <lit 

IJf:«UQIf)/ tlrwllm, aM, ... rJ.fot«I .. 00",,_ Codr Ste,,,,, 6JIJ01; .,1It" .. 
..-1$1.., P';~w.y oa~ <lit lilt propnty If _ ...., ... d lID co-.pIy.,iIII CaliJi-*> 

RWtkNW CotJ. S«t/oft lUlU. 

J. MQtlv{<Icl~,.,.j ~ drill do ___ J10 ut-foil ;" lIN. 

9OJ.l" GrolD 5=1 th.1I be IImtllded .. follows: 901.2 OJ 0f0II9 S. 901.2.! (I) A Gro.ap S fi~ _ 

txe-lt J,600Jq_ftfl. 

toJ.l.IO Groll $.J £psl!W1l Plrld" G ...... ...... I be .... tnded II fol ....... : 903.2.10 (I) WbcR 1M 

fino .,... of, ... onc:1oted perkin,....,. .J<tccdI J.6OO,.,-. fo,L 

See!!01 !!01 Crt AI.rm lId Dtltclktp SUlCal 

!!I7.l,. W,,", f!.c,qulm;! N"" 8·11",., or SIOICtum 1m 1Ip,),601! NUl! ftrt th.1I be.clclod 

.. followa: All opprowdfi .. a/""";dollt:f"" IJGI'''' ~""'I 1M itutalled ;" dJ 6NiidittgJ .... 11 /1ft-_ 

leu IIIDIo J,600MpIDN/Hf. 

E ... plkHu, 

4 a...- tJttd ~u, dwell. (R-J ~/a tJttd Olltt. QCCfIIPIl'IC'.ItI c1aul/Md ... 

"U"). 

J. AgI-IcWlwaI /HtiIdiItp _ ..... JPlCW ...., /H"";' 0NlI"" _ IIHd P C~ • • ",1tlI 

Jl'I'POJU (I .... .. tail. HI .... food ul"Ylcf. 0NlI0l' 6pCClai 'wlll3). 

 20-0203 K Page 11 of 40



6. MdHog;I "*" a floor _ lea ..... JOO " ... /HI...a,. IN UJI"'fJI. AI GmnNMd b,. 

lIN Fin Cltiej. IN lWIM,dWy_1roriad rt~M. boudM buildilttcaASl1'"Clialo 

_~riDI-tfmtw'n. IoNtIolo. 0«...-,.",... -tdl.l4IrIU oIItupo.wu. 

9!!7.1.b SIPI"" of Edlriol BIiUdiap IIIalI be IIddN • foIlowI: bo ".ISI'" hlldUws wllltoolt ... 

I1p(JiVWd OI<I_ic spriN:Ju s,..u .... OlIN, tIDr __ IN '-t-It,. Mil.., .... tJtfrlctilllll'OJ b.md.., 

"'" wtth, Ip«iDI "" ~""iljrN eotrUMrCiai pwpo&u'" o/h 01_ ~ltcfiOlt ,,.m,,.:bu _ uW 

tIIId IlwjlOOl' _ qfllN bMlldilog or .J/nIC1W'f Is lote:rttJSN or"..diftf<i by _ .. lltIny~_ (J~ 

or 1.000 ",... fo~l. ",lIiclw .. , Is IUJ, ,,,,,11 bMildi"ll or strW:fIft Mall IN ..:dt oIIt COOtt/ontt It> Srcfion 

901 ... r"tfMWd by lIN FIN CII~ 01' ItlsJ7,f'doIIy (1U/horiNd rtpNst" IQlI.. 8M/ldbop wIdo "floor 
_IUJ tIDr 500 ~ lut...ay IN u~"'fJI. <If .'~l'Jttbttd by lIN Fin Cltl<f. twlti.sl1wrdoJy OIII/toriud 

rtpreltrtllltliw. baJ«J "" bllildi", ~INCfialo _t,iiMI tIIId foot"",. 10000i ..... ~ /)pt. _ 

dl.UOItCI .tI upoJWf' 

Pf7J.s MHI!Ori'l IIIalI be ~ • follow$: All fin oIanN.'tc/l"" S)'J/~1fIS ,Ito/I IN CONf«Nd 

dir'K/Iy 11rroItgII __ iJOnd by 0 U.L QIIII"O .. d emlnIl. proprielary or rt _ _ loti "~. wNo:,.\ 

fhIU lIWdibk _....,..,. 'ipoll '" 0 ~_'ly aIf~ Iocatialo. AU sp,illkltrtd bMlldlnp .1toI1 IN 

-"""' 
£u: • .. 

1. 0Iw- <PIli '-J-u" ~1J1Itp ~-J O<:e,,-,kr -' OlIN, _,,-,ies ci=ifted OS 

~lr). 

8. A~ bodldiI\IJ _ ...... sp«101 ..,. ~nNt md'0f' "'" t4fd for com_1'cioI 

pwpuu.:s (~ .... ,.,/oIh Ma, food "~. tMlVtw 1pK1oI_1IU), 

"',14 Type I Us 1 .... 1ll1iqg IIIalI be IIddN .. followl nw ~_Itf tf 1ruttll1atilNt. Of' 

rtplcalftf'tI'. of 0 ryp. , HOIJtI $)sU .. rItoII I'ftI"lN "Jh oWnttIsprNJf' ~ mit. to IN 

IttsfDIltd. Of' for tIN Itood S)'Slt .. '" IN CONt«IN .tI ... "./sIi", ~ oIanttI1prlMJtr _uorillg .(I'Jtt .. 

for tid b"ildillg. 

?O7",1,1 Sugtdla Pom SMPltlr nil be IIddtd • followl. hi _ .......... Ill NFI'A 71, tIN 

.~ putIItl' s"I!PIY fJ'O'IIditt& " .. 111,.",_ U-Itow fKI""'r ~ ..Jw ~ Iot>d (qu,.. 

ope_i", ;"" -.01 ..... tOf!duiM) ,lta/I IN _ndtd oIIt 0 .. ;"i .. " .. 71-Jtoo, IKI""" copadry. 

~: TIw uls/tltCfl of ... ~-'I"'IOCJ' bod-up fK1"'tT INppIy tItr.JI _ Of' U>;tN tJw 

rapirt,.,.u ojClllljfomio Flit eodt C/wlpfff 11. 

o.aptff 11 

'i'nh' Ill) Ea,mIQ lid S,"dllx ,.".". SnltI!. 

 20-0203 K Page 12 of 40



IlU,!.1 Iw"peW IhIlI be Qended .. follows: £mersency (lCIWe II)'SIanI Md tCI./Idby power 

.Yllmlflhlll be iIutIlled in _dow..:. .ith!hl: Califorllio BWldi/laCode.,!he Califorllio Electric Code, 

NFPA 110 I.nd NfpA 111.AUIIIIiIdi!!p, QlIwrI __ tlltd~,*,iJy"'lI.., ... iD, ....togrictJrwaI 

bIoik/illp I!(Jf ~ for C:O-I'CItII ",.-,x¥Q. • .:do IlQItdby pt1WU • • halI '-- 0 IIwIi trip dnioI tJx. 

dU~1S QJI ~ ,f()Ift'Q' fro drI hlldUtg. "W'owd by ," ji,., otJdI oAicltll. £W1iltg iJuldlot,,­

.hall N mal",o/totd .. ~ will! drI origiloa/llfiP'ooul_ 

SecIlOI JJIO Am" (or F1"O,IItJ., 

n!OJ fa.1tt Ilh.,llIs:eJlo! ... 11 be tdcleclu (allows: Prior /0 tIItd d!iriI!g~ '"" uppio": 

<!ddrru ,Ip ,hall lie fI"O"kkd '" .adji,., "'" ._,-p1lC)' ... lUck ~ rood.""Y IIUo drI pro/«I. 

Su!l91 un We\!( SUoly for fir! ProlftliG, 

»'1.' WItno RegYlred IIhI.II be amended .. followa: Prjo, 10 COIr!b ... ,lbI. _uIoU..mhtg "" •• 

," flrt ~ _~ "Y"." .hall b. itulollftJ "'" maiMo~uJ ill corr'~_ opcro/iooo. "'" __ ~ 

__ ."Pf)/ifd ,halI_, drI NqMindjin Jaw for IIw proj«l. 

C"'plff .. , 

5«ctIot f!tJ PI",. 

490J.! WileI'! ile!!ll/red ...... ' be tdckd .. follows: T/wjJN coM officlci <1{1" MFPD may NqMi,.. 

dIw~ proj«;tI /(IciWd It! Modoot •. Jflfh "'" rny-Hi,h Fir-f HozonJ s...,rity Zoo!u 10 ,1IbMi1 

1" f'"*CI/aII pm TItiI ~ IItoII N ..,.-owJ b, t>«/I ," "" ""* official ""',"" <1III/roriud 
,..",a_Of;'" jor drllt;;cd CAl. FJRE, (Aoil cltiq (if loc:oIed bll"" ,I:mu R •• potulbility A,... ISM}) 

priM II> tIw reconIiI!g 0{ dw fotoI ... p drI f"OJ«l b)' • c-, 0{ £J Do;odo, 

Sn"tk>J nos WINK" p",ustl9r &tWig CoU'Mtio • 
.. 90S. .. Roof C_nt!Iloto Reg .. ...-... ...... / be Idded U follows. AU _ COOUI7WfIcw. IItt:lud~1l 

addiliofu. ~;..u a CIcIu A I'«j" cow-,." Of' _MbI)' All ,.,.<OOfhr "",wI,.,, a- A ~ c-owrf..,. 

'" _1IIbIy III 0 ~ Re......".. It! oau If 'OM oj,"" t.du.., _""., ./jll/lt OIl)' _ Y*' 

pmodwl1llO«al~ tItot I."" '"liN aC",," A '"11_,." Of' ",,=+'}'. a ___ CIcIu 

B Of' Cjin ",I<>Idtlfw tnotNi tIItd QI' ___ WOfItI u.ou Of' .lIb¢Ia .... _ uppo,"", .. " roof 

_ ring _rldjorClouA~. 

Cbptcr 50 

SsctlOl SOOl Ctltr!l 

 20-0203 K Page 13 of 40



SIOI.' L.illbiUn for u."'l!ft shill be added u follows: Ally ~5 ot' COU ra~111ng /rOttt tIw 

~ Iot»d ... spill ot'~ oftMyloaztJldtna _riOU ~ICOIUlilwlfl tklHQgQIIul <IIIy'ucIt 

~.jinrl OI',~ioII ~Ing nO 5piJJ QI' discharp. T1W.", iI: ccJWctibJ, I1y tJt. FI,., Ow/. Dr 

1tUIJ., dwIy_1torlzed "prf5tl_tw.. *' IIw __ <2J ill • (::II2:H of<lll obIlgat/(}ll ...... lIfHtffl1CI. 

UpT'tutdQl'iItfpI_ 

CtI'ptu54 

SesJio. *1 G .. e" 
;!6OI.l r'!'!I1! R!Qodred ohaIl be amenckd. follows: Penniu IIWI be .... ~ired u Nt rOI1h in Sec.ion 

IOU and rq~l.ated in ..:con:Ianee wilh this SCCIion. WIN" npl05h1u Pf""ju GrY ,...,~If'fd. Ilwy,hall 

I» w..I 6y • FIrt Ow/. Dr 1Ii.1IIIt, dilly (JIdQI'Wd "'f""H"latlYf. tMd IIw EI DondD C_O' 

SJwrf/f, Dtpc».aw,,,. WJwN.finwo#tJ Pf""/U 1In,...,1Ihd. 1Iwy,1ttJI11» w-J I1y dw F"IT't Cim/. Of" 

IlilAwl"Nytlllllu iud ,.,~~. fIIId dw EI Damdo COMl)' IJ-.J ofs..pe,.,iJ"". 

5601.2.1 Dono ..... laboa tball be added • folio",,: 1Jw AHJ ,1tO/J Iw4 dw awhorlry fO ,.,qual 

.x.c-...,..,;,. ~ oIll11JpfCf1 of dwfo ,.""otI prl#1fI«bt. 

5601.2.1 P!'!!!!!'id!ry II!"onuCioI .... n be Idded • foItcrw.: nw AHJ ... 1lI prof«:I "'I profI'M~ 

~. 

SUdOl 'TOt SlOAn 

S!1H.L!.i,1 ' z:e1ioN WkR AIIoyr::<iro"d Ta!", 'n ProI!!W'd IhalI be -.dod • follows: 

Sttnge ole .... [ ...delw II fllmm~ liqutch In .... pound IMD _ick c{lNlldinas ill prohibftecl 

.... UlQ(JpI"OII«I &,)'11w FIrt CIW/. 01' /t4IJw, Ny_horlud"'picwtl,arr.. . ..... Pf~ ..... Fh 

CIt~t 01' /tIsIIIv Ny _Iroriud ,.,prat_"'. 011 ... ro-I aMfl) Dr ... bulDl/arto.u for tIw 

,1Ot"Ilp o(CIau I. II QI' 111 jI....-bIt tMd a»tb""ibl, Ilqtdib sItoIl ~ .... dIGM ,...,ttIn __ .. 
1fI/or11t &y dw Califon",. FIrt C_. n. CaJifom/Q Firr C_1lttJII Q/IQ ~ '" ifwaJitJliau"" I. __ ~~ /wi ~/Ilc _Ic>tu .. Iw,.,~,..,... .-. It. oq .... oJ. 

SUllo! ,'Ot Spu!.t! OR'"IIqU 

S7Q6J,i,' LmdoU W)sn AIro!tCCOnd tny .It rrotrtlwtsc! .... , be _ended u rollowl: 

SttnF ofel_ ! IIoIId C .. II flammlblc liq~idI in aboYo-pound III\b OUtIick o/'buiklinp is prohibited 

.. las I1fIII' 011«1 by". Firt Cloit/. Dr IoWlto,doJy _Itorintd "'pi _ liM ...... t-nWrtdq",. F .. 

Cltllj. " ~, Ny _ltorlItd "prf5'II/"II ..... aJJ ... f'"O""'I aMfl) or ....... /IuIQ/ItJlloIUji;r ",. 

IU1tap q(CI4u I, II 01' 111 j1"......,./H. tMd ~btul/bI' Ilqw.16 ,Iro/l eo.pIy w/tll,.,., "'qttln_ tJI 

., fordt ..... Califom/Q Fn C«II. 1Jw Cal/fi;n<1D FIN Codot lItDII ., ..,Jy '" iAUalitJl/olu «ltv 

.b __ ~Iokl. {wI dilpMJl#IfJ JIQ/1oN w/w,., obo..,.f'"O""'I.J/Of""ap /I ,...,.... 

 20-0203 K Page 14 of 40



CUpltr 58 

Sud" _ fltaalb" Cnomj!; f1," 
-J 1J.ludou IIooU be ammdod. follows Sunp olfllm .... CI')\1I ' ......... __ , 

_inerI outside of buikhnp iI protubilld ..wu. 4'P'g • .,..,. I. ,,,.. Clrltq. QIf 1IaIIw,..." 

IM~ rfP'YM-;';" ,n", "....mtd 111 "" Fh CIritt QIf ....,.,. A6< _1tCrlZ.I ,y",.-to«. 

IIIJ IIi1Iiottary CDttI ...... P I. '1OnIp 0/ Jf<-b" ,,,.,..../1: jhMtb .. ~ wid! ""­

... .w-.-. Qf _Pt. by dw Coll/onrkl F"" COtlf. TIw Col/lOmlG F".. COtlfu.u..,,..Jy II> 

iJulo/IQfjQN ...... _ ... /lid. /wi dUpfN~' "./oAt ... ,. ...... vo-d ..... II nflIii.-.J. 

Su:! $ "Of 1.,._ '(Lf·c. 01111'"0 

"IMJ M .. ley Ctpteky w'YI. EfI'b1iIbd Y.'!lwl! be amended. follow" TlwIHlnlp af 
lilf,..jlM/ ,..tNk_ .... ~ 0/ .... ' ' ..... 0/ l ,OOO-pto.o _, <XIpQC1ty .. /wit ~td .. ~ 

_.IvII! (111) .,iI. fr'o.~"Y --,,,,~.--for ,.,/dvtIItJlItS. "*'. J.IJ.JI o--ItaIf (111) .w • 
.rw- aiu,.,. ~jaJ .... "". , ...... ....,Ity ".."., ,'''''' _ (I) dwfll/lli ... /1 P" llC,. "*' .. 
IMIu _.JtaI! (JtlJ ..u. fro- ~ """I QIf _I .. <M"""td ..... ..uu ~ <ft1 Q 

'PfCJQIko.;dilJo,ool_ ",...11. "'wti&, dw C-oo 0/ EI /)(wodQ 

DilpMS/Itg .. /I/;;; alObiulwd I/oIoU. WIfIIjo; dw IJa/IU tJI<IbIulrod .,. '- ""*1;", I. dbpttnlott af 
/iq...tW ,..troIt- .. jIOJr ". pnIl«f/olt ~ Iw<rwIy JIOPfIIaM<I or COtIpMtd _ "" QQ"1qW' 

O<Ip«iQ'ojMy'- lIUIoIJ ....... u.u _ uc..J. _"""",Iry <l/1,OOO",u,-. 1MtIUf»N'''I if 
liq_jIed pHl'tIk_ .. itt ~ ... "ii' .,a' 0/ l,OIJO..pIJOff _ "'I"Eq ....... ~ 

'" GI __ 1vII! (In) ",Urli'- prlIpfrot .... ", d., ..... /tJr .. ~lIM.t __ .-'" hili -1ttIIf 
Oil) 1iIlU/t'OIIt G Uinta ,.,idnolltJl ~ willi • ...,." pNI" , .... _ (/) ~ .. /I,. 
.:.:....wI ttl Nau --ItaIf (112) "'* fro- "'tI' /ooHJ or.ul " oIl<JMtd ..... AJU i; 0 .... ...J Q 

'PfCJdIr:o>;diliofotll .... fHnllil /Ii luwd., I. C-,. if £I DDmtJa. 

Sub till UP", Elrnlioe Y.M¥ 1'tSrp!c1. GM ,.",!leW" lUOO-root .... t!v.r' ... 
IIII:!IlIlb.U be IddecI II foIlowl: 

6111,1 Ba,lew Mal. Ire IddecI M follows; 

1\, ....... qwlutut I)/I/Ic.,PttIl k "'1(11/1 .. "'_~ .. / •• -t{ot:t>;u ... "" .. "" 

~/IgI' ,., ..... /}OUf:MI .W. fllllDlIfJ Off till U'O wllll/all._ 

1M". ... loa i , Mall. IIufaIJfId ....., , • ...,.,. ,...", _, .lIf1PIw .. lI. "..... n. 
... ' "'~ .... ,..._ ,., I_,Jta/i _poiMeddl>w--.t 1MjInt SIQft' ~ 

,W. pI-o.t lID _ rfHI af" p<I ,.,." .. ill ~ COfIFM' 1Mb.., /Q atJq., )ulbllitylltaJd -.t 

 20-0203 K Page 15 of 40



, 

~ on:w tI".un ;0. .. )IIII'fJ fIIIMIlltdl IN 10CQICd ItOt ." ,,- J iltcltu (/rorironlaUy) 

fro-,Iw ..oIlsojlw-.l 

n. RCo.iIIlCll" • __ rWr JIIIM UtaH .. ilulalltd ...... tJw '""'" of"- bMiJdiltg. /If CIOH .... 

~iaI6Ic 10 tIw bwiIdlrrt .... 1. 1WI"-' ,1wII1 II. ~o-lttppOfI~ 10 dor wdJ ~i~ 

10 btclta HI_,,, "1 '_ 10 4f 10 pnwN 1N..m"Jl qfdtt p;p. .." ___ SNM/"1CfI I<»tb. 

If pt'OI«Ir.....,.,., ~ b,. dw plltpplltr tal BoJIdi..g 0f/Ic1Dl. sldi bot iNJaIIrJ OWl tM.CONI 

"... rYpIttfOf' IftiI«Wfi'y IIf'PO' ~ 10 tlw rrovtd '" tIiagottDIly., "'" -'L 

7k riFIr pipu Jot' l/rw )I<PII pipho, ,1taiJ ItOI ... ~ .. ~N CONnIt pUad QrOwW/ nd 

riul'UtdIIHr lwIdb.:da!.aM I mdfro. all ..... if. fJIIH. 

AI t/w,... of ~ic.itJftfor"Y 1I",ldill, pmtriI. wild ~ tilt iluulIillI.., aj <III LPG ./)'fl ...... 

oppIktIItr VtDII s-...u /III LPG ')'Iu .. p/at pial bt J wpia (QI'digiIdly <IS PDF). 17w LPG pIaf pi... 

"""I wlllllk. bIiIltOt H /",.,., 10, 1M /GIOt /oct1IiotI. (J'fJpQwI .... ~.IIy lit U.s. fU/Jotu. .- of 
ytfti pipiItg. Iocmo.. of 1M riuT ~ at 1M b .. /diItg, P'0I'f' /)' ~ .., ... 0fII/;" r; all 

Ulsl~ /)It/idiNgl Of! tJw /()( -' II tkpiclioft of tIw .w,t/tN of...,. 6viJdiItJ 10 IHr l."tiftl 

will. LPG. 1'IIQ ,1ttJI1 aJ.w Ixfo~ 10 tlwapPl'opriauftn district 10 _ "",,1_ ...... .­

of"'fIM~""', 
LocotIiM af. cml,1'IiII. a/LPG la1Ib ,Ito/I be pc •........ Ndy -W by /Itt "" of _ .... 4 . _ til 

... <:I,nd.. Sloe" ./akr,,1taI1 hi of Il'/lkiertllwlghllO N ..wbl. ' ......... _ icip<nJ -,"1 __ .",,, 

'" 11M ~ttw lOC4IiM 1ltJIOIlatiOll --' .oooi",-_ of IJoa. ..- f/plu _ "" <'UpoN/bllill' of .. ""-
~ t1ppihtcu aNi accamria sltallltOllM p" ... ilfN /" ...,. _ iluUJIIDriDfo ~(IW tJwjl..ujloq; 

or INlow "..... w!tit:lww, .. aorfI rGlriclM. 

f1IlJ vmx.' Rbcr PlpiM !haIl be added. follows: 

NMi_ of SdotdIJ. 80 - '"'" pipblg 

1Jw riMr"11td/1N >WdWr J _.ItorboNQ/1y '1jllw-.l 

SWilla' jIIiMJ ~ltdl k iNl"1td .... awJ kIow .. Ipri 10 I"fI"kh for do. ,... _"~I (SI,.,., 
d~ sIdJ _ IM""'O. 

A I ... jlftibl, ,..,., UlfUtrvae:I qf copptr '" MI>btIUN(ftl ~ twI poou"wf b)l 11,,1 cow""" 
JIwQlIwd _1'iIII """'" k -" /luteotJ q/ ""''''~. T/Iw fluibl, ",_IN UttJJI poovkM ~lIjJIck'" 

Mad /0 tIiI_ JoI''' _ .. "" II. 
illy Me.,l. lid JAsltIoM ~J be added. folloools: 

A~ ...,.uNi ~Ip sNJ/J 1M I«OIird dI_l/y .... • rIIu .. oil WJJw c.o ". hildbtt III G' >NlbI, 

foc:arioIo. 

T/Iw lifwf_ p«NI,.. am ntpfJllvlld/ (jJb 11_","',. ""~ .... III.'" q/,Iw .. 

-..Jw ,.-titta _ . nu ,.1Id1""",* ,''' s."p;.r,_ ... '''''PI'''' If/'f>iw-~_w. 

 20-0203 K Page 16 of 40



• 

r ...... /allilllott Jlttil IN ,._~I/y -'-l ." /I _,III (W >«>Od _ e,JaI SIIQW ~" .. It~ /I 

",111'_ di_1tJ1oIf of 2 bodIou by 2 iIIdwI. 1'-.....". -*CO, shoJI N if .lIjficieNllwiPI It> /VI.abow 

1M _ifill __ pdo tMti UtalIH II """bon/", of 10 /HI ill /w/gltf. nw IM> .. -Un shaJJ II. ptJinuJ 

".t/qw _1Q«Wd OIl t;>ppM.,.. .IOdJ if UwIlN. 

Sud .. till UI!Itn:m"d LI'C T"Yil!lallptio" .. 4 Ow.o.!!t slw.lI be.clded u follow" 

t i ll I ftlWlib 1M' ",p iIh&Il be added .. Ibllo ... " P"MIlJ ,ltd/ IN 'fl{lI.rw/. """pi..., ,WI to. 
..... inftijor dl ...... g.a-IlOIIt Uutdl«ioIu.., <1fII"O* by dw AIU. 

" Il.l URCltn,..td LPG TagkOwDtrHlRlhoJl be Iddtd .. follow" UNk.-gmwtd LPO/QIIJrulwi1 

H proIubilN fr'rJ- lie.., roItJ to D.,/.»sm -' .1ttJJI ... moiMtJ by U. LI'O """PI"I.I' WIdtr " ,..,,.. 

~ IJIIH'" 10 ''''''"props OIIInItlI....u./eNMCC "'I..n_II" __ ottd _",ded. 

5miu 80. Nfl". UP-Ii - Stro,d'rd for '~e laspU.!IoI ol S,ri.kk, Snit.., It OIHI!! Iwg 

fuljb l!!oC!!jm I"" Ma .. !Mnm P o n " ,Melded "l,J,!.l, toJ-M 
Nfl''' no.. A_MeoI SectIon .. follows, 

RerioeSeHio. 5.1.1.2" noN ........... , 

C..,pter II!. NFtA uo. s'1,q A nwIY <f flit /ftul_ "'fOd""..wI ,..._IpriMJ" .. td 

wltltbf /IN p.-.oHrU ,1ttJI1 k --..H "" ," fJ"OI'D'Y '" ... 4; 0 ... 1 I~/ofo. $1«* Ipt"WlVI Urall 

t.. iyt .. " _'-tI .... 1ICCUI1I;k alb ... , 

ae.. .. Semo. ,.t ....... ~; 

CUQC!r 19. NfPA, IJO. ,.t A loctIII_. jfow .... ~ .. P'O '1 .. "" QJl/h~".I)d_;" 

~ ..... .."..,'<'*1 /oc«IoIr OIl ,Iw UHtW of". Mil"., 

..... Sed .... 11~1 . 11o noN .. ,.,...,...", 

O . me 10. NFPA UP, l!.l, l ,! When. lire del*"'1CtII poRI*" COOM«Iioo, II nac prao-iokd. Iho 

I)'itml ihlll be hy~ic&11y 1I$IIoCI1I " ..,,11_ ~ '" IJO pawwb ~.19- "d, ~ for 
"" 1_ dwM " Jo."';IIiIH dwnrtioft wl,hoW .. 1oMi<j(' • k ' Wi. kII _lIttrIIw wlllllUJ«J .,. u. fin 
c.(jfkld. 

II I 

 20-0203 K Page 17 of 40



, 
,~ "'''' ., M 
,,",W MATI " W 

C ... ... 
moo srRfl'l • .. , 
"no. . ..... ". 0. , .... . .... ~ 

I:;'" 
.-• " n) 

,"- ow ..... " .. ... •• 
~, , •• .. ) 

1 - ),600 .. , ... , - • 
• ...-.-

MOl n .. Vol. ~ - - • • •• 
• ,~ ,-..... • 11M. - ". 'm 

$.If ... 
" -• ... ... -

1- 1.600 .... - , 
IOU.I . , .• , 
' " M • "" .. "'" . ...... 
II),) ., 

M '" ~ 
."" ,., - >- ,n , 

.- tou.t - , 
, .~ · " '" ~ , .. 
"'" . • .... .. . 
II),) fI/f . " M '" " a._I I-. .,. 

 20-0203 K Page 18 of 40



• 

, - , . 
• 
" '" 

T.bk BI05.1 1Ug,Im fir! flo ... [or B.!kll'a !!!"'r tie. 0,.. .... "fw?,r,.!!y 
DMIII,o. eNID Me'ltd B-1 1.!IcII,a I!CI !P,"" ... WI! be NIIended .. folloWll: 

AUTOMATIC MINIMUM MW 
SPRINkLER SYSTEM fillE-fLOW OURATIQN 

(0.11" Sill_rei) 
...... ~ (Hln) 

.1 .... ) 

~ . -... -"...... v ..... ill T_ ....... ,-
810S,I(21 B'OUm 

_ tol.J. U ....... c.o. Fft UO<o j(ItII 0('" Dot-. .. T _ 

'"' ..... In Tobit BID! 1(2) • k 
IiIIOS,I(l)' _ ..... -

_ .au 1.2 "' .. co. ftro uoo._"r .... ~.T _ 
Codit f/OIIq -a- • __ _ .. T_ BIOS. I(21 • k 
.... J.~.w-; IIO',lal _110 ..... 

b. TIM ... LII*I lin !low 111.11Il0l be las dton l.soo IJ"II 

SWIOl Dill MI. ', •• SmriI!g!IGII 

plll.1 Arceoo R!!!d Wid,. wi ••• P ydn,t ihall be amadadM follow,. addin,lheexceprion: 

£X«;;,. 7 : Dri"""'}'i' 

DIIJ.l Grade lhIIll be omended .. 101"-': f""" ~ _ roadI Mod driw_1YI .... 11 lICIt aOIId 

IS.m lit""" -us "fP'owd "' .... AJU '" by IIw £J Domdo C-,), JMOftothd Cdlfon*o l'ttIJIic 

Ruowcf(;«k 1JIJ,J4 I Duiptadl.-_ S'm' '" u..-.I 

~: 0.-'001'" J,GOIl/t-' 1IwIII_uu..J 11K 

DIIJJ J,p'" Radl .. 1haJ1 bo .... anded .. foIlDwI: T1w minim .... l1Im"" ndillllhall be ~ined 

by the fue code oflklal: ttttd 1lwIII_ iIchJI c .... ..w pII"', 

 20-0203 K Page 19 of 40



0103.5 Fin Ap!!!"I!!! Mrn. Road Ca leolhall be mended &.I follow,: Subucrioll (1) : Jf'~rw a 

.Ingl~ gau is prollltkd. IItt gal~ widlll.1oalI bt IIOlIUJ ,'''''' 10 /HI (6096 Mm,I. Wlfen aflrw apparrW.I 

.-.-J ctHI.JUU of a dMkd~. IItt g'* widtillilaJl _ bt I~u ,""" jj /HI (4571 Mm,I. 

DlOl.1i.! ROfIdl It 10 :9 [WI II wklt" Ihan be amended &.I follow;, : fire lane IiIPI' &.II speciflCld in 

Section 0103.6 shall be paned on bodIlide d fn appu1ItU5 _I TOIds the! are 20 10 1P fed wide 

(609610 In4.4 mm). 

Fmrpdn", £Jnmiotu ~ 5,(}()()jt. <u tkl-wd by Iht AH.I. 

010l.6.l ROfIdI 110., ,,, .. :9 fed ill Wid'" shall be amended. follQW3: fire IIMlignIu specified 

in Section 0103.6 lhall be po&Ied on one lide of lire Ippara1U5 """" TOIds lIMIte than 29 ta:t wid.: 

(1534.4 mm) and less thanJ6 (OJC{ wide (l09n.1 mm). 

£XCepdo,, · E/ewll/oN oIKNr J.rJQ() jI. Q.J ikrmnlM<i by liw AH.I. 

0104.4 Cin:umfmltjl!! Cia ARpetJ1J11 A"'II 8 ... 41 thall be.oded II follows: WIfe~ nquind by 

IItt lin cotk affidol. olin apporolWS QCCUI road shalllH CONlI'>tCltd 10 rllCO_. tlw utlrouy qf 0 

.m.:tIIn attd ,1taII f»"U"Itk a eottti_ .....aN of tlrWrgtltC]l vMIclr QCCU •• 

SECTION 4: CONFLICT 

ThaI CKdi_ No. 2016-37 of !he MFPO, and all ocher Ofdinanccs ... ~ of ordin_ hmowith ~ ben:by 

_I<d. 

SECTION 5: S[VEW!!,.rrx 

If any CKdinancc, ani~le, IUbeection or subdivision tkcnIof, provision, sentence, clause or phrqe of this code, or my 

application thHeof, it fur lMIy I"eISOIt Mid 10 be invo.lid by I court of competent juriMliction, such dK.ision shtJI rIOt 

affect the l"emlininj provisions of this code, which CIMI be ,iven effid without tho invalid pOrtions and, lhen:fooe, 

fum invalid poniQ1\5 ore dlclared 10 be sewnble. The MFPIl ben:by dlclares thai It would how: enacted this 

CKdinance IIld oach of its articles, sectiool$, 511bsections. or subdivisions thcra"lf, prOVisions, semenoes, clauses or 

p/IrueI irrespectivcoflbe &oct 1hM one or more iXthmt it declared m .... !id. 

SECTION 6: EFFEC nVE PATE AND PUBLICATION 

This Ordinance shall take effect thin)' (30) days after ill lIdopIion. The MfPO Soud Clerk il directed 10 publish 

this ordinance in I ~ of penJ circulation in Ihe District. In lieu of publication of the fiIll tell! of the 

ordinance, a iummary of the ordinance m.y be publi$bcd by the by tho Board Secretary within Ii,*" (I S) daYSlfter 

its pa$S&F IIIICI • certified cop)' shtJ! be posted ill the office of Ibe MFPD punua.nt to o"W"'_' Cad. S«lioft 

J69JJ(c) (I). 

 20-0203 K Page 20 of 40



, 

The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the MFPD on October 17,2019, and 

it was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the Ordinance to be read for the second time on 

November 14, 2019 and approved by the following vote: 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the MFPD this, _14th_day of _November __ , 2019. 

AYES: Directors Barbara Mikel, Charles Schnell & Taffy Warner 

NOES: Director William Buhnerkempe 

ABSENT: Director Kathy Pico 

ABSTAIN: -0-

Barbara Mikel. Board President 

ATTEST: 

, ~ / 
S),1UL/t~· .. 

Sharlyn Fields, Board Secretary 

 20-0203 K Page 21 of 40



MQT&PIO 

Fire Code # 
Significant 

What Is the Change? 
Locally adopted I SFM adopted I 

Why Is There a Local Change? 
change? Amended 

101.1 N Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Administrative need 

LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than 

Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate 
air and can easily be trapped under a home, if ignited it can 

105.6.27 y quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving Locally adopted and amended 
lead to an explosion. At elevations above 5000 feet there is 

occupancies in Group R-3. 
an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire 
activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional 
attention. 

Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance 

106.6 N Add section Locally created and adopted 
of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines 
penmits, plan checks, and inspections as allowed in Health 
&Safety Code 17951. 

106.6.1 N Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to 
the Fire District 

106.7 y Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspections by contractors. 

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District 
is added to read as follows: 
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this 
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an 

109.4 y Added section 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals 
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County of EI Dorado's 
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals 
timeline. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 
Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that 

portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 
protects life and property. Fees have been updated to 

110.4 N 
better left to localities to determine the 

Locally adopted and amended match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the 

fees/penalties for their respective areas. 
District Attomey's Office. The change to the language to 
include the tenm infractions. 

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s), 

110.4.2 N 
Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before 

Locally created and adopted 
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 

but under a different number) violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health and Safety Code of the State of Califomia and 
Chapter 5c (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 

112.4 N 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 

Locally adopted and amended 
All violations of the code have been consolidated under 

better left to localities to detenmine the Section 110.4 to include the penalties for violations. 
fess/penalties for their respective areas. 

Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District, 

202 N Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopted 
Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd 
Manager. Definition of campfire shall not include LPG or 
Propane fueled appliances. 

302.1 N Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for clarity 

307.4.4 through 
Due to the high fire danger that exists in EI Dorado County 

307.4.4.2 (d) 
Y Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopted we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires 

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas. 

 20-0203 K Page 22 of 40



Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical 
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for 
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus 
components. It also allows an extended time frame before 

Changed vertical clearances to 15 feet and road 
having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional 

503.2.1 N Locally adopted and amended height for vegetation clearances acts as an increased buffer 
widths to 20 feet. 

for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of 
shoulders, as measured face of curb to face of curb is 
needed. These structures can be difficult to navigate with 
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the total 
drivable road surface 

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the 
Fire apparatus require areas for turning around when 

Fire Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations to 
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This 

503.2.5 N Locally adopted and amended includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides 
match as they require turnarounds for fire apparatus 

better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds turn 
access roads and driveways. 

around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated 
Surfaces of EI Dorado County and Appendix D of the 
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be 

503.2.6 N Surfaces to state and match EI Dorado County Locally adopted and amended 
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an 

Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17. 
alternate means & methods that is not less restrictive than 
the Fire Code. 

503.4.2 N Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes Locally created and adopted 
This section clearly defines the 'No Parking in Fire Lanes" 
rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle Code. 

Added section regarding no parking in front of 
This section clearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire 

503.4.3 N Locally created and adopted hydrants" rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle 
hydrants 

Code. 

Added seciion regarding fire lanes based on road 
This section clearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D 

503.4.4 N 
width 

Locally created and adopted as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire 
lanes. 

Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on 

503.5.3 N 
emergency access and consistency through all 

Locally created and adopted 
roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing 

roadway gates in EI Dorado County, referring to the the best possible emergency access to maintain fast 
gate standards adopted by the FPO's. response times. 

505.1 N 
Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of 

Locally adopted and amended 
Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing 

buildings based on the District's addressing standards. 

Added more conservative standard for the 
Commercial properties are required to install hydrants at 

507.5.1 N placement of hydrant and their relationship to Locally adopted and amended 
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150 
feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in 

commercial buildings 
between). 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2 N in new buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

greater within the district. to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.a N 
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they 

Locally created and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 

to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
structure, whichever is less. 

feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

 20-0203 K Page 23 of 40



Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds occupant protection for existing buildings less 
of EI Dorado County and their conbibuting factors to our 

than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.b N Locally created and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 

to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
structure, whichever is less. 

feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of EI Dorado County and their conbibuting factors to our 

903.2.1, 903.2.3, 
These sections were created to give specific increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.4, 903.2.7 
N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Manufactured Homes - The intent of this code section is to 
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two-
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar 

This section was created to include manufactured 
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban 

903.2.82 y residential single family R-3 in the residential Locally created and adopted 
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption 
due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The 

sprinkler program 
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a 
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk 
successfully in many California communities. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of EI Dorado County and their conbibuting factors to our 

These sections were created to give specific increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2.9, 903.2.10 N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Added occupant protection for fire alarms in 
buildings with a floor area less than 3,600, except 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
R3, AG buildings not used for commercial 

907.2.a N 
purposes, and buildings with a floor area of less 

Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

official. 

Added occupant protection for existing buildings 
Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.b N 
without automatic sprinkler systems to install a fire 

Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
alarm if they add more than 30% or 1,000 square 

the event of a fire or smoke. 
feet to the structure, whichever is less. 

Added occupant protection by stating all fire alarm 
detection systems installed shall be connected to a Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.c N monitoring service that notifies the fire department Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
upon activation and is installed per Section 907 of the event of a fire or smoke. 
the fire code. 

Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
907.2.d N systems to be connected to a monitored fire alarm Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

system when installed or replaced. the event of a fire or smoke. 

907.6.2.1 y Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply 
Locally created and adopted 

Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E 
Modification safety related power outages. 

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to 
1203.1.3 N Shunt bip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up 

power supplies 

3310.3 N Address requirements for construction sites Locally created and adopted 
Addressing for construction sites is important to assist 
responding emergency crews. 

 20-0203 K Page 24 of 40



3312.1 N 
Water supplies at construction sites with 

Locally adopted and amended 
Water must be on site prior to combustible material being 

combustible materials on-site stored or vertical construction commencing. 

EI Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout 
This section was created to include Fire Protection 

4903.1 y Locally created and adopted 
the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire 

Plan for all fire hazard severity zones. Protection Plan due to climatic, geological, and 
topographical conditions. 

This section clarifies that within the boundaries of EI Dorado 

4905.4 y Added a section to clarify roof construction 
Locally created and adopted 

County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are 

requirements 
wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be 
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly. 

5001.7 
Any damages or costs from negligent practices that 

Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate. 

y cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally created and adopted 
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 

cost recovery fee. 
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the 
negligent parties. 

Added safety protection with pennits being issued 
Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and 

5601.2 N 
by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for 

Locally adopted and amended 
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of 

fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding 

Supervisors for fireworks. 
of the applications they will be used for. 

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any 

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make 
documentation including timing and proprietary infonnation 

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 N available all requested documentation pertaining to Locally created and adopted 
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they 

the firework presentation 
deem necessary. This infonnation is understood to be 
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as 
such. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5704.2.9.6.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
Special/Conditional Use Pennit from the County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5706.2.4.4 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Gode Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid special 
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval 
and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County. 

Administrative need to add District name. Established limits 

5806.2 N 
Administrative addition of District name. 

as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable 

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code 
Locally adopted and amended Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ 

approval and a Special/Conditional Use Pennit from the 
County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code Official for 

5806.2.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted and amended locally 
Flammable Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. 
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use 
Pennit from the County. 

Establishes distances between LPG storage and 
dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential 

6104.2 N 
Established limits for LPG storage and dispensing 

Locally adopted and amended 
developments and high-density hotels, motel, apartments, 

near or adjacent to residential development 
etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would 
have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death. 
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

 20-0203 K Page 25 of 40



, 

Establishes propane regulator requirement for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. Including requirements for two-
stage regulator use and location of first and second stage 

Establishes propane regulator requirements for 
regulators. Additional requirements are outlined for 

6112.1 N 
locations above 5000 foot elevation 

Locally created and adopted protective covers, riser pipe installation requirements, 
building permit submittal and review, tank center-line 
marking, and grade requirements. These requirements are 
based on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feel. 

Establishes vertical propane rise requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. Pipe schedule location, swing 

6112.2 N 
Establishes propane vertical riser pipe requirements 

Locally created and adopted 
joint requirements, and the use of flexible riser piping as 

above 5000 foot elevation well as swing joints. These requirements are based on 
significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather 
conditions encountered above 5000 feet. 

Establishes marking and location requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. This section addresses signage 

6112.3 N 
Establishes propane marking and location 

Locally created and adopted 
location, emergency contact information, and snow related 

requirements above 5000 foot elevation tank marking requirements. These requirements are based 
on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feel. 

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground 
tanks: 

6113.1 N 
Permits and plans shall be submitted and approved 

Locally created and adopted 
Allows us to require plans be submitted for review prior to 

by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction). installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks 
require substantial maintenance including inspection and 
anode replacement at regular intervals. 

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without 

6113.2 N 
Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the 

Locally created and adopted 
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when 

property of the LPG company sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground 
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected. 

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on-
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow 
alarm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in the 

NFPA 13D-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the event of water activation in a vacant structure, and 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 

Y 
District has been amended to update various 

SFM Adopted and amended locally 
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 13D 

13D-16 provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water 
systems in one-and two-family dwellings damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements 

were also added to ensure water circulation through the 
system, reducing stagnant water and backflow concems 
(EID encourages this type of system). 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system 

13D-16 Section Y 
system minimizing damage 

SFM adopted and amended locally 
must be available on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet 

5.1.1.2 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
An audible alarm system is added to notify occupants and 

13D-16 Section 7.6 
y Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation SFM adopted and amended locally in the activation of the system when the building is not 

occupied allow for detection minimizing damage. 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and 

13D-16 Section Y System test to a pressure of 150 p.s.i. SFM adopted and amended locally 
failures and assures proper gluing of system components. 

11.2.1.1 

Appendix B: Table 
Changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 

B105.1(1) 
N elevation, to match fire flow precedents used in Locally adopted and amended to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 

EDC for years used for over a decade in EDC. 

Appendix B: Table 
Established a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM, Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 

B105.2 
N below 5000 foot elevation, for all commercial Locally adopted and amended to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 

projects used for over a decade in EDC. 

 20-0203 K Page 26 of 40



Appendix D: D103.1 N Made an exception for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended 
It is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to 
construct a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant. 

TiHe 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways. 
Appendix D: D103.2 N State law requires no greater than 16% grade Locally adopted and amended In our EI Dorado County Title 14 adoption we allow greater 

than 16% grade with AHJ approval and hard surface. 

Appendix D: D103.3 N Text to include curbs and gutters Locelly adopted and amended 
20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutters due 
to potential access issues and turning radius concerns. 

Appendix D: D103.5 § 
Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided 

N Fire apparatus access road gates Locelly adopted and amended roadway the gate width shall not be less than 15 feet due to 
1 

radius issues. 

No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet 

Appendix D: D103.6.1 N Roads widths 20 to 29 feet Locally adopted and amended 
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does 
not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire 
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all other elevations. 

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet 

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36 
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of 

Appendix D: D103.6.2 N 
feet in width 

Locally adopted and amended elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The 
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D 
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations. 

Appendix D: D104.2 
Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

N building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 
Exception 

have only one approved fire apparatus access road. residents and first responders. 

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 

Appendix D: D104.4 N 
Added to require circumferential fire apparatus 

Locelly created and adopted 
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire 

access roads structure and shall provide a continuous means of 
emergency vehicle access. 

Appendix D: D106.1 
For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Exception 
N Removed Exception in its entirety. Locelly adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

residents and first responders. 

Appendix D: Dl07.1 
For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Exception 
N Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locelly adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

residents and first responders. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.2 through 101.5 N 

Adopted to establish scope, intent, severability and 
Locelly adopted Administrative clarity 

validity 

102.6 through 102.8 N References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

102.10 through 102.12 N 
Conflicting provisions, Other Laws, Application of 

Locelly Adopted Administrative clarity 
references 

103.1 through 104.1 N 
Definition of the Fire Prevention Division and ability 

Locelly Adopted Administrative clarity 
to enforce the code 

104.3 through 104.4 N Right of Entry, Warrants, and Identification Locelly Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.6 through 104.6.4 N Record retention Locelly Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.8 through 104.9.2 N 
Modifications, alternate means and methods, and 

Locelly Adopted Administrative clarity 
test 

104.11 through 
N 

Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of 
Locelly Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.11.2 systems 

104.11.3 N Authority of systems and devices inoperable Locelly Adopted Administrative clarity 
105.2.3 N Time limitation of application Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.3.1 through 
N Operational permits Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.3.2 

105.6.12 N 
Dry cleaning operational permits required for 

Locelly Adopted Administrative clarity 
hazardous cleaning solvent use 

 20-0203 K Page 27 of 40



Permits for various business operations for. Magnesium, 

105.6.2.28 through Adopted this section for administrative clarity and miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation 

105.6.35 
N 

fire and life safety inspections 
Locally Adopted vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing facilities, open burning, 

open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and 
organic coatings 

105.6.37 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Permits for places of assembly 
fire and life safety inspections 

105.6.39 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Permits for private fire hydrants 
fire and life safety inspections 

Permits for pyroxylin plastics, refrigeration equipment, repair 
105.6.41 through 

N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
garages and motor fuel-dispensing facilities, rooftop 

105.6.46 fire and life safety inspections heliports, spraying or dipping, storage of scrap tires and tire 
by-products 

105.6.48 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Permit for tire-rebuilding plants 
fire and life safety inspections 

105.6.50 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
Permit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material, 

fire and life safety inspections lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 cubic feet) 

106.1 through 106.3 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Fee schedules for permits 
fire and life safety inspections 

107.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Inspection authority 
fire and life safety inspections 

Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
equipment, re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping, 

108.1 through 109.3 N 
fire and life safety inspections 

Locally Adopted supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding, 
Board of Appeals established, limitations on authority, and 
qualifications 

110.3.2 through 
N 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Locally Adopted 

Compliance with orders and notices, prosecution of 
110.3.4 fire and life safety inspections violations, and unauthorized tampering 

110.4.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Abatement of violation fire and life safety inspections 

113.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

locally Adopted Authority to disconnect service utilities 
fire and life safety inspections 

Asphalt kettles contain highly flammable substances and 
303.1 through 303.9 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical) 

Managing ignition sources through responsible application 
305.1 through 305.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted of standards will reduce the number of fires in various 

sellings (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY 
306.1 through 306.2 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted flammable and require special handling (Climatic, 

geological, and topographical) 

307.1 through 307.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
Open burning, recreational fire, and portable outdoor 
fireplaces, (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
Open flame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

308.1.2 through 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 

Throwing or placing of ignition sources, torches for 
308.1.3 removing paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Locations near combustible, open flame devices, signals 
and markers, portable fuel open-flame devices, sky-

308.1.5 through N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
lantems, religious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming 

308.1.8.5 food and beverage preparation, dispensing, containers not 
in use, serving of flaming food, location, fire protection 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.2 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
Permits are required for above section (Climatic, geological, 
and topographical) 

 20-0203 K Page 28 of 40



7>:' 

Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices, 
308.3 through 308.4.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted theatrical perfonnances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 

donnitories (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

310.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to smoking (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

310.3 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
"No Smoking" signs (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with "No Smoking' 
310.4 through 310.8 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted signs, ash trays, buming objects, hazardous environmental 

conditions. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Vacant premises condition and safety requirements, 
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant 

311.1 through 311.4 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted premises, security, fire protection, fire separation, removal 
of combustibles, removal of hazardous materials. (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

319.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to mobile food preparation 
vehicles. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

319.2 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
Pennits for mobile food preparation vehicles (Climatic, 

fire and life safety inspections geological, and topographical) 

Exhaust hood, fire protection, fire protection for cooking 
equipment, fire extinguisher, appliance connection to fuel 
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, metallic 
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking oil 
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting, 
nonnal vents, emergency vents, lPilaS systems, maximum 

319.3 through aggregate volume, protection of container, lPilaS container 

319.10.3 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted construction, protection of system piping, LPilas alanns, 

CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel, 
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG 
container construction, CNG containers supplying 
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping, 
methane alanns, maintenance, exhaust system, fire 
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems. 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

403.8.1 through Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1 

403.8.1.7 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted (residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and 

fire safety plans. 

403.10 through Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancy 

403.10.1.3 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic, 

geological. and topographical) 

405.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

510.3 N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Locally Adopted A pennit is required for emergency responder radio systems 

fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a 
807.5.2 through 

N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

locally Adopted maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in 
807.5.2.3 fire and life safety inspections educational facilities (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical) 

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5 

903.2.1.5 N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Locally Adopted 

(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers) 
fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000 

square feet. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

 20-0203 K Page 29 of 40



Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders 
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from 
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time 

Adopted this section in existing buildings for the 
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by 

1103.2 Y safety of firefighters and other emergency Locally Adopted 
the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind 

responders. 
this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury 
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0101.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

General requirements for fire apparatus accass roads 
through 0102.1 firefighters, and other emergency responders. including loads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Oead end fire apparatus access road requirements for a 

Appendix 0: 0103.4 N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. Locally Adopted tum around at 150 feet. (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0103.6 N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
'No Parking, Fire Lane' signs requirements. (Climatic, 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0104.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus 

through 0104.3 N Locally Adopted 
(excluding exception) 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. access roads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0105.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

Requirements for aerial fire apparatus access roads 
through 0105.4 firefighters, and other emergency responders. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential 

through 0106.3 N Locally Adopted 
(excluding exceptions) 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0107.1 
One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be 

(excluding exceptions) N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire 

through 0107.2 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 

climatic conditions. 

Appendix 0: 0108 N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle. 

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

 20-0203 K Page 30 of 40



Towhom It mlY concern, 

MOSQ UITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
8801 ROCK CREEK ROAD 
PLACERVILLE. CA. 95661 

(530) 626·9011 
Fu (530) 626-3240 

Fortht MOsq ... il:o fire Pfot~ion DIstrict 2019 Fire Code Adoption, p ... blic notice wlS achie~ thro ... gh 
Posting our Notice of Inlent in the foUowlnlthree Ioc.itlons. 

• On the tKJ.rd located In the front 01 FIre Station 75 It aaCll Rock Creek Road 

• Community Bulletin bolrd" the Cafl! It Finnon like 
• On the Oist ricts webslt., det.illnl thllocil ion and time of the meeting where the ad04J11of'I 

was lOIn, to take piau. 

The dil.trlct wlS IlwIYS forthocomlnl with th. Informiliion of pmposed chanses and had It rndlly IViilable for 
review by the p ... blk;. Additionally, the OMrlct JIve enouiJh lime for p ... bli(: (Ommen! and W!wlng. 

Sincerely, 

 20-0203 K Page 31 of 40



90-6" ·ON uO!:J,nlos8H 

:J,:l!J:J,S!O UO!:J,:l8:J,OJd 8J!:I o:J,!nbsolN 

 20-0203 K Page 32 of 40



• 

RESOLUTION 19-06 

A RESOLtITlQN OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF TIlE 
MOSQUITO FlRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENfS TO 
THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

A rtilOtution fot the Moaquito Fire Protection Oistrict IIttting forth fuding.s with =ped 10 
local condllionl within the Fire District which make certain lrIOdifications Ind cbanaes Ie) 

!be California Fire Code ~l)' ne<:essuy for..-vma fire and life safety in !be 
MC*juilO Fire Prom:tion Di$tricl 

The Oovemin& Board of the MotquilD Fin Protection District fuds and 19)1vell as 
folloW! : 

WHEREAS, Health It. Safety Code Section 17958.5 penniu • Fire Protection 
District 10 adopt .n ~iJlBDCe which clwtges or modifies the SUite Housing regulations -po.nuant to Health .t. Safety Code Section 17922 upon determination thIl.ueh dallies or 
modificaliolll are,...,...,wy due 10 local conditions that paWn resWations lovemina 
conditioo:u bazanIous to life, poopcrty I!Id the environment from rICe, explolion,lwardout 
nweriaIs mel bazaldouI U!ieS; Uld 

WHEREAS, Health A Sakty Code 5mion 17958.7 requires the!. District's Board 
of Di~ors making any ~es or modifications pursuant 10 Health &: Safety Code 
Scdion 1795'.5 sball lII&ke exptC$$ find.in& hI such cban&es or modifiCiltioIU an needed; 
md Ihall file • copy of such d>anp or modifigtions with !be ~cnt of Howina and 
Community Devdopment. 

WHEREAS, the UDique local clirrWic, geologic:al, wi ~ieal c:onditiom 
existina wilhin tbe bouadaria of tile District make it raIOIIIIbIy """'Hly for the Diswicl 10 
impoR more strinaan rcqllimDents Ibm! lilt forth in the California Fire Code tnd pur$UIlU 

10 California Health and Safety Code xdions 13869.7 -' \79SI.7, the District 
desires III maLe expess fiMings 10 that dfurt 

NOW, THF..REFORE, BE IT RESOl.VED tIWIlbe Bo.rd orDirecton of the 
MO$Cjuito File Protection District,.J\er hllviq duly noticed ~ hekI publit bearin&s. hereby 
ldoptS the followiq findings C(IDCCI,Jn& CWftllI unique InOO conditiDIU that 
together mabu.c:h modifi~n III the c.liromi. rite Code. reuonabIy 111.: "''}' 10 
provide IdeqUlle .00 effective Pf'OIec:liOll or life, piopelty tnd the envil'Ollmenl more 
speo::iflcally sec forth as follows : 

.,. 

 20-0203 K Page 33 of 40



FrNDiNGS OF FACT 
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TOTItE STATE BUILDING 

STANDARDS CODE (TITLE l4 PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL 
CONDITIONS 

A. General. 

After due consideration, the eo.td of Direculn of tile MotquilO Fire I"roteetion Dimia, 
hmby finds m.t due to local eJiIruotic, aeoloaic lind lQpOanophlc oondilioru., u IIta1ed wilhUl 
tbiI doaament, Ihm: is a ~ 10 provide the modiflea,iOl'll and dwnae contained in tilt 
adopti~ Ordinllllce ofw CaJifllnlia Fire Code. Suc:1! chana" '"' deertKd 10 be RUOIlabIy 
...... ""'Y 10 provide .oequate and dfeeti~ proteCtion of life, propeny, and. the 
cnviroDmcDl 

The MoaquilO fire Proteetion District proYida ftR protection, cmeraeney mediea/ 
xrvica, and lpCCializl:d ratue KrYiea 10 topproxlmately 1,000 people In a 12 1QU&rt mile 
area. The DiJUict is Ioeated OD the Wqtml aJop. orEl Dorado County. The 
IOPO&rtPhy of the Distriet ranaes from roliina llilll of ana. oak woodland. ItIiC 
qlWltiti" ofbnish, and I1Ce:p cIralnAaet. The weather conditiont vtry from mwna 
temperatures with oecasiorW _In wiater, 10 IUINTICI" Imlpert~ tlw reauJarly 
exceed 100 deiJUS-

The MotquilO Fire Protection DUtriet illII "aII-riIk~ "CI"IC)' . The District ~I,*u in a 
lOpbistieated mutual aiel proaram IDCI is diJpucbed IIIrou&h Ii"'Cmcnl by tile California 
~t ofFOI"UUy and. rlrt Procection (Cal·F"lrtJ III CamillO. The ~ of tile 
Dimet will respond 10, and deal with. any type of emcraency. The temI "Fire 
Proleetion~ in \hil docllmCf\llI t:.u.d and 1m:1u6a.eIpOi I to firta, amote, and ocb­
invcltiaa1ions. alarms. public uailt (a)1t, hNatdoUli materi&ll incidents, medical us. and. 
tpeelaliz:ed rtICUCS. 

The District has one, part time, Nffed f\rt ltMion 10 pmYide _Fdq .mce to the 
c:ommunity. Fire Station 75 II 10Cllled It 8&01 R.oek Creek Road. The District tau 2 
ruJl·timc, eueer peTlOMcl, alona with I part time man.acmenl position. 2 part-time 
administntl~ SIIppOrt po.ltions, and IheIC '"' tupplcmented with volunteer Chief 
OfficctS, Fin:fi&hlctS, &DC! rlrt Prevention Office .... 

8. Climltic. 

The MoIquiIO Fire ProIectioII Distriet is loeated within l fooIhilll"CJlon. The Diitriet iI 
lUbjed 10 four I "1, 'Nilb 1ft lMuti snowfall in the win1cr iTIOIlthI of2 inebc:s, in 
.witioa1O 1ft.YaqC! rainfJll 0(39 Loebcs per y .... Thcx adverse weather condition! 
~ ~ bazardouI road conditiON and fIoodinl; .. _ll .. rockslide buards aIon& tile 
maio ___ .-. within, as YidI as .,. the District trom the S\IITO\II\diIl8 -. Due 10 

.,. 

 20-0203 K Page 34 of 40



.. . 

periods ofrain&.IJ, alona with ~ted road dO$U(eS, the ability oftbe fife Protection 
Diatrict 10 provide immediate emeracne)' mponse is often delayed, These same adverse 
eiilNtic oonditionl oftal result in • larae number of vehiallar accidents IiIIII place 
ULI(>11e resuaints 011. the availability ofemeramcy responK to perform emersencr 
~ue. firstllid, hazardous materials control, mel fudighting. The ~limatic conditions 
oft= ~I in alUbstanli&l at tofIII t.cl: of ability of the Fire Protection DistricllO 
rt:SJlMd immedwe]y III other types rL emergency lituatiOlll thaI occur. Examples of these 
ert\O'ieDCY linwions iDcIude struc:nIre firm. wildland and fens fires, Doodina. 
haDrdowi material. il\l:idcnlS, emergt:nl:)' medical calls, vt:bicle aocidents, and vertical 
ns:ues. The murual aMi agreements established with adjoining fiR agencies miahl not be 
possible d!,r, 10 advene climatic a:mditions, restrictina or lOwly b1ocldoa aocess into the 
Disoiet. 

Summ.ry: 

These local climllK conditions affcd the I!;:I;:C/a-ation, intensity, tnd tize of fila in the Fite 
District. Tunes otlitde at!lO rainfall. low humidity, and hi&ll tetnperarure!I Clate 
dCl1enidy hazardous CODdltions, pmticuIarIy u !hey relate 10 the wildland-urt-n 
interface. Winds c:xperienoed in tbis _ C*l bave. significant impKI upon stnIclIIn= fua, 
especially in buildinp in clo.e proximity III ODe WIOCber, and 10 wildJaJxb 
eommonJy found in the Mosquito Fire PToIectiolI DiRrict. SIrUCtInS buill within the 
Mosquito Fite Protection District nllD! be buill with these variabla in milId 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District wloca!ecl within JDOden\le llcismic Zone Three. The 
seismic, geologic&l conditions ~ • potenl:i&l for multiple fires, major breakqe of W1tU 
mains, multiple electrical power failures, multiple collap!ed ttrucNI'eS and. Lwre number 
of calls for emCflOmcy medical aid. all of w!tich tI'IlY occur simullaDeOusly durina' .tC:ismic 
event. The water district hu nwnerous water-pumpilla I)'IIems UIDd for fiR supprasiOll 
~ delivery. IS ..... dllS ...... 1« IUlnp WIb providina WIler I)'Item preaure. Ma.! of tile 
pumping system, we dependent (II elecuitaJ powa- for openrioI:L Sud! declical po_ 
may DOt be available during aleismic event. WIIWI\Onrp WIb UIIId. for JIOfIge of 
~uinld fire 
suppression ...... Ier may abo ooIllj)1e in NCb NI evad forcina the .tditionll MOd 10 tnnIpon 
...... ter via w:lditiOl\ll pieces of fire appIfIIlUS which will pIKe. aiifllfieant reIU'Ilinl on tile 
ability of the Disuiello ptOvkle the 
required emergency services. 

Summuy: 

Loo;alleo~hle and leololical feal\lteS and proeenes exist within tile boundaries of !he 
DistrielS tllal may halnper the ability of the Ma.:juiro Fire Protection District 10 perfonn its 
sworn dune.. Fire following III earthquake IIu the potential of eluting ll'l:lter loa of life 
and dama&e than the eutbquW ilKlf. 

.). 

 20-0203 K Page 35 of 40



D. TopognlpbiHI. 

The Di.aicl: is primarily ~ of areas tbIt are considcml by the State to be hiib fire 
hIzud ItVtriIy ZOIW!L Muo:b of the hill is IocaJM within foochiU terrain, a:lVI:fW with hiahly 
combustible vqewioa, intludina the pRSCnee ofmNIY c:oniferous forested.reu. The 
e]evarion within the Distrid ranps fiom -wroximate1y 100 ft:clto over 2500 ft:cllll the: 
hiahw point. Slope within the District ranps &om 0 II) 90 de~. The stndwa within 
the areas of tile foothill'. terrain have very limiled fiR: KCeSS, due IIIl1ftOW 
roadwIoys with steep aradeI aDd poor I"I*Isurfa::e coaditlolll. The presences of mNly 
existina struetures within the hiib fire severity lOne aras provides lor • very biib 
polattial of. ItnX:tIJre fire spreadina into I wildlmd 01" Iixm fire conditiollas 'Ndl u the 
potential for. wildbnd or forest lin! ~ 10 ..-ucrutes. 

Summary: 

The alianment of canyons, valleys, aDd slopes into inhabited.-eas, combined with the 
vlli.ble natute of tile ten"lin, yield polential for increued fire risk. Most structures, both 
~idential and commercial, are inor are surTOllJlded by areas that contain sigrufictllt pus. 
brush, mixed oak woodland, and mixed conifer fUcl IoC. Due 10 drol/iht 
conditions. beetle inkstations, and lack of ve&ewion ma!lIiement. muo:b of the _ is 
popWaled with either deed 01" dyina ma, <."O!Itributin& 10 extreme the dania. 

Local dimatic, geographic, Ind topographic conditions described above incm.te the 
fro:queney, intemity, and .si7le of fires invtl1vina buildinp in the Fire District. f\lrther, theae 
conditions impac:l potential damage 10 structures from an eerthquake and 
subsequent fire. Therefcn, it is reuonably necessary thaI the: Californil Fire Code be 
modified 10 mitigate the: efficu of the .bove conditions. Callforni. Health &; Safety Code 
Se;tioo 179S1.7 requires that modific.ltions to the Fin C()(\e be expressly mIlt.edaod 
identified IS to which each fmdina refen 10 wlUch Code modification. The .rw:hed 
Appendix It. provides thil conncdion. 

INTRODUC[D 1111 re&ular meetina of the Board of Directors oflbe Mosquito Fin 
PlOlection Distria on Nowmber 1.-,20]9 

PASSED AND ADOPTED III re&u1ar meeUn& of tile Board ofDirecton of tile 
Mosquilo F1R Protection Distri~ on November 1.-, 2019 by the followina ron can vote: 

 20-0203 K Page 36 of 40



• '. 

A YES: Directon Barbara MikeJ, Charlet Schnell, Taffy Warner 

NOES; Director William 8uhnerlccmpe 

ABSENT: Director Kathy Pico 

ABSTAIN: None 

ATTEST: BY: 

SlIarlyn fiekb. 80M! Clerk 

 20-0203 K Page 37 of 40



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 

101.1 X Admin 

105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.5 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.5.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

505.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

 20-0203 K Page 38 of 40



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
6104.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

6112.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix B: Table B105.1(1) X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

Appendix B: Table Bl05.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

101.2 through 101.5 X Admin 

102.6 through 102.8 X Admin 

102.10 through 102.12 X Admin 

103.1 through 104.1 X Admin 

104.3 through 104.4 X Admin 

104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin 

104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin 

104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin 

104.11.3 X Admin 

105.2.3 X Admin 

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin 

105.6.12 X Admin 

105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin 

105.6.37 X Admin 

105.6.39 X Admin 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin 

105.6.48 X Admin 

105.6.50 X Admin 

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin 

107.1 X Admin 

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin 

110.4.1 X Admin 

113.1 X Admin 

 20-0203 K Page 39 of 40



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 eFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
303.1 through 303.9 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

305.1 through 305.5 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra phica I 

306.1 through 306.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

307.1 through 307.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra phica I 

308.2 X Admin 

308.3 through 308.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.4 through 310.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

311.1 through 311.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

319.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

319.2 X Admin 

319.3 through 319.10.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

403.10 through 403.10.1.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

405.5 X Admin 

510.3 X Admin 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.1.5 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

1103.2 X Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0101.1 through 

0102.1 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0104.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

0104.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix 0: 0105.1 through 

0105.4 
X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

0106.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix 0: 0107.1 (excluding 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

exceptions) 

Appendix 0: 0108 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra ph ica I 

 20-0203 K Page 40 of 40


	Resolution_Mosquito
	Reso Mosquito 2-25-20



