RESOLUTION NO. XXX-2020

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO
(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 020-2017)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the
State every three years; and,

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective January 1, 2020; and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a
county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably necessary
because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter
1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulations to the
local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her
authorized representative or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representativeand,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the fire
protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on November 12, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Pioneer Fire Protection District adopted
Ordinance No. 2019.1, which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with amendments the District deemed
necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of EI Dorado
ratifies Ordinance 2019.01 of the Pioneer Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement of the
ordinance to the Pioneer Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code inthe following sections:

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4 through
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1.
507.5.1, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9,
903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2,
5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 through 6112.3,

6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 5.1.1.2,

Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B:
Table B105.1 (1), Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D103.5
Section 1, Appendix D103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4.

20-0203 L Page 1 of 52



Resolution No. XXX-2020
Page 2 of 2

The Pioneer Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety,
including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2018 edition not
adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403.4,
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12,
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808,
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106,
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception), D107.1
(Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J,
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019
California Fire Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said

Board, held the day of , 20__, by the following vote of said Board:
Ayes:

Attest: Noes:

Kim Dawson Absent:

Clerk of the Board of Supervisors

By:

Deputy Clerk Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Board of Supervisors

20-0203 L Page 2 of 52



20-0203 L Page 3 of 52



Attachment No. 1

Pioneer Fire Protection District Ordinance

No. 2019.01

20-0203 L Page 4 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ORDINANCE NO. 2019.01

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE PIONEER FIRE
PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS:

An ordinance of the Pioneer Fire Protection District (P10) adopting the 2019 Edition of the California Fire
Code, incorporating the 2018 Edition of the /nternational Fire Code, regulating and governing the safeguarding of
life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances,
materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises
in the PIO; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing Ordinance No. 2016-37
of the P10 and all other ordinances end parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith.

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the PIO, also known as the Pioneer Fire Protection
District:
Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS
Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS
Section 4: CONFLICT
Section 5: SEVERABILITY
Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

The PIO makes cenain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 2019 Edition, pursuant to
Health & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.7 and /8941.5 during this code adoption process. Such changes
are necessary because of local climatic, geological andfor topographical conditions. The PIO has adopted,
pursuant to Section J8941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these
conditions by Resolution #2019-10 of the PIO dated September 19, 2019,

SECTION 2: ADOFTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
The PIO adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, including Appendices,

incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the
exclusions listed below:

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 1

20-0203 L Page 5 of 52



Exclusions: 105.6.17-105.6.19, 105.6.39, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 4033,
403 4, 403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.102, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12, 404.1-404.4,
405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 305-807 (adopting 807.5.2), 808, 904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9
(adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception),
D106.1 (Exception), D107.1 (Exception), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J,
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not sdopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 California Fire
Code.

SECTION 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS
The following Sections are hereby amended or added:
Chapter 1
Section 101 Scope and General Requirementy
101.1 Title shall be amended as follows: Add name of jurisdiction [P10]

Section 105 Permits

- 105627 LPG-gas shall be amended as follows: Add to the exception: At or above 5,000 feet of
clevation, a permit is not required for individual containers with a 125-gallon water capacity or less,
or multiple contminer systems having an aggregate quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving
occupancies in Group R-3.

- Section 106 Fees

- 106.6 Permit. Plan Review snd lnspection Feey shall be added s follows: A schedule of foes
adopted by the district board of directors for plan review, inspections and the issuance of permits by
the district may be found in the most current district fee schedule (Health & Safety Code 17951).

- 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees shall be added as follows: Fire service fees may be charged 1o any
person, firm, corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the district to respond to the scene of an incident. A
district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the district provides or the cost
of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code 13916). The fee shall
not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to the scene of an incident.

- 106.7 Administrative Costs shall be added as follows: When a test or inspection is scheduled, and
the contracior fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ
may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/inspection location and
the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs.

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 2

20-0203 L Page 6 of 52



i Appe: nd Timelines shall be added as follows: Any person or entity who
believes they may be mﬁmc!y qﬁ'umd by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code
official through a wrilten notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on
the notice. All such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for
the district. A timely appeal shall stay further action by the fire code official until the marter is
determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in Section 109.2, unless the issue poses an imminent fire
or life safety hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify the appellant by
certified mail of the date and rime of such hearing. The hearing shall be scheduled o 1ake place no
sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified mail. The appellant shall have the
right to appear in person or by agent al the hearing and present oral, written and/or photographic
evidence to the Appeal Beard

- Section 110 Violations

- 110.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows: Persons who shall violate a provision of this
code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter,
repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents ar directive of the fire code
official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting attorney or agency, punishable by a
fine not exceeding 3/00.00 for a first violation,; 2. A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation
of the same provision within one year; 3. A fine not exceeding §1000.00 for each additional violation
of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding /80 days, or both such fine
end imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be
deemed & separate offense. (Heaith & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995).

- 11042 Citatlons shall be added as follows: The Fire Chief or histher duly authorized
representative, may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant 1o
Section 13871 of the Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter 5¢ (commencing
with Section 853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California.

- Section 112 Stop Work Order

- 1124, Failure to Comply shall be amended as follows: Any person who shall continue any work
after having been served with a siop-work order, except such work as that person is directed o
perform to remove & violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or
both as described in Section 110.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections ]3145 and 17995).

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 3

20-0203 L Page 7 of 52



Chapter 2

- Section 202 General Definitions

- Add definition for Campflre - Shall mean a fire which is used for cooking, personal warmih, lighting,
or aesthetic purposes. This includes fires contained within outdoor fireplaces and enclosed stoves
with flues or chimneys, stoves using jellied, liguid or solid fuels, portable barbecue pits, braziers, or
space heating devices which are wsed outside of amy structure, mobile home, or any living
accommodation mounted on a vehicle.

- Add definition for District - Shall mean the district and all other areas within the exterior boundaries
thereof now or hereafier established.

- Add definition for Driveway - Shall mean a vehicular access that serves up 1o two (2) parcels with no
mare than two () residentual units and any number of non-commercial or industrial building on each
parecel.

- Add definition for Executive Body - Shall mean the Board of Directors of the District

- Add definition for Flre Chief - Shall mean the Chigf Executive Fire Officer of the Fire
department/district serving the jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative.

- Add definition for Trained Crowd Manager - Shall mean standby personnel, wnally a security
guard or usher personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure fo exil peopie from a tent or other
place of public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency

Chapter 3

- Section 302 Definitions

= 3021 Definitions shall be amended es follows: Added Campfire definition, as shown above in
Chapter 2.

- 307.44 Campfire Restrictions shall be added as follows:

- 307.44.1 /t is unlawful for any person to light, maintain, or use a campfire upon or near any brush-
covered land, grass-covered land. or foresi-covered land during the time when burning permits are
suspended by the Director of the Department of Forestry and Fire Protection, the CAL FIRE Unit
Chief, or the AHJ.

Exception: Commercial cooking operations with approval of the AHJ

- 3074.4.2 When campfires are allowed, it should be unlawful for any person 1o light, maintain, or use
a campfire upon any brush-covered land, grass-covered land, or foresi-covered land unless the
Sollowing minimum requirements are complied with.

- 307442 (a) The area within 5 feet of the periphery of the campfire is cleared of all flammable

material and vegetation.

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 4

20-0203 L Page 8 of 52



- 307.44.2 (b} One serviceable shovel with a handle of at least 12 inches is ready for use at the
immediate area of the campfire.

- 307.4.4.2 (c) Campfires shall be limited to a | foot by 1 foot area, unless in an approved manufactured
cooking device or fire ring.

- 307.44.2 (d) Written permission gf the landowner must be obtained prior to the ignition of the
campfire and shall be on site,

Chapter 5

- Section 503 Fire Apparatus Access Roads

- 503,21 Dimensions shall be amended as follows: Fire apparatus access roads shall have an
unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet, exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb to
face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and unobstructed
vertical clearance of not less than /5 feet. All driveways in the district shall not be less than 12 feet
wide.

- 503.2.5 Dead Ends shall be amended as follows: Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways
in excess of 150 feet in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around fire
BppETAS.
503,.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces shall be amended as follows: Where & bridge or an elevated
surface is part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in
accordance with the current El Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge Standard or Appendix
D of the current California Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive. Bridges and elevated surfaces
shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load
limits shall be posted at both entrances 1o bridges when required by the Fire Code Official. Where
elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces which are not designed
for such use, approved barriers, approved signs, or both shall be installed and maintained when
required by the fire code official.

- 503.4.2 No Parking in Fire Lanes shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, or leave
standing any vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary lo avoid conflict with
other traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his‘her duly authorized
representative, Peace Officer or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway, at any
curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking facility,
designated as a fire lane by the district with jurisdiction over the area in which the place is located.
The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to, and visible from, the
designated place clearly stating in letters not less than one inch in height that the place is a fire lane.
(2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color, marking the place with the

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 5

20-0203 L Page 9 of 52



words "FIRE LANE", which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) by a red curb or red paint on
the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words "FIRE LANE".

- 5034.3 No Parking in Front of Hvdranty shall be sdded us follows: No person shall stop. park. or
leave standing any vehicle within |5 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle is
attended by a licensed driver wha is seated in the front seat and who can immediately move such
vehicle in case of necessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire department and is clearly
marked as g fire department vehicle.

- 503.4.4 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width shall be added as follows: Fire lanes shail be based on
road width as reguired in Appendix D as amended by the disirict.

- 503.5.3 Fire Apparatus Access Gates shall be sdded as follows: All automatic and manual gaies
installed over fire apparatus access roads shall comply with the district gale siandard as approved
by the fire code official

- Section 303 Premise Identification

- 5051 Address Identification shall have the first line of this paragraph amended as follows:
Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply with the district address standard as approved
by the fire code official

- Section 507 Fire Protection Water Supplies
- 507.5.1 Where Required shall be amended as follows: 400 feet shall be amended to /50 feet.

Chapter 9

- Section 903 Fire Sprinklers

. 903.2 Where Reguired shall be amended es follows: An approved sutomatic sprinkler system shall
be required and installed in new buildings and structures 3600 square feet or greater when
constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction as described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12.

Exception: Agricultural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial purposes.

- 9032.a Where Reguired shall be added as follows: Stanes of existing buildings greater than 3,600
square feet. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than one and rwo-family dwelling
units, and agricultural bulldings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, where the
Sfloor area of the building or structure is increased by an addition of more than thirty percent (30%)
or 1,000 square feet whichever is less, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section
$03.2.

- 903.2.b Where Reguired shall be added as follows: Statws of existing buildings less than 3,600
square feet. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, where the

Ordinance 201901 Page &

20-0203 L Page 10 of 52



Jloor area of the building or structure is increased to a total square footage over 3,600 square feet,
by an addition of more than thirty percent (30%) or 1,000 square feet, whichever is less, such building
or structure shall be made to conform to Section $03.1.

- 903.2.1 Group A shall be amended as follows for A groups A-1 through A-4: 903.2.1.1 (1) The fire
area exceeds 3, 600 square feer.

- 903.2.3 Group E shall be amended as follows: 903.2.3 (1) Throughout all Group E fire areas greater
than 3,600 square feet in area.

- 903.2.4 Group F-1 shall be amended as follows: 903.2.4 Group F. 903.2.4 (1) A Group F fire area
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

- 903.2.7 Group M shall be amended as follows: 903.2.7 Group B end M. 903.2.7 (1) A Group B and
M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

- 903.2.8.2 Manufactured Homes shall be added as follows: An aufomatic fire sprinkler system shall
be reguired in all new manufactured homes and multi-family mamufactured homes intended for use
as a one-and two-family dwelling, The design and installation of such systems shall be in accordance
with California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300.

Exceptions:
1. Manufactured homes located within an existing mobilehome park complying with
California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3.

2. Manmyfactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an
accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Governmeni Code Section 658502; when the
existing primary residence on the property is not reguired to comply with California
Residential Code Section R313.2.

3} Mamyfactired homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size.

- 903.2.9 Group §-]1 shall be amended as follows: 903.2.9 Group S. 903.2.9 (1) A Group S fire area
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

- 903.2.10 Group §-2 Enclosed Parking Garages shall be amended as follows: $03.2.10 (1) Where
the fire area of the enclosed parking garage exceeds 3, 600 square feet,

area less than 3,600 square feel.
Exceptions:
1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified
ar “U").
Ordinance 2019.01 Page 7

20-0203 L Page 11 of 52



20-0203 L Page 12 of 52



Chapter 12

= 1203,1.3 Installation shall be amended as follows: Emergency power systems and standby power
systems shall be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electric
Code, NFPA 110 and NFPA 111. All bulldings, other than one- and two-family dwelling units, and
agricultural buildings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a shunt trip
device that disconnecis all power sources to the building, approved by the fire code afficlal. Existing
installarions shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval,

Chapter 33

- Section 3310 Access for Firefighting

- 33103 Premise Identification shall be added as follows: Prior to and during construction, an
approved address sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into
the project

- Section 3312 Water Supply for Fire Protection
- 3312.]1 Wheo Required shall be amended as follows: Prior to combustible materials arriving on
site, the fire hydrant water system shall be installed and maintained in continuous operation. The

amount of water suppiied shall meet the required fire flow for the project.

Chapter 49

- Section 4903 Plans

- 4903.] Where Required shall be added as follows: The fire code official of the PIO may require
development projects located in Moderate, High and Very-High Fire Hazard Severity Zones to submilt
fire protection plan. This plan shall be approved by both the fire code official and the authorized
representative for the local CAL FIRE Unit Chief (if located in the Siate Responsibility Area [SRAJ)
prior to the recording of the final map for the project by the County of El Dorado.

SeCtinn all 1 Al

- 49054 Roof Construction Requirements shall be added as follows: All new construction, including
additions, requires a Class A roof covering or assembly. All re-roofing requires Class A roof covering
or assembly ar a minimum. Re-roofing in excess of 50% of an exisiting structure within any one year
period will necessitate that the entire roof be a Class A roof covering or assembly as a minimum.
Class B or C fire retardeant treated and or non-ireaied wood shake or shingles are nol approved as
a roof covering material for Class A assembiy.

(€ A TOTELTG Al

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 9

20-0203 L Page 13 of 52



Chapter 50

- Section 3001 General

- 50017 Liability for Damages shall be added as follows: Any damages or cost resulting from the
careless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall constituent debt against amy
such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge. This debt is collectible by the Fire
Chigf, or his'her duly authorized representative, in the same manner as in the case of an obligation
under contract, expressed or implied.

Chapter 56

- Section 5601 General

- 56012 Permit Reguired shall be amended as follows: Permits shall be required as set forth in
Section 105.6 and regulated in accordance with this section. Where explosives permity are reguired,
they shall be issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado
County Sherifl's Department. Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be issued by the Fire
Chief, or histher duly authorized represemtative, and the El Dorado County Board of Supervisors.

- 5601.2.1 Documentation shall be added as follows: The AHJ shall have the authority to request
documentation regarding all aspects of the fireworks presentation.

- §6012.2 Proprietary Information shell be added as follows: The 45 will protect all proprietary

ted shall be amended as follows;

Swnp of Class [ and Class [I lammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited
unless approved by the Fire Chief. or histher duly authorized representative. When permitied by the
Fire Chief, or histher duly authorized representative, all above ground tank(s) or vault installations
for the storage of Class I, IT or [II flammable and combustible liguids shall comply with those
requirements as sei forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall also apply 1o
installations other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above-ground storage is required.

SmuuufﬂmluﬂcmnﬂmmhﬂquidlhlbuwmmMufHMh
prohibited unless approved by the Fire Chigf, or hisher duly authorized represemiative. When
permiited by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized represeniative, all above ground tank(s) or
vault installations for the storage of Class I, I or I1] flammable and combustible liquids shall comply

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 10

20-0203 L Page 14 of 52



with those reguirements as set forth by the California Fire Code. The Califormia Fire Code shall also
apply to installations other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing siations where abave-ground storage
is required.

Chapter 58

- Section 5806 Flammable Crvogenic Fluids

- 5806.2 Limitations shall be amended as follows: Storage of flammable eryogenic fluids in stationary
containers outside of buildings is prohibited wnless approved by the Fire Chief, or histher duly
authorized representative. When permitted by the Fire Chief, or histher duly authorized
representative, all stationary containers for the storage of flammable cryogenic fluids shall comply
with those requirements as set forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall also
appiy to installations other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above-ground storage
ix required.

Chapter 61

- Section 6104 Location of LP-Gas Containers

- 61042 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits shall be amended as follows: The storage
of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacity when located at
least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-half
(1/2) mile from existing residential development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit per
acre and at least one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved, and a
special/conditional use permil iz issued by the County of El Dorado.
Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the dispersion of
liqguefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested areas, the aggregate
capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a warer capacity of 2,000 gallons. The dispensing
of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 1,000-gallon water capacity when located
at least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-
half (1/2) mile from existing residential development with @ density greater than one (1) dwelling unit
per acre and al least one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved and
a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado.

. 6§112.1 Regulators shall be added as follows:
Two-stage regulator system shall be installed in accordance with manufacturer requirements.
= Two-stage regulator systems shall be installed on all LPG installations.

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 11

20-0203 L Page 15 of 52



- The first stage regulator shall be installed under the hinged gauge cover supplied with the tank. The
atmospheric pressure aperture of the regulator shall be pointed downward. The firsi stage regulator
shail be plumbed to the riser of the yard piping with soft copper tubing to allow flexibility should tank
shifting oceur. The riser from the yard piping shall be located not more than 3 inches (horizontally)
from the walls of the tank

- The second stage regulator and riser pipe shall be installed under the eave of the building, as close
as practicable fo the building wall. This riser shall be securely supported/braced to the wall
appraximately 10 inches below the regulator so as to prevent bending of the pipe by lateral snow/ice
loads.

- A protective cover, approved by the gas supplier and Building Official, shall be installed over the
second stage regulator and securely supported to the ground or diagonally to the wall

- The riser pipes for the yard piping shall not be embedded in concrete. Concrete placed around such
riser shall be held back at least 1 inch from all sides of the pipe.

- At the time of application for any building permit, which involves the installation of an LPG system,

the applicant shall submit an LPG system plot plan in 3 copies (or digitally as PDF). The LPG plot
plan shall include, but not be limited to, the tank location, proposed tank capacity In U.S. gallons,
route of yard piping, location of the riser pipe at the building, property boundaries, and an outline of
all existing/proposed buildings on the lot and a depiction of the ridgeline of any building to be
supplied with LPG. This shall also be forwarded to the appropriate fire district lo serve as a locator
map in event of an emergency.
Location of the centerline of LPG tanks shall be permanently marked by the use of snow stakes, one
ai each end. Such stakes shall be of sufficient height to be visible through anticipated maximum snow
depth at the respective location. Installation and maintenance of these smow stakes are the
responsibility of the LPG user.

- Propane appliances and occessories shall not be permitted in any new installation below the first
Jloor or below grade, whichever is more restrictive.

6112.2 Vertical Riser Piping shall be added as follows:
Minimum of Schedule 80 - iron piping.

~  The riser shall be within 3 inches horizontally of the tank.

- Swing joints shall be installed above and below tank level to provide for the tank movemen: (Streer
elbows shall not be used).

- A listed flexible riser constructed of copper or stainless-steel mbing and protected by steel covered
sheathed material may be used instead of swing joints. The flexible alternative shall provide sufficient
slack to allow for tank movement,

- 61123 Marking and Locations shall be added as follows:

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 12

20-0203 L Page 16 of 52



- An approved sign shall be located direcily above the riser shut off valve on the building in a visible
location,

-  The liquefied petroleum gas supplier shall affix a weatherprog/ identification tag to the inzide of the
tank valve protecting cover. This tag shall contain the supplier's name and emergency relephone
mumber.

= Tank installation shall be permanently marked by a metal or wood material snow marker, with a
minimum dimension of 2 inches by 2 inches. The snow marker shall be of sufficient height to rise
above the annual snow depth and shall be a minimum of 10 feet in height The snow markers shall
be painted yellow and located on opposite ends of the tank.

- §113.1 Permits and Plans shall be edded as follows: Permits shall be required, and plans shall be
submitted for ail underground tank installations as approved by the AHJ.

- 61132 Underground LPG Tank Qwaership shall be added as follows: Underground LPG tanks
shall be prohibited from being sold to end-users and shall be retained by the LPG company under a
lease-type sysiem (o ensure proper anmial muintenunce requirements are met and recorded

Chapter 80

. Chapter 80. NFPA 13D 4.7— Residential fire sprinkler systems installed in all new one-and
dwellings shall utilize a “Passive Purge” system design unless otherwise approved by the Firs Code
Official. Exception: Manyfactured home installed, tested and approved by the California Department of

7 "
(AL LT K

- NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows:

= Revise Section 5.1.1.2 to read as follows:

- Chapter 80. NFPA 13D. 5.1.12 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkier used
within the premises shall be maintained on the property at an approved locarion, Stock sprinkiers shall
be kept in a mounted and accessible cabiner.

- Revise Section 7.6 to read as follows:

- Chapter 80. NFPA 13D. 7.6 4 local water flow alarm shall be provided on all fire sprinkler systems in
homes ai an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling.

= Revise Section 11.2.1.1 to read as follows:

- Chapter 80. NFPA 13D. 11.2.1.1 Where a fire department pumper connection is not provided, the
system shall be hydrostatically tested st g minimum pressure of | 50 pounds per square inch gauge for no

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 13

20-0203 L Page 17 of 52



less than a 30-minute duration withow! evidence of leakage. Such test shall be witnessed by the fire code

afficial.

Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings

Code

in Table B10S.1(2)®

B10S.1(2) at the reduced

- Table B105.1(1 uired Fire Flow for One- and Two-Family Dw roup R-3, and R4
Buildings and Townhouses shell be amended as follows for elevations below 5,000 feet:
FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FLOW
CALCULATION SPRINKLER FIRE- DURATION
AREA SYSTEM FLOW s
(square feer) (Design (gallons per
Standard) minute)
0 - 3,600 Ne automatic 1,000 1
sprinkler system
3,601 and greater Na sutomatic Value in Duratlon in
sprinkler system Table Table
B105.1(2) BI0S.1{2) at
the  required
fire-flow rate
0= 3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 540 4
of the CA Fire 1000 1
Code or Section
3133 of the CA
Residential Code
3,601 and grester Section 903.3.1.3 112 value of i
of the CA Fire Table 2
Code ar Section BI0S5.1(2)
3133 of the CA {tnin, 1000
Residential Code GPM)
- - and Two-
shall be amended as follows:
AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER MINIMUM FLOW DURATION
SYSTEM FIRE-FLOW (hours)
{Dresign Standard) {gallons per
minute)
HNo automatic sprinkler system Value fin  Table Duration in  Table
BI05.1(2) BI05.1(2)
Section 903.3.1.1 of the CA Fire 4%, 50% of the value Duration in  Table

Ordinance 2019.01

flow rate
Section 903.3.1.2 of the CA Fire 268 50% of the value Duration in  Table
Code (Only applier 1o locations in Table B105.1(2) B105.1(2) at the reduced
below 5,000-foot elevation) flow rate
b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 gpm
Page 14

20-0203 L Page 18 of 52



Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads

- D103 Minimum cifications

- D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hvdrant shall be amended as follows, adding the exception:

- Exception: Driveways
D103.2 Grade shall be amended as foliows: Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not
exceed [ 5,.9% in grade unless approved by the AHJ or by the El Dorado County amended California
Public Resource Code Title 14 / Design and Improvement Standards Manual.

Exception: Elevation above 5,000 feet shall not exceed 12%.

- D103.3 Turning Radius shall be amended as follows: The minimum tumning radius shall be
determined by the fire code official; and shall not include curb and gutter,

- D103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates shall be amended as follows: Subsection (1) Where a
single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm). Where a fire
apparaius road consisis of a divided roadway, the gate width shall not be less than 13 feer (4372
mn).

- D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as specified in
Section D103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide
{6096 to 8534.4 mm).

Exception: Efevations above 5,000 fi. as determined by the AHJ.

- D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as
specified in Section D103.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29
feet wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm).

Exception. Elevations above 5,000 fi. as determined by the AHJ.

-  D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads shall be added as follows: When required
by the fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirety
of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access.

SECTION 4: CONFLICT
That Ordinance No. 2016-37 of the PIO, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances herewith are hereby

repealed.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or phrase of this code, or
any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by & court of competent jurisdiction, such decision
shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code, which can be given effect without the invalid portions and,
therefore, such invalid portions are declared to be severable. The P1O hereby declares that it would have enacted

Ordinance 2019.0] Page 15

20-0203 L Page 19 of 52



this Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, sentences,
clauses or phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid.

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION
This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The PIO Board Secretary is directed to publish
this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the District. In lien of publication of the full text of the
ordinance, a summary of the ordinance may be published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15) days
after its passage and a certified copy shall be posted in the office of the PIO pursuant to Government Code Section
36933(c) (1).

The above Ordinance was introduced at n meeting of the Board of Directors of the PIO on October 17, 2019, and
it was then read for the first ime. A public hearing was set for the Ordinance to be read for the second time on
November 21, 2019 and approved by the following vote:

- N
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the PIO this, | & day of "N et hea 2019,

AYES:
NOES:
ABSENT:
ABSTAIN:

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 18

20-0203 L Page 20 of 52



MQT & PIO

Fire Code # Significant What Is the Change? Locally adopted / SFM adopted / Why Is There a Local Change?
change? Amended
101.1 N Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Administrative need
LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than
Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate air and can easx(y be trapped Lfnder a home, if ignited it can
' ) ) lead to an explosion. At elevations above 5000 feet there is
105.6.27 Y quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving Locally adopted and amended . . AR S
occupancies in Groun R-3 an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire
P pR-S activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional
attention.
Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance
. of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines
1066 N Add section Locally created and adopled permits, plan checks, and inspections as alfowed in Health
&Safety Code 17951.
106.6.1 N |add section Locally created and adopted | couon 106.6-1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to
the Fire District.
106.7 y Add section Locally created and adopted Sgchop 106.? To recover the actual costs of avoidable
failed inspections by contractors.
Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District
is added to read as follows:
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an
109.4 Y Added section 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire
Code Official. Based on the County of El Dorado's
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals
timeline.
Completed the section by fllng in the blank Allows th‘e Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that
N . protects life and property. Fees have been updated to
portions that were not completed by the SFM. Itis . )
110.4 N - y Locally adopted and amended match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the
better left to localities to determine the o X
. f . District Attorney's Office. The change to the language to
fees/penalties for their respective areas. . ) .
include the term infractions.
110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2
Citations
The Fire Chief or hisfher duly authorized representative (s),
11042 N Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before Locally created and adopted may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor
o but under a different number) Y P violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the
Health and Safety Code of the State of California and
Chapter 5¢ (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California.
Completed the section by filling in the blank
portions that were not completed by the SFM. Itis All violations of the code have been consolidated under
124 N better left to localities to determine the Locally adopted and amended Section 110.4 to include the penalties for violations.
fess/penalties for their respective areas.
Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District,
. . Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd
202 N Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopted Manager. Definition of campfire shall not include LPG or
Propane fueled appliances.
302.1 N Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for clarity
307.4.4 through Due to the high fire danger that exists in Ei Dorado County
30'7'4 4.2 dg)’ Y Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopted we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas.

20-0203 L Page 21 of 52




503.2.1

Changed vertical clearances to 15 feet and road
widths to 20 feet.

Locally adopted and amended

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus
components. It also allows an extended time frame before
having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional
height for vegetation clearances acts as an increased buffer
for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of
shoulders, as measured face of curb to face of curb is
needed. These structures can be difficult to navigate with
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the total
drivable road surface

503.2.5

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the
Fire Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations to
match as they require turnarounds for fire apparatus
access roads and driveways.

Locally adopted and amended

Fire apparatus require areas for turning around when
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This
includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides
better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds turn
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150",

503.2.6

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated
Surfaces to state and match E! Dorado County
Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated
Surfaces of EI Dorado County and Appendix D of the
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an
alternate means & methods that is not less restrictive than
the Fire Code.

503.4.2

Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes”
rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle Code.

503.4.3

Added section regarding no parking in front of
hydrants

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire
hydrants” rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle
Code.

503.4.4

Added section regarding fire lanes based on road
width

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D
as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire
lanes.

503.5.3

Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain
emergency access and consistency through all
roadway gates in Ef Dorado County, referring to the
gate standards adopted by the FPO's.

Locally created and adopted

Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on
roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing
the best possible emergency access to maintain fast
response times.

505.1

Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of
buildings

Locally adopted and amended

Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing
based on the District's addressing standards.

507.5.1

Added more conservative standard for the
placement of hydrant and their relationship to
commercial buildings

Locally adopted and amended

Commercial properties are required to install hydrants at
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150
feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in
between).

903.2

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation
in'new buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or
greater within the district.

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread. .

903.2.a

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the
structure, whichever is less.

Locally created and adopted

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of Ef Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feetin size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

20-0203 L Page 22 of 52




903.2.b

Adds occupant protection for existing buildings less
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the
structure, whichever is less.

Locally created and adopted

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

903.2.1,903.2.3,
903.2.4,903.2.7

These sections were created to give specific
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on
occupancy and square footage

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

903.2.8.2

This section was created to include manufactured
residential single family R-3 in the residential
sprinkler program

Locally created and adopted

Manufactured Homes — The intent of this code section is to
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption
due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk
successfully in many California communities.

903.2.9, 803.2.10

These sections were created o give specific
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on
occupancy and square footage

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

907.2.a

Added occupant protection for fire alarms in
buildings with a floor area less than 3,600, except
R3, AG buildings not used for commercial
purposes, and buildings with a floor area of less
than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code
official.

Locally created and adopted

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of a fire or smoke.

907.2.b

Added occupant protection for existing buildings
without automatic sprinkler systems to install a fire
alarm if they add more than 30% or 1,000 square
feet to the structure, whichever is less.

Locally created and adopted

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of a fire or smoke.

907.2.¢

Added occupant protection by stating all fire alarm

detection systems installed shall be connected to a
monitoring service that notifies the fire department

upon activation and is installed per Section 907 of

the fire code.

Locally created and adopted

- |Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that

allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of a fire or smoke.

907.2.d

Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood
systems to be connected to a monitored fire alarm
system when installed or replaced.

Locally created and adopted

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of a fire or smoke.

907.6.2.1

Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply
Medification

Locally created and adopted

Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E
safety related power outages.

1203.1.3

Shunt trip power safety devices

Locally adopted and amended

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to
ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up
power supplies

3310.3

Address requirements for construction sites

Locally created and adopted

Addressing for construction sites is important to assist
responding emergency crews.

20-0203 L Page 23 of 52



33121

Water supplies at construction sites with
combustible materials on-site

Locally adopted and amended

Water must be on site prior to combustible material being
stored or vertical construction commencing.

4903.1

This section was created to include Fire Protection
Plan for all fire hazard severity zones.

Locally created and adopted

El Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout
the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire
Protection Plan due to climatic, geological, and
topographical conditions.

4905.4

Added a section to clarify roof construction
requirements

Locally created and adopted

This section clarifies that within the boundaries of El Dorado
County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are
wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly.

5001.7

Any damages or costs from negligent practices that
cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a
cost recovery fee.

Locally created and adopted

Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate.
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the
negligent parties.

5601.2

Added safety protection with permits being issued
by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of
Supervisors for fireworks.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and
fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding
of the applications they will be used for.

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make
available all requested documentation pertaining to
the firework presentation

Locally created and adopted

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any
documentation including timing and proprietary information
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they
deem necessary. This information is understood to be
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as
such.

5704.296.1

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class Il combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a
Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County.

5706.2.4.4

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class I combustible liquid special
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval
and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County.

5806.2

Administrative addition of District name.
Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Administrative need to add District name. Established fimits
as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable
Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ
approval and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the
County.

5806.2.1

Established fimits as set forth in the Fire Code

SFM adopted and amended locally

Established limits as required by the Fire Code Official for
Flammable Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers.
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use
Permit from the County.

6104.2

Established limits for LPG storage and dispensing
near or adjacent to residential development

Locally adopted and amended

Establishes distances between LPG storage and
dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential
developments and high-density hotels, motel, apartments,
efc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would
have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death.
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use
Permit from the County.

20-0203 L Page 24 of 52




6112.1

Establishes propane regulator requirements for
locations above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes propane regulator requirement for locations
above 5000 foot elevation. Including requirements for two-
stage regulator use and location of first and second stage
regulators. Additional requirements are outlined for
protective covers, riser pipe installation requirements,
building permit submittal and review, tank center-line
marking, and grade requirements. These requirements are
based on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet.

6112.2

Establishes propane vertical riser pipe requirements
above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes vertical propane rise requirements for locations
above 5000 foot elevation. Pipe schedule location, swing
joint requirements, and the use of flexible riser piping as
well as swing joints. These requirements are based on
significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather
conditions encountered above 5000 feet.

6112.3

Establishes propane marking and location
requirements above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes marking and location requirements for locations
above 5000 foot elevation. This section addresses signage
location, emergency contact information, and snow related
tank marking requirements. These requirements are based
on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet.

6113.1

Permits and plans shall be submitted and approved
by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction).

Locally created and adopted

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground
tanks:

Allows us to require plans be submitted for review prior to
installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks
require substantial maintenance including inspection and
anode replacement at regular intervals.

6113.2

Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the
property of the LPG company

Locally created and adopted

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when
sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16

NFPA 13D-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the
District has been amended to update various
provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler
systems in one-and two-family dwellings

SFM Adopted and amended locally

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on-
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow
alarm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in the
event of water activation in a vacant structure, and
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 13D
sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water
damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements
were also added to ensure water circulation through the
system, reducing stagnant water and backflow concems
(EID encourages this type of system).

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section
51.1.2

To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkier
system minimizing damage

SFM adopted and amended locally

A supply of each type of sprinkier head used in a system
must be available on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section 7.6

Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation

SFM adopted and amended locally

An audible alarm system is added to notify occupants and
in the activation of the system when the building is not
occupied allow for detection minimizing damage.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section
11.2.1.1

System test to a pressure of 150 p.s.i.

SFM adopted and amended focally

A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and
failures and assures proper gluing of system components.

Appendix B: Table
B105.1(1)

Changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot
elevation, to match fire flow precedents used in
EDC for years

Locally adopted and amended

Allows us to match what developers and residents are used
to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been
used for over a decade in EDC.

Appendix B: Table
B105.2

Established a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM,
below 5000 foot elevation, for all commercial
projects

Locally adopted and amended

Allows us to match what developers and residents are used
to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been
used for over a decade in EDC.

20-0203 L Page 25 of 52




It is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to

Appendix D: D103.1 N Made an exception for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended construct a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant
Title 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways.
Appendix D: D103.2 N State law requires no greater than 16% grade Locally adopted and amended In our Ef Dorado County Title 14 adoption we allow greater
than 16% grade with AHJ approval and hard surface.
Appendix D: D103.3 N Text to include curbs and gutters Locally adopted and amended 20 foot rqad mdths.shall ot lnc!udfe CU[b? and gutters due
to potential access issues and turning radius concerns.
Appendix D: D1035 § Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided
1' ’ N Fire apparatus access road gates Locally adopted and amended roadway the gate width shall not be less than 15 feet due to
radius issues.
No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet
. ] in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does
Appendix D: D103.6.1 N Roads widths 20 to 29 feet Locally adopted and amended ot apply. This section is adopted s it stands in the Fire
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all other elevations.
Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet
. } allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of
Appendix D: D103.6.2 N ZZ??:m::s mors then 29 feet but less than 36 Locally adopted and amended  |elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations.
Appendix D: D104.2 Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
P Exce ﬁon ’ N building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
P have only one approved fire apparatus access road. residents and first responders.
When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus
Appendix D: D104.4 N Added to require circumferential fire apparatus Locally created and adopted access road shall be co.nstructed _to encompass the entire
access roads structure and shall provide a continuous means of
emergency vehicle access.
Appendix D: D106.1 For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
i Exce {Zon . N Removed Exception in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
P residents and first responders.
Appendix D: D107.1 For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
Exce {ion : N Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
P |residents and first responders.
Adopted with no Amendments
101.2 through 101.5 N Cﬁs" fo estabiish scope, intent, severabity and Locally adopted Administrative clarity
102.6 through 102.8 N References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
10210 through 10242 N |Conficting provisions, Other Laws, Application of Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
references .
Definition of the Fire Prevention Division and ability - .
103.1 through 104.1 N 1o enforce the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.3 through 104.4 N Right of Entry, Warrants, and identification Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.6 through 104.6.4 N Record retention Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
1048 trough 104,92 | N [Modreatons,altemate means and mefhods, and Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.11 through Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of s .
104.11.2 N systems Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.11.3 N Authority of systems and devices inoperable Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
105.2.3 N Time limitation of application Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
53 through N |Operational permits Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
Dry cleaning operational permits required for SO, .
105.6.12 N hazardous clsaring solvent ugs Locally Adopted Administrative clarity

20-0203 L Page 26 of 52



Permits for various business operations for: Magnesium,
miscelfaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation

105.6.2.28 through Adopted _thss sect»c?n for afimmistrat:ve clarity and Locally Adopted vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing faciltes, open buring,
105.6.35 fire and life safety inspections
open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and
organic coatings
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and .
105.6.37 fire and lfe safety inspections Locally Adopted Pemlts for places of assembly
\ Adopted this section for administrative clarity and g .
105.6.39 fire and lf safety inspections Locally Adopted Permits for private fire hydrants
Permits for pyroxylin plastics, refrigeration equipment, repair|
105.6.41 through Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally Adopted garages and motor fuel-dispensing facilities, rooftop
105.6.46 fire and life safety inspections ¥ Adop heliports, spraying or dipping, storage of scrap tires and fire
by-products
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and L -
105.6.48 fre and lfe safety inspections Locally Adopted Pemit for tire-rebuilding plants
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Permit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material,
105.6.50 fire and life safety inspections Locally Adopted lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 cubic fest)
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and .
106.1 through 106.3 firs and fifo safety inspections Locally Adopted Fee schedules for permits
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and " .
107.1 fre and ife safety inspeciions Locally Adopted Inspection authority
Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of
s y - . equipment, re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping,
108.1 through 109.3 ?rio:rt':dlitft:ss:g‘gc?:sfo;;gfnllsn|strahve clarty and Locally Adopted supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding,
P Board of Appeals established, limitations on authority, and
qualifications
110.3.2 through Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally Adonted Compliance with orders and notices, prosecution of
110.34 fire and life safety inspections y Adop violations, and unauthorized tampering
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and -
110.4.1 fire and ife safety inspections Locally Adopted Abatement of violation
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and . A R
1131 fire and lfe safety inspections Locally Adopted Authority to disconnect service utilities
Asphalt kettles contain highly flammable substances and
303.1 through 303.9 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted require stringent safeguards {Climatic, geological, and
topographical)
Managing ignition sources through responsible application
305.1 through 305.5 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted of standards will reduce the number of fires in various
settings (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY
306.1 through 306.2 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted flammable and require special handling (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)
. . " Open buming, recreational fire, and portable outdoor
307.1 through 307.5 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted fireplaces, (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
. . . Open flame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and
308.1 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted topographical)
308.1.2 through ’ A " Throwing or placing of ignition sources, forches for
308.1.3 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted removing paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Locations near combustible, open flame devices, signals
) and markers, portable fuel open-flame devices, sky-
308.1.5 through . ’ " lanterns, religious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming
308.1.8.5 Adopted this section for fire and ife safety Locally Adopted food and beverage preparation, dispensing, containers not
in use, serving of flaming-food, location, fire protection
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)
3082 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted Permits are required for above section (Climatic, geological,

and topographical)

20-0203 L Page 27 of 52




308.3 through 308.4.1

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted .

Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices,
theatrical performances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2
dormitories (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

310.1

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

General requirements relating to smoking (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

310.3

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

"No Smoking" signs (Climatic, geological, and
topographical)

310.4 through 310.8

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with "No Smoking”
signs, ash trays, buming objects, hazardous environmental
conditions. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

311.1 through 311.4

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Vacant premises condition and safety requirements,
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant
premises, security, fire protection, fire separation, removal
of combustibles, removal of hazardous materials. (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

319.1

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

General requirements relating to mobile food preparation
vehicles. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

319.2

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

Permits for mobile food preparation vehicles (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

319.3 through
318103

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Exhaust hood, fire protection, fire protection for cocking
equipment, fire extinguisher, appliance connection to fuel
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, metallic
storage tanks, nonmetaliic storage tanks, cooking oif

{storage system components, design criteria, tank venting,

normal vents, emergency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum
aggregate volume, protection of container, LP-gas container
construction, protection of system piping, LP-gas alarms,
CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel,
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG
container construction, CNG containers supplying
transpiration and cooking fue!, protection of system piping,
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems.
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)

403.8.1 through
403.8.1.7

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1
(residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and
fire safety plans.

403.10 through
403.10.1.3

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancy
Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

405.5

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

510.3

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)

807.5.2 through
807.5.2.3

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a
maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in
educational facilities (Climatic, geological, and
topographical)

903.2.1.5

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers)
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000
square feet. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

20-0203 L Page 28 of 52




1103.2

Adopted this section in existing buildings for the
Y safety of firefighters and other emergency
responders.

Locally Adopted

Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings.
Alf buildings will be required to allow emergency responders
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by
the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind
this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Appendix D: D101.1

Adopted this section for the safety of the public,

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads

firefighters, and other emergency responders.

through D102.1 N firefighters, and other emergency responders. Locally Adopted including loads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
. . ; Dead end fire apparatus access road requirements for a
. Adopted this section for the safety of the public, L ’
Appendix D: D103.4 N Ifiefighters, and other emergéncy fesponders, Locally Adopted turn aroun'd at 150 feet. (Climatic, geological, and
topographical)
. Adopted this section for the safety of the public, "No Parking, Fire Lane" signs requireménts, (Climatic,

Appenix D: D103.6 N firefighters, and other emergency responders. Locally Adopted geological, and topographical)
Appendix D: D104.1 Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus
through D104.3 N firefighters, and other emergency responders Locally Adopted access roads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
(excluding exception) ners, gency resp ’ ) - geciogical, pograp
Appendix D: D105.1 N Adapted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adonted Requirements for aerial fire apparatus access roads
through D105.4 firefighters, and other emergency responders. y Adop (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Appendix D: D106.1 Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential
through D106.3 N firefighters, and other emergency responders Locally Adopted developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
{excluding exceptions) ghiers, gency responders. op , geological, and topograp
Appendix D: D107.1 One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be

penclk L. LAY Adopted this section for the safety of the public, equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire
{excluding exceptions) N Locally Adopted N .

firefighters, and other emergency responders. apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and
through D107.2 . e
climatic conditions.

Appendix D: D108 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopted Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction

standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Grey cells aré previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle.

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions.

20-0203 L Page 29 of 52



20-0203 L Page 30 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Board of Directors Board Meeting

October 8, 2015 at 6 p.m.
Marle Fitts - Board Chalr, Ripley Howe - Vice Chair,
Ellesn Strangfeld - Board Secretary, Jarry Jumper - Director

Mission Statement
Te provide & professional ond compassionate level of community fire protection, emergency medical and
rescue services to the citfrens and property owners within the Fire District, in onder to prevent or minimize the
loss of iife, poin, suffering and property domage as @ result of fire or other types of emergency.

Meeting location: PFPD Administration Offices— Boardroom
7060 Mount Aukum Road, Somerset, CA 95684

1. CALL TO ORDER (Director Strangfeld will be attended the meeting telephonically from 5075
Cary, Grizzly Flats CA.)
1.1 Roll Call
1.2  Pledge of Allegiance
2. DETERMINATION OF QUORUM AND CONFIRMATION OF AGENDA
21  Adoption of Agenda
3. SPECIAL ANNOUNCEMENT /| PRESENTATIONS / GENERAL BUSINESS
3.1  TIME SENSITIVE MATTER
2010 Fire Code Adoption - Public Hearing — Direciors will convene & public hearing prior to the first
reading of Ordinance 2010.01 (California Heelth and Safety Code Section 13886.7)
4, PUBLIC COMMENT
Any parscn may address the District Board on any subject pertaining to District business, which Is not
listed on the agenda. This comment is provided by the Ralph M. Brown Open Meeting Act (Government
Code § 54850 el. saq) and may be limited to three (3) minutes for any person addressing the Board.
8. CONSENT CALENDAR
Consant calandar itamas are considerad routine and are acted upon by the Board with a single action.
Members of the audisnce wishing to provide public input may request that the Board remaove the item
from the Consent Calendar. Comments may be limited to three (3) minutes.
51  Minutes from Board Meeting July 8, 2018
52  Minutes from Board Meeting August 21, 2018
53  Minutes from Board Meeting September 10 2018
5.2  Approval: payment of bills ~ grean sheats
6. MONTHLY/STANDING ACTIVITY REPORTS:
8.1  Administrative/Chlef's Report
8.2  Local #4586
83 PVFA
6.4  Financial
7. OLD BUSINESS (The Board may slect (o review, discuss, iake acflon or vots on any okd business. The Board Chair may
request & roll call vots on itams)
7.1  Open Board Position (BOD Fitts)
7.2  District Investigation 001-2010 (letter of Concarn, related to 2015 Incident) (Chief)
7.3  PILT Funding - Possible misuse and or distribution of funds by the El Dorado County Auditor

1
PFPD Board Meeting, October B, 2019

20-0203 L Page 31 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Board of Directors Board Meeting

7.4  Payroll Services (Chief)

7.5  PFPD Vegetation Management (Ad-hoc updates) Ordinance (Director Jumper/Chief)

7.6 Pioneer Fire Protection District Building/ Facility Use Agreement (Chief)

7.7  Auto Aid Agreesment; between Amador County Fire Protection District & Pioneer Fire Protection
District. (Chief)

7.8  MOU Per-Diem Position with Amador Fire Protection District and Ploneer Fire Protection District
(Chief)

7.9  “Accept Pioneer Union International Association of Firefighters, Local 4586 demand to continue
bargaining successor MOU."” (BOD Fitts)

8. NEW BUSINESS (The Board may review, dlscuss, take action or vote on any new businass. The Board Chair may
request a roll call vote on items)

8.1 HR policy review and updates (Chief)

8.2  Ordinance 2019-01 Adopting the 2019 Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the
2018 Edition of the International Fire Code, regulation governing the safeguarding of life and
property from fire and expiosions hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of
hazardous substances, material and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property
in the occupancy of buildings and premises In Pioneer Fire Protection District (PFFD), providing
for the issuance of permits and collection fees therefore: Repealing and previous PFPD
ordinances. To include all information and preceding to be discussed for Ordinance adoption.
(Chief)

8.3 Resolution 20198-006 ~ Findings of Fact - Discussion/Information/Action - Resolution setting
forth findings with respect to local conditions which make certain modification and changes to
the Caiifornla Fire Code necessary for preserving fire and Iife safety In the Ploneer Fire
Protection District — (Chief)

8.4 Fire Code - Ordinance 2019.01 - First Reading of the 2019 Fire Code Amendments -
Discussion/Information — Staff to present the 2019 Fire Code Ordinance to the Board, (Health
and Safety Codes: 13869.7, 17958.7 and 18841.5) (Chief)

9. CORRESPONDENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS AND/OR REVIEW

8.1  Thank You letter from Amador Fire Protection District for Pioneer fire Protection’s support with

vegetation and debris clean up In River Pines (Vierra)
10. GOOD OF THE ORDER
11. UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS:
12, CLOSED SESSION

Woods Claim Update (closed session with attorney)

12.1 Anticipated Litigation Case # PC20190038 Katherine Wood VS Ploneer Fira Protection District
(Significant exposure to litigation pursuant o Gov't. Code Section § 54956.9(d)(2) or (3). Update
from attorney via conference czall. (BOD)

12.2 Possible exposure to litigation (1 matter) pursuant to Government Code Section § 54956.9(d)
(2). Facts and circumstances that might resuit in litigation need not be disclosed. Conference
call from attorney regarding potential appeals. (BOD)

12.3 Labor negotiation (MOU) Pursuant to Government Code Section § 549857.6, conference updates
and information batween District negotiators and Local #4586 (BOD)

13. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION
14. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (if applicable)
15. AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH

PFPD Board Meeting, October 8, 2019

20-0203 L Page 32 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Board of Directors Board Meeting

16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday
November 12, 2010 at 6 p.m.

Preparad by:

Joy A Administrative Assistant! Amended by Mark Matthews, Fire Chief

The Pionser Protection District (“Disirict?), In complying with the Americans with Disabilities Act ("ADA", requests
Indhviduals who reguire special sccommodations lo access, atlend and/or participate In District board meelings due fo a
disability, may be requested by cailing (530) 622-4444 no later than 72 hours In advanca of the scheduled meeting ime. In
compliance with Government Code Secilon 54857.5, non-exempi writings that are disiributed o & majority or afl of the
Bosvd in advanca of a meating, may ba viewed af 7087 Mount Aukum Road, Somarsel, Callfornia. in addition, if you would
like & copy of any record relafed lo an llem on the agenda, please contact the District Administrative Assisiant af (530) 820-
4444, Station 38 has disabled access and fecliilies. All Board meeling are recorded. Offfios hours Tuesday through Thursday
Pam fo 1pm.

Agenda posted af the Disitrict's Adminisiration Buflding, Post Offices in Somersel, Moun! Aukum, Grizzy Flats and the
Ploneer Fire Protection Disiricts website sl www.ploneerine.org,

Si R FF 4 me ’hn’_
Date Pomed:~ 10 /0 /2014 Time Posted: 7?1;14_

Amended 101062019 doe to Direcior Strangfeld needing to attend via telephonic communications, nothing to the sgenda bas change
except the eddition thet the will be attending via phone due 1o exigent circumstances.

PFPD Board Meeting, October B, 2019

20-0203 L Page 33 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Board of Directors Board Meeting

18. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday
November 12, 2018 ot & p.m.

Amended by Mark Matthews, Fire Chief

District ("District”), In compiying with the Americans with Disabilitiss Act ("ADA"), requests
apecial accommodations (o acoess, sllend endlor pariicipate In Disirict board meetings due o a
disaniity, may be requesied by calling (530) 6224444 no later than T2 hours in advance of the scheduied meeting ime. In
compilance with Govemment Code Sedtion 54957.4, non-exempt writings that ere distributed to @ majorlly or af of (e
Board In advance of a meeting, may be viewsd at 7081 Mourt Aukum Road, Somarset, Cailfomia. in addiion, I you would
iike a copy of any record raisted lo &n em on the agends, pleese contact the District Adminisirative Assistant af (330) 820-
4444. Station 38 has disabled scoess and feciities. All Board meeting sre recorded, Office hours Tuesday through Thuraday
Pam lo 1pm.

Agenda posted af the Districts Administration Buliing, Post Offices In Somerset, Mount Aukum, Grizzly Flats and the
wabsite st wyw.ioneerfie.org

Wﬁa

Posted /?/é/? Tmeromed ___7-OC 0

Amended 10/06/2019 due to Director Scrangfeld needing to amend via telephonic communications, nothiog to the agends has change
except the addition that she will be attending via phone due to exigent circumstances.

PFPD Board Meeting, October B, 2019

20-0203 L Page 34 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Board of Directors Board Meeting

16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BQOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday
November 12, 2019 at 6 p.m.

Prepared by:

Joy Vierra, District Adnfinistrative Assistant’ Amended by Mark Matthews, Fire Chief

The Pioneer Fire Protegtion District ("District’), In complying with the Americans with Disabilities Act (“ADA"), requests
Individuals who require’special accommodations fa access, aftend andfor participate in District board meetings due fo a
disabiilty, may be requested by cafling (530) 622-4444 no later than 72 hours in advance of the scheduled meeting time. In
compliance with Govemment Code Section 5§49567.5, non-exempt wiitings that ane distributad to a majorily or all of the
Board In advance of a meeting, may be viewed at 7067 Mount Aukurn Road, Somerset, Callfomia. In addition, if you would
like a copy of any record relaled to an item on the agenda, please contact the District Administrative Assistant at (530) 620-
4444, Stetion 38 has disabled access and facllities. All Board meeting are recorded. Office hours Tuesday through Thursday
9am to 1pm.

Agenda posted at the District's Administration Building, Post Offices In Somerset, Maunt Aukum, Grizzly Flats and the
Fiane, rotaction Districts website at www.plonserfire.orq,

o O

Signa Location

Date Posted: Mﬁ éﬂ{i Time Posted: g ‘f{s?m

Amended 10/06/2019 due to Director Strangfeld needing to attend via telephonic communications, nothing to the agenda has change
except the addition that she will be attending via phone due to exigent circumstances.

PFPD Board Meeting, October 8, 2018

20-0203 L Page 35 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Board of Directors Board Meeting

16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday
November 12, 2019 at 6 p.m.

Prepared by:

The Pidneer Fife Protection District ("District’), in complying with the Americans with Disabilities Act ("ADA"), requests
individuals who require special accommodations to access, attend and/or participate in District board meetings due fo a
disability, may be requested by calling (530) 622-4444 no leter than 72 hours in advance of the scheduled meeting time. In
compfiance with Government Code Section 54957.5, non-exempt writings that are distributed to a majority or all of the
Board in advance of a meeting, may be viewed at 7061 Mount Aukum Road, Somerset, California. in eddition, if you would
like a copy of any record related to an item on the agenda, piease contact the District Administrative Assistant at (530) 620-
4444. Station 38 has disabled access and facllitles. All Board meeting are recorded. Office hours Tuesday through Thursday
9am fo 1pm.

Agenda posted at the District'’s Administration Building, Post Offices in Somerset. Mount Aukum, anzly Flats and the
Pioneer Fire Protection Districts website at www.ploneerfire org.

o) »
Qﬁ/}. } A DN 0L &y

Signaturf Location
Date Posted: 1 D;l["’/go /ﬁ Time Posted: 7 /[Dfﬁ)"lf\—

Amended 10/06/2019 due to Director Strangfeld needing to attend via telephonic communications, nothing to the agenda has change
except the addition that she will be attending via phone due to exigent circumstances.

PFPD Board Meeting, October 8, 2019

20-0203 L Page 36 of 52



Fjl

PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Board of Directors Board Meeting

November 12, 2019 at 6 p.m,
Marie Fitts - Board Chair, Ripley Howe - Vice Chalr,
Jerry Jumper - Board Secretary, Michael irish - Diractor

Mission Stotement
To provide o professional and compassionate level of community fire protection, emergency medical and rescue
services to the citirens and property owners within the Fire District, in order to prevent or minimize the ioss of
fife, pain, suffering and property domage as o result of fire or other types of emergency.

Meeting location: PFPD Administration Offices— Boardroom
7060 Mount Aukum Road, Somerset, CA 95684

AGENDA

1. CALL TO ORDER
1.1 Roll Call
1.2 Pledge of Allegiance
2. DETERMINATION OF QUORLUM AND CONFIRMATION OF AGENDA
21  Adoplion of Agenda
3. SPECIAL ANNOUNCEMENT /| PRESENTATIONS | GENERAL BUSINESS
31 Recognition & Honor of the following: Kenneth Strangfeid
4. PUBLIC COMMENT
Any person may addrass the District Board on any sublect pertaining to District business, which Is not
listed on the agenda. This commaent ls provided by the Raiph M. Brown Open Meeting Act (Govermnment
Code § 54860 et. seq) and may be limited to three (3) minutes for any person addressing the Boand,
5. CONSENT CALENDAR
Consent calendar ltems are considered routine and are acted upon by the Beard with a single action.
Membaers of the audience wishing to provide public input may request that the Board remove the itam
from the Consant Calendar. Commaents may be limited to three (3) minutes.
51 Minutes from Board Meeting October 8, 2019
62  Minutes from Special Board Meating October 28, 2018
5.2  Approval: payment of bills — green sheets
6. MONTHLY/STANDING ACTIVITY REPORTS:
6.1  Administrative/Chiefs Report

6.2  Local #4586
8.3 PVFA
8.4  Financlal
7. OLD BUSINESS (The Soard may siect 1o review, discuss, take aclion or vote on any oid business. The Board Chair may
requesl a ol call vote on Nems)
74  PILT Funding - Possible misuse and or distribution of funds by the El Dorado County Auditor
(Cnlef)

72  Payroll Services (Chief)

1.3  PFPOD Vegetation Management (Ad-hoc updates) Ordinance (Director Jumper/Chief)

7.4  Ploneer Fire Protection District Building/ Facility Use Agresment (Chief)

7.5  Auto Aid Agreement; between Amador County Fire Protection District & Ploneer Fire Protection
District. (Chief)

PFPD Boerd Meeting, Novemnber 12, 2019

20-0203 L Page 37 of 52



Nov 12 2219 Aqende,
fqz

PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Board of Directors Board Meeting

7.8 MOU Per-Diem Position with Amador Fire Protection District and Pioneer Fire Protaction District
(Chief)

7.7(a) Fire Code - Ordinance 2018.01 - Second Reading of the 2018 Fire Code Amendments — Chief
to present the 2018 Fire Code Ordinance to the Board. (Health and Safety Codes: 13869.7,
17658.7 and 18841.5) (Chief)

7.7(b) Ordinance 2018-01 Adopting the 2019 Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the
2018 Edition of the International Fire Code. To Include all information and preceding to be
discussed for Ordinance adoption. (Chlef)

7.8  Update on open board position; (\Vierra)

8. NEW BUSINESS (The Board may review, discuss, lake aclion or vote on any new business. The Bosrd Chair may
request a roll call vote on llems).

8.1  Pay rate review and potentlal adjusiments/changes o the OES deployment rate for volunteers
and reserves,

9, CORRESPONDENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS ANDIOR REVIEW
10. GOOD OF THE ORDER

11. UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS:

12. CLOSED SESSION

12,1  Labor negotiation (MOU) Pursuant to Government Code Section § 54857.8, conference updates
and information between District negotiators and Local #4588 (BOD/Chief)

12.2 Conference with Real Property Negotiations (§ 54856.8) Property located at 4847 Sciaroni Rd
Grizzly Flats CA 85684 (BOD/Chief).

13. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION

14. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (if applicable)

16, AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH

16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday
December 10, 2019 at 6 p.m,

Tha Pioneer Fire Protection Distric! ["Districr), in complying with tha Americans with Disabilities Act FADA"), requests individuels
who require special accommodaiions (o sccess, attend andior perficipate In Distrie! board meafings due lo a disabilly, may be
requasied by calling (530) 822-4444 no ister than T2 hours in advance of the scheduled meeting ime. [n compllance with
Govemmani Codes Secion 54057.8, non-sxempt writings thel are distibuled o a majorily or all of the Board in sdvence of a
mesting, may be viewed af 7081 Moun! Aukum Road, Somersel, Calfomia. In addition, If you would ke & copy of any record
ralaied io an llem on the sgends, please sonfact the Diatrig! Adminisirative Assistant al (530) §20-4444. Station 38 has disabied
access and faciiities. AV Board meeting are recorded, Office hours Tuesday through Thuraday Bam g 1pm,

Agende posted sl the Distrior's Adminisiration Building, Post Offices In Somersel. Moun! Aukum, Grizzly Flals and ihe Ploneer Flre
Protection Districts website a! www plongerine org

Front Do

Date Posted: H/E'_/-’Di"? Time Postad: 35i5'-pfh...-

PFPD Board Meeting, November 12, 2013

20-0203 L Page 38 of 52



NOV [z 2019

PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Board of Directors Board Meeting

76  MOU Per-Diem Position with Amador Fire Protection District and Ploneer Fire Protaction District
(Chief)

7.7(a) Fire Code - Ordinance 2018.01 - Second Reading of the 2018 Fire Code Amendments — Chief
to present the 2019 Fire Code Ordinance to the Board. (Health and Safety Codes: 13868.7,
17958.7 and 18941.5) (Chief)

7.7(b) Ordinance 2018-01 Adopting the 2018 Edition of the California Fire Code, Incorporating the
2018 Edition of the Intemational Fire Code. To include all Information and preceding to be
discussed for Ordinance adoption. (Chlef)

7.8  Update on open board position; {Vierra)

8. NEW BUSINESS (The Board may review, discuss, take sction or vols on eny new business. The Board Chalr may
requast & roll call vole on ltems).

8.1  Pay rate review and potentlal adjustments/changes to the OES deployment rate for volunteers
and reserves,

9, CORRESPONDENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS AND/OR REVIEW
10. GOOD OF THE ORDER

11. UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS:

12. CLOSED SESSION

12.1 Labor nagotiation {(MOU) Pursuant to Government Code Sectlon § 54857.8, conference updates
and information bafween District negotiators and Local #4588 (BOD/Chief)

12.2 Conference with Real Proparty Negotiations (§ 54856.8) Property located at 4847 Sclaronl Rd
Grizzly Flats CA 85884 (BOD/Chief).

13. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION

14. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (if applicable)

15. AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH

16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday
December 10, 2010 at 8 p.m.

mﬁw

District Administrative Assistant

The Flre Protection District ("District’), In complying with the Americans with Disabilities Act (“ADA"), requasts Individuals
who require apecia/ sccommodalions o access, attend andfor participate In Disiric? board meelings due fo a disablity, may be
requestad by caling (530) 622-4444 no later than 72 hours in advance of tha schacuied mesting Bime. in compliance with
Govarnmen! Code Section 54957.5, non-exsmpt writings that are distribuled fo a mafority or all of the Board In advance of 8
meeling, may ba viawed al 7081 Mount Aukum Ruwd, Somersel, Callfornia, In addition, if you would ike & copy of any record
reinted fo an ltem on the agenda, please contact the Disirict Administrative Assistant aif (530) 620-4444, Stetion 38 has diseblad
acocass and faciifies. All Boand mesiing are recorded. Offfcs hours Tuesdey through Thursdey Bam lo Tom.

An’lndlpn]hdlfl’ll Disirict's Administration Buliding, Poat OMces in Somersal, Mount Aukum, Grizzly Fials and the Ploneer Fire

phsits af www.pioneerfire.org /ga

Location

-I ”"’/3/"? Time Posted: S0y

PFPD Board Meeting, November 12, 2019

20-0203 L Page 39 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Board of Directors Board Meeting

7.6  MOU Per-Diem Pasition with Amador Fire Protection District and Pioneer Fire Protection District
(Chief)

7.7(a) Fire Code - Ordinance 2019.01 - Second Reading of the 2019 Fire Code Amendments — Chief
to present the 2018 Fire Code Ordinance to the Board. (Health and Safety Codes: 13860.7,
17958 7 and 18941.5) (Chief)

7.7(b) Ordinance 2018-01 Adopting the 2019 Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the
2018 Edition of the International Fire Code. To include all information and preceding to be
discussed for Ordinance adoption. (Chief)

7.8 Update on open board position; (Vierra)

8. NEW BUSINESS (The Board msy review, discuss, take aclion or vots on any new business. The Board Chalr may
raques! a roll call vote on items).

81 Pay rate review and polential adjustments/changes to the OES deployment rate for volunteers
and reserves.

9. CORRESPONDENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS AND/OR REVIEW
10. GOOD OF THE ORDER

11. UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS:

12. CLOSED SESSION

121 Labor negotiation (MOU) Pursuant to Government Code Section § 54857 .8, conference updates
and information betweean District negotiators and Local #4586 (BOD/Chief)

12.2 Conference with Real Property Negotiations (§ 54856.8) Property located at 4847 Sciaroni Rd
Grizzly Flats CA 85684 (BOD/Chief).

13. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION

14. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (if applicable)

18. AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH

18. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday
December 10, 2019 at 6 p.m.

Fire Protection Disirie! (*District”), in compiying with the Amenicans with Disabillties Act ("ADA"), requests indhvidusis
who require special sccommodations o sccess, sftend andior participale In Distric! board meetings due o a disabiity, mey be
requaested by caling (530) 622-4444 no lster then 72 hours in edvance of the scheduied meeling Bime. in compliance with
Govermment Code Section S4857.5, non-exemp! weifings that are disidbufed lo a8 majonly or alf of the Board in sovance of »
meeling, may be viewed ai 7081 Mouni Aukum Road, Somersel, Callfomia. In addilion, if you would ke & copy of any record
related to an fem on the sgenda, pisase confect the District Adminisiralive Assisian! at (830) 620-4444. Station 38 has disabled
access and faciities. All Board meeting are recorded. Offioe hours Tuesday through Thuraday Bam fo 1pm.

Agenda poated al the District's Administration Bullding, Post Offices In Somarsel, Moun! Aukum, Grizziy Fisls and the Pionser Fire
Protectian wabsite af www. plionserfine.org

&F #e

Location

Posted: /f/-!/f’ Time Posted: __& €O P

PFPD Board Meeting, November 12, 2015

20-0203 L Page 40 of 52



NOY 12 2019 Agenda
Fq 2z

PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Board of Directors Board Meeting

78 MOU Per-Diem Position with Amador Fire Prolection District and Ploneer Fire Protection District
(Cnief)

7.7(a) Fire Code - Ordinance 2019.01 - Second Reading of the 2018 Fire Code Amendments — Chief to
present the 2019 Fire Code Ordinance o the Board, (Mealth and Safety Codes: 138607,
17958.7 and 18941.5) (Chief)

7.7(b) Ordinance 2019-01 Adopling the 2019 Edition of the Callfornia Fire Code, incorporating the 2018
Edition of ths International Fire Code. To include all information and preceding to be discussed
for Ordinance adoption. (Chief)

7.8  Updais on open board position; (Vierra)

8. NEW BUSINESS (The Board may review, discuss, laks aclion or vole on any new business. The Board Chair may request

a roll call vote on fama).

81  Pay rate review and potentlal adjustments/changes to the OES deployment rate for volunieers
and reserves.

9. CORRESPONDENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS AND/OR REVIEW
10. GOOD OF THE ORDER

11, UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS:

12. CLOSED SESSION

121 Labor negotiation (MOU) Pursuant to Government Code Section § 54857.8, conference updates
and Information between District negotiators and Local #4588 (BOD/Chief)

122 Conference with Real Property Negotiations (§ 54956.8) Property located at 4847 Sclaroni Rd
Grizzly Flats CA 25884 (BOD/Chiaf).
13, RETURN TO OPEN SESSION
14. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (if applicable)
15. AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH
16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday
December 10, 2019 at 8 p.m.

Prepared by:

-

Adm tive Assistant

Fire Protection District ["Distric), In complying with [he Americans with Disabiilties Act ("TADAY, requests individuals
who require apecial sccommoditiona fo sccasa, altand andlor participate in District board meatings dus (o & dlsabilly, may be
requegied by celling (530) 823-4444 no laier than 72 hours In advance of tha acheduled meating dme. in compllance with
Gevernmeni Code Section 549676, non-axsmp! writings thet are distribuled (o # majority or all of the Boand in advance of 8 meeling,
ey be viewed of 7081 Mount Aukum Roed, Somersel, Calfornia. In addition, if you wouid ike 8 copy of any record relaled Io an
itam on the aganda, piesss contect (he Distict Adminiatrative Assistant af (530) 820-4444, Station 38 hes disabied sccess and
facilties. Al Board meeting sre recorded. Office hours Tuesdaey through Thursdey Bam lo 1pm,

Agenda posiad af the District's Administration Bulding, Post Offices in Somerse!, Mount Aukum, Grizely Fists and (he Plonesr Firs

ihbosls

uabened _[1/8)2019  rosren 315 g

i
PFPD Board Meeting, November 12, 2019

20-0203 L Page 41 of 52



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted | Adopted as Amended Finding
101.1 X Admin
105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
106.6 X Admin
106.6.1 X Admin
106.7 X Admin
109.4 X Admin
110.4 X Admin
110.4.2 X Admin
112.4 X Admin .
202 X Admin
302.1 X Admin
307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
3310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5001.7 X Admin
5601.2 X Admin
5601.2.1 X Admin
5601.2.2 X Admin
5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 L Page 42 of 52




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section

Adopted

Adopted as Amended

Finding

6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

6113.1 X Admin
6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16§ 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix B: Table B105.1(1) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix B: Table B105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.5§ 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

101.2 through 101.5

Admin

X
102.6 through 102.8 X Admin
102.10 through 102.12 X Admin
103.1 through 104.1 X Admin
104.3 through 104.4 X Admin
104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin
104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin
104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin
104.11.3 X Admin
105.2.3 X Admin
105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin
105.6.12 X Admin
105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin
105.6.37 X Admin
105.6.39 X Admin
105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin
105.6.48 X Admin
105.6.50 X Admin
106.1 through 106.3 X Admin
107.1 X Admin
108.1 through 109.3 X Admin
110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin
110.4.1 X Admin
1131 X Admin

20-0203 L Page 43 of 52




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section

Adopted

Adopted as Amended

Finding

303.1 through 303.9

>

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

305.1 through 305.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

306.1 through 306.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

307.1 through 307.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.2 through 308.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.2 Admin

308.3 through 308.4.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical

310.4 through 310.8

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

311.1 through 311.4

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

319.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

319.2

Admin

319.3 through 319.10.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.10 through 403.10.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

405.5 Admin
510.3 Admin
807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1.5 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1103.2 Topographical
Appendix %100120111 through Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.4

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.6

XX X IXXPX]X XX XXX XXX XX XXX x<XIX]|>X]|x

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.1 through

D104.3 (excluding exception) X Climatic/GeQIogicaI/Topographical
Appendix DDlDOlSOjl through X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
nggr;d(zleu?::::Xz:;?og:) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendixs(:cgstoiz.nls;excluding X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 L Page 44 of 52




20-0203 L Page 45 of 52



20-0203 L Page 46 of 52



20-0203 L Page 47 of 52



20-0203 L Page 48 of 52



20-0203 L Page 49 of 52



20-0203 L Page 50 of 52



RESOLUTION NO. XXX-2020
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO
(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 011-2017)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is
updated by the State every three years; and,

WHEREAS, the 2019 Calilurnia Fire Code became ¢fTective on January 1, 2020; and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5
permit a county to meake such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2,
Chapter 1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety
regulations to the local level and grams authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building
official, or his or her authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his
or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, enforcement of the Fire Code in the County of El Dorado has been delegated to the
chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, on November 12, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Pioneer Fire Protection
District adopted Ordinance No. 2019.1 which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with
amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or
topographical conditions,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El
Dorado ratify the following amendments to the California Fire Code adopted by the Pioneer Fire
Protection District:

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following
sections:

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4 through
307.4.4.2 (g) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1.
507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2,
903.2.9, 903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905 .4,
5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 through
6112.3, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 (NFPA 13D-2016), Appendix B: Table B105.1 (1),
Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D103.5, Appendix
D103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Exception, Appendix D104.4., Appendix D106.1 Exception,
Appendix D107.1 Exception.

 20-0203 L Page 51 of 52



20-0203 L Page 52 of 52



	Resolution_Pioneer
	Reso Pioneer FPD 2-25-20



