
RESOLUTION NO. XXX-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 020-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the 
State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a 
county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably necessary 
because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 
1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulations to the 
local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her 
authorized representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the fire 
protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a 
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection 
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on November 12, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Pioneer Fire Protection District adopted 
Ordinance No. 2019.1, which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with amendments the District deemed 
necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado 
ratifies Ordinance 2019.01 of  the Pioneer Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement of the 
ordinance to the Pioneer Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections: 

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4 through 
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1. 
507.5.1, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 
903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 
5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 through 6112.3, 
6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 5.1.1.2, 
Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA  13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: 
Table B105.1 (1), Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D103.5 
Section 1, Appendix D103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4. 

 20-0203 L Page 1 of 52



Resolution No. XXX-2020  
Page 2 of 2 

 

 
The Pioneer Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, 
including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2018 edition not 
adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

 
105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403.4, 
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12, 
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808, 
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, 
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception), D107.1 
(Exceptions  1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, 
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M. 

 
Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 

 
 
 
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said 
Board, held the _____ day of _____________________, 20__, by the following vote of said Board: 
 
 Ayes: 
Attest: Noes: 
Kim Dawson Absent: 
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors  
 
By: _____________________________________ _____________________________________ 
 Deputy Clerk Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Board of Supervisors 

 

 20-0203 L Page 2 of 52



Dc<ccmbcr II, 2019 

PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
no • RESCUE. EMS 

P.O. Box 128 
7061 Mt. Aukum Road 

Somerset. CAlifornia 95684 
Phone (530)620_4444 • Fax (530) 620·4317 

www pionttrfi~ 01X 

Don Ashtol'l. Chief Admini.nratl\'e Officn 
EJ Dondo County Board ofSupcr.ison 
330 Fai, Lane 
Placerville, CA 9S667 

...... 101 ....... 

_f •. ~ 
..... _ -V ... a­.-..... -, 1oOi.. __ _ 

E __ "" _ 

Subject ; R~)u lutlo .. Ratil'}"iII~ OrdiunCC' No. 1019,01 01 tb Ptou~r fin' P",I«Iioa 
Di'< rritl .. hleb adop ts th 1019 Califo ... il Fin' Cod~ witb I mndmc.11 n'III~ t. 
loul clima tic. gWlrapbie Ind tupograpllic cOldit io .... 

~ar Mr. A.hum: 

T1w Pioour FiJ-e Prot«tioo Disulct (PFPD) is requesting the Board ofSupcrvison (BOS) rari fy 
ilS OrdtlWlC~ No. 2019.01which adopu the 2019 C.li fom .. Fin: Cod~ 15 alMnckd due 10 speci fic 
local chmllie, ileoanphie and topographic conditions. Califomi. Health and Safety Cock S«tion 
13169.7 ~uires the legislatl\~ body of the city or county ... ~ the ordinance witlappl ~ 10 n lify, 
modify or deny the adopted ordinance. The 80S must also deleilate cnfor<:ClMnl orthe ordinance 
10 tither tht Fire Dislnct (or il$ I"CJl'l'senlllm'e) or tht Chief Buildin, Orr": ;11 
TheJ-efOR. we rtql,lCl;t tht County Board of Supe rv.sors .. tify Ordinarw:c No. 2019.0 1 With 
arnc:ndmcnlS to the 2019 CII'fom;' Fire Code. and delega te the enfOr<:cmcnt of' .... t Ordinance to 
tIx Plonttt Fire PnMKtioo District Chief. A PfOIIOSC'J BOS rCloOluliOn Is enclosed for your J-ev;cw 
and use on this topic 

This resolution hu 00 direcl !i1lCfl1Impac:t 10 the COWlly. 

ATIACtIMENTS, 
I. Pioneer FiJ-e ProtectKlO'l Ot.wic. Ord .... nce No 20 19.01 
2. Pioneer FiJ-e ProIcoCuon D.stricl Findil\l of Filet k nolU1ion No. (1(16..20 19 
3. Dnlft EI OorIdo COunt)' 80S RC$IOIution 

 20-0203 L Page 3 of 52



Attachment No. 1 

Pioneer Fire Protection District Ordinance 

No. 2019.01 

 20-0203 L Page 4 of 52



, 

P IONEER FIRE PROTECTION DlSTRl CT 

ORDlNANCE NO. 201',01 

BE IT ORDAINED BY 1'HE BO .... RD OF DIRECTORS OF THE PIONEER FIRE 

PROTEcnON DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS: 

An otdinanc.e of !be I'ioDc:er fiR l'roIoction District (1'10) ..topti", the 2019 Edil>OD of the CQ~~itl En 

Cod.!, iDoecllpo ... tina; the 2011 Editiora of the 1~11'II'I eo.u, "'auJ.tina anc1 aovemin, I.hc .re,uanli", or 

life lind lAoperi)' fmD In IDCI explolion huard. visiD& from tbe IIorqe. hand.linlllld 11K ofhazatdcus 11It.!aJK)Q, 

-.erial.1IDd deYlCCS, aDd !rom oonditioas hIoPl'dout 10 iiJe «< propaty ill the 0D01IpIOey ofbuildillp wi prtn'IiMs 

ill the PlO; pt<>VidiJ!a for tbe i»Iw>cc of pcrmils .... c:oIlocIi<Ia of r-Ih=for; RcpcoliDl CIrdinmc.e No.1016-l7 

oftbe PIO _ all OIlIer ordin_ "'" pont ofllle onti_, ill collDid llIcrntilh. 

&. it ORDAINED by the BoW of Directcn of the PIO, IlIo known .. \be PioDeer FIft Procectiool 

Dillric:t: 

Section I : FINDINGS OF fACll 
SectiOII2: "DOnlON Qf COpE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

SecUcm J: LOCAL AMENDMENTS 

Sectiao 4: CONE!.ICI 

Ser;tioa 5: SEVERABILlTX 

So;tioo 6: £FrEen V! DAD MID PUBLI CATION 

SECTION I : f1NDL"CS OF FACTS 

Ths PIO makes cenaill ch&Dae1 (lilted below) 10 \be c.tiforltlll FIN Cod., 1019 EditioD, pIIrWaI'II: 10 

1f«,1/. ol Sofoty C(Jth s.ct/I>IU J J86'.1, 1795& 7 .ad I~/.J duriq Ihi. code .dopciOlI procell. S\Ic:Io chaaaa 
.... n ...... my bcelutc of local e/ilDltic, aoolotkol aJI&Ior IOpOpphk:o.I conditlonJ. The PIO hu 1IIopIed, 

punuant 10 5«1;011 /8941.5 of the C4l1jiJr1d4 11ft/III <l S4fty CoQ, the fmdinp of recti mlliYe 10 ~ 

conditiolls by ReIollllion 112(119.\0 of the PIO dated September 19, 2019, 

S£CfION 1: ADOPTION Of CODI WITH EXCLUSIONS 

Tho PIO..x,pu!be 2019 Ctlli[omkl FIrt C"*, nu. 14, Put 9, II II! ndruy. incNdlq Appendi-. 

;_Ponllial tbo&e aec:tIar.I of 1hI/~ FIrt Coer, 2018 ocIilioA DOt ldopIed by the MM6, with It. 

uc/usioas u.ted below: 

Ordinance 2019.01 , .." 

 20-0203 L Page 5 of 52



£II~ !~.6. !7· !OH.I', 1 ~.6.J9, :101.1.4. 309, )11.5, )1 1.6, ']1, 403 I, ~3.2. 1-403.2.4, 40).3, 

4034, 40)6, 4OU, 403.1 ( ....... 4Ol.I. I-4Ol.l.I .7}..tO)', 40).]0.2, .to).IO.3, 40) .11, ~'. Il, 4O'.1-40U, 

4O$.1~.4, tOS.6-40S.' . .06, m.«I7 (tdnp.., 107.5.2).101, 9001.1.1, 1]0], 110'3.1, 110'3.).] ]QM, IIQl.P 

(..tapoial IIQUI). IIQ3.10, 1104-1106, CIAptcr 25, CIIaptcr l6, the acepDcaa IIIIdcr 0104..2 (£xc:epQoQ). 

0]06.1 (EaafI~ 01071 (Ettc" ..... )' .... ppmdi. A, Appendix E, .... ppendi .. F, .... ppendi. 0, Appendix 1, 

A;P h~""n ..tid ....... , I'.N. 

SEcrtON ): LOCAL MUNPMENIS 

1loc IDIkrIrtIna ScctIoIII w. heRby IP100Ilded or ocIdocl; 

Chapter I 

Sut!PI !OI Stgps.M Gearn! KtgW."u 

191,1 IlIIt ...... be--"'d.rc.uo..: AM_~jwrlrJ/*.{PJOJ 

Sttt\ol 1!15 h r.!U 

105.6.17 Lf'G.I!" Ihallllc 1
m 

1 ' .. 10lI0 .. .: Add IU dill Me. h' AI or IboYe '.000 r.: 01 

de. jo-~. pcII"IIIiI" aoc iequilod fbr Indi~ _iIMn whb. 1l.S,pJke _ ClpKIty or .... 

or a:wltqioIe _",_ ''-- .............. Ie quantity aoc ata:diq 115 pu.:... -w., 
occo~ ill Group R·). 

Sum' 1M fm 

lK.' Puwll nil Bn,lnr yd lullSS'"' flU Ihallllc Iddood .. follo11l.: "w...n.J. ~J-
Nk,'ld b)' t.V.tir&ric1 ~~tIfHaonfiJrpIM ........... IlufHCliOtIl MIl 1M '"""'- ofpnwo/IJ",. 

.... ~..,. latfowttJ 110 Ill. -.1__....lII.JlrldjiHWrwlwI. (HIGItA" S4fory ClMJ. 179,,). 

10U. 1 Coli 8uovtry fHl IbIlIIIc MkIod I' folloWl· FIN 1.,w"J"- ""0'''' dotIJ,WIII 0111 

~ fir-.. _JIOIruiOll t1' buJlnW IMI 1lIt9WP ~ql/plcc. vfoI,,'1ofI 0[ 1M u... • <II .. rvtJl of 
~INU, II _poIIS/bl. for Ill. __ of I~ lII.JlriI:f III _poNI .., 1M .JOlIN of .... IIocIMou. A 

dUrrid boGrrI ~ c44.-p .. /H 10 0:0""- 1M COol/ of '"'I)',.,me. wIridIlM dlnrft:t ,*0 •• dw (:GIl 

of rrrf«"dnI all,)' rlfl'IaI/oIIfor w4WIllNjiH II ~1tMJH (HHlIlI " $qfc0' a..1J91~. "" foulloll 

/lOt u;nOItl 1M ocnoaI 1;01/ qf 11Ippt'aU.." 1M fin iINIIfIf" .... pfHOIii,., 10 1M ~ of lUI btdd-. 

11)6.7 Adulplwltlvs CRill lballb. tOcIod .. follo....-.: It'll ..... ,." I1'IIupe ';CI'I" ~IH. _ 

Ill. COIIIrOClOf'" faJJt 10 1H"f- 10 1M ~ ... O/IM ""rMrlot ....".,ftuUdic.fi ... (AJU). 1I\ • .uu 
_y btU Ill. COIIIrDC/Ot" for «1WIl U-1pMl ~ 10 MI/ /f'wtf loW rcn.1MpIC"I .... /oQI1I ....... 

lite n-lpMl <I' 1M lallflvpect/9tl M.., .".JJ .., """"' .. "...",. _"-

Ordirnonoo 201\1.01 .... ' 
 20-0203 L Page 6 of 52



Set!». l !)f BU ri ofApptal' 

Su!lu 11M AppgJ fussdl!ra apc! DlPtURe. $ball budded u folloW!: A1f}'pnwII or'"li/)'''''WO 

bft~ fAtq ""!7 k ~ 4«led by "" onhr. d./(;/.riOll. ()I' d"~""iMlkHI /ItDd, by l~~ji.., cod, 

o/ficl4ll~II" wrililtl ItDIkI .....,. "",*,lllIiI Mllllv...uJrill 15 c"/'ndu t/to>! ifllt, pDJlmu/r Oft 

Ut.t ItOdca All tOIdt appH/J ,A .. U be jIIed ill wriloJlg wilit tit, s.c..,Wy qJlM Go","",n, Bt;NJrd for 
IN distriCI. A dlMiJlIPP«'l ,IuJII'fQ)r forthu «dol! by tit, fi.., Ct)l/. l).Dietl)l ImIfI 1M "..,11.,. II 

df/VMi"ed by Ut, APPfJtlI BOllni .., I)JIlllnN iI. $«ljlHl 109.2. l1li1." Ute Luu. poIlI .... /"",,1IIMt fin 
()I' IV. UI/Ity Iwud IQ _be,., Df 1M jJlIbIlc. 'nil fin coM DjJicl4l ,1IQ1l1rOt0' ,.... oppcI/tmt by 

ccfflji..J .... 11 Q[ lit. dllM D"" lim, "f.rudt It",ri",. 7JIc itMrirIj' 111411 be ,cMduled 10 ULb p,", ltD 

,..,.", ... IIt"" 20 «dlJ>d~r <illy, f,."". 1M dD" ,it.".." IHIIIM urtijitd -SL 'nil lippfl/"'" ,MIl"'" tlM 

ripl III tip""''' I" IH"'D" ()I' by IIpIII /II ,.... ItH1'in6 I11III P"fI"'1 ~ -u:". aJtdItw pItDt/lgraplUc 

1Vtd_ 10 tit. APP"'I BO/Ird. 

Sml08 110 Vloillioill 

110 .• YIPlatlog PClIl!Iet IhaU b- UDCDCScd .. r.:.11ows: PenoDs who IhaU violalc. pmviDon oflhil 

code 01' IbaU I:a!.lIO comply '!VIlli aD)' of cbc ~_Ibo:noo( or who IIhalI erecc, wlall. ilia'. 

rep.rr or do work ill violation of ~ appmvcd _lion docl!mmll or d:inclive of tbo: fU'C code 

official, 01' of • penni! or ccrtif"",tc .... 1IIIder pn>YiD<>na of IhiI code, sball ba ,...aty of • 

misd_ rw iJ!I;oaiOfl, III tlM 4/.J.t;I'Itioft /If Ut.t prWfICllli ... <>ItOnMy or "P"o/. punishabl .. by • 

flllll POt exceed;", J/OO.OO/Or oftm WtH/Ili<M, 2. Aj/Iw /tilt uc:udI ... JjOO.OOpo ,«Ond vWladlllt 

of tA, ....... pnw/IlII1I ",",I" -)MlIr, J, A/iM _ UCHtI"" 11000 00 /Or lad addjlialtlll v/(J/alilHl 

of tJw _ pt'VIIisitJII witAoilf _,...". or by imprilOl'lmeo! IlOl exceedinj 180~. or bod! Sl>Ch fIDe 

and imprilonrn. ... L £adI da)' ilia! I vioIatioa ccmlinllCS after <NlI DIMice hal bee:ra ~ abaD be 

~ ' ''4 • 6epIlI!e o{f-. (H",111t d Sqfitty OHM Saclilllu 1310 GIld 17995). 

"M~ CUlliog. Jb.il be ~ II follows: 7JIc Fi.., C~I" Dr ~13n.v duly ""lltDrilIld 

~/llIi .... ""!7 iuW dl~tioru frw l'l/rrXrilHll rw ",lId,,,,_ r 1Iiolllllt.oru of"'l1 CI)tie ~I III 

$«Iit;m 13'11 0/11t, 1ka11~ d W./)' CtMh ofllll SkIll ofC/IJifom1D 0IId CIIapiu 'c (_~ 

lOlitA $«d()tl 833,6) ifnll, 3 of Port 2 0/"', P'NlI Colli of liN sw. qfCo/(fDnlk 

Stctjgg III SlOp Work Order 

11M, Ia!lut 10 Comply IhaU ba I ma'ldcd II follow" ArJ)')XnOCI who IbaIl conrin" c Ill)' wort 

Ifter IIIIving been --' .... id! I ttOp-work order. Ucep! -=h wort 1:1 b! per.a ia d:incte4 !D 

perform to If:IIIOV8 • viol,lion 01' \IIIIIf, condition, IhaII b. pwtislotJbll .... 0 JIM rwl/npriroMlloll 0' 

bolA <u ducribed IItS«doll110,4 (H#I111~" StV~ Cc* Secrio-, 13UJ "'1799J). 

0rdi.nJnce 2019.01 .... ' 
 20-0203 L Page 7 of 52



SUt!oI m ct'"" Qso"llm 
Add deflftition for e.NDO,. -SII"II_'JIrr MIld! " "-'»-~. /NrNttIII ___ lip d., 
or oadtMk~. 7lir itK:htths~ eoNIIlMtI tftdU _door ftrwpJ_ """' ~ ,_ 

...uJtf"'a ordi ..,.. _ l<Suwi*1Wd. /iqIftd. fir n>hI/wb. porrobN boorlNaor pIb. ~ I>r 

.IpG« '-tiItt dcWea WJ\idt '" I4Id 0Iim. • "'Y IlTIICtlln. 1ftObiI. ~ or <my Iiviftt 
• cc a f 'i.- _fd OIl. ""Aid .. 

Add ~ b Plalrlsl • SlttJII "' ... " dw "'''*' -' 1111.",.,,.,. aNaJ wifAIII fIN ~ botowJIrlc 

-"-0"''' • ...."fI .. uf4bl~A..J. 
Add ckfuuboa fbr Drh.",u - SJWI _ • .... lnJr _ diot _ '" ... _ (2) fIIII'«b ... 111 .... 

.ooon1Mll1WO (1J ~l l/IIltr oM "'1 __ fl/--a.I . iItdu...w ~ 011 MtA 

,.,-
Mel defiaita b Emy!lvt Body - SIIoll_dw a--i rj" DirffftIJ6'J rj"dw DVfrlct. 

Add de:fiaitica far fin "Ie' -S1tall _ 111. CIN", E:uc..liw F'In ~ • W. F'In 

NptJ~ ",.,....,,,, 1M j~rl.JdidltM ,., a duly a../Itorlzfd npNUttltnM. 

Add deliMioll fDr Tt,'nrd Cro",d M,YH, • SJ/IIlI_ ,ltUttIby ~ ~ a ucvrify 

porItNIII .... ~t .... II_~ .. dw,..,..,~ fa _""1'-11_,.,l14li. 
pIooIII/JII'b&4W~ III 011 fInhrly_ ""_/iuA/i;M lit u.. ~.... ,.:q 

Ch.plu] 

Ssctjoa 3U Qsfttldoll 

lOt-I DcGaltlo1l IbIU be .uc:DCled. all follow., Added Campr,,~ dd"wu.... .. __ abcm. ill .,.,.., 
Sum. H? OR" 'm'''' S,mtUoul firn. lId OMI" t'kspltS" 

3f7,U C._Ran Sutrkdou .wi b- tddlId .. followa: 

)!7,1,1_1 h " ",,'nfol fiv 11\)''''''''' • /iaI'It _111,,",11, • III. a ~ IqIOII tN .... "/0' bnuA • 

..... aJ .w.t. ~ laM. or foral_. «I""" dwrlllf III. liNN ...... hi""", pUIit/1l ,.,. 

nllpllldltl by lIN Dil"«for qfdw /)qltvrlll1IIt. F"rulry oM fln ""91«#411, "" CtL FlU thtIt 

OUt(; or fIN AHJ. 

~,'C-",nmI~..".,....doouwUl~q{flNAHJ. 

]f7.M,l ..... ~ _ "Ib_ It ,bltt/ IN ""Itn.foU/II' ... ~ • 4lAt ....tllf4fll. tN .... 

• ~..-..,.....,. CiII''' • .IIM( fJ'OU-...... ,.. fir farc~"'ued """ lilt/us tJrt 
/OlkIwVII """""'_ ...... J _ _ I!iIIIIIpIJIIIi willt. 

Wld,4.l (Il n. _ wilIIloo S". qf fA. p.rlp~.,., ~ IIw COMpjI,.. " cI«lrWI qf IIll fl--bII 

0nIiDm;e 2019.01 ..... 
 20-0203 L Page 8 of 52



3OM,1.l !b\ 0... umc:N/>k showl Milt " IttIIuJI. q{ III t.an 11 iItCIwD: if NIIIdy P IU. III tIN 

i ..... Nicu. _ of 11M """llfi .... 
3!I7.M,l Is;) o."'Pfi_ s/IIIll N /ilfllud 10" I foof b)'1 fo«..,., ""G ", .... "PF'IoW ... turtif=><rM 

COtOob'",. "*' 01' fin 1'IfIC. 
397.4.4,1 (dl Wnue. ~ q{ tIN ' ___ r _I N tJbi .. ilOtd prlof' to III. lrollltJn of lIN 

a.mpfin tmd sIUIIl k Of! sllC. 

Chlpter 5 

Sm'" ,OJ F ire ApP!(!!UI Amu R ... d, 

" 3 2.1 WlllfUioA' IbIl.I be ..,...idcd II Collow,: Fire IppulllU aooeu roedI IIIIll .... "" III 

UDObI1nocIcd width of DOt less !ban l O fi:d, eJCcllllive or sboulden, IU MtuWl'ed frtmfac. of ""rb to 

loa q{ c:wb, eJ.cqlC fbi" opprowd ...cwil)' pta ill ~ with Seeliaa 503.6. aad ~\fId 

vcrtiell clcInncc 01 DOt lea !ban J' /1«. All dn.......,., lit ,.. dillrlct slodJl ..." k I.u IMn 11/1« 

""'. 
503.1.$ Ured Ep4I obo.Il. be Imended .. follow1.; Dead end fiR ~I\IS _IUds onJ drillr«lll)'r 

in ex ... or 150 red in lena;1h shall be provided wilb In approved uea fer I'IImina: In)Und fire -"-503,2.1 Bdda$! 'Rd [lty.!td SW rf.m WlI be iUnerIde(I .. tollow,: When!. brldaeor III ellMlllld 

surface ill put af I fue IpputlNI access ro.d, !he bridae WIll be consc=.1cd I!ld maintained In 

Iccordance wldr 1M n/""'" EJ Dorodo CO«II/), f)oaltSpMGliOlt Di'NiOlt Br/dgf Sumd~1'd f)r ApfHtldlx 

D of lIN ,,*,,",,1 OIIiJOt'I1i~ n,. (Ad .. wIIic/lr.w if --. _trlcdw. &idaet mel. cLc\·,tad .urflCOl 

sNll be _II""' rtr I Ii"" to.d ~ !D carry ~ impotOd IMdI ot fin: IppUatus.. Vehicle loAd 

limilS Ibal! be pOI\CICI" boCh enlJ1lQCCI 10 bridaet Wen requited by !he Fir. Code Official. Wbcre 

ekv1roted ~ de&i&Ded fer cmcrteDe)' vdlicle \lie. are ad.iaunt !D IIIrfkea which an: PDt de.iJllCd 

fbr -.ch .... '1'1*0.-..1 Ilai oicn, approYed siaos. Of boob Iball be instilled and mlmtliDed wbat 

requinod by 1M fin: code officill. 

,03, • .1 No Plrkln II fin klu Iha!l be added u tollows: No JMnrPI.tlul1I s/Cp. ptDt, 01' I ... .., 

sl#JltJu..1lI!JI wltlel" wII"lt" (l1I.1td'" 01' "Nau",d"'. ""PI """ ... MCCIICII)' to /lvold <!Oft/IWI wlilt 

IIlIiIlT 11'tlIfI~ II'" / .. eompllm_ wlilt III, dlr«fiotu of d .. FITt CAUf, II'" hWh'r dilly awdwrlurl 

''P' i411IU1dw, Prou OJIiefr 01' rdf/cI,,' trqJJI~ _U'OI drN;e "I""" dOl. of""" htghlO<ly, at 1liiy 

c:wb. 01' ill ...". toa.lifHI / .. " pwb/kly 01' prlWUlly IIWMd 01' opralM 11/1_' panu., }ilclli/),. 

duf"",'eti AI "fin 111M b)' 1M disllicf willt ~ _III, _ lit wIIkIo lit. pIII« Is "'--. 

n. rlui$MdOlt IMII k /lid/Mild (I) by.slp ptJI'N IIMtIdialfly ~IIO, twI vIIibll frorrr. t.W 

dcsipNld pta.:. clerl)-lIatu.. bt lIMn ..." 1m ""'" _1JOdt u. ~I dIcu IIw pI/ICf II "j/f"f btl, 

(l) b)' (lUl1ini", 01' plllIlliIII do, p/lIc. III red-t ill COII_f/llt NIfw. ",1Irl;i", III, pille. Mill '" 

0rdinInec 2019.01 Pogo, 

 20-0203 L Page 9 of 52



-W HFlU LANE-• .....wd _ d-t, ""IbI.;o. <I ..... leM, or(1) by <I .......... or"J*#tl 011 

,IN fIIIp r¥ 1It.~ ""'" WIWdI " ~ ~ IIw __ HFIU UNE-

3M.l No hrkl" II Frill of H)'dgll' tbaII be..tded .. (oJ1owa: No ~ I/WI,..,,.,.,., 

1_ 'fQ~ ...,. wJticN wllAVo J J /HI 0{ • In """'~, ~ a:r foI~ (~If oM .... k .. II 

,t-.u.J ", <I liccrontI ~ .... II ,'''' flo ,.. froN HdIIJlld ..., COlI 1.....&u1lJ _ IUd 

w/licl, III QU' of~. (PJ) 1/ lIN "-"':1." __ iN f1fHnIl«I by tl/in d'pat'UJlMI __ 1I """'0-
_rl:IJ tu oflr- d...,-, wAick 

!OM" Un Lilli IIHd 01 BOld WldJll lhIll be Ickled u folio ..... : Fin fMll 11I4lI H twuf</l "" 

"",d wldlll 01 ,..,Mirtd '" AppuIdb; D tu tl-..Md by lIN dUIrl« 

50M3 fln ApRION. Mag Gun tblU be.oded .. follows: AU au_lie __ ~ ..,., 
IrultllW 0_ 1n.."...,1W _ rootb 111l1li toooIp()o ";I~ lIN dUIrkI rtl'-I~ till .",.,0.­

.... ,""fin ....... qj/idfIl-

StsQgI $9! tnm. ldSllltktlit1 

$95.1 Add"" Idn!lfkldu tball IIIw the ftnI 11M 0( !lib parI&I'IIpb ammded .. follow.: 

Add_for"'" fIIWI ainbw IHltUUWs 111<111 COIIIp/y willi! ..wlll.tfrlCl ~ ~ a:r.,....,WId 

6yIA·fow ....... qtftcfal. 

SUI", $91 tln 'ronda. Wiler Supplle' 

CbIoptu ' 

Scstiql!O) fin Spdtkka 

MlJ Wit,.. Btuln!! tball be _lIDded u fOllows: AI> 1'P'0.ed _~ apriIIId« I)'Ittm JIIoIl 

.. ,..,..,.. .. IluUIJIMi '" ..... /Nihlittp twI , __ J600 ,...". /ItIt iN Vf!<lI<I1' ..... "" 

fGM __ iN rIiooaw wllIIl~ lIN jMrbdkllftll till .-:n'bed In Seo:!Iou 1103.1.1 !brou&b \1103.1.12. 

£u,ptIa" ApblinonJ buildln" not WIder I ~ _ pormil IIIIId far -.m.a.1 p:rpoteI. 

993.h WMn Rta,ktd w.n be Iddod .. follawt.: St.uw o{Girfillt bodJdUtr' ","flO' tIttfl.ot J,6OO 

"""",,..,. f~ IXllli,., IIt.lldl,.., 1.600 lqUD,..jHlor,,../Cr. 0IMr lI\0II_ ... _jiurdly "'_III,., 
.... 0. _ qrlatlrwal lHlildi,." 1101 wtd", ~IIIH pInIIi. for two _ • d.II pwpoJu. ""''"' lit. 
II- _ 0/ 1M 1It.1u..., IN I/f"\OC/W,.. U ittuwsffl by .. ..JdIIIo,t 0{ __ ..-. IItIrly ",""I (J~ 

II' J.CIOO....-.J-I ..... ~ II ..... I/Ido /;<vlhlilll"""'" .-'O ........ -PM 10 $«,,,,,, .. "-
"3tH Wltsrs Rrq.!ud IIalI be tddecI u rouow.: sa-, 0/ cdldq /;<vlldilfp IaJ tM.. J,6(IO 

~ J-t. ht au"", /;<vIM""" 1.600 JfI>'M' fottI • WA. ..,. ... -"" ~-fturllfy ","IIUW 

..u:.. turtI ~1_11It.11dfntJ ..." w. Zfl«W _ ,...u,." ~ "" dol J1IU7IOHI. ,..,.,. u.. 

p .... 

 20-0203 L Page 10 of 52



flow _ of'" btdl4iaz".ItnodI/tw"~.d III. tohoJ,.-.,ro-p _ J,600.,..,../HI. 

by ... ..tditj"" of~ ..... liUfyfN'N"l (~(If' I.OOO~.r-- ............. " ..... ~ ~ 

(If' ~11wIJ N .... III c; """. 10 s.a;"" I/IOJ.1. 

POU.I Cmp A -..:1 too ammdDd II foIlo:noll'or A IJOUPI A·I dIroup A"-: IIOU.I 1 (1) n. fire 

_,""c:-b J.600~fea. 

til,},) Calp E l1li1 too .... mH II follow1.: 903.2.3 (I) ~ 10 ~ E art.,.. IfeIIW 

tbu ),600,......../iHf jp ..... 

"Uri Ca MP F_I all be ImencXd II follOWS: 903.U Group F. 9Ol.l •• (1) A Group F fire llU 

,""OMCh J.600 .......... /«I. 
!IOJ~7 CrwP M .t.lI be .... c::ndod II folloovs: 9OU. 7 ~ B ad IlL !iIOJ.2.1 (I) A On.up B IIIId 

N fIN_ ,""oeecII J.6OII ........ ..-jHl. 

PIJ.ld,] MI,y[,stJrtd Homu lb&ll be added .. follows; All .. "; ' .... ".IprlMI, 1yI~""IItJU 

.., • ",II ... , r Q ,'-..u" "'-III",. no. da/p" ""~ II( ltd 1yI/fJOII rlltJU N III tI«OI'rIo...:. 

Mdi ,."..,."'" c-. of R .... l4tkPu. ro,. 2J, f4m - , 
1. Mllltll/«lund Iromu loau-I Mdlill .. Giltt", 1IIObU~ pIVt C<IIIIpIyI", wiIAo 

Co/!{omfQ H~11t tJnd $Qfoty O>th. !:1t<MitNt I J, I'wf J.J (It' 2.J. 

2. l/""wjiJclW.--d ,,_ lI.a, flo _ UCftd 1.1(J(J,......- /HIli! M lntd _ III.'" 

~ tt-1II11IwW. III rJl/i-''''' c.-."mmt Co.N S«tfooo 6185111; wII ... "'­

cairli.., pftlNU)l ..,itIMt« _ 11M jJf c,: /,)' 11_ , .. iNtI /11:1 COIIIpIy >Mdo OJlVOmU> 

R~dtJl C_SectK.t n/J.1. 

J. u~.-.u 1Jiol. _ QCMJt/ J1()~/Nf '" nrc. 
IIUU GnMp 5::1 tbalI btl am-sed II I'oIIowI:: 90] .2.9 Group S. 903.2.!I (I) A (lroop S fin: an:a 

uce.il J.600,. .... ,../I« 
203,] ,11 Gavp $-] ttdoK1l 'arid" c ..... '" oI:.Il b. _ended II follow1.: !lOU. IO (1) Wb.n 

S!«!oa "7 De Alum ADd PtIKllaa Spira!! 

"'.lrl rom aegylnd - HI!! •• 8411Q or SIAmm"" I'" Mot IQnn R'I .tIaIl b. added. 

as folio.....: All ¥fI'OWd 1" .Ianv" ,aio:M IyINItf ,ItoU N IIIIldl,., bo fill /IIoi/dUsp wWI • fo­
_1aI tJ.... J,600 IfUAI'lI fost. 

Ordin&nct20I!I.OI 

F. • n·u.t: 

I . a.- MJ r.aJO i!1lbM/iIIp (R.] ~fu ..... oeM- ""'¥" Hr ~"'I(II" 

lIS -U-). 

.. .. ' 
 20-0203 L Page 11 of 52



2. Agricultural buildings 1I0t under special use permit and/or not used for commercial 

purposes (e.g., retails sales, food senJice, and/or special events). 

3. Buildings with aftoor area less than 500 squarefeer may be exempt, as determined 

by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, based on bUilding 

construction material and features, location, occupancy type, and distance to 

exposures. 

907.2.b Status of Existing Buildings shall be added as follows: In existing buildings without an 

approved automatic sprinkler system, other than one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultural 

building /lot under special use permit for commercial purposes where a jire alarm detection system 

does not exist and the floor area of the building or structure is increased or modified by more than 

thirty percellt (30%) or 1,000 square feet, whichever is less, such building or structure shall be made 

to conform to Section 907 wilen required by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative. 

Bui/dings with af/oor area less than 500 squarefeet may be exempt, as determined by tire Fire Chief, 

or hislher duly authorized representative, based on building construction materials and features, 

location, occupancy type, and distance to exposures. 

907.2.c Monitoring shall be added as follows: Alljire alarm/detection systems shall be connected 

directly through and momtored by a V.L. approved central, proprietary or remote station service, 

which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly attended location. All sprinklered buildings 

shall be monitored. 

E.-cceptiolls: 

1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified 

as "U'1. 

2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial 

purposes (e.g .• retails sales, food service. alld/or special eventJ~. 

907.2.d Type I Hood Installations shall be added as follows: Tlte requirement of installation. or 

replacement, of a Type J Hood System shall require a fire alarml.fprinkler monitoring system to be 

installed. or for the hood system to be connected to an existingjire a/arm/sprinkler monitoring system 

for that building. 

907.6.2.1 Secondary Power Supply shall be added as follows: bt accordance witlt NFPA 72, the 

secondary power Slip ply providing a minimum 24-lIour power capacity under quiescent/oad (system 

operating in a non-alarm condition) shall be amended to a minimum 72-l1ollr pol',,'er capacity. 

Ordinance 2019.01 

Exception: Tlte existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed the 

requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12. 

Page 8 

 20-0203 L Page 12 of 52



Ch.pln n 

Sullol no} emil""! ud St.pdbx PflrH Snt.m, 

Un!'] IM".II,tln .. II be _-s.I .. ~ EawJ-:y poww ~. and Itondby power 

I)'IUIInS IIb&lI be iD4IlIllecilD aceordanee wi!h cbc: Califomia BIIildID. CoOe, die Califoraia Electric 

Code, NFPA 110 and NFPA III . A.U boJJ~ odNr,..... _ ""'" twojizIfIily dwaIbot l1li/",-, 

.w"".,1 bt./1Ji,." _ a_p ""' .... "W fIU'1IOHJ . ..... ,1IJIIdby,.,--, rJotsU.w... /I , AI<llIII'ip 

~ "'" dixoM_ tJll "'--'00 , .. III UN ~ fIPI1"I'Wd by no. fi,. coM ojfic/aJ. &Uti • 

.... ~ ,1t4tl b. _btlOl~d iJllICCOf'daltU .... "" "". orlzlNJl ...."",...L 

Clllpter 33 

StcAn lJ 10 " ssm (or flanc'rlu 

PlY m.,l" Idu!lfktllop l1li11 be added .. toUows; Ptfo, ICI -' ....... """',"",I':"'" .... 

"1'; OM tMIdra, ,Ip,IIaJi IMproWdM III Mdlfo'-'" .. ""'1->' ..... _ roM"'&7 brIO .. ,..,... 
Stcdpe 3311 Witte Sypply (or Firs fnm!lqp 

3)1 LI W_'I RCPMlrsd ... 11 be LtIIaDded .1 followw; PrW..., ~ribN _.-loll ~ ... 
,u., .. Jh lIyfJra~f _.,.._ .It/IU 1M I",UI/~ /If//I ,..,./lIboM lit _s- ........,... no 
_ ~ _ .... ...,.I«J NJJ _1M !'Wllilrtdji,.j/tTw /w UN prqJ«f. 

Cblpltr49 

Sutlol 4t!!J Pbu 

1"1.1 W)m R.uln4 1bt11 be td6ed .. fOllows: :rrt.Jv. eN. oJ/idlllll/lM PIO ~ ,.,...,. 

.... '; mpn1jecllltxatelill MotInoN. H~ft<WJ V",...m.fI Fin Huaris.-JooZ-lOneboooil 

jt,. pt'Ol r Ii .. pGJ.. n" pImo ,II.oU k "I'P">v«I b)' boUt 1M jt,. "* o/ftdIIl ... 1M _' bJ 

~ for .. '-' CAL FlU lhlft Cldq tV/-- /II tH.s.. JWJIO'IIIbUU1"'" (S/U)) 

"....10 .. --'i"" ttl. fI-J ... p ... pni«f b)' 1M c...mo- f/ D Dg ..",. 

Secllop1t95 WildOn f'rlt\lct!91lylldlu Cmlrys1101 

420M Bpp( ColllnlsliQ. Rrgvlr,.,,, _II be td6ecI .. follows; A.U __ ~ brt;1W .... 

IlidldoJu.. I"IIJ"fIV1 a.uA ,.oq~"...-bOo. AII~ ....... CJauA J'O/If~ 

II' ow.o()r III , 0IIIbI'-~~ lor"""" ""ON of ... eldJJIi,.,'InICfIn .... 1Abo '"".Y_'" 
JHrlH will ~_ ,..., .. ..vI,. "IlI/lN II CIAf. A J'O/Ifco..;,., t1t' _ ... bIjoo _II ..w,-

Chu • • II' C jt,. "'"""'-" _,_ """'" ___ woo4 ,AU.." $lti",1a _ ... fIIIF ol«lllr 

/I -¥~ _NrltII/wa.w A_MtbO< 

~20]9.01 ..... 
 20-0203 L Page 13 of 52



• 

("lIlp"r !'ill 

Sum. HOI Gmol 

SO!!,7 Lltbility ftc D'Rud Iball be ICIded IS folio....., AJO' """qa Of COIl rMOllflltfr- I~ 

t;tJnIcu ""-IIilC, qIllrw tIiIdlll'f' 0{ lUI)' I!{ulJl'fiDw ""'Imau ~W '-"~I HhI...,uu/ .., 

,lido fWlOIt.j/ntIlW WfjlOfiAiIM caouiII,J ,lid! 'PIU or dix~ .. "'II oIdw II coIl«tJbM ., ,.. n .. 
ellit{. fit' ~ .... d ~ ,.. rfPt"II:J_'~ ill dI. __ .... ,. lit tAo. _ fIf ... Nllp_ 

....,.--~~ ... j~ 

Chlpler 56 

Sw.!! • .581 CgH:nl 

SHU PeNiS Bcnlrtd I1Ia!I be unaided .. fOIlo_ P<rmlll IbIU be reqIIlrod .. lot for1h .. 

S«tioD LOS.6..:d rqularod i1I ........ daQu wiI;h IIU. _tioa. 1rlI_ uplwfl'U JM""'/U""',.""..u.( 

r.\q,1IoJ1 tM iuwtI by /Jtc Finl Ok[. Of ~.(II .... dtorllcd "'--"'Iiw. _ loW EJ Dora4tJ 

CDW/lO' $/ImjJ',lNptNf_t w-."' ..... b ~ _ ~ 1Aq,1taII k w..- by .. r_ 
0Itt(. Of' o\i."",.. ...... dIot f:J ' .. = utJltvoo, _lIN EJ Dorodo c-.O' BII<lI'fl ofSlt~. 

$flU,],! Potu.ut.!!n IhaII be Idded .. ~: 7k AHJ ,IIDU AQw tilt Q&I/JtorlO' "",......, 

__ ... ",tItm ~ oil up«U o{u..Jir-b,.,-an-. 
s§(t!.l t} fnpl1!IKY IgCora.1os IhaII be Idded u faIIoMI: 7'-.llIJwUlJl'Ol«' oU proprllltJ17 

~I/& -w... 

CIrI'p' er ST 

$sedoR 5794 Slum 

"..1 u.liMJtioll WlnnAbOyt=Groud Xu", tr. rr,, !blltd Iblll beamcodocl .. fOllowa: 

su.-. olCIMs 1 aDd CIuI n flammable liqlridt ID tbo-1fOWId t:ub ouuIdoa olborildinca II pI"OiIibi!ed 

__ fin • ...J., 1M FIrI CIIi¢ 01" hlJAt .... dilly ""~_ ~ ..,.,....ut.I by .. 

FfH ~ (W ~ ..". fNlJrorlI. "Y'W"'~. l1li....., ,,--1DIIt(.d or "'1Nfa111ldotu 

~ .. IWqe t{ a... l, U." DJ fl--bIc " -....udblc ~I oJ.JI ~ MIlt ..... 

"",wi n ., ,.,.,.. by .. c.1ifMrKt fT ... Cod.. 7TN C/Jli/onUII FIrt COllI rIIolI aLto "I'fIl1 "" 
1_lhIfio<Is ......... __ ... /tid, fo« <IUpc,.,1q 11/Ir/4N ......... -.II • e .t ,,...,. fr Nt""""" 

sullp':lm SR'Sh' Qpmtft" 

:l1OUz.u Looth" "\1[1 ...... yt=CroYId Ink' H . Prolllblltd Ih&I! b& ameDdecI '" foliaq; 

SIOn&C' of a.. I _ Cluo II n'mm,bl .. Ilq\liob III .bol_ifOIII'Id taW OlItAde of IJIIiIctiQp w 
prohibited !III'" .. .,..J .,. 1M TIN CJd4 "AWII.,. dIq ItIItlttJriu<Irwpcrm! -.... Int>r 

,-.slIM.,. IlMI'IIw ~ ,,"""" ~..w-v.d ~tM. fill..., ~ '*Ik(1)" 

.-II llullr/kt/olvfor IN ~ .C'= I. II "lllj/~ AIIII_boQlib/c liquid$llt(all-.ply 

Ontinaace 2019z01 

 20-0203 L Page 14 of 52



• 

~ u-.~., Iltfon/l ~ 1M ~ FIn<Ad •. nw- c.JifonUit> TIn eo.r.u"uflbo 

«ppb 10 wltlllariolU __ ,.., _w/JkI.jwJ ~fJItf 'uo./cfu ...... o~ ... ji '" Jrroo .... 

u,..,w.L 

SUdctl 9Q6 Dlm.,blt em'elk flM ld. 

'!!Of,} um11l1io1' sbaII be 1IDG>Iiod. fOIlowl: Storlie or tIamm.obleCf)'Qpnic Duicb izI.\e1ioDary 

OOQIIIIIICnI __ of ta.oildl:\a.l it prohibited lllliu.I ap~ by u.. Fin Cltll{. '" 1tU/JI,r otuOo 
..u.orlzlll ~1IJIi.... If'IIa pm,rlttN by 1111' Fin Cltiq, 01' JoU/Mr duO' _lIIorlzrcl 

,......,_dw. a/l,tIH/Q • ....,. ~I...n for lIN Ifotfll'l q{ fIawurrabJ. ujOJeli<: jfIiitb ,iHJlI co...pl)o 

wi,. __ '..... MII.,,.,fonJt ",. 1M C,/fIonru. FIn c-.. n. c..Iifonoitl FiIw ColI. ,1ItIJ1 obo 

f¥1PI~. iAJMllrric>v .... .", _ ~fwl ~ 1IJIIfbu""""" ~ I~ --
Cbapter 'l 

Sud" "14 IMIdo' o(LP-G1l C9R!'[PC[l 

'!M,2 Mulwym C'Rlslly !!'Ilhip EII.blllbed Limlu lllal] be 1IIIaIdcd .. folloWl; TJ.,,~ 

tJ{ liqwfiaJ ,,-01- f'U ill GCUI qf all .."..,01' q{l.000..,0/br IMlIr etlpodry -...Mn 1_.,. <II 

1Mu, -.Io4(f(J11) ...u. Jr- jJl'GfHlTjI _" '" dulplJ* for ,...,.,.1kII ...... ",,4 01 1*>11 o ... ·Iw/f 
(111) .. /Ufo- uhli.., ,..,1iJ,,,Iiil/ dnw/oplMlIl ..". 0 d~ ,..., ,.." _ (I) dwIIlhtr WIllI pM 

IDW" oll..,,_-lla((lll) ",iI,from....,.1.oW Of' 1Itt)Iti" au., Ii ..... AHJ '¥f'I'OIIH, t/NJ. 

IpKidllrxNotlilkwlJ 11M JWMir iI w-I b)' "'" c-o- f/ 61 CJor./o, 

~....u.\6! ultlb/ulNi s-i". WitJ\iJr 11M a.a .. ~ ... 6)1 ..... _lri~ lIN dlJ}Mniotf tJ{ 

liqII~ /H11'OI_ ... '" 11M ........ ,"'" III ~ p:fItII4UJt1 iN ~I*I..,.." tU ~ 

arpoa()I of 1IIfI- lIu/IIIllIJliOil ,..11 ..., U£MtI. _ .:apcIdo< qf 1.1XJ() sal/olu. TIll dilPftUbc 

fI!/ifWJIH ,.11'01 . ... flU '" _ qf Po ,,",.,au qf1.(J()(J.pIl"" _w C<lpGdry ...... ,octUH 

III ~ Go .. ~'If (/11) ".u, J'- P"fIPi'/'tIItIIMII 01" dul"..rfti for "a/tint/ltli III' .. ,1/ _I _ 

itol[(ln) IltdJ,jroM UUIn., rv/th,.,itJI ~I willi • 4tlUfC>' ,..". dIcur _ (I) "'-I1u., IUIII 

pU l/a'f Will !.oJ, -.llAvon) """fro- MI)' /tol,1 tw.wol<ll " "II.,..". Mo. AHJ ~ "'" 

" IpId4VCOltditiGMJ lIN pttWril " WIHIi by fI\t c-Iy "EJ Dot.J", 

S'wn" 1l1U.", £kudO' Ya"Otd. p,tl9I,,_ Gt, l nt.lI.tlop' (Uoo-fool '!sUllo" lId 

fll1.I 8.,,11190 IbIIl be JdcIcd AI fO!IaIwa; 

f'wo.Ilqf ,.1aIot- qr_1IttIJI N fIu.lI., loe ,,,,,,,,,,,,," wldt _"",acIWV ~ 

.,.,..,..,,~ npu/4/tw .1)11'''' u.JJ N (lul{l//etl "" til UG fMldlktliOA$. 

 20-0203 L Page 15 of 52



, 

T1o.finll~ "",14101'" slit/II", ilU/(lllftf IiIIIkI' lAc Ai"Pfl I""P ,_ '''PpIiN wi/it "'. UUtk. lJtc 

aUffDSpJruic pru$Wf ~ q{1Ac ,...../(J/()f' sM1I1H poIllltd d_IIWf11'd. 11i. JIm ,~ ,..plall)l' 

,1ItII1 /of pluMbed 1\:1 1M riHt" q/w y<Uti plpi"Z willi Iqft «>ppn ,ubl"Z 10 1I1/gw JIu:fbUlt,/l ,1100.1t1 ",ILl: 

Ilrl/ll", ocaor 11w rl.ru fr- lIN ytJI"d plp/", ,1uI1I1H It>C<>fd It()/ _ ... t.w. J illClttl (/IorlzotIlalJ,) 

Jr- 1M >Wllb of~.IIIILl 

1M fflX)lfd '. npJmOf" alld rls. ~ ,1tQ1I1H /Ju/oiltd ulldrr lIN _of lIN INfld;"I- QS elM. 

QS prtJCtimbl. /0 lit. bttildUtz >mil. 1lI/s r/s., l/tall IH 1~1y "'PfKW1..t1lwaced 1<1 u.. _II 

iIf'I"'O>'i""'t-'Y 10 I/OdIe klo .. lit" re,..IOII)I' HJ as /(} P"- betti;", qfl •• ~ b)' '-nil III......, ..... 

'''''''. 
If pro/n:ti..., _r, ~ by tMf/It nlppll,T IIIId B~lId,·,., OffIcial, ,10011 be 11U1lIl1«I_ do" 

s«rmtl Sfllp reJllllalor tlIId ucwnly Illpporled 10 1M V'Of'Itd or di~1Jy 10 til. -0. 

ntc TUfT pipa P IM!)IQ'd pipillZ ,Iul// ItOlIM tmbcddItJ ill ctHtenf.. C~,. p/tlMllIrOWtd .ndI 

rlnr IAIIllIH 1t.uJ b<ad:: /If i«Isl J inclt fro'" ailsidu "lilt. pip& 

A/lIN 1/"" if APPilcnlio" for <'Ill)' ""ildi". pntfIi~ Mild, /IM)#.Ia lAc iNliIIllNlQII Q[ .... lJ>G Jyl'1Mt, 

1.'1. ypllCQ/t1 ,loQllnlbM/1 ..... LPG .1)'11_ p/oI plan It! J cop<a (or di6illllly .., PDF) . ~ LPG pkH 

p/tm 'lraJll~lud .. t:.a..." IN Ilmi'_ 10. 1M I4IIA: I_'/oii, propos" UIItk topOCity III u.s. pl/Qlu. 

rllNlC of yard pipUI£ /octIl1ool oftM rl.rv * til rJt.1N~ PfDIHI'TY boimdaric, lIItd 411 _u... qf 

all U/sI~H /MldUv OIl r.\a lot tmtI a tkpicllfNI of 1M ,;q.niH of '"'9' buJldi,., '" IH 

supplied will. LJ>G. f1tir IMlI "t"o k /Of _ tNd III) 1M tlpproflri<ll' firw tJf:!lrict *' _ M" I«atoo-

~ oftltt __ ~ o/LJ>G 11Mb s/tall kpu7'lQlfDflly.....nat by 1M ..... oj'_Sltlka, lIII' 

al Hdi ..... SMelt s/ll.l:v sWJ k of lII/Jici_ ~II" k .... ibi. tlIf'OIl6It tDttidpatftllOlllrim ..... , .""" 

tkplIt af 1M IWp«IM '-'t/oIo. /,.,1411",., and IOIQ~ tJf dleu ,JIOO .... s..w _ 1M 

TUPQftJlbility 0/ 1M t.PG ....... 

I7t:>ptmc app!ia_ """ DC'CQ,Joriu .1raII _ k pmt4iuaf lit all)' _ Uulllll/Jli,llfl bel" ... IA. /inl 

II- or btl ... , .... 1IO'I\idI...".1s...", ,...,rXtMt 
§lllJ VsrdulllIa[ Piplg ..... U be ~ u follows: 

Ali,,/....,.. O/St: .... '" 10· iI'\IIf pIpUtt. 

17tt rfJiII' ,1ttIJ1 bf """'" J bIc"-t /torlzoNa/1y of ,''' I. 
S'wi.o.,jOOw ,/tall " wlllilftl abow IINJ "low tGn.t I"'" to provid, for ," taM ",ow.on.", (Slrftt 

dl>oom ,ltall_ k ... ..0-
.. Ibred jluibl. ,u". aMJtn«:r«i of copper or swill/uNr«1 ",bill, aM prorfCled by ,1H1 cowrrd 

,AeotII.d _uial....,. t. ... iPI.JN<Jd at rwIItfjal"U. '11I.j1aibl. "II_Ii ... ,1taJ/ provjde n.jf/dIuIl 

stod /o"n"",,,,,_ .....-fII( 
till,) Mlrkln'l!! LOUtl911' ab&ll be ~ u folio .... : 

Ordi."IIIIClC 2019.01 

 20-0203 L Page 16 of 52



• 

A~ ~ ..... lltall _1OtJaM/ ~""'IM rlHr v.w off ........ OIl'" btdIdUta;" .. ..ulbM -"'" ~ fH~ .... swppUer .li0ii_ 1I....otA.,p'o<d ~., .... """'" "'H 
-.t """"'" 1M mi", _ . nv "" .11 _1iIfII ..... ,..",&n _ ... I"" ''''IIQ "I~ _ .... 
TMt w/tllllJtitHt lIMIt bt: fH-11)o IllllrUd by .. IMUII • 'r¥OO4I -.rllII __ ,u,.. ""III .. 

.oM .... ~ of 1 "',,",u by 2 11Idw. 1"- ""'''' _ ... u.u k of 1IIfIId- • ..,111 10 riI. 

obow fIN .. ..-1_ MplJr twI,bU". .. ,"illj",~", qf UJ/wl lit heWol n.r '_lMrftn ,/tall 

H ptrhtlell,w/low w '-"ed "" oppoIiI' .,.." oflN t-.t. 

Su!!. ' Ill V,dtarqllg LtC TuklllltaUAtitIl'ad (hr,erHlR DI1 be Idded u follow&: 

i ll l .1 hra!" lad PIII' wU ~..sdId If follows: "-ia .ludIk twqtUred. .ttdpJtllV .!toll k 

1IIbtttiIud/ll'.JI"' ...... i 'OWn4 ..... /"'I4lIarbu .. W .... by"" AJU. 

tip.! U,dtrtNlM!ld.l.rC T'M" OnmMt IMlIIM add.:! u follows; ~!.PO-o 

MaliN proItibUed fr-1Hf", MJUJ 10 __ .n ... ,MJJ IN NUll'" by .. LPG ~"Y ....... 

~ 'JI'I'- 1II...nn /1"<IIIU ......... ~"" ,.."w-II _ .. It """ 1'fCrJnJ..J. 

Cb.pterlO 

C!gmt 10. HIPA '3D 4.7 It.,iMItlitJljin.,wJ. qt_huuJlletIl".II_on .... nd ~ 'O/-u, 
MIII,..11 !lUIIu .. ~Pa.l1M Pwp~ ..,.u- duip....s- 0IltvMst ~ by tIw FIn QI60 
O/flNl. buptl •• ; }/t>Jto{tlc"",tI ..... iIosfDU., ... IM. ¥Po,. by tIw c..ljpn!t. Dfpll~ ~ 
HOI4I",wC~f),""';Wirl. 

Sse_to. NfPA, uP-Jj _ SIIm"rd (or tI!c Ipm'!&dge If $pd,Usr Snit., I. OM-ltd J):t 

[,mlly Dwt!l!pu 'pdM ... ",,,,,,,, Hwn" 1m"*,, !O),J,!,}, !OJ,J,$ 

HFPA 13D, "wuded5«th .... r....,,: 

Revll, s.cno. S.U.l c.1"MHI .. r.tIowJ: 

Chlpler 19. NUb pP. s,!.I.l A IIIfIIII1 of _/MIt _ of.ode I)pI MIll -. ..... ~ u.J 

wlliIIII tJM ~ .,1" _(~ CHI tIM?ope1y at all approlltfll«atloft. Strx:.t qtriMhn NIl 

1M Upf III • __ -'..xasiblt ~. 

RevIM ~. 'U l1li RMI u ~IOWI: 

9!p'K II. mA 130' M A 1ooaI_ flow"""" ,1ttU11MJ1fVVi __ CHI lIJ/WlprlIrkW 11#M"" 110 

M.u .., ... .",. • .., 'II 1~(IO!OI!.~oftJo'mlli~ 

Revhe Sectioe 11.1.1.1 .. ,... u rolla",,: 

C"D!U ft. KfPA up. 11.1.1.1 1/ibe:re • fin, dopuUllOAl pump<If OM nloo II 0CIt pto.icIod, 1M 

.,stem IIIbalI IM ~ '1. jce!!)' --' III ..w-~ of/SO ptNIf(b,...-.1d pwpp 100 

0rdinan0tlO151.01 P.~ 13 

 20-0203 L Page 17 of 52



I~D IIr<ur a J(}.minwlfl du,...lio~ ""i,hau, ,,,,d~nc~ of I~ .. SuclIIUI .JuJII 1M wilnufi!d by ,~ fi~ eoth 

official. 

Apptndb II _ Fire Flow Requirelll~ntt for Bulldln,1 

~' "" O. ~ I 

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM fU)w 

CALCULATION SPRINKL[R " ... DURATION 

.. L< SYSTIM FLOW (~O\ItI) 

(Iq . ... rHt) (Dtlill' flail ••• ptr 
S.ud. rd) .. iu •• ) 

0_3,600 ~ -- ,,., , 
1,1m'lld .. 0)'0Iem 

),60lonoI_ .... No 
_. ,- • ...... • .-- ,.~ f.llI. 

810S.I(1) B10l.1(2) • 
W ~~ 
_flow .... 

--. .... $octloo. m .l.l.l .. • 
of 1M CA Fn ,.'" , "...-
31D of .... CA 
Rooi ... dol Codo 

3,601 ..... .,....... Sod:iOll 903.3.1.) III v,lbo • • 
of ... CAFn ,~ , 
Coole ... s.otion 8105.1(2) 
)1).3 <Ill III. CA ,..,. 

'''' R-.....JCodo " .. 
T.blt BI95.2 Regulud fire flow for B"UdJQRI 9!be' Ib,!! Out- ud Two-Ftmily 
Dwcllign. CrollP B-3. lAd R-<I B!!!!d!ggs ud Iowpbollgl lball be amendedu follows: 

AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER 
SYSTEM 

{Dwi. S, ... dard) 

Ordinulce 2019.01 

,n 

II> Tab'" BIOl.l(2)' 

DURATION 

DIIrttiort 10 Tobl. 

B10l.1(2)ot""' ......... ..... 

OR. 

Plie14 

 20-0203 L Page 18 of 52



Appel\dlx D _ Fin ApplUlIlI Autll ROIId, 

S[!Stfon DIOl Mlnhpura Spedflnl!oll 

DIO}.I Am" Ro.d WId!b ... lI b .llydT!g! wI! be amended u follow •• tddiDa!lle exception: 

& U ptiQII: Dri-..oy,r 

DlOl.! Grad. Ihan be: amended u foUowl: Fire apparatUI lCCess roads &rid driveways m..ll not 

exl;COd I H'" 11I6rod. wlIl_ appmwd by 1M AH) or by til. EJ Dt>radQ Cowl!ly IIm.ndfti Ctl/(frntla 

I'\d)IIc Ruource Cod, 1Ttk 14 I lkri6n aM Intpr'l)_.111 SromitlniJ Mtlnwal. 

buptloll: E~VQlio>! Qbow J,(}()() fUI11u>JJ /IQt ~ 11K 

QlOJJ Turp in R.dlu~ shall be: amended .. fullows: 1M minimum !Umiaa rriius shall be 

determined by the fire code officill; <IIffl sltDlIlIC>l includ, curb aNI pltu. 

PIUS FIre ADp"n!us Mcm Road Glt .. wll be amended .. fOllows: Subuc,IQIl (1): WIIuf, 0 

,'''ZI. pl' II provided. die wale wU/t~ JIu>JJ be /101 leu litem 10 f- (6096 "' .. ",,1. 1J7tve" fin 
appllTaIW road ro .... ,m of 0 dlvl<Jed """'-Y, fh. "'''" wid'" S/tQJlIIOl 1M fcs rIIatt I J ftfl (' ''1 

mm). 

DIQJ.U Road,!O !019 rot! In ... Idlb m-ll be _ ended II fol low.: Fin lane lians" specified in 

Seetioo D103.6 than be JX'lIted QII. both aide of fire Ipparatus .cec:ss roada IlIaI ..... 2Q to 19 feet wide 

(6096 to 8534.4 rnm). 

ExupdQII : Elewuio1lS obow J.(}()() jt. <u dn.",,/ItN by dI, AHJ. 

DlOJ.6.2 Road! mort IbID 12 r.st I, Wldlb $hall be &mended u fullows: Fire laDe ~anl II 

$pCclficd in Section 0 103.6 thaI! be: posted OD one side of fire lppantus aceeu ro.ds mono than 19 

fed wide (aS3U mm) aDd 1_ than J6foel wick(10971.8 mm). 

Exuptio,.: EI.wltJo,.. obow J.()()I) fI. 41 d,,,,,,,11t«J by dr. AHJ. 

DlOU ClrmnfKwli.! FIn APRtrtlU A«UJ ROld, dlall be r.dded u follow&: WII.,. rwtIOIINti 

by 1M flI'f cod~ offiCial. a fil'f OPfKU'l'IW acceu road I~oll be COIttlf1lcted 10 '~COWIpOM tIw en/iI'fty 

of a 11I'IIC1I<I'f aM IhaJJ providf 0 conlillllO .... III"",", of ~-'ZDIcy wIIlcI, QCCGJ. 

SECTION 4: CONFLICT 

Tha! OrdiMnc;a No. 2016-37 of !be PlO. and III other ordinanceII OJ puts of ordinancco herewith OR hereby 

repealed. 

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY 

If aD)' Ordinance, utiele, IUbseetiOll OJ subdivision thereof, ptOvision, IIaIto:nca. Wille or phrase oflllis code, or 

an)' application thereof. il for any RISOII held 10 be in ..... lid by • <;Ourt of competent jwisdietion, SIICh decision 

.!hall 001 affect the rem.inina; provisions oftllis code, whicb can be: IPvaI effect without !be inva.!id portions cd, 

therefore, IUCh invalid ponIOlII an: d",,1and to ba S6 ___ ble. The PIO Mnby dee1 ..... IlIat ;t would hi ..... _ted 

Ordin.mce 2019.01 

 20-0203 L Page 19 of 52



• 

tbiI Ordi_ -' edI. of lit 1trticI ............ , ..... 1ioM, ".. I\Ibdiviaonl !bawl, pmv..aon., .eruen~_ 

d...- Of phrucI ineapactl...c or tho! fxt IbII. _ (I' man: of IIlera is de::lared iDvaJid. 

SECTION' 6: EFfIC'IIYI DAtE AND puBLICATION 

n.. Onb....,... ftU .a drill:( d:inJ (lO) dIyI.tt. ill'" '1"!()~ 1bc Pia 80M! Sc:cmary ill dinoc:ud 10 publisb 

tbiI onion· .... ' ill. "A 1114<4 01 • ..-.1 eimlJllioII ill Iba DU:trir:\. In lieu. o{publicaoo.. oldie I\ill_ of_ 

antinolK'A', • .......,. of" ~ .. y be p"bliobed by dx by tbc Boud s~ wlchia !itt.. (I S) do,. 

att..r III puMp _. -ulied OOP)IWU be polled ill tile office oftbe Pia puniMIII110 QI_ , _ c.:w ........ 
J69JJ(q (I) . 

no. obove Ordu.- ..... ia!nld\lc:ed .1.lIIoetU!a ortbe 80eld ofDiredonoflbe PlO .. OcIOba 17,2019. IIIId 

it wu IbI!III re.d for 1M f\nIlime. A public hearint w .... b \be Ord"-"e 10 be rail for tile .-...d am. 011. 

November 21,2019 aDd opprovtd by lIIe rotIowina "'*' 

PASSED ANO ADOPTED by th8 Soan!. oroa-oIlbe pta thIa, \2.. .... day ocNl>.,\c.-\otI..., 2019, 

AYES: 

NOES: 

ABSENT: 

ABSTAIN: 

OrdinancalO19.0] 

 20-0203 L Page 20 of 52



MQT&PIO 

Fire Code # Significant 
What Is the Change? 

Locally adopted / SFM adopted / 
Why Is There a Local Change? 

change? Amended 

101.1 N Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Administrative need 

LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than 

Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate 
air and can easily be trapped under a home, if ignited it can 

105.6.27 y quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving Locally adopted and amended 
lead to an explosion. At elevations above 5000 feet there is 
an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire 

occupancies in Group R·3. 
activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional 
attention. 

Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance 

106.6 N Add section Locally created and adopted 
of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines 
permits, plan checks, and inspections as allowed in Health 
&Safety Code 17951. 

106.6.1 N Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to 
the Fire District. 

106.7 y Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspections by contractors. 

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District 
is added to read as follows: 
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines· The intent of this 
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an 

109.4 y Added section 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals 
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County of EI Dorado's 
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals 
timeline. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 
Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that 

portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 
protects life and property. Fees have been updated to 

110.4 N 
better left to localities to determine the 

Locally adopted and amended match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the 

fees/penalties for their respective areas. 
District Attorney's Office. The change to the language to 
include the term infractions. 

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s), 

11D.4.2 N 
Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before 

Locally created and adopted 
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 

but under a different number) violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health and Safety Code of the State of California and 
Chapter 5c (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 

112.4 N 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. ltis 

Locally adopted and amended 
All violations of the code have been consolidated under 

better left to localities to determine the Section 110.4 to include the penalties for violations. 
fess/penalties for their respective areas. 

Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District, 

202 N Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopted 
Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd 
Manager. Definition of campfire shall not include LPG or 
Propane fueled appliances. 

302.1 N Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for darity 

307.4.4 through 
Due to the high fire danger that exists in EI Dorado County 

307.4.4.2 (d) 
Y Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopted we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires 

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas. 

 20-0203 L Page 21 of 52



Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical 
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for 
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus 
components. It also allows an extended time frame before 

Changed vertical clearances to 15 feet and road 
having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional 

503.2.1 N 
widths to 20 feet. 

Locally adopted and amended height for vegetation clearances acts as an increased buffer 
for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of 
shoulders, as measured face of curb to face of curb is 
needed. These structures can be difficult to navigate with 
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the total 
drivable road surface 

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the Fire apparatus require areas for turning around when 

Fire Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations to 
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This 

503.2.5 N 
match as they require turnarounds for fire apparatus Locally adopted and amended includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides 

access roads and driveways. 
belter access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum 
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated 
Surfaces of EI Dorado County and Appendix D of the 
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be 503.2.6 N Surfaces to state and match EI Dorado County Locally adopted and amended 
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an 

Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17. 
alternate means & methods that is not less restrictive than 
the Fire Code. 

503.4.2 N Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes Locally created and adopted 
This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes" 
rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle Code. 

Added section regarding no parking in front of This section clearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire 
503.4.3 N 

hydrants 
Locally created and adopted hydrants' rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle 

Code. 

Added section regarding fire lanes based on road This section clearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D 
503.4.4 N 

width 
Locally created and adopted as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire 

lanes. 

Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on 

503.5.3 N emergency access and consistency through all 
Locally created and adopted 

roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing 
roadway gates in EI Dorado County, referring to the the best possible emergency access to maintain fast 
gate standards adopted by the FPO's. response times. 

505.1 N 
Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of 

Locally adopted and amended 
Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing 

buildings based on the District's addressing standards. 

Added more conservative standard for the 
Commercial properties are required to install hydrants at 

507.5.1 N placement of hydrant and their relationship to Locally adopted and amended 
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150 

commercial buildings feet frorn any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in 
between). 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2 N in new buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

greater within the district. to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.a N 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 

Locally created and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

structure, whichever is less. to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

 20-0203 L Page 22 of 52



Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds occupant protection for existing buildings less of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.b N Locally created and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 

to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
structure, whichever is less. 

feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

903.2.1, 903.2.3, 
These sections were created to give specific increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.4, 903.2.7 
N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Manufactured Homes - The intent of this code section is to 
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two 
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar 

This section was created to include manufactured nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban 

903.2.8.2 y residential single family R-3 in the residential Locally created and adopted 
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption 

sprinkler program due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The 
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a 
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk 
successfully in many Califomia communities. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

These sections were created to give specific increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2.9, 903.2.10 N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Added occupant protection for fire alarms in 
buildings with a floor area less than 3,600, except 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
R3, AG buildings not used for commercial 907.2.a N 
purposes, and buildings with a floor area of less Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code the event of a fire or smoke. 

official. 

Added occupant protection for existing buildings 
Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

without automatic sprinkler systems to install a fire 907.2.b N 
alarm if they add more than 30% or 1,000 square 

Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

feet to the structure, whichever is less. 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

Added occupant protection by stating all fire alarm 
detection systems installed shall be connected to a Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.c N monitoring service that notifies the fire department Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
upon activation and is installed per Section 907 of the event of a fire or smoke. 
the fire code. 

Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
907.2.d N systems to be connected to a monitored fire alarm Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

system when installed or replaced. the event of a fire or smoke. 

907.6.2.1 y Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply 
Locally created and adopted Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E 

Modification safety related power outages. 

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to 
1203.1.3 N Shunt trip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up 

power supplies 

3310.3 N Address requirements for construction sites Locally created and adopted Addressing for construction sites is important to assist 
responding emergency crews. 

 20-0203 L Page 23 of 52



3312.1 N 
Water supplies at construction sites with 

Locally adopted and amended 
Water must be on site prior to combustible material being 

combustible materials on-site stored or vertical construction commencing. 

EI Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout 

4903.1 
This section was created to include Fire Protection y Locally created and adopted 

the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire 
Plan for all fire hazard severity zones. Protection Plan due to climatic, geological, and 

topographical conditions. 

This section clarifies that within the boundaries of EI Dorado 

4905.4 y Added a section to clarify roof construction 
County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are 

requirements 
Locally created and adopted wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 

covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be 
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly. 

5001.7 
Any damages or costs from negligent practices that 

Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate. 

y cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally created and adopted 
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 

cost recovery fee. 
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the 
negligent parties. 

Added safety protection with permits being issued 
Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and 

5601.2 N 
by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for 

Locally adopted and amended 
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of 

fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding 

Supervisors for fireworks. 
of the applications they will be used for. 

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any 

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make 
documentation including timing and proprietary information 

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 N available all requested documentation pertaining to Locally created and adopted 
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they 

the firework presentation 
deem necessary. This information is understood to be 
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as 
such. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5704.2.9.6.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5706.2.4.4 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid special 
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval 
and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County. 

Administrative need to add District name. Established limits 

5806.2 N 
Administrative addition of District name. 

as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable 

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code 
Locally adopted and amended Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ 

approval and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the 
County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code Official for 

5806.2.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted and amended locally 
Flammable Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. 
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

Establishes distances between LPG storage and 
dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential 

6104.2 N 
Established limits for LPG storage and dispensing 

Locally adopted and amended 
developments and high-<lensity hotels, mOlel, apartments, 

near or adjacent to residential development 
etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would 
have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death. 
Requires AHJ approval and a SpecialfConditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

 20-0203 L Page 24 of 52



Establishes propane regulator requirement for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. Including requirements for two-
stage regulator use and location of first and second stage 

Establishes propane regulator requirements for regulators. Additional requirements are outlined for 
6112.1 N 

locations above 5000 foot elevation Locally created and adopted protective covers, riser pipe installation requirements, 
building permit submittal and review, tank center..fine 
marking, and grade requirements. These requirements are 
based on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feel. 

Establishes vertical propane rise requirements for locations 
above 5000 fool elevation. Pipe schedule location, swing 

6112.2 N 
Establishes propane vertical riser pipe requirements 

Locally created and adopted 
joint requirements, and the use of flexible riser piping as 

above 5000 foot elevation well as swing joints. These requirements are based on 
significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather 
conditions encountered above 5000 feel. 

Establishes marking and location requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. This section addresses signage 

6112.3 N 
Establishes propane marking and location 

Locally created and adopted 
location, emergency contact information, and snow related 

requirements above 5000 foot elevation tank marking requirements. These requirements are based 
on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet. 

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground 
tanks: 

6113.1 N 
Permits and plans shall be submitted and approved 

Locally created and adopted 
Allows us to require plans be submitted for review prior to 

by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction). installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks 
require substantial maintenance including inspection and 
anode replacement at regular intervals. 

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without 

6113.2 N 
Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the 

Locally created and adopted detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when 
property of the LPG company sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground 

tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected. 

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on-
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow 
alarm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in the 

NFPA 13D-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the event of water activation in a vacant structure, and 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 

Y 
District has been amended to update various 

SFM Adopted and amended locally 
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 13D 

13D-16 provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water 
systems in one-and two-family dwellings damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements 

were also added to ensure water circulation through the 
system, reducing stagnant water and backflow concems 
(EID encourages this type of system). 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system 13D-16 Section Y SFM adopted and amended locally 

5.1.1.2 
system minimizing damage must be available on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
An audible alarm system is added to notify occupants and 

13D-16 Section 7.6 
y Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation SFM adopted and amended locally in the activation of the system when the building is not 

occupied allow for detection minimizing damage. 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and 

13D-16 Section Y System test to a pressure of 150 p.s.i. SFM adopted and amended locally 
11.2.1.1 failures and assures proper gluing of system components. 

Appendix B: Table Changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 

Bl05.1(1) 
N elevation, to match fire flow precedents used in Locally adopted and amended to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 

EDC for years used for over a decade in EDC. 

Appendix B: Table 
Established a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM, Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 

B105.2 
N below 5000 foot elevation, for all commercial Locally adopted and amended to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 

projects used for over a decade in EDC. 

 20-0203 L Page 25 of 52



Appendix 0: 0103.1 N Made an exception for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended 
It is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to 
construct a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant 

Title 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways. 
Appendix 0: 0103.2 N State law requires no greater than 16% grade Locally adopted and amended In our EI Dorado County Title 14 adoption we allow greater 

than 16% grade with AHJ approval and hard surface. 

Appendix 0: 0103.3 N Text to include curbs and gutters Locally adopted and amended 
20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutters due 
to potential access issues and turning radius concerns. 

Appendix 0: 0103.5 § 
Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided 

N Fire apparatus access road gates Locally adapted and amended roadway the gate width shall not be less than 15 feet due to 
1 

radius issues. 

No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.1 N Roads widths 20 to 29 feet Locally adopted and amended 
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does 
not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire 
Code Appendix 0 section 103.6.1 for all other elevations. 

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet 

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36 
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.2 N 
feet in width 

Locally adopted and amended elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The 
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix 0 
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations. 

Appendix 0: 0104.2 
Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

N building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 
Exception 

have only one approved fire apparatus access road. residents and first responders. 

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 

Appendix 0: 0104.4 N 
Added to require circumferential fire apparatus 

Locally created and adopted 
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire 

access roads structure and shall provide a continuous means of 
emergency vehicle access. 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 
For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Exception 
N Removed Exception in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

residents and first responders. 

Appendix 0: 0107.1 
For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Exception 
N Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

residents and first responders. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.2 through 101.5 N 

Adapted to establish scope, intent, severability and 
Locally adopted Administrative clarity 

validity 

102.6 through 102.8 N References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

102.10 through 102.12 N 
Conflicting provisions, Other Laws, Application of 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
references 

103.1 through 104.1 N 
Definition of the Fire Prevention Division and ability 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
to enforce the code 

104.3 through 104.4 N Right of Entry, Warrants, and Identification Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.6 through 104.6.4 N Record retention Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.8 through 104.9.2 N 
Modifications, alternate means and methods, and 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
test 

104.11 through 
N 

Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of 
Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.11.2 systems 

104.11.3 N Authority of systems and devices inoperable Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
105.2.3 N Time limitation of application Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.3.1 through 
N Operational permits Locally Adapted Administrative clarity 

105.3.2 

105.6.12 N 
Dry cleaning operational permits required for 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
hazardous cleaning solvent use 

 20-0203 L Page 26 of 52



Permits for various business operations for. Magnesium, 

105.6.2.28 through Adopted this section for administrative clarity and miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation 

105.6.35 N 
fire and life safety inspections 

Locally Adopted vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing facilities, open buming, 
open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and 
organic coatings 

105.6.37 N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Locally Adopted Permits for places of assembly 

fire and life safety inspections 

105.6.39 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

locally Adopted Permits for private fire hydrants fire and life safety inspections 

Permits for pyroxylin plastics, refrigeration equipment, repair 
105.6.41 through 

N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
locally Adopted garages and motor fuel-dispensing facilities, rooftop 

105.6.46 fire and life safety inspections heliports, spraying or dipping, storage of scrap tires and tire 
by-products 

105.6.48 N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
locally Adopted Permit for tire-rebuilding plants fire and life safety inspections 

105.6.50 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
Permit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material, 

fire and life safety inspections lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 cubic feet) 

106.1 through 106.3 N Adoptedthis section for administrative clarity and 
locally Adopted Fee schedules for permits fire and life safety inspections 

107.1 N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
locally Adopted Inspection authority fire and life safety inspections 

Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and equipment, re~nspection and testing, recordkeeping, 
108.1 through 109.3 N 

fire and life safety inspections locally Adopted supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding, 
Board of Appeals established, limitations on authority, and 
qualifications 

110.3.2 through 
N 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Locally Adopted 

Compliance with orders and notices, prosecution of 
110.3.4 fire and life safety inspections violations, and unauthorized tampering 

110.4.1 N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Locally Adopted Abatement of violation 

fire and life safety inspections 

113.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Authority to disconnect service utilities 
fire and life safety inspections 

Asphalt kettles contain highly flammable substances and 
303.1 through 303.9 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical) 

Managing ignition sources through responsible application 
305.1 through 305.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted of standards will reduce the number of fires in various 

settings (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY 
306.1 through 306.2 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted flammable and require special handling (Climatic, 

geological, and topographical) 

307.1 through 307.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
Open buming, recreational fire, and portable outdoor 
fireplaces, (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

30S.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Open flame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

30S.1.2 through 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 

Throwing or placing of ignition sources, torches for 
308.1.3 removing paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

locations near combustible, open flame devices, signals 
and markers, portable fuel open-flame devices, sky-

308.1.5 through 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 

lanterns, religious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming 
308.1.S.5 food and beverage preparation, dispensing, containers not 

in use, serving of flaming food, location, fire protection 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.2 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
Permits are required for above section (Climatic, geological, 
and topographical) 

 20-0203 L Page 27 of 52



Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices, 
308.3 through 308.4.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted theatrical performances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 

dormitories (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

310.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to smoking (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

310.3 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
"No Smoking" signs (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with "No Smoking" 
31Q.4 through 310.8 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted signs, ash trays, buming objects, hazardous environmental 

conditions. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Vacant premises condition and safety requirements, 
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant 

311.1 through 311.4 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted premises, security, fire protection, fire separation, removal 
of combustibles, removal of hazardous materials. (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

319.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to mobile food preparation 
vehicles. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

319.2 N 
Adopted this section for administrative darity and 

Locally Adopted 
Permits for mobile food preparation vehides (Climatic, 

fire and life safety inspections geological, and topographical) 

Exhaust hood, fire protection, fire protection for cooking 
equipment, fire extinguisher, appliance connection to fuel 
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, metallic 
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking oil 
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting, 
normal vents, emergency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum 

319.3 through 
aggregate volume, protection of container, LP-gas container 

319.10.3 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted construction, protection of system piping, LP-gas alarms, 

CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel, 
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG 
container construction, CNG containers supplying 
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping, 
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire 
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems. 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

403.8.1 through 
Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1 

403.8.1.7 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted (residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and 

fire safety plans. 

403.10 through 
Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancy 

403.10.1.3 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic, 

geological, and topographical) 

405.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

510.3 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems 

fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a 
807.5.2 through 

N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in 

807.5.2.3 fire and life safety inspections educational facilities (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5 

903.2.1.5 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers) 

fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000 
square feet. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

 20-0203 L Page 28 of 52



Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders 
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from 
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time 

Adopted this section in existing buildings for the 
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by 1103.2 Y safety of firefighters and other emergency Locally Adopted 
the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind 

responders. 
this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury 
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0101.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads 
through 0102.1 firefighters, and other emergency responders. induding loads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Oead end fire apparatus access road requirements for a 

Appendix 0: 0103.4 N Locally Adopted tum around at 150 feet. (Climatic, geological, and 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. 

topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0103.6 N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
'No Parking, Fire Lane" signs requirements. (Climatic, 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0104.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus through 0104.3 N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. 

Locally Adopted 
access roads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) (excluding exception) 

Appendix 0: 0105.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

Requirements for aerial fire apparatus access roads 
through 0105.4 firefighters, and other emergency responders. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential 

through 0106.3 N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. 

Locally Adopted 
developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical) (exduding exceptions) 

Appendix 0: 0107.1 One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire (exduding exceptions) N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. 

Locally Adopted 
apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and through 0107.2 
dimatic conditions. 

Appendix 0: 0106 N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle. 

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

 20-0203 L Page 29 of 52



D«ember 26. 2019 

PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
FIRE. RESCUE. EMS 

P,O 13u,,; 128 
1061 Mt Aukum Road 

SOIOc-r,c-I , California 95684 
Phont (5301620 4444 . FlU! (5 JOj 620 4317 

ww",·. pionc-erfire.org 

Pi~r Ii~ Protection District I- and 2" readina postin" rOl" Ordinance No. 2019.01 

.... , ... C"OOO 
~..., __ v"" ~ 
o..w,-.~ 

~.--­l _ s.....,... _ o...no. 

Altadlrd In: ~ pentin., fOl" Lhe ftnt and second publ..: .. otiu fOf Oniinancf No 2019.01 
The I- rndilll wa.sloc.ated in the October Slflo Pio:"lter Fin: PI'I)I«IIOO DtJlrkt Board Meet!n, 
Almda. Postinp .... ~re located on the PiOll«r FI" Prol(oCtlon DIJukt Front door, Somel"Jl:t POlt 
Off,". Oriuly Flat Post Office and on the Pion«rflR.ora: webs;", on 101612019 ThI: r' 
read,", .... -u located in the Novo:mbcr 1:zI' Pioneer Fire Proe«tion OUtriet Board Meetinl 
A.a;mda. POSIinp wen: i~alcd on the P_r FIR Protection District Front door. Somcnct 
Post Offic:c, Qrizz.ly Fl.. rOSI Office. and on the P,OO«T'fire .ora: wfbsite on 1 111120 19. 

 20-0203 L Page 30 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
SOard of Oire«OrJ SOInI MHtlnl 

(ktuber t , 20111 11 , p.m. ...... _._000Ir ....... _-_~ . 
... lIrI .. IIId ·_s.a...., . ...,.....,. .~ 

Iofiubt SfCII_ 
r. ",- • 'hi t III _ .., ..... '.'" __ ., _,." /frt ..... !«dIw!. w ..... '" __ 
_ ........... dIIrfftf _ pIO{Itftr -" MIMI 1M Ih ~ /0 -. .. ...- "" ........ !flo 

... ~ .... ". W/Iftfnf.wl property __ GI ....... ~f/tI ""ON I)9tf .-.,14 

MHtlIlII ~tIolI: PFPC Admlnw.tnolkln otnce.- 8011rdr_ 
7010 Mount ...... Iwm ROJd, a-Ht, CA ~U 

AGENpA 

t. CALL TO ORDER (C~ ".,mgf.1eI wiN IN atlendMI the mHtlr18 telephonically from 5075 
City, Grtzzty I'lm CA.) 
1.1 RDlCd 
1.2 ~01~ 

2. DETERMINATlON 01' QUORUM AND CONFIRMATION Of AGENDA 
2.1 AdapIIon 01 AQenc\II 

3. SPECIAL ANNOUNCEMENT I PRESENTATlONS I O! NERAL I!IUSINESI 
3.1 11ME SENSITIVE NATTeR 
20111 1h eo. Ado9tIon - PUblic: HMttno - oncw. ... ~. pubic ~_.iQ pr\Df to the tnt 
~ 01 Oodli.1Oe 2011Un (CII~ HMlllII'ICI Uti)' Code; $tt;IIorll3ee8.T} 

4. puauc COMMENT 
Any pInOIIlM)' IIddI-. ... DI.crtd eo.rd on «TY ~ perUolnlng 10 Clttrtd buill .It, which .. not 
Itt.d on the 1IQWId& ,.,. oomment .. PfO"Id«I by the ~iI:Ih M. Brown Optn ~1 .. 1L"" Ad (Go'.ii.IiM c:oo., ~ tl..,q) n m.y IN Imittd to tv.. (3) "*MH far .rTf penon.cklr 7 'If" 8oW'd. 

IS. CONSENT CAlENDAR 
ConHnI n' !dar""" IN COMid-.d IOI.AInt; n _ .-d UfIOI'I ~ the Board IMI\ • IIingIoI M:!Ion. 
MII"bell "' ... audItnoI ~ 10 pI'O'I'Ide pubic. ~ mey Nqu.!. 1'IIt .. Boen:I ,. ic .. 1hIo flam 
/rom ... eon..r.. c.JInOar. eomm.n. nybe ~ Ii:) ..... (3) minutea. 
1.1 MInnM IIrotn eo.'CI MMtinQ.A*'l8. 20111 
8.2 ........... trom ec.d MMIi'Ig AugutI21 , 2Cl11 
U "...",.. tom brO MMIIng Sapw",ber 10 2010 
U ........ o.lIt~oI.-~-"-

.. MONTHL Y/STAHDINO ACTMTY REPORTS: 
1.1 ~,Repon 
1.2 Loc* 114688 
1.3 fl"lFA 
U FbncIIoI 

T. OlD BUSINESS C1bt eo.dllllll' IIIIIct " ,..." ....... _ -. ... _ ....... aIII .. 1 _ . no. IoenI a.....,. 
NqIOIIIt I ... 0lIl_ ......... ) 
7.1 es-n s-d PoeIIIotI (800 ..... ) 
7.2 DInkt m-lIgtitlon 001 ·201'o.u- (1/ eor-m, ""tlld 10 201S 1nc:IdMt)(CNtf) 
7,J PILT FuncIrl; - PoMlbM rn*- 8IId Ofdle1rlbullon oIlul'ld. ~ "'" El DorIdo ~ AudIta 

, 

 20-0203 L Page 31 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
Board of Directors Board Meeting 

7.4 Payroll Services (Chief) 
7.5 PFPD Vegetation Management (Ad-hoe updates) Ordinance (Director Jumper/Chief) 
7.6 Pioneer Fire Protection District Building/ Facility Use Agreement (Chief) 
7.7 Auto Aid Agreement; between Amador County Fire Protection District & Pioneer Fire Protection 

District. (Chief) 
7.8 MOU Per-Diem Position with Amador Fire Protection District and Pioneer Fire Protection District 

(Chief) 
7.9 "Accept Pioneer Union International Association of Firefighters, Local 4586 demand to continue 

bargaining successor MOU." (BOD Flits) 
8. NEW BUSINESS (The Boerd may review, dlscu •• , take action or vote on ony new business. The Board Chair may 

request a roll call vote on Items) 
8.1 HR policy review and updates (Chief) 
8.2 Ordinance 2019-01 Adopting the 2019 Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the 

2018 Edition of the International Fire Code, regulation governing the safeguarding of life and 
property from fire and explosions hazards arising from the storage, hendling and use of 
hazardous substances, material and davices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property 
in the occupancy of buildings and premises In Pioneer Fire Protection District (PFPD), providing 
for the Issuance of permits and collection fees therefore: Repealing and previous PFPD 
ordinances. To include all Information and preceding to be discussed for Ordinance adoptlon. 
(Chief) 

8.3 Resolution 2019-006 - Findings of Fact - Dlscusslon/lnformation/Action - Resolution setting 
forth findings with respect to local conditions which make certain modification and changes to 
the California Fire Code necessary for preserving fire and Iifa safety In the Pioneer Fire 
Protection District - (Chief) 

8.4 Fire Code - Ordinance 2019.01 - First Reading of the 2019 Fire Code Amendments -
Discu8sionllnformatlon - Staff to present the 2019 Fire Code Ordinance to the Board. (Health 
and Safety Codes: 13869.7,17958.7 and 18941 .5) (Chief) 

9. CORRESPONDENCE FOR POSStBLE BOARD ACTIONS ANDIOR REVIEW 
8.1 Thank You letter from Amador Fire Protection District for Pioneer fire Protection's support with 

vegetation and debris clean up In River Pines (Vierra) 
10. GOOD OF THE ORDER 
11, UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS: 
12, CLOSED SESSION 

Wood, Claim Update (closed s8sslon with attorney) 
12.1 Anticipated Litigation Case # PC20190038 Katherine Wood VS Pioneer Fire Protection District 

(Significant exposure to IIUgation pursuant to Gov'l. Code Section § 54956.9(d)(2) or (3). Update 
from attorney via conference call. (BOD) 

12.2 Possible exposure to litigation (1 matter) pursuant to Government Code Section § 54956.9(d) 
(2). Facts and circumstances that might result In litigation need not be disclosed. Conference 
call from attomey regarding potentiel appeals . (BOD) 

12.3 Labor negotiation (MOU) Pursuant to Government Code Section § 54957.6, conference updates 
and Information between District negotiators and Local #4586 (BOD) 

13. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION 
14, REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (If applicable) 
15. AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH 

2 
PFPD Board Meeting, October B, 2019 

 20-0203 L Page 32 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
Board of Dlrecton Baird M eetlnll 

15. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEEnNG SCHEDULED fOR. T..a., 
Nov.mWr 1Z, 2018 >It II p.m. 

1'- FIe ' , c.: I 0I0tfd /"DIII*fI;t'). 1'1 co,pi)tIQ .... 1M ~ .." Db.' FE I Ad r~" -.to 
__ • ~ ffI«/IfI : ,", ... _10 -.. IIiIMd_PA,' ~ .... .. Dlln<tbNn1.....ung..",. 11>. 
", ' 'll>, """'N_"'IIy~ (J,XIJ /Il2-U« "" _ .... ntro.nl'l __ oIlM~1MMIng 6_ It! 
"""i 7 __ Gowi,",_ eo. s- ~7.5, ,.",..u""'" ~ _ ... ~ lei. fN/I:!tty or., (J/ "'" 

ao..r .. _ad, ~"..,..o.......wll ~.wount ........... Rt»I1, ~ c./IIbmI& .. -.. ryou ~ ... _ "'_..ad IMlfId Ji:I .., .e.m 0/1 fIN ~. ,.,. CII:HUd 1M DIIIMt AdmW __ III. /S3OJ IUO­
+Ut. $1_" ..... ",*-d_ .. IIfIII,..... AlBo«d~_, __ . '*'-_ r""""YfIwugh 1'III.ndty 
hm ICI/pm. 

~ poDd .. ". CMIri;t', Adi,.iIICr_ 1iI-.g, Po« 0dIc>N 1'1 S-w(, WounI ""/un, Gfz$' RIIr Md 1M 
PbnHr FIte Ae .. :tb. D/lJfrlftO _ Iff D'I' F!/Mee:t! qp. 

...... 
TI ....... 1":"'" 

~ 1 d !1MMn019 .... ~s.. .... IoId-..lOaIoDd ..... ' ,hnoic_--.D<IIhlII .. tho....,.s..bu~ .. 
...... tddillclbol ..... 100 ,,' ' .. oIafll- .... eaIpIII ......... _ . 

, 

 20-0203 L Page 33 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
Boatd at Directors Boorord MMtlI'II 

1 .. AO.IOURNMeMT TO THE NEXT REGUlAR BOARD M~O SCHEDULED 'OR TIN".W 
Ho¥wnbw12, 201 . ... ....... 

... _ ... Ihe __ e: 'P' All 

;,::~'~':':.~.' ;"=':"'~:':':'::::';1':_~"""'- ao ""', ...... AIauII ~ CJIIzz$I ___ l1li 

n.~=~9~.~~~~::::: A ' 'IM6IlOl .... DioMw......,.,w ........ -.. ...... ' , dw.DOI!Iiot"' ............. ................... wm"" , ' ...... pIrI.-_IO.cIpoaI.. t 

• 

 20-0203 L Page 34 of 52



.-
PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

Board of Directors Board Meeting 

16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday 
November 12,2019 at 6 p.m. 

inistrative Assistant! Plmended by Mark Matthews, Fire Chief 

The Pioneer Fire Prote tion Dlstnet ("DIS/ricr), In complying with the Americans with DlsabNlties Act ("ADA"), requests 
individuals who requir& speciel accommodations to access, attend and/or participate In District board meetings due to a 
disability, may be requested by caNing (530) 622-4444 no later tl1M 72 hourn In advance of the scheduled meeting time. In 
compliance with Govemmant Code Section 54957.5, non·exempt writings that are distributed to a majority or all of the 
80ard In advance of a meeting, mey be viewed et 7061 Mounl Aukum Road, Somerset, California. In addillon, If you would 
like a copy of any racord related 10 an Item on the agenda, please contact the District Admlnlstraw .. Assistant at (530) 620· 
4444. Station 38 has disabled access and facnltles. All 80erd meeting are /Bcorded. Office hours Tuesday through Thurnd8y 
9amto 1pm. 

Agenda posted at the District's Administration 8ulldlng, Post Officas In Somarset, Mount Aukum, Grizzly Flets and the 
Pione Protection Districts website at www:p/onaert/cB ora. 

Location 

Time Posted: 8'2tlS/m 
Amended 10/0612019 due to Director Stranllfcld needing to attend via telephonic communications, nothing to the agenda has change 
except the addition that .be will bo attendillg via phone due to exig.at circumstanc ••. 

3 
PFPD Board Meeting, October 8, 2019 

 20-0203 L Page 35 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
Board of Directors Board Meeting 

16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday 
November 12, 2019 at 6 p.m. 

Prepared by: 
Ass 

Administrative Assistant! Amended by Mark Matthews. Fire Chief 

. 6 Profection District ("District,,) , in complying with the Americans with Disabilities Act ("ADA j , requests 
individuals who require special accommodations to access, attend and/or participate /n District board meetings due to a 
disability. may be requested by calling (530) 622-4444 no leter than 72 hours in advance of the scheduled meeting time. In 
compliance with Government Code Section 54957.5, non-exempt writings that are distributed to a majority or all of the 
Board In advance of a meeting, may be viewed at 7061 Mount Aukum Road. Somerset, California. In addition, if you would 
like a copy of any record related to an item on the agenda, please contact the District Administrative Ass/stant at (530) 620-
4444. Station 38 has disabled access end facll/tles. All Boerd meeting are recorded. Office hours Tuesday through Thursday 
9am to lpm. 

Agenda posted at the District's Administration Building, Post Offices in Somerset. Mount Aukum, Grizzly Flets and the 
Pioneer Fire Protection Districts website at www,p/oneerftre,org. 

,,'iitJ l~QbkA-
Date Posted: 1 0 / (.2 / f}..D I 'j 

j f 

Location 

Time Posted: __ ·1..!.-.'-'I"'DT D<..<)-''V'-''-=-___ _ 
I 

Amended 10/0612019 due to Director Strangfeld needin, to attend via telephonic communications, nothing to the agenda has change 
except the addition that she wilt be attending via phone due to exigent circumstances. 

3 
PFPD Board Meeting, October 8, 2019 

 20-0203 L Page 36 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
BCNlrd of Dlrecton 80lIrd MHUnl 

NCIYefI\ber U, 20U It 6 p.m . 
........ Aas ·_a..,...,._·Yk:lChW, 

/ItI'y ~.1oHr1j Secmorr, 1\oIIchNI ..... . CIIrIcf<M 

M llfiIM $tO!flllfft! 

"j :t. 

TiI"....~_cnc _"',""ofCll!ll~ ... ,oII)f/fr,<Wt~~_.rtII_ 
"""'" "" IIlf ...... _ ~.-.., _ ., RrI DIInI1<C. .. "'* tit """"'" or __ Il1o tu '" ......... ,."., _ "..,.,ny-..-•• taOf fI/ f/fr ... 1idtIt 4'Pft "' __ 

MHtlng 100011I0I'l; PFPO Admlnlalnotlon ~ &o.rd_ 
7060 Mount Aukum Rotod, 9--. CA..5&84 

AGENDA 

1, CALL TO ORDER 
1.1 RoI011 
1.2. ~ of Ah;'-

2. I)I!!TERMINAnON Of QUORUM AND CONFIRMAnON OF AGENDA 
2.1 Adoption of ,tqIndIo 

1. SPECIAL ANNOUNCEMENT I PREBEHTAnONS I GENERAl. BUSINESS 
3.1 RltCOgnltlon • Ho.- of tn.1oI1_1~; ~ Strwlgfeld 

... I"UI!IL1C COMMENT 
At'If peraon m.y addr_ ItM 0ktrIcI so.rc! on In)' IWbIeeI ~1iI1O 0It1r\cl buIInn-, ..nIch I, not 
IIII8d on !he -c;lenOa. Tl'III COi.i*l'll1l j)!0i01ded ~ 1M RaoIp/I M. Btovon Open Mw~i\1 Ad.(GoIoOli.i ...... 
CocM t 54QI5() II. Mqln """y be ....... to IhrH (3)lI'bAMfor.ny pmon.odi ling "" eo.tI:I . 

II. CONSENTCAlENPAR 
eo",.,1 ~, I..., • • r-. eonelcllred rouIl,... IIld .. IIC:e.d upon by ItM BoIfd with I lingle IdJon. 
MlmbM rl lhlltlIdIIru WIlIng to prcMde ~ nput iTIIY requIIl hi 1M BoIrd .- !he Item 
from "" CanMnI CIIend.-. CcmrnerltIi I'I'IIY bllmled to IhrII (3) m~. 
~ . I MIrIuteI from BoIrd MII~i\I ();mber II, 201& 
5.2 Mlnul. frQ!!l Speclel BoenI Milling Odober2ll, :rolll 
5.2 ~: ~1tII of bIIJ-~.twn 

e. MOMTltLYISTAH01NG ACTMTY REPORTS: 
11.1 ~1I'IIIChlel'l Report 
8.2 LOClII I4586 
11.3 PlJFA 
IU FNncW 

7. OLOSUSINESS (T1ooec-l....,_D ...... , ............ III'_OfI..., ""' .. t i The lb.H:t ....... 
NqIItIII . l1li ... _ "" __ 1 
7.1 Pil T Funding· Ponlbll mitun nI or dII.-IbutIon of funt:II by !hi EI Oorildo Coynty AuOiIor 

1-
7.2 P.,a Set'o'IoM (OWl) 
7.3 PFPO Vegl\lllDn Man.gernenI (Ad-floo updtIlM) Ordtnl nce (OirwolOr Jl,nlplr/CNef) 
7.4 PIontlr Fir-. PfoIecIIon Oi~ ~d~ Fidlity UN AgrIemenI (ChIt!) 
7.5 Auto AId ~It; bet.'Mn A.mIdor County FA P,,*,cllon DiftrId , PIo:IM ... Fn ProtIctIon 

""""-1-
, 

 20-0203 L Page 37 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRI CT 
Soard of o rrecton Soard Meetrnl 

7.8 MOO Per-Olem Pa.rtlon w!th lImedor FIre Protection 0istrX:!: and PIoooeer FA Protec:IIon 0iMrid: 
(e"",, 

7.7(1) Fire Co6e . QrdI".,oe 2019.01 - Second Reedlng d 1M 2018 fh; COde Nnendmenl. - CI"eI 
to pr_nt tt. 20111 FIre Code Ordln.-.ca to 1M 801lt"d. (Health and SIfeIy CodM: 138611.7. 
17~.7 Ind 18a.41 . .5) (Ct-Mf) 

1.7(b) Or~lnClO 201!J.01 AdopIIng !he 20111 Edition d a-.. C.ifomil FIre ~, inootpotll:loG the 
2018 edition d the InIIm8IiDnII FIr1I Code. To h:tId ... Information .-d preceding 110 t.. 
drlCllMed tor Ordnanc.lOI"loptlon. (ChIef) 

7.S Update on open bolrd ~: (VIOl,,"",) 
S. HEW BUSINESS (TM _ "'"I' _ . -. _.c:ton ot _ on...,. _ .. , ,<, ,It TIIIt _ Chili...., 

~.I'011" ..... on ..... ). 
8.1 PlIy r.te r.YIew and poterltlal ed~ \0 thto OES depIoym«l\ rate /of voIunteef. 

Ilndreeervet. 
I. CORRESPONDENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTlONS AHDIOR REVIEW 
10. GOOD OF THE ORDER 
11. UPCOMING CM.ENDAR OF EVENTS: 
U . CLOSED SESSION 

12.1 l..-bor ~otilllon (MOl/) P'UrtUlI"II to GoY.' i" iIIII Code s.ctIon f 54e67.8, o:anr.ren... updaIM 
.nd Wormatlon ~ DIIIrIcI ~tor. ..-..dl.otel f.45&e (~h!ef) 

12.2 COnt ... woo. .1th Real PI"O!*tY ~ (f 5411.5e.S) Propetty located III 4&47 Scbironi Rd 
QrtWt Flatt CA IiI(I(I84 (EIOOI'C1IieI). 

13. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION 
14. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (If IpplleebleJ 
18. AQI!NDA ITEMS ~OR. NEXT MONTli 
11. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR TUIed,,. 

December 10, 2011 at S pm. 

, 

 20-0203 L Page 38 of 52



• 

• 

PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
BOlrd at DlrectoD Board Meellna 

1.t! MOU Per-ot.m PoIIIIon IIr1Ih Amedor fire Protadlon DI&I1IcI WId Pb _ FA Pror.dlon 0iItrieI ,-
].7(.) Fn ~. OrdIr.I'ICCI 201U1 • 5<Ioand ~ oIlhe 2019 fire Code Arnenclmentl - ChIef 

10 po ... !"It \tit 2019 Arlo Cod. 011;111 ... 100 III the Board. (HM/Ih WId s.1e!y COde.: 13889.7, 
1 nM. 7 Ilrw:I 1iSt4I.e) (ChItI) 

7.1(b) ~ 201Ikll AdopIIr'Ig \he 2019 EdItIon d me CroWoml!l ' 1,. Code, ~Ung the 
201& Edition ci the IntemlltioNll Fn COde. To Indude , I r.formlllon aM preoedi1g to be 
dI"',,'ed lot 0n:IhM0e «Iuptb •. (ChIef) 

7.8 Updtte on 0I*l boerd ~ (V'-rn) 
L HEW BUSINESS (Tho I\oIwd f'IIO)' ........ _ ... -. or _ an lIlY '-~. The lion CII*,..., 

................ _011-..). 
8.1 PI)' .. " /WNw and PO*~ 1Idj""\JmI~ to the OES depioymowll I'll" lor \OIunteera 

end r1IHIfWl. 
II. CORREspONDENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS AND/OR REVIEW 
10. GOOD Of THE ORDER 
11. UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS: 
12. CLOSED SE8SION 

12.1 Lebor negoll,1kln (MeU) P'\K ..... rrt to GoYen ment Code SectIon , 54867.8, COl" to _ ~ .. 
and informtllon ~ OIItrIc:t ~tcn n !.DellI «586 (~ 

12..2 Conference y,11h RMl p,opeo1) N~tIotIII (f 54956.8) Prope,Tty Ioct.t.d., *41 Sdan:InI Ad 
Grmty flail CA i5U4 (~. 

1:1. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION 
14. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (If -wllcablttJ 
I!. AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONn1 
Ie. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REG UlAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR TUIMl.ly 

o.o.m'*' 16. 2Dtl M II p.tlt. 

" ~".....~,...... 

..... ".,-.110 '**'*"" ___ ....... """O'I!II:H~ 100, ...... _~ CII1aI\'I'fm_IIo~,Ih ._*'_ .. ..... 
... 

, 

 20-0203 L Page 39 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

7.e MOl) Per-Diem Pa.ItIon wth Amador Ar. Pro!Kdon Oittriec.nd PIa .,f flo. ProltCtlon 0iMrIct ,-
7.7(. ) Fn COde • Onfnanca 201g.01 . s.cond R.dIg 01 the lOla,," Code Am,"douwu - ChIef 

III pr __ 1he lOla F"n Code Ord~ne4lIClIhe Board (HN1h..., SafMy CodM. 138e11.1, 
l1V158 7.nd 18941 .5) (Chief) 

7.7(b) Ordin~ 201G-Ol Adopting the 2018 Edition oIl1w c.Iifomi. F"n eoo., ineofpofMing 1M 
20111 Edition 01 the Intem.tlooal FA Code. To ~ .. 1nIom!~ end ~ing to be 
1f..euIMd for Ofcfl'l.ra .doptlon. (Chief) 

7 e Updlll on open board po.ition: (VIIorno) 
• . NEW BUSiNESS en- s...... 1liiy ...t_, dloc:uM, lib Ktan Of .... 011 ""' _ t>u""_ TIw 801'" CllIi" .... ' 

~ ......... -"" ..... ). 
, 1 Pay rite review MCI poIenIl. 1 .dJu,tmeont~ 10 the OES o8l*:JYmen\ r1Il. for voluntlllll'S 

IIIdr-.s. 
t. CORRESPONDENCE fOR POSSIBLE BOARD AcnONS AN(lJOR REVIEW 
10. 0000 OF THE ORDER 
11 . UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS: 
,2. CL.OSED SESSION 

12.1 UIbor negobtion (MOU) PufIUft 10 Qq..,.,*", Code S.aIon f ~.7.e. 00tV ... ~ upd.t_ 
IWId lnIorm~ beh,lIn 0Ittric:c ~ort WId LocaIlUsee (BOOIChIM) 

12.2 CoIY«enoe v.ith R • ., p~ Negofi.!iont (f s.ase.e) Property IDCllliId.t 4847 5<*onI ReI 
GrtWy Flats CA 95M4 (BOOlChiet) 

1~. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION 
1 • • REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSiON (If .ppl~bl.) 

11. AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH 
" . ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tund_y 

Dec:HlHr 10, 201' _II p.m. 

;~=~:::;:;:~~;::~:::~:~ _ ... ___ "" I p i • Acf rNJA'l. ....- h~ I''''' .."., _ .... I t · .. h OIIMCII _", . .......... _ iiM'It I ..,.,. 0-
n __ h MIl .... _ ... lid'oJC'W ~ ..... h """S ' ... _ 

CCl'I 'II'IN/lt c- 541"'" _ •• ..., ..... ,.. _ IIIIUiDcISH' III. mfI/«Ilr 01" '" III ~ h ." .. OCW "'. 
~, mI,bt~.1Of' ___ -.... Sow .... c~ h ....... ',ou"""''''''''''''''' _ 
_ Ii:> Ill ..... "" 11M ~",... __ ... CIoIIIra .-.tI."',fM AMIII ...... fit (UO) .Xl-f#f S/IIoIrI,. _ .,IS I 
__ SrI __ I AlIJotItI......., _ ,_-. 0SI0I __ TUHd., ~ T/IulIdiIr ..... Ii:> !jIm. 

AgIlodipoolld II fl. C*ttft:!'.Ad"' • ..,,_ . ...... F'Oft OMcHh ~ _ ........ 0ftnIIi f'IfU _ ... PIrInttr,.. 
Plo..:11"" ... O* ............. rIb"'P 

L __ 

..- -"//",/a,,,j,-,, __ _ TDo PCIIIId: ---,?,,-,' '""~,~;>'---___ _ 

, 

 20-0203 L Page 40 of 52



• 

PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
BoMd Q'I Dlrtaou 6o~rd MHtln. 

1.8 MOU "-r-OiMn Po," co , '" NftaIID FIN ~ 0IIItrIet n PIoi_1'b Pi ............ , ~ ,-
H{.) FhCode· OIdo .. 1OO 20111.01 • S«:orw:I RMdlI'G dille 20111 Fn CodeAn,.udm.1tt - CHeI' 10 

PI' II. h 2011 Fb eocr. 0rII1nMIoI kiN IIoIIrd. (HM,," and WIlY em..: 13eee.7, 
17'N1.7 Md 11."".5) (0Mt) 

7.1(1:1) en.- 201M1 ~!he 20111 EdIIonof". ~ I'InI coo.. ...... ""' •• "'!he 201. 
Sdft:rI d It» IrftmIIIIDIwI ,..,. CocIe. To InI:Iu<Ie ,. klfoarm.tIon ancI pr-.llllljllo 1M; 1hQ ...... 
bOdo_a edopIiM. (CNet) 

7.1 ~an..,bowd~ t ~~) 
.. NEW BUSINESS ('n."*"'..,. ................ - .. _ ... ..,._ .. ' n.._a....lMY"'­

. ....... _01'1_). 
' .1 fTJ 1'liiio mtew and ~ adjUlm..alc:f'IaI9M 10 ,. OfS ~ ,... for ~ .,... .... , 

t . CORRUI"OHOEHCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS ANOIOfI R£VlfW 
10.0000 OF nu! MOl!" 
11. UPOOMINO CAl..£HOAA OF EVENTS: 
12.. ClOSED ttaSION 

12.1 labar~1kIn (MOV1PuraMnlto GoIO. ,.i.1I. Code SedIon t 1l4861.8, COI"lIa~_ 
rod InfonMIIotI ~ 0It1!1d ~ ...... lind I..DcII f46881~ 

t2.1 Coo ...... ..., R..t ~ Neoc* .... (I $4a56.lj PtO$*'tt kQ-.J" ~7 SoXonI ReI 
Ortz:"'f l'1li8 CA iM84 IIOCI.OIIeI). 

U . RET\JRH TO OPEN SUSla N 
14. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (II appIbblto) 
1 S. AG!NOA I11!MS fOR NexT MONTl1 
' .. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NOO REGUlAR BOARD MEETlHG SCHEDULED fOR lUNd.y 

o.c.mber 10, 201 ••• p.m. 

..IA ..... 

..... ,..-_ .. ~_.F I ........ ,.,_ao· __ AIAIoI,~""'_""""""" 
1"1 " tIIIIIcft _ • ..,.+. 'i.«a, 

, 

 20-0203 L Page 41 of 52



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 

101.1 X Admin 

105.6.27 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra phical 

503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

505.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

 20-0203 L Page 42 of 52



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix B: Table B105.1(1) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Appendix B: Table BI05.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 
Appendix 0: 0103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Appendix 0: 0103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 
Appendix 0: 0103.6.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 
Appendix 0: 0104.4 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 
101.2 through 101.5 X Admin 

102.6 through 102.8 X Admin 

102.10 through 102.12 X Admin 

103.1 through 104.1 X Admin 

104.3 through 104.4 X Admin 

104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin 

104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin 

104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin 

104.11.3 X Admin 

105.2.3 X Admin 

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin 

105.6.12 X Admin 

105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin 

105.6.37 X Admin 

105.6.39 X Admin 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin 

105.6.48 X Admin 

105.6.50 X Admin 

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin 

107.1 X Admin 

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin 

110.4.1 X Admin 

113.1 X Admin 

 20-0203 L Page 43 of 52



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
303.1 through 303.9 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

305.1 through 305.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

306.1 through 306.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

307.1 through 307.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.2 X Admin 

308.3 through 308.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.4 through 310.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

311.1 through 311.4 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ical 

319.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

319.2 X Admin 

319.3 through 319.10.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

403.10 through 403.10.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

405.5 X Admin 

510.3 X Admin 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.1.5 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

1103.2 X Topographical 

Appendix D: D101.1 through 

D102.1 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D104.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

D104.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: D105.1 through 

D105.4 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D106.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

D106.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: D107.1 (excluding 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

exceptions) 

Appendix D: D108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

 20-0203 L Page 44 of 52



 20-0203 L Page 45 of 52



• 

RESCL.UT'ON NO; 006·2019 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD Of DIRECTORS OF THE PIONEER FIRE 
PROTECTION DISTRICT ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING 
AMENDMENTS TO THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

/It I'HOlulion for (Ile Pioneer Fire I'rotectioo District senina fOI1l1 findinas .... "ilh respect 10 
loxil conditions .... ithin the Fire District "'rueh make eMliin modifiellion, iltId chanllC:S 10 
the Calif..,.ru. Fi~ Code rc3$Qn11bly necusary f()l" ~rvina /ire and life ,.fo:l)' in the 
Pi~ Fi~ Protection District. 

The Q..,\nnina Soan:! orl~ PiOfltt'< fi~ Protection Distrkt fiOOllnd ~$(II\'c, as 10110",,, 

WHEREAS. Heallh &: Salfly Code Seetion 11938.5 penni" l Fire Prolttlion 
DiSiricl 10 adopt an ordinantt which chanlle5 or modifies the Slate HOU5ini rcaulations 

IdopIed pumIIIIl \0 Hnhh &: Safe'!) Code S«tion 17922 upon detmninllion thal such 

c~ 0.- modi6ClUions = ~- due 10 locil roOOiliOllll lhal penain rellu\elions 
1IO\'mIina rondirions hamdous to ]'foe. propeny and lh( en\ironmem from fire. explosion, 

~s materials ....:I hazardous uses; &nd 

WHEREAS, Health &. Saf~ Code S«1ion 119SS 7 ~tri1'H that • District's 
Board of Directors makina any char\,aH or modiflClOtions pursuant 10 Huhl! &. Sak1:)" 
Code S«tion 179511.5 .haIl maU npte$S findinllhat suo:h chan&a or modifi(:&liOl1s '" 
neroro: and shall file a copy of SII( ~ d_ges or modifiallions with the Department of 

Housina and Community Ikv<:lopmenr: and 

WHEREAS, t~ umq~ loct.l cJimalic. plollrcal. and ~cal conditions 
e~imn8 within t~ boundariC$ of tile Districl rnak.: il~)' necessary for !be Distric1 

\0 imPQ:5ot more stringent requirementl than JC1 forth in tht California Fire Code and 

pursuant to California Health and Saf(1)" Code sections 13869.1 and 119s&.1. the IMuict 
desi~ 10 male e~preu findinll$ 10 ,10.1 e1T«t; and 

NOW, THEREFORE, liE IT RESOLVED Wllhe Board of Directors oftht 

r ioneu Fin: Prot«lion District, after having duly noticed and Iltld public hWings. IKJcby 

adopts the followillj findinas conceminll cum.nt unique I,.,;al conditions thaI !~ 
make eadl modifK:alion \0 the C.+fomia Fire Code. rarsonably necessary 10 pro~ide 
adequale and effecti.e proie<:lion of lite. propM} and the tn~irorll'llenl m<>re specifically 

SCI fOl1~" foUo"'1; 

Resolution No: 006-2019 

 20-0203 L Page 46 of 52



• ·-
-. 

fiNDINGS OF fACT 
fOR CHANGES OR MOD/FICA liONS TO THE STAn: Bllt.DI'G ST ANDARO'i 

CODE mTLE 2~ r . .t.RT') BECAlS[ OF LOCAL CONDlTIO:"S 

A. General. 
ACter d...., considenllion. the Board 01 Dire«O!"l of ~ Piont<:r ri~ Prottc:lion DiwiCl. 
hereb} fonds that d..e (0 local ~Iimali<:. i"OLoai<: alld l0p0&r89ltie cond'li0n5. .., Sl3tN 
",;Ihilllhis document. 111m: is a n«d 10 pro~ilk the lI1Odifie.tiolll Md dlllnae5 rontained 

in the lIdopIivt Otdiflllncc of the CalifornIa Fj", Code Such ClwlafS ~ ~Ied to be 

!'C1Isooably O«Qslll) \0 pro,ide adequale and effe..'1ivc pn:uaion of life. propert). and 
the cm;rorunm1. 

llIc Pioneer Fi~ Protection Dislrict prClvides fire proiectiOll, cnlf:rgenc) mt<licil services. 
and 'pe<:ialized rescue servkn 10 appnlKimalely c'&hl rholi$.ll1d people in a 296 square 
mile Ifrl.. The Dimicl is 1O<:PlW In IOOIh FI Dorado County. The topography of the 
District raIlaes rrom roIlinll hills ot' ~s and oak .... 'OOdlalldl in the ""'eSt and oak and 
linl~ in !hie Sl~p mountainou1 wild dnr.inlllLC'$ of the eall ponion. The "'nmer 
C(lndilion1 Vlry from freninlt Itmpmltures Wilh oeeasionalsnow in the lower elevation 

Ind 5lIOW in tM higher eI~'ations in "lnter. to swnmcr temperatures thai ~~ed 100 

"""". 
The D,strin cen bI: di,'jded inlo (h'e dislinct a~u, TIle core lrea encomplll5eS Mount 

Aukum. Sotr"',3Cl Fliipla)' and Outinlld • .Ic. The core: ate. is more tuban inlmtICe and 

COIIUlins ITIOSt of 1M Districfs eOIti$l.inllL cornmm::1llI de\~lopiT1<fll ~nd p<Xalli.a1 for 
rommm:ial ~Iopmenl. The northeast. tOrizzly Flats) and sootbeasl (Omo RMcb) 
U"eIIS typically contlm UTIlI! subdivisions and iwlated residentiaL developments. These 

.feU ate clIInctGUUi: of the su~ inlCrlace, fuming or I1IIlCh CT,,"irol"lll"lenl. The 

""Ht,.,...1 mtOi~ lilt Sand RidIlC.-n «M1wnina Jm&n wbdi.isions. small isol111ed 

fe$idmtill ~Iop"d. and _ of filml~hini- The east b«omcs vay isolated 
and mol"e 1\II"1I1 .. ~)"OII molC funtln .".y fron. Grinly Flats and the Omo Ranch 8mlS. 

The PiOU"f Fift' Pn)/t<1ion Dwnn is an .... U-rislr.-ll&COCy. The District par1icipltes in. 
iOphislj(1lltd au!onun", 1..:1 ])IOirutl and is dispelrlled !hruu~ aar=nent by I~ 
C.IiI'omi. Dq:l8nmenl of Fotesuy and Fire Proiection (CII-Fire). at CIIIil;no. The 
resources orthe Diwict "ill respond 10.. and dell! "'1m, Iil~ Iype of ~ The Imn 
-Fire Prolleclion" in lhis document is brotod and includes respoos.es to fim. "nob IIIld 
odor in\"csliplions, .lam15 .. public ass;$!. calls. hazardous IIlItm.1s incMXnI5. rMdiQl 
aid. and specialized. ~\cues. 

nl(" nisuicl lias ~Iblished OIlC. full·lime. stafftd tire stllioo and 1;\"( Mlldlite Ii .... 
JII\\;' ·~ s 10 pr"(' lde enl"8eoc) s(1"li~ 10 the comnlunit)·. Firt SCllion 38 it locale(! in 

Re!IQlulilln No: C·lw"'~()19 ' . N, 
Marie Fi~ '> Eilenl Slranafeld ~ 

 20-0203 L Page 47 of 52



llie "nil'lC<:I<p(lnli!'<l 10"" of Son~. at 1061 Muunt Aukum IW. Fi.., Slation 37 ;J 
10Utcd in 1M- Wlinrorporlti!'<l iO\\ll of OnWl Ranch.. 81 6021 51", Guidi Road. Omo 
Ranch CA. fin! Station 33 is located I.l 41131 Sciaroni ROIOd. Griul)" Flats, CA. fire 
Stalion 3" i~ located in 1M unino,;ol"pOl"lIted lawn of Mount Aukum, al 2400 Omo Ranch 
Rd, Mount Aukum CA Fin! Station n iJ located in the Sand RidjIC !lin. III. 477Q SMd 
Rktae ROIOd. PlOCft"Villc. CA. Firt Silliion 31 i~ \ocaiN in thc Sweeny Croosinllalft. al 
7960 GrluJ)· Fllll IW~ Somer$(!. C A The DiSlri~t lias Jix full-tune. Caettr per$OOMI. 
Ilona ";Ih 1\0."0 mana~rMnt positions, OM administmi,·e support positions. 01"11: pUblic 
c4\1Cl1tion. Iwmty-eight QRT tEMS!\\.'ikilandl \olunletrs wid four Rc-sene!Volunteers. 

B. Cll .. aci~. 
The Piol1«r Fire Prol~tlon Diluici is Iocaled ,.ithin I foothilt and lUountainol'S rtaron. 
The District is subject to four K&$Ons. ,.ith Ilfl IMUD! a"f"I"lIif snowfall in the: .... ·inter 
month, of ~ ioches in tM- foothills. 46 inches in (he Gn7.l.1y FlalS and Onto Ranch ~ 
and 300 inches in the mountainous ""'lIS. in addition 10 an al~ rainfall of 311 inches in 
1M 10v."ft ric>.'3I.ions and ~. inches in tM hillhl:t ~J~ion~ per )eal. The$e Ii:herse 
weather conditions creact WI·tA' hozardoos road condiTioru.. fIoodi", as ... ~It as rock ,tide 
haunls along the main ..xe$$ roads .... ithJn.. as "~II as iNo. lhe Distri<:t from the 
surrounding MUS. Due- 10 periodJ (If ... infall .• Iuni .. ilh ~ed rwd dosu~. thc 

ability of the Fi.., Proteclion Oimict 10 provide immedilte nntrgeney =ponJe is olkn 
delayed or unp • .uable. These same advcnc climatic conditions often =ult in I IIIJ¥f 
number (If vehicular ac<;id~nts Ihal place tXlrtme reslr8in($ on Ihc availabiliTY of 
CTMfiCncy rnpo!IK \0 perform tl1\ol!Tiency rescue. rlO4 aid, hazarOOllS m.Terials conlfQl, 
and fire. flghtill&. ~ climatic OOndilioll5 often Te1uh in a SIlMtanti.1 or lotal IIK:L of 
ability of !be Fire ProIfC\1oo DiSirictlO respond imrntdiattly 1O.x1l« types (If trM1lenq 
situations ThaI 0«\11". Exampk\ of thn<: c~ency s;tl,ql'Lons include ~ !ires. 
wildl-.nd and fOT¢$l fit"el, fIoodil\i. haurOOus Inmerial.s incideoo., ~nc:y medical 
C111tS. "ehicle IK:cic\ent!J,. and "mical rescues. The mU1\III1 aid l&1e<;o~n\S ntablWt.cd with 

adjoinini fire lie1\cies miih( not be puuible due to adlerse cJi'NIIH: conditions. 
=tricl1n& or tOtfllty blockinl ~CtU into tbe District. 

Su ••• .,: 
These local ,·limatic cOl1dil1oos afred the acccltraliOl\, lnlemil). Ind siu of fires in thc 

Fire District. nlnet of liule or 00 rainfall. 10"· humidity. lind hi'" !nn~ Cn!lle 
extremel) haurdoos .vnditions. particularl)· as !bey rriale 10 thc ... il.!land-urban 
interfilce. Wi"Js c.\jXrienc«t in llns ;u« can ha\'e a .igniflCllnt imi*CI upon Slr\Jctun: 
li"'5. espc:o:isit) in buildings in close ptO ... imi~ 1(1 OM ~r. and to "ilcil.ods 
commonly fOWId in the Pi(lneer Fire Protection Districi. SInK:tul"e"$ t:>uih \lithin the 
P\onttr Fire Protection Oistrin mlm be: buill .... ith these ,·ariabln in mind. 

 20-0203 L Page 48 of 52



C. G"Iogjn.I. The Pioneer Fire Prot<:<;tion District is located within modo:"'le kt'vu~ 

stl5nllC Zone Tlvtt. The seismic. yeoloi!ical conditions ,,",Knl a potentiBI for muhiple 
lires. major breabl!e of water mains. nmltiple el«tricil power failures. multiple 

collapsed struc:to.='! and a ""IC num~r of ellis for cmerlOcnc~ me<liulaid, III of ",hich 

ma.~ occur simulllneOUSI} durilli I seismic cvcnl. The Wlln districts have nUlllffOUI 

"'tn-pwnpinl! S)Sl.C1TU uxd for fire sUpPre$s,on WatCT dell,el). Iti .... ellis "'Iter sionollt 
tanks pro~idina "'IIC' 1)"Slem pressure. Most of tile pumping I~slcm s are dependent on 

el«lricai power for operation. SlICh cI«tncll pow~r lI1&y 1101 be avail.ble during. 
5alll1ic C'"CfIt Wlte, ltoraiC ~s usc4 for tile Iloraae of requ,,'cd fire $UIlprt:Slion w.ln 

may abo collapse in weh lUI e'·enl fon:in.ll the: additiOlll1 need to t","sporl WlItcr vi. 
ltddilJonal pi«cs of fire Ippttno1US "hkh will place. ,iJ'lific.nt retl ... int on the ability of 

the: DlStnc\ to pro~ide Ille requited cmeracncy SCf\ices. 

Sun,I1\"): 
Local p&rIPlllc and iIC'llo$":ll fell\ll'C$ Ind processes eliist wllhin the boundaries of the 
district It.! rn.) hamper the ability of the: Pion-cer Fire PI"OI«:tion Dit'rict to perform its 

S"'1)n1 duties Fire foliowinlllUl 9fthquakc ha tile potCT1lial of clusinll greater loss of life 
.nd dama.,'C than tile car1hq\ll~e ilself, 

D T opo,nphkal The DiSinct it primarily tompose,j of nu~rous .reas lhat are 
considemi by the St.ale 10 be hiah fire IIazlIrd K\C,;ty zones The District is localro 
wuhin about 70 pc:n;rot fOOlh,1I terra.n and 30 pen::mt mount.ainous lernt;n. coH'red with 

hillhl) tombuslible ''CIetltoon, indudinalhc pKSCTIeC of man} coniferous foresled areu, 
TIle cleation ",ithin the DimiC1 rIIIaH from II 1,900 feet to over 7.300 fttt.t the 
hlahc1! point. Slope ""ithin th.t Di$tric • .-.nan from 0 dea.rccs to 90 degra'S The 

StNCM'eS withm the IIreI$ of foothills terrain hive: limited lire IiC"CCSS, due to narrow 
n:MId~lIrs with SlO!Cp ifldel and poor rOIid SurfKC rondillons. The pre$CnCe of man~ 

existina SlructUfCS "'ithin tile hii/l fire hazard sc~eril) zone ami pro~idn for a ~ery high 
jX)tCT1till or. Structure fire: Spre1\dina into. wildland or fo=t fire: condition as well as the 
potennal for • w itdl.nd or (om! ftre spreading 10 Slructul'C$. 

Summa,")': 
The 1lianmcm of clltyons. \":IIIc)"1. ,nd dopes into inhabited 1m$, I;OI!1bincd ~ith the 

van_ble Tllturc of tile lmain. yidd polenli.l for i~ fire risk. Most structun:s, both 

residential and conunerdal. are in or an:: sum:ourdcd by areas thai contlin liimfiullt 

SrISI, brusb.. mixed oak ,\oodland. and mixed conif~ fuel load. ~ 10 drou~t 

conditions, beetle inlCsla1 ions. and lack of vcgcI.tion managerroc.nt. much of the lrea is 
popuilled with eitller dead /)0" d}ini trttl. contributina to ex~mo: fire dan.:cr. 

RC$Olution No: 006-2019 Mlrie FiL~ Eileal Slranafdd Ui 

 20-0203 L Page 49 of 52



• . - • 

E. Con~lu,I(ID: 

le>cal dirn.:uic. &w&raphic and IOpoJU1lphic rooditiom dncribed abo"e i ...... ,,'it {he 

tteq~ncy. intensily, and sia of fires invohing huildinp in the rin: District. FYnher. 
!hew oondilions inlpact Pf>I<"IIliJJ darn&&e to SIl'UctUle:5 from an mrtt>qune and 

subsc-q~nt fire. n,..,..,ron:, it is ~lLIIbI}' I>I:CcUU) that the Califomill Fin: Cod<: be 
m.xlified !O millg,lle Ihc effects of the .bo>e tondiriOll'$. 
C&lifomia Heallh and Sat~) C<><k= S«hon 1795&.7 requi~ Ilia mo,lIIlcltians 10 !he Fio: 
Cock ~ cxprr .. l) mailed MOO identif,ed .. 10 "hkh ~h finding refen 10 "'hich Codr 
modification. The 11l3C1>ed Appmdi.~ A pro\ ioks this «'Olno:<.:lion 

INTROOUCEO 11.1' Iqulaf m«ting of the Board ofDim:tors oflhc Pionm- FIn: 
PrQl~lion Dimict on 1R1OOcr 81h. 2019. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED all "'iU1ar mtt1inll of the Board ofOire.."too ofthe' 
Pinn«r Fill: ProI«IiOfl Dim'ict on Octvber Ith. 2010 bJ. the [ollo)"ln~ roll call \'OIe 

VOTE ON PASSAGE: 

Marie FilU, &.td Cluoir 

Ripley Ho;"( 

JftT)' Jwnper 
M.-k Filll 
EII«II Slrtlljtdd 
0,<0 

L Ab:.lam .fL. N1r 

(iI > 

No! P~l 

I. Ell"" SI.--gftl./, S«n,..,.", 1M "-rJ. do ~ COllY," Iltot 11w,~ klQltlllan No _191' 
,...,. ,'OHd lIpOfi ...J "fJP' ""~,{ 10 •• • ., ... jonIj ..".. of tI" a.-,I . ... I'" r dQ)" oJ Ort«- MIl) mod / 
j"f'lMr<YJ1;f .. iht C'OMf1I;..,n. ... n~ ,"" (<J/fI«I kwl,.i<>n -' ,ot.- ~s oJ'''' BoanJ 

( , , • 

Rl:SOlu~ion No: 006-2019 Marie r~ EiI~ Slran;fdd E1J 

 20-0203 L Page 50 of 52



RESOLUTION NO. XXX-2020 
Of THE BOARD Of SUPERVISORS OF THE COUI'ITY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 011-2011) 

WHEREAS, the California Code ofRegul.tions, Title 2", Pan 9, the Cliifomia Fire Code. is 
IIpdated by the State every three ~&n: and, 

WHEREAS, !he 2019 CaliforniK Fin: CoUc btoI;IlJU~ cITec:Li.c OJI Jlllll.lllty I, 2020: llJid 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5. 11958.1 and 18941.5 
permit. COWlty to make.ruch locli ammdments and modifications IS the COWlty determines Ire 
reasonably neceSSl1)' because of local climatic, gwlogieaJ or topographical wnditions; and. 

WHEREAS, the Cliifomia Code ofRe8u1.tions. Health and Safety Code, Division 12. Part 2, 
Chapter I. Article 12. Section 1J1"6, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety 
re"u1ations 10 the locallevel8lld grants authority to delepte cnforc:emenlto tile chiefbl.li1ding 
official. or his or her autbori~ representative, or to the miefofthc fin protection district, orhis 
or her representative: and, 

WHEREAS. enforcement of tile Fire Code in the County ofE! Dorado Iw been delegated 10 the 
chief oftbe fire protection dis~t, orhis or her representative: and, 

WHEREAS, on November 12, 2019, the Board ofOireclOJ'$ ofthc Pioneer Fire Protection 
District adopted Ordinance No. 2019.1 whicll adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with 
llI'Iendments the District deemed IleUSsary 10 deal with locli climate, ~Iogical or 
topogrllpbicaJ conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, IhIt the Board ofSupcrvison oftbe County ofEI 
Dorado ratify the following amendments to the California Fire Code adopted by the Pioneer Fin: 
Protection District 

These changes include amendments and additions to the Cal ifornia Fire Code in the following 
sections: 

101.1. 105.6.21. 106.6. 106.6.1, 106.7. 109 .... 110.", 110.4.2. 112.", 202. 102.1, 101 ...... through 
107 ....... 2 (I) through (d). 503.2. 1, 501.2.5. 501.2.6, 503 ... . 2. 503.4.3, SOH ... . 503.5.3, 505.1. 
501.5.1, 509.3, 901.2 including (I) and (h), 903.2.1. 903.2.3. 903.2 ... . 903.2.1. 903.2.8.2, 
903.2.9,903.2. 10.901.2 .. throush 901.2.d, 901.6.2.1. 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 33 12.1. "903.1. 4905 .... 
5001.1. 5601.2. S60 1.2.1, 5601.2.2. 5704.2.9.6.1. 5106.2 ... . 4, 5806.2. 61 04.2, 6112.1 through 
6112.3.6113.1,6113.2, Chapter 80 (NFPA 130-2016). Appendix B: T.ble B1OS.1 (I), 
Appendix B: Table BI05.2, Appendix 0103.1 through 0\01.3. Appendix 0103.5, Appendix 
0103.6.1. Appendix 0103.6.2, Exception, Appendix 0104.4 •• Appendix 0106.1 Exteption, 
Appendix DI 01.1 Exception. 

 20-0203 L Page 51 of 52



l ..... a. 

The Pioneer Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in 
its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 
2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 
Resolution No. 000-2020 
Page 2 of2 

105.6.17-105.6.19,308.1.4,309,311.5,311.6,318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4,403.3,403.4,403.6, 
403.7,403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2,403.10.3,403.11,403.12,404.1-
404.4,405.1-405.4,405 .6-405.9,406,805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3),808,904.1.1, 
1101,1103.1,1103.3-1103.6,1103.9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, 
Chapter 26, the exceptions under D 104.2 (Exception), D 106.1 (Exception), D 1 07.1 (Exceptions 
1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix 0, Appendix J, Appendix K, 
Appendix L, Appendix M. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County ofEI Dorado at a regular 
meeting of said Board, held the 71h day of January. 2020, by the following vote of said Board: 

Attest: Ayes: 
James S. Mitrisin Noes: 
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors Absent: 

By: --------------------Title Sue Novasel, Chair, Board of Supervisors 

 20-0203 L Page 52 of 52


	Resolution_Pioneer
	Reso Pioneer FPD 2-25-20



