
RESOLUTION NO. XXX-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 012-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is 
updated by the State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines 
are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, 
Chapter 1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety 
regulations to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building 
official, or his or her authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his 
or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the 
chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and 
maintain a memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining 
to the inspection of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on November 13, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Rescue Fire Protection 
District, adopted Ordinance No. 2019-01 which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with 
amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or 
topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Supervisors of the County of El 
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Rescue Fire Protection District and delegates the 
enforcement of the ordinance to the Rescue Fire Protection District Chief. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following 
sections: 

101.1, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1,307.4.4, 307.4.4.1, 
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1. 
507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 
903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 
5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 
NFPA 13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 4.7, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 
5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1,  
Appendix Table Bl05.l (1), Appendix Table Bl05.2, Appendix Dl03.l through D103.3, Appendix 
Dl03.5 Section 1, Appendix 103.6.1, Appendix Dl03.6.2, and Appendix D104.4. 

20-0203 M Page 1 of 36



 
 
 
 

Resolution No. XXX-2020 
Page 2 of 2 

 

 
The Rescue Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in 
its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 
2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

 
105.6.17-105.6.19, 105.6.39, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4,403.3, 
403.4, 403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 
403.12, 404.1-404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2), 808, 904.1.1, 
1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, 
Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception), D107.1 (Exception), 
Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, 
Appendix M. 

 
Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 

 
 
 
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said 
Board, held the _____ day of _____________________, 20__, by the following vote of said Board: 
 
 Ayes: 
Attest: Noes: 
Kim Dawson Absent: 
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors  
 
By: _____________________________________ _____________________________________ 
 Deputy Clerk Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Board of Supervisors 

 

  20-0203 M Page 2 of 36



Rescue Fire Department 

5221 Deer Valley Rd.· Rescue, CA 95672 • Phone (530) 677-1868· Fax (530) 677-9609 

Maurice Johnson 
Fire Chief 

December 18 , 20 I 9 

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer 
EI Dorado County Board of Supervisors 
330 Fair Lane 
Placerville, CA 95667 

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Rescue Fire 
Protection District, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code with 
amendments related to local climatic, geographic and topographic 
conditions. 

Dear Mr. Ashton: 

The Rescue Fire Protection District (RFPD) is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS) 
ratify its Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code as amended 
due to specific local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. California Health 
and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of the city or county where 
the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance. The BOS must 
also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District (or its representative) 
or the Chief Building Official. 

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2019-01 with 
amendments to the 2019 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that 
Ordinance to the RFPD Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for your review and 
use on this topic. 

This resolution has no direct fi cal impact to the County. 

Si;7Y' 

ffi/.tefL 
Fire Chief 

ATTACHMENTS : 

1. RFPD Ordinance No. 2019-01 
2. RFPD Resolution No. 2019-08 
3. Draft EI Dorado County BOS Resolution 

"ServinB tfie Communities of c£[ C[)oraao Jrd[s, CJVscue ana Latro6e" 

  20-0203 M Page 3 of 36



1-0-6 I-O~ ·ON a:.ueulpJO ad.:lH 

" ·ON JuawI.I:.eJJY 

, 
  20-0203 M Page 4 of 36



• 
, I 

RESCUE: FIRE I'ROTECTION IlISTRlCT 

ORDINANCE NO. 1019.01 

BE IT ORDAINED Bynm BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE RESCUE FIRE 

PROTECTION DISTRlCT AS FOLLOWS: 

An ordilWlCC ofthe Rescue F,,·., P~oe1ion DiS1ricl (RFPD) adopIiq the 2019 EditIOn oflhr Cil/ifor>oia Fin 

Cod,_ inOOl110lltina the 2018 Edition of the JnltntallO<lai Fi" Code, n:gu.laulIi.m pr.oerwllllbe safquanli ... of 

life and property from ftre and explO1ion hIIzanII ari11lli from lhe SIOJ1l&e. IlandIiDg and we oflwardous JUbd ........ , 

materials one! !lev;tq, and from cond,tIon, I\uardoU$ to life or property in the OOCIIJ*ICy ofbuildinp and pmniJoes 

10 the RFl'D; providing for 1he ISS1.LlIICf; ofpc:nniu md roUcction of fees therefor; Repealina OrdinlllCe No. 2016-01 

oftbe RFPD and .n other ~I and pAI'Il of the <>rdinaD:es in conflict thmwitb. 

Be it ORDAINED by !he Hoard of Dlrcc10n of the RFPD: 

Sectioo ] : fINDlNGS Qt' t'''CIS 

SocIiorll: ADQmotl Of COVE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

SectIon 3: LOCAL MIt:NDMENIS 

Section 4: CONFJ.lCf 

Section 5: SEVERABILITY 

Sectioo 6: EFFEcnyE DAn AND rUBuqIION 

SECfION 1: fINDINGS OF FACTS 

l1\e RFPD m.ku co:n.in change. (Iisl.cd below) to the ell/i/o""" Fin Code, 2019 Edition, pur3Uanl to 

Hm/l. d: Stlfoty Qxk s«/10ftJ 1:11697. J7'l51J.7 and J8'J.fU dunna un. code Idoptioo procell. Such ebt.nlco 

are neceswy beaux of local eliml1ic, lleo1op:a.l andI« lOpOJrIpbjc.al conditiooa. The RFPD l1li adopted, 

pul1uant to &CriOfl J8tU/j of \he Cahfontifl HaJ/III .t Sa/lry C«k, the fllMliDp of fao;a, relative 10 \hue 

ronditioos by ResoluUOD _201948 of tbe RFPD dated October 9, 2019. 

SECI10N 2: ADOPTION OF COPE WITH EXCLUSLONS 

The RFPD~' the 2019 Ca/ifontia Fi" Codl, nl/I U, Pori 9, Ip i1s M1lmy, iQ(:luding Appendices. 

iou:o ...... tiat!bote lled;i(llll or the lit_tiona/ Fi" C()f/I, 2018 oditiOfl not adopted by the .ate, with the 

er.dusiOl\llI~ed below: 

Exdll~: IOS.6. 17-IOS.6.19, IOS.6.39, 308. 1.4, 309, 31 U, )11.6, 318, 400.1, 403.2.1-403.1.4, 403.3, 

403.4,403.6,403.7,401.8 (adopIiDa 403.8.1-403.8.1.7). 403.9, 40).10.2, 40) .10.3, 403.11, 4OJ.l2, 404.1-404 .... 

Ordin&nce2019-01 'og< ' 

  20-0203 M Page 5 of 36



-405 405 805-807 807.5 904.1 1, 11 1103.1,11 1103.6,1103.9 

.. .n ....... ,""I-" .. ...., ...... under D I 04.2 

DI06.1 F, 

\.OT)enlQ]c::es not .... rt,.." .... t •• r1 can be used for reference in other sections the 2019 Fire 

Code, 

SECTION 

The Sections are 

1 

amemlea as name 

the in the most current 

..::....:::;...=.:..;:;.....~~..::..::..::=..:...::::..::...o.l-=-=::..:::. shan be added as 

person, that 

A SCllellUle 

mspel-::tllms and the issuance 

schedule (Health & 

Fire sen'ice 

is .·v.·TI, ...... ' the di,\'trict to rej:D(Jlna to the scene nc,lue'nl, A 

district hoard may r'rJ,"'J"crp to cover the cost 

no! exceed 

the ,.... ... il'ftrnr,''''y 

may bill the 

the time 

time 

CeSIIlJIlSf.,eCllO'l1 site as 

H'llen a fest or 

as a OJrnUll s 1'1' ai' II costs, 

as 

cost 

incident, 

and 

Ins.CJec.;'cwln {()carrWln and 

or 

ael'erJ?Ul1arlon made code 

"''''',1''",' tl'll'''',710'''' a written notice may Q'f),pelll this matter within 15 calendar nn",rn1nr'V on 

the notice .. Atl 

the FIJ~1rl,"'., matter is 

the L"1L1Vc.;(AI as Ou,lflf.lea in ... ,..,,,n.,,,.,,,, an lmJrnUlen 

2 

  20-0203 M Page 6 of 36



II/ /if( ,\lI!( /1 JiU:::ard to lIIt'lJIbcl'S Ihe jJublic. The lire code ojlle'ial slwll no/i/l' the oppel/alii 

l/ r!!fl( d mail ill il,. dal! owl filld 511cl; /uaring, J h( hew illg ,1/10111,( ,Ie/I( dilled f(l faAl.: II/un: 1;0 

,Ioon«', thall 20 calclldw (10m [he dUll' ShOll'lI OJi the c('ni/ied mail. 7i1t' appellant shall have III( 

righl 10 appl'fJr in persoli (II III heallllg and prescnt oml, H'rif(('11 (lnd/or {J!t%gmphi( 

f:vidence to Ihe 

.!...;;..;:;::.:..:-.:,.;==~~==::::. shall as fo]]O\",s: Persons \vho shall violate a provision 

~ode or sha 11 

repan or Ull 

or 

fille not 

ojtlu! same 

and 

deemed a 

10 comply with any the thereof 01 who shall ereel, mslall. aller. 

constnJclion documents 01 dJrective of the 

or certificate used under provisions of this shall a 

ill the discn:liul/ oftl/I: prosecutil1g allomcy or agel/cy, by a 

$} 00,00/01' afirs! violatioll; 2. A /illc 1/ot $5VU ()(j/or (l second violation 

wilhin one year,' 3. Afine not exceeding $1000. additiona/l'iolatioll 

within one year, or by imprisOlm1ent not 180 or such [me 

Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served be 

(Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995) 

shall be added as follows: Dll: Fire Chief. or his/her (jill horized 

may issue citaliolls/or iI((racliolls or misdemeanor violations ~{this pursuant to 

Section the Health & Safety Code of the Slate of Ca/~{ol7lia and Chapter 5c (commencing 

with Section 853.6) o{ Tille 3 (I{ Part 2 q{lhe Penal Code ()(the Slu/i.! o(CalifiJmia. 

Section 112 Stop Work Order 

.;!...!.;=.:....::.=..::.:..:::....:.:~=~!.l.. shall amended as follows: Any person 

with a stop-work order, except such work as that person IS 

np·r1t\Trn to remove a or condition, shaH be punishable by 

both as in Section 1) 0.4 (Health & Safety Code SectloliS 13145 and 1 

Chapter 2 

or purposes. This includes fires contained within UUlU(;Uf 

any work 

to 

or 

stoves 

with flues or chimneys, stuves using jellied, liquid, or solid fuels, portable hn,-h.of'1 or 

home, or any living .IJ)(U;(' healing which are used outside of any structure, 

accommodation mounted on a vehicle. 

Ordinance 201 Page 3 

  20-0203 M Page 7 of 36



Add f()r~::.:..::..= mean the all other areas within the exterior boundaries 

thereo/Ilow or hereafter 

Add definition fe.r Shull mean a vehicular access that serves up to two parcels vvith 

no more than rn.:o (2) residential units and any number nJnon-commercial or industrial buildings on 

parcel. 

Add ddlllilioll for ===..!.,;!";...!.:..:;=.!.. - Shall mean the of Directors of the District. 

definition - Shall mean Executive Fire the Fire 

department/district the jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative. 

Add definition for .;::..:...::::.:.;==--:::.::.:..:::...:.:..:::::-:..:.::.:==.t:>.:= - Shall mean stalldhy personnel, usually a security 

guard or usher personnel, Mho are trained in the proper procedure to exit people Fom a tent or other 

oJpublic assemblage in an orderly and calm/ashion in the event oj an emergenq. 

3 

=::.:.::..-=-:=='-"'-'" shall be as follows: definition, as shown above In 

=.;..;..;~-=.11 is unJawjil1 Jor any person to light, or use a upon or near any brush-

,'l1lJP,'I'U land, grass-covered or j(Jresl-covered land during the time when permits are 

suspended by the Director of the Department of Forestry and Protection, the Unit 

Chie}: or the AHJ 

Exception: Commercial operations with approval oJlhe AHJ 

=.:..:..:== When campfires are allowed, it should be unlawful for any person to light, maintain, or use 

a campfire upon any land, grass-covered or land unless the 

minimum I'Pll1J1rPI'tlpnl.<;: are r'nmr:llu'n with. 

=~~""-"""'"" 
nlC area within 5 of the periphery oj the is cleared of all flammable 

material and vegetation. 

=~~""-:..=. One serl'iceahle shovel with a handle of at least inche., is ready Jor use at 

immediate area oJthe campfire. 

=.:..:...l.=~:;.L Campfires shall be limited to a lfoot by lfoot area, in an approved manufactured 

or fire 

"'-"-"-"-'.:..:.::.::::...;=-<, Written the landowner must obtained prior to the ignition of the 

campfire and shall be on site. 

Ordinance 2019-01 4 

  20-0203 M Page 8 of 36



Chapter 5 

unobstmcled width of not 

except fi)! 

clearance of nol less than 15 

"wide. 

lows: Fire apparalus access wads shall have :ill 

shoulders, as 

ill accordance with Section 

(0 

and unobstmcled 

A II drin'lI"oys in the district shall not be llum 12 f£,<:t 

503.2.5 Dead Ends shall be amended as follows: Dead-end fire apparatus access and dri1'(!WllVS 

in excess of 1."0 fcct ill lcn,!!th shall be provided with an approved area for turning around fire 

apparatus. 

===~:..:-"''''''''''--''~'-''='''-''-':..==~::.:...:== shall he amended as follows: Where a or an elevated 

surface is pari of a fITe apparatus access 

accordance wifh the current El Dorado 

the bridge shall he constructed and maintained in 

Transportation Division Bridge or Appendb.: 

D of the current California Fire is more reSTrictive. 

shall he designed for a live to can)' the imposed loads of fire load 

be posted al both entrances to required by the 

elevated surfacr:s desi!:,1ned for emergency vehicle use arc adjacent to surfaces which are not 

for such usc, approved barriers, or bOUl shall be installed and when 

rpr,""rp" by the fITe code offiCIal. 

as follows: No person shall SlOp, park, VI' leave 

standing allY vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when I/ecessary tv avoid with 

other traffic or in compliance with directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly OllflUWI:rerl 

representative, Peace Of lIce l' vr official control device along the edge of any at any 

curb, or in allY location in a public~v or oWlled or operated off-street facility, 

'>'fi;"""';U as afire lane by the district withjurisdictiolf over the area in which the place is IOcatea. 

111e shall be indicated (1) a adjacent to, and the 

clear~v stating in letters f10t thall one inch ill that the place is afire 

outlining or painting the c%r, marking the place with the 

words "}<]RE LANE", which are 

the edge afthe roadway UpOll which is 

or (3) by a red curb or red paint 011 

wo,.d~· "FIRE LANE". 

=::;":",,:,",,,,-.::....:..::,--=--=-:=:.>o....:=-..;:...::..;:::.=:.....;:;.;::...=;.,c..;:::== shall as follows: No person shall stop, park, or 

15.ket of a fire hydrant except (l1>' follows: (a) If the vehicle is 

attended by a /iamed driver who is seated in the front seat and who can immediately move such 

vehicle in case o/necessity, (b) !Jthe vehicle is 01' by afire department and is clearly 

marked as a fire department whicle. 

9-01 5 

  20-0203 M Page 9 of 36



503A.4 Fil t' Lam'~ Blt~nl on Hmlti Widlh shall be added as follows: Fire lanes shall be based on 

road width as required ill Appendix D as amended by {he district. 

503.5.3 Fire ApparalllsAccess Gatrs s11all be added as follows: All automatic and lI1allual gates 

installed overfire apparatus access roads shall comply \·vith the district gate standard as approved 

by the fire code official. 

Seclion 505 Premise Identitication 

505.1 Address Identification shall have the first line of this paragraph amended as follows: 

Addresses for new and existing bui ldings shall comply with the district address standard as approved 

by the fire code official 

Section 507 j'"ire Protection Water Supplies 

507.5.1 Where Required shall be amended as follows: 400 feet shaH be amended to 150 feet. 

Section 509 Fire Protection and Utility Equipment 1dentification and Access 

509.3 Fire Control Room shall be added as follows: Fire ~pnllkler risers,fire alarm control panels, 

solar photo voltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression or 

similar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building The fin! 

control room shall have minimum dimensions afjivefeet by sevenfeet in size with a total usable area 

of not less than 35 square feet, The room shall be located within the huilding on an outside wall at a 

location approved by the Fire Code Official alld shall be accessible Fom the exterior. An exterior 

access door with a dear width ofllot less than 32 inches and height of not less than 80 inches shall 

be providedfor access into the room, A durable sign shall be affIXed to the exterior of the door with 

the words "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters /lot less than 4 inches in height. A key box complying 

with Section 506 shall be installed on the exterior side of the jire control room door opening. 

The room must he capable of maintaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit. A 

clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers to any adjacent walls. This 

room can be a shared with other building utilities or fire protection equipment that is not 

incompatible, An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the fire 

sprinkler system and other fire protection equipme/Jt This room shall 110t be used for any other 

storage. 

Exception: Olle-and two-family dl-i'ellings, manufactured homes or similar uses defined as either 

a Group R-3, R3.1, or R-4 occupancy. 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 6 

  20-0203 M Page 10 of 36



Chapter 9 

Seniop 903 Fire SprtpkJen 

'03.2 When RN_irM ohall be amended lIS foUowl : An approved au10mahC sprinlder system l/wl! 

Ix ~uired U1Id wUl/led in "ew build"'gs and ,'rue"'r,,", 3600 sq>UI"" f U I or grealer wlren 

colUlNded or reloct>led willou. Iloejurisdiction Os descn"bod in Secfiom903.2.1 throulifJ 903.2.12. 

BxcqHlolI: Agr-icul",,...1 buildings not under 0 Jpeciol ... ~ pumil Wledfor collt1lte1'ci<ll pUrpostl 

993,1,1 Wbeu Reqllired shall be added a. roDows: S/(UItS of exisll"g buildingl gffllier Ihon 3,600 

S'l1Uln jUt. /n autin, buildingJ 3,60/)''1'',,1'1 foel 91' gntJlet", OIher rJoan OIIt and IWO-fomi/ydwt./Iu.g 

unll4, aIIli ogri=/IU .... I buildin~ 1101 under ,pecia/use pennitfor commemal purpa<eJ, wll~n 1M 

floo1' anti of Ille building 01' J/T1l<:lun it incNtJSN by an tuidi/ion of mon I~(JII IMrty percent (J~ 

or 1,()()() squore feel wIoic/teYv i,l"",,, ,,,,,11 buildiJ>g Or Itnu:lure ,""II Ix mtlde 10 Cl»I/c»'m 19 SectIoII 

9()3.2. 

?03,1.b "''hr'" RlNuirn! .1 .. 11 be: • .wed ... fullow. : SiuJN> uf tal.>ling buildjny;1 Iu, lloun J,6Qt) 

squ_ /eel. In ui$ting buildingr 3,600 sqUiJn /eel or lUI, "'Ioer 1""11 Oftf<QM fW<>..fomJ/y dwelliq 

un;fI, olld ogricullJU"al buildings not uMer speciolwe permilfor C"Ommt!rcjoJ purpa<fI, wItere lite 

floor a,..,,,, of I~e building Or IINd"n ;., il'lCYfaled w 0 lOIollquare jooJagt OWr 3,600 sq_"" ful, 

by an tlddilUm of more lIIanlloirty percent (3(mJ or 1,000 IquOTe feel, ..michn>U 11Ie.u, Stich building 

01' /lrucIW't ,"aI/ix mtJde 10 ronform 10 Section 903.2. 

9(1;),;,1 Grope A shall be amended as follows for A groups A-I through A-4: 903.2, 1.1 (1) The fi~ 

area exceeds 3,600 rquonfeet. 

29),1.3 Group E shall be amended as folloM!: 903.2.3 (I) Throughout aU Group E fire amIS greaser 

thaD 3, 6IXhqlllln fUI in area. 

903.1.1 Groap F-I shall be amended.., follows: 903.2.4 Orol,lp F, 903,2.4 (I) A Group F fire.,.,. 

excecdl3, 600 SqlilJn feel . 

903.1.7 Gl"9pp M shall be amcDClal as foliowl; 903,2,7 Group B and M. 903.2.7 (I) A Group B and 

M flte _ exC«.d.l 3,600lqlillnf«t. 

903.1.!!.1 Manufuturtd HOlD"" !Wall be added as followa: ,1/. all/onwtic fire sprinJ:kr 1)I$lellllitoll 

Ix ""'PDred i" all ""'" lIIlUIllj"fJCttInd Iwmu and multi-family lII01I,ifacfWed Ioomes inU/.ded for rue 

as a --.d two-/ami/y dwelll",. "If design and IltSloJlotion of lucit #jIlltl'4l ,""U be I" acconlonot 

wil" CDJifornla Code if ReguiatioltS, TItle 15, §4300. 

&wepWIIIS: 

Ordinance 2019-01 

I. M01IUfoclllred homes iOCtlted willoln an ubtfng mabileltome park complying willi 

CDlifor?l;Q HtQlt" o,w Stif~ty Code, DIvision 13, Pan 1. 1 or 1.3. 

l. Manrlj=fII,ed II"",,,", 1111# do ItOl tJCcud 1,200 sqlWTt feel i" size and Itrve as on 

accusory dIwlllnK .. nil, 01 defined III Govern""",1 Code Section 658501; wll"" 1M 

Page 7 

  20-0203 M Page 11 of 36



C):i::itillg primary on the nI'l'H1P'rn! is 1/ot required to comply with California 

Residential Code Section R3J3.2. 

3. Mam!factured that do not 320 square feel in size . 

.;;,.;:;.;==-..:;;;.::...::;..;:;:..<:-=-..;:. shall be amended as follows: 903.2.9 S. 903.2.9 (]) A Group S arca 

exceeds 3,600 squarejeet. 

~~~~~~~~~~~==~~~~~~~ 
shall be amended as follows: 10 (I) Where 

the fIre area of the enclosed garage \Ch''''''''.U'' 3,600 square/eel. 

Section 907 I;'in.' Alarm and Detection SYstems 

~.:...::.:::.:..:::.....::...:.c=~:..::..::::.::a..:::.::..:...::,-=--'-'c..::...:.:c..:;.::.==""",",,-=,-=:..::..;;;;:..:..:..=...;=-=~:....:..:.=:...=..:.:.;.:.-,,--,,.!C:.::.::.:...::....:.:= S lla 11 be added 

as follows: All approved fire alarm/detectioll 

area less than 3,600 square feet. 

shall be installed in all buildings with a jloor 

!;xceptiofl.f>: 

J. and two-family dvvellillgs Occupancies and other 'runnnr:,p<: classified 

as "U'). 

2. Agricultural buildings not under ,\pecia/ use permit and/or not used for commercial 

purposes (e.g.) retails sales,food service, and/or ~pecial events). 

3. Buildings with area less than 500 may be as determined 

the Fire or his/her duly authorized represemative. based on building 

construction material and features, location, occupancy type, and 

exposures. 

to 

~.:...::.::.!""---",-,-:::.:...::.:;:..,,;'::..:....==;..:.;..o~==~ shall be added as follows: III existing without an 

approved automatic sprinkler system, other than one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultural 

building no/ under special lise permit for commercial purposes where detection system 

does not exist and the floor area of the building or structure is increased or modified more than 

thirty percent (30%) or J, 000 whichever is less, such or structure shall be made 

to conform to 907 when required by the Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative. 

Buildings with afloor area than 500 may as determined by the Fire 

or his/her duly authorized representative, based on building construction materials and features, 

location, occupancy type, and distance to exposures. 

907.2.(' Monitoring shall he as follows: Allfire alal'midetection systems shall be connected 

directly through and monitored by a UL approved central, proprietary or remote station service, 

which audible and visual signals at a constantly attended location, All sprinlJered buildings 

shall be monitored. 

Exceptiolls: 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 8 

  20-0203 M Page 12 of 36



I o..~ and two-jamily ~/lingl (R·J Ocoqx:ltCkl aNi ",10" tlCCtiPQnCfe, darsiji«J 

as HU~). 

1 Agricu1l14ral buildlltgs no{ UMn- Ipte/alwe ptmm tmtl/.,.. '101 und for COftUJIettial 

pliT]XJSe3 (e.g .. retails _Itl. j<>Oti seMCt/!, and/or IptL'ial rKt:IIUj 

297.2,d Ivpe! 1100<1 10rtall.tloA' ~ll be added as follow .. · "/lie rrqraWlltN ofllllltJJlalWtt" ~ 

repioCtl!fM:m. of a Typt / Hood Syslem 110011 I"tqujn a fin olO17ll!sprinkJer ",,,,,II"""", syn_ ro be 

;IIII0/l,d. or for Ihe haaJ S)'$lem 10 be ~ 10 "" auuIIsfire alanlllJpriII!1er -",oring.",_ 

for Ihtll build/II,. 

?!)7.(i,U Suoad.D' Power Sopply dlall be added as {ollows: /11 actXNda~ ... tlo NFPA 72. 1M 

leC<Jndary po_, ¥lif'p/y providing a m;II'''' ..... 24_hour ~ cap«ily IINkr qui_llood (.",_ 

optrol/"g /11 a __ alt1l7ll condit/an) ,Iulll be_ItdetJ ilia minimum 71.Jwou ,--capacity. 

~pdo,.: 17te ulsle1lCC of all '-rgello/ /x>d;-l'p ~r supply IItoI __ or extud 1M 

~,re",tlll3 of c../ifumlo Fire Catk Cltopter 11. 

Ch.pter 11 

S«";IJQ! 1203 ~:lIItWllCY aDd Stapdby POl!K SISt.." 

110~,1.J !"taU.tiol Ih.tJI be IIDaIded as (01loW$! Emeaeax:)' power f)'$Icm5 md st&Dciby pow« 

.)'Itemt shall be mstflJ1ed In ~ ... 1Ib the CalIfornia Buildiar: Code, !be Califonwr. l::lcdric 

Code, NI'PA 110 aDd NJ-l'A III. All buiwu.,p, tXlIu lhot< OIW- OIUI_jOllllIy ~IIIIIg II1I/U, """ 

lI~etJ/Iiro1 build/lip _ 0414 fW __ r-C:UrJ ~u. ...vlo lumdby power. Ilullliwrvc a 1111"" /rip 

dfflct llull dUCOI"O«.H~JI ~ ~ ro I/w build/'¢. IlPP' o.ttI by dot fin .,.,. official. bUtI", 

iMltlUal/OM ,Iulll be "'O'"'tl""j III ~ willo IIot oriKi-1 "I'fI"OWl1 

ScWo1 3310 Am .. for firtfl,,,,IC 

D1U PIea!!! IdcatllklUOI eball be ~ .. follow.: PritJ, 10 -' dw1", C"tHI.I'mocriOfI, "" 

opprowd oddrullip ,MJI be provitJtJ tll wdtfi" tJNJ e_r-p""Y wIIkl, II<XUJ road miry 1"'0 

llot PlVitcl 

SullO! 3m Wlltt SlAmV for fire frol"*a 

nil,! WMI Rrotlml Ib.ll be MneIldcd I. folio."..: Prior 10 rombflSt/b/, IrIIIltrIDll IIrrivillg 011 

,;It, 1M fin Ioydrortt _,.,. 1)'1_ 111011 M WillI/ttl tlM """/IIllli"'" III CO/tIi __ Opv"QI/OII. 1"114 

QJfIQWI/ of water ~PIkd ,4<111_ IIw ~ fil'ljlow for I~' proJu •. 

Page iii 

  20-0203 M Page 13 of 36



be added as RFPD may 

This 

the local CAL FIRE Unit Area 

Dorado. 

or U.hic-tifHJi as a minimum, 

will necessitate that the entire 

anyone year 

as a minimum. 

retardeant treated and or or \·,.,Il'rUIP .... are not 1I1TJ,..-"",un as 

a A /H'4~Dl"lVl"j';J 

50 

added as or cost r~~IHI,rtnJt 

hazardous materials constituent debt ~A...""r"", any 

such person, firm or I"r>:I"J"I/'lI"I""hr:, ... This debt by the Fire 

or in same manner as in case 

under contracl, L),\'o,\,'.o<'<'£,,1 or "fJ,v .. ' ......... 

Section 105.6 and 

amended as foHows: as set 

..... K .......... ~ ........ in accordance with this section. 'If/here eXJOl(,).w;es nO~''''?JH' are 

or 

as AHJ 

the Fire 

10 

  20-0203 M Page 14 of 36



hnphl 

Sectioll_5iO.:t ~tonll!£ 

~~..:;:.-:.::...:~:;.::...::-"-'::.;.;;..::.:..:.:='-"--'-'-:::...:..::~."==_:..."-~,,-==-=-:::.=;;;;:::c~:::.:.(' PI ohihitl'd slu,l] ht al!lcllJvd il~ jnllow;;: 

IW1~~ outside is plOhibihd 

the Fire Chief, or his/her dull' authorized rcpresentmivf. When hy 

Fire or his/her duh aUfhorized representative. all abol'(: ground tUIlk(:,;) or vault im/allalionl 

.for Iht: :,to/(J)!L' of C/ass I, JJ 01 III flammahle alld comhllsTihle liquids shall comply wilh Iho,l( 

requirements as set Jorlh Ca/i[oniia Fire California Fife shall also apply lu 

in<'(ulialiol/.l other than motor dispensin.!!. slat ions 11'h('l'(: ahove-gmlllld is required 

::::"':"===~===:.:l:-:":"':'=~:"'::':;;:':::"':''::::''''===~==:'':::'::''':::'''''!;'''!''=~= shall amended as follows: 

flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is 

unless approved by the Fire Chiej, or hislher du~v authorized represelltative. When 

rhe Fire Chief, or hislher du~v authorized representative, all above ground /(/lIk(\) v}' 

vault insfallativIIsfvr flit· I, 11 or and liquids shall complv 

Wilh requirements as sci Jorth by the California The shall also 

to installaliom' ollieI' (han motor vehicleJild 

is required. 

sllllfUns when:, abuve-ground storage 

,>"""'n""'" as follows: of flammable .... n."-." .. """ fluids in stationary 

outside of buildmgs is prohibited unless approved by the or hislher duly 

representative, When permitted hy Fin Chief, or hislher du~v authorized 

all slatiollmy conlainers Jor the oj flammable cryogenic fluids shall comply 

as the California Fire Code. The Fire Code shall also 

10 insrallalions o(Iier motor vehicle filet UL,oe,,,, station.'> where 

61 

be amended as follows: The 

oj liquefied petroleum gas i 11 exce,u oj all of 2,000-gal Ion water 'when located at 

one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated Jor residential use and at least one-half 

(J 12) mile }rom existing residential development with a density greater than one (J) dwelling unit per 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 11 

  20-0203 M Page 15 of 36



acre at mile frum any hotel or motel is 

use is issued by the 

established limits. Within the limits established 

gas the protectioll of heavily populated or 

of anyone installation shalll/ot exceed a water capacity 

of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2, (){)O-gallon water 

AID appruved, and a 

the Iwr"'UHI 0/ 

T7le dispensing 

when located 

at lewa mile from property zoned or designated for 

residential development \vilh a density 

flP'''"111 use and at least onc-

hal/(l12) than one (I) dv.!ellillg u/Jit 

per acre at least one-half (l12) mile/rom any hotel or motel is allowed ",.'hen approved and 

a use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado. 

added as follows: 

~~~~~~~~~~= 
shall be added as follows: Permits shall and plans be 

underground tank installations as approved the AH). 

~~~==.!...I:t.;!...:!..:=~~:;;;::""'::":':':=-==""'-=~ shall be added as 

shall be prohibited }rom being sold to end-users and shull be retained 

!Ylt:rorarl~"""J LPG tanks 

LPG company a 

to ensure proper annual maintenance are mel alld recorded, 

so 

Amended Sections as follows: 

Add Section 4.7 to read as follows: 

==-<=.::....;::;.;::.:.~"-"'-.:.::..==-.;.:.;.. Residential/ire sprinkler systems installed in all new one-and two-family 
"Passh'e Purge" system design unless otherwise approved by the Code 

Manufactured home installed, tested and approved by lhe Ca/(fornia Department of 
and Community Development. 

5.1 .1.2 to read as follows: 

.::=:.:::.&==--.:::..:::..:....::...:..:=-=-:...::....::.=;:.:;.;:...:;;;.:.;=-=-=.= A suppli' of at least olle of each type and TPll'ln<'f'n 

within the 

be 

shall be maintained on the property at an approved location. 

acces.~ible cabinet. in a rtI()!unteu 

Revise Section 7.6 to as foIlO\\'s: 

=.::=..==-..::.::=!....:....;..:,-=-,-"-,,-,,-,,,,-,-..:...:.=A local waterflow alarm shall be provided un 

humes at an "'ny""·,,,,,,,·n location on the exterior of the dwelling. 

Uevise 11.2.1.1 to read as follows: 

IrOiltlanCe 2019-01 

used 

shall 

ill 

12 

  20-0203 M Page 16 of 36



, , 
CblP!tt 19. Nt.,,,, PD. II.U. ! Wb~ a 1m dcpa.rtmen! pumper c:onnedion is J\OI providod, lb. 

l)'Slem shill be b~,caJty _ed II " ...;"j_ prull»'f of J 50 poIiI/th ~ Iqwan I"c~ g<lu~fOl' 110 

I~ Utmt II J()..",i",,~ iIwnItitM willlOu, rvfdt1tCf of I~, .st.c. Itlll/tiJ1I k wilneJUd by rhl /iFf codt 

oJfoc ... f. 

Appeadu B _ Fln Flow R",uinm~ld. for Bllildin,' 

M "" "" , • . 0, .. • N.' , .. " 
I""" 1 1 

Fl'R&-n.DW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM ".ow 
CALCULATION SPRlNKI.I;:R ~·IR&. DURATION 

AR ... SVS'f1l:M nnw ....~) 

(.'1 •• .., fffl) <- (pllol. per 

S. ... d.l.rd) .... ,,' 
0_3,WO ~ IU'''''''';'' '.~ 

, --3,601 ond _, .. ~ ... - ,,- '" ~ '" opriakla" ryso..., ,- ''''' BIOS.l(l) BIOS.lm • 
1M ...... ---0 MOO ~ IlOl.)LJ - • 

cI tI"e CIt Fn ",. , 
Cede Of SectiGD 

) I J.l '" 11M CIt 
R • I Mol C<>do 

).601 ... ..- s-.. !lOl.ll') '" - ~ , 
d .... CAf ... ,- , 
CooIo Of Se<rioo 810:5 .1(2) 
3 tH 01 11M CA ( .... ,~ 

• , ~"" "'" 
Table 810$,2 8rqy&m:1 fln tlow (or Bpodlpg. "Ibn Ibn Qoe- IDd Tw2::Flmlly 

Dwdllpll. Goup B-3. apd 8-1 BllildluQ IRd IowpbouI" shall beamcnded u follows: 

AUTOMATIC MINIMUM "... FLOW DURATION 

llPRIHKI.F.R SVSTEM ".oW (boan) 

(DHIp SUMard) (I .... o. ... 'IIIIDIII.) 

N. ..-..cit ..... '" ,,- '" Tabl. o.nti"" in T.t>Ie 81 OS.I(2) 

.- BIOS.I(2) 

Seo::tKwI 9OJ.3 U or",," CA _ JeM oflbo voluo In Dlrdioo iD Tobie B1OH(2) 
FiRCode Table 9 1011 .1 (2)' .t die red_ Iloto .-

Secboa !Ol.l12 or 1ho CA _ j/N"' ........ in o...ticm '" Tobie 91OS.I(2) 
FintCode T.bk 9105 .1(2) ....... red_Dow .. 

Ordinance 2019.{)1 

  20-0203 M Page 17 of 36



That 

Ifany 

any 

Dnenl[UX D r~ir(' nnoC.lrt.lTI'Ii.: Access Roads 

in 

Puhlic Resource 

access roads and tire 

the AHJ or the El 

shall be amended as follows: 

Manual 

Imnimum 

ht' amended as 

not 

, J¥herc a 

gate i.\" the gate width shall he no/ less 'han 20 J¥here (J 

apparllllis road cunsist!.> a divided the !'t'idth shall nol be less than 15 

=-:::....;:;.;;;;=;.;;;;"",;=;.;;;;;;.;:=-.::;;..;;......;;;..;:;..~-..;;;...;;;..;;;:...::.-.::..:;;;;;.......;..;...;;..;;;,;;..;;.;;;;; shall be anlenloe:Q as Fire as ........ .., .. "" .. ~~ In 

Section 0103.6 shall be side fire access roads that are 20 to 29 wide 

be aIllemJea as lane as 

on one side of access roads more than 29 

feet wide and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 

::;....::.;..::::.....:::.-::-~=-=...::=:.:..::.::....:::...::.::.::.::..:;;...:....::~.;:....:...::..L:...I~;...;;.;..;...:::::..:::....:...::::...;=-=....:;:.=...:.;......::..;;...;~;;.;;. sha II be as 

code 

II structure Gnd 

No. 2016-01 of the 

a continuous means 

and all orcllnan(~es or 

constructed to encompass the 

vehicle acces.\. 

.... H .. ' .............. .., herewith are 

sentence, or of this or 

a court decision 

Ordinance and each .:>"' .... UVH;;), sut)Se:Cllons. or " .. I''l.I''lI",,,<::<. 

have enacted 

sentences, 

of the fact that one or more them is 

14 

  20-0203 M Page 18 of 36



, 
• 

SEC'llON 6: EffECTIVE PATE ANP PUBLICATION 

TIIu ~ .a.Jl taU erre« Ihuty (30) day..fter IU adopllOll. 1m: Rl-l'O Bo.rd S«'retary I. dl.eo;:taIlD 

publi:sll thiI on!,_ ... KWJPIIPU of eencnI c,rru!.bOrIlII the lMtnct_ In lie.. ofpubli ... 1ioa ortlle t.llllat 

of the onhnanc~ llUIILIIIM)' of do<: ordtnaIIcc IU)' be publlIhcd by \lie by Ihe Board Sec;'e\af)' ,..,t!un fifleen (lS) 

d.IyI.tIcr ,Up.. .... IlIId. 0Irtlfied C(l9y au be po.ted LD!be olTlCC oflhc: RFPD punuaJll 10 ao.......-CoM 
s«nCM J69JJ(c} (I) 

The aboYe O"h_ ...... IDV'Odl>c:ed" • m«:tini of lhc: Bo.rd of l>irecton oflbe RFPD 011 Oelnbcr~, 2019, 

and " wu Ibm r~ for the fint IUIlC A pubhc hcarm, wu Ict for lheOrth ... ..,., 10 be read for tbo: ICOOnclliJM 

011 N(M:IIlber J), 2019 and approved by the: followlIl8 vote: 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the 9Mrd ofo.rccll.'lr1l of tile RFPD thot, (~ dlyof IJoJavb.c 2019 

AYES: '5 
NOES: -e 
ABSerr, .e 
ABSTAIN: e 

OrdinaDt:e 2019-01 Plit 15 

  20-0203 M Page 19 of 36



Fire Code Amendment What Is the Change? Locally adopted I SFM adopted I Amended Why Is There a Local Change? 
101.1 Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Administrative need 

Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance 

106.6 Add seCtion Locally created and adopted 
of fees to cover actual costs. Saction 106.6 defines 
permits, plan chacks, and inspections as allowed in Health 
&Safety Code 17951. 

106.6.1 Add section Locally created and adopted 
Saction 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to 
the Fire District. 

106.7 Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspections by contractors. 

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District 
is added to read as follows: 
109.4 Appeal Procedures and TImelines • The intent of this 
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an 

109.4 Added section 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals 
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County of EI Dorado's 
Vegetation Managment Ordinance Board of Appeals 
timeline. 

Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that 
Completed the section by filling in the blank portions that were protects life and property. Fees have been updated to match 

110.4 not completed by the SFM. It is better left to localities to Locally adopted and amended the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the District 
determine the fees/penalties for their respective areas. Attomey's Office. The change to the language to include the 

term infractions. 

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s), 

110.4.2 
Added Saction 110.4.2. (This section existed before but under 

Locally adopted and amended 
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 

a different number) violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health and Safety Code of the State of California and 
Chapter 5c (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank portions that were 
All violations of the code have been consiladated under 

112.4 not completed by the SFM. It is better left to localities to SFM adopted and amended locally 
Section 110.4 determine the fess/penalties for their respective areas. 

Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District, 

202 Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopted 
Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd 
Manager. Defintion of campfire shall not include LPG or 
Propane fueled appliances. 

302.1 Added definition for Campfire to Saction Locally adopted and amended Added for clarity 

Due to the high fire danger that exists in EI Dorado County 
307.4.4 through 307.4.2.2 (d) Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally adopted and amended we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires 

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas. 

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical 
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for 
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus 
components. It also allows an extended time frame before 

Changed vertical clearances to 15 feet and road widths to 20 
having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional 

503.2.1 Locally adopted and amended height for vegetation clearances acts as an increased buffer 
feet for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of 

shoulders, as measured face of curb to face of curb is 
needed. These structures can be difficult to navigate with 
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the total 
drivable road surface 

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the Fire 
Fire apparatus require areas for tuming around when 

Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations to match as they 
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This 

503.2.5 require tumarounds for fire apparatus access roads and Locally adopted and amended includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides 

driveways. better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum 
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

  20-0203 M Page 20 of 36



Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated Surfaces to 
Surfaces of EI Dorado County and Appendix 0 of the 

503.2.6 state and match EI Dorado County Transportation Division Locally adopted and amended 
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be 

instead of AASHTO HB-17. consistent throughcut county agencies and is allowed as an 
alternate means & methods that is net less restrictive than 
the Fire Code. 

503.4.2 Added section regarding ne parking in fire lanes Locally created and adopted 
This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes" 
rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicle Code. 

503.4.3 Added section regarding nO parking in front of hydrants Locally created and adopted 
This section clearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire 
hydrants" rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle 
Code. 

This section clearly defines California Fire Code Appendix 
503.4.4 Added section regarding fire lanes basad on road width Locally created and adopted o as the reference for road lane width and their relation to 

fire lanes. 

Created and adopted 503.4.5 to maintain emergency access 
Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on 

503.5.3 and consistency through all roadway gates in EI Dorado Locally created and adopted roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing 

County, referring to the gate standards adopted by the FPO's. the best possible emergency access to maintain fast 
response times. 

505.1 Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of buildings Locally adopted and amended 
Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing 
based on the District's addressing standards. 

Commercial properties are required to install hydrants at 
Added more conservative standard for the placement of 

507.5.1 Locally amended 
300 foot intervals, thus they shculd never be outside of 150 

hydrant and their relationship to commercial buildings feet from any given hydrant at anytime (hail the distance in 
between). 

Buildings are getting more sizable in the county. It is more 
common to have new buildings with solar arrays that 
continue to generate power even when the buildings general 

Added verbiage to bring all of the necessary fire controls for a 
509.3 Locally added 

utillities have been shut off. When there is an emergency, it 
building to one location. is vital that we have rapid access to all of the controls in one 

location for public evacuation and firefighter safety. Due to 
the fire danger present in EI Dorado County throughout 
most of the year, this change is appropriate and advisable. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation in new of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

903.2 buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or greaterwithin the Locally amended 
increased response times, aiong with the fact that fires 

district. double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater than 3,600 of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

903.2.a square feet to install sprinklers if they add more than 30% or Locally created and adopted 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

1,000 square feet to the structure, whichever is less. double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds occupant protection for existing buildings less than of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

903.2.b 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they add more than Locally created and adopted 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

30% or 1,000 square feet to the structure, whichever is less. double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

These sections were created to give specific direction on the of EI Doredo County and their contributing factors to our 

903.2.1,903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7 sprinkler requirements based on occupancy and square Locally adopted and amended 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

footage double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of spread. 

  20-0203 M Page 21 of 36



Manufacb.ued Homes - The Intent of this code section is to 
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two-
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found In 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar 
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban 

903.2.8.2 This section was created to include manufactured residential 
Locally created and adopted 

interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption 
single family R-3 in the residential sprinkler program due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The 

rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a 
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk 
sucessfully in many Caifomia communities. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

These sections were created to give specific direction on the of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 903.2.9, 903.2.10 sprinkler requirements based on occupancy and square Locally adopted and amendad 
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers footage 
to be installed in structures once they reech 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of spread. 

Added occupant protection for fire alarms in buildings with a 
Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.a floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG buildings not used 
Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Rre Department notifICation in for commercial purposes, and buildings with a floor area of 

the event of a fire or smoke. less than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code official. 

Added occupant protection for existing buildings without 
Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.b 
automatic sprinkler systems to install a fire alarm ~ they add 

Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notifICation in more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the structure, 
the event of a fire or smoke. whichever is less. 

upant protection by stating all fire alarm detection 
Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.c 
installad shall be connected to a monitoring service 

Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in that notifies the fire department upon activation and is 
the event of a fire or smoke. installed per Section 907 of the fire code. 

Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood systems to be Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
907.2.d connected to a monitored fire alarm system when installed or Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

replaced. the event of a fire or smoke. 

907.6.2.1 Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply Modification Locally created and adopted 
Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E 
safety related power outages. 

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to 
1203.1.3 Shunt trip power safety devices SFM adopted and amended locally ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up 

power supplies 

3310.3 Address requirements for construction sites Locally created and adopted 
Addressing for construction sites is important to assist 
responding emergency crews. 

3312.1 
Water supplies at construction sites with combustible 

SFM adopted and amended locally 
Water must be on site prior to combustible material being 

materials on-site stored or vertical construction commencing. 

EI Dorado County has a siginifcant fire danger throughout 

4903.1 
This section was created to include Fire Proctection Plan for 

Locally created and adopted 
the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire 

all fire hazard severity zones. Protection Plan due to climatic, geological, and 
topographical 

This section clarifies that within the boundaries of EI Dorado 
County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are 

4905.4 Added a section to clarify roof construction requirements Locally Created and adopted wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be 
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly. 

Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate. 

5001.7 
Any damages or costs from negligent practices that cause a 

Locally created and adopted 
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 

hazardous materials incident will cause a cost recovery fee. process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the 
negligent parties. 

Added safety protection with permits being issued by both the Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and 
5601.2 Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for explosives, and by the SFM adopted and amended locally fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding 

Rre Chief and the Board of Supervisors for fireworks. of the applications they will be used for. 

  20-0203 M Page 22 of 36



The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any 

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make available all 
documenlation including timing and proprielary information 

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 requested documentation pertaining to the firework Locally created and edopted 
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they 
deem necessary. This information is understood to be 

presentation 
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as 
such. 

Eslablished limits as required by the Rre Code for Class I 

5704.2.9.6.1 Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM edopted and amended locally 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
SpeciallConditionai Use Permit from the County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5706.2.4.4 Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM edopted and amended locally 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid special 
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval 
and a SpeciallConditional Use Permit from the County. 

5806.2 Administrative addition of District name Locally adopted and amended Administrative need to add District name 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code Official for 

5806.2.1 Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted and amended locally 
Rammable Cryogenic fluidS in stationary containers. 
Requires AHJ approval and a Special!Conditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

Eslablishes distances between LPG storage and 
dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential 

Eslablished limits for LPG storage and dispensing near or 
developments and high-density hotels, motel, apartments, 

6104.2 SFM adopted and amended locally etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would 
adjacent to residential development 

have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death. 
Requires AHJ approval and a SpeciallConditionai Use 
Permit from the County. 

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground 
tanks: 

6113.1 
Permits and plans shall be submitted and approved by the 

Locally created and adopted 
Allows us to require plans be submitted lor review prior to 

AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction). installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks 
require substantial maintenance including inspection and 
anode replacement at regular intervals. 

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without 

6113.2 
Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the property of 

Locally created and adopted 
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when 

the LPG company said to the end user. This does not apply to above ground 
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected. 

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench 
on-site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water 

Chapter 80, NFPA,130-16 NFPA 130-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the District flow alarm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in 

Sections 4.7, 5.1.1.2, 7.6, has been amended to update various provisions pertaining to 
Locally amended 

the event of water activation in a vacant structure, and 

and 11.2.1.1 the installation of sprinkler systems in one-and tv.\:l-family hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 13D 
dwellings. sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water 

damage from pipe failure, and the addition of a passive-
purge system. 

We changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot 
Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 

Appendix B: Table B105.1(1) 
elevation, to match fire tiow precedents used in EDC for years 

SFM adopted and amended locally to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 
used for over a decade in EDC. 

We made a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM, below 5000 
Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 

Appendix B: Table B105.2 
foot elevation, for all commercial projects 

SFM adopted and amended locally to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 
used for over a decade in EDC. 

Appendix D: D103.1 Made an exception for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended 
It is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to 
construct a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant. 

Title 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways. 
Appendix D: D103.2 State law requires no greater than 16% grade Locally adopted and amended In our EI Doredo County Title 14 adoption we allow greater 

than 16% grade with AHJ approval and hard surface. 

Appendix D: D103.3 Text to include curbs and gutters Locally adopted and amended 
20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutters due 
to potential access issues and tuming redius concems. 

Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided 
Appendix D: D103.5 § 1 Fire apparatus access road gates Locally adopted and amended roadway the gate wiidth shall not be lass than 15 feet due to 

radius issues. 

  20-0203 M Page 23 of 36



No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.1 Roads widths 20 to 29 feet locally adopted and amended 
in width above 5000 feet. lower than 5000 feet this does 
not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire 
Code Appendix 0 section 103.6.1 for all other elevations. 

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet 
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.2 Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36 feet in width locally adopted and amended elevation. lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The 
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix 0 
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations. 

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 

Appendix 0: 0104.4 Added to require circumferential fire apparatus access roads locally created and adopted 
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire 
structure and shall provide a continuous means of 
emergency vehicle access. 

Removed the wording that limited the section to 30 dwelling 
For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 
units. residents and first responders. 

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 
Appendix 0: 0107.1 Adopted 0107.2 Remoteness in this section. locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

residents and first responders. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.2 through 101.5 Adopted to establish scope, intent, severability and validity Locally adopted Administrative clarity 

102.6 through 102.8 References, Subjects not regulaled by the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

102.10 through 102.12 Conflicting provisions, Other Laws, Application of references locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

103.1 through 103.4.1 Definition of the Fire Prevention Division Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
104.1 Ability to enforce the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
104.3 through 104.4 Right of Entry, Warrants, and Identification locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
104.6 through 104.6.4 Record retention locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
104.8 through 104.9.2 Modifications, a1temate means and methods, and test locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.11 through 104.11.2 Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of systems locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.11.3 Authority of systems and devices inoperable locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
105.2.3 TIme limitation of application locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
105.3.1 through 105.3.2 Operational permits locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.6.12 
Dry cleaning operational permits required for hazardous locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
cleaning solvent use 

Permits for various business operations for. Magnesium, 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life 
miscellaneous combustible storege, mobile food 

105.6.2.28 through 105.6.35 locally Adopted preparation vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing facilities, open 
safety inspections 

buming, open flames and torches, open flames and 
candles, and organic coatings 

105.6.37 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and Ine locally Adopted Permits for places of assembly 
safety inspections 

105.6.39 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life locally Adopted Permits for private fire hydrants 
safety inspections 

Permits for pyroxylline plastics, refrigeration equipment 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life 

locally Adopted 
repair garages and motor fuel-dispensing facilities, rooftop 

safety inspections heliports, spraying or dipping, storage of scrap tires and 
tire by-products 

105.6.48 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life locally Adopted Permit for tire-rebuilding plants 
safety inspections 

105.6.50 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life 

locally Adopted 
Permit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material, 

safety inspections lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 cubic feet) 

106.1 through 106.3 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life locally Adopted Fee schedules for permits 
safety inspections 

107.1 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life 

locally Adopted Inpection authority 
safety inspections 

Mantenance of safeguards, testing and operation of 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life 
eqUipment, re-inspectlon and testing, recordkeeplng, 

108.1 through 109.3 
safety inspections 

locally Adopted supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding, 
Board of Appeals established, limitations on authority, and 
qualifications 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life locally Adopted 

Compliance with orders and notices, prosecution of 
safety inspections violations, and unauthorized tampering 

  20-0203 M Page 24 of 36



110.4.1 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life locally Adopted Abatement of violation 
safety Inspections 

113.1 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life locally Adopted Authority to disconnect service utilities 
safety inspectiOns 

Asphalt kettles contain highly flammable substances and 
303.1 through 303.9 Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and 

topographicel) 

Managing ignition sources through responsible application 
305.1 throuogh 305.5 Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted of standards will reduce the number of fires in various 

settings (Climatic, geological, and topographicel) 

Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY 
306.1 through 306.2 Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted flammable and require special handling (Climetic, 

geological, and topographical) 

307.1 through 307.5 Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
Open burning, recreational fire, and portable outdoor 
fireplaces, (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.1 Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
Open flame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
Throwing or placing of ignition sources, torches for 
removing paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

locations near combustible, open flame devices, signals 
and merkers, portable fuel open-flame devices, sky-

308.1.5 through 308.1.8 (excluding 
Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 

lanterns, religious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming 
308.1.4) food and beverage preparation, dispensing, containers not 

in use, serving of flaming food, location, fire protection 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.2 Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
Permits are required for above section (Climatic, geological, 
and topographical) 

Group A occupencies open-flame decorative devices, 
308.3 through 308.4.1 Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted theatrical performances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 

dormatories (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

310.1 Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to smoking (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

310.3 Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
'No Smoking' signs (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with "No Smoking' 
31Q.4 through 310.8 Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted signs, ash trays, burning objects, hazardoous environmental 

conditions. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Vacant premises condition and safety requirements, 
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safegaurding vacant 

311.1 through 311.4 Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted premises, security, fire protection, fire seperation, removal 
of combustibles, removal of hazardous materials. (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

319.1 Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to mobile food preparation 
vehicles. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

319.2 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life 

locally Adopted 
Permits for mobile food preperation vehicles (Climatic, 

safety inspections geological, and topographical) 

  20-0203 M Page 25 of 36



Exhaust hood, fire protection, fire protection for cooking 
equpiment, fire extinguisher, appliance connection to fuel 
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, metallic 
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking oil 
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting, 
nonnal vents, emergency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum 
aggregate volume, protection of container, LP-gas container 

319.3 through 319.10.3 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted construction, protection of system piping, LP-gas alanns, 
CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel, 
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG 
container construction, CNG containers supplying 
lransporation and cooking fuel, protection of system piping, 
methane alarms, maintenance, exhuast system, fire 
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems. 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1 
403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 Adopted this section for fire and lITe safety Locally Adopted (residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and 

fire safety plans. 

Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, molel) occupancied 
403.10 through 403.10.1.3 Adopted this section for fire and lITe safety Locally Adopted Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic, 

geological, and topographical) 

405.5 Adopted this section for fire and lITe safety Locally Adopted Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

510.3 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life 

Locally Adopted 
A pennit is required for emergency responder radio systems 

safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life 

Locally Adopted maximunm amount of flammable wall coverings in 
safety inspections educational facilities (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical) 

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5 

903.2.1.5 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life 

Locally Adopted 
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers) 

safety inspections (Climalic, geological. and topographical) greater than 1000 
square feet. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Emergency Rasponder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders 
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffIC to and from 
each other and the emergency dispatch center. lime 
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 

1103.2 
Adopted tihis section for the safety of firefighters and other 

Locally Adopted phasing in of a system over a period of time, detennined by 
emergency responders. tihe fire code offICial, is acceptable. The rationale behind 

this section is tihat on almost all emergency responder injury 
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected with tihe addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas tihat do not have 
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0101.1 through Adopted tihis section for the safety of the public, firefighters, 
Locally Adopted General requirements for fire apparatus access roads 

0102.1 and otiher emergency responders. including loads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, firefighters, Dead end fire apparatus access road requirements for a 
Appendix 0: 0103.4 

and other emergency responders. 
Locally Adopted tum around at 150 feet. (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0103.6 
Adopted tihis section for the safety of the public, firefighters, 

Locally Adopted "No Parking, Fire Lane' signs requirements. (Climatic, 
and otiher emergency responders. geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0104.1 through Adopted tihis section for the safety of the public, firefighters, 
Locally Adopted 

Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus 
0104.3 (excluding exception) and otiher emergency responders. access roads. (Climalic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0105.1 tihrough Adopted this section for the safety of the public, firefighters, 
Locally Adopted Requirements for arial fire apparatus access roads 

0105.4 and otiher emergency responders. (Climalic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 tihrough Adopted tihis section for the safety of the public, firefighters, 
Locally Adopted 

Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential 
0106.3 (excluding exceptions) and other emergency responders. developments (ClimatiC, geological, and topographical) 

One- or lwo-dwelling residenital developments shall be 
Appendix 0: 0107.1 tihrough Adopted tihis section for the safety of the public, firefighters, 

Locally Adopted 
equipped tihroughout with two sperate and approved fire 

0107.2 (excluding exception) and otiher emergency responders. apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 
Climatic conditions. 

  20-0203 M Page 26 of 36



Appendix 0: 0108 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, firefighters, 

locally Adopted 
Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction 

and other emergency responders. standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Grey cells are previously 
amended, adopted, or 
changed code sections that 
are being adopted again in 
this code cycle. 
White cells are newly 
amended, adopted, or 
changed code sections that 
differ from previous code 
adoptions. 

  20-0203 M Page 27 of 36



From: ... , 
To: 

Slephal1ie Laytoll "~YlonO~""firedepan~org> 
Moodioy. October 28, 201910:13 AM 
MJrsnall Co. 

Subject: fwd: Confiflllalion of Scheduled Publication: Noti«- of Public ~rill9 - Notice of Intent to Adopt 
2019 Fire Code 

---- fofwaroed mess~e --­
From: Lea;als <1"II~ls@mldemog .. t.net' 
Date: Fri. Oct 25. 2019 .. 111:44 AM 
Subject: Confirmation of Scheduled Publication: Notice of Public fluring - Noti«- of Intent 10 Adopl 2019 Fire ~ 
To: Slephal1ie uyton <slilvton@reKU~flr~deRffl ..... nt,9!!!' 

Confirmation of Scheduled Publication: Notice of Public Hearing· Notice of Intent to Adopt 
2019 Fire Code 

~~ewspaper: Mountain Democrat 
\,}j.]Pub date(s): [.i,.j10f3OJ19, 1111119 
Ref ad#: ~7077 
Charges: $ ~75.00 

Thank yOtJ for publishing in our newspaper, 

Allison Rains - Public Notice~: 
Mountain Democrat - Georgetown Gazette, ~::~:.'~ 
I I • 

On Oct 24. 2019. at 8:28 AM, Stephanie liIyton <r;lavton@rHCUefl<edeHnment.!?!I!>wrote: 

Good morningl 

Plnse publish the .ttached notice In the Mountain Democrat the two eariiest dates possible? 

Think YOU. 
Stephanie 
<PUBLIC !+OnCE Of INITNT 2019.pdf> 

, 

  20-0203 M Page 28 of 36



80-6 ... o~ ·ON UO!:anlos8H Od:lH 

~ ·ON :aU8WI.I:»e:a:av 

I 
If. > 

  20-0203 M Page 29 of 36



, 

RESCUE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

RESOLUTION 2019-08 

Resolution of the Board of Directors Adopting Findings Supporting Amendments to 
the Fire Code 

WHEREAS, the Rescue Fire Protection District Board (Fire Department) 

intends to adopt an ordinance adopting the California Fire Code, 2019 Edition, and 

prescribing regulations governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the 

environment from fire, explosion, hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological and topographical 

conditions existing within the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the 

District to impose more stringent requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code 

pursuant to California Health and Safety Code sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the District 

desires to make express findings to that effect. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Rescue Fire Protection 

District (Fire Department) hereby adopts the following findings concerning current unique 

local conditions that together make each modification to the California Fire Code, 2019 

Edition, reasonably necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life, property 

and the environment. 

CLIMATE 

1. Precipitation. Average annual precipitation ranges from approximately 25 to 32 

inches per year. Approximately 88% of the average rainfall occurs during the 

months ofNovemher through April and 12% from May through October. TIlls 

area has experienced major droughts in the last two decades: 1986 -1991, 1998 -

2003,2007 - 2009, and 2011 - 2015. It is possible that more droughts will occur 

in the future based on the weather cycle pattern. 

  20-0203 M Page 30 of 36



, ; , , 

2. Humidity. the summer months (May through September), 

daily hwnidity arOlmd 20% and occasionally to the low 

teens. 

3. the summer months (May through September), the daily 

leIlnp(~ral:un~s C()mJrno:niy vA""~ 90 degrees Fahrenheit, with T",n,nprJ:l 

rP'r"""""'/1 as as 115 degrees. 

4. Winds. surrurner prevailing winds are out of the south 

winds occur during the spring (April and May), the fall 

October), and occasionally during the sunnner ... ,,' .... ,.., 

July August). Velocities are generally in the range offive to 

to 30 miles per hour during the summer mo,ntlJiS. 

local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity and in 

of little or no rainfall and hlgh temperatures create 

ha2:araous ,,",Vlll.llL!UU':', particularly as they relate to residential roof 

The climatic conditions are one of the greatest to 

emergency events due to uncontrollable nature . 

1. . n"!~ti.r.n Rescue is located in the ... VV ......... l" at an 

altitude of approXimately 1,214 feet above sea level. 

2. and Population. The Rescue Fire Protection 

enc,omipru;.ses approximately thirty-three (33) square a current 

  20-0203 M Page 31 of 36



, 

population of approximately 2,500-3,000 reSIoents with a OfCllecrea population 

increase, due to new residential development. 

3. Seismic Location. The nearest identified fault zone 

is the Bear Mountain Fault. fault zone is split into 

through the 

branches which 

transect the area between Folsom and Shingle Springs. The closest branch 

passes through middle of our neighboring fire district, El Dorado along 

the western of Browns Ravine. The next nearest ext,enslon of this fault 

system is located immediately at the north end of the District, and extends from 

the southeast arm ofFoIsom north to the City of Auburn. No recent 

geologic activity has been observed along this fault. However, studies of the 

east branch ofllie fault zone, conducted by Woodward-Clyde Associates the 

Auburn Dam, and by Tierra Engineering Consultants near Folsom Lake, indicate 

the fault may be reactivating on recent tectonic trends and should be 

potentially 

4. Topography. The topography ofllie from level to 

over a 40% slope. greatest degree of slope occurs throughout the District. 

Hilly throughout area or areas to as 

"chimneys" which accelerate the spread of fire. 

5. Roads and Streets. The District has narrow driveways, which not 

always connect, :r ..,,..,,,,,.,, the ability for traffic to With an ...... ,.., .. "''''"". 

of vehicular traffic from neighboring areas development and tourism, it causes 

congestion which can 

apparatus. 

a on the rest)oruse time 

  20-0203 M Page 32 of 36



• jiI , , 

• 

The above geographic topological conditions .nl',r",,,,,,,'· the magru.tuQle, e:KJ)CISW"e 

accessibility problems and hazards that the Department must handle. Fire 

following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life and damage 

to property than the earthquake itself. 

Other variables may tend to increase the situation: 

1. The ... ",ua./'; ... that may occur to the water ",,,.,t,,,,,, 

2. extent of isolation due to roadway damage, overpass collapse and debris 

blocking the roadway_ 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board Fire Protection this 

to / '1 / I q 2019 by the following vote: 
I I 

AYES: 

NOES: 

ABSENT: 

ATTEST: 

  20-0203 M Page 33 of 36



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 

101.1 X Admin 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.5 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

503.2.6 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.3 X CI imatic/ Geologica I/T 0 pogra ph ica I 

503.4.4 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

507.5.1 X CI i m atic/Geo logica I/T opogra ph ica I 

509.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T 0 pogra p h ica I 

903.2.a X CI i matic/ Geologica I/T 0 pogra ph ica I 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.4 X CI i matic/ Geologica I/T 0 pogra ph ica I 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geologica I/T 0 pogra p h ica I 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4903.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ical 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

  20-0203 M Page 34 of 36



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 

6104.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X CI i matic/ Geologica I/T opogra p h ica I 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 4.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix B: Table B105.1(l) X CI i matic/ Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix B: Table B105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ical 

Appendix 0: 0103.2 X CI i m atic/ Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.1 X CI i matic/ Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: 0104.4 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

101.2 through 101.5 X Admin 

102.6 through 102.8 X Admin 

102.10 through 102.12 X Admin 

103.1 through 104.1 X Admin 

104.3 through 104.4 X Admin 

104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin 

104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin 

104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin 

104.11.3 X Admin 

105.2.3 X Admin 

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin 

105.6.12 X Admin 

105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin 

105.6.37 X Admin 

105.6.39 X Admin 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin 

105.6.48 X Admin 

105.6.50 X Admin 

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin 

107.1 X Admin 

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin 

110.4.1 X Admin 

113.1 X Admin 

  20-0203 M Page 35 of 36



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
303.1 through 303.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

305.1 through 305.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

306.1 through 306.2 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

307.1 through 307.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.2 X Admin 

308.3 through 308.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.1 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

310.3 X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

310.4 through 310.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

311.1 through 311.4 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ica I 

319.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

319.2 X Admin 

319.3 through 319.10.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

403.10 through 403.10.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

405.5 X Admin 

510.3 X Admin 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1103.2 X Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0101.1 through 
X Climatic/Geologica I/Topogra ph ica I 

0102.1 

Appendix 0: 0103.4 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6 X Climatic/Geologica I/T opogra ph ical 

Appendix 0: 0104.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

0104.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix 0: 0105.1 through 

0105.4 
X Climatic/Geological/Topogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

0106.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix 0: 0107.1 (excluding 
X Climatic/Geologica I/To pogra ph ica I 

exceptions) 

Appendix 0: 0108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

  20-0203 M Page 36 of 36


	Resolution_Rescue
	Reso Rescue FPD 2-25-20



