
RESOLUTION NO. 035-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 014-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is 
updated by the State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are 
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, 
Chapter l, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to 
the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her 
authorized representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of 
the fire authority, or th_e chiefs authorized representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a 
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection 
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code;and, 

WHEREAS, on November 19, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Cameron Park Community Services 

District adopted Ordinance #2019 .11.20, which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with amendments the 

District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El 
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019.11.20 of the Cameron Park Community Services District and 
delegates the enforcement of the ordinance to the Cameron Park Fire Department Chief, or his or her 
representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections: 

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202,302.1, 307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 
(a) through ( d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1, 507.5.1, 5 09. 3, 903.2 
including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 907.2.a through 
907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 
5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 through 6112.3, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80NFPA 
13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6, 
Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table BIOS.I (1), Appendix B: Table 
Bl05.2, Appendix D103.l through D103.3, Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix D103.6.l, Appendix 
D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4. 

20-0203 C Page 1 of 41 



Resolution No. 035-2020 
Page 2 of 2 

The Cameron Park Community Services District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 
24, Part 9, in its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the 
International Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403 .3, 403.4, 
403.6, 403 .7, 403 .8 (adopting 403 .8.1-403 .8.1.7), 403 .9, 403 .10.2, 403.10.3, 403 .11, 403.12, 
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405 .6-405 .9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808, 
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103 .3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, 
Chapter 25 , Chapter 26, the exceptions under Dl04.2 (Exception), DI 06.1 (Exception), DI07. l 
(Exceptions I and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, 
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M . 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of 
said Board, held the _JQ_ day of March , 2020, by the following vote of said Board: 

Attest: 
Kim Dawson 
Clerk the Board of S 

By: 1-1-'--""-''---"-L......,!_.=..,;;--'-''-----=+--P....--e:----

Ayes: Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin, Novasel 
Noes: None 

Absent None • It k~.,,._,,_ 

B rian . Veerkamp, Chair, Bo d of Supervisors 

20-0203 C Page 2 of 41 



Cameron Park Fire Department 
Jn ooope t n the 

California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection 

Flr Station 89 
3200 Country Club Drive 
Cam ron Park. CA 95682 

(530) 677.6190 
(530) 672-22.48 FAX 

December 18, 2019 

Fi St .on 88 
2961 Alh mbr Drive 
Cameron P rk. CA 95662 

(530) 672-7350 
(530) 672-7352 FAX 

Subj t: Re olution R tifying Ordinance No. 201 .lJ.l.O of the m ron Park Community 
en•ic DiHrkt / 'amuoo Park Fire D panm nt, h h d pt the 2019 .allfornla Fire 

Code with amendment related 10 locaJ c.llm tie, phi I d tor,o llphic conditions. 

Dear Mr. Ashton: 

The Cameron Park Community Services Di trl l (CPC D) la ~q u in he B o. upc:rvisor (BOS) 
ratify its Ordinance No .. 2019.1 1.20 which dopt.s the 20 19 li Fire Code me ed due to 
specific local climatic, geogrnphk o.nd topogr . phic c nditi n . li fomia He th and cty Code ction 
13869.7 requires the legislative body of the city or ounty wharc the ordin cc wi ll pply to ratify, mo Ji y 
or deny the adopted ord inance. The BOS mus! o.l o dol.egat enf; rcement of the o in nee to either the 
Fire District (or its representative) or the Chief Building ffici l. 

Therefore, we request the County Board of upervisors ratify rdinonce No. 20 19.11.20 with amendment 
to the 20 l 9 Cali fomfo Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement. of !hilt rdinance to the ameron Park 
Fire Department Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for your review and use on tbis topic. 

This re,solution has no direct fiscal impact to the aunty. 

;2·L 
Jed Gaines 
Fire Chief 

20-0203 C Page 3 of 41 



Cameron Park Fire Department 
In cooperation with the 

California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection 

Fire Station 89 
3200 Country Club Drive 
Cameron Park, CA 95682 

(530) 677-6190 
(530) 672-2248 FAX 

ATTACHMENTS: 

Fire Station 88 
2961 Alhambra Drive 
Cameron Park, CA 95682 

(530) 672-7350 
(530) 672-7352 FAX 

I. Cameron Park Community Services District Ordinance No. 2019.11.20 
2. Cameron Park Community Services District Finding of Fact Resolution No. 2019-22 
3. Draft El Dorado County BOS Resolution 

20-0203 C Pa e 4 of 41 



Cameron Park Fire Department 
In cooperation with the 

California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection 

Fire Station 89 
3200 Country Club Drive 
Cameron Park, CA 95682 

(530) 677-6190 
(530) 672-2248 FAX 

Fire Station 88 
2961 Alhambra Drive 
Cameron Park, CA 95682 

{530) 672-7350 
(530) 672-7352 FAX 

Attachment No. 1 

Cameron Park Community Services District 

Ordinance No. 2019.11.20 

20-0203 C Page 5 of 41 



CA MF.RON PARK CO!\·IMtrNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 

ORDINA:"ICE NO. 2019.11.20 

BE IT ORDAl}.iED AY TH!: AOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE CAMERON PARK 

COM~.1U~ITY SERVJCES DISlHlCT AS FOLLOWS: 

l\n ..rdir.;mce nf1he Cameron Park C:ommuniry Services Distrid :1dupti11g the 20t9 F.ditio11 oflhe ('uli/im1ir1 

Frio! Cui:i~. incorpN11tmg the 20 I & !Aition of the l111~ma1iv11al Fir!! Codt!. n:~ulati11g end govcr11i1w the :;11tcg11n1di11g 

c.'f life and propert:· from fire and explosion haz.uth Jr 1si11g from 1hc ,l0ra8e, handling and u~e of hawrdou, 

subsaan.::e,;, material3 and de,ices. and from conditions h,1urdnw; tn lite nr rrnperty iri the n.::i.:up11111.:y ot huildi11),I.~ 

1rnd pn·mi~e~ in the Carneroo Parl C·)mmunity Senice5 l1is1rict r11,-,·.'H!rn~ t,:,, the 1~~1u1111:e nfp\:rniih ~nd ,.:oilcl:l.1011 

of fees therefor: Repealii1g (1rdinancc '-Jo 2016. ! Cl. i '.> of !ht• 'lin~·rn11 P1lo. C,lmrrwnity Ser,::cc, D1s1rii:t and 1111 other 

ord inanc:es and part, of the ordinances in conrnc1 then.'\\. ith 

Beil ORDAINED by thi: Board ,)f Dire·~t,)rs .:,f the C.111wr<H1 Par~ (:,11111111mtty '),:rvice~ Dimitt 

Section I : FIND11'GS Of [ACTS 
Section 2: ADOPTION Of COO[ WITH EXcu:s10NS 

Sectio11 3 LOCAL AMENDMENTS 

Seclirnl 4: CONFLICl 

Scclirm 5, S[V[RALHLIT\' 

Section 6: EFFECTIVE: l>AT[ AND PllULICATION 

SECTION I~ fi'INl)fN(;~ Of FACTS 

The Camer•111 PMk Com1111m1ty ~erv1~,·~ fJ1,t11ct rnn~.<"- ·-cnnir. ,L/1111,1~·,: ( iht,:d hcl,m / tu I'~ Cal,/;1,nw 

Fire Crxll', 2019 l:1li1io11, pu~uanl W H,.a/rl, & S,1fl"t1• Cod,· \,··: 11,111.1 /381,:, ·. t ;''i5 ~." .'!mi 189.J I 5 drn iug 1hi~ 

code a1foptio11 prw.:e.,\. Such ,:hanie~ 11rt 111:t:c~s.11y hc..:a1hc ,.,f Jr,u1I clitlllllic, l,(Cnln11,icai ll!ld.,r.,r t·,pv!!rilf)hicnl 

,:ondi1ions. The C1m1c,,111 1'11rk l \m1111tm1ty Sci vice~ Dis1rkt hn\ :,d"l'k(L p11r,;ua111 re, S,Ytw11 18~.J I 5 c,f the 

( ·,rli/orma llea//h ,1:· Sa/t•t,• ("1,de, th~· fin,fo11,1.~ of !11(t~ 11::l~riv, 1,, 1l1c\c -:rn1di1ions h:, Kes,1t.11ion 21i:9.22 {:,r' The 

Ca111cro11 l'nrk Crnn1111111i1y Scr\•kt·s fli:-.1t1c1 dRted lhc(,htr U,, ~019 

SECTION 2: AOOrTION 01< coam Wlltl FXCLl!SIONS 

·r l,c C111m:ro11 i>lll'k Comin1111i1y Scrvi(;CS [)i,;1ric1 rv.lnpts the ~UICJ 1 '11/i/,m1iu Fo-.: Cr,dc, Tit/If 14, l'ar1 9. in 

ii~ 1:ntir ... ty. iod11,l111g 1\ppc11diccs, 111cnr'pOrnlillr,! 1hnse s~cik,ns ol 1hc blftrtmlirmal flt1c ('1xfe. 2(Jl 8 edition nol 

11dnp1cd by the stnlc, with the l'Xllmions listed below: 

Onlin,mcl' 2019.11.20 Culilomiu Fir,: Co<le PHge I of 17 

20-0203 C Page 6 of 41 



Ex...:lusions !05.6.l?-105.6.l'J, lll)AJIJ, i08.i .;, )1W. :,Jl\ Jllf>,318.·lCJ.i. 403].J.41,3_2~.403\ 

403.4, 40J.6, 403.7, 40::U (11dopli11g 403.8.1--403.8 I 7). 401.9, 403. i tl.2, 4113.10.\ 403.1 i. -403. 12, ~04. l--lfl.i .i, 

405. 1-405 .4, 405 ,6 .. J05.!J, 406, 805-807 f 11d,ip1inl-'. 80i 5.2), 808, 904.1. I, I ii) I. i I ,)3. ! , I I QJ -~-- l I 03 .6, 1103 .9 

(aclnpting 1103.9.1). 1103 to, 1104·1106. l'huptr."f ~'.\ Ch:tprer 2!i. the nceptmn; under DlO-.:: fExc~puon). 

D106.I (Exccptto11), D107.I (f,'.:,,;u•pliouL 1\ppcnd1s :\, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G. Appendix J. 

Appendix K, Appendix L, Ap1~11dix M. 

;\ ppen,iicc, not adopted cn11 he used for 1t'fi:rc11c!!' in enh.11cing other sections of the 20: 9 ('.-rli/1·1r11io Fire 

SECJ'ION 3: LOCAL AMENDl\.·IENTS 

Chapter I 

~ction IOI Scope and General Regui~ments 

IO 1.1 TIiie shnll be ;,mended as fol l,1w,: Add name ofiuriwiiclion /Cnmero11 Pork Community Service'> 

I >, .. 1,i.:1/ 

~cli2n I 05 Perm ii! 
105.6.27 LPG-e,1u shall he. amended as f,:illov.~: Add to the c,ceptioo: At"' ahovt S.000 feer nf 

I': !e,,1tton. i\ permit 1~ r,ol required fi:ir (1;di.-idual contai,:crs ,,..,th n 12 ').g:1lln11 w,1rer c.:,1p11d1y or less. 

or rnulrirle cd111Hi11cr ,ystems naving 11n aggrcgtlte quanriry n:,r !!'Xcccdio!l 125 ~Hli, ·,11, \en·i11i 

occupanc ics in Group R-3. 

Sc:c1ion I 06 Fees 

106.6 l"ermh, Pl11n Review 11nd Inspection Fen ,hf!II be ud(kd M follu,,,, A ,d1t1d11/~· 0//u.1 

odoplcd by f/11• districl bourd of dih•d11n li,,· plan n•1•ii••1 11np,·, ·11,111.1 ilf'ld 1h1.• 1.1111an,·,· ,,(1'!<!n111!.1 hy 

the distr1c1 rnoy be _;i111nd in 1he mm! 01.rn:ni d,.,-1nu/,·,· 1tl11·,l11!, t'lfro/lli .~. Sot,·1_1° ·,,d,: r .:·''h I) 

106.6.1 Cost Rccovcn· Fees shall be uddcd !l~ folh,ws: Fit(' .. 1r,vi<1' /rr.1 ma} hf' ,h.srg<'d ro (111)-' 

per.1·011. ffrm, corpnra//rm or h11si11~·.1·s !hat tlw,111xh nel(li.i:(·rwt', 1·i11/af111n <'.I !ht- hm·. nr, ,~ a te.rn/1 of 

.-arckl'Sness, is re.\'/Jfmsih/(' fi1r inc cmi.tt• r>{ 1ht• d1.11,·1n 111 ri-1Jlfm, t lo iht> .1am: nr w, ,m ul<'11f . .. -1 

dislrkl board 111ay clu,,.g11 a/i•e to co~'t'r tlw cosl u(anv .1(Tv1cc which !ht' dntr·rd pr,i1·i.l<: 1 01 1he cos! 

qf t!n{orc·ing (111)' re>:rtlatinn_fhr wl11d1 th<!./a i.Y l l,or.i:t•d (} fro/ti, & Sufi•ty C,nle 13 ') 16) 7h,· Ji:!! shC1!l 

nol l!XCt!t!d lh,, m:llml cos/ o(.Yll/lfl/'f',\.,·m.ll, 1/w./in.- mul!ur n•.,1><1m/i11g to th,.• .,cn1c u/ on w,:itl,•n/. 

106.7 r\dministn,tivr Coi1, shull be mld1.:d ns lnllows: Wht·n (/ /t'I/ r)/ 111\'/k'('/IOtl i.1 .1d,c.•d11lcd. and 

1hr: c:ollfrt1c/or/i1ils to /lt'l:fiwm lo Int' satisli1,·ri1111 n(dlt' w,1/,wily /1111'/l/g tlln.1-di,·11011 (.·f 11,!J. rht :4 HJ 

Ordinance 201Q. I UO Culift>llllU Fire Co<lc Page 2 of 17 

20-0203 C Page 7 of 41 



may bill the comraclor.Ji>r actual timl! spent ll'aveli11g to and from the teMlit1,\J)l!dio11 location and 

/he time spent at the tesllinspeL'lioh site as: well a_r administrative costs. 

Section l09 81J1trt.l of Anne11ls 

Section 109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timclincs shall be added as follows: Any person or f!nlity who 

believes 1hey may be adversely affected by an order, deci.~ion. or dele1"111inatio11 made by the fire code 

1ificial 1hrough a written notice m~v appeal this ma(ler within 15 calendar days of the po.r1mark on 

the notice. AJI such appeals shall be filed in writing wilh the Sc!cretary of the Governing Board }or 

the district. A time(v appeal shall :,;tay Ji1r1he1· acrion by the fire code <~l/icial until /he maller is 

determined by the Appeal Board as 0111/ined ;n Section 109. 2, unless !he issue poses an imminent fire 

or {U"e sqfety hazard lo 1111m1b(•rs qf the public. Thi! fire cock o/1h·ia/ shall notify the appellam by 

certified mall qf the date and lime ,fsiu:h hearing, The l11!01'1ng shall he scheduled ro wke place no 

sooner rhan 20 .:ale11dar days from the date shown on the certi/ii1d mail. The ap11ellanr slra/1 have 1he 

right to appear in person or by agent af the hcal'lf/R and presem oral, wriuen and/or phutugraphic 

evidence to the Appeal Board. 

Section 110 Violations 

l l0.4 Violation Pll'nalties shall be amended as follows: Persons who shal! violate a provision of this 

code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thl"!rc(11' or who shall erect install, alter, 

repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code 

official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a 

misdemeanor or it//racl/011. at the di.1·c1·efion of !he prosen,1ing ouorne1· ur agency, punishable by a 

fine 1101 exc~cding S JOO. OD.for aftrst l'iolation, 2. A Jine nor e.H:eedi11g $51)0.00for tt seumd 1'io/a1io11 

of rhe same pmvisio11 wilhin one ywr: 3_ Ajinl! not excee,/;nJ.( $1000.00for each additional vio/arion 

ofrhe ,mmt: pmvision wifhin one ywr, or by imprisonment not exceeding, /80 doys, or both such tine 

and imprisonment. Each day 1h01 o violntion continues niter due notice hos been served shall be 

deemed a separate offense. (l-lealtli & Sqjety Code Sec1ion.1· /Ji.JS and J79Y5). 

I I0.4.2 Cirationl'I shu 11 be added as follows; The Fire Chie( or his/he I' duly authorized 

represc11tlltfre, may is.me citoliotafor 111tractions or 111isd,·111e111w1· violations of1his codl! p11r.Hum1 to 

Sat ion I 3871 of the Healrh & Sofety Code of Lhe State of Coli(orniu and Chaple!· 5c (w111menci11g 

wi/)1 Section 853. 6) 1~/' Title J of Po/'I 2 of tlte Penal Code of the Slate o/Cali/im1fr,. 

Scclion 112 S19p Work Order 

112.4. Fitilure to Comply shall he amended as follows: Any person who shall con1inue nny work 

arter hnving been served with tt slop·l\.'Olk ol'der, except such WOl'k as thnt perso,, is directed to 

Ordinance 2019, 1120 California Fire Code Page 3 of 17 

20-0203 C Page 8 of 41 



perfom1 to remove o violntion or unsafe comlition, shall be Jmni.{hahlc by ,1fine or impri,rnnmmf ,;·r 

both as descrihed in Section 110.4 (H,wlth & S,7fi.•ry Code ,':,~·ctiom I 31.J5 and 1 ?'IY5!. 

Chapter 2 

Seclion 202 Ge11cral Pcfinlcions 

Add definition for Campfire - Shall mean afire which is ust!d/!1r cn<1/ri11K, pa.w,wl w,1r1111/i, /ightirt,i:. 

or w:sth1.•ric p11rpo.ves. This ind11d,•.1· fires contaillr!d wilhin mt1dom'fircplac,•.i and e1J<:los,•d s1ow·.t 

wilh/711<'.,. r,r cbimm•y.,, stoves 11si11g jrdlied, liquid. or sa/,dfuels, porfllbl.: barben,e pirs, hn-izia.~. or 

space lreatinx d(,vicr!J" wluch are used outside of any structure. mobrle home, or any !ffing 

an:t/lml/Oc/U//011 I/Wllnf1•d On (l 1·d1/dt•, 

Add dcl!11ili1.111 for Di.strict - Shull mean the dislricf and alt nther OriXlS 1~f1hi111he exterior bmmdorin 

thr:n·,~I now or h1•r.:u/rcr ,•.1·1t1hl1Jhcd. 

Add definition ft)r () rj,·cwu - Shall mt'an a l'L'irinrlar access that scr--..•es no more than ri.o buildings 

with no more tho11 t>t,·i:e ,bl't•!linK 11n/1s on u singh• 1•.ir,·,d and any 1111111h:,·r of uaesAJr_\' buildin'?,-~­

Adtl dcli11i1 i~!I I for E~roJth'<' IJ94't" . Shall lpJ(!{ln rhe 81_,ord or Drreclo•s ol the Di.wricr. 

Add dcli11ition for f'lrt Chh:f - Sholl mean rht Chit'_( Eraum~· Fire: q(ficcr /)( the Fm! 

,ll'/Xlrfm1.•n/i,/isrrin .H•1·1•i11g the j11ri.,rlrcf1m1 or a d11(,, amhoriz<',I t·q,r1; St'nltl/11'<! 

Acfrl dC"tinition h11 ·,·rained Cro,HI Managn - Shall mew, .,:,mdb, 11awnnc'I u.uw/11- a Jt'.:11rity 

Ch11ptcr 3 

Scslion 302 Odjnifion) 

302.1 DcliniliQn! shall h..: ilme11d.:.t 11., t~,tln~,; Added ( ,1mplirc ddl1111i,1:1, lh ~hown ubove in 

Chnptcr 2. 

Sec1ion 307 Op~n Burnjn1. Rrcrc111tonal I- ire~. ind Ouu.Joor t'irq1l11c;c, 

307A.4 Can1111in· Rtitrjs:Jiqns sh11ll be added a~ follov,," 

307A.4.I it 1s 1111l<1w/1il /;:,r .:my p,•r.,on to i':ght '"'11111am m· u.rt II nm1pfir,• upon or ttf!OI' an_\' f>msh· 

CiH'f'l"r!d fond, }:ri'HS•ul'. '<'I t'.f Jo/'ld, ()r /w·r:.\{•1.IB't'f'<~t/ fom/ ,/W'lil,1,/, /h,• //JIit' ,,,hen h111·11ifl/l, /i'<'l'llllh' r,r(: 

.w.1pendt.'d by rm.• D1r<'Cfo• ,,( lfi<' r.,,,.p,1.1,1mrnt ,l( 1-u, ,.,,n and 1-·1t't' !'1 r11,•,·11, m. th<' CA I. FIRE Unif 

Cl,1,:f ur the A fJJ. 

Excttp1im1: C11111mcruol r11t1j{nJ,[ Of"t'l',//11111\' w11h ,,p11,·,11·,rl "/:h,• All.I. 

307.4.4.2 When ca11111tirt'\ nn: ollm,rd. It ,rh,wld hf- 1111"111'/id/11r 11n_1· /lf'l',wn lO light. 11111111rai1,. 1)1' wr 

jol/owmg minim11111 1T<f11//"t'IIIN1f., art• ('11111/Hil'd with 

Onlinar1cc 2019. [ 1.20 Califrxnia f-irc Code l'agc 4 {)r l 7 

20-0203 C Page 9 of 41 



307.4.4.2 (a) The area withi11 5 feel <~/' the periphe1y of' the ca1111>/ire is deored ol all .fla111111able 

111ateric1/ and vegetation. 

307.4.4.2 (b) One serJ1iceable shovel lt'it/, a handle of e11 leasl 12 inches is ready Jiw use al the 

immediale areo oj'lhe cw111~/ire. 

307.4.4.2 (cl Cwnp{tres slw/1 be limited too I.foot by lji.wl urea, 11nh•ss in an e1ppmved 111am!/c1t'l//red 

cooking device or.fire ring 

3ll7.4.4.2 {d) Wrillen permission <?l the lcmdowne,· 11111s1 be ob,ained prior lO 1he ignitio11 of the 

campfire and slw/1 be on site. 

Chaptcl' 5 

Sedion 503 Fire Ar>parntus Access Roads 

503.2. t Dimensions shal I be amended as follows: fire apparatus access roads shal I have an 

unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet. exclusive or shoulders. w; 111ea:mredfiw11.fi1ce o/'rnrh to 

fc,ce olcurb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and unobstrucl~d 

vertical clearance of not less than 15.feet. All driveways i11 the district shall nm be less them 12 Jee/ 

wide. 

503.2.5 Dc:ul Ends shall be amended as follows: Dead-end lire apparutus access mads a11d drivewc!)IS 

in excess of" 150 feet in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around lire 

apparatus. 

503.2.6 Bridges nnd Elevated Surfoccs slrnll be amended as follows: Where a hridge or an elevated 

surfi1cc is piirt of' a fire apparatus access rnad. the bridge shall he constructed and 111aintaincd in 

accordance wifl, the: c11rre111 El Do1·aclo Co1111~\· 1h111s1x1rwlio11 Dil'isio11 Brid~e Stwulorcl or Appendi.\' 

I) ,?f'tl,e c11rr<'//t Cal{/hmia Fir<! Code. ll'hic/,e1•e1· is 111vre restrict ire. Bridges and elevated surfaces 

shall be designed for a live loud sufncicnt to carry the imposed loads of fire oppnratus. Vehicle lond 

limits shall be posted al both entrances to bridges when required by the Fire Code Official. Where 

elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces which are 1101 designed 

for su<.:h use. approved barriers. approwd signs. or hoth shall be installed and 111ain1ai1H::d when 

required by the fire code onicial. 

503.4.2 No Parking in Fire Lanes shall be added ns follows: No person shall stO/J. park. or leave 

stondinK any ve/1ic:/e, whether alle11clec/ or 1111<1fle1tcll!d. e.\Te/>I wlu!n 11ecesSC11J' to avoid co1?/lic1 with 

other lr<!f.lk ,11· in co111pliw1ce with the clirl!l'tions r?f tl,e Fire: ( 'hief. m· /1islhcr ,In~\' 0111/1ori21!cl 

1·e1>resl!l'll<1lil'I!, l'eace (Jf/icer m· o/f,cial traffh· control tleric'e 11/011g !ht! c•c(~e <>lW(I' h(~ll\l'c~I'. 111 w1y 

nll'I>. or in ,11~1· location in a 1111hlit'(r or 111·h•<1teh- m1·11ecl 111· 1111c•r11tecl o//:.,·treet 11arki11g .fi.1cility. 

clesig11c11ecl as e1.fil"e lane/~,, 1/w tl(wricl 11·itl1j11risclic1io11 m·er 1/1c: a/'eo in ll'hiC"l1 th" 11l11t'e is lol'alecl. 

1hl! cles(~1wtio11 sl1all be i11dic111ed ( /)bra s(~II /IOstecl i111111ec/iale(1· acliace11l lo. wul 1·isihle.fi'0111. th<• 

clesignatecl plcl<'t! dearly staling in feller.,· 1wt l<'s.\' than 01w i11<"h i11 /,eight tltat 1/,e place i.i afire la11e. 

Ordinance 2019.11.20 California Fire Code l>ugc 5 of I 7 

20-0203 C Page 10 of 41 



( 21 hy 11111/11,ing or 11aintmg 1he plan• In red and, in icontmsfing color, 11111rk,nx ,he plact' wi1h 1}11.· 

word, 'FIRE LANE" whic:h are elem·~(· visihleji·um r11't!hit:/c. or (3) by a red curb or red paint vn 

du edxe ,,f 1'1e roadway upon which is dearlv 11uwked the woi-ds "FIRE LANE'" 

503.-1.J No Parking in front of H-nlrant'.I shall be added as follow~: No person shall .wop, p,wk, or 

fe,r,·t swndmg tmy ,>t:l11d,: wirhm J 5 feel of a fire hydrant except as _/(,J/ows; (a) If the w/,ic/,• i.\' 

,1/ll!mi.:d by a h,·rmed drivt!r who is s~ated in the from .ww1 and who can immediatclr imH'e such 

1 ehicfe in c11.,e o(Ma.uity. /!,} filhe ~·elricle is owned or O/Jeralt>d hy afire deparhmml and is deod_,, 

503.4 . .f Fire Lanes Based on Road Width shilli be added as follows: F/rl! lanc.r .\'hall be ha.,·l!d on 

roaJ,..,,,J,h as reqwr,:d in AppemHi: Das mnend.:d by !ht! dislncl. 

503.S.J fire Appanllu'.1 Access Gate! ~hair be added as f1Jllows. All mu.111wlit' and manual go/I!,\ 

inJlallt!d O\'t:r .f"ire CifJ/Xll'O/fls occess road:, shc11/ comp/_,. ll'llh rhe di.rtricr gate .,1,11kle1nl oJ .,,,,,,.m,,·d 
by lhefire code ,>r"fh·:,1/ 

Section S05 PrcmiK ldutificatio11 

SOS.I Address ldcntift511tion s.hall hs•e the fir~t l11~e of rh1'> p,1rit!1,nep11 arncn•lcd 1.1s r;,u"w:i: 
,4,ddr.:sses f,lr new and n isling h11ildin11. .. { j'hall (011111/1· wit.Ir rhc di w· 10 ,uldrr:.r., .rt,mdm·il <1.,· 1111111·111'"" 

by Jhe fire cudc offh. Iii/ 

Section 507 fire Protccliyn Water Syppfics 

51)715.1 Where Rcguin:d ~hall be .,mcmlcd 1H fr,llrms. ,100 fee\ ~hall be ,1111.:ndcd !Ci /5!Jla1. 

Scclion S09.3 Fire Control Room 

.1hull hm•c 111ir,um1111 dim,·1,.Hr111.1 offi1·,· /r-d b1·.1,·1•,.,, to•/ m 11:e \Hin 11 tot.1{ 111,:t1hi,· .ir,:a 0(1101 iec:.1· 1iJa11 

15 .H/UW't·ft•c/. 1ht· mo/II shalt be /11,·ofi.•d w/11,m rht· h1,ild11J,'i:, m: m1 n1Jl1id,: wufl at o f,"<."llf/,m 111i1ir,11'<:'fl 

/)_11 lh<" Fin· Co.;(,: 1 )f/i,.-1,il and 1h11/I hL' ,1L·c,·_1 i/t,/,· /;-,,,,, th,· t•.11ai11,· ".f n •·-~·1,·1·io1· o,·c~_,_r dt)<,r ,d/h o deur 

wi<bh ol 11u/ ll'n 1ha11 .i} i11c}w.1 ,11/il a 1,n~hl 1101 J,.u than 8/1 111che.1 .;hall h•· ,,,·,n·i.J,,,f for 1/CCe.il irllo 

rite rrlllm A drin1M,· .ll,l.'.11 .1/111// lie fl//h,·r/ lo th1· L'ri1•1·,•u1· "/11,,: d(,;ir w1/h f~ ,.,orch FIRE ('(),\/ROI. 

/(()();\I" /11 lt:/11.'/'.\' /iol /t',\',\ 1hc111 ./ mch,·s Ill lwi~/11 ,i A't'y hox u1111pl_1·111g 1;·11h ,k'L'l,'<ill ,if)() ,1/i(,// ~ 

i1Mial/t'd r'J/1 th,· n'f,•rifll .rnle u( 1/re /irl' cu11/l'11I ro,1111 door r!Jklllll;.!. The room 1111is1 hr cap;.1hl<' or 

111,1i11111i11111~ ii 111im11mm 1,:1111,,•1·<11111·,• •d .JIJ d,·~n·,·1 1:ohr.•11l1er1 A cf,,,11·,mc.: of I] i11cllf!5 .\hall hf! 

pro1•id1•d fnm, 1/te /i1't' .,prinA'l,•r r/s,tr, 10 uuy ml/t1n.!111 \Htlk This nw111 can ht' :,lmn-.;i H·irh r){/?,rr 

Ordina111:..: 2019.l l .2/J C,1li(ormu Fire Code Page 6 fJf 17 

20-0203 C Page 11 of 41 



h11ilili11x 111ilities urjire protection equipment 1ha1 is compatible. An vppna·ed ct1bi/1('/ or c,111/llim:r :shall 

he pmvided to store record plans of 1/,c Jire Jpri11kla rysrem, other Jire protection cq11ipmc.'nf, and silt~ 

plant This romn sha/11101 he u.redfor uny other ston1ge 

Chapter 9 

Section 903 Fire Sprinklers 

903.2 Where Required shall be iimendcd as follows: An approved 11utomatic sprinkler ~ys1cm .1·hol/ 

be req11irt·d um/ in.~la/1..:d in llt!W buildin,",tJ und strllL'fl{l"<'S 3600 squan• fi!I'/ or g,,•afr'f' ll'he11 

com1n1t·ted or reloct1ft'd wilhin thejurisdioion us described i11 S1:dions 903.21 1hrot1Hh 90].1-12. 

Exception: Agriculturnl buildings not under a spednl use rcrmit used for u11mnc1rntl purpoo;c~ 

903.2.a Where Required shal I be added ll':i follow~: Sta/us of cxisli'1g h11ildi11x,f J.:1·e,J/,•r llwn 3,600 

5quan:fu1. Tn c.r:rstmx lm/ldm~5 3.MJO square fed or gn!tllC'r. olher lhan one and 1wo}m11'v ,lw,·llinJ{ 

unils, .ancl agric11/111ral fmildin;.p not under .1'/loeciaf u.r~ /ll!l'tnif Ji,r .. ·omm,'.1·d11/ 1111,-,1<1n•.,·. 11•herc 1111: 

Jloor arta of the huilding or \'lrucfw·.: i.r inc/'<'11.'ft:(I by an wldirr'o11 of 111ort: titan thirty /Jctciurf (30%) 

or !, 000 .tquarc /~ct 11"11id1,•1•1·r i.1 fess .. 111d1 h11ildm.11. or .,·1111rf11n• shut/ hi.• ,1111./11 to c1111/i1,·111 lo Sl'cf/011 

903 2. 

'JOJ.2.b Wh.,rc Rc1111irctl sh<lll be added lH f<.>llow~: Sta/11{ ,·,,r ,·.l·i,ti11g f111{Jdfng.~ fo,n rlwn J,600 

square: fn•1. In ,•xr.<ti,,.i: l>utldmxs 3.tilJO sqrwr.• Ji!l'I ur l,•.1.Y, nlht·r Own ,;n,•-,uul 1wo-fa111ily rlwl'ili11,L~ 

im1ts. a"'1 m!,r,•,·u/1111·,J/ hui/,hn~; not 1mder 5/!r.•ual 11.re 1><:1w1I }.or ,·011111wrn11l ;11,rrms,-.1, 1,,J1rrt• lhl' 

/h11)1' /}f'f(/ o( {hi! im1l,lmx m· .l'lf'//Urwc IS IU('ffil.\C,I /IJ " /ll/nl .1//1101'(.' fi111/t1ge ove/' 3,6()U Sl(lltlf'I! jet'/, 

hy ,m ,uidi1wn ,;11,,or,• t!wn ihirty 11rn or/ 1JrJ%) "' J. (}()() .,,111a1·,·,,ti•,•f, wlridrt•Vt'I' i.1 less. ,\I/ch h11/ldin.~ 

,Jr w uc111rt .rha/1 hf .. •11ade fl> ,·,m/i,n11 lo ,\'t•uion 903 .1 

'.'OJ.?. I (; roup A sh;i11 r:< :imcndcd HS I, ,nows fnr· t\ ~1 oup•; /\ - t 1hr.;u,ul1 A-4: 90J I I. I (I) The lire 

903.?.J Group [ ~hall be .u11c11dcd M tl,llnw.,: •lf) 1 2 l ( l) lh11 •H!1hm11 all < iro11p E lire area~ wearer 

1hn11 3,til)() H;umr,fr•eJ in Mre:a 

?QJ.2,-4 yroyu ··-1 ,hnll be .111H:11d~-,~ ,1' lo!l,,w-.: ·~Ll.? 4 G1,mp F •HU.2A (I) A f1t(11lr• F tire nrea 

exceed<. 3, 1.00 .1q1mr,: te,•1. 

903.2.7 c;rnuu M ,hall be illllc."IHkd 85 fu!lo\~\ 'IOJ.~ 7 (Jn,up B ,t!id M. 90J.2, 7 (I) A Cro11p B Bild 

M fire n~n e,,eeds JJ'il'I<) H/uan• /en 

903.2.8.2 M•nufaclurrcl Homes sha 11 be added 1H lnl lm~ \: ."1 rr aw1111111f 1cjirt' sprinklu sy.wi:m shall 

n\'" ,11k:-,1r1d 11,·o-/a1111/1 dw,•IJ,,,~ ! hi' d,· 511.'.'1 ond im1t1/Ji11101111{such ,q·,·Jt!ms shalt~ m ,,ccordmu.·e 

1vi1h (_ 'alili>rnia t ·oae of /frg11l.i1ions Tiiir 2 5 .. fJJOO. 

Oulinim~c 20 I 9J 1.20 Califomiil Fi~ Code rage 7 of 17 

20-0203 C Page 12 of 41 



M,m11/:1c1urc'd homcJ lo('dit'd 1;.·t1h1n on r1·i.11in,-: m1Jhil,;'i1m11.· park complying wuh 

C11l1Jiw111a fit'.o!fh ond S,!f,•n ('o,Jc, Ui1·1.111m /.J, Pan 2.1 1,r ::: 5. 

,\,,fmw/,1.-r11n·il homn 1har do 1,01 ;,·.-:·e<'d J,lliO l</IIOrc fi!tr Fr: size WIG serve as an 

OtYt'HO/'I' ,llrcllin;.: unit. <1J ,k/im:.t in (Jll\'t11-ni11i:nt Code Se,·r,011 65.~5Ul. u·hen the 

t'Xisling ;11'i1Pwr1· l'l\1/de-11r,i on 1h,1 pro11tirt1· is nnl n'.quirtd lo comply \1ilh Cu/it,1rnia 

N11s1det11iaf Cod,· Seu ion RJJ 3.1 

3, M,1111f/i1t'llm~rJ home.r thill do nor exceed 320 square feet in .size. 

90J.l.1J Group ~-I slrnll be: 01mc11dcd ns follows: 903.2.9 Group S. 903.2.9 ( I) A Gw,up S fire area 

cxccctls J, 600 i<flltll'•' feet. 

')03,2.iO (,n,uu S-2 t:ncl1m~11 P11rkin2 G11ru2c~ shnll he amended as folkw,s: 903.2. !O ~ IJ Where 

1hc tire 11rc11 cif the l't1d,.i~cd parking gRrage cx:cci:ds 3.600 square feet. 

$t'1:lion 901 •'ire Al11rn1 11nd l>elt'clio11 S,·.stems 

907.2.a \\here Rc11uircd - Ncn Buildings or Sti·u1:1u1·cs lcll§ thgn J,600 square feel sholl be ecldcd 

11, fol bws: -~ rt ,111pn•1•c.l Jirt! alurm:'di!lection system .shall be in.vfalled in all huildi11gI Mlh a_flom· 

a,·,.u it :u :har: J l',00 ,.;uure (et!/ 

E.,·,·e1,1imu: 

'~J,11•- ,rrn:I two-/i.11111/v dwdlin.1;.~ (R-3 o~·u111,111~'it'5 and tJ(her m·cr,p,ml'I,·.~· ,111.ui/i,·d 

ill' ' ",1. 

~ Agnc11/11,ra/ hwlding.\ not under .,pecial II\<' 1wrmt1 arnil,w no/ 1,wclpJr om,m,·11·111/ 

by the Ffrt• Chief or his:iwr du/_1· ,:11th<1t·1:nl t,.'1.•1·,.,1,•11/nlnr, h,n,:d on h111ldmg 

c.-.11.1·u-1,ct1on mt11t'r111/ and /t',lflifj;I_ /1•(<1/1011 i1n·u1J,mn· {_1'/lt', and d1.,·1,u11:,· to 

i!X/}(J.SI//'(' .\. 

907.2.b Scacus of [,;istine Buildings sf.all be 11dded ns k,li,~-,,~- In t.·r1.rni,g h111/du:g, ..-11hn111 wr 

b11ildi11g nof under sp1.!ciul 1He permil for c11111mrrcial t""'l"'1.,1:., wht-rf' a/ire dorm ;J~,~1·11011 n•.(f,:m 

does not exist and the jlm>r an::a o(tlre h11ild111,:. 01· .11,,r1c1111 l' i.1 inu c,n,•d o, m.icl/fi<'d h1 mmt lfwn 

rhirty /H?rcctrl (30%,J or I, 000 sqlimc _/r!t.-1. 1,hid1r l'f'/ n /t.•.1.1, .11n·h h111Mi11,~ or .,11·11cf11n· 1JH.ill ~ r,1<1Jt" 

(o confor111 /o .s·ec1im1 90 7 w/N.•n l't'ifllll't'.I hy 1hc 1:;rc, < '/,rrf. 01 /ir.\.·'her duly 1111111011:<'d, ,,;,,·~·'""1111/R 

/J11ildit1gs with a/Joor a1·,~a le.rs tllw, 500 .,41m1·<'/r••111111,r- hr ,.,·,·111p1 o,, d~1rr·m11N:,J hy rllc' Firf' Clt1d 

or hislhe1· duly t111fliori::ed 1·i·pn·M·11r,11i1•,•. hu1·cd ,111 hud,im),!, i'r!IHll'll(fl•lfl mment1/.\ ,md !t:1111,re.~ 

hx:alim1. occ11pw,9• 1ypt•, und disla11n• to t•.\'fM.'illf<'.1. 

Ordinance 2019-11.20 Califomin Fire Code Page 8 or I 7 

20-0203 C Page 13 of 41 



907.2.c Monitorin2 shall be added 11:-. follows: Al/jire 11/ar111liktl!ctio11 .1_1'Slt!m1 shall be ,·amli'dl!d 

d11·,·e1/1, through and mvnitored hy a U. L 11p11r111>c:d n•llfral, p1·oprlt!twy or· remote 5fatio11 .,,·n·ice 

~·hid, gives audible! ond vu1wl ,qg11,tl, al a ,·,,,wantly affemled focolitm A II .1prinlr/,•rt•,I hrdldi11g.~ 

rhoil lie mmllfored 

Exceptfons: 

as "U'"). 

2 .4gricu!t11rol b11i!tl11t1(.J ftol under 5/J<."cwl use r>ermit ond:or not uudfor < 01;1m,•r.::ial 

purpose.,· (e.g., re/ails .mltJ, j,x>d service. amfior SJJCC i,1/ ,•1't<r1t,1 ! 

907.2,d l'yoe I Hood ln~tallAtiom1 shall be added 35 foll,iws: The r,•q111r.:111m1 4 ,n,1,11/a11on, or 

rt!plau!r11<!nt, of a Tr·pe J Hood S1•.1·/•!III .,·hall tt!qwre a jire 11/umt'\p,·in!c/,•r m1,11/torin,.; .rvstt•m 19 be 

inswllotd, or for the hood s_1·.,·1c111 to fx.· ,·,m,redt!d to an exi.ftin.~/in· altirm,'.~f.lf'Ullch•,· 1110,ri1oring .'Jy,1,fc111 

Jt>r tho/ h11ildlng 

90'7.6.l.l Secondan Power Su1,11h .~hall he added as follows In ac,m·rlan.·.- wilh NFPA 72, the 

.,,·condar) fX!Wer s11pp/; p,·0~·1,imJ.: a mimmum :,1 ,ho11r p,.lwer ca11<1cit1' und~·r q11i,'..w.:cnt load (sysh•m 

operming in a m>n~1/unn um,loitwi .1/wll !)(l amended too n11mn111111 7 }.J,0111· J'1fW,'l!r i:<1J"1ci1y. 

Exception. !11'! ,•.u,H,'t1,·r of nn ,•mcrgenc_1 bac.1.:-up J><'H- er .\/lfJf'h th.it meets v!' exceed the 

rc,111/rt'menl.1 r1/< .',,li1i11 nia Fin: Codi! Cirapft•r / .1. 

Chapter 12 

Section 1203 Em,;rgensr Rod Sl1111dby Power Syslcnn 

1203.1.J lnsral)1Uion sh11ll be .u11c11t1ed as J\)tlows: l~mcr![C'lll~Y puwer sys1cms and standby power 

systems sh al I be i11~1.1I !ed in ac.:,m!anci;; with the Ct Ii fornm Buililin~ Code, the Californ in l:il!i;lric 

C.:ce, NFPA 110 1111<1 ~fPA I l / Alf /mi/dings. other rhan rm.:· and ,a,,,.1:1111i(1• dwdlin,: unirs, und 

uJ,:rfr11lturr1l hmhlin,.:,.\ ,w/ 11.,c.J;r.•1· ,·01111111.:n:ial flUll'"·1·e·,, with .,1an,Jh1· power, .~hall havr a slt11nf rrij, 

de1'ict: rlwt ,1,,,.,,,,,,...,1 oll 1 ...... ,wa .wur,·e1 Jo I~ lm1/din,'( ,,1,prr,1'C!d h_, rhe_ti,·t· code ollicial. t.\isti//lf 

insto!la/iwH .,'hull ~ wamtame,i in ,1ccordanLY -..·irh thi• ,wi~m,,I 11pprm·.,,' 

Ch11ptcr 33 

Section .JJ IO A\'\'c:iis ro,• Firefighting 

.BI O.J Prfmisc ldrnllflution sh nil be addtl1 ns l'ull11w:-;: ('1'ior lo and during rnmtr1i.·11,m an 

,1p;,1·myd 11,ldn·.H ,ixn shall fx., Jwot·ide,/ w <!ad1 ji1·1: 11ml ,.'lll<'l',1!,'flC.\I 1•t"hid1.: ucci-,u rotHI <'nfty tnfo 

S~clton )JI l W;11u Supply for Ffrc l'rnrcclion 

Ordinant:c 2019.11.20 California Fi~ Code P.igc 9 of 17 

20-0203 C Page 14 of 41 



3312.1 When Required shall be amended as follows: Prim· lo co111h11stihle 111aterial.,· arriving 011 

site, the ,lire hydrant ll'oler ~yste111 sholl be instollecl and 111ainfoim·d in nmti1111m1s operation The 

mJ101111t qf'wafer supplied shall 111ee1 the req11ired/ire.fl0tvjiJ1· the projec.:I. 

Chapter 49 

Sel'liou 4903 Plans 

4903.l Where Required shall be added as follows: The.fire code official <!/the CPFD 111ay require 

develop111enl projects loi·oted in Modemte, High and fle1y-l fig!, Fire Hozard Severity Zones to submit 

.fire protection plan This plan shall he apprnved hy hoth the /ire rnde official ond the m11horized 

represenWI ive ./<>r the lorn/ CAL Fl RE U11il Chief ((/located in the ,\'tale Responsibility .freo [SRA}) 

prior to the recorcli11g al the .final 11wp.fiJ1· the J}l'<!jecl by the County o/EI Domdo. 

Section 4905 W iltl lire Protection BuiltlinJ;! Construction 

4905.4 Roof Construl'lion Requirl'mcnts shall be added as follows: All nell' conslmction, i11c/11di11g 

additions. requires a Class ;I rno/coveri11g or assembly. A II re-ro()ji11g requires Class A roo/'co11ering 

or asse111hly as o 111i11i11111111. Re-ro<~/ing in excess o/50% ,!(an exisili11g .1·1r11ct111·e ll'ithin any one year 

period tl'ill 11ecessi101e that the entire• rool be " Closs A roo/ covering or osse111hly as o 111ini11111111. 

Class /1 or ('jire ,·etardeonf treated w1d or non-treated wood shake 01· shingles are 1101 appro11ed as 

a r<H?/'covering 11wterialji>r Class A assembly. 

Chapter 50 

Section 5001 Gcm•rnl 

5001.7 Linbilih· for Damngcs shall be flddcd ns follows: Any dm11oges <II' cost res11fli11gji'Ol11 the 

careless lu111dli11g. s1>ill or discharge <!l e111_1• l1<1zardo11s 1110/<'l'ial.1· sh,,// co11slit11e111 debt against any 

such 1>erson. Jir111 or <'<>1'/H!l"ofion l'<111sing .rnd1 s1>il/ o,· disdwrge. Jbis deht is colh·uibll' by 1/11! Fire 

Chief or his/her duly 0111/wrized rq,re.,·e11talil'e. i11 lhe same 11101111<'1' os in tl,e <'OSC! ,!f'cm ohligation 

under co111roc1. expressed or il/lp/iec/. 

Chapter 56 

Section 5601 General 

5601.2 Permit Required shall be amended as ft)llows: Pcrmils shall he rcq11irccf as sci forth in 

Section I 05.6 and regulalcd in acl't1rda11t·t· with this section. WhC'rt' c.\'/J/osh·es pc•r111ils OI'<' r<'q11irecl. 

1hev shed/ he iss11ed hy the Fire ( 'l,i,'.f.' 01· hisi/,er c/11ly c11lfhori;:ec/ l'l!/Jrese/lfotii·e. mu/ f/,e 1~·1 Oorado 

( ·01111ty Shenjf.1· /Jeport111e111. Where /il'<·1i-orks 1>en11i1.,· are required t/ici· .1/iull he issued hr f/1e Fire 

( 'l,ief m· h1Vher c/11(F c111thurizec/ re1wc.,·c'lltotin·. wu/ tl,e D Dol'Cldo ( 'on111_1· /Jucml u/'S11p,:n,isors. 

Ordinance 2019.11.20 Culifornia Fire Code Pugc IO of 17 

20-0203 C Page 15 of 41 



5601.2.1 Documentation shall be added as follows: The AH.I shu/1 how fht' w1rh,w//y /rJ /'(q,,u, 

clocumenlatim, n?J;llf'ding all mpec:ts of /he firewo1·ks pre.~e111a111111 

5601.l,2 Proprietary Information shall be added as follows: The A I /J wil/ 1,r,1tt'Cf a/J pmprieta•y 

111/'ormati,m. 

Chapter 57 

1)c1;J19n 5704 SCOtlli!C 

~704.2,9.6,1 l.oc11tion~ Where Abovc-<;round Tanks are Prohibited shall be amended as. follows: 

Stornge ofc'lnss I Rnd Class II flammable liquid~ in atiove.grounrl tanks out~idc ...,fbuitdm~s js prohihitetj 

unless apprm,,t•d h.v !he Fin: Ch,'c:l ot' Md1cr duly awhoti1.!d t',!pre.h·!11L1;i1·t·. U,.her. perl'lllted by ilk! 

Fire Chhf 1>r hi.1/lrf.,r duly milltoi-i:.cd r,!pl'<'.H!rrlafi1·e. <.Iii abow.: ground twrk(JJ or 1·a:.:it mstalianmis 

/tJI' tht• .,·t,,ruge ,~( Cla.u /, II ,J1· ill t70•111110M1· and .:.,Hnf11,s11hi,· /;quids .,ha!! ,:;ompir ·,.,ith tho.h! 

r,:,111ir,:111,:111s OJ ,I<'/ jrmh hy th( (.'oliihmia Fire C,:idt:. The C.'aitfi,rnia Fire: Codtt shall ,J/50 vpply lo 

1'i1.,·1aflalim11· oth;:r //ran motor vd1iclr/utl di,{pcn.wig ·,wtinm ·,d;t'rl' ah11\·e-grmmd.f/oragit i, requir,•d 

St'clton ~706 Spt·,·i•I Operation\ 

~706.2.4.4 Locatiu111< Where Abon·-Groynd 'hnks 11rc l'rohibilctl shat[ be amended as fol/cw•, 

Sh11 age ,.,f Clnss I ,md Cla.\s I I flam11whlc I iquid" ir; ,1h,i\c·1,;H11111<t lank<. 011hidc of buildings ,s 
pnlhihitt•d 1mlr JS ,1ppra,·t'd tn· tht' /iin ('lrie.f. 1.,1 lrrr,')i.:, d1n'y 1J1.thor1:.:<i rq11·,·.,·en1ari1.:. When 

p,·rmil/cd by r!re Fin' t. 'l,rt'/, or hi\.-'lr<',. du/1· alllhori:,·.i ,·epr~sc,1/,111\',•. (i!i obof'!" w·,.11md tan/,Js) or 

vau/r 1111·rt11/minn.\'})/' rhc .•.1,·"·agL· o(i. '/.is.1· ,', // ,,, III /lo111muhl,· and, m•1h11.whit' liq111d~ sho// (omph· 

is r,·q111,-,·d 

Chapter S8 

Scl'tion S80(> ..-h1m111abll' (.'no2ulc t·luid, 

~806.2 Limhacions shall be ,unendcd ns foflq;,,, Sf,·11,1)1.c ,,f11"w1m,1hk (l'y-•)!,(cn11,; fluuh in ~1i11in11ary 

\.'.Onlniners ,:,IJ!;,i,!c ,1f h11ildi11gs i~. pu:,hihtle(l !//lie.,, iJJ)fll()l",•d In· ilw Fin• C 'hie( or hi.1· .. 'llr'r duly 

,mthoriud rr.'(Wt'.h'rt/111/w. When /'lc:n1/l/tr'd by Ilk' ;.:1,·c: I. ··1i11-r. 01· lta.ih1•1· d11/y ,·1111/wn:1·d 

rt'prr!St'n/11/irt· all _i/'atfr>n.i1·y con1am,•1'I /o.r th(' llnr,t)!i' o/ Jlwnmohlc 1'1}'flt.:<',11cl/11id.1· .iho/l nm1pJ1• 

wi1h those r,~1;11,r.•,11,·111., n1· <('' ,t;11/h In t.>r,: ( ·,,/i/i1011d Fin: Code Jh,. ( ',d1f,1n1w Fwc c,,dt• shall al.111 

apply to ,ns!a.'i<111011.,· of ht',· I hem mot,,,· ,1:.hir!~ !i1.-:I diJpt•11x1 fl.I( ., 1011r 111-1 11·hc n• oh,u ,,. ,ll,/'l llmd .\'llirug11 

is n:q11irt:d. 

Ordmancc-2019.I 120 California Fire Code Page 11 of 17 

20-0203 C Page 16 of 41 



Chapter 61 

Section 6I04 Location of LP-G11s ConlRinc:n 

6104.2 Maximum CallRCif}' within Est11blished l..imil~ ~hell be nmc:nded 11s follo\\s The sturugoc 

of Jiqif(~fied p,.:trolt!um go.v i11 t'.\Ct'.H (?fan r1>?Kl'•\l{<lll' '!l l, {)/J/J.gc1J/11n il'ater capacity wh,rn locm.:d at 

least (Jm:-hal( ( f/2) mile from /Jl'Of"TII' zonnl or ,ks1'>,:nof1•djrw r,.·si,lential uu and ar leasr one-half 

(li2) mile from i!J'i.,·ting: l'L•,1idenli11/ rl,•1°,!lo1m11•nr with a d,imity gn•mt.!r Own one (I j dH"L'liin.r.: unil per 

acre und ut lca.,r mre-lto/((l/2f milt• f1om m1_v hold or motel 1.1· allowed when AH.I approvt!d, anJ o 

spt.•<:iaL'<.·m,ditional UH' J1t'l'f'1il is isrned br th.: (_ ·,mmy ~r El Dorado. 

Di.rpcmin~ within L'Jrah/1rl1c:d h,1111s Within the limits ,·st<1blisl1t·d by law restric:1i11g the di.1JH!r.rirm t/f 

{iqut!f:t'II fN.:trol,·11111 ,r,11 1111· tllf' I" 111,•cflnn of hn11•1A f>"f''iloti•d or congesred areas. the aggregut1.• 

capat'lt_l uf ,my 11•tr oH/11)/,1/1, ,,, ihull not ,·xr,•ed u WiJf<'r capacitr of 2,000 gallons. The cli.,pensinX 

r~( liq11c_li1•d f><:lrol,·11m ga\ 1n r .:cr1.1 /I/an 11g,f(,rt'xate o/'2. 000-:;.all,m water capncily when localt!cl 

at lt·ast nm!· hoi( // } J milr from /WO/><'rt,1· zoned 111· design<1ted _(or resi<lenlial r1Je and at /,:r151 one­

ha(I 1 /.), mr!t"from ,.-.n11in.~ r1·1,dem1.-il d,:1·,·fo11m,:-m i•·ith a ,i,:11.\ir_1,greuu•r than one (Ii dwdlm.~ 11ml 

per acre urrd at f,•,11r ,,,·w-ltdi/ 1 /, }i mlfc _thm, :my hOle/ or mr)le/ is allmn!d wben A.HJ .:prwm•ed ar'l<.i 

a JJH!1.:i,1lc-'um.li1rorr,1/ ust /><'1'11111 1s 1~u1,ed tiy I~ Co111t~,· l:(EI Dorado. 

Secelon bl 12 lliKh Ueulion UyudieJ Petroleum Gas Installation, {S,OO(l-foyl dtn1tion1 11nd 

11bovc) s.hull bt 11.dded £1S t,:,lfc,ws: 

6J 12.1 l~eguh1tyn; ,hall be 11tlded 11~ k,llo..,..s· 

Two-.,·top,t• n•1,11l,1101 .1·v1·fr111 .rhnll b;_, im·to!led in accordunn· with 111iln11(i1c11wer rt',/llll',•111,•11/\ 

Two· l't,1.i.:<· l'<'J:tilatm· s1,.1u111.1 .rh<1/J ht• rn.ftalled on all LPG in.~t.11/arrom. 

Jhejirst slagt' r,·g11/111ot· shall he irt.\'lolled 11r1Jer tire hinged ;:uuKt: r.·m·cr .,11,•rlr,·d 1,·i1h tl,t tarr, i'nc 
almo.1plw,·ic p,·,·.1·.,;nr1: ll/l('l't11r,• o/'Jhe rt'gr1/af'-w shall he pointed do,wrn·,w./ Thf'.fini sf,;,'(_r 1,·_~11/olor 

shall I><: 11/11111b,·d 10 the n.1·1;r o/rhe yard p11nng, with soji cop/><-'r 11,hin;;: I0 '1ilow 1/c.-,nd11,1 ,hould tonk 

slri/1111.~ on-111· l'h1• rist·r.fi·om the yard 111pi11g shall be lncmed no/ mo,·,: than J indH:.i 1/•,111:.,11n,1/111 

from th,~ watls u(the tank. 

Th(• .•:rcnml .tWJ?.c r,.ig11la1rir and ri.,1•r pipe shall he lh.ftolfrd rrnder !ht: ,:ave,~/ ilw h111Mm,v,, tH dosi• 

m prnniL·ahlc lo the building wall. This ris<'r shull be .1·,..uu·c:/.1• ,\'11/>J>til'l<'d/brm·i·d ro /hi! wall 

0111110.rn11,1f('/\· /(I inchi!s l>elow tire reg1Jlalor so t1s lo 1m.•1,.·nt hemling 1,f'tht! /!1/W hy lwrrul 111ow/ic.­

Jo,.u.h, 

-~ 11rnr.:,:1i,'<' c,n-er. (J/lfH·m1ctl by the gm .111p11ht-r 1111,J l/11il,/111g 0//wiul. ,!rail he lm/11//,,d 11\'t'I' 1/w 

.,ot',·oml .floge re;.:11/ntor and s,~Clll'('(l· .1!1/1/"ll'l,·d fO th<' g,·111111fi ,;1- d111go,1,;1/fr to the walr 

The n.ver /IIJ"Jesfor !flt! yard pif!lnY, shall n,1r ,'>.: ,·111hnld,•d 1n 1 .-,1,nrfl· ( '11mT1•/1• 11J111·(·d an J11111l s11ch 

riser .,ho/I fH' /~Id hack u, lt!a.11 r inchti·ont ,Iii ,,1i/n o/fht' 111pc 

Ordinance 2019. I UO California Fire Code Page 12 of I J 

20-0203 C Page 17 of 41 



At t/1(' ti111e o(applicatio11Jhr ony b11ildi11g pen11it. which involves the installation oj"an [,PU svste111, 

tlte (lfJj>licanl shall s11b111il an /,PG .1yste111 plot 1Jl11n i11 3 CO/Jies (or digitallr os PDF). The LPG plot 

plan shall include, /mt not he /i111ited lo. the tunk location. proposed lank capacity i11 U.S. g(l//ons. 

route q(yard piping, location rftl,r: riser pipe al the IJ//ilding. pmperty ho1111daries. and 011 0111/ine <~l 

all existi11glpmpo.1·ed lmildi11gs on the lot and o depiction <?l the ri,~'!,elin,, o( 1111y IJ11ilcli11g to he 

supplied 1Pitlt lf'G. T/1is sh,,!/ also be.f<1n1•arded to the appmpricllefire district 111 serve os <t lornlor 

fll{//J in e11ent 0/011 emergency. 

location of r/,e centerline qj'LPG tanks shall he pemwne,,rly marked by tlte use qf".1·11011• stokes. 011e 

01 each end Such stakes slw/J he qf's11!J1cient height to he Pisih/e through c1111ic1jmled 111axi11111111 s11011· 

depth at the respectiVl' /oc(l(io11. Installation and 11win1e11a11ce of these s11011• stakes are 11,e 

reJpo11sibili()1 of the LP0 user. 

Propane appliances and accessories sh(,!/ nor he per111i11ed in any new i11st(l/l(lfio11 below Ille .first 

floor or beloll' gracle. whichever is 111ore restrictive. 

6112.2 Vertical Riser Piping shall be added as follows; 

A1i11i11111111 1~f"Sc/1ed11le 80 - iron piping. 

The riser sl,al/ he wilhin 3 inches horizontally of"tl,e tank. 

Swing joint.,· shall be installed abo11e and bcdow tank few/ tu provide .for the tonk /J/O\>e111ent (Street 

elbows sha/11101 be used). 

A listedjlexihle riser i.:011.1·/rncled o_(copper or stainless-steel t11binJ; and 1wotected by steel cu1>ered 

sheathed 111<1teriol 111oy he IIS<'cl i11stecul o(sll'i11gj11inrs. The/lexihle o//enwtil'e sl,c,I/ /Jm1·irle wffide11t 

sl11C·k to ol/owfi,r tank 11mve111e111. 

6112.3 Mnrking and Locations shall be added as follows: 

An Of)j)/'Ol'i!d sig11 shall he' loc:atecl clirecl~\' aho\lC' the riser sh,11 a.tr valve 011 the /111i/di11g ;,, (I 11isil,/e 

local io11. 

The liq11e/iecl petmle11111 gm s11pplier shall affix <1 11·eC1therpror?/"ide11t{/icalio11 lag to the inside <?/the 

tank \'(//11e /Jl'Olec1i11g co11er. This log .,·hall contoin the s11pplier's name 1111d e111erge111:1· tele11ho11e 

1111111/,er. 

'/'011k i11sta/h11io11 s/1(11/ he pen11011e11t/y 111arkecl hy o 111erol or 11100d 111aterial s11m1• 11111rker. 11•ith <I 

111i11i11111111 c/i111e11sio11 ol l i11ches hy l inches. TIit' s11011· 11wrker shall he r!f's1!f/ide//l he(~ht 10 rise 

uhcm: 1/1<' 1111111101 s11011· dc•11tl, a11cl slwll h<' a 111i11i11111111 ol I 0/ciet i11 he(~ht. The .,·11011· 111orkc•rs shall 

he pai11ted yellow 11//ll located on op11osile ends olthe funk. 

Section 6113 llndcrgronnd LP<; Tuuk~ lnstallutions and Ownership slrnll he nddcd as l'nllows: 

6113.1 Permits and Plnns shall hc addcd ns fi.illows: l'ent1ils .,·hull he re,111ir<'d. w1d 11la11s s/,a/1 he 

s1dm1itted/iw ull 1111ckrgro1111d to11k i11s10//ali//11s w a1,1m"'<'d hy the A 1-/.J. 

Ordinance 2019.11.20 Culifornia Fire Code Page 13 of I 7 

20-0203 C Page 18 of 41 



6113.2 lJndu2rnp111.I LPG Tank Owncn1hin shall he added as folkw.·s: /ind,:,f!row•d U•(J 1anh 

.~ho/I be pmht'h/1<1dfrom being .mid fr> <'nd-11.1·,·1·s and .iholl b,· rewim·,·i by the l./1
(,' c"III/Jcln)' under c1 

/,'.a.1t• -ripe ,ysr,!m to t!nsure propc, a11m1al ,1,11inh·,1a11c,· n•1111irem,mr,J are ntl!f and r,•f111·,k.l. 

Chapter 80 

ss:~cion 801 Nfl'A. 130-16 - Standud (or the ln,tall•Cion of Sprin~r Sy,km, in One-and Two 

hmU,· D"cllin2s and Manufa('turcd Home~ 10 amended 903.3.1.J, 903.J.5 

N•'PA l3D, Amended Sections a, follmu: 

Revise Section 5.J. l.l Co rtad as followJ: 

Chapter 80. NFPA J3D. 5.1.1.2 .-·I .11111;,h' o/ llf /1•(1.r1 om, 1~.f each ti1n, 11n,I 1,•m1'-<'r<11111,.· •;funA.!,•r used 

1.-ilhin the f11'<!mi.H!.~ shall h<! 111ai11/ailwd on /he JJ/'OJ>a~v al an <1J•pro1·,·d lo .. ·atron ,'itod1. y,rinid,:r.1· .rho/I 

ht' kept in a mo11n1ed and ac,:cJ.1ih/1° 1:oli/11, 0 1. 

Re'llise ~lion -r,6 to read as foUo~,; 

Ch.apter 80. :"IFPA I JO. '7,t, .f i1xal •~Oftr Ji .. 1w a/arm shail 1'ic p, 111 idi:d 011 ,1i!/ir,: .1·prwklr:1· .1.ystemJ in 

homes al an apprm·,:d ilJoL,.'/11111 011 the <'.1'f1.'1'1or of t!u ,htdii,1g. 

nc'llisc Section I L2. I. I to rud n follo~'I: 

Chapter 80. NFPA I.JU. 11.2. I. I Where a fire Jep,mment pmnpcr ,~.,11111.4c:t11111 is no1 pro\ 1dcd, the 

sy~lelll shal I be hydroslnl ii.:,,lly tc:stcd 111 a 111i11i1m111.1 prn,rnrc 1~1 I 50 rum1<i.1 J'<'I 14i,1,.1r,• ,1rch gaugc_(ur 110 

i.•n than a JO-mh111r,,1 dm·o1io11 wt'l/1011/ ,T1dr:11ci: o.flcalmJ.:.,.'. S11<.lr 1,:,1·1 .1/i,,// fl<, w1r11,·.,xr:,/ n:r1h;;,11rf ;·1_,d,: 

o[[Kial. 

Ord inane~ 2019.11.20 Calilomiu Fire Code Page 14 of l 7 

20-0203 C Page 19 of 41 



ApJK'ndh 8 - Fl1'1! Flow RN1111rrmrnh for Ruildin,:• 

hble DJO~.l(JI l<e•1uired tin· tlo" for On"· •nd I"o-hmif' l>"ellinr.,, (;rnup 8-3. 1od R-4 
R11il!lh121 •!cl To,•nh211i9 ,hall h<'. 11111c11<t",1 ns 11,ti. rn,, fur ,•i,·1 .,n, ,,,, h,111 .. \. 1)011 }ut 

: 
FIJO:-J."LOW 

CAtCUL, ... TION 

AREA 

AllTOMA'T'IC 

SPRINt\U:k 
_..,ysn:M 

I MfNIMl!M I fl.OW 

(1quut fttl) (l>nl~n 

l "it.nduJ) 
1----------------~--. -l ~i .. _L'_~:_,._, --

11/,01 '"' ,,, .. ,. 

! 
i !i }N-..1'.1 

i 

~-.'(1 1.tu!o,r rtl i1.: 

1rr,r~. l1 ( 'i.~\l1~fh 

~;11 1u.~qmn,i~. 

~r.r:r·\ kr \\ 1,li,·rr-

~ ( ,:;.··r,- 1·1· ~,-1·!~11n 

FIRE-
I FLOW 

r1.uun, 
11111111 Ir I 

I .l~lO 

VNJ11,-

·i .ut,k 

111 ii'· t (,' I 

W<J 

' (J()f/ 

l.'.' ·· ,1lur 

II lu.~ : ! !, 

DURATION 

tho11n1 

t•tr 

i 
111 lh1rftll,,n 

·-·-----1 
ii, f 

Tnhli: 
1111)~ 111, nl 

llw ,,:.,~lllrnl 

ri.-c--llow rn1,, 
·-· ---··--·------

Vf 

Table BlOS.2 Re<1uin:d Fire Fl•1w for IJuildjg,:.s ocho than Ons- •ml l"o·hn1ih 
Dwellings. Group R-J, 11nd R-_. Huildinr.~ 1,nd J1nu1h911u, sh11'l he u1nc11dc:'1 <.1.< (,.p""'" 

r-----------------·· ··--~---·-- -------·-·. 
I Al.JT0,1ATIC SPRINKLER 

I S\'ST[M 

, _________ _ 

: 1r•.' 

MINl\.111\1 

flR[,fl.OW 

I ( It" lloni fl«' r 

I ~;;::: :" , .,,, 

' 

;.s.""- \(}S ~fth,: ,,_1,1,.; 

111 11~,h.: .'.t!U~.I\~,·• 

:;i"". ,.,s .1{ ht: •;,~~l·,~ 

! lri ':H·k!tl' 1
~ tr).~ 

.. ,._ -·~-------------
-;..··fh1.:-r;du(C(l t\,. iln•., ,h.11 n(,I "I( I(·,, :tnn : 'JJ() 5-P:ll 

··-1· F-;~0~-1>1:-k~ TIO"i 

I jhou1 u 

111 

I Dur.,l11\1, :n 1 :,..le 

[ 

t ~ Ii,~ 1 _: :· 1 ·ol I t.c ((•i Und 

11,-t11.· r;JlL' 

- ... ----·--------

111n5 11;! .,11h, wJ-,,·c,J 

n~'i":'' r~1h.: 

Page I.S of l 7 

20-0203 C Page 20 of 41 



Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

Section D 103 Minim um Specific:,tions 

D103.l Access Road Width with II Hydrnnt shall be amended as follows, adding the exception: 

Exc:eptim1: LJriveways 

Dl03.2 Grade shall be amended as follows: fire upparnllls access roads and driveways shall not 

exceed 15. 9% in grade 1111/ess UJJ}Jl'O\'ed by the AH.I or hy t/J,, J::I Dvruclu Cor11uy w11ended ( 'a/j/im1ia 

Pub/it' Reso11rce Code Title 1./ / Design 011d h11prm•e111e11t Standards Ma1111a/. 

Exception: Eleva/ iun above 5. UOO.feel shall not exceed 12%. 

Dl03.3 Turning Radius shall be amended as follows: The 111ini11111111 r11rni11g. radius shall be 

determined by the fire code official: and sl,a/11101 inc/11de rnrb and g1111er. 

D 103.5 Fire Armaratus Access Road Gales shall be amended as follows: Subsection ( I): Where a 

single gate is provided. the gate width shall be not less than 20 .feet (6096 111111). Whel'e a .fire 

apparnt11s rood consists of' a diPidecl madwa)', rlw gate ,11iclth slw// 1101 be less than 15 .feet ( ./5 7 2 

1/1111). 

D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width shall be .imended as follows: fire lane signs as specified in 

Section DI OJ.6 shall be posted on both side of fire appnrallls access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide 

(6096 lo 8534.4 111111). 

En·eptio11: t:/evutio//S abo11e 5.0UV.fi. os deter111ined hy the .-/H.J. 

D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width shall bl! amended as follows: fire 1:mc signs as 

specified in S<.:ction DI 03.6 shall b<.: p\>Sle<1 011 one side or fire apparatus a<.:<.:ess roads more thun l') 

fcct wid<.: (8534.4 111111) and less thm1 36 feet wide ( 10972.8 111111). 

Exc:eptio11: Elevatio11s ahove 5.000.fi. as deter111i11ed /~1· the AlU. 

D104.4 Circumferential Fire Ap1)1lr11t11s Access Ro11ds shall be added ns follows: Whe11 n·1111ir<'tl 

by the jire t·o,k o//ic ial. a.fire opporof/1s oc1·ess road slwl I he com·tr rn.:ted to encoll1JHl.l'S I l,e rnl irety 

qla str11c/1,re and shall prol'ide a co11/in11011s 111eons <d e111erge1lly Fehicle access. 

Ordinance 2019.11.20 Culifornia Fire Code Page I 6 o I' I 7 

20-0203 C Page 21 of 41 



SECTIUt\ 4: CONFLICT 

!'hat Ordinance ?-.o. 2016. l 0.19 J f the C11ncrnn PMk Cummunity Services Di~tri..:i, and Ill I other ord i11a11ces or 

par.s of ordinances hcre"'irh arc hereby repcitlcd. 

SECTIONS: SEVERABILITY 

If any Ordinance, arlicle, suhsct.:lion <11 -.uhd ivr~io11 thc1 e,,C µ,•}\is ion. 5en1cncc, cl.rnse or phr<tsr;: vi tli is code, or 

1111y npplicntion !hereof, is for Any reRson held tu be irwaiid by a coun of compctc111 .1urisdi.:1i,,1L .5,1,Jch decision 

shall not affect the remaining provbi,,115 of this code, which can be gi..,.·en effect \,i1h1)U! the invalid p,:ir1i~ns and. 

therefore, such invalid p<in ions 11re declar-ed 10 be severable. The C'amcrnn Park t_"omrmmity Sci\ ices District 

hereby declares thot it would hnve e11nde1I this Ordi11..-mce and ench of its nrtklc~. ~cctions, subsectiom. :'.lr 

subdi\ is ions thert.'of. provisiuus, scntc1Kcs. clnuses or rtm1ses irrespective of the foci 1hn1 one or more of them is 

declared invalid. 

SECTIO~ 6: EFFECl'l\'E l>ATE AND PUBLICATIUI\ 

I h1s Ordinance shall take effect thirty 1301 days ailer its adoptic,n The C,m1eri111 Park t:n111munity Services Di,tricl 

Board Secretary is Jireucd to puoli,h this ~,rdinancc in a fiC\~Spapcr Gf f(cneral cir..:ulntion in the District In licL1 

of publication of !hi; full 1c,.t ,Jf the uniinancc. a summary of the ,•nlin.,ncc may be publi~hcd by the by the Board 

Secretary within fifleeu ( 15) dn:,s alter it.s passa~c and a i:crtified cipy ~h111f h~ p,,,tcd in the office of the Cam,;r,111 

Park Community Scn·ii.:c~ l)i\11 icl ptas,1a111 to C,',.m:r11m,-11r C.){k .'i<·,·tron ~t\')3 !1,') ( }), 

The above Ordimrncc wn~ introduced nt a meeting; of the Board of Di1ee10r,; of the Cameron Pan.: (>,mmu11it) 

Service,; District 011 c k111hcl' 16, 2019, and it was then read for the lit~t I ime. A puhlic hearing. Wl'l:s sci for 1hc 

Ordinance 10 Ix: rend frn the second time on November 20, 20 I 1) nud iljlflf ovl·d by the following. \'OIC' 

PASSED A ND A IX JPTED by the Boan:! of Dir~Cli)r:; u r the Cm111.~1t!l1 Pork Community Services District th is 20111 

day of N,,vi:m~i, 2019 

AYES. mS) Hp, I r-c.. ' £J...} l E ,A. 

Noes: No (u.:. 

ABSENT· No Y'\ <L. 

ABSTAIN: rJ c.>l'\J..-

Monique: Scol:i<y 1.;;,e Pn:si(knt 

f°wMd of f)i~Cl<H\ 

Ordinnncc 2019.1 ! .20 California Fire (ode 

':-iel.'rcrary to the Board 

l'ttg.c I 7 of 17 
20-0203 C Page 22 of 41 



RESOLUTJON NO. 2019-22 

OF Tl-IE BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

Of THE CAMERON PARK COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 

RESOLUTION ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO THE 

CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

A resolution of the Cameron Park Community Services District (District) setting forth findings with 

respect to lorn! conditions within tht> District which make certain modific;itions ;ind changes to the 

C;iliforni;i Fire Code reasonably necessary for preserving fire and life safl'ty in the Cameron Park 

Community Services District. 

The Governing Board of the Cameron Park Community Services District finds and resolves as follows: 

WHEREAS, Health & Silfdy Codl' Section 17958.5 permits ;i Firl' Prolt'ction District to adopt an 

ordin;incc which changes or modifies the Stiltc Housing regulations adopted pursuant to Health & 

Silfety Code Section "17922 upon determin.ition that such changes or modifications arc necessary due to 

Inc.ii conditions th;it pert.iin regul.itilll1S governing rnndilions h.izardous to life, property .ind the 

environment from fire, explosion, h.izardous materials and hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, Hei1lth & S.ifl'ty Cndc SC'Ction 17958. 7 n'quircs th.it il District's Bmrd of Directors 

making .iny changes or rnodific.itions pursu.int to Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 shall rnc1ke 

express finding that such chi1nges or rnodific.itions c1re necckd; nnd shall file a copy of such changes or 

rnodifirntions with the Dep,1rtment nf Huusing nnd Community Development. 

WHEREAS, the unique lt1Gi! clirn.itic, geological, .ind topographical conditions existing within 

the boundaries of the Distrkt mi1ke it reasonnbly necessary for the District to impose more stringent 

requirements thnn set forth in the Cnlifornia foire Code and pursunnt to California Hei1lth ,md Safety 

Code SL'ctions 13869.7 .ind 17958.7, the District desires to m.ike express findin~s to lh,1t efiect. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the Cameron Pnrk 

Community Services District, ilfter hi1ving ,l duly noticed nnd held publil' meeting, hereby adopts the 

following findings concerning current unique lorn! conditions th.it together make each modification to 

llw C'.ilifornin Fire Codl', reason,1bly 1wn'ssMy to provide .1deq11atl' and l'lfl'Ctive proll'clion of life, 

property nnd the environment more spl'cifirnlly set forth as follows: 

Page I of4 

20-0203 C Page 23 of 41 



CAM&GEO 

Fire Code II 
S1gn1f1cant 

WhJt Is the ChJngc? 
Locally ado,:ted I SFM adopted/ 

Wily Is There a Local Change? 
change? Amended 

101.1 N Amend with the name of the jurisdiction locally adopted and amended Administrative need 

LPG tanks are known lo possibly leak, LPG is heavier than 

Exception: Above 5000 feel having an aggregate 
air and can easily be trapped under a home, if ignited it can 

105.6.27 y quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving Locally adopted and amended 
lead to an explosion. At elevations above 5000 feet there is 
an ina-eased risk accompanied wilh significant historical fire 

occupancies in Group R-3. 
activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional 
attention. 

Adqpting this section to allow for the a-eation and Issuance 

106.6 N Add section Locally mated and adopted 
of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines 
permits, plan checks, and inspections as allowed iri Health 
&Safety Code 17951. 

106.6.1 N Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.6.1 Cost RecovelY Fees: To recover the cost to 
the Fire District. 

106.7 y Add section locally created and adopted 
Section 106. 7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspections by contractors. 

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District 
is added to read as follows: 
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this 
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an 

109.4 y Added section 109.4 locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal lo the Board of Appeals 
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County of El Dorado's 
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals 
timeline. 

Completed the section by fimng in the blank Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that 

portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is protects life and property. Fees have been updated to 
110.4 N 

better left to localities to determine the Locally adopted and amended match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the 

fees/penalties for their respective areas. 
District Attorney's Office. The change to the language to 
include the term infractions. 

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s), 

110.4.2 N 
Added Section 110-4.2. (This section existed before 

locally created and adopted 
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 

but under a different number) violations of this code pursuantto Section 13871 of the 
Health and Safety Code of the State of Californla and 
Chapter Sc (commencing with section 853.6) of TtUe 3 of 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 

112.4 N 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 

Locally adopted and amended 
All violations of the code have been consolidated under 

better left to localities to determine the Section 110.4 to indude the penalties for violations. 
fess/penalties for their respective areas. 

Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District, 

202 N Added definitions ror clarity Locally created and adopted 
Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd 
Manager. Definition of campfire shall not include LPG or 
Propane fueled appliances. 

302.1 N Added definition for Cam plire to Section locally created and adopted Added definition for darily 

307 .4.4 through Due to the high fire danger that exists in El Dorado County 

307.4.4.2 (d) 
y Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopted we have written more stringent rules pertaining lo open fires 

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas. 

20-0203 C Page 24 of 41 



' ' ,' 

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical 
dearance of 15 feet provides proper dearance for 
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus 
components. It also allows an extended time frame before 

. 503.2.1 N 
Changed vertical dearances to 15 feet and road 

Locally adopted and amended 
having to reaJt the growth of the vegetation. Addtional 

widths to 20 feet 
height for vegetation dearances ads as an increased buffer 
for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exdusive of 
shoulders, as measured face of curb to face of curb is 
needed. These stnictures can be iJffirult to navigate with 
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the toial. 
drivable road surface 

' . 

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the 
Fire apparalus require areas for turning around when 

503.2.5 N 
Fire Code and TiUe 14 Fire Safe Regulations to 

Locally adopted and amended 
multiple vehides are on the scene of an emergency. This 

match as they require turnarounds for fire apparatus 
indudes fire vehides as well as civilian vehides. Provides 

access roads and driveways. 
better access for ingress/egress, Additionally, adds tum 
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

Allows codes and slandards for Bridges and Elevated 

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated Surfaces of El Dorado County and AppendiJC D of the 

503.2.6 N Surfaces to state and match El Dorado County Locally adopted and amended 
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be 

Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17. consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an 
alternate means & methods that is not less restrictive than 
the Fire Code. 

503.4.2 N Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes Locally aeated and adopted 
This section dearly defines the 'No Parking in Fire Lanes' 
rules and is consistent with the Catifomia Vehide Code. 

503.4.3 N 
Added section regarding no parking in front of 

Locally aeated and adopled 
This section dearly defines the 'No Parking in front of fire 

hydranls 
hydrants' rules and is consistent with the Caifomia Vehicle 
Code. 

503.4.4 N 
Added section regarding fire lanes based on road 

Locally aeated and adopted 
This section dearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D 

width 
as the reference for roed lane width and their relation to fire 
lanes. 

Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on 

503.5.3 N 
emergency access and consistency through all 

Locally aeated and adopted 
roadways based on the Disbicts gate standard, providing · 

roadway gates in El Dorado County, refening to the the best possible emergency access to maintain fast 
gate standards adopted by the FPO's. response times. 

505.1 N 
Added section per1aining to the visual addressing of 

Locally ad opted 111d amended 
Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing 

buildings based on the Disbict's addressing standards. 

Added more conservative standard for the Commercial properties are required to install hydrants at 

507.5.1 N placement of hydrant and their relationship to Locally adopted and amended 
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150 

commercial buildings 
feet from any giYen hydrant at anytime (half the distance in 
between). 

Buildings are gelling more sizable in the county. It is more 
common to have new buildings with solar arrays that 
continue to generate power even when the buildings 

509.3 y Added verbiage to bring all of the necessary fire 
general utilities have been shut off. When there is an 

controls for a building to one location. 
Locally created and adopted emergency, it is vital that we have rapid access to all of the 

controls in one location for public evacuation and firefighter 
safety. Due to the fire danger present in El Dorado County 
throughout most of the year, this change is appropriate and 
advisable. 

,., Due to the topographic, dimatic, and geographic conditions 

•:. Adds ii requireni~t for sprinlder system insiallation 
of El Dorado County and their conbibuting factors to our 

903.2 N 
Increased r'lisponse times, aking with the fact that fires 

in new buikirigs and structures 3,600 square feet or . Locally adopted and amended ciool>hi iri size each arid every minute. we require sprinklers 
gfBl:lter within the district. · · · io be lrisiaHed In structures once they reach 3,600 square 

ree1 in size as they· ni1a1, Iii fire beliavior and· rate of• 
&plead.·.· .. 

20-0203 C Page 25 of 41 



i· 
Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

903.2.a than 3,600 square feet lo install sprinklers If they 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

N LocaUy created and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 

to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
structure, whichever is less. 

feet iii size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
: spread. 

· .. 

( ·. 
Due lo the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

·. of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
Adds ciccupant protecti<in for existing buildings less 

.. 
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they increased response times, along Mlh the fact that fires 

...... 903.2.b N Locally creaied and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers . add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 
io be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 

structure, whichever is less. 
•. feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 

•. I• spread, . 

· .. Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

!' of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

903.2.1, 903.2.3, 
These sections were created to give specific inaeased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.4, 903.2.7 
N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage lo be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread . . 

Manufactured Homes - The intent or this code secijon is to 
ensure that manufactured homes that S8IVl! as a one or two 
family dweUings are consistent with the provisions found in 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to buill dwellings of a similar 

This section was created to include manufactured 
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-1Jr!>an 

903.2.8.2 y residential single family R-3 in the residential Locally created and adopted 
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption 

sprinkler program 
due to the light-weight nature of their consllllction. The 
rapid fire spread throughout these slructures presents a 
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk 
successfully in many California communities. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geogf11Phlc conditions 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

These sections were created to give specific increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2.9, 903.2.10 N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and f1V8r'J minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Added occupant protection for fire alarms in 
buildings with a floor area less than 3,600, except 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
907.2.a N 

R3, AG buildings not used for commercial 
Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in purposes, and buildings with a floor area ofless 

than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code the event of a fire or smoke. 

official. 

Added oca,pant protection for existing buildings 
Provides proper emergency notificatiiJri for occupancies that 

without automatic sprinkler systems to instaD ii fire 
907.2.b N 

alann if they add more than 30% or 1,000 square 
Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

feet to the structure, whichever is Jess. 
the event cl a fire or smoke. 

Added occupant protection by stating all fire alarm 
detection systems installed shaU be connected to a Provides proper emergency notifii:aljon for occupancies that 

907.2.c 
. N monitoring seivice thai notifies the fire department Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

upon activation and is instalied per Section 907 of the event of a fire or smoke, 
·. 

the fiie code; · · · · · 
,. . 

1: : · . Added iicicupan1 protection for type 1 Hood. ·.i ... / Prcivides proper elllergency notincat1ai fur ocxuJ)lfflcies ~at . 
907.2.d: 

· .. 

Locally created and adopied •· N systems to be connected ii> a mooiioied fire alarm 1· aNow public use and ensures Fire [)epilrtiniint notification in 
system when 1nsia1100 or replaced. · the event of a fire or smoke. . . 

20-0203 C Page 26 of 41 



;_-

907.6.2.1 y Primary Secondary Alann Power Supply 
Locally created and adopted 

Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E 
Modification safety related power outages. 

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off de'lices to 
1203.1.3 N Shunt trip power safety de'lices Locaffy adopted and amended ensure emeigency power shut off during the use of back-up 

power suppfies 

3310.3 N Address requirements for construction sites Locally created and adopted 
Addressing for construction sites Is important to assist 
responding emeigency crews. 

3312.1 N 
Water supplies at construction sites will 

Locaffy adopted and amended 
Ws.er must be on site pnor to combustible material being 

combustible materials on-site stored or vertical construction commencing. 

El Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout 

4903.1 This section was created to indude Fire Protection y Locally created and adopted 
the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire 

Plan for all fire hazard severity zones. Protection Plan due to dimatic. geological, and 
topographical conditions. 

This section darifies that within the boundaries of El Dorado 

4905.4 y Added a section to darify roof construction 
Locally created and adopted 

County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are 

requirements 
wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be 
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly. 

5001.7 
Any damages or costs from negligent practices that 

Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate. 

y cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally crealed and adopted 
11 the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 

cost recovery fee. 
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the 
negligent parties. 

Added safety protection with permits being issued 
Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and 

5601.2 N 
by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for 

Locally adopted and amended 
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of 

firewaks to approve them and have a dear understanding 

Supervisors for fireworks. 
of the applications they will be used for. 

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any 

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 
Fireworks companies or vendors shall make 

dOC1Jmentation induding timing and proprietary infonnation 

N available all requested documentation pertaining to Locally created and adopted 
that pertains lo any aspect of a fireworks display that they 

lhe firework presentation 
deem necessary. This infonnatior is understood lo be 
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as 
such. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5704.2.9,6.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County. 

Established llmits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5706.2.4.4 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid special 
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval 
and a SpeciaVConditional Use Penni! from the County. 

Administrative need to add District name. Established limits 

: 

5806.2 I N 
Administrative addition of District name. 

as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable 

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code 
Locally adopted and amended Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ 

approval and a Special/Conditional Usa Permit from the 

.·· . . . County . . . 
Established limits as required by the Fire Code Official for 

5806.2.1 :·. N Established limits as set fortti in the Fire Code SFM adopted a~ amended locally 
Flammable Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. 
Requires AHJ approval and a Speciaf/Concfltional Use 

. Penni! from the County . 

Establishes distances between LPG storage and 
dispensaries that are directly related to safely for residential 

E~bllshed Hmils for LPG st~e and dispensing 
. 

6104.2 N Locally adopted tind amended• 
developments and high-density hotels, motel; apatments. 

,···· near or aqacent to residential developmeni. 
etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gis would 

, .•.. : ', .. 
have a high probability cl injury, lnhalatton, or death: 

L 
. ' Requires~ approval and a Spedal/Conditional Use 

Pennii from the County, . 
.":· .. ·: ·. ... .. '· : . .. 

' . 

20-0203 C Page 27 of 41 



6112.1 

6112.2 

6112.3 

6113.1 

6113.2 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
130-16 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
130-16 Section 

5.1.1.2 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
130-16 Section 7.6 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
130-16 Section 

11.2.1.1 

• · Appendix B: Table 
. a1os: 1(1). . 

. · Ajlpendbt B: T ~~e 
8105.2 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

y 

y 

y 

y 

Establishes propane regulator requirements for 
locations above 5000 fooi elevation ... 

Establishes propane marking and location 
requirements above sooo foot elevation 

Pennits arid plans shall be submitted arid approved 
by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction). 

Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the 
property of the LPG company 

NFPA 130-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the 
District has been amended to update various 
prollisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler 
systems in one-and two-family dwellings 

To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler 
system minimizing damage 

Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation 

System test to a ptessure or 150 p. s. i. 

Changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot t~t;tatc11 firefl(7,V prea,dents useci in ... · 

Established a miiiimum requirement of 1 ;soo GPM, 
below 5000 foot elevation, for all commercial 
projects 

. LocaUy created and adopted· 

Locally aeated and adopted 

locally aeated and adopted. 

Locally created and adopted 

SFM Adopted and amended locally 

Establishes propane regulator requirement for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. lnduding requirements for two­
stage regulaicr use and location of first and second stage 
regulators'. Additional requirements are outlined for 
protective covers, riser pipe installation requirements, 
buHding permit submittal and 1'81/iew, tank center~ine 
rnmmg, and grade requirements. These requirements are 
based on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 
~eathtli' coiiditioils encountered above 5000 feet 

Eslll~ish~ verti~I propa~e rise iequiiements for locations 
above 5000 foot etevaiion. Pipe $Cheduie iocatioo, swing 
jointiequirements, and the use of flexible riser piping as . 
well as swing jolnis. These requirements are based on . 
s/griificiinl fire histoiy in heavy snow and. extreme weather 
coiiditions encountered above 5000 feet 

Establishes marking and location requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. This section addresses signage 
location, emergency contact information, and snow related 
tank marking requirements. These requirements are based 
oil significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet 

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground 
tanks: . .. 
Allows us to require plans be subniitted for Al'liew prior lo. 
installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks 
require substantial maintenance including inspection and 
anode replacement at regular interwls. 

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak wilhout 
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when 
sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground 
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected. 

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on­
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water ffow 
alarm to aeate an audible alert for the ffow or water in the 
event of water activation in a vacant structure, and 
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 130 
sprinkler system installation deaeaslng the risk of water 
damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements 
were also added to ensure water circulation through the 
system, reducing stagnant water and backffow concerns 
(EID encourages this type of system). 

A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system 
SFM adopted and amended locally must be available on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet 

SFM adopted and amended locally 

SFM adopted and amended locally 

An audible alarm system is added to notify occupants and 
in the activation of the system when the building is not 
occupied allow for detection minimizing damage. 

A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and 
failures and assures proper gluing of system components. 

Ailows us. to match what developers arid residents are used 
to .in regard~ to GPM fire flow requiremenls thafbave been . 
iiS8!1 fa' over a decade in EDC. . . . . . . . . 

Ailows us 10 mati:h what 11eve1opers and resdents are used 
to iri. rajards to GPM fire flow ~ieinents thai have been 
used for' over a decade in EDC .. 

20-0203 C Page 28 of 41 



Appendix D: D103.1 N 

Appendx D: D103.2 N 

Appendix D: D103.3 N 

Appendix D: D103.5 § 
N 

1 

Appendix D: D103.6.1 N 

Appendix D: D103.6.2 N 

Appendix D: D104.2 
Exception 

N 

Appendix D: D104.4 N 

Appendix D: D106.1 
N 

Exception 

Appendix D: D107.1 
N 

Exception 

101.2 through 101.5 N 

102.6 through 102.8 N. 

102.10 through 102.12 N 

103.1 through 104.1 N 

104.3 ihrough 104.4 N 
. 

104.s through 104.6.4 N 

104.8 through 104.9.2 N 

104.11 through N 
104.11.2 

104.11.3 NO.. 
105.2.3. N. 
105.3.1 through Ni.··. 
1Q5.3.2 •. ······.' 

105.6.12 •. ·. N 

Made an exception for residential driveways 

State law requires no greater than 16% grade 

Text to indude curbs and gutters 

Fire apparafus access road gates . 

Roads widths 20 to 29 feet 

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36 
feet in width 

Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered 
building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to 
have only one approved fire apparatus access road. 

Added to require circumferential fire apparatus 
access roads 

Removed Exception in its entirety. 

Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. 

LocaHy adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

I· Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Adopted with no Amendments 
Adopted to establish scope, intent severabiHty and 
validity 

References, Subjects not regulated by the code 

Conflicting provisions, Other Laws, Application of 
reierences 

Definition of the Fire Prevention Division and ability 
to enforce the code 

Right of Entry, Warrants, and Identification . 
· ...... ·. " ... . .. • . 

·.·: -: · ... 
Record retention 

Modifications, alternate means and methods, and 
iest . ', 
Auttiority at fires, right of access, maintenance of 
systems•. 
Authority of sysiems and devices inoperable 
Tiine runiltition of application •. · ', . . 

,,, 

Dry deaning <i!)eralioria1 peonits ri,'quired tor . · 
iiazarcioos deaning so1veo1 use · · ·. ;, · · . \ 

Locally adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Loi:aUy Adopied 

Localiy Adopted. 

Locaiy Adopted 

Locally Adopted 
· .. ,' " ··. 

Locallv Adopted 
Localfy Adopted ·. ·. 

Localy Adopted. 

It is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to 
construct a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant 

TIiie 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways. 
In our 8 Dorado County Tide 14 adoption we all?-" greater 
than 16% grade with AHJ approval and haid surface. 

20 foot road widths shall not indude curbs and gutters due 
to potential access issues and turning radius concerns. 

Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a cflVided 
ioadway' ttie gate width shall not be less than 15 feet due to 
radius issues. . . . . 

No par1cing on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet 
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does 
not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire 
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all other elevations. 

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet 
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of 
elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The 
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D 
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations. 

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 
ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 
residents and first responders. 

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire 
structure and shall provide a continuous means of 
emergency vehicle access. 

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 
ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 
residents and first responders. 

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 
ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 
residents and first responders. 

Administrabve dality 

Administrative darity 

Administrative darity 

Administrative darity 

Administrative dality. . 
.. . . . . . . :•. 

Administrative darity 

Administrative darity 

Administrative daril)' 

Administrative darity . ·. 
Administrative diritv 

~i.nislriltive darity .•. 

Adlninislnitivf darity, . ·. 

20-0203 C Page 29 of 41 



-·----r----.,...---------------.------------.-----------------, 

105.6.2.28 through 
105.6.35 

105.6.37 · 

105.6.39 
\. ·. 

105.6.41 through 
105.6.46 

· .. ·. 

105.6.48 . 

105.6.50 

106.1 thioogh 106.3 

107.1 

108.1 through 109.3 

110.3.2 through 
110.3.4 

110.4.1 

113.1 

303.1 through 303.9 

305.1 through 305.5 

306.1 through 306. 2 

307.1 lhrough 307.5 

. 
308.1 . 

308.1.2 through 
308.1.3 

308.1.5 through 
308.1.8.5 

308.2 

·. 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N.:.·• 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative darity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and Irle safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections . 

. 

l\dopted this section for administrative darity and 
fire and life safety inspection11 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and fife safety inspections .. 

·. 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative dariiy and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and fife safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and tile safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and 6fe safety .. . 

Adopted this section for fire and life sa'ety 

Adopted this section ~ fire arid life safety 

Adopted H1is seclion for fire and life safety . 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopied 

i..ocat~ Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

. t.o'ca11y Adopted . 

Pellllits for various business operations for: Magnesium, 
miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation 
vehides, motor fuel-<lispensing facilities, open burning, 
open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and 
01911nic coatings 

Permits for places of assembly 

Permits for private fire hydrants 

Permits for pyroxylin plastics, refrigeration equipment repair 
garages and motor fuel-<lispensing facilities, rooftop 
heliports, spraying or dipping; storage of scrap tires and tire 
by-products 

Permit for tire-rebuilding plants 
.. . .. 

Permit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material, 
lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 cubic feet) 

Fee schedules for permits 

Inspection authority 

Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of 
equipment re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping, 
supeNision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding, 
Board of Appeals established, limitations on authority, and 
qualifications 

Compfiance with orders and notices, prosecution of 
violations, and unauthorized tampering · 

Abatement of violation 

Authority to disconnect service uU!ities 

Asphalt kettles contain highly flammable substances and 
require smngent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Managing ignition sources through responsible appUcation 
of standards wiU reduce the number of fires in various 
settings (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY 
flammable and require special handling (Cffmatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

Open burning, recreational fire, and portable outdoor 
fireplaces, (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

. 

Open flame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and 
klpograplllcal) . 

Throwing or placing of ignition sources, torches for 
removing paint (Climatic; geological, and topographical) 

Locations near combustible, open flame devices, signals 
and markers, J)Ol!able fuel open-flame devices, sky­
lenterns; refigioos ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming 
foeid and l>everage preparation, dispensing, containers not 
In use, !ring of flaming food, location, fire protection 
(CliriiaHc; gedogk:al; and topographical) .. ·. 

Permits aie required for above section (C&matic, geological, 
and k)pOJraphical) •.·· . . . . . 

20-0203 C Page 30 of 41 



Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices, 
.308.3 through 308.4.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safely Locally Adopted theabical performances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 

.. dormitories (Oimatic, geological, and topographical) 

310.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safeiy . Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to smoking (Climatic, 

. . . . . geological, and topographical) 

310.3 N Adopted this section for fire and lif;e safely Locally Adopted 
'No Smoking' signs (Climatic, geological, and .. · . . topogra~lcal) • 

: 
. ' : .. 

Removal of signsj)rohibited, compliance with 'No Smoking' ... : 

310:4 through 310.8 N Adopted this section for fire and life ~fety Locally Adopted signs; ash trays, bumirig objects, hazardous environmental 
.. coodilions. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

.- ·. 1.-_-... . . :· .· · . . .. ·. 

· ... · 

Vacant premises ~dilion and safely requinmients, ·. 

311.1 through 311.4 Adopted this section for fire and life safety 
Abandoned premises,. tenant spaces; safegilaic/ing vacant 

N Locally Adopted premises, securiiy, fire protection, fiie' separation, removal 
of combustibles; rernovai of hazardous miiterlaJs. (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

319.1 N Adopted this section for fire ~ life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements reialing to mobile iood preparation 
vehldes. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) . 

. · 

319.2 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
Permits for mobile food preparation vehides (Climatic, 

fire and life safety inspections geological, and topographical) 

I Exhaust hood, fire proieciion, fire protection for cooking 
equipment fire extinguisher, appliance connection lo fuel 
supply piping; cooking oil storage containers, metallic 
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking oil 
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting, 
normal vents, emergency vents, LP.gas systems, maximum 

319.3 through aggregate volume, protection of container, LP11as cootainer 

319.10.3 
N Adop\ed this section. for fire and life safety Locally Adopted cooslruction, protection m system piping, LP-gas alarms, 

CNG systems, CNG coolainers supplying only cooking fuel, 
maximum aggregate volume. protection of container, CNG 
container construction, CNG containers supplying 
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping, 
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire 
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems. 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

403.8.1 through Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1 

403.8.1.7 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted (residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and 
fi(il safety plans. 

403.10 through 
Adopted this section for fireand life safety 

Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancy 

403.10.1.3 N Locally Adopted Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic, 
geological, and topographlcal) 

405.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety. Locally Adopted 
Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

510.3 N 
Adopted this section for administrative darity and 

Locally Adopted 
A penmit is required for emergency responder radio systems 

fire and life safely inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a 
807.5.2 lhrough 

N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in 

807.5.2.3 fire and life safety inspections educational facilities (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

AA automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5 

903.2.1.5 N 
Adopted this section for administrative darity and 

LocaRy Adopted 
(sporting arenas, amusement pa,k structures, bleachers) 

fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological. and topographical) greater than 1000 
square feel. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

20-0203 C Page 31 of 41 



Emergency ResJ)Ollder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders 
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from 
each other and lhe emergency dispatch center. Time 

Adopted lhis section in existing buildings for lhe 
frames can be developed to come into compliance and lhe 
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by 1103.2 y safety of firefighters and other emergency Locally Adopted 
the fire code official, is acceplable. The rationale behind 

responders. 
lhis section is lhat on almost all emergency responder injury 
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected wilh the addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix D: 0101.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
LocaRy Adopted 

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads 
through 0102.1 firefighters: anil ottier emergency responders. induding loads. (Climatic, geological; and topographical) 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
LocaQy Adopied 

Dead end fire apparatus access road requirements for a 
Appendix D: 0103.4 N 

firefighlels, and other emeigency responders. 
tum around at 150 feet (aiinatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Appendix D: 0103.6 N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
'No Parking, Fire Lane' signs requirements. (Climatic, 

firefighters, and other emergency responders . geological, and topographical) 
. 

Appendix D: 0104.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Commercial and indusbial development fire apparatus 

through 0104.3 N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. 

Locally Adopted 
access roads. (0"1111atic, geological, and topographical) (excluding exception) \ 

Appendix D: D105.1 
N 

Adopted this secilon for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

Requirements for aerial fire apparatus access roads 
through D105.4 firefighters; and other emergency responders. (aiinatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix D: D106.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential 

through D106.3 N Locally Adopted 
(exduding exceptions) 

firefighters; and other emergency responders. developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix D: 0107.1 
One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire 
(excluding exceptions) N 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. 
Locally Adopted 

apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 
through D107.2 

climatic oondilions. 

Appendix D: 0108 N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. standards (Climatic. geological, and topographical) 

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle . 

. 

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

20-0203 C Page 32 of 41 



Cameron Park Fire Department 
In cooperation with the 

California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection 

Fire Station 89 
3200 Country Club Drive 
Cameron Park, CA 95682 

(530) 677-6190 
(530) 672-2248 FAX 

To whom it may concern, 

Fire Station 88 
2961 Alhambra Drive 
Cameron Park, CA 95682 

(530) 672-7350 
(530) 672-7352 FAX 

For the Cameron Park Fire Depanmcnt 2019 Fire Code adoption, public notice was achieved through 
posting our Notice of Intent in the following three locations: 

• On the board locaied in the front of Fire Station 89 at 3200 Country Club Dr. 

• Packets placed in the front office at Fire Station 89. and available for the public to view_ 

• On the Districts website, detailing the location and time of the meeting where the adoption was 

going to talce place. 

The district was always forthcoming with the information of proposed changes and had it readily available 
for review by the public. Additionally, the District gave enough time for public comment and viewing. 

Sincerely, 

Jed Gaines 
Fire Chief 

20-0203 C Page 33 of 41 



Cameron Park Fire Department 
In cooperation with the 

California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection 

Fire Station 89 
3200 Country Club Drive 
Cameron Park, CA 95682 

(530) 677-6190 
(530) 672-2248 FAX 

Fire Station 88 
2961 Alhambra Drive 
Cameron Park, CA 95682 

(530) 672-7350 
(530) 672-7352 FAX 

Attachment No. 2 

Cameron Park Community Services District 

Resolution No. 2019-22 

20-0203 C Page 34 of 41 



lffSOLUTIO!\ NO. 2019-22 

OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

OF TiiE CAMERON PARK COMMUNI1Y SERVICES DISTRICT 

RESOLUTION ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO THE 

CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

A r<'solution of the Cameron Park Community &>rvkes District (District) setting forth findings with 

respect to local conditions within the District which make certain modificahons and change!> to the 

Califomi,1 Fire Code reasonably nen•ss.,ry for pn•st•rving fire and life safetv in the Cameron Park 

Community Scrvict>5 District. 

The Governing Board ol the Cuncron Park Community Services District finds and resolves as follows.· 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code St-ct ion 17958 5 permits a Fire Protection District to adopr an 

ordinance which changes or modifi~ the Stl\te Housing regulc1tions adopted pursuant to Health & 

S..1foty Code Section 17922 upon determination that such .:hanges or mo..iifications are neccss.iry due to 

local conditions that pertain r~~ul.,lions governing cund11ions hazardous to life, property and the 

environment from fire, explosion .. h,,z.lrdous millerials and hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, Health &i: S.,il·ty Code S«tion 17958, 7 rf!'\Juire'i that a District's Board of Directors 

making any changes or mod1f1c.-1tions pursu.lnt to He.11th & Sa£etr Code Section 17958.5 shall make 

expreS5> finding that such .:hangl-s or modifil·..11ions are needed; and shall file a copy of such chang•~s or 

modificc1tions with the Department of Housing and Community Development. 

WHEREAS, the uniqu(' loc,,I dimnttc, geological, and lopographic.:,I conditions existing within 

the boundaries of the Distrkt make it reasonably necessnry for the District to impose more stringent 

requirements than set forth in the C.ilifornla Fire Code and pursuant to C.1lifornia Health and Safety 

Code se<tions 13869] and 17958. 7, the District desires lo make express findings to that effect. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOl.VED that the Board of Directors of the CamC'ron Park 

Community Services District, after having n duly notked nnd held public meeting. hereby adopts the 

following findings concerning current unique loc11I conditions that to~ether make each modification to 

the California Fire Code, m,sonably necess.uy lo provide adequate and effective protection of life, 

property and the environment more specific.illy set forth ns follows: 

Page I of4 

20-0203 C Page 35 of 41 



rr ... I .. ~ . 

flNDINGS OF FACT 
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BlJILDfNG STANDARDS 

CODE (TITLE 24 PART 9> DECAUSF OF LOCAL CONDITIONS 

A. General. 
After due i.:onside1'.1tion. the Board of Diwcturs of lhe Cuneron Park Community Serv1Cl'5 

District/Cilmcr,:,n P~rk Fm: Dq,.,nrrnent. ht:rd)V finds thnt due to locai climatic, geologic and 

topogrilphic Cfmdition:; .. i15 Sl,1ted within thb dncunwnt, thNt! J<, a need to provide the modific,,tion.s 

and changes contilrnt:d in the .,doptive Unlinilncc of the California Fire Code. Such changes Me 

det!med reas.:m.1bly n,~.:,:s:-,,,ry ttl pn•vid,'. o1dt•tp1,*' and dfectiv1! protedion of life, property and rh.._. 

erwironment 

The Cameron I'arii:. Ct>rnrl1utlttv S.:rv:ct:s Dbtrid/C.imernn Park Fire Department provides firl' 

protection t·mergl'11cy nwdic.il .'>crv1n•s and specl.llized rescue services to approxirnatdy twenty-three 

thous,mJ ~._,pl,: in ;in l, :-,ql1,1ri: mtl{' ,ire;i. The Oistri.:t 1s hKatt>d on the w1.•stcrn slope uf El D0r,1d11 

County. 11H: topn~r,11,hv ,II the Di~rrict (OllS1sls o! a cen1r.1l valll'y along the Deer Cn:ck drilinage, 

appro);imi11ely ''. milt• wi,fo · .... irh a nonhv.:est/sourhe,l'i! orientation. C.1mcron Park's area of the Pirw 

Hill Pre-.en·e is ,lpproxa,1.1t,:I\' 42.,:; ,wws ot m-'t\lrc stands of M,mzanita and ChemlS,(' brush .ind dense 

oak wood l.inrl fnn>SI!- 111 the we~t. The we,11her conditions ',·ary from freezing lcmpl.'rJtUrl's with 

occas1on;:il snow m \,•mter to summer 1em~'{'ratures that regularly e.:..::eed JOO dc~re;.-s. 

The District can t... div1d,·d into f,:)ur di:,tind nreas: The core. southern are.1. cncomp;isses the ! !ivy 50, 

Cmwron P.-1rk and C,11nhridg1· Ro;id :c,rrid,:-;rs The core ;irea is urban ,md c,mtai11:; ir.ost ,.it the 

Districl's ,!xistin!<; cummert.'tili ,md rl·.s1dential developments. The north and e~st areas tvp;1.:,1Hv rnnt,1111 

small subdivisil'111S, golf 1.:1)Lrrse .• 1irpurt and a 40 ,,ere lake. The we:-.tl'n; .irca ·. ont,111\:> the ['ine Hill 

Pn!Sl:r Vl'. 

The C.1nwnm Pi!rk Community SerVk'.t!S Districl/Cam•~n:m F.:irk Fire LkpJrtm,.-nt is M1 ·,1ll·nsk · 

.1gP11cy. lhe District pi1tlic1p.1tcs m .i sophisticated ilutnm;itic aid progrilm ;ind i~ d i~~'ill(hed 1hrou~h 

,1gr1~·1111..'.nt by the C,lifnmi,, l)eparlrnent of Forestry and Fire Pr<Jll'dii)n (CAL.+IRE) i1t C.1minn. The 
r('sources of the District will respond to, and deal with, any type o( l'mN~l'.ncy. Tiw rerrn · Fire 
l'roti._..,:t1011" in this dP<rnn~nl i" broad ,md it,dud('S responses to t1II types of firt"S, ... rn11kl' .ind ,..._ior 
mvc<otig.,tion~, ,1Lirms, publ1( assist calls, hazardous materials i1n.:ld(•nts. medk.il aid ilnd speoalized 

rt>scues. 

The Distrkt h,1s established two .. fufl.time. staffed fire sl,1lions to provide enwrgency ~,,.rvin:-~ to the 

(,m1munit:,'. fire Staii,m 59 is loc,1kd in the soulhl'rn part uf lhl' uni111..urpl1t·,1kd Me;i ofCaml.'ron Park. 

iH 32(Kl Countn· Club Drive. Fire Stillion 88 is locat1ed In the nortlwm p..1rt of the unincorpnratt!d Men 

of Crn1eron Park, ;it 296t Alhambra Drive. The Di,;trkl h,1s 18 ltrll·!inw. c<11ecr F1<.>rso111wl, ,1]1.1ng with 

!W,c'nty·iivc p.nt-!imc Volunteer Res1dcnl F1refi~hters. ,rnd two p.1rt trm,: rirc Prevention Spcdc1lisls for 

lhe di'>lrict·s weed .1b,llem1::nt prn~ram 

20-0203 C Page 36 of 41 



B. Climatic. 
The Cameron Park Community Services District/Camt~ron Park Fire Department is located within a 

foothill region. The District is subjed to four se,lsons, with an annu,11 avcrnge snowfall in the winter 

months of 1-2 lnches, in addition lo an average rainfall of 40 inches per year. These adverse weather 

conditions create severe hazardous road conditions and flooding as well as rock slide hazards along the 

main access roads within, a~ well as into, the Di!'>trict from the surrour,ding areas. Due to periods of 
rainfall, along with rcpc.:ited road dosu re's, the ability of the Fire Protection District to prov id~ 

immt!diate emerg1.:.'nt.:y response is at times delayed. These same .idvcrsc climatic conditions often 

result in a large number of vehicular accidents that place extreme restraints on the availability of 

emergency response to perform emergcm:y rescue, first aid, hazardous materials control and 

firefighting. The climatic conditions often result in a subst~ntial or total lack of abiltty of the Fire 

Protection District to respond immediately to other types of emergencies that occur. 

Examples of these emergencies include structure fires, vehicle fires, wildland (grass, brush, tim~r), 
fires, flooding, haz.irdous materials inddents, emergenc;• medical calls, vehk[e accidents and vertical 

rescues. The mutual aid agreements established with adjoining fire agencies might not be possible" due 

to adverse climatic conditions, restricting or totally blocking access into the District. 

Summary: 
ThesE" local clim,1tic conditions affe<"t the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the District. Times of 

little or no rainfall, lo~: humidity and high ternpcral,irl'S create Pxtrcmely h,12,mious rnndition::., 

particularly ilS they rr.l,itc to the wildl;ind · urban interlace (WUI). Winds experienced in this area can 

have a significant impact upon strncturc fires, c~pecially in buildings in dose proximity to one another, 

and to wild lands commonly found in the Cameron Park Community Services District. Structures built 

within the Cameron Park Community Services District must be built with these variable.sin mind. 

C. Geologic-al. 
The Cc1meron Park Community Services Distrkt is located \Vithin moderate ildivity seismic Zone 3. 

The sdsmk, gL>t.>logical .;ondition1- present a potential for multiple fires, major breakage of wiltcr muins, 

multiple elcclrical power tailurcs, mulliplc rnllilpsed structures and a large number of calls for 

emergency rneclknl aid, all of which may occur simultaneously during a seismic event. The water 

distrkt has numerous water-pumping systems used for fire suppression water delivery, ilS well as 

wiHer .storage tanks providing water system pressure. Most of the pumping systems are dependent on 

electrical power for operation. Such dectric::al power may not be available during a seismic event. 

Water storage tanks used for the storage of required fire suppression water may also collapse in such 

an event forcing the additional need to transport water via additional pieces of fire ,ippr1ratus1 which 

will place a significant restraint on the ability of the District to provide the required emergency 

services. 

Summary: 
Local geographic ,md geologic.ii features c1nd pro<'esses exist \.\1ilhin the boundr1rics of the district. thnt 

may hamper the ability of the Canwron Park Community Services District/Cameron Park Fi re 

Department to perform its sworn duties. Fire foll1>wing an earthquake has the potential of cnu~ing 

greater loss of life and damage than the e,uthquuki:.• itself. 

Pegc 3 of 4 

20-0203 C Page 37 of 41 



O. Topographical. 
TI,e Dbtrict is prim,1rilv (ompo~·d ni ;,reas th;i1 .ire ~-onsi,kr~d by the State to be high !ire h.iz.,rd 

:.everity ;orws. r,..1uch of the Db,rid 1~ k1(,1kd ·,,·ahin to,.ilhdl terrilm, ,:overeJ .,,:[th hii.;hly combustihh~ 

vegd,1ti0n, mduding tlw prl'·"''tHl' of rn,my m<1tun· :,l,1nrl~ of bru:;h and dense oak \•.:o,c'liland-forested 

areas. The elev.,lion \Vilhin the Distri(t r,ll'l);l'S from at l .000 feet to over 1h00 feet at tht highest point. 

Slopes \\•1thin the District r,mges from 1.5':·;,.4(1':c .. up to the ridge ~ops. The slructure,s within the areas ui 

foothills t~rrain hilv(' VN)" lirni1t•rl fiw Uc(•t~<;, due w nMrow w;;idways and drivewJy~ with steep 
wades and pc:H1r sm Lice cnnditinm. The presenn· oi mc1ny existing structures withm the high flrt.1 

h,l:r.;ird s1•v,~r1t)' ,.one Mi!il'i p1t1vidt•<; (or a ve1y high pott!nti.i! oi a structure lire .spa·c1.!i1115 inw ,) 

wlldkmd or forest fire (ondition as well as the f-",otential for a wildland or fores\ fire ,pe.i.iin~ to 

'.>lfU(lllrt .. ·~-

Summary: 
The ,1lig11111(•tit ot , .. ,1t1y,111s, v,1Jl1!'(' ,10d slop6 into inhabited areas, combined with the •;;m.ibit· n;i!-urc 

of the tcrr.itn, yidd :i potential for increased fire risk .. Most structures, both residentiill anrf .:nm111i-1Yial, 

ar,, m. or .uc surrmmd~d hy ,1reil.S: that ('ontain a significilnt grilss, brush, mixed oa~ woodl,md, ,md 

mrxf'd ,',miler luel load .. Due to drought conditions, beetle infl!:-1..itinn!j, and lack oi vq~et,,th,n 

m.111,1g~·nwnt, much of the arei'I is populated with either dead or dying trees, (11ntributinK fC) ,m 1!.,lrcme 

!:rt' dan~1:r 

E, Conclusion: 
Luc,! dirnilli,· /l;l'ngraphic ;,nd l(1pogr;;iphi~- c1mditil•n~ tksnil:wd .ibovi_, illl'f(',IS...' lhe (n:'lu,•rwy. 

intt~ns1t\'. and size of tires involvmg buildings in the Fire Distrid. Further, these t:onditiow; imp;-.ct 

Foh:ntial d;1111il)r.;C to structures from an earthqu.1ke and subse,.1uent fire. lherdori\ it Js rc,1soni\bly 

neo·ssar v !hat the California Fire CJJ,, be mod tfi,!d to miti~ilte the dtects of I he abov,~ c'\it1d ii itm•;. 

C.11ifomi.1 rk.tlth & S..1foty Code Sechon 1795\7 ro~quir•:~ that modiiiciltions to the Fire Code be 

,t~pre~sll' miltkcd and identified ,15 to wh1·.::h each ti'.1,-lirg ,Piers to v,1hich C:.:,de m,_,.Jifi(,111,m The 

,lttached Appendi,· A prc>vid,!s this conr;e,,J10p 

PASSED AND ADOPTED at.:,. regular me,,tin~ nf lhe Hoard of Diri!clnr:, ni the C1rtwrn11 P;irk 
Community Sc-rvices Oi~tricl on (lcl.-:iber 16.' ·w 19 by the I, 1llowi11g rnl r '· all Vi Jtf-: 

AYES: vv,~ ) H l,'Y\ 'f="c... I ELJ: £ A 
NOES: h Ov\...(_ 

ABSTAIN: ~1 o Y\JL 

ABSENT: 

ue Scobey, Vice Prt'.sidcnt 

Board of Directors 

,,·?~r-~<:~ 
·Jill 1~tzm,m, (;e11cr;d Mana~cr 
5.., n•tar)' to the Bo,1ni 

Page 4 Df 4 

20-0203 C Page 38 of 41 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
101.1 X Admin 

105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.S X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.6 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.4 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

509.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topographica I 

903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phica I 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Clim atic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ical 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

20-0203 C Page 39 of 41 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topograph ica I 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 11.2.1.l X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix B: Table 8105.1(1) X Climat ic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix B: Table 8105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.1 X Climatic/Geo logica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.2 X Climat ic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix O: 0103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix O: 0103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geo logica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra phica I 

Appendix 0: 0104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

101.2 through 101.5 X Admin 

102.6 through 102.8 X Admin 

102.10 through 102.12 X Admin 

103.1 through 104.1 X Admin 

104.3 through 104.4 X Admin 

104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin 

104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin 

104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin 

104.11.3 X Admin 

105.2.3 X Admin 

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin 

105.6.12 X Admin 

105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin 

105.6.37 X Admin 

105.6.39 X Admin 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin 

105.6.48 X Admin 

105.6.50 X Admin 

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin 

107.1 X Admin 

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin 

110.4.1 X Admin 

113.1 X Admin 

20-0203 C Page 40 of 41 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
303.1 through 303.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

305.1 through 305.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

306.1 through 306.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

307.1 through 307.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topograph ica I 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

308.2 X Admin 

308.3 through 308.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ical 

310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.4 through 310.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra phica I 

311.1 through 311.4 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ical 

319.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra phica I 

319.2 X Admin 

319.3 through 319.10.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra ph ica I 

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

403.10 through 403.10.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

405.5 X Admin 

510.3 X Admin 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

903.2.1.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1103.2 X Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0101.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Dl02.l 
Appendix D: D103.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0104.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

D104.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: D105.l through 

D105.4 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: 0106.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

D106.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix 0: D107.l (excluding 
X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

exceptions) 

Appendix D: D108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

20-0203 C Page 41 of 41 




