RESOLUTION NO. 035-2020
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO
(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 014-2017)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is
updated by the State every three years; and,

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2,
Chapter |, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to
the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her
authorized representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of
the fire authority, or the chief’s authorized representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code;and,

WHEREAS, on November 19, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Cameron Park Community Services
District adopted Ordinance #2019.11.20, which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with amendments the
District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019.11.20 of the Cameron Park Community Services District and
delegates the enforcement of the ordinance to the Cameron Park Fire Department Chief, or his or her
representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections:

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2
(a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2
including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 907.2.a through
907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905 .4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2,
5704.2.9.6.1,5706.2.4.4,5806.2,6104.2,6112.1 through 6112.3,6113.1,6113.2, Chapter 80 NFPA
13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6,
Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table B105.1 (1), Appendix B: Table
B105.2, Appendix D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix D103.6.1, Appendix
D103.6.2, Appendix D104 .4.

20-0203 C Page 1 of 41



Resolution No. 035-2020
Page 2 of 2

The Cameron Park Community Services District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title

24, Part 9, in its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the
International Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with theexclusions listed below:

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403 .4,
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12,
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808,
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106,
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception), D107.1
(Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J,
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019
California Fire Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of

said Board, held the 10 day of _March , 2020, by the following vote of said Board:
Ayes: Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin, Novasel
Attest: Noes: None
Kim Dawson Absent: None
Clerk ofjthe Board of S ﬁVlsors , /
Z//ﬁ%ﬂ Bk Vossrepy
Deputy Clerk Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Boafd of Supervisors

20-0203 C Page 2 of 41



Cameron Park Fire Department

In cooperation with the
California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection
CAL FIRE
Fire Station 89 Fire Station 88

2961 Athambra Drive
Cameron Park, CA 85682

3200 Country Club Drive
Cameron Park, CA 95682

(530) 677-6180
(530) 6872-2248 FAX

(530) 672-7350
(530) 672-7352 FAX

December 18, 2019

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors
330 Fair Lane

Placerville, CA 93667

Subject:  Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019.11.20 of the Cameron Park Community
Services District / Cameron Park Fire Department, which adopts the 2019 Califorunia Fire
Code with amendments related to local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions.

Dear Mr. Ashton:

The Cameron Park Community Services District (CPCSD) is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS)
ratify its Ordinance No. 2019.11.20 which adopts the 2019 Califomia Fire Code as amended due to
specific local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. California Health and Safety Code Section
13869.7 requires the legislative body of the city or county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify
or deny the adopted ordinance. The BOS must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the
Fire District (or its representative) or the Chief Building Official.

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2019.11.20 with amendments
to the 2019 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the Cameron Park
Fire Department Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for your review and use on this topic.

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County,

Sincerely, ‘

Jed Gaines
Fire Chief

20-0203 C Page 3 of 41




Cameron Park Fire Department

In cooperation with the

California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection

CAL FIRE

Fire Station 89 Fire Station 88
3200 Country Club Drive 2961 Alhambra Drive
Cameron Park, CA 95682 Cameron Park, CA 95682

(530) 677-6190
(530) 672-2248 FAX

(530) 672-7350
(530) 672-7352 FAX

ATTACHMENTS:

1. Cameron Park Community Services District Ordinance No. 2019.11.20
2. Cameron Park Community Services District Iinding of act Resolution No. 2019-22
3. Draft El Dorado County BOS Resolution

20-0203 C Page 4 of 41




Cameron Park Fire Department

In cooperation with the
California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection

CAL FIRE

Fire Station 89 Fire Station 88
3200 Country Club Drive 2961 Alhambra Drive
Cameron Park, CA 95682 Cameron Park, CA 95682

(530) 672-7350

(530) 677-6190
(530) 672-7352 FAX

(530) 672-2248 FAX

Attachment No. 1
Cameron Park Community Services District

Ordinance No. 2019.11.20

20-0203 C Page 5 of 41




CAMERON PARK COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT
ORDINANCE NO. 2019.11.20

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE CAMERON PARK
COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRITT AS FOLLOWS:

An ordisance af the Cameran Park Community Serviees District adopting the 2019 Fdition of the Culiforiia
Fire Code, incorpomting the 2018 Edition of the lvernationat Fire Code. reguiating and governing the snteguarding
of life and property from fire and explosion hazards avsing from the storage, handling and use of hazardous
substances, materials and devices. and from conditions hazardous ta tife or property in the accupancy of buildings
aid preovises i the Cameren Park Community Services Distace providing ter the issuance af permity and collection
of fees therefor; Repealing Ordinance Mo, 2016, 1519 o the Cameron Park Community Services District and all othey
ordinances and parts of the ardinances in confhict therewith

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the Cameron Park Community Servives (istrict

Section 1 FINDINGS OF FACTS

Sectinn 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUNSIONS
Section 3; LOCAL AMENDMENTS

Section 4: CONFLICT

Scctivm 3 SEVERABILITY

Scction 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

The Cameron Pack Commumity Services Drstrct mabes ceaamn changes (listed belaw o the Californico

Fire Code, 2019 Edition, pursuant 1o Health & Satery Code Sectiomy PI8E5.7 79587 and 195941 5 donny this
code adoption process, Such chimges wre necessary beessise of Jocal chmatic, geatngicai and’or thpographical
conditions,  The Cawmurou Park Community Sersaces District has adopted. pursuant 1o Sechon 78940 5 of the
uliformea Health & Safery Code, the Gndings of facts relarive 1o these conditions by Resolation 2619.22 of the

Cameron Park Commumiity Services District dated Clcraber 16,2619

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS

The Cameron Park Cammunity Services Distrier adopts the 2019 Cafifornio Fire Covte, Title 24, Pare V. in

its entivety, incliding Appendices, mearporating those sections of the ineriational Fire Code. 2018 edition not

sdopted by the state, with the exclosions listed betow:

Ovdinanes 2019.1 120 Culifornia Fire Code Puge L of 17
20-0203 C Page 6 of 41



Exclusions, 1056 17-105.6,1%, 105639, 3081 4, 309, 3115 3106, 118, 4030, 403.2 1403 2.4 403 .3,
4034, 403.6, 403.7 403 8 (adopting 403 8. (-403.8.1 73, 4039, 403,102, 403,30,3_ 403,11, 403,12, 404, 14048,
405.1-405.4, 405,6-405.9, 406, BOS-807 (adopting 807.5.27, BOB, 004,11, 1iD), 11031 110G3.3-1103.6, 11039
(adapting 1103.9.1), 110310, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D042 {Excepuony,
Di106.1 (kxception), D107} (Exceplion), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix 1.

Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendin M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sectians of the 2009 California Fire

Cexchie.

SECTION 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS

The fullowing Sections are hereby smended or added:

Chapter |

Nectign 101 Scope and General Requirements
- 1011 Tide shall be sinended as follows: Add name of jurisdiction fCameron Park Community Services

[hstrict/
Section 105 Permits

105.6.27 LPG-gas shall be amended as follows: Add 1o the exceptivn: At ar above SO0 feer of

clevation, a permit is nol required for individual contaiers with o { 25-gnlon water capacity or less,
or maltiple comainer systems naving an agpregate Quuntity nat exceeding 123 palins serving

occupancies in Group R-3.

- Scction 106 Fees

106.6 Permit, Plan Review and Inspection Fees shall be added as tnllows: A sededdude nf fees

alapped by the district bourd of direciors for plon veviese dnspecitons amd the toarmee of peennls by
the district may be fmind in the mast curcent distrrct jev schedule pHoolth & Safeiv ke 17931,

- 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees shall be added as follows: Fire service fees may be sharged 10 any

person. firm, corporation or businesy that thrpugh neglivence, vindation of the fasw, or as o result of
carelessness, (s respimsible for the cause of the disieice 1o respond 1o the scene ot an incident, A
district board may charge a fiee fo cover the cost af anv seovice whicl the dixteict provides or the cost
of enforcing anv regulation for which the fee ts charged (Health & Sufeiy Uodde 139161 The fer shall
ot exceed the actual cust of xuppressing tw five and/or responding to the scene of on ascddent.

- 1067 inistyative Costs shall be ndded ns Tnllows: When o rest o mspeciion is selwduded, and

the comtractor fails ta perforn to the satisfinction of the anthyrity favione furisdicsion (ALY, the AHS

Ordinance 2019.11.20 Culifornie Fire Cude Page 2 of 17
20-0203 C Page 7 of 41



mept hill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/inspection location and

the time spent at the iest/inspection site as well as administrative costs.

- Sectigp 109 Board of Appeals
- Section 109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines shall be added as follows: Any person or entity who

believes they may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code
official through a written notice may appeal this maiter within 15 calendar days of the posimark on
the notice. Al such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for
the district. A timeh: appeal shall stay firther action by the fire code officicd umtif the matier is
derermined by the Appeal Board as oullined in Seetion 109.2, unless the issue poses an imminent fire
or life safety hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify the appellam by
certified maill of the dafe and time of such hearing. The heaving shall be scheduled to take place no
sooner than 20 calendar days front the date shown on the certificd mail. The appeliant shali have the
right 10 appear in person or by agent at the hearing and present oral, written andior photographic

evidence 1o the Appeal Board.

- Section 110 Violations

- 110.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows: Persons who shal! violate & provision of this

code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereat” or who shall erect, install, alter,
repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code
official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of &
misdemeanor or infruction, al the discretion of the prosecuting altoriey or agency, punishable by a
fine not exceeding 3/00.00 for « first violation; 2. A fine not exceeding 3300.00 for « yecond violarion
of the same provision within one year, 3. 4 fine not exceeding $1000.00 for each additional violation
of the same pravision within one year, ar by imprisonment not exceeding /80 days, or both such fine
and imprisonment.  Each day that a violation continues afler due notice has been served shall be
deeined a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13143 and 17993),

- 110.4.2 Citations shall be added as follows: The Fire Chief. ar histher duly amthorized

representative, may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor viofations of this code pursuant (o
Section 13871 of the Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapier Sc frommencing
with Section 833.6) of Tile 3 of Purt 2 of the Penal Code of the Stuate of California,

- Section 112 Stop Work Order
- 1124, Failure te Comply shall be amended as follows: Any person who shall continue any work

alter having been served with u slop-work order, except such work as that person is directed to

Ordinance 2019.11.20 Califomia Fire Code Page 2 of 17
20-0203 C Page 8 of 41



perform to remove o vialation or unsafe condition, shall be punishuable by u fine or imprisonment v:r

bath as described in Section 110.4 (Health & Safery Code Scciinns (3145 and | 7993).

Chapter 2

- cli ¢ efinition

- Add definition for Campflire - Shall mean a fire which is used for coaking, personal warmeh, lighting,
or aesthetic purposes. This includes fires contaived within owdoor fireplaces and enclosed sioves

portable barbecne pits, braziers, or

with flues or chimneys, stoves using Jellied, liguid. or solvd fuels, p
space hieating devices which are used outside of amy structure, mooile home, or any living
accommaodation mounted on a vehicle,

Add definition for District - Shall miearn the disirici amd alf ather areas within the exterior boundories

thereof now or Berveafrer established.
Add definition for Driveway - Shall mean a veiticular access that serves po more thar rwo buildings
with my more than three dwelling unirs vn g single parcel. and any munker of accessory buildings.

- Add detinition tor Executive Body - Shall mean the Board of Directors of the Bistricy.
Add detinition tor Fiee Chiel - Shall mean the Chigf” Execuine Fire Officer of the Fire
deparimensdisivict serving the jurisdiction or a duly aurborized representative
Add definition for Trained Crowd Manager - Shall memrs stamdby peesonnel usuath: a securiny
xrard or usher persanned who ave (ramed o the proper procediire ro exit peopte from g tene or other

place af public axsemblage in an orderly and calm tasinon i the event of ae emergency.

Chapter 3
Section 302 Delinitions
302.1 Definitions shall be amended ay tollows Added Camplire definition, ss shown nbove in

Chapter 2.

- Section 30T Opcen Burning, Recreutional Fires, and Qutdooy Firceplucey

- 307.4.4 Campfire Restrictions shall be added as tollows:

- 3074848 i1 iz undaw il far any eeson 1o QAT IMGIGHn. or Use o camplive upon or mear any brush-
covered fand, grass-covered fand or fovest-covered Tomd diwving the e when hurning perwts are
suspemded by the Divectoe oof the Departinent of Fovestry and Fire Proechion, the CAL FIRE Uinit
Chicf or the 451J.

Exception: Conmerciol cooking opevatrons with approval of the 441,

- 307.4.4.2 When camptirex are allowed, it siwndd be undewtid for any person (o lighi. maivain, or use

a campfire ypon any hrush-covered fand. gross-covervd Tamd or forest-covered lomd unfesy the

Jollowing nunimum requirements are ceamplicd with.

Ordinance 2019.11.20 Califorma Fire Code Papgc4 ol 17
20-0203 C Page 9 of 41



- 307.4.4.2 (a) The area within 3 feet of the periphery of the campfive is cleared of all flanmmable
material and vegetation.

- 307.4.4.2 (b) One serviceable shovel with a handle of at least 12 inches is ready for use at the
immediate areu of the campfive.

- 307.4.4.2 (¢) Campfires shall be limited 1o a 1 foor by | foot area, unless in an approved manufactired
cooking device or fire ring.

- 307.4.4.2 (d) Written permission of the landowner must be obrained prior to the ignition of the

campfire and stiall be on site.

Chapter 5

- Section 503 Fire Apparatus Access Roads

- 503.2.1 Dimensions shall be amended as follows: Fire apparatus access roads shall have an

unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet. exclusive ol shoulders, as measired firom face of curb to
Jace of curh, except for approved security gates in accordance with Scction 503.6, and unobstructed
vertical clearance of not less than 13 feer. All driveways in the district shall not be less than 12 feet
wide,

- 503.2.5 Dead Ends shall be amended as follows: Dead-end five apparatus access voads and driveways
in cxcess of 150 feet in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around fire
apparatus,

- 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces shall be amended as follows: Where a bridge or an elevated
surface is part of a fire apparatus access road. the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in
accordance with the current El Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge Standard or Appendix
D of the current California Fire Code, whicliever is more restrictive. Bridges and clevated surfaces
shall be designed for a live load sulficient to carry the imposed loads of fire apparatus. Vehiele load
limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when required by the Fire Code Official. Where
clevated surlaces designed for emergency vehicle use are adjacent 1o surfaces which are not designed
for such use. approved barriers, approved signs. or both shall be installed and maintained when
required by the fire code official.

- 503.4.2 No Parking in Fire Laues shall be added as follows: No person shall siop. park. or leave

standing anv vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary to avoid conflict with
other traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief. or histher dnbhe auhorized
represemiative, Peace Officer or official eaffic control device along the edye of am: highwar, ar any
curh. o in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated offssireet parking facility.,
designated ay « five lane by the district widh jurisdiction over the area in whicli the place is located.
The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sivn posted immedicnely adfacent 1o, and visible from, the

dexignated place clearty stating in leiters not less thean one incl jn heighe that the place is o fire lave.,

Ordinanee 2019.11.20 California Fire Code , Page Sof 17
20-0203 C Page 10 of 41



FEL by outhining or painting the place in ved and. in contrasting color, marking rhe place with 1hy
werds FIRE LANE" which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) by a red curb or red paint on
the edge of the roadway upon which is clearfy murked the words “FIRE LANE™

- 503.4.3 No Parking in Front of Hyidrants shall be added as follows: No person shall siop, park, or

feave stamding any vehicle within 13 feer of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) if the vehicle iy
attended by a licensed driver who is seated in the from seat and wha can immediately mive such
vehicle (n cuse af necexsity, /by If the vehicle is owned or operated by u fire department and is vlearly
ntarked as a fire depariment vehicly

- 503.4.4 Firc Lancs Based on Road Width shail be added as tallows: Fire lanes shall be bused on

road width as required in Appendix D as aonended by the disirict.
503.5.3 Fire Apparatus Access Gates shall be added as follows. AN awmomatic and menial gotes
installed aver fire apparatus access roads shall comply with the district gate standard os approved

by the fire code officl.

- Section S05 Premisc Idcntification

- 505.1 Address tdentificution shall have the first line of this paragraph wmended ws follows:

Addresses tor new and existing buildings shall comply with the disieict addrexs standard ax approved

by the fire code official

- Scction 207 Firc Protection Water Suppli¢s

£07.5.1 Where Required shall be amended as tollnws: 400 teer shall be amended 1o /3 feer.

- Section 509.3 Fire Controt Room

£09.3 Fire Contrel Rovm #wre frotection apd Litity Rgupmony Ldentifuation and Access, v heveby

amended by aililmg the foffowiig i reids Fire aprnkice cisers, fire aluom contied pamels, yolar
Photavediar poseer S¥xtem roquet xhutof switches. and other fire delecton, suppressaa o sumidar
corfrol switches shal be focated inswde i xiede fire Caatrol raom for the huildng The fire canirol yvoonr
shell have minmnn dimensions of five feet &vaeven oot in size with stotal useabie area ofnod less than
I8 square feei. The room shalt be focated withun the Budding on an outside wall at a focation upproved
hy the Fire Code etficiod and siwdll be acevssible from tie exterionr An exierior access dooe with o clear
widily of net lesy than 32 inches amd a height no lexs than 38 nches shall be provided for access ini
the roome A cduwrable xiv sbud! be aflived s the coteenae of the door with e words “FIRE COUNTROL
ROCM " dut fetters riof Jexs ihan 4 nches i heighi. A key box compiyving with Section 306 shafl be
instidled on the exterior side of the fire comesd roun door upenimg The roomr must be capable or
Mg o i femperaguee of I degeees Foheenben A clearance af 12 inches shall be

provided from the fire sprinkler visees n any adjacent wolls. This oo can be shared with other

Ordinance 2009.11.20 Califorma Fire Code Page 6 of 17
20-0203 C Page 11 of 41



building wilities or fire protection equipment that is compatible. An approved cabiner or cootainer shall
he provided 12 stare record plans of the fire sprinkler system, other five provcction cquipment. and site

plans. This roowi shall not be uxed for any other storage

Chapter 9

- Section 903 Fire Sprinklers

- 903.2 Where Required shall be amended as follows! An approved automatic sprinkier system sha/f

be required and istalled in new buildings and structures 3600 squeare feet or greater when
constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction as described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12.
Exception: Agricultural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial purposes.

- 903.2.a Where Reguired shall be added as tollows: States of existing huildings greater than 3,600

square feel. Inexustmy huildings 3,600 square fect or greaver, other than ane and iwi-fanulyv dwelling
units, and agricnlrurad huildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, where the
floar area of the huilding or structure iy increased by an wddition of more than thirty percen (302%)
or 1000 square feet whichever (s less, suck huildmg or sivuctine shadl be nade 1o confora (o Secton
Y32

- Y03.2.b Where Required shall be added s folloss: Starues of existing huildingy Tesy than 3,600
square feer. in exusting buddings 3600 square feet or less, ather than one-and two-fanmiily dwelling
unifs, and agricultual Muddings pot under spect! use peomil for commercinl purposes, where i
Aocr area of the buildimyg or siricivre s inereased o a intol square footage over 3600 square feet,
by an addition of more than ihirty percent (30%) or {00 square fret, winchever s lexs, such batlding
pr structure sholl be wmade 1 conforns to Section %30

- 903.2.1 Group A shalt be amended as loHlows for A groups A=t theagh A-4 903 210 (1) The lire
ares exceeds 1800 yquine feed,

- 903.2.3 Group E shall be amended as tollows: 50323 (15 Thionghout al) Group € {ice areas greater
than 3 600 squurce feef in drea

- 90324 Grgup F-b shall be amended as tollows) HL2.4 Gronp F 0324 00 A Group F o fire aren
exceeds I A0 square fec:.

- 903.2.7 Group M shall be wmended as fullows. 903.2 7 Group B and M, 903.2.7 (1} A Group B and

M fire nren exceeds 3800 squary feer.

903.2.8.2 Munufactured Homes shall be added as todlows: dn awtamaiic fire sprinkler system shatl

he rognered in all new wanufacrared homes and midrcfamiv manitacieed homes intewded for use
ay d ope-arkd pwo-faimly cheetiimg The design and insealtation sf such sestems shalt be in accordance

with Californiu Code vf Resuidotions Tide 23, $4300

Ohrdinance 2009.11.20 California Fire Code Page 7 of 17
20-0203 C Page 12 of 41



Exceptinns:

P Mamgfactred homes locared within an existing mobileome park compiving with
Cafifirma Heatth and Safen Code, Livision 13, Part 2.1 or 23

S Mantfinctured homes thar do i exceed 1 3610 square feei in Site and serve as an
gccexsort vwelling unit. as defined in Government Cade Section 635302 when the
CXINGg primary restdence on the property iy nol required to comply with California
Rextdential Code Sectfon R313.2

3 Meanifacinred homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size.

- 903.2.9 Group S-1 shall be amended as follows: 903.2.9 Group S. 903.2.9 (17 A Grewp S fire area

exceeds 3,600 square feet,

903,210 Group 8-2 Enclosed Parking Gurages shall be amended as follows: 3G3.2 16 (1} Where

the tire arer of the epclosed parking garage exceeds 3,600 square feer.

Section 907 Fire Alnrm nnd Detection Svstems

- 907.2.8 Where Required - New Buildings or Structures legs than 3,600 square feet shall be added

85 follows: An uppraved fire alarmdderection system shafl be installed in all buildings with ¢ floor

cved fesy hran 340G 3‘.1!1/(;,'(17’(5(5!
Exceprions:

P e amd pwa-tamily dheellings (R-3 Oceupancies and other vecupancws classificd

3 Agnicultural busldings not under special uve pernut andior not wsed for commerciad
prerpases Yoy retanls safes, food service. andior spectal events

Bueddings with ¢ foor area lexs tian SO0 square peei may he exenypyt as determined

e

o or Bisier duly anthorized sopresentattve, hased g idding

by the Fire Ci
construction itaterial and feaiurey. focalion occupaney e, and distonce 1o
CXPUSHIeS.

907.2.b Status of Existing Buildings shall be added as yolivax In evrsung fldigs without as

appraved antomatic sprinkles sysiem. other than ane- or tvosfonndy awelloy weis agradtoead
buildiang nor under special use permiv for commercial purposes where o fire alarne deteciion svstent
does not exist and the floor arca of the buiding or structire & invcicayed or modified by more than
thirty percent (3084 or 1,000 square feet whichever s fess, such budiding ar stvuciure shafl be muade
fo conform to Secrion 907 when veipnred s the Five Cliet or bissher duly uurborized repwreseniaiive
Buildings with a floor area less than 500 sqnare foet may be voempt.as derecouned by the Fire Chief.
or histher duly authorized veprosentarive, based an haiddmy canviruction marerials ond featires

focation. occupancy Iype. and distance (o exposures,

Ordinance 2019.11.20 Calitomin Fire Code Page 8 of |7
20-0203 C Page 13 of 41



907.2.c Monitoring shall be added us fallows: A fire alarnvdetection svstemy shall be conmected

diectly throngh and monitored by a UL approved central, propriciary or remole station service,
which xrives audible and visuol sigencds at a constantly aisended tocation, AN sprinkiered brildings
shali he monifared

Exceptions:

;. Ore-and rwo-fromily chveltings (8-3 Occupancreys and other ocitipancivs clasyified

L*)

Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and'or not used for conmercial
purposes (e.g., retails sufes, food service, andior special events).
- 907.2.d Type | Hood Installations shall be added as follows: The requirement of mstallation, o

replacement, of a Type | Hood Sysiemt shall require a fire alarmisprinkicr monitoring svstens 10 be

installed, or for the hood sysiem to be cannected to an existing fire alarmesprikivr: monitoring system
for that huilding

- 907.6.2.1 Secondary Poweyr Supply shail be added as tollows: In accardance with NFPA 72, the

secondary power supply providing a nininnom 24-hour pawer capacite under quiescent load (system
Y po L KAN fod A t (5)

pperating in a non-aiarm comduiont shall be qmended 1o o mmimume 72-hisee power capacity.
Exception: The carsience of an emergency: back-up power supply that meets or exceed the

requirententy of Calitorpia Fire Code Chaprer |2

Chapter 12
- Secction 1203 Emergency und Standby Power Systems

1203.1.3 Instaliation shall be amended as follows: Emergency power systems and standby power

systems shall be installed in accordance with the Calitorma Buikling Code, the Califormia Electric
Ciode, NFPA | 1 and NFPA 11 4T buildings. other than nae< and nvo-fanly dwelling units, and
agricultiral busldings not wsed for commercial purposes, with starddby power, shall have a shunt rip
device that disconmects ulf power sources 1o the butlding. approved by the tive code official. Existing

mnsiallations xhatl he smaintained in accordance wirk the ocigimil approsal

Chapter 33
- Section 3310 Access for Firefighting

- 33103 Premise ldentification shall be added as follows:  Prior ta and during comstrnction. an
approved aildresy sign shalt be provided ar cach fire amt cmergency vehicle access rowd entey inte

the project.

- Section 3312 Water Supply for Fire PProtection

Ordinance 2019.11.20 Califomia Fire Code Page 9 of 17
20-0203 C Page 14 of 41



- 3312.1 When Required shall be amended as follows:  Prior to combustible materials arriving on

site, the fire hydrant water system shall be instolled and maintained in continnous operation. The

amomnt of water supplied shall meet the required fire flow for the project,

Chapter 49
- Secction 4903 Plans
- 4903.1 Where Required shall be added as tollows: The fire code official of the CPFD may require

development projects located in Moderate, High and Very-FHigh Fire Hazard Severity Zoves 1o subnit
fire protection plan. This plan shall be approved by both the fire code official and the amhorized
representative for the local CAL FIRE Unit Chief (if located in the State Responsibilite Area [SRAJ)

prior to the recording of the final map for the project by the Couniy of El Doracdo.

- Section 4905 Wildfire Protection Building Construction

- 4905.4 Roof Construction Requirements shall be added as follows: A/l new construction, including

additions, requires a Class A roof covering or assembly. All re-roofing requires Class 4 roof covering
or assembly ax a miniuium. Re-roofing in excess of 30% of un exisiting structure within any one year
period will necessitate that the entive roof be a Class A roof covering or assembly as o mininm.
Class B or C fire retardeant treated and or non-treated wood shake or shingles are not approved as

a roof covering material for Class A assembly.

Chapter 50
- Scction 5001 General

- 5001.7 Liabitity for Damages shall be added as lollows: Any damages or cost resulting from the

careless handling. spill or discharge of any hazardons materials shall constituent debr against any
such person, firne or corporotion causing such spill or discharge. This debe is collectible by the Fire
Chief. or histher duly authorized represetative. in the same manner as i the case of an obligation

under contract, expressed or implied.

Chapter 56
- Section 5601 General

- 5601.2 Permit Required shall be amended ax follows:  Permits shall be required as set forth in

Section 105.6 and regulated in accordancee with this section. Where explasives perwits are required,
they shall be issned by the Fire Chicef. or histher dulyv authorized represemative, ond the 11 Dorado
Caoumty Sherviff's Department. Where fireveorks permits are requived. ey shall be issued by the Fire

Chief. or his/her dulyv authorized represemative. and the EL Dovado Comny Board of Snpervisors.

Ordinance 2019.11.20 California Fire Code Puge 10 of 17
20-0203 C Page 15 of 41



- 5601.2.1 Documentation shall be added as foltows: The AH/ shall have the quthorite 1o reguess

documentation regarding all aspects of the fireworks preseniation

- 5601,2.2 Proprietary Information shall be added as follaws: The 4710 will protect ali proprietory

miformation.

Chapter 57

- Section 5704 Sterage
- 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Abave-Ground Tanks are Prohibited shall be amended as follows:

Storage of Class | and Class | lammahle liquids in above-ground tanks ontside of buitdings is prohibited
unless approved by the Vire Chict or hischer duly auhorized representaiive. Wher pervutted by the
Fire Chief, or hissher duly authorized represemative, all above giound tankexs or vaull mstatiohons
dor the strage of Class )01 o Jl flommable and combustible hauids shall compdv with those
requirentenss ax set forch by the Colifornia Fire Code. The Californio Fire Code shall dlso apply to

emxtallations other thar moror vehicle fuel dispensing siations where ahove-grosnd storage is required.

- Section $706 Special Operationy
5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Grgund Tanks are Prohibited shall be amended as follows:

Storage of Class T and Ulass [T ammable Liguids in abave-gromund lanks outside of buildings is
probibited vndess upproved by the Fire Chict) e higher duiy authorized reprexentarive. When
perntined by the Fire Cidef, ov bicher duly awhorized representative, ali above graumd fank(s) or
vault mstallationy for the siorage of Class £ I av L flommable and combustible Siguids shall comply
with those regquirements os ses fortd byvothe Cadirma Fiee Cade The <alitoraia Fre Code shall alsis
apply i mstullatiory suher thae motor vebicle e Ssmensg siatawns sehere ghove-granmed storage

ix required.

Chapter 58
- Section 5806 Flammablec Crvogenic Fluids

- £806.2 Limitations shall be amended as fallines: Storage o ammable crvogenic Qunds in stationary

contaivers vutside of buildings s prolbued wnfesy approved by e Fire Chiefl or hiséher duly
authorized reprexcriotive. When permitied by the Fue Chuef or Bischee duly andhorized
representative. all stativmay comainers for the storage of flammable eryoneme fuidy shatl comphy
with thase reqirements i sed fontk by the Caliturn Fire Code The £ altforvera Fire Code shall alse
aupph 1o nstaiiacaony other than motor vehicle fiuel dispensing stotiones where above-growd siorage

i required.

Ordmance 201911 20 California Fire Code Page 11 ol 17
20-0203 C Page 16 of 41



Chapter 61
- Section 6104 Location of LP-Gas Contniners
- 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits shall be amended as {ollows- The sioruge

of ligucfied petroleum gas in excess of an aggrvgate of 2,00ilyallon water capacity when located at
feast aonc-hall (1.2} mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and af least one-half
{1:2) mile from cxisting residentiol development with a density greater than one (1} dweilling unit per
acre apd at least ooe-half ¢ 1525 wule froom any fotel or motel i allowed when AHJ approved, und o
speciatzconditional use permit is issued by the Conmy of El Dorado.

Dispensing within esrablished limits Within the Limils established by law vestricting the dispersion of
fiqueficd perrofeum gus for the peotection of heavily popudated or congested areas, the ugyregate
capaciy of any one instollation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The dispensing
of liguetied petroleum gas ineceesy of an aggregate of 2,.000-gallon water capacin: when located

at least one-half (170 mile fram properry zoned ne designated for residential vse and ar teast one-
half (121 mile from existing cesdential develommens with a density greaier than one {1 daelling unil
per acre and ot feast ome-haly 1172 mde from any hotel or motel s allowed when AHT approved and

w spechibcomdinonal use perout is Issued by the Counny of Et Dorado.

- Scction 6112 High Elcvuation Liguefied Petroleum Gas Installations {5,000-foul clevations and

ubove) shnli be added as follows:

~ 61121 Regulators shall be added ss folluws:

- Two-stage reguladon svstem shall be insialled in accordunce with manyfactures seguireme nts
Twaoestage pegrdatar xestems shall be installed on alt LPG installations.

- The first stage reeulator shall be installed under the hinged gauge cover supphied with the tom. The
atmospiheric pressuve aperture of the vegulaion shall be pointed dovmward - The first stage egidater
shatl be plumbi-d 16 the viser of the yard piping with soft copper ibing 1o atlow plecibiliny should iank
shigting vecur The viser from the yard paping shall be tocated not more than 3 inches chorizomallv:
from the walls of the tank.

The second srgge reqadaior and riser pipe shall be msialled under the cave of the blfding, us close
as prociicable to the building wail.  This riser shall be securely supportedidraced o the wall
approxumately 1 inches below the regulator so as to priovent hewding of the pipe by hateral snowdice
loads,

A protective cover. appeoved by the gas sepplicr amd Builbug Offnciad, shall he installecd over the
second stage regutator and securelv supported 1o the groved oe diagonally 1o the wall,

The riser pipes for the vard piping shall nor be cmbidded in concevte £ ancrete paced aroand such

riser shail be held back at teast 1 inch front afl oddes of the pipse

Ordinance 2019.11.20 Califomia Fire Code Page 120 17
20-0203 C Page 17 of 41



- At the time of application for any building permit. which involves the installation of an LP( system,
the applicant shall subwit an 1,.PG systen plot plan in 3 copies (or digitally as PDFE). The LPG plot
plan shall include, but not be tinited (o, the tank location. proposed tank capacity in U.S. gallons,
route of vard piping, location of the riser pipe at the building. property boundaries, and an outline of
all existing/proposed huildings on the lot and a depiction of the ridgeline of any huilcling 10 he
supplied with LPG. This shall also be forvarded 1o the appropriate fire district to serve as a locator
map in event of an emergency.

- Location of the centerline of LPG tanks shall be permanently marked by the use of snow stakes. one
at each end. Such stakes shall be of sufficient height to he visible through anticipated maxinum snow
depth at the respective location.  Installation and naintenance of these snow stakes are the
responsibility of the LPG user.

- Propanc appliances and accessories shall not he permitted in any new installation beloy the first
Sloor or below grade, swhichever is nore restrictive.

- 6112.2 Vertical Riscr Piping shall be added as follows:

- Minimuum of Schedule 80 - iron piping.

- The riser shall be within 3 inches horizontally of the tank.

- Swing juints shall be installed above and below tank level to provide for the tank movement (Street
elbows shall not be usedd).

- A listed flexible riser constructed of copper or stainless-steel tubing and protected by steel covered
sheathed marerial may he used instead of swing joints. The flexible alternative shall provide sufficiem
stack 1o allow for tank moveent.

- 6112.3 Marking and Locations shall be added as {ollows:

- dAnapproved sign shall be located divectly above the riser shut off valve on the building in a visible
location.

- The liquetied petrolenm gas supplier shall affix « weatherproof identification tag to the inside of the
tank valve protecting cover. Thix tag shall contain the supplier’s name and energency telephone
nuniher,

- Tenk installation shall he permanently marked by a metad or wood material snow marker. with o
minintm dimension of 2 inches by 2 inches. The snow marker shall be of sufficient height to rise
above the annal saose depth and shall he o minimn of 10 feet in heighi. The suove morkers shall

he painted yellow and located or opposite ends of the tank.

- Section 6113 Undergronnd LPG Tanks Instatlntions and Owoership shall be added as (ollows:

- 6113.1 Permits aud Plans shall be added as folloss: Pernity shall be required. and plans stall he

submitted for all vaderground tank installations as approved by the A H.J.

Ordinance 2019.1£.20 California Fire Code Page 13 0f 17

20-0203 C Page 18 of 41



sl be ndded as follows: Undergrownd 1 PG nankx

shall be profichited from being sold e cnd-users and sholl be retained by the LPG company under @

leusefyvpe Systen (o efsure propec atnad ssiintenapee reguirements are mer and reconded,

Chapter 80
Scction 80, NFPA, 13D-16 — Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systemy in Ope-and Two
Family Dwellings snd Manufacturcd Homes us amended 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5

NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows:
- Revise Section 5.1.1.2 to read as follows:
Chapter 80, NFPA 13D, S§.1.1.2 A suppedy of ar teast one of vach hpe and tsoysecatice gwinkler used

within the premises shall be maintained on the property at an approved location. Stock sprinklers shall

he kept in a monnted and aceessible cahiner,

Revise Section 7.6 (0 read as followy:

Chapter 80. NFPA 13D. 7.6 4 /ocal water flow afarn: shafl be provided on all fire sprikler svstems in

hames at an appraved location on the exterior of the dhweiitng.
- Revise Section 11.2.1.1 to read ax follows:

- Chapter 80. NFPA 13D, 11.2.1.1 Where a fire deparunenl pumper conpection is not provided, the

systen) shall be hvdrostimtically tested at o sjmimm pressure of 130 pounds per square (nch gauge for o

fess than a 30-winute duration withow evadeee of leakage, Such fest ! be wittessed b the fire code
offictal.
Ordinance 2019.11.20 California Fire Code Page 14 of 17

20-0203 C Page 19 of 41



Appendin B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings

Jable B10S.1(1} Required Fire Flow for One- and Two-Familv Pwellin ' -3, and R-4
Buildings and Townhouses shall he mucnded as foblaws for ¢feviminy befoa 3004 feetr

i FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMIIM FLOW ’
! CALCULATION SPRINKLER FIRE- DURATION
AREA -\VRT“I“ "14‘)W (huun)
k {squnre feet) " (Design (gnlinns per
i Stamsfard) minuie)
G 3 Nt Ao G LI
sperehbe 3
LAGT and grewiae ir ALIHMALC Yl fn Pruration i
e Sler wvsiem Y ahthe | Table
IS T BHs 2y o
e rngubed
fire-How tane
1 3 & Cmectivp MO LV vy
i’"i‘ he YA vire KK 7
Lte v Section
Ttk ot e T
Bt O de
L . o e —
3601 nnd repter Kyt K18 VT % £ walue o '
it e T0A i iolabtl
Cokie ap Seetien Brus o
TEYY o ek A e BEEE i
oeifenl 2 [T AT |
- Table B105.2 Required Fire Flgw for Bujldings other thap One- und Two-Family
Dwellings, Group R-3, und R-4 Buildings and Townbyuses shall he amended as follows
AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER f MINIMUM FLOW DURATION
f SYSTEM FIRE-FLOW {hourst
1Design Standard) {ynllons per
minulc)
Mg pytamatic spemkiler voram W ol i [ ablc S darmtion in Tanlg
s 1y Blros i
QeCiwe AT T Ll o e T T 5% M LTThe L atoe Ddumnse in Taric
Crads in et NtuA ot By 1T o the reduced
e raty
Rewtowr Wil b Do sl i e ?;‘.k'; eMad he sl Fhitatewp in Tk
Towle ety apgee ol G Uiy Tabiz (108 1025 WS HZ) Al the reducesd
Aedion 4 NBL bt phyne iy rute
;...]_'.‘.(._;L:d;‘v((d_ Vi aw shighh nit be 1cas R SO0 gpm
Oidinance 20191120 Calitoma Fire Code Page IS af {7

20-0203 C Page 20 of 41



Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads

- Section D103 Minimum Specifications

- D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant shall be amended as follows, adding the exception:

- Exception: Driveveays
- D103.2 Gvade shall be amended as follows: Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not
exceed /3.9% in grade wiless approved by the AH or by the £l Dorado County aimended California
Public Resource Code Title 14/ Design and Improvement Standards Manual,
Exception: Elevation above 3.000 feet shall not exceed 2%,

- D103.3 Turning Radius shall be amended as follows: The minimum twning radius shall be

determined by the fire cade official: and shall not include curb and guier.

- D103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates shall be amended as tollows: Subsecrion (1): Where a
single gate is provided. the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm). Where a fire
apparatus rouad consists of « divided roadway, the gate width shall not be less than 13 feer (4372
nun).

- D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width shall be amended as tollows: Fire lane signs as specified in

Section D103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide
(6096 to 8534.4 mm).
Exception: Elevations above 3.000 fi. as determined by the A1H.J.

- D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as

specified in Scction 1D103.6 shall be posted on one side ol fire apparatus access rouds more than 29
feet wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 fect wide (10972.8 mum).
Exception: Elevations above 5.000 fi. ax deterniined by the Af1).

D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads shall be added as follows: When required

by the fire code official. a fire apparatus aceess road shall be constructed to encompass the entivery

af a structure and shall provide a contimous means of emergency vehicle access.

Ordinance 2019.11.20 California Fire Code Page (6 oF 17

20-0203 C Page 21 of 41



SECTION 4; CONFLICT
That Ordinance No. 20161019 ot the Cameron Pack Comnpanity Services District, and all other ordinances or

panis of ordinances herewith are hereby repealed.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision. sentence, clause or phrase of this code, or
auy application thereof, is for any reason held ta be invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such decision
shall not sifect the remaining provisivns ot this code, which can be given effect without the invalid portians and.
theretore, such invalid portions are declared 10 be severable. The Cameron Park Uommunity Services District
hereby declares that it would have enacted this Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or
subdivisions thereol. provisions, sentences, clauses or phrases irrespective af the fact that one or more of them is

declared mvahd.

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

This Ordinance shall take effect thinty 1307 days afler its adoption. The Cameran Park Community Services District

Board Secretary is directed to publish this ordinance in 8 newspaper of general airculation io the District. [n lieu
of publication of the full text of the vrdinance, a summary of the ordinance may be published by the by the Board
Secretary within fifteen {15) danyvs after its passage and a certified capy shall be pasted in the office o7the Cameron

Park Community Servives District pursuant 1o Govermment Code Sevtton 369330} i1,

The above Ordinunee wax introduced at & meeting of the Bourd of Directors of the Cameran Park Cramunity
Services District an Cictoher 16, 2019, and it was then read for the livst time. A public hearing was set for the

Ordinance to be rend tor the second time on November 20, 2011 aud approved by the following vore:

PASSED AND AXOPTED by the Board of Dircctiars al the Cameran Fark Community Services District this 20"
day of November, 2019

AYES: MS, Hpn, Fe E) EA

NOES: N cut

ABSENT: None

ABSTAIN: A nd

ATTEST,

A~ N
b

Monique Scobey, Vice President il Ritzman, General Mannger
Roard of Directors Secretary to the Board
Ordinance 2019.1 1.20 Catiterma Fire Code Puge |7 of 17

20-0203 C Page 22 of 41



RESOLUTION NO. 2019-22

OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS
OF THE CAMERON PARK COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT

RESOLUTION ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO THE
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

A resolution of the Cameron Park Community Services District (District) setting forth findings with
respect to local conditions within the District which make certain modifications and changes to the
California Fire Code reasonably nccessary for preserving fire and life safety in the Cameron Park

Community Services District,
The Governing Board of the Cameron Park Community Services District finds and resolves as follows:

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permits a Fire Protection District to adopt an
ordinance which changes or medifies the Slate Housing regulations adopted pursuant to Health &
Safety Code Section 17922 upon determination that such changes or modifications are necessary duc to
local conditions that pertain regulations governing condilions hazardous to life, properly and the

environment from fire, explosion, hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and

WHEREAS, Health & Safely Code Seclion 17958. 7 requires (hat a District’s Board of Direclors
making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 shall make
express finding that such changes or modifications are needed; and shall file a copy of such changes or

modifications with the Department of Housing and Community Development.

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions existing within
the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the District to impose more stringent
requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code and pursuant to California Flealth and Safety

Code sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the District desires lo make express findings to that effect,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the Cameron Park
Community Services District, after having a duly noticed and held public meeling, hereby adopts the
following findings concerning current unique local conditions that together make each modification to
the California Fire Code, reasonably necessary 1o provide adequate and effective protection of life,

property and the environment more specilically set forth as follows:

Page | of 4

20-0203 C Page 23 of 41



Fuc:Code #

101.1

CAM & GEO
Locally adopted ! SFM adopted /

What Is the Change?

Amend with the name of the jurisdiction

Amended
Locally adopted and amended

Why s There a Local Change?

Administrative need

Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate

LPG tanks are known lo possibly leak, LPG is heavier than
air and can easily be trapped under a home, if ignited it can
lead to an explosion, At elevations above 5000 feet there is

105.6.27 i i i i =
mszlz:i:cggrggés gallons serving Locally adopted and amended an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire
pR-S. activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional
attention.
- Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance
! ; s : of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines
. Al e
1065 cd section Locally created and adopted | i olan checks, and inspectons s allowed in Health
’ &Safety Code 17951. )
0 : Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to
106.6.1 Add section Locally created and adopted the Fire Distict
: Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable
106.
06.7 Add section Locally created and adopted faled inspections by contractors.
Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District
is added to read as follows:
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an
109.4 Added section 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire
Code Official. Based on the County of El Dorado's
Vegetalion Management Ordinance Board of Appeals
timeline.
Completed the section by fiing in the biank Allows thg Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that
. . protects life and property. Fees have been updaled lo
portions that were not completed by the SFM. itis . ;
1104 - ) Locatly adopted and amended match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriale by the
befterloft to localites to datermine the District Attomey's Office. The change to the language to
fees/penalties for their respective areas. include the term infracions.
110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2
Citations
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s),

Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor

1042 but under a different number) Locally created and adopted violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the

Health and Safety Code of the State of Califomia and
Chapter 5c (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Califomia.

Completed the section by filling in the blank

portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is All violations of the code have been consolidated under

1124 better lef to locaites to determine the Locally adopted and amended 1o :cn 110.4 to include the penalties for viotations.

fess/penalties for their respective areas.
Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District,
- . Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd

2z Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopted Manager. Definition of campfire shall not include LPG or
Propane fueled appliances.

3021 Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for dlarity

307.4.4 through Due to the high fire danger that exists in El Dorado County
30'7'4 42 ds), Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopted we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas.

20-0203 C Page 24 of 41



503,21

ChB'n'ged vertical clearances to 15 feet and road
widths to 20 feet

Locally adopted and amended

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus
components. It also allows an extended time frame before
having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional
height for vegetation ciearances acls as an mcreased buffer
for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of
shoulders, as measured face of curb to face of curb is
needed. These strichires can be difficult to navigate with
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the totai
drivable road surfaoa

503.2.5

Added a spedific section for R3's where it allows the
Fire Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations to
match as they require tumarounds for fire apparatus
access roads and driveways.

Locally adopted and amended

Fire apparalus require areas for tuming around when
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This
includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides
better access for ingress/egress, Additionally, adds tum
around for apparalus in driveways greater than 150",

§03.2.6

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated
Surfaces to state and match El Dorado County
Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated
Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendix D of the
cuent Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an
alternate means & methods that is not less restrictive than
the Fire Code.

503.4.2

Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes”
rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicle Code.

503.4.3

Added section regarding no parking in front of
hydranls

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire
hydrants” rules and is consistent with the Califonia Vehicle
Code.

503.44

Added section regarding fire lanes based on road
width

Locally created and adopted

This section cleary defines Califomia Fire Code Appendix D
as the reference for road lane width and their refation to fire
lanes.

503.5.3

Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain
emergency access and consistency through all
roadway gates in El Dorado County, referring to the
gate standards adopted by the FPO's.

Locally created and adopted

[the best possible emergency access to maintain fast

Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on
roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing -

response times.

505.1

Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of
buildings

Locally adopted and amended

Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing
based on the District's addressing standards.

507.5.1

Added more conservative standard for the
placement of hydrant and their relationship to
commercial buildings

Locally adopted and amended

Commercial properties are required to instal) hydrants at
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150
feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in
between).

509.3

Added verbiage to bring all of the necessary fire
controls for a building to one location.

Locally created and adopted

Buildings are gelting more sizable in the county. Itis more
common (o have new buildings with solar arrays that
continue to generate power even when the buildings
general utilities have been shut off. When there is an
emergency, it is vital that we have rapid access to all of the
controls in one location for public evacuation and firefighter
safety. Due to the fire denger present in EIl Dorado County
throughout most of the year, this change is appropriate and
advisable.

S e

Adds a requnremen( for spnnider sys!em mstall_ahon

m new bmk_ings and stmdnms 3 600 squar feel ol

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, ciimatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires -
double in'size each arid evéry minute, we require sprinklers
lobe lnstalled In strijcturés once !hey reach 3,600 squere
feet in size as they relate to ﬁre behavior and rata of

spread

 20-0203 C Page 25 of 41



- 9032a

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers If they
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the
structure, whichever is Jess.

Locatly created and adopted

Due to the topographic, dimatic, and geographic conditions
of E} Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
fest in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of

spreed

than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they

 ladd more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the

stmcture, whrchever rs less

A&déMbah‘tbromarfor'exrsbng‘buddngsless '_-f‘ L
"~ Locally created and adopted

Dua to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require spnnklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relale to ﬁre behavror and rate of .

spread

© 9032.1,90323,
324, 903.27

These sections were created to give specific
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on
occupancy and square footage ’

Locally adopled and amended

Due to the topographic, ciimatic, and geographic conditions
of €1 Dorado County and their contributing factors to our.
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every mirute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
fest in size as they refate to fire behavior and rate of

spread.

903.2.8.2

This section was created to include manufactured
residential single family R-3 in the residential
sprinkler program

Locally crealed and adopted

Manufactured Homes - The intent of this code section is to
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two-
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildtand-urban
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption
due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk
successfully in many Califomia communities.

903.2.9, 903.2.10

These sections were created to give specific
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on
occupancy and square footage

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of Ef Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

807.2.a

Added occupant protection for fire alams in
buildings with a floor area less than 3,600, except
R3, AG buildings not used for commercial
purposes, and buildings with a floor area of less
than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code
official.

Locally created and adopted

Provides proper emergency notification for cocupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of & fire or smoke.

907.2b

Added oeeupant protection for exrstrng bur!drngs

alamm if they add more than 30% or 1 ,000 square
feet to the structure, whichever isless.

without automalic sprinkler systems to install a fire |- ;

Locally created and adopted

Provides proper emergency notificaion for docupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department nohﬁwtm in
the event of a fire or smoke.

Added occupant protectron by stahng all fire’ alarm
detection systems instatied shall bé connected to a
monitoring Sefvice that notifies rhe fire department
\ipon activation and is rnstaﬂed per Sedron 907 of
me ﬁre code i

Locally eréated and adopted

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of a fire or smoke . .

systems tobe conficted to a monrtored ﬁm alarm
system when %nstalled of replaced :

" Locally ceated and adoptad | -

Provrdes pmper emergency nohﬁmbm for occupanaa that
allow public use and ensures Fire Departmen! noﬁﬁcatron in
the event of a fire or smoke : .

20-0203 C Page 26 of 41



explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of
Supervisors for fireworks.

Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E
907.6.2.1 o P
Modification Locally created and adopled safety related power oulages.
This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to
1203.1.3 Shunt trip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up
power supplies
i : Addressing for construction sites Is important to assist
3310.3 Address rem ts fi trudJon it Local d .
‘. requu en or cons! sites ocally created and adopted . ing emergency ]
' Water supplies at oonshud:m sltes with L Water must be on site prior to combustible material being
33121 - : e nie
T combuistible materials on-site Locally adopted and amended stored or vertical construction commencing.
El Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout
This section was created to include Fire Protection the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire
4903.1
Plan for il fire hazard severity zones. Locally crealed and adopled Protection Plan due fo dimatic, geological, and
topographical conditions.
This section clarifies that within the boundaries of Ei Dorado
. . . . County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are
Add ti
4305.4 requ‘i’r‘;;::fs on to dlarify roof consiruction Locally crealed and adopled  |wildiand fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly.
" . Hazardous matenials related incidents are costly to mitigate.
Any damages of costs from negligent practices that L . ) .
5001.7 cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally created and adopted Ifthe incident cs'caused by neghgem?e due to a business
oost process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the
recovery fee. ) .
negligent parties.
Added saf tection wil its being issued , .
by bomsm:%f: C:?g:: nvt;g‘h?e?ﬂ? Depanrt?r::::j for Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and
5601.2 Locally adopted and amended fireworks to approve them and have a dear understanding

of the applications they will be used for.

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make
available all requested documentation pertaining to
the firework presentation

Locally created and adopled

The Fire Marsha! of any jurisdiction may request any
documentation including timing and proprietary information
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they
deem necessary. This information is understood to be
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as
such.

5704.29,6.1

. |Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class I combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks, Requires AHJ approval and a
Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County.

5706.2.4.4

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Established limils as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class I combustible liquid special
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval
and a Spedial/Conditional Use Permit from the County.

' 5806.2

Administrative addition of District name.
Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amiended

Administrative need to add District name. Established limits
as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable
Cryogenic fiuids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ
approval and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the
County.

T 5806.2.1

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

SFM adopted and amended locally

" |Establishied limils as requued by the Fire Code Official for
Flammable Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers.
Requires AH. approval and a Specia/Conditional Use
Permit from the County.

' Established llmns for LPG storage and dlspensmg

near o adaoent to mndenhal development

Locall adpted and ariended

Establishes distances between LPG storage and
dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential
. jdevelopments and high-densily hotels, motel; apartments,

- |etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would
have & high probability of injury, inhalation, or death;
Reqmra AHJ approval and a Speaal/Cona“ uonal Usa .
PermufrommeCounty S S

20-0203 C Page 27 of 41




g2

Establishes propane regulator requrrements for
locations above 5000 foof elevatron e

- Locally created and édonted L

Establrshes propane regulator requirement for locations
above 5000 foot efevation. Including requirements for two-
stage regulator use and location of first and second stage
regulators. Additional requirements are outlined for
protective covers, riser pipe installation requirements, -
bulldlng permit submittal and review, tank centerdine
marking; and grade requrrements These requrrements are
d on signicant fire history in heavy sriow and extreme
her condmons enoountered above 5000 feet.

e 5000 toot elevatlon

Estabiishes propaneverheal nserprpe requrrements . e

" Locally created and adope

e vertleal propane iise requrrements for locabons
above 5000 fook elevation. Pipe schedule location, svvrng
joint requrrements and the use of flexible riser piping as
well as swing joints. These requirements are based on
srgnrﬁcant fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather
condmons encountered above 5000 feet

61123

Establrsh&s pmpane markrng and lomtron
rsqurrements above 5000 foot elevation

" Locally created and adopted

Estéblrshs nia'rltrng and lo'wtron r'equuénients for locations

} above 5000 foot efevation. This séction addresses signage

focation, emergency contact information, and snow refated
tank marking requirements. These requirements are based
on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme
weather conditions encountered above 5000 fest.

61131

by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction).

Permits arid plans shall be submitted and approved |

Locally created and adopted.

Permrttrng and Plan submittal requrrements for underground
tanks:. .

Allows us to requrre plans be subrnrtted for review prior to-
installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks
requrre substantial marntenanca including inspection and
anode replacement at regular mtervals

61132

Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the
property of the LPG company

Locally created and adopted

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when
sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16

NFPA 13D-16 of Chapler 80 of the Fire Code of the
District has been amended to update various
provisions perfaining to the installation of sprinkler
systems in one-and two-family dwellings

SFM Adopted and amended locally

Amended to indude on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on-
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow
alamm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in the
event of water activation in a vacant structure, and
hydrostatic lesting requirements to assure proper 13D
sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water
damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements
were also added to ensure water circulation through the
system, reducing stagnant water and backflow concems
(EID encourages this type of system).

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section
51.1.2

To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler
system minimizing damage

SFM adopted and amended locally

A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system
must be avaitable on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section 7.6

Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation

SFM _adopted and amended locally

An audible alarm system is added to notify occupants and
in the activation of the system when the building is not
occupied allow for detection minimizing damage.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section
11.21.1

System test to a pfessure of 150 p.s.i.

SFM adopted and amended locally

A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and
failures and assures proper gluing of system components.

:-'Appendpr Table
8105 1(1)

- |Changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot .-
: elevabonto atct fif ﬂowprecedentsusedrn

Locally adopled and amended

" |Allows us 1o match what developers and residents aré used

to in regards 10 GPM fire flow reqmements that have been
loroveradewdernEDc '

81052

Appendrx B: -Table

below 5000 lo_ot elevatron, fcr all oommeraal
projects. " :

" Locally adopted and amendsd

' s to match what developers |
toin regards to GPM fire flow requuements that have been
used for over a decade i inEDC. .

20-0203 C Page 28 A




lll is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to

N Stats law requum no greater than 16% grade

‘ Appendix D: D103.1 N Médg an exception for residential Wa?'s Locally adopted and amended construct a 26 foot wide space for to a hydrant.
Title 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways.
Appendix D: D103.2 Locally adopted and amended  [in our El Dorado County Title 14 adoption we allow greater

than 16% grade with AHJ appfoval and hard surface.

Appendix D: D103.3

20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutters due
to potential access issues and tuming radius concems.

T

Appendix D: D103.5 §|°

Where fire apparatiss access roads consist of a divided
roadway the gate wndlh shall not be less than 15 feel dueto
radius issues. . : . Lo

Appendix D: D103.6.1

N Text to include curbs and gutters ‘Locally adopled and amended
N Fi_ﬁé'abpéraﬁ:s’ access road gates L X " | Locally adopted and amended -
N Roads widths 20 to 29 feet Locally adopted and amended

No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does
not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all other elevations.

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of

Exception

have only one approved fire apparatus access road.

Appendix D: D103.6.2 N fest in width Locally adopted and amended elevalion. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations.
Appendix D: D104.2 Remaved the exception that allows a sprinklered For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
pe . ’ N building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the

residents and first responders.

Appendix D: D104.4

N Added to require circumferential fire apparatus

access roads

Locally created and adopted

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus
access foad shall be constructed lo encompass the entire
structure and shall provide a continuous means of
emergency vehicle access.

Appendix D: D106.1

Removed Exception in its entirety.

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of

L |hazardousdeanmg.solven!use

Excootion N Locally adopted and smended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
cep residents and first responders.
Appendix D: D107.1 For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
Ex l'ion ! N Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
P residents and first responders.
Adopted with no Amendments
1012 through 1015 N Ca"l‘."gi:;‘m““b"s" soope, intent, severabity and Locally adopted Administratie claiity
102.6 through 102.8 N. Refereno&s, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative darity
10210 through 102.42f N Cref°""'°""" provisions, Other Laws. Application of Locally Adopted Administrative diarity
» DeﬁnmonoﬂheFre Prevention Division and ability . AR e
103.1 through 104.1 N Jto aiforce the code o L.t)ca!lyMppged;_ A@lnushgnye danty. .
104.3 trough 1044 N Rigﬁto_fénuy,'wauahls, and déntification . Locally Adopled - Administrative clarity.” .
104.6 thicugh 10464 | -~ N Reoord retenuon *Locally Adopted: Administrative daity
104.6 through 104.9.2 N tl::::i.i.fl.eations altemate means snd methods, and Localy Adooted Administrative déﬁty-. -
104.11 through Aulhontyatﬁrs dghlofawess mamtenanoeof . e
104.11.2 N fsystems _ L Lw"“’”’e".. . [Administative darty. -
104.11.3 NG Authontyofsystans mdde\ncesmoperable . f o Locally Adopled . . - |Administrative dlanity- . . - .-
105.2.3, N Time ﬁmvtabon ofapplwanon e Locally Adopted - - - - |Administrative dlarity. = - - . . -
105.3.1!hrwgh5 N : I e e
10532, - v
056142

20-0203 C Page 29 of 41



105.6.2.28 through

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and

Permits for various business operations for. Magnesium,
miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation

|

i - h Locally Adopted vehicies, molor fuel-dispensing fadities, open buming,
105.6.35 fire and life safely inspections open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and
organic coatings
_ Adopled ﬂns section for admlmstratwe danty and . .
10,5'6:3-7 fire and life safety inspections - Locally Adopled Penmts for Pla°§ of assemply o
. . Adoptedﬁussechonforadm;msb’aﬂvedantyand e
105639 R fire and life safety in s Locally Adopted Permns for pnvate fire hydrants .

S . Pemmits for pyroxyiin plasbm refngerabon eqmpmant. repair]
105.6.41 through Adopted thls sedion for admlnlstratrve danty and 1 ocally Adopt ed garages and motor fuel-dispensing facilities, rooftop
105646 . ﬁre and Ilfe safety mspeebons . AR heliports, spraymg or dippmg, storage of scrap tires and tire

5 A Adopted this secﬁon foradmimstrabve danty and . T S
105648 o Hfie and ifa safety inspections Locally Adopled Petmll forhre-.rebmldmg_";_):la_n_le
PO Adopted this sectm for admmlsuauve danty and Pesmit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material,
105650 ﬁreandﬁfe safety mspewms Lw_’"’“"”’?" lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 cubic feet)
e Adopted thls Séction for administrative clarity and . )
106.1 thmegh 106.3 fire and lfe safety inspections ) Locally Adopted Fee schedules for permits
| Adopted this section for administrative clarity and N .
107.1 fite and ife safety inspections Locally Adopted Inspection authority
‘ ‘ Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of
. Ad: l‘ P A . equipment, re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping,
108.1 through 109.3 fro an:dﬁ:'z:fx‘;:;m af!m;mstrabve darity and Locally Adopted supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding,
) . . Board of Appeals established, fimitations on authority, and
- quahﬁcahons
110.3.2 through Adopled 'ﬂ_ils section for administrative clarity and Locally Adopted Compliance with orders and nobws prosecution of
110.34 fire and lifé safety inspections , Y viofations, and unauthorized tampering
_ Adopted this section for administrative clarity and . L
110.4.1. !ﬁre and lfe sefety ions Locally Adopted Abatement of violation
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and . . o
113.1 Iﬁre and e salety inspections Locally Adopted Authority to disconnect service ulilities
Asphalt kettles contain highly flammable substances and
303.1 through 303.9 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and
topograptueal)
Managing ignition sources through responsible application
305.1 through 305.5 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locaily Adopted of standards will reduce the number of fires in various
se(hngs (Climatic, geological, and topographml)
. Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY
306.1 through 306.2 Adopted this section for fire and ife safety Locally Adopted ﬂammab!e and require special handling (Climatic,
geclogical, and topographical)
: L Open buming, recreational fire, and portable outdoor
307.1 through 307.5 Adopted this sechon for fire and life safety Locally Adopted fi replm (Clir'h'a'ﬁc, g eologi cal, and topographical)
308.1 Adopte tis section for fire and ffe safety Locally Adopted
308.1.2 through T . Thmmng or placmg of ignition sources, torches for
308.1.3 _ Adopted this section for fire and lfe safety Locally Adopted removmg paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Locations near combustible, open flame devices, signals
S L S and markers, portable fue! open-flame devices, sky-
308.1.5 through | i e o fo PR Q o lantems, reﬁgious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming
308185 @ - Adopled this ; for ﬁre anel e safety LocelIyA dop ed ) food aiid beverage preparation, dispensing, containers not
: : EEEE UL in use, serving of flaming food, location, fire protection
geologiml and topographml)
308.2 ’ Adepted ihis section for ﬁf_é and e safety. Ldeelly' . i . P its are requnred for above sectlon (Ckmahc, gedogncal

and fopographical)

20-0203 C Page 30 of 41



308.3 through 308.4.1

|Adopted this section for fire and lfe safety

Locally Adopted

Group A dccupancies open-fiame decorative devices,
theatrical performances, Group R occupancles, Group R-2
dormitories (Climaﬁc, geological, and topographical)

304

Adopted this section for fire and life safely

Locally Adopted

General requirements refating to smokmg (Chmahc
|geological, and fopographical) - . B

3103

Adopted this section for ire and ife safety.

Locally Adopted

“"No Smoking® sngns (Chmahc geologwal and
topographlcal) .

3104 throigh 310.8

Adoptod this secton for i and ife saféty.

LocauyAdopted

Remova! of stgns ‘prohnbuted oompuance vnth No Smokmg'
signs, ash brays, bummg ob;ects hazardous envionmental

311.1 thiough 311.4

Adopted this secton for fire and ife sefey

" Locally Adopted

Vacant premnses condmon' and safety req,nrements
Abandoned pranuses ‘tenant spaces; safeguardmg vacant
premuss secunly fire) protecuon fire separahcn removal
- |of combusiibies; removai of hazardous malerials. (Chmatic,

geologwal and topographml)

319.1

_ Adop(ed thns section for ﬁna and hfe safety

Locally Adopted

General réquirehents relating to mobile food preparation
vehicles. (Climalic, geological, and fopographical) -

Ja10.2

Adopted this mdwn for admumsirahve dan!y and
lfire and life safety inspections -

Locally Adopted

Permits for mobile food preparation vehicles (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

359.3 through
319.10.3

[Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Exhaust hiood, fire protection, fire protection for cooking

" |eauipment, fire extinguisher, appliance connection to fuel
supply piplng, cooking oif slorage containers, metallic
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking oif
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting,
nommal vents, emergency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum
aggregate volume, prolection of container, LP-gas confainer
construction, protection of system piping, LP-gas alarms,
CNG systems, CNG conlainers supplying only cooking fuel,
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG
container construction, CNG containers supplying
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping,
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems.
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)

403.8.1 through
40_3.8. 1.7

Adopted ‘this section for fire and life safety. -

Locally Adopted

Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1
(residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and
fire safety plans. - :

403.10 through
403.10.1.3

Adopted this section for ﬁre'_and fife é?afety

Locally Adopted

Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancy
Evacuations, diagrams, eniergency duties, (Climatic,
geoiogical, and topographical)

405.5

Adopted this wchon for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Emergency Planning and record keepmg (Clumabc
geological, and topographical)

510.3

Adopted thls section for administrative danty and
fire and life safely inspections

Locally Adopted

A permil is required for emergency respondef radio systems
(Climatic, geclogical, and topographical)

807.5.2 through
807.5.2.3

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and lfe safety inspections .

Locally Adopted

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a
maximum amount of lammable wall coverings in
adicational facilities (Climatic, geological, and

topographical)

903.2.15

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers)
(Climalic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000
square feet. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

20-0203 C Page 31 of 41




Adopted this section in existing buildings for the

Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings.
All buitdings will be required to aliow emergency responders
lo receive and fransmit emergency radio traffic to and from
each other and the emergency dispalch center. Time
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by

firefighters, and other emergency responders.

11032 Y ::sfety gfe\:;eﬁghlers and other emergency Locally Adopted the fire code official, is acceplable. The rationale behind
ponders. this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. - This
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Appendnx D D101 1 N Adopled this section for the safety of the public, L oeally Adopted - General requlrements for fire appataws acCess roads
through D102 1 = ﬁmﬁghters and ‘otfier emérgency respmdefs : T mdudmg loads. (Cumahc geologlcal and topogtaphleal)
Lo _ ' Déad end fire apparatus access'road requirements for a
I : Adopledthis monformesafetyoimepubllc, NI
Appendns D: D103.4 N ﬁreﬁghtem ah d olfier emergency respon ders, Lacally Adopted turn afound at 150 feet, (Climatic, gedogical and
o : topographical) .
i Adopted this séction for the safety of the public, ‘ "No Parking, Fire Lane" signs requirements. (Climatic,
¥ .‘d;x 0:D1038 N firefighters, and other emergency responders. Locally Adopted geclogical, and topographical)
N roul g:nt()?o 4D31 041 N Adopled this sectlon for the safety of the public, Localy Adopted Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus
(ex dudmg ex ion) ﬁreﬁghterf, and other efnggency mpondgg _ acc&ss roads. (Climatic, geok.agml, and topographu:al)
Appendix D: D105.1 N |Adopted tis secton for the safey ofthe pubc, Localy Adopted Requirements for aerial fire apparalus access roads
thirough D105.4 Ifirefighters; and other emergency responders. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Q"r‘;’;‘;‘:"(‘):’(;;’;w \ |Pdopted s section fo the saetyofthe pubc, Localy Adoted Fire apparaus acoess roads for muliple-family residentia
(excluding exceptions) firefighters, and other. emergency responders. _ _ developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Appendix D: D107.1 One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be
(exciudi t;xee pﬁéns) N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopted equipped throughout with iwo sperate and approved fire
" firefighters, and other emergency responders. y Adop apparalus access roads due to topographic, geographic and
through D107.2 . .
climatic conditions.
Appendix D: D108 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopted Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction

standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle.

White cells are newly amended, adopled, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions.

20-0203 C Page 32 of 41




Cameron Park Fire Department

In cooperation with the
California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection

Fire Station 89 Fire Station 88
3200 Country Club Drive 2961 Alhambra Drive
Cameron Park, CA 95682 Cameron Park, CA 95682

(530) 677-6190
(530) 672-2248 FAX

(530) 672-7350
(530) 672-7352 FAX

To whom it may concern,

For the Cameron Park Fire Department 2019 Fire Code adoption, public notice was achieved through
posting our Notice of Intent in the following three locations:

e On the board located in the front of Fire Station 89 at 3200 Country Club Dr.
s Packets placed in the front office at Fire Station 89, and available for the public to view.
e On the Districts website, detailing the location and time of the meeting where the adoption was

going to take place.

The district was always forthcoming with the information of proposed changes and had it readily available
for review by the public. Additionally, the District gave enough time for public comment and viewing.

/-

Vi G

Jed Gaines
Fire Chief

20-0203 C Page 33 of 41



Cameron Park Fire Department

In cooperation with the
California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection

CAL FIRE

Fire Station 89 Fire Station 88
3200 Country Club Drive 2961 Alhambra Drive
Cameron Park, CA 95682 Cameron Park, CA 95682

(5630) 677-6190
(530) 672-2248 FAX

(530) 672-7350
(530) 672-7352 FAX

Attachment No. 2
Cameron Park Community Services District

Resolution No. 2019-22

20-0203 C Page 34 of 41




RESOLUTION NQ. 2019-22

OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS
OF THE CAMERON PARK COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT

RESOLUTION ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO THE
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

A resolution of the Cameron Park Community Services District (District) sctting forth iindings with
respect to local conditions within the District which make certain modifications and changes to the
California Fire Code reasonably necessary for preserving fire and life safety in the Cameron Park

Community Services District.
The Governing Board of the Cameron Park Community Services District finds and resolves as follows:

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958 5 permits a Fire Protection District to adopt an
ordinance which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations adopted pursuant to Health &
Safety Code Section 17922 upon determination that such changes or modifications are necessary due to
local conditions that pertain regulations governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the

environment from fire, explosion, hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and

WHEREAS, Health & Satety Code Section 17958. 7 reqquires that a District’s Board of Directors
making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 shall make
express finding that such changes or modifications are needed; and shall file a copy of such changes or
modifications with the Department of Housing and Community Development,

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions existing within
the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the District to impose more stringent
requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code and pursuant to California Health and Safety
Code sections 13869.7 and 17938.7, the District desires to make express findings to that effect.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the Cameron Park
Community Services District, after having a duly noticed and held public meeting, hereby adopts the
follawing findings concerning current unique local conditions that together make each modification to
the California Fire Code, rcasonably necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life,

property and the environment more specifically set forth as follows:

Page | ol 4
20-0203 C Page 35 of 41



FINDINGS OF FACT
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BUILDING STANDARDS
CODE (TITLE 24 PART 9} BECAUSE OF LOCAL CONDITIONS

A, General.

After due consideration, the Board of Directors of the Cameron Park Community Services
District/Cameron Park Fire Department, hereby finds that due to locai climatic, geologic and
topographic conditions, as stated within this document, there is a need to provide the modifications
and changes contammed in the adoptive Ordinance of the California Fire Code. Such changes are
deemed reasonably necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life, property and the

environment

The Cameron Park Community Services District/Cameron Park Fire Department provides fire
protection, emergency medical services and specialized rescue services to approximately twenty-threc
thousand people in an 17 square mile area. The District 1s located on the western slope of El Doradn
County. The topography of the District consists of a cenural valley along the Deer Creek drainage,
approximately ' mile wide with a northwest/southeast arientation. Cameron Park's area of the Iine
Hill Preserve is approximately 425 bores of mature stands of Manzanita and Chemise brush and dense
oak woodland forests i the west. The weather conditions vary from freezing temperatures with

occasional snow in sinter. o summer temperatures that regularly exceed 100 degrees,

The District can be Jivaded into four distingt areas: The core, southern area, encompasses the Hiey 50
Cameron Park and Cambridge Road corridors. The core area iy urban and contains most of the
District’s existing commercini and residential developments, The north and east areas typicaily contain
small subdivisions, goll course, airport and a 40 acre lake. The westerr area contams the Pine Hill

Preserve.

The Cameron Park Community Services District/Cameron Park Fire Department is an “all-rask”
agency. The District participates m a sophisticated automatic aid progrom and is dispatched through
agreement by the California Department of Forestry and Fire Pratection (CAL-FIRE), at Camino. The
resources of the District will respond to, and deal with, any type of emergency. The term “Fire
Protection” in this document is broad and includes responses to all types of fires, smoke and odor
investigations, alarms, public assist calls, hazardous materials incidents, medical aid and specialized

rescues.

The District has estabiished two, full-time, statfed fire stations to provide emergency services to the
community. Fire Station 8% is located in the southern part of the unincorporated area of Cameron Park,
at 3200 Country Club Drive. Fire Station 88 is located in the northern part of the unincarporated area
of Cameron Park, at 296! Alhambra Drive. The District bas 18 full-time, career personnel, alung with
twenty-five part-time Volunteer Resident Firefighters, and two part time Fire Prevention Specialists for

the district’s weed abatement program.

Page 2 of 4

20-0203 C Page 36 of 41



B. Climatic,

The Cameron Park Community Services District/Cameron Park Fire Department is located within a
foothill region. The District is subject to four seasons, with an annual average snowfall in the winter
months of 1-2 inches, in addition to an average rainfall of 40 inches per year. These adverse weather
conditions create severe hazardous road conditions and flooding as well as rock slide hazards along the
main access roads within, as well as into, the District from the surrounding areas. Due to periods of
rainfall, along with repeated road closures, the ability of the Fire Protection District to provide
immediate emergency response is at times delayed. These same adverse climatic conditions eften
result in a large number of vehicular accidents that place extreme restraints on the availability of
emergency response to perform emergency rescue, first aid, hazardous materials control and
firetighting. The climatic conditions often result in a substantial or total lack of ability of the Fire
Protection District to respond immediately to other types of emergencies that occur.

Examples of these emergencies include structure fires, vehicle fires, wildland (grass, brush, timber),
fires, flooding, hazardous materials incidents, emergency medical calls, vehicle accidents and vertical
rescues. The mutual aid agreements established with adjoining fire agencies might not be possible due
to adverse climatic conditions, restricting or totally blocking access into the District.

Summary:

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the District. Times of
little or no rainfall, Jow humidity and high temperatures create extremely hazardous conditions,
particularly as they relate to the wildland - urban interlace (WUI). Winds experienced in this area can
have a significant impact upon structure fires, especially in buildings in close proximity to one another,
and to wildlands commonly found in the Cameron Park Community Services District. Structures built
within the Cameron Park Community Services District must be built with these variables in mind.

C. Geological,

The Cameron Park Community Services District is located within moderate activity seismic Zone 5.
The seismic, geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires, major breakage of water mains,
multiple electrical power failures, multiple collapsed structures and a large number of calls for
emergency medical aid, all of which may occur simultancously during a seismic event, The water
district has numerous water-pumping systems used for fire suppression water delivery, as well as
water storage tanks providing water system pressure. Most of the pumping systems are dependent on
electrical power for operation. Such electrical power may not be available during a seismic event.
Water storage tanks used for the storage of required firc suppression water may also collapse in such
an event forcing the additional need to transport water via additional pieces of fire apparatus, which
will place a significant restraint on the ability of the District to provide the required emergency

services.

Summary:
Local geographic and geological features and processes exist within the boundaries of the district that
may hamper the ability of the Cameron Park Community Services District/Cameron Park Fire
Department to perform its sworn duties, Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing
greater loss of life and damage than the carthquake itself.

Page 3 of'4

20-0203 C Page 37 of 41



D. Topographical,

The District is primarily composed of areas that are considered by the State to be high fire hazard
severity zones, Much of the District is located within toothill terrair, covered with highly combustible
vegetation, mchuding the presence of many mature stands of brush, and dense sak woodland-forested
areas, The elevation within the District ranges from at 1.000 feet to over [ 500 feet at the highest paint.
Slopes within the District ranges from 13%-4/V5 up to the ridge tops. The structures within the areas of
foothills terrain bave very limited fire access, due to parrow roadwavs and driveways with steep
prades and poor surtace conditions. The presence of many existing structures within the high fire
hazard severity zone areas provides for a very high potential of a structure fire spreading into »
wildland or forest fire condition as well as the patential for a wildland or forest fire spreading to

structures.

Summary:

The alignment of canyuns, valleys and slopes into inhabited areas, combined with the vanable nature
of the terratn, yield a potential for increased fire risk. Most structures, both residential and commercial,
are . or are surrounded by areas that contain a significant grass, brush, mixed oak woudland, and
mixed conifer fuel load. Due to drought conditions, beetle intestotions, and lack of vegetation
management, much of the area is populated with either dead or dying trees, contributing to an extreme

fire danger

E. Canclusion:

Local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions described  above increase the froquency,
intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District, Further, these conditions impiaut
potential damage ta structures from an earthquake and subsequent fire, Therelore, it js reasonably
necessary that the California Fire Code be modilied to mitigate the effects of the above conditions,
Cabfarnia Health & Safety Code Section 179587 requites that modifications to the Fire Code be
expressiv marked and identified as o which each tindirg refers to which Code modification. The

attached Appendix A provides this connection

PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meating of the Board of Dhrectors of the Cameron Park,
Community Services District on October 167, 2T by the tollowiny, roll call vote:
. . n <
AYES WS Him FC B £ 4
NOES: ey
ABSTAIN: e ng_

ABSENT: 1y (¢

APNEST: -
N g
b e
Director MOsique Scabey, Vice President Jaill l;ltzmnn, General Manager
Board of Directors Sevretary to the Board

Paged of 4

20-0203 C Page 38 of 41



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted | Adopted as Amended Finding
1011 X Admin
105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
106.6 X Admin
106.6.1 X Admin
106.7 X Admin
109.4 X Admin
110.4 X Admin
110.4.2 X Admin
112.4 X Admin
202 X Admin
3021 X Admin .
307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
509.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.3 X CIimatic/Getﬂjgicalﬁ opographical
903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.6.2.1 X CIimatic/GeoIo_g_icaI/Topographical
1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
33103 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
33121 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5001.7 X Admin
5601.2 X Admin
5601.2.1 X Admin
5601.2.2 X Admin
5704.2.9.6.1 "X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 C Page 39 of 41




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted { Adopted as Amended Finding

6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

6113.1 X Admin
6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16§ 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix B: Table B105.1(1) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix B: Table B105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D; D103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.5§ 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

101.2 through 101.5 X Admin
102.6 through 102.8 X Admin
102.10 through 102.12 X Admin
103.1 through 104.1 X Admin
104.3 through 104.4 X Admin
104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin
104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin
104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin
104.11.3 X Admin

105.2.3 , X Admin

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin
105.6.12 X Admin
105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin
105.6.37 X Admin
105.6.39 X Admin
105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin
105.6.48 X Admin
105.6.50 X Admin

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin
107.1 X Admin

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin
110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin
110.4.1 X Admin

1131 X Admin

20-0203 C Page 40 of 41




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section

Adopted

Adopted as Amended

Finding

303.1 through 303.9

x

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

305.1 through 305.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

306.1 through 306.2 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
307.1 through 307.5 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
308.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.2 through 308.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.2 Admin
308.3 through 308.4.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
3101 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.4 through 310.8 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
311.1 through 3114 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
319.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical

319.2 Admin

319.3 through 319.10.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.10 through 403.10.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

405.5 Admin
510.3 Admin
807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1.5 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1103.2 Topographical
Appendix % 1%120111 through Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.4

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.6

i x I ixIxlxlix]>xi>x]I>x]x]|>x]|xIxix]|>x|>x]|x]x]|>x]|x{x

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.1 through

X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D104.3 (excluding exception) gical/Topograp
dix D: D105.1 th h .
Appendix D: D1 roug X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D105.4
Appendix D: D106.1 through L . .
Geol | |
D106.3 (excluding exception) X Climatic/Geological/Topographica
Appendix D: D107.1 (excludin
PP 'xexcep::)ionsi xeluding X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 C Page 41 of 41






