RESOLUTION NO. 036-2020
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO
(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 013-2017)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is
updated by the State every three years; and,

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2,
Chapter |, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulations
to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or
her authorized representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative;
and,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the
chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS; the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain
a memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the
inspection of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on November 13™ 2019, the Board of directors of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire
Protection District adopted Ordinance No. 2019.01, which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code
with amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or
topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado
ratifies Ordinance No. 2019.01 of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire. Protection District and delegates
the enforcement of the ordinance to the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Chief, or his
or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following
sections:

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202,302.1, 307.4.4 through
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1.
507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7,903.2.8.2,
903.2.9,903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1,
4905.4,5001.7,5601.2,5601.2.1,5601.2.2,5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2,6104.2, 6112.1 through
6112.3,6113.1,6113.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016

Section 4.7, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6,
Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table B105.1 (1), Appendix B: Table
B105.2, Appendix D103.1 through DI03.3, Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix D103.6.1,

Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104 4. 20-0203 D Page 1 of 40



Resolution No. 036-2020 Page
2 of2

The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code,

Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the
International Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4,309,311.5,311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403 .4,
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12,
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808,
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106,
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception),

D107.1 (Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G,
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019
California Fire Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting

of said Board, held the 10 day of March , 2020, by the following vote of said Board:
Ayes: Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin, Novasel
Attest: Noes: None
Kim Dawson Absent: None
Clerkﬂthe Board of S rviy/ 5\ : M
By: /M%v 7( ] ,K VoA ke D—
.V Deputy Clerk Brian K Veerkamp, Chair, Boardbf Supervisors

20-0203 D Page 2 of 40



QKD P
VL 0RATIGS

Diamond Springs - El Dorado Fire Protection District

501 Pleasant Valley Road Diamond Springs, CA 95619 ~ (530) 626-3190 Fax (530) 626-3188
www.diamondfire.org

December 19, 2019

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors
330 Fair Lane

Placerville, CA 95667

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado
Fire Protection District, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code with
amendments related to local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions.

Dear Mr. Ashton:

The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District (DSEDFPD) is requesting the Board of
Supervisors (BOS) ratify its Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code
as amended due to specific local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. California
Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of the city or county where
the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance. The BOS must also
delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District (or its representative) or the Chief
Building Official.

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2019-01 with
amendments to the 2019 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to
the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is
enclosed for your review and use on this topic.

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County.

Sincerely,

gg_an/l(ansdell
ire Chief

ATTACHMENTS:

1. Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Ordinance No. 2019-01
2. Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Finding of Fact Resolution No. 2019-10
3. Draft El Dorado County BOS Resolution

20-0203 D Page 3 of 40



Attachment No. 1
Diamond Springs El Dorado Fire Protection

District Ordinance No. 2019-01

20-0203 D Page 4 of 40



DIAMOND SPRINGS-El DORADO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ORDINANCE NO. 2019.01

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE DIAMOND
SPRINGS-EL DORADO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS:

An ordinance of the Diamond Springs El-Dorado Fire Protection District (DSP) adopting the 2019 Edition
of the California Fire Code, incorporating the 2018 Edition of the Infernational Fire Code, regulating and governing,
the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of
hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of
buildings and premises in the DSP; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing
Ordinance No. 2016-37 of the DSP and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith.

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the DSP, also known as the Diamond Springs El-Dorado
Fire Protection District:

Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS

Section 4: CONFLICT

Section 5: SEVERABILITY

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

The DSP makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 2019 Edition, pursuant to
Health & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.7 and 18941.5 during this code adoption process. Such changes
are necessary because of local climatic, geological and/or topographical conditions. The DSP has adopted,
pursuant to Section 18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these
conditions by Resolution #2019-10 of the DSP dated October 9, 2019.

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
The DSP adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, including Appendices,
incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the

exclusions listed below:

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 1
20-0203 D Page 5 of 40



Exclusions: 105.6.17-105.6.19, 105.6.39, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3,
403.4, 403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12, 404.1-404 4,
405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2), 808, 904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9
(adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception),
D106.1 (Exception), D107.1 (Exception), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J,
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 California Fire
Code.

SECTION 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS
The following Sections are hereby amended or added:

Chapter 1

Section 101 Scope and General Requirements
101.1 Title shall be amended as follows: Add name of jurisdiction [DSP]

- Section 105 Permits

- 105.6.27 LPG-gas shall be amended as follows: Add to the exception: At or above 5,000 feet of
elevation, a permit is not required for individual containers with a {25-gallon water capacity or less,
or multiple container systems having an aggregate quantity not cxcceding 125 gallons serving

occupancies in Group R-3.

- Secction 106 Fees
- 106.6 Permit, Plan Review and Inspection Fees shall be added as follows: A schedule of fees

adopted by the district board of directors for plan review, inspections and the issuance of perniits by
the district may be found in the most current district fee schedule (Health & Safety Code 17951).

- 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees shall be added as follows: Fire service fees may be charged to any
person, firm, corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the district to respond to the scene of an incident. 4
district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the district provides or the cost
of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code 13916). The fee shall
not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to the scene of an incident.

- 106.7 Administrative Costs shall be added as follows: When a test or inspection is scheduled, and

the contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 2
20-0203 D Page 6 of 40



may bill the comtractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/inspection location and

the time spent ai the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs.

- Sect Board of Appeals

- Section 109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines shall be added as follows: Any person or entity who
believes they may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code
official through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on
the notice. All such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for
the district. A timely appeal shall stay further action by the fire code official until the matter is
determined by the Appeal Board os outiined in Section 109.2, unless the issue poses an imminent fire
or life safety hazard 1o members of the public. The fire code official shall notify the appeilant by
certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be scheduled to take place no
sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified mail. The appellant shall have the
right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and present oral, written and/or photographic
evidence to the Appeal Board.

- Section Violations

- 110.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows: Persons who shall violate a provision of this
code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter,
repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code
official, or of a permit or écrtiﬁcate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting attorney or agency, punishable by a
fine not exceeding $7100.00 for a first violation; 2. A fine not 2xceeding $500.00 for a second violation
of the same provision within one year; 3. A fine not exceeding 31000.00 for each additional viclation
of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment rot exceeding /80 days, or both such fine
and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be
deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995).

- 11042 Citations shall be added as follows: The Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized
representative, may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to
Section 13871 of the Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter 5c (commencing
with Section 853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California.

- Secti 12 Stop Work Order
- 112.4. Failure to Comply shall be amended as follows: Any person who shall continue any work
after having been served with a stop-work order, except such work as that person is directed to

Urdinance 2019.01 Page 3
20-0203 D Page 7 of 40



perform to remove a violatjon or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or

both as described in Section 110.4 (Health & Safety: Code Sections 13145 and 17995},

Chapter 2

- Section 202 (eneral Definitions

- Add definiion for Campfire - Shall mean a fire whickh is used for cooking. personal warmth, lighting,
or aesthetic purposes. This includes fires comained within owtdoor fireplaces and enclosed stoves
with flues or chimneys, stoves using jellied. liguid, or solid fuels, portable barbecue pits, braziers, or
space heating devices which are used outside of any structure, mobile home, or anmy living
accommaodation mounted on a vehicle.

- Add definition for District - Shall mean the district and all other areas within the éxterior boundaries

thereof now or hereafler established,

- Add definition for Driveway - Shall mean a vefiicular access thar serves up 1a 1wo (2) parcels with ne
mare than two (2) residential units and any number of non-commercial or industriol buildings on each parcel.

- Add definition for Executive Body - Shall mean the Board of Directors of the District.

- Add definition for Fire Chief - Shall mean the Chief Fxecutive Fire Officer of the Fire
department/district serving the jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative,

- Add definition for Trained Crowd Manager - Shall mean standdy persomnel, usually a security
guard or usher personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other

place of public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency:

Chapter 3

- Sectiop 3 finitions

~302.1 Definitions shall be amended as follows: Added Campfire definition, as shown above in
Chapter 2.

- Section 307 Open Burning, Recreational Fires, and Qutdoor Fireplaces
- 307.44 Campfire Restrictions shall be added as follows:
- 307.4.4.1 It is unlawful for any person to light, maintain, or use a campfire upon or near any brush-

covered land, grass-covered land, or foresi-covered land during the (ime when burning permits are
suspended by the Director of the Department of Forestry and Fire Protection, the CAL FIRE Unit
Chief, or the AHJ.

Exception: Commercial cooking operations with approval of the AHJ.

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 4
20-0203 D Page 8 of 40




307.4.4.2 When campfires are allowed, it should be unlawful for any person 1o light, maimain, or use
a campfire upon any brush-covered land, grass-covered land, or forest-covered land unless the
Jollowing minimum requirements are conplied with,

307.4.4.2 (a) The area within 5 feet of the periphery of the campfire is cleared of all flammable
material and vegetation.

307.4.4.2 (b} One serviceable shovel with a handle of at feast 12 inches is ready for use at the
immediate area of the campfire.

307.4.4.2 (c) Campfires shall be limited to a 1 foot by 1 foot area, unless in an approved manufactured
cooking device or fire ring,

307.4.4.2 (d) Written permisston of the landowner must be obtained prior to the ignition of the
campfire and sholl be on site,

Chapter §

Section 503 Fire Apparatus Access Roads
503.2.1 Dimensgions shall be amended as follows: Fire ,apbaratus access roads shall have an
unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet, exclusive uf shoulders. as measured from fuce of curb to

face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and unobstructed

vertical clearance: of not less than 15 feet, All driveways in the district shall not be less than 12 feet
wide.

503.2.5 Dead Ends shall be amended as follows: Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways
in excess of 150 feet in length shall be provided with an approved area for tuming around fire
apparatus.

503.2.¢ Bridges and Elevated Suyfaces shall be smended as follows: Where a bridge or an clevated
surface is part o7 a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in
accordance with the current Ei Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge Standard or Appendix
D of the current California Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive. Bridges and elevated surfaces
shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load
limits shall be pasted at both entrances to hridges when recuired by the Fire Code Official. Where
elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces which are not designed
for such use, approved barriers, approved signs, or both shall be installed and maintained when
required by the fire code official.

503.4.2 No Parkiug in Fire Laocs shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, or leave
standing any vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary to avoid conflict with
other traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized
representative, Peace Officer or official iraffic comrol device along the edge of any highway, at any

Ordinance 2019.01 ' Page 5

20-0203 D Page 9 of 40



curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-sireet parking facility,
designated as a fire lane by the disirict with jurisdiction over the area in which the place is located.
The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately ad;acent to, and visible from, the
designated place cleariy stating in letters not less than one inch in height that the place is a fire lane,
(2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color, marking the place with the
words "FIRE LANE", which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) by a red curb or red paini on
the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words "FIRE LANE ",

- 503.4.3 No Parking in Froni of Hydranty shull be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, or

leave standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant excepr as follows. (a} If the vehicle is
attended by a licensed driver who is seated in the front seat and who can immediately move such
vehicle in case of necessity, (b} If the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire department and is clearly
marked as a fire department vehicle.

- 503.4.4 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width shall be added as follows: Fire lanes shall be based on
road width as required in Appendix D as umended by the districl.

- $03.5.3 Eire Apparatus Access Gates shall be added as follows: All awtomatic and manual gates
installed over ﬁre apparatus access roads shail comply with the district gate siandord as approved
by the fire code official,

- Section 505 Premisc Identification
- 505.]1 Address Identification shall have the first line of this paragraph amended as follows:

Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply with the disirict address standard as approved
by the fire code official.

- Section 507 Fire Protection Water Supplies
- 507.5.1 Where Required shall be amended as follows: 400 feet shall be amended to /50 feer.

- Section 509.3 Firc Control Room
~  50%.3 Fire Control Room Fire Protection and Utility Equipment ldentification and Access, is hereby

amended by adding the following to read: Fire sprinkler risers, fire alarm control panels, solar
photovoliaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression, or similar
control switches shal be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The fire control
room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in sixe with a total useable area of not
less than 35 square feet. The room shall be located within the building on an outside wall at a location
approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from the exterior. An exterior access door
with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and a height not less than 80 inches shall be provided

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 8

20-0203 D Page 10 of 40



Jor access into the raom. A durable sign shall be affixed to the exterior of the door with the words
“"FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters not less than 4 inches in height. A key box complying with
Section 506 shall be installed on the exterior side of the fire control room door opening. The room
must be capable or maintaining a mininuom temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit. A clearance of
12 inches shail be provided from the fire sprinkier risers to any adjacent walls. This room can be
shared with other building utilities or fire protection equipment that is compatible. An approved
cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the fire sprinkler system, other fire

protection equipment, and site plans. This room shall not be used for any other storage.

Chapter 9

Section 903 Fire Sprinklers
903.2 Where Required shall be amended as follows: An approved automatic sprinkler system shalf
be required and instalied in new buildings and structures 3600 square feet or greater when
constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction as described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12.
Exception: Agricultural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial purposes.
903.2.a Where Required shall be added as follows: Status of existing buildings greater than 3,600
square feet. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than one and two-family dwelling
units, and agricuitural buildings not under special use permit for commerciai purposes, where the
floor area of the building or structure is increased by an addition of more than thirty percent (30%)
or 1,000 square feet whichever is less, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section
903.2. |
903.2.b Where Required shall be added as follows: Status of existing buildings less than 3,600
square feet. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, where the
Jloor area of the building or structure is increased to a total square footage over 3,600 square feet,
by an addition of more than thirty percent (30%) or 1,000 square feet, whichever is less, such building
or structure shall be made to conform to Section 903.2.
903.2.1 Group A shall be amended as follows for A groups A-1 through A-4; 903.2.1.1 (1) The fire
area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
903.2.3 Group E shall be amended as follows: 903.2.3 (1) Throughout all Group E fire areas greater
than 3,600 square feet in area.
903.2.4 Group F-1 shall be amended as follows: 903.2.4 Group F. 903.2.4 (1) A Group F fire area
exceeds 3,600 square feel.
903.2.7 Group M shall be amended as follows: $03.2.7 Group B and M. 903.2.7 (1) A Group B and
M fire area exceeds 3,600 square fee:.

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 7

20-0203 D Page 11 of 40



- 903.2.8.2 Manufactured Homes shall be added as follows: An automatic fire sprinkler system shall
be reguired in all new monufactured homes and mnlyi-family manufactured homes intended for use
as a one-and twa-family dwelling. The design and insiallation of such systems shall be in accordunce
with California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300.

Exceptions:
1. Manufactured homes located within an existing mobilehome park complying with
California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2,3,

Muarufiuctured homes that do nor exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an

[

accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 638502, when the
existing primary residence on the property is not required to comply with California
Residential Code Section R313.2.
3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size.
- 903.2.9 Group S-1 shall be amended as follows: 903.2.9 Group S, 903.2.9 (1) A Group S fire area
exceeds 3,600 square feer.
- .10 Group $-2 Enclosed Parki arages shall be amended as follows:; 903.2.10 (1) Where
the fire area of the enclosed parking garage exceeds 3,600 square fee!.

- Section 907 Fire Alaym apg Detection Systems
907.2.a Where Required — New Builldings or Structures less than 3,600 square feet shall be added

as follows: An approved fire alarm/detection system shall be installed in all buildings with a floor
area less than 3,600 square feet.
Exceptions:
1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other vccupancies classified
as "/,
2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/cr not used for commercial
purposes (e.g., retails sales, food service, and/or special events).
3. Burldings with a floor area fess than SO0 square feet may be exempl, as determined
by the Fire Chief, or his‘her duly authorized represeniative, based on building

construction material and features, location, occupancy type, and distance to

exposures.
- 907.2.b Status of Exjsting Buildings shall be added as follows: /n exisiing buildings without an

approved automatic sprinkier system, other than one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultural
building not under special use permic for commercial purprases where 2 fire alarm detection systen
does not exist and the floor area of the building or structure is increased or modified by more than
thirty percent (30%) or 1,000 square feet, whichever is less, such building or structure shall be made

Ordinance 2019.01 Page &
20-0203 D Page 12 of 40



to conform to Section 907 when required by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative.
Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempi, as determined by the Fire Chief,
or histher duly authorized representative, based on building construction materials and features,
lacation, occupancy type, and distance to exposures.
907.2.c Monitoring shall be added as follows: All fire alarm/detection systems shall be connected
directly through and monitored by a U.L. approved central, proprietary or remote station service,
which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly atiended location. All sprinklered buildings
shall be monitored.
Exceptions:
1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified
as “U”).

2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial

‘ purposes fe.g., retails sales, food service, and/or special events).

907.2.d Type I Hood Installations shall be added as follows: The requirement of installation, or
replacement, of a Type { Hood System shall require a fire alarnvsprinkler monitoring system to be
instailed, or for the hood system to be connected to an existing fire alarm/sprinkler ntonitoring system
Jor that building.

,6.2.1 Secon wer Supply shall be added as follows: In accordance with NFPA 72, the
secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power capacity under quiescent load (system
operating in a non-alarm condition} shall be amended to a minimum 72-hour power capacity.

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed the
requirements of California Fire Code Chapler 12.

Chapter 12

Section 1203 Emergency and Standby Power Systems
1203.1.3 Installation shall be amended as follows: Emergency power systems and standby power

systems shall be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electric
Code, NFPA 110 and NFPA 111, A/l buildings, other than one- and two-family dwelling units, and
agricultural buildings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a shunt trip
device that disconnects all power sources to the building, approved by the fire code official. Existing

installations shall be maintained in accardance with the ariginal approval.

Chapter 33

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 9

20-0203 D Page 13 of 40



- Section 3310 Access for Fircefighting

- 3310.3 Premise ldentificatign shail be added as follows: Prior to and during construciion, an

approved address sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into

the project.

- Section 3312 Water Supply for Fire Protection
- 3312.1 When Required shall be amended as follows: Prior to combustible materials arviving on
site, the fire hydrant water system shall be installed and maintained in comtinuous operation. The

anmionnt of water supplied shall meet the required five flow for the project.

Chapter 49
- Section 4903 Plans
4903.1 Where Required shall be added as follows: The fire code official of the DSP may require

development projects located in Moderate, High and Very-High Fire Hazard Severity Zones to submit
Sire protection plan, This plan shall be upproved by both the fire code official and the authorized
representative for the local CAL FIRE Unit Chief fif located in the State Responsibility Area [SRA])
prior to the recording of the final map for the project by the County of El Dorado.

- Section 4905 Wildflire Protection Building Construction

- 4905.4 Roof Construction Requirements shall be added as follows: All new construction, including
additions, requires a Class A roof covering or assembly. All re-roofing requires Class A roof covering

or assembly as a minimum. Re-roofing in excess of 50% of an exisiting stracture within amy one year
period will necessitate that the entire roof be a Class A roof covering or assembly as a minimum.
Class B or C fire retardeant treated and or non-treated wood shake or shingles are not approved as

a roof covering marertal for Class A assembly.

Chapter 50
- Sectio (3
- 5001.7 Liability for Damages shall be added as follows: Any damages or cost resulting from the

careless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall constituent debt against any
such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge. This debt is collectible by the Fire
Chief, or histher duly authorired representative, in the same manner as in the case of an obligation
under contract, expressed or implied.

Chapter 56

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 10
20-0203 D Page 14 of 40



- Section 5601 General
§601.2 Permit Required shall be amended as follows: Permits shail be required as set forth in
Section 105.6 and reguiated in accordance with this section. Where explosives permits are required.
they shall be issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado
County Sheriff"s Deparinrent. Where fircworks perniits are required, they shall be issued by the Fire
Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County Board of Supervisors.

- 5601.2.1 Documentation shall be added as follows: The 4AHJ shall have the authority 10 request

documentation regarding all aspects of the fireworks presentation.

- 5601.2.2 Proprietary Information shall be added as follows: The AHJ will protect all proprietary
information.
Chapter 57

- Sectiop 5704 Storage
- 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Abgve-Ground Tanks are Prohibited shall be amended as follows:
Storage of Class I and Class II flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited

unless approved by the Fire Chief, or his’her duly authorized representative. When permitted by the
Fire Chief, or his’her duly authorized representative, ali above ground tank(s) or vault installations
Jor the storage of Class I, II or HI flammable and combustible liquids shall comply with those
requirements as set forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall also apply to

installations other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above-ground storage is required.

tion 57 i ¢ s
- 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited shall be amended as follows:
Storage of Class [ and Class Il flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is
prohibited unless approved by the Fire Chief. or his‘her duly authorized representative. When
permitted by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, all above ground tank(s) or
vault instatlations for the storage of Class 1, I1 or ilI flammable and combustible liquids shall comply
with those requirements as set forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall also
apply to installations other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above-ground storage

is required.

Chapter 58

- Section 5806 Flammable Cryogenic Fluids

- 5806.2 Limijtations shall be amended as follows: Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary
containers outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the Fire Chief, or his‘her duly

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 11
20-0203 D Page 15 of 40



authorized representative. When permitted by the Fire Chief, or his‘her duly authorized
representative, all stationary containers for the storage of flammmable cryogenic fluids shall comply
with those requirements as set forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall also
apply 1o installations other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above-ground storage

is required.

Chapter 61

- Section 6104 L.ocation of LP-Gas Containers

- 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits shall be amended as follows: The storage
of liquefied petrolewm gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon st;alez' capacity when located at
least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-haif
(1/2) mile from existing residential development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit per
acre and at least one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved, and a
special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado.

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law resiricting the dispersion of
liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested areas, the aggregate
capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The dispensing
of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacity when located

at least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least onc-
half (1/2) mile from existing residential development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit
per acre and at least one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved and

a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado.

- Secction 6112 High Elevation Ligquefied Petroleumn Gas Installations (5.000-foot elevations and
above) shall be added as follows:

- 6112.1 Regulators shall be added as follows:

- Two-stage regulator system shall be installed in accordance with manufacturer requirements.

- Tiwo-stage regulator systems shall be installed on all LPG installations.

- The first stage regulator shall be installed under the hinged gauge cover supplied with the tank. The
atmospheric pressure aperture of the regulator shall be pointed downward. The first stage regulator
shall be plumbed to the riser of the yard piping with saft copper tubing to allow flexibility should tank
shifting occur. The riser from the yard piping shall be located not more than 3 inches (horizontally)
JSrom the walls of the tank.

- The second stage regulator and riser pipe shall be installed under the eave of the building, as close

as practicable to the building wall. This riser shall be securely supported/braced to the wall

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 12
20-0203 D Page 16 of 40




approximately 10 inches below the regulator so as to prevent bending of the pipe by lateral snow/ice
loads.

- A protective cover, approved by the gas supplier and Building Official, shall be installed over the
second stage regidator and securely supported to the ground or diagonally 1o the wall.

-~ The riser pipes for the yard piping shall not be embedded in concrete. Concrete placed around such
riser shall be held back at least 1 inch from all sides of the pipe.

< At the time of application for any building perntit, which involves the installation of an LPG system,
the applicant shall subniit an LPG system plot plan in 3 copies {or digitally as PDF). The LPG plot
plan shall include, but not be limited to, the tank location, proposed tank capacity in U.S. gallons.
route of yard piping, location of the riser pipe at the building, property boundaries, and an outline of
all existing/proposed buildings on the lot and a depiction of the ridgeline of any building to be
supplied with LPG. This shall also be forwarded 10 the appropriate fire district to serve as a locator
map in event of an emergency.

- Location of the centerline of LPG tanks shall be permanently marked by the use of snow stakes, one
at each end. Such stakes shall be of sufficient height to be visible through anticipated maximum snow
depth at the respective location. Installation and maimenance of these snow stokes uare the
responsibility of the LPG user.

~  Propane appliances and accessories shall not be permitted in any new installation below the first
floor or below grade, whichever is more restrictive.

- 6112,2 Vertical Riser Piping shall be added as follows:

- Minintum of Schedule 80 - iron piping.

~  The riser shall be within 3 inches horizontaily of the 1ank.

- Swing joints shall be installed above and below tank level 10 provide for the tank movement (Streer
elbows shall not be used).

- A listed flexible riser constructed of copper or stainless-steel tubing and protected by sieel covered
sheathed material may be used instead of swing joints. The flexible alternative shall provide sufficient
slack to allow for tank movement.

- 6112.3 Markingg and Locationps shall be added as follows:

- An approved sign shall be located directly above the riser shut off valve on the building in a visible
location.

- The liquefied petroleum gas supplier shall affix a weatherproof identification tag to the inside of the
tank valve proteciing cover. This tag shall comtain the supplier's name and emergency telephone
number.

- Tank installatior shall be permanently marked by a metal or wood material snow marker, with a

minimum dimension of 2 inches by 2 inches. The snow marker shall be of sufficient height to rise

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 13
20-0203 D Page 17 of 40



above the annual snow depth and shall be a minimum of 10 feet in height, The snow markers shall

be painted yellow and located on oppasite ends of the (ank.

- Section 6113 Underground LPG Tanks Installations and Ownership shall be added as follows:
- 6113.1 Permits and Plans shall be added as follows: Permits shall be required, and plans shall be

submitted for all underground tank installations as approved by the AHJ.
~  6113.2 Underground LPG Tank Ownership shall be added as follows: Underground LPG tanks
shall be prohibited from being sold to end-users and shall be retained by the LPG company under a

lease-type systen to ensure proper annual maintenance requirements are met and recorded,

Chapter 80

- Section 80, NFPA, 13D-16 ~ Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One-and Two

Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes as amended 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5
-~ NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows:

- Add Section 4.7 to read as follows:
- Chapter 80. NFPA 13D 4.7 Residential fire sprinkler systems installed in all new one-and two-

Jamily dwellings shall utilize a “Passive Purge” system design unless otherwise approved by
the Fire Code Official.

- Exception: Manufactured home installed, tested and approved by the California Department of
Housing and Community Development.

- Revise Section 5.1.1.2 to vead as follows:
- Chapter 80. NFPA 13D. 5.1.1.2 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkier used

within the premises shall be maintained on the property at an approved location, Stock sprinklers shall
be kept in a mounted and accessible cabinet.
- Revise Section 7.6 to read as follows:

Chapter 80. NFPA 13D. 7.6 A local water flow alarm shall be provided on all fire sprinkier systems in

homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling,
- Revise Section 11.2.1.1 to read as follows:

- Chapter 80. NFPA 13D, 11.2.1.1 Where a fire department pumper connection is not provided, the
system shall be hydrostatically tested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square inch gauge for no

less than a 30-minute duration without evidence of leakage. Such test shall be wimessed by the fire code
official.
Appendix B — Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings

- Table B105.1(1) Requijred wo-Fami i Group R-3, and R4
Buildings and Townhouses shall be amended as follows for elevations beiow 3,000 feet:

QOrdinance 2019.01 Page 14
20-0203 D Page 18 of 40



FLOW

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM
CALCULATION SPRINKLER FIRE- DURATION
AREA SYSTEM FLOW (hours)
(square feet) (Design (railons per
Standard) minute) N
0- 3,600 No aAutomatic 1,000 ]
: ‘ sprinkler system
3,601 and greater No automatic Vealue in Durstion n
sprinkler system Table Table
B105.1(2) Bi105.i(2)
the  required
fire-flow rate ]
03,600 Section 903.3.13 00 *
of the CA Fire 1.000 !
Code or Section
3133 of the CA
Residential Code
3,601 and greater Section 903.3.13 {72 value of +
of the CA Fire ‘Table 2
Code or Section B105.1{2}
3133 of the CA fmin. 1000
Residential Code { GPMI
- 1s .2 Re w rt - 8
Dwellings. Group R-3, and R-4 Buildings and Townhouses shall be amended as follows:
AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER MINIMUM FLOW DURATION
SYSTEM FIRE-FLOW (hours)
(Design Standard) (gallouns per
minute)
No¢ automatic sprin<ler system Vilue in Table Durstion in Table
B105.1(2) B10S.1(D)
Section 9033.1.1 of the CA Fire 3% 30% of the value Durstion in  Teble
Code in Table B105.1(2)* B105.1(2) oi the reduced
B flow rete
Section 9033.1.2 of the CA Fire M 30% of the value Duration in  Table
Code (Only apples to locations in Table B105.1(2) B105.1{2) at the reduced
below 5,000-foot elevation) Row rate

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 gpm

Ordinance 2019.01

Page 15

20-0203 D Page 19 of 40



Appendix D — Fire Apparatus Access Roads

Section D103 Minimum Specifications
D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant shall be amended as follows, adding the exception:

Exception: Driveways
D103.2 Grade shall be amended as follows: Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not
exceed [5.9% in grade unless approved by the AHJ or by the El Dorado Counnty amended California
Public Resource Code Title 14 / Design and Improvement Standards Manual.

Exception: Elevation above 5,000 feet shall not exceed 12%.
D103.3 Turning Radius shall be amended as follows: The minimum turning radius shall be
determined by the fire code official; and shall not include curb and gutter.

D103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates shall be amended as follows: Swbsection (1): Where a

single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm). Where a fire
apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall not be less than 15 feet (1372
mmy).

D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane sigus as specified in
Section D103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide
(6096 to 8534.4 mm).

Exception: Elevations above 5,000 fi. as determined by the AHJ.

D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as

specified in Section D103.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29
feet wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm).

Exception: Elevations above 5,000 f1. as determined by the AHJ.
D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads shall be added as follows: When required
by the fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirety

of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access.

SECTION 4: CONFLICT

That Ordinance No. 2016-37 of the DSP, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances herewith are hereby

repealed.

SECTION §: SEVERABILITY

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or phrase of this code, or

any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such decision

shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code, which can be given effect without the invalid portions and,

therefore, such invalid portions are declared to be severable. The DSP hereby declares that it would have enacted

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 16

20-0203 D Page 20 of 40




this Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, sentences,

clauses or phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid.

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION
This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The DSP Board Secretary is directed to publish

this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the District. In lieu of publication of the full text of the
ordinance, a summary of the ordinance may be published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15) days
after its passage and a certified copy shall be posted in the office of the DSP pursuant to Government Code Section
36933(c) (1).

The above Ordinance was introduced at 8 meeting of the Board of Directors of the DSP on October 9, 2019, and
it was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the Ordinance to be read for the second time on
November 13, 2019 and approved by the following vote:

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District
this, 13* day of November, 2019.

AYES: l
NOES: O
ABSENT: |
ABSTAIN:DD

illiams, Board President

ATTEST:

Douidushus

Loti Tuthill, Board Secretary

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 17
20-0203 D Page 21 of 40



Fire Code #

Significant
change?

DSP, ECF, & GRV

What Is the Change?

Locally adopted / SFM adopted /
Amended

Why Is There a Local Change?

101.1 N Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Administrative need
LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than
Excaphon: Above S0 feethavig s e oo xpon At coalont o 500 s Do
105.6.27 Y quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving Locally adopted and amended N exp - Aleleva

occupancies in Group R-3.

an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire
activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional
attention.

406.6.1.

Locally reated and adopled.

Sechon 10561CostReeoveryFea Tomcoverﬂ'necosﬂo

the Firé District. ~

106.7

Add section

Locally created and adopted

Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable
failed inspections by contractors.

108.4

Added section 109.4

Locally adopted and amended

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District
is added to read as follows:

109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this
provision is to dlarify the procedures and timelines for an
individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire
Code Official. Based on the County of El Dorado's
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals
Jtimeline.

110.4

Completed the section by filling in the blank
portions that were not completed by the SFM. ftis
better left o localities to determine the
fees/penallies for their respective areas.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that
protects life and property. Fees have been updaled to
match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the
District Attoney’s Office. The change to the language to
include the term infractions.

1104.2

Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before
but under a different number)

Locally created and adopted

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2
Citations

The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s),
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor
violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the
Health and Safety Code of the State of Cafifomia and
Chapter 5c (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Califomia.

112.4

Compleled the section by filling in the blank
portions that were not completed by the SFM. Itis
better left to localiies to determine the
fess/penalties for their respective areas.

Locally adopted and amended

All violations of the code have been consolidated under
Section 110.4 to include the penalties for violations.

202

Added definitions for clarity

Locally created and adopted

Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District,
Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd
Manager. Definition of campfire shalt not include LPG or
Propane fueled appliances.

302.1

Added definition for Campfire to Section

Locally created and adopted

Added definition for clarity

307.4.4 through
307.4.4.2 (d)

Added a sections for campfire resliictions

Locally created and adopted

Due to the high fire danger that exists in Ef Dorado County
we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires
within grass, brush, and tree covered areas.

20-0203 D Page 22 of 40



Fwe apparatus are beoommg lamer and taner A vertucal
clearance of 15 feet provides proper ciéarance for .
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus
oomponents L also auws an extended ume frame before

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the
Fire Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations to

Fire apparatus require areas for tuming around when
muitiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This

503.25 ! Locally adopted and amended includes fire vehicles as well as divilian vehicles. Provides
match as they require turnarounds for fire apparatus better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum
access roads and driveways. . .
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150,
Allows codes and slandards for Bridges and Elevated
" , Surfaces of E} Dorado County and Appendix D of the
Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated : . ) ! o
503.2.6 Surfaces to state and match EI Dorado County Localty adopted and amended wrranl Fire Code whichevef is mare r&stncuve lobe
Transpotation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17 consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an
’ allemate means & methods that is not less restrictive than
the Fire Code.
" . L This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes”
503.4.2 Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes Locally created and adopted rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicle Code.
- ) . This section clearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire
503.4.3 :dm;mm regarding no parking in front of Locally reated and adopted  |hydrants” rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicle
Y ) Code.
: Added sectio " based This section clearly defines Califomia Fire Code Appendix D
503.4.4 width section regarding fire lanes _ on road Locally created and adopted as the reference for road lane width and their refation fo fire
| lanes.
Created and adopted 503,5.3 to maintain Alfows fire districts the authority to approve gates on
emergency access and consislency through afl roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing
5035.3 roadway gates in El Dorado County, refesring to the Locally created and adopled the best possible emergency access to maintain fast
gate standards adopted by the FPO's. response fimes.
Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of Allows Fire distiicts the authority to approve addressing
5051 buildings Locally adopted and amended based on the Dislrict's addressing standards.
o o sttt bxbe oo 10
507.5.1 placement of hydrant and their refationship to Locally adopted and amended |5 5 oo morvels, Bus they should ;
: ol basi feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in
commercial buildings DA
Buildings are getting more sizable in the county. It is more
common to have new buildings with solar amays that
continue to generate power even when the buildings
. . general utilities have been shut off. When there is an
500.3 Added verbiage Lo bring al of the necessary fire Locally creatod and adopled |emergency, it is vital that we have rapid access to all of the

contrals for a building to one tocation.

controls in one location for public evacuation and firefighter
safety. Due to the fire danger present in E} Dorado County
throughout mast of the year, this change is appropriate and
advisable.

Addsarequuremntﬁorspnnklet system mstaﬂatmn Lo v

Due fo lhe topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our-:

es, along with thefad!hatﬁres.-f.
every' mlnute W require or:
ctures once they reaeh 3,600 square
elate lo fire behavvor and rate :

20-0203 D Page 23 of 40




s0iza

Adds a requnrement for exnshng bulldings greater
than 3,600 square fest to install spnnklers ifthey
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the
gstructure wh»chever fsless: :

" Locally created and adopted

. {féetin snze as th relate_to fire beha\nor and mte of.

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditons
of Ef Dorado County and their contnbuung factors to our
increased fesponse fifmes, alorig with the fact tiat fires
double in size’ 'each and evafy mlnute we require spnnklers
o be installed in stiuctures orice they reach 3,600 squara

" Locally created ard adopted

rapmc eonditmns

= %03, 24,90327

© 903.21,903.23,

Thesesecuonswereu'eaedtog 6 Spedi c .
diréction on the sprinkler requlrements based on
occupancy and s squam footage S

Locally adopted éind amended

' mweasad response 95, along with the fact that fires

1d their contibuting factors ta our

double in size sach and every minuts, we require sprinkiers
o be |nstalled in structisres once they reach 3,600 square
foet in size as lhey relate to fire behavior and rate of

spread

This section was created to include manufactured

Manufactured Homes ~ The intent of this code section is to
ensure that manufactured homes that sefve as a one or two-
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption

Lipon & 'honandusmstalledperSecﬁmgmof

803.28.2 ::sr;::]net;a;fs:gnrgal:‘ family R-3 in the residential Locafly created and adopted due lo the light-weight nature of their construction. The
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a
significant risk lo their occupants. Residential sprinkler
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk

{successfully in many Catifomia communities.
Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
These sections were created to give specific increased response times, along with the fact that fires
903.2.9, 903.2.10 direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
. feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.
Addedocwpantprotechonforﬁmalarmsm e v
- wi"gm:nzm:t:dl::g;%;?: except _ Providss proper emergency notification for occupancies that
907.2.2 Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensurés Fire Department notification in
L purposes, andhnldmgswumaﬂoorareaoflas meeventofaﬁreorsmdce )
' Jthan 500 squara feet as approved by the ﬁre code 3
ofﬁdal '
907.2b sprinkder syst " Locally created end adopled ~  [allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
alarmllmeyaddmoremmao%oMOOOsquare |the event of a fire or smoke
feet to the structure, whichever is less. ‘ -
Added occupant protection by stating all fire alarm
detection systems installed shall be connected toa |. Prwdes proper emergency notification for occupancies that
momtoung seivice that notifies the fire department |- aliow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in

Locally created and adopted

ﬂteeventofaﬁreorsmoke

system when mstalled o replaoed

I necled to a moriltored 'ﬁre alarm

* Locally cealed and adbpted

e

eventofaﬁreorsmoka .

20-0203 D Page 24 of 40



Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply

Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E

907.6.2.1 Modifeation Locally created and adopted | _tet. etated power outages.
PERERTY R NI S ,TNssecbonaddsaShuntTﬂppwershuloﬁdewcesto
120813 . |Shunt tsip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended . |en: ureemergencypowershutoﬂ diring the use of badwp

4903.1

This section was created to include Fire Protection
Plan for all fire hazard severity zones.

Locally created and adopted

El Dorado County has a ﬂgmﬁmnl ﬁre danger throughout
the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire
Protection Pian due to climatic, geclogical, and
fopographical conditions.

4905.4

Added a section to clarify roof construction
requirements

Locally created and adopted

This section clarifies that within the boundaries of El Dorado
County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are
wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly.

5001.7

Any damages or costs from negligent practices that
cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a
cost recovery fee.

Locally created and adopted

Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate.
If the incident is caused by negligence due fo a business
process or practice the actual cost wilt be passed on to the
negligent parties.

5601.2

Added safety protection with permits being issued
by both the Fire Chief and Sheniffs Department for
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of
Supervisors for fireworks.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and
fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding
of the applications they will be used for.

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2

Fireworks companies or vendors shall meke
available all requested documentation pertaining to
the firework presentation

Locally created and adopted

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any
documentation including timing and proprietary information
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display thal they
deem necessary. This information is understood to be
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as
such.

5704.2.96.1

Established imits as set forth in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class 1l combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a
Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County.

5706.2.4.4

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Established fimits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class Il combustible fiquid special
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval
and a SpeaallCondmonal Use Permut from the County

Administrative addition of Distict name, .
Estabished imits as set forth in the Fire Code

Lbcaly adopted and amended

Administrative neéd to add District name. Established fimits
s required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable. - -
Cryogemc fluids in stahonary oonlainers Requures AHY
approval and a SpeuaVCondluonal Use Permlt from the
County “ R Ve

5806.2.1

Established fimits as set fothinthe Fire Code

SFM adopted and amended locally

Establlshed fifnits’ as
Flammabie Cryogemc fluids in statronary containers, " -
Requires AHJ approval and a SpeuallConoﬁﬁonal Use
Permit from the County

61042

v Locaﬂyadopted afx_i' aménded _

Estabnshes dlstanoes belween LPG storage and
d:spensanes that are difectly refated to safety for resdennal
developments ar ’hnghdens!ty_ hqt § mgtel apar(memz

20-0203 D Page 25 of 40



. Establlshes propane regulator requarement for locabons

Locally crealed and adopted:

) bove 5000 foot elevation. tncluding requurements for two-
] stage regulator use and lowuon ol ﬁrst and seoond stage

- |Establishes propane vertical riser pipe req lrements

_ sigrificant fire history in Tieavy snow and extreme wea&her
condrhons encountemd above 5000 leet o )

Establ shaﬂopane markmg and lomnon e
requurements above 5000 foot elevahon S

Locally created and adopied

Estabhshes maﬂung and kx:anon requlrements for locabons

- |above 5000 foo( elevatlon This Section addr&eses signage

location, emergericy contact information, and sriow refated
tank marking requ:raments These requirements are based
on significant firg history in heavy snow and extreme
weather cohd‘stibns"éhbdﬁméred above 5000 feet.

Permits and plans shall be submitted and approved |

Locally created and adopted

Petmnttmg and Plan submzttal reqwrements for underground
tanks: . Lo
Allows Us to requlre p(ans be submltted for remew prior to

et shall be submitied and a
) 8 by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction). installations of undergroiind LPG {anks. Underground tanks
. ot T require substantial maintenance indliding inspection and
anode replacement at regular intervals.
K S Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without
§113.2 Requires underground LPG tanks o remain the Locally created and adopted detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when

property of the LPG company

sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
130-16

NFPA 13D-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the
District has been amended to update various
provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler
systems in one-and two-family dwellings

SFM Adopted and amended locally

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on-
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow
alarm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in the
event of water activation in a vacant structure, and
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 13D
sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water
damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements
were also added to ensure water circulation through the
system, reducing stagnant water and backflow concems
(EID encourages this type of system).

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section 4.7

Correction of a system quality issue

SFM Adopted and amended locally

Amends the current code set to include the addition of a
passive purge system lo keep the water in the sprinkler
piping System from being stagnant.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section
5112

To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler
system minimizing damage

SFM adopted and amended locatly

A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system
{must be avaitable on-site in an accessible mounted cabinel

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section 7.6

Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation

SFM adopted and amended locally

An audible alarm system is added to notify occupants and
in the activation of the system when the building is not
occupied allow for detection minimizing damage.

Chapter 80, NFPA,

A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and

13D1-16251e;:non System test to a pressure of 150 p.s.i. SFM adopled and amended locally failures and assures proper gluing of system components.
 Agp e 8 Tabi: | Changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot Yoo oo |Aiows usto match what developers and residents are used
B105; 1i1)'3 o elevation, to maich ﬁre ﬂcw precedenls used m Lomlly adopted and amended o in regards to GPM fire flow requtrer_nents that have been

EDC for years. -

Used for over 2 decade in EDC.

20-0203 D Page 26 6740




Appendix B: Table
. B1052.

Established a minimur requirement of 1,500 GPM, |
belm5000footelevabon foraucommerual i

-+ Locally adopted and amended.

-|toin regards to GPM fire flow requ:rements that have been

Aliows us to match what developers and residents are used

usedforuveradeesdemEDC

Agpendix D: D103.1

prqeds

" Locally adopled snd amended

Itis unreasonable to requure a rwdennal dnveway to
constrict a 26 foot wide space forawess to a hydranl .

Appendix D: 0103.3

Text to include curbs and gutters

Locally adopted and amended

20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and guiters due
1o potential access issues and turning radius concems.

Fnreapparatusacoass oss 10ad gates - S

‘appératus acoess roads consist of a divided
ay the gate vndth shall no! be Iess than 15 feet due to

radiils issu

No parking on roads allowed on roadways fess than 28 Feet
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does

feel in width

. D103.6. i ) . : )
Appendix D: D103.6.1 Roads widts 20 to 29 feet Localy adopted and amended not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all other elevations.
Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet
" aflowed. This is not required less than 5000 feel of
Appendix D: D103.6.2 Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36 Locally adopted and amended elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The

section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations.

Appendix D: D104.2
Exception

Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered
building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to

have only one approved fire apparatus access road.

Locally adopted and amended

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
residents and first responders.

Appendix D: D104.4

Added to require circumferential fire apparatus
access roads

Locally created and adopted

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire
structure and shall provide a continuous means of
emergency vehicle access.

Appendix D: D106.1

Locally adopted and amended

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of

Excent Removed Exception in its entirety. ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
ception .
residents and first responders.
Appendix D: D107.1 For the safety of the communities we five in, two ways of
E " ' Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingressiegress are required to ensure the safety of the
xception !
Jrasndents and first responders.
Adopted with no Amendments
101.2 through 101.5 mn‘;d 1o estabish scope,inten, soverabilyand | Locally adopted Admiistrative cariy -
’1;)226 through 102.8 Refefences Subjeds not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative larity Vo
102.10 through 102.12 Conflicting p“’"‘"°_"s Other Laws, Ap”"“”m of Locally Adopted Administratve cladty - -
DA references... - L S Lol
R Definition of the Fire Prevenbon Dms»onandabifty R L _ e
103 1. lhrough 104.1 ko enforce the code IS Lomlly Adoptefl | @mws@ve_ dgpty:' N
104.3 through 104.4 Right of Entry, Warrants, and Idenliﬂc'ation Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.6 through 104.6.4 Record reention - B Locally Adopted Adminisirative darty
1048mtough 10492 B Mﬁwﬁﬁs dte@atemﬁnsandmemods.and : . _Lb'mlly ” I '. |
10411through : T :
10112 ,L°°°"”"°"°°"_

" ocall Adopled | Administrtve

ocallj Adopied A

20-0203 D Page 27 of 40



OB

105612 .

Dry cleaning operational penmils required for .
hazardous deanmg solventuse . - -

Locally Adopted

wn;s'a’.aﬁvaaaﬁ&:a -

105 6.2. 28 through

and torchies open flames and ‘candies, and: . :

Adopted this sedzon for admlmsuahve elamy nd

- Localy Adopled. .-

ﬁre and que safe!y mspecbons o

thcugh 1063

fire' and iife safely inspections

 Adopted this section for admmnstrabve elanty and
ﬁraandhfesafetymspechons :

lnspechon authonly

108.1 ihrodgh 109.3

ﬁre and lsfe safety mspednons

Lol Adopled

Mamtenance of safeguards, teshng and operamn of
equlpment, re-inspection and teshng. motdkeepmg.
supervision, rendering équipment inoperable, overcrowding,
Board of Appeals establlshed llmllabons on authonty and
quanﬁcahons :

Adopted this section- for admlmstrahve danty and
fife and life safety inspeciions. Lo

Locally Adopied.

Complnance with ordels and nohm, pmsewhon of
violations, anid unauthorized {ampering = e

Adopted this section for admnmslratwe danty and
fire and life safety inspections -

Locally Adopted -

Abatement of violation

fire and life safely inspections

Adopted this section for administrative danly and )

Locally Adopted.

Authonty to disconnect service ubmm

303.1 thiough 303.3

Adopted this section for fire and life safely

Locally Adopted

Asphalt kettles contain highly ﬂammable substances and
require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and
topographml)

305.1 through 305.5

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Managmg ignition sources through responsible application
of standards will reduce the number of fires in various
selhngs (Cllmabc gedogml and topographneel)

306.1 through 306.2

Adopted tis secton fr fre and life safety.

e lMohonpwmreprqechonmmsandﬁlmamHlGHLY
Locally Adopted

flammable and require special handhng (Clnmahc,

3071 through 3075

Popid s setion for ro sy

Locally Addgpted

P geologml and topographlml)

Open bummg, recreahonal ﬁre and poﬁab(e outdoor
(Chmaﬁc, geoioglcal

081

Adopted this section forfre and e safety -

Locally Adopled .. | topographlcal)

Open ﬂame general requurements (Chmahc geologreal and

308.1.2 through

[Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted:

Throwmg or placing of ignition sources, torches for
removmg pamt (Clnmabc geologlcal and topographacal)

20-0203 D Page 28 of 40 _



308.3 thirough 308.4.1 |

Adopted lhrssectron for fire and lrfe safety.

Locally Adopted _

Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices, _
theatncal performances, Group R occupancies, Gmup R2
dormr(ones (Clrmauc geologml and lopographrcal)

310,

. |Adoptea tis section for fire and ife safety . _

| Localy Adopted .. |geological, and topographical

General requrrements relatrng to smoklng (Chmahc.

'No Smokmg srgns (Clrmahc,geol _cal d-

o and e sfey

" Locally Adopted " |p & protection,
UV T T lof combustibles, removal of hazardous matenals (Chmanc

geolog!cal and topographrcal)

3191 Co

B Adopted dns secuon for ﬁre and Irfe safety

" Locally Adopted.

General mqurremen\s relahng to mobrle food preparabon
vehldes (Cnmatrc geologrcal and topographical)

3192

Adopled thns section for admmlstrahve danty and

" Locally Adopted

Permrls for mobnle food preparatron vehides (Climatrc,
geological, and topographml)

319.3 through
Me.03

ﬁre and life’ safety mspeohons

Adopted this section for fire and ife safety

Locally Adopted

Exhaust hood ﬁre pmteobon, ﬁre proteooon for oookrng
equipment, fire extinguisher, applranoe oonnectron to fuel
supply piping, oookmg oil storage oontarners, metalhc )
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, oookmg off
storage system oomponents design criteria, tank vanung,
nommal vents, emergency vents, LP-gas systems maximum
aggregale volume, protection of container, LP-gas container
construction, protection of systen piping, LP-gas alarms,
CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel,
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG
container construction, CNG containers supplying
transpiration and cooking fuef, protection of system piping,
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems.
(Climatic, geological, and topographica)

403.8.1 through
403817

Adopled this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1
(residential care facifities and group hornes) evaouahon and
fire safety plans.

403.10 through
403.10.1.3

Adopted this secﬁon for fire andlife safety_‘- o

" Locally Adopted

Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel motel) occupancy
Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duh&s (Cllmahc
geological, and topographical). .

4055

Adopted thls secnon for ﬁre and Irfe safety

Locally Adopted

Emergency Pianning and record keepmg (Clrmabc
geological, and topographical) .- L

5103

Adopted thrs sectlon for admmrstrauve clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)

6807.5.2 through
807523 -

Adopted this section for administrative darity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

Wall coverings in group E occupandies (Schools) sets a
maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in -
educational faciities (Climahc. eologrcal and )

topographical)

903.2.15

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers)
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000
lsquare feet. (Climatic, geological, and topographicat)

20-0203 D Page 29 of 40



lﬁreﬁghters. and other emergency responders.

Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings.
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time
i ian i ayist i frames can be developed to come into compliance and the
Adopted this section in existing buildings for the o ) ) .
phasing in of a system over a period of lime, detemnined by
102 Y ::etynzl;:isreﬁghters an other emergency Locally Adopted the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind
P ) this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury
of fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Appondix D;D101.1 | " . |Adopled tis secton for e satejoltopobic, | Localy Adopled . |G80era euiements fo fro dpparas scess roads
through D102 1 T ﬁreﬁghters, and otfier ¢ emergency responders : o » R mdudmg loads. (Chmahc geologml and topographwal)
S o SN ARSI R Deadendﬁreapparamsaccessmadrequnremmfora
e o 1 1 g Adoptedmlssedlonlorthesafetyofmepubhc, R
Appe__ndx D: D103.4 N- Locally Adopted. tum around at 150 feet (C!xmahc gedoglcal and
e o ﬁmﬁghtefs. and other emergencyrespmdem o topographical)
""" - Adopted od this Section for t_he"sa'fél’y' of the public '. o5 e Parking, Fire Lane® signs requnremenls (Clunahc.
Appe"d'w oi03s N ﬁre_ﬁghtérs, ahd‘dm'er‘em«gen'cy' resp_or'_vd‘e'm Locall M°”t°" ' geologlml and lopographiml)
mu[()?of ;04 ! N Ad°P‘°d tis section fortha safety of the PUUIC. dea;iy Adopled. Commercial and industrial deve{opmenl ﬁre apparatus
(e,dudmg emep.m) : lﬁreﬁghters. and other emefgency mponde's A access roads. (Cllmauc, geologlcal and lopographlcal)
Appen :ﬁ,x'D:_, 6105.1 N ‘Adopled this Section for:the safét‘y of the pﬁblic, Local Adopted - Reqmrements for aenal fire apparatus aceess roads
mréugh‘°1°§-_4 * lfirefighters, and other ermergency responders. y Adopied. (Chmaﬁc. geological, and topographml)
m: B?OGD; %1 - N Mopted this secton for the safety of e bybﬁq Locally Adopted: Fire apparatus access raads for ‘multiple-family residential
(exdud‘ng ‘exceptions) : firefighters, and other emergency responders. y developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Appendix D: D107.1 . One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be
(e’:(duding exceptions) N Adopled this section for the safely of the public, Locally Adopted aquipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire
through D107.2 {firefighters, and other emergency responders. y apparatus access foads due to topographic, geographic and
) dlimatic conditions.
Appendix D; D108 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopted Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction

standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle.

White celis are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions.

20-0203 D Page 30 of 40



Mountain@Bemocrat

PROOF OF PUBLICATION
(20155 C.CP)

STATE OF CALIFORNIA
County of El Dorado

I am a citizen of the United States and a resident
of the County aforesaid; I’m over the age of
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in
the above-entitied matter. I am principal clerk of
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation,
printed and published Monday, Wednesday,

and Friday, in the City of Placerville,

County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has
been adjudged a newspaper of general circula-
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El
Dorado, State of California, under the date of
March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258; that the
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy
(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been
published in each regular and entire issue of said
newspaper and not in any suppiement thereof on
the following dates, to-with:

10/2, 10/4

ALL IN THE YEAR 2019
I certify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that
the foregoing is true and correct.

Dated at Placerville, California, this 4™ day
of OCTOBER, 2019

Mo Racna-

Signature

Proof of Publication of
NOTICE OF INTENT

Notice is hereby given 10 the intention of the
Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection
Oistrict 1o adopt the 2010' Calfornia Fire
Code with-smendmants. The District shall
hold ts fimt public hearing &t 6:00 PM. on

 October 9, 2019 at %01 Pleasant

Road, Diamond Speings, CA, regarding
the adoption of the 2019 Califomia Fire
Code pursuamt to Hesith and Safety
Code Section 13869, Copies of ths code

20-0203 D Page 31 of 40



Mountain@)Bemocrat

PROOF OF PUBLICATION
(20155C.C.P)
Proof of Publication of
NOTICE OF INTENT
STATE OF CALIFORNIA
County of El Dorado

I am a citizen of the United States and a resident
of the County aforesaid; I’'m over the age of
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in
the above-entitled matter. I am principal clerk of
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation,
printed and published Monday, Wednesday,

and Friday, in the City of Placerville,

County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has
been adjudged a newspaper of general circula-
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El
Dorado, State of California, under the date of
March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258; that the
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy
(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been
published in each regular and entire issue of said
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on
the following dates, to-with:

10/28, 11/4

ALL IN THE YEAR 2019
I certify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that
the foregoing is true and correct.

Dated at Placerville, California, this 4" day
e of NOVEMBER,2019 .. __ . ____ _ ..

Mo Raoma-

Signature

20-0203 D Page 32 of 40




Attachment No. 2
Diamond Springs El Dorado Fire Protection

District Resolution No. 2019-10

20-0203 D Page 33 of 40



RESOLUTION No. 2019-10 @

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE DIAMOND SPRINGS-EL
DORADO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO THE
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

A resolution for the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District setting forth findings with
respect to local conditions within the Fire District which make certain modifications and changes to the
California Fire Code reasonably necessary for preserving fire and life safety in the Diamond Springs-El
Dorado Fire Protection District.

The Governing Board of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District finds and resolves as
follows:

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permits a Fire Protection District to adopt an
ordinance which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations adopted pursuant to Health & Safety
Code Section 17922 upon determination that such changes or modifications are necessary due to local
conditions that pertain regulations governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the environment
from fire, explosion, hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that a District’s Board of Directors
making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 shall make
express finding that such changes or modifications are needed; and shall file a copy of such changes or
modifications with the Department of Housing and Community Development.

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions existing within
the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the District to impose more stringent
requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code and pursuant to California Health and Safety Code
sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the District desires to make express findings to that effect.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the Diamond Springs-
El Dorado Fire Protection District, after having duly noticed and held public hearings, hereby adopts the
following findings concerning current unique local conditions that together make each modification to
the California Fire Code, reasonably necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life,
property and the environment more specifically set forth as follows:

20-0203 D Page 34 of 40




FINDINGS OF FACT
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BUILDING STANDARDS
CODE (TITLE 24PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL CONDITIONS

General.

After due consideration, the Board of Directors of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection
District, hereby finds that due to local climatic, geologic and topographic conditions, as stated within
this document, there is a need to provide the modifications and changes contained in the adoptive
Ordinance of the California Fire Code. Such changes are deemed to be reasonably necessary to provide
adequate and effective protection of life, property, and the environment.

The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District provides fire protection, emergency medical
services, and specialized rescue services to approximately thirty-five thousand people in a 93 square
mile area. The District is located on the western slope of El Dorado County. The topography of the
District ranges from rolling hills of grass and oak woodland in the west and oak-timber in the steep
drainages of the east portion. The weather conditions vary from freezing temperatures with occasional
snow in winter, to summer temperatures that regularly exceed 100 degrees.

The District can be divided into three distinct areas: The core area encompasses Diamond Springs, El
Dorado, and the Missouri Flat Road corridor. The core area is more urban and contains most of the
District’s existing commercial development and potential for major commercial development. The
north and south areas typically contain small subdivisions and isolated residential developments. These
areas are characteristic of the suburban or ranch environment. The north and south areas become very
isolated and more rural as one moves further away from the core of the District.

The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District is an “all-risk” agency. The District
participates in a sophisticated automatic aid program and is dispatched through agreement by the
California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal-Fire), at Camino. The resources of the
District will respond to, and deal with, any type of emergency. The term “Fire Protection” in this
document is broad and includes responses to fires, smoke and odor investigations, alarms, public assist
calls, hazardous materials incidents, medical aid, and specialized rescues.

The District has established one, full-time, staffed fire station and four satellite fire stations to provide
emergency services to the community. Fire Station 49 is located in the unincorporated town of
Diamond Springs, at 501 Pleasant Valley Rd. Fire Station 46 is located in the unincorporated town of El
Dorado, at 6170 Pleasant Valley Road. Fire Station 48 is located at 3840 Missouri Flat Road,
Placerville, just north of Highway 50. Fire Station 44 is located in the Logtown area at 6109 Quartz
Drive, El Dorado. Fire Station 47 is located in the Sleepy Hollow Subdivision, at 2312 Oakvale Drive,
Shingle Springs. The District has 18 full-time, career personnel, along with two management positions,
two administrative support positions, and two Fire Prevention Officers.

Climatic.

The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District is located within a foothill region. The District
is subject to four seasons, with an annual average snowfall in the winter months of 2 inches, in addition
to an average rainfall of 45 inches per year. These adverse weather conditions create severe hazardous

-2- 20-0203 D Page 35 of 40



road conditions and flooding as well as rock slide hazards along the main access roads within, as well as
into, the District from the surrounding areas. Due to periods of rainfall, along with repeated road
closures, the ability of the Fire Protection District to provide immediate emergency response is often
delayed. These same adverse climatic conditions often result in a large number of vehicular accidents
that place extreme restraints on the availability of emergency response to perform emergency rescue,
first aid, hazardous materials control, and fire- fighting. The climatic conditions often result in a
substantial or total lack of ability of the Fire Protection District to respond immediately to other types of
emergency situations that occur. Examples of these emergency situations include structure fires,
wildland and forest fires, flooding, hazardous materials incidents, emergency medical calls, vehicle
accidents, and vertical rescues. The mutual aid agreements established with adjoining fire agencies
might not be possible due to adverse climatic conditions, restricting or totally blocking access into the
District. '

Summary:

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the Fire District.
Times of little or no rainfall, low humidity, and high temperatures create extremely hazardous
conditions, particularly as they relate to the wildland-urban interface. Winds experienced in this area can
have a significant impact upon structure fires, especially in buildings in close proximity to one another,
and to wildlands commonly found in the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District.
Structures built within the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District must be built with these
variables in mind.

Geological. The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District is located within moderate
activity seismic Zone Three. The seismic, geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires,
major breakage of water mains, multiple electrical power failures, multiple collapsed structures and a
large number of calls for emergency medical aid, all of which may occur simultaneously during a
seismic event. The water district has numerous water-pumping systems used for fire suppression water
delivery, as well as water storage tanks providing water system pressure. Most of the pumping systems
are dependent on electrical power for operation. Such electrical power may not be available during a
seismic event. Water storage tanks used for the storage of required fire suppression water may also
collapse in such an event forcing the additional need to transport water via additional pieces of fire
apparatus which will place a significant restraint on the ability of the District to provide the required
emergency services.

Summary:

Local geographic and geological features and processes exist within the boundaries of the district that
may hamper the ability of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District to perform its swom
duties. Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life and damage than the
carthquake itself. )

Topographical. The District is primarily composed of areas that are considered by the State to be high
fire hazard severity zones. Much of the District is located within foothill terrain, covered with highly
combustible vegetation, including the presence of many coniferous forested areas. The elevation within
the District ranges from at 1,000 feet to over 1,800 feet at the highest point. Slope within the District

"3- 20-0203 D Page 36 of 40



"

.

ranges from 0 degrees to 90 degrees. The structures within the areas of foothills terrain have very Limited '»j'
fire access, due to narrow roadways with steep grades and poor road surface conditions. The presence of
many existing structures within the high fire hazard severity zone areas provides for a very high
potential of a structure fire spreading into a wildland or forest fire condition as well as the potential for a
wildland or forest fire spreading to structures.

Summary:

The alignment of canyons, valleys, and slopes into inhabited areas, combined with the variable nature of
the terrain, yield potential for increased fire risk. Most structures, both residential and commercial, are in
or are surrounded by areas that contain significant grass, brush, mixed oak woodland, and mixed conifer
fuel load. Due to drought conditions, beetle infestations, and lack of vegetation management, much of
the area is populated with either dead or dying trees, contributing to extreme fire danger.

Conclusion:

Local climatic, geographic, and topographic conditions described above increase the frequency,
intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, these conditions impact
potential damage to structures from an earthquake and subsequent fire. Therefore, it is reasonably
necessary that the California Fire Code be modified to mitigate the effects of the above conditions.
California Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that modifications to the Fire Code be
expressly marked and identified as to which each finding refers to which Code modification. The
attached Appendix A provides this connection.

INTRODUCED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the Diamond Springs/El
Dorado Fire Protection District on October 9th, 2019.

PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the Diamond
Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District on October 9th, 2019 by the following roll call vote:

AYEs: 111
NOES: O
ABSENT: 1|

ABSTAIN: O

ATTEST:

Chou Jutkuik

Lori Tuthill, Board Secretary Patrick Williams, President

-4- 20-0203 D Page 37 of 40




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted | Adopted as Amended Finding
1011 X Admin
105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
106.6 X Admin '
106.6.1 X Admin
106.7 X Admin
109.4 X Admin
1104 X Admin
110.4.2 X Admin
112.4 X Admin
202 X Admin
302.1 X Admin
307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
509.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
33103 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
33121 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5001.7 X Admin
5601.2 X Admin
5601.2.1 X Admin
5601.2.2 X Admin
5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 D Page 38 of 40




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted | Adopted as Amended Finding
6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6113.1 X Admin
6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 4.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix B: Table B105.1(1) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix B: Table B105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.5§ 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
101.2 through 101.5 X Admin
102.6 through 102.8 X Admin
102.10 through 102.12 X Admin
103.1 through 104.1 X Admin
104.3 through 104.4 X Admin
104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin
104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin
104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin
104.11.3 X Admin
105.2.3 X Admin
105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin
105.6.12 X Admin
105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin
105.6.37 X Admin
105.6.39 X Admin
105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin
105.6.48 X Admin
105.6.50 X Admin
106.1 through 106.3 X Admin
107.1 X Admin
108.1 through 109.3 X Admin
110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin
1104.1 X Admin
113.1 X Admin

20-0203 D Page 39 of 40




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section

Adopted

Adopted as Amended

Finding

303.1 through 303.9

X

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

305.1 through 305.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

306.1 through 306.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

307.1 through 307.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
308.1.2 through 308.1.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
308.2 Admin
308.3 through 308.4.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
3101 Climatic/Geological/Topographical’
3103 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.4 through 310.8 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
311.1 through 3114 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
319.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
319.2 Admin

319.3 through 319.10.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.10 through 403.10.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

405.5 Admin
5103 Admin
807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1.5 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1103.2 Topographical
Appendix 05:3)12011'1 through Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.4

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.6

XX X O XPXIXXIX XXX |IXIX XXX [X XX [X{X]|X]X]X

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.1 through

X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D104.3 (excluding exception) gical/Topograp
dix D: Ath h . . .
Appendix D: D105.1 throug X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D105.4
Appendix D: D106.1 through L . ;
X Climatic/Geol |/Topographical
D106.3 (excluding exception) imatic/Geological/Topographica
dix D: 7.1 ludi
Appendix qu (excluding X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
exceptions)
Appendix D: D108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 D Page 40 of 40




