
RESOLUTION NO. 036-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 013-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is 
updated by the State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are 
reasonably necessaty because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, 
Chapter 1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulations 
to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or 
her authorized representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; 
and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the 
chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain 
a memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the 
inspection of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on November 13th. 2019, the Board of directors of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire 
Protection District adopted Ordinance No. 2019.01, which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code 
with amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or 
topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado 
ratifies Ordinance No. 2019.01 of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire. Protection District and delegates 
the enforcement of the ordinance to the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Chief, or his 
or her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following 
sections: 

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202,302.1, 307.4.4 through 
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503 .4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1. 
507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b ), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 
903.2.9, 903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 
4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 through 
6112.3, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 130-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 
Section 4.7, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6, 
Chapter 80 NFPA 130-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table BIOS.I (1), Appendix B: Table 
Bl05.2, Appendix Dl03.l through DI03.3, Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix Dl03.6.l, 
Appendix DI03.6.2, Appendix DI04.4. 20-0203 D Page 1 of 40 



Resolution No. 036-2020 Page 
2 of2 

The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, 
Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the 
International Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403 .1, 403 .2 .1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403 .4, 
403.6, 403 .7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8 .1.7), 403 .9, 403 .10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403 .12, 
404. l- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2 .3), 808, 
904. l.1, 1101 , 1103.1, 1103 .3-1103.6, 1103.9 (adopting 1103 .9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, 
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D l 04.2 (Exception), DI 06.1 (Exception), 
Dl07. l (Exceptions l and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, 
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting 
of said Board, held the _JQ__ day of March , 2020, by the following vote of said Board: 

Attest: 
Ayes: Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin, Novasel 
Noes: None 
Absent: None 

20-0203 D Page 2 of 40 



111 .. 

' 
Diamond Springs - El Dorado Fire Protection District 
50 I Pleasant Valley Road Diamond Springs, CA 95619 - (530) 626-3190 Fax (530) 626-3188 

www.diamondfire.org 

December 19, 2019 

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer 
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors 
330 Fair Lane 
Placerville, CA 95667 

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado 
Fire Protection District, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code with 
amendments related to loca) climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. 

Dear Mr. Ashton: 

The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District (DSEDFPD) is requesting the Board of 
Supervisors (BOS) ratify its Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code 
as amended due to specific local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. California 
Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of the city or county where 
the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance. The BOS must also 
delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District (or its representative) or the Chief 
Building Official. 

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2019-01 with 
amendments to the 2019 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to 
the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is 
enclosed for your review and use on this topic. 

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County. 

Sincerely, 

~·ri_sUYRansdell 
Fire Chief 

ATTACHMENTS: 

I. Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Ordinance No. 2019-01 
2. Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Finding of Fact Resolution No. 2019-10 
3. Draft El Dorado County BOS Resolution 

20-0203 D Page 3 of 40 



. 
' 

Attachment No. 1 

Diamond Springs El Dorado Fire Protection 

District Ordinance No. 2019-01 

20-0203 D Page 4 of 40 



DIAMOND SPRINGS-El DORADO FlRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

ORDINANCE NO. 2019.01 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE DIAivIOND 

SPRINGS-EL DORADO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS: 

An ordinance of the Diamond Springs El-Dorado Fire Protection District (DSP) adopting the 2019 Edition 

of the California Fire Code, incorporating the 2018 Edition of the lnter11atio11al Fire Code, regulating and governing 

the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of 

hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of 

buildings and premises in the DSP; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing 

Ordinance No. 2016-37 of the DSP and all other ordinances and parts oft~.e ordinances in conflict therewith. 

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the DSP, also known as the Diamond Springs El-Dorado 

Fire Protection District: 

Section l: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS 

Section 4: CONFLICT 

Section 5: SEVERABILITY 

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

The DSP makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 20 I 9 Edition, pursuant to 

Health & Safel}' Code S-et!tl,ms 13869. 7, 179j8, 7 and 1894/.5 during this code adoption process. Such changes 

arc necessary because of local climatic, geological and/or topographical conditions. The DSP has adopted, 

pursuant to Section 18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these 

conditions by Resolution #2019·10 of the DSP dated October 9, 2019. 

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

The DSP adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, including Appendices, 

incorporating those sections of the l111ernalfo11al Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the 

exclusions listed below: 

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 1 

20-0203 D Page 5 of 40 



Exclusions: I 05.6.17-105.6.19, I 05.6.39, 308. J.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 

403.4, 403.6, 403. 7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12, 404.1-404.4, 

405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2), 808, 904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9 

(adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under 0104.2 (Exception), 

DI 06. l (Exception), 0107.1 (Exception), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, 

Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 Califomi" Fire 

Code. 

SECTION 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS 

The following Sections are hereby amended or added: 

Chaptel' 1 

Section 101 Scope and General Requirements 

101.1 Title shall be amended as follows: Add name ofj11risdictio11 [DSP] 

Section 105 Permits 

105.6.27 LPG-gas shall be amended as follows: Add to the exception: At or above 5,000 feet of 

elevation, a pennit is not required for individual containers with a 125-gallon water capacity or less, 

or multiple container systems having an aggregate quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving 

occupancies in Group R-3. 

Section 106 Fees 

106.6 Permit, Plan Review and Inspection Fees shall be added as follows: A schedule of fees 

adopted by the district board of directors for plan review, inspections and the issuance ofpen11its by 

the district may be fozmd in the most current distric:t Jee schedule (Health & Safety Code J 7951). 

106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees shall be added as follows: Fire service fees may be charged to any 

person, firm, co,poration or b11siness that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of 

carele.ssness, is responsible for the cause of the district to re:,pond to the scene of an incident. A 

district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the district provides or the cost 

of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code J 3916). The fee shall 

not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to the scene of an incident. 

106.7 Administrative Costs shall be added as follows: When a test or inspection is scheduled, and 

the contractor fails to pe1form to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ 

Ordinance 2019.0 I Page 2 

20-0203 D Page 6 of 40 

•, 
! :.t· 



~. 

may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/inspection location and 

the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs. 

Section 109 Board of Appeals 

Section 109,4 Appeal Procedu~s and Timelines shall be added as follows: Any person or entiry who 

believes they may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code 

official through a written notice may appeal this r,,atter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on 

the notice. All such appeals shafl be filed in writing with the Secreta,y of the Governing Board for 

the di:i;trict. A timely appeal shall stay farther action by the fire code official until the mailer is 

determined by the Appeal Board as om/ined in Section 109.2, unless the issue poses an imminent fire 

or life safety hazard 10 members of the public. The fire code official shall notify the appellant by 

certified mail of the date and time of such hearing, The hearing shall be scheduled to take place no 

sooner than 20 calendar days fi·o,n the date shown on the certified mail. The appellant shall have the 

right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and present oral, written and/or photographic 

evidence to the Appeal B()(Jrd. 

Section 1)0 Viol•tions 

110.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows: Persons who shall violate a proYision of this 

code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, 

repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code 

official, or of a pcnnit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a 

misdemeanor or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting auorney or agency, punishable by a 

fine not exceeding $JOO. 00 for a first violation; 2. A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation 

of the san,e prov,:.s ion wil hln one ytar; 3. A fine not exceeding $1000. 00 /or each add it Iona/ violation 

of the same provision within one :~or, or by imprisonment oot exceeding 180 days, or both such fine 

and imprisonmec1l Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be 

deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections/3145 and 17995). 

110.4.2 Citations shall be added as follows: The Fire Chief. or his/her duly authorized 

representative. n,ay issue cilatiortsjor infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to 

Section 13871 of the Ilea/th & Safety CCH:k of the State of California and Chapter 5c (commencing 

with Section 853.6) a/Title 3 of fart l of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

Section 112 Stop Work Order 

112.4. Failure to Comply shall be amended as follows: Any person who shall continue any work 

after having been served with a stop-work order. except such work as that person is directed to 

Ordinance 2019.0l Page~ 

20-0203 D Page 7 of 40 



perform I.a remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be pmtishable by a fine or imprisonmt.'111 or 

both a.s described in Section Ii' 0.4 (Health & Safe~\' Code Sectiom 13145 and 17995). 

Chapter 2 

Section 202 General Definilions 

Add definition for Campfire -Shall mean a fire which is used for cooking. per.rnna/ warmth. lighting, 

or aesthetic pwpose."i. This includes jiru contained within 011rdoor fireplaces and enclosed stows 

with )foes or chimneys, stoves using jctlic.( liquid, or .mlid ji11ds, portable barbecue pfts, bra:o:il'rx. or 

space heatinK devias which are used outside of any structure, mobile home, or a~}' JivinK 

accommodation mounted on a vehicle 

Add definition for Di!ltrict. Shall mean the district and all other areru within the exterior bmmdar/e$ 

thereof now or hereajier established. 

Add definition for Driveway - Shall mean a velzicular access that ren'es up ro two (2) parcds ,nth no 

more rhan two (1) residential units and any number of non-commudal vr industrial buildings on each f,<lrctl. 

Add definition for Execulive Body · Shall mean the Board of Direcwrs of the District. 

Add definition for Fire Chief · Shall mtan the Chit} F:.xecutiw~ Fire Officer of the Fire 

Jep.mment/district serving the jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative. 

Add definition for Trained Crowd Manae,er - Shall mean standby personn,!l, usually a sec11rity 

guard or usher personnel. who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people.from a tent or other 

place ofp11blic assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the e\.~nl of an emergency. 

Chapter 3 

Section JOl Definitions 

302,l 1>enpitions shall be amended as follows; Added Campfire definition, as shown above in 

Chapter 2. 

Stt1l9b JQ7 Open Burning, Recreational Fires, and Outdoor Fireplaces 

307,414 Campfire Restrktion.s shall be added as follows: 

307.4.4.1 /tis 1mlawfulfor any persc>n to light, maintain, or use a campfire upon or near any brush­

covued land, grass-covered land, or foresr-coW!rrd land during tht time when burning permits are 

suspmded by the Director of !/tt lxponment of Forutry and Fire Protection, the CAL FIRE Unit 

Chief, or the AHJ. 

Exceplkm: Commerda/ cooking opel"Ollt>N with oppnnwl of the AHJ. 

Ordinance 2019,01 Page4 

20-0203 D Page 8 of 40 

... 



307.4.4.2 Jt11en campfires are allowed, ii shoJJid be 1111/aw/JJl/ol' any {Hl'JOn ro light, maintain, or use 

a campjire upon any brush-covered land, grass-cowred land, or fores/-cow.>reJ land unless the 

following minimum requirements are complied with. 

307.4.4.2 (u) The area within 5 feet of the periphery of the campfir1• is cleared of all fla111111able 

material and vegetation. 

307.4.4.2 (b) One servlce,1ble shovel with a handle of at feast 12 inches is ready for use at the 

immediate area of the campjil"e. 

307.4.4.2 ( c} Campfires shall be limited too J foot by J foot area, unless in an approved manufactured 

cooking device or fire ring. 

307,4,4,l (d) Writ/en permission of the landowner must be obtained prior to the ignirion of the 

campfire and shaJI ~ on site. 

Chapter S 

Section 503 Fire Apparatus Acs,ess Road, 
503.l.l Dimensions shall be amended u follows: Fire .apparatus access roads shall have an 

unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet, exclusive uf\houlders. m· measured.from face of curb to 

face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and unobstn1ctcd 

vertical clearance, of not less than J 5 fut, All driwways in r~ district shall not be less than 12 fut 

wide. 

503,l.S Dead Ends shall be amended as follows: Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways 

in excess of 150 feet in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around fire 

apparatus. 

503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces shall be limended as follows: Where a bridge or an eleyated 

surface is part o~ a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in 

accordance with lhe current El Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge Standard or A.pJ"ndix 

D of the current California Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive. Bridges and elevated surfaces 

shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load 

limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when rec_uired by the Fire Code Official. Where 

elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces which are not designed 

for such use, approved barriers, approved signs, or both shall be installed and maintained when 

required by the fire code officiaL 

503.4.2 No P1rh,111 lg Fire Lapg shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, or feaw 

standing any \tehicle, wMther attended or una1tended, except when necessary to avoid conflict with 

ot~r traffic or in complfance with IM directions of the Fire Chief. or his/her duly authorized 

represen1a1iw, Peace Officer or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway, at any 

Ordinance 2019.01 P,ge 5 

20-0203 D Page 9 of 40 



curb, or in any location in a public(y or private~~· owned or operated ojfstreet parking faciJ/ty, 

de.rignated as a fire lane by the district with jurisdiction over the area in which I~ plact'. is focated. 

The d,,signation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to, and visible from, the 

designated place clearly slating in let1ers not /us than one fr,ch in height that tht plw·e is 11 fire lane, 

(2) by outlining or painting the place m red and, in contrasting co{ol', markinK the pla.:e with the 

words "FIRE LANE", which are c/e(lr/y visible from a whicle., or (3) by a red curb or red pain/ on 

the edge of/he roadway upon which is clearly marked the words ''FIRE l.ANE" 

503.4.3 No Parking in Fron I of Hydranb shull be added us follows; No per.mn ,\'hall stop, park, or 

leave standing any vehicle within 1.5 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) ff the vehicle is 

attended by a licensed driver who is seated in the front seat and who can immediately movt such 

vehiclt' in case ofnecesJ'ity. (b) lftM vehicle is owMd or operated byaftrl! ·depal'fment and is clearly 

marked as a firt department vehidt. 

503.4.4 Fire Lanes Based on R9ad Width shall be added as follows: Fire lanes shall be b~d on 

toad width as required in Appendix Das umemkd by the district. 

S03.5.3 Fire Apparatus Access Gates shall be added as follows_· All automatic and manual gates 

installed over fire appamt11s access roadt shall comply with the di,rtricf gate standutd as appt0ved 

by the fire cock official. 

Section 505 Premise Identification 

505.1 Address ldentifkation shall have the first line of this p11rngraph amended as follows: 

Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply with the district ,1ddress standard as approved 

by (!~Ji~ code official. 

Section 507 Firt; Protedi9a Water Supplies 

507.5.1 Where Required shall be amended as follows: 400 feet shall be amended to 150 feet. 

Section 509.3 Fire Control R9om 
509.3 Ftre Coqsrol Room Fire Protection and Utility Equlpment /dentijicotion and Access, is hertby 

amended by adding the following to read: Fire sprinkler risers, fire alarm control panels, solar 

photovoilaic power :,ystem rapid shutoff .switches, and other fire detection, suppression, or similar 

control .switches shol be l<x:ated inside a single fire control room far the building. The fire control 

room shall haw minimum dimensions of Jh~ feet by st\'en feet in sizt with a total use able Ol'fa of not 

less titan 3.5 squarejru 11w room shall~ located within the b11ilding Ol'I an outside wall at a location 

approved by the Fire Code Official and shall~ accessible from the exurior. An exterior acctss door 

with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and a height not /,ss than 80 inc~s shall~ provided 

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 6 

20-0203 D Page 1 O of 40 



.. 
'. ' 

for access into the room. A durable sign .shall be affixed to the exterior of the door with the words 

"FIRE CONTROL ROOM'' in letters not less than 4 inches in height. A. key box complying with 

Section 506 shall be insta(/ed on the exterior stde of the fire control room doo1' opening. The room 

must be capable or maintaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit. A clearance of 

12 inches shall be provided from the fire sp1·inkler risers lo any adjacent walls. This room can be 

shared with other building utilities or fire protection equipment that is compatible. An approved 

cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans ·of the fire sprinkler system, other fire 

protection equipment, and site plans. This room shall not be used for any other .storage. 

Chapter~ 

Section 903 Fire Sprinklers 

903.2 Where Required shall be amended as follows: An approved automatic sprinkler system shall 

be req"ired and installed in new buildings and structures 3600 square feet or greater when 

constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction as described in Sections 903.2. l through 903.2.12. 

Exception: Agricultural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial purposes. 

903.2.a Where Required. shall be added as follows: Status of existing buildings greater than 3,600 

square feet. In existing buildings 3,600 square/eel or greater, other than one and rwo1amily dwelling 

units, and agricultural buildings not un<kr special use permit for commercial purposes, where the 

floor area of the building or structure is increased by an addition of more than thirty percent (30%) 

or 1,000 square feet whichever is less, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 

903.2. 

903.l.b Where Required shall be added as follows: Status of existing buildings less than 3,600 

square feet. Jn existing buildings 3, 60() square feet or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling 

units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, whtrt the 

floor area of rhe building or structure is increased to a total square footage over 3,600 square feet, 

by an addition of more than thirty ~rcent (30%) or l, 000 square feet, whichever is less, such b11ilding 

or structure shall be made to co,iform to Section 903.2. 

903.l.l Group A shall be amended as follows for A groups A-1 through A-4: 903.2.Ll (1) The fire 

area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

903.2.3 Group E shall~ amended as follows: 903.2.3 (I) Throughout all Group E fire areas greater 

than 3,600 squar-efett in area. 

903.l.4 Group F-1 shall be amended as follows: 903.2.4 Group F. 903.2.4 (1) A Group F fire area 

exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2()3.2.7 Groan M shall be amended as follows: 903.2.7 Group Band M. 903.2.7 (1) A Group Band 

M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 7 

20-0203 D Page 11 of 40 



903.2.8.2 Manufactured Homes shall be added as follows: An automatic fire sprinkler system shall 

be required in all new mom!foclJlrt•d homes and nm/1i-;,1111ily .mamlachtrot,d homes intendedfor use 

as ,1 one.and two-famiiy dwelling. The deJign and installation of s1.1ch S}-St~ms shall be in acc,)rd,mce 

•~
1ith California Code of Regulations" Title 15., §4300. 

Exceptions: 

1. Manufactured homes localt'.d within an existing mobilehome park complvinr, with 

Ca/ffornia Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2. 1 ,:-,r 2. 3. 

2. Afanufi1ctured /,om,:s that do nor exceed 1,200 square feel in size ond ser-ve as at1 

acces.;o,J' dwellinx unit, as defined in Government Code Section 65850?, when the 

existi1Jg prima,y re.sid,~nce on the property is not required to comply with California 

Residential Code Section RJ/3.2. 

3. Manufactured homu that do not exceed 320 square feet ir:i size. 

903.2.9 Group S-l shall be amended as follows: 903.2.9 Group S. 9D3.2.9 (I) A Group S fire area 

exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

903,2.10 Group S-2 Enclosed l,arkipg Garages shall be amended es follows: 903.2.10 (1) Where 

the fire area of the entlosed parking garage exceeds 3,600 square fut. 

Section 907 Fire Alarm apd DeCectioo Systems 

907 .2.a Where Regulred - New Build lugs or Structures le.ss th•n 3,600 square reel shall be added 

as follows: An approve:d firt 1llarmiaetution system shall bt ir,stal/e.d in all buildings with a floor 

area less than 3,600 squanfeet. 

E.xcept/o,,s: 

l. One- aTJd two-family dwellings {R-3 Ocrnp<mcies and otl,t!r occupancies classified. 

as "U"). 

2. Agric1Jltum/ buildings not undtr special use permit andlc-r not used for commercial 

purpose.f (e.g., retails sales, food service, and/or special e ver11s). 

3. flu11d1ngs with t1Jloor area less rhan 500 squartJtet may be ext.mpt, as determinecf 

by the Fire Chief. or his/her duly authorized reprtsentative, b~d on building 

constt-uction ma/trial and features, locatio,i, occupancy type, and distance to 

txposurts. 

907.2.b S1acus o[ Ellsllng Buildings shall be added 1s follows: In existing buildings without an 

approved automatic spri,ikJtr systtm, otMr than OM- or two-family dwelling 1.1nits, agricultural 

buildi1tg 11()( 1111tkr 5(,ledal till permit for comlr(etr:ial p«r{IONs w~rt a /in alarm detection .1y.1/t11t 

dou not uist al'ki t~ floor area of IM building or structwre is incrtastd or modified by mort thor, 

thirty ~rcent (30%) or 1,000 squarefett, whr'c~wr is ltss, such bui/di,,g or structure shall bt ma<k 

Ordinance 2019.01 Page a 
20-0203 D Page 12 of 40 

I . 



.; 

.. 

to con/om, to Section 907 when required by the Fire Chief, or hislher duly authorized reprt'sentative. 

Buildings with a /1001· area less th(m 500 square feet may be e.templ, as determined by the Fire Chief. 

or his!lter duly authorized representative, based on b11ilding construction materials and features, 

location, occupam.y type, and distance to exposures. 

907.2.c Monitoring shall be added as follows: All fire alarm/detection systems shall be connected 

directly through and monitored by a UL approved central, proprietary or remote station service, 

which gives audible and visual .signals at a constantly auended location. All sprinklered buildings 

shall be monitored. 

Exceptions: 

1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies. cla.s.sift.ed 

as "U''). 

2. Agricull11ral buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial 

purposes (e.g., retails sales, food service, and/or special events). 

907.2.d Type I Hood Installatioiis shall be added as follows: The requirement of installalion, or 

replacement, of a Type l Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system Jo be 

lns1alled, or for the hood system to be connected to an existing/ire alarmlsprinlcler monitoring system 

for that building. 

907.6.2.1 Secondary Power Suplili;'. shall be added as follows: In accordance with NFPA 72, the 

secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-ho11r power capacity under quiescent load (system 

operaling in a non-alarm condition) shall be amended to a minimum 72-hour power capacity. 

Exctptiot1: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed the 

requirements of California Fire Code Chapter n. 

Chapter 12 

Section 1203 Emergency and Staandby Power Systems 

1203.1.3 lnstaUatiog shall be amended as follows: Emergency power systems and standby power 

systems shall be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electric 

Code, NFPA 110 and NFPA 111. All buildings, other than one- and two-family dwelling units, and 

agricultural buildings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a shunt lrip 

device that disconnects all power sources to tire building, approved by the fire code official. Existing 

installations shall be ,nain(ai~d i'1 accordance with the original approval. 

Chapter 33 

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 9 

20-0203 D Page 13 of 40 



S«tion 3310 Access for Fircfighliag 

3310.J Premise ldenlificati9n shall be added as follows: Prior to and during tons1ruc1ion, an 

approred address sign shall be provided al twchflre and emugency vehicle accus road entry into 

the project. 

Section 3312 Water Supply ror f'irc Protection 

3312.1 When Required shall be amended as follows: Prior to combustible materials anivin,; on 

site, the fire hydrant wate/' system shall be ins/a/Jed and maintained in c011limm11s opa(l/ion. The 

amo11nt of water supplied shall mut the requiredjire flow for the project. 

Chapter 49 

Section 4903 Plans 

4903. J Where Required shall he added as follows: The fire code of!,cial oft~ DSP may 1·eq11ire 

development projects locared in Moderate, High and Very-High Fire Hazard Severity Zorws to submit 

firtt protection plan. This plan shall be apprnved by both the fire code official and the authorized 

representative for th« local CA I, FIRE Unit Chief (if located in the Stale Responsibility Area [SR.A]) 

prior to the recording of the final mop for the project by the County of El Dorado. 

Section 4905 Wildfire ProCection Buildigg Construction 

4905.4 Roo(Cogstruction Rcq14irements shall be added as follows: All Mw con.struclion, including 

additions, requires a Cla.rs A roof covering or assembly. All re-roofing requires Class A roof covering 

or assembly as a minimum. Re-roo/thg in uct.s.s of 50% of an exisiiinK :m·;1cture within any Ont year 

period will necessitalf' that t~ tnlire roof be a Class .'f roof covering or a.ssembl}' as a minimum. 

Class B or Cftre ~tardeant /rt.·attd and or non-treated wood .shau or .~hingles are not approved as 

a roof covering marenal for Ci ass A as.sembly 

Chapter 50 

Section 5001 General 
5001.7 Liability for Damues shall be added as follows: Any damages or cosJ resulting from the 

careless handling. spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall con.stituent debt against any 

iuch person, firm or corpot·ation causing such spill or discharge. This dlbt is collutiblt by the Fire 

Chief, or his/her duly authariud rtpresenlative, in tht san~ manMr ar in tM ca.rt of an obligation 

unt:kr contract, txpressed or implied 

Chapter 56 

Ord'inance 2019 .O l Page 10 

20-0203 D Page 14 of 40 

.. 
. . 



Section S60I General 

5601.2 Permjt Required shall be amended as follows: Permits shall be required as sec forth in 

Section 105.6 and regulated in accordance with this section. Where explosiws ~nt1i1s are required, 

they shall~ is.sued by rhe Fire Chief. or hiJ/her duly authorized representatfre, and rht El Dorado 

County Shuifj's Department. Where fin'worlcs permits are required. they shall be iuued by t>1t Fire 

Chief. or his/her duly authorized repn!stmtatiwi, and the El Dorado County Board ofS11per11iiors. 

5601.2,1 Documentation shall be added as follows: The AHJ shall have the authori~y to request 

documentation regarding all aspects of the fireworks presentation. 

5601 12.2 Proprjetan Information shall be added as follows: Tht AHJ will pmtect all proprietary 

information. 

Chapter 57 

Sectjoq 5704 Storage 

5704,l.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited shall be amended as follows; 

Storage of Class I and Class 11 flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited 

11n/ess appro~-ed by the Fire ChfeJ; or his/her d11ly auJhorized repre.sentati~. Whtn permifted by the 

Fire Chief. or his/her duly a1tthorized representative, all above ground tank(s) or WlUlt installations 

for the storage of Class 1, fl or l/I flammable and combustible liquids shall comply with those 

requirements as set forth by tht Calijornia Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall also apply to 

installations otlwr than 1'10tor 1,1ehiclt fuel di.sptn.Jing stations wlwre abow-grou11d storage is required 

Section 5706 Special Operatjoas 
S706.l.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are ProhibjJed shall be amended as follows: 

Storage of Class I and Cius ll tlammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is 

prohibited unit.JS approved by the Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized rtpresenrative. When 

permitted by the Fire Cl,ief. or his/her duly authoriud representative, all abovt1 ground tanll.(s) or 

vault installations for t!H! storage of Class 1, II or lll.flammable and combustible liquids shall comply 

with those requirements as set forth by the California Fire Code, The California Fire Cock shall also 

apply to Installations othtr than motor vehicle fuel dls~ruing stations whtre above-ground storage 

i.s nquired. 

Cbapter58 

Section S80§ Flammable Cryogeaic Fluids 
S806.l UmU•liogs shall be amended as follows: Storage oftlammablc cryogenic fluids in stationary 

containers outside of buildings is prohibited wrless approved by tht Fire Chit/, or hi~r duly 

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 11 

20-0203 D Page 15 of 40 



authorized representative. When permitted by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized 

representative, all stationa,y containers for the storage ofjlammable c1yoge11ic fluids shall comply 

with those requirements as set forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall also 

apply to installations other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above-ground storage 

is required. 

Chapter 61 

Section 6104 Location of LP-Gas Containers 

6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits shall be amended as follows: The storage 

of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2, 000-gallon water capacity when located at 

least one-half (1/2) mile fi"om property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-half 

(1/2) mile from existing residential development with a density greater than one (J) dwelling unit per 

acre and at least one-half (112) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved, and a 

special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado. 

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the dispersion of 

liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested areas, the aggregate 

capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The dispensing 

of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2, 000-gallon water capacity when located 

at least one-half (J /2) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one­

half (1/2) mile ji·om existing residential development with a density greater than one (l) dwelling unit 

per acre and at least one-half (l/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved and 

a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado. 

Section 6112 High Elevation Liquefied Petroleum Gas Installations (5,000-foot elevations and 

above) shall be added as follows: 

6112.1 Regulators shall be added as follows: 

Two-stage regulator system shall be installed in accordance with mamifactttrer requirements. 

Two-stage regulator systems shall be installed on all LPG installations. 

The first stage regulator shall be installed under the hinged gauge cover supplied with the tank. The 

atmospheric pressure aperture of the regulator shall be pointed downward. The first stage regt1lator 

shall be plumbed to the riser of the yard piping with soft copper tubing to allow flexibility should lank 

shifting occur. The. riser.from the yard piping shall be located not more than 3 inches (horizontally) 

from the walls of the tank. 

The second stage regulator and riser pipe shall be installed under the eave of the building, as close 

as practicable to the building wall. This riser shall be securely supported/braced to the wall 

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 12 

20-0203 D Page 16 of 40 



approximately J(} inches below rhe regulator so as to prewmt bending of the pipe by lateral .snow/ice 

loads. 

A pl'olective cover, approl!ed by tht gas suppliu and Building Official, shall ~ installd oYtr tht 

second stage reg,·1lator and securely .,upported to the ground or diagonal~,, to the wall. 

The riser pipes for the yard piping shall not be embedded in concrete. Concrete placed around such 

ri.str shall be held back al least 1 inch from all sides of the pipe. 

At the time of application/or any building permit, which involves the insrallation of an LPG system, 

the applicant shall submit an LPG system plot plan in 3 copies (or digitally a.s PDF). The LPG plot 

plan shall include, but not be limited to, tht tank location, vroposed tank caJ)licity in CJS. gallons, 

route of yard piping, location oftht risu pi[M al the building, property boundaries, and an outline of 

all existing/proposed buildings on the lot and a depiction of the ridgeline of any building to be 

.supplied with LPG. This shall also M forwarded 10 tht appropriate fire district Jo serve as a locator 

map in event of an emergency. 

Location oft he centerline of LPG tanks shall be pumanently marked by /ht! use of snow sralces, one 

at each end. Stich staus shall be of sufficient height to ~ visible through anticipated maximum snow 

depth at the respectfre location. Jrntallat1011 and riwimenance of these snow staJces ure the 

responsibility of the LPG user. 

Propane appliances and accessories shall n<>I be pumifted in any new installation below the first 

floor or below grade, whicht!ver is more restrictive. 

6112,2 Vertical Riser Piping shall be added as follows: 

.Minimum of Schedule 80 • Iron piping. 

The riser shall be within 3 inches horizontally of the tank. 

Swing Joints shall be in.stalled abo~ and below tank few/ to provide for tht tank moYemenl (Slrttt 

elbows shall not be 11sed). 

A listed flexible riser constructed of copper or stainless-stet/ tubing and protecred by steel co1Jertd 

sheathed material may be used instead of swin~join/s. The flexible alternative shall providt! sufficient 

.rlack to allow for tank movemf!nl. 

6112.3 Markigg and Locations shall be added as follows: 

An approved sign shall be located directly above rht! riser sf.iut off valve on the building in a visible 

location. 

The liquefied ~trolew,i gas s11pplitr shall affix a weatherproof identification tag lo the inside of the 

tank wJlvt protecting covtr. Thi1 tag shall contain the supplier's name and emergency relepltone 

n11mber. 

Tank insrallatiorr shall be permaMl'llly marked by a metal or wood material snow marker, with a 

minim11m dimen.s ion of 2 inches by l ittelte.t The snow marker shall ~ of sufficient height to r,~ 

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 13 

20-0203 D Page 17 of 40 



above the annual snow depth and shall be a mini11111111 of 10 feet in height. The snow markers shall 

be 11ainted >··el/ow and located on oppo.fite ends of the tank. 

Section 6113 Underground LPG Tanks Installations and Ownership shall be added as follows: 

6113.1 Permits and Plans shall be added as follows: Permits shall be r!!quired, and plans shall be 

submlttedfor all underground tank installations as approved by the AHJ. 

6113.2 Underground LPG Tank Ownership shall be added as follows: Underground LPG tanks 

.fhall be prohibitedf,-0111 being sold to end-users and shall be retained by the LPG company under a 

lease-type system to ensure proper annual maintenance requirements are met and recorded. 

Chapter 80 

Section 80, NFPA. 131)..16 ~ Standard for the (nstallation of Sprinkler Systems in 01e-and Two 

l?amily Dwellings and Man11factured Homes as amended 903.3.1.31 903.3.5 

NFPA l3D, Amended Sectic>ns as follows: 

Add Section 4.7 to read as follows: 

Chapter 80. NF'PA 13U 4J_ Residential fire sprinkler sys rems installed in all new one-and two­
family dwellings shall uli/ize a "Passive Purge" system design unless otherwise approved by 
the Fire Code Official. 

Exception: Manufactured home installed, tested and approved by the California Department of 
Housing and Community Developmenr. 

Revi.se Section 5,1,1,2 to read as follows: 

Chapter 80. NFPA l3D. 5.1.1.2 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature .sprinkler used 

within the premises shall be maintained on the propert)1 al an appro1,·ed location. Stock sprinklers shall 

be kept in a mounted and accessible cabinet. 

Revise Section 7 .6 to read as follows: 

Chapter 80. NFP A l3D. 7 .6 A local water flow alarm shall be provided on all fire sprinkler systems in 

homts at an approved location on the exterior of the dwe/Uug. 

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 to read as follows: 

Chapter 80. NFPA l3D. 11.l.l.1 Where a fire department pumper connection is not provided, the 

system shall be hydrostatic.ally tested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square inch gauge for no 

less than a 30-minute duration wUhout evidence of leakilge. Such test $ha/I be wimessed by the fire code 

official. 

Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Bulldlnas 

Table 8105.l{ll Required Fire flow [or Ope; and Two-Family DweDings, Group R-3, and R-4 
Buildimzs and Townhouses shall be amended es follows for elevations beiow 5,000 feet: 

Ordinance 2019.01 Page,., 

20-0203 D Page 18 of 40 



r--:--. I .. -... 

FIRE-FLOW 

CALCUl,ATION 

AREA 

(square r11t) 

0 J,600 

3 ,6-0 l md areatcr 

·'-·--- ,,_ 

AUTOMATIC 
SPRINKLER 
SYSTEM 

(Desltn 
Standard) 

--·----
______ _. 

No Automatic 

~prinkler syitem 

No 11utom1.tic 

sprinkler system 

-,----,-·-- ..-.,. - ---~~----· 

MINIMUM FLOW 
FIRE· DURATION 
FLOW (hours) 

(tallons per 
minute) 

---·----···--

1,000 I 

·-
Value in Du,,.,ioo ,n 
Table Table 
BlOS,1(2) 8105.1(21 at 

the required 
fire-flow raie ___ ,_., _______ .. 

----·· - ·-------·- - - ------- ~·----------
0-3,600 Se<;tion 903.3.1.3 ~ V. 

of the CA Fire IJ)()(J / 
Code or Scctiori 
31:U of the CA 
Rc~idential Code j 

---- .. 

3,60 I 11\d areater Section 903.3.1.3 l!l ~alue o( + 
of lhe CA hr, Table 2 
Code or Scctioo B105, 1(2) 

)13J of I~ CA (lfl/fl, /0()0 
Residential Code GPMJ [ 

··- --· -

Table B105.2 Required Fire Flow [or Buildings ocllcr tbap Ope- and Two-Family 
DwelUggs. Group R-3, Hd R~ D11Hdings and Townhouses shall be amended as follows: 

-~-----·--

AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER MINIMUM FLOW DURATION 
SYSTEM FIR[-FLOW (houn) 

(l>ffi1• Standard) (aalloas per 
minute) ____ ,_,.._,,. ... , 

No 111tom1tic sprin<lcr systtm Vililc in Tible Duration In Table 
8105 . .1(2) BlOS.1(2) 

-·· ·-
Section 903.J.LI of the CA Fare ~ j(J% 0(1he value Duration ln Table 
Code In Table BIOS.l(l)' BI OS.1(2) at the red~ 

Oow.-.te 
~------·--·--··- .. _ ... 

Secdon 903.3,Ll of I.he CA Fire »-4JO% of the value Duratio_n in Table 
Code (Only appNu to loca1101u in Table B 105, 1(2) B !OS, 1(2) 11 the reduced 
lwlow J, 000-foot ~wvat/on) flow ralc 

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than l ,500 apm 

I 
I 

! 

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 15 

20-0203 D Page 19 of 40 



Appendix D - Fire Appal'atus Access Roads 

Section D103 Minimum Specifications 

D103.l Access Road Width with a Hydrant shall be amended as follows, adding the exception: 

Exception: Driveways 

D 103.2 Grade shall be amended as follows: Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not 

exceed J 5. 9% in grade unless approved by the AHJ or by the El Dorado County amended California 

Public Resource Code Title 14 I Design and Improvement Standards Manual. 

Exception: Elevation above 5,000 feet shall not exceed J 2%. 

Dl03.3 Turning Radius shall be amended as follows: The minimum turning radius shall be 

determined by the fire code official; and shall not include c11rb and guller. 

Dl03.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates shall be amended as follows: Subsection (1): Where a 

single gate is provided, the gale width shall be not less than 20 feel (6096 111111). Where a fire 

apparat11s road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall 11ot be less than J 5 feet (4572 

mm). 

D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as specified in 

Section DI 03.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide 

(6096 to 8534.4 mm). 

Exceptio11: Elevations above 5,000 fl. as determined by the AHJ. 

D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as 

specified in Section D 103.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 

feet wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm). 

Excepticm: Elevations above 5,000 fl. as determined by the AHJ. 

Dl04.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads shall be added as follows: When required 

by the fire code official, a fire apparaws access i-oad shall be co11st1·ucted to encompass Jhe entirety 

of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access. 

SECTION 4: CONFLICT 

That Ordinance No. 2016-37 of the DSP, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances herewith are hereby 

repealed. 

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY 

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or phrase of this code, or 

any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such decision 

shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code, which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, 

therefore, such invalid portions are declared to be severable. The DSP hereby declares that it would have enacted 

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 16 

20-0203 D Page 20 of 40 

.. 



V·. 
this Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, sentences, 

clauses or phrases irnspecti\/e of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid. 

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The DSP Board Secretory is directed to publish 

this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the District. In lieu of publication of the full text of the 

ordinance, a summary of the ordinance rnay be published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15) days 

after its passage and a certified copy shall be posted in the office of the DSP pursuant to Government Code Section 

36933(c) (1). 

The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the DSP on October 9, 20 I 9, and 

it was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the Ordinance to be read for the second time on 

November 13, 2019 and approved by the following vote: 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District 

this, !3th day of November, 2019. 

AYES: 11 
NOES: 0 

ABSENT: I 
ABSTAIN:0 

ATIEST: 

Lori Tuthill, Board Secretary 

Ordinance 2019.01 

... 

Page 17 

20-0203 D Page 21 of 40 



,. 

DSP, ECF, & GRV 

Fire Code# S1gn1f1cant What Is the Change? Locally adopted I SFM adopted I W'1y Is There a Loe.al Change? 
change? Amended 

101.1 

105.6.27 

.. . 

106.6. 

106.6.1 

106.7 

109.4 

110.4 

110.4.2 

112.4 

202 

302.1 

307.4.4 through 
307.4.4.2 (d) 

. 

I·. 

I• 

N 

y 

Amend with the name of the jurisdiction 

Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate 
quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving 
occupancies in Group R-3. 

. ";.:_=:_. ', 
· . 

N'· ·~~••' 

. . . 
N Add section 

y Add section 

y Added section 109.4 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 

N 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 
better left to locali6es to determine the 
fees/penalties for their respective areas. 

N 
Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before 
but under a different number} 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 

N 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 
better left to localities to determine the 
fess/penalties for their respective areas. 

N Added definitions for darity 

N Added definition for Campfire to Section 

y Added a sections for campfire restrictions 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally created and adopied 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally created and adopted 

Administrative need 

LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than 
air and can easHy be trapped under a home, if ignited it can 
lead to an explosion. At elevations above 5000 feet there is 
an increased risk accanpanied with significant historical fire 
activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional 
attention. 

Section 106~6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to 
the Fire District . . . 

Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs or avoidable 
failed inspections by contractora. 

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District 
is added to read as follows: 
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines • The intent of this 
provision is to darify the procedures and timelines for an 
individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals 
regarding an order, decision, or detennination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County of El Dorado's 
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals 
timeline. 

Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that 
protects life and property. Fees have been updated to 
match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the 
District Attorney's Office. The change to the language to 
indude the term infractions. 

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s), 
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 
violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health and Safely Code of the State of California and 
Chapter 5c (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

All violations of the code have been consolidated under 
Section 110.4 to indude the penalties for violations. 

Added definitions for. Campfire, Driveway, District, 
Executive Body. Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd 
Manager. Definition of campfire shall not indude LPG or 
Propane fueled appliances. 

Added definition for darily 

Due to the high fire danger that exists in El Dorado County 
we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires 
within grass, brush, and tree covered areas. 

20-0203 D Page 22 of 40 



503.2.5 N 

503.2.6 N 

503.4.2 N 

503.4.3 N 

503.4.4 N 

503.5.3 N 

505.1 N 

507.5.1 N 

509.3 y 

903.2 

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the 
Fire Code and TiUe 14 Fire Sare Regulations to 
match as they require turnarounds for fire apparatus Locally adopted and amended 
access roads and driveways. 

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated 
Surfaces to state and match El Dorado County Locally adopted and amended 
Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17. 

Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes Locally created and adopted 

Added section regarding no parking in front of 
Locally created and adopted hydrants 

Added section regarding fire lanes based on road 
Locally created and adopted 

width 

Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain 
emergency access and consistency through an 

Locally created and adopted road«ay gates in El Dorado County, refening to the 
gate standards adopted by the FPO's. 

Added section per1aining to the visual addressing of 
Locally adopted and amended buildings 

Added more conservative standard for the · 
placement of hydrant and their relationship to Locally adopted and amended 
convnercial buildings . 

Added verlliage to bring all of the necessary fire 
controls for a building to one location. 

Locally created and adopted 

. . . . . . . . 

Adds a requirement for sprin~er system inslffltatioo 
i~ n6YI buildings ~nd stnic:tures :tsoo squn reet or . . .• i..oca.·. uy .~led. anc1.~en.. ded 
greater within the district.' .·· · · · · 
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . : . 

Fire lippaatus are ~ng Illig~ and taller. A vertical 
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for· · 
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus 
c:cimponentil. It also. allows an extended time frame before 
ha~ng to retUt lhe gfCM'lh of the vegetation. Additional ·•. 
height for vegelati<lll i:iearan'* acts as an increased buffer 
tor th~ spread of fire. Aroad Width oi 20 feet exclusive ot .· 

~7Th~;t;~~:;r:~~:::wiur 
fire apparatus 'and stioufd not be counted in the total .··. . 
dri~able road Stlrfl!ce \ . . . . . . . . . . 

Fire apparatus require areas for turning around when 
multiple vehicles are on the scene or an emergency. This 
includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides 
better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum 
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 
Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendi~ D of the 
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be 
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an 
alternate means & methods that is not less restrictive than 
the Fire Code. 

This section clearly defines the 'No Parking in Fire Lanes' 
rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle Code. 

This section clearly defines the 'No Parking in front of fire 
h)drants' rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle 
Code. 

This section clearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D 
as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire 
lanes. 

Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on 
road«ays based on the Districts gate standard, providing 
lhe best possible emeigency access to maintain fast 
response times. 

Allows Fire districts the authority to approve ad<tessing 
based on the District's addressing standards. 

Commercial properties are required to install hydrants at 
300 foot intervals; lhus they should never be outside of 150 
feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in 
between). 

Buildings are getting more sizable in the county. II is more 
common to have new buildings with solar arrays that 
continue to generate power even when the buildings 
general utilities have been shut off. When there is an 
emergency, it is vital that we have rapid access to all of the 
controls in one location for public evacuation and firefighter 
safety. Due to the fire danger present in El Dorado County 
throughout most of the year, this change is appropriate and 
advisable . 

. Due lo the topographic. climatic. and geographic conditions 
dB Dorado County and their contributing factors to our· 
i~as,ed response ti Illes,. along with the fact that fiie$ ·.:. ·. 
dcluble ill ~~e each ~d eveiy minrte, we require spiinkleni 
to.Ile.install~ in struciiiies oitce they reach 3,600 square 
teet in size as ihi,y relate 10 fire tiehaviorarid raie or< · ·. ~··.··· .... 

20-0203 D Page 23 of 40 



goj.2.a·_ 

!!()3.2'.1, 903.2.3, 
903.2.4, 903.2.7 

903.2.8.2 

903.2.9, 903.2.10 

907.2.a 

907.2.b 

907.2.c 

N 

N 

y 

N 

N 

N 

N_ 

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater 
thari 3,600 square reet to install sprinklers if they 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square foot to the 
structure. whichever is less. 

These sections were created. lei give sjlecific . 
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on 
occupancy and square footage• 

This section was created to include manufactured 
residenijal single family R-3 in the residential 
sprinkler program 

These sections were created to give specific 
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on 
occupancy and square footage 

Added occupant protection for fire alarms in 
buffdings with a floor area iess than 3,600, except 
R3. AG buildings not used for commercial 
purposes, and buildings with a floor area of less 
than 500 square reet as approved by the fire code 
official. . . 

Add_ed occupant protection for existing buildings 
wiihoot automatic sprinkler systenis to install a fire 
alaim If they add more than 30% or 1,000 square 
feet lo the structure, whichever is less. 

Added occupant protection by stating all fire alarm 
detection systems.installed shall be connected to a 
monitoring service that noti_fies the fire depalfrnent 
upori activation arid is installed per Section 907 of 
tile fireroile. 

Locally created arid adopted 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally created and adopted 

. Locally created and adopted 

i.ocally created and adopted 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their conbibuting factors to our 
increased response limes, alollg with the fact that fires 
double iii size each arid every minuie, we require sprinklers 
to be ins~ed in. stiuctures once they reach 3,600 square 
feei in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate ,of •. 
spread: ·. · · · · · · · · ·. · · · 

Due to tile lop()grapliic, Jmatic:; andgeograpliic conditions 
of El Doraoo Coonly and their contributing fiictors to OIJr 
increased resporise times, along with the fad that fires 
doubl11 in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Manufactured Hornes - The intent of this code section is to 
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or tw 
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar 
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban 
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption 
due lo the light-weight nature of their construction. The 
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a 
significant risk to their OOOJpants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk 
successfully in many California communities. 

Due to the topographic, dimatic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their conbibuting factors to our 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
to be instaned in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire beh!Mor end rate of 
spread. 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
allow publlc use and ensures Fire D11Partmenl notification in 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

' Provides proper emergency notification for occilpancies that 
allow public use and ensures Fire Dllf)8rlment notification in 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
the event of a fire or sinoke: .. · . 

20-0203 D Page 24 of 40 



907.6.2.1 

1203.1.3 

4903.1 

4905.4 

5001.7 

5601.2 

s601.2.1 and sso1.2.2 

5704.2.9.6.1 

5706.2.4.4 

5806.2 

I 
5806.2.1 

6104.2 

·. 

y 

N 

N•·• 

y 

y 

y 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply 
Modification 

This section was created to inciude Fire Protection 
Plan for all fire hazard severity zones. 

Added a section lo clarify roof construction 
requirements 

Any damages or costs from negligent practices that 
cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a 
cost recovery fee. 

Added safety protection with permits being issued 
by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for 
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of 
Super.;sors for fireworks. 

Fireworb companies or vendors shall make 
available all requested documentation pertaining to 
the firework presentation 

Established Nmits as~ fortt, in the F11e Code 

Established ~mils as set fortt, in the Fire Code 

Administrative addition of District naine. . 
Established Hmlts as set forth in the Fire Code 

.. · . ..... 

Established fimiis as set forth in the Fire Coc1e 

. • 

· .. ·.. . . ··.. ·. :.· 

i~i~w~~:~~ng 

I. 

I;. 

Locally created and adopted Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E 
safely related power outages. 

This section adds a sliunt Trip power stiut off devices to 
Loi:al!y adopted and amended . ensure en'uirgency power shut off ooring the use of back-up 

power supplies · · · - ._ ... __ . 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Localiy adopted and amended 

SFM adopted and amended locally 

LocaHy adopted and amended 

El Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout 
the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire 
Protection Plan due to climatic, geological, and 
topographical conditions. 

This section clarifies that within the boundaries of El Dorado 
County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are 
wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be 
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly. 

Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate. 
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the 
negligent parties. 

Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and 
fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding 
of the applications they will be used for. 

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any 
documentation including timing and proprietary information 
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they 
deem necessary. This information is understood to be 
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as 
such. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for aass I 
flammable and Class II combustible ff quid storage in above­
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
Special/Conditional Use Permit m the County. 

Established limits as r~ired by the Fire Code for aass I 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid special 
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval 
and a SpeciaUConditional Use Penni! from the County . . . .. 
Administrative rieed to add Disbict name. Established limits 
as required by the Fire Code Officilll for Flammable · 
Cryogenic fluids in stationary coritalrieril. Requires AHJ · 
approval and a SpedaVCon<litional Use Perini! from the 

eourity, . __ . · .. __ •• __ .-· .. · .. ·• .. _ 
Established limits as required by the Fire Code Official tor. 
Flammable Cryogenic fluids in stationary containBIS. . 
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use 
Permit from the County, • . . 

Establishes distances between LPG storage and . 
dispensaries that BAI ciiectly retaied to safeiy for residential 
d~elopments and high~ity hotels. ~. apa,tmeirts, 
etc. where a~ by leak'cir expl~on of LP-Gas would 
have a high probability of injury, Inhalation; or- death. . ... 
Requires Al:tJ: approval' anif a Spec:ialieond"itldnal Use 

l

i>emiit from the G<,u~ty.\: i i ._· • •. • : . i > : ·. < .__ . < .• .. •.; 

20-0203 D Page 25 of 40 



6113.1 

6113.2 

Chapter 80, NFPA. 
13D-16 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 Section 4.7 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 Section 

5.1.1.2 

Chapter 80, NFPA. 
13D-16 Section 7.6 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 Section 

11.2.1.1 

Appendix B: Tabie 
9105:1(1). •. 

N .. 

N 

N 

y 

y 

y 

y 

y 

N 

Peiintts a~d plans shall be submitted and approved 
by the AHJ (Authority Halling Jurisdicttonr . 

Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the 
property of the LPG company 

NFPA 13D-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the 
Disbict has been amended to update various 
provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler 
systems in one-and two-family dwellings 

Correction of a system quality issue 

To anow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler 
system minimizing damage 

Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation 

System test to a pressure of 150 p.s.i. 

Chilriged 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM; below 5000 foot 
elevation; to match fire flow precedents used in. 
EDC for years . . . 

Locally created and ~dopied 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally created and adopted 

SFM Adopted and amended locally 

. · ... 

Establishes propane regulator requirement for locati.ons 
above 5000 foot elevation: Including requirements for two­
stage regulator use and location of first and second stage 
regulators. Additional requirements are outlined. for .• 
proteclive covers;. riser pi~ installation requirements;. 
buikirig permit subm1ttill and review, tank cooter-lin~ · .· 

f}:;!i!~~t~£~!1;=~:· 
.. :!i~;:liep~~;:~7~:t:js 

joini requirements; and ~~ use· of ffexibie riser piping as .. 
wen as swing ja'nts. These requirements are ba~ oo 
significant fire history iri. heavy snow and extreme weather 
conditions encountered above 5000 feet 

Establishes marking and kication requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elewtiort This section addresses signage 
location, ~ergency contact information, and snow related 
tank marking requirements. These reqilirements are based 
ori significant fire histoiy In heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet 

Peimitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground 
iilnks: 
Allows lis to require plans be submitted for review prior to 
installations of uildergrolind i.PG ianks. Underground tanks 
require substantial maintenance including inspection ilild 
anode replacement al regular intervals. 

Underground tanks corrode easily and cen leak without 
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when 
sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground 
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected. 

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on­
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow 
alarm to create an audible alert for the How of water in the 
event of water activation in a vacant structure, and 
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 13D 
sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water 
damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements 
were also added to ensure water circulation through the 
system, reducing stagnant water and backftow concerns 
(EID encourages this type of system}. 

Amends the current code set to include the addition of a 
SFM Adopted and amended locally passive purge system to keep the water in the sprinkler 

piping system from being stagnant. 

A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system 
SFM adopted and amended locally must be available on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet 

SFM adopted and amended locally 

SFM adopted and amended locally 

Loc:aUy adopted and ~mendeci 

An audible alarm system is added to notify occupants and 
in the activation of the system when the building is not 
occupied allow for detection minimizing damage. 

A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and 
failures and assures proper gluing of system components. 

Allows us io ma!th Mia! developers and residenbi are used 
iii in re!iarils lo GPM fire flow requirements 111a1 ii ave been 
iised for over a decade in EDC. . 



Appendix 8: Table 
8105.2. 

. . . 

Appendx D: 0103.1 
.. ··,: ...... ·.·,·.-: 

Appendix D: 0103.3 

AJ>pendix C>:010:i.s § 

1 

Appendix 0: D103.6.1 

Appendix D: 0103.6.2 

Appendix 0: 0104.2 
Exception 

Appendix 0: 0104.4 

Appendix D: 0106.1 
Exception 

Appendix 0: 0107.1 
Exception 

101.2 through 101.5 

102.6 through 102.8 

102.10 through 102.12 

103.1 lhroogh 104.1 

104.3 lhroiigh 104.4 

104.6 through 104.6.4 

100 through 104.9.2 

104.11 through 
10.i:11.2: 
104; 11.3 
105;2.3 :' ·:.:. 

10f3:1 thrtiugh 
105.3.2 . 

N 

N 
. -.: .· 

N. 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 
. : 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

"· N'·. 
N, 

r{ 

Established a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM, 
below 5000 foot elevation, for aU commercial 
projects · .. ·. . : 

Made ~" exception for residential driveways · 
'·. :-:. ·: : ... _,:. \·,: ..... · ... : :: 

Locally adopted and amended. 
·. 

Locally adopted and amended 
...... ·,·., ... · ·.: 

•. · ' Lcx:alfy ad~ted and ariiooded 
1-: 

. I, 

Text to indude curbs and gutters 

i=lre appa~tus -~-roa<tgates ·•.· 

Roads widths 20 to 29 feet 

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36 
feel in width 

Removed the excepoon that allows a sprinklered 
building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to 
have only one approved fire apparatus access road. 

Added to require circumferential fire apparatus 
access roads 

Removed Exception in its entirety. 

Removed .Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. 

Locally adopted and amended 

Ii · · · · 
. [()('.Bl~ adopted and amended.··. 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Adopted with no Amendments 
Adopted to establish scope, intent severilbility and 
vafidity 

References, Subjects mx regulated by the code 

Conflicting provisions, Other Laws, Application of 
references.: 
Definition of the Fire Prevention Oi'Jision arid ability 
to enforce the code : . ·, 

Right of Entry, Warrants, and Identification 

Record retention 

Locally adoPled 

Locally Adopted . 

Local! y Adopted 

Localiy Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Allows us to niatch what developers and residents are used 
to in regards lo GPM fire flow requirements that have been 
used f<il: CNer a diicade in EDC. . . .. · . 

. 

It is unreasonable to require a residential dliveway to .. 
cc,,stnicl a 26 fool wid& space for access to a hydrant 

.· .'. ,' ,· ...... · ,' ··. i '. . . . · ... . 

ttlle lirequirllll .fot us to only ~ up t~ 16% dlive-Ml)'S: 
111 our 8 Donickl Coonty Ttlle 14 adoption we aila,,, greater 
than 1 s% grad& witii AHJ approval arid hard surface. · 
:·. ".::. ·. :.:, ·' ·.. '·: : .·. -:· 

20 foot road widths shall not indude curbs and gutters due 
to potential access issues and turning radius concerns. 

Vv1181'8 fiie apparlltus access roads consist of a dMded •.. :_· 
roadway'the gate width shilil riot be less than 15 feel due to 
radius issues: . . . . . . . : 

No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet 
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does 
not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire 
Code Appendix O section 103.6.1 for all other elevaoons. 

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet lo 36 feel 
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of 
elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The 
section is adopted as ii stands in the Fire Code Appendix O 
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations. 

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 
ingress/egress are required lo ensure the safety of the 
residents and first responders. 

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire 
structure and shall provide a continuous means of 
emergency vehicle access. 

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 
ingress/iqess are r~ired to ensure the safety d the 
residents and first responders. 

Fa: the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 
ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 
residents and first responders. 

Administrative clarity 

Administrative darity 

Administrative darity 

Administriitive darity •· 

Administrative clarity 

Administrative clarity 

:;rlfications, alternate means ant methods; and . . . Locally Adopted. Admini~ clarity 
: 

... :. 

20-0203 D Page 27 of 40 



105.6.12 

1Ht3'2 throogh 
110::{4. 

110.4.1 

113.1 · 

303.1 through 303.9 

305.1 through 305. 5 

306.f through 306.2 

301:1 through 3<17.5 

308. {2 through 
308.1.3 · 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

Dry deaning operational pennits required for 
hazard6us deaning soliient use . 

·:'· . :· \:. . ' ·. ; 

AdoJ/tedthis:sectiQi for administrative darity and· 
fire and life safety inspections .· .. 

AcJopied this section for administrative daniy arid 
fire and life safeiy inspections . 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
·. fire and life safelyinspiictioos . . 

. ~ .. -........... ~ .. 
fire and life safety inspections . . . . . 

Adopted this section for administrative darity arid 
fire aiidlife safety inspections . 

Adopted this section tor administrative darity arid 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative darity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopled this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopled this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this ~on for fire 'arid life. safety 

Adopted this section for fire and fife safety 

:· ";; ·. ·. · .. 

Adopted tis seclicx1.forfire and life safety : .·. · 

locally Adopted . 

Locally Adcipted, 

loi:aily Adopied 

locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

i.ocally Adopted ·. 

locally Adopted 

locally Adopted 

Localiy Adopted •. • . 

Adminisb'ative darity. ·. 

Peni!i1$·~ various business operations for. Magril!Sium, . · 
miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food pieparation 

' l:iif1::rJ:1es~~t~'.ld 

Permit ii wO<ld products storage (chips, oogged material, 
lumtie.-~ pl~ocxt. in excess of 200 cubic feet). 

Fee sc11ed~res fiir permil$ .· · ... · 

Inspection authority 

Maintenance of saf~ards, testing and operali~ of 
equipment re-iilspection and testing, recordkeeping; 
supe!Visioo, rendering equipment inoperable: overcrowding, 
Board of Appeals established, limitations on authority; end 
quaftficatioos 

Compliance with ordeis and notices, prosecution of 
violations, arid unauthorized iampefing 

Abaiement of violation 

Authority to disconnect s81vice utilities 

Asphalt kettles contain highly flammable substances and 
require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Managing ignition sources through responsible application 
of standards wiU reduce the number of fires in various 
settings (Climatic, geological, arid kipographical) 

Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY 
flammable arid require special handling (Climatic, . . 
geological, arid topograpijicai) •.·. . 
. . 

()pen ix;ming, r~tional fire, a~dpatable outdoor. 
~replaces, {Climatic; geologicai, and topographical)' 

Open flame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and 
topograJj\ical) 

1:IJrowinjj or placing of ignition si>urt:eS, torches for . 
removing paint {Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Pen'nirs are requiied toratiove section (Cfimatic, geological, 
and 1opographica1) . · · · 

20-0203 D Page 28 of 40 



··:.....,,.-·-----,-----,---------------.-----------.----------------, 

308. 3 through 308:4.1 

319.2 

319.3 through 
319.10.3 

403.8.1 through 
403.8.1.7 

403. 1 O through 
403.10.1.3 

405.5' 

510.3 

807.5.2 through 
807.5.2.3 . 

903.2.1.5 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

Adoptl!<I this ~oil for fire and fife safety. 

Adopted this sectionfor fire and life safety .· 
.. ,· ·-:::;,.'::-·, .. : .. :: .. ···>-·:·, · .. :··;· .. .-.·._"\ :"' . . ·,·: 

Adopted this section for administrative daiity and 
fire and life safety inspections ... 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for administrative darily and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted.•.· 

. Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices, . 
theatrical pelformances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 
dormitories (Ciimatic, geological, and topographical) • 

General requirements relating to smoking (Cffr'natic,. • 
oeo1ogica1. ~nd topcigrapliicaJ) · 

~einWat~~ns ~~led, axhpliaria! ~tll '~o ~oking• 
signf ash irays. burning obj~. hazard<lus envi,ronmental 
ciiliditfons. (Climatic,. geologlcai; and topographical) . 

·mr~~ 
ofooriibustibles, remiivalof hazardous iliateiials. (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) . 

General. requiremenis ~~ting to mobtle food preparation 
vehldes. (Cllmalic, geofogical, and topog~lcal) · · 

Permits for mobile food preparation vehicles (Climatic, 
geological,· and tojl<igraphical) 

Exhaust hood,· fire protection, fire protection for cooking 
equipment. fire l!Xtingufsher, appliance connection to fuel· 
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, metallic' 
storage tanks, nonmetalfic storage tanks,. cooking oil 
storage system c:c,mponents, desigi criteria, tank venting, 
normal vents, emergency vents, LP.gas sysieins, maximum 
aggregate volume. protection of container, LP-gas coniainer 
constiuction, protection of system piping, LP-gas alarins, 
CNG systems, CNG containera supplying only cooking fuel, 
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG 
container construction, CNG containers supplying 
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping, 
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire 
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems. 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1 
(residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and 
fire safety plans. 

Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancy 
Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) · · 

Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) . 

A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Wall CO'Jerings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a 
maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in 
educational faciRties (Climatic, gedogical, and 
topographical) 

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5 
(spa1ing arenas, amusement park strudures, bleachers) 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000 
square feet. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

20-0203 D Page 29 of 40 



-· 

Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders 
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from 
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time 

Adopted this section in existing buildings for the 
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by 

1103.2 y safety of firefighters and other emergency Locally Adopted the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind 
responders. 

this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury 
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendi~ D: D101.1 N Adopted this section for the siifetr'or the public, 
·1· Locally Adopted • 

General requiieme11b for fire apparatus access roads 
through 0102.1 firefightera, lind other emergency responders:. . iiiciuding ioiiils. (Climatic:geoiogical, and topographical) 

Appencix D: D103.4 
Ad<,pted ttii~ se<:fion ior the safety of the public, 

, .. Dead. end fire apparallis · ac:cess· road requirements for a 
N 

firefighters, iind other emergency respooders. 
Locally Adopted tum around al 150 feet (Ctinialic, geological, and· 

.. . · . ' ... topographical) . 
. . ... 

Adopted tti,s section for the safely of the public, ;No Palking, Fire 1.ane' signs requirements. (Climatic,· Appendix D: D103.6 N 
firefiglitera, and other emergency responders. 

Locally Adopted. 
geological, and topographical) . 

Appencflx D: D104.1 
Adopted this section for Ifie safety of the public, Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus 

through 0104.3. N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders: 

Locally Adopted access roads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 
(exduding exception) 

' . 
. 

Appendix D: 0105.1 Adoptedthis section for the safety of Ifie public, ·. Requirements for aerial fire apparatus access roads 
through D105.4 

N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. 

Lcicafly Adopted 
(Climatic, geoklglcal, and topographical) 

·. '· 

,4.ppendix D: D106.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential through 0106.3 ·. N Locally Adopted·. 

(exduding exceptions) 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical) .. 

Appendix D: 0107.1 
Adopted this section for the sately of the public, 

One- or two-dwelling residential developments shaft be 
equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire 

(exduding exceptions) N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. 

Locally Adopted 
apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 

through D107.2 
dlmatic conditions. 

Appendix 0: 0108 N 
Adopted this section for Ifie safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle. 

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

20-0203 D Page 30 of 40 



;fflJlountatn(l)llemocrat 
PROOF OF PUBLICATION 

(2015.5 C.C.P.) 

ST ATE OF CALIFORNIA 
County of El Dorado 

I am a citizen of the United States and a resident 
of the County aforesaid; I'm over the age of 
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in 
the above-entitled matter. I am principal clerk of 
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray 
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation, 
printed and published Monday, Wednesday, 
and Friday, in the City of Placerville, 
County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has 
been adjudged a newspaper of general circula­
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El 
Dorado, State of California, under the date of 
March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258; that the 
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy 
(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been 
published in each regular and entire issue of said 
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on 
the following dates, to-with: 

10/2, 10/4 

ALL IN THE YEAR 2019 
I certify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that 
the foregoing is true and correct. 

Dated at Placerville, California, this 4'h day 
of OCTOBER, 2019 

~ovt~ 
Signature 

Proof of Publication of 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

• T - ~ ', 1 r 'd 
rt r '..l , T ! f•l t 

l r'- r •, ·. f 1 -:: 1 r l 

Notice ls,'*-by given to the lnlantlon of the 
lllarnond Spmge.£1 Dorado Finl PIWcaon 
Ols1rlc:I lo adopt Iha 2018' Callorria File 
Code wltlt ............ The Dls1rlc1 lllwll 
hokf Its h publlc 11..tng .i 8:00 P.M. on 

·, October 9, 2019 Ill !1(11 Plouanl I/alley 
-. Diamond Spring,, CA, regllding 
Iha adoption ol the 2019 Califomll Fn 
Code p,nuanl lo H-.ilt! and Sa'81y 
Code Section 138811. Coples of Iha code 
MCllon l9lend lo ind any hCCnClllry code 
sec1lona l9f1lmlct to, adopted by ref-. 
.. on Ille with Iha Secl'llaly ol lhe Dls1rlc1 
and .. open lo put,lic lnlpectlon, AdopClon 
ol lhe 2019 Calilomla Flnt Code wa enable 
d Dlslric:I ~ lo follow one HI of 
NI• and ragulalior1I wkh n,gn to lhe 
heal!h and ur.ty ol lhe put,lic and Ille 

. Cb~'s mpot,a9 "-· 
•, 10/2, lllf • 119112 

20-0203 D Page 31 of 40 



.. 

mountain{l1!lemocrat 
PROOF OF PUBLICATION 

(2015.5 C.C.P .) 

STATE OF CALIFORNIA 
County of El Dorado 

I am a citizen of the United States and a resident 
of the County aforesaid; I'm over the age of 
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in 
the above-entitled matter. I am principal cJerk of 
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray 
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation, 
printed and published Monday, Wednesday, 
and Friday, in the City of Placerville, 
County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has 
been adjudged a newspaper of general circula­
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El 
Dorado, State of CaJifomia, under the date of 
March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258; that the 
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy 
(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been 
published in each regular and entire issue of said 
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on 
the following dates, to-with: 

10128, 11/4 

ALL IN THE YEAR 2019 
I certify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that 
the foregoing is true and correct. 

Dated at Placerville, California, this 41h day 
.. ------· ____ oLNOY.EMBER,.2019 ______ ... _ ------- .... 

~i~ 
Signature 

Proof of Publication of 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

: :: '.'.. / .. . ., .. 
~JCT C[ er 1.·.~r,.~TO/,[)Ot:'f TH( 

701° (:t,LIFOnt:1,, FtnE COD:; 

NaUce;la llli9IJy • to Ille 1nien11on 
of Ille· Diamond SPfl!lgl-EI Dcnc1o· Fh 
Prolectlon· Dlilitcil- ti, adopt Die 20111 
Cdome Fh Code With . . , ··~~ '"""-,..'.•· .. " . . . . .. .. •ffl!ll!dmenb. 

.• '!" , ......,... 'lllill·flald Ila IICiJnd. pulJllc 
ll~atB:OOP.M.cnNowmbt,13 2019' ·:t.;: 501 .......... - . I u..u.;.; Road. · nd . . .... ·-, ..... - . 

. 'Ille g ~ ~ lhe'alldptkin al 
' . . -~.Flnl Cod•.P!l!IIW1t lo 

0HN1111-and:~,Code·Sei:11on· 13aeo·; 
: "Coplai of Ille COde iec:iton ,. . . • ; 
• . ..,, ACOndiry eoc1e 11e1ona =~,·-

•dcpted by ..r..ilce, in an tile wllll tile • 
• Stc:r"9Y.ot.11111 Dll1r1ct anc1.- open 1o I . e_ ~- Maptlon of Ille 2011: . -··Fh ~ wll enatile .. Dlalllcl. 

'IMflC)llnll ·to·~ one Ml of n11n -, : · , 
·~·""" llpld lo lhe'hNlh and' •.•.. 
ulacy or .111• publlc ind lhe. Dlsll'k:r, · 
l'llpOnN tbimo 

--~11128,:.111• ', : 7~ 

20-0203 D Page 32 of 40 



.. 

Attachment No. 2 

Diamond Springs El Dorado Fire Protection 

District Resolution No. 2019-10 

20-0203 D Page 33 of 40 



... .. 
RESOLUTION No. 2019-10 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE DIAMOND SPRINGS-EL 
DORADO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO THE 
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

A resolution for the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District setting forth findings with 

respect to local conditions within the Fire District which make certain modifications and changes to the 

California Fire Code reasonably necessary for preserving fire 3:11d life safety in the Diamond Springs-El 
Dorado Fire Protection District. 

The Governing Board of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District finds and resolves as 

follows: 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permits a Fire Protection District to adopt an 

ordinance which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations adopted pursuant to Health & Safety 

Code Section 17922 upon determination that such changes or modifications are necessary due to local 
conditions that pertain regulations governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the environment 
from fire, explosion, hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that a District's Board of Directors 

making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 shall make 

express finding that such changes or modifications are needed; and shall file a copy of such changes or 
modifications with the Department of Housing and Community· Development. 

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions existing within 

the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the District to impose more stringent 
requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code and pursuant to California Health and Safety Code 

sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the District desires to make express findings to that effect. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the Diamond Springs­

El Dorado Fire Protection District, after having duly noticed and held public hearings, hereby adopts the 

following findings concerning current unique local conditions that together make each modification to 
the California Fire Code, reasonably necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life, 

property and the environment more specifically set forth as follows: 

- I -
20-0203 D Page 34 of 40 



FINDINGS OF FACT 
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BUILDING STANDARDS 

CODE (TITLE 24PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL CONDITIONS 

A. General. 
After due consideration, the Board of Directors of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection 

District, hereby finds that due to local climatic, geologic and topographic conditions, as stated within 

this document, there is a need to provide the modifications and changes contained in the adoptive 
Ordinance of the California Fire Code. Such changes are deemed to be reasonably necessary to provide 

adequate and effective protection of life, property, and the environment. 

The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District provides fire protection, emergency medical 
services, and specialized rescue services to approximately thirty-five thousand people in a 93 square 

mile area. The District is located on the western slope of El Dorado County. The topography of the 

District ranges from rolling hills of grass and oak woodland in the west and oak-timber in the steep 

drainages of the east portion. The weather conditions vary from freezing temperatures with occasional 

snow in winter, to summer temperatures that regularly exceed 100 degrees. 

The District can be divided into three distinct areas: The core area encompasses Diamond Springs, El 

Dorado, and the Missouri Flat Road corridor. The core area is more urban and contains most of the 

District's existing commercial development and potential for major commercial development. The 
north and south areas typically contain small subdivisions and isolated residential developments. These 
areas are characteristic of the suburban or ranch environment. The north and south areas become very 

isolated and more rural as one moves further away from the core of the District. 

The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District is an "all-risk" agency. The District 
participates in a sophisticated automatic aid program and is dispatched through agreement by the 

California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal-Fire), at Camino. The resources of the 

District will respond to, and deal with, any type of emergency. The term "Fire Protection" in this 

document is broad and includes responses to fires, smoke and odor investigations, alarms, public assist 

calls, hazardous materials incidents, medical aid, and specialized rescues. 

The District has established one, full-time, staffed fire station and four satellite fire stations to provide 

emergency services to the community. Fire Station 49 is located in the unincorporated town of 
Diamond Springs, at 501 Pleasant Valley Rd. Fire Station 46 is located in the unincorporated town of El 
Dorado, at 6170 Pleasant Valley Road. Fire Station 48 is located at 3840 Missouri Flat Road, 

Placerville, just north of Highway 50. Fire Station 44 is located in the Logtown area at 6109 Quartz 

Drive, El Dorado. Fire Station 4 7 is located in the Sleepy Hollow Subdivision, at 2312 Oakvale Drive, 

Shingle Springs. The District has 18 full-time, career personnel, along with two management positions, 
two administrative support positions, and two Fire Prevention Officers. 

B. Climatic. 
The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District is located within a foothill region. The District 

is subject to four seasons, with an annual average snowfall in the winter months of 2 inches, in addition 

to an average rainfall of 45 inches per year. These adverse weather conditions create severe hazardous 

- 2 - 20-0203 D Page 35 of 40 

•. ,,, ,. 



. ,•. 
4 ,oad conditions and flooding as well as rock slide hazards along the main access roads within, as well as 

into, the District from the surrounding areas. Due to periods of rainfall, along with repeated road 
closures, the ability of the Fire Protection District to provide immediate emergency response is often 
delayed. These same adverse climatic conditions often result in a large number of vehicular accidents 
that place extreme restraints on the availability of emergency response to perform emergency rescue, 
first aid, hazardous materials control, and fire- fighting. The climatic conditions often result in a 
substantial or total lack of ability of the Fire Protection District to respond immediately to other types of 
emergency situations that occur. Examples of these emergency situations include structure fires, 
wildland and forest fires, flooding, hazardous materials incidents, emergency medical calls, vehicle 
accidents, and vertical rescues. The mutual aid agreements established with adjoining fire agencies 
might not be possible due to adverse climatic conditions, restricting or totally blocking access into the 
District. 

Summary: 
These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the Fire District. 
Times of little or no rainfall, low humidity, and high temperatures create extremely hazardous 
conditions, particularly as they relate to the wildland-urban interface. Winds experienced in this area can 
have a significant impact upon structure fires, especially in buildings in close proximity to one another, 
and to wildlands commonly found in the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District. 
Structures built within the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District must be built with these 
variables in mind. 

C. Geological. The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District is located within moderate 
activity seismic Zone Three. The seismic, geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires, 
major breakage of water mains, multiple electrical power failures, multiple co11apsed structures and a 
large number of calls for emergency medical aid, a11 of which may occur simultaneously during a 
seismic event. The water district has numerous water-pumping systems used for fire suppression water 
delivery, as well as water storage tanks providing water system pressure. Most of the pumping systems 
are dependent on electrical power for operation. Such electrical power may not be available during a 
seismic event. Water storage tanks used for the storage of required fire suppression water may also 
collapse in such an event forcing the additional need to transport water via additional pieces of fire 
apparatus which will place a significant restraint on the ability of the District to provide the required 
emergency services. 

Summary: 
Local geographic and geological features and processes exist within the boundaries of the district that 
may hamper the ability of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District to perform its sworn 
duties. Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life and damage than the 
earthquake itself. 

D. Topographical. The District is primarily composed of areas that are considered by the State to be high 
fire hazard severity zones. Much of the District is located within foothill terrain, covered with highly 
combustible vegetation, including the presence of many coniferous forested areas. The elevation within 
the District ranges from at 1,000 feet to over 1,800 feet at the highest point. Slope within the District 

- 3 -
20-0203 D Page 36 of 40 



ranges from O degrees to 90 degrees. The structures within the areas of foothills terrain have very ·nmited •~' 
fire access, due to narrow roadways with steep grades and poor road surface conditions. The presence of 
many existing structures within the high fire hazard severity zone areas provides for a very high 
potential of a structure fire spreading into a wildland or forest fire condition as well as the potential for a 
wildland or forest fire spreading to structures. 

Summary: 
The alignment of canyons, valleys, and slopes into inhabited areas, combined with the variable nature of 
the terrain, yield potential for increased fire risk. Most structures, both residential and commercial, are in 
or are surrounded by areas that contain significant grass, brush, mixed oak woodland, and mixed conifer 
fuel load. Due to drought conditions, beetle infestations, and lack of vegetation management, much of 
the area is populated with either dead or dying trees, contributing to extreme fire danger. 

E. Conclusion: 
Local climatic, geographic, and topographic conditions described above increase the frequency, 
intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, these conditions impact 
potential damage to structures from an earthquake and subsequent fire. Therefore, it is reasonably 
necessary that the California Fire Code be modified to mitigate the effects of the above conditions. 
California Health & Safety Code Section I 7958. 7 requires that modifications to the Fire Code be 
expressly marked and identified as to which each finding refers to which Code modification. The 
attached Appendix A provides this connection. 

INTRODUCED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the Diamond Springs/El 
Dorado Fire Protection District on October 9th, 2019. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the Di~ond 
Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District on October 9th, 2019 by the following roll call vote: 

AYES: I I l 

NOES: 0 

ABSENT: ·J \ 

ABSTAIN: 0 

ATTEST: 

(101.i~ 
Lori Tuthill, Board Secretary 

- 4 - 20-0203 D Page 37 of 40 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
101.1 X Admin 

105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.1 X Climatic/G eologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

503.2.S X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.5.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ica I 

509.3 X Cl imatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/T opographica I 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ical 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/T opographica I 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

20-0203 D Page 38 of 40 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra phica I 

6112.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 4.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 8: Table 8105.1(1) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 8: Table 8105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

101.2 through 101.5 X Admin 

102.6 through 102.8 X Admin 

102.10 through 102.12 X Admin 

103.1 through 104.1 X Admin 

104.3 through 104.4 X Admin 

104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin 

104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin 

104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin 

104.11.3 X Admin 

105.2.3 X Admin 

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin 

105.6.12 X Admin 

105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin 

105.6.37 X Admin 

105.6.39 X Admin 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin 

105.6.48 X Admin 

105.6.50 X Admin 

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin 

107.1 X Admin 

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin 

110.4.1 X Admin 

113.1 X Admin 

20-0203 D Page 39 of 40 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
303.1 through 303.9 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

305.1 through 305.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

306.1 through 306.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

307.1 through 307.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ical 

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.2 X Admin 

308.3 through 308.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.1 X Cl imatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica 1 · 

310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.4 through 310.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

311.1 through 311.4 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

319.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

319.2 X Admin 

319.3 through 319.10.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

403.10 through 403.10.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

405.5 X Admin 

510.3 X Admin 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1103.2 X Topographical 

Appendix D: D101.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

D102.1 
Appendix D: D103.4 X Climatic/G eological/T opogra ph ical 

Appendix D: D103.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D104.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

D104.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: D105.1 through 

D105.4 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D106.1 through 
X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

D106.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: D107.l {excluding 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

exceptions) 

Appendix D: 0108 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phica I 

20-0203 D Page 40 of 40 


