
RESOLUTION NO. 037-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 015-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is 
updated by the State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958 .7 and 
18941.5 permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county 
determines are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical 
conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, 
Chapter 1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety 
regulations to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building 
official, or his or her authorized representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his 
or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the 
chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and 
maintain a memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities 
pertaining to the inspection of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on November 21, 2019, the Board of Directors of the El Dorado County Fire 
Protection District adopted Ordinance No. 2019-02, which adopted the 2019 California Fire 
Code with amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or 
topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El 
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-02 of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District and 
delegates the enforcement of the ordinance to the El Dorado County Fire Protection District 
Chief, or his or her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following 
sections: 

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106 .7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202,302.1, 307.4.4 
through 307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 
505.1. 507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 
903.2.9, 903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 9 07.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 
4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 
through 6112.3, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 130-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 
Section 4.7, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D -2016 Section 5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 
7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table Bl05.1 (1), AppendixB: 
Table B 105.2, Appendix D103. l through D103 .3, Appendix Dl03.5 Section 1, Appendix 
D103.6.l, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix Dl04.4. 

20-0203 E Page 1 of 39 



Resolution No. 037-2020 
Page 2 of 2 

The El Dorado County Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, 
Part 9, in its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International 
Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

105 .6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403 .2.1-403 .2.4, 403 .3, 403.4, 
403 .6, 403.7, 403 .8 (adopting 403 .8.1-403 .8.1.7), 403 .9, 403.10.2, 403 .10.3, 403 .11 , 403.12, 
404.1- 404.4, 405 .1-405.4, 405 .6-405 .9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808, 
904.1.1 , 1101, 1103.1, 1103 .3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, 
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D 104.2 (Exception), D 106.1 (Exception), 
D107.l (Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, 
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting 
of said Board, held the _JQ_ day of March , 2020, by the following vote of said Board: 

20-0203 E Page 2 of 39 



. ,- • "" 

J u'.' 

rte 

Dccernber 18 , 2019 

Don . sh1on, Chief Admin1!.trntive Otlicer 
El D r.1do County Board of. llpcrvisor:; 

. O Fair Lane 
Pt ccrville, CA 95667 

,.,zg u _r:r()I, • ,,. u· • . 
• .~.· .. ,.,,, .' 1' /,' I ~ • y 

{ t ~ frt"· -:ty 

~ubjec.t: Resolurion Ra1ifying Ordinance No. 2019·02 of the El Dorado County Fire 
Protection Di trlct, which adopt!! the 2019 California Fin: Code with 
Hmendmcn~ rcl~kt.l lo I c l climatic, geographic and topogruphic condition!!. 

Dear Mr. Ashton: 

The El Doradu Cow11 y tir Pro1ectiun District (E Fl js requc 1ing Lh Board of Supervisors 
<BOS) ratify its rdinam:e No. '.>Q 19· 2, which adopts the 20 l 9 Ji m1 a ire Code ns amended 
due to specific local dimmic, gco~rnphic and topographic condi tions. C Ji ornitl Health and 
Safety Code Section 13869. 7 requires the legislative body of the city or count y whe-re I.he 
ordimu11.:e wiH apply to ratify, rnc11lify or deny th· adopted ordinance. The BOS must also 
delegate enforccm •nt f tho ordin£1nce to either the Fire District (or ilS representative) or the 
Chief Buildir g J t ic ial. 

Tht:refore, w rcquc ·1 !he unty Aouro of Superv isors rutif)' Ordinance No, 2019-02 with 
amcndm nts to the 2 l 9 C· Ii omia Fire Code. and delt: gate d1e enforcement of that Ordinance co 
the El Dorado o nt · Fire P tee tJOn Dis tri · Chle[ pf p se BOS resolution is encl11sed for 
your re \l iew nd us on this t pie. 

This resolut.ion h L5 no direct fiscal impa.:t to the ·uni . . 

Sine re}Y, 
. :I 
1// • ,· ·, 

_J "; ~\J-' /, ,/" #-- - . ,_ .,,.-· -

Lloyd Ogon 
Fire Chitf 

A TI A '"' HMF.NTS: 
I. El D md County Fire Pro(ection Di.strict Ordfoancc No. 20 19-02 
-i El Dorodo County Fire Proteclion District Finding of Fact Resolution No. 2019-08 
3. Draft El D rado Coun1. OOS Re:.,olution 

El Dol"ltUO County Fire Protection 01u1rld • •040 C · son Rood I Pt) Bo,: S07 • Camino, CA 851 
53\1-6«·9630 • 5J -6-14-96-36 (1"111 

20-0203 E Page 3 of 39 



,. Ir r 

Attachment No. 1 

El Dorado County Fire Protection District 

Ordinance No. 2019-02 

20-0203 E Page 4 of 39 



El UORAOO C0l1?\a\' ~110: f'l«>n.cllON l>ISTRKT 

OIU)INAN<'•· lOU-02 

---------~·-------- ---

BF IT ORDAINH> BY TIO~ U(}Af{f) OF DIRl (' I OHS Or nn~ 1-L [)(JR.\l}(J 

CUUN I Y FIRE l'ROll:Cl'IUN !JI:-:. l l<I( I ASH >UJJW:s 

An otd11111nu· o( 1hc El (,orado ( o•mty Fire: rrotrction Dt,1rict 1J-( Ff'l>l •dnpting the- ~·010 f.dit)OO o( the 

(-,1'1/tvn,a f-'11t ('od,:, Hl<_ .. f:Tl'}AlinJ! the 10 ! ll J:d1t1,1n c,( ihe /111amu10,..,f Firt ( ·("-''· rt1tul•t111g 1md JWcming the 

1.1feiuarum~ of life: uui P"Jf'C~ from ?ir~ and i:-p10,1ttt1 h:wmh 11u111i rrum 1hr .\Jufllgc. h•ndltllf and u!e of 

huirii, .. u~ subst.alK.l'-S, maten1b &11d 1~\lk.'.4"~. tUld ftom ,nnd1tl•)m h1111rrJoo\ tr, hfe or P'°r"'"Y Ill tht ,,.;cup&ney of 

builJ in~ 11n<l ptemi\<', in the F.1 D, ,r,.,lo t' 1)\Jnl) F,ro i)rutodio11 l>hlncl. prt,v 1rHn11 for the: t~wtncc o( pcnnits and 

.'.'>llc.:1iot1 ,,f fe,e1 1hctcfoc R~liOl( fJr.Jmaocc- ~r.1. 2016 fl~ ol IM U lk',r11tlo County F1tt. l'mtec111,t, Di~nct and 

all other •1'dln&tKC5 end ~ uf t_hc •.inli1lllt1\e1 iu ,:nf\llid therr.wilh 

Be it ORDA rNED by the 8('&td •Jf 01re,.:t,)I\ uf th(' 1.CJ l'lJ, 1h'l known •~ 1hc El IJ,,r..Ju C11unry f:ire 

Pr.:Jlccf1011 D,~trict 

Section LFINDl,NGS OF FACTS 

Scc11ori ;:; ADOPTION Of CODE wrTtt EXC kl'SION~ 
Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMt:N I~ 

Section 4'. CONFLICT 
Section :5; SEVERABILITY 

Section 6: EFFECTJVI:: DATE AND PllPLICATION 

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF t'ACl'S 

The El Dorado Count} Fire ['rottoccion District makts ,4:m1in lllan,3c., 1.hnN bek1Wj to 1k Cu/1fu,""' 

Fir, Code, 2019 Edition, pursu11n1 to !f,altlt d S,~(tr•, c,)(if' S11ctimu J.UWJ. ?, 17918 7 and /~./U during dm 

code tldop1ion procc.~. SU<:h chone;es a~ neccs~ary bccau:ic of local climat11:, ~logical and/1• ~gra5Jhi'-'t 

,onditions The El Dorado County Fire Protection l>i\trict h1u itd,,pt~, pu~uaut lo ,x-c1to1t 18941. 5 •1f the 

Cahfornio ff•alllt & Safety Code, the finJin1, of facu relat111c to the5e wndiuons by R~lution tlOIQ-Oll of 

the El [.>orado Cc~m~y fire Protec;lloo Oistrict dated October I 7, 20 I? 

SECTION l: ADOPTION Of CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

The El Dorado Count)' Fi"' Protection Dimict adopt~ the 2019 C.alifontia Fin Cods, Tld.t 14, P"1 9, ii 
ID epljnty. including Apt>ffldices, tncorpoRting those \CCttom of the /rvmtatioftcl/ Firt Codt, 2011 edition noc 

adopted by the $Ute, with the excltHK>nS Ii.seed below: 

Ordinance 2019-02 hge 1 
20-0203 E Page 5 of 39 



!i'.t..:.h,.,1on, 10.~.6 p.!l_l~,,J l":', lltH., 1:,, )OS! c. _\IJ9, JIU, Jll.6, Jl!, -4(/J.L 403.2:~J',.24. ~tEi, 

40 I ,I, to U,, 40U, 40l 3 (1.11loph11g •UH.8 l -·iO t .8 l 7 ). 4ff1 9, 40). IO 2, 40110.3, 40) 11, 4(}::I U, .04 I !t14 •I. 

•UIS ! ,4n~ .i. •l05.6-.UJ5 '->. -H.MS. Su5-N~ 11.:lc~m~ 80 .. ~ .i:i. S08. 90.C. I. I. 1101, I !OJ I, I 103.] ':o}.6, i 10}.9 

,adopn1111. 1103.'UJ, 110].lO, 1 !04-! 10{,, i..."haple: 25, l'hApt~I '16, 1he cia.~ol't111os undtr [Jlt'J.1; ;E,u:cpe1ot1>. 

D!06. I I l::~.,;cphr,n ~. Dl07 i I E~.;<pti,1r.,. A..ppendt•. ~ ·\p~nJ1-. f. l\pp,'11,jia. F, 1\pjo.rnd1- (1 AW•1<.t1, J, 

Ap~nd,,. K, AppenJi,. L, .-\ppcndi;i,: M. 

Ch•pt~r l 

MSJtoq 111 ¥®f 1ud c,;en!'nl k!SIIJJ!lllfat~ 

)Ol.1 I illf ~hlll ~ amt'11dcd es follo\O.S: .4.dd i,a~f •:Jl111~iiclivn {£1 L">..~m,A, C,iunlY firT /',-.,,1" tli.-n 

Dtttr•.:t ECFl'D! 

St«+o• 105 Permits 

105.6.F LPG~Lat s.h10 be amend,,d ~ foll,~-~~ AdC, tn !N: n,eriti<,.·, At or aoo~c '.-,{J(J'j ,~ ,;-,! 

elevation,• pt"llnll ts n,:.,t 1<e1.1Uired for 1ndiv1duaf c0n1ame1~ Wllh • l:!Y1i111l!L>11 Waler ~p11:i1y r,r· ie,;.1, 

,:)f nhlUipk c:onta111cr n ~term lla,..lnij an •1o11Jrc1o1alc 'iuMllll'.• 1101 eitc(«'l'li 11.~, 1altJ(I~ .,u,1~ 
u«:11p,ar...:1ei m ijrwp R· 3. 

s«cte11 ao• fm 
106.6 rcraO, r, .. H~•s• .... lntDC5Utn [HI shall be ldd~ a! follows: A St:~du/1 o.f fou 

.,..,p(rt1 ~' llw° J. ltrl.-1 b._,ard' of ,J1rtc/orJ ~ plan ,.,._.I<,. .. t,u,-.~·ttof'IJ and the LIS~ of ptrtml.J 

hy ,,., 1/ur,1,·1 mo.~ N ,.,,-,,m,J ,,. ,,,. MO.fl Cl',.,.,,,, ,hsmc1 /n s-.;;.,.dtllr ( 11,,1((>, & Suµry L«N n~j J) 

lifa-t.l Ctt• M,sowyn hes shall be added u follow,; Fire J~rvic,r /n1 ~ b« ,1t.7,:,t,l 10 iJIJ)' 

pctr,on. fin,t, coffA'HJJti<>n or b11.\i,ttH that ,,.rowgl, n•gl1pft(.-,, .,,oJat1t,r, t1it~ JtlW, or a," ratlJt of 

car*lrutwn_ i.J ~'J/X>11n(l;,I, jo, t>w cc:wst of tlw dutric( ,~ .-.i,runJ tr, t>w lcw• v/ ~ 111,-,J,,w A 

d"°",ct board ""1)' citwyr i> jH IO ,o~, tlllt cost of .:iny nrv,~ w,;l,irlt tlw Jwr,.'1 f"'C.••ttk• OI' tlw 

cost of r,,ford,rg OIi)' f"#gM/at101t far ..-leiclt tlw /H i.t .-Jwr,.,I tll•altlt t1 -~f'I Cod, J JQ 16) 11w 

J,, sJtoJJ noJ uc~u! ,,. a,ctwa/ rosl o/ .uy,,n:i.unx rlt. /tN ~w r-upu,..ti"6 ,c tJw I("""' .-,J"" 

il'lc1J, ltl. 

106. 1 A4•MUJ!h'.! Cttf! SMJI be ldded ~ tohow~. W11u a test or I/Up'l'Cf;u,,. u ~a. o11Jd 

tM ,:cmtrm:tor follr rv pufor,,t to tlw hltujiJcuon of tit« awtitortl)i itaw,"t 1wi1Jia.,,,. ,.AH.Ji, tlw 

(.>tdinat1\:C. 20l'J-02 r,~2 
20-0203 E Page 6 or .,~ 



AHJ may bill t>w '-'Orttra,:f1>, for acrual t,me ~, rrinrling Io and_(r.,,,, tlk leJl/m.t1w,:iu11 lo.x,:Jinn 

a'1<.I the 1irn1 ,,,.n, at lht IL>.rtifn.sput,o,r silt as well flS atlmimsrrolivt costs. 

SuUon 109 Board or Aopeal!l 

S,clioo 109.4 Aopeal Procedurn 11ad TtmeHnH shall fl( added llS follows: .foy pmon or entiry 

~ho bt!litw., {My May b4 advuul,r ,iffect~(i b:.; an Oh~,., dui.ria,i. ot dttum1tUJtio11 'l'ladt !1}' 1Jw 

l}rr codi! o/fic'ial tht'm1}!.h a wrllten notice "'".\ appeal tlu:r ma11u w1t>11n ! j cal,md,r day.r ,f r>w 

p,,s,mark orr I~ n<.m.:t .fl! l11ch appe,·1/s .1"'21/ b,,, filul in writing ~Ith tht' Setl'(fd"}' of the 

(,"'llf:rmng 8tJ(Jrdfor th,- di.m·1r1 .( 11mrJ.,.- <lppt'<-,J Iha/I .,,a., furtlvr action hv /,W firt wJ, official 

Mnt(/ thtt ntntl,n is .kttrmined hy Ow Ap~al Board as 01ulm~d in s.-.-,,o,. /09,]. unitJJ //tt us11e 

po.teJ a,r tmmlfll'fll /iff or life safety hazard 10 mem~r, of t>w puhlic Tlw /lre .:ode ,1_(Jir'111/ 1hali 

,,orify r~ oppelianl by arrifie,i mad of rM d.iu curd 11m, of such "'arlng T>w ~"i"S 1>.l/1 ~ 

.rc~Jultd tc, take pla1..'t: no svo,wr than 20 ,:u/endar dny.f from tht- da1, .rhow" on the ~·cr,Ui~•' mall 

T1w ap~Jlt.ml shall h.JW tlte right w apptu.r I" pu.ro,, t.,,. 6y ag~,,, at IN heurll•Jt and ,,.,.,._,.,m, orol, 

wrttt,n a,rd/or photogr'Gphic t!1·1dcnrr to tht- • .fpp,a/ Board 

Sec:tiog IJU ViolatioH 

110.4 Vlolatlon Penalllcs shall be omendC'\1 11:. follow,: Per.ion~. who shall ~ iolate a ?flJ'lli1ioo M 

this c{,ik iJr shell f,.ii tu comply with •ny of the m.,111remenu thereof or who shall cmct, instllll, 

alter, repair or du work in violation of the tpprovoj ,:x,iutructioo rfocuments oc <lirectr,c of the fire 

code offkinL or of• permit or tertilic111e used under provisions of this code, ~hall ~ guilty of• 

mud,,,....a,wJr or 1,ifrcJ£1io1t al 1/w disatriort of th~ proucuting 11trorfM!y o,- "Jl'tlt<.'}', punbhnble by a 

fine nix e,-;i.::eed,ng 1100.00 for a fir.st ,•ioi<Jt1on. } .4 fiM "°' t'n·ud,,w J.SOO.tl(J jv a ,econJ 

violaiion of tlw. ,1'1/tH provlJio,i wilhi,t OM )Je(J}'i J. A _1,,... flOl ucttding JJ000.00 for each 

,Kidirionc,I \•1oi.:x1on ({ riJe 1om1 provisu,,, wilhin OIK .~ar. ot by impri,onmenl n<>I u,~eding 180 

days, or both suth nne &nd imprisonment. Each d11y that a ..,,o14lloo ~ontinues aftor due, nociu hu 

been ~vcd shat I ~ dttmcd • ~cpanilc offcn.se_ (/1.talth & Safety Cotk Seel ions I JI ~.5 urtd J 7995), 

I t0.:4J CttalioA1 shall bco added ti follows: Tlw Firt Clti~f. or luithiu dui)· allthorr;11J 

n!pn.tttntariw, '"ay issut cltotio,u for infractions or misrkmMnor viola11,1"J of thu cudt pvrS110nt 

to S.ltion 1 )8 J J of Ow Htalth & Safe()' Codt of rlw SMt, of Callfawnia alfd • .'hopttr Jc 

(cm,tmt,ici"8 111111>, &ct ion 8H. 6) of TIJJ. 3 of Part 1 of tltt! ?,n<Jl C<><* of tlttr Slau nf ( 'ql/fiy,,NJ 

SccUot 112 SCop Work Order 

Ordinance 2(H'HP. 20-0203 E Page 7 ~oo-. 



l ll.4. FaUure to Co111plv shall be amenrled as inlluws: Any person who shall 1:on1inue 11ny work 

after h1wing been served with a stop·IA.urk order, e~cept 1uch work us that person :s directed to 

perform to remove a vinlntion or unsafe cooditiun, shall be punuhable by a jif'Jlt or imprtson~n, or 

both as de.rcribt!d in St't'tion I J().4 (JJ~·alth & Safer~· Cock &criom i 3 l ./5 a,id 1799,~J 

Cbapttr 2 

Section 202 General Definitions 

Add definition for Camp[irr · Shall m~an a fire which i.1· ustd for 1·,mking, Mr.r.:ool warmrh. 

lighlinll, or lle.,t/tr>tic purpo.n!s. Thu include.or firer ,:.omained wultm outdoor firtpl,1(U and 

enclosed stow!s with ft11•s or chimrwy.f. stoves u.singjl'llit'd, liquid or .<tolidfuels, por111ble barbecue 

pits, braziers, or space healing tk'~·ii.:es which au JJ1ed outsid~ Df any :11ructure, mobile home. or 

arry /1\>ing ..Jccm,,modation mounted on u whic/f! 

Add definition for DitldsC · Sholl mean titt Jisrricr and all othi!r areas within the itxterlor 

boundaries thereof now ar here,~/ftr establ,s~d. 

Add definition for prlnway · Sita/I mean a wJticular access rhaJ 5en,es up 10 two 11) parct/J with ,w 

more t>wn two (2) rt'siiknrial units a,,d ari_y numher of non-commercial or industrial huiJJinv on each 

parct'I 

Add definition for E!ec:ulin Bod" · Shall mean tM Board of D,rutors of the Dismcr 

Add definition for Fin Chief · Sholl mean ,>,,. Chief E.xecutlw Fire Offiur ~( tM Fi~ 

departmrnudistrict stnnng t>K Jurisdidton or a dk/y authon:ed rtpr«'Sentalfre. 

Add definition for Tral11ed Crowd Mugn · Sita.II 111ean sru"'1by ~rsonnel, u.suul/1· a se,·uriry 

guard or us~r perso~J. who are trai~d in the pm~r proct'J11re to rxil people from a tent or 

other pluct- ofpublic assembl~ in an ortiul>· and calm fashion "' lht evtnr of an tntr!rgwq 

Chapter 3 

Seetioa 302 De0nitjops 

30211 DcOalttons shall be amended as follow.: Added Campfire definition. llS shov.11 abo't'e in 

C!\apter 2. 

Sectjop 307 Opea Burnin1, Rt<rutiogal Fires, •94 Outd99r flreplace1 

307,,U Campfire Rettrktlops shall be added ns follo~: 

30714,4.l /tis Wtlawfal for any person to ligltl. ,,wintotn. or MJt a rnmpfirt Mpon or ,war any l>r-Mslt

rowertd land. gras.1.co...._red lllltd. or fortsl-COWrt!d land during 1>w ti1M when hurm"I ~nnfts an 

sus~nd,d by t~ Dirtctor of tlw Dtpurt,rwnl of For,stry Oltd Fire Proltclion. tlw ca FIRE Urtit 

C lti,f or tht A HJ. 

Excqtwn: Comwwrc,a/ cooking opualions witlt opproliOI of tlw AHJ. 

Ordinance 2019-02 20-0203 E Page 8 B,~ 



.307 .,t.4,2 WMn campJirts arc alluwed. it Jlit~uld be 1.mfrrw~I ji.>r any p,rr.wn tu lighl, ,.,amtam. or 

uu• a campji,.l Uf..'1.m any bru.1h-cvvt1Yd /arid, grcus·nH·,•recl land. Of' jurt?st-co,.,-ue.J fr111d unfr,o tlw 

fl.lliok'ing m1rt1m11m rtquir('menl..{ arc (·omphed .,,,;,;. 

30714,4,l l!l The arw within J f~rl qi rh.! pedpl,e.ry oj 1hr cw,,,,Ji,.r' l..f clr.m~d of >Ji/ ffumm,1bJ,. 

m,11•r1al U1'1d \'~1{tfatlon 

JO'? .-4.4.2 (b} Onie un1c,~11bit ~hovti ,.,,,1, a >zandlt- vf JI lea.ti J 2 il"lches i.s r,:mfx /~ uu al the" 

lmmedtatc urtl.l of l~ ('untp_firt· 

307.4.4.2 jc} Gmtp/Jrts shall b,t limOed to .i I foot hy J foot ar<!a. unitu in w1 upprovecl 

,,wm,f<Jeluri,d c,.oft1n,c i:hvice ,,,.. (;r, ring. 

)07 14.4.l j'd) Written p,.•nrtlwon of tlw' !unJown,,, rwm ~ ohtmMti prfor ro the rg1111irm o( the 

camp/ir~ ,mJ 1hall 1M on siu. 

Chapter 5 

Section ~-• I' In Aoparata1 Acce11 Ry•ds 

SOJ,l.l Oimepukuu 11h1II be :unemkd M foll()Wi: Fire llppanllUS accon roads ~r.,o have 1n 

unobstructed width of not lc"ls than 10 feet, c;,tc.lusi.,,c of ~ould~rs, as m~wuredfr-om _lai:.-t af curb '" 

/ocr of cur~. CJl:l.'.cpt for awr•)ved .securiry gares in oc.curdancc with Siection 50J.ri. and unoburt.rc1cd 

verti.;:al dca.-.ncc of not less than I 5 frtt. ,411 ,Jrnv-.. uy.r in IM diJfrlLI shall r,01 f>e it.rJ 1hm1 I 2 fut 

)4•id, 

SOJ.2.5 DHd Egd11 ~hall ~ limencied u follows: C>ead-cnd fire •pparatu.s access road~ and 

Jriwwayj in ex~5S of 150 fe,ct in length .~hall be provided with an approved area for turning around 

fire apparatus. 

~03.l.6 Bridgg ud Elnated Sy.rraccs ~hall be amended as follo\''' Where • tirid@e or 11.11 

dc\'oted surface is pa~ of l fire apparatus accets road, the bridge shall t~ co,utructrd and 

maintained in accordance willi tl-w cvrrem El Dorado Corimy T'r11nsp()rt1.111on Otvu/on Bridg, 

Standard or Appt'nd/.t D of th~ c~nt CaJifo,.nia Fire C0t-k. whicM~r u mott n!strich\, 8ridge5 

and elevated surfaces !hall ~ designed for • live load sufTicicnt lo Clll'l)' the impo~cd loads of flre 

appar11us. Vch)de load limlt:i. shall be po!ted at both entrances 10 bridg~ when req11lred by the Fin, 

Code Official, Whert- c1~·111ed surface, designed fur emergency vehicle use are adjacenr to surfaces 

which arc not de,igned for such use, approved barriers, approved signs. 0< bo(h shall be insulltid 

and maintained when required by~ tire code official 

503.4.2 No Parkig I• fin Laae, shall be added u follow,: No ptrso" sl,aJI stop, part. or t,aw 

standing C1PI)' v«hiclt, w~t~r attmt.l11d or wnalttntkd. uupt ..,,..,. mtu.uar)' to avoid wn.fttcr ,.,iJJ, 

otNr traffic or '" complia"u with tlw dtrtctio,u o/ rlw Firt Cit,./. or hWlwr duly authori#d 

~pnttltlatiw, P,au O.f/k,r or official tm_l]k contNJ/ ditYkt along tlw ,dgt of any J,ig/r.Jay, aJ a11y 

cwb, or in any Jocatiun in a pub/Id_-., or priWJl11ly owHttd rx ~ratrd olf-stnl't parh!fB {,lf.·1/ity, 

Ordinance 2019-02 20-0203 E Page 9 Br~ 



dcngnatl!cl aJ a fir-t lanf! by rht dun-1,'f with j11n,d1dwn ov"r the arN in which ff,, pJact i, l<J<ir.JUd 

The dt.,1g11a1ior, rh,1JI bt rrttlic,ued ( I) by u Si'l,i fHJSteJ 1m11tc!diatt'fr 11dja.-,u,r to. anJ ,istbit from, 

tlw ,k,r1gr,aftd pl,Kt' clt'arly HOTlfff< in ltlfu.t nrJt /e,u t>,ur, one 1n.::J, i,t he1'gJ1t tNJr the rJoct is c: lirr 

loM. 12} by outlim"R OJ' painun.L! IM pl,,, t ;,, rtd and, in rnntro,Wr1g -::olor. mar/ting 1itt pfou with 

rhe words FIR.£ L1 ,VE · ~ h1ch art' cl,arf)· ,•isiblt from u l'<' hi.:k ,,r (J) by o red curb or rfii pairrt 

on 1hit r1dge {if chit rowiway 11pon which IS dearly morkul t}~ ward.1 'FIRE f_,ANE". 

503.<4.J No r,rk,nl.! In front of llydrul.1 ,h111l be 11dde<l 4s follows: No p,tr.mn ,1hal/ ,11op, park, or 

li,Nt: stunding G'I}' ,•f'hidi. ,,,.,1,11111 J.5 feet of a fir,: li11dram r:i:apt '1{ folfows: (,,i I( r.lit ~·d11dt: is 

atfendl'd b,Y a lin·,utd d•n·«r who i.{ Ji'lzted in tht: from 1•r<Jf and who ~'a" tmmedt.Jttli· mo\'t sue!,, 

~·ehicl" in cau (}_l ne'C~.wf\ (D) If lht vehtclf' i.s uw~d or o~roteJ b.-v a _{,rt depofllfi(!n/ r:md H 

clear!>· martl!d ru a fit'e departmtnl ~·ehidr::, 

503.4.4 fin L.nu DHtd op Road Widtla shall be 11dded •~ follow~; Fir, l~$ .~h,11/ b~ t,~d on 

road width as r,:qi,,irtd in Ap~ndix D ,a arnernk1i b:,, rhe di,tricr 

SQJ.S.J Fin Appar•cu, Accen G•t~ shall be add~J 1u followii . . 411 aim,matic a""i lll(JnUi1I gatr:J 

i,uralled OVflr firt i1fl/•aranu ,x,;tsJ roadr Jha/J .:_·11mp~}' wtth lh-t distri~·r 1(cJlt slcmdard iJS appnwtd 

b_Y 1h.t fir, code n}flcial 

Section SOS fumite ldcntificaUon 

SOS.I AddnJ$ IdenllfKalaon 'Shall have the fi~I line •}( 1hls p8ni~t11pn amcndec il5 fnllows: 

,,fck/r'essr.f for Ml<' ,md ,•x1rnng b11ildl,igs shall ,:omply with rJ~ ,#stricl a.J.Jress rraHJa,d i,LJ 

iJPP,O~t!d b,ll /}w .firf C(>(N t)LfJelll/. 

S«tion S07 fin fro1ectioo Water Supplla 

507-~.l Wben Reg11ircd shall~ amend~ as tlillows; 400 feoet shall be amem:1~.J to /511,r;,.~1 

StctJoD 509.J Fitt Coalrol Room 

509.J Flrt t:ogtrol Room F,re Proltdlon and Utility £q11ipmenf i<kntiftcatim1 and Arcts.s. Lr 

!wrtby amended ~· od,/i,,g Int following to rtad, Fin spri,1Utr r/rtrs, fi,.. alarlft COfllr'OI panels. 

rolar phot0~'0/UJic powtr S)'Sttm rapid Jh111ojf, :rw/1clws. al'td otlwr fue tkt1c1ion, ·'"11f"VJSiofl. or 

r1mifor cor,tro/ N'ltch,,r sltal b, localt!d /,uuk a ringlt fin t:rmrml mom for ,,- h111idi11g. TJ,, ftrt 

control room .rhall ~ minimum d1m1,uiom offit1tt fa~r by st\le" fttt ;,. sizt w/Jh a t,:,t11/ weable 

CIN!a o_(rt0t /us titan 35 sqwa~ fHt, ~ room thall ~ localed within IM bM1ldi11g 011 '"' outsid&

woJ/ at a locc1tion ,;ippro~d by t>w Fire C~ Official <JJ'td shall 1M acceMihl• from 1~ UJerior. ,(,i 

txttrior oc~.s.r door with o cltar widllt of ftl'Jt lt,u than 31 t',w;ltts ar,,d a ,lt,1gltl "°' 1us titan 80 

i,w:~s .shall bf provtdfdfor ixcts, ln10 Int room A dlU'ablt sign lltoll bf affittd to tltit uttrior of 

tJw door •tth 1>w "WOrw "FIRE C0~7ROL ROOM" '" let1rr1 "°' I~ titan ~ inclws "' htigltt, .4 

Ordinance: 2019--02 20-0203 E Page 1 O ~~ 



by box comp/.~·mx wirl, S..·,: tio" 5<M .shall bt uu111J/,-,i on the t:.J./l'rh>r sick oft~ {IN> t'ontrol room 

Joor openinJ(.. 1'M room m"'5t ~ capab/( or mc1mtulning a thint,m,m ,~mpt'rrtlur~ ;;{ 40 degrtts 

Fahrenheit. A dearana of 12 1nd1rs shall bt p,·,w,did fro.m tiff' frrt .rpr;nklu rt~, J :o .JilY 

.uijacmt wall.t '/1,u room nm ~ shar~d wilh other building utiliflr.J or fin! pmlri:trun equipmtnl 

r>,a1 iJ compa11b/r? ,-4n upprmcJ ,=ohm<!I or co,,taml!r .shall be prrmded to store r~t·orJ plans o/ lht 

firt spnmJ.:r .syllr'm, ulhtr fiN protc,: tfon t'IJUipmttll. iJnd sil<' plan,. T~i.s room .fhail flOf bl! tni!d 

for any othrr ,,;wmge. 

Cbapler 9 

~ction 90.3 fir~ SpriDkll'n 

2QJ.2 Wbett kl'guired 5h&II he 11rne11ded as- follow~. An .sppriwcJ <1utom11lic sprinkler 1:,-.h:m .rJiaJJ 

l>-t r~q1JireJ and in.stall~d '" n-w bui/di,ws a,id tfrueturts 3600 .rquart Jett or grwrtr WfMn 

nm.flructtd CM r~Jocaud wirJ.m fM juritdlCtlfln as de~cribed in Scction-i 903.2. r lhrough 90).2. 12. 

Eu:eplioll: A.~ricultural buildings not un~r .11 sp~,:ia! use pcnn11 \J~J for commen:111: pU11JOSC5. 

903.l.a Wben Reguind shill be added~ follows: SltJIIIS of rri:rtrng b11ilding,r g,·twllrt!tan J,60<t 

1qllan feet. In ~XLi/1~ buildmK'' 3,600 squart fetl or grtattr. achu than ont ul'll1 two-famtly 

,t,; elhl'lg 11,iitJ,. u.,.,J agricwi,11r,,I buildings l'JQ( 1,1ndtfr ipecial lJSI' f>#!rmll for commrr~·i,1/ purpost1·, 

w>ierc tht ftuor r.nea of rite hui/ding or slrllclllrt' i.f incrttl.~~d by !l1f mJdition of mcm than thirty 

p,!rcerit (3(J%.J or I.()()(} Jq'llant fut whicht!vu i., /(,tr, such building or .1tructurt. Jhoi! M mod;, Jo 

i:ort/o~m to S~t·lion 903. 2. 

903.l.b Where Requiffd shall be added u fo~lowl: Status of C.fl.WrrR, buildt"l(S ltsr than J,600 

5quan feet. Jn .ixisr1ng b111ldmgi J.600 squart frtl or ltn, othtr titc:m (Jwt-and r•w•lom,IJ' dwelhng 

units. and agrir.ulrutal huildmxs ilOI ~t ,JW,:lal u.u f'('r,nJt for l·ommnciul pwrpo~; wlwrt Jlw 

Jloor aua 4,~ h11ilding or illmcturl! is increo.ttd to '1 rotal sqawn footagr. O\'*' J,6/;'J 1'1"°" fetr, 

6)' cm add1tiot1 of w,o,.. rlto,, thirt)• Pf!1"C~nl (30%1 or I, ()(}(J squart fett. whiclte111tr rJ less, such 

/mi/ding or ,Jtructwrt" sltalf bot Mot* ro ~-ori.form r<> s",·11on 903.2 

?03.l.l Group A sh.JI be 1mcnded as folk,w:,; f,)( A groups: A-1 thrnugh A-4: 903.2. U ft) The tirt 

a, e.a e;(1;;=d:it J. 600 squu,tt fcttl. 

903.l.3 Graup E shall be amcmded as follows: 903.2.3 (I) ThroughQul all Group f. fire areas 

greater than J, 600 1q11an fed in .area. 

903,2.4 Gr9!9P F·l shall be amended as follu~: 901.2.4 Group F. 903.2.4 (I) A Grou~ F fire arc• 

exceeds 3,600 sqwon ~el. 

,VJ.7 Grv,g M shall be amended IL5 follow<;: 903.2.7 Group Band M. 903.l.7 (I) A Group B 

and M fire area exceeds 3.600 JfftlO'~ jH1 

!QJ.l.8.l Mapa(act•nd 89111g shall be added u folloW5: A1t atdo""1tic /irt sprtnkJ,, ryst,m .shall 

N '""l"'"d '" all 111.,. "'afflf/«tund ~s and multi-family man11jocr111Yd ho1M,1 11-"*d for IUf 

Ordimmcc 2019.-02 20·0203 E Page 11 bMg 



tu a u11e-unJ h\'o-familJ· Jwellm.'< n,,. dt.Ii.r;n und /11s1ullation of such n'JtemJ shall l.: ill 

accordur,cc ... ,,,r Cal1Jornia ('()d, of Rtg11/atir>ITT. Titlt lJ. §JJOO. 

Except Im, s-: 

I. ,\faml}actun:d l,o,,w I focuNd ·w,thm 11.'1 di,111ng "10bl/,:lrum,• f',;Jl'K ,X,-y:'l .• mir wilh 

Cal,fornia H,alth and s,!ftl)' C.'oaL',· I )1\11.mm ! 3, Part 2.1 or ; J, 

Manufactur~<l 1'->mt.r <ltat do not t!>:.Cttd I ,20() .squar~ fi,d m si.ce umi 11:rvt! as an 

acasmry Jwe/linK ur,J( OJ ~_fim:d tn (")m•ernmenf Crx.ie- St!ctmr, 65851)2, wht., th« 

01.sting pinuny r,.\1d.!nci!. tm th1 1•rop,!rr\· 1.s not rcq111r.:d to ,,11t:ply w,1/t Ca//Ji1mt11 

Residential Cock S<'Cfli.l'l R.?H1 

J Afam,fllL'lurl!d homt'.5 that do not t.tcu,J 3.20 square fer:t 1,1 .uzt. 

90J.2.9 Group S-1 shall be 1uncndcd as folk,w5: 903.2.9 Gtoup S. 90L!.9 ( I) A Gro11p Stire area 

~xc-Js 3.6()0 ~q11au fe~t. 

903.2.10 Group S-2 Eoclosed Parklae Ganect sh1dl be umended as follows: 903.2.) 1) (I/ Where 

rhe fire 11tca of the enclosed p11rkittg g.:irnge exceed., J, 6()() sq"ar~ _ftt1 

Secho• 907 f'ire Alarm and l>t1tclion System~ 

907.l.• Wbcrt: Req11ind - New BuHdinti or Structures lcn than 31§00 square- reel '>hllll he 

added 11 follow~; .4n a,11,ruwd/ire ularrn.'delt(llun J')Jlt'm shall b<t in.rmUt>d In all b111l,lmgs with a 

floor arw Jess than J.600 .squart fut 

£.xceptfo1u: 

I. (°iM- and twnfamily dw,ellfnxs (R-J Ckcupanc,e,\' a,id ot~r occupant:l(S das!ljt.-,i 

ilS ··u·). 

J 

.4K7"rcult11rnl bulidings not imditr .,pt!cwl use JH!rmif anJ/,Jr not used}nr ,;on,m('l"dal 

purpowJ (t.g. rttai/J suln, _t,-.,>J s('r-.'ice, and/o, Jf.'"cwJ t'Wnt.1) 

Rvi/Jit1g.t with a Jloor arl!a lut 1han JOO squmt. /ttl Ma)' be eumpt, ill ckttrmirwJ 

by tht Fire Chief or ht.t!hc•r duly u11lhori1ed repre.\'~ntati\Jtt, ba.ttd on building 

.:."Qnrtroctio" rr,aterial a,wJ /totu~s. location, <>C1.'U{XU1t)' type, and ,list,,m-~ rv 

t_-rp<).\1'Tt.\. 

907.2.b SlatgS or E19tins 811Hdinu shall !>O ad~d 4S follow~: In f'.X1Sl"1g bu,lchn1r wtllw>wt aTI 

appmwd automaUc sprmAJtr systtm. ot~r than OM· or rwv-Jamily dw~Wng rmitJ, <JKTltultura/ 

huilding not v~r J~t ie1J use permit for ,ommt'rcial p"rposu wh,rt u jlrt alarm <klldian .syJttm 

®#J "°' ~iist and,;,,, floor ana oft~ bktlding or slructurrt l.r lncrea.rtd or modified by 11t0n than 

thirty percent (J(/%) or I. (J()(J Sl/flOrt f~•I. whi'111vu is /1.u. SMClt in,ildi~ or struc111r, sho/1 ~ 

,rtQltt to conform lo Su,ion 9()7 wlw1t rtqt11rtd by tlw Fir• Cltitf, or ltbllwr dtily 0111horiztd 

npr1s,n1a1ive. 8111/dings wilh ufloor ana f,s.s tlttm 5()() squarr fo,t may bt txt1"pl. as •r.r11i,wd 

Ordinance 2019-02 20-0203 E Page 12 8,~ 



by tilt. Firt Chi,'}. or hiitlier d,tl~· ,111/hariud rtpresl'rlltlllw. based mi b14ilding constr11cflnr1 

rrwtawls a"'/ ftUJa.us, location, oc,·upam::y ry~, and d1'.1ta,rc1 to t.rpo5uro 

90i.l.c ~tonUorlnr shall be added n fo1k,ws: AU /irt ,1/,mn,Jttution J)'jtt1ru fh.'lll !ii conn.:ct~,1 

dirtL'l/.v through mt<i mo11itorl!d by n U. L apprrwtd cr11tr,,I, /H·oprietar.· or rr"wll .JU1;0n Jen·i,~t:. 

which gh>e.i u11diblt and visual J1°R1wls at a con.st,1111/~1 ""'''"'"d locmio11. All .iprlnil..:rtd buildln,,:.1 

,hail M momtnr.tJ. 

Ex~plio1u; 

I. u,,~. and fwo4amilv ,l\,,t1/h11g.s ,'f.:.j (>r:cup,innt!J. and ol~r ll(OJpanc:H d,uJijit'J 

lU "f) '') 

i A,',j1'1.:.ultr,ral building., '1(}I under ,fpt'ci'ol uslf! {Nrmit und!ur not u.rtd f,:>r cammrri'ial 

purpoies (t,g,, r-ttm'l.1 .ralu, fovd J<frvicr, a~or .spec1<1/ 1'.Yl'nf~i 

90i .l.d Tyo« I Hood lastallaUoD1 5h.aH be added L" follows· Tht nrquiremo,r of ilt!tall,uion, or 

rtplacetr1tJ'fl, of a Ty~ 1 Hood ~Vjft'tft Jnall rtqulrt' ,1 (IN 1,lar1,t/Jpr1nkltr ,.,,,ni,oring ;y11r,.,, lo tu 

i,islal/iul. 1>r for IM hood ,l)1.rflmr lo ht a,m,er:lt:d IO ar, r:dsting J1rt "larm.'rpririld~r mon/lorfog 

sy.1ttmfor lntJ/ building 

~'l'.6.2.J S~opdan Powu Supply shAJI be added u follows. In t1cc..·"'·Jm,c~ with NFPA 72, the 

5~cond.i.ry pt)"'+'t!" n,pplJ fW•)\lldir,g ,i minitnum .'I ·hm.r fXJ't'H.r ,::11pu.;1,y untitr q11if:Jt·~nt /()ad 

(system apuatmg in a nt1tHJlurm wndition} .1h,1/I hr anttl'llkd to a rnintmum ~2-ltour polWr 

cop,.idry. 

E.r.cq,tloff: Tlte OW1'1kt of an l.'mergtm:y had:-up po...,a ,mpply that meets ur t!J.cti•J tht

r"'l'"'~mt111S ol Cuh/r,•tila Firt CO<k C'hapctr- J l 

Chapter 12 

s«tiy9 1203 £mergenn •nd Staadbv Powt:"r Syslems 

llOJ.J J l11•tallatio11 .shal I be amended as follows; Emergcn~:,i po~t systems and Mlndby power 

system, shall be installed in 11"on:lance with the California Building CoJe, the C111ifomie Electric: 

Code, Nfl'A 110 and NFPA t 11. All build111gs, otlter tltim vM· .-md r..o:fomiiy cJ....-;/l;,"f u11io, l11'ld 

agric1Jlt11ml building:r nfJt k!Itd for commercial pwrpusts, with .ttundby po'IWr, .rlwJJI "°"'~ a shunt 

rrip d~ict tnat dacon~cts all power soMrcls to the build,ng, opproll(!d by IN firt rl><lt official 

l.ti.Iting uutalla11an, 1#toll N maifllaiMd ;,, un:ordann witlt tlw oriJJinal approval. 

Chapter 33 

Sectioa JlJO ACC!f! {or flreD1-tfn1 
lJ lU Pruiue ldealUkatio1 shall be &Jded as follows: Prior 10 and durtrtg cmurruction, a" 

appnn~d addrtss sign sltoJJ bt pro-ridtd al ,adt firt aJtd tlfW~n<:y wlticlt accr.1.s rood ttrtry into 

tlw proJ~cl. 

Ordinance 2019-02 20-0203 E Page 13 g~ 



Srclion 3.312 W atn ~um1ly for Fin i>rou!cdgn 

3312.J \\'hen Reguit~d iball be amended <1s follows: Prior ro comliusriblt matf't10/1 arr/l'inR ort 

51ft' the fire hyJranf water .rr.\ttm 1holl bt mstafle.i a11,J mainw,,,,:,i 111 conl1nu.,w ,,perolimr, Thi 

am()Ulfl ()_{ waru .11ipph.:tl JJui/1 mu/ r~ r<1quire.dfit1 /fo11• F.">r rh, pr()Jt.:t 

Chapter 49 

Sccllon .a90J Pl11ts 

4903. I Whctt' N.equirvd s.hail be added M follow~: T!w .. fir, c1)•~ offic"'J ,J( t!k' E:I D{)rado ( c,un(~' 

Fin: Prorcctkm District may r!'!qu1H .kwlopmt·nl fl"t!i1:ct.f /ocored in A-fodt•ra1,:, High m,J Ver:,.-·-H,gh 

Fire Hawrd Sl!'l'atl\' lo,~s lo u,bmir jirt: protf!Ctfon pfart l'his plan shall be approw.f ~-'' both rhe 

/ir~ cod,;:. ojjic,al and IM a111h..,rued rtprt:s,:nlatlvt:' fr,r the local CAL FIRE Ti,11r Chief Ii( fotaied in 

rh< Stall! R,H1xiruihi/i1r :1rt<J [SR.,t lJ prior ru rht r~cording uf tht jit1af map fM th# prt1/tct by ,~ 

Cou111.,1 of El Dor,1&.1 

SHU~)g '490S Wild Rn Protection B•Uding Cyp.llruction 

"90~.4 Roof C9aatrvc1lon Reuuiremeat, -sh1tll be 11ddcd as fnllo'-''5: All n•w i:umtr,,oio". 

inc/1,dt,ig addition.,. requ,r-~., ,1 C/aJ.s ,-( rvof rn1·ai11~ or 11.'iS~mbf~· .4J/ re-r,x~fir,,g rtqMire.f Class,~ 

,,,,Jf c1Jwring or assemMv a.I a minimum. R~-r1>(1fi11{ in •Het$J of 50% (}fan u1.t11!Jfg .11r11cturc 

wirhin ar1)' unt J't!'OT p~ttod will Mces-'ntilt<' thai the errlrrt roof~ a Clas.! .4 mo/ c1H"tnng or 

autmbl.v as a ,,,,mmMm. Clrut li t>r C fire rr:t,Jrcitwnt treaud und or nan-tr~attd ...,c,o.d shait or 

:.ltinRit'.! are no/ appn:w(•d o.r u roof co.-,rlng moterwl j~v Class,( ..i.,u;,,bty 

Cbapcer ~O 

Se<&ion SOOI General 

~001.7 LJabiUt\· for Damaces. shall be eddcd 11~ follows: Alf.l' damageJ or ,oit rffs11J1111g fro"' tlw 

i:uul~S.J liandi"'g .rpUI or di~charg~ <>! any har.urdous mattr111/J shall ,;omlilMt!nl debl against any 

.sue/, p,..r.t()tl, firm or L·orpnrotfrm rnu.ung such 1pi/J or discl1t1rge. This <kht i.r (.:olle,11blt by tlw P:fre 

Chi~/. or hisllwr duly aittlt,>r~td rtprtJ('fltJtr,•t, in tltei samt "'"""-' as in tht cas~ of WI ob/igaJ11m 

1md«r cu1t1r11ct. upnt.Jjtd or imp/11J 

Chapter 56 

Sedioa S601 Gtper1I 

5601.l PermU Reg1lred shall be IUTlendcd a:s follows: Pcnnits shall be required as ,et forth in 

Section 105.6 and regu!Aled in accord~ with this section. l+?iere u.ploJIYu JNrmiu irt nquind, 

they sl,all bl wwd by the fl~ Otte/, or hwh~r duly authur,:ed repruen1011w~ a,,d I~ El Doroda 

Coun~· Shsrt(f'.s £Hpart,ntnl ()( tht P(actrvilft Polic, lkparlmt!rtl Wlw~ Jtf'flworlu p#rmits QfT 

Ordinance 20 I 9-02 20-0203 E Page 14 8'"91 o 



r11q,iirr1J, thty .shall fie i1n1rd by thi: Fire Urr~j. u, hu/Jrcr dwly authorJuJ rrpresmt,:Jfre . .i"41 t>r 

£/ Dorado County Fiwrd of Sup,trvi.sor.f. 

5601.2.1 Doc:um11Rl11lion shall be added n, foll•..1ws: TIM! AHJ shall hrJw, th6 authoriry to rr.qut<xl 

dr,~·unttnlatwn r~garc/•11~ all aspe,;ts o/rh<t fir~\~Mk.l prrs,mtatirm. 

5601.2.2 PrupritlU)' lftformalioa shall be added tH follows: Th# .f JU w1Jt protect uN pmpr1o't,1r~· 

l'!.fi1rnrmion. 

Ch11pter 57 

~cttoa 570-4 Stora11«: 

57CM.2.9.6.1 Lo~alion, Wbue Abov~Gruund Tanks •t! rryhlbhed shall be Jnlcnded as 

follows Slora~e ,_.r Cltt'il l and Clu., 11 0.tmmabie liquids in 1bovs= ·lU"uod le.nlu ootsld~ oi b111lJing,; 

is prohibited 1mlt.H upprm:"d by tht Fir·tc Chif"J, or his, ik:r dMl_v 11utlwriz~d reprr:srr.t1i11-.,t:. rn~11 

ptrmi11ed hy the hrt! Chief. or hi.flht,· duly owhnriud repro~nra,tw, all above gro1,,,.,f t,mk1:11 ,:ir 

WDJII in:stollmiom for tke Jtorage f)j Clas:r /, II llr /1/ jlam,,mhli! and r:ombustlble liq,miJ .1~11 comp/_•· 

11.-ith tltose r<fqUlrt'mt'ntJ as rt;forth by I~ C,1/ifi)rnta Fire Crx:J,. Tht Calijonria Fir~ Cud,• Jha/1 also 

apply to rru1a1lammt ,-,tliiir than rr.CHQr ~·r-iridt /'liill dii~mm~ uatrrin, where abr-1~-e-~1·r11wl ~ftlrut?t is 

rf!qu1rcd 

Seccion 5706 Sped11I Operation~ 

57%.l.,4 . .f l-,outiou Where Abon-Gruiand Tania ure l'rohlbHt'd shall be amcode<J a., follows; 

Storage of Clu.\ I and Clas:. U flllfflm11ble liquids in above-ground ranks out~hfo of bu tiding~ is 

prohibilcd 11n/ni approw:d b_\o' r~ Firt Ch/;:f: ur lris.1h1tr du/~· <1uthorizt?d r~prt.Xt!fllatiw. When 

~rmttttd by I~ fir,: Chief or hil,,•/v.r di.I>· autno,rud f'f'.prf.J('r,(,Jli\'f:, all abo"H gr.111./ t(Jflk./!I/ or 

vm,I, instt11lati,111s for the Jtorage of Cla.n I, II or JI/ ,llamm,1ble aftd .:omb14:rlthlt l:qu1dJ shllJI 

comply w11>, /host rtquircmenl.s a.s ,h!I forth by the Ca/ifrJrnw F1rr Code. T>K Culifon1111 Firt Codt 

.1/taJI also iJfJplv 10 1,u1aJtat1mu otltu tha,i MOlor wltldr fa,,,/ dispensing s,ati()nl' w/terl! above

ground ,11oraxi: iJ r~qumid 

Chapter 58 

s,tUgn 5806 flammable Cnogepjc t'luids 
580§.l I ,hM091jon.1 ihalt ~ ttmemJcd as follows Storage of flamm,ible cryogenic tluids in 

.stalJOfll.r)' containen outside r1f buildings is prohibited unlu:s opproW!d by tit# Fl,.. Chi~(. or huih#r 

dtJ_y m,thorm.d ~p~nntatTVf. W1it1t ~n,,itttd by tlw FIN ClticJ; or hi.v'lwr dMly outhoru~d 

r,pnstr,ta,i~. all staJionary contaiMrs for t.lte flOnll(f ofrftllffmablt cryo,rtnlc.' ftwtdJ Shall compl:v 

wltlt those r~q11inmenu a.f s,I forth by tlw Culifarniu FirT CO<M, 11t, Coli/orn#o Fin C°'* slta/1 

Ordinaoce 2019,02 20-0203 E Page 15 6f'!91 1 



,·J/.11> opply /u 1m1al/ot({Jllt 111,W, tit.m mntm wtiru:J,: ju~/ dt.'i/Jt:nfi,ig _;f,itiQ,u wire~ .ilf.we-grmmd 

.,toraj,':t' 1s r.-q1,1red 

Chaptu 61 

Secllon 6104 l.ocalion of LP-Ga1 Co••••ntr, 

6 I04.2 Muimum C•p•dh withan [stabUshtd l.imfb .shill! be amcndod a.s follows Tht!: Jf()rtJ>{e 

uf llquC'./l«'d petrol.:um gas,,, t.t~·uJ ofan aggregaf<' o.f '!,000-gallon water ,:apaciry w>,io,, lo,.-atcd ai 

lt!a.sl on~-hc1/f (///) milr fro/'11 pmJ~rry w~d or d1ts1.~ated for re.ndtniia/ use ,md ar /r'.LSI ,1~-h.:,(f 

(ll.,') mi let frorr, <' nsri,ig residenrial .ttwJopment with o de YU it)' g~artr tltu11 •)M (1 J ~-e/Jmg unll 

~r acr« and ar leas/ one-half (}/2) mile from any note{ or motel is uli<n,·~d .. ·1¥11 A.HJ apf"lr'IH'f!,t 

and tJ .fpecit1lli:ond1tio1Jal u.se [N'l'mil rs luued by t~ Coumy of £J Dorado or tM City oJNaetrvilk 

Dis~nri,iJ( within c.,tahlished limits. Withi11 thl! limiu e.rn1blished by Iii- run-1.:ring t/tt ,ILf/~rfKm 

of liqutt/ieJ pt>t1·oleum gas for 1l1t! protution of hem·ily pupulairJ nr t oi,gtsud ,1rtw, 1.>. u~g,11r 

c11pac1t)• ,if any onl' installation shall not en:eed a watrr capacity ol 2, ()()0 gallons T!w d1tpt''I.Wtg 

o/'liq11e/1ed pelroleum gas in ex,·ess of an aggregate of 1. 1)00-gullnn water capuclty wllf11 lornttd 

at least ont!-hnlf (/12) mile from pro~rty ,m,ed or dt!signated for N!fi<kntial UM a,,J or l1tlll OM

ha~f (li2) ,,11/e from nt.~ling rl!sidential development with a da11ttv ,;rMtu ihun ottt i l,t .t,11tll1,w 

uni/ ~r acrt! and at ltast 0'1~-hall (/12) rr1i/e from a"y hoftl or tr101tl /J allowed wlwr, A/11 

approved and a .specialkonditional use ~rm1'1 is iss11ed hy the County ol El /Jom.-Jn 1v thi, < .·11-;, <J.f 

f'l11arvillt'. 

SediOD 6112 High Elevalion Liquefied Petroleurn Ga, ln1t1tll11ion• (S.OOO-root elt~9Uo1t aod 
•hon) shall be added 1s frtlk1....-s 

6112.l Rgulaton ~hall be added as follows 

Two-.stage rtgulator system shall~ ,r1..lfall~d In an·orJm,a with mat1&ff«1eturdr rt!qu,r•i,wnt.r 

Two.stagt'- rt!gu/11tQr syJtt'mJ 1/tall blf imln/lt't/ on all LP(J imtallal1o'IS. 

Tlw fir:rl stag~ ~gulator .rhail fw. 1t1.It,J/l~cl *'""'' tit• hit1g~d gaugC' cu~·t!r .~u!Jplitd with thf. tank 

Tht atmosphtric p~.nur~ ClfH!rtuu ,}f rltt , .. g11l,m1r shall ~ P,Jifllt!cl dow,rwar,1 n,, first SIUB" 

ry~a.ioJor .shall b<t plu,nbrd to I~ r-~r c,/tlw yard piping wilh .raft cop~, 11,hJng to allow jlt.ribili,y 

1lto11ld ,an.t shiftitrg ocnir ~ m,r fro,,i 1/iw yor# p1pmg 1irall bf 1o~.,,1tJ It()/ ltt()f"t rlnn j lndtt .r 

(horilorrtal/y) fro"' tlw walls of tlw tan>.. 

71w ncond 11ag. ryg•lcJtor and ri..wr p1,,. sh.JI/ ~ ttuta/lrd .,,,,_,. tlw 1cr,,1 of c!M b"ildtng, as ck»lt 

as prochcablt! ta tiw bui/dittg wall. ntu ,u,r 1itall I,, •~cllNI> support,dlbroc~d to tltt wall 

approx.i,nattl;~, JO 1nclws below tlw l"f',CNlator so l1S to p,tWlfl btrtding of tlw pip, l,"y (aJ~ral 

Jl'f(}W/ict1 JoorJ.s 

Ordinance 2019-02 20-0203 E Page 16 8~12 



. .( prortmve .:ow.r-, oppnm:d by 1~ gas 5uppli,•r unJ Building O!Ji.-,u/. ri,aJI bt JnstDJJc/d ovrr /he 

sutmd stag~ regt,lmor ,md iaurt!IF mpportc,I to thl' grouml or diagonal/.,, 10 tltr wall 

Tlw ruu pipits for t~ yurd prping shall not ti. l'mbe,lded in Cotic:r~te. CmM:ri:re pl.xed ,,mam.t 

.rvch n.ur shall /1e ~Id bt1elc al leasf 1 mclr trurn all sid~J of the pipe. 

-~' tht cim~ of appli,allon {u· .:111)-' buildinx ptm111 .,..hid1 inVofres riw 11utll/J11tio11 of an LPG nrt,m. 

tht ,ipp/t(anr shall .rubmi1 ,in JJ>G sy1km pio1 plan in 3 ,opie.t (or dig1tt1JI~· .2.r ."f)F} r:~ LPG plot 

p"1n .rhall include. but noJ be limited to. tht tanA lowrwn. pmpoffd ton); capar:ity if! '/S gal/om. 

ruuu o_(yard pipi11x. fon11fon ,,_(the ri.ru pi~ at 01tt building, prn~rty bo1md,1rits. Mi an uutliN 

11/ all r1:isr,ng,'pr1_1p.1,·,.J huilJings on Iii< lot ,md a drpi,:tlon of th, rid~:dint" of any b..,ldm>: to he 

u,pp/1t-d will, I.PG Thi.f s!taJI also b, filn.·<1,dai to tit,- <1ppmprit11,• fire district /I) servt as 11 

Jn,·aJor "'ap in ew,e/ nf <1rr f11tl'rget1<)' 

/.ocarion oflM c:r!nttrlint' of LPG tanb shall bt ,~rmanr,rr/_1 marAld b,· tl,.e r.:st ofs,,.,_,,. st.ik., oN 

01 toch u,d, Surh .rl~s shall bf! ,~( .niffic/t!rtf )1;!ighi lo bt •·ilibl, llrrough an11r.:1pwtJ ma11m11m 

sno1it· tkpth at the rr!s~,:t/11,.. lm:<1/inn lml,1ll111ion and moim,nm,a o/ l~st' snoi. Jt.l~r.r IJN' t~ 

rt1pom1biliry 1Jf tlK LP<J u:.tr. 

Propant' applian<ts and acce,soritJ shall no/ ~ P"'""tted in a,iy nt-.v installariun btl1Jw tht Jir:st 

tloar or ~to .. - ~rwk, whl,nr\'Cr 1., mr.,u .•,orrt,·riv-e 

6112.l Vertk•I Rber P,p1a2 shell be 11dded as follows: 

Minimum ofSdwdult 80 · iron pip(ng. 

T~ ristr .slwll ~ wilhin 3 inchu hori:ont.ill)· rJJ the Jank. 

Swmg jomts sltoli ~ 1ns1al/,:d abow and f'J~fow IClltlc. lt!vtl lo pr1J\'i1Jt1 fort~ tanA muYn1•'"' (Strett 

,/b(,.,.s shall lltQJ ~ wrd_J. 

A li.tti!d /l~".1.ib/11 ristr ,·01t.flr1'Cfed ol t:opp,tr or .r:am/e:n-Ju~I t"Nh1ng a,rd ?"Ol•dtd bv Jiwrl coWri!d 

.rheathed matf!rial may be u.ud tnstf!°'I of .rwing 1olt11J. 71K _flc.1iblc aitrrnom-t .iitull 1mJ11i<k 

sufficit,rl slack. to allow .for rank move,,,t!nt 

61 ll.J M9rldng and LonhollJ shall ~- added 11.S follows: 

Ar, 41ppmwd slg,, jltaJ/ M l,>caud J1rutly abo~ I~ riJer .O,ut off ~·at.~ 011 (}w b"'i/,Jtni ltt a visibl, 

lo.:otl(Jn 

·TM l1qut!fi,d fJ('trolr'um gas supplier Jha/1 affu: a Wtllthtrproof fdt!,uific4llro" ta~ 10 tit, i,u1J# o/tM 

tan* valw 1,rotuting co1>«r. Thir tug shall roNtain tlw rt1ppl,rr's name and l'fMrgtNr ttlep!,oM 

"""'b(,r 

Tmtk i,utallation shall ~ f:Jf!NttOMnlly marked hy a meurl or wood 1"iJt•rial .rnow ,i,artu, with a 

"''"'''"'"' dilM,uion of Z 11tefw.J by 1 (ncl.s Tlw J'90W marker shall ~ of n,jfkitnt lttighr to rise 

abow rlw a"'"'°/ snow ditprh aNJ shall ~ a mlnimMm of IO ftet Iii h#ight. T1w .rnm.- "1'1TQrs shall 

~ painte,I ~/low and locatrd on vppo1itt tnds of tht tanl 

Ordinance 2019-02 20-0203 E Page 17 8f~13 



• 

Section 6 l 13 t: ndu:round I.Pt; hnkt l111t111Jatfon1 and 0'!:ntnhlp ~h, 111.-c iu!ilcJ 11 fttll,N,\'. 

6ll3. I Perndb aod Plant ;hall ~ t1.1.idcd u tolltlW~ l'nmu, s>raJI .~ ~r1;1w .. ,I, an,i rJ:m ,· ,h.:JII htt 

.n,hmltud fi1•· u!I "".laxrvwmJ tunk. i>utuilatwns as apprm"t:J by I~ :OU 

ill.J_!!..i.' !l.'!!!f rou•d I.PG 'Tan~ Owaenbip sh11ll ~- eddr:-d ~ foll,,~,; 1 _,iJ,·t,(n.Julfl.· U't, 1,mt1 

1hall t., f"·,·,>.1h1udtr,1m !,, 1,r,.: wJ.I to ,~ncl-11.n-r.1 ,md Jhali he rttm,it:d by th, LPG nJ•1tptm 11md,r ,, 

lt!an'-f_H>r ", >It!"' lu ,,u1.1•"t! pr,Jptr ,mm111/ mwnro111>1tr >eqwr,•mr!,rl~ arf "'"' ark/ an,r.kd 

Chapfe.r HO 

S«tino '9. NFPA. t.30-16 - St•_~J•nl for eta. l•••-•.IJ~11,,• of SprinlLte, s~11tenu ia Oae-aod T"o 

Funlh Dw!Jtiap and M.,.uf1ctu!Jd Hoam a11 amended 9fJJ.J.I.J, 90).J.5 

NFP A I.JD, Amudtd ~ctions at follow~: 

Add ~ctiotl -4. 7 lo rtSd a, follows: 

~trr $9. Nt·p :\ l3D ... 7 RtJidt,,11,li fir,! 1rr1rr.In • ~j/f1'0 rhJ(,i/i'd Ill uli ,,,,.,.. ""'' ·,JIIJ (Wo:h1lfflh 

Jwdltnv .1rull utill:t 11 '1't1SJ,W, Purgt•" J>:flt~ de•1gn l,llf/4J1 O,hr'ntllt •'('f!f'<,W,I hyi'w frr# (,-..;, 

I J/fi1:ttJi 

Ut..Yplitut. Mum,{c,ctur,•,/ h.),nt 1mllilltd, (t!Jlt'd a/Ill approv~a· b}' I~ Cal,(f1niw L<tpan~"t .,,. 
Ii• •1.Lll"lf at,d C,;m,,umU\' l'*''"lurm,•n1 

k.nt.r SK11na S.l.1.l to rad .. foltu,n: 

Ctuae•~r 80. Nff!\ IJU~J...J.J_ . .f •"i'f'I•· ,·: ,- lll l, .. w """ -1t tad, rypt. and tt:mp,mirwu I!'Tut.tfrr w.1~ 

Wilhm I~ {lfl.'ltli.~C'\' f,.,.11! ~ ,,1111111,011,-,I "" /~ , ... ,.,.,,.n, •II ,m 1if'f•r,Jii.,d lt•,;',J/l(•n Sioct: :;,iff*il'r~ Ji,a/f 

f>t, tlpt in a ,nounJ~J and ,,111. n·ulb/r. c dh,,,,.., 

Rn-we StttioQ 1 .6 to rad •• f Plk,.n: 

Chaplf[ 80. Sfl" A IJO. '7 .6 . .f l,x,1i '"1f~r /7()-.· ,llnnn .r!tl,/1 h, prnvlil,,l ,m ,ill /Irr: .,prlnlw,. i~lfr'IH~ 1H 

>iomr..t al an appruwd lo,·,111tm o,i tltt .·.ttt'rrnr ,:,( rlN ;hi'l/my, 

Rtvbt S.-cttun l 1.2.LI co rud u foUo"-s: 

\'.b•nttt 80. NFPr:\ up. ) l...2.1.l 'w'hete .. fire deportment pU!nJ)tl <:,)nt\(>.:ll<JO u l'IOI ~rm1dcd, the 

,y,1cm shall be h_v1!rry,ta11c.allv re:,ted 11 ,1 minimum pre.rsun of J 50 f"'tJfhlt ~r Jq~ i,·1, ,t1111k(t J'c-r 

nt.., /01 I~ a J(l.lftj•lk/t ,fu,,111,111 w(1"1,,1,11 ,\1,if'1t,:1• of /~a*agt. S~~lt It!/ Jltaf/ ~ WlfnuuJ h.Y ti" fl~ 

rod, offtnai 

20-0203 E Page 18 ~'!91
"' 



Ap~ndh. 8 - Fire Flo,. ){'"quiremenrs ror Uulldings 

Tabf~ B105.Hl I ({rgui~d Fire Flow for Ot11'- acid 1·"'1rt·arnll\' l>wellioe~. Group R-3. 1ntl ft_. 
BuHdam Hd Towuhou1es ~hat! be amen1fd ~ follows /;It elt..atioru ~el,m 5 OOO(f't/' 

t,"lkF.,fLOW 

C.H,f ll LA TlON 

.~REA 

1iq11art fut) 

0 .. J.M:W• 

I AUTOMATIC 

f 

SPRINl\1.t-:R 
SYSTEM 

I 1D~it• 

'111-.IMUM 
F"IRE

FLOW 

("allun• prr 

FLOW 

rnnuTJO~ 
(ho11r1) 

i Standard! 1 lnlnutr, 
----l- ---·----· 

, ~priiu:kt 1_,~l•m __ _ 

i No . lllllfolll-lk 

j ~rirJ,; kr ·,~ ll~n• 

I. 

! .-----1 
l Se1:m,1, \lflL 1.1 1 

j ;,r 11'1t Ci\. nre 
I /''-,I <• ' I ,uue ,,r ,.,,,:1100 

j 31 U ')f ,he CA 

-·-------1 M e-it,Jt~t~al C~k ______ _ 

i ~:1,,J> ~JJ.l~I_ . .: 

, ,,f \he c ·" nrl': 

('oot r-r ~ection 

3UJ "r chi: CA 
llt,,.Jr-111,,d Codt 

:. l,11(•1 

v.1 .. , in r11blc 

HIOjl(l! 

, able 

[.1uf11t1C11"1 1 n 

hble 
H 1111, Hl) 11 th, 

"'G'""',d rite-

fl IO~ 11'.2> , 

~;:;_J __ 1::>.- _____ L_ 

Table 8105.l RNuired f"I~ Flow for Buikll,ca odler tlfaa Oae- •pd T"'o-f'1ait" 
Dwellih.&1, Group R-J. and R..,. Buildings agd T1nubouK1 shall be amendd &~ 

follows: 

i Al'TOMATIC 
\ SYSTEM 

SP R I "'ii( U:JC [ MINIMUM 

I FIRt-fLO\\" 
fl.OW DURATION 

1 
I lho11n1 

·.----1 

I 1Delltn ~landenJ) !plloa• ~r 1· 

mln•lr) , 

Ne; 1u1nm11k ~inl:ltt sy~~ ---~-;-~u5tHlt __ Table-- r=·:.. ;, _'"''' I 
SKlk)(I <;4,))31.1 c.i lh, c., f\" ~-'l:~ofth(vaJu,: t~l"ltion '" ht,1~ 

(odt -------- _._, ____ _j~~T,b~-a IU5 l(l)' l ~:s;, ~ IJ\e ~l 

Sectkin 90).J.1.2 of th• c;.. ~ht I ...._ Jh" or 1k v,111, t.i\&Btioro '" rat>t, i 

c~ (Only 411Pirt) Ir, /<'CtMIU•U In l1hk 810S.lll) ftl05.l(l) II the 1"1'1MiM l 
b,,t/o,i, J.<>t»-fooulrtWJUOl<IJ now 111~ 

b~·"-Th~Cf'fduced fire OOw ihall uoa ~ lctt thar. l, 500 iPm -----

Ordinance 20 l 9~2 20-0203 E Page 19 B,ie91 s 



Appendit D - Fi" Apparatu~ AcctH Koads 

Section 0)03 Minimum Sp«tfkadop.1 

0103.1 Accu• Road Wid1b witit • IIYdrant shall be 111111:ndcd 6.5 follows. adding t.hec.,ceptioo 

Exception.· l>rivl!'w,1vs 

DlOJ.l Grade shall I)( amended 1n rnll(lW.s: Fire" ,1rpnr.it111, acces5 ronds und dnvi,w,ys shnll not 

eJtc.ced J 5. V% in grJde 1mioJ .ippriiwd by 1Ju ,iHJ 1.>r by tire El Donkio r ·.,r,111r amtr,;kd 

C'ul1/orrti<1 P11bl1~ Re:wura C,>dr Tufr J-4 .' Design llrld lrnpro,·,vrr<!nt 'ifr1miurdi Jfam,,t.' 

£trtJlllun: El11vation abow: ~S,1/00fee( shuit no/ ,•ff.a,-f 12% 

DlOJ.J ·rurnlpe, (udlus sh11U he llfttt'11ded e.'i follnws The minimum turning ra,fa1s shall ~ 

detcnninc<I hv tht!' fire code oflici11I; and shall r101 mc/11Je curb a11d guun 

DtOJ.5 Fir~ Apparatus Acc~n Road Gates shall be ,11~nded as foH,Jw,: S11b.ucticmO) Where' <1 

ringi< got, {s provideJ. f~ gatr '"1dth y!,o/1 t~ not 1, 55 thor, ;(i fut (6096 mm) IYJr;trt ,i .firil 

upparatu., rood consis/1· ,if a di~ided ru<1dwct),·. t~ xate width shaJl no/ be lc,.1 than ;5 f~,1 (IP 2 

mm). 

DIQJ,6.1 R9•d1 20 to 29 fHt In width shall be 11mendcd as follows: Fir-e lane signs aBpe<.llied in 

Sectton DI 03 .6 shall j:\e posted on both side or fire Jpparatus ac:ce% roads that are 10 to J? feet 

wide (6('96 to 8534.4 mmJ. 

Exception: f.lemtimu above 5.00()/t w dct<'rmmtJ hy 1/w AH.J 

D lQJ.6.l Roads more than 29 feet in Wldt~ shell be amended ns follows Fi~ 11ne \tgm il5 

:ipe<.:ihed ,n Section DI 01.6 shall be posted on nnc .~ide of fire opp11111t\Js 1m::ess roads morie than 29 

feel wide (11534 4 mm) 11n<l tn.s than 36 f~t wnic { I 0972.8 mm). 

Exr:~ption Elrvot,oro rJbo'tle 5. 000 .ft .:1, ~u-rrnined b~· f~ .iHJ 

UHM.-4 Clrcumferentffl [Irr Apparatus Ac:cttn Roads shall b<'J added as follow;: lflotn rtquind 

hy I~ fin c-<Xk official, a fire <lpp(lnll11s ,u:c..-ss r<KW shall M nm.rlr11,:t~d to enrnmpa.11 tlrt trttir,{r 

,J,f u .1rrwctu~ and :sh<ifl {lf">Vl<k a contim,01,.v mean., of l!m~rg~nry ,·t-h1de access. 

SECTION 4: CONFLl(1" 

That Ordinnncc No. 2016-02 of the El. IJorado Councy Fi~ Protection Disttkt. •nd all o~her (1rdiod,1.:e\ or paru 

of ordinances hen,with •~ hereby repealed. 

SECTION 5: SEVERABILJT\' 

If any Ordinance, article, iubsc:<:tion or subdi\tision thereof, pro\'ision, S4:nC<'n~. clau~ or phruc oOhis oodc, or 

11ny application thcreot i9 for any reason held I(• M invalid by • coun c,f compe(ent jurhdicti1.m, PJCh deciiiOO 

!hall noc effect the remaining provisions of thi! code_ which can be given of'fecc without tht invalid portions 

and, the«:fOR, such in.,alid p()ftioni are declamd 10 be severable. The El Dor.do County Fi~ Protection District 

hereby de\;lares that it woulJ have enacted thi1 Or,Jinancc and e&d1 of its anid~. section,, ~ub:iectioos, or 

Ordinance 2019-02 20-0203 E Page 20 8P~'6 



t 
I 

~11b<livis1LJO'> thereof, prov i~ions, sentr:ncc,. clauses or ph(:He, irre:.pcchvc of the tittt that rinc w 1no1 c of 1hem 

ti declnrcd invalid 

SECTIO.'l 6: •~FFECTIVF DATE ANU PllBLICAflON 

lllis Orclin1111ec.- 5hall raJ.:c ttlc,;1 thirty (30,1 du:,,~ 110er its ad,~puun. The El [)ondo Count\ f1t1: Pron.-ctiur; 

Di:;tri(.t Bo1mi So:.-.:rcl11ry i:,. dim.:(cd \,) publis!1 thi~ ordinance i,i II new~l"'f>Ct :iC 11.em:ral ..:1rcu1&tion 1n the 

r>1,;1fic1, In lieu of publicJJlk,n of ti~ fu II text 111 the •mlinam.:i.:, h .,ummii.n· of the ord,nan,:;c mlly be pHhli<Jied 

by the bl t~ Bourd S«r•~'"')' within fifteen,: i '.ll day, utter it.\ pnSUKC 110<11 cer1ilird copy ~•ll l:,r, pos1ed in 

tr.e •Jfficr:- nf the El Dorn.d,, C,)un~ Fire Pruiectinn D1~Hcl punuu,1 tr, G,wi!r""'""' C,'><:k St!ctmn jf,vH(<I /1.}. 

T~ llbove Ord1mmce ,...-a, mtroduccd 111 J meeting of 1he Bnani of Oi1c,;.1,)~ of the El i)(lnclo Counl) fln: 

l'mtcct1on Diruict >Jn 01:t,,t)C, i7. 2019. und i1 was then read fort~ fi~t t,me. A public he.aring 'M5 set fur thi! 

t.>rdini1m:c to be re.!!il for lhc secon(l 1imc on Novembci 21, 20 I !j 1111d ~pprovcd by the following vott: 

PASSED AND A l)OPTFD by the Board c,f Directors of the El [>,-.ni,iu County Fire Protectioo Distict this, 21" 

day of November. 20!9 

,o\ YES: 

~OES. 

AHSEl'fl r·. 

ABSTA!l~: 

Marl• B11111lon. B,:>ftrtl Prendc11t 

_.i.~- l, j -· ,: 

Kathlcefl Freeman, a.:.rd s~rclar) 

Ordinanc.~ 2019-02 20-0203 E Page 21 ~g 7 



I 

DSP, ECF, & GRV 

S1gn1f1cant Lccally JJoptcd / SP,1 adopted I 
F,re Code# ? What Is tl'e Charge? Wry Is T'1cr8 a Local Change? 

change An ended 

101.1 

105.6.27 

106.6 

106.li.1 

106.7 

109.4 

110.4 

110.4.2 

112.4 

202 

302.1 

307.4.4 through 
307.4.4.2 (d) 

N 

y 

N 

N 

y 

y 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

y 

Amend with the name of the jurisdiction 

Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate 
~antity not exceeding 125 gallons serving 
occupancies in Group R-3. 

.. 
Addseciion 

Add section 

Added section 109.4 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 
better left lo localities to determine the 
fees/penalties for their respective areas. 

Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before 
but under a different number) 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 
better left to localities to determine the 
fess/penalties for their respecbve areas. 

Added definitions for clarity 

Added definition for Campfire to Section 

Added a sections for campfire restrictions 

. 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally created 111d adopted . . 

· .. 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally adopted and amended 

LocaHy created and adopted 

Locally created and adopteg 

Locally created and adopted 

Administrative need 

LPG tanks are known to possibly leak. LPG is heavier than 
air and can easily be trapped under a home, if ignited it can 
lead to an explosion. At elevations above 5000 feel there is 
an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire 
activity due to snow load. These tanks require addibonal 
attention. 

Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance 
of fees I<> cover actualcosts: Section 106.6 defines 
permits, pliir{i:hecks; and inspections as allowed in Health 
&Safeiy Code 1795f. •. , . , ·.·. , 

SectionJ06J 1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to 
the Fire District. · · · · 

Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspections by contractors. 

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District 
is added to read as follows: 
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this 
provision is to clarify the procedures and timetines for an 
individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals 
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County of El Dorado's 
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals 
timeline. 

Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that 
protects life and property. Fees have been updated to 
match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the 
District Attorney's Office. The change to the language to 
include the term infractions. 

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s), 
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 
violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health and Safely Code of the State of California and 
Chapter 5c (commencing with section 853.6) ofTiHe 3 of 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

All violations of the code have been consolidated under 
Section 110.4 to indude the penalties for violations. 

Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, Disbict, 
Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd 
Manager. Definition of campfire shall not include LPG or 
Propane fueled appliances. 

Added definition for darity 

Due to the high fire danger that exists in El Dorado County 
we have written more sbingent rules pertaining to open fires 
within grass, brush, and lree covered areas. 

20-0203 E Page 22 of 39 



-----,---,---------.----------,------------, 

503.2.1 N 

503.2.5 N 

503.2.6 N 

503.4.2 N 

503.4.3 N 

503.4.4 N 

503.5.3 N 

505.1 N 

507.5.1 N 

509.3 y 

; .. 

. ·I.· ,,. 

Ctianged verticitl clearances to 15 feet and road 
widths to 20 feel 

Added a specific section for RJ's where It allows the 
Fire Code and TiUe 14 Fire Safe Regulations to 
match as they require turnarounds for fire apparatus 
access roads and driveways. 

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated 
Surfaces to state and match El Dorado County 
Transportafon Division instead of AASHTO HB-17. 

Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes 

Added section regarding no parking in front of 
hydrants 

Added section regarding fire lanes based on road 
widtti.• 

Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain 
emergency access and consistency through an 
roadway gates in El Dorado County, relening to the 
gate standards adopted by the FPO's. 

Added section pertaining lo the visual addressing of 
buildings 

Added more conservative standard for the 
placement of hydrant and their relationship to 
canmercial buildings 

Added verbiage to bring all of the necessary fire 
controls for a building to one location. 

. ... , .. 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally created and adopted 

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical 
clearan~ of 15 feet provides proper clearance for 
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus 
components. It also allows an extended time frame before 
having to reart the growth of the vegetation. Additional 
height for vegetailon clearances acts as an increased buffer 
for the spread of fire. A road widlh of 20 feet exclusive of 
shoulders, as measured face of ciirb to face of curb is 
needed. These structures can be diflirult to navigate with 
fire apparatus arid should not be counted in the total 
drivable road surface 

Fire apparatus require areas for turning around when 
multiple vehicles are on the scena of an emergency. This 
includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides 
better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum 
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 
Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendix D of the 
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be 
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an 
alternate means & methods that is no! less restrictive than 
the Fire Code. 

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes' 
rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle Code. 

This section clearly defines the 'No Parking in front of fire 
hydrants' rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle 
Code. 

This section clearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D 
as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire 
lanes. 

Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on 
roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing 
the best possible emergency access to maintain fast 
response times. 

Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing 
based on the District's addressing standards. 

Commercial properties are required to install hydrants at 
300. foot intervals, thus they should never be oulside of 150 
feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in 
between), 

Buildings are getting more sizable in the county. It is more 
common to have new buildings with solar arrays that 
continue to generate power even when the buildings 
general utilities have been shut off. When there is an 
emergency, it is vital that we have rapid access to all of the 
controls in one location for public evacuation and firefighter 
safety. Due to the fire danger present in El Dorado County 
throughout most of the year, Ulis change is appropriate and 
advisable. 

Due to the topographic, dimatic. and geographic conditions 
ii B Ooradci Coimiy and their contributing factors to our 
fni:reasecl response tiiries, along with the fact U,at ftres • .. · . 

~f~:!~F 
·. 

20-0203 E Page 23 of 39 



903.2.a 

903.2.b 

. 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 
903.2.4, 903.2.7 

903.2.8.2 

903.2.9, 903.2.10 

907.2.a 

907.2.b 

907.2.c 

N 

N 

N 

y 

N 

N 

N 

N 

Adds a requirement for existing buikings greater 
than 3,600 square feet lo instaR sprinklers if they 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 
structure, whichever is less. 

Adds occupant proteciion for existing buildings less 
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feel to the 
structure, whichever is less. 

These sections wer~ created to give specific 
direction on the sprinkier "requirements based on 
occupancy and square footage 

This section was created to include manufactured 
residential single family R-3 in the residential 
sprinkler program 

These sections were aeated to give specific 
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on 
occupancy and square footage 

Added occupant protection for fire alarms in 
buildings with a floor area less than 3,600, except 
R3, AG buHdings not used for commercial 
purj>oses, and buildings with a floor area of less 
ttiaii 500 square feet as approved by the fire code 
official .. 

Addeo occupant protection for existing builcings 
without autooiatic sprinkler systems to install a fire 
alam, ii they add more than 30% or 1,000 square 
teei to the structure, whichever is less. 

Added occupant proteciion by stating all fire alarm 
detection systems installed shall be connected to a 
inonttoririg servi~that notifies the fire deplirtmeilt 
upon activation and is installed per Seciioii 907 of 
iiie fire cooe: · · · · 

locally created and adopted 

Locally aeated and adopted 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally aealed and adopted 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally aeated and adopted 

Locally creaied and adopted 

Locally created and adopted 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
double in size each and fN8rY minute. we require sprinklers 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. . 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conwtions 
of El Dorado County and their conbibuting factOIS to our 
inaeased response times; along with Hie fact that fires 
double in size eadi arid f1V8fy minute; we require sprinkle!s 
1o be iilsta11ed in structures oiii:e they reach 3.soo square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of.. 
spread. . 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of El· DQilido Gwnty and thllir contnliutiiig. factors to our 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
double in size ~-.cllld. MfY minute, we require sprinklers 
to be installed iii structures once they ieacll 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. . 

Manufactured Hornes - The intent of this code section is lo 
ensure that manufactured homes Iha! serve as a one or tw 
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions round in 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar 
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban 
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption 
due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The 
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a 
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk 
successfully in many California communities. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
double in size each and fN8rY minute, we require sprinklers 
to be instaHed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Provides proper emergency notification fur occupancies that 
allO'N public use and ensures Fire Depaitment notification in 
the event of a fire "or smoke, 

Provides proper emergency riotificatioii for occupancies that 
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
the event of a fire or smoke .. 

Provides proper emergency notification fur occupancies that 
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
the event of a fire or smoke. . 

20-0203 E Page 24 of 39 



-
907.6.2.1 y Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply 

Locally created and adopted 
Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E 

Modification safety related power outages. 

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to 
1203.1.3 N Shunt trip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emeigency power shut off (lJ!ing ihe use of back-up 

power supplies 

3310.3 N Address iequiremenls for construciion siies Locally created and adopted 
Addressing for consbtJction sites is important to assist 

' . responding emeigency crews. · .·.' 
,. 3312.1 N Water suppies at construction sites with . · 

Locally adopted and amended 
Water musi be on site prior to combustible material being 

ooinbustible materials on-site. . . stored or vertical consbuction commencing, 

El Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout 
This section was created to indude Fire Protection 4903.1 y Locally created and adopted 

the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire 
Plan for all fire hazard severity zones. Protection Plan due to dimatic, geological, and 

topographical conditions. 

This section darifies that within the boundaries of El Dorado 

4905.4 y Added a section to darify roof construction 
Locally created and adopted 

County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are 

requirements 
wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be 
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly. 

My damages or costs from negligent practices that 
Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate. 

5001.7 y cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally created and adopted 
If the incident is caused by negligence due lo a business 

cost recovery fee. process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the 
negligent parties. 

Added safety protection with permits being issued 
Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and 

5601.2 N by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for 
Locally adopted and amended 

explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of 
fireworks to approve them and have a dear understandi119 

Supervisors for fireworks. of the applications they will be used for. 

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any 

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make 
documentation induding timing and proprietary information 

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 N available all requested documentation pertaining to Locally aeated and adopted 
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they 

the firework presentation 
deem necessary. This information is understood to be 
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as 
such. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code· for Class I 

5704.2.9.6.1 N Established fimits as set forth in the Fire Code LocaUy adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
SpeciaVConditional Use Permit from the County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5706.2.4.4 N Establlshed limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible §quid special 
operations in above-ground tanks: Requires AHJ approval 
arid a SpeciaVConditional Use Peilnit from the County . . . . 
Administrative need to add District name. Esiablished limits 

Administrative addition of Dlsirict name. · 
5806.2 N LocaUy adopted and amended 

as required bYtlre Fini Code Official for Flammable 

Established Nmits as set forth in the Fire Code Cryogenic ilirids in stationary containers: Requires AHJ 

1-
approval aild a SpeciaVConditional Use Permit from the 
County. 

.' 
Establis_hed lirhils as requited by the Fire Code Official for 

5806.2.1 N Established Umits as set forth in the Fiie Code SFM adopted and amended locally 
Flammable Cryogenic fluids in stationary containeis: 
Requires AHJ approval and a SpeciaVConditioilal Use 
Pemiit from the County, 

E~lablishes dista~ces between LPG storage and . 

Established fimlls for i.Pd storage and cli~ng 
disperlsaries that a~ <lreclly related lo safety for residential 

6104.2 N Locatly adopted and amended 
<levek,pmenis ~rid higlK!ensity hotels, moiei, apartments, 

near or ildjacent to residential devel~ent e1c. wtieni a re1ease by iiiak or~ o1 l.P-Gas would 
.. have a high prql>abi!lty of injury, inhalation; or deaih; . 

.. . . . ' ~~i~m:~ a SpeciaVCoodi~on~ Use .. ,·· .. .·._._:.· .. ··,. 
·. 

i'..-.·,. ·('·> ·. 
:.= .. < : · .. - .· 

. .,· .. . · .... :-.-.· :_. ·:.::, ,:.- . . :.\ ·. .: ·<·:(}.:_:":-'...:}· · .. : . /-' .. 

20-0203 E Page 25 of 39 



6112.1 

6112.2 

· .. 6112.3 

6113.1 

6113.2 

Chapter 60, NFPA, 
13D-16 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 Section 4.7 

Chapter 80, NFPA. 
130-16 Section 

5.1.1.2 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 Section 7.6 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 Section 

11.2.1.1 

· ·. Appendix e: Table 
·.•·e1os:1(1) 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

y 

y 

y 

y 

y 

. . 

Establishes propane regulaior requirements for 
locations above 5000 fool elevation ·. 

Establishes propaiie marking and location 
1equ,rements above 5000 foot e1evalion. 

Permits and plans shall be submitted and approved 
by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction), • 

Requires undelground LPG tanks to remain the 
property of lhe LPG company 

NFPA 130-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the 
District has been amended to update various 
provisions pertaining lo the installatioo of sprinkler 
systems in one-and two-family dwellings 

Correction of a system quality issue 

To allOY1 for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler 
system minimizing damage 

Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation 

System test to a pressure of 150 p.s.i. 

~lllged 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM. beloN 5000 foot 
elevation; to match fire b precedents used m 
Ebe i"a- years . . . . 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally creaied and adopted 

LocaHy created and adopted 

Locally aeated and adopted 

SFM Adopted and amended locally 

SFM Adopted and amended locally 

Estabflshes propane regulator requirement for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. Inducing requirements for two
stage regulator use and location of fi!st end second stage 
regulators. Additional requiremenls are ouUined for 
prolective covers; riser pipe iristallation requirements; 
building peimii submittal and review, lank center-line 
rnaoong: aricl grade requirements, These requirements ilre 
based on significant fire hislay in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encoontered above sooo feet . 

Estabfisll~ ~CIII propa,e rise requiremi,,ts for locatiolls 
above 5000 foot elevation. Pipe schedule location. swing 
joinf~uillffllents:andJhe use of flexible riser piping as . 
"ell 8S swing joints._ These requirements are based 00 • • · 

significant fire history in iiei!Ny snow and extreme weattier 
COl'lditions encountered above 5000 feel 

. . 

~slablishes maoong and l<>ciltion requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elevatic:,r This sectioo addresses signage 
locatiOn, eine,gei,cy airitact information, and snow related 
tank niarldrig requirements. These requirements lire based 
on significant fire history in heavy snciw and extreme 
weather cooditions encountered above 5000 feet. 

Permitting and Plan subirutiaf requirements for underground 
iilnks: ·-.. . . ·.. ; 
Alows us kfrequire plans be submitted for review prior to 
fnstaffations of undeiground LPG tanks. Underground tanks 
require substantial maintenance rriciuding inspection arid .. · 
anode replacement at reg~ar iittervms. . . 

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without 
deleclioo. They are also are not routinely maintained when 
sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground 
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more eas~y detected. 

Amended to indude oo-site sprinkler heads and wrench on
site for emergent repairs, the indusion of a local water ffOYI 
alarm to aeate an audible alert for the flow of waler in the 
event of water activation in a vacant structure, and 
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 130 
sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water 
damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements 
were also added to ensure water circulation through the 
system, reducing stagnant water and backftow concerns 
(EID encourages this type of system). 

Amends the current code set to include the addition of a 
passive purge system to keep the water in the sprinkler 
piping system from being stagnant. 

A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system 
SFM adopted and amended locally must be available oo-sile in an accessible mounted cabinet 

SFM adopted and amended locally 

SFM adopted and amended locally 

Localy ~ed and amended 

An audible alarm system is added to notify occupants and 
in the activation of the system when the building is not 
occupied allow for de!ectioo minimizing damage. 

A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and 
failures and assures proper gluing of system components. 

Allows u~ to matcli ~at developers arid residerlts are used 
to in regaids to GPM lire flow requiienients that have been 
used foi QVer. a deraie in EDC. . . 

20-0203 E Page 26 of 39 



-, 

Appendix B: Table 
Established a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM. Nlows us to match what developers and residents are used 

B105.2 
N below 5000 foot elevation, for all commercial Locally adopted and amended lo in regards lo GPM fire flow requiremenls that have been 

projects used for over a decade in EOC. 

Appendix D: 0103.1 N Made an exception for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended 
It is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to 
construct a 26 foot wide space for access to ,a hydrant 

Appendix D: 0103.2 
. . : TIiie 14 requires for us to only accepi lip to 16% driveways. 

N Staie law requires no great~ thari 16% grade Locally adopted and amended In our El Dorado County Tiile 14 adoption we allow greater 
than 16% grade with AHJ approval and hard surface. 

Appendix D: D103.3 N Tex! to indude curbs and gutters Locally adopted and amended 
20 foot road widths shall not include airbs and gutters due 
lo potential access issues and turning radius concerns. 

Appendix I}. D103.5 § 
Fire awiratus access. road gates· 

Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided 

1. 
N Locally adopted and amended roadway the gate widih shall not be less than 15 feet due to 

. radius issues. . . 

No par1<ing on roads allowed on road.Yays less than 28 Feel 

Appendix D: D103.6.1 N Roads widths 20 to 29 feet Locally adopted and amended 
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does 
not apply. This section is adopted as ii stands in the Fire 
Code Appendix O section 103.6.1 for all other elevations. 

Par1<ing on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feel 

Roads widths more Ulan 29 feel bu! less than 36 allowed. This is no! required less than 5000 feet of 
Appendix D: 0103.6.2 N 

feel in width 
Locally adopted and amended elevation. Lower than 5000 feel this does not apply. The 

section is adopted as ii stands in the Fire Code Appendix D 
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations. 

Appendix 0: 0104.2 
Removed the exception Ula! allows a sprinklered For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Exception 
N building with a square footage of 124,000 or less lo Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

have only one approved fire apparatus access road. residents and first responders. 

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 

Appendix D: D104.4 N 
Added to require circumferenHal fire apparatus 

Locally created and adopted 
access road shall be constructed lo encompass the entire 

access roads structure and shall provide a continuous means of 
emergency vehicle access. 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 
For the safety of the communities we rive in, two ways of 

Exception 
N Removed Exception in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required io ensure the safety of the 

: residents and first responders. 

Appendix 0: 0107.1 
For the safety of !he communities we live in. two ways of 

Exception 
N Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are requifed to ensure the safety of the 

residents and first responders. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
1.01.2 through 101.5 N 

Adopted to establish scope, intent severability and 
Locally adopted Administrative clarity. validity .. ·. 

10i6 through 102.8 N Refer~ces. Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted • Administrative clarity . 

102.10 through 102.12 N 
Conflicting provisions, Other Laws, Application of 

locally Adopted Adminlslrative clarity• references . .. 

103.1 liirriugh 104.1 N 
Definition of the Fire Prevention Division and ability 

Locaily Adopted : Administrative clarity· 
· .. fuenforce the code . . . . 

·· ... 

104.3 through 104.4 N Ftight of Entry, Warrants, end Identification Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.6 °thiough 104.6.4 N Record retention Locally Adopted Administrative darity 

104.8 tt\rough 104.9.2 N. 
Modifications, alternate means end methods, end 

Locally Adopled : Admtnlslrative clarity. . test· .. :. . ... : ... ·. 

104; ff ihrough N Aulhciiity at finis; right of licx:ess, rnainteiim of 
Locally Adopted Adlilinislra~ ~arity 

1,04;11.2 . .. ,.·• . systems· ... ·.i:, .... \,, ·.: :• . ,• . ·. '··.· ,.: ,·.·:·., · .. 

104Jt3.· .. <'. :· .. it ~ty of systems llfid'devices iilopei'itble· .•.: , .. · . LocillyAdopted::; Adminis!i'ative clarify/ : .,· .. ·, ..... 

105.2;3 ·••.:·:: . ·: · .. : '.:}( .. Tirne ilmililtioifof aj)piication\ . • . \ :; < ..::··· LocallyAdooied : , · Adn\inlsii'ii~ c1an1y.·· \ .. :. :·.· :/ 

. ~i:itttmql .· ''·</: ~ati<lllid,~~: ;··· ...... 
·' ·. I.or.Ill Adopted . > •: "· , . ', 

.·· .. •··· 

. y . . Ad~ri,~u~J~ .. · · . . 
· .. · .. . . 

20-0203 E Page 27 of 39 



--- ~----,-----,.-------------,-.---------------'------------, 
105.6.12 

105.6.2.28 through 
105.6.35 

... '·: 

105.6)]·. 
... ·.: 

io5:&.39· 
•.: 

1os.S:41 thfoog~: · 
1os:s:4s · · 

105.6.48 ....... :: . ·. : : :: 
. ... · .. 

105.6.so'. •·· 
·--.... :-.. 
106.1 lhrough 106.3 

107.1. 

I• 

1: .. 
108,'lthrough 109.3 

·, ·. 

11lt3.2 through 
110.3.4 

110.4.1 

113.1 

303. 1 through 303. 9 

305.1 through 305.5 

~:1 thi'oilgh 306.2 
. ·,: 

,. 

I· 

I. 

3or 1uirough 307.5 . 
: .. -.·· ·. 

308.1 

308.1.2 through 
308.1.3 

1'·.'· 

·.·:-·' . 

~i1.s through 
308\8.5 . · ... 

N 

N 

N 

--::. 

N 
. . . · 

N .· 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N. 
. · 

N 

N 

N 

Dry deaning operational permits required for 
hazardous deaning solvent use 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections ·. 

. ~ ·. . .· .· 

.: . · .. ·. - . .·, .. : .-: . : 

Adopted this section for adminisliaiive darity and 
fire ilnd life safely imipections . · ... ,· . . . . . . 
Adopted lii,ii sediori for administrative clanty and 
fire and life sareiy inspections _.· . > : : ,. 

Adopt~~~~ for 8~inistratiV8 cl~ and I : • 

fire and nre safety inspections · · · · 

.. ' ··. ·. :<- _. ._. ·: ·,: .·· .. 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire arid life safety inspections : < : / . . .. '· . 
Adopied ~w ~onfJadml~i~,ti~ clarity and 
fire and life safety inspedions ·. :.·· .... 
.. _. .·. ::,.:\: ,:.·.,.· ·'- :·,· 

Adopted this section for adrninistialivecfarily and 
fire and life safety inspections . · · 

Adopied this section for administraiive clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections ·:. 

. -.· 

I· 

Adopted this section for adminlslia!M! clarity and .. 
fire and life safety inspections . . .. ·. . 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections : . . . . : ·, ·. 

Adopted this section for administrative darity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative darity and 
fire and life safety inspectioris 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this .section for fire and life safety 

I· : 

Adopted this section for fire and lifii safely 
: ·. 

Adopted this secilori for fire arldnfe safety 
'·· .'·.·· .. ,: 
... 

Adopted thts ~on for fire and life safely 

Adopted this ~on for fire and life safety . ' . 

·, '· · .. : 

. .. :: ·. .·.. ·. 

~~..,.l,~,m .... ~ 
:; ·:·,·:. : ·-. ·. 
:·---··,:.·,:::-: : ... 

.: 
,.·: 

..· 

···. 
·.· .. 
· ... · 
:..-

_.. · . 

. : . 

: .,·,: '_-.·. · .. , ... 
,:_:)·. \\.}/· .. ·. 

:. 

· •· .. ··.N.· ... ··. Adopled~is ~C>rl b lire !1ii1l1re ~rely · · · · 
·. ·."·: .. ·.:·.-.·.-

LocaHy Adopted 

locally AdoPted 

Locany Adopted ·. 

localiy Adopted . . . . · : . 

locally Adoptilcl . 

Loca11y Aciopted 

Local~ Adopted.· 
·.: .. · .: 

Locally Adopied 

locally Adopted .. 

locally Adopted • 

Locally Adopted 
. 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

locally Adopted 

locally Adopted 

_. 

locally·~·-

locally Adopted : . 

Locally Adopted·. . 

locally Adopted 
: ... 

· ... · .'.· :_·. : ·_, 

· .. ' .. ' 

Locally Adopted 

L~ly~ed. 

Administrative darity 

Permits for various business operations for. Magnesium, 
miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation 
vehicles, motor fuel-dispensingfadlities, opEIII btlming, 
open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and 
organic coatings· 

·. _..· . 

Pennits for places of assembly 

Permits for private fire hydrants .· -
.. : ... · ...... ·. '.·, · .. : .. 

Pilrmits tofpyroxytin plastics,refrigntion equipmen~ repair 
garages and root« fuel-<fisJ)ensing facilities, roolloP . . 
helipoits, spraying Of dipping, storage of scnip tires and tire 
by-products .· , · . . : , 
:_ ... :·:. : ·._:_.· .. 

. Permit for tire-rebuHdi11g plants 

Pennit for wood prod~cts storage (chips, hogged material, 
1um&er or plywood. iii excess or 200 cubii:feetJ. 
·:: ,·: ...... · .. · .::...: .. :.::-.-.-,.-. .· .. : ' .: . 

Fee sc1iedtJ1es for ~its.·· · .· · 
·. . . . ·:·. 

Inspection authority . ' 
:. . ·:··, ·. ·.·, · . 

1:· ...... · .·:·,.::, .,:.·.:,.:. ·· .... ·_.·· ·. ·. 
Maintenance of safeguards; testing and operation of 
equipment re-inspectklli 'and testing, recadkeeping, · 
supetvision, randenrig equipment inoperable, overaowding, 
Board of Appeals estabiished, limitations on authority, and 
quaNfications . 

· ... ·. : '·. 

Compliance wilii ordelS and notices, prosecution of 
violations; aiid uniii:itt\cirized tainpering · 

Abatement of lliolation 

Autho!ity to disconnect s8IVice utilities 

Asphalt keffles contain highly flammable substances and 
require slringent safeguards (Climatic. geological, and 
topographical) 

Managing ignition sources through responsible application 
of standaids will reduce the number of fires in various 
settings (Climatic; ge<llogical, amfiopographical) · .. 

. . ·, .. ·.· 

Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY 
flariimaiile' and require special handling (Ciimalic; . 
geological; and iopcigraphical) : .· : .. ·. . . . 

Open flame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and 
toj)ographical) · , · ·, 

Thrc,ioog or placing of ignition soorais; ~ for. 
removing paint (Climatic, geological; 111<1 topographical) 

. . . .·~ .. 

20-0203 E Page 28 of 39 



'----<··-----r-----.--------------,-----------.-----------------, 

308.3 through 308.4.1 

310.1 

319.3 through 
319.fo:3. ', .. 

403.8.1 lhrough 
403.8.1.7. 

403: 10 throtigh 
403.10.1.:i . 

C 

4-05.5 

510.3 

80i5.2 through 
807.5.2.3 , 

'' 903.2.1.5 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

Adopted this section for fire and life saiety · 

Adopted this section for fire andUfe safely 

Adopted this SectiOl'I for administrative Clarity end ·. 
fire arid imi safety inspections ' ' 

Adopted this section for fire and life safely • ' 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire arid life safety · 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted !his section for administrative clarity end 
lire and life safety inspections· , · · 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Locally Adopted 

LocaUy Adopted 

locaffy Adopted 

. : . . . . . 

LocaHy Adopted.·. 

locally Adopted' 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices, 
theatrical peifoiinances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 
dormitories (Climatic, geological, end topographical) 

Geneial requirements relating to smoking (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) · 

'No Srilolung' signs (Climatic, gedogical, and. 
topographical) · 

~emoval of signs prohibited, compliance with 'No Smoking' 
signsiash trays, burning objects, hazardous enviionmental 
comi,tions. (Climatic; geological, end topographical) 

1/acanlpremises condition and safety requirements; 
Abandoned premises; tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant 
premises; security, fire protection, fire separation, removal 
of combustibles; removal of hazardcius maieiiais .. (Ciimatic, 
QeologKial, arid topographical) 

den era I requirements relatiiig to mobile food pr!!paration 
Vl!hicies.' (Climatic, geological, and topoglllphtcal) ' 

Peirriits for mobile food preparation vetiicles (Climatic, 
geological, arid topographical) · · · 

Exhaust hood, fire protection, fire protemontot cooking 
equipment fire extinguisher, appliance connection to fuel 
suppiy piping. cooking oii storage containers. me1a111c 
storage tanks, nonmetallic storege tanks, cooking oil 
stciage system components, design criteria, iank venting, 
normal vent,; erilergency'veiits, LP;gas systems, maximum 
aggregate volume, prciection of c:ontaiiler, LPiias container 
i:oiistiuctioo, proledion ofsysteni pj'ping, LP11as alarms, 
CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel, 
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG 
container construction, CNG containers supplying 
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping, 
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire 
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems. 
(Climatic, geological, end topographical) 

Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1 
(residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and 
fire safety plans. ' ' 
Group R-1 (Boarding house. hotel, moiel) ocaJpailcy 
Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic, 
geo1og1ca1, and topographicaJl 

Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic, 
geological, and iopographical) ,' 

A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Wall coverings in group E ocaJpancies (Schools) sets a 
maximum amount of ffammable wallcoverings in 
educationai facilities (Climatic, geological, and· 
topiigrephlcal) ' ' 

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5 
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers) 
(Climatic, geol()IJical, and topographical) greater than 1000 
square feet. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

20-0203 E Page 29 of 39 



1103.2 

Appendix D: D101.1 
itirotigti 0102; 1 ,. ·.·.···· ·.·, .. ·. 
,: .:• ... ,.>: ..... 
Appenaix D: D103.4 

. 
. ' . . 

l\ppendix D: D103.6 

,.· .. 

Appendix D: D104.1 
through D104.3 
(excluding exception) 
. ..,, 

Appendix D:D1os.1 
tll(Oligh D105A .. • 

Appendix ti: 0100.1 
through D106.3 
(excluding exceptions) 

Appendix D: D107.1 
(excluding exceptions) 
through 0101.2 

Appendix D: D108 

y 
Adopted this section in existing buildings for the 
safety of firefighters and other emergency 
responders. 

. ••· Adopted tllrs section for the safety of the public, 
N · · ·. . ·. firefigtitera, and oiiier emergency respoodeis: 

N 

N,. 

N, 

N 

N 

N 

. ,:._ . . .. . : 

·. 

Adopieci tllis section for' the safety of the pu~ic. 
tiiefigh~; and other emergency f#indeis. .· .. 
Adopted this section for ihe safety of the pubi~ 
firefighters; and other emergency responders. . 

:: . . . 
. . . . : 

Adopted this section for tile safety of tha public, 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. . . . . 

!\dopteg this section tor. the safely of Iha public, 
firelighteis, and other emeigency responders . .. ' . . . .. 

A<lopled tilts section for Ifie safety of tile pubiic; 
firefighhn, and other emergency responders. 

Adopted this section for the safely of the public, 
firefighiers, and oth.er emergency respond81S. 

Adopted this section for Iha safely of the public, 
firefight81S, and Olher emergency responders. 

Locally Adopted 

L9tally Adopted • 

Locally Adopted .· 

.· locally Ad~ 

locally Adopted · 

. . 

Locally Adopted: 

Locally Adopted · 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders 
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to end from 
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time 
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by 
the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind 
this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury 
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Generalrequlremoots for fire apparatus access rollds . . 
including ioads: (Climatic, geological, and topographical)·.• 

. ' . ..· ..... 

Deed end firii aP1>Brafus access road requirements ror a · •·· · 
li:iiri around ai 1 so teet (Cffriiatic;' 9eo1ogical; and · 
1opograi>hica1) . . : · . . · ·.. .· 

;No Paoong; Fire Lane' signs requirements. (Climatic,: 
geological, aiid topographical) · 

. . 

Commercial. and industrial development fire apparatus 
access roads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Requirements for aerial fire apparatus access roads 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

. . . . 

Fire apparatus access roads. for multiple-famHy residential 
davelopmenis (CUmatic, geological, and topographical)· 

One- or two-<fwe!ling residential developments shall be 
equipped throughout with two sparate and approved fire 
apparatus access roads due lo topographic, geographic and 
climatic conditions. 

Adopt reference slandards dealing with gate construction 
standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

. Grey cells are previously amended,. adopted, cir changed code sections that are being adopted again· in this code cycle . 

.· 

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

20-0203 E Page 30 of 39 



;ffiountain i!\emocrat 

www.mtdemocrat.com 
FAX# 530-344-5092 

LEGAL 
AD Proof 

ADVERTISERS: PLEASE READ CAREFULL YI 
A proof Is provfded to avoid printing errors & to 
show the a"angement of composition. Marie an 
corrections with a pen. We cannot be responsible 

Ad R Allison Size: 6.0" for printing errors not correcl6d on the proof. 
....:.A..:...;rt;;..;l:..:.st;::.a: :.;.__....:...::.:..:..::....:;..;.;__--=-=-=-=~-~ Our deadline schedule don not allow 
--------------- copy changes or additions. 
Chan Unless we hear from you 

by on 
Start Date: 10N19 AD WILL RUN A--s--s""R .... o-w-N ..... __ , 

Ale Name: 7011 Contact your advertising reprnentatlve .. ~~~~~~~~~ 
graphics /Legala/AdslMountatn Demo 

NOTICES OF l'<H.'H 

Fl~t Notice 
Notice of Intent to Adopt a 

FIAi Code Ordinance 
Notice Is hereby gtven of the Intention 
or the El Ootado Counly FIN Protection 
Distrtct to adopt a Finl Code Ordinanc». 
The Dlstrtct Shall hold Its Int public 
heMng at 1:00 P.M. on October 17, 2019 
at 2850 Failtlne Ct .• Building C, PlaceMle, 
CA. raga,dlng Ille adoption of Ille FIIV 
Code Odriance ~ IO HNl1fl and 
Setely Code Sec1lons 13888 and 131189. 7. 
Coples of the code section ralemld to and 
any seconcla,y code sections 181emid to. 
adopted by relnnce. n on tile with the 
Seaewy of Ille Olslric1 and ... open IO 
pubfic Inspection. Adopllon of lie Finl 
Code Onfinanc8 wll adopt the Callomia 
Finl Code • CUl'lllntly publtshad In Title 
24. Part 9, of Ille Calfomla Code of 
~lationa, governing fire prevention 
and bulldlng Standalos ruled to 1118 Ind 
panic safety with soma lffllllO'IWIII. In 
IIOffl8 instances the El Dorado Cowlly Finl 
ProlaC1lon Ol8tr1cl's propoeed Fll8 Code 
Ordnance proposes bulldlng standanfs 
men stringent than tllOee minimum 
building standardS adopted by the 
State Finl Mnhal Ind contained In the 
callfornla Building Standlntll Code. 

Second Notice 

Notice or Intent to Adopt a 
Fll8 Code OrdinWICe 

Notice is hereby given of the Intention 
of the El Dorlldo County Finl Protec:11on 
Olatric1 to adopt a Finl Code On:linance. 
The Oistrlel shal hold 11a second public 
hea1ng at 1:00 P.M. on November 21, 2019 
112850 Flilllrle CL, Building C, "'-ville, 
CA. fflQlrdng Ille lldoption ol the Finl 
Code °"*1ance pnuant to HNltll and 
Sar.ty Code Sec1lons 13889 and 1311119.7. 
Coples of the code section rafwnld to and 
any secondllly code secliona l8r-.d to. 
adopted by 181..x:e • .,. on f• with the 
Sec111ta,y of the Diltl1ct and n open to 
public inspection. Adop1lon ol the Fl,e 
Code On:llnance wil adopt the Califomll 
Fn Code as curninttv publisMd In Title 
24, Part 9, of the Calllomla Coda of 
Reptlona, governing Ira p,ewntion 
and buldlng Standatds lllllled to h and 
panic safety with S01M -idmll!IIS. In 
soma lna1a1Ce5 Ille B Dorlldo County Fll8 
Protection Olstnc:rs propoNCI Fn Code 
Ordnance PIQPOHS buldlng standalda 
men stringent thin thou minimum 
bUllcling atanduds ldopteCI by 11\e 
State Fire Manhll Ind contained In the 
Calltomla Bulldlng Standalds Coda. 
10/9 7011 

20-0203 E Page 31 of 39 



' .. 

Attachment No. 2 

El Dorado County Fire Protection District 

Resolution No. 2019-08 

20-0203 E Page 32 of 39 



rl OOJUIH) UH 'NI\ HRE l'IHfff1 TIO" ltlSTIW T 

.\ IH\OU TIO' 01· ·111F BOARD()(,' Ollff( TOHS OF IHF. EL notnllo Cl II li'H \' Fllff 
l'l~nfH ·110.'I Db IHI( ·1 

\ no1· 11,,c; H \[)I\,(;~,, if'f'( IH 1 J.~j; .\,\II· ,h.\ff,\T, TO l'IH.' 
( \I.IHIH:\I.\ flH.F <our 

1\ rc,;ulll!ll>n for th~ 11 l i,,r.u.lo l :ount~.' Fire r•rnrediun Dis1ri,.:t wtring fort!! nn,hn):,'.~ \\ ilh resr"-'Ct ht (()<:&I 

t:i>nditi,_;ns ~\ilhin th<: Fin: Disiri1:1 v.hid, rnuh ,·t·rt:iin modil1L'ali011,; and drnn~c'> 1.o 1he C1lifomi11 Fitt! 

(._.,J~ 1c-.1..,,)n.1ht! r,,x~··hJ.rY f,_,r pn:~cnin~. foe and lifo s:tfcty in the Et Dorado 1 ,_;unty Firr; Prull'\:ti,,n 
U1~1ric1 

WHE:R[AS, I kalth & Sakty Code Sc\.'l!On ( 7<.15g 5 permits fl fire l'rt•lcdion District l(111,li1pl Ull 

ordin.:tni.:I! wh1d1 ch1m~cs or m(~1fo::s 1h~ Slate I lousing rq:ulations adopted pur.;uant to l·kalth t~ S.1tery 
Code Sc-t::lion ! 792;. ur.~in ,ickmmt.1ti1.,n that s:Ji:.:h ch,mgt.'~ or rn~,Jifi.cation., tll'C nclc:iS,O'}' Jui:.: In local 

r1111diti1JflS thnr rcn"i" regul at1nns g_f•vcmin!! cor.diti ons huJr,fous to ii 1c. prc,p.:-n J .11.nd the ,.11,·1tnnmcnt 
from fire, explosion, h:1.1,ardous ma1eri1th tt.nd hazarJnus u~c-<:, and 

WJU:R[.AS, Hc::ilth & \111;.,,, ( o<le S..:d ion l 7')5/'L ? IC\JUin:s thRt 11 I >tMm:t 's Board nr· 0111:"dtw, 

mak1r1g ar,y 1.hange-. ,)f mo<lrtiv1tinn'. rur'.iUant to H·~ahh & Safdy Codi: s~·1.:tinn l 79SI(~ ;.hal( m1tke 

cxprcss findinJl thot .~uch chang.e:; (or m, ... lific.11,on.-; ere ,w~dc,L tl!ld .shull lik ,1 ,opy of sudi ~·h.1n)Z(".s or 

mwJilicmiom with the Department of 11,msing and C .in1n11111it:, Dc.-veloprncnl 

\\!tU:.Rt>\S, the unique lo<.'ul dimutic. ~enln~ical. 1t11d hJpo~r,1phi1.'jl t.'L•ndition:,; ~~Nin~ within 

the buunJ.iric'> ,JI the Distri..:t mak,: tt rr:a.s,1nably fll.'l.'1:s:mry f.:1r the rJJstrio.:t to impose rnurl· t>lring.:111 
rtquirements thru1 ~t forth i.n 1t,c: t'ilhforma Fire Co<le and pursu.ant tu L'ah fornla I lcaJrb and '-at(I\' Code, 

<;c:<.t1on5 13869. 7 and 1795&, 7. tbc r )i~in.:t Jesirc-. to rnah cxpre5'~ findmg'> t,., that cffot.:1 

NOW, THEREFORE, Bf. IT RESOLVED 1hat the Boa.rd •:it Ditn:tor. d the El D,1,1.Jc, (,:1unty 

Fire Protcc:ti,in Dimicl, after h11v1u~ duly nolil'..:ll 1md held public hcunnts, h~~~y uJ1,pls tht- followi~ 

lindmgs (•)occmiog cumn! uniqut· loca! conJitions lhilil lugcthcr mlll,:c each m\1Jitii::at11111 10 th!-: 
C11ltforni11 FiJt (ode, rcason.:,lil~· n~t>S.sar" t•J pm,.iJc 11.Jcquatc and cffc.;tivc rrot~tion of lite, pmperty 
and lhe i:nvirnnmcnl more ,pcd Ii~ ally ~Cl forth a, l11tl11w~: 

20-0203 E Page 33 of 39 



l•INHl\f;s OF f ACT 
FOR CHAN(;t.~~ OR MODIFICATIONS TO TREST ATE 01.111.DlNC; STA1'DARUS 

coot. (TJTl.f 24PART 9) 10'.( 'Al :sr. OF LOCAL ('ONOITIONS 

, \ C~t>nnal. 
A her <lue considcmllu11, the BuMd of Dir'-"\'1n1, "' th<' Fl Dorado ( ~uUIW, Fire Pr01ect1on D1~1rict, here~_. 
fin;.h that due 10 l,)c11l ,limati-:. geologic ind 111rc1p-;1phic condm,-,n~ . .i., s1~1tvj \,ithm Ll11<:< J,~·1,n-11cnl. 
lhcn.• j,; Ii o~ lo pn,viJc.· lh,: 1nodifo:..itwns .1nJ :i1an~es ..:,ml.Jim:J in the ud,1p1ivc: OnJirumv! ,_,f th<'." 
t ultforniJ fire Co.de "11d1 d1.m~s are. t1cxnm:.l w t>e rcasonahl~ nu:n~an {(i pn_)viJc Jd~i11.11c !Ul,I 
ef)t"f.U'.t! pr,)(r!cntm ot lilt·, pmpcrt) and th= cm·11,.mrn..:nt. 

Th( Fl Dorado Cow1{_v fir!'. r'1otc:(tion Di:mkt provide~ fire protection, C'1111:rgcn1:y mt'\lical )(l"\·11.\'!> 1md 
.1pc\.·i:ililcd n:-scue serv1t.:.:~ tn 11pproximutcly '.st!v~nt\-lnur thousand p..·ork in u 2XI :;quarc rriik 11n.~11 

rnc I )islrii.:l is J.-,cakd on the W~!ittcm slope.- of f I [)ur.tdn Cnunt1. The lt1p..1Ji!rnph y (,f the Disuict ran~ci 
front nilling hill~ of ~rn~;.', nm1 ouk woodland in the \\i:_~I o1nd o.aAimt>c, in 1h<! ~:".'.cp drdi011gec1 ot tl,e ("tt5l 
purli,111 f"he wcachcr (und1t1nm var1 trom lrt\.'/1111 kmp,.·rn1ure'., wirh ,Kc;t-.100.tl inow in winlC'r, r,-, 
:mrnml"r ,~mperature.:; that rc~1dllrl:, cx.:«d I tHt J!.'~_,-..:('~ 

fh,: l>hlrKI 1:, JivtdeJ i,w, rht" ,Jis1inc1 areas: <jcild Hill, City of PIL\1:crvillc, Plca.sUHI Valky, Pollll\:k 
l'mc:,•Str.t'.dl(.'rry. and ~h,ngk Spnngs. Mo5t of tlM: U\tnmercial and l11dustriul ar1=r1~ file lrn.-~lt.'d <tlnu.,
thc c1midm uf Hi~hway 51J and mort: rural t.:m11rnu11ilit<s with home siles on brgC'r pa.reels al1.m~ \}v;: 
nu1cr arc-.:i.s of 1hr: dis1ric1 

The Ll Dorm:k• County Fire l'r,1t~..:w,n [)i:-;tmt ts an :di ,r,·"k'· .•>ecnc:y tn .,.,,.h,d1 t.'lc D1Slfl\'.t parti,1p,llc:·, 
In ll ,c!plti~ti.:~u-J au1om1.11i,: aid pn.1i,:rnm v.-ith ,_Ht,er ,l)l<'O<.lt':, ',nth.in the ,011111~ fh,:, re,;rnJn:C'.'i <,f the
Oi<,1rit.1 ._,.ill rcsp.·,nd la, 1m<.! ,.kal with iill'.i' ryp1.- r,) cm~~rgcn.::,. The !cm, 'Tm~ f•m,~ctinn·' in H1i~; 
,J1x:umtnt 1s hn.iifd and ind1.dc~ r1..~pc•n.,e.- to fires, s111n~t· ;md (,dor invl!stig,HiorL'-., ;11:irm<.:, public ttSSi~t 

,:-4Jh, h,LC.lfdo,.1, materials 111eidn1t\. n11:,1ica) aid, fi~ lll\ntig..1ti1)ns onJ spcch1li:rcd r~-·KUC':;, 

Tht lfr,tnd hLL; ,i,:; fiill-timc. !;ta!h:J flrc- stmion:s whi,.;h pro,:id,: crm•rg...:111;:y \l;'r\'i,;.:~ h• the ,:,immunit~. 
Fire Statinn 17 ,s lf,caced in the 1111i11rnrr11ir.ded h,v.11 n( l111lli.1d Pine~ 11! i:430 l'ony lxpre-;~ Tnul. Viw 
Station 19 i;:: lui:ml.'J in the lmin, nrpn1111(d iirt-,l •:ii l'Jiii:cr\ ii h: hwwn Ith Plea.s.1111 \.' 1llcv la! 44 :9 Pk:as:am 
Vitllc:y R(wJ Fire '-latir,n :, I ,~: l,P\.'Jlc..! the •.mmcurv,x,2ti:-d tn\\TI c1f Cm.mo 4! 4( ... Ci C :.u:,1111 RoaJ. Fire 
S1.11i,:,n .:) 15 lcK:th:d 1n the (it.:, .-,f P!:1tc1v!lk at JP,H Sa\.ta1,1,:nw Srre\.'t Fire Sta111111 .'~ ,., i.~atcd in the 
1m111corp,,1.11cd lO',>,'n of Shtn~k Sprrnw., 1,1 .3860 P,·10,kn•:»1 Road. Fin: Stution n. i.~ h.Kati:d in th~ 
W\mcor{ll•r.l•cd (f.iY,'Tl of Co,:il al 7 }[)!! :-:111nl Horin Co11rt fhc 1),:-;trid has 72 11111-umc, can:,cr personnel. 
,d,.mg witli ihn:,; ,11pp<.1tl st11fT ii.. 1\1li1111., 

II ctim1uic 
The El Dorndo Luunry hR" Protcoi,,n Di•mid i:, l,~calo::d ,~1!hin ,, fn11thHI region .. r ~ I >1:,tt1c1 l5 ~Ut'.'Jt'(:l 
to four seasons .. wlth .m ,mmuil .1,1:1u~c ~.11ow foll in th-: winur m,)mhs c,f 2 il\\'.ht-:,. rn .lJditmn to an 
average rainfall of 45 inche;; ~' Yt:41 I h~-~<-' .tLhc~· \\t>~1thcr ..:~•rkl1trom create '.'-'H"~ tuuMdrnL'i roQCf 

.:onJ11ions and 11, ... )dtng a~ ',l,~ll ,1:; ri:,d: \I idc h.u.-u-ds a!on~ !he mnin ,KCl.'·s.s roads \\ 11hi11. us 11.·ell o.:; 1mu. 
1hc Distri..:t ff(,m the ~urruu~imv tuie,t·;_ Due to p<>ri,J.Ji of r.1intall. ulong with re~:11~1 ,oa,J closures, 
1he abili1) 11i th<: Fill!'. l'rotc:cflt)n Dt·Hnd tu pn,\·idc immc.Ji;i11'.' \."ma~ency re.;;ponsl" i:, ,,tkn dt'l11~·ed. 
H·,ese SAmc a.Iver,;~ dimatic con<l11inm, ollen re~rnlt in a larg~ rn1mhcr of vehicular iK\'.idcnL, that place 
..:xlrcrm.· restrninls on the a\"3ilabilitv ol etm:r~~·ncy rcspom.~ to pcrtimn emef¥cn<:~ n:-.'-4:i.,c, lint aid, 
h1t1.itnfl)US matl'ri11b (:ontml and fi~" lillhhn~ I h.e dimatic c1mJi1wn-. rJt\en result in u :,tJb~ranLi;tl <X 

total lack. of nbilit\' ol the Fire Prorc:cti1;in I >ism..:1 lo n.'spun,t 11nme'(iiatch- tn other ry~ (1( m1<'rtt<'t11:y 
situations I.hat occur [ll\amples of thtsc em<:fi;!l!'OC) situations include -;tructun: fires. w1MlanJ vld 
fo1cst fires, 0()(11.Jing, hu.m.kiw. nwtc:tiab 111\.'idcnts. 1.-mer~cnq tm:d,(·al ,;a.ll~~ vchidc l\:,idcnt, and 

. 'i. 

20-0203 E Page 34 of 39 



"'-''ik:Jl r,;:-,C:,•~:·.. ihL .1;uluaJ aid n;r~cnwnls ~~1ahli~b,.·.J with ,1J;,.1inmg lire n~~·ni.:i(':, rnil,!hl not h,• 
pns:;i l,le- due \(• .idn,r,i.: dima',L ,:,111,l11wtt:.-. r.:<.tri~ting ,ff lornlly hkt.:king JJ;:;.,;i;.-.::. in1.,_1 ihe DijlrirJ. 

~URIDllll')': 

·1 hc:,e llical di1w1tk c1111.:H1ionl'i atku 111<: ,11:1:ekr.1tin11. 11\ttn,il'.I, and siii: 111 lire, in th:: rrrc l)1-.1n.:1 

I imcs ,.1f liUli: iJr nv ratnfall. l0w t111r11idity and high lcmpcr;1_1urc."', create c\l1c.:1ndy hazarJou~ ,'.t1ndtt1,,n~. 
f'-l!ticul.irly ,.,~ th~·:, 1dat,~ to th( \.t·ildlanJ - urb;m int•~rt.u;.:. Winds exp~ncnccd in thi~ Jr,-;, ,·.111 havt'. J 

,t~niltcJnl \mp.t..:t ur·-•n ;1ni.: tur,_· !tr·~~,. c\pc-o:ull: m builalitl!,'!' in close' pru (illlily 1(1 ,Jnc ~noth..:r. 1md to 
,q!Jl,n1d); .._,,nu11••11ly fr,u;d ir, the 1·.1 t),;r.1d,:- C,,unt, f-1r, .. h,H\.'1.'.ti,H, l.l1_;tn,_r, 'ilrndme!ihuilr \\ill1tn ttw, 
l-:1 11,irad,, (1,umy Fir~ Pw1e.::.1i,.,n D,~1,kt mu;;,1 t-,.;. tu1!; v,ith theY: Y,iri.1tik~ in n11nd 

1 · (~l'ological. The El Dor,1d0 C oumy Hrc PnHcdi1111 D1•.trnt is loc;1tcd ._,;ithin ll\Ulkr..uc:: ~rj\ rl\ ·.c,srm-: 
l(m~ niri.:c. Tl1t· s~·ismiL, ~e .. J,,g,..:al ,·,111ditions Jlh.:sl.'nl o potential for m11lt1pk tir"'°:c., m<!Jt•1 l11ratJg,: ••I 
1.v:m:r m,u11:-. multiple cle.;tri,:~tl p<_1.,.,e-r- t':iilure<;. m11llipk L'nll.1pscd stnl<:lllr~·., um! a lar!:=e numt:. ... r of '-;tlls 
fr,r r:mcr~,:ni.:_r mctiii.:J.l ,3id. 3ll 1.1i "hi1.:h mav (1~cur ,;imullunl.'ou..;Jy durini; u ·;cismi.; even! l'hc: w,1kt 

Jistrkt h..cs 111m1eruu:i ·.\<1l;:r-pump1ng ~yslcrnc u;;.cd f,:,r lm: :;uppr~s-;1,111 w;,i11;r deh\'cr:,. a.'i ~~II ,t'> wntc1 
~lt.'fi.lgC t:tnk::- prnvidin~ 'S8l,:r ;-.~ '>l\:lr\ )'fCS.SIH'\.· \111,l 11{ rJie p1Hllfllnf -;~<;lt'ms f1l': Jt:p,entk111 •Jn 

tlectri1.:al pow,.':T for Of'I.TJtin11. Sud, .:k~lni:,11 p0wc-r may not t>e i1',o;1il.1hlt: dLJrin9- a '><."bmk t·.,.\·llt. 

\Vatcr :sll,ra!!c tunks used for !he ,;tor;igc of required rin: supprl!S!iion Wiil<'r rnav also ooll1p'iC ir: :,ud1 1m 
event fi1r~111~ the- additional nl.'t'd to trrmsport v.,.atc:r via ;,ddilitinal piecl'., (,f ftrt appantu, whkh will 
pla..:l'" ~ignil1.:1.1111 r\.'slraim •Jn die .ihili1y of the I Ji~trld lo priividr lhl' fl'i,111irl'd eiru:rgl.'n4.'\ S<.'n'K\!5. 

Summar~·: 
LLxa! ~t'nlJ.ntphic and ~eolngical t~.1tures ;u1d pru~c,~,; i:x Vi,l \\ llhm •.hi: huumlarit's r:;/ 1hc Jistrid that 
moy hamJ1{·r 1hc 11bil1ty d the 1-.1 Dor:ufo County Fin: Pritte..:tion [li,,tri~-r to JX'.fflmn its :-.\,,:u11 dut,e'>. Fi~ 
fnllPwin~ no curlhquakc has 1h1; potential r:,f ..:;iu\11lt' ~n:,ller l,.1ss nf lifr 1,nrJ damage thwi th-: .:arthquakc 

itself. 

D. fop111tr•phical. The Dismct i:s prim.nil~ c,.irnpi:,se.t ,_.r o.reas tha1 tU1: .-1,nsiLkred by th<: St.utc to~ h1g.h 
fot hazMJ :-c,cri1y wncs. Mu..:h (1f the Di:'>tm:t 1:, l\),::ated within 11,uthill terrain. Cu\'c:rcd wilh highly 
comhusl ihk vegetati,)ri, Jm luJi11~ the prcscnc<: 1_, f miArlV ,;.:onilernu~ I, ,n::stcd !lt'eas. lhc d11.•\ 111ion Y.ithin 
rhc tfr,tril'.I rnnges from al 1.400 fti!t to uvc.1 h,•100 fc:t"t ul the hi_i,lht.:\! rioinr Slo~ within the Di'i.lm:1 
r:mltC-5 from U degrees to 90 dqrrt:c~. The s1n11.:1uri:~ \,ithin the ureas c.f frK,thills terram h..ive ver:,· limitoJ 
fire ai.:.:<'.'SS. due to narrow rt1i1J way1, with l>lcq• ~rn,k.s nnd poor ro&d :.urincc cnnJ,tio~ Th(; Dlstnc• ;, 
r1..:~·c:s,ihk only from !hi.:: nuc~,d(· by one Ststc Highway and one U.S. llighwu) lb,:. Highway SfJ 
corridor goes dirt:ctl) lha,t1gh lhc El Oora..:ll, Councy Fire District 11r1d 111 limes may be cluscd by !Srtt)W or 
mud5htk., This can rnll);C J(ces:, rn mail) purl'> 1.if ~ El L>Nado (\ iunty Fire Dio;mu Jitl'kult Tlk 
prcsenc..: •>f many c::x1 .. 1m~ <.1011.:turcs \~iihi11 the high fl.re hautrtl scwrity zone arcllS rro,1de;; for a v-:n 
high putcnti,11 of .i strntlurc (1rt jprt'ading irw, ., wiltH,md or .ftm:~t '.Ir! CimJition a.~ v.~11 ~ the J'l')tcnti;d 
for a wi ldlund or forest lire '\prcdJing to strudurt~ 

summan·: 
The ,ttisn'ment .:,f -.:an~11n.,, '>allc}s and slnp<'s into 1nhaltil.!<l un:a'i. l.'1Hnbin~ wnh the \<uriahlc CllitUre ot 
the terrain, yield a po1.;:nt111I for incrc3.,e.J fire ri:ik Most stmchth:~. bcith reshknti11I and rnmmercial. are 
in, or are surrounJ11.'\l b! area:; that ·~onta111 11 ~ignilk.utt t!nu..--., hrush, miwd ou ¥>ooJlmJ. and mi.\\.'ll 
~:onifrr fuel load. Due lo Jroughl cunditit.1n~. bt-C'tlc intc!.ttlltiJfl~. all)O lad: •.if \'C'l_(C:tation fQ40.lgCOlC1lt. 

much of the area i~ popul11tcd with either deod nr Jyin~ lrce~, 1., •ntrihuting co an e)(lrtmc fire danger. 

- 3 -

20-0203 E Page 35 of 39 



• 
f:. Cooclu,ion: 

Local dimilltC, ~c\)i;ruphi~· anJ topn~1;1phi,;; rnnditions dc-st:rib(d ahove innrnse t.he frequcncr. 1n1cnsit:,. 
and :size of ltrc5 invohing huildm11.:; in the: hr•! r>i.strKt. Furtht'r, the~c i.'()fld1tions impud p111«mtial 
,iamage lo slmdLHcs from an earthqu,1>;c !Uld ~utl~qucn! tire. Thcrdur1:, it i\ fl'as1:-nahly nc~·c~'-<lfY fhar 
!he CaHfomia F irr Code~ mnditied 10 rni:1~ati: the dfrct\ ,,f the above .:11nJitiom_ 
CJ.lifomia 1ft';1hh & Safot~ Ccxk :'icdiPn 179'58.7 re,pttrcs that mi:K.liliutliom to the Virr ('ode be 
n:prcssl~ mJr"-c..'J 1md 1de:ntifie,t 1, to which eilch finding refers 10 whkh (o<lc m0Jifirntii11t The: 
nt!ached App<'.ndix A pwviJes this i..:11nnecti(1rL 

I N'fRODUCF'.IJ ut u reg_ular meetiu~ ,,f th1; l~oard ,:if Oirci:ior-: ,:,f the El r),1r ,1d,1 t ._.um~ Fire Pr(1ICL'l 11·,11 

Distriu on (1rt,)l.~t 17th, 2019. 

t'ASS[D AND \()OPTED at a rc~\11:Jr pv:cirng. iJf the B.-arJ ot D111!\.'.IN~ ,:if tht tJ D,lradl, L,;u11t~' f-<'h·,. 
Pn ,tt:~taon r }1.,1r1 .. 1 ,)n < kNber 17th. 21) l ·~ rw the fulJ,,wini,: r!JII t.:all vote; 

AYES :t 

I 
NOES .1 -· 

&.8Sl~T 

' ' ' 
·-. . i .,' ,· ' ,' ~ ,( 

' - :::.:+J..-..Li.....L- ·---· ...... 
rt:~hf<"cll Frccnnn. Ht)£tnJ Scuetar:, 

•• 

20-0203 E Page 36 of 39 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
101.1 X Admin 

105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Clim at ic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ical 

503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.6 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phica I 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographica I 

503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

509.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

903.2 X Cli matic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra phica I 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

20-0203 E Page 37 of 39 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
6112.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Cli matic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ical 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 4.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Appendix 8: Table 8105.1(1) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 8: Table 8105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Appendix D: 0103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Appendix 0: D103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix O: D103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Appendix D: D103.6.l X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Appendix 0: 0104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
101.2 through 101.5 X Admin 

102.6 through 102.8 X Admin 

102.10 through 102.12 X Admin 

103.1 through 104.1 X Admin 

104.3 through 104.4 X Admin 

104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin 
104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin 

104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin 

104.11.3 X Admin 

105.2.3 X Admin 

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin 

105.6.12 X Admin 

105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin 

105.6.37 X Admin 

105.6.39 X Admin 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin 

105.6.48 X Admin 

105.6.50 X Admin 

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin 

107.1 X Admin 

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin 

110.4.1 X Admin 

113.1 X Admin 

20-0203 E Page 38 of 39 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
303.1 through 303.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

305.1 through 305.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

306.1 through 306.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

307.1 through 307.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/T opographica I 

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.2 X Admin 

308.3 through 308.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.4 through 310.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

311.l through 311.4 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phica I 

319.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

319.2 X Admin 

319.3 through 319.10.3 X Climatic/Geo logica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

403.10 through 403.10.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographica I 

405.5 X Admin 

510.3 X Admin 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra phica I 

903.2.1.5 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

1103.2 X Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0101.1 through 
X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phica I 

0102.1 
Appendix O: 0103.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix O: 0103.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0104.1 through 
X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topograph ical 

D104.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix 0: 0105.1 through 

0105.4 
X Climatic/ Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

Appendix O: 0106.1 through 
X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phical 

0106.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix 0: 0107.1 (excluding 
X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opograph ica I 

exceptions) 

Appendix 0: 0108 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

20-0203 E Page 39 of 39 




