RESOLUTION NO. 037-2020
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO
(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 015-2017)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is
updated by the State every three years; and,

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958 .7 and
18941.5 permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county
determines are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical
conditions;and,

"WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2,
Chapter 1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety
regulations to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building
official, or his or her authorized representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his
or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the
chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and
maintain a memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities
pertaining to the inspection of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on November 21, 2019, the Board of Directors of the El Dorado County Fire
Protection District adopted Ordinance No. 2019-02, which adopted the 2019 California Fire
Code with amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or
topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-02 of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District and
delegates the enforcement of the ordinance to the El Dorado County Fire Protection District
Chief, or his or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following
sections:

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106 .7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4
through 307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3,
505.1. 507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2,
903.2.9, 903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 9 07.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 49031,
4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1
through 6112.3, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 130-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016
Section 4.7, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D -2016 Section 5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section
7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table B105.1 (1), Appendix B:
Table B105.2, Appendix D103.1 through D103 .3, Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix
D103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104 .4.

20-0203 E Page 1 of 39



Resolution No. 037-2020
Page 2 of 2

The El Dorado County Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24,
Part 9, in its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International
Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403 .4,
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12,
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405 .4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808,
904.1.1,1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106,
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception),

D107.1 (Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G,
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019
California Fire Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting

of said Board, held the 10 day of March , 2020, by the following vote of said Board:
Ayes: Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin, Novasel
Attest: Noes: None
Kim Dawson Absent: None
Clerk ofthe Board of Sup isors / /
ﬁ/ W . /L/ / Rtk
Deputy Clerk Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Board of Supervisors

20-0203 E Page 2 of 39



¢ dr e dedicarted 1o providirgg a professtonid and
L ;

2107 5 . e T -y
COUTIETUS TEPVIL T TN

-~

D288 @aud cormmmiiniire s wiltik
g

’
i
Idg- s TOIIC L T f .y
Xrude, Trust & Sniegrily
€ b

December 18, 2019

Don Ashton, Chief Adminstrative Officer
£l Dorado County Board of Supervisors
330 Frir Lane

Placerville, CA 95667

Subject:  Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019-02 of the El Dorado County Fire
Protection District, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code with
amendments related to local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions.

Dear Mr. Ashton:

The El Dorado County Fire Protection District (ECF) is requesting the Board of Supervisors
(BOS) ratify its Ordinance No. 2019-02, which adopts the 2019 Califarnia Fire Code as amended
due to specific local climatic, geographic and lopographic conditions. California Heaith and
Safety Codc Scction 13869.7 requires the legislative body of the city or county where the
ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance. The BOS must also
delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District (or its representative) or the
Chief Building Otticial.

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No, 2019-02 with
amendments to the 2019 California Fire Code. and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to
the El Dorado County Fire Protection District Chief A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for
your review and use on this topic.

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County

Sinccrc}y,

ol A AT
Lloyd Ogan
Fire Chief
ATTACHMENTS:

I. El Dorado County Fire Protection District Ordinance No. 2019-02
2. El Dorado County Fire Protection District Finding of Fact Resolution No. 2019-08
3. Draft £l Dorada County BOS Resolution

£l Dorado Counly Fira Protection Gatrict « 4040 Carson Road / PO Bax 807 » Camino, CA 85709
530-6544-9830 » 530-644-0626 (fax)

20-0203 E Page 3 of 39



Attachment No. 1
El Dorado County Fire Protection District

Ordinance No. 2019-02

20-0203 E Page 4 of 39



El DORADO COUNTY KIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

ORDINANCE 2019%.02

BE T ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRFCTORS 7 THE 11 DORADO
COUNTY FIRE PROTECTHON DISTRICT AS POLLOWYS

An ordinance of the El Dorado County Firce Protection Dintrict (RCFRD) adopting the 2019 £dition of the
talifornia Fue Code, ncorporsting the 7018 Fdition of the internacional Fire Code, regulating knd gpveming the
safeguarding of life and property from lire and explosion hasards sty from the somage. handling and use of
hazardous substances, materials and Jevices and from candions hazarrdous 1o life or propeny m the wcupancy of
buikdingy and premines in the Ei Dorada tounly Fire Protection Piatnct, providing for the isauance of permits and
collection of feer therefor, Repealing Dirdinance No. 2016 07 ot the LY Do County Fire Pmtection District and
ali other stdinances and parts of the valinances in conflict therewith

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directory uf the ECHPLY, alsa known as the Ul Darsdu Ciunty Fire
Protection Dictrict
Scction 1 FINDINGS OF FACTS
Section 2 ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS
Section 4: CONFLICT
Section 5: SEVERABILITY

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICAT]ON

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS
The Ei Dorado County Fire Protection District niakes cectain changes ilisted beiow) 1o the Culiformia
Fire Code, 2019 Edition, putsunm to Heolth & Safery Code Sectiony J3869.7, 17938 7 and 1894/.1 during this

code adaption process. Such changes are necessary hecause of local climati, geolugical and/cw wpographical
conditions. The El Darsdo County Fire Protection District has adopled, pursuant to Section 18347 5 of the
California Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these conditions by Resolution #2019-08 of
the El Dorado County Fire Protection District dated October 17,2019

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
The El Dorado County Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, |g
{83 eptirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the /nrermational Fire Code, 2011 edition not
adopted by the state, with the exclustons listed below:

Ordinance 201902 Puge 1
20-0203 E Page 5 of 39



factosiony, 1036 47004 6 4y, Tt e W 0% L& 309 T1{5, 4116, JI8 403, 4032 4304 A01T,
A0, 06, 401.7, 4038 (adoping 403 81400 K | 7) 4019, 403.10 2,403,103, 403 11, 407 {3,404 | 414 4,
ADS 1,408 4, 405 6-405 9, 306, BGS-107 cadopting 807 & 13, B0, 9A4. 1L 10, 1103 1, 1103360006, 11029
wdupting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Uhaprer 23, Chapter 26, the caceptives under DI 3 iException y,
D106} Exception), DIOT § 1 Exceptioni, Appendiy. A Appendin B, Appendia F, Apgrendin (i Appeadin J,
Appendia K, Appendix L, Appeadin M.

Appendices not mfupted can be vood for e ferenus ' atom iy other se.tians of the 201Y i wdcrmict Sire
Cnde

SECTION 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS

The (cliawing Sectinns are heacchy amenided vt sdded

Chapter {
Section 181 Scoge and (eencral R megts
101,) Lide shall be amended as follows. Add agme of i isdiction [E1 Doroke County Fire Prufection

Dusericy ECFVPDY

Section 105 Permits

105.6.27 LPG-psy shal} be amended a3 foliown: Add 1o the excepticn At or sboye 400 foat 5!
elevation, 8 penmnit s notrequired for individuat contamers with a 125 gailon water capity or less,
o7 myullipie contmmezr cyilems Rmving an aggregale yuastity nol exceeting 1724 galbaix serving

oehipancies in Grosp K3,

Sestion 106 Fres
106.6 Permiy, Plsn Review aud laspection Fees shall be added as tollows: 4 schedule of fees

ockipted by ive diirict boord of directors pr plan review, inspecions ond the isswarce of permits
hy the district may be foend 19 1he most current disirici fee scheauie [Heatth & Sagery ode 17v31).
106.6.1_ Cest Recovery Fees shall he added as foliows: Fire service fees may be charped 10 any
person, firm, cotporasion or business that through negligence. violation of the low, or a3 a reswlt of
careiesimess. is respomible jor the ceuse of the district (0 reipomd 1o the scens of an incrdent. A
district board may charge o fee to cover the cost of any yervice which the dLitrict peuades or the
cost of eaforcing amy regulation for which the fee is chargeil iHelth & Nqlety (o 11918} The
Jee shall nol eiceed (he octwal cosi of ayerining the fire ambor respomting o the wane of an
incidem

- 106.7 Administrative Costs shall be added aa tollows. WAen a 1est or imapection 13 xhechded and
the contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the awikority havimg nwrisdiction (AHS), the

Ordinance 201902 20-0203 E Page 6 5’{‘?{92



AHI may biil the contractor for acival time spent trdveling 10 and from the lestiinspecion loudion

and the time spany at the testeinspection site as well as adpmrinistrative cosis.

- Section 109 Board of Appeals

Section 109.4 Avopeal Procedures and Timelines shall be added ns fvilows: dny person or entity
who believes (hey may be adversehy: affected by an order, decision. or (determmnarion made by the
fire code official theough a written rotice may appeal this maner within 13 calendir days of the
postmark on the notice Al such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the
Gaverning Board for the disirict. { umely appeal shall itay further action by the fire code official
untfl the matter is determined by the dppeat Buard as mitlned in Nection 1092, upiess the issue
poves an impunent fire or life safery aazard 1o members of the public. The fire code officil skall
notify the appellant by certified mail of the date and ume of such mearing. The hearing shail be
ycheduled to take place no sooner than 20 culendar duays from the date shown on the certified mail
Fhe appellunt shall have the right to appear In person or Sy agent ai the heuring and present oral,
written andior photographic eviidence 1o the Appeal Boord

- Sectiog 110 Violations
- 110.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended ax tollows: Persons who shall violate » provision of

this zode or sheil fail to comply with any of the requirements thercol” or who shali crect, nstall,
slter, repair or dc work in violation of the spproved construction documents o directne of the fire
code official. or of w permil or centificnte used under provisions of this cede, shall b guilty of a
misdemearor o infraction. af ke discretion of the prosecuting uttorney or agency, punishable by 8
fine not exceeding 5/00.00 for a first violation. i 4 fine not exceeding $500.00 v a secomd
violation af the samu provision within one year, 3. A fine not exceeding 31000.00 for each
additionol violotion of the same provision within one wear, or by imprisunment not exceeding /30
days, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each dauy that a violation continues after dus notice has
been served shail be deemed » separate olfense. (Health & Safety Code Sectinons {3145 md 17995).
- 11042 Citations shall be added =5 follows: The Fire Chief or kivher duly authorzed
reprexentative, may issue cltations for infructions or misdemcanor violations of this code purswant
to Section 13871 of the Health & Safety Code of the Ste of California and (hapter Sc
{commencing with Section 853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of © alifornia

Sectio 2 Wor er

Ordinance 201941 20-0203 E Page 7 ohd0~



112.4. Failure to Complv shall be amended as fnlluws; Any person who shall continae any work
after having been served with a stop-work order, except such work us that person s directed to
perform to remove a violation or unsate condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imgrisonment or

both as described in Section 110.4 (Health & Safery Code Sections (3145 and [ 7995,

Chapter 2

Section 202 General Deflaitions
Add definition for Campfire - Shall mean a fire which is used for cooking. persinal warmih,

fighting, or aesthetic purposes.  This includes fires contained wirthin outdoor firrplaces and

enclosed stoves with flues or chimneys, stoves using jellied, liguid. vr solid fuels, portuble barbecue
pits, braziers, or space heating devices which are used outside of any structure, mobile home, or
any living accommodation mounted on a wehicle.

Add definition for District - Shall mean the district and all other areas within the exterior
boundaries thereof now or hereafter estabhished,

Add definition for Driveway - Shall mean a vehicular access that serves up 1o two (2) parcels with no
more than two (2} residentiol units and any number of non-commercial cr industrial buildings on each
parcei.

Add definition for Executive Bodv - Shall mean the Board of Directors of the District

Add definition for Fire Chje{ - Shall mean the (hiel” Executive Fire Officer of the Fire
department/district serving the jurisdiction or a duly authorized representaiive,

Add detinition for Trained Crowd Mawsager - Shall mean stundby personnel, usuolly a security

guard or usher personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or

other pluce of public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency

Chapter 3

tion 302 Definitions
302,1 Definitions shall be amended as follows: Added Campfire definition. as shown above in
Chapter 2.

Section 307 Open Burning, Recreational Fires, and Outdoor Fireplaces
307 * re Res shail be asdded ns follows:

307,4.4.1 Jt is unlawful for any person 1o ligh, maintain, or use a campfire upon or near ary brush-
covered land, grass-covered land, or forest-covered land during the time when burning permits are
suspended by the Direcior of the Depurtment of Forestry and Fire Protection, the CAL FIRE Unit
Chief. or the AHJ.

Exception: Commercial cooking operations with approval of the AHJ.

Ordinance 201902 20-0203 E Page 8 8#99*



- 307.3.4.2 When cumptires are allowed, it should be uniawtul for any person to light, mamiain. or
use a campfirc upon any brush-covered land, grass-covered land or furesi-covered [ond unlexs the
following muipmimum requirements are complied with.
307,3.4.2 (a) The area within § fect of the periphery of the campfire 13 cleared of il lammable
muterial and vegetation.

- 307.4.4.2 (b) One¢ serviceable shovel with a handle of at least |2 inches is reudy jor use of the
immediate urea of the campyire
307.4.4.2 ¢} Tompfires shalf be limited 10 o i foor by ! foor area. unless in an upproved
manufactured cooking device or fire ring

- 307.4.4.2 (d) Written permission of the landowner mus; be ohtained prior to the gmrion of the

campfire and shall be on site.

Chapter &
- Section $0) Fire Apparatus Access Ruads

503.2.1 Dimensions shall be amnended as follows: Fire npparatus sccess roads shell have an
unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet, exclusive of shoulders, as measured from e of curh 1o
Joce of curb, except for approved security geres in sccordance with Section 503.4, and unabstructed
vertical clearsnce of nol less than /5 feer. Ail drrveways in the disirict shall not be lestthan |2 feet
wide.

503.2.5 Dead Ends shail be amended as follows: Dead-end fire spparatus access rosds omd
driveways in excess of 150 feet in length shall be pravided with an approved area for tuming around
fire apparatus.

- 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces shall he amended as follows: Where o hridge or an
elevated surface is part of & fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall te constructed and
maintained in accordance with the currens El Dorado County Trumsportaten Divition Bridge
Standard or Appendix [t of the current California Fire Code. whichever is more resiricive Bridges
and elovated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposod loads of fire
apparsius, Vehicie load limits shail be posted at both entrances 1o bridges when required by the Fire
Code Official. Where elevmed surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use are adjacen! to surfaces
which are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs, or both shall be instalted
and maintained when required by the fire code official

- 503.4.2 No Parking is Fire Laues shall be added as tollows: No person shall stop, pork, or leave
standing any vehicle, whether aitended or unattended, except whan necessary 1o avoid conflict with
other traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief or his'her duly authorized
representative, Peace Officer or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway, as any
curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parhing fixility,

Ordinance 2019-02 20-0203 E Page 9 8t3%



designated as a fire lane by the tistrict with jurisdiction over the area in which the plac is located.
The designation shall be idicited (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to. and vistbie from.
the designated place cleariy siaring in letters not less than one inch in height thas the ploce is o fire
lume, 12} by outlining or painting the pluce in red and in contrasning <olor, marking e place with
the words FIRE LANE which are clearly visible from u vehicle. vr (3) by a red curb or red paint
nn the vdge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words "FIRE LANE .

503.4 3 No Parkine in Front of Hydrusts shsll be sdded as follows: Mo person shali sop, park, or

leirve stunding any sehicle within 15 feet of g fire hyvdrant eecept as follows: ¢ai If the vehicle is
atiended by a licensed driver who ix seated in the frorms sear amd who can immediately move such
vehicia in case nf necessity, (b} If the vehicle is vwned or aperuted by a fire deparment and i
clearly marked as a fire departmens vehicle,

503.4.4 Fire Luney Based op Road Width shall be udded a3 follows; Fire domes shall be based on
road width as required in Appendix D) us amended by the distric

503.5.3 Fire Apparatus Accesy Gates shall be added a3 follows: 4l auiematic and manual gutes

installed over fire appararus xxcess roads shall comply with the district gate standard as approved
by the fire code official.

Section 505 Premise ldgntification
- $0S.1 Address Identification shall have the first line of this pamgraph amended as follows:

Addresses for pew and existing bwildings shall comply with the districi address stardard s
approved by the fire code offictal.

Section 507 Fire Protection Water Supplies
507.5.1 Where Reguired shal! be amended as tisllows: 400 feet shalf be amended 1o /50 feer.

- Section 509.3 Fire Control Room
- 509.3 Fire Coatrol Room Fire Protection and Ulility Equipment [dentification and Access, i3

hereby amended by adiling the following to read. Fire sprinkler rixers, fire alarm comrod panels.

solar photovoltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, swppression, or
similar control switches shal be located inside o single fire control room for the builiting. The fire
comirol room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a isiai useable
areu of mot less than 35 square feet. The rvom shall be located within the building va an outside
wall at a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from the euerior. An
exterior access door with o clear widrh of not less than 32 inches and a height not less than 80
inches shall be provided for occess inio the room A durable sign shall be affived 10 the exterior of
the door with the words "FIRE ("ONTROL ROOM" in letiers not less than 4 inches m height. 4

Ordinance 201902 20-0203 E Page 10 889~



ke box complvinyg with Section 306 shall be wnstulled on the exterior side of the fire control room
door apening. The room must be capable or mamniaining a minimum remperciure of 40 degrees
Fahrenheit. A clearance of 12 wnches shall be provided from the fire sprinkier roers 16 any
whacent wafls. This room can be shared with other building utilities or fire proteciun equipmeni
that iy compatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the
Sire sprinkler system, other fire protection equipment. and site plans.  Thix room shail not be wed

Jor uny ather storage.

Chapter 9
Section 903 Fire Sprinklers
3.2 Wheye Required shall be amended as follows. An sppraved automatic sprinkler system shall

be reguired ond installed in new buildings and structures 3600 square feet or greater when

congstructed or relocated within thy jurisdicrion as described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12.
Exception: Agricultural buildings not under a special use perindt used for commercu; purposes.
%03.2.8 Where wired shall bo added as follows: Stasuy of existung bvildings greater than 3,604
square feer. In exuting buddingy 3,600 square feef or greater. other than one urmd two-famiiy
dwelling wnits, umd agriculreral bulddings not under special usp permit for commercinl purposes,
where the floor urea of the building or structury is increased by an addition of maore than thirty
perceni (3113%) or 1 000 square feat whichever ix lesy, such binlding or structure shotl be made to

conform o Section 9113, 2,

- 903.2.b Where Reguired shall be added as follows: Status of exisitng buildings less than 3,600
square feei In existing buildingt 3.600 square feet or less, other than ome-and rwo-fomdy: dwelling
units, and agricultural buildings moi under special use permit for commercial purpose; where the
Jloor area nf the building or siructure is increased to a rotal squore foolage over 3,600 ;quare fee,
by ar addition of more than thirty percemt (30%) or [,000 square feel. whichever is less, such
building or structure shall be madde (o conform fo Section $03.2

- 903.2.1 Group A shall be nmended es follows for A groups A-1 through A-4: 903.2. 1.1 11 The fire
wea cxcoody 1000 squure feret.

903.23 Grouwp £ shall be amended as follows: 903.2.3 (1) Throughout all Group £ fire areas
greater than J 600 square feet in ares.

903.2.4 Group F-1 shall be amended as foliows: 903.2.4 Group F. 903.2.4 (1) A Grous F fire arce
exceeds 3,600 sguare feel,

993.2.7 Group M shali be amended as follows: 903.2.7 Group B and M. 903.2.7 (1) A Group B
and M fire srea exceeds 3.600 square fee!

903.1.8.2 Magufactured Homes shall be added as follows: An awtomatic fire sprinkier system shall
be required in all mew manufaciured homes and multi-family manufoctured homes inendad for use

Ordinance 201912 20-0203 E Page 11 5¥39



as g oneand two-family dwelling  The design und insiullation of such systems shall te i
accordance with California Code of Regulations. Title 75, 4300
Exceptions:
(. Munufactured homes located withn an cxisting mobilehume park complving with

California Health and Safery Code, 1hvision 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3,

L

Manufactured komey that do not exceed |, 200 square feel in size and serve as an
accessory dwelling unit, as defined 1 Covernment Code Section 65852, when the
cxisting primary residence on the progerty i not required to cnmply witk Californiv
Residential Code Sceiton R313.2

¥ Manufaciured homes that do not exceed 120 squore feet 1 size,

903.2.9 Group S-1 shal! be smended as follows: 903.2.9 Group S, 903.2.9 (1Y A Grow S fire area

exceeds LA square fest.
- 903.2.10 Group S-2 Eaclosed Parking Garapes shall be amended 25 follows: 903210 (1) Where

the fire area of the eaclosed parking garage excecds I, 600 square fres.

Section 907 Fire Alarm and Detection Systems
907.2.8 Whert Required ~ New Buildings or Structures leys thun 3,600 square feet shall be

added us follows: 4n approved fire alarmdeiecuon system shall be instailed in alt buidings with a
Hoor area less than 3.600 square feet
Exceptions:
[ One- and rwo-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and ather accupancies classfied

as ")

b

Agricultural bwildings aot under spectal use permil andor not used for commercial
purposes (e.g.. refails soles, food service, and/or special events).

3 Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feei may be exempe, x: determine.d
by the Fire Chief. or histher duly awthorized representative, based on building

consiruction material umd frotures, location, occupuncy type, and distonce 1o

exposures,
- 907.2.b Swatus of Existing Buildings shail be added as follows: In extsung burldings withour an

approved automatic sprinkler system. other thun one- or two-family dwelling wnits, agriculturol
huilding not under special use permil for cammercial purposes where u fire alarm dewition system
does not exist and (he floor area of the bwiliding or siructure Is increased or modified by more than
thirty percent (30%) or [.000 square feai. whichever is less, such building or siructure sholl be
made to conform fo Section 907 when required by the Fire Chief or his‘her duly authorized
representative. Buildings with u floor area (ess than 500 square fest may be exempt, as determined

Ordinance 201902 20-0203 E Page 12 6%



by the Fire Chief. or hissher duly authorized represemtative, based on building construction
muterials amd feanures, locarion, occupancy rvpe, and distance (0 exposures

907.2.c Monitoring shali be added a3 follows: All fire alarmedetection systems shail & commected

directly through amd monitored by n LiL. upproved cemral, proprietary or remowe sizion service,
which gives uudible and visual signaly at a constanly attended location. All sprinkiered buildings
vhall be montiored.
Exceptions:
/. Cme- and two-family dwellings (R-3 ixccupancres and other accupancss classified
ay ")
¢ Ayricultural buildings not under special use permit undior not used for commercial
purposes (e.g.. retails sales, food service, andior special evenis)

907.2.d Type | Hood Installations shatl be added as follows: The requirement of jnuallation. or

replacement, of a Type 1 Hood Sysiem shall require a fire :Aarm'sprinkier monitoring cystem io be
installed, or for the hood system to be connecied 1o an existing fire slarm/sprinkier monitoring
svstem for that building

907.6.2.1 Secopdary Power Supply shall be added as follows: In accordance with NFPA 72, the

secondury power supply peoviding o minimum 4 -hour power capocity under guesceny load
{system operating in o non-alarm conditioni shall he amended (0 o minimum Tl-hour power
capaciry.

Exception: The existence of an emergency hack-up power supply that meets or excerd the

requirements of Culifornia Fire C Chaper 12

Chapter 12
Section 1203 Emergency und Standbv Power Systems

< 1203.1.3 Installation shall be amended as ollows: Emergency power systems and stndby power

systems shall be instailed in sccordance with the California Building Code, the Califunia Electric
Code, NFPA 110 and NFPA i 11, All buildings. other than ome- and two-family dwellimg units, and
agricwltural buildings not wsed for commercial purposes, with stundby power, shall kave a shunt
orip device that disconnects all power sources to the building, approved by the fire code official.

Existing installations shall de mainiained in uccordance with the original approval.

Chapter 33

- Section 3310 Access for Firefighting

- 33183 Premise ldentification shail be added as follows: Prior o and during consruction, an
approved address sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access rood entry into
the project.

Ordinance 2019-62 20-0203 E Page 13 §MR°



-~ Section 3312 Water Supply for Fire Protection

- 3312.) Whea Reqguired shail be amended as tollows: Prior to combustible materials arriving on
site. the fire hydrant water system shatl be ingtalled and maimained in continuous operation, The

amount of warer suppiicd shatl meet the required fire How for the project

Chapter 49
Section 4903 Plans
- 4903.1 Where Reguired shall be added as follows: The fire code official of the £l Darado County

ire Protection District may require developmunt projects located in Moderaie, High amd Verv-High
Fire Harurd Severiy: Zones 1o submir fire prowgction plun. This plar shall be approved by both the
fire code official ond the authorized representative for the local CAL FIRE Tinit Chief iif torated in
the State Responsibility Area [SRA]) prior to the recording of the final map for the project by the
Cowunry of El Dorab.

- Section 4905 Wildfire Protection Byilding Construction
4905.4 Roof Coustruction Keguirementy shull be added as follows: Al new constrwtion,
including additions. requirex o Class 4 roof covering or assembly A{l re-roofing requires Class 4
roof cavering or assemhly as @ minimum. Re-roofing in excess of 50% of an exisiing siructure
within any une yeor period will mecessuate thai the entire roof be a Class A roof covering or
assembly as a minimum. Clast 8 or C fire retardeant treated ond or non-ireated woeod shake or

shingies are not approved as a roof cavering maieriol for Class A assembiy.

Chapter 50
- Section 5041 General
- %001.7 Lijability for Damages shall bo added as follows: Amy damages or cost resuling from the

carefess handling. spill or discharge of any hazdardous materials shall constituent debt against any
such person, firm or corparation causing such spill or discharge. This debi is colfectible by the Fire
Chief, or his’her duly authorized represemtative, in the same munner as in (e case of an obligation
under contruct, expressed or implied

Chapter $6

- Sectios 5601 Geperal

- $60]1.2 Permit Regulred shall be amended as follows: Permits shall be required a5 set forth in
Section 105.6 and regulated in accordance with this section. Where expiosives permits are required,

they shall be issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized represeniotive. and the El Doruda
County Sherifl"s Department or the Plucervilie Police Department Where fireworks permiss are

Ordinance 20{9-62 20-0203 E Page 14 88910



reguiired, they shall be issued by the Fire Chief, 0r hsiter duly authorieed represemcve. and the
ET Dorado County Bourd of Supervisors.
S601.2.1 Documentation shall be added ns follows: The AH/ shall huve the authoriy 10 request

documentation regarding all aspects of the fireveorks presentation.

5601.2.2 Prupcictary Information shall be added as follows: The £H.S will protect all propriseiury

imformation.

Chapter 57

Sectiog $704 Storage
£704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tmaks are Pryhibited shall be amiended ay

follows: Storage of Class | and Class |l flamnuabie liquids in above gmund fenks outside of buildings
is prohibited unless approved by the Fire Chicf, or hisiher dulv authorized represeviutive, When
permitted by the kire Chigf, or hivcher duly inihorized representative, all above growmd tankisi or
vawlt installations for the storage of Class 1, 1l or 1] flammablz and vombustible liguidy sthall comply
with those requirements as sei forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall also
apply 1o insiallations Hther than moioe vehicle futl dispensing sialians where above-growmd sturowe is

required.

Section 5706 Special Operations
5706.2.4.4 Locutions Where Above-Ground Tanks ure Prohibited shall be amended as {ollows:

Storsge of (lass { and Class (I flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of ouildings is
prohibited uniess approved by the Fire Chiet or histher duly authorized represenative. When
permitied by the Fire Chief. ar hischer duly authorized representative, all above ground tank(s) or
vauly installations for the storage of Class 1, I or 11l flammable and combustible iquids shall
comply with those requirements as sei forth by the Califorma Fire Code. The Culifornia Fire Code
shall also apply 10 mswallations other fhan molor vehicle fuel dispensing siations where above-

ground storage is required

Chapter 58

- Sectign 3806 Flammable Cryogepic Fluids
$806.2 Limitations shall be umended as follows: Stwrage of flammable cryogenic fluids in
stationary containers outside of buildings is prohibited uniexs approved by the Fire Chief or his'her
duly owthorized representaiive. When permitted by the Fire Chief, or hisher duly authorized
representasive, all starionary containers for the sinrage of flammable cryogentc fluids skall comply
with those requirements as sei forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall

Ordinance 201912 20-0203 E Page 15 5%9""



odso apply w insiallations other than matar wehicle fuel dispensing stations where sove-ground

xtorage 15 required

Chapter 61

Section 6104 L.ueation of LP-Gas Contuiners

6104.2 Maximum Capwcity within Established Limits shall be amended as follows The storape

aof ltquefied petroleum gas in excess of an ageregate of 1.000-gullon water capacity when located at
least one-half (42} mile from propern: :oned or designated for residential use and ar ieast one-holt’
(i40) mile from cxisting residenrial development with o density grearer thun one () welling umi
per acre and af least one-half (1.2) mile from any hotel or motel is ullowed when 4#! approved
and o specialiconditional use permit is issued by the Counny of El Dorado or the City of Placerviile.
Dispensing within extablished limits. Within the limits exiablished by law restriciing the dispersian
of liquefied peiroleum gas for the protection of heavily populuied or congested areas, e aggregate
capacty of any one Installation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 gallons  The dispensing
of liquefied peiroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capucity when lacated

at least one-half (12} mile from property zoned or designaied for residential use and o leasi one-
half (1:2; mile from existing residentiol development with o densty greater than one /1) dwelling
unit per acre and at leasi one-half” (1/2) mile from amy hotel or motel is allowed when AH/
approved and a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorndo o the City of

Placerville.

Section 6112 High Elevation Liquefied Petroleum €as Installations (3.000-fout chevations and
above) shall be added s foliows.

- 6112.1 Regulators shal! be added a3 follows:

Two-stage regulaior system shall be installed in accordance with manufucturer requirements

- Two-stage regulntor svstems shall be installed on all LP(s installations.

- The first stage regulutor shall be instolled under the hiinged gauge caver supplied with the tank

The atmospheric pressure apertire of the reglator shall be pointed dowmward.  The first stage
regulator shall be plumbed iy the riser of the yard piping with soft copper whbing to allow flexibility
shouid 1ank shifting occur. The riser from the yard piping shall be located ot more than 3 inches
thoruonially) from the walls of the (onk.
The second stage regulator and riser pipe shall be installed under the eave of the building, as close
as procticable to the building wall.  This riser shall be securely supported/droced 1o the wail
approximately 10 inches below the regulator so as to prevery bending of the pipe by lateral
snow/ice loads

Ordinance 2019-02 20-0203 E Page 16 61%59'2



A proteciive cover, approved by the gas supplicr und Butlding Offictul. thall be instaued over the
second stage regularor and securely supported (o the groynd or diagonally 1o the wall

The riser pipes for the vard piping shall not ha cmbeidded in concrete. Concrete piaced uround
such riser shail be held back at least | inch fram all sides of the pipe.

A1 the time of applicaiion for any building permit which involves the mstallation of an LF<7 sysiem
the upphicant shall submis an LPG system piot plan in 3 copies (or dignally 21 PDF} Tre [P ploi
plan shall include. but noi be limited 1o, the twonk location. proposed tonk capacity in L8 gatlons.
route of yard piping, location of the riser pipe at the building, properiy boundaries, aad an outling
ot all existing/propesed huildings on the lot and a depiction of the ridgeline of any bildg 1o be
supplied with LPG  This shall also be forwarded ti the appropriaie fire district 1o serve as a
Incator map in event of an emergency:

Location of the centertine of LPG 1anks shall be permanently marked by the wse of snow stukes. one
at each end, Swch stakex shall be of sufficiemt height 1o be visible through anticipuied macimum
snow depth al the respective location Instollation and maintenance of these snow stakes are the
responsibility ot the LFG user.

Fropane applionces and accessortes shall not be permitted in any new installation beow the first
floor or helow grusk, whichever s more restrictive,

6112.2 Vertical Riser Pipiag shall be added s follows:

Minimum of Schedule 80 - iron piping.

The riser shall be within 3 inches horizomully of the tank.

Swing joints shall he installed above and below tank level to provide for the tank movemeni (Street
rlbows shall mot be usedi.

A listed flexible riser constricted of copper ar siainless-stee! tvhing and protected by seei covered
sheathed material may be used insicad of swing joints. The flexible alternative swall provide
sufficient slack to allow for tunk movement.

61123 Marking and Locatons shs!l be added as follows:

An approved sign shall be located directiy above the riser shut off valve on the building in a visible
locatinn.

-~ The liquefied petroleum gas supplier shall affix a weatherproof identification tag to the inside of the
tank valve protecting cover. This tag shall contain the supplier's name and emergency 1elephone
number.

- Tamk inviallation shall be permanently marked by a metal or wood muterial snow nwrker, with a
minimum dimension of 2 inches by 1 inches. The smow marker shall be of sufficiemt height to rise
above the annual smow depth and shall be a minimum of 10 feet in height. The snow markers shall
be painted yellow and located on vpposite ends of the tank

Ordinance 2019-02 20-0203 E Page 17 Br#g'3



Section 6113 Underground 1.PG Tanks Installntions ugd Ownership shall be added s follows!

6113.1 Permits snd Plans shail be added &5 ollows: Fermiis shall be requireid. ami pian o thall ba
suhmitted for olf underground tank insailaiions as approved by the AN
61111 Underground 1.PG Tank Ownership shall be added as follow:.  Lndergrouad (10 tonks

shall be prohtbited rom betny sold to end-users und shall ke cetcined by the LPG compiny winder

lease-fype sytem (4 erure proper inuel mante oo require ments are mel ind recorded

Chapter R0
Sectina 80, NFPA, 13D-16 - Stundurd for the Installation of Sprinkler Svutems in One-sad Twu
Familv Dwelliags and Manufuctured Homes as amended 903.3.1.3, 903 3.5
NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows:
Add Section 4.7 to resd s follows:

Chapter 80. N¥PA 13D 4.7 Residemiial fire sprinkler sivmy instalied in all new nowomd fwo-family
dwellings thall utitize a “Passive Purge” system design wnless otherwive approved by tw Fire Cinde
{ Ml el

Exception. Munufuctured home ouiilied, tested amd approvwed by the California Duparinent of
Houving anc i ommuniy evelipment

Hevise Sectwan 5.1.1.1 1o read as followy:
- Chapter 80. NFPA 13D, $,4.1.2 4 wypyphy o7 at leass ume of each rype and temperanare mrintier wed

within the premises shall he maintined na the paiapsery o am approved locofton Stoce zprnkices shadl
he kept in a mounted and accevible cabine

Revise Section 7.6 10 reand s flotlowa:

Chapter 0. NFPA 13D. 7.6 4 focai warer flow alarm shall e provicled om ail five sprindter sviteis in

homes of an approved locaiton on the exsertor of the sheelling
Revise Section 11.2.1.1 to read as follows:
Chapter 80. NFPA 13D. 11.2.1.1 Where a fire deparument pumper connection 1 not rrovided, the

system shall be hvidrmntatically iested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square iwh puye for

a0 lesy than @ 31 mpsute sbeaiiion withour svidence of leakage Swch tesi shall be witnessaf Ay the fire
conde offxciat

Ordinance Y190} 20-0203 E Page 18 81%9'



Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements (or Buildings

Table B105.1(1) Required Fire Flow [or One- and Two-Familv Dwellines. Group R-3. and R-4

Bulldings aad Townhouses shall be amended a3 foliows for elevations below 5.000 feer

| AUTOMATIC

[ MINIMUM

FLOW

i nr Bectlon
{1 313Y o the CA
{

FIKF-FLOW
CALCULATION SPRINKIER | FIRE- DURATION
AREA SYSTEM FLOW (hours;
faquare feet) {Design {gnilone per
i Standard} minute)
0 - s NG At pahy IRRELY y
sponkict 1ystam
:f 1,60 anc greater No Wi ju Valie in Table Cruration in
’ sprirkiar sy stzrm BI0S (D) Yahie
WD, 121t the
i roguimd fire-
> Niow rate
i~ 3,600 Secten WIS o &
of we CA bie £ Uit i

1601 and grestey

i

L Rcwlrmutk ie i
[ Smctin W31 5 [EE Y YN 4
Pol the A Fire ?‘ubl: h
Code rr Section HIG2 323
3133 ol the TA fmin. UKD
!lcsnlmlml C ude G

Table B105.2 Required Fire Flow for Buildings other thap One- and Two-Family
Dwellings, Group R-3. and R-4_Buildings and Tuwnhousey shall be amended as

follows:
AUTOMATIC  SPRINKLER { MINIMUM F1L.OW DURATION
SYSTEM FIRE-FLOW iNowrs)
(Design Standerd) {gatloas per
minwute)
Na sutomatic speinkler syuem Yalve In Table Durstion in Table
8105 1) BIOS.1(2)
Section Y33 1.1 i the £ Fire W 35S of the value Duration  in Tible
Code in Table RIUS ()" B105 )(2) o the redwe
Aaw rase
Secuon 90)3 1.2 r)f the CA l'nt e 3% of the value Luration ‘n Tehie
Code [Cnly applies I locwtions In Tabke B103.1(2} B105.1{(2) m ihe reduoe
bdou 5.000-fout elevation) Now rate

"b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less thu 1,500 gpm

Ordinance 2019402

20-0203 E Page 19 8193




Appendix D - Fire Apparstus Access Koads
Section D103 Minimum Specifications

D103.1 Accesy Road Width with » Hvdrant shall be nimiended es follows, adding the exception.
Exception: Drivewavs

D103.2 Grade shall be amended a3 follows: Fire apparatus access roads und drivewsys shall not

exceed [ V% in grade wniery approved by the AHT or by the Ei Dorodo ouyv amendeid

California Public Resource Cade Tule 4.7 Design and improvement Standurdy Aanus

Exception: Flevation above 514104 feet shall not vvceed 12%

0103.3 Turning Radius shall he amended es follows: The minimumn tming radius shall be
determined by the fire code ofticial; and shall not include curb and gutrer

D103.5 Fire Appsratus Accesy Road Gates shell be minended as tollaws: Subsectioni]). Where a

single gote is provided. the gote width sholl b¢ not lesy than D feet (6096 mm)  Where o fire
apparaius road consists of o divided roadway. the gote width shall not be less than |3 feet (4573
mmj.

- DI103.6.1 Rouds 20 to 29 feet in width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs ee specified in
Section [1103.6 shal} be posted oo both side of fire spparatus access roads that are 20 1o 19 feet
wide {6096 10 8534.4 mm].

Exception: Elevations ubove 3,G00 fi as deternnmed by the AHS
- D103.6.2 Rouds more than 29 feet in Width shall be mibended as tollows: Fire iine signs as

specified in Section D103.6 shall be posted on ane side of fire apparatus sccess roads more than 29
fect wide (R334 4 mm) and less than 36 feer wide {19728 mm).
Exception Elevations ubove 5,000 ft as determined by the AHJ
- D104.4 Circumferentigh Fire Apparatus Access Roads shail be edded as folfows: Waep required

by the fire code officiul, a fire apparatus access road shall be consiructed 1o encompar the entirely

of u siructure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access,

SECTION 8: CONFLICT
That Ordinance No. 2016-02 of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District, and all other ordindnces or parts

of ordinances herewith are hercby repealed.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY

If any Ocdinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or phrase of this code, or
any application thereof, is for any reason heid to be invalid by a count of competent jurisdiction, sich decision
shall not affect the remuining provisions of this code, which can be given offect without the invalid portions
and, therefore, such invalid portions are declared to be severable. The El Doredo County Fire Protecion District

hereby devlares that it would have enacted this Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or

Ordinance 2019-02 20-0203 E Page 20 §1%9'®



stiibdivisions thereof, provisions, sentences, clauses or phrases imespective of the teit that ane or morc of them

15 decinred invahid.

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

This Ordinunce shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adopuion. The El Domdo County Fre Prorectiorn
District Hourd Secretary s directed o publish this ordinance 1 » newspaper 20 genersl circulstion in the
Dhstict, {n lien of pablication of the full text of the ondinance, o summary of the oniinance may be priblished
hy the by the Bourd Secrctary within fifteen (1 5) days atier its passage and a centified copy shall be posted in

the office of the El Dorado County Fire Protection Dhstrict pursuant to Drovernment {ode Section 3a%33¢¢) (1)

The above Ordinance was mtroduced 8t 3 meeting of the Board of Directines of the El Dorsdn County Fire
Protection District on Octubey (7, 2019, and it was then read for the first hme. A public hearing wes set fior the

Urdinance to be read for the second time on November 21, 2019 and spproved by the following vote:

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the EY Domido County Fire Protection Disnct this, 21°
day of November, 201

AYES ). o ) ‘ I
NOES. |

ABSENT

ABSTAIN:

Mard Bruntani, Board President

ATTEST:

s i-;; — i

Kathleen Freeman, Board Secretary

Ordinance 201902 20-0203 E Page 21 b¥d’



Fire Code #

Significant
change?

What Is the Charge?

Amend with the name of the jurisdiction

DSP, ECF, & GRV
Lecally adopted / SFM adopted

Amended
Locally adopted and amended

Why Is There a Local Change?

Administrative need

105.6.27

Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate
quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving
occupancies in Group R-3.

Locally adopted and amended

LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than
air and can easily be trapped under a home, if ignited it can
lead to an explosion. At elevations above 5000 feet there is
an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire
activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional
attention.

1066

o Myqe‘a’led:md adopted -

Adophng this section to allow for the creation andi |ssuanee
of few to coveradual costs Section 106.6 defines:’

perTnits; plar i_checks and mspecﬁons as allowed in Health
&Safely Code 17951,

10661

Locally created and adopted

Sectwn!OSS‘lCostRecoveryFm Torecovarmecostlo
the Fire District. "

106.7

Add section

Locally created and adopted

Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs of aquable
failed inspections by contractors.

109.4

Added section 109.4

Locally adopted and amended

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District
is added to read as follows:

109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an
individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire
Code Official. Based on the County of EV Dorado's
Vegelation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals
timeline.

110.4

Completed the section by filling in the blank
portions that were not completed by the SFM. Itis
better lefi to localities to determine the
fees/penalties for their respective areas.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that
protects life and property. Fees have been updated to
malch the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the
District Attorney’s Office. The change to the language to
include the term infractions.

1104.2

Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before
but under a different number)

Locally created and adopted

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2
Citations

The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s},
Lmay issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor
violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the
Health and Safety Code of the State of Califoria and
Chapter 5¢ (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Califonia.

1124

Completed the section by filling in the blank
portions that were not completed by the SFM. Itis
better left to localities to determine the
fess/penalties for their respective areas.

Locally adopted and amended

All violations of the code have been consolidated under
Section 110.4 to include the penalies for violations.

202

Added definitions for clarity

Locally created and adopted

Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District,
Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd
Manager. Definition of campfire shall not include LPG or
Propane fueled appliances.

302.1

Added definition for Campfire to Section

Locally created and adopted

Added definition for clarity

307.4.4 through
307.4.4.2(d)

Added a sections for campfire restrictions

Locally created and adopted

Due to the high fire danger that exists in El Dorado County
we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires
within grass, brush, and lree covered areas.

20-0203 E Page 22 of 39




" 503.2.1

" Changed vertica! clearances to 15 feet and road
widths to 20 feet.

Fire apparatus are becorning larger and taller. A vertical
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus
components. It also allows an extended time frame before
having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional

deally édbptod and amended height for vegetation clearances acs as an increased buffer

for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet éxclusive of
shoulders, as measured face of ciirb to face of curb is.
needed. These stmctures can be difficult to navigate with
fire appafatus and should not be counted in the total
drivable road surface

503.2.5

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the,
Fire Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations to
match as they require tumarounds for fire apparatus
access roads and driveways.

Locally adopted and amended

Fire apparatus require areas for tuming around when
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This
includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides
better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum
around for apparalus in driveways greater than 150'.

503.2.6

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated
Surfaces to state and match El Dorado County
Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated
Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendix D of the
cumrent Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an
alternate means & methods that is not less restrictive than
the Fire Code.

5034.2

Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes®
rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicle Code.

503.4.3

Added section regarding no parking in front of
hydrants

Locally created and adopted

This section cleary defines the "No Parking in front of fire
hydrants® rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle
Code.

'503.4.4

Added section regarding fire lanes based on road
width

Locally created and adopted

| his section clearly defines Califomia Fire Code Appendix D
as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire
lanes.

Created and adopled 503.5.3 to maintain
emergency access and consistency through all
roadway gates in EI Dorado County, refeming to the
gate standards adopted by the FPO's.

Locally created and adopted

Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on
roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing
{ﬂ\e best possible emergency access to maintain fast
response times.

505.1

Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of
buildings

Locally adopted and amended

Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing
based on the District's addressing standards.

507.5.1

Added more conservative standard for the
placement of hydrant and their relationship to
commercial buildings-

Locally adopted and amended

Commercial properties are required fo install hydrants at
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150
feet from any given hiydrant at anytime (half the distance in
between). .

$09.3

Added verbiage to bring all of the necessary fire
controls for a building to one location.

Locally created and adopted

Buildings are getting more sizable in the county. it is more
common to have new buildings with solar arrays that
continue to generate power even when the buildings
general utilities have been shut off. When there is an
emergency, it is vital that we have rapid access to all of the
controls in one location for public evacuation and firefighter
safety. Due to the fire danger present in €1 Dorado County
throughout most of the year, this change is appropriate and
advisable,

" Losslly adopted and simended

. |puetothe topogmphlc dlimatic, and geographic conditions
' ofElDoradonntyandﬁwelromtnMng fado'stoour
nse hmes_‘ along'wnh lhe fact mat ﬁres

20-0203 E Page 23 of 39



903.2.a

Adds a requirement for existing buikdings greater
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the
structure, whichever is less,

Locatly created and adopted

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact tha fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as Ihey relate to fire behavior a__nd rate of

- 9032b

add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the
stmeture whrche’ver is Iess i :

Adds oeeupant protecuon forexrsung burldrngs foss |
| than 3,600 square feet to install spnnklers if they

Locally crealed and adopted

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of EI Dorado County and their oomnbuhng ‘factors to our

increased response times; along with the fact that fires
double in size eaeh and every minute; we requra sprinklers
tobemstdledm stmcturesmcemeyread\s 600 squdre
feetin srze as !hey relare to fire behavror and rate of:

spread

| 903.21,90323,
903.2.4,903.2.7.

These sechons were ureated lo glve speaﬁc
direction on the spnnkler requrremenis based on
owupancy and square footage .

" Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographrc. climatic, and geographlc conditions
of EI Dorado County and their conibuting factors toour
along with lhe fact that fires
double in size each and every minule, we require sprinklers
tobemstalledln strucunesoneeﬂreyreach 3,600 square
feetin size as they relate tofire behavror and rate of
spread . . S

903.28.2

This section was created to include manufactured
residential single family R-3 in the residential
sprinkier program

Locally created and adopted

Manufactured Homes ~ The intent of this code section is to
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or tw
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in‘j
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar
nalure. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption
due to the light-weight nalure of their construction. The
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk
successfully in many Califomia communities.

903.2.9, 903.2.10

These sections were created to give spedific
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on
occupancy and square footage

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions

of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minule, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

907.2.a

‘Added occupant protection for fire alams in
buildings with a floor area less than 3,600, except
R3 AG buiidings not used for commercial

purposes, and buildings with a fioor area of less
then 500 | square feétas approved by the fire code
oﬂiaal .

Locally created and adopted

Provides properemergmcy notification for occupandies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
rheeventora ﬁreorsmoke

" g07.2b

<ipant protection or existivg buikings

alerm dthey add more than 30% or 1,000 square
reet to the struchire, whichever is less,

without automiatic sprinkler systéms to instalf a fire | -

Locally creaied and adopted

Provides proper mergency otfication for occupaindies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of a fire or smoke..

- e07.2c

Added o'oeupenr protection by stating all fire alam
detecuon systems instafled shall be connected to a

: and is rnstalbd per Seeuon 907 of

moni 'r‘rg sefvice that nofifies the fire department | -

) Locell)r created and adepted

e theeventofaﬁreorsmoke K

Provides proper emergency nobﬁcabon for occupancies that
aliow public use and ensures Flre Departmenl nohﬁcauon in

€ event of a fire or simoke:- '. T

20-0203 E Page 24 of 39



TPn‘mary Secondary Alarm Power Supply

Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E

 |néar or adjacest to résidéntil development

6.2. Y W
907.6.21 Modification Localy created end adopted safety related power outages.
PR This section adds a Shunt Trip powsr shut off devices to
1203.1.3 N Shunt trip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off during thie use of back-up
o .o power supplies
33103 N Addms requwemenls for emstrucbon sﬂa o FL;)éa.llyve'teat'ed and adopted Addressing for construction sites is lmponant to assist
. L L ST T jresponding emergency crews. R
Chin T Water supplies at consuuwon sites with-. ST Water must be on site prior to combustble matenal bemg
331?'1 B N “Joombustible materials on-site ‘Loeally adoptqd a_"d amend:ed stored or vertical construction commencing.
. E Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout
This section was created to include Fire Protection the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire
49031 Y Plan for all fire hazard severity zones. Locally created and adopted Protection Plan due to climatic, geological, and
topographical conditions.
This section clarifies that within the boundaries of El Dorado
. . ) County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are
4905.4 Y Adi?fe:‘::gm to clarify roof construction Locally created and adopted wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof
e covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly.
. . Hazardous materials related incidents are costiy to mitigate.
Any damages or costs from negligent practices that P ) ;
5001.7 Y cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally created and adopted Ifthe incident ls'caused by neghgenge due fo a business
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the
cost recovery fee. . .
negligent parties.
Added safety‘prote(':hon with perm s being issued Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and
by both the Fire Chief and Shenffs Department for )
5601.2 N . . i Locally adopted and amended fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of of the applications they will be used for.
Supervisors for fireworks. ppications they '
The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any
. . documentation including timing and proprietary information
Flre.works companies of vendors stya!l make' , that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they
§601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 N available all requested documentation pertaining to Locally created and adopted L ion is understood lo be
the frework presentation deem necessary. This information is un lers o
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as
such.
) Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
T . " flammable and Class Hf combustible liquid storage in above-
5704.2.9.6.1 N Established kimits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended ‘groun d tanks, Requires AHJ approval and a
Special/Conditional Use Pemnit from the County.
Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
: " , flammable and Class !l combustible fiquid special
5706.2.4.4 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Codg Locally adopted and amended ’operahons in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval
and a SpeuaIICond onal Use Pemut from tﬂe Cwnty
Admsmstrahve need to add District name. Estabfished limits
: ) Sl _ as nequwed by lhe Fira Code Official for Flammabla )
5806.2 N Qggg:mﬁzd;ﬁ:: aﬁg;?m":?:e Code Locally adopted and amended Cryogemc fiuids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ-
: : : h approval and a SpeaalICondmonal Use Permit from the
c L T s e T : Estabhshedhmats equwedbytheFreCodeOfﬁaalfor
L i e ERd et gy FlammableCtyagemcﬂusdsmstabonarymtamers
5806.2.1 N F—Isfabhsheé mm a§ set forfh in the Ftre.C?t_!e SfM adopted and aménded locafly Reqires AHJ approval and a Spea allConditional Use
: ' ’ ' Permit from the COunty
61042 ' Locally adopled and amended

20-0203 E Page 25 of 39



6112.1

Establoshes pmpane tegulator neqmrements for
looabons above 5000 fool elevation '

.\ Locally created and adopted

Establishes propane regulator requirement for locations
above 5000 foot elevation. Including requirements for two-
stage regulator use and location of frst and second stage
regulators. Addinonal requirements are outlined for .
protective covers; fiser pipe installation requirefnents;
building pefmit submuﬂal and review, tank centerdine
madong, and grade reqmremenbs These reqmrements are
based on sigh cant ﬁne huskxy in haavy sow and ex(reme

'oet22

s roqiroments|

Locally creatd arid adopted

Estabiishiss propan_e marking and location ‘. N
mqmremenbs above 5000 foot elevabon ' v -

Locally reaied and adopted

§113.0

Permits and plais shall be sibmitled and approved s

by the AHLJ (Authodty Having Jurisdicton): - - Locally created and adopled . ataions of undefground LPG tanks. Undergrodind tanks
T S S ’ F requlresubstannalmamtenancemdudmgmspecnonand
anode replacement at regufar mlefvals ‘
T Unaagmundtahksodnddéeasuyandcanleakv)iuiodr
" 1132 Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the Locally created and adopled detection. They are also are not roulinely maintained when

property of the LPG company

soid to the end user, This does not apply to above ground
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16

NFPA 13D-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the
District has been amended to update various
provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler
systems in one-and two-family dwellings

SFM Adopted and amended locally

Amended (o include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on-
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow
alamm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in the
event of water activation in a vacant structure, and
hydrostalic testing requirements to assure proper 13D
sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water
damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements
were also added to ensure waler circulation through the
system, reducing stagnant water and backflow concems
(EID encourages this type of system).

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section 4.7

Correction of a system quality issue

SFM Adopled and amended locally

Amends the current code set to include the addition of a
passive purge system to keep the water in the sprinkler
piping system from being stagnant.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section
5.1.1.2

To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler
system minimizing damage

SFM adopted and amended locally

A supply of each type of sprinkler head used ‘in a system
must be available on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section 7.6

Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation

SFM adopled and amended locally

An audible alarm system is added to notify occupants and
in the activation of the system when the building is not
oocupied allow for detection minimizing damage.

Chaper 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section
11211

System test to a pressure of 150 p.s.i.

SFM adopted and amended locally

A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and
failures and assures proper gluing of system components.

AppendixB Table
8Os 1(1)

. Chmged5OOGPMtoIOOOGPM betow 5000 foot |+ -
2. - |elévation, tomatdmﬁreﬁawpraeedentsusedm
| EBC for years - : .

et

Allonsuslnmatdmha(developersandrmmmused
toin regardstoGPM ﬁreﬂowreqmremmts that havebwn
ised fof over a decade in EDC. : : .

2

0-0203 E Page 26 of 39



( Appendix B: Table

Established a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM,

Allows us to match what developers and residents are used

B105.2 below 5000 foot elevation, for ali commercial Locally adopted and amended to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been
' projects used for over a decade in EDC.
" ! L ~ |itis unreasonable to require a residential driveway to
Append»x D: D103.1 ];we an.e)feepum for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended construct a 25 foot wide space for accsss to @ hycrant
Co O R TtﬂeMreqmresforustoonlyacceptuptme%dnveways
Appendix D: D103.2 | State law requires no greater than 16% grade Locally adopted and’améﬂd'e_d in our E Dorado County Title 14 adoption we aiow greater

lhan 16% grade wrth AHJ approval and hard surfaoe

Appendix D: 0103.3

Text to include curbs and gutters

Locally adopted and amended

20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gulters due
to potential access issues and tumning radius concems.

Appendix D D103.5 §
SRR e

Firé spparatus accessroad gates: .

Locally adopted and aiended

[Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided
roadway the gate w»dth shall not be less than 15 foet due to
radius issues. o R .

Appendix D: D103.6.1

Roads widths 20 to 29 feet

Locally adopted and amended

No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feel
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does
not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all other elevations.

Appendix D; D103.6.2

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36
feet in width

Locally adopted and amended

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet
alfowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of
elevation, Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D
Section 103.6.2 for al other elevations.

Appendix D: D104.2
Exception

Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered
building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to

have only one approved fire apparatus access road.

Locally adopted and amended

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
residents and first responders.

Appendix D: D104.4

Added to require circumferential fire apparatus
access roads

Locally created and adopted

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire
structure and shall provide a continuous means of

Locaily Adopled .

emergency vehicle access.
ix D: D106.1 : For the safety of the communities we five in, two ways of
o Ex cepllion ) Removed Exception in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended  {ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
) : residents and first responders.. -
ix D: D107.1 : For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
o Ex l'ion ’ Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
cep residents and first responders.
Adopted with no Amendments
101.2 through 101.5 c;?u?:;d w&‘mmw nent swmb'"w and _ Locally adopted Administrative clarity. . - 3
1026 through 102.8 Referenoes. Sub,eots not regulated by me code Locally Adopted - Adminisirative claity - .|
102.10 throuigh 102.12 Confitng p“""s_"""s Other Laws, A"p"“"m of Locally Adopted - . [Adminisbiative carty: -
Deﬁnmon oﬂhe Fire Prevenh on Dmsmn and abxhty ST e
1031 through 104.1 to enforcs the code _ »Locaily Adopted . . i dlarit
104_.3‘uubugh 104.4 Right of Entry, Wa'nanrs', and Identification Locally Adopted Administrative claity
104.6 thiough 104.6.4 | Record atenion e Locally Adopted Adinistratve clarity
fo48toigh 10492 | * N ”°'i'_"°°"°"* et '““"“"" e ond pamiisatie ity .

20-0203 E Page 27 of 39



105.6.12

Dry cleaning operational penmits required for
hazardous deaning solvent use

Locally Adopted

Administrative clarity

105.6.2.28 through
105635

Adopted th)s sedlon for admmrstrahve danty and
ﬁre and hfe safety mspechons '

Locally Adopted

Permits for various business operations for: Magnesium,
miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation
vehicies, motor fue!-dlspensmg faciities, open buming,
open flames and torches, open ﬂames and candles and
otgamccoatmgs [T .

Locally Adopted. . -

pomis i s ofassemuy -

. Locally Adopled -

" Locaily Adopted:

L@!&Addvteg o

orage (chips, hogged matenal

lumbef o plywood excess of 2oo'eub|c feet)

" |fre and ife safety inspections. ¢

'Locauy Adopted

Adopted this sedlon for admamsrrahve danly and

ﬁre and life safety mspedwns

Locally Adbpl_ed .

" Locally Adopted

eqmpment, mmpecﬁon and tesung, (_eoordkeeplng. :
supemsoon rendenng eqmpment inoperabis, ovemmding

quahﬁwuons

fire and life safety mspechons

Lde'eﬂy.AdBﬁt:ed

COmpﬁance with ordérs and notices, proseclmoﬂ of.
violations, and unauthorized lampenng ] :

Adopted this section for admlmstrabve danty and
fire and lile safety inspections .~ :

Locally Adopted

Abalementofvuolabon —

Adopted this section for administrative danly and
fire and life safety mspeohons

Locally Adopted

Aulhonly to disconnect semce ublmes

303.1 through 303.9

Adopted this section for fre and ffe safely

Locally Adopted

Asphalt kettles contain hnghly ﬂammabla substances and
require stringent safeguards (Cllmauc, geological, and
topographical)

305.1 through 305.5

Adopled this section for fire and lfe safety

Locally Adopted

Managing igdih'on sources through responsible applicaﬁon
of standards will reduce the number of fires in various
setungs (Chmauc, geologm! and topographml)

306, throughi 306.2

Adopted this section for fr and i safely. .

Mohon pwmre pro;edzon rooms and ﬁ!m_ara HIGHLY

308.1.-

Adopted this secton for ire and ife safety -

Locally Adopted”

|topographm|)

308.1.2 through
0813

dopted tis sechon for fre and ife safely

(Adopted this section for fire and life safety.

"20-0203 E Page 28 of 39



Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices,

308.3 through 308.4.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life saf:eiy ' Locally Adopted theatrical perfornances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2
s : Lo . dormitories (Clima'tic, geological, and topographical)
Mo o N Adopted this sed:onfof fro and ife safely. . .‘ - Locally Adopted General requlrements relating fo smokmg (Cllmahc

gedlogical, and topographical). - .
"No Sriioking" slgns (Cllmahc, gedogwal and_

Localy Adopled . - (opographical)
A ER RS E Removalolsvgns prohiblted eomph i oewnh 'No Smokmg
Adopted this ection for fire and life safety ° .- l_;owlly Adopted.- - signs; ash trays, bummg objects, hazardous ‘environmental

condiﬁons.' (Cllmahc gedogvcal and topograph:oal)

AT R | ”bandoned premises, !enantspaces, safeguardmg vacant
S Lo'cally Adopted” - premlsas seounty fire protection, fire separahon removal
o e s fof combiistibies, removal of hazardods malenals (Cllmahc
’ geologml and topographml)

" {Adopted this sector for fire and i safety

311.1 trough 311.4

General requnremems relatmg to mobile food prepamuon
cles. (Cumaﬁ geologlml and f

Loy aed

) 4 RTINS Petmmformob:lefoodpreparauon vehldes(Cﬁmauc
ﬁreandlufesafetymspoohons TR Lmuymted 7 . |geological, andtopographlcal) : .

Exhausl hood ﬁre proteouon, ﬁre protaouon f0f oookmg

supply piping, * Gookirig oil storage containers; melallic
storage tanks, nonmetaltic storage anks, cooking oil
slorage system oomponents design criteria, tark venting,
nomial vents, emergency vents, LPgas systems, maximum
Lo - L aggregatevolume protecﬁmofoontamef LP-gas container
Adopled this section for fraand lifesafely. -~} - - Locally Adopled. © " - {constiuclion, protection of system piping, LP-gas alamms,

- ERC C ' : -~ . |CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel,
maximurn aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG
container construction, CNG containers supplying
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping,
miethaneé alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems.
{Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1

"N Adopted this section for firg and iifésafgty_ VI o Locally Adopted (residential care faulmes and group homes) evaouauon and
R R S TR : B e fire safety plans, . - T )
v T L N GmupR1(Boardnghouse hotel, motel)oowpancy
N Adopte‘d mi's_sed_ion for fire and Iife';afety,- S Lowlly Adopted--,_ - Evacliations, diagrams, emergency duh&s (Cllmatlc,

. {geclogical, and lopographical)

N Adopledmlssectnonforﬁreandhfesafety T LoeallyAdopted .

Emergency Planmng and record keepmg (Clvmahc
geological, and topographical). . -
Adopted thls section for administrative danty and A permit is required for emergency responder I'adiO systems
5103 N fire and life safety inspections Locally Adopted (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
L - o Wall coveririgs in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a
807.5.2 through - |-~ Nﬂ- Adopted this sectm for admmlstrahve danty and : Lowlly Adopled e maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in -
8_97.5.2.3_ SR SIS ﬁre and life safety mspecﬁons AL educaﬁona! faulrﬁes (Climaﬂc gedogwal and
An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5
1903215 N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and (sporting arenas, amusement park struclures, bleachers)

fire and life safety inspections Locally Adopted (Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000
square feet, (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

20-0203 E Page 29 of 39



Adopted this section in existing buildings for the

Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings.
All buildings wil! be required to aliow emergency responders
to receive and transmit emergency radie traffic to and from
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by

: ﬁreﬁghters: nd otheremergencyresponders N Locally Adopted

1032 Y [safely of irefighters and otner emergency Locally Adopled the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind
responders. this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This
situation can be comrected with the addition of radio
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have
strong signal. (Climatic, geologicai, and topographical)
Appendlx D 0101 1 o Adoptr_ad this sectlon for the safety of Ihe pubhc'

perdix b':-bida.s

"No Padong, Frre Lane sign's reqmrements (Clnmabc '
geological, and Iopographwal) o L

firefighters, and other emergency responders.

‘m“’ m”e"dh ;?MD;M L 'N o LAdopted this setion for lhe safety oﬂhe publrc ' Local Mopt ed o Commerclal and lndustnal development fire appamtus
(ex i “g exoepuon) o ﬁmﬁghters and other emergency responders R y A iawess roads. (Chmabc geologmal and topographml)
AppendrxD D1051 . N . Adopted !fus secuon forlhe safety ofthe pubhc. - LowIIA e x Requirements’ loraenal fire apparatusawssroads

: e & ters, and other emergency responders o y 'd‘c‘ 'p_: t-e.‘d‘_ _‘f (Cllmauc gedoglcal and (opographwal) o

: N Adop(ed this section for the safety of the publn; : _: L m" Adopted ) Frre apparatus m roads for multiple-famity’ res:denual

(exdudmg excepdons) . Pﬁreﬁghters and other emergency responders | Loy R developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
o 4x D: D107.1 o o thooubi Ont?- or two-dwe:lling re.sidential develop?ents Sh:; !;e
‘(:xpdeu" dl'qngm  exceplions) N Adopte_d u_ris section for the sa_fety_lb e public, Locally Adopted equipped throughout with two sperate an ' approve re
thiceiah D107.2 firefighters, and other emergency résponders. apparalus access roads due to topographic, geographic and
o 9 : o L climatic conditions.
Apoendix D: D108 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopted Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction

standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Grey cells are previously amended,'_édop_ted, or 'g:hahged ';ﬁéde sections that are being adopted again in-this code cycle. -

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions.

20-0203 E Page 30 of 39



Mountain Bemocrat

www.mtdemocrat.com
FAX # 530-344-5092

LEGAL
AD Proof

Ad Rep: Allison Size: 6.0"

Changes:

Start Date: 10/8/19

File Name: 7011

graphics /Legals/Ads/Mountain Demo

ADVERTISERS: PLEASE READ CAREFULLY!
A proot is provided to avoid printing errors & to
show the arrangement of composition. Mark all
corrections with a pen. We cannot be responsible
for printing errors not corrected on the prool.
Our deadiine schedule does not allow
copy changes or additions.

Unless we hear from you
by on ’
~ AD WILL RUN AS SHOWN.
COnhc: your advertising representative
a

NOTICES OF INTENT

First Notice

Notice of intent to Adopt a
Fire Code Ordinance

Notice Is hereby given of the intention
of the El Dorado County Fire Protection
District to adopt a Fire Code Ordinance.
The District shall hold its first public
hearing at 1:00 P.M. on October 17, 2019
at 2850 Fairdane Ct., Building C, Placerville,
CA, nguding the adoption of the Fire
Code Ontinance pursuent 10 Health and
Safety Code Sections 13868 and 13868.7,
Coples of the code saction referrad to and

Fire Code as cumrently published in Title
24, Part 9, of the Calitornis Code of
Regulations, governing fre prevention
and building standards related to firs and
panic safety with some amendments. In
some instances the Ei Dorado County Fire
Protection Districts proposed Fire Code
Ondinance prop buliding rds
more stringent than those minimum
bullding standards adopted by the
State Fie Marshal and contained In the
Californis Building Standards Code.

Second Notice

Notice of intent to Adopt a
Fire Code Ordinance

Nolice is hersby given of the intention

20-0203 E Page 31 of 39




Attachment No. 2
El Dorado County Fire Protection District

Resolution No. 2019-08

20-0203 E Page 32 of 39



VIl DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICY

RESOTUTHON 20408

AREFSOCLTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRFCTORS OF THE EL DORADHO COUNTY FIRE
PROTECTION DIS{RICH
ADOE TING FINDINGN SEFPORTING ANIENDMENTS TO PaE
CALTFORN A FIRK CODE

A resolution for the 11 Uocudo County Fire Pratection District setting forth findings with respect to locs)
conditions within the Fire Disericy which make certain moditieations and changes 1o the Calitomnin Fire
Ciode seasonably mecessary for preserving hire and hite safety in the Ef Doradeo County Fire Protection
Districy

The Gioverning Beard of the Ef Doradi County Fire Protection Disinet finds and resobves as (4 lowsy

WHEREAN, Heulth & Safety Cade Section [ 79585 pernats a Fice Protection District1o adopt an
prdinsnce which changes or modities the State Housing regulations adopied pursuant to Health & Safety
Code Section 17922 upon detenmamation that such changes or modifications are necessary due 1o jocal
conditions that pertun regulaunns goverming conditions hazardous to Hfe, propeny and (e anvieonmen
(e fire, explosion, huzardous muterials und hazardous uses, and

WHEREAS, Health & Sufuty Code Section 17958, 7 requires that u Distnet's Board of Digectors
making anv changes or medibonions pursuant o Health & Safety Code Scetion 179585 whall muke
express finding that such changes or pusdificabions are aceded: and shall Tile o copy of such changes or
madilications with the Department of Housing and Commimity Developmen

WHEREAS, the unigue Incal climatic, genlogical, and topographical conditions exising within
the boundarnics ol the District make it reasonably necessaey for the District to impose mure stringent
requirements than set forth in the Califorma Fire Code and purswant o California Health and Satety Code
sectnns 138697 and 179358, 7 the Dhstrict desires (o make ¢xpress tindmgs (o that ¢tfect.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE 1T RESOLVYED that the Board oy Dirvetors of the Bt Dvwade County
Fire Protection District, after having July noticed und held public heurings, herehy adopts the tisllowing
tindings concerning current unique Jocal conditions that together make each muoditicanon 1 the
Culifornia Fire Code, reasonably pecessary t2 provide ndequate and effective pritection of lite, propeny
and the environment more specthically sef tonth as tallows:

20-0203 E Page 33 of 39



H.

FINDINGS OF FACT
FOR CHANGEN OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BUILDING STANDARDS
CODL (TITLE 24PART 9) BECALSE OF LOCAL CONDITIONS

(ieneral.

Atter due consideration, the Board of Direvions of the Ef Dorado County Fice Protection Distnct, herehs
tinds that due to local climatic, geolugic and tonographic conditons, ax stated within Quy dovument,
thert 15 & peed 10 provide the modifications and changes contained in the adoptive Ondinunee ot the
Lulitornia Frre Code Such changes are deerned o be reasonably accessary © provide adequiste and
eftecuve prodection of e, properny and the envaonment,

The 1t Dorado County Fire Frotection District provides fire protection, emergency medical services and
apecialized rescue senvices o npproximately seventv-tour thousand people 10 i 2%1 square mile srew
The District 13 located on the western slope of I Durado County. The topography of the District ranges.
feom rolling hills of grax, and cak woodland i the west and oak-timber in the steep drainages of the cast
partion  The weather conditions vary trom frecsiny temperatures with octsonal snow in winter, 10
summer temperatures that cepularty exceed TR degrees

The Dhstrict s divided into Bve distinet areas: Gold Hill, City of Placerville, Pleasiwt Valley, Pollock
PinexsSteawberry, and Shingle Spongs. Most of the commiercial and industnul areas are located alony
the comidor of Highwiay 50 and more rural commumities with home sites on larger parcels along the
suter areas of the distric!

The Ll Doradee County Fire Protecnion Distnet 15 an “sdlrsh” ageney i which the Distnet panticipate:.
in g saphisticated automatic 3 propram with other agencies widun the canmty The resources of the
District will respond 1o, and deal with any type o emwergeney, The term “Fue Prowection” in this
document iz broad and includes responses o fires, smoke and odor investigations, atarms, public ussist
<alls, hazasdons materials mcidents, medical aid, fire investigations and specialized rescues,

The Dhestrict has b Badl-time, statied fre statiens which provide emergency services o the community.
Fire Stanan 17 is located in the unmncarporated town af Pollock Pines al 6430 Poay Express Tmil. Fin-
Station 19 i Jocuted in the unincorpormed area of Plavers e bnown as Pleasant Valley a1 4429 Pleasion
Valley Road  Fire Station 21 v tocated the smincurporsted tnown of Camine at S04 (Crann Road. Fire
Station 238 1 Jocated i the City of Place:ville at 3034 Sacramnento Strect. Fire Staton 28 0 wated in the
unincorporated tawn of Shuele Sperays at 3860 Pondenisa Road. Fire Swtion 72 s located e the
unuicorporated own of Coad al 7200 Swnt Flornin Ceunt. The District has 72 full-ume, career personnel,
aong with theee support safl positions,

Climatic.

The El Dorado County Fire Protection Distact is focated within o toothill regron. The Distesct 1 subgect
o four seasons, with an annual wvntage anow fall in the winter months of 2 inche i additon o an
averave rointnll of 45 inches p2r year These adverse weather condittons create sovere hazardous road
conditions rnd eoding as well s rock dide harzards along the man access roads within, us well as imto.
the Distnct from the surtounding sreas. Due o peniods ol raintull. along with repeatedd 10ad closures,
the ability of the Fire Protection District to provide immediate emergency response 1+ olten delaved.
These same adverse chimatic conditions ollen result in a large number of vehicular accidents that place
cxtrerne restraints on the availability of emergency response o perform emergency rescue, Bicst ad,
huzardous materinls contiod and Rre- Ngbting The cdimatic condivons oflen result in a substantial oc
total lack of ability ol the Fire Protection Distnet o respund immediately to other types of emergency
situations that occur. Examples of these emergency situations include structure fires, wildland and
forest fires, flooding, hazardous materials incidents, emergenty medical calls, vehicle mcidents and

L9

20-0203 E Page 34 of 39



0O

senigal resewes. Thu anitual did agreements established with adjoining lire agencies might aot be
possible due W0 sdverse climais canditians, restrictiag o (nlally blacking acce.s inte the Disto,

Summary:

These local clinntic conditions alleer the acceleration, iviensity, and size ul fires in the Fire Distng
Fhnes of litde o po ramdall, low harmidity and hiph temperatures create exticmnely hazapjous conditione.
particularhy as they sefats to the wildband - urban inertace. Winds expenenced in this aren can have a
SIIRTACINT et upon strucure Hires, espeaially an budidiogs e close proamity 10 ope another, wnd 0
wildlands commonly found o the 1 Dorade Coants Fies Peatection Districn Stenehires bailt within the
Fd Dorado County Fire Protectivg [Dastict must be buily seirh these variables an mind.

Geological. The Y Dorado Counmy Fire Prosection Distaet is located -within muoderide iy sesmi
Zome Three. The sesmic, geologwal conditions present o potential for multiple Hres, magon breahdee o
water mans. muople glectrical power failures, mulliple collapsed structures and o large number of calls
for emergeney medicad aid, all ob which may occur simultuneously during a seismic event. The wader
disurict has puinerous water-pumpdpg sysiams uscd tor bire suppression water debivery, 2y well w, water
storage tanks providing waler sysian pressre Most of the puanping syvstems ary dependent on
clectrical powsr for operation. Such <lectneal power may not be wvatlable during a scismic event.
Water storage tunks used for the storage of reqoired line suppression water niay slso collapse wnsuch an
event forcing the additional need to trnsport water v addiional pieces of tice apparstus which will
place a significant restraint on the ability of the District (o provide the reginred emergenes services.

Summary:

Local geopruphic and gealogical testures and processes exist within the baundanes oif the district that
may hamper the ability of the Fi Dorado County Fiee Protection Diztniet to perform its sworn dutes. Fire
following an curthquake has the potential 5f causing greater foss of tife anig damage thun the canthquake
wself.

Topographical. The District is prumanly composed of areas that are considered by the State to be high
fire hazard seterity zones. Much of the District s located within {oothill terrain, covercd with highly
combustible vegetation, including the presence of many coniferous Jorested arcas. The chesation within
the District ranges from at [ 400 feet 10 uver 6000 feet ol the highest point. Slope within the Distnet
ranges from 0 degrees to 90 degrees. The structures within the ureas of foathilis terram have very limited
fire access, due to narrow roadways with sicep yrades and poor road surface conditions The Distnet s
accessible only from the outside by one State Highway and opc 1S, Highway The Highway 50
corridar goes direvily through the El Dorado County Fire District und at fimes may be closed by snow or
mudshides This can make sceess 1o many punts of the £ Dorado County Fire Dising ditficult. The
presence of many existing stouctures within the high fire hazird severty zone areas provides lor a very
high potential of a structuee fire spreading inte s wildiand or orest fire condition as well as the potential
tor a wildlund or forest fire spreading o structures.

Summary: :
The niign.mem of canyons, valleys and shipes into inhabited arvas, combined with the vunable asture of
the terruin, vield a potential for increased tire nish. Most structures. both residential and commercial, are
in, of are surrounded by arcus that contain e significant grass, brush, mixed ok woodland, and mixed
conifer fuel load. Due 10 drought conditiuns, beetie infestations, and lack «f vegetation management.
much of the area 1§ populated with either dead or dying trees, contnbuting (o an extreme fire danges.

20-0203 E Page 35 of 39



Conclusion:

Local elimatc, geographic and opographic conditions described above increase the frequency. intensity,
and size of tives involving building: in the Fire Distnct, Further, these conditions impect potential
damage to stnictures from an earthquake and subsequent tire. Theretore, it is reasonably necessary that
the California Fire Code be maoditied o mitigate the ¢ffects of the above conditions.

California Health & Satety Code Scetion 179387 requures that madifications to the Fire Code be
expresshy marked and identified w10 which each finding refers o which Code medification. The
attached Appendix A provides this conneetion,

INTRODUCED nt u regular meeting of the Boiard of Directors of the E) Dosda  ounty Fire Protection
District on Octaber | 7th, 2016

PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meenag of the Board of Directors of the €1 Domada Coupty Fire
Protection [isinct on October 17th, 2049 by the following roll call vote;

NOES . = o
ABSENT

ABSTAIN:

ATIEST

S o ! ';;7 { i
[ [ c . o g .

v il L‘Ju"‘.“‘:-. . N i RANORI
Rathfcen Freeman. Boand Sceretary Mun-fhanion, President

20-0203 E Page 36 of 39



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted | Adopted as Amended Finding
1011 X Admin
105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
106.6 X Admin
106.6.1 X Admin
106.7 X Admin
109.4 X Admin
1104 X Admin
110.4.2 X Admin
112.4 X Admin
202 X Admin
302.1 X Admin
307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
509.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topograpbhical
903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.7 X CIimatic/GeoIogricaI/Topographical
903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1203.13 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
33103 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5001.7 X Admin
5601.2 X Admin
5601.2.1 X Admin
5601.2.2 X Admin
5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 E Page 37 of 39




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted | Adopted as Amended Finding
6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.2 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6113.1 Admin
6113.2 Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 4.7

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16§5.1.1.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 7.6

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 11.2.1.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix B: Table B105.1(1)

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix B: Table B105.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.5§ 1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.6.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.6.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.4

HKIXPX|IX X IX|Xix<|X|[Xx]XxX|X|>x|x{x|x<ix]x{|x

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

101.2 through 101.5

Admin

X
102.6 through 102.8 X Admin
102.10 through 102.12 X Admin
103.1 through 104.1 X Admin
104.3 through 104.4 X Admin
104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin
104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin
104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin
104.11.3 X Admin
105.2.3 X Admin
105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin
105.6.12 X Admin
105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin
105.6.37 X Admin
105.6.39 X Admin
105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin
105.6.48 X Admin
105.6.50 X Admin
106.1 through 106.3 X Admin
107.1 X Admin
108.1 through 109.3 X Admin
110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin
1104.1 X Admin
113.1 X Admin

20-0203 E Page 38 of 39




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section

Adopted

Adopted as Amended

Finding

303.1 through 303.9

X

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

305.1 through 305.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

306.1 through 306.2 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
307.1 through 307.5 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
308.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.2 through 308.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5

308.2 Admin
308.3 through 308.4.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.4 through 310.8 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
311.1 through 311.4 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
319.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical

319.2 Admin

319.3 through 319.10.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.10 through 403.10.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

MM XX XXX XXX I XXX} (X[ X[>x]|x

405.5 Admin
510.3 Admin
807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1.5 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1103.2 Topograpbhical
A dix D: D101. h
ppendix 01.1 throug X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D102.1
Appendix D: D103.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D_104'1 thmf:gh X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D104.3 (excluding exception)
dix D: D105. h
Appendix 105.1 throug X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D105.4
Appendix D: D106.1 through o . .
X Climatic/Geol | hical
D106.3 (excluding exception) imatic/Geological/Topographica
Al dix D: D107.1 ludi
ppendix . (excluding X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
exceptions)
Appendix D: D108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 E Page 39 of 39






