
RESOLUTION NO. 038-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 011-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is 
updated by the State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines 
are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, 
Chapter 1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety 
regulations to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building 
official, or his or her authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his 
or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the 
chief of the fire authority, or the chiefs authorized representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and 
maintain a memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities 
petiaining to the inspection of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on November 21st, 2019, the Board of Directors of the El Dorado Hills County 
Water District adopted Ordinance No. 2019-01 which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code 
with amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or 
topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El 
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the El Dorado Hills County Water District and 
delegates enforcement of the ordinance to the El Dorado Hills County Water District Fire 
Chief, or his or her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following 
sections: 

101.1, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202,302.1, 307.4.4, 307.4.4.1, 
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1. 
507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 
903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 
5601.2, 5601.2.1, 560 l.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 
NFPA 13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA BD-2016 Section 4.7, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 
5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA BD-2016 Section 7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, 
Appendix B: Table BIOS.I (1), Appendix B: Table Bl05.2, Appendix D103.1 through Dl03.3, 
Appendix Dl03.5 Section 1, Appendix Dl03.6.l, Appendix D103.6.2, and Appendix D104.4. 

20-0203 F Page 1 of 36 



Resolution No. 038-2020 
Page 2 of 2 

The El Dorado Hills County Water District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 
9, in its entirety. including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire 
Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

105 .6.17-105.6.19, 105.6.39, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5 , 311.6, 318, 403 .1, 403 .2.1-403 .2.4, 403.3 , 
403.4, 403.6, 403 .7, 403.8 (adopting 403 .8.1-403.8 .1.7), 403.9, 403 .10.2, 403 .10.3, 403.11, 
403.12, 404.1-404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405 .6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2), 808, 904.1.1 , 
1101, 1103 .1, 1103.3-1103 .6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103 .9.1), 1103 .10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25 , 
Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception), Dl 07.1 (Exception 1 
and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, 
Appendix L , Appendix M . 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting 
of said Board, held the _!Q_ day of March , 2020, by the following vote of said Board: 

Attest: 
Ayes:Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin, Novasel 
Noes: None 

Absent:None _ IL 
Bdan K4:~!c~!t:f Supmisms 

20-0203 F Page 2 of 36 



EL DORADO HII,IS 

FIRE DEPARTMENT 
"Serving tlie Communities of <E[ ({)orado Jfiffs, cJ{escue and £atro6e" 

December 18, 2019 

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer 
E1 Dorado County Board of Supervisors 
330 Fair Lane 
Placerville, CA 95667 

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the El Dorado Hills County Water 
District, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code with amendments related to 
local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. 

Dear Mr. Ashton: 

The El Dorado Hills County Water District (EDHCWD) is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS) 
ratify its Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code as amended due to specific 
local climatic, geographic and topot,1Taphic conditions. California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 
requires the legislative body of the city or county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny 
the adopted ordinance. The BOS must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District 
( or its representative) or the Chief Building Official. 

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2019-01 with amendments 
to the 2019 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the EDHCWD Fire 
Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for your review and use on this topic. 

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County. 

ATTACHMENTS: 

1. EDHCWD Ordinance No. 2019-01 
2. EDHCWD Resolution No. 2019-10 
3. Draft El Dorado County BOS Resolution 

1050 Wilson BouleWlrd • El Dorado Hi/11, California 95762 • T,lrphont (9/6) 9JJ-66JO-;,O?Q._~9~}?iJ~~,,'3 ~f 3..,~•1t1.&'dhjlruom 



Attachment No. 1 

EDHCWD Ordinance No. 2019-01 

20-0203 F Page 4 of 36 



EL DORADO HILLS COUNTY WATER DISTRICT 

F.L DOH.ADO I-IILLS FIRE DEPARTMENT 

ORDINANCE NO. 2019-01 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE EL DORADO H1LLS 

COUNTY WATER D1STR1CT AS FOLLOWS: 

An ordinance of the El Dorado Hills County Water District (EDHCWD) adopting the 2019 Edition of the 

California Fire Code, incorporating the 2018 Edition of the International Fire Code, regulating and governing the 

safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of 

hazardous substances, miiterials and <levices, and from conditions hazardous lo life or property in the occupancy of 

buildings and premises in the EDHCWD; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; 

Repealing Ordinance No. 2016-37 of the EDHCWD and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict 

therewith. 

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of lhe EDHCWD, also known as the El Dorado Hills Fire 

Department: 

Section I : FINDINGS OF FACTS 

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WlTH EXCLUSIONS 

Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMJ<:NTS 

Section 4: CONFLICT 

Section 5: SEVERABILITY 

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

The EDHCWD makes certain changes (listed below) to the Cal((ornia Fire Code, 2019 Edition, 

pursuant to Health & Safery Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.7 and 18941.5 during this code adoption process. 

Such changes are necessary because of local climatic, geological and/or topographical conditions. The 

EDHCWD has adopted, pursuant to Section 18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the findings of 

facts relative to these conditions by Resolution #2019-10 of the EDHCWD dated September 19, 2019. 

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WJTH EXCLUSIONS 

The EDHCWD adopts the 2019 Califomia Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, including 

Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, 

with the exclusions listed below: 

Ordinance 2019--01 Page 1 

20-0203 F Page 5 of 36 



J 

Exclusions: 105.6.17-105.6.19, 105.6.39, 308.1.4, 309,311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 

403.4, 403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12, 404.1-404.4, 

405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2), 808, 904.1.1, 1101, I 103.J, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9 

(adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under DI 04.2 (Exception), 

D106.I (Exception), D107.l (Exception), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, 

Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 California Fire 

Code. 

SECTION 3: LOCAL AMENl)l\1ENTS 

The following Sections are hereby amended or added: 

Chapter 1 

Section 101 Scope and General Requirements 

101.1 Title shall be amended as follows: Add name ofjurisdiction [EDHCWDJ 

Seclion 106 Fees 

106.6 Permit, Plan Review and Inspection Fees shall be added as follows: A schedule of fees 

adopted by the district board of directors for plan review, inspections and the issuance of permits by 

the district may be found in the most current district fee schedule (Health & Safety Code 17951). 

106.6.1 Cost Reconn· Fees shall be added as follows: Fire service fees may be charged to any 

person, _firm, corporation or business thal through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of 

carelessness. is responsible for /he cause of the district to respond to the scene of an incident. A 

district hoard may cha1·ge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the district provides or the cost 

of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code I 39 l 6j. The fee shall 

not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding ,o the scene of an incident. 

106.7 Administrative Costs shall be added as follows: When a test or inspection is scheduled, and 

the contractor fails to perform lo the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ 

may hill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/inspection location and 

the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs. 

Section 109 Board of Appeals 

Section 109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines shall be added as follows: Any person or entity who 

believes they may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code 

official through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of/he postmark on 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 2 

20-0203 F Page 6 of 36 



th<! notice. A ff such aJJpeals shall he filed in writing 11·1'/h the Secretary o/the Governing Board fur 

the district. A timely appeal shall stay further acrion by the fire code official until the matter is 

determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in St!clion 109.2, unless the issue poses an imminent fire 

01· life safery hazard lo members of the public. 7he fire code official shall notify the appellant by 

certified mail of the date and time ~f such hearing. The hearing shall be scheduled lo take place no 

sooner than 20 calendar daysfi·om the date shown 011 the certified mail_ The appellant shall have the 

right to appear in person 11r hy agent at the hearing and present oral, wrirten and/or photographil' 

eridence to the Appeal Board. 

Section ] JO Violations 

J 10.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows: Persons who shall violate a provision of this 

code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, 

repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code 

official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a 

misdemeanor or infi·action, al the discretion of the prosecuting attorney or agency, punishable by a 

fine not exceeding $100. 00 for a first violation, 2. A fine not exceeding $500. OOfor a second violation 

oft he same provision within one year; 3. A fine nor exceeding $1000.00 for each additional violation 

of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding /80 days, or both such fine 

and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be 

deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995). 

l J0.4.2 Citations shall be added as follows: The Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized 

represent alive, may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations(!( this code pursuant to 

Section 13871 of the Health & Safety Code of the Stare of California and Chapter 5c (commencing 

with Section 853. 6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penul Code of the Stare of California. 

Section lll Stop Work Order 

J 12.4. Failure to Comply shall be amended as follows: Any person who shall continue any work 

after having been served with a stop-work order, except such work as that person is directed to 

perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or 

both as described in Section l 10.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995). 

Chapter 2 

Section 202 General Definitions 

Add definition for Campfire - Shall mean afire which is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, 

or aesthetic purposes. This includes fires contained within outdoor fireplaces and enclosed stoves 

with flues or chimneys, stoves using jellied, liquid, or solid fuels, portable barbecue pits, braziers, or 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 3 

20-0203 F Page 7 of 36 



space heating devices which are used outside of any structure, mobile home, or any living 

accommodation mounted on a vehicle. 

Add definition for District - Shall mean the district and all other areas within the exterior boundaries 

thereof now or hereafter established. 

Add definition for Driveway - Shall meun a vehicular acceH that serves up to two (2) parcels with 

no more than two (2) residential units and any number ~(non-commercial or industrial buildings on 

each parcel. 

Add definition for Executh:e Bodv - Shall mean the Board of Directors of the District. 

Add definition for Fire Chief - Shall mean the Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire 

department/district serving the jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative. 

Add definition for Trained Crowd Mana2cr - Sha/I mean standby personnel, usually a security 

guard or usher personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other 

place of public assemblage in an orderly and calm fa.~hion in the even! of an emergency. 

Chapter 3 

Section 302 Definitions 

302.1 Definitions shall be amended as follows: Added Campfire definition, as shown above in 

Chapter 2. 

Section 307 Open Burnin2, Recreational Fires, and Outdoor Firenlaces 

307.4.4 Campfire Restrictions shall be added as follows: 

307.4.4. J Jt is unlmvf11I for any person to light. maintain, or use a campfire upon or near any brush­

covered land, grass-covered land, or.forest-covered land during the lime when burning permits are 

.suspended by the Director of the Department of Forestry and Fire Protection, the CAL FIRE Unit 

Chief, or the AHJ. 

Exception: Commercial cooking operations with approval of the AHJ. 

307.4.4.2 When campfires are allowed, it should be unlaHful for any person lo light, maintain, or use 

a campfire upon any brush-covered land, grass-covered land, or forest-c01·ered land unless the 

following minimum requirements are complied with. 

307.4.4.2 (a} The urea within 5 feet ~( the periphery ~( rhe campfire is cleared of all flammable 

material and vegetation. 

307.4.4.2 lb) One serviceable shovel with a handle of at least 12 inches is ready for use at the 

immediate area of the campfire. 

307.4.4.2 (c) Campfires shall be limited to a 1 foot by 1 foot area, unless in an approved mam!factured 

cooking device or fire ring. 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 4 

20-0203 F Page 8 of 36 



307.4.4.2 (ti) Written permission of the1 lando1\'11er must be obtained prior to the ig11itiu11 of the 

campfire and shall be 011 site 

Chapter 5 

Section 503 Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

503.2.1 Dimensions shall be amended as follows: Fire apparatus access roads shall lrnvc an 

unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet, exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb lo 

face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503 .6. and unobstructed 

vertical clearance of not less than 15 feel. All driveways in the district shall not be less than 12 feet 

wide. 

503.2.5 Dead Ends shall be amended as follows: Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways 

in excess or 150 feet in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around fire 

apparatus. 

503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces shall be amended as follows: Where a bridge or an elevated 

surface is part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in 

accordance with the current El Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge Standard or Appendix 

D of the current California Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive. Bridges and elevated surfaces 

shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load 

limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when required by the Fire Code Official. Where 

elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces which are not designed 

for such use, approved barriers, approved signs, or both shall be installed and maintained when 

required by the fire code official. 

503.412 No Parkin& in Fire Lanes shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, or leave 

standing any vehicle, whether attended or unallended, except when necessary to avoid conflict with 

other traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized 

representative, Peace Officer or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway, at any 

curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or opernted off-street parking facility, 

designated as afire lane by the district with jurisdiction over the area in which the place is located. 

The designation shall be indicated ( 1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to, and visible from, the 

designated place clearly stating in letters not less than one inch in height that the place is afire lane, 

(2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color, marking the place with the 

words "'FIRE LANE", which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) by u red curb or red pain/ un 

the edge o_fthe roadway upon which is clearly marked the words ''FlRE LANE". 

503.4.3 No Parking in Front of Hydrants shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, or 

leave standing any vehicle within 15 feel of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle is 

attended by a licensed driver who is seated in the front seal and who can immediate(y move such 

Ordinance 2019-0 l Page 5 

20-0203 F Page 9 of 36 



vehicle in case of necessity. fb) If the vehicle is owned or operated by afire department and is clearfy 

marked as a fire department vehicle. 

503.4.4 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width shall be added as follows: Fire lanes shall be based on 

road width as required in Appendix Das amended by the district. 

503.5.3 Fire Apparatus Acct:ss Gates shall be added as follows: All automatic and manual gates 

installed oi:er fire apparatus access roads shall comply with the district gate standard as approved 

by the fire code official. 

Section 505 Premise Identification 

505.J Address Identification shall have the first line of this paragraph amended as follows: 

Addresses for new and existing bt1ildings shall comply with the district address standard as approved 

by the fire code official. 

Section 507 Fire Protection Water Supplies 

507.5.1 Where Required shall be amended as follows: 400 feel shall be amended lo 150feet. 

Section 509 Fire Protection and Utility Equipment Identification and Access 

509.3 Fire Control Room shall be added as follows: Fire sprinkler risers, fire alarm control panels, 

solar photovoltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression or 

similar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The fire 

control room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a total usable area 

of not less than 35 square feet. The room shall be located within the building on an outside wall at a 

location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from the exterior. An exterior 

access door with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height of nut less than 80 inches shall 

be provided for access into the room. A durable sign shall be affixed to the eXJerior ufthe door with 

the words "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters not less than 4 inches in height. A key box complying 

with Section 506 shall be installed on the exterior side of the fire control room door opening. 

The room must be capable of maintaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit. A 

clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers lo any adjacent walls. This 

room can be a shared with other building utilities or fire protection equipment that is not 

incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the fire 

sprinkler system and other fire protection equipment. This room shall not be used for any other 

storage. 

Exception: One-and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes or similar uses defined as either 

a Group R-3, R3. I, or R-4 occupancy. 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 6 

20-0203 F Page 10 of 36 



' 
I . 

Chaptl'T 9 

Section 903 Fir<' Sprioktcrs 

903.2 Where Required shall be amended as follows: An approved automatic sprinkler system shall 

be required and installed in new b11ildi11gs and slructures 3600 square feet or greater when 

constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction as described in Sections 903.2. l through 903.2.12. 

Exception: Agricu/Jural buildings not under a :.pecia/ use permil used (or commercial purposes. 

903.2.a Where Required shall be added as follows: Status of existing buildings greater than 3,600 

sq rwre feet. 111 existing buildings 3,600 square feet or grea/er, ulher I han une and two-family dwelling 

11nils, and agricultw'al buildings not 1mder special u.se permit for commercial purposes, where the 

floor area of the building or structure i.~ increased by an addition of more than thirty percent (300/o) 

or 1,000 square feet whichever is less. such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 

903.2. 

903.2.b Where Required shall be added as follows: Status of existing buildings less than 3,600 

square feet. 1n exislinx buildings 3,600 square feet or less, othel' than one-and two-famif.v dwelling 

zmifs. and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, where the 

floor area of the building or structure is increased to a total square footage over 3,600 square feel, 

by an add it ion of more t lu.m thirty percent (300/.;) or l, 000 square feet, whichever is less, such building 

or structure shall be made to conform to Section 903.2. 

903.2.1 Group A shall be amended as follows fur A groups A-1 through A-4: 903.2.1.1 (I) The fire 

area exceeds 3,600 square feel. 

903.2.3 Group E shall be amended as follows: 903.2.3 (1) Throughout all Group E fire areas greater 

than 3, 60U square feet in area. 

903.2.4 Group F-1 shall be amended as follows: 903.2.4 Group F. 903.2.4 (1) A Group F fire area 

exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

903.2.7 Group M shall be amended as follows: 903.2.7 Group Band M. 903.2.7 (]) A Group Band 

M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

903.2.8.2 Manufactured Homes shall be added as follows: An automatic fire ~prinlcJer system shall 

be required i11 all new manufactured homes and multi-family manufactured homes intended.for use 

as a one-and two-family dwelling The design and installation ofsuch systems shall be in accordance 

with California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300. 

Exc~ptions: 

Ordinance 2019-01 

1. Manufactured homes located within an existing mohilehome park c:omplying with 

California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3. 

Page 7 

20-0203 F Page 11 of 36 



2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an 

accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; when the 

existing primary residence on the property is not required to comply with California 

Residential Code Section R313. 2. 

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size. 

903.2.9 Group S-1 shall be amended as follows: 903.2.9 Group S. 903.2.9 (I) A Group S fire area 

exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

903.2.10 Grouu S-2 Enclosed Parking Garae,es shall be amended as follows: 903.2.10 (i) \\'here 

lhe fire area of the enclosed parking garage exceeds 3,600 square.feet. 

Section 907 Fire Alarm and Detection Systems 

907.2.a Where U.eguired - New Buildings or Structures less than 3,600 square fret shall be added 

as follows: An approved fire alarm/detection system shall be in.stalled in all buildings with a floor 

area less than 3,600 square feet. 

Exceptions: 

1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified 

as "U"). 

2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for ,·ommercial 

purposes (e.g., re/ails sales, food service, and1or special events). 

3. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt. as determined 

by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, based on building 

con.srr11ction material and features. location, occupancy type. and distance to 

exposures. 

907.2,b Status of Existing Buildings shall be added as follows: In existing buildings without an 

approved automatic sprinkler system, 01he1· than one- or tv,:o-fami/y dwelling units, agriculwral 

building not under special use permit.for commercial purposes where afire alarm detection system 

does not exist and the floor area of the building or structure is increased or modified by more than 

thirty percent (30%) or J, 000 square feet, lthichever is less, such building or structure shall be made 

to conform to Section 907 when required by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative. 

Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, us determined by the Fire Chief, 

or his/her duly authorized representative, based on building construction materials and features, 

location, occupancy type, and distance to exposures. 

907.2.c Monitoring shall be added as follows: All fire alarm/detection systems shalt be connected 

directly through and monitored by a UL. approved central, proprietary or remote station service, 

which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly attended location. All sprinklered buildings 

shall be monitored 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page B 

20-0203 F Page 12 of 36 



h.xceptitm!i: 

I One- and rwo:finnily dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies class(fied 

as ''ll"). 

2 Agricul111ral buildings 110/ 11ndi:r :.pecial use perm ii t1ndlor not used for commercial 

purposes (e.g., retails sales.food service, and/or special events). 

907 .2.d Type 1 Hood Installations shall be added as follows: 1111, require111<'nl of installation, or 

replac:emenl. of a Type I Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system to be 

installed, orfor the hood system to be connected to an existing/ire alarm/sprinkler monito,·ing system 

for that building. 

907.6.2.l Sccond111ry Power Supply shall be added as follows. ln accordance with NFPA 72, the 

secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power capacity under quiescent load (system 

operating in u non-alcmn condition) shall be amended to a minimum 72-hour power capacity. 

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or e:xceed the 

requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12. 

Chapter 12 

Section 1203 Ementency and Standby Power Systems 

1203.1.3 Installation shall be amended as follows: Emergency power systems and standby power 

systems shall be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electric 

Code, NFPA 1 IO and NFPA 11 1. All buildings, othe1· than one- and two-family dwelling units, and 

agricultural building.,· not used fol' commercial purposes, with standby power, .\'hall have a shunt trip 

device that disconnects all power sources to the building. appruved by the fire code official. E,isting 

installaJions shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval. 

Chapter 33 

Section 3310 Access for Firefighting 

3310.3 Premise Identification shall be added as follows: Prior to and during construction, an 

approved address sign .,1,all be provided al each fire and emergency vehicle access road ent,y into 

the project. 

SecCion 3312 Water Supply for Fire Protection 

3312.l When Required shall be amended as follows: Prior to combustibl~ materials arriving on 

site. the fire hydrant water system shall be installed and maintained in contin11ous operation. The 

amount of waler supplied shall meet the required fire flow for the project. 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 9 

20-0203 F Page 13 of 36 



Chapter 49 

Section 4903 Plans 

4903.l Where Required shall be added as follows: The fire code official of the EDHCWD may 

require development projects located in Moderate. High and Very-High Fire Hazard Severity Zones 

to submit fire protection plan. This plan shall be approved by both the fire code official and the 

authorized representative for the local CAL FIRE Unit Chief (if located in the State Responsibility 

Area [SRA}) priol" to the recording of the final map.fur the project by the Counry of El Dorado. 

Section 4905 Wildfire Protection Building Construction 

4905.4 Roof Construction Requirements shall be added as follows: All new construction. including 

additions, requires a Class A roof covering or assembly. All re-roofing requires Class A roof covering 

or assembly as a minimum. Re-roofing in excess of 50% of an exisiting structure within any one year 

period will necessitate that the entire roof be a Class A roof covering or assembly as a minimum. 

Class B or Cjire retardeant treated und or non-treated wood shake or shingles are not approved as 

a roof covering material for Class A assembly. 

Chapter 50 

Section 5001 General 

5001.7 Liability for Dama2es shall be added as follows: Any damages or cost resullingfrom the 

careless handling. spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall constituent debt against any 

such person, firm or corporation causing such )pill or discharge. This debt is collectible by the Fire 

Chief or his/her duly authorized representative. in the same manner as in the case of an obligation 

under contract. expressed or implied. 

Chapter 56 

Section S601 General 

5601.2 Permit Reguired shall be amended as follows: Permits shall be required as set forth in 

Section I 05.6 and regulated in accordance with this section. Where explosives permits are required, 

they shall be issued by the Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized repl'esentalive, and the El Dorado 

County Sheriff's Department. Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be issued by the Fire 

Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County Board of Supervisors. 

S601.2.1 Documentation shall be added as follows: The AHJ shall have the authority to request 

documentation regarding all aspects of the fireworks presentation. 

5601.2.2 Proprietary Information shall be added as follows: The AHJ will protect all proprietary 

information. 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 1 D 

20-0203 F Page 14 of 36 



Chapltr 57 

St'ction 5704 Sloraer 

5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where AboYc-Ground Tanks are Prohibitl'd shall be amended as follows: 

Storngc of Class I and Clas~ II flammable liquids in abo\'e-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited 

1111/e.l'S apprm•ed hy Lhe Fire Chief. or his/her duly authorized representative. When permitted hy the 

Fire Chief. or his/her duly authorized representative. all above ground tank(s) or vault installation5 

for the srorage q( Class I, 11 or Ill flammnble and combustible liquid~ shall comply with those 

requirement~ as set forth by the Culifornia Fire Code. The California Fire Code shaTI also apply to 

installations other thun motor vehicle Ji1e/ dispensing stations where ahove-ground storage is required. 

Section 5706 Special Operations 

5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Abovt'-(;round Tanks are Prohibited shal I be amended as follows: 

Storage of Class 1 and Class 11 flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is 

prohibited unless approved by the Fire Chief. 01· his/her duly authorized representative. When 

permitted by the Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative, all above ground tank(s) or 

vault installations for the storage o[Class l, JI or lllflammable and combustible liquids shall comply 

with those requirements us set forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall al.w 

apply to installalions other than motor veh;cle fuel dispensing stations where above-ground storage 

is required. 

Chapter 58 

Section 5806 Flammable Cryogenic Fluids 

5806.2 Limitations shall be amended as follows: Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary 

containers outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the Fire Chief,' or his/her duly 

authorized representative. JiJ'hen permitted by the Fire Chief. or his/her duly authorized 

repl'esentulive, all stutiona1y containers for the storage of flammable cryagenh·fluids shall cumply 

with those requirements as set forth by the California Fire Cade. The California Fire Code shall also 

apply to installations other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above-ground sforage 

is required. 

Chapter 61 

Section 6104 Location of LP-Gas Containers 

6104.2 Maximum Capacin• within Established Limits shall be amended as follows.- The storage 

of liquefied petroleum gas in exces~· of an aggregate of 2, 000-gallon water capacity when located al 

least one-ha/f (l/2) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-half 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 11 

20-0203 F Page 15 of 36 



(l/2) mile from existing residential development with a densiry g,·eater than one (1) dwelling unit pel' 

acre and at least one-half (l-'2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved. and a 

specialt'cnnditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado. 

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the dispersion of 

liquefied petroleum gos for lhe protection of heavily populated or congested areas, the aggregate 

capacity ~f any one instal/arion shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The dispensing 

of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2, 000-ga/lon water capacity when located 

at least one-half (112) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one­

half (1/2; mi/efi"om existing residential development with a density greater than one (J) dwelling unir 

per acre and al least one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved and 

a special/condilional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado. 

Section 6113 underground LPG Tanks Iustallalions and Ownership shall be added as follows: 

6113.J Permits and Plans shall be added as follows: Permits shall be required, and plans shall be 

submilledfor all underground tank installations as approved by the AHJ. 

6113.2 Underground LPG Tank Ownership shall be added as follows: 1./nderground LPG tanks 

shall be prohibited from being sold to end-users and shall be retained by the LPG company under a 

lem,·e-rype sys/em to ensure proper annual maintenance requirements are met and recorded. 

Chapter 80 

Section 80, ~FPA, 130-16 - Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Svstems in One-and Two 

Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes as amended 903.3.J.3, 903.3.5 

NFPA 130, Amended Sections as follo~·s: 

Add Section 4.7 to read as follows: 

Chapter 80. l\FPA 130 4.7 Reside111ial fire .1prink/er systems inswlled in all new one-and two-family 
dweffings shall utilize a "Passive Purge" system design unless otherwise approved by the Fire Code 
Official. 

Exception: Manufactured home installed, tested and approved by the California Department of 
Housing and Community Development. 

Re,•isc Section 5.l.1.2 to read as follows: 

Chapter 80. l\'FPA 13D. 5.l .l.2 A supply of at least one of each t;,pe and temperature sprinkler used 

within the premises shall be maintained on the properry at an approved location. Stock sprinklers shall 

be kept in a mounted and accessible cabi11et. 

Re,ise Section 7.6 10 read as follows: 

Chapter 80. :\FPA l3D. 7.6 A local water flow alarm shall be provided on al/fire sprinkler systems in 

homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling. 

Re\·ise Section 11.2.1.1 to read as follows: 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 12 

20-0203 F Page 16 of 36 



I . 
U111ptcr 80. J\Fl'A l3D. l 1.2.1.1 \\'lie1t ;i fin: depunmcnt pumper c.onncc1io1J 1~ uol provided, tht'. 

~yslem shall he hydroslfllic111ly 1es!ed ill o minimum pressw·c of 150 pounds per squarr inch p..1111g.r'for no 

less than a 30-minule dumtion without evidence of leakage. Such lest shall be witnessed by the.fire code 

official. 

Apprndu B - .Fire .Flow Requin>ml•nt~ for Tiuilding~ 

Table BJUS.ljl) Required !-'ire Flow for Om·- 1rnd Two-Famil\' l>wellint:s, (;roup R-3. and R-4 
Buildings and Townhouses shall be amended as follows: 

~------ ~-···----·- ._ ... -----------.---------·r-------------· 
FIRE-FLOW 

CALCULATION 

AREA 
(square feet) 

() - 3,bOO 

AllTOM,\TlC 
SPRJNKU:R 
SYSTEM 

MINJMllM 
FJRR­
FLOW 

(Dt>si~u (j!allon~ per 

Standanl) minute) 

FLOW 

DIIRATION 

(hours) 

-----··---,--- ---------- ---- ---·-- ·----~---~---- --

No I.GUO 

sprinkler systeni 1--------------~---------+-----------1-----------1 
3 .60 l and v~alcr Nn aulomatic 

sprinkler .~y)lcrn 

Value in 

Tahle 

lil05.1(2) 

Dural ion m 

Tahlc 

UI05.1(2) at 

the rcqu,rtd 

fire- flow rate 
1------------+--·----~------1--------------------1 

0- 3,600 ~L'CllOn 901 .. 1 I.J 

{If 1hc l"A I-in: 

Code 01 .',<·,·lilHl 

i 313.3 of the CA 

I Residential Codt: 

~ 

1,0()0 

1-----------------t--·- -------+---------+--····-------
3,601 and grcHtcr Sce1ion 903.3. I .3 

of the ('A Fire 

Code or Section 

313.3 of the CA 

Residential (_' ode 

I /2 vulu~ of 

Table 
BIOS.1(2) 
fn11n. 1000 

(;J'M) 
-------~------------- ----~--------~---,. ----· --

Table 8105.2 Required ,Fire Flow for Buildings other than One- and Two-Family 

Dwellings, Group R-3, and R-4 Byildine.s and Townhouses shall be amended as follows: 

~----
AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE-
SPRINKLER SYSTEM }'LOW 

(Design Standard) (gallons per minute) 
--· 

No automatic .~prinklcr Value In Table 

system B IOS.1(2) 

Section 903 .3, J. J of the CA ~ 50% of the l'aluc in 

Fire Code Table B105.1(2)b 

Section 903.3. 1.2 of the CA ~ 50% oflhc ,·aluc in 

Fire Code hhlc RI OS. I (2) 

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 gpm 

Ordinance 2019-01 

Fl,OW DURATTON 

(hours) 

..,.._ ___ , ___ . __ 
Duration in Table Bl 05.1 (2) 

·-
Duration in T Kbk 8105.1 {2) 

at the reduced flow rBle 

Duration in Tahlc B105.!(2) 

at the reduced now rate 

Pi:!ge 13 

20-0203 F Page 17 of 36 



•Appendh l) - Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

Section D103 Minimum Specifications 

D103.l Access Road Width with a Hydrant shall be amended as follows, adding the exception: 

Exception: Driveways 

D103.2 Grade shall be amended as follows: Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not 

exceed 15.9% in grade unless approved by the AHJ or by the El Dorado Counry amended Cal!fornia 

Public: Resource Code Title 14 I Design and Improvement Standards Manual. 

Dl03.3 Turning Radius shall be amended as follows: The minimum turning radius shall be 

detennined by the fire code official; and shall not include curb and gutter. 

Dl03.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates shall be amended as follows: Subsection{}): Where a 

single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm). Where a fire 

apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall no! be less than 15 feel (4572 

mmj. 

Dl03.6.1 Roads 20 lo 29 fee1 in wid1h shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as specified in 

Section DJ03.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide 

(6096 to 8534.4 mm). 

D103.6.2 Roads rnorc than 29 feet in Width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as 

specified in Section D 103 .6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 

feet wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm). 

DJ04.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads ~hall be added as follows: When ,·equired 

by the fire code official, afire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirety 

of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access. 

SECTION 4: CONFLICT 

That Ordinance No. 2016-37 of the EDHCWD, and an other ordinances or parts of ordinances herewith are hereby 

repealed. 

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY 

Tf any Ordinance, articie, subsection or subdivision thereot~ provision, sentence, clause or phrase of this code, or 

any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of competenr jurisdiction, such decision 

shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code, which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, 

therefore, such invalid portions are declared to be severable. The EDHCWD hereby declares that it would have 

enacted this Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, 

sentences, clauses or phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid. 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 14 

20-0203 F Page 18 of 36 



, 

. -
s1-:c,·1os 6: t:rt1;cn\'L DATE ANP t·l~BL&CATlo~ 
Thi:<. (.1rdtn•m·" ~,u,11 ("k(" dTen thrrt} fJO) days 1tn<·1 II"- a1fopfiu11 Ilic EOHCWD Board Secrdary g d1rtnt·,110 

publish 1 hi~ , ,1d111:11u1x m ;1 ncwsp.per of gcm:ral 1.: l1t:ul,11Jo11 In the Plf>lrkt. ln lieu of publication of tht foll l"-A:I 

oftlk: n1dinuna:, u ,1u111111u~ t•fthc ordinance muy l'.I<~ p11hll,-hrd by t~ by lhc Boi.lrd Secrc>lat) wnhm tilti-rn ( l 'iJ 

day., afkr ii,; pai,\RRI'. .,nd 1• certified copy shall be po..rt'd in lhe omi:<- of'lhe FDHCWD purs1JM1l lu G,N,•mlf,,rir 

Cock St<cr,011 3693J(d (I). 

The above Orditlant:C' Willi lnrroduced et a meeti.1g \>f tht Bo,rd i"JI fJirectM1 tlf the EDHCWD on l..khi~r 17. 

2019. and ii \I. .u thcri r rAci f.-.r the fir~,. nmc. A p,;l>li-; hcw+n~ w4, ~1:,1 tor the Ordinance lo be read fo< th<' iecond 

t,mc: Qn Nov~m!X'r : ·;. :r.119 .:.mt •rr~•Wcd by the: fo11,,win~ vutc .. 

AYES: 

NOES: 

,.\ 13SENT: 

ABSTAIN: 

( ~~-~z=?L/·· 
.' ,,,,. 

:\Tfl:Sl 

~~~;,JJ.~ 
frs.•;a(.JI Braddock, Board Scuctary 

Ordinam:.c 2019-01 f':igc , S 

20-0203 F Page 19 of 36 



F1r(t C0i~ Arnr;r.Cm~ it \\i1 lt Is u,~ (.,ha•,g~' L0\'.2IIJ ad0~1rd SFt~ ;:id0pt,~d I A,,...r,,t'.ci tin I \s Th::·~ a Lcca lt'2r:9e, 

101.1 Amend wi1l1 the riame or the Jurisdiction Locally aoopted and amended Admlnislraliw need 

Adop~ lhis section to alloW for 1he craation and lssuaa 

106.6 Add section Localy created and adopted 
of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines 
permits, plM checks. and Inspections as allowed in Health 
&Safely Code 17951. 

106.6.1 IAdd section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.6.1 Cost Reco\lllly Fees: To recover Iha cost to 
lhe Fire District 

106.7 Add section LocaRy created and adopted 
Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs or avoidable 
failed Inspections by contrac10rs. 

Section 109.4orChapter 1 oflhe Fire Code of the Dlsll1ct 
is added lo read as lollatls: 
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timeiines -The In lent of !his 
provision is lo ciooly lhe procedures and timetines ror an 

109.4 Added section 109.4 Locally a:lopted and amended individual or entity lo file an appeal IO the BoanJ of Aweafs 
regadlng an order, decisioll, or determination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County or El Dorado's 
Vegetation Managmenl Ordinance Board of Appeals 
limeline. 

Allows Ille Fire Code Official lo enforte lhe Fire Code lhat 
Completed the section by filing in lhe blank portions lhal were proteds life lWld property. Fees have 1-1 updated lo math 

110.4 not completed by the SFM. It is better left lo localities lo locaHy adopted and amended the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the District 
delennine the fees/penalties for their respective areas. Attorney's Office. The change lo the language to include lhe 

tenn infractions. 

110.4.2Cilalions ls added to read as rolkw,s: 110.4.2 
Cilalials 
The Fire Chief or his/her duly aulhofized representative (s), 

110.4.2 
Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before but under 

LocaUy adopted and amended 
may issue citations for infractions or misdeme.wior 

a dlffeleol numbEf) violations of lhis code pursuant lo Section 13871 ol lhe 
Heallh and Safety Code ol lhe Slate of California and 
Chapter 5c (COll'fllencing wilh section 853.6) or Tide 3 ol 
Part 2 of the Penal Code ol the Slate or California. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank portions lhat were 
All violations of Ille code have been consiladaled under 

112.4 nol completed by Ille SFM. II Is better left to localities to SFM adopled.and anended locally 
Section 110.4 

determine the fess/penalties for !heir respective areas. 

Added definitions for: Campfllll, Drivaway, Oislric~ 

202 Added defirilions for clarity Locally crealed and illopled 
Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained CIO'Mf 
Manager. Definlion ol campfire shall not include LPG or 
Propane fueled appliaoces. 

302.1 Added delinilion for Campfire to Section locally adopled and amended Added for clarity 

Doe kl lhe high fire danger lhat exlsls in El Dorado County 
307.4.4 lhrough 307.4.2.2 (d) Added a sections for campfire reslriclions locally adopled and amended we have written more slringent rules pertaining to open fires 

within grass, brush, and lree covered areas. 

Are apparatus are becoming lager and taller. A ll8l1icaf 
clear.Ilea of 15 feel provides proper cleaance kl" 
apparatus lo pass \llder wiU1oul dema,ilng lljlpllllllus 
components. It also allows an extended time frame before 

Changed venical clearances ID 15 leet and road widths to 20 
having ID recut lhe growth of the vegetallon. AddiUonal 

503.2.1 locally a;lopled and amended ~ht for vegetallon cfearances acts as an lnaeased buffer 
feet for lhe spread or lir8. A. road !Mdlh ol 20 feel excluslve of 

shoulda's, as measured lace ol Ctlb to face or Ctrb Is 
needed. These structures can be dlfflclAt lo navigate with 
fire appaatus and should not be counled In the W 
drivable road surface 

Added a specific section for RJ's where ii allows the Fire 
Fire appa,atus require areas for turning around 'Mlen 
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This 

503.2.5 
Code and Title 14 Fire Sale Regulations to match as they 

Locally adopted and amerded includes fire vehicles as IW!I as civilian vehicles. Provides 
require l\rnatllllds for fire apparatus access roads and 

better access for Ingress/egress. Additionally, adds ti.m 
driveways. ll'IJIJrld for appaatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

20-0203 F Page 20 of 36 



' 

AUows codes and slaidards for Bridges and Elevated 

Changed lite section b' Br1dges and Elevated StlfiDlS 10 
Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendix Dor lite 

503.2.6 state and match El Dorado County Transportation Division Locally adopted and amended 
cummt Fire Code whichever is more resbictive IO be 

instead of AASHTO HB-17. 
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an 
IWlffllate ll18alS & methods that is not less restrictive than 
lhe Fire Code. 

503.4.2 Added section regarding no parl<ing in fire lanes Locauy created and ooopted 
This section clearly defines the 'No Pal1<ing in Fire Lns" 
rules and is consistent lvith the California Vehicle Code. 

This secHon clearty defines the 'No Partdng in front of fire 
503.4.3 Added section regarding no parl<ing in front or hydranls Localy created and ooopled hydrants• rules and is consistent lvilh the Cal[omia Vehicle 

Code. 

This section cleal1y defines California Fire Code Appendix 
503.4.4 Added section regading fire lanes based on road width Localycreated and adopled Das the reference for road lane width and their relation IO 

fire Janes. 

Created and a!opted 503.4.5 IO mantaln emergency a:cess A1ows fire dlstrlcls the authority to approve gales on 

5015.3 and consistency through all nmway gates In El Dollllo Localy created and adopled 
roacJways based on the Districts gale st.mard, providing 

County, referrirQ to lite gate standarda ooopted by the FPO's. 
the best possible emergency aa:ess ID maintain fast 
response times. 

505.1 Added section pertaining IO the visual addressing of buildings Locally ooopted and lll11800ed 
Allows Fire dislricls the authority to approve addressing 
based on the Disbict's addressing standanls. 

Commercial properties are requital IO Install hydrants at 
Added more conservative standanl for the placement of 

507.5.1 Locally amended 
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be ou1slde or 150 

hydrant and their relatfonslip to commen:lal buildings feet tom any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance In 
between). 

Buildings are gelling more sizable in the county. It Is ITlOf1! 

common to have new buildings lvilh solar arrays that 
continue to generate power even when the buildings general 

Added verbiage to bring all of the necessa,y fire controls for a 
509.3 Locally added 

utilities have been shut off. When there is an ernetger,ey, ~ 
building lo one location. Is vital Iha! we have rapid access ID all of the conlrols in one 

location for public evacuation and firefighter satety. Due lo 
the rire danger present in El Dorado County lhrooghout 
most of the year, this change is appropriate and oovisable. 

!NJ to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement b' splinkler syslem installation In new 
ol 8 Dorado County and their conlribuing laclots ID our 

903.2 buildings and sructures 3,600 square feet o, greaJerwithln the Locally amended 
Increased response times, along ~lh the fact that fires 

dlSlrfct 
doUlle in size each and every minu18, we require sprinklers 
ID be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet In size as they relate to fir& behavior and rats ol spread. 

Due lo the topographic, climatic, and geographic coofltions 

Adds a requirement b' exislilg buildings greater than 3,600 
of El [)o,ajo County and their con1riboong ractcrs ID our 

903.2a squin feet lo instal splinklers if they ood more than 30% o, Locally created and ooopled 
Increased response times, along lvith Ile fact !hat fires 

1,000 squae feet lo the sbucbn, whicheV81 is less. 
dotiJle in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
IO be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and ra18 ol spread. 

. 1M lo the Jopographlc, cHmatic, and geographic confitions 

Adds~ protdon Jo, existing buidlngs less than 
of El Dorado County and their conlribulng faclln lo our 

903.2.b 3,600 ~ feet lo install spri,.,ers V they add more th111 Locally created and adopled 
increased response times, along lvith the fact that fires 

30% or 1,000 squanJ feel lo the structure, whichever is fess. 
doLCJle in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
to be Installed In structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet In size as they relate to fire behavior llld ra18 of spread. 

1M IO the topographic, cllmalic, and geographic condltions 

These sections were created to give specific dlreclion on the 
ol 8 Dor.rJo County and their contrWng factors ti our 

903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.24, 903.2. 7 sprinkler requlremems based on occupancy and squn Localy ooopled and amended 
Increased response times, along lvith the fact that fires 

foolage 
doUlle In size each and every mlnule, we reqwe sprinklers 
t> be lnslaled In strucllns once lhey reach 3,600 squae 
feet in size as they rela!e ID fire behavior and rate ol spread. 

20-0203 F Page 21 of 36 



Manufactured Homes - The Intent of this code S8Clon Is lo 
ensure !hat manufactured homes lhat serve as a one or l'M>-
famly dwellings are consistent wilh the provisions lotrd in 
CRC Section 313 pertainiflll lO built dwellings cl a similM 
nature. Manufactured t'omes placed in lhe wildland-url>an 

903.2.8.2 
This section was created to include maiutacbxed residential 

L.ocaly created ard adopted 
inlEl!ace have a heightened risk of raJjd fire cons\111~ 

single family R-3 in the residential sprinkler PfO!lranJ due lo lhe fight-weigh! nature of lheir construction. The 
rapid fire sprea:l lhroughout these structures presents a 
significant risk lo their OCCtJpanls. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been inCOIJ)Orated to decrease !his risk 
sW!SSfully in mir,y Calfomia C00101tJf1ilies. 

Due lo the topographic, climatic, and geographic oordilons 

These sections were created lo give specific direction on lhe 
of El Dorado County and their conlributir,;i factors lo 001 

903.2.9, 903.2.10 sprinkler iequiremenls based on occ~ and sqUlr'8 Locally edopted and .mended 
Increased response times, along wilh lhe fact lhat fires 

tJotage 
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
to be instated in structures once lhey reach 3,600 squire 
feet in size as they relate lo fire behavior ard rate of spread. 

Added occupa,I prolectlon for fre urns In buildings with a l'!Ovides proper 8l118flj8f1:y nolificalion for occupaicies that 
floor na less than 3,600, mept R3, AG buildings not used 

907.2a br commen:ial purposes, and buildings wilh a floor area of 
Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Are Depamlent notificallon in 

less than 500 square f8et as approved by lhe fire code official. 
lhe event of a fire or smoke. 

Added occupa1l protecilon ror existing tx.ildings without 
Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

aJ\omatic sprinkler systems lo lnslal a fire allllll ff they add 
907.2b 

more than m or 1,000 square feet to the stncille, 
LocalJy Cl88led and edopted allow public use and 8flSlll8S Are Oeplrtment notification in 

v.tichevef is less. 
lhe event of a fire or smolte. 

Added OCCl4)ai protection by stating all lire alarm detection 
Provides proper~ notiflcation ror occupancies that 

systems Installed shall be connected lo a moriklling service 
907.2.c lhat notifies the fire depa1ment upon activation and is 

Locally created and adCll*ld allow l)IA>llc use and ensures Fire Oeplrtment notification In 

instaled per Section 907 of the fire code. 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

Added OCCl4)ai protection for Type 1 Hood syslems to be Provides proper emergerx;y notfficalioo for occupancies that 
907.2.d connec1ed lo a moritored fire allllll system when ln$lalled or Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Oeplrtmenl notificaUOO in 

19placed. the ewnt of a fl,e or smoke. 

907.6.2.1 Primary Secondii"Y Alii"m ~r Supply l.tx!ilicalion locally created and adopled 
Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up ~ due to PG&E 
safety related power outages. 

This section adds a stunt Trip pc,Mlr shut off devices to 
1203.1.3 Shunt trip power safely devm SFM adopled arx1 ameooed locally ensure emergency power shut off during lhe use of baek-up 

power supplies 

3310.3 Address requi,emenls for construction sites locally created and adopted Addressing for cons1ruction sillls Is lmporta,l lo assist 
responding eme,gerx:y crews. 

3312.1 
Wala supplies at constructioll sites wilh combustible SFM adopted arxl anended locally 

Wala must be on site prior to combustible matsrial being 
materials on-site sbad or vertical constru:tlon commencing. 

El Dorado County has a siglnifcant fi,e danger lhroughout 

4903.1 
This sectioo was crealed to inch.de Fire Procleclion Plan for 

Locatly created ard adopted 
lhe county. Al J)lqecls will be required to submit a Fire 

all fi,e hazard severity zores. Protection Plan due lo climatic, geological, ard 
topographical 

This section clarifies Iha! v.ilhin the boundaries of 8 Dorado 
County, fire jurisdictions v.ill require lhal al roofs are 

4905.4 Added a section ID clarify roof conslructioo requirements locally Created ard adopted wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be 
instaled as lhey are not a Class A rated assembly. 

Hazardous materials ,elated Incidents n costty lo mitigate. 

5001.7 
fvr'/ danages or costs from negligent practices that cause a LocaUy created and adopted 

ff 1he incmnt is caused by negligence due kl a business 
hazardous materials incident v,;n cause a cost reaNerf fee. process or practice the actual cost .,,;11 be passed on to the 

negligent partjes. 

Added safety protection v,;th permits being Issued by boCh Ille Allows agencies that need to koow about explosives arxl 
5601.2 A,e Chief arx1 Sheriffs Department for explosioies, and by the SFM adopted arxl anerded locally ftrewol1(s lo appove them and haw a cu tn!erstllldlng 

Are Chlef.ard the Board cl Supemsors for fireM>rks. d Ille applcations they will be used for. 

20-0203 F Page 22 of 36 



The Fire Marshal of IWIY jurisdiction may request IWIY 

Fi~ companies or vendors shall make avai~ all docunentation including tining and proprietay infoonation 

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 requested documentation pertaining to the fite'Mlf1t Locally created and adopted 
that pertains to any aspect of a firewoiils display that lhey 

presentation deem necessary. This infonnation is urderstood to be 
proprietary aid v,;11 be pro!SciEd by the Fire Maisha! as 
such. 

Estabr!Shed limits as required by the Are Code for Class I 

5704.29.6.1 Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted aid amended locally 
ff1111ma*i all! Class II combustible llqt.id sloolge In me-
ground lanlts. Requires AHJ approval and a 
Specla/Condilional Use Pemlit from Ille Ccxny, 

Established limits as set rortli in the Fin! Code 

Established limits as required by lhe Fire Code for Class I 

5700.2.4.4 SFM al<lptedaill irneooed locally ilaminallle and Class II combi1st1b1e liquid special 
operations in above-glW1d lal1ks. P.equb8s AHJ approval 
aid a Special/Condilional Use Pennlt from lhe County. 

5806.2 Administrative addition ol llstrlct name Locally adoDi!d a,d amended Admlnlstrati\le need to add Ols1rict name 

Estabished Rmlts as recµred by lhe F,re Code Offlclal for 

5806.2.1 Establlshed llmlts as set fcrth In the Fie Code SFM adopted all! irnended locally 
Alllliriable Cryogenic ffulds In statlonay conl.alners. 
Requres AH.I approval .m a SjJeclal/Corl!ilional Use 
Pennlt from the County. 

Es!ablshes distances between LPG storage and 
clspensaries that are d'll8Clly reJaled ID safely for residenlal 

6104.2 
Eslllblished limits for LPG mrage a,d dispensing ne« or developments a,d high-density hotels, motel, ~. 

aljacent to residential development 
SFM adopted and !l11fflded locally etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas 'MJUld 

ha\'8 a high probability cl Injury, Inhalation, or death. 
Requres AH.I ~provaJ .nl a Special/Coo:lltional Use 
Pemllt from lhe County. 

Permitting and Plan submitlaJ requiremenls for undelgroood 
tanks: 

6113.1 
Peimlts m pla1s sl1al1 be submitted and ~proved by the 

Locally created and adopted 
Allows us ID reqt.ire ~ be SIA>mltled for review prior ID 

AHJ (~ly Having Jt.risdlclion), lnslallations of undeiground LPG Iris. UnderglOUOO tanks 
requre substaltial mantenance tncJllflng inspection 111d 
a10de replacement at regulll' lntelvals. 

Undergram lanks corrode easily and can leak without 
Requres underground LPG tanks to remain the property of 

6113.2 Locally created and adopted 
delecilon. They are also are not rotA!nely maintained when 

the LPG company sold t> lhe end user. This does not apply t> above gflX.lnd 
Janks where corrosion a,d leaks are mere easily delected. 

Amended to include on-sile sprinkler heals IW1d wrench 
on-site for emergent repars, the inclusion of a local water 

Chapler 80, NFPA, 130-16 NFPA 130-16 o/ Chapter 80 of the Fire Code or lhe District flow alarm to ere ale an audible alert ror the flow of water in 

Sections 4.7, 5. 1.1.2, 7.6, has been .mended to update various provisions pertaining to 
Locally amended 

the event of water activation in a vacant stn.dure, and 

and 11.2.1.1 the Installation of sprinkler systems in one-and l'M>-ramily hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 130 
dwelings. sprinkler syslem inst.;Jation decreasing Ille risk of water 

damage from pipe failure, and the addition of a passive-
purge system. 

Appendix B: Table 8105.1(1) We chalged 500 GPM tl 1,000 GPM, below 5000 fool Allows us t> maJch v.tiat developets and l8Sldents n used 

elevation, tl malCh fire flow precedents used In EDC for years 
SFM adopted and ill18nded kx:aly to In regards ti GPM nre flow requirements that have been 

used for over a decade In EDC. 

Appendix B: Table 8105.2 
We ma1e a mlrimum requirement of 1,500 GPM, below 5000 Allows us ti maJch v.flat developers and residents are used 

foot elevation, for all commercial projeC1s SFM adopted and 1111ended locally to in regards ID GPM fire flow requirements that have been 
used for over a decade In EOC. 

Apperdx 0: 0103.1 Male an exception for residential driveways locaUy adopled a,d amended It is unreasonable ti require a residential driveway to 
construct a 26 foot wide space for access t> a hydrllll. 

TIiie 14 requres for us t>only aa:eptuplD16%driwways. 
Appendix O: 0103.2 State law requires no greater th!Wl 16% grede lDcally adopted and amended In our El Cb'ado County Title 14 adoption we allow greater 

than 16% grade with AHJ eppoval and hall! sllface. 

Appendix 0: 0103.3 Text ID include curts and gutters locaUy adopted and .mended 
20 fool road widths shalt not lnclllfe curbs and gutters due 
ID polential access issues and uning radius ooncems. 

Append'IX D: 0103.5 t 1 Are appntus access road gates 
When! fire apparatus access roals consist of a divided 

Locally adop!ed a,d amended roadway the gale wldlh shall not be less than 15 feet due tl 
radius Issues. . 

20-0203 F Page 23 of 36 



No parking on roads allowed on roa'.!ways Jess than 28 Feel 

Appendix D: 0103.6.1 Roads widths 20 Jo 29 leet Localty adapted and aniended 
in 'ftidth above 5000 feel. Lower than 5000 feel this does 
not apply. This section is adopted as ii stands In the FJ19 
Code Appeoolx O section 103.6.1 fa all other elevations. 

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet 
allowed. This is not required less lhan 5000 feel of 

Appendix D: 01016.2 Roads widlhs more than 29 feel but less than 36 feel in width localy adOpled arxl ilTlended elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The 
section is aoopted as ii stands in the FJ19 Code Appendix 0 
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations. 

When required by the fire code official, a lire apparatus 

Appendix 0: 0104.~ Added to requil9 drcumfereolial fire apparatus access roads Locally created and adopled 
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire 
stn.cture and shall provide a continuous meillS of 
emergency vehicle access. 

Removed the v.ordlng that llml1ed the section to 30 dwelling 
For the saety of the canmlllities we Irie In, l'6o ways of 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 
units. 

Localy adopted and amended ingress/egress 819 reqwed to ensure Ille safely of the 
resldenJs and fi'sl rasponders. 

For the safety of the canrruities we live In, MO ways of 
Appendix D: 0107.1 Adopted 0107.2 Remoleness In this section. locally adapted and aniendled ingress/egress n requited to ensure Ille safely of lhe 

resldenJs and fi'sl respoooers. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.2through 101.5 Adopted to eslabllsh scope, lnten~ severat,illty and valkf',ty locally adopled Administrative clarlty 

102.6 through 102.8 References, SubjeclS nol regualed by lhe code Locally Adopted Admlolslratlve clarity 

102.10 through 102.12 Contrlding provisions, Other Laws, Apptlca!ion of references Localy Adopted AdmilistratiYe clarity 

103.1 tllrOUgll 103.4.1 Definition of the FJ19 Prevenlion Division localty Adopted Ad"*11stative clarity 
104.1 Ability to enkree the code Locally Adopted Admlnislratlve cJarily 

104.3 tllroUah 104.4 Riohl of EnbY, W.rrants, ard Identification Locally AdoOtsd Adminlsb'ative clarity 
104.6 through 104.6.4 Record retention Locally Adopted Admiislratiw clarity 
104.8 through 104.9.2 Modiflcaions. allemate means ax! me11x>ds, and test LocallvAdopted Administrative clarity 

104.11 through 104.11.2 Autholtty at fires, right cl a:cess, maintenance of systems Locally AdOjJled Administrative clarity 

104.11.3 Aulhority of svstems and devices Inoperable Locally Adopted Administrative cianty 
105.2.3 nme limitation of Mnllr.Jltil>n J.ocallvAdooted Administrative clarity 
105.3.1 through 105.3.2 Operational Dl!flri1s Locally Adopted Adrmstrative clarity 

105.6.12 
Dry de.ring operati(lnal pemits required ~ hazanlous 

locally Adopted Admlnlslrative clarity 
cleMing solvent use 

PenniJs ~ vanoos business operations fer. Magnesium, 

Adopted this section ~ admlrutrative clarity and fi19 and life 
misCellaneous combustible stirage, moblla food 

. 105.6.2.28 lhroogh 105.6.35 Locally Adopted preparation vehlclel, moto,- fuel.dl51)811S1ng facilHles, open 
safety inspecllons 

butting, open ftlllleS ax! bt:hes, open ftames ax! 
c.ndles, and organic coatings 

105,6.37 
Adopted Ns section ~ administrative clarity and fi19 and Ile 

Locally Adopted Permi1s for places of assembly 
safety Inspections 

105.6.39 
Adopted ltis section for administrative clarity and fire and life 

locally Adopted PemilS for private fire hYdrri. safely Inspections 

Pemils ~ pyroxylllne plastics, refrigeration eqlllpmeri. 

105.6.41 lhrough 105.6.46 
Adopted this section~ a!minlstratlve clarity and fire end life 

Locally Adopted 
repair ginges and moklr fuel-dispensing facilities, rooftop 

safety Inspections hallporta, spraying or dipping, storage of scrap Ures and 
619 by-producJs 

105.6.48 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life 

Localy Adopted Pemit fortil9-i'ebullding planls 
safely lnspec1ions 

105.6.50 
Adopted this section b' almfnlstrative clarity and ft19 and Ille 

Localy Adopted 
Penni! for \MlOd pr!Xll:Js stirage (chips, tqged material, 

safety lnspec1ions lumbel or piylo,ood, In excess of 200 cttllc feet) 

106.1 through 106.3 
Adopted Ns section ~ !llminlstratlve clarity and fire and life 

Locally Adopted Fee schedues for pemits 
safety lnspec1lons 

107.1 
Adopted !tis section for administrative clarity and fi19 and llfe 

Localy Adopted lnpectlon aJ1honly safety lnspec1ions 

Mantenance ot safeguanls, testing and operation of 

Adopied this section b' lldminlstratiYe clarity and ft19 and life 
equipnent re-inspection and les1ing, recordkeepr,g, 

108.1 lhrough 109.3 safety ilspectlons 
Localy Adopted supervision, rendering equipment Inoperable, OY8ltlO'Mfing, 

Boan! of Appeals esta>llshed, llmitalons on atAhority, and 

'·. ·., .. · . .'. :· .. :,. .. · .. · .. 
qlJailflcatiins . ... : .. ·• ,: ',. 

110.3.2 ihroogh 110.3.4 
Adopted ltis section for alminlstratlve clarity and fire and life ...... · 

l.ocaly ~led Cilinpllm with on1e11 and no11ces. prosecution of . 
iitety Inspections . ~ti, in! unautliorizad tar1118ri~ 

20-0203 F Page 24 of 36 



110.4.1 Adopted lhis section for administratve clarity and fire and ire 
Locally Adopted Abatement of violation 

safely Inspections 

113.1 
Adopted !his section for adminiStrative clarity and fire and ife 

Locally Adopted Authority to disconnect servk:e utiities 
saely lnspectkris 

Aspllat kellles contain tighly flammable Sllbsfalces and 
303. ! through 303.9 Adopted !his section for fire and life safely Locally Adopted requre stringent safegua:ds (Clima!ic, geological, and 

~) 

., Ma1aglng ignition sources thro\Jgh responsible application 
305.1 IMluogh 305.5 Adopted this section for fire and Ille safety Locally Adopted oi standards v,;n radu:e 1118 oomber or fires In vaious 

settings (Clmatic, geologlcal, and klp(Jgraphical) 

Millon picture projection rooms and fim are HIGHLY 
306.1 lhrough 306.2 Adopted this section for fire and life safely Locally Adopted flammable and requre special handling (Climatic, 

geological, cnl topographlcaf) 

307 .1 through 307 .5 Adopted lhls section for fire and life safely Locally Adopted 
Open btrnlng, recreational ftre, and portable Mloor 
lirepl;l:es, (Climatic, geological, and tipo;iraphica) 

308.1 Adopted !his section for fire and life safely Locally Adopted 
Open !lane general requirernelts (Climatic, geological, and 
klpographical) 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 Adopted !his section for fire and life safely Locally Adopted 
Thro'Mng or placing cl ignllion sources, loo:hes for 
relllO'ling pant (Cllmalic, geaogk:al, end topographlcaf) 

Locations Ile.I' combustible, open flame devices, signals 
and rnarkefs, portable fuel ~flame devices, sky-

308.1.5 lhrough 308.1.8 (excfllfing 
Adopted this section for fire and life s.tely Locally Adopted 

lanterns, religious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming 
308.1.4) food and beverage preparation, dlspensmg, cootainers not 

In use, serving of flaming food, locallon, fire prolectkln 
(Cfimatic, geological, and klpograpncal) 

308.2 Adopted 1111s secllon for fire and ire safety Locally Adopted 
Pennlts ;n reqiired for above section (Cfimatic, geological, 
and topographical) 

Group A occupancies open-name decorative devices. 
308.3 lhrough 308.4.1 Adopted this secfon for fire ard life safety Locally Adopted lheetrlcaf peoomances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 

dolmafories (Cimalic, geological, and klpl)graphical) 

310.1 Adopted tis section for lire and 1ne safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to smoking (Cimalle, 
geaoglcal, and topographical) 

310.3 Adopted tlis section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
"No SITX!ldr,t signs (Climalic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Removal of signs prohibited, compllance with 'No Srnolting' 
310.4 lhrough 310.8 Adopted lhis section for fire and IWe safely locally Adopted signs, ash !rays, bu,ring objects, ha!adoous environmental 

conditions. (Clmallc, geological, and klpOgraphical) 

Va:ait premises condition and safely requirements, 
Abandoned premises, teoa,t spa:es, safegllllllng vacant 

311.1 Uvough311.4 Adopted tis section for lire and IWe safety Locally Adopted premises, security, fire prolecilon, fire seperation, removal 
cl comllusUbles, removal cl hazardoos materials. (Climatic, 
geological, and lopograpnical) 

319.1 Adopted tlis section for fire cn1 life saety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relallng to mobile food (J8pal'allon 
vehicles. (Climatic, geological, cnl topo,Jraphical) 

319.2 
Adopted 1his section for roninislratiYe clarity and fire and Ide 

Locally AdOpted 
Permits for moble food pniperalion vehicles (Clmatic, 

saely Inspections geaoglcal, and topographical) 

20-0203 F Page 25 of 36 



Exhaust hood, fire polecilon, fire protec1lon for coocing 
equpiment, fire extinguisher, appliaice comectlon kl fuel 
supply piping, cooking oil st>rage containers, metallic 
smge tanks, nonmetallc sk>rage IDS, cooking ol 
smge system components, design aite!la, tank venting, 
nonnal vents, emergency vents, LP.gas systems, maxim1111 

Adopted !his section for fire ard·1we safely 
aggregale 'IOIIJlle, prolaction or contaner, LP.gas contaner 

319.3 through 319.10.3 locatly Adoptoo ~. protection or syslem piping, LP.gas alallns, 
CNG systems, CNG containers supplying 0/lly cooking fuel, 
maxlm1111 aggregate volume, protection of c;ontaner, CNG 
container constructton, CNG oonlaners supplying 
lransporalon and eooking fuel, prota:lion of systllm piping, 
methane alarms, malmenance, exhuast system, fire 
protsctlon systems and devices aid fUel gas systems. 
(Cllinatic, geological, and qxigraphica) 

Adopted lhls section for fire and life safety 
Emergeocy plaining and prepaedness In group R-2.1 

403.8.1 tlrough403.8.1.7 Locally Adopted (residential care facilities and ~ homes) evacuation and 
; fire saety p1w. 

Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, roolel) occupancled 
403.10 through 403.10.1.3 Adopled this section for ftre and Ille sitety Locally Adopted Eva:uaoons, diagrams, emergency duties, (Cimatic, 

geoogical, and topographica) 

405.5 Adopled this section for fire and life safety Locally Adop181 
Emergeocy Plamlng IFd recOfd keeping (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

510.3 
Adopled lhls section for admlristralve cla1ly and fire and life 

Locally Adopted 
A permit Is required for eme,gency raspllder radio systems 

safety Inspections (Cllmatic, geological, and q>ograii/iCa) 

Wall coverings in group E occupa!cles (Schools) sets a 

807.S.2 tvough 807.5.2.3 
Adopted this section for adrnnlsntive claily and fire and life 

Locally Adopted 
maximunm amoont of ftllTll!lable wall COYerings In 

salety inspections edu:allonal facilities (Cfimalc, geological, and 
~) 

An aubnatic sprinkler system Is required in Group A-5 

903.2.1.5 
Adopted this section for admlnlslrative clarity and fire and fde locally Adopted 

(sporting arenas, amusement pa,k sll\lctures, bleachers) 
safely Inspections (CHmatic, geological, and klpograii/iCa) grealerthan 1000 

square feet (aimatic, geological, all tipograplllcal) 

Eme,gency Responder redo coverage in exislng buildings. 
All buildings 'MIi be required k> allow eme,gency responders 
k> receive and lransmlt emeigency radio lraffic k> and from 
each other and the emetgen:y dispatch center. Time 
ftames can be developed k> come iloo compliance and the 

1103.2 
Adopted this section for the safely or firefighters and other Locally Adopted JNSlng In of a syslem over a period of time, delennined by 
eme,gency responders. the ffre code officlal, Is aa:eplable. Toe rationale behind 

this section is lhat on almost all emeigency responder lnjlly 
ix falalty incidents comm1111cation is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected v.ith the addilon of radio 
equipment k> boost the signal In areas that do not have 
strong signal. (Cllmallc, geologlcal, and tJpographical) 

Appendix 0: 0101.1 through Adopted tlis sect1oo tir lhe saety of the ptAJlic, firefighters, 
Locally Adopted 

General requkemenls for fire app.ntus access roads 
0102.1 and other emergency responders. including loals. (CUmatic, geological, all lopographicalJ 

Adopted ttis sect on tir the sliely of lhe piblic, firafighlars, 
Dead end fire appaatus access road requlremeris for a 

Appendix D: 0103.4 Locally Adopted tum around at 150 feet. (Climatic, geological, and 
and other emergency responders. 

lopographical) 

Appendix D: 0103.6 
Adopted tlis seclon for lhe safety d the piblic, fireftghlers, Locally Adopted "No Parking, Fire Lane" '9lS requirements. (Climatic, 
aid other emergency responders. geologlcal, 11111 topographical) 

Appendix D: 0104.1 throtql Adopted this seclon tir lhe safety or lhe piblic, firefighfels, 
Locally Adopted 

C<Xnmerclal 11111 illluslrial de'l'8lop!renl flle appaatus 
0104.3 (~ufing exception) and other emergency responders. a:cess roais. (Climatic, geological, and topographical 

Appendix D: 0105.1 throtql Adopted !tis sec1on tir lhe saety d the piblic, firefighters, Locally Adopted 
Requirements for aial fire apparaluS access roals 

0105.4 and other emergency responders. (Clmatlc, geological, and q>ographical) 

Appendix D: 0106. 1 throtq1 Adopted tlis secton tir lhe sitely of the public, firefighlers, Locally Adopted 
Are appaatus access roals for mulliple-famly residential 

0106.3 (excbling 8Xa!j)tions) and other emergency responders. de'lelopments (Cllmatlc, geological, all topographical) 

Appendix D: 0107. 1 thiaql 
One-ix ~ resldenltal developmenCs shall be 

Adopted Ns secton tir the sare1y or the ptA)lic, ffrefighlers, Locally Adopted equipped thrOllgholi with l'M> spiN'llt9 and applOW!d fire 
0107.2 (exwling excepllon) and other emergency responders. apparatus a:cess roads due lo lopograplic, geographic 11111 

cftmatic 001d11ons. 

20-0203 F Page 26 of 36 



Appendix 0: 0108 Adopted 1his section for the safely of the pulilic, firefightas, 
~yAdopted 

Adopt reference slandanls dealing \\ith gate construc1ion 
aid other ~ency responders, slaldanfs (Climatic, geologica, aid lopoJraphlca) 

Grey cells are previoUsly 
amended, adopted, or 
changed code sections that 
are being adopted again In 
this code cvde. 
White cells are newly 
amended, adopted, or 
changed code sections that 
differ from previous code 
adoPtions. 

20-0203 F Page 27 of 36 



Marshall Cox 

Ffom: 
Sent: 
To: 

Stephanie Llyton 
Monday, October 28, 2019 10:11 AM 
Mar1hall(o .. 

Subject; FW: Confirmation of Scheduled Publicabon: Notice of Public Hearing . Notice of Intent to Adopt 
2019 fire Code 

FfOffl: lepls <le8.ils@lmtdemouat.net> 

Sent: Friday, Octobe, 25, 201911:31 AM 
To: Jessica Braddod <jbraddock@)edhfire.com> 

Cc: Stephanie Llyton <staytoo(!'edhfire.com> 
Subject: Confirmation of Scheduled Publication: Notice of Public Hearin& · Notict! of Intent to Adopt 2019 Fire Code 

Confirmation of Scheduled Publication Notice of Pubhc Hearing - Notice of Intent to Adopt 
2019 Fire Code 

[J,..bf,I.J,.;Newspaper Mountain Democrat 
~l~:P ub date( s )'. ;1,]10/30/19, ·1111119 
Ref ad#: ;htfl7076 
Charges: $ ~;}!;}~75.00 

Thank you for publishing in our newspaper 

Allison Rains - Public Notices~~~: 
Mountain Democrat - Georgetown Gazette Newspapers 
legals@mtdemocrat.net - legals@gtgazette.com :~~:.-
( 530)344·5086 - fax (530)344-5092 

Good morning1 

can you please publlsh the auo1chcd notice Int~ Mtn. Democrat tht' two ~arHest dates possible? 

TMnk voul 

J,:ssi,:11 Braddod 
/ Jirl.'.:tor of Fir,um.·e.i/roard ,\',·,·rt'l11r_l' 

<ma1eOOt. png> 

El Dorado llil/J Fire Departn,ent 
''Scrri11x 1he ('umnmmllcJ of El L>11rmlo /JUI.,, l.41troht• an,I Re,"'"''" 
Adainlllntit"e Offlte: IOSO WIison 8oulcvord, El Dorado HIii§, CA 95762 
Pboae: (916)9JJ-662J .rxt. IU20 
FH: (916!933-5983 

20-0203 F Page 28 of 36 



' , . 

Attachment No. 2 

EDHCWD Resolution No. 2019-10 

20-0203 F Page 29 of 36 



',) 

EL DORADO BILLS COUNTY WATER DISTRICT 

RESOLUTION 2019-10 

Resolution of the Board of Directors Adoptinf! Findings Supporting Amendments to 
the Fire Code 

WHEREAS, the El Dorado Ht1ls County Water District Board (Fire 

Department) intends to adopt an ordinance adopting the California Fire Code, 2019 Edition, 

and prescribing regulations governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the 

environment from fire, explosion, hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological and topographical 

conditions existing within the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the 

District to impose more stringent requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code 

pursuant to California Health and Safety Code sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the District 

desires to make express findings to that effect. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the EDHCWD (Fire 

Department) hereby adopts the following findings concerning current unique local 

conditions that together make each modification to the California Fire Code, 2019 Edition, 

reasonably necessary to provide adequate and effective protection oflife, property and the 

environment 

CLIMATE 

I. Precipitation. Average annual precipitation ranges from approximately 25 to 32 

inches per year. Approximately 88% of the average rainfall occurs during the 

months of November through April and 12% from May through October. 1rus 

area has experienced major droughts in the last two decades: 1986 -1991, 1998 -

2003, 2007 - 2009, and 2011 - 2015. It is possible that more droughts will occur 

in the future based on the weather cycle pattern. 

20-0203 F Page 30 of 36 



. ' 

2. Relative Humidity. During the summer months (May through September), the 

daily humidity generally ranges around 20% and occasionally drops to the low 

teens. 

3. Temperatures. During the summer months (May through September), the daily 

temperatures commonly exceed 90 degrees Fahrenheit, with temperatures 

having been recorded as high as 115 degrees. 

4. Winds. The summer prevailing winds are out of the south and southwest. 

However, north winds occur during the spring (April and May), the fall 

(September and October), and occasionally during the summer months (June, 

July and August). Velocities are generally in the range of five to fifteen mites 

per hour, gusting to 30 rniJes per hour during the swnrner months. 

SUMMARY 

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity and size of fire in 

the community. Times of little or no rainfall and high temperatures create extremely 

haurdous conditions, particularly as they relate to residential roof fires and wildfire 

conflagrations. The climatic conditions are one of the greatest impacts to fire 

behavior and other major emergency events due to their uncontrollable nature. 

GEOGRAPHIC AND TOPOGRAPHIC 

1. Geographic Location. El Dorado Hills is located in the foothills of the Sierra at 

an altitude range of approximately 650 feet to 1,500 feet above sea level. 

20-0203 F Page 31 of 36 



2. Size and Population. The EDHCWD (Fire Department) encompasses 

approximately seventy to eighty (70-80) square miles and has a current 

population of approximately 50,000 residents. 

3. Seismic Location. The nearest identified fault zone rurutlng through the District 

is the Bear Mountain Fault. This fault zone is split into several branches which 

transect the area between Folsom and Shingle Springs. The closest branch 

passes through the middle of the District along the western edge of Browns 

Ravine. The next nearest extension of this fault system is located immediately at 

the north end of the District, and extends from the southeast arm of Folsom 

Lake, north to the City of Auburn. No recent geologic activity has been observed 

along this fault. However, studies of the east branch of the fault zone, conducted 

by Woodward-Clyde Associates for the Auburn Dam, and by Tierra Engineering 

Consultants near Folsom Lake, indicate that the fault may be reactivating based 

on recent tectonic trends and should be considered potentia1ly active. 

4. Topography. The topography of the District varies from level 0% slope to 

terrain with over a 40% slope. The valley floor is relatively flat with gentle 

slopes and consists of grassland and trees. The east and west sides of the valley 

floor increase to approximately 40% slopes and consist of trees, brush and grass­

covered range land. The greatest degree of slope occurs in the northern end of 

the District and extends northeast from there. Hilly terrain throughout the area 

provides gullies or areas referred to as "chimneys" which accelerate the spread 

of fire. 

5. Roads and Streets. The District has seen an accelerated degree of utban and 

commercial development within the last 15 years. With this development comes 

20-0203 F Page 32 of 36 



. 
' . 

.. 
the increase of vehicular traffic and congestion which can have a direct effect on 

the response time of emergency apparatus. 

6. Building Clearances. As residential development continues to occur in the 

District, the clearance between homes has decreased which increases the ability 

of fire to spread from one home to another by both radiation and convection 

heat. 

SUMMARY 

The above geographic and topological conditions increase the magnitude, exposure, 

accessibility problems and fire hazards that the Department must handle. Fire 

following Wl earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss oflife and damage 

to property than the earthquake itself. 

Other variables may tend to increase the situation: 

1. The damage that may occur to the water system, and; 

2. The extent of isolation due to roadway damage, overpass collapse and debris 

blocking the roadway. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of the El Dorado Hills County 

Water District this 19th day of September 2019 by the following vote: 

AYES: 5 
NOES: 0 
ABSENT: 0 

ATfEST: 

Sl~1~~~,~ 
Jesica BraddoC: Board Secretary 

20-0203 F Page 33 of 36 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
101.1 X Admin 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topogra phica I 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ica I 

503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.6 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ical 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographica I 

503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra phica I 

503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ica I 

505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

509.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra phica I 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ical 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

4903.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

20-0203 F Page 34 of 36 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 4.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra phical 

Appendix 8: Table 8105.1(1) X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix B: Table 8105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: D103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: D103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: Dl03.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: D103.6.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra p h ica I 

Appendix 0: D104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

101.2 through 101.5 X Admin 

102.6 through 102.8 X Admin 

102.10 through 102.12 X Admin 

103.1 through 104.1 X Admin 

104.3 through 104.4 X Admin 

104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin 

104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin 

104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin 

104.11.3 X Admin 

105.2.3 X Admin 

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin 

105.6.12 X Admin 

105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin 

105.6.37 X Admin 

105.6.39 X Admin 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin 

105.6.48 X Admin 

105.6.50 X Admin 

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin 

107.1 X Admin 

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin 

110.4.1 X Admin 

113.1 X Admin 

20-0203 F Page 35 of 36 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
303.1 through 303.9 X Climatic/Geological/f opographical 

305.1 through 305.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

306.1 through 306.2 X Climatic/Geological/f opograph ical 

307.1 through 307.5 X Climatic/Geological/f opogra phica I 
308.1 X Climatic/Geological/f opographical 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/f opographical 

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5 X Climatic/Geological/f opographical 
308.2 X Admin 

308.3 through 308.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.1 X Clim at ic/Geological/T opogra ph ica I 
310.3 X Climatic/Geological/f opograph ical 

310.4 through 310.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

311.1 through 311.4 X Climatic/Geological/f opographical 

319.1 X Climat ic/Geologica 1/f opogra ph ica I 

319.2 X Admin 

319.3 through 319.10.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 X Climatic/Geological/f opographical 

403.10 through 403.10.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

405.5 X Admin 

510.3 X Admin 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 X Cli matic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

903.2.1.5 X Climatic/Geological/f opographical 

1103.2 X Topographical 

Appendix D: 0101.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/f opographical 

0102.1 
Appendix 0: D103.4 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix D: 0103.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D104.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topogra phica I 

D104.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: D105.1 through 

D105.4 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D106.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/f opographical 

D106.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix 0: D107.1 (excluding 
X Climatic/Geological/fopographical 

exceptions) 

Appendix 0: D108 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra ph ica I 

20-0203 F Page 36 of 36 


