RESOLUTION NO. 039-2020

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the
State every three years; and,

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a
county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably necessary
because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1,
Atrticle 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulations to the local level
and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized
representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the fire
protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, on November 26™ 2019, the Board of Directors of the Garden Valley Fire Protection District
adopted Ordinance No.2019-08 which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code

with amendments, the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological, or topographical
conditions.

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection of
certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado
ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-08 of the Garden Valley Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement
of the ordinance to the Garden Valley Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections:

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4 through

307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1.

507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 903.2.10,
907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1,
5601.2.2,5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 through 6112.3, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 NFPA
13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 4.7, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 5.1.1.2, Chapter 80
NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table B105.1 (1),
Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix D103.6.1,
Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4.

20-0203 G 1 of 40



Resolution No. 039-2020
Page 2 of 2

The Garden Valley Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title
24, Part 9, in_its_entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the
International Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed

below:

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5,311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403 .4,
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12,
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808,
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106,
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception),

D107.1 (Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G,
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019
California Fire Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular
meeting of said Board, held the 10 day of _ March , 2020, by the following vote of

said Board:
Ayes: Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin, Novasel
Attest: Noes: None
Kim Dawson . Absent: None /
Clerk ofthe Board of Supervisors 7{/-/ /.
/ &

By: ! W U /,M/@»J-

{/ Deptty Clerk’ Brian K7 Veerkamp, Chair, Boafd of Supervisors

20-0203 G 2 of 40



Garden Valley Fire Protection District

December 19, 2019

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors
330 Fair Lane

Placerville, CA 95667

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019-08 of the Garden Valley Fire
Protection District, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code with
amendments related to local climatic, geographic and topographic
conditions.

Dear Mr. Ashton:

The Garden Valley Fire Protection District (GRV) is requesting the Board of Supervisors
(BOS) ratify its Ordinance No. 2019-08, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code as
amended due to specific local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. California
Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of the city or
county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance.
The BOS must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District (or
its representative) or the Chief Building Official.

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2019-08
with amendments to the 2019 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that
Ordinance to the Garden Valley Fire Protection District Chief. A proposed BOS
resolution is enclosed for your review and use on this topic.

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County.

Sincerely,

il

Clive Savacool
Fire Chief

ATTACHMENTS:

1. Garden Valley Fire Protection District Ordinance No. 2019-08

2. Garden Valley Fire Protection District Finding of Fact Resolution No. 2019-07
3. Draft El Dorado County BOS Resolution

20-0203 G Page 3 of 40



Attachment No. 1
Garden Valley Fire Protection District

Ordinance No. 2019-08

20-0203 G Page 4 of 40



GARDEN VATTEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ORDINANCE NO. 2019.08

BF IT ORDAINLD BY THF BOARD O DIRECTORS OF THE GARDEN VALLEY
FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS:

An vrdinance of the Clarden Valley Fire Protection Distact {GR VY adopting the 2019 Edition of the Califoraio
Frre Code. incorpomating the 2018 Edivion of the lmernutional Fire Code. regulating and governing the safeguirding
af bfe and propensy from fire and explosmn hazards ansing from the storage, handling and use of harardnus
subsgances, matenals and devices, and Irom conditions hazardous to life or property i the ccoupancy of baddings
and premises m the GRV: providing for the issunnce of permits and collection of Tees therelor, Repealing Ondimancs
Mo 201637 of the GRY and alf other ordinances sand parts of the ordiances i conflict therewith

He it ORDAINGD by the Board of (drectors of the GRV, alwo Mnown as the Garden Valley Fire
Provection THstnct
Section | FINDINGS OF FACTS
Seviion 2: AW TION
Section J LOCAL AMENDMENTS
Seetion 4. CONFLICT

Sechon 5 SEVERABILITY
Section 6: LEFECTIVE D

SECTION & FININGS OF FACTS

The GRV makes cedain changes disted belowi o the Culiforn Fire Code, 2009 Bdition, pumuant 1o
Hewlth & Safers Cowdee Sectiony 128609 7 17058 7 and (89015 dating thisy code adoplion process Such changes
ane mecessary because of locul climaue. geclogieal and/or topographical conditions.  the GR'YV has adopied.
pursuant 1o Secfroa (9405 of the Coliforma Health & Sufine Code. the findings of fcts relative o these

conditions by Kesoluwon 7201910 of the GRV dawd Scprember (9. 219,

SECTION 20 ADOPTION OF CODE WITH FACEUSIONS
The GRY adopts the 2019 Californio Fire Code, Trife 24, Pard 9, inils entirety, including Appendices

icurporating those sechiony ol the faternativnal Free Code. 2018 edition oot sdopted by the state. wah the

evclusions histed below

Ordinence 201998 I'age 1

20-0203 G Page 5 of 40



achshoans TOSG6 LT E05 6 10 RSO3 30K G0 09 T80 5 3116, JEK. 40X 1 403 2 dni 7 ) Gt
A4 AG3 B AT3 TR cadupting SU3E TSUET R T A5 0403 102, 400 10T A0 UL 403,13, 30 |40,
ARSI BOA A DR G KOS ROT dadepiine A0 5 00 HOKCRE T LEOL LR O3 ST as G, [0
Cadoponog PHOI 9 DTG T P L6, Chapter 00 U haptar 26, the exceptions under DIGED (Exceptng,
B306.1 tExceptionl, DIOT. 1 ikaceptioni. Appesdin AL Appendin 12 Appondin B Appendin G Appuridin 1

Appendin K, Appendin L Appendin M.

Appendices itaf wdopted van be osed for refercove moenforcing other sections of the 2009 Coffew g Fire

SECTION 3 LOC AL AMENDMENES

The tullowing Sceetions are hereby amendad o addad,

Chapter 1

- Sextivg (U1 Seope und Gencral Requirements

- 100.Y Titde ol b amended 30 b o L LT omie st Jusandvcrien JEAR B

Sectiop 05 Permits
102.0.27 PG -gas shall be amended o Tallow s Add Gt oveeplion At o above

ERY HER 2
clevation, o permitis ot seqgiened for s duad contmoors with a0 I3 pa 0 watar capaaty oo hos,
sooapudnple contamner systemns having an aggregate quantty sl exeoading 175 pathons cening

Cocupanses o6 S R

Seytion 106 Fces

106.6 Permit, Plan Review and Taspociion bees -hall te sfied as fobinss 5 sodeand oof 30

sndespiied By oo ddiSericr Boaed sf e cler e Pl sevaes omspectisits and iy iscuans ool peems By

Py disericr s B fonsd v thie oSt srrrent drsda f e vekwedide Cifeadth & Safery Ot 1T

[U0.0.1 Cost Rexovery Feey shull b owlded ws follona Frre terviee feey wray Ao s harssd e aey

Pt fomm S OrQE e baagieay S trsnen e glnacmor veobation of the hiw o0 s o resalt o)
Carcleviiu e T rasseen e S e Same e divera s an tespesd D0 e scese of ane iseldam o
sTricd BernE st e sl o D e B R A e YIS e WIS H TR It pseeavades ar phy cong
O R Y e reng foi bk e foe o Clavoea fealth & Salery Coete J T e Fre coe shiedl

sext exced the aonanl cond of suppressieg the fee cond o cespranding o dhe oene sron inc i

- 0.7 Administrutiye Coyty shall be sdded s tollows, When a toxe o gnapres B s sechodidesd, and

Py omrscor B i paertorng 1o JRe S Do ond the i heee itV ey purividiction (AN the 81
atiiy hill the comractor T adduad tiese speat trovelony Beoand from the o inspectton focation and

f"l,(“ (e _(""‘(’HI ik et i"l,f( VIS e SN s I &RTE) l.l’ﬂHHZTﬁ"l’;\ FRESHANN

Ohdinance 019,08 I'age 2

20-0203 G Page 6 of 40



»
T

Section 109 Board of Appents

Section 109.4 Appesl Prucedures and Timelines shall be added as twlows: Anv persan or enity whe
belivves they mav be adversely affecied By an order, decisivn pr determimanon made by the fire code
officral through v writtens nonice may apyseal they marter waithin 7S coferdar sy of the puistmark o
the notice. AN such uppeois hall be filed in weiting scith the Secretary of ihe Coverming Board for
the district. A vimely appeadd shall sty further action by the fire code oficial wntd the mwstier is
determined by the Appeal Hoard acoudined in Section 1092 unless the ixsue poses an innminent fire
or tife safery hacard o members of the public. The fire vode official shall notify the appellant by
certified mail of the date and time of such hearing, The hearing sl be xeheduled to 1ake pluce ne
ot thon 20 calesdur davs fram the dite vhowi an ihe cortitivd mail. The appellant shatl hove the
righi o uppear in peesan ar by agenr at the heoring und presesu vral, writien and or photographic

evidence o the Appeal Bourd

Scction 110 Violationy

110.4 Viglgtion Peanltics <hall be amended gy fallows: Persons who shall violate a provision of this
code ar shall Tail o compls with any ol the requiremients therent or wio shali erect, install, alter.
repair Gr do sork in violaton of the zpproved conatracbion documents of dircctine of the fire code
official. ar of 4 peamit ur cenificate used under pravisiony of thie code. shall be guilty ot a
miischemeamor or infraction. ot the diveretion of the prseoiting aitorney or ageacy, punishable by g
fine not exceeding SIUEUO for c first violation: 2. 4 tine not overeding N300 fur o cecond viedarion
of the samy provision within ane vear: 3 4 fine wod gxeecTiny SIILINL for each wdkitional violatron
B thye sumee pravisios seling pie vear, of By imprisonment not excecding (80 deys, ot both such fine
and imprisonment. Tach day that a violsion contmipes aller due notice has been served shali be
deemed 4 separate offense 2 Health & dofen Cede Nectione {3145 und 1 79930,

110.4.3 Ciuations hall be added o tollows  The Fue Cluef or his her duly uthorized
repwesentative MUV IXSuE Sitalions foe wfrochony ur dnsdemeanir violations of 1his code purseant i
Nevrron JISTE of the Health & Safery Uinde of the State wf Culifornio and Chapter 3¢ icommencing

with Sevhion 853,06, of Title 3 of Paer D of the Ponol Crde it the State of California

Sectign 112 Stop Wark Order
112.4. Fallure 10 Comply shall be amended as tullows: Any person wha shall continue any work

after having been served with w stup-work urder, except such work as that person i direuted (o
perform 1o rermove o s ilation ar unsafe condinen, shall be punishuble by a fine or imprisonmeni or

hoth as deseribed i Segtion 110 3 tHealih o« Xafers Oade Nections [ 3145 and 17995

Ordinance 2019.08 'age 3

20-0203 G Page 7 of 40



Chapter 1

< Nexli : cfinitions
Add delinition for Campfive - Shall mean a fiee which v used fir cooking, personal warmih, Tighting
or aesthetic purpuses  This includes fires comtained within outdoor fireplaces and enclosed stoves
wath flues or chimmevs. stoves wiing rellied /iquid vr solid fuels poriabie harbecue pits, heasiery, ar
apce heating devices sohich are wsed ontside wf any drncture. mohile home. or any living
docemimadation msunied on o vehicle,

- Add detinason tor DISANCU - Shall mear the district and dl sther areay w tthin the exterior boundaries
thereof mow or hereufier esiublizhed,

- Add delinption for Deivewny - Shall mean o vehicular acoess that series up o byo (21 parcels with
no mwre than twa 2 residentiol wiits and ans number of non-commerciol or industriad on each
purce!

- Add dehimtion lor Execmtive Body - Shaff mean the Board of Dhirectors of the Dicirret

- A definition tor Fis Chief - Skall imean the Chief Execunive Fire Othcer of the Fire
department disirict xerving the sueisdiction ve o dtdv authorized representative

- Add detinition fur | reined Crowd Meanger - Shall mean standby personned, wsually o securiry
guard pr usher personnel, whis are irained in the proper procedure e e peopic from o rene or other

place af public ssaemblagee 1n v srdvrly amd calm fushion in the event of ap emergency

Chapter 3}
Section 302 Definitions

- 302.1 Definitions “hail he amended sy follows Added Campfiee detininon. as shewn abave in

Chapier 2

Section 117 Open Hurning, Recreationu) Firey, wnd Vuidoor Fircplaces
307.4,4 Cumpfire Restrigtions shall be added as folluws

S €T AL s wndawhud foe any person n fight marmane or tav o campftire upon or near gny hrash-

vinered fomd. grass-cavered lawd or forest-convered fand during the nme swhen hurmng [rermite ary
sipended by e Director aof the Departaren of Forestry amed Fire Protection. the ©AL FIRE e
Chief or the AHJ,
Exceptinm: Commerc) covking aperativesy wih gppeova! of the 144,

< AT When cumplires are aflos ed i chondid b andinecful Jor any person wor ight, moiniam, ey
d i flee upon anv Arivhecovered land. grasicovered lami or focest-covered fand unless the
fodlow oo o Lmunt requirements ure cumpliesd wirh
307.4.4.2 18) Fhe wrva within 3 feet of the periphery of the campfire is cleared of all flommable

marteriad and vepctation.

Ordinance 201908 'age 4

20-0203 G Page 8 of 40



:‘,‘.’:.:’ﬂ!ug lhj PR G s gl sl wthoer Pl e e e N K
LI T L Y DU N N D i L
N "“q:!:§'.;.__151 Eomipliegs ikl e Lesed oo 0 e o e egte weiear prr om

AL b e o T e e ey
MIT ALY (dy W prormeecin o i Db e s e e at e s e

sormgitory o st A e e
!

Chapter §

< Nection $03 Fiee Apparatus Agcess Rusds

SOV Dimensions shoaf] be gmendod gn Tollonc F e dppatalion aovess foa by vkl fiae

¥

sebbrgad g wodthe Yot Dees Doan J0 foe earhirav e a0 et Ly b o e 1y

i

LA ourd i

Sk

TR et LR D appees el wovuty pat o agcondhire stk Setion b b st Liebeteact ol
sorcal clvananog o e e than Sl R teev ooy s the adestrrcr ahadd e e T thers
re

£00.2.5 Dead Eady om0 hosnteraad o0 befhue Bhad et e appatatin add dvs poads o feiven

A

APRATAS

£03.2.6 Bridges und blevated Narfaces o5

SERI trel g benth coall Teoaeen dcd sl ap appronoed e forr SUHITY nenal tice

PP eamemded v foihinds Where o boadge oo an clesated

surface vooputt D g Gre appanarae o o b beplpe gl Be ciastradisd mind pountained

reent Ak b e [

avieidanoe wik e o

Py odthe cyrrcir o ornng ©

i

shall be deswned for o e Tand TR EXVINTRR TN SRR PT AU | S8 SRTYTEYSEIUE I TROML DRSS B FEP R PERPR TR (TR IS TR P2

freers <hal) b oeostosd 40 Dol vaimroes o enhre by sewneed b sbe Faog toead 00y,

clesated oz e dtovaenesd O oo

tor such due. spprosed barecoe ool e o

TATNR

reguiread by the T cods

- B03.4.2 No Parking in Fire Lapes 2l e added o Bdlosse oo peran adard sing px

u.run/f'u: ey vetdilg fr o feibtor vatimhsd oo piscido g ARTE AT Bt e vty S ety ,:u[;.n T

arher traffic or b comnprliinn e sciide ahe Fuscdioee o e Dieo Chad o ar i Boe dndy anatinaess

1

represonbaiive . Feace PN cr o i el sogfoe el dovee wlong the e ol iy i

Al W

sorieptsn Elicinaa Be e Nosdard or dppemder

el e s wg it de Mendpcy i lovsted aartaeen

RIS T TR YRR TL FERTTE STUAAN [} 15 SRR EFRVINS PO TITTRY

s viedatiod ust pietaed ahea

&

I

coehe wr v s Sowadiiee v oo pablich o pedaiedy nverd e viperated ot ovireer parkiig Lo

;

oM gy g Fire Tone Syvoiiee deaescr weth suelo v o B e pe whnc B ihe pfoce ok

Jedtiey

Fire dergmaor vhsil o ndiostod e oo s ponded St awdiace ot o cnd vicibio froee e

FRSTI U A

H

S gt <
PEEE YRR | S AR TR Pl

s, omturkome ik

c HceRtRnastiing g !

Oirdimance SR ax

20-0203 G Page 9 of 40

Sy argtin on Selive s s des than e e bane fucisdre thari Fle zsiee i e L

tina ik SR

Page 5



e

words TEIRE LANET whneh ove clearly vivble from o vehicle, or {3) by a red curl ur red point on
ihe edye of the rodway wpos schich e cleely siarked the words "FIRE [ ANF.

$03.4.3 No Packiog ig Front of Fivdmats shall be added as toflows: N person sholl stop, purk. or
feave stamding oy vehicle within 15 feer of u fire Avdrons except ax foblowy - (ar I the vehicle §s
sttended by a licensed deiver wh 1o weared fo the front yeal amd wha con immediatedy move such
vehicle incase of necorsiny, ihy f the vehicle is mned or uperated by o fire department and is clearty
marked as a fire Jepuriment ey

$03.4.4 Fire {.anes Buzed op Rosd Width shall be added as Tollows: Fire ianec <hull be bused vn
rod width ay required in Appendix 11w amended by the districe

%03.5.3 Firy Appurutys Access Gates shall be added as follows: A/ awomaine und manual gates
imstalled over fire upparationy accesy rodds sholl comply with the districs gate stundard as approved

by the fire codde official,

Section 308 Premise Identificativn
S$0S.1 Addrepy ldcatificution <hall have the 0ot hine of this paragraph amended as follows:

Sddresces for new ard exesiing buddidings shall compdy vk the disiencr adidee ss siandard us approved

by the fire conde officnil,

Section S07_Fire Protcctiop Waicer Supplics
7,5 Wherr Reguired shall be smended as faliows 400 feet shall be amended W 750 feer

Section 209.3 Firg Contrul Ruum
09,3 Fire Coatroel Room Fire Protection and ity Equipment hiontficution wid Access. is hereby

wumemted kv akding the following (o read Fire sprobler risers, fire adarm control pancls, solur
phetovodbatc power ceatens ragid sharott switchex, ond sther fire detection. suppression, ur similar
cemtlril ow ey i be D ated ixicle o vingle tire contrnd roonr for the building  The fire cramrod
roscmy shwall B e misemn dimension of five feer Svesen feet i size soith u toral wseable ared of nor
fesc thein 33 square ot The room Yhuili b fowiried within the hulh[ing vset st Ll side wall at u location
uppeoved by the Fire Code Official and shofl e o csnbde from the oxierion g cderior avoes Jdoor
with s clear saidih of oot lexy than 32 ecbey and a heighr nop lese thant Xtb incites shall be provided
for accexy mto the roveme A durable sign hall be affixed 1o the exterior of the door with the words
CFIRE CONTROL ROOAM ™ in hetters mor fess than 4 inchey it height. A kev box complving with
Kection 506 sholl be instadled an the exterior swde of the fire control ruoeni door vpening. he rinm
muast be capable or moimaining o cmmum femperatire of 31t degrees Fohresheit. A clearance of
L2 mches shatt be provided from the fire speinkicr risers to any adjacent walls, Fhiy room can be

vhurcd with siher huilding utilitees o fire protection equipment that is compatible.  An approved

Ordinance 200408 Page 6

20-0203 G Page 10 of 40



-

cubinet cr comamer shull be provided tcostire record plats of the fire sprinkler swatem, other fire

presection cquipment. amd site flons Tis rocin shall sot be weed for anv other storage.

Chapter 9
Sextipe 903 Fire Sprinkiery
- 303.2 Where Requirgd shall be amended as follos st An approved automatic sprinkler system shall

be required amd intailed in newe buildings amid structures 3804 square feer e greuter wheit

vonstrucied or eclucaied within the jurivdiciion w descnbed in Sections 903,20 through 903,212,
Exception: Agncolural buildings nor under a special use permit used for commercial pUIPOsSEs.
90).2.4 Yhere Re ed shall he sdded s follows: Nrarur of existing buildings grearer than 3,600
square feer I cxsting huildings 3600 xquare feei or greatir. other than one and rw o -family dwelling
unify, and agriculturol buddmgy not yndder speciil use permic 1 commercial purposes. where the
floor areu q/!}w hm'ldl'ng or structure s increased by an additicn of more thar thirty percent (1)
or 4 OM) square feet whickever 1s fess, such building cr steucture yhall be made (6 conform 1o Sechion
Wi
903.2.b Where Required shall be added as follows: Starus of vxisting buildings less tham 3 604
square feetr In existing buildings 3 61K square feer or [ess, vther iy one-and mo-fumily dwelling
units. and ugricufiural buildings not under special wse permi; for commercud! purposes swhere the
Noar area of the huilding or strucewre is imcreased 1o a roral squarg Teotage over 3600 square fred,
by ankditisn of more than thirty percens 3Ry or LI square feet, whichever s fess such building
ar siructire shall he made 1o conform in Section #1320
993.2.1 Groug A shall be amended s+ Ebows for A groups A< throughe A8 008 261 1)y The foe
area exceeds 3 AN synare feet
903.2.3 Group F shall be amended as tollows 9032 001 Vhroagbout all Groap B fiec arcas grealet
than J. 40 square feef in ated.
90).2.4 Group F-1 shall he amended as toblows M 204 Group B9 (1 A Licoup F ire anea
exceeds S A cquaure feer
2.7 M shall be armended as follmes: 903 27 Group Bt ™M, 9012 7 (1) A Group H osnd
M fire ares exveeds S 800 squirre foet

903.2.8.2 Manulacturcd Homes shall be added s tolkoss: Jngutomi fire speinkfer costent shutl

be required e il oew manutuctwr ed hories dred mndpi-famidyv necvstacneed homes aremdied Jor wie
us @ one~md nwe-fumedy cheellion: The devign cend unsiafles oo e apvem shall be i accordance
with Californnr Code of Regwlationy oce 28 34 W
Exceprions:
Lo Manufociured Bosies ocated withor an ecsting e home park complving with

Califoenia Heolth amd Safeny Uiodde. 7 0iseee 22 Part 2 f e 23

Ordinance 201908 Pagce 7

20-0203 G Page 11 of 40



L Momwtortueyd voney tsa e sa s ed DI spiicare frel in e amd serve ay an
ww Py iy s defised o Daorameni Cwde Nection 63307 swhen thye
exavling primies Cesdienc on flle g operny 18 maé requteed fir comply wirh Cglifoenio
Kesoferttivegd 1 cigde e bt KIET D

X sanufuctier el B chett desni cvceed 10 cqwire teel i s

903 2.9 Group S-1 shail he amendead oy fothoas QU3 Y9 Gegup 5. W03 2001, 4 Groap S fire wrea

excecds afit Sefointrr et

903.2.10 Groop S-2 Egclosed Parking Gaarages snail be amendal as foltows: 991 2 10 (1) Whay

the fire arcn ot the encloned parking parsgy vacceds 3 i apure feef,

Section MW7 Cire Alarm sod Detection Systems
207.2.9 Whery Required - New Buildings o Structores less than 3,600 sqware feer shall be added

ay follows A upproved fire alorur detection oontem shafl be msiofied in ali buildings wirh u floor

atrecs bexy than 3 8061 square foen,
Exceptiony:

i

Gt arerd rwae-fands v ellimey PR J Clecupancies o ot socrpancies clissaifod
TR

L dwriculaurod huildings hor under Special ko permin smbor not wied for commre cial
Parpises (6.8, retaidy sales. fockd service, and or speciid evenrsi,

U Building s awvith o fliwir arva lesy ihan SO0 sipaars foel miee by compt o ddetermansid

kv oabhe Fire Thief or Wi her dulv ashorized represemtitive baskd o bk linge

conxrructiae maienial ond fearuees, fncaiton, RPN ’_V"" ced dickinner i

CXDN e

907.2.b Status of Fuisting Baildings ~hsl! he added o dlow s sviaiey butlidings witdssur v

apprad Sdwane sprmvkier cssiom. other diag e e ovisfamibv dwellmng unie el
Suitding st wndar specicl wie permil fur Cammnieciol paarpena s where i Hev idir o ihetesciens waen
e s Mol cvE sind e floe arew of i Swdding or stewciees oomvesaned oe mosdificd Be mare than
vhire parcerd 1 20 ar 1D Gpare frer whicheves 11 lens vuch haidibing or aructnure aholl be Hexdet
e cemfue s 1 BN on 0T o e realienr e e e Fiee U Rang e s her Y st darr v f reprevenotive.
Rusidings wolh v Ar i fers iern M g fro dheas B oimgig abs vt manegd by the Fied 1 Wl
ar i her v uiharized copee semtative, Mavel it Midding comnpraction meeals gend featne e,
I AL TS T, ST Y e ricd vty ¢ dor A pavimen

907.2.¢ Mositoniag shail be added s tallony (0 pres afaem ditestica avvicmn vhadl b connectedd
shirectly (heoieh unid marciored S i U appesed sreiead peopricfars ar remode st Service.
which gives nwfihde e vovad spnids o cuesicentfy odesded Tecdtion 40 g inkiered buildings

shiddl bu momron oif

{rdinance 2019.08 Page 8

20-0203 G Page 12 of 40



Exveptiany:
Pk and nwo-fumgli JAvallings c BT Ccumin s et ather s cupancies clasfied
us T

Dot i il Biitlingy mes woder siiecasd die perntin o ar nod ssed Jor commerciad
Prerposes o0 2 etk vifen fead Servioed and e apecsd evendsg

907.2.d Uvpe ! Hood Installntigpy shall be stdod a- fullos The reyuiremen of fmstadiation or

repiacement. wf v Ivpe { Hod Nystem sl require o fire alarm sprialder moenitoring syxiem o be

istidled aie Jusr the beaad vestemto be connected te an exnting lire wlurmspeinkler monitoring sesiem
foe ther bunldding
7 Sceon Fower 8 shisll be ndded as follows.  Jn accordimce with NFPA4 78 i
e ondae e pawer xupply providing g i 3-hour power capacity under gutescent lsd oxticm
sgsceating st non-afuem copdittons il be amemtod 1o minimnm T2 howur piwer capaciy.
Exception The copience af un emeryeacy buck-up porwer supply that meets oe ereeed the

repprremenit of Lalinesta Fire Cude Chapree |2

Chapier 12

Section (203 Emergency apd Sinaddy Power Svatemy
1203.1.3 Imvealiation <hail he smendod a, follons. baergency power aystems amd ctthy power

syaterms shall be mstalicd i sesardance with the Caliternia Buldiog Code, the U alitarmug Llectne

Code, NFPA TEG and NEPA V0 4 buabdingy. wther thae ones aml owitamaiy shaetlong v, ol
AN vlturad B w'l'u‘lm;,« AEY uved for sommper sl R lsL g ul bk vramdby Fuser st bwave s adeinn o
et Thedt s biigais a."."(.nh 2R st e Suihiing wppraved Ry e Loy code wticiad - bdsting

rastetthtionen Shedl be mantained J0 e ardaecr stk Ure il appeaadd

Chapter 33
- Secty (1] ces for Fircfightin

3310.3 Premise {dentification shall be addied e tollowe FProow oo amid Juring Cinsie et i

spprovced whilress oo sholl e proveded ot v i Bre ol emvoencs Vel docers eoad endey it

the profect.

- Segtjon 3312 Water § or Fire Protecti
- W ired <hall he amended as Fllawe Prar n vamhusiable materials jirriving on
site, the fire lvdrion water ot ahadi b ovealled vt masssvisined g s notirions Y R in.

camuoimi of seuter supplied shall mect the reigiored Jiee s for the project

Ordinance 2019.08 Page 9

20-0203 G Page 13 of 40



Chapter 49

1903.1 Where Reguirey -hail e added as tidlwee The fire sodde offictsd of the GRE may requiry

Fewwlapravens grogecis Jocwied in Mosfeeane Hapehr iartid Fery - Migh Mire Placiarid Nesvrioy Somney eoyubmit
toe peuiectin plave Thes plaw shall Be apgeoved by both the fire coxde opfo vt ond the soiporrced
evpreveniiiine for che dowal C U TIRE Ui Chuet tif tovssed in the Stane Resgamyibdey Aepa ISKAD

poine ter the reconding af 1he final prsp for thw prisfect A the Cowiry of £ Droegadi

Segijon 4908 W ildfiry Profection Building Conatruction

49054 Roy( € upsiruction Requirementy shall e sddet 1 (oM ¢ 4/ mew o wmvicwg ooa imclaling
abdvgsons regmires o Ulave g eoef covermg o assosbiv Al ryersofing requires Claty 4 oved ©owening
e gutemhiy av a s Ke-roafing on cacer i DY b e e 1iag e e iR my o et
Jreraat Wil Heefvntate BRal e ertiss coct b o 000 o el iy of ariem Rl Gy e me e
fduny Mot firv ronardang tvatied cund ur o an oy et ibnde e :u‘rm’w‘, vore R e ad

rmtf FaeNETrib nmlruuf Jor b v d Gt ey

Chapiee S0

S 1% 184.1}

ml b 'J.mu!! !O! p!nu‘n chall g edded a0 (s o gy dorange e sl re“(-d"'l!!r_flum the

BTV AT TN !on‘».ff:ﬂy Ve e el e AR i s yhsll comictifident ibetd iyt sty

Jq)» FRESTETE farim 0 T e Rt Ty it g anﬁ }!?!fl' ¥4 y(‘tt‘;‘“‘iulxrf‘ Thi- Jrh[ i :_u)[‘)’ﬁrkl/"lc My thy Firy
howf ror Wiy her iuly b hosc s sl el e e iRy cal (E JOHTLe RIS b i the vase of an abligation

visgiduy o oereiin pde pagn rvoad e Ur)}f:h of

Chapter S6

$601.2 Ucrmit Reguired sivuli he aoiended as follawse Penuits shall be required as set fonth
Sectran HIN A andd eopulaiad o acerndan e will this section, here explosives permifs are requirad
rhrey sheddd By isaiadd (o the Feee € et e By e ey anthorized eepreseniciing. anid the Bl Plocud
# oy Sherifl s Liepaarimeng Whos ficga s ky prrmsity arec eeginirod, they vnell Se issinedd iy rine Fres
. hocd, vie iy hoe ahidy wathese o ropees st cond the £ Docaadi i smints fangrg af Supervitpe

%05.2.1 Dosymcotation whatl be wdbet as tdbow s The d207 bl bave the quhoesy i eequn

Jew-wtneiitainm vegardbting adl aype ot ot the Litenekt pirg et aa

$00L4.3 ruptician e{ormatien !l fo mbded e follony The WH T url porei ull peapeecions

efoar avilieein

(rdmance 2019 0K Page 10

20-0203 G Page 14 of 40



Chapter §7
- Section 3704 Ntorage

$704.2.9.6.1 Logations Where Abuve-Ground Tanks are Prohibited shall be amended ax follow s

Storage of Class L and € faxs [ flammable iquids in abos e-ground tanks vutude of Buildings 13 prohibited

unfess approved by the Fire Uheef, or hiCher dufi authorized ropresenistive. When permisted by the
Fire Cluef, or bus herduly aurhorized representative, wll ubave grownsd miis: or vauic idafiations
Sfor the siorage vf Class 1 fE or HE flammable and combustible hquids shall comply with thuse
requircments s sel forth M the California Fire Code. The Californie Fire Code shall alsa apphy o

installarions suher than motor vehicle fucl dispensing stationy where ubove ground storage is reyuired

Section $706 Specinl Operations
2706.2.4.4 Locations Whers Abuve-Ground Tanks nre Probibited shali be amended as follows:

Storage of Ulass £ and Class 11 flammable liquids in abose-ground tanks vutside of buildiags is

prohebited wnless approsed By the Fire Chief or his her duly authorized representative. When
permitted by the Fire Uhief, or biy hee dulv anthorizad represeniative, all ubave ground tunkfst or
vaudt intollutions fur the storage of Clase [ ae 11 Bamgmable und combustble liguids shall comph
with thoye requirements us sor forch By the Culifornie Fire < wdel Phe Caltfornia Fire (ode shall also
apply sex disstathations other than motor vedecly fuel dispessing sty where ubove-ground storagce

ix required

Chapter 58

Sectivn 8806 Hlammable C rvogenic Fluids

£800.2 |imitntivay shall be amended as fallaw s Storage of Hammable cryogenic tiuds in stanonan
comtarners outstde af buildingy o profubicd wafess auproved by the Eire Chiel or Jis her dulv
authoresed copresearariv. Wien permstrsd b the bore Chier, pr histher duly  auhorized
represemtative ol stationary contners for the storagee of flammable cryogemic fluids shall comply
with those requiremenis as cof forrh by ke Ualetorma Fire Code The Catifornie Fire Code shall afse
appdsc i anstatlanony ather than e vobdle el doipessing atuiions where above-xround storige

tx reqntred

Chupter 61

Section 6104 Locution of L.1* C,ax Containers
6104.2 Murimum Capacity wighin Established Limity shall be amended us Follkows. The storag

of tiquefied perroleun gay m cxcess of na apgresate of JA00-gallon warer capacity when located

feast one-hall i1 21 mite trom property zoned or designared for residential dse anmd at least one-half

Orcdinance 201908 Page 11

20-0203 G Page 15 of 40



120 mile from exising ressddentidd develupment with e densiy greater than one ( { dwetling wmif per
acre und at least ane-holf o1 21 mile from any hotel or imotel s sllvwed when (R approved. umd
special. comditional uve permil i issued by the Caunty of Ei Dorodo.

Dispensing within esiubliched Timits, Within the ftmeits estublished by low restricting the dispersion
of liquefied peirafeum vy for the protecrion of heavily pppulited or congested areas. the aggregiily
capaciiv o any one ssstallation shall not exceed o water copucity of 2000 gotlons.  The dispensing
of lguetied petroleunr 26 01 € coess of an agpregate ofF 2 inni-gatlon water capacity when located

at least vhe-half (1 20 mile from prapernn zoned or designated for eesikdential wuse und ot least pre-
half ¢! 20 mude from existing residential development with g density greater than nne (15 dwelling unit
per acre and at least one-half 11 20 ante fronr any botel o motef s altowed when AHT approved ond

a special.comditiona use permit is issued By the County of ET Burado.

- Sectiog 0l Elevatign Li m (.ns Inatallat
abgve) shall be added s follows:

- 81121 Reguintors shall he added as follews

- Twaossiuge regufaior svstens shall he ivtafled e acvnrdance with manufocturer requirements.

- Two-stuge regulaies systems shalf be installed oo oll LG installarions

- The first viape regulutor shall be invialled wider the hinged gavge cover cupplicd with the tunk. The
atmwrspheric prexsice aperture of the eegriatoe shall re poimted downward. The fiest stuge regulafor
vhutl be plumbed ter the piser of the wird piping with safl copper tubing 1o allow fledditity <hould nank
shifting vecur The river from the yard piping shafl be Locared mit more than 3 inches ihorizonrailv:
from the swalls of the tank.
Fhe secomid atuge regudator amd eiser pupie shall be inctalled under the eve of the huilding. as close a
pvovncable do the building wali T riser hall Be securels vapported braced 1o the wall
approcimately Dinches kelins the regulator sy to prevenr beading of e pipse Ay laterad snow foe
finscds
A peoveciive cover, gppreved by the gacowupplier and Building (cial. shail fe instulled over the
weanmd stage regudator emnd securely supported (o the yround or diagonadly e the wali
The riser pipes for the vard piping shall not be embedded in concrete. Cancrete plauced around such
river shatl by held back af least |inch from afl sides of the pipe

- Avshe timg of applicatiion i any building permii, whick involves the installation of an LPG sysiem.
the applicant 5l submit an TPG sostem pdot plan in 3 copies for diitullv s PDE). The LG plot
plan shull incliade. but ot Be fiouted 1o the tnk {oeatien, proposed tak capacity i (28 gallons,
vonte of vard piping. lxatiosi af the river pipe at the buadldure. propeery boundaries. und an vutline of

el exisungproposed building s an the fop amd o depicrion of the ridgelone of any huilding 1 ke

Ordinance 2019.08 . Page2

20-0203 G Page 16 of 40



suppficd wab LEC Thiv shadlaslse be e sedod 2 the spppropriate fire disirict @ serve s w focator
LA T A F VY LA Y SN
Tomeuntiornn of thre comterbiere o UPG Sanay shadl Be prermionentiv ovarked by the uvwe ef anosw stoakey, one
il ek erad Nugh ke s iR e of suttocent dreleind 1 5e v ittt amtic ipated s o
depth ol e covpes iove Fos oo Ly and maattean e of Dieve o ks are the
respomsibiliic of the LFG nuer
Propane applionces and acccssarees shuld ot 2o seronttod o ans s wrshadlation haiova the first
foor or heluw grade whochever i moere resirrciny

- 6112.2 Vertig bser Piping shall he added as rolloawe

- Uiriimmn 007 Na hipdnle Stb - iyan Jupring
The risste shulf booweriifn 1ichoy e izenpardfs of the fonk

R ‘S‘-,”y‘g gy vhafd Boomvtiadledd chave amd Bedow tank level {1 ;!r-l\‘l'./«' !l” ihe fank mivement (8treer
el shal! oo by rseds
A drsend tlodibie seser Conininded of capper cririnleconaend tubiag anmd progecied My steel covwrad
Stcathed muterrgl iy Sy asdad oS oy cante fhe el dtornative il peohe cufficient
elisc b ree fie e Bar Lo wies e

- 61123 Marking snd Locatjons shall he adided a< Foilnw

- Anapproved sy sl e foeoted e By o the riaer b arf voive an the hudidimg in a visikle
,"'rn'ul.uu_

- Ihe diguefand petredcum g -ulr;!he;r Al G e arer pr sl cfe gt it IR L the i de L e
wank vaboe protectine cover FThis tag shell compan the sappdion’s mime vnd omergency selephie
reresibe

Fand dospeddostron chall B ormcgsentdy ko by metid e owosed mer il vnow mirker, b o

et esinee Jimropis iy a3t ok chey Sheovens ararkee shall e s xufficivny height 1o
by the ol e Jopdd and Aal] S s sihomiees 0 S fedl i gt Bise oy mparkcrs i

o i . H is -
v 'H.N'r!m)‘ Vi st ithS {iw gty RN E DU S PUNNT 203 CURREN S ANCREFFEEY §

Scotjon o1) ) Underpround VPG Tanks Installationy and Owgershyp shail bo added as folion,

61131 Permits and Pluny shull be added as Dl Poronts shali be required, and plas e shull ke

vebmniod G GV sinderercaesd una angaidiptees o agieroved By the (ML

0l )2 Enderground 1.1°G Tank Owgerhip ~bais b sdded we Tollowss Dindergramid LFG nonis

Vel by prodiibited fram heing cobd oo oncercamd ancll e cetanmed Mphe LRG L capaay wnidior o

/;‘;nwh‘[m SpEiem o cHshre fragrce cimntl puntymin e el A e et caiid e cerde

C hapter 80

Ordinance S0 DN Fage 13

20-0203 G Page 17 of 40



Section O, NEP A, 130-10 - Mtundard for the Instaliation of Spriakier Sratems i Une-sad [wo-

Famibs Dwgilings aud Manufactured Homes ny ameaded 033,13, 9033 &
NEPA 13D, Amended Sectinns as follows:

Add Nection 4.7 10 read ws [olfows:

( hﬁnl;‘f BU.NEPA VMDD 4.7 Kovieh e B spranbler cocemi v G400 sl e can i te e

14 ¢

dwifings Al s o Fasvee Pares T vesien AN BTN G s e Ry iy Fare i
oM Nt

Exception: Matitocturid Bom: undatiedd despeid ct e cif v the dibien s Diepartatear af Honsen
undd ©omoninioy evelopatent

Revise Section 5.1.1.2 10 read a3 folluny;

Chapter 80 NFPA 13D 5. 0,02 1 vigppdy oof ar Jeast ot vancht type et pomypsanistiere yprentkly s siredd

within P eromnes SRR e i f ot tae peapv' iy b e appieeceid ossitiont Nos d spemkbeny sl
S kepr i moiresd ansd Gocseuhie kg
Revise Section 7.6 1o read as follow s

Chapter 80 NFPA 13D, ™0 ot Sovcd v oo silwom sdidd he proivcedye of van sl fiee speandive syatems

h{n’!.‘g‘} Lt Al‘,"{'!r‘l'x,"'-" £ Nadtoany et Hhe s de it %f‘." TR YR A VY 3
Revise Sechon 11.2.1.1 to read ay hllows:
Chapter 8. NFPA 13D 11211 Wheer 3 tre oy etmadt pooyss conndatian o et peosaded, the

sy aterm sl De v et areai s deded B sn im0t oF DI IR BT i f 0B gidaah foe s

&

Jevw cRarr g Momnds nergtion b et s e by Dieni pe st vkl Bewiimeas o f Be i e sl

Mo wu

\ppeadin B - Fire Hlow Requitements for Buildings

Jable B10%.1(1} Required Fire Flow for One and Two-Famils Dwethings, Group R-1, and R4
Buiidiags and Towabouwses bl e govended an Toltasws o wly Cvadnins feiiey o it tpas

PIRE-FLOW ALTOM VTG CMIENEMA M FLOW

CALOULATION SERINKLER VIR - DLRATION
ARE A MSEEM HLOW thours}
(aquary feen) (i sign igallony per
L andard, L _misuic) .
Cyecmange i iix Pagc 14

20-0203 G Page 18 of 40



ik

Pt
! R ; N ; —
i RIS C 1R INTITENG ST o e i S i -
t il e
| e A0 5 T T
i [DYIYRTSE
: fitv-llow rat,
e EERT A S E b ' e
fe!
Lk geed pectter t o
AN ! S £
[ Y B e Fhbars o,
D3bEd o e o Cws ey

R ubenial ¢ ot

Table B105.2 Required Fire Flow fur Bujldings other than One- and Two-Family
Dwelliags, Groyp K-), and R4 Buildingy agd Townbouses shail be amended as fudipw -

AUTOMATIC  SPRINKLER MINIMUM CFLOW DURATION
SYSEEM HIRE-FLOW (hours)
iDesign Standard) igatlony per
minuic)
Sl e pnvlon anem B i Tt fhraoon i Tarir
o (g0 [AR LRI FIR
PRTSCYTRS T I B T T it Ping Letoae PoLhatas g 1 Palife
Py R R LR A CRELEA T e b pechoeeid

P oy

dhag s R I IV TEeY) 1 RTINS

R R e T TR SN B e

B “ 1 YT

Appendiv D - Fire Apparatus Acceas Raads
Section D103 Minimum Speciflicativas
PIYY. ) Accoss Road Widib with & Hydrual ~halt be aniendad an o oaas adiding the exceplion

ff.\'g‘epu‘nn CRpavani g
DP1OY.2 Grade ~hull S amcaded o etles Fiee apgmaritins sidess 1aids and deivew ays shall oo
excced (590w prowhe e appaarved B ehe S ce viame FEDGeado Caunt e ameende § U gl

Piablic Resorce Cande Tode 14 Besagn and Imprecmiens NMondyrdy Ao

Orrdingnce 209.08 Page 15

20-0203 G Page 19 of 40



N

Exception: Elvvation ukeve S U8 fecr onili st etier 00
D19).3 Turgisg Radius «hall be amended as Toilows, [he minimum tuening cads shall ne
determmed by the Nee code cHiveal amd shadfl st o Timde cutt amd Qutior
D19S.S birs Apparetus Accens Rogd Galey 1hali be amended as tokivws Subsection £ r Where 4
angle wae i /mn).!mi_ Che o waide widthe p b e v Sesy than T feer A6 mimi RBhere o fire
SHNIT sy romd conpyisiy A g diided recadwaay, the Cate swadih shgii met be fevs thar (Y feer 14570

nine!

D103.6.1 Roads 10 to 29 feet ig width shail be ameaded as follows: Fire fane signs as specitied in
Secton THO1.6 shall be posted on both «de ef G spparatus access 1osds that are 201 0V feet wide
O LR SREE RUITIEY

Frveption: Liesarons above S ekt oo ditermoned dy ihe AfLS

- £193.6.2 Roads more thap 29 fegt jn WidLh shatl be amended as tollovs Fire lane sgns 1»

specified i Section D10 4Shall be posted an voe side p! (ire apparstun access roads more thap 'Y
feet wide (BS54 3 mmi and lesvs than 14 teet wade (1097 K win)

Exception Flecationy whine S i 8 ucdeternnned by the A#H4
D104.4 Circomferentjnl Fire Apperntys Accese Ronds shal) be wddad as lollaws When required
by the fire coxde offscral ox fiee appaaratius soocss reard shall becansteicied 1o encompass the enticery

af vrariectyre g tholl eovade o ontorpiuy micsns of Crserency VeRiche ey

SECTION 4: CONFLICTY
That Oedinance Noo 201617 of the GRY | and all ather spdingoges or party vl ordinanves herewith ase hnehy

repealed

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY

Ifamy Ordinance, anticte. subscotion s subdisistm theres !, powy iann, wentence. clauve oo phrave of thiy code ot
any application thereol, 1y for wny reasan held o he ranalid by a cvaet o competent junisdiction, such decision
shall not aflect the remaining provisions of this code, which can be given effect without the invalid purtions and.
therefore, such invalid portions are declared o he severable. The GRY here o declates that it sould have enacted
this Oirdinance and cach of ity anticles, sechony, subsectiins. o subdivisions thereol, pmivisions, weniences

clauses or pheasas irrespective of the fact that onc wr e of them s declaret ins alid

SECTION 6;

['his Ordinance shall rake offoct tharny (301 dass sfter s adoproon The GRY [loard Scoretary s directed W
publich this ordinapee in g nesospaper of general circutation o the Dhatnct. In beu of publication of the tull tex:

of the ordnance, 1 summan o the ordinance may he published by ke by the Board Sccrctan within fitcen (1 H)

Ordinance 2019.0R Page 16

20-0203 G Page 20 of 40



days alter its passage and 4 cerrfied copy shall be posted 1n the oftice ot the GRY punsuant ta Governmens {ixde

}:‘(x,"“‘:]’ll _7693.’1’{‘,‘ 3 !_‘\

The above Ordinance was sntreduced at a meeting of the Beard of Directors of the Garden Valley Fire Protection
Districs on Otober 17, 2009, and o was then read for the first time, A public hearing was set for the Ordinance

tv be read for the second ime on November 26, 2019 and approved by the fulfowing vote

PASSED ARND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors ol the GRY 1his, 26 day of Nevember. 2019,

AYES: A
NOES: |
ARSENTL: )
ABSTAIN: (I)

- /
LT A

Ed Hawhins, Board Prestdent

Liss Howard, Board Secretan

Ordinance 201908 Page 17

20-0203 G Page 21 of 40



DSP, ECF, & GRV

Amenrde

101.1 Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Adminisirative need
LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than
Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate :aw :[;d oy eamlx u t::,;ped :‘inderz;:vo;n:(')(l):)e::teglzr:ai:
1056.27 quantity not exceeding 125 gallons senving Locally adopted and amended | =20 12 &1 Explosion. At levalions above 100 et
occupandies in Group R-3 an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire
e PR3 activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional
altention.
SR FIEA L Adophngthissecbontoallowforﬂleueaﬂmand:ssumoe
066 - 03 cnebin TN SEIT DT of foés to cover actual costs: Section 106.6 dafines: -
1068 Add section. L-‘?“’_""_ °'_°_at°d and ad_‘"_’ted pemils, plan checks, and .nspeeuons as allowed i Health
o _ S &SafetyCode17951 :
o SR il ot Sedmn‘lOGMCoﬂReooveryFees Toreoovermecos!to
106.6.1 Add section:.... . - . Locally created and adopted the Fire Distict. ,
. Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs of avmdable
106.7
0 Add section Locally created and adopted faled inspectons by contractors
Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District
is added to read as follows:
108.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this
provision is to clarnify the procedures and timelines for an
109.4 Added section 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire
Code Official. Based on the County of E! Dorado's
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals
timeline.
Completed the section by filling in the blank Allows lhg Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that
. . protects life and property. Fees have been updated fo
portions that were not completed by the SFM. itis ! o
110.4 - N Locally adopted and amended malch the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the
befter eftto ocalites to determine the District Attorney’s Office. The change to the language to
fees/penalties for their respective areas. include the tem infractions.
110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2
Citations
The Fire Chief or hisfher duly authorized representative (s),
Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor
1042 bul under a different number) Locally created and adopled violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the
Health and Safety Code of the State of California and
Chapter 5¢ (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Califomia.
Completed the section by filling in the blank
portions that were niot completed by the SFM. Itis All violations of the code have been consolidated under
124 better lef to locaiiies Lo determine the Locally adopled and amended e s on 110.4 to include the penalties for vioiaions.
fess/penalties for their respective areas.
Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District,
" . Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd
202 Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopted Manager. Defiriion of campfire shall not include LPG or
Propane fueled appliances.
302.1 Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for clarity
307.4.4 through Due to the high fire danger that exists in Ef Dorado County
30'7 4 N 20(:? Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopted wa have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas.

20-0203 G Page 22 of 40



324

Changed veﬂscal dearanees to 15 feet and road
S wndths to 20 feet .

" Locally adopted and amended

Fire apparatus are becoming farger and taller. A vertical
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus
components. It also allows an extended time frame before
having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional
height for vegelation clearances acts as an maeased buffer
for the spread of fira. A foad width of 20 feet exdclusive of
shoulders; as meastired face of curb to face of curb is.
needed These shudures can be difficilt to nawgate with
fire apparatus and should not be counted |n the tolal» ; :
dnvable road surfaoe R

503.2.5

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the
Fire Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations to
match as they require tumarounds for fire apparatus

laccess roads and driveways.

Locally adopted and amended

Fire apparatus require areas for tuming around when
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This
includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides
better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum
around for apparalus in driveways greater than 150'.

§03.2.6

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated
Surfaces to state and match &I Dorado County
Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17.

Locally adopted and amended

Alfows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated
Surfaces of Ef Dorado County and Appendix D of the
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be
consistent throughout county agendies and is allowed as an
altemate means & methods that is nol less restrictive than
the Fire Code.

§034.2

Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes

Locally created and adopted

This section cleary defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes”
rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicle Code.

50343

Added section regarding no parking in front of
hydrants

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire
hydrants” rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle
Code.

503.4.4

Added section regarding fire lanes based on road
width

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D
as the reference for road lane width and their refation to fire
lanes.

503.5.3

Crealed and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain
emergency access and consistency through all
roadway gates in El Dorado County, referring to the
gate standards adopted by the FPO's.

Locally created and adopted

Allows fire districts the authority to approve gales on
roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing
the best possible emergency access to maintain fast
response times.

505.1

Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of
buitdings

Locally adopted and amended

Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing
based on the District's addressing slandards.

5§07.5.1

Added more conservative standard for the
placement of hydrant and their refationship to
commercial buildings

Locally adopled and amended

Commerdial properties are required to instal hydrants at
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150
{feet from any given hydrant at anytime (haif the distance in
between).

509.3

Added verbiage to bring all of the necessary fire
controts for a building to one localion.

Locally created and adopted

Buildings are getting more sizable in the county. {tis more
common to have new buildings with solar arrays that
continue to generate power even when the buildings
general utilities have been shut ofl, When there is an
emergency, it is vital thal we have rapid access to all of the
controls in one location for public evacuation and firefighter
safety. Due to the fire danger present in El Dorado County
throughout most of the year, this change is appropriate and
advisable.

in new buildings and structures 3,600
grgatet wlthl_n the d_ssmcL S

Addsaremnrementforspnnldersystamnstallahon S R B,
* Locally adopled and amended

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of EY Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response fimes; along with the fact that fires
double in size each very minits, we require spnnlders

to bé installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feetm slzeasmey toﬁrebehaworandra{eof

20-0203 G Page 23 of 40



" 9032

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they
add more than 30% or 1 OOOsquamfeettothe
strudure. whldlevensless o

" Locally created and adopted

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of E! Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet n s»ze as mey relate to fire behavuor and rate of

ated and adopted .

Due to the topographw, dsmahc. and geographnc comihons

| 903.2.1,903.23,
903.24,903.27

Thesa secbons were ereated to glve speaﬁc
diréction on the sprinkler requirements based on
occiupancy and square footage. = - -

' Locally adopled and aiended

increased mpmse times, along with the fact that ﬁres
double in size each and every ‘minite, we require sprinklers
6 ba installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as mey relate to fire behavuor and rate of
spread. Co o .

903.2.8.2

This section was created to include manufactured
residential single family R-3 in the residential
sprinkler program

Locally created and adopled

Manufactured Homes — The intent of this code section is to
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption
due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk
successfully in many California communities.

903.2.9,903.2.10

These sections were created to give specific
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on
occupancy and square footage

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minule, we require sprinklers
to be inslalled in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of

spread.

907.2.a

Added occupant protection for fire alanms in
buildings with a fioor area less than 3,600, except
R3, AG buildings not used for commercial
purposes, and buildings with a floor aréa of less
than 500 square feetas approved by the fire code
official. -

Locally created and adopted

Provides proper emergericy notification for occupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fwe Department notification in
lhe eventofa ﬁre or smoke

907.2.b

Added 'dddapanl' protecion for existing buﬂdmgs
without automatic sprinkler systems to install a fire

Locally created and édopted

* [Providés proper emergancy natficaton fof cocupandis that

upon acivation and is installed per Seabon %7 of |

|atam if they add more than 30% or 1,000 square :‘":ﬂex‘!:':; US; :r:r! ;nnzres Fire Department notification in
foot o the srucurs, whichever s ss. F a e
Addedocwpantprotechonbystahngallﬁreaiann ) FI
S deleehonsystemsmstaﬂedshanbecqnneded toa| - . L o Provides proper emergeicy notification for occupandies that
907.2¢ momtonng senvice that notifies the fire department || Locally created and adopted

allow public use and ensures F ire Depamnent nobﬁcahon in
Meevenlofaﬁreorsmoke -

system when mstalled or replaced e

ol g
lthe eventof a ﬁre or smoke

20-0203 G Page 24 of 40



explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of
Supesvisors for fireworks.

' Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG3E
7.6.2.1 N
% Modification Locally created and adopted safely related power outages.
S . This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to
1203.1.3 Shun( trip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off dunng the use of back-up
‘ ) : . power supplies
coen o Addesmngforconstrudnonsﬂemsnmpoﬂanﬂoas&sl
< 33103 Address ulremem foroonsuucbon sutes Locally created and od ‘
ol ™ _ Ccally created and adoptod | oponding emergency crows. . ..
TR AR Watefsuppfmatoonstmwmsutesmm e Wl ustbeonsntepnortoeommsbblsmatmalbemg
7.8 ) 1 i combustible materials on-site. - :L@'y a“?""’ and amendeq stored or vertical constriiction commending.” :
El Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout
This section was created to include Fire Protection the county. Ali projects will be required to submit a Fire
03.
49031 Plan for all fire hazard severity zones. Locally created and adopted Protection Pian due to climatic, geological, and
topographical conditions.
This seclion darifies thal within the boundaries of £l Dorado
. . ! County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are
4905.4 x?fe;:nfm to larify roof construction Locally created and adopted wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly.
Any damages or costs from negligent practices that :-fi?hzar.do!: mta_teria!ss;zlabted imlz'idents :‘: o:)s:yb:::::wgsate.
5001.7 cause a hazardous malerials incident will cause a Locally created and adopted & incident s caused by negigence due o
|process or practice the actual cost will be passed on {o the
cost recovery fee. . .
negligent parties.
:ms;f:t;izoéﬁ: nzng'h:.f";;“;::;m |ss;1$:r Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and
5601.2 Locally adopted and amended  {fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding

of the applications they will be used for.

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make
available all requested documentation pertaining to
the firework presentation

Locally created and adopted

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any
documentation including timing and proprietary information
that pertains lo any aspect of a fireworks display that they
deem necessary. This information is understood to be
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as
such.

5704.2.9.6.1

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class Il combustibls fiquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a
Special/Conditional Use Pemmit from the County.

5706.2.4.4

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

" Locally adopled and amended

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class il combustible liquid special
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval
and a Speaal/Condltlonal Use Pefmvt from me County

58062

Admlmstra!rve addmon of Dls!nct name }
Established lmuts as set forth in Ihe Fure Code

" Locally adopted and amended

Administrative need to add District name, Established fimits
a5 reqmred by the Fi¥e Code Official fof Flammd:la
Cryogenic ﬂunds in'e ﬁbnafy containers. Reqmres AHJ
approval anda Speual/Condmonal Usa Petmnt 1rom the -

- 5806.2.1

Eslabished fimits as set forth in the Fire Code

" SFM adopted and amended locally

requn'ed by the Fre Code Oﬁaal for
Flammable Cryogemc fluids in stebonary containers.
Requires AHJ approval and a SpeaaI/CondmonaI Use
Permit from the Counly .

* Locally adopled and amended

20-0203 G Page 25 of 40



U Bi12.1

Estabiishes propane regulator requirements for
locations above 5000 foot elevation

’ Locally created and adapted

Establishes proparie regulator requirement for locations
above 5000 foot elevation. Including requirements for two-
stage regufator use and location of first and second stage
reguiators, Additional requirements are outfined for
protective covers; riser pipe instaflation requirements, -
building permit submittal and review, tank center-lirie
marking, and grade réquiréments. These requirements are
based on srgnrﬁcant fire history in heavy snow and extréme.
wealher condmons encounlered above 5000 feet oo

: :..' Establrshm propane verhcal riser prpe requrrernenls '_'_

above 5000 foot elevahon '

Lomltyereated and adopted.

Estabhsha vertcal propane fise requrrements for lomhons

above 5000 foot etevation, Prpe schedule location, swing:
“joint requrrements and the use of ﬁexlble niser pipmg as’

oondmons encountered abova 5000 feet

6123

Establisha propane madung and Iowbon
requrrements above 5000 foot efevation’

“Locally created and adopted

Establishés marking ahd focation reiqunrér'ne‘nbs for locations
above 5000 foot elevation. This section addresses signage
location, eniergency contact information, and‘snow refated
fank marking requirements. These requirements are based
on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme
weaher conditions encountered above 5000 feet.

61131

Permits and plans shall be submitted and approved |- -

by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction).

Locally created and adopied

Pennrttmg and Plan submuttal reqmramenbs for underground
{tanks:

Allows us to requrra plans be submmed for review pnor to
instaliations of underground LPG {anks, Undergrourid tanks
require substantial maintenance including inspection and .
anode replacement at regular intervals.

6113.2

Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the

{property of the LPG company

Locally created and adopled

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when
|sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground
tanks where corosion and leaks are more easily detected.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16

NFPA 13D-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the
District has been amended to update various
provisions pertaining to the instatlation of sprinkier
systems in one-and two-family dwelfings

SFM Adopted and amended locally

Amended fo include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on-
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water fiow
alamm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in the
event of water activation in a vacant structure, and
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 13D
sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water
damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements
were also added to ensure waler dirculation through the
system, reducing stagnant water and backflow concems
(EID encourages this type of system).

Chapler 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section 4.7

Correction of a system quality issue

SFM Adopted and amended locally

Amends the current code set to include the addition of a
passive purge system to keep the water in the sprinkler
piping system from being stagnant.

Chapler 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section.
51.1.2

To aliow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler
system minimizing damage

SFM adopted and amended locally

A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system
must be available on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet

Chapler 80, NFPA,

An audible afarm system is added to notify occupants and

EDCforyears

130-16 Section 7.6 Addition of an audible atarm upon System activation| SFM adopted and amended locally  {in the activation of the system when the building is not
' occupied alow for detection minimizing damage.
Chapter 80, NFPA, . .
e . A pressure test is adopled to minimize system leaks and
1301-:6281e$hon System test fo a pressure of 150 p.5.i. SFM adopted and amended locally failures and assures proper gluing of system components.
" foiandix B: Table Changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM, below 5000foot | . . - = . Allows us to fatch what developers and residents are used
o BM0S 1'(1)- elovation, to match ﬁre ﬂow prewdents used m Locally adopted end q'mended- foin regards to GPM fire flow requrrernen(s that have been

usedforoveradeeademEDc

20-0203 G Page 26 of 40




Appendix B: Table
» B105.2

Established a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM,
below 5000 foot elevation, for all commercial
projects

Locally adopted and amended

Allows us to match what deveiopers and residents are used
lo in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been
used for over a decade in EDC.

Appendix D: D103.1

Made an exception for residential driveways

Locally adopted and amended

Itis unreasonable to require a residential driveway lo
construct a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant.

 Appendix D: D103.2 | 1

State iaw requlrés no grester than 16% grade

‘Locally adopted and amended

Title 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways.
In our El Dofado County Title 14 adoption we allow greater
man 16% grade wvth AHJ approval and hard surface

Appendix D: D103.3

Text to include curbs and gutters

Locally adopted and amended

20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutters due
to potential access issues and tuming radius concems.

1

Appendix D: D1035§) -

Firé apparatus access oad gates. -

" Locally adopted and amended

Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided
roadway the gate width shall not be less than 15 feet dus to
radius issues. .

Appendix D: D103.6.1

Roads widths 20 to 29 feet

Locally adopted and amended

No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does
not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire
Cade Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all other elevations.

Appendix D: D103.6.2

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36
feet in width

Locally adopted and amended

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of
elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations.

Appendix B: D104.2
Exception

Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered
building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to

have only one approved fire apparatus access road.

Locally adopted and amended

For the safety of the communilies we live in, two ways of
ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
residents and first responders.

Appendix D; D104.4

Added to require circumferential fire apparalus
access roads

Locally created and adopted

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus
access road shall be constructed lo encompass the entire
structure and shall provide a continuous means of

test

emergency vehicle access.
Appendix D: D106.1 For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
Ex M ' Removed Exception in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingresslegress are required to ensure the safety of the
coption ,
residents and first responders.
Appendix D; D107.1 For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
Ex " ' Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
ception . d
residents and first responders.
Adopted with no Amendments
101.2 through 101.5 m‘:" to estabiish scope, intenl, severabillty and Locally adopted Administrative larty
102.6 through 102.8 Referenees.’ Subjects not reguratédbyme code Locally Adopted Administrative claxity
10210 through 102.12 Confcing "'_m'“_‘s Other Laws, Application of Locally Adopted Administative dlarty
Deﬁmhon of the Fire Pvevenhon Dmslon and abcmy - TR O N
‘ to enforce lhe code’ e : Lomlly Adopted Administrative danty_ o
1_04}3 lﬁ‘rtmgh 104.4 Right of Entry, Warrants, and Identification Locally Adopted Administrative darity
'10'4..5 through 104.6.4 | - Record retention L Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
1048 toigh 10492 |- N M“‘ﬁ“"“‘s' *’"m“’ means "“" '“""""’s_“"" Locall Adopted Administatve carity

104.11 Ihrwgh »

anmsb‘abvedamy -

20-0203 G Page 27 of 40



1056.12

105635 .

gﬁreand hfesafetyinspechons_ C

Dry cleaning operational permits required for - .
N hmrdws dleaning solvent use. _ Locally Adgpted o Administrative dlarity
: i ) Permits for various business operations for. Magnesium,
105 69 98t C e miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation
105.6.2.28 through N Adopted this seoﬂon for admmustrahve daﬁfyand |-°¢8"_¥_ Adopted . |vetiis, motorfuekispensing facies, open buming.

opea ﬂames and torches, open ﬂames and mndles and

" |fire and lfe safety mspecﬂons

Adopted thts section for admmlstrahve clanty and

308.1.3 -

N e and lifesafetyinspecﬁons Permit fqrtife-c‘_ebu ding p P'a.ﬂfs Lo
" N Adopted this secuon for admnmst:ahve danty and Locall : Adopted B _ Pormit for wood produds stomge (ehtps, hogged material,
L [reandile safty inspections. caynopee. imber or pywood, i excass of 200 cubic oef)
f g Adoptedmlssewonforadmnms!rauvedantyand' PRI S ;
1061 throggﬁ 106.3 N fire and fife safety i N Locally Adopled _» . F_ee sdledules forpermﬂs o
PO Adop(ed this section foradmmosbabve danty and . ‘ ' L
AR N lﬁre ad bl samy ins e Locally Adopted Inspection authority .. .

5 S . . antenancaofsafeguards testmg and operation of
ST R PO oquipment, re-inspéction and testing, recordkesping,
108.1 through 109.3 N Qm?ﬁ:s“?;ﬂsmd;‘n;mghbve ‘anly and Locally Adopted. " - supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding,
SR - : o Board of Appeals astabhshed llmnabmsmaun\omy and

qualifications -
110 3 2 mmugh N Adop(ed this secbon for admlmstrahve dmty and 'L ocally Wl od Compliance with onders a_hd noti'ce's, prosecution of
1034 * |fre‘and life safely inspections’ | - . LA violations, and unauthorized tampering

Adopted this section for administrative danty and N
110.4.1 N fire and ife safety inspections Locally Adopted Abatement of wo!ahon
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and . : ) -
1134 N fire and fife safety inspecions Locally Adopted Authority to disconnect service ulifities
] Asphalt kettles contain highly flammable substances and

303.1 through 303.9 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and

topographical)

Managing ignition sources mrough.mponsible appfication
305.1 through 305.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted of standards will reduce the number of fires in various
s L R : o ST seﬂmgs(Climabc geologwal andtopographml)

_ : o o Mohonp:euureprqecbonmomsandﬁlmareHlGHLY
306.1 through 306.2 N Adopted this section for firg and kfe safety. Locally AdOpte¢' . flammable and reqiie special handlmg (Clmahc
SR P S e qeological; andtopographml)
e S TR AT Openbummg. v jorial fire, andpoﬂablewtdoor
30” :mr‘q.:‘gh 3075 R N o Adomed mlsmﬂm for ﬁr_e and fo fety ﬁreplaces (Chmauc geologlcal and topograpmca!) . '-'_ T
W81 - N [Adopted this sectin for fire and lfe safely 'Locany Adipted Opn e 9°"°"" '3"““““""“ (C"""““ 9°°'°9"”' and
A s ot sy - lopographical)

308.1.2 through N Adopt od this sect:on ior fre and lafe safety - | fopted: Throvnng o placmg of ignition souices, torches for

removing paint (Cllmatlc, geologiml and topographlcal)

" [Adopie tis sec

"20-0203 G Page 28 of 40



Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices,

3083 through 30841 N Ad&ﬁmmtssecuonforﬁreandmesafeay Locally Adopted - theatrical perfrmances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2

PO - dormitoris (Climatic, gedogical and topographical)
General requirements re{atmg to smokmg (C!lmabc.
301 N Adopt _ ____ ed this secton for fire and fe salely | Locally Adopted geological, and topographical) )
N o T o A iandod. .+ |"No Smoking™ stgns(Chmauc.gedoglcaland

HS AR Adopto ths scion for e v e sy Localy Adopled. - Joporapica)

RN e TP I T T Removalofs:gnsprohabﬂed comphance‘vnm'NoSmokmg

310.4 through 310.8 Adopted this section for fire and ifasafety . - | .~ Locally Adopted. " ls

311.1 thiough 3114,

Adopted tis section for fre'and ife safety -

Loy Aped

of combusubles,

Vacant| premcses condition and’ safety requtrements

Abandoned prem»sqs tenanl spaws safeguandmg vacant

reroval of hazardous matenals (Climatic,
geologleal and topographml)

ot

N Adoptedthss sectlon forﬁre and lfe safety

" Locally Adopted

Geneml requurements relaung (o fnobile food preparation
vehndes (Clamauc geologml and topogmphmi)

282, -

Adopted this section for admmxstmhve danty and
fire and life safely inspections .

Locally Adopted

Permlls for mobile food preparahon vehldes (Clvmahc
geological; and topographucal)

319.3 tﬁrough
319.10.3

N |Adopted this section for fire and ife safely

Locally Adopted

Exhaust hood ﬁre protecﬁon fire protedlm for ooolung
eqmpment fireé extinguisher, appluance connection to fuel
supply pqpmg, cookirig oil storage containers, metaflic:.
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, , cooking oil
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting,
nomal vents, emergency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum
aggregate volume, protection of container, LP-gas container
constrction, profection of system piping, LP-gas alarms,
CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fue,
maximumn aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG
container construction, CNG containers supplying
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping,
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems.
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)

403.8.1 through
403.8.1.7 -

N [Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1
(residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and
fire safety plans. . .

403.10 through»
403 10 13

N Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancy
Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Ckmahc
geological, and topographical) - o

4_0,5,5

N Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted v

Emergency Planhing and record keeping (cumahc

4Lgeologml ‘and topographical) .

§10.3

Adopted this section for admlnustratlve clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)

807.5.2 through
807523 -

Adopted this section for administrative dlarity and
|fire and e safety inspections

Locally Adopted .

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a
maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in_
educational facifities (Chmatic, geologncal and
topographical)

903.2.1.5

Adopled this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5
{sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers)
(Climatic, geclogical, and topographical) greater than 1000
square feet. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

20-0203 G Page 29 of 40



Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings.
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time
. L g frames can be developed to come into compliance and the
Adopted this section in existing buildings for the S . . ]
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by
11032 Y :::tgn?’fef;eﬁghlers and ofher emergency Locally Adopled the fire code official, is acceplable. The rationale behind
’ this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury
or falality incidents communication is a key issue. This
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have
strong signal. (Climalic, geological, and topographical)
Appendix D: D101.1 N Adoptad this sechon for the safety ofthe pubhc, Locall A@ ed General requirerents for fire apparatus aceess roads.
through D102 1 . : ﬁreﬁghtets and other emergency responders. Y (A mdudmg {oads. (Climatic, gedogml and topogmphml)
S B Deéad end ﬁre apparatus accéss road requirements for a
. Mopted this secuon for the safe(y of !he pubhc, .
Appendix D D103.4 N ﬁrefighlets. an d o!her mwmw ders Locally Adoptgd tum around at 150 feet. (Clsmanc mologml and
S i . topographical)
o Adoptsd this section for the Safety of the pubic, : "No Parking, Fire Lane" signs requ'remenis (Climatic,
Appenix D: D103.6 N Ifrefighters, and other emergency responders. Locally Adopted gedlogica, and topographical)
mAppend‘m)gh )l; :)640;04.1 N Adopted thls section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopted Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus
(exdluding exception) » ﬁreﬁghters and other emergency responders. , Jaccess roads. (Climatic, gedw@, and topographical)
Apgén_d&b: D105.1 N Adopted this section for the safety of the pubic, Locaily Adéted Requirements for aerial fire apparats ccess roads
through D105.4 ' ﬁreﬁghters and other emergency responders. y Adopted, (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
mm:';?éﬁo;: 01 N MOPM ‘hls section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopted Fire apparatus access roads fof muliple-family residential
(excluding exceptions) firefighters, and other emergency responders. developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Appendix D: D107.1 One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be
(excludi e'x Iit‘:ns) N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopled {equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire
ng excep firefighters, and other emergency responders. y apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and
through D107.2 Al )
climatic conditions.
Appenix D: D108 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopted Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction

firefighters, and other emergency responders.

standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle.

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions.

20-0203 G Page 30 of 40



Garden Valley Fire Protection District

To Whom It May Concern,

For the Garden Valley Fire Protection District 2019 Fire Code Adoption, public notice was

achieved through posting our Notice of Intent in the following three locations:

- On the board located in front of Station 51 at 4860 Marshall Road,
- Packets were placed in the front office, and were available for the public to view.

- On the District’s website, detailing the location and time of the meeting where the adoption was

going to take place.

‘The District was forthcoming with the information of proposed changes and had it readily available
for review by the public at all times. Additionally, the District gave sufficient time for public comment

and viewing.

Sincerely,

(o

Clive Savacool
Fire Chief

20-0203 G Page 31 of 40



Attachment No. 2
Garden Valley Fire Protection District

Resolution No. 2019-07

20-0203 G Page 32 of 40



RESOLUTION 2019-07

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE GARDEN
VALLEY FIRL PROTECTION DISTRICT
ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS 10O THIL
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

A resolution for the Cianden & allex |y Podaxcinm Phisine setting forth ﬁndlngs with
respect to fucal conditions withun the bire Thstiicr which make certain modilications and
changes to the Calitornin | ire Code reasonable necessary for presorving fire and hife
salety in the Gurden Valley Fire Protection District

IBe Governing Bourd of the Gurden Valley [ire Proteciion District finds and resolves as
follows:

WHERFAS, lealh & Safcry Code Section [ 7958 5 perits u Fire Protection
Distnict 1o adopt an ordinance which changes or modifies the State Housing regulatuons
sdopied pursuant 1o Health & Satery Code Secrion 17922 upon determination that such
changes or modifications are pecessary duc to local conditions that pertan regulalions
governing condinions huzardous 1o lifc, property md the environment from fire.
explonon, hazardous matenals and harardous wes; and

WHERFAS, Health & Safery Code Section 17958 7 reyuires thut o Disinet's
Board of Mirectors making any changes or modifications pursuant o Health & Safety
Conde Section 17958.5 shall make express Ginding thay such changes or modificanons are
needed. und shall file a copy of such changes or modifications with the Depanment of
Housing and Comunmunity Deselopiment

WHEREAS, the umique fwal chimatic, geological. and topographical conditions
eximing within the boundanes ol the Diginct make it reasonably necessany for the District
1o imposs more sogent tequirements than el forth i the Califormia Fire Code und
pursuant 1o Califorme Health and Safery Code sechons 118697 and 17958.7. the Distna
desires t make express findings to that ¢lfon

NOW, THEREFORE, BF I'T RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the
(rarden Valley Fire Protection Distnct. atter bas ing duly noficed and beld public
nearings. heredy adopu the following findings concermng current unigise lucal conditions
that together make cach modibieanion 1o the Califorms | ine Code, reasomably necessan w
provide adequate and effective protection ol Ule, property and the environment more
specifically sct [orth as folluws:

20-0203 G Page 33 of 40



FINDINGS OF FACT
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BUILDING -
STANDARDS CODE (TITLE 24 PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL
CONDITIONS ,

General.

Atler due constocration. the Board of Directors of the Garaen Yalics P Peotevton
Distnict. hereby finds that due 1o lical climaic, gentogic und wpographic comdition ., i
stated within this dovument, there 15 i need to provide the rodifoations wd e
contained in the sdoptive Ordinance of the Calilomia Fire Code Soch changes are
dJeemed 10 be reasonably nevessiny o provide adeyuaie and e Teotive peotection of Wfe
property. and the covironment.

Ve Garden Vatley Fire Protection Dismnct provides fire proection, emerpgenoy niodl
services, and specialized rescue services to approximitely 7,508 people ina 66 wuar
mile arco. { he District 15 locawed op the Western shope o FI Dorade Counts The
opography of the District ranges from roliing hitls of grass. oub wocdland, large
wuaniitics of brush, and steep drainages. The weather conditiony vary leom friee siny
termperal s with SCcasionad 3a0W in Winfer. 10 sutier leinperaturcs dut regularfs
enceed HE Jeyprees

[he Distric can boe disrdad inde threc distnor ancas: Dacden Valiey, Lireenwixsd anil
Posdsey . These areas 1y preathy coptain smal groupimgs of cosidential des clopmienis und
ishied restdental dovelopmenta, with cormamerciul businusses spezad theoughout e
e Phose areas are chargctenstie of the wildiand-urhan interfacs criviroiaent.

Fhe Crarden Valles Fue Posection Uhstnct is ap “at-rish” agopey, The Distogy
pasticrpate s i saptieaested gutomgiie ad progsun 3nd s dispached thiough
dprecment e ahe Califormn Department of L orestny and Tire Prowechom i Cal-Fred at
Caoer §he resoutees o the Pisiret wod] reapond o0 and deab withe any vype of
croegenes Phe e Chere Protection T this docoment o broad and includes resgonses
o P ok, et edar o esteations, alaros, pu?"li( assint calls, hazardaus materals
medeniy, medical ad and specdissd resenes

[ e Eratosct fuas e 100t 1o stabled e staten and £ ansiatfed satelhive ire sutions o
POOYLEC amyrans syt b the commaunety, | ire Stanon ST s located in the

amnw orparated iown ! Garden Vadley nc 4860 Mashalt RA. Fire Station 53 1s Tocated in
the ummeorpuasted sown i Greegweed. o 350 Highaway 193 Fire Suation 52 s focated
W e unincarporatet lown ol Keisev at 926! Gevrgetown Rd. The District has 6 ful)-
time, carcer petwatnel siony with one part ime management position, one administralive
Sppor posibons, und these wee supplemented st voluntecr Chief Officers, Firelighters,
and ke Presention Oficers '

20-0203 G Page 34 of 40



Climatic.

The Gurden Valley Dire Pritection Distnict is locnad within a foothill region. 1he Disimct
i5 subjoct to o seasons. with an annual snow (all i ihe winter months of 2 ioches. in
addition 1 an wverape raintall of 29 inches per vear. These sdverw seatker conditinns
create sovers hazardous road condstiana and Toding ay wefl o rock shide tuzards along
the thain access mmds within as well as infa. The Distnet frum the surrounding areas. Due
(o periods of raielall, along with repeated mad closures, the shility of the Fire trotection
Distnet tw provide immwdine emergency response 5 often delayed | hesss same adverse
climatic comditions uitere result in a large number of vehicular secidents that place
Catreqmie reatrainty on ihe waailability of emergency response 10 perfoem cimergency
rescue, first and, hazaedous matetials control. and fire-fighting. The climatie conditions
often result v a substanual ar tual Lick of ability of the Fire Protection Distric o
respond s diately 1o aother iy pes o emergency situations that oceur. Examplen of thew
emeryency situations ww hade structure Nircs, wildtand and forest fires, Nexxdiny,
hazardous materials inctdents, emergency medical calls. vehicle accidents. ind verteal
rescues. The mutual sul agrsomenis established with adjoining fire agenvics might oot be
possible due o adverse chimaie conditions, restriciing of 1otlly hluacking ucemes i thy
Orsinct

Summary:

These locs: climatic conditions atfeqr the accelrinian, imtemiaity, and wize of firey y (rwe
Fire District. Limes of hitle oy nerainlafh, b humidity | and mgh icmpenitunes creae
cxtremety hazardows conditions . pushicuizrly oy they telute to the wilidland -urten
interface. Wangs eapoiicnond o this arce o have 3 significant impacl upon struciure
fires, eypeciahny o banddings in clode peaximiry 1o ane another. and o waildlaats
commonhy found in she Garden Valley Foe Prowcctian District, Structuees hudt within the
Garden Valley Fue Froiection {striar must be built with these vanahles snnind

Geological.

The Garden Valley Fire Protecnion Dostoet o losuied within moderate seismic Zune
Theee, The seisinic, geatogicsl canditivns present o potensial for multiple vires iragor
hecakage of water minns. multple clectecal power failures, mudtiple coflapsed structires
unid u targe numbser of calls for conergency roedical aid. ol of whiv may oceur
simultapeously during a seismic event. The swiator Jistrict has umereus water -plimping
svstems used tur {ire suppression winter dohivery. as well us water sorage tanks providing
water svstem presaare, Mostaf the pumping © geme are dependent on clectical power
tor operation. Such electnical poseer miay oot by isindable dunog o seismic evenl. Water
sworage fanbs used for siorage of requined 1ire supiwexsien water may also collapse in
suchan evemt forcing the addianal need s trampant water vis additeind pieces of fire
appar s which Wi Dooe 3 sipmficant restratny wa the bty of the Thsnet o provade
the teyuited vmenvency Crvices.

20-0203 G Page 35 of 40



D.

Summary:

Pocal geographic and geological teatures and processes exist within the boundaries of the
Disteicts that may hamper the abiline o the Garden Valley Tire Pre tection District to
pertorm ity sworn dates. Fire tollowing an earthquake has the potential ol causing
eredter Joss o tife and damaze than the eanthguah e iiselt

Topographical.

Fhe Districtis prinsarily composed ofateas that wre considered by the State o be high
fire hazard severity zones, Muach of the hill s located within toothill terran, covered with
Aighly cambustible vepctation, including the presence ot many coniterous forested areas,
The elevation within the DistricUranges from SO0 peet o over 2300 teet at the highest
point. Slope within the Districtranges from 0o 90 degrees. The structures withim the
areas of the foothills terrain have very limited fire sccess, due o narrow roadway s with
steep grades and poor road surlace condivons. The presences of many existing structures
within the high tire severity zone areas provides tor avers high potential ot structure
Are spreading mto o wildland or forest iire condition as well as the potential tfor a
wildland or torest tire spreading 1o structares

Summary:

The alignment ol cany ons. valley s, and Slopes e mhabited areas, combined with the
variable nature ofthe werraing yvicld porential torincreased tire sk, Mostsiructures, both
re~idential and commescial, are i or are sarrounded by areas that contain sigriticant
cris, brushy mined oak woedlond, and mixed coniier fuel load Due o drousht
condittons, beetle lestations, and Lach of vezetaton management. much of the area is
populated with either dead or dyving reess contrthuting o entremie tire darger,

Conclusion

tocal chimate, ceographic, and topogniphic conditions described abhove icrease the
feguency, intensity s and size ot fires involvine bullding s in the Fire Dhistmet. Further,
these conditions impaet poteniial damage o strackares from an earthygiake amd
subsequent fire, Fherelore, inis reasonably neeessary that the California Five Code be
moditied o mitizate the eitects o the above vondivons, Calitornia Health & Sarens Code
Scetion TTOSS7 reguires that meditications o the Tire Code he expresshy marked and
rdantitied as o which each linding reters to whech Code moditication. The ditached

Appendin A provides this connection

20-0203 G Page 36 of 40



[

INTRODUCED at i regulnr meeting of the Buiard ot Directors of the Garden Valicy
Fire Protectom District on October 12 24149

PASSED AND ADOPTED i u regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the
Gurden Valley Fire Protection District un Ovtober 229 2049 by the folfawing roll call

YOLE
AYES: ‘—k
NOES: ¢
ABSENT |\
ABSTAIN: CP
ATTEST.

/)
Wt

Lisa tloward, [oard Secretary

]
LY
[

BYy:

v' B
Ty ‘-,,;I B
Glle p Tl —
d Hawkous, Premdein

20-0203 G Page 37 of 40



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted | Adopted as Amended Finding
101.1 X |Admin
105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
106.6 X Admin
106.6.1 X Admin
106.7 X Admin
109.4 X Admin
110.4 X Admin
110.4.2 X Admin
112.4 X Admin
202 X Admin
302.1 X Admin
307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
509.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.b X CIimatic/GeoIogicaI/Togggraphical
903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
3310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5001.7 X Admin
5601.2 X Admin
5601.2.1 X Admin
5601.2.2 X Admin
5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 G Page 38 of 40




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section

Adopted

Adopted as Amended

Finding

6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

6113.1 X Admin
6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 4.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix B: Table B105.1(1) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix B: Table B105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.5§ 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

101.2 through 101.5

Admin

X
102.6 through 102.8 X Admin
102.10 through 102.12 X Admin
103.1 through 104.1 X Admin
104.3 through 104.4 X Admin
104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin
104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin
104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin
104.11.3 X Admin
105.2.3 X Admin
105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin
105.6.12 X Admin
105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin
' 105.6.37 X Admin
105.6.39 X Admin
105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin
105.6.48 X Admin
105.6.50 X Admin
106.1 through 106.3 X Admin
107.1 X Admin
108.1 through 109.3 X Admin
110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin
110.4.1 X Admin
113.1 X Admin

- 20-0203 G Page 39 of 40




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section

Adopted

Adopted as Amended

Finding

303.1 through 303.9

X

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

305.1 through 305.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

306.1 through 306.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

307.1 through 307.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.2 through 308.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.2 Admin
308.3 through 308.4.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.4 through 310.8 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
311.1 through 311.4 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
319.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical

319.2 Admin

319.3 through 319.10.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.10 through 403.10.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

405.5 Admin
510.3 Admin
807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1.5 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1103.2 Topographical
Appendix DD' 1%120:1 through Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.4

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.6

XKEIX] X XXX XXX XXX XXX | X]|X]|Xx

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.1 through

X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D104.3 {excluding exception) & Pograp
A dix D: D105.1th h .
ppendix roug X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D105.4
Appendix D: D106.1 through L . .
X Cl c/Geol | h
D106.3 (excluding exception) imatic/Geological/Topographical
dix D: D107.1 ludi
Appen o 10_ (excluding X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
exceptions)
Appendix D: D108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 G Page 40 of 40






