
RESOLUTION NO. 041-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF ELDORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 017-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is 
updated by the State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January I, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are 
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 
2, Chapter I, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety 
regulations to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building 
official, or his or her authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or 
his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the 
chief of the Lake Valley fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and 
maintain a memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities 
pertaining to the inspection of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on 12th of December 2019, the Board of Directors of the Lake Valley Fire 
Protection District adopted Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopted the 2019 California Fire 
Code with amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or 
topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El 
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District and 
delegates enforcement of the ordinance to the Lake Valley Fire Protection District Chief, or his 
or her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following 
sections: 

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 114.1, 114.2, 202, 302.1,307.1.1 
307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 
503.6, 503.6.1, 505.1, 505.1.1, 506.1.1, 506.1.3, 507.5.4.1, 507.5.7, 604.1.2, 901.4.7, 901.11, 
901.12, 901.13, 901. 14, 902, 903.1, 90 3.2 including (a) and (b ), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 
903.2.7, 903.2.8, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.4.4, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 
3310.3, 3312.1, 4905.4, 5001. 7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 
6102, 6104.2, 6112, 6112 (1) a,b,c,d,e,f, 6112 (2), 6112 (3), 6112 (4), 6112 (5), 6112 (6), 6112 
(7), 6112(8), 6112(9), 6112(10), 6112(11), 6112(12), 6113.1, 6113.2, 6114, 6115.1, 6115.2, 
Appendix D103.l through Dl03.3, Appendix Dl03.5 Section 1, Appendix Dl04.2, Appendix 
Dl04.3, Appendix D104.4, Appendix D 105. 1, Appendix D105.2. 

20-0203 I Page 1 of 50 



Resolution No. 041-2020 
Page 2 of 2 

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, 
Part 9, in its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International 
Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403 .2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403 .4, 
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403 .8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403 .11, 403.12, 
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405 .9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808, 
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9(adopting 1103 .9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, 
Chapter 25 , Chapter 26, the exceptions under D 104.2 (Exception), D 106.1 (Exception), 
D107. l (Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, 
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M . 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of 
said Board, held the _!_Q_ day of March , 20 20, by the following vote of said Board: 

Attest: 
Kim Dawson 
Clerk o he Board of Su 

'Ll/u;_ 

Ayes: Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin, Novasel 
Noes: None 
Absent: None 

20-0203 I Page 2 of 50 



~AKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

\l_1!;,1J ,•J'l!i.1~~·10, ... 
I .i:,,m, .·\lf,11 
lt,,h,·n ,1.:1h:11t.:, .. 1r1 
.l .. h11 H1.-
llri;u1 II, 1~:111 
1.i;.1r~ \ ln;,r.: 

I kccmbcr 1 8. 2019 

"Serving the Community Since 1947" 
Tim Alameda, Fire Chief 

I >on 1\shton. Chief !\dministrali VI! Onicer 
I :I Dorado Count~ nui.lrd or Supervisors 
~30 Fair Lam: 
i>lnccrville. CA 95667 

Subjcd: Resolution Rntif)·in~ Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Lnkl· Valk~· Fire Protection District, 
which 11doprs lhc 2019 Californin Fire Codl· with nmcndmcnts related lo local climatic, 
~cogratlhic :and topographic condition~. 

l>car Mr. Ashton: 

The Lake Valley Fire J>ro1cc1ion l>islric.:1 is rc4ucsling. lht:: Board or Supl!rvisors (BOS) ratify its 
Ordimmcc No. 20 I 9-0 I which adopls 1he ~019 Cali lilrnia Fire Code as a1ne1Hlcd due to spccilic lm:al 
climatic. g,:ographic anJ tnpogrnphic conditions. California I lcullh muJ Sal~·ly ('ode Sc1:1ion 13861).7 
requires 1hc lcgisla1ivc body ,11' lhe city or wunty when .. • 1hc ordinance will appl~ 10 rnlif'y. motlily or 
d,my the adopted ordinance. The BOS must also dekg.atc enforcement of 1he ordinance 1,1 either 1hc Fire 
District jor its repn.:scn1ativc) or the Chief lluilding OIT1dal. 

Thcrdi.wc. v..-c request 1hc ('oun1y Board or S11pe1"visors ra1ify Ordina111:c No. 2019-0 I wi1h amendments 
lo thl.' 2019 California Fire Cod1.·. and t.ldcgatl.' the cnforn:mcnl of that Ordinance lo the Lake Valky 
Fire Pru1c1:1ion l>is1ri1:1 Chief. ,\ proposed nos n:solu1io11 is enclosed l'or your n:vicw· mid use on this 
topic. 
This resolution lms no 1.Jircct li~al impact lo the Cou111y. 
Sinccrdy. 

,/ .. -,--:- J-.. r. /lA-A c_ I!./' 
J L/v\l\ ~ (/V n I,,.; r.-t_ 
Tim !\l;uncda 
Fire Chief 

i\Tl"!\CHMENTS: 
1. Lake Valley Fire Protection District Ordinance No. 2019-01 
2. Lake Valley Fire Protection District Finding of Fact Resolution No. 2019-08 
3. Draft El Dorado County BOS Resolution 

Hl"s1u·ct. lntcj!rily, l>t•dk:llion. l"ositin• Atlihtdl' :md Tl'11mwork 
~~ 11 1-,,l'l"lil"' "'i.t 'tu f ,,~,· I alHl\'. l ·., W,I ~ll • c '11ll "':°'· ~"'.' t"" • I ;i, ~7; ·; 7~•1 • ''"" f .1~r\·~11k, l·m.· 111~· 

20-0203 I Page 3 of 50 



Attachment No. 1 

LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTiqN DISTRICT, 

ORDINANCE NO. 2019-01 

20-0203 I Page 4 of 50 



• LAKE VALLE\' FIRF: PR0Tf.CTl01'' l>IStRICf 

ORDIN ANCF. NO. 2019.fH 

i\N URGENCY DROIN,-\l'KE FOR I HE LAKE V,\LLEY FIRE PROTCCTION DtSTRlC'T 
i\/v!F.N111N(i rHf FIRE CODE Of THI: DISTRICT J>ERTAINING TO THE AMENDMENT AND 
i\lJOPllON OF ·1 HF 201? EDITION OF TIIE CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE 

(TITLE 24. C.t\LIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATl()NS,. P,\HT 9(2019 C Al.If OR NIA rnu:. 
CODE) INCLUDING ,\PPENDICES B. C. D. H. I. N and 0. AND Rl.-:l'b\LING OIU)iNI\NCE 

NUMBER 2016-01. OF THE LAKE VALLEY fllH·'. l'ROT[CflON DISTRICI AND ALL 
OTHER OKDINANCF.S /\ND Pt\RTS OF THE ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT THERE\VITH. 

W!lERE,'\S. fire: J1t'Oh:(tion distri.:ts ilrc i:;.:111:ralty required to adopt 1he S1.1ti: Building Standards, . 

illld 

WI IEREAS. lit<! pro!c<"I irn1 distric:1s ,tr~' all()wcd to m;ikc :11i1c11dmc:nh to !hose s!utc st11111farJs when 
Justilicd by local l\ipngrnphic:il. clf1m11ic and \,\C<)~raphical condi1i1ms. and 

Wl 1uu:_t\S . .::ontempor:111.:ousl:, hcn:with 1h;: lh>ard ,,f l)m:..:1<1n has matte such fl11dinis aud 

dim.:tcd that they be submi!lcd lo Lhc Stat..- lunh" ith. 

NOW. Tl 11:Rl-.l'OR Ill IT ORIMIN!:D BY Tf II: I.AKI:. v'r\LLl:Y FIRl·. l'IWlLlTION 
DISTRICT. ,1\S THE GOVERNING OOARO OF Tl IF DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS 

.;;l!ctfon I: FINDINGS Of' FA Cl: 

"icc!in11 l: Al>OPTION (ff COl>t; Wll'II rXCLUSIONS: 

"cctio11 J: LOCAL AMENl>t\U:,,rrs: 

'lcr1ion 4:. ('0;'1 FLICT: 

So.!clion 6: EfH:CTIVE IMT[ AND f'l.lHUCATION 

20-0203 I Page 5 of 50 



SECTION I: flNDING$ OF FACT 
The Lake Valley Fire Protection Diftrict (LVFPD) makes certain change• (lilted 

below) to the California Fire Code., 2019 Edhion, pur1u1nt to Haith and S.r.ty Code Sechon.s 

13869.7. 179SS.7 Md 11941.S durinathisc:odeadopdon process. Suchchanaesareneceaa,y 

because of local climatic, geoloaical and/or topographic condkions. The LVFPD has adopted, 

pursuant 10 Sec«ion 11941.S of the California Heallh and Safocy Code. the findiftp of ficu ,-Jttivc 10 

these conditions by Resolution #1019-88 of the LVFPD dated Nove•~er 14, 2019. 

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 
The LVFPD adopts me 2019 C.lifomi• Fire Code. Title 24, Pal1 9, la la g&ilJCY. inctudina 

Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code. 2011 edition not adopced by 

the llate. Wilh the exclusions lisled below: 

Exclusions: IOS.6.17-lOS.6.19. 105.6J9, 3ot.L4, 309, 31 l.S. 311.6, 311. 403.1, 403.2.1-

403.l.4, 403.3, 403 .... 40).6, ,40). 7, 403.1 (adopting 403.1.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9. 403.10.2. 403.10.l, 

403.l I, 403.12, 404.1.-404.4, 40S. l-40S.4, 40S.6,.40S.9, 406. IOS-807 (adopting I07.S.2). IOl. 904.1. I, 

1101. l 103.1, 1103.J-llOl.6, 110).9 (adopting tlOJ.9, I). 1103.10, I l04- ll°', Chapter 25. Chapter 

16. theexceptiont _., 0104.2. D106.I, D101. I (I). Appendix E. Appendix F. Appendix 0. 

Append!• J, Appendix K, Appencfoc L. Appendix M. 

Appendices no1 ~ can be uted for reference in enfOR:ing odMlf sections of~ 2019 

California fire Code. 

SECTtON l! LOCAL AMINPMENJS 
The followint Sectiofts n hereby ammdec:I or addtd: 

Oapter I 

· ScctiN IOI Scope ud G....-.1 Recf•INtM•b 

lfl.1 Ddr shall be amended u follows: add name of juritdiction [I.Ake Valet Fln 

holtctiiN O.trktf 

· S.dN 115 ........ 

l95,U7 l,PG:cN shall be amended u follows: Add to lhe exception: At or above 5,000 

f..c or•v11ion., permit is no( required for Individual containers with a l2S-ptlon water 

eac-city or Seu. or muftipte container 1ysttm1 having an agrepte quantity not exceedina 

12S pllons Nf'Vi"tl O(CUpenciet In 8fOUP k•3. 

20-0203 I Page 6 of 50 



• Sttdo• 106 Fees 

116,6 Pn;•IL Plag Revifw pd laMtSIN fw sh.all be added • follows: A schedule 

of fees adopled by tht Fire Diurict Board ofDtrectors ro, Plan Review, Inspections and 

the issuance of Pormits by the Fire Discric1 may be found in tbe molt CWTON District foe 

schedule (Health and Safety Code I 79S I). 

116,6,I cm Bmnn ftSJ shall be llddod as r~tows: f~ sarvw:.: foes may be cfwJed 
10 any person, ftrm, corporation or business that through negligence. Yiotation of the law. 

or u a result of can,lessness. is responsible for the cause of the Fire District to respond to 

the scene of 1n incidenL A diSlrict board may charp a re. to cover the cost of IMIY ser,ice 

which the district provides ot the COil of enfotcina any rqulloon fbc- which the fee is 

charged. (Health end Safety Code I 3916). The fee shall not exceed lhe actual COit of 

IUf)lnflinl the flre and.'or responding: to the tceae of an incident. 

ltt,7 Adaig1radu ca shall be added u follows: When a 1e.1t or inspection is 

scheduled and I.flt contrac:IOr f'ail1 to peffonn to die atisflcuon oflbe authority t.ving 

juritdtcrion. the a..uiority havinajurisdicdon may bill tile conuador fbr acaal time spent 

trtv.llna 111> and from the lal/insptction location and lhe riffle ..... die test/inspect.ion 

,1111 u well u adminmratlve com. 

• S.Cdoa I It Vloladou 

110.1 YideMt• r,-,Mlf shall be alMftded • ro11ows: Penons who shalt violMe a 

provision oflhia codt or nfl rail to COfflf)fy wilh any ofdle requnmonts thfflor or who 

shalt enct., int1all, ahw, ,.,, « do wort in violation of Iha approved construction 

docunumu or directive of lhe flre codt official, or of a pennic or ~iricaM 1111d llnckr 

p,ovisioM of this code. lhllt be pHty oh mi:scltmeln(J; ot lnhcdon.11 lhe dllcretlon of 

CM proNcudnt attorney°' aaency, punithlbk by• nne noc uoeedin1 $100.00 for a fnt 

violation; 2. A RM not oxceedifta $500.00 for a second viowion oflhe 11mt pro"'ision 

within one yw-; l. Anne not O*eediftt SI000.00 tor uch adcU1ional violation ofdw 

same provnion within one ,..,.. o, by lmpritonm.fllt not exc.tina I IO days, or both such 

flM and imprisonment. Each day that a vloi.tion continua 1ftw M nociot hat *' 
-,'Yed lhalt be deemed•...,... om.na (H•kh end Safety Code Section I l 10 and 

t799S). 

3 

20-0203 I Page 7 of 50 



110.i4.2 Chaliops shall be added u follows: The Chief, Of his/her duly authorized 

representative, may issue <:itarions for infractions or misdemeanor ,;iolalions of this code 

pursuant to Section 13871 of the Health and Safety Code of the Seate of California and 

Chapter Sc ( commern:ing with Section 153.6) o fTitle 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the 

State of California. 

- Section 111 Stop Work Order 

l ll,:f. Faij1re 10 Co11pl,x shall be amended as follows: Any person who shall continue 

any work after having been served with a stop wor1c order, except such work as that person 

is directed to perform to mnove a ,;iolation oc unsafe condition, shall be liable 10 a fine of 

not less than one hundred ($100) dollars or more than one thou.sand ($1,000) dollars. 

(Heal1h & Safety Code Sections 1314S and 17995). 

Section 114 Rftervhq or Ri&hts 

l lf,1 Geunl, There is reserved. to the Board of Oim:iors of the District, the right to 
amend. modiry. supplement, revoke in whole, or in part, any of the provisions contained or 
incorporated herein, a11ny time and from time to time. 
t 14.l Umltallon o[ Bic,1. Nothing herein contained shall be deemed to limit or restrict the 
rights.. duties or obligations given, gRnted or opposed upon this District by tbe laws of the 
State of California now in effect or hereinafter adopted. 

Chapter 2 

Seetloa 282 General Definition, 

Add definition for Approved shall mean • as accep(ed by the Fire Chief of said District or 

!heir aulhoriied representative, Of' as approved punuant to the standards now existing or 

hereafter adopted by the Dislrict. 

Add definition for CampQre shall mean - a fire which is usod for cooking, personal 

wannth, liahting. or aesthetic purposes. This includes fires contained within ourdoor 

fireplaces and enclosed stoves wilh flues or chimneys, S10ves using jellied. liquid. solid. or 

gaseous fuels. portable beri>ecuc pits, bruien. or sptce heating devices which me used 
outside of an)' structure, mobile home, or any living accommodation mounted on a 

vehickt. 

Add definition for Corpon"99 or l)latricl CQMplfl shall mean • the attorney for the 

District. 

4 

20-0203 I Page 8 of 50 



Add doflnition ro, Dgtrjcc shall me1n • the Districl and aU odw weu within lhe exterior 

boundaries thereof u now or hereafter established. 

Add dofinkion for Qrtun, shall meu - a vehiculat ac.coss that Mne$ lt0 men than 

three dVw'llllina unira on a single pen:el, ad any number of acc:eaory buildinp. 

- Add definition for £ypti!f Body shall man - the bc)lnf or dil'1IC10t'S of lhe District 

• Add dofinitioft for DEi Clllt{ sflall mean • tho Chier Executive Ofrar of lht Fire 

Deperoncnc/Distric1 servina lhe jurisdicaion. or a duly authorized rep,uentatlvc. 

Add definition ror J1rildisdot shall man • a!I an,u within 1he District boundaries. 
Add deftnitiotl f'or P1091(•> shall man - 111 persons. firms. auocia&es, orpniutions. 
corpot1tions. tndividu.ls or other aaenc>'-
Add definition fc:,r 8111 lhall mean - mandatory . 
Add definition for Mu shall meaci. permissive. 

• Add dofmi1ion for Jn•td Crowd Mf PMtt shall mean • SWtdby personnel. usually • 

security guafd or usher penonnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit ~ 

from • tent or other place of pubf ic aaomblqc in an orderly and calm fashion in the evonc 

ofan cmcracncy. 

ChapterJ 

• Sectioa Jt1 Ddlllltlou 

- J02.l Pdl4dou shat! be emended u follows: Added Campfire definition u shown 

above in Chlpcer 1. 

. Secdoa 311 0,.. B•ntiaa. llecreadout Ftrw alld PertaWe O.tdoor Flrepl1ta1 

· m,1.1 fro'fbtld °"' a,c,w•, c,.,a ... h•Pm, forllbk Q•hl9tc flcta1aca. 
B,crydoyl flm •td c,.,n,, IMlckdtne lh1II be added U follows~ 

J07,1,I Open bumina. campfires. bonfires. portabk outdoor fireplaces and recradonal tim. 
shall be prohibt,ed when atmotphefk condhions « focal circumstances make auch fires 
hanrdous inc:ludina when. in the judpMnt or the Fire Chief or his desigaee. the menace of 
destrvclion by fir-. to life. improved prapttty, or natu,.I resoun:cs is. or is fOC"WCU to become, 
eximne due to critic.I f1te weedier, nre ~ fotee1 Nina hN\'ily cocnmitll.d to 

conuol fires alrady buminc. _.. dt)'IMII of the ~. or other t'acton thee may caute 

tht l'lpid sprad or fire sum u hip winds. k,w ""' mo--. ftns walher or Red Ft., 
Wamiqs. "°""' dnlt ol wildlMd flN. or ~ of Fin Reslrictions on land, ldjactnt to 

tt. District by the United S..... FOf'IIC Sentct or C. lfirt. 

Ex~ions: 

I . Pl"ltcribed bumina for die purpc)le or roductna the impact of wildland fire when 
authorind by the fire code official. 

s 

20-0203 I Page 9 of 50 



2. Gu (LPG. NO) Olifdool' n... pits and ~ peflec griUslsmokcrs. Excq,1 dclrin1 
Red Flaa condicioftl. Alt Opte Bumina. Campfires. Bonfires. Ponable Outdoor 
Fireplaces lftd Rect-cttional Fires ate prohibiMd c:lurifla Red Ftq W*1linp. 

}. Campfim and chercoel barbeques in a desipted campground ancf.lor picnic: 1ra 

loc.ted on Stale o( federal llndt. 

4. Ow-coaJ bubcques for• commercial mcaurant. catering operation or special event, 
with additional restrictions as permitted by the District. 

• 307 .4,4 C,apOrs RgtricdoU shall be added u follows: 

• 307.4.4.J It is unlaw(ul For any penon to llahl. mainllin. or use a campfire upon or near 

any brush-covered land, grass-covemi land. or l'omt-covered land during lhe time ~ 

burning pcnnits are suspended b)' the Director of the Department offon:stry, the 

CALFIRE Unit Chief. or che authority havinajvnsdietion. 

- 307.411,l When campfires are allowed. it should be IU'llawf'ul for IA)' pef'IOCI IO lilht. 

iMintain, or '* a campfire upon any bn&sh-coYored IMd. gran-c:oVfflld IMd,. or tor. 
covered land unlas lhe f'ollowina minimum roquiremena 1ft complied wicb. 

· J0?,4,1,2 (al The area within 5 feet of the periphery o(che campfire is cleared ohll 

flammable mllerial and veaec,uion 
. Jf7,c,y {b} One scrv1c:eal:>le shoflt with a handle of II leM 12 inchta is ready For 1111 11 

tho immediate area ofct.. umpfire. 

. lfl.1.U ($) ~res shalt be limited IO l 'x I' fool. unless In III apptoved manufactunsd 

cooldna device, Of fare tins. 
. lfltM.1 (d) Wriaen permission or the landowner must be obtained prior co the ianllion 

of die campfire 1111d shall be on sne. 

Chaptff 5 

. Stcdo• 50J fin Apparatus Acc:ea Roads: 

• 5QJ.l. l Ptewktu shall be amended a Follows: Fire appamus acces:t re.di lhall have 

an unobstrucwd widlh or not km than 20 feet. exchasiYO of lhoutders. curbl and auners.. 
except fbr approved seourlty ptes in ~ wid'I Section 503.6, and unobetrvct9d 

v..-tical clearance or not leu than IS feet. All driveways in the District shaJl not be lea 

than l2 fie« wide. 

• 50l.1.5 Rwt &w lhall be amended .. follows: o.d-erKI ,..,. ........ ec:cw "*' 
and driveways in excess of I SO reec in lenpa shaU be pto"ided with u app,ovtd 11111 for 

1umln1 around nre appencus. 

' 
20-0203 I Page 10 of 50 



503.l.6 Brhl&n and Elevated s,rraw shall bo amended as follows: Where a bridse or 

an elevated surface is part of a fire apparatus access road. the bridge shall be constructed 

and maintained in accordance with any current County Bridge Sfandatd. Bridps and 

elevated surfaces shall be des.ianed for a live load sufficient to CllfT)' the imposed loads of 

f1te appa,atus. Vehicle load limits 1hall be posted at both entrances to bridges when 

required by the fire code official. When: elevat.cd surfaces designed for emeraency vehicle 

use are adjacent to surf aces which are not designed for such use, approved barriers, 

approved sisns or both shall be installed and maintained when required by the fire code 

official. 

• 503,4.2 Nt Ptddu la Fla WIC• shall be added u follows: No person shall stop, park, 

or leave standing any vehicle, whether a.ctcnded or unattended, except when necessary to 

avoid confli~ with ocher tnff'tc or in compliance with the directions of a fire code official, 

peace off"tcer or offic1al 1raffic control device along the edgo of any highway, 11 any curb, 

or in any location in I publicly or privaloly owned or operated off-street parking facility, 

designaled as a frre lane by the fire department or fire district with jurildictioo over the 

area in which the place is located. The designa1ion shall be indicated (I) by a sign posted 

immediately adjacent to, and visible from. the designated place clearly stating ill letters 

not less 1han one indt in height that the place is a fire lane, (2) by outlining or peintins the 

place in red and, in contrasting color. marking the plla widl the words .. FIRE LANE'', 

which arc clearly visible from a vehicle. or (3) by a red curb or n,d peint on the edp of the 

roadway upon which is clearly marked the words .. FIRE LANE". 

513.4.J No ParklH NI fro•• of Hydrapll lhall be added IS follows: No Pffl(Jn shall 

stop, pM'k, or leave scanding any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydranl except u follows: 

(a) If the vehiele is attended by a lteensed driver who b teated in the front !eat and who 

can immediately move such vehicle in CIH of nocessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or 

operated by a fire depanmen1 and is clearly marked as a fire department vehicle. 

5QJ.4,4 Fig La111 hffd on Road Wkltb thaH be added II follows: Fire Lana shall bo 

baed on r'Old width u required in Applfldix Du ldopled locally. 

50J,' StHdh Galg, Add the fotlowina to Section 503.6 of the California FlN:1 Code: 

Private road gated enuance: 

t. O.te openinp to be 2' wider than the roadway served. 

2. Emergency vehicle accesa shall be provided by both a "Knox" over•ride switch and an 

lf)proved emergency radio frequency pte opening device (CtlcklEnter type) or other 

device approved by the authorily havinajurisdiction. 

7 

20-0203 I Page 11 of 50 



J. An IAJn)ved hammert.d. tum-around bulb or other means of sum-around shall be 

pn>vtded on the tfttl')' side of the pie. 

4. Ol&eS lhlll automaticaJly open from Iha interior without use oh special code °' 
de11ic:e. (hUpetic snip or prasure pad memblies are accepcable). 

5. All electric plN lhaJI •• in the opet\ position. i.e.. loss of power. bauery failu,-. All 

ltleS shall bt equipped, at a minimum.. with 12-hour beClery backup. 

6. Vertic:al cleannc::es lhall be no less dlln IS'. 

7. Gale thall be loaaed no dow lhM 30' &om the inlcnect.ing roadway ultimate ed&e or 
pavement. 

8. Provide a ..,.,_ penonnel pie or opening sized and surfaced IO allow tor 

pedestrian and aecossibility IICCeS$. 

9. Oato components shell be rnaiftlained in• openlli~ condtlion II all rimes and 

replaced or repaired when defoctivc. 

• SQJ.6,l SfcMdty DIM flt mHs!tiel ddunU shall be added u foUo-s: o.d 

residen1ial drivcrways shall hive a toy operaaed o'YWride switch iftMalled f'ot fire 

deputmcnl access. The switch shall be a Knox S)'1tem type key switdl wilb ·Fire 

Depanment .. decal. 

- SectJoa 505 Prealac ldeadfteadoa 

· 505.1 Add cw ldHdftgtipg shall have the fint line or dlis pa,q,aph ~ at 

follows: Addresses b new and exis1ina buildinp lhell comply with di. lor.al discrict 

address standard as approved by the ftre ccdl official. 

- 595,A,L INJ!Uedqll, Lggllgg IN YIIAbllJY of AtltllJIHI lhall be ldd.t • follows: 
I. All buitdinp shell htvt • permanently posted address, which thatl bl pllc4d at eadl 

driveway IIIICranCC Ind visible !tom both directiof\1 or tnvol •Iona tht rold. In all 
cues. me lddna nil be poatecl 11 d'8 bealnnina or consuucrion Ind shall be 
mainiained therwfter, and die addreu shall be visible and teai.blc f'tom the rolld on 
which the lddras Is located. 

2. Addnm aps afona OM-wt)' roads shalt bt vl1ibl. from bolh UM intended dtreccion or 
travel and die e>pposj• dincdon. 

). Where multiple lddrlllllOI are NqUired at a slnate driveway, they shall be mountod on a 
sinppoll 

4. Wt.a. a Nllldway p,ovW.1CC111 IOlely IIO 1 1inalo eommtt"Cial or lnduttrial business, the 
lddras sip ... , be placid Ill ........... 1n1 ... 1on providina acceta to lhal Ilia . 

• 

20-0203 I Page 12 of 50 



- Sectio• .506 Key Bous 

• 506.t.l Lodg shall be amended as follow,: Any structure which hu tccieaa conb'Olled 

by an electric pro shall hive I key operated ovemde switch ins&alled for fire department 

access. The 1wileh shall be I Knox System typo key switch widl Mflte DeplirlnMNrt'" 

decal. 

at,1,3 Kar btm for btplldlm m .. •1'91M!k •RdlNtr •Ylfltll shall be added u 
follows: Any building or complex of buildings. in which an automatic sprinkler System 

is installed, shall be provided with I Knox Boxe, mounu,d in an approved location. 

cocnaining appropriate keys for tire department ecceu. ihis teetion applies co all new 

Installations and Ol(isting installations. as requif1d by die Fite Chief. 

- SectlOI 5417 Fire ProteeHoa Waler S•pptia 

· 507.!,4.1 s.,,,. n•lfll shall be added IS follo~: No penon shall place. push or dump 

,now on or around any fin, hyd,anc or rsre depenmenr connection. and I minimum of fifteen 

(IS) foot elev apece shalt be maintained to the fi'ont aod sides of 1ftY hydrant or fire 

depamneru connection. 

• S,Cdpo 37.!, 7 - Pglk Prtus, bdtmNP ftpd rot le{[ll!ffl!!!!..,. S:.U,I 
"'"'"'"'· ... be added u follows: Thi Oltcrid hereby ldopU I public priVlle pe,tnenhip fuacl inf'tallnleture and capital 
improvementt {PlltMnhip Fund) to NC::eiw coalribulions of call or property quaji(ying 

under Internal Revenue Codi Sect.on l 70 at a charitab,C contribution if the contribution or 
aift it mede for axchisi\'efy public purpo:tes. Contributions to die Partnership Fund dlall be 

rnainlaiMd and ldffliniltenld u 1 ~ lnlllf fund subject IO inVeslment restrictions 
applicable IO the dmricl ln the inaaqeffifftl of its fund and ldminisrered to pcinntt 

expendiwres of KCtued principal and interesc 11\ef deductions of reasonable costs of 
ldtninistrltion. fell infrutructurt Md capital impn,vcment tiequisitions. Operations Ind 

m&tnlenuot.. including but not limited to mobile WUif' suppf)' apfletl&US such U fire boet(s). 

and/« w.. leflder(s). 

c ... , .... , 
s.dloa 6t4 - Electrical Eci•IP .. •C.. Wirf .. Hd Haaard1: 

· hsw fklJ .. Macha tNall bt ldded u follow1: Eme,pncy power 1ys1ems and 

scandby power IY1Wffll dlall be installed (n tcCOrdance with chis codie. NFPA 110 and NFPA 

111. All buildlnp with stand-by pow1ir lhall have t shunt trip device thal dilCOflfleets all 

power trMCet to dlt buildina. 1ppn,ved by the F'lte Code Of'ncial. EJ&i1tln1 lnsaaHatkms shall 

be maintained in accordance with lhe ori1inal approval. 

20-0203 I Page 13 of 50 



Cbpter9 

S«do• 901 - Geoenl: 

- !f l..t.7 Applqdo• fO N1w 114 l&Mflll S1ryc1u,:u stiall be added II rotlows: Tho 

Otstrict usumes no mponsibllity for inst1U11ion, maln1en1nce. operation or monitorin1 of 

die system the same being solely 1h11 oftlte ownw oflhe structwe. The provisions ofdds 

Chapter, and, or those requirements in the California Fite Code relatfn1 to automatic 

sprinkler systems shall apply to a SU\ICture. and tho entire structunt shell be mllCN to 

comply with these provisions, under any of the following circumstaftcot: 

I . When I building pennil is issued for a new structure, or a new stnlc:ture wher. no 

pennit is required unless plans wwe pN:viously app,oYOd by the Disrric:t prior to the 

elTective date of thb chapter, er any structure found IO have been c:oM&NCted after the 

effective date of this chapter, without a pcnnit when a permit would have been required~ 

or 

2. When there iJ • change in use in al~ or • portion. of an u:isting strucbJre which would 

cause occupanc:y clusific:ation to dwtp to I Group A. E.. H. I. R· 1. a.2; or 

J. When a buildtna pormi& it issued to allow additions '° be ma to an cmistang structure 

so u to: (I) inc:rouo lhe Total Firo A* of 1hct original srructuro grcalCI' than fifty porwnt 

( 50%) and (2) the ...,..... square foocap of the uisling building and the addilion 

exc:eedt the ...,.. t'ootap threshold in section 903.2 otlhe District Fire Code or 3600 

lqU&R feel f'or RJ occupMCiet includina atlachlld ...... 

- !91,1 l rtD AJaqu lltlkM shAII be addlict as follows: All valves con1r0Uin1 the water 

SU9Ply tor au1omadc 1prinlder l)'Sllllffll and __.now switches Oft 111 sprinkler syMems 

SMII be e~lly luplf'Viled. Valve supervision and water-flow 1ltrm and trouble 

sipail shall be distinctly ditr.enc anct shaff be automuically transmiaed lo an approved 

centnl tta1ion.. incfudina R-l occupancies when a 

sprinkler system of more thin 100 head& i.a inslllled. 

· ?91,U flA Altnu ......... llhlll be addld u f'oUows: All tire alann syscems inst1lled 

or maintatned in die Dillrict lhatl bis hmaHed and maintained In a"°1dance with the 

requirements ol thi• atticlll, 

t. All devices and tquiPffi*'t shall be COMtl'UCt4ld. inMUed and maintained in confonnity 

with Nalional Fitt Protection Aaociation Sllndard 7l for central station slpalina 

systems. AH lmOke detectors as required in the Califomia Bulldlna Code for residential 

10 

20-0203 I Page 14 of 50 



structures shall be imen:om,ec:1ed so u to ~nd an alarm throuahout the entire 1tn1eture 

should a single deteclot be activated. 

2. When a fire allnn ii rtquired, shop drawinp 11 required by NFPA 72 are required to be 

submmcd for review prior to installalion of NCh 1yuem1. 

3. All fire alann systems shall be supervised in a manner ac:C41ptabfo to the fire Chief. 

4. Upon rccommefld•ion of the Fire Chief, lhe Board of Dit'ffl0rl may adopt by 

resolution such additional rul• and reautationi relttina to the iMtaUation, maintenance, 

and 1.11e of fire alann systems u are consis&enc with aoocf p,actices. 

S. E'lef)' required fini alann system shall be maintained in tood worklna ordtr and shall 

be repaired and/or ~stored lo such within twenty-four (24) hours after ectivttion or 

failure. 

6. Any building or complex of buildings wil:tl an auromttic rn llarm aysaan thall be 

provided with a Knox Box.. mounted in an approved location, containing appropriate keys 

for firt department access.. This 9eCtion applies to all new installations and oxi1tina 

installations as required by the Finl Chief. 

911.lJ flo &AIOI Ytt49c Bn•ladgg shall be added as followt: Fire alarm 'tClr\dors 

shall comply with the f0Uowin1: 

I . Upon dem.lrld. Meil vendor shell provide the Fire Chief widt the .«ldteu of OKh 

bwlldina. pCac:e. or premises within the Distria for which the penninee sells or inss.11111 a 

ftl"I alln'n sysa.n. 

2. Each \'endor who ins11lls or servtceS a fire alum system shall clearly insflUCC the 

sublulber in panon, Ind in writing. in the proper use and operation of tho ffre alarm 

system, especially thotl recton which could caute f'alae 11arms. 

3. A w«ktot Mall times shall rnaintaen its equipment in aood state ofrepaw at no cost 10 

the Def*1mem. 
4. Any person. Rnn ot corpc)l'Mlon providing service under the authority of this article 

shall provide repair senic:e lO ics subscribers withtn twenty four (24) houn after 

noURcatiGn that thent is 1rouble with the fire 1lann system, or the system has 

malfunctioned. 

S. Each v.-dor shall display to the fire Chief, upon request, the pennittee's rec:ords or 

inspection and repelr of any n,. alarm aystem. 

6. Each vendor shall nodfy tht monitorln1 centtr when.vw • 1Ub.c~ fin, alarm 

system 11 under service or repair. 

11 

20-0203 I Page 15 of 50 



• Ml.14 N JIF ffl ,\lany shall be lddod u follows: Any fire aJ.-m ofwnich continuous 

ecrivation is deuinnined by die Fite Chief to be a Ruisuce alarm will subjecl the owner of 

such ftra tilffll to I OM hundred dollar (SI00.00) fine. 

hsUtt m DtO•ldtui The f'oUowina definitions. shall be added: 

v....., taaU fflCIII any bulifteu ~ by a,_.., rwm. or corporation who enpps in 
the activity of akrtin&, intlaifing. leasing. mailuining. repeiring. n:placina. sdling o, 

serticina fare alarm systcffiS. 

ADIHJY:!d shall mean ICCc:pled by lhe Fire Chief and in ICCOnfance with the requirements of 
Iha Undctwrilffl ~ Enc., the Facto(y Mucual Engineering Corporation, The 
National a-u of Standards. the NtttOMI Fire Procectioe Associatioa. or die Sc. rn 

Manhal. 

A191Udt AJ•on lhlll me111 an alarm 1ystem. wbich when actiVlled aeaeme, an IUdible 
~ on the premises. 
hAM Mam shall mean an alarm signal. either sileat or audible, prompting a respomc co be 
made by the Fire Depanment when an emecaecicy situalion for which !he alarm l)"Kenl was 

intended does not ea isl. 

En Alfm Sutt,g shall moan any manual or automa1ic nw of deeec:tina rn. and 
1ranamittin1 1llffllS of lire from private premiNS end ... II include alt 'YI* of inc.ior rue 
alums systems and auxil*)' fire alvm systems approved by the Discrict. 

Local fire Altal Sntw shall mean any fJnt alarm system desiped tolely so pnwide an 
alarm of fir,, wilhin the protected snmises. 

- Stl!ffljber shall mean • person who owns or leues property ot premites on which an alann 

syseem has been instaJled c:w is propo.ed to be iMllllod ot who COftll'ICU or pl'OpOIIS lo 

concract with an alarm business for the leasln1, Mrvicina, or maifttlintftl of Ill alann tysaem, 

and who has or will have the authority to cau• the 1lann s)'Mem to bt wviiced, ,...,.ired. or 
remtWed after the system is installed. 

12 

20-0203 I Page 16 of 50 



• Sectio• 903 Fir• Sprhaklen: 

913.1 No1:(teul1& shall be added as follows: All automatic rms sprinkler systems shalt 

be of the anti-freeze l)'pe or other approved non-m,ezina (includiq air ftlled) type of 

system. 

· IN+• Wyq BltMltecl shall be added u follows: Slaws of eiustma buildings~ 

than 3,600 squanr feet. In existing buildinp 3600 square feet or greater, olhet lhan one 

and 1wo-famlly dwelling units. and agricultural buildings not under Special Use Pennil for 

commercial purposes. where the floor an,a of die building or structuR is increased by an 

addition of more than rhiny pen:ern (30%) or 1,000 square feet whicheYer is less. such 

building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 903.2. 

ttJJ.b w,m 8M•ir:,d shall be added as folk>ws: s.u, of ~isting buildings less than 

3,600 squan, feet. In existing buildings ),600 tqUate feet or lea. 04'het than one-and two­

famil)' ctwellina units, and agriculturaJ buildin,a not under Special Use Permit for 

eommen:111 pwpo-. whffl thil floor.,. ofdle buildin1 or structure is increased to a 

icMal square foocage over l,600 1q1N1re feet. b:, an aictilion of more lhan thirty percent 

(lf:M) or 1,000 square r..c. whichever is lea, such building or SlnletUte shall be made co 

conf'onn to 5-lon 903.2. 

- N,1,1 Gc,11 A SMJt be tmended u follows for A lf'OUpl A-I throup A-4: 903.2.1.1 

( I ) The In .,. exceeds 3.600 squ.,. feet. 

· 5l.l.J Gr:up I shaJI be amended u follows: 903.l.) (I)~ all Oroup E fire 

.,... a,n.w rtwn 3,600 ,quan r., In.,.. 

- ftl,J.4 Gcup f•I lhlU be amMdld II follows: 903.2.4 Group F. 903.2.4 ( I) A Group f 

file .,.. OJCCCOd1 3,600 square -

· 903.1.7 Cmp M shall be IIMnded u ft>iiows: 90l.2.70n>up Band M. 903.2.7 (I) A 

Gf'OtlP 8 ud M n,-.,. exceeds 3,600 lqUlfl k 
. N,1,1 Gm• I_,, be amendld u follows: 903.2.8.1 shall haw the fotlowfna 

"8rbiaac tdded eo the end of Che .,.,......: Fire tprinklor l)'IMffl1 nll be inltalled in now 

manuf1etuted homes (HSC NCdons 18007 a 18009) and multiple family manufactured 

homes with two dwelling units (HSC IIOOl.7) in ICCOl'dlra with Tklt 2$ otdle 

California Code ofReplations. 

~ N,1,9 Gn11 S-1 •u be amended II follows: 903.2.9 Group S. 903.l.9 (I) A Group S 

rwe .,_ ~ 3.600 squans k 

u 

20-0203 I Page 17 of 50 



· HlJ,ll Gflll S-1 llldoled bdliN GttuM shall be amended IS follows: 903.2.10 

(I) When die Are .,. of the encloNd pericing prap exceeds 3,600 tqwue feet 

· 8M,1 8 f 1 *' '"'"MW shalt be ldded as follows: Alt residential occupanciet 

requa,e audible IIOl1r1CMion in all sleepina room, of• sprinkler w.ierilow alann. Thia 

notif'k«tion mull be It lellt 7Sdb et pilk>w height. 

• S.Cdoa M7 Fin At.r• Hd Der.cdoa Syatem,: 

• 907.l,1 Wb,a Bn!lrd - Nm IMUdlpq pr S1nc11rn lta •n MOO MM!!, ... 
shell be added u rollows: An approved fire alarm/detection system shall be installed in •II 

buildings with a floor are.a IHI than l.600 square feet. 

o Exceptions: 

• One- and two- rwnlly dwollinp (R-3 Occuptneies end other ~pancies 

clu.ailled u .. tr'). 

• Agricultunl buildinp not undw Special U• Permit flltd/or no« used for 

commorcial purpoecs <•·•· rc1aU1 ....._ food service, and/or special 

events). 

• Buildinp with• floor 11a las lban SOO 1quare ,- may be eicernpt. es 

detennmed by the Fire ChW. baled Olt buildiffa COftStnlction material end 

features. locarion. oc:eupancy type. 111d diance 10 uposures. 

- 907.lJp s,.,,. ,c ERdH ltM•a ahaU be added a rotk>ws: In OAistin1 buildings 

wilhout • IIJPl'Owd autometic sprinkler syaem. ocher rh&n OMoo or two-ramlly dwellina 

units. apiculturat building no1 Wider Spocial Ute pennit for commercial purpc,Ns where a 

fn alarm detedion syseem does no« uist lftd d'8 floor INI of the buildlna or strueture is 

iAcreaed or modified by more thin thirty percent (30%) or 1.000 mqun feet, whichever Is 

lat. such buildina or structure shall be mldit to conronn to S.Ccion 907 wtttn r.qulrwd by 

lhe Fu. O.ief. Buildings \IIAlh • floor.,.. i..a &hu SOO square reet may be exempt. u 

detfflnined by the Fire Chief, bued on buUdina conatniclion m1tori1l1 met tw1un11, 

tocalion. occus-ncy type, Ind distance to oxposum. 

· tfZJ.g M11Htdu shatl be added II follows; All fire alannlCM*tlon 1ystem1 lhall be 

connected directly through and monitONd by• U.L. approved centrtl, propriewy or 

remote mtion ~let. which atvos audibUJ and visual sipal111 a conacancly aaended 

localion. All sprinkt~ buildinat shall be monitored. 

14 

20-0203 I Page 18 of 50 



o Exceptions: 

• One- and rwo- family dweltings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies 

classified as .. U,. 

• Agricultural buildings not under Special Use Permit and/or not used for 

commercial purposes (e.g. retails sate.t. food sen,ice., and/or special 

events). 

!fZ.l,d Trpe I Hood lutallatkpq1 shall be added as follows: The roquirement of 

installation. or replacement. of a Type I Hood System shall require I fire alarm/sprinkler 

monitoring system to be installed. or for the hood syscem to bo connected to an existing 

fire alann/sprinkler monitoring system fOf that building. 

• 907.6,l,l Secoadary Pow,r Supply shall be added u follows: In accordance NFPA 72, 

the JeCOOda,y power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power capacity under 

quie!Ceflt load {system operating in I non-alarm condition) shall be amended to a 

minimum 72-hour power capacity. 

Exception: The existence of III emorgency backup power supply chit meets or exceeds 

the rcquirctneflts of California Fire Code Chapter 12. 

Chapter 12 

SecdoD 1203 Emerp1cy Hd Saaadby Power S,YIIHU 

1103,1,J lllltallattog lhall be amended u follows: Emorgency power systems U'ld 

sWldby power systams shall be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, 

the California Electric Code, NFPA 110 Ind NFPA I 11. All buildings, other thin one- and 

twc,.family dwelling units, and agricultural buildings not uted for commen:ial purposes, 

with stand-by power shalt have • shunt 1rip devi(:e lhat disconnects all power sources to 

the building. approved by the Fire Code' Offlci1I. Existing installations shall be 

mainlainod in acconilnce with the original approval. 

CbaptcrJJ 

- Sectloa "10 Acea, ror Flreflptla1 

~ Jllt,J tmnlff ldtadQSlllo• shall bo added as follows: Prior 1o and durina 

construction, an approved address sip shall be provided al each fire and emera,ency 

vehicle access n.t entry into tho project. 

15 

20-0203 I Page 19 of 50 



Sfftlon 3312 Water Supply For Fire Protection 

JJ12,l Wbep reqJired shalt be amended as follows: Required fire hydrants shall be 

installed and approved for continuous sef"lice prior to combustible materials arriving on 

sile or vertical constructloo commencing. 

Cllapter•9 

Sectlo111 4985 - Wlfdftre Protection Balldln1 Coaatnctioa 

imA lloo( Ctxtdll Ste•41nl shall be added u follows: All new construelion, 

including additions, requires a Class A roof covering or assembly. All re-roofing requires 

Cius A roof covering or assembly as a minimum. Re-roofing in excess of fifty (SO) 

percen1 or an exislins structure within any one-year period will necessitate ttw the entire 

roof bet a Class A roofcO\'ering or assembly u •minimum.Cius B or C fire retardant 

treated and/or non-treated wood shake or shingles are not approved u a roof coverine 

material for Class A assembly. 

Chapter50 

· Section 5801 General 

5001,7 Llablllty (or Dt••m shall be added as follows: Any damages ot cost resulting 

from the careless handling, ,pill or discharge ohny hu.ltdous materials shall constituent 

debt against any such person, fmn or corporation causin11 such spill or discharge. This 

debt is collectible by the fire chief in the •me manner u in the cue of an obligation under 

contr1e1, expressed or implied. 

Chapter 56 

S.ctlo1 5601 ee .. n, 

• 5601.l ft(1DH BS9uired shall be amended &S follows; Permits shall bo required IS set 

forth in Section I OS.6 and reautared In accon:tance with this secdon. Where eicplosives 

permits are required, they shall be issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her representative. and 

the County Sheriff's Department. Where fireworks ponnits J.N: required, they shall be 

issued by the Fire Chief and the County Board of Supervisors. 

5601.l.l D9S1•t1IIQR1 shall bo added II follows: The AHJ shall have the authority to 

request documentation regarding all aspects of the nreworks preten&ation. 

5601J,l Propdtlfa h(or111lloa shall be added u ronows: The AHJ will protect all 

proprietary information. 

16 

20-0203 I Page 20 of 50 



Ct.apter 57 

- Stcdon 51CM S1oraa1 

· 5704.l.9.6.l Loydo11 WIMq Altfn:Grtltd T11ly aq PntNMtt4 mil be amonded 

as follow,: Sto,qe of Cius I Md Clus II f1arnmebkt liquids in abcM ground ranks outside 

of buUdlflll it prohibited unless approved by the m chief. When permitted by the fire chief, 

all lbow .,,and tank(S) or vault inslallllions for the SfOr11t of Cius I, II or 111 flammable 

and combusdb6e liquids shill c:omply with dlOM requimnents u •• forth by the California 

Fire Code. Tho California Fite Code shall •ho ~y to installalions other thin motor vehicle 

ful4 di.tpontin1 SUtions wheft abotle around JlOft&O ts requltlld. 

• Seclloa 57H Special Operatloa1 

- 570f.l,:1,1 Los•ltou Wla•R Aboyt;Grogd I11b an tmNNN ahall be amended u 

rollows: S1oraae of Cius I and Cius II tltmmab .. liquids in lbow grocand tanks outSidc 

of buildinp I• prohibited unlesa appn>ved by the Fire Chief. When !*'fflined by the Fite 

Chief. all abow lfOUnd tank(s) or vault ~lations ror the saorqe of Cius I, II or Ill 

tltmmable and combustible liquids shall comply with those niquiremenu u set forth by 

the California Fn Code. The C.lifomia Fire Code shall also appt~ to instaltaions other 

cheft fflOIOI' vehicle fuel dispensiftl S(ations where above ground stora,e is required. 

c,apterS8 

. Secdoa 5'°' Plll•m•blt Cryopalc fl•idt 

· HOY Y•ltadou lhaU be amended as follows: Storap of nammable c,yopn~ nuids 

in stationary containers outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by mt RN chief. 

When pennittod by tho fin chief. all stMic>c\aty containers for the s10f8P of flammable 

cryogenic nuids shall compfy wilh thotc requinwnencs • • bth by the Caltfbmia Firw 

Code. The California fire Code thaH allo epfH)' liO installations odler lhlf'I motot vehicle 

fuel dispeasina stations wheN above pound sconae is requited. 

Claapter61 

· SU. f lR p,o.idop the foHowma dlftnitions shall i,. added: 
&MbMMte shall w a SIOftlll t.Mk dlaip.d for tho containment of liciu-Aed petRMeum 
ps. or metw wembfy rqulltina nltUral pa. re,, UN by a customer for residential. 

17 

20-0203 I Page 21 of 50 



commm:ial. or indldtria! purpoMt.. tofldle,' • ~ pipes. riMn. PUIM. Ind 
.... equipment. 

J..tSi Liql;efled pN10htum .... 

· hrMsr •11 w any p1n10n or~ which .. ita. • rewl. LPO. °' any com,-n)', 
wtlich suppl• Nib.di,.. f'or ,.... .... COfflffl«Cial or lndu.tlriat 11111. 

· N,,.._ l(lmta (INIJI oaJy apply IC> LIO inteallationt) lhatl w tit NrV~ IMII 
bo COMkilted lo be inllmlpCed whenevet s«vlce is discontinued becaate of hu.atdous 
condition, chanl' in sin or cypt of lfflllce. whtnclYer the Clftk. meter. reple.lor(s). val~ o, 

odw exa.riof MtVic« supply componenu "' removtd. repllced.. or "Plired. whclnever rhe 

servke it relocated., whenewr me building. IUk p4pin1 or eoc,lf)Olaenb n damqed to die 
utent thM the smri<:in1 utility. nn « building depann,cnt considers the tmta '° bt 
potenlially haurdous. Nonnal mlllina of 1n lfflpt)t or partially empty rant. met routine 

main1tn11nco or in1erior applianca, thall noc be e.onsideted • tin intenuption of service. 

• Sec1fon 61CM Louttoa or LP-GM Co•ta•n 

· ,,01.2 Mgl•t• Cu,clCX w:UNI , • .., ... I trtt shall be amended II follows: 

The llOf'III or liquefied p,1tt0leum pt in.._.. of an qgrep11 or 2.000-gallon waw 

capacily when located It 1eut one-half ( 1/2) milt from Pf'Clt*1Y 1DftOd or desipllted for 

ruidontlll '* and at last one-half ( 1/2) mU• hm u.istina residential devefopmcn1 wkh 

• denaity l,l'Mter than OM (I) d,wetllna unit por ten Ind III i.st OftCHl&lf ( 112) mile &om 

any hotill or mot_. ia allowed whtrl AHJ -.,p,oved Ind a Special/Conditional U• Permit is 

lawed by tht Councy. 

Oispemlnt wWtin-..blithed llmitt. Within tfMI fmtib established by law restrictins the 

ditpet'ffl)n of liq..-fted pt*rofeum ... tor the pl'Otection of heavil)' populated or congestod 

......_ lhe ...,.._ capectty or any one inMall•cion shall noc exceed I water C&l*i'Y of 

2.000 pitons.. TM di1penllna ot liqt.aefled petroleum ps in excess of an qgrep1e or 

2.00().pllon watllr capacll)' whtn located 

at.._ onc,.tudf ( 1/2) mile fh>m proper,y IOned o, desipted for raidentiaf \IN and at 

•• OM· half( 112) milt trom exittin, restdendal development with a dcnflfy purer 

dlan Oftll (I) dw.Hin1 lfflft per ICtl and M IOMi ont-hlllf(l/l) mite from eay bolet ormocef 

is allowed whN AHJ lppfOWd ud I S,.CiallConditional U• Permit ii i-...d by Che 

County. 

• Sactlott 61 n HJall ,..._ ... u. .. w ............ a. ...... ..._ (s.tM,... 

~-aM allove) nU be lld&tld • foUowl: 

Any new LPO installation ..U COMpty _.. .. I>~ 

11 

20-0203 I Page 22 of 50 



I. A pcrmil is ~uiftd by this Code for individual LPG containers or ll.S gallons or peater. 

,\t the time of 1pplicarion by any pmon for a permit to ins&all an LKi S}'1lem u requited 

by thb Code, the applicanl shall submit an LPG plot plan to the District for lpp'Oval and 

shaft conuain the following: 

1. Stamp of approval ofrbe prospective LPG supplia'. 

b. iank k>calion showing distances to structure and edge to ectaa of pavcma11 or odMlt' 

ldentit'yina ma,k. 

c. Tri capacity in US pitons. 

d. Location of riser pipe • building. 

e. Pf'Of*tY bowtdaries. 

r. An outline of 111 existift&'proposed bvildi"IS on the lot Md a depiction of the roof ridge 

line of any buildina to be supplied with l..PO. 

2. Two -. ......,.. sy1leffll thall be installed on all LPG installations irl ICCOrdllace with 

menu~ inttN:tions. All fim .. nplatOt"! and QOMOCliftl Ptlllib lhajl be 

iM&aHed ul'ldor a p,ctactive velve ~ °" IMk. AU~ ins&aUod undct lhis cover 

NII be fiNld tad ...,..o\ltld for tht.1 ute and position of fflOUftlin&, A OOlu*'Of providin1 

ffwbilil)' thall be uaed IO connect the fant ... repluof IO the maia service vtl'le on the 

tank. All copper pt111ib all be iftcerully tiftned ud 1111 CHlly forpd n.. nuts.. 

J. The riw tro. thl )'ltd pipins IMJI be a miflimum of Schedule IO and shall be locued not 

more dlan 3 inches horiJoncally m,m the walls oflhe l:lnk. Md swiaajoints wilt be ldOd 

above Ind below tallk leYel to provide fi:w tank fflOVtffllnt (SIIWC elbow, shall not be used). 

An approved flexible lhemllive is preftsned In lieu of riald 111111 pipe for tfte tlnlt .;. . This 

wit include but not be limited to plascic (PE), COPS* &ubifta. stai11leu Ktet. AU. 

Fl.£X1Bt..E MA TEJllAL USEO FOR. THE TANK llJSER SHALL BE SHEA THEO fN AN 

APnOVEO STE£t. COVER FOR PkOTECTlON. As swiqjoin11 a,w _.,mi'*9CI in 1n 

appoved fleaible al.,.llve. wffldtftl lllck mid« be matmalned ID 1Uow f'ot link 

~ ucllor upan:sion and concrtatOl'I of ahe ateem.tiw ffllhrial. Alt plutic: pipe shatt 

be buried M .... Ir below finished pade. Aft NClricatly COftfltNOUS conoslon miNMI 

b'IClf wire (Min. AWO 14)or cape shall be buried with the plulc pipe to l'tci1111te loca1lng. 

Oae end lhlll be btoi,pt iboft lf'04lnd IC die buildina w.11 or ri• lftd lht other end nll 

be bnJupt .... .,.,... ... ...... 

19 

20-0203 I Page 23 of 50 



4. TIit second Slip replator and riMr pipe shaft be instllllld on the pblc end of the building. 

u cto.e as pnierical to the building wat~ \N'lieu this i• not feua!Me dQe to structl.lf'tl ot 

copoaraphical <:OnJU'ainu. An appt'Oved pa shutolTvtlve,... f'or a minimum of l2S PSI 

shall be installed immediately priot to the second saaae regulator. An approvod pa shut off 

sign or odler identifier shall be installed dirocdy above die ps thut off vttw, on the 

buildin& in • visible location within three {)) feet of die eaves of the' roof or roof lint if no 

eaves are present. lf lhe second 5*age regulator or a combtftllion fnt/tcc:Ond l1qie replllOr 

is med a.t the lank. then an appro¥ed ps shua off valve shall be kDled II lhe buildina. 

.S. A protective cover shall be installed offl' the ICCOOd scaac replator and..,... (if in•lled) 

at the building. The minimum design ror lhc protective cow, shall be c,qual tQ., or a,eater 

lhln, lhe Building Design Load (determined by die building department). and shall be 

secunily supported to the around or diagonally to lhe building wall. When~ to me 

pound, the footing for the suppoftS shall be founded 6 inches below ftnimed grade. ~ 

concRte piers may be used in lin of poured fOOlings. flC'OVided they ant placed Oft stable 

soil. If second Stage rqulaton'mder memblies coukt be Sld!ject lo vehicle~ dNIIII 

minimum of 3• 1lNI crash post filled with COftC1* nH be inscaJled ror p,acection. Cmh 

poas sftall hive • minimum depth in 1he pound of24•, embedded in coneffle. 

6. Observation and inspection. if any, by die Oiscric:t st.II not comrituee III approval of the 

wort of inseallllion of the afotenNntioned protective c:owr, nor sllaU it be deemed to crate 

any llebilky or re,ponsibiliiy on lhe pen of the DiSlrict for Ille desitn or consrructlon of ahe 

p,olldiwe cove,, ncr IO any third pany or encicy whatsoever. 

7. The mer pipel for dM yt,d s>il>ffl& shall nae be embedded in coacn:tc. asphalt or other riatd 

substance. s.ch sutamnce pllCed around a ri• shlll ba held back u least J inches from all 

sides of the pipe.. AH e.itpoted oXllrior ps piping utlld for runs along walls or roofs shall be 

miaimum tc"-dwe IO st.I pis- suppo,lld MCI -..red by app,o~ SU'lpl at inteNals not to 

uc.1 row <•> r.c. 
I. LPG taak1 IMII bt pamanendy mttbd by a lqUlle ot ocher approvod equal scab of wood 

or odMW fflll.«iat wim I minimum dimen1Wlf'I ofl• X r or• cross ,ectional widlh of 2", 

nomtMl lllfflber. 

9. Such SIUCS sllatl be of 1ufficiellt htipl tori• above lho anticiplled snow depth, with the 

miftim,11ft hei&flt belna 10 r.. The snow-. lhall be yellow in color and wiU bt placed 

oa the OflflOIM side of ct. &ank fhxn the ritor, and dinictly oppo1i1e the tlftk valves. The top 

tweM mches of the ab shall be peinbMI onnae. The 16de of I.he stake adjacent to the tank 

thall COftflfflHI with die onnp co$or a minimum of II inches from dM top of the stake. 

20 

20-0203 I Page 24 of 50 



I 0. Installation and m1inten1ne1t ofall tank stakes shall be thlt responsibility or the LPG 

supplier. No rank shall be ftlltd ot serviced unless lllbd u provided in this chapter. 

11. Any supplier supptyi.ag propane to a tank must atTix a label or other means of identirk:ltion 

to die iftside of die sank vtlve protective cover. The llbel or olher dfwiee mu11 be watetproof 

and conlain the supplior's rwne Md tme'lfllCY telephone number. 

12. All LPG ranks shaft be placed on approved concrete supporu. Aoceptable 1ank supports 

shall include, but not be limimd to: Pre~ reinforced concrete pads. reinfon:ed concrete 

slab. or pre-«St reinf'of'ced concrete saddles. UN of un-reinforced c,l'ldet building blocks is 

speciricaUy prohibited. If saddles are used they shill C<lfdllC:1 a minimum of l to degrees or 
the tank ci«:umference. Asphalt impregnated fel1 of not leu than 3/8• thickness ahaU be 

installed between the container and the c:oncffle saddle. Suppocts may by poured in place in 

Ueu of prefabricaced supports. If poured in ptlc:,e it shall be • minimum of 4 inches thidt and 

reinfofced wich not less than WWF 6X 12, W 16 by WM or 413 reber in each direction. In 

uas wtaere tank may be subject to shift.inc snow, unstable pound or odw hazardous 

condition. the Fire Chief may requn additional tank supportine. lDCUrinaorprocection. 

• S.Ctloa 61 Jl 011dersrHad LPG Taeb lucallado• aad OwNntalp shatl be added u 

follows: 

· 6113111 Pfnljg IM PfAII: Pfflnits shall be requi,-d. 11\d plant shill be submitted for 111 

underp,und &allk insullarions a approved by the AHJ. 

• 6l ll,2 UUVV91ad LPG Ja•k QwMDMP. Unclerp,und LPO tank.I shall b.s 
prohibited from bem& sokl to end-users and shall be retained by the LPO company under a 

leuHype sysrem to en,un, proper annual maintenance roqulremtnll are mtl and 

recorded. 

- S.Cdow 6114 Nat ... al G., shalt be added as follows: 

Existin& nauaral ps installtdons ttiall compty with the following: 

I. The meter usembly stiall be inmlled on the pble end of the buildina. u close as 

praclical to the bulldlna wall, unleu chis ii not feasible due to Sb'Ueblnll or IOflOPIPhical 
constnlnta. 

2. A proltCClvo com-, desianed lo be equal lo or palet rhall die Buildlnc Oettt,1 Load 

(decenniMd by the buildlna depw,menJ). appn>ved by die supplier. shall bl Installed O¥tr 

the meter u:wmbfy, ,ecurel)' sllPPOf1,9d to the pound or diagonally to the build•na wall 

21 

20-0203 I Page 25 of 50 



When ~ 1o the ground. die foodna for me suppons sbatl be founded 6 inches 

below finished lflde. Pre-c:at concrete pien ffll)' be used in lieu poun:d footings, 

pro•idid they IN p&accd Oft IClbfe 100. 

- Secdoll ,115 Vloladou shalt be added u (°'lows: 

• 61 l5. l Viollldou, ll shall be w,lawful for an LPO supplier to provide Mt"Yice to a LPG 

inst1Uation, which does oot comply with the provisions in sec:1ion 6112 or 611 J. 

- ti lS.l hilgre JO PttYlde Cone, f 1ilure b)' d\e CUIIOmef to provide: I cover 8S required 
for I natural ps meter assembly Is a violation of mis code and will subjoct the eustorMr to 
• one hundR:d dollar ($100.00) flfte. 

APPENDlX D - FIR.I APPARATUS ACCl:SS ROADS 

- Section Ill Mlaiat .. S,.IRitalloM 

Dt03.l Assm Bw Wk&·-· BYSkus shall be ameadod • follows: Excefl'ion; 
Driveways 

· DIOJJ Gnde shall be ameftded • f'otiows: 

fin, apparatus access roads shall not exceod 10 petecftC in.-. 

E.m:ption I: In arees lbo¥t S.000 ft. devation. dri\le\llllys of R·l Occl.lplfteies shltt not exceed 
12 percawt in pade. 1111ha odlcrwite authorized by the Fire c:hiet: If appro~ chi driveway 
slope may excad 12% ( 12 vertical r.t. IIO one hundred horimnsal feet). provided lhe driveway 
mtMS cw exceecb lhe prescribed minimum width. lftd is no lonlff in lenllh thin lht maximum 
penntllible heipt o(lhe SCl"UCWft widain suchjurisdktioft. ~ in no WI more lhlin 35 feec. lftd 

ha lhe approp • llmlidoaat slopes It the edat o( pm,mcnt to property llnt-. end ha no 
s.pificant uticulltion .,_. Chai 4.S" angle in its a1tire ieftath). 

· DtW Itt1iM WIM shall be~• follows: 1lte ,-inlmum 111mina radius shall be 
decenntMd by die fn code official; and shalt noc include curb and guner. 

· QIW fin ARPIQJM Ac:sW RNd Galp shall be amended as rotlows: Where • sinale 
pte is provided. the pt• width shall be not less than 20 r- (6096 mm). Where a ff..­
appenna,. road consists of• divided f'Oldway. the pte width shall not be lea rhan I S f'eet 
(4572 mm).. 

Sectto. DIM - ColUltrelal 1acl llldlllbial o.n1o,....11 

RlN l .. tw usee,tlpc A W MMD fMt II vt1 SMII be lftltlded u follows: 
Bulldmp or fidlirla luiving a anm buildina.,. of nlO«e than 61.000 .. .,. ,- shall bt 

provided with two ,epera&e end approved fbe ~ access roads. Dttlte acepdon. 

20-0203 I Page 26 of 50 



· DllU P 7 st I NM .. 1111111d.t • follows: When cwo accets roads u. rwquir.d, they 

thMl bt ,-.t • d~ tpWt ...-1 IO ftOl laa lhM one half of lhe ien., of it. maximum 
.,.,..JI,.... .._,ioa ot'lk p,opwC) « ... IO be set'\'eli, measured in I ttnipt line 
~.« ..... 

e..u.,cion: fint....,.,.,... caanat be ifttlafW because o(loclltion on p,openy, 

....... y. ~ nor .. waoc .... "*' ot similar eoodicion. ltld Ill appro'4d 
1...,,...ve IMIM of nre protection ii provided. 

Qlff.1 Cl,gaffmdal fig t\WAfW 6sire 8MII shall be added u follows: W. 
required by rha Fire Codt Official,• flte applrllhlt access nied shall be COMtruCted to 

encom,-u the .ntirery of I stl\lCl\n and lhall provide • conciltuous ws of eme,psicy 

vehicle acc.aa, 

• Secdoo Dlt! · Aerial flR Affan1tus Acaa .._. 
· p1m,1 Wun mlAD4 lhall be ........ u follows: Buildings or pomons ofbutldiap or 

facilkiet 1xceedln1 lO ,- in hei&ht lbofl lhrl lo'Welt ie'vel of In~ 'ltllicle lCCUI 

thall be provided with appnwed r ... ..,.... tceal raeds capable of acconunodMio& fire 
J.pe,tmant 111Wial 1peNll'llhls. OwrhMd ulilky and power lines shaff ncc be k>c:accd wkhin the 

aerial fttt apparatus IJCOllil roadway. 
. 01w wwa 1tia11.,. amended .. ro&1ows: Aerial m aJlPIM1ICUS 1Ca1$$ l'Ollds .,.., tia\l'e. 

minimum unobstruded width of 26 fiNic. oulusive of tllouJden. in lhe immedi11e vicinity or 
any buHdifts OIi portion of building men dlan JO feet in hciaflt 

- Sect• DlM • M....,...F..a, Rall .. adal 0.k'll1,-..11 

· D11t,1 tnl a 1aYM1-, dt¥ •• •• Tr ..... shall be .mended as roltows: 
M ....... flllfflily m....._. projects hrnna .... dlln 100 ctwemna unib shall be equipped 
dmNpoua wilh f'tilll'O ..,._and~ fin~ tcceu roads. Oelece exc:epdon. 

. S... D111 • OMwT ...... Nttl)' Rnf1111tial Dewlepaatl 

D11'1,I Pit: K ta tnft ... tr r IC MIi ........ shall be llffilftded u 
follows: ~ o( on.- OIi rwo- ,._ily dweUinp shall bt pn:wided widl ...,_ Md 
iflf'RM'd fire~ 1CCeS1 raeds Md IMII ffllll tbr nDqUilWftU of O I 07 ,2 ltemollnc:II,. 

*MR reqund b) die Fin Otter. Oelecl ucq,tiont. 

SECTION 4: CONFLICT 
Thal Ontiuan No. JOlMI of the LVffD, wt 1U odw onlillWCS or p1rt1 o( ontlnwcs herewith 

.,. hnby ,-pealed. 

2l 

20-0203 I Page 27 of 50 



SfC'flON s~ SEVUt1\Jlll,IJY 

tr 1rny Ordi1t111Ke. an 1clc, ,;ub•,ct·li•.lit or subsiivisim-1 lht:'r1.'tif. pm, 1sm11. '>l'.'ntc11cc. dau3.C: or phr;1•«! u! 

!h1; ,:;o,k. or ill\)' apph,;-atinn 1h~n:-nf 1•, for !lll)' ~n tl('fd In he· i1wulid by u court of ClHH()<.:l~JH 

111n:,d11:1ivn. iuch d1.>Ci;1011 ~h .. 1111-l! ,1nec1 rht: rcmami1111, rm1vl'iilHI'< 11f1ht.'> code, which cn11 be i,.iv1:n 

dfc,·i <Nith~•ol the mvalid p<irnom ,md. th\•rd•m:, such invillid J}f1f1ioll~ a!'I! 11!.:dared IO be scvctnbk 

The LVfP'l> hcrchy th:dnres ilml ii would h11v1: cnac11:d this Onht11.mcc and each nf it~ artidi=s, 

,ei:1111115. '>Hliscc:inrn:;. 1Jr suhili,-1siun~ thcn:or. pW\i1Stnn'!, ~c1il~n..:,.;~ dnu'it'" m phr,1s.:s im:,r1t.xt,v.: 111 

1hc fact that on,: or more •Jf thl.'m 15 dcd1trc-d irl\'alid 

SECTION 6: £t,-fEcnvE DATE AND 1•UBUCATION 

Th,,; ( lnhn,1111.:-c ,hall tali;,: dfec: thirty OOi 1fays a£\cr i1;; i1dop1m11 fhe l,VFrr, Hoard Sccr~~l.tr) ,~. 

din.-ct.cd to ()t;bhsh lh1s onJirnuwe in a t11t~\spap(:r of g.cl\\!n.tl c1r.:uh111v11 in lhc Di:Hricl. In lieu of 

p11hHc.11ion of the full 1c_,1 ,Jf rhc urdinancc, u ,w,mrnry or !he ordin:,ncc ,miy Ix published by the by 

1h,: B<)ard s~c1"Clill)· within f!lkcn f 15 l duy~ u!ler 11s pa.ssagc and n c1:11ilit.'d wpy t,hull be p,1~1cd 10 1hc 

ollicc of the LVn•t>. pur,;11an1 to timcr111nc111 Cock ~-c110•1 J!\1JH(d ( I 1 

The ab,;,,,e ( irtlinani:c \lo-Jlr, irnrnduccd al a rntcu11g 'JI ,he Hoard of D1n."t.'.tof~ nl !he LV f PD un 

'io\'Nntn:r 1,.1ott-1 and 11 was then rea;J for 1h~ i!r"lt hmc .. The f)rd111nm:c ,-.ns rend (or 1h1: s.:cond 

tirnc OH D«flmbc,· 11. 2019 and appn,vc,1 by the l11Jl11\\:fn1,1, vote: 

PASSED 1\NO AIX )I' !ED by the Boord ofl>i~c1111, nf'rln: LVFPI> rhi\, 12th d•y nf Dttember 

1019 

MlfS. 6' 

•\B$EN1 .{:r 
•\BSTA.IN t:_~' 

tdTFST 

t" .... 
//' ,,,, 

__ /LLLL£q 11 

1\:. -~· 

K1k1~h L•)l.•do. Ho.irrl Clt>,l • 1 

! 

20-0203 I Page 28 of 50 



LVF 

Fire Code# 
S,gn,f1cart 

1'1/hJi Is ti E Cl>an3e? '!.'hf Is Tl•crc a l.ccJI OJOge? 
change? 

101.1 N Amend with Iha name of the jurisdiction Locany adopted and amended Adminislralive need 

Adq,ling lhis section addresses Cfimatic c:ooditions: LPG 
gas shal be amended as follows: Add to !he exception: At 
or above 5,000 feel of elevation, a permit is not rec,Jired for 

105.6.27 y Add section locally adopted and amended individual containers With a 125 gallon water capacity or 
less, or multiple conlainer syslems having an aggregate 
quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving occupancies in 
group R 3. 

Adopting this section to aKow for the aeation and Issuance 

106.6 N Add section LocaRy created and adopted 
of fees to cover actual cosls. Section 106.6 defines 
permits, plan checks, and inspections as allowed in Health 
&Safety Code 17951. 

106.6.1 N Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover Ille costlo 
the Fi111 Oislrict. 

106.7 y Add section locally created and adopted Section 106. 7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspections by contractors. 

Completed Iha section by fil~ng in lhe blank 
Alows Iha Fire Code Official to enforce !he Fire Coda lhal 

portions that were nol compleled by lhe SFM. It is 
protects life and property. Fees have been updated ID 

110.4 N 
better left to localities lo del8!Tlline the 

Locally adopted and amended maid! the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by lhe 

fees/penalties for lheir respective areas. 
District Attorney's Office. The change to lhe language lo 
Include the lenn Infractions. 

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2 
Cilations 
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized represenlative (s), 

110.4.2 N 
Added Section 110.4.2. (This section exisled belore 

LocaUy created and adopted 
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 

but unds a different number) violations or this coda pursuanl 10 Seclioo 13871 ol lhe 
Heallh and Sa/ety Code of lhe State ol Calil011Va and 
Chapter 5c (commencing ll!ilh section 853.6) of TiUe 3 of 
Part 2 of Iha Penal Code ol lhe Slale of California. 

Completed the section by fining in lhe blank 

112.4 N 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. II ls 

Locany adopted and amended 
All violations of the code have been IXlllsoidated under 

belier lell to localities lo deleimine the Section 110.4 lo indude the penalties for \iolatlons. 
less/penalties for their respective areas. 

114.1 lhrough 114.2 N Allows Limitation and Reserving of Rights locally adopted and amended 
Added lhe ability ror the Board of Directors ol the District. 
lhe right to amend, modify, supplemen~ revoke in whole, or 
in part, any of the provisions conlained or incorpo,aled 
herein, al any time and from time to time. 

Added definitions for. Campfire, Dislrict Executive Body. 

202 N Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopted 
Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd Manager. 
Definition or campfire shall not include LPG or Propane 
fueled appliances. 

302.1 N Added definition for Campfire lo Section locally created and adopted Added definition for darilv 
307.1.1 N Added restrictions due to weather/Red Flag Locally created and adopted lnaease risk of cataslrophic wild fire. 

307.4.4 lhrough 
Due to Iha high ire danger that exists in El Dorado County 

307.4.4.2 (d) 
y Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally crealed and adopled we have wriHen more slringent rules pertaining to open fires 

. within grass, brush, and lree covered areas. 

20-0203 I Page 29 of 50 



Fire apparatus are becc,nlng la!ger and taller. A veltical 
dearance of 15 feet provides proper dearance for 
apparatus to pass under wilhout damaging apparatus 
components. It also allows an extended time frame before 

503.2.1 N Changed vertical clearances to 15 feet and road 
Locally adopted and amended 

having to recut lhe growlh or the vegetelioo. Additional 

widlhs to 20 leet. 
height !or vegetetion clearances ads as an increased buffer 
!or the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feel l!llclusive of 
shoulders, as measured face of curb to race of curb is 
needed. These structures can be difficull to navigate with 
fire apparatus and should not be counted in lhe total 
drivable road surface 

Added a specific section for R3's where ii allows the 
Fire apparatus require areas ror turning around llrtlen 

503.2.5 N 
Fire Code and TIHe 14 Fire Sale Regulations to 

Locally adopted and amended 
multiple vehicles are on Iha scene of an emergency. This 

match as they require turnarounds lor fire apparatus 
includes fire vehides as well as civilian vehides. Provides 

access roads and driveways. better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum 
around lor apparatus In driveways greater than 150'. 

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 

Changed U,e sectioo for Bridges and Elevated Surfaces of B Dorado County and AppendlK D or the 

503.2.6 N Surfaces to state and match El Dorado County Locally adopted and amended 
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be 

Transportation Dil.'ision instead of AASHTO HB-17. 
consistent Uiroughout county agencies and is allowed as an 
allemate means & methods that is not less restrictive lhan 
the Fire Code. 

503.4.2 N Added section regarding no patking in fire lanes Locally created and adopted 
This section clearly defines lhe "No Parlting in Fire Lanes" 
rules and is coilsistent with the California Vehide Code. 

503.4.3 N 
Added section regarding no parlung in front of 

Locally created and adopted 
This section clearty defines the "No Parting in front of fire 

hydrants 
hydrants" rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle 
Code. 

503.4.4 N 
Added section regarding fire lanes based on road 

Locally created and adopted 
This section dearty defines California Fire Code Appendix D 

wldlh 
as the reference for road lane width and their relatioo to fire 
lanes. 

Created and adopted to maintain emB19ency Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on 

503.6 through 503.6.1 y access and consistency through all roadway gates 
Locally created and adopted 

roact.Yays based on lhe Districts gate standard, providing 
In El Dorado County, refening to the gate standards the best possible emergency access to maintain fast 
adopted by the F PO'S. response times. 

505.1 N 
Added section pertaining lo Ille visual addressing of 

locally adopted and amended 
Allows Fire districts the aulhority to approve addressing 

buildings. based on the District's addressing standards. 

505.1.1 N Added additional addressing requirements locally created end adopted Establishes instalation, location, and visibiity requirements. 

505.1.1 (1) N Added ad<itional addressing requirements Locally created and adopted 
Establishes requirements for pennanent posting and 
visibility requirements from construction through completion. 

505.1.1 (2) N Added additional addressing requirements Locally created and adopted 
Establishes requirements for address signs along one way 
roads assuring l.'islblffty from both directions 

505.1.1 (3) N Added adcilional addressing requirements Locally created and adopled 
Establishes requirements for multiple addresses accessed 
from a single driveway shaft be moounted on a single post. 

Establishes requirements for where a roadway provides 

505.1.1 (4) N Added additional addressing requirements Locelly created end adopted 
access to a single commercial Ill industrial buUding lhe 
addess shaN be placed at the nearest road lntersecllon 
providing access. 

506.1.1 through 
Created and adopted to maintain key boas and 

Allows Frre Distrid to require key boxes for eme,gency 
506.1.3 

N locks for buidings with gates and.'or sprinkler Locally adopted and amended 
systems. 

access. 

507.5.4.1 y Created end adopted to address snow removal and 
Locally adopted and amended 

Allows Fire District to mainlain emeigency access without 
. snow storage. impedance by snow removal or storage. 

20-0203 I Page 30 of 59 



Allows the Fire District to adopt a pubic private partnership 
fund infrastructure and capital improvemeols (Partne!Ship 

Created and added Public Private Partnership Fund Fund) to receive contributions of cash or property qualifying 
y Locally created and adopted under Internal Revenue Code Section 170 to fund 507.5.7 

for Infrastructure and Capital Improvements 
operations and maintenance, induding but nol limiled to 
mobile water supply apparatus such as fire boal(s), and/or 
waler tender(s). 

Created and added to impose the requirements ol 
Locally adopted and amended 

Aligns the installation of emergency and standby power '604.1.2 N NFPA 110andNFPA 111 for emergency and 
systems with NFPA. standby power systems. 

Created and added to address sprinkler systems 
Locally adopted and amended dleineates the requirements for sprinklers and fire alram on 901.4.7 N 

and fire alarms existing and new buildings 

901. 11 through 901.14 N Created and added to address 6re alarm systems Locally adopted and amended Added definitioo for clarity 

Added definitions for. Vendor, Approved, Audible Alarm, 
902 N Added definitioos for darity Locally created and adopted False Alarm, Fire Alarm System, Local Fire Alarm System, 

Subscriber 

Due to the climatic conditions of the District all sprinkler 
903.1 N 

Adds a requirement for all sprinkler systems lo be 
Locally created and adopted systems must be of the anti-freeze or non-lreezilg type to 

anti-freeze or non-freeziig type. 
function property. 

Due to Ille topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their ca,llibuting factors to our Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater 
increased response limes, along with the fact that fires 

903.2a N than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they 
Locally created and adopted double in Size each and eveiy minute, we require sprinklers 

add more lhan 30% or 1,000 SCJl&re feet to the 
to be installed In structures once they reach 3,600 square strudure, whichever is less. 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to lhe topographic, climatic, and geographic cmdilions 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors lo our Adds occupant protecticJn for existing buildings less 
Increased respoose times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.b N 
than 3,600 square feel to inslaff sprink!ffl if they 

Locally created and adopled double In size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to Ille 

to be inslalled in slructures once they reach 3,600 square structure, whichever is less. 
feet in size as they relate to fire beha'lior and rate of 
spread. 

Due lo the topographic, clinatic, and geographic ca,ditions 
of El Dorado County and their conlribwng factors to our 

These sections were created to give specific inaeased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2.1, 903.2.3, 

N direction on the sprinkler requiremenls based Oil Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 903.2.4, 903.2.7 
occupancy and square foolage to be installed in slruclures once they reach 3,600 square 

feet In size as they relate to fire beha'lior and rate of 
spread. 

Manufactured Hornes - The inlent of this code section is to 
81'11Ure that manufactured homes that seive as a one or two 
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to bu~! dwellings of a similar 
nature. Manufaciured homes placed in lhe wildland-urban 

This section was created to include manufactured 
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumpllon 903.2.8 y residential single family R-3 in the residential Locally created and adopted 
due to !he light-weight nature of their consbuclion. The 

SP/inkier program 
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a 
significant risk to their occupanb. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated to decrease tis risk 
successfully in many California communities. 

20-0203 I Page 31 of 50 



Due lo the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditiCNls 
ot B Dorado County and their contributing ractcn lo our 

These sections were aeated to give specific inaeased response times, alCN19 with the fact that fires 
903.2.9, 903.2. 10 N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and emended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage lo be inslalled in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
lee! in size as they relate lo fire behavi<J" and rate of 
spread. 

Adds audible notification in au sleeping rooms of a 
Allows Distin:! to require audible of a sprinkler water flow 

903.4.4 N sprinkler water flow alarm in residential locally aeeted and adopted 
occupancies. 

alarm. 

Added occupant protection for fire atanns in 
buUdings with a noor area less than 3,600, except 

Pr!Mdes proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
R3, AG buildings not used for commercial 

907.2.a N 
purposes, and buildings v.ilh a floor area of less 

Locally aeated and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

than 500 square feel as awoved by the fire code 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

official. 

[Added occupant protection for existing buildings 
Pn:Mdes proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.b N 
without automatic sprinkler systems lo install a fire 

Locally aealed and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Depa,tment notification in 
efarm if they add more than 30% or 1,000 square 

the event of a fire or smoke. 
feet lo the slruclure. whichever is less. 

Added occupant protection by stating atl fire alann 
detection systems installed shall be connected to a Provides proper emergency notificalion tor occupilllcies that 

907.2.c N monitoring 581'1ice that notifies the fire department Locafly aeated and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification In 
upon activation and is inslalled per Section 907 of the event of a fire or smoke. 
the fire code. 

Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
907.2.d N systems lo be connected lo a monitored fire alarm Locally aeated and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

system when installed or replaced. lhe event of a fire or smoke. 

907.6.2.1 y Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply 
Locally aeated and adopted 

Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E 
MOdification safety related power outages. 

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to 
1203.1.3 N Shunt trip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up 

pa,,,er supplies 

3310.3 N Address requiremenlS for consl/Uetion sites Locally aeated and adopted 
Addressing for constructiCNl siles Is Important lo assist 
responding emergency aews. 

3312.1 N 
Water supplies at conslruclion sites with 

Locally adopted and amended 
Water must be oo site prior to oombustible material being 

combustible materials on-site stored or vertical construction commencing. 

This section darilies that within lhe boundaries of El Dorado 

Added a section to darify root construction County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are 
4905.4 y 

- requiremenlS 
Locally aeated and adopted wildland fire sale and shall be oomprised of a Class A roof 

covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not lo be 
inslalled as lhey are not a Class A rated assembly. 

Any damages or costs from negligent pracUces that Hazardous materials related incidenls are cosUy to mitigate. 

5001.7 y cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally aeated and adopted 
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 
process or practice the aclual cost wil be passed on lo the 

cost re,;;overy lee. 
negligent parlies. 

Added nlety protection with permits being issued 
Allows agencies that need lo know about explosives and 

5601.2 N 
by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for 

Locally adopted and amended firewolb lo approw them and have a dear und81S1anding 
explO&ives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of 
Supemscn for fireworks. 

of the applications they wNI be used for. 

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any 

Fireworl(s companies or vendors shall make 
documentation inducing timing and proprieta,y information 

5601.2. 1 and S601.2.2 N available al requested documentation pertaining to Locally aeated and adopted 
that pertains lo any aspect of a firewats display that they 
deem necessary. This inlormaHt11 is understood to be 

the firework presentation 
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as 
such. 

20-0203 I Page 32 of 50 



Established limits as required by the Fire Code for aass I 
5704.2.9.6.1 N Established limits as set forth in lhe Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 

flammable and Class II combusbble liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
SpeciaVConditionat Use Pemlil from lhe County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Oass I 

5706.2.4.4 N Established limits as set forth In the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended flammable and Class II combustible liquid special 
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval 
and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from lhe County. 

Administrative need to add District name. Established lmils 

Administrative addition of Distlict name. 
as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable 

5806.2 N 
Established limits as set forth in lhe Fire Code 

Locally adopted and amended Cryogenic fluids in stationaiy containers. Requires AHJ 
approval and a SpeciaVCondilional Use Permit from the 
County. 

6102 N Added definiHons for darity Locally created and adopted Added definitions for: lnsta9ation, LPG, Supplier, 
lntenuplion of Seivice 

Establishes distances between LPG storage and 
dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential 

Established limits for LPG storage and dispensing developments and high-density hotels, motel, apartments, 
6104.2 N near or adjacent to residential development Locally adopted and amended etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would 

have a high probability of injury, inhalalion, or death. 
Requires AHJ approval and a SpeciaVConditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

Establishes pr~res for the safe handling of propane 
above 500 feet There are special requirements above 

Establishes propane regulator requirements for 
5000 feet due lo snow loads and sheer the made propane a 

6112 N 
locations above 5000 root elevation 

LocaUy created and adopted significant ignition SOUft8 and danger during lhe winter 
monlhs. This section requires certain rules for regulators, 
vertical riser piping, markings and locations, and permit and 
plan requirements. 

Establishes permit requirements for propaie tanks greater 

Establishes propane regulalor requirements ror than 125 Gallons. There is a requirement for a plot plan for 
6112 (1}a,b,c,d,e,f N 

locations above 5000 foot elevation 
Locally crealed and adopted all new installalions signed 'by a lpg supplier that contains 

builcing locations, lot lines, capacities, riser pipe location, 
root ridge ~ne depiction. 

Establishes requirements for regulalors. lnstalation of 

Establishes propane regulalor requirements ror regulators shall meet manurac11rers instructions, 1st stage 
6112(2) N locations above 5000 foot elevation Locally created and adopted regulators to be located under a cover, all regulators must 

be listed and approved, ffexible connectors shall be used 
balweell first stage regulator and main service valve. 

Establishes vertical propane rise requirements for locations 
for lhe District. Pipe schedule location, sv.ing joint 

6112(3) N 
Establishes propane vertical riser pipe recµrements 

Locally created and adopted requirements, and the use of ffexibte riser piping as well as 
above 5000 root elevation swing joints. These requirements are based on significant 

fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather conditions 
encountered above 5000 feel. 

6112(4) N 
Establishes prop111e shut off valve requirements 

Locally created and adopted 
Establishes shut off valve requirements including locations 

above 5000 foot elevation at lhe gable end of the bUilding and visibi~ty requirements. 

Establishes propane protective covers ror second Establishes construction requirements for protective covers 
6112 (S) N stage regulators and meters requirements above Locally created and adopted for second stage regulato.'S and meters inducfmg concrete 

5000 foot elevation piels and footings. 

6112 (6) N 
Establishes prop!l18 endernnity clause Locally created and adopted 

Establishes obsetValional and Inspection protections for the 
requirements above 5000 fool eleva5on Disbicl. 

Establishes propane vertical yard riser pipe 
Establishes propane yard riser pipe requirement dearanca 

6112 (7) N 
requirements above 5000 foot elevation 

Locally created and adopted fer concrete instaffations and the use of schedule 80 sleel 
piping as a rninumum requrement 

20-0203 I Page 33 of 50 



6112 (8) N 
Establishes propane LPG tank marlllngs 

locally aeated and adopted 
Establishes minimums of a 2'x2' wooden stake lo 

requiremenls above 5000 foot elevation pennanently mark tank locations. 

6112 (9) N 
Establishes propane LPG tank martdngs 

Locally aeated and adopted Establishes height requirements for stakes. requirements above 5000 foot elevation 

6112 (10) N 
Estabtishes propane installation and maintenance 

Locally aeated and adopted 
Establishes requirements for lhe stakes to be installed by 

requirements above 5000 foot elevalion lhe LPG supplier. 

Establishes marking and location requirements for locations 
ror the District. This section addresses signage location, 

6112 (11) N 
Establishes propane marking and location 

Locally aeated and adopted 
emergency contact infonnation, and snow related lank 

requirements above 5000 loot elevation marking requirements. These requirements are based on 
significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather 
conditions encountered above 5000 feet. 

6112 (12) N 
Establishes propane tank support requirements 

Locally aealed and adopted 
Establishes approved propane tank supports such as pr&-

above 5000 foot elevation cast reinforced ooncrete pads, slabs, or saddles 

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground 
tanks: 

6113.1 N 
Permits and plans shaN be submitted and approved 

Locally aeated and adopted 
Aftows us to require plans be submitted for reviaw prior to 

by Ille AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction). installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks 
require substantial maintenance including inspection and 
anode replacement at regular intervals. 

Requires unde,ground LPG tanks lo remain Ille· 
Underground tanks COllode easily and can leek without 

6113.2 N Locally aealed and adopted detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when 
property of lhe LPG company sold lo lhe end user. This does not apply to abcM ground 

tanks where cooosioo and leaks are more easily detected. 

Establishes requirements for natural gas Establishes requirements for nalural gas installations lo 

6114 N installations, meter locations, and proledive cove1s Locally aealed and adopted 
protect lha meter on slruclures. These requirements are 

over meters. 
based on signlkant fire histoiy in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet 

Establishes a violation process for LPG installalioo that 
Adds a violation process if an LPG Supplier encounter high $!10W loads and do not meet Sections 6112 

6115.1 N provides seriice lo a LPG installation that does nol Locally aealed and adopted or 6113. These requirements are based oo significant fire 
comply with Seclioos 6112 or 6113. history in heavy snow and extreme wealher conditions 

encountered abow 5000 feet. 

Establishes a viofalion process for LPG installalion that 

Adds a violation process if a customer does pro','ide 
enaxmler high snow toads and do not meet Sections 6112 

6115.2 N 
cover fol a natural gas meter assembly. 

Locally aealed and adopted or 6113. These requirements are based on significant tire 
history in heavy snow and excreme weather oonditions 
encounleted above 5000 feel 

Appendix D:. D103.1 N Made an excep6oo for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended 
It is unreasonable to require a residential driveWay to 
consllucl a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant 

Esla!J!ishes requirements for fire apparetus access Due lo the significant fire history in heavy snow and 

Appendix D: D103.2 y roads lo not exceed 10 pelt8fll grade and In areas 
Locally adopted and amended 

extreme weather conditions encountered above SOOO feet 
above 5,000 Feet elevation driveways of R-3 these requirements will allow apparatus to access 

·· occupancies shall not aJ!ceed 12 peicent grade. occupancies when heavy snow limHa tradlon. 

Appen<ix D: D103.3 N Text lo include cums and gutters Locally adopted and amended 20 foot road widths shalt not include curbs and gutters clle 
lo potenlial access issues and turning redius concerns. 

Appendix D: D103.5 § 
Where fire apparalus access roads consist of a divided 

N Fire apparatus access road gates Locaty adopted and amended roadway the gale widlh shall nol be less lhan 15 feet due to 
1 radius Issues. 

Appendix D: D104.2 
Added lo requre two equally spaced two fire Where buildings~ 62,000 square feet two equally 

N apparatus access roads on buildings !hat exceed LocaNy aeated and adopted spaced fin, apparatus access roads wiH be required to allow to D104.3 
62,000 square feel aa:ess in file ~es. 

20-0203 I Page 34 of 50 



When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 

Appendix D: D104.4 N 
Added to require circumferential fire apparatus 

Locally created and adopted 
access road shall be conslllJcted to encompass the entire 

access roads sbucture and shall provide a continuous means of 
emeigency vehicle access. 

Amended to require fire apparatus access roads on 
For lhe safely of the communities we live in, ingress/egress 

Appendill D: D105, N buildings that exceed JO feet in height that are 
Locally adopted and amended Is required for fire depar1rnent aerial apparallls to ensure D105. I, D105.2 capable of accomodating fire departrnenl aerial 

the safety of the residents and filSt responders. apparatus. 

For the safely of the communities we live in, two ways of 
Appench D: 0106.1 N Removed Exception in its entirety. Locally adopted and anended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safely of the 

residents and Int responders. 

For the safely of lhe communities we live in, two ways of 
Appendix D: 0107.1 N Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirely. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety ol lhe 

residents and first respond1111. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.2 through 101.5 N 

Adopted lo eslablish scope, inlenl severability and 
Locally adopted Administrative clarity validity 

102.6 through 102.8 N References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

102.10 through 102.12 N Confticting plll'lisions, Other Laws, Application of 
Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

references 

103.1 through 103.4.1 N Definition of the Fire Prevention Drlision Locally Adopted Adninislrative clarity 

104.1 N Ability to enfon:e lhe code LocaUy Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.3 through 104.4 N Right of Entry, Warrants, and Identification locally Adopted Adninistrative clarity 

104.6 lhrough 104.6.4 N Reconl retention Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.8 U,rough 104.9.2 N Modifications, alternate means and methods, and 
Localy Adopted Administrative clarity 

test 

104.11 lhrough 
N 

Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance ol 
Localy Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.11.2 systems 

104.11.3 N Authority of systel)ls and devices inoperable Localy Adopted AdminiSltalive clarity 
105.2.3 N Time liln~ation of application Localy Adopted Adminisllative clarity 

105.3.1 through 
N OperatlcnaJ pennits Locaffy Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.3.2 

105.6.12 N 
Ory cleaning opendicnal permits required for 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
hazardous cleaning S<llvent use 

Permits for various busln86$ operation& lor. Magnesium, 

105.6.2.28 through Adopted this section for administrative darity and miscellaneous combus6ble storage, mobile food preparation 
N Locally Adopted vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing facilities, open burning, 

105.6.35 fire and Ule safety inspections 
open ffames and torches, open flames and candles, and 
Of!l&nic coatings 

105.6.37 N 
Adopted Ulis section for administrative darity and 

Locally Adopted Permits for places ol assembly 
fire and life safety inspections 

105.6.39 N Adopted this sacUon for administrative clarity and 
LocaUy Adopted Permits for private fire hydrents 

fire and life safely inspections 

Permits for pyroxylin plastics, refrigeration equipmen~ repair 
105.6.41 lhrough N 

Adopted this section for administrative darity and 
Locally Adopted 

garages and motor fuel-dispensing facilities, rooftop 
105.6.46 fire and life safety inspections helipats, spraying or dipping, storage ol saap tires and tire 

by'f)l'ocb:ls 

105.6.48 N 
Adopted this section ror administrallve clarity anc1 

LocaUy Adopted Permit for tire-rebuilding plants 
fire and rife safely inspections 

105.8.50 N 
Adopled this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
Permit for wood products storage (cflips, hogged material, 

fire and life safely inspections lumber or plywood, in excess ol 200 aiblc feel) 

106.1 lhrough 106.3 N Adopted this section ror adminlst,ative clarity and 
Locally Adopted Fee schedules ror permits 

fire and life safely inapections 

107.1 N 
Adopted this section for acmnistrative clarity and 

Locaty Adopted Inspection authority 
fire and life safely inspections 

20-0203 I Page 35 of 50 



Maintenance of safeguards. testing and operation of 

Adopted this section fer administrative darity and 
equipnenl re-inspection and tesling. recordkeeping, 

108.1 lhrough 109.3 N Locally Adopted superiision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding, 
fire and fife safety inspections 

Boald of Appeals established, limitations oo authaity, and 
qualifications 

110.3.2 through 
N 

Adopted this section for administrative darity and 
Locally Adopted 

Comptiance with orders and notices, prosecution of 
110.3.4 fire and &le safely inspections violations, and unauthorized tampering 

110.4.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative darity and 

Locally Adopted Abatement of violation 
ftre and file safety inspections 

113.1 N 
Adopted this section fol' administrative darity and 

Locally Adopted Authority to disconnect service utilities 
lira and life safety inspections 

AsphaK kelUes contain hirjlly flammable substances and 
303.1 lhrough 303.9 N Adopted this section for lira and life safety locally Adopted require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical) 

Managing ignition sources through responsible appkalion 
305.1 thrwgh 305.5 N Adopted this section for lire and fife safety Locally Adopted of standards will reduce !he number ol fi"15 in ~arious 

settings (Cfimatic, geologtcal, and lopographlcal) 

Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY 
306.1 lhrwgh 306.2 N Adopted this section fol' fire and Ufe safety locally Adopted nammable and require special handling (Cijmatic, 

geological, and topographical) 

307.1 lhrough 307.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
Open burning, recreational fire, and portable outdoor 
fireplaces, (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.1 N Adopted this section ror fire and Hfe safety localy Adopted 
Open flame general requirements (CHmatic, geologlcal, and 
topographical) 

308.1.2 through 
N Adopted this section fol' fire and life safety Localy Adopted 

Throwing or placing of ignition soun:es. lc,ches for 
308.1.3 removing paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Locations near combustible, open name devices, signals 

308.1.5 lhrough 
and markers, portable ~el open-ffame dm:es, sky-
lanterns, religious ceremonies, aisles and exils, flaming 

308.1.8 (exduding N Adopted this section re, fire and lile safety Localy Adopted 
food and beverage preparation, dispensing, containers not 

308.1.4) 
in use, seriing of flaming food, location, fire protection 
(Cfimatic. geological, and lopographicaij 

308.2 N Adopted this section for fire and Hfe safety LocaNy Adopted 
PennllS are reqtired re, abova section (Climatic, geological, 
and topographies~ 

Group A occupancies open.flame decorative devices, 
308.3 through 308.4.1 N Adopted this section for fire and tile safety Locally Adopted lhealrical perlom1anc:es, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 

donnltorles (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

310.1 N Adopted this section for fire and fife safety Localy Adopted 
General requirements relating to smoking (Climatic, 
geological, and lopographical) 

310.3 N Adopted this section for fire and file safety LocaUy Adopted 
"No Smoking" signs (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Removal or signs prohibited, comptiance with 'No Smoking' 
310.4 through 310.8 N Adopted this section for fire and tife safety Locally Adopted signs, ash trays, burning objeds, hazardous environmental 

concfitions. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Vacant premises condition and safely requirements, 
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant 

311.1 through 311.4 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Localty Adopted premises, security, fire proleclion, fire separation, removal 
of axnbustibles, removal of hazardous malelials. (Cfimalic, 
geological, and topographical) 

319.1 N Adopted this section for fire and tife safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to mobile food preparation 
vehicles. (Climatic, geological, and lopographlcal) 

319.2 N 
Adopted this section for adminisbative darity and 

Localy Adopted 
Permits.for mobile food preparation vehicles (Clmalic, 

fire and fife safely inspections geolOfJical, and topographical) 

20-0203 I Page 36 of 50 



Exhaust hoed, lire protection, fire pro!edioo for cooking 
equipment, fire extinguisher, appliana, connection to luel 
supply piping, cooking oil storage conlaineB, metallic 
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking oil 
storage system components. design criteria, tank venting, 
llOITllal vents, emeigency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum 

319.3 through aggregate volume, protection of container, LP-gas container 

319.10.3 
N Adopted lhis section ICC' fire and ~le safety Locally Adopted conslnlclion, protection of system piping, LP.gas alarms, 

CNG systems, CNG containers supplying a1J coolcing fuel, 
maxiroom aggregate vaume, protection of container, CNG 
i:ootainer consbuction, CNG containers supplying 
llanspiatioo and cooking fuel, protection of system piping, 
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire 
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems. 
(CHmaUc, geological, and topographical) 

403.8.1 through Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1 

403.8.1.7 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted (residential care facilities and group homes) evaruatioo and 

fire safely plans. 

403.10 lhrough Group R-1 (Boarding hoose, hole!, motel) occupancy 

403.10.1.3 
N Adopted this section for fire and Hie safety Locally Adopted Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (CRmatic. 

geological, and topographical) 

405.5 N Adopted this section ICX" fire and Pie safety locally Adopted 
Emeigency Planning and recold keeping (Oimatic, 
gedogical, and topographical) 

510.3 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
A permit is required for eme,gency responder radio systems 

fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schocls) sets a 
807.5.2 lhrough 

N 
Adopted this section for administrative daiity and 

Locally Adopted 
maximum amount of ftammable wal coverings in 

807.5.2.3 fire and life safety inspections IKllcational faciffties (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5 

903.2.1.S N 
Adopted this section for administrative darity and 

Localy Adopted 
(sporting arenas, amusement paril slrucbns, bleachers) 

fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000 
square feet (Climatic, gec>l<9cal, and topographicaQ 

' 

Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buHdings. 
All buildings wil be required to allow emeigency responders 
lo receive and transm~ emergency radio llaffic lo and from 
each other and the emergency cispalch center. Tlme 

Adopted this section in existing buildings for the 
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 

1103.2 y safety of firefighters and olher eme,gency Locaffy Adopted 
phasing in of a system owr a period of lime, determined by 

respondent lhe fira code official, is acceptable. The ralionale behind 
lhis section is lhat on almost all emeigency responder inju,y 
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected wilh the addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
sllong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appencix 0: 0101.1 
N 

Adopted lhis section for lhe safety of lhe public, 
Locaay Adopted 

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads 
through 0102.1 firefighters, and other emergency responders. Including loads. (Cimatic, geological, and topographical) 

Adopted this section for the safety of lhe public, 
Dead end fire apparatus access road requirements for a 

Appencb 0: 0103.4 N 
fire/91lers, and olher emergency r8$pO!lders. 

Locally Adopted tum around at 150 feet. (Ctimatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Appencb O: 0103.6 N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locafty Adopted 
'No Partclng, Flee Lane' signs requirements. (Clima1lc, 

fire'9ilers, and other emergency responders. geological, and topographical) 

Appencix D: 0104.1 
Adopted this section for the safely of the public, Cornmeraal and irdlstrial development fire apparatus 

through D104.3 N LocaNy Adopted 
(exduding exception) 

fireli!llters, and other emergency responders. access roads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

20-0203 I Page 37 of 50 



Appendix D: D105.1 N Adopted this section for the safely of lhe public, 
Locally Adopted 

Requirements for aerial fire apparatus access roads 
lhrough D105.4 firefighters, and other emeigency responde,s. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix D: D106.1 
Adopted lhis sedion for the safety of the public, Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential 

thlough D106.3 N locally~ed 
(exdudlng exceptions) 

firefighteis, and other emergency respondels. developments (Crtmatic, geological, and l!Jpographical) 

Appendix D: D107.1 
One- or lw<Hlwelling residential developments shall be 

lhrough D107.2 N Adopted lhis section for the safety of the public, 
Locally~ed 

equipped throughout with two spe,ate and appto11ed fire 

(exduding exception) 
firefighters, and other emeigency responders. apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 

dimatic condilions. 

Appemlix D: D108 N 
Adopted lhis section for the safety of the public, 

locally Adopted 
Adopt reference standards dealing wilh gale construction 

firefighters, and other emergency respondeis. standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle. 

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

20-0203 I Page 38 of 50 



Tri liii
0

fi e 
580 Mallory Wa'{ Carsen Crty NV 89701 
PO Box tB88 CarS(),'\ City NV 89702 

r.775} !381-'L2Qf FAX (775! 887-2408 

Proof and Statement of Publication 

Ad #; 0000505390.01 

Notice of Intent to 
Adopt the 2019 

Callfornla Fire Code 

.---------------------. Notice is hereby given to 
the intention of the Lake 

Legal Account 

LA.KE VALLEY FIRE PROTE.cnoN DIST 
221 l KEETAK ST 
SOUTH LAKE TAHOE. Cf., 96150 

Attn K!leigh Latnado 

Bailee Liston aays; 

That {sp·,e is a legal cier}; of !he 

Tahoe Oafly Tribune., 

a newspaper published Fnday 
af South Lake Tat-,oe. in ftie S!.tte ot CaMom1a. 

Copy Line 

Notice NO'ii , 4 J\.dopt Fire Cooe 

PO#; 

Ad fl: 0000505390·.01 

of t.th1ch a copy is h~n'~!o ark~ was pubhShi?d 

in said newspai,t!, ftir t.he fuil reQtJiretJ penoo ol 
2 hMe{s, commencing on 1110112019, 

and ending on 11/08/2019, all days mthJSiV~ 

Signed . 
Dale 11/08120H+ S11,1e of Navaaa. Can.on C1tv 

Thi• I• an Origlnal Electronic An'ldiavit, 
Prlco; $ 67.00 

Valley Fire Protection 
District to adopt the 201 9 
California Fire Code. 
The District shall hold its 
first public hearing at 
4:00 P.M. on Nov 14 
2019. at 2211 Keetak St. 
South Lake Tahoe. 
California, regarding the 

I adoption of the 2019 
I California Fire Code pur­
l suant to Health and 
I Safety Code Section 
/ 13869. Copies of the 
1 code section referred to 
! and any secondary code 
! sections referred to. ! adopted by reference~ 
1 are on file with the 
i Secretary of the District 

I and are open to public 
, inspection. Adoption ot 
the 2019 California Fire 
Code will enable all 
District personnel to fol­
low one set of rules and 
regulations with regard 
to the health and safety 
of the public and the 
District's response there-

...... _~~--~~~~~--~~~~~~~__. to. 

Pub: November 1, 8, 
2019 Ad#0000505390 

20-0203 I Page 39 of 50 



Tritillfie 
~t MNkwt '>'-Y Gtiti,1;1n Oiy N\i 89 1 01 
P (:} &~ !~ Cat'SOO Ci!'t ~v !9lOZ 
1n11 ei:n.1201 F.AX tTT5) 88f-24Cll 

Proof and Statement of Pub41cation 

Aa #': 000050SJ96..01 

Notice of Intent to 
Adopt the 2019 

Callfornla Fire Code 

Notice is hereby given to 
··-·--cv-•tffi'M( ic;;;~t ,:--;.irj;-,-:,.i -·---·-.. -·----------.[ the intention of the Lake 

1 Valley Fire Protectton 
I District adopt the 2019 
I Califomia Fire Code. 
! The District shall hold its 
! second public hearing at 
14:00 P.M. on ·oecembe, 
! 12. 2019. at 2211 Keeta~ 
I St.. South Lake Tahoe. 
i California. regarding the 

Legal Ac.<:outtt 
LAKE VAU.EY FIRE f'f<OTECTiON Dtsr 
221'! i<E.f:TAK ST 

SOUTH lAl<E TAHOE CA (,EiSO 

Attn K.~1'1 Labritdr.1 

B1114l,e L'9tOn ••y11; 
Tnat (1)he is a legal clerk of Iha 

Tahoe Oaiy Tribune, 
a new!l-paper published Friday 
at South Lake fahOu in !M Stalt! of CaHtornaa 

Copy L.ioe 

Nohce Dec 12 Adopt Fin~ C:()d6 

PO#; 

Ad t: 00(l0!10$396"0 l 

of whrch a copy i!t h,t1ri!-to Altt:hed w~s p.Jbh~ti~d 

in s:a,d r,ew.sp,itper for !he tuli tfft~Wrerj p~ir:,i:1 ol 

2 time1,Si comrflelnc1nq on H/29/2019. 
and ending on 12!0612019 4H duyl'.I mc1v1.ive 

S·9nei:1: --------··---·-
Oate t 2Kl9i2m 9 Statt! of 1'Mv11d" C.trfiun City 

Th.- l• an Ortgln.d Eloctrotth; Artidlltvlt. 
Pric.tt'. I 89 80 

I. adoption of the 2019 
1 California Fire Code pur·· 

1

1 suant to Heafth and 
, Safety Code Section 
· 13869. Copies of the 
code section referred to 
and any secondary code 
sections referred to, 
adopted by reference. 
are on fite with the 

l s_ ec retary of the o_ istrict 
and are open to public 

1 inspection. Adoption ot 
I the 2019 California Fire 
1 Code will enable all 
District personnel to fol· 
low one set of rules and 
regulations with regard 
to the health and safety 
of the pubUc and the 
District's response there­
to. 

Pub: November 29, 
December 6, 2019 
Ad#0000505396 

20-0203 I Page 40 of 50 



Attachment No. 2 

LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

RESOLUTION NO. 2019-08 

20-0203 I Page 41 of 50 



10:sotUTION NO. 2019-08 
Lakt Valte)' fire Protection l>i:,;trict, El D0t1ltlo Count}, C11lifornin 

\doJllin; f."imlings Surportin~ A1m:ndmenl.s to the 20 I 9 Californht Fire Code 

;\ rcsoh1tion for the lake Valley Fire Pro1cc1inn l)istricl ~,tin~ forth t"rndini;s with rcspccl to 
l,xal cornfoions ,,·ilhin th,c District whkh rn.:ike C'l.'rrnin 1nndili1:a1.ii1n, .rnJ changes 10 the 
Caltfom1J Fire Code n:asonahl:, w.:,:cssar:; t::Jr tir,~ an<l lifr ~Hkly in the DistrKl. The (i11l·l·rni11g 
Board oflhc Lah Valkv Fire J>r,1tcction J>1s1nc1 lind~ an<l resolves ;1s follo\V: 

WHEREAS. Health & Sak:\ Cn<lc Sc-..:ti,m 17958.5 p;:rmit;; u hn: Protc-:tion l>i•ilri..:t 10 mJnpl 

an ordrnann: '>vhtch chang,;;5 or modi flt.~ the Stal<.' I lousmg n:gulalHl!l!> aJi 1p1.:d pur::nm,11 to 
I kalth & Salel} Code.' Scctton ! 7922 upon <lcti.:nm11a1io11 Iha! such change•, or mo<li!kali1ms arc 
ncccssar~ dUt: 10 loc.:1! condition<;:: and 

WHrllf.AS.1-kalth & S;;!ciy Code Scctmn t 7958 7 ri:qmtc5 lhut a Bonni nl Dirci:h1N makir\&; 
any chango:s or modilicaliom, pur':'luanl lo I kulth & S;ikl) Co<lc S,:di,m I. Ni8 :'i shall mal..l.'. 
npre~s lim.iinH !h~il such d,ungcs or modi!is:at,orh un; rtt:,:dcd; a11d -.;haB liic a copy of sud1 
ch,Hl~('i or modifica11nns wilh ihi; lkr;1r11111:nl n! HniJ•:mg and. Cnrnmunit> lksclt1pml.'nL 

NOW. THUU:FOIU~. Hf. IT IU:SOLVf:D ANO ORO.:tU:O. that th\.' Board ot the Lakr: 
Valley r:iri: (irotccl1on l)i,.1nc1. alkr ha,in~ duly nolit:cd ;rnd held puhlic h.:aring. c,prc~~t) 
l"m<ls \h;11 ~uch ...:ha11gcs or mnd1fi...:all1111'.' ;1rs: re:;1,w1.1hh ncc1;\~an l~c111,.: or local ...:unu11ion~. 

more s1x:cHicall~ set t'onh as !i1!!ows 

FIM>IM;s OF FACT 
FOR Cfl .. \NGt:.l.i OR MOl>lflCA TlON'S TO TIIE STATE Htll.lHNG STA'l>MWS 

COin~ ,nn.t-: H PART 9) Uf.TA('Sf: Of I.OC\L CO'il>ITIONS 

CllANW·:S OR .\IOOlflCATIONS: l11w,rnmt to S.:1.:'!mn Ins~ S I N5!i. 7 and 1st;i4 U of irw 
California I kahh & S,1k1~ ( o,k. ihc l.k.af\J n( I Jiri:.:1t1r, ,if lh.: L.if...1: Vaiky !-ire 1'ro1.:c1ior1 
Dist1·i1.:t. in ii", nnlin.111.:~· ,tdoptini'- and 1111w11i.lin1,: th1:.· .;'!ll 9 California rin: ( ,1(k. .:hang.c~ nr 
11w<li!ie~ n:rtam pn11 i ... inn:; ol the 1019 lhiildin}'. "-.1a11dard~ (rw.k i. I ilk 24 Pnn 9i. a.•, i1 p.:rtam~ 
tt\ th.: rt•gulatinn (1f huihlmgs used (or hum,m h;1h,1at1m1 ;md nt!1<:r lyp,:s <lf smh:lur\'s and general 
mks for tiri.· ... all.'!: 

flNl>IN(;S: l'ur,u:1111 to Sec11tms I 7'>5K 5. I NSX 7 um! 1894 !.S nfthc lk;1hh & S.ih:1:, c,,..k_ 
the Bourd ol'l)irt~-1,11, of the 1.ak Valley 1:irr: l'n11cuH•11 Dis1ril.'I has J4.•lcm11ni.:d :rn,J rind~ that 
the :111a1:hl.'d t:hang~·,; or mtl<lilk.11 inm Ill tht: 20 l 9 Ci! 1 l11rnia Ou1lding S1,111JanJs Code lit le 24 
Pnrt 9 nrc 1l..:l'1kd and an: ri:ns11nahl) 1ici:css;1r~ hi:.:au~.,.. uf roe.if dinlsllic. l,!1:11gr,iph1c and 
l11po~rnph11: 1;1111diti1111s Such i:hangc5 an: ,h.:1:111..:d to lx:- r~:asonahl\ n..:cc'i.s.ar:, to pnn i.J,: 
adcqunlc and cfkctin: pro1.:i.:ti,H1 to life. pnipcn~ an<l !he cm ,rorl!m.:m 

20-0203 I Page 42 of 50 



FINDING NO. ONE· Private propenies lying within the Lau Valley Fire Protection Olslrict 
are classified u very high wildland fire hazard. 

FINDING NO. TWO· The menace of destruction by fire to li£e, impro~ propcny, or natural 
raources may be, or be forecast to become. extreme due to critical ftre weather. tire suppession 
fon::cs being heavily commiued to control. fires already bumina. acute dryness of the 
veaetation. or other facrors that may cause the rapid spreed of fire JUCh a hiah winds. low fuel 
moistures. Fire Weather or Red Flaa Waminp. or severe threat of wildland fire. 

FINDING NO. THREE· Cooperatina federal or suue agencies address lhe threat of wildland fire 
on lands adjacent to the District by issuance of Fire Restrictions which restrict or ban open 
burning. inchldtng rec:reatt0nal fires. 

LOCAL CONOITlONS: Local conditions hive an adverse effect on the prevention of (I) 
major lou fires. (2) major canhquake damqe, and (3) the potential for life and property loss. 
muina chanaes or modifications to the aforementioned codes necessary to provide a reasonable 
dearee of property security as well as ffre and life safety in this jurisdiction. 

Below are liSlcd adverse local climatic, aeoar-Phic and topoa,aphic conditions found in 
the Lake Valley Fire Proteaion Discrict: 

L Clhpatle 

L Pttdpttatioa. 
Annual precipitation fluctuate, greatly. Approximately 90 • 9S percent of the l)ffl:ipitation occurs 
durina the months of November thf'ouah April. and S • 10 pct'C*lt occun from May throua,h 
October. This area hu experienced major drouahta in lhe rec:cnt put; one in 19n • 1978. one 
which started in 1919 and luced inco 1994, othen from I 999--2004. and 2006-2009. Orou&hts 
continue to cycle to this day. Electric•l storms art freq~t and 1n1 usually accompanied by little 
rainfall. potentially creating numerous lia)\renina caused Rres. 

Snow storms and lou of access and avalanche are routine. Heavy winter snows are responsible 
for delays in response and aeccu lo bulldinp and patients at emeraency scenes. Winter snow 
storms alona with t.e.vy tourist traffic routinely brlna all community ttaflk to I standslill during 
weekends and holidays; 

b. Rllative Humlclky. 
Durina tht month& of June 1hrouah September, the daily humidity ranp Atound 30 percent. Md 
often drop& to the low lftflt. Low relative humidity have allowed for .,eater spread of wildfim 
111d cauted 1truc&ure nm 10 readily lpt'eld to the wildland Interface. 

e. T..,..nnra. 
During the months or June throuah September. daily temperatures exceed 70 ctearees 10 90 
cJearea Fahrenheit Winter t.empenrw. can drop to below O dqreet Fahrenheit. The hiahoat 
recorded temperature wu 99deafeel Fahrenheit in 1981 with the lowest being negative ll 
dqrees Fahrenheit February 0(2019. 

20-0203 I Page 43 of 50 



d. Wiads. 
Prevailing winds ate out of the south and southwest. However, north and eut winds occur during 
the spring (May through June). rhe fall (late September and October), and OC(Uionally during 
the summer monlhs. Wind velocities generally ranae from nve 10 nfteen miles per hour. gusting 
to 1hirty miles per hour during the summer months. 

Given the increased risk of wildland fire in Califomia'1 mounlain reaions, electric utility 
companies have begun a policy shutting off power to entire regiont and counties. This practice 
has been responsible for a recent fire in the District and will increase risk for communities in one 
respecl while limiting risk of powerline initiated wildland fires. 

e. s ...... ry. 
These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the Lake 
Valley Fire Protection District. Times oflittle or no rainfall, low humidity~ hiah tempemum 
create extremely hazardous conditions. particularly u they relare to tbe wildland - urbln 
interface. Convcndy. heavy winter snows bring a host of flood, avalanche. mpon,e and 
structure fire challenaes to lhe community. Winds experienced in this~ can have a sianificant 
lmpacl upon structure fl res, especially in buildings in close proximity co one anolher, and to wild 
lands commonly found in the Lake Valley Fire Procection OistriCL 

II. Gt910nhlc ItPPCOQllk 

The t\re environment or a cornmuniry is primarily a combination of two factors: the physical 
aeoaraphie charac&eristics of tbe area and the historic pattern of de\-elopment. Thcle two facton 
create a mixture of environmenu thll ultimately determines the area's fire protection needs. 

The Lake Valley fire Protection Dittria provides fire prevention. fire protection, advanced 
emerpncy medical and rescue ,ervica for unincorporated El Dorado and Alpine County 
area within the Lake T ahoc Batin. 

The Lake Valley Fire Procection Dislrict serves 8.S square miles via Station 7, localed at 2211 
Keetak. S1ation 6, locared at 1216 Ooldcn Bear Trail. Station S located at l009 Boulder 
Mounllin Court is sw'f'ed by Calfire via I leue ~nt with the DistricL 

The Lake V1Jley Fire Protection District service aret includes: California State Highway SO 
from C&mp Sacramento to the City of South Lake Tahoe boundary; California State Hiahway 
19 South from Alpine County Willow Creek RO.S to California State Hiahway SO In Meyers. 

Extendina alot1& California SWe Hia)\way 89 North. me Fire Di1tric1 extends from the Northem 
boundary of the Chy of South Lakt Tahoe (Wett Way) to Eqle Creek In Emerald Bly. 

The service area hu a varied 1opoa,aphy and veae11t!vc cover. It hu rel1tively Hat areaa ajona 
lhe shoreline.. or Lake Tahoe Ilona Pope and Baldwin Beach areas (622S feet II LaJte level). 
Steep hills and moun(ajn peak, over 10,000 feet are part of the Tahoe Bllln. The moat 
prominent peak in the fire District ii Moun1 Tallac at 9735. Veaetatlve cover ranps from 
stands of manzani11 to deNe romlf of fir and plne trees. 

l 

20-0203 I Page 44 of 50 



The main commerciai areas arc in Meyers and Tahoe Paradise alona rhe highway SO corridor. 
Bushwsaes • well • the CaJifomia Aa,icuhural Station. the Meyers Elemenwy School, two 
aotf COUl'1ft and the local Tahoe Pandise Park are in this ara. 

Nei&ftborhoods in vicinity of Pioneer Trail include; Elks Club, Golden Bear, Cold Creek, High 
Melldow, Black 8ert, Kokance Trail. Montaomery Estates., Washoan. This corridor alto 
includes the Siem House School and the South Tahoe Public Utilities District work lites. 

The neighborhoods of North Upper Truckee, Echo View E.s1ates. Mountain View Estates, and 
Tahoe Mountain were affected by the Angora Fire of 2006 with the lou of 2S4 homes. The 
area sees .sipi(ic.nt traffic delays due to tourist travel and i.s hiahly prone to hea..,y snows. 

The neiahborhoods of South Upper Truckee and Christmas VaUey off'ofboth S111e Hiat,way 
SO at Echo Summit and Suite Highway 89 to Alpine County also sutler traffac delays &om 
tourist travel and heavy snows. Echo Swnmit, via State Highway SO. is I funnel ror tnft"wc 
congestion and highly prone to winter avalanches. 

The Stale Hiahway 89 conidor. north to Emerald Bay, is the most heavily travded l'Old the 
Lake Tahoe Basin. Of the estimated 20 million tourist visiting the Tahoe Bain annual, 
rouahly 4. 9 million stop to take a picture of Emerald Bay. This busy highway MIS throuah 
Camp Richardson Resort, Pope. Kiw and Baldwin Beeches .t USFS historic sica. 
Travelina nonh the Mounc TaUa<: lnlil held. accesa to FIUen Leaf lake.. the Cascade Lake Ind 
residential area. the Sprina Creek summer residential areas are pMSed •Iona the way to 
Inspiration Point and Emerald Bay, Vikina, Holm and the Ea&Je Falls Creek. 

The fire District exlends atona Slate Hipway SO. ovet Echo Summit on the west side of the 
Siena craa co the Echo Snow Park· Adventun: Mountain and Siem at Tahoe Ski Resort. 
Additionally the District tervea the hamlets orUnle Norway, the, Moum Ralston Subdivision. 
Echo Likes. Philips. Sierra Pines. Bryan Creek, Tamarack Park, Sayles Canyon and Camp 
SIICl'8fflet\lO. . 

Due lO 1hc remotenes1 ofrhe communities and recrutionat areas orscrawberry, Twin Bridges. 
Hone Tail Falls, Lover's Leap and the 39 mile tnct., Lue Valley Fire District personnel are 
called to serve these areas within the Et Dorado Coun1y Fire Protection District. 

.. S...le Loudon. 
The rel•Uvely youna aeological processes that aqted the Tahoe Basin is still active.. The 
Districts entire land surfac& ia in the hiah-to,.modertte seismic hm.rd mnes. 

b. Sia and Popwlatlon. 
The District coven 8' square miles with I population or 13,000, swellina to over 100.000 
durina lhe summer mon1hs. TM Di1tric1 bu 3 fti. 11adona; two •trod by 22 •fety penonMI 
Md one ( l) Ore slit Ion via Cal nre contract. The Dillrict hll four (4 > Chief Offlcen, lncludina 
the FlNI Chief, one ( t) Fire Prevention Technician, one ( l) Mechanic/Fleet Manqet tnd one (I) 
Administrative Manqer. Overall. there 29 flre lOtlJ District personnel. The District ovenlte is 
via the five (S) members of the Fire Board of Oir.:con. 

4 

20-0203 I Page 45 of 50 



c. Roads and Sh'Hrs. 
Many roads are sub-standard; nanow wtdths, on-street park int, lea thin 20 feet of unobsttucted 
pavement and ingress and egress issues during peak population nuctuations. Some areu are 
served by single lane roads. severely restrictina emerpncy vehicle. 

d. Topography. 
The topography of the District varies from near level to terta.in in excas of 1 40 percent slope. 
AJ a rule of thumb, the rate of fire spread doubles as the slope percenrqe doubles. aH other 
fact.ors remaining the same. 

Most residential and commercial structures, are in, or are surrounded by forested areas, Due to 
drouaht. beetle infestations. tnd heavy veaetation, many the area have dead or dying trees. 
contributing to fire danaer, Elevation ranaes from about 6200 feet a, lake level to over noo 
feet on mounwn pas roads wilh peaks exceedina 9000 feet In elevation. 

e. Vcget•tion. 
Veaetation in the Fire District varies from sub-alpine forcsu of upen and pine to pine and cedar 
forests.. with subantial brush fidda of manzanila. snow brush, and while thorn. 

Residential development in the Fire District is ,enerally concenualed in heavily forated areas. 
This situation allows fire to lnlvef easily fi'om home to home. forest to home. or home to fon:st 
by radiation, con\'eded heat and/or ftying embers 01\en dwellinas are completely surrounded by 
hi1hly combustible vegetation. compoundlna the rtre problem. 

r. Summary. 
Local aec,a,aphic and 1opoanphic conditions increase the ftre hazard presented in the D\stricr. 

Other variable$ that tend to intensify the fire danaer include: 
I) damage to the piped water system infrastructure 
2) isolation due to bridge collapse 
3) roadway damqe and/or amount of 

debris blockina roadways 
4) availability of timely mutual aid 

assistance 
S) the pr9ence of dwellings with wood 

shinale or shake roof coverings 

I· Conchuloe: 
Local cllmatie, poaraphlc and 
topoaraphic conditions dac:ribed above increase lhe frequency, 
intensity. and 1ia of ftm invol'lifll buildinp In the Fire Dl11rict. Funher, thelC conditions 
Impact porauial damaae to atn,ctura hm an 11rd,qu1b and subsequent nre. Thereftn, it II 
reuonably necaNrY thac Che Callfbmia Fire Code be modtned to mltipte 1he eff'ectt or the 
abow conditions. 

s 

20-0203 I Page 46 of 50 



Cuhfomi;.i Health & S.lkt; Cudi: ,;;c,:1i,n1 17958 7 ri:<1111rcs 1hal 1m,dll'il.:t1l1rnh io the Fire lode~ 
.:xpr.:s:11~ 111;1rt..:d ,llld 1d..:n1dicJ U!\ !1; whit.:h ;,:/ich fin.JH1!f rdcr-. w \\ h11:-h Code 1111Klilkt1 ion fhc 
f,,!iowing llll'llc prm tdC\ thl\ CPllllt'.,'.llt\11 

Cod(!' ~L-----·-· ... Findin~ 
Chapr1:r 1 ,.\dminis1mtiv<: 
Chapter~ .-\d111i1fr•,m111v.: 
Chapter J l.(a). I .(bl. 
Chapk·r 5 I.( a), ii.( c) 
Chnpl,:r 6 1.{d). l(e-), II {,ij ll.(1~i. lL!d! 
Ch,iplc( LJ L(a). 1.(c i. 11, .k I 

Ch;lplt:r 12 l.(a). 
(huplcr U IL(c) 
Chup11.·r ¥1 l.(a ). L(d I I i,h ,. I t .(,) 

Chuptcr .50 Ad111inislrnti1:.; 
Ot:tpkr 56 I. II. 
Ch1tp11.:r 57 l.(.i). L(bl. I tel. ii fai. i! ibl 
Ch,11,1.:r 58 I.Id>, IL (i>l. lllcl 
<'huph:r 61 L{a). Lie/. !I (b~. 
,\ppi:mli\ I) f.{a). L(d. 11.(a!. Ii {h;, IUcL II (1.f}. !l {c.:i 

,\,J.,f'lh:d b:, lfa: follmv'ing vol_,: oy lhi: Boaro of 01ri:c:1¥"'· "' th;: L,f..,· V.ilk} ~ 1r,; l'n•t1;.:tiun Dic;tns:i 
1h1 .. / 'f cta::, qf IV Jv~""!l:ii.t:.: 20tri 

;J < ' •• • / id,)!:.- .,..J--
/~ ,;!' ~ ....... .,, .... , J __ _ 
Rnbcn !kt1.:n,,,u1\ 1._ hairJ:icr:•,.,n 

Al I I, i 

20-0203 I Page 4 7 of 50 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted as Amended Finding 
101.1 X Admin 

105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

114.1 X Admin 

114.2 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ical 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d} X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.6 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opographical 

503.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

505.1 X Climatic/Geological 

505.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

506.1.1 X Climatic/Geological 

506.1.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opographical 

507.5.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

507.5.7 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opographical 

604.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

901.4.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

901.11 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra phical 

901.12 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

901.13 X Admin 

901.14 X Admin 

902 X Admin 

903.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phical 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topographica I 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phica I 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opographical 

903.2.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phica I 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.4.4 X Geological/Topographical 

20-0203 I Page 48 of 50 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opograph ical 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geological/T opographica I 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phica I 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Cli matic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ical 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topograph ica I 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6102 X Admin 

6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ical 

6112 (1) a,b,c,d,e,f X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phical 

6112 (2) X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phical 

6112 (3) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112 (4) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112 (5) X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phical 

6112 (6) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112 (7) X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ical 

6112 (8) X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phical 

6112 (9) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112110) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
6112 (11) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112 (12) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6114 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6115.1 X Admin 

6115.2 X Admin 

Appendix 0: 0103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: D103.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phical 

Appendix D: D103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: 0104.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phical 

Appendix D: 0104.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D104.4 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phical 

Appen~lix 0: 105.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: 105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

20-0203 I Page 49 of 50 



20-0203 I Page 50 of 50 




