RESOLUTION NO. 041-2020

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF ELDORADO
(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 017-2017)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is
updated by the State every three years; and,

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January I, 2020; and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part
2, Chapter I, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety
regulations to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building
official, or his or her authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or
his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the
chief of the Lake Valley fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and
maintain a memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities
pertaining to the inspection of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on 12th of December 2019, the Board of Directors of the Lake Valley Fire
Protection District adopted Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopted the 2019 California Fire
Code with amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or
topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District and
delegates enforcement of the ordinance to the Lake Valley Fire Protection District Chief, or his
or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following
sections:

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 114.1, 114.2, 202, 302.1,307.1.1
307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4 4,
503.6, 503.6.1,505.1, 505.1.1,506.1.1, 506.1.3, 507.5.4.1, 507.5.7,604.1.2,901.4.7,901 .11,
901.12,901.13,901.14, 902, 903.1, 90 3.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2 4,
903.2.7,903.2.8, 903.2.9,903.2.10, 903.4.4,907.2.a through 907.2.d,907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3,
3310.3, 3312.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2,
6102, 6104.2,6112,6112 (1) a,b,c,d,e.f, 6112 (2), 6112 (3), 6112 (4), 6112 (5), 6112 (6),6112
(7), 6112(8), 6112(9), 6112(10), 6112(11), 6112(12),6113.1,6113.2,6114,6115.1,6115.2,
Appendix D103.1 through DI03.3, Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix D104.2, Appendix
D104.3, Appendix D104 .4, Appendix D 105. 1, Appendix D105.2.

20-0203 | Page 1 of 50



Resolution No. 041-2020
Page 2 of 2

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24,
Part 9, in its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International
Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403 4,
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12,
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405 .4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808,
904.1.1,1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106,
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception),

D107.1 (Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G,
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019
California Fire Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of

said Board, held the 10 day of  March , 2020, by the following vote of said Board:
Ayes: Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin, Novasel
Attest: Noes: None
Kim Dawson Absent: None
Clerk o ﬁhe Board of Supérvisors g\ [
Ué/ / (OR Mot
Deputy Clerk’ Brian K.'Veerkamp, Chair, Board bf Supervisors

20-0203 | Page 2 of 50



' LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

“Serving the Community Since 1947
Tim Alameda, Fire Chief
Bemaed oF irectns
teons Mlen
Robert Hetiomeonnt
John Rive
Hean Flogan
s \lowe

Pecember 18. 2019

Dan Ashton. Chiel’ Administrative Officer
11 Darado County Board of Supervisors
330 Fair Lane

Placerville. CA 93667

Subject:  Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District,
which adopts the 2019 California Firc Code with amiendments related to local climatie,
geographic and topographic conditions.

Pear Mr. Ashton:

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District is requesting the Board ol Supervisors (BOS) ratify its
Ordinance No. 2019-01 which adopts the 2019 Caltlornia Fire Code as amended due to specilic focal
cliniutic, geographic and topographic conditions. California Tealth and Salety Code Scction 13869.7
requires the legislative bady of the city or county where the ordinance will apply 1o ratify, modify or
deny the adopied ordinance. The BOS must also delegate enforcement ol the ordinanee to cither the Fire
District (or its representative) or the Chief Building ()Hu.ml.

Therefore. we request the Coumy Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2019-01 with amendments
to the 2019 California Fire Cade. and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the Lake Valley
Fire Protection District Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed Tor your review and use on this

Lopic.
This resolution has no direet fiscal impaet to the County.
Sincerely.
- ] R . 7
| U M\/L(‘/(

T Alameda
I"ire Chicl

ATTACHMENTS:

1. Lake Valley Fire Protection District Ordinance No. 2019-01

2. Lake Valley Fire Protection District Finding of Fact Resolution No. 2019-08
3. Draft €l Dorado County BOS Resalution

Respeet, Imu;.ril\ I)wlic.nion. Positive Auilmlc .m|l 'I’num\mrl\

20-0203 | Page 3 of 50

y




Attachment No. 1

LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT,
ORDINANCE NO. 2019-01

20-0203 | Page 4 of 50



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ORDINANCE NO, 2019-01

AN URGENCY ORDINANCE FOR [HE LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTCCTION DISTRICT
AMENDING THE FIRECODE OF THE DISTRICT PERTAINING TOTHE AMENDMENT AND
ADOPTION GF THE 2019 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CGDE
(TITLE 24, CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS): PART 22019 CALIFORNIA FIRE
COODE) INCLUDING APPENDICES B C. D HL L Mand O, AND REPEALING ORDIMANCE
NUMBER 2016-01, OF THE LARKE VALLEY FIRL PROTECTION DISTRICT AND ALL
OTHER ORDINANCES AND PARTS OF THE ORIANANCES IN CONFLICT THEREWITIH.

WHEREAS. fire protection districts are generally required to adopt the State Building Standards,
und

WHEREAS. fire protectian districts are allowed w make atendments 1o those state standards when
justified by local wopographical. climatic and geographicat conditipns. and

WHEREAS. camemporancously herewith the Board of Drectars has nade such findings and
dirccted that they be submitted 1o the State forthawith,

NOW, THERLIOR BLITORDAINED BY THE LAKE VALLEY FIREPROTECTION
DUISTRICT, AS THE GOVERNING BOARD OF THE DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS,

Section H FINDINGS OF FACT:

Section 22 ADOPTION OF CODE WITH ENCLUSIONS:

Seetion 3 LOCAL AMENDMENTS:

Section 4 CONFLICT:

PRI L e

Seevion 3T SEVERABILITY .

Seetion 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

20-0203 | Page 5 of 50




SECTION I: FINDINGS OF FACT
The Lake Valley Fire Protection District (LVFPD) makes certain changes (listed

below) to the California Fire Code, 2019 Edition, pursusnt to Hesith and Safety Code Sections
13869.7, 17958.7 and 18941.5 during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary
because of local climatic, geological and/or topographic conditions. The LVFPD has adopted,
pursuant 1o Section 18941.5 of the California Health and Safety Code, the findings of facts relative o
these conditions by Resolution #2019-08 of the LVFPD dated November 14, 2019.

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
The LVFPD adopts the 2019 Califomia Fire Code, Title 24, Pant 9, |5 its egtirety, including
Appendices, incorporating those sections of the Internationa! Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by
the state, with the exclusions lissed below:

Exciusions: 105.6.17-105.6.19. 105.6.39, 308.1.4,309,311.5,311.6,318, 403.1, 403.2.1-
403.2.4, 403.3, 403 .4, 403 .6, 403.7, 403.8 (sdopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9. 403.10.2, 403.10.3,
403.11, 403,12, 404.1-404 4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 305-307 (adopting $07.5.2), 808, 904.1.1,
1104, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9 (adopting {103.9.1), 1103.10, 1 104- 1 [06, Chapter 25, Chapter
26, the exceptions under D104.2, D106.1, DI07.1 (1), Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G,
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopied can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019
California Fire Code.
SECTION 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS
The following Sections are hereby amended or added:
Chapter |
- Section 101 Scope and Genernl Requiremants
181.1 Titly shall be amended as foliows: add name of jurisdiction {Lake Valley Fire
Protection District|

Section 183 Permita

- 195627 LPG-gas shall be amended ss follows: Add to the exception: At or sbove $,000
fest of sisvation, a permit is not required (or individual containers with a 125-galion water
capacity or less, or multiple container systems having an sggregate quantity not excoeding
125 gailons serving occupancies in group R-J.

2

20-0203 | Page 6 of 50



Section 106 Fees

196.6 Permit, Plan Review and lnsoection Feca shall be added as follows: A schedule
of fees adopied by the Fire District Board of Directors for Plan Review, Inspections snd
the issusnce of Permits by the Fire District may be found in the most currert District fee
schedule (Heslth and Safety Code 1 7951).

186,61 Cont Recovery Fees shall be added as follows: Fire service foes may be charged
to any person, firm, corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the [aw,
or as a result of carolessness, is responsible for the cause of the Fire District to respond o
thve scene of &n incident. A disirict board may charge a fee to cover the cost of say service
which the district provides or the cost of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is
charged. (Health and Safety Code 13916). The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of
suppressing the fire and/or responding: to the scene of an incident.

186.7 Administrative Costy shall be added as follows: When & test or inspection is
scheduled and the contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the suthority having
jurisdiction, the authority having jurisdiction may bill the contractor for actual time spent
traveling to and from the test/inspection location and the time spent st the test/inspection
site as weil as ndministrative costs.

Section 110 Viclations

110.4 Vielaticn Penalties shall be amended as follows. Persons who shall violate a
provision of this code or shall fail to comply with say of the requiremants thereof or who
shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved construction
documents or directive of the fire code official, or of 8 permit or centificale used under
provisions of this code, shall be guilty of & misdemeanor or infraction, at the discretion of
the prosecuting attorney or agency, punisheble by s fine not exceeding $100.00 for » first
violation; 2. A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of the same provision
within one year; 3. A fine not exceeding $1000.00 for each additionsl violation of the
same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not excesding |80 days, or both such
fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violstion continues alter due notios has been

served shall be deemed & separsie ofTense. (Health and Safety Code Section 13145 and
17995).

20-0203 | Page 7 of 50



110.4.2 Citationg shall be added as foltows: The Chief, or his/her duly authorized
representative, may issue citations for it’\ fractions or misdemeanor violations of this code
pursuant to Section 13871 of the Health and Safety Code of the State of California and
Chapter 3¢ (commencing with Section 853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the
State of California.

Section 112 Stop Work Order

112.4; Failure 10 Comply shatl be amended as follows: Any person who shall continue
any work after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person
is directed to perform to remove a violstion or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of
not less than one hundred ($100) dollars or more than one thousand (31,000} dollars.
(Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995).

Section 114 Reserving of Rights

114:1 General. There is reserved, to the Board of Directors of the District, the right to
amend, modify. supplement, revoke in whole, or in part, any of the provisions contained or
incorporated herein, at any time and from time to time,

114.2 Limiagion of Righta. Nothing herein contained shall be deemed to limit or restrict the
rights, duties or obligations given, granted or opposed upon this District by the laws of the
State of Califomia now in effect or hercinafter adopted.

Chapter 2

-

Section 202 General Definitions

Add definition for Approved shall mean - as accepted by the Fire Chief of said District or
their suthorized representative, or as approved pursuant (o the standards now existing or
hereafler adopled by the District.

Add definition for Camplire shall mean - a fire which is usod for cooking, personal
warmth, lighting, or aesthetic purposes. This includes fires contained within outdoor
fireplaces and enclosed stoves with flues or chimneys, sioves using jellied, liquid, solid, or
gaseous fuels, portable barbecue pits, braziers, or space heating devices which are used
outside of any structure, mobile home, or any living sccommodstion mounted on a
vehicle.

Add definition for Corporntion or Distrist Counael shall mean - the attorney for the

District.

20-0203 | Page 8 of 50



Add definition for District shatl mean - the District and all other areas within the exterior
boundaries thereaf as now or hereafter established.

Add definition for Driveway shall mean - a vehiculsr access that serves no more then
three dweiling units on s single parcel, and any number of accessory buildings.

Add definition for Expeutive Body shall mean - the board of directors of the District.
Add definition for Firg Chief shall mean - the Chief Executive Officer of the Fire
Department/District seeving the jurisdiction, or & duly suthorized representative,

Add definition for Jurisdiction shal! mean - all areas within the District boundaries,

Add definution for Paraon(s) shall mean - all persons, firms, associates, organizations,
corporations, individuais or other agency.

Add definition for Shal) shall mean - mandatory .

Add definition for Mgy shall mean - permissive.

Add definition for Trained Crowd Maasger shail mean - standby personnel, ususity s

security guard or usher personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure 1o exit people

feom a tent or other place of public assemblage in an orderly and calm faghion in the event

of an emergency.

Chapter 3

Section 382 Definitions
302.1 Defigitions shall be amended as follows: Added Campfire definition as shown
sbove in Chapter 2.

Section 387 Open Burniag, Recreational Fires and Pertable Outdoor Fireplaces

ires. Fortatie Outdoo [$8

N Crogibiteq Open Bucal RRLItE B¢ [ ¥ :
Recrestional Fires nsd Camp(lirs Rasirictions shall be added as follows:
307.1.1 Open burning, campfires, bonfires, portable outdoor fireplsces and recrestiona! fires,
shail be prohibited when atmospheric conditions or {ocal circumstances make such fires
hazardous including when, in the judgment of the Fire Chief or his designee, the menace of
destruction by fire to life, improved property, or nstursl resources is, or is forecast to become,
extreme due to critical fire westher, fire suppression forces being hesvily commitied to
control fires already burning, acute dryness of the vegetation, or other factors thet may ceuse
the rapid spread of fire such as high winds, low fuel moistures, fire weather or Red Flag
Wamings, severe threat of wildland fire, or issusnce of Fire Restrictions on lands sdjacent 10
the District by the United States Forest Servica or Ca IFire.

Exceptions:

{. Prescribed bumning for the purpose of reducing the impact of wildland fire when
authorizod by the fire code official.

20-0203 | Page 9 of 50




2. Gas (LPG, NG) outdoor fire pits and berbeques, pellet grills/smokers. Except during
Red Flag conditions. All Opes Buming, Camplires, Bonfires, Portable Outdoor
Fireplaces and Racreational Fires ars prohibited during Red Flag Wamings.

3. Campfires and charcoal barbeques in a designated campground and/or picnic area
located on Stase of Feders! lands.

4. Charcoal barbeques for & commercial restsurant, catering operstion or special event,
with sdditional restrictions as permitted by the District.

- 74,4 Campfice Restrictions shall be added as follows:

- 307.4.4.1 ltis unlawful for any person to light, maintain, or use & campfire upon or near
any brush-covered land, grass-covered land, or forest-covered land during the time when
buming permits are suspended by the Director of the Department of Forestry, the
CALFIRE Unit Chief, or the authority having jurisdiction.

- 307.4.4,2 When camplires are sliowed, i should be unlawfut for any person 1o light,
maintain, or use & campfire upon any brush-covered land, grass-covered isnd, or forest
coversd land unless the following minimum requirements sre complied with.
307.4.4.2 (8} The srea within 5 feet of the periphery of the campfire is cleared of all
flammable material and vegetation

- M1.4,4.2 (b) One serviceable shovel with & handie of st least 12 inches is ready for use &t
the immediate area of the camplire.

- M14.4.2 (¢) Campfires shali be limited 1o 1'x1" foot, unless in an spproved manufactured
cooking device or fire ring.

341.4.42 (4} Written permission of the landowner must be obtained prior to the ignition
of the campfire and shall be on site.

Chapter §

- Section 503 Fire Apparatus Access Roads:

- 803,21 Dimzasions shall be amended as follows: Fire apparstus access roads shail have
an unobstructed width of not loss than 20 feet, exclusive of shoulders, curbs and gutters,
except for approved securlty gates in accordince with Section 501.6, and unobstructsd
vertical clearance of not less thin |5 feet. All driveways in the District shall not be less
than 12 feet wide.

- 503.2.5 Dead Ends shall be amended ss foliows: Dead-end fire apperatus sccess rosds
and driveways in axcess of |50 feet in lenathd\tllbepmvidad with an approved srea for
tuming sround fire apparstus.

20-0203 | Page 10 of 50




303.2.6 Bridges and Elovated Surfaces shail be smended as follows: Where a bridge or
an elevated surface is part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed
and maintsined in accordance with any current County Bridge Standard. Bridges and
elevated surfaces shall be designed foe a live load sufficient to carry the imposed loads of
fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when
required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle
use are adjacent to surfaces which are not designed for such use, approved barriers,
approved signs or both shall be installed and maintained when required by the fire code
official.
503.4.2 No Parkiag in Fire Lanes shall be added as follows: No person shall siop, park,
or leave standing any vehicle, whether antended or unattended, except when necessary to
avoid conflict with other traffic or in compliance with the directions of a fire code official,
peace ofTicer or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway, at any curd,
or in any locstion in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking facility,
designated as a fire lane by the fire department or fire district with jurisdiction over the
ares in which the place is located. The designation shail be indicated (1) by a sign posted
immediately adjacent to, and visible from, the designated place clearly stating in letters
not less than one inch in height that the place is a fire lane, (2) by outlining or painting the
place in red and, in contrasting color, marking the place with the words “FIRE LANE",
which sre clearly visibie from a vehicle, or (3) by & red curb or red paint on the edge of the
roadway upon which is clearly marked the words "FIRE LANE".
$63.4.3 No Parking ia Frost of Hydrants shall be added as follows: No person shali
stop, park, or leave standing any vehicle within |5 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows:
{a} If the vehicle is attended by a licensed driver who is seated in the front seat and who
can immedistely move such vehicle in case of necessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or
operated by a fire department and is clearly marked as a fire department vehicle.
503.4.4 Firs Lanes Based on Road Width shall be added as follows: Fire Lanes shall be
based on road width as required in Appendix D ss adopted locally.
50).6 Security Gaiss. Add the following to Section 503.6 of the California Fire Code:
Private road gated entrance!
. Gate openings to be 2 wider than the roadway served.
2. Emergency vehicle sccess shall be provided by both a “Knox™ over-ride switch and an
spproved emergency radio frequency gate opening device (Click2Enter type) or other
device approved by the authority having jurisdiction,

20-0203 | Page 11 of 50




1, An approved hammerhead, turn-around bulb or other means of tum-around shall be
provided on the entry side of the gate.

4. Gates shall sutomatically open from the interior without use of a special code or
device. (Magnetic strip or pressure pad sssemblies sre acceptable).

5. All electric gates shall fsil in the open position, i.c., loss of power, battery failure. All
gates shall be equipped, at & minimum, with {2-hour battery backup.

6. Vertical clearances shali be no less than 15°.

7. Gate shall be locsted no closer than 30" from the intersecting rosdway ultimate odge of
pavement.

8. Provide a separate personne! gate or opening sized and surfaced 10 atlow for
pedosirian and sccessibility access.

9. Gate components shalf be maintained in an operstive condition at all times and
replaced or repaired when defective.

6.1 Se s for residential drivewsys shail be sdded as follows: Gated
residential dnvmys shall have a koy operated overcide switch instalied for fire
department access. The swilch shall be a Knox System typs key switch with "Fire
Department” decal.

- Section 505 Premise Identification

- 5051 Address Ideatification shall have the first line of this paragraph replaced as
follows: Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply with the local district
address standard as approved by the fire cods official.

o, Lot ddresssa shall be added as follows:
i, All bmtdiny Shl" hﬁvt 8 pumnmtty pomd address, which shail be placed at each
driveway entrance and visible from both directions of travel along the roed. In all
cases, the sddress shall be posted ai the beginning of construction and thail be
maintained theroafter, and the address shall be visible snd legible from the road on
which the address is located.

2. Address signs along one-way roads shall be visible from both the intended direction of
trave! and the opposite direction,

3. Whers mulliple addressos are required of & single drivewsy, they shall bs mounted on &
single post.

4. Whaers s rosdway provides access solely to & single commercial or Industrial business, the
address sign shall be placed &t the nearest roed intersection providing access to that site.

20-0203 | Page 12 of 50




-

Section 506 Key Boxes

506.1.1 Locks shall be smended as follows: Any structure which has scoess controlied
by an electric gate shall have a key opersted override switch installed for fire depertment
access. The switch shall be & Knox System type kay switch with “Fire Department®
decal.

2 K xet for baildiags w tomatic sprisjds temas shall be added as
foltows: Any building or complex of buildings, in which an automatic sprinkier system
is installed, shall be provided with a Knox Box®, mounted in an approved locstion.
containing sppropriste keys for fire departmeni access. This section applies to all new
instalistions and existing installations, as required by the Fire Chief.

o, KLY DOxes for Datidiags wi lomatic sprinkd

Section 307 Fire Prolection Water Supplies

507.5.4,1 Snow removal shall be added as follows: No person shali place, push or dump
snow on or around sny fire hydearg or fire depactment conniection, and a minimum of fifleen
{1 5) foot clenr space shall be maintained to the front and sides of any hydrant or fire
department connection.

M Yeln t X § I0% 3
shall be ndded as follows:

The District hereby adopts & public private partnership fund infrastructure and capital
improvements (Psrtnership Fund) o receive contributions of cash or property qualifying
under Internal Revenue Code Section | 70 as a charitable contribution if the contribution or
gilt is made for exclusively public purposes. Contributions to the Partnership Fund shall be
maintsined and sdministered as & separste trust fund subject 10 investment restrictions
applicable t the district in the management of its fund and administered © permit
sxpenditures of sccrued princips! and interest after deductions of ressonable costs of
administration, for infrastructure and capital improvement scquisitions. Operstions snd
maintenance, including but not limited to mobile water supply apparstus such as fire bost(s),
and/or wasr tender(s).

Chapter é

Section §04 — Electricsl Equipment, Wirlng and Hazards:
Section 604,12 Instaligtions shall be sdded as follows: Emergency power systems and
standby power systems shall be installed in accordance with this code, NFPA 110 and NFPA
t11. All buildings with stand-by power shall have a shunt trip devics that disconnects ail
power sources to the building, approved by the Fire Code Official. Existing installations shall
be maintained in sccordance with the original approval.

20-0203 | Page 13 of 50



Chapter 9

- Section 90! ~ Geversl:

- 991.4.7 Application to Now and Existing Structures shall be added as foltows: The
District sssumes no responsibility for installation, maintenance, operation or monitaring of
the system the same being solely that of the owner of the struciwe. The provisions of this
Chapter, and, or those requirements in the California Fire Code relsting to sutomatic
sprinkler systems shall apply to & structure, and the entire structure sha!l bs mads to
comply with these provisions, under any of the following circumstances:

I, When a building permit is issued for & new structure, or a new structure where no
permit is required uniess plans were previously approved by the District prior to the
effective date of this chapter, or any structure found 1o have been constructed after the
effective date of this chapter, without a permit when a permit woukd have been required;
o

2. When there is a change in use in all, or 8 portion, of an existing structure which would
cause occupancy classification to change o 2 Group A, E, H, {, R-1, R-2; or

3. When a building pormit is issued to atiow additions to be made to an existing structure
30 a5 to: ({) incrense the Total Fire Area of the original structure greater than fifty percent
(50%) and (2) the aggregate square footage of the existing building and the addition
exceeds the square footage threshold in section 901.2 of the District Fire Code or 3600
square feet for R3 occupancies including attached garage.

- 99L11 Fire Alarms Required shall be sdded as follows: All vaives controlling the water
supply for sutomatic sprinkler systems and water-flow switches on all speinkler systems
shall be electrically supervised. Valve supervision and water-flow alarm and trouble
signais shall be distinctly different snd shall be automatically transinitted to sn approved
central station, incheding R-3 occupancies when a
sprinkier system of more than 100 heads is instalied.

- 99112 Fire Alnrms Reguinted shall be edded as follows: All fire alarm systems insialled
or maintained in the District shall be installed and maintained in accordance with the
requirements of this article.

1. All devices and equipment shall be constructed, instatied and maintained in conformity
with National Fire Pratection Association Stsndard 72 for central station signaling
systems. All smoke detectors as required in the California Building Code for residential

10

20-0203 | Page 14 of 50



structures shall be interconnected 30 83 to sound an alarm throughout the entire structure
should a single detector be activated.

2. When s fire alarm is required, shop drawings as required by NFPA 72 are required to be
submitted for review prior to instaliation of such systems.

3. All fire alarm systems shall be supervised in a manner acceptable to the Fire Chief.

4. Upon recommendation of the Fire Chief, the Board of Direciors may sdopt by
resolution such additional rules and regulations relating to the installation, maintenance,
and use of fire alarm systems as are consistent with good practices,

5. Every required fire alarm system shail be mainuined in good working onder and shail
be repaired and/or restored to such within twenty-four (24) hours after activation or
failure,

6. Any building or complex of buildings with an automatic fire alarm system shall be
provided with 8 Knox Box, mounted in an approved location, containing appropriste keys
for fire department access. This section applies o ali new installations and existing
installations a3 required by the Fire Chiell

90113 Firs Alarm Veadoc Reguiations shali be added as follows: Fire alarm vendors
shall comply with the following:

1. Upon demand, each vendor shall provide the Fire Chiel with the address of each
building, place, or premises within the District for which the perminoe sells or installs »
fire alarm system.

2. Each vendor who installs or services a fire alarm system shall clearly instruct the
subscriber in parson, snd in writing, in the proper use and operation of the fire alarm
systsm, especially those factors which could cause false alarms.

3. A vendor st all times shall maintain its equipment in good state of repair at no cost o
the Department.

4. Any parson, firm or corporation providing service under the authority of this article
shall provide repeir service (0 its subscribers within twenty four (24) hours after
notification that there is (rouble with the fire slarm system, or the aystem has
malfunctioned.

5. Each vendor shall display to the Fire Chiel, upon request, the permittes’s records of
inspection and repeir of any fire slarm system.

6. Each vendor shall notify the monitoring center whenever s subscriber's fire alarm
system is under sarvice or repair.

1

20-0203 | Page 15 of 50



991.14 Nuisance Alnrma shall be added as follows: Any fire alarm of which continuous
activation is determined by the Fire Chief to be a auisance alarm will subject the owner of
such fire alarm to & one hundred dolinr (3100.00) fine.

Sectins 991 Defigitions: The following definitions shall be added:

Yender shall mean any butiness opersted by a person, fim, or corporation who engages in
the activity of alerting, installing, icasing, maintaining, repeiring, replacing, selling or
servicing fire alarm systems.

Apuroved shali mean accepied by the Fire Chief and in accordance with the requirements of
the Underwriters Laborataries, Inc., the Factocy Mutual Engineering Corporation, The
Nationa! Bureau of Standards, the National Fire Protection Associstion, or the State Fire
Marshal.

Awdible Algris shall mean an alarm system, which when activatod generates an sudible
sound on the premises.

Enlse Alarm shall mean sn alarm signal, either silent or audible, prompting s response to be
made by the Fire Department when an emergency situstion for which the alarm system was
intended does not exist.

Firs Alarm System shall mean any manual or automatic means of detecting fire, and
iransmitting ainrms of fire from privale premises and shall include all types of interior fire
alarms systems and suxiliacy fire alarm systems approved by the District.

Local Fire Alacm Svatem shall mean any fire alarm system designed solely to provide an
atarn of fire within the protected premises.

Ssbscriber shall mean s person who owns or Jeases property or premises on which sn alarm
system has boen insialled or is proposed to be installed or who contracts or proposes o
contract with an alarm business foc the leasing, servicing, or maintaining of an slerm system,
and who has or will have the authority to cause the alanm system (o by serviced, repaired, or
removed after the system is installed.

1

20-0203 | Page 16 of 50




Section 903 Firs Sprinkiers:

993.1 Nop-freczing shall be added as follows: All sutomatic fire sprinkier sysiems shall
be of the anti-freeze type or other approved non-freezing (including air filled) type of
system.

993.2. Whers Reauired shall be added as follows: Status of existing buildings greater
than 3,600 square feet. In existing buildings 3600 square fest or grester, other than one
and (wo-family dwelling units, and agriculturs! buildings not under Special Use Permit for
commercisl purposes, where the lloor area of the building or structure is incressed by an
addition of more than thirty percent (30%) or 1,000 square feet whichever is less, such
building or structure shail be made 1o conform to Section 903.2.

903.2.6 Whers Reauired shall be sdded as follows: Status of existing buildings less than
3,600 square feet. In existing buildings 3,600 square foet or less, other than one-and two-
family dwelling units, and agricultural buildings not under Special Use Permit for
commercisl purposes, where the floor area of the building or structure is increased to a
tota! square footsge over 3,600 squars foct, by an eddition of more than thinty percent
(30%) or 1,000 squars feet, whichever is less, such building or structure shall be made to
conform to Section 903.2.

203.2.1 Group A shall be amended as follows for A groups A-1 through A-4: 903.2.1.}
(1) The fire area exceeds 3,600 square foot.

993,23 Group I shell be amended as follows: 903.2.3 (1) Theoughout sl Group E firs
areas grester than 3,600 square fost in sres.

903.2.4 Group F-1 shati be amended as follows: 903.2.4 Group F. 903.2.4 (1) A Group F
fire arsa exceeds 3,600 square fost.

903,27 Group M shall be amended a3 follows: 903.2.7 Group B and M. 903.2.7 (1) A
Group B and M [lire sres exceeds 3,600 squars faet,

903.2.8 Grous R shall be amended as follows: 903.2.8.1 shell have the following
verbiage added 0 the end of the psragrsph: Fire sprinklor systems shall be installed in new
manulsctured homes (HSC sections (8007 & (8009) and multiple family manufactured
homes with two dwelling units (HSC 18008.7) in sccordance with Title 23 of the
California Code of Regulations.

903.2.9 Group §-| shell be smended as follows: 903.2.9 Group S.903.2.9 (1) A Group S
fice ares exceeds 3,600 square fest.

20-0203 | Page 17 of 50



963.2.18 Greup S-1 Euclosed Parking Garsges shall be amended as (ollows: 903.2.10
(1) Where the firs sres of the enciosed parking garage exceeds 3,600 square feet.
21344 Residestinl accupencies shell be added as follows: All residentiat occupancies
require sudible notificastion in all sleeping rooms of a sprinkler waterflow alarm. This
notification must be &t least 75db st pillow height.

Section 997 Fire Alarm and Detection Systems:
907.2.2 Where Reauired ~ New Bulidings or Siruciures less than 3,600 sguare feet
shail bo added as follows: An spproved fire alsrm/detection system shall be installed in aff
buildings with a {loor arca less than 3,600 square feet.

o Exceptions:

*  One- and two- ity dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies
classified as “U™).

*  Agriculturs! buildings not under Special Use Permit and/or not used for
commarcial purposes (e.g. retails sales, food service, and/or special
evenis).

«  Buildings with a {loor sres less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as
determined by the Fire Chief, based on building coastruction materisl and
features, location, occupancy type, and distance 10 exposures.

997.2.b States of Existing Buildings shuil be added as follows: in existing buildings
without sn approved sutomatic sprinkler sysiem, other than one- or two-family dwelling
units, agricultural building not under Special Use permit for commercial purposes where s
fire slarm detection system does not exist and the floor sres of the building or structure is
increased or modified by moce than thirty percent (30%) or {000 square feet, whichever is
less, such building or structure shail be made w conform to Section 907 when required by
the Fire Chiel. Buildings with a floor area less than 300 square feet may be exempt, as
determined by the Fire Chiel, based on building construction materials and features,
location, occupency type, snd distance [0 exposures,

997,25 Monitering shall be added as follows: All fire alarm/detection sysiems shail be
connected directly through snd monitored by a U.L. spproved central, proprietary or
rernote station service, which gives audible and visual signals st s constantly attended
location, All sprinklered buildings shall be monitored.

14

20-0203 | Page 18 of 50




o Exceptions:
*  One- and two- family dwellings (R-3 Occupancics and other occupancies
classified as “U™).
= Agricultural buildings not under Special Use Permit and/or not used for
commercial purposes (e.g. retails sslos, food service, and/or special
svents).

- 997.2.d Tyoe | Hood [mstallations shall be added as follows: The requirement of
installation, or replacement, of a Type | Hood System shall require u fire alarm/sprinkler
monitoring system 1o be instalied, or for the hood system to be connected to an existing
fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system for that building.

- 997.6.2.1 Secondary Power Supply shall be added as follows: In accordance NFPA 72,
the secondary power supply providing & minimum 24-hour power capacity under
quiescent load (system operating in & noa-alarm condition) shall be amended to &
minimum 72-hour power capacity.

Exception: The existence of an emergency backup power supply that meets or exceeds
the requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12.

Chapter 12

- Section 1203 Emergeacy and Standby Power Systems

- 1203.1.3 iastalistion shall be amended as follows: Emergency power systems and
standby power systems shall be installed in sccordance with the California Building Code,
the California Electric Code, NFPA 110 and NFPA 111, Al buildings, other than one- and
two-family dwelling units, and agricultural buildings not used for commercial purposes,
with stand-by power shall have s shunt trip device that disconnects ali power sources to
the building, approved by the Fire Code Official. Existing installations shall be
maintained in sccordence with the original approval.

Chapter 33
~  Section 3310 Access for Firefighting

- 3318 Premise identification shall be added as follows: Prior 0 and during
construction, an approved address sign shall be provided at ssch fire and emergency

vehicie access road entry into the project.

15

20-0203 | Page 19 of 50



-

Section 3312 Water Supply for Fire Protection

3312.1 When reguired shall be smended as follows: Required fire hydmnts shall be
installed and approved for continuous service prior to combustible materials arriving on
site or vertical construction commencing.

Chapter 49

Section 4905 - Wildfire Protection Bailding Coastruction

4905.4 Roof Covering Standacd shall be added as follows: All new construction,
including additions, requires & Class A roof covering or assembly, All re-roofing requires
Class A roof covering or assembly as a minimum. Re-roofing in excess of fifty (50)
percent of an existing structure within any one-year period will necessitate that the entire
roof be a Class A roof covering or assembly as a minimum. Class B or C fire retardant
treated and/or nan-treated wood shake or shingles are not approved as a roof covering
materizl for Class A assembly.

Chapter 50

-

Section 5001 General

5001.7 Liability foc Damagea shall be added as foliows: Any damages or cost resulting
from the careless handling, spiil or discharge of any hazardous materinls shall constituent
debt against any such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge. This
debt is collectibie by the fire chief in the same manner as in the case of an obligation under
contract, expressed or implied.

Chapter 56

-

-

Section 5681 General

5601.2 Permit Reguired shall be amended as follows: Permits shall be required as set
forth in Section 105.6 and reguiated in accordance with this section. Where explosives
permits are required, they shatl be issued by the Fire Chicef, or his/her representative, and
the County Sherifl"s Department. Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be
issued by the Fire Chief and the County Board of Supervisors.

5601.2.1 Documentation shall be added as follows: The AHJ shall have the authority to
request documentation regarding all aspects of the fireworks presentation.

5601.2.2 Proncisiary Information shall be added as follows: The AHJ will protect all

proprietary information.

16

20-0203 | Page 20 of 50




* Chapter 57

Section 5704 Storags
, gcations Where Above-Groam % Prohibited shall be smended

s follows: Storage of Class | and Class | flammable liquids in sbove ground tanks outside
of buildings is prohibited unless appwoved by the fice chief. When permitted by the fire chief,
all sbove ground wank{s) or vault installations for the storuge of Class |, 1l or 11l lammable
and combustible liquids shall comply with those requirements as set forth by the California
Fire Code, The California Fire Code shall siso apply to instalistions other than motor vehicle
fusl disponsing stations where above ground storage is required.

t

- 1 o

Section 5796 Special Operations

3106.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited shall be amended as
foliows: Storage of Class | snd Cilass 11 flammable liquids in above ground tanks outside
of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the Fire Chiel. When perminied by the Fire
Chief, all sbove ground tank(s) or vault instaliations for the storage of Class |, H or |]1
fismmabile and combustible liquids shall comply with those requirements as set forth by
the Califomia Fire Code. The Californis Fire Code shall also apply o instalistions other
than motor vehicle fuel dispensing siations where above ground storage is required.

Chapter 58

Section 5806 Flammabie Cryogeanic Fluids

3506.1 Limitations shal! be amended as follows: Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids
in stationary contsiners outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the fire chiel.
When permitted by the fire chief, ali stationary containers for the storage of flammable
cryogenic fluids shall comply with those requirements as set forth by the Califomia Fire
Codo. The California Fire Code shall also apply %o installations other then motor vehicie
fuel dispensing stations where sbove ground storage is requined.

Chapter §1

-

Section 6192 Deflnitions the following definitions shall be added:
isatalintien shall mean a storuge tank designad for the containment of liguefled petroleum
§AS. or meter sssembly regulating nstural gas, for use by a customer for residential,

17

20-0203 | Page 21 of 50



commercial, or industrisi purposes, iogether with sppurteaant pipes, risers, gauges, snd
LEG Liquefied patroleum gas.

Susalisr sheil mean any person or business, which sails, st retail, LPG, or sny company,
which supplies naturel gas, for residentisl, commercial or industrial use.
Iatarrandion of Servigs (shall only apply to LPG installstions) shall mean the service shail
be considerad to be interrupted whenaver service is discontinued because of haxardous
condition, changs in size or type of service, whengver the tank, meter, reguletorn(s), vaivs or
other exlerior service supply componems are removed, replaced, or repaired, whenever the
service in relocated, whenever the building, tank piping or components sre damaged 10 the
extert that the servicing utility, fire or building department considers the service 1o be
potentinily hazardous. Normal refilling of an empty or partinily empty tank, and routine
maintenance of interior sppliances, shall not be considered as an interruption of service.

Section 6104 Location of LP-Gas Containery

£104.2 Mazimym Canecity within Established Liits shall be amended as follows:
Tha storags of liquefisd pstroleum gas in excess of an aggregats of 2,000-gallon water
capacity when located st least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for
residential use and st lonst one-haif (1/2) mile from existing residemial development with
» density greater than one (1) dwelling unit per ecre and st least one-half (1/2) mile from
any hotel or motei is allowed when AHJ spproved and & Special/Conditional Use Permit is
issued by the County.

Dispensing within established limits. Within the fimits established by law restricting the
disparsion of liquefied potroleum gas for the protection of heavily populsted or congestod
aroas, the aggregate capacity of any ons installation shall not exceed s water capscity of
2,000 galions. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an sggregate of
2.000-gailon water capacity when located

ot heast one-half (1/2) mile from property zonod or designated for residential use and at
Joast one- half {112) mile from existing residentisl development with a density grester
than one (1) dwelling unit per acre and st least one-twil (172} mile from say holel or motei
is sliowed when AHJ approved and a Special/Conditional Use Permit is issued by the
County.

Saction 6112 High Elevation Ligusfied Petreleum Ges lnstaliations (5,000 foet
clevations and sbovs) shall be added as follows:
Any new LPG instaflstion shall comply with tw following:

s

20-0203 | Page 22 of 50



I. A permil is required by this Code for individusi LPG containers of 125 gallons or greater.
Al the time of application by any person for a permit to install an LPG sysiem ss required
by this Code, the spplicant shall submit an LPG plot plan to the District for spproval and
shail conain the foltowing:

s. Stamp of spproval of the prospective LPG supplier.

b. Tank location showing distances to structure and edge (0 edge of pavement or other
identifying mark.

¢. Tank capacity in US galions,
d. Location of riser pipe & building.
¢. Property boundaries.

f. An outline of all existing/proposed buildings on the lot and a depiction of the roof ridge
line of wny building to be supplied with LPG.

2. Two stage regulsior sysiems shall be instalied on ali LPG instaliations in accordance with
manufacurer's instructions. All first stage regulators and connocting pigiails shall be
installod under a protective valve cover on tank. All reguistors installed under this cover
shall be listed snd approved for this use snd position of mounting. A conmector providing
Nlexibelity shall be used 10 connect the first stage regulator to the main service valve on the
unk. All copper pigtuils shell be internally tinned and use only forged flare nuts.

3. The riser from the yard piping shall be & minimum of Scheduls 30 and shall be located not
movre than 3 inches horizontally from the watlls of the tank, snd swing joints wiil be used
sbove and below tank level to provide for tank movement (street eibows shall not be used).
An approved flexible sherative is preferred in lieu of rigid el pipe for the ank riser. This
shall include but not be timited to plastic (PE), copper tubing. stainless steel. ALL
FLEXIBLE MATERIAL USED FOR THE TANK RISER SHALL BE SHEATHED IN AN
APPROVED STEEL COVER FOR PROTECTION. As swing joints are efiminatad in an
approved flexible alternative, sufficient slack must be maintained o allow for tank
movement snd/or expansion and contrection of the altemative material. All plastic pipe shall
be buried at leust |8” bolow finished grade. An slectrically comtinuous comosion resistant
trucer wire (min. AWG 14} or tape shall be buried with the plastic pipe to facilitate locating.
Owe end shall be brougit sbove ground st the building wall or riser snd the other end shall
be brought sbove ground of the tank.

19

20-0203 | Page 23 of 50



4. The second stage regulator and riser pipe shall be instailed on the gable end of the building,
a3 close a5 practical to the building watl, unless this is not feasible due to structural or
topographical constraints, An spproved gas shutoff valve rated for a minimum of 125 PSI
shali be installed immedintely prioe Lo the second siage regulstor. An approved gas shut off
sign or other identifier shall be instalied directly above the gas shut off valve, on the
building in a visible location within three (3) feet of the eaves of the roof or roof line if no
caves are present. [f the second stage regulator or & combination first/second stage reguistor
is used at the tank, then an approved gas shut off valve shall be located at the building.

5. A protective cover shall be¢ instalied over the second stage regulator snd meter (if installed)
at the building. The minimurm design for the protective cover shall be equal to, or greater
than, the Buikling Design Load (determined by the building department), and shall be
securely supported to the ground or diagonally to the building wall. When supported 1o the
ground, the footing for the supports shall be founded 6 inches below finished grade. Pre-cast
concrete piers may be used in lieu of poured footings, provided they are placed oa stable
soil. If second stage regulator/meter assemblies could be subgect 10 vehicle damage, then
minimum of J* steel crash post filled with concrete shall be instalied for protection. Crash
posts shall have a minimum depth in the ground of 24", embedded in concrete.

6. Observation and inspection, if sny, by the District shali not constitute an spproval of the
work of instalistion of the sfocementioned protective cover, nor shall it be deemed to create
any lisbility or responsibrility on the pen of the District for the dasign or construction of the
protective cover, noe 10 any third party or entity whatsoever.

7. The riser pipes for the yurd piping shall not be embedded in concrete, asphalt or other rigid
substance. Such substance placed around e risar shall be heid back at least 3 inches from all
sides of the pipe. All axposed exterior gas piping used for runs along walls or roofs shall be
minimum schedule $0 stesl pipe supported and secured by approved straps st intervals not to
excend four (4) feet.

$. LPG tanks shall be permanently marked by  square or other approved equal stake of wood
or other material with 8 minimum dimansion of 2 X 2 or 8 cross sectional width of 2°,
nominal lember.

9. Such ssakes shall be of sulTicient height to rise above the snticipstced snow depth, with the
minimum height deing [0 fest. The snow stakes shall be yellow in color and will be placed
on the opposite side of the tank from the riser, and directly opposite the tank valves. The top
twebva inches of the stake shall be painted orange. The side of the stake adjacent to the tank
shall continue with the orange color s minimum of |8 inches from the top of the stake.

20

20-0203 | Page 24 of 50



-

10. instalistion and maintenance of il tank stakes shall be the responsibility of the LPG

supplier. No tank shall be filled or serviced unless staked as provided in this chapter.

11. Any supplier supplying propane to a tank must affix a Iabel or other means of identification

to the inside of the tank vaive protective cover. The label or other device must be wsterproof
and contain the supplier's name and emergency telephone number.

12. All LPG manks shall be placed on approved concrets supports. Accepiable tank supports

shall include, but not be limited to: Pre-cast reinforced concrete pads, reinforced concrete
slab, or pre-cast reinforced concrete saddles. Use of un-reinforced cinder building blocks is
specifically prohibited. If saddles are used they shall contact & minimum of | {0 degrees of
the tank circumference. Asphalt impregnated folt of not less than 3/8" thickness shali be
instatled between the container and the concrete saddle. Supports may by poured in place in
lieu of prefsbricated supports. If poured in place it shall be & minimum of 4 inches thick and
reinforced with not less than WWF 6X 12, W16 by W26 or 4 #3 rebar in each direction. In
areas where tank may be subject to shifting snow, unstable ground or other hazardous
condition, the Fire Chief may require additional tank supporting, securing or protection.

Section 6113 Underground LPG Tasks Instalintions snd Ownarskip shall be added as
follows:

6113.1 Permits and Plaws. Penmits shall be required, and plans shall be submicted for il
underground tank instatiations as approved by the AHJ.

§113.3 Upderaround LPG Tank Oweerahin, Underground LPG tanks shall be
prohibited from being sold to end-users and shall be retained by the LPG company under a
lcase-type sysiem 1o ensure proper annual maintenance roquirements ace met and
recorded.

Section 6114 Naturs! Gas shall be added as follows:
Existing natural gas installations shall comply with the following:

t.  The meter sasembly shall be installed on the gable end of the building, as close as
practical to the building wall, unless this is not feasible due to structural or topographical
constraints.

2, A protective cover, designed to be equal to or greater than the Building Design Load
(determined by the building department), spproved by the supplier, shall be instalied over
the meter sssembly, securely supported 1o the ground or diagonally to the buiiding wall.

21

20-0203 | Page 25 of 50



When sugporied to the ground, the footing for the supports shail be founded 6 inches
below finished grade. Pre-cast concrete piers may be used in lieu poured footings,
provided they are placed on stable 0il.

- Section $115 Violations shall be added as foliows:

~  6115.1 Viglmtions, ki shall be unlawful for an LPG supplier to provide service to a LPG
installation, which does not comply with the provisions in section 6112 or 6113,
- 6115.2 Failure to Provide Cover, Failure by the customer to provide a cover as required

for » natural gas meter assembly is a violation of this code and will subject the customer to
& one hundred doltar ($100.00) fine.

APPENDIX D - FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS

Section 103 Miaiosum Specifications
D103.1 Access Road Width with & Hvdrant shell be amended as follows: Exception:
Driveways

- D193.2 Grade shall be amended s follows:

Fire apperatus access rosds shall not exceed {0 percent in grade.

Exception |: in areas sbove 5,000 R. elevation, driveways of R-3 Occupancies shall not exceed
12 percent in grade, uniess otherwise suthorized by the Fire Chief. IT spproved, tw driveway
slope may exosed 12% (12 vertical feet to one hundred horizontal feet), provided the driveway
mosts or exceeds the prescribed minimum width, snd is no longay in lengih than the maximum
permissible height of the structure within such jurisdiction, bt in no case more than 15 feet, and
has the appropriate transitional slopes st the edge of psvement to property line, snd has no
sigaificant srticulation gremer thasy 45% angle in its entive length).
- D193 Turning Rading shall be smended as follows: The minimum tuming radius shall be
determined by the fire code official; and shall not include curb and gutter.

- DI93.S Firs Apparatus Access Road Gates shall be amended as follows: Whers a single
gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 foet (6096 mm). Where & fire
spparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall not be lesa than |5 feet
(4572 mm).

Section D104 - Commercial and industrial Developments

D184.2 Bulidings sxceeding $2.000 square foet is area shell be amended as follows:
Buildings or facilities having s gross building arca of more than 62,000 square feet shall be

provided with two seperate snd spproved fire spperstus eccess roads. Delete exception.

2

20-0203 | Page 26 of 50



- DiS4.) Ressatasans sheil be srncnded ss follows: Where two sccess roads are required, they
shall be piasced & distance spart oqual 10 not less than one haif of the length of the maximum
overnl! dingonal dimension of the property or ares 10 be served, measured in a straight line
between actemes.

Exception: Fire spparatus rosds cannot be instalied because of location on property,
topogrsphy, watorways, ronnegotiable grades or similar condition, and an spproved
shemative means of fire proteciion is provided.

R184.4 Circumfarsatial Fire Apnacaive Aciess Reads shall be added s follows: When
required by the Fire Cods Official, a fire apparstus access road shall be construcsed o

encompass the entirety of a structure and shall provide s continuous means of emergency
vehicle access.

- Section D183 - Asrisl Fire Apparatus Access Reads

- D19S.] Whare reasired shail be amended as foliows: Buildings or portions of buildings or
facilities axcoeding 30 foet in heigit above the lowest jevel of fire depantment vehicle access
shall be provided with approved fire apperstus sccess roads capable of accommodating fire
department serial apparatus. Overhead utility and power iines shall not be located within the
serial fire apparatus access roadway.
D168.2 Wikith shall be smended a3 follows: Aerial fire apparstus access roads shall have a
minimum unobstructed width of 26 feet, exclusive of shoulders, in the immediate vicinity of
sny building or portion of building more than 30 feet in height.

- Section D106 - Multiple-Family Resldentinl Developments

D196.1 Preiects havies smere than 109 dweiling units shall be amended as follows:
Multiplo-famity residentisi projects having more than 100 dwelling units shall be equipped

throughowt with two seperate and spproved fire apparstus access roads. Delete exception.

«  Section D107 - Oss or Two-Family Residential Developments
D107.1 One- or tweo-family dwrniiing residestinl dursiopments shall be smended as
follows: Developments of one- or two- family dwellings shall be provided with separsee and
approved fire apparstus access roads snd shall meet the requirements of D107.2 Remoteness,
when required by the Fire Chiel. Delsts exceptions.

SECTION 4: CONFLICT
That Ordinance No. 2016-01 of the LYFPD, and il othver ordinances or parts of ordinances herewith

sre hereby repesied.

20-0203 | Page 27 of 50



SECTIONS: SEVERABILITY

Wany Ordinonce. anticle, subacetion or subdivision thereot. provisiat. sentence, <lavse or phrawwe of

this coide, o any apphoation thereat) s for any reason beld o be invalad by a court of campaient
parosdiction, sueh decinon shall aur et the reroaming proveiions of this code, which can be given
offect without the invalid porions und, therefore, such invarlid pastions are deslared © be seversble
The LYFPD hereby declares thid # would huve enacied this Ordimance and cach of 15 arficies,
secnoms. subsections, or subkhivisions thereol provisions, setences. clauses or plvascs irespectoe of

the fact that one ar more of thern s dechired wvalid.

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

This Ordingnge shall take effecy thinty (307 days after i3 adopnon The LYFPD Hoard Sceretiry
dirvected 0 publish thes ordinance o o newspaper of generat circulation w the District, o ley of
publication of the Tull text of the ordinance, a sumasary of the ordinance may be published by the by
the Board Secretary sithin fifteen (13 days after its pussage and a centified copy shall be posted i the

office of the LVFPB. pursuant to Govemment Code Secton 3693 3c) o)

The above Ondinance was mroduced st 8 mecning af the Board of Dhrectives of the LYFPD an
Novemher b6, 209 andd i was then read (or the Brst e, The Ordinance was read Yor the secamd

e oi December 12 2009 and approvedd By the Jubllowing vote:

FASSED AND A TED by the Board of Directurs of thie LYFPD sins, 12th duy of December
019

VER Habes o Tk i NP 41 o apieade b g @ Py
AVES dotier ! Botizncpar i tons Alien Clarg i’ Joba Bl Brign Hogen

NOFS., &
ABSENT £
ABSTAIN: &

ATTEST.
Radegh ,‘Eizldn, Rusarsd Cledk * Rubert Hettoncour. Boand Chairpereson

i
2

20-0203 | Page 28 of 50



Fire Code #

What s the Change?

Amend with the name of the jurisdiction

LVF

Locally adopted and amended

Wiy Is There a Lecal Change?

Adminisirative need

Adopbing this section addresses Climatic conditions: LPG
gas shall be amended as follows; Add to the exception: At
or above 5,000 feet of elevation, a permitis not required for

105.6.27 Add section Locally adopted and amended individual containers with a 125 gallon water capacity o
less, or multiple conlainer systems having an aggregale
quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving occupancies in
group R 3.

Adopling this section to allow for the creation and issuance
" of fees to cover actual cosls. Section 106.5 defines
106.6 Add section Localy created and a pemils, plan checks, and inspections as allowed in Health
&Safety Code 17951.
. ) Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fess: To recover the cost to
106.6.1 Add section Locally created and adopted the Fire Distrct
) Section 106.7 To recover the actua! cosls of avoidable
106.7 Add section Locally created and adopted failed inspections by conbractors,
Completed the section by filing in the blank Allows !hfa Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code thal
portions that were not completed by the SFM. [tis protecis lfe and property. Fees have been updated to
110.4 - ) ’ Locally adopled and amended malch the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the
better left to localities to determine the N
feas/penalties for their respective areas. District Atiomey’s Office. The change to the language to
include the tenm infractions.
110.4.2 Citations is added to read as foliows: 110.4.2
Cilalions
The Fire Chief or his/er duly authorized representative (s),
Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before may issue citalions for infractions or misdemeanor

11042 ‘bul under a different number) Locally qeated and adopled violations of this code pursuanl to Section 13871 of the
Health and Salety Cods of the State of Califomia and
Chapler 5c (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California.

Completed the section by filling in the blank
portions that were not compleled by the SFM. Itis All violations of the code have been consoiidaled under
1124 better lek to localites to delermine the Locally adopted and amended  fo. +on 110.4 to inciude tha penaltes for vilations.
fess/penalties for their respective areas.
Added the ability for the Board of Directors of the District,
114.1 through 114.2 Allows Limitation and Reserving of Rights Locally adopled and amended the righ! to amend, modify, supplement, revoke in whole, or
in part, any of the provisions contained or incorporated
herein, at any ime and from lime to time.
Added definitions for. Campfire, District, Executive Body,
- . Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd Manager.
202 Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopled Defition of campfire shall nol include LPG or Propane
fueled appliances.
3021 Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for cladty

307.1.1 Added restrictions due to weather/Red Flag Locally created and adopled Increase risk of catastrophic wild fire.

307 4.4 through Dus 1o the high fire danger that exists in El Dorado County
30'7 4 4 20(‘3 Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopled we have wiitlen more stringent rules pertaining to open fires

Jwithin grass, brush, and tree covered areas.

20-0203 | Page 29 of 50



Changed vertical clearances to 15 feel and road

Fire apparatus are becoming farger and taller. A vertical
dearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for
apparatus to pass under without damaging spparatus
components. it also allows an extended ime frame before
having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional

§03.2.1 widlhs to 20 feel Locally adopted and amended height for vegetation clearances acls as an increased buffer
) for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of
shoutders, as measured face of curb fo face of curb is
needed. These structures can be difficult to navigate with
fire apparatus and should nol be counted in the total
drivable road surface
Added : . . . Fire apparatus require areas for tuming around when
Fire c;:mﬁ%;:?ﬂi::s?:;:;;ml:g the multiple vehicles are on the scena of an emergency. This
503.2.5 ] Locally adopted and amended includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides
malch as they require lumarounds flor fire apparatus N »
. better access for ingress/egress. Additionslly, adds tum
|access roads and driveways. ;
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150",
Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevaled
Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated Surtaces of E1 Dorado County and Appendix 0 of the
current Fire Code whichever is more restictive to be
503.2.6 Surfaces to state and match E! Dorado County Locally adopted and amended ; ; .
Tran tion Division instead of AASHTO HB-17 consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an
' allemate means & methods that is not less restrictive than
the Fire Code.
. . L This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes”
503.4.2 Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes Locally created and adopled rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicie Code.
, , - This section clearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire
503.4.3 Added section regarding no parking in front of Locally created and adopled  [hydrants" rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehidle
hydrants Code.
. This section deary defines Califomia Fire Code Appendix D
50344 :“’:ﬁ‘:" section regarding fire fanes based on road Locally crealed and adopled [as the reference for road fane width and thir relation to fire
lanes.
Crealed and adopted (o maintain emergency Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on
access and consistency through alf roadway gates roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing
$03.6 through 503.6.1 in E) Dorado County, referring to the gale standards Locally crealed and adopted [the best possible emergency access to mainlain fast
adopted by the FPO's, respoase times.
Added section pertaining lo the visual addressing of Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing
505.1 rbuildings. Locally adopted and amended based on the District's addressing standards.
505.1.1 Added addiional addressing requirements Locally crealed and adopted Establishes instalfation, location, and visibility requirements.
. . . Establishes requirements for permanent posting and
§05.1.1 (1) Added additional addressing requirements Locally created and adopled visibifty requirements from conslruction through completion.
- . ) Establishes requirements for address signs along one way
505.1.1(2) Added additional addressing requirements Locally created and adopted roads assuring visibilty from both directions
. . ) Establishes requirements for multiple addresses accessed
505.1.1 (3) Added addiional addressing requirements Locally created and adopled from a single driveway shal be moounted on a single posL.
Eslablishes requirements for where a roadway provides
. . . access (o a single commercial of industial buliding the
505.1.1(4) Added additional addressing requirements Locally created and adopled addess shal be placed at the neares! road intersection
providing access.
Crealed and adopted (o maintain key boxes and o
6.1 rough locks for buidings with gates andlor sprinkler Localy adopled and amerded [Aow Ffe st 0 requiekey baves ffemergency
o systems. .
507.541 Created and adopted to address snow removal and Locally adopled and amended Altows Fire District to mainlain emergency access without

.|snow storage.

limpedance by snow removal or storage.

20-0203 | Page 30 of 50



Created and added Public Private Partnership Fund

Allows the Fire Distric to adopt a public private partnership
fund infrasiructure and capilal improvemens (Partnership
Fund) to receive contributions of cash or property qualifying

and fire alarms

§07.5.7 for Infrastructure and Capilal Improvements Locally created and adopted under .Intemal Revgnue Code'Secﬁc'm 170lo fupd'
operations and maintenance, including but ot fimited to
mobile water supply apparatus such as fire boal(s), and/or
water lender(s).

Created and added to impose the requirements of ’ .

504.1.2 NFPA 110 and NFPA 111 for emergency and Localy adopled and amended | o e selaion o emergency and standby power

|standby power systems. systems wi -

901.47 Created and added fo address sprinkler systems Locally adopled and amended dleineates the requirements for sprinklers and fire alram on

existing and new buildings

901.11 through 901,14

Created and added to address fire alam syslems

Locally adopted and amended

Added definition for clarity

802

Added definitions for clanity

Locally created and adopted

Added definitions for: Veendor, Approved, Audible Alamn,
False Alamm, Fire Alann System, Local Fire Alarm System,
Subscriber

903.1

Adds a requirement for all sprinkler systems lo be
anti-freeze or non-freezing lype.

Locally crealed and adopted

Due fo the climatic conditions of the District all sprinkler
systems must be of the anti-freeze or non-freezing type to
function properly.

903.2.2

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater
than 3,600 square feel to instaif sprinklers if they
ladd more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the
structure, whichever is less.

Locally created and adopted

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions

of €l Dorado County and their contribuling factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact thal fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
lo b installed In structures once they reach 3,600 square
feel in size as they refate {o fire behavior end rate of
spread.

503.2b

Adds occupant protection for existing buildings less
than 3,600 squate feet to instal sprinklers if they
add mora than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the
structure, whichever is less.

Locally created and adopled

Due to the topographic, dimatic, and geographic conditions
of £1 Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased responsa times, along with the fact that fires
double In size each and every minute, we require sprinkiers
to be instailed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

903.2.1,903.2.3,
903.2.4,903.2.7

These sections were created to give specific
|direction on the sprnkier requirements based on
occupancy and square foolage

Locally adopled and amended

Oue to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of E Dorado County and their contributing factors te our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require Sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feel in size as they refate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

903.2.8

This section was created to include manufactured
residential single family R-3 in the residential
{sprinkler program

Locally created and adopted

Manulaclured Homes ~ The infent of this code section is to
ensure that manufactured homes thal serve as a one of two-
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dweflings of a similar

nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumplion
due fo the light-weight nature of their construction. The
rapid fire spread throughout thesa structures presents a
significant risk {o their occupants. Residential sprinkler
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk
successfully in many Califomia communities.

20-0203 | Page 31 of 50



These seclions were created to give specific

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires

903.2.9, 903.2.10 direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locelly adopted and emended double in size each and every minule, we require sprinklers
occupancy and square foolage to be installed in struclures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate lo fire behavior and rate of
spread.
~ JAdds audible notification in all steeping rooms of a L § . .
90344 sprinkler waler flow alarm in residential Locally created and adopled :"'a“m’ Distirctto require audible of a sprinklar water fow
Added occupant protection for fire alamms in
buidings w'u:' a foor area less than 3600 except Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
R3, AG buildings not used for commercial ! y P
907.2.a , ; Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
purposes, and buildings with a floor area of Jess he event of & fire or smoke.
than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code .
offical.
W ocwpant P O“?d’o" for existing b" idings Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
without automatic sprinkler systems {o install a fire ) o L
907.2b y Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Dapartment notification in
alarm if they add more than 30% or 1,000 squere the event of a fire or SMIOKE.
feet to lhe structure, whichever is less. :
Added occupant protection by stating all fire alamm
delection systems instalied shall be connecled to a Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
907.2.c monitoring service that notifies the fire department Locafly created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
upon activation and is installed per Section 307 of the event of a fire or smoke.
the fire code.
Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
907.2.d systems (o be connected to a monitored fire alarm Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department nolification in
system when installed or replaced. the event of a fire or smoke.
Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due lo PGAE
907.6.2.1 IMoification Locally created and adopted safely related power cutages. .
This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to
1203.1.3 Shunt trip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up
power supplies
. s Addressing for construction sites is important to assist
33103 Address requirements for construction sites ww created and adopled responding emergency crews.
Water supplies at conslruction sites with Water must be on sile prior to combustible material being
312 combustible materials on-site Locally adopted and amended stored or vertical construction commencing.
This section clarifies that within the boundaries of El Dorado
. . . County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are
49054 |fadded 2 sectonto cay roof constcton Locally crealed and adopled |wikdiand fire safe and shal be comprised of & Class A roof
req covening of assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be
installed as they are not a Class A raled assembly.
v g s s e e
5001.7 case a hazar::s materials incident will cause a Locally created and adopled process ot pracice the actual cast wil be passed on fo the
covery fee. negfigent parties.
s ey o gt et b o s
5601.2 . N Locally adopted and amended i to approve them and have a clear underslanding
oxplosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of of the anplications they will be used for
Supervisors for firoworks. pplications they :
The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction mey request any
Fireworks comparies o vendors shall make 1?:::& T:}ugs?;t":;‘g m ;t;ya;n that mI:;ﬂ
$601.2,1 and 5601.2.2 available afl requesied documentation pertaining to Locally created and adopted

the firework prasentation

deem necessary. This information is understood to be
proprielary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as
such.

20-0203 | Page 32 of 50



Eslablished limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammeble and Class I combustible liquid storage in above-

§704.2.9.6.1 Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a
Spedal/Conditional Use Permit from the County.
Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
" . . flammable and Class il combustible liquid special
§706.2.4.4 Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended operations in above-ground tanks, Requires AHJ approval
and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County.
Administrative need to add District name, Established kmits
. . . . as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammabie
5806.2 2:;‘;’::::::‘,’;’ ;ﬂ:ﬁ:ﬁﬁmj’m cote Locally adopted and amended [Cryogenic flids in stationary containers. Requires AH)
approval and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the
County. )
" . Added definitions for: Instalfation, LPG, Supplier,
6102 Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopled Intemuption of Service
Eslablishes dislances between LPG storage and
dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential
. - " ) developments and high-density hotels, molel, apartments,
6104.2 'mﬁr‘;gﬁgﬁm :::g;:ndr::mslng Locally adopted and amended etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would
» [pave  igh proabity ofjr, e, dealh
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use
Permit from the County.
Establishes procedures for the safe handling of propane
above 500 feet. There are special requirements above
] 5000 feet due to snow loads and sheer the made propane a
6112 f::;'::?brv?a sggoﬁzﬁzvm'mms for Locally created and adopted significant ignition source and danger during the winter
months. This section requires certain rules for regulators,
vertical riser plping, markings and locations, and penmil and
Iplan requirements.
Establishes permit requirements for propane tanks greater
. . than 125 Galions. There is a requirement for a plot plan for
6112 (ab.cdef li*::‘;’fm"mw":o'mmﬁmm for Locally crealed and adopled all new instaliaions signed by a Ipg supplie thal contains
building locations, tot lines, capacilies, riser pipe location,
roof ridge line depiction.
Establishes requirements for regulalors. Instaliation of
. . regulators shall meet manufacturers instructions, 1st stage
6112 (2) ﬁ:x :eamr?ﬂ:t:v;mmnaﬂs for Locally created and adopted requiators lo be located under a cover, all regulators must
be listed and approved, flexible connectors shall be used
between first slage regulator and main service valve.
Establishes vertical propane rise requirements for locations
- for the District. Pipe schedule localion, swing joint
Establishes propane vertical riser pipe requirements requirements, and the use of flexible riser piping as well as
6112(3) above 5000 foot elevation Locally crealed and adopted swing joinls. These requirements ara based on significant
fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather conditions
encountered above 5000 feel.
Establishes propane shut off valve requirements Establishes shut off valve requirements inciuding locations
6112(4) above 5000 foot elevation ) Locally created and adopted at the gable end of the building and visibility requirements.
Establishes propane prolective covers for second Establishes conslruction requirements for protective covers
6112(5) stage regulators and meters requirements above Locally crealed and adopled for second stage regulalors and melers induding concrete
5000 foot elevation piers and foolings.
Establishes propane endemnity clause Estabfishes observational and inspection protections for the
61126) requitements above 5000 fool elevaton Locally reated and adopted | L 15y
) . A Establishes propane yard riser pipe requirement dearances
8112 (7) Establishes propans vertical yard rise pipe Locally created and adopted [for concrele inslallations and the use of schedule 80 steel
lrequwemm above 5000 oot elevation . .
: piping as a minumum requrement.

20-0203 | Page 33 of 50



Establishes propane LPG tank markings

Estabishes minimums of a 2°x2" wooden stake lo

6112(8) N' reqirements above 5000 foot elevation Locally cieated and adopled | - - rertly mark tak locations,
6112 (9) N f::mh::;’:::::ﬁg "::‘;""“?‘9‘ Locally created and adopled | Establishes height requirements for stakes.
Establishes propane installation and maintenance Establishes requirements for the slakes to be instailed by
6112(10) N' lrequirements above 5000 foot elevation Locally created andadopled )\ oG suppe.
Establishes marking and tocation requirements for locations
for the District. This section addresses signage location,
Establishes propane marking and location emergency contact information, and snow refated lank
s112(11) N requirements above 5000 foot elevalion Locally crealed and adopled marking requirements. These requirements are based on
significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather
conditions encountered above 5000 feel.
Establishes propane tank support requirements Eslablishes approved propane tank supparts such as pre-
§112(12) N above 5000 foot elevation Localy created and adopled cast reinforced concrets pads, slabs, or saddles
Permitting and Plan submitial requirements for underground
tanks:
Permits and plans shall be submitted and approved Allows us lo require plans be submitted for review prior to
6113 N by the AHJ (Authorty Having uisditin), Localy created and adopted . aiatons of underground LPG tanks, Underground tanks
require substantial maintenance including inspection and
anode replacement al regular intervals.
. Undenground tanks comrode eesily and can lesk without
Requires underground LPG tanks o remain the ) detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when
61132 N propesty of the LPG company Locally created and ed sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground
tanks where cormosion and feaks are more easily detected.
Establishes requirements for natural gas ;s&aeb;is::"r‘;q::r:nm:nnlf g;agiga:eqm;::rfms ;{:
6114 N T::m. meter localions, and proteclive covers Locally crealed and adopled based on significant fre history in heavy snow and exreme
' weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet.
Establishes a violation process for PG installation that
Adds a violation process if an LPG Supplier encounter high snow loads and do not meet Sections 6112
61151 N {provides service to a LPG installation that does not Locally created and adopled or 6113. These requirements are based on sigrificant fire
comply with Sections 6112 or 6113. : history in heavy snow and extreme weather conditions
encouniered above 5000 feat.
Establishes a violation process for LPG instaialion that
o . ] encounter high snow loads and do not meet Sections 6112
6115.2 N mz‘:‘:ﬁg& mgl:r:]::::{ym provide Locally created and adopted or 6113, These requirements are based on significant fire
) history in heavy snow and extreme weather conditions
encountered above 5000 feet.
i . e it is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to
Appendix D: D103.1 _N Made an exception for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended construct a 26 fook wide space for acoess lo a hydrant
Establishes requirements for fire apparatus access Due lo the significant fire history in heavy snow and
. roads to not exceed 10 percent grade and in areas extreme weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet
Append D: D103.2 Y above 5,000 Feet elevation driveways of R-3 Locally adopted and amended these requirements will allow apparatus to access
- |occupancies shall not exceed 12 percent grade. occupancles when heavy snow limils fraction.
' . 20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and guiters due
Appendix D: 0103.3 N Text o include curbs and gulters Locally adopted and amended lo potentisl access issues and luming radius concems.
Appendix D: D1035 § Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided
1’ ' N Fire apparalus access road gates Locally adopted and amended roadway the gale width shall not be less than 15 feet due to
radius issues,
Appendix D: D104.2 Added to require wo equally spaced two fire Where buildings exceed 62,000 square feet two equally
oD 10" 3 ’ N apparatus access roads on buildings that exceed Locally created and adopted spaced fire apparatus access roads will be required to allow

62,000 square feet

access in fite emergencies.

20-0203 | Page 34 of 50




Added {o require circtimferential fire apparatus

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus
access road shall be conslructed to encompass the entire

Appendix D: D104.4 N acoess roads Locally created and adopled structure and shalf provide a continuous means of
emergency vehicle access.
Appendix D; D105 Cf.'.'.?;".{',f t:»::exwe:';oaf?;;:‘::igm etk For the safely of the commurities we lve in, ingress/egress
D105.1. D105.2 ' N capable of ing fire department aeril Locally adopted and amended is required for fire department aerial apparatus to ensure
o ’ " S the safely of the residents and first responders.
pparatus.
For the safety of the communiies we live in, two ways of
Appendix D: D106.1 N Rermoved Excepion in its entirety. Locally adopled and amended ingress/egress are required o ensure the salety of the
residents and first responders.
For the safely of the communities we live in, two ways of
Appendix D: D107.1 N Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirely. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safely of the
residents and first responders.
Adopted with no Amendments
101.2 through 101.5 N m&” 1o estabiish scope, inten!, severabllty and Locslly adopted Administrative darity
102.6 through 102.8 N References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
10210though 10212] N CM""““‘“’@ provisions, Other Laws, Appication of Locally Adopted Administrative diarity
erences
103.1 through 103.4.1 N Definition of the Fire Prevention Division Locally Adopted Administrative darity
104.1 N Ability to enforce the code Locally Adopted Administrative ciarity
104.3 through 104.4 N Right of Entry, Wamants, and identification Locaily Adopted Administrative clarity
104.6 through 104.6.4 N Record retention Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
1048 trough 10492} N ‘t'a““‘t ications, shemale means and methods, and Localy Adopled Administrative dlarty
104.11 through Authonty at fires, ight of access, maintenance of N .
104.11.2 N systems Locally Adopled Administrative clarity
104.11.3 N Authority of systems and devices inoperable Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
105.2.3 N Time fimitation of application Locally Adopled Administrative darily
105.3.1 through } N .
105.32 N Operational permits Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
Dry deaning operational permits required for T .
105.6.12 N hazardous clean; tuse Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
Pormits for various business operations for, Magnesium,
; . . " . miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation
13:2;2;528 through N ﬁ?ﬂ?ﬂz‘:aw for afmn:ﬂsbahve claiity and Locatly Adopted vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing faciliies, open buming,
o specti open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and
organic coatings
Adopled this section for administrative clarity and )
106.6.37 N {fire and i satety inspections Locally Adopted Permits for places of assembly
Adopled this saction for administrative clarity and .
105.6.39 N fire and lfe safety i ions Locally Adopted Permits for private fire hydrents
Permils for pyraxytin plastics, refrigeration equipment, repair
105.6.41 through N Adopled this section for administrative clanity and Locally Adopled garages and molor fuel-dispensing faciities, rooRop
105.6.46 fire and fife safety inspections hefiports, spraying or dipping, storage of scrap tires and tire
by-producls ’
Adopted this section for administrative darity and T -
105.6.48 N Jﬁm sndif salety inspections Localty Adopted Permit for tire-rebuilding plants
Adopled this section for administrative clarity and Permit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material,
105850 N [ it sty npocions Locally Adopted fumber o plywood, in excess of 200 cubic feel)
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and .
106.1 through 106.3 N fire and lfo salety i ions Locatly Adopted Fee schedules for permits
Adopted this section for administrative clanty and ’ ]
107.4 N fe and ife afety inspect Locally Adopted limpecbon authority

20-0203 | Page 35 of 50



Adopted this section for administrative clarity and

Maintenance of safeguards, tasting and operation of
lequipment, re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping,

iﬁm and lifa safety inspections

108.1 through 109.3 ) . Locally Adopted supesvision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding,

fire and e safety inspections Board of Appeals established, limitations on authority, and

qualifications

110.3.2 through Adopted this section for administrative dlarity and Locally Adopted Compliance with orders and notices, prosecution of
110.34 fire and e safety inspections Y violations, and unauthorized tampering

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and ' -
110.4.1 im and e safety inspoct Locally Adopted Abatement of violation

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and . . A
1131 fira and lfe safety inspecions Locally Adopled Authority to disconnect service utilities

‘Asphalt kettles contain highty lammable substances and
303.1 through 303.9 Adopled this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted require stringent saleguards (Climatic, geological, and
Jtopographical)
Managing ignition sources through responsible application
305.1 through 305.5 Adopled this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted of slandards will reduce the number of fires in various
settings (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY
306.1 through 306.2 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopled flammable and require special handling (Climatic,
geological, and lopographical)
] . ] Open buming, re&ea!imal fire, and portable outdoor
307.1 through ,307'5 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted freplaces, (Climatic, geological, and lopographical)
308.1 Adopted this section for fire and ffe salety Localy Adopled Open flame general requirements (Climatic, gealogica), and
topographical)
308.1.2 through . . ) Throwing or placing of ignition sources, torches for
308,13 Adopled this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted removing paint (Climati, geological, and lopographical)
Locations near combustible, open flame devices, signals

308.1.5 through and markers, portable fuel open-iame devices, sky-

. ) . . , lanterns, religious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming
:g.:.:)(exdudmg Adopled this section for fire and life safety Locafly Adopted lood and beverage prepacation, dispensing, containers not
o in use, serving of flaming food, location, fire protection

(Climatic, geological, and lopographical)
) . . Permils are required for above section (Climatic, geological,
308.2 Adopted this section for fire and life safely Locally Adopted and topographical)
Group A occupancies open-fiame decorative devices,
308.3 through 308.4.1 Adopled this section for fire and life safety Locaily Adopted theatrical performances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2
dormitories (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
) ’ General requirements relating o smoking (Climatic,
310.1 Adopled this section for fire and life safety Locatly Adopted geological, and topographical)
N *No Smoking" signs (Climalic, geological, and
3103 Adopled this section for fire and fife safety Locatly Adopled lem phical)
]Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with *No Smoking*
310.4 through 310.8 Adopted this section for fire and kfe safety Locafty Adopted signs, ash trays, buming objects, hazardous environmental
conditions. (Climatic, geological, and topographical}
Vacant premises condilion and safely requirements,
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant
311.1 through 311.4 Adopled this section for fire and iife safety Locally Adopled premises, securily, fira prolecton, fira separation, removal
of combustibles, removal of hazardous materials. (Cimatic,
geological, and topographical)
L ) General requirements relating to mobile food preparation
3191 Adopted this section for fire and lifa safely Locally Adopted vehicles, (Climatic, gsological, and topographical
3192 Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally Adopled Permits. for mobile food preparation vehicles (Climatic,

lgedlogical end topographical

20-0203 | Page 36 of 50




319.3 through
319.10.3

Adopted this section for fire and life safely

Locally Adopted

Exhaust hood, fira protection, fire protection for cooking
lequipment, fire extinguisher, appliance connection o fuel
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, melalliic
storage tanks, nonmetalfic Storage tanks, cooking oil
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting,
nomal vents, emergency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum
aggregate volume, protection of conlainer, LP-gas conlainer|
construction, protection of system piping, LP-gas alarms,
CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel,
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG
container construction, CNG containers supplying
transpiration and cooking fisel, protection of system piping,
methane alamns, maintenance, exhaust system, fire
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems.
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)

403.8.1 through
403.8.1.7

Adopled this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1
{residential care faciliies and group homes) evacuation and
fire safety plans.

403.10 through
403.10.1.3

Adopted this section for fire and ife safety

Locally Adopted

Group R-1 (Boarding house, hatel, motel} occupancy
Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic,
geclogical, and topographical)

405.5

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopled

Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic,
geologica), and topographical)

510.3

Adopled this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopled

A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems
(Climatic, geological, and lopographical)

807.5.2 through
807.5.2.3

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a
maximum amount of lammable wa¥f coverings in
educational facilites (Climatic, gedlogical, and
topographicai)

903.2.1.5

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Localky Adopled

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5
{sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bieachers)
(Climatic, geologicat, and topographical) greater than 1000
square feet. (Climatic, geotogical, and topographical)

1103.2

Adopted this section in existing buildings for the
salety of firefighters end other emergency
responders.

Locally Adopted

Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing butldings.
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from
each other and tha emergency dispatch center. Time
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by
the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind
this section is that on almost alf emergency responder injury
or fatality incidents communication is 8 key issue. This
sitiration can be comrecied with the addition of radio
egquipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have
strong signal, (Climatic, geological, and lopographical)

Appendix D: D101.1
{through D102.1

Adopled this section for the safety of the public,
firefighters, and otfier emergency responders.

Locally Adopled

General requiremnents for fire apparatus access roads
including loads. (Cimalic, geological, and topographical)

Appendix O; 01034

Adopted this section for the safety of the public,
|firefighters, and other emergency responders.

Locally Adopled

Dead end fire apparatus access road requirements for a
tum around at 150 feet. (Climatic, geological, and
topographical)

Appendix D: D103.6

Adopled this section for the safety of the public,
firefighters, and other emergency responders.

Locally Adopted

"No Parking, Fire Lane® signs requirements. (Climatic,
{geclogical, and topographical)

Appendix D: D104.1
through D104.3
(exduding exception)

Adopted this section for the safety of the public,
firafighlers, and other emergency responders.

Locally Adopted

Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus
laeees foads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

20-0203 | Page 37 of 50



firefighters, and other emergency responders.

Appendix D: D105.1 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopted Requirements for aenial fire apparalus access roads
through D105.4 firefighters, and other emergency responders. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
{,‘,,""e’f‘;?;s";“" N Adopled this section for the safety of the pubiic, Localy Adopted Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential
(exoc‘;sdk\g exéptions) firefighters, and other emergency responders. developments (Climatic, geofogical, and topographical)
Appendix D: D107.4 One- or two-dwalling residentiaf developmants shall be
A 0167 A . N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopted equipped throughout with two sperate and epproved fire
(exclud exéaph'on) firefighters, and other emergency responders. apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and
" climalic conditions.
Appendix D: D108 N Adopled this section for the safely of the public, Locally Adopted Adopl reference standards dealing with gale construction

standards (Climalic, geological, and topographical)

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle.

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions.

20-0203 | Page 38 of 50



Tribune

Yoor Mows Yowmr Tabos. - tahoedailytribune com

384 Mallary Wary Tarsor Ty, WY 85701
PG Box 1888 Carson City NV 89702
(775 BB1-12GY FAX (775)887-2408

Customer Account #: 10807732

iegal Account

LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTIOM DIST
2211 KEETAK ST

SOUTH LAKE TAHQOE, €A 3815C

Attn Kdewgh Labrade

Ballee Liston says;

That {sjhe :s 3 legal clerk of the

Tahoe Daily Tribune,

a newspaper pubhished Frrtay

at South Lake Tatoe. in the Siate of Caltoma

Copy Line
Motice Nov 14 Adopt Fire Code

PO#:

Ad #:; Q00050538001

of which & copy &5 hemto adched was pubhshiag
in sasd newspaper for the hdl rpauared perusd ol
2 ime(sj commaencing on 11012019,

and ending on 14/08/2013, all days inclugive.

Fonke Fofuar

Signed
Data Y1/GB/2019 Siate of Mavada, Carson City

This la an Qriginal Electroiic Aftidavit,
Price: § 87.00

Proof and Statement of Publication
Ad ¥ 000050639001

Notice of Intent to
Adopt the 2019
California Fire Code

Notice is hereby given to
the intention of the Lake
Valley Fire Protection
District to adopt the 2019
Califomia Fire Code.
The District shall hold its
first public hearing at
4:00 P.M. on Nov 14
2019, at 2211 Keetak St.
South Lake Tahoe,
Califomia, regarding the
adoption of the 2019
Calitomia Fire Code pur-
suant to Health and
Safety Code Section
13869. Copies of the
code section referred to
and any secondary code
sections referred to.
adopted by reference,
are on file with the
Secretary of the District
and are open to public
inspection. Adoption ot
the 2019 Califomnia Fire
Code will enable all
District personnel to fol-
low one set of rules and
regulations with regard
to the heaith and safety
of the public and the
District's response there-
to.

Pub: November 1, 8,
2019 Ad#0000505390

20-0203 | Page 39 of 50



Tribune

Your thews Your Tahow - taboedatiylsriiess som

S Makory May Carson Coy NY 88700
0 Bos 1BB8 Carsun Say NV 86707
CFIALBRY.YIDY FAN [7TS) BBT-J408

Cuntowmer Account & “TERITAQ

Legal Accound

LAKE WALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DIST
221 KELTAK BT

SOUTH (AKE TAHQE A 58150

Alln Kiagh Latwads

Bsllee Liston says:

That {syhe is a legal clark of the

Tahoe Daily Tribune,

a newspapel published Friday

a! South Lake Tahoo (0 the State of Califorma

Capy Line
Motice Dec 12 Adopt Fire Code

POY:

Ad & (G000505396-01

of whch a copy i herito altehed #as pubhshed
i saud rewsoapes for the full reuieed perog of
2 e 55 comimencing on 1H28/2013,

ard endling on 120A/2019 all days mchmsive.

[ %) [ fu,.‘ Ferey

St
Digte 12002615 Siate of Nevada Cason Uiy

This is an Origioal Eloctronic ANidavit.
Price: § 8980

Proof and Statemaent of Publication
Ag ¥ DODOSNSIHE-0

Notice of iIntent to
Adopt the 2019
California Fire Code

Notice is hereby given to
the intention of the Lake
Valley Fire Protection
District adopt the 2019

Califomia Fire Code.

The District shall hold its
second public hearing at
4:00 P.M. on Decembe:
12, 2019, at 2211 Keetal
St., South Lake Tahoe,
Califomia, regarding the
adoption of the 2019
Califomia Fire Code pur-

suant to Health and
' Safety Code  Section

13869. Copies of the
code section referred to
and any secondary code
sections refaerred to,
adopted by reference,
are on file with the
Secretary of the District
and are open to public
inspection. Adoption of
the 2019 California Fire
Code will enable ali
District personnel to fol-
iow one set of rules and
regulations with regard
to the heaith and safety
of the public and the
District's response there-
to.

Pub: November 29,

December 6, 2019
Ad#0000505396

20-0203 | Page 40 of 50



Attachment No. 2

LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
RESOLUTION NO. 2019-08

20-0203 | Page 41 of 50



RESOLUTION NO, 201%-08
Lake Valley Fire Protection District, El Dorade County, Culifornia
Adapting Findings Supporting Ameadments to the 2019 Californis Fire Code

A resolution fior the Lake Valley Fire Protection District senting forth findings with respect to
Iocal conditions within the Disirict which make cortin modifications and clunges o the
Calttomma Fire Code reasonably nucessary Tor fire and dile sabety i the Distniet The Governing
Board of the Lake Vallev Fire Protectian [Bstrct {inds and resolves as follow;

WHEREAN. Health & Salety Code Secnon [ 79385 permits o Fire Protecoon [District w adopl
an ordinance which changes or modittes the Stz Housing regulations adopred pursuant 1o
Health & Satety Code Secuon 17922 upon determunation that such changes or modilications are
necessary due o focal conditions: and

WHERFAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17938 .7 requures thut 3 Boaed of Directors nuiking
any chanyes or moditications pursuant to Heslth & Solety Code Secton 17958 3 shall make
express finding thal such changes or modiisalions are nevded: and stud) file o copy of such
changes of modificanons with the Depanimest of Hou<aong and, Coomunity Developmens,

NOW, THEREFORF, BE I'T RESOLVED AND ORDERED, that the Board o1 the {Lake
Yaltey Fiee Protection. Disinct slier having duly noticed and hebd public hearing. expressly
finds that such changes o modificanons aee reaemabls necessan because of Tocal conditions,
more specihically sel tonth as follows:

FINDINGS OF FACT
FOR CHANGES ORMODIFICATION'S TO THE STATE BUILDING STANDARDS
CODFEATITLE 24 PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL CONMTIONS

CHANGES OR MODMFICAVIONS: Pursosnt to Seetron 793805 F7998. 7 and 18941 5 of the
Culitormia Health & Sotets Cade. the Boand of Dircgrors of the Lake Valtey Fire Proteciion
Dt in s onbinance adopting and smending the 2008 California Piee Code, changes ar
imedifies certam provisions of the 2019 Pabdiog Stnatands Code 00 itke 24 Part 93, a5 1 pentass
t the regohation af butdsigs used for bumuan habsistion and oter tvpes of stnnctures and general
rudes for e salvn

FINDINGS: Pursuunt to Scetons 179385 17938 7 and 189415 ol the Health & Sateny Cinde.
the Bowed o Directors of the Fake Valicy Fire Prodochion Dhsseics has deterimmed aimd Gnds tha
the attached chgex or modificatings to the 2019 Californs Butldieg Standirds Code Titte 14
Part 9 are peeded and are reasonibly necessacy beaise ol focal chinutic. peographic and
tupographic conditions Such changes are deemed 1o be reasonably necessany to pronide
adegunte and cliective protection 1o life propens and the enviromnment.

20-0203 | Page 42 of 50



FINDING NO. ONE - Private properties lying within the Lake Valley Fire Protection District
are classilied as very high wildland fire hazard,

FINDING NO. TWO - The menace of destruction by fire to life, improved property, ot natural
resources may be, or be forecast to become, extreme due to critical fire weather, fire suppression
forces being heavily committed to control. fires already burning, acute dryness of the
vegetation, or other factors that may cause the rapid spread of fire such as high winds, low fuel
moistures, Fire Weather or Red Flag Wamings, or severe threat of wildland fire.

FINDING NO. THREE - Cooperating federal or state agencies address the threat of wildland fire
on lands adjacent to the District by issuance of Fire Restrictions which restrict or ban open
buming, including recreational fires. ‘

LOCAL CONDITIONS: Local conditions have an adverse effect on the prevention of (i)
major foss fires, (2) major carthquake damage, and (3) the potential for life and property loss,
making changes or modifications to the aforementioned codes necessary to provide a reasonable
degree of propenty security as well as fire and life safety in this jurisdiction.

Below are listed adverse jocal climatic, geographic and topographic conditions found in
the Lake Valley Fire Protection District:

L Climatic

a. Precipitation.

Annual precipitation fluctustes greatly. Approximately 90 - 95 percent of the precipitation occurs
during the months of November through April, and 5 - 10 percent occurs from May through
October. This area has experienced major droughts in the recent past; one in 1977 - 1978, one
which started in 1989 and lasted into 1994, others from (999-2004, and 2006-2009. Droughts
continue to cycle to this day. Electrical storms are frequent and are usually accompanied by little
rainfall, potentially creating numerous lightening caused fires.

Snow storms and loss of access and avalanche are routine. Heavy winter stiows are responsible
for delays in response and access to buildings and patients at emergency scenes. Winter snow
storms along with heavy tourist traffic routinely bring all community traffic to » standstill during
weekends and holidays.

b. Reiative Humidity.

During the months of June through Seplember, the daily humidity ranges around 30 percent, and
often drops to the low teens. Low relative humidity have allowed for greater spread of wildfires
and caused structure fires (o readily spread to the wildiand interface.

¢. Temperatures.

During the months of June through September, daily temperatures exceed 70 degrees to 90
degrees Fahrenheit, Winter temperstures can drop (o below 0 degrees Fahrenheit. The highest
recorded temperature was 99 degrees Fahrenheit in 1988 with the lowest being negative 13
degrees Fahrenheit February of 2019,

20-0203 | Page 43 of 50



d. Wiads.

Prevailing winds are out of the south and southwesi. However, north and east winds oceur during
the spring (May through June), the fall (Iate September and October), and occasionally during
the summer months. Wind velocities gencrally range from five 1o fifteen miles per hour. gusting
to thirty miles per hour during the summer months.

Given the increased risk of wildiand fire in California’s mountsin regions, electnic wtility
companies have begun a policy shuiting off power to entire regions and counties. This practice
has been responsible for a recent fire in the District and will increase cisk for communities in one
respect while limiting risk of powerline initisted wildland fires.

¢. Summary.

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the Lake
Valley Fire Protection District. Times of little or no rainfall, low humidity and high temperstures
create extremely hazardous conditions, particularly as they relate to the wildland - urben
interface. Conversely, heavy winter snows bring a host of flood, avalanche, response and
structure fire challenges to the community. Winds experienced in this area can have & significant
impact upon structure fires, especially in buildings in close proximity to one another, and 1o wild
lands commonly found in the Lake Valley Fire Protection District.

1L Geographic Tepegraphic

The fire environment of a community is primarily s combination of two factors: the physical
geographic characteristics of the ares and the historic pattern of development. These two factors
creste a mixiure of environments that ullimately determines the area’s fire protection needs,

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District provides fire prevention, fire protection, advanced
emergency medical and rescue services for unincorporated El Dorado and Alpine County
areas within the Lake Tahoe Basin.

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District serves 85 square miles via Station 7, located at 2211
Keetak, Station 6, located at 1286 Golden Bear Trail. Station 5 located at 1009 Boulder
Mountain Court is siaffed by Calfire via a lease agreement with the District.

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District service area includes: California State Highway 50
from Camp Sacramento to the City of South Lake Tahoe boundary; California Siate Highway
89 South from Alpine County Willow Creek Road to California State Highway 50 in Meyers.

Extending slong Californis Swute Highway 89 North, the Fire District extends from the Northern
boundary of the City of South Lake Tshoe (West Way) to Eagle Creek in Emerald Bay.

The service ares has a varied lopography and vegetative cover. [t has relatively fiat areas along
the shoreline, of Lake Tahoe along Pope and Baldwin Beach areas (6225 foet at Lake level),
Steep hills and mountain peaks over 10,000 feet are part of the Tahoe Basin. The most
prominent peak in the fire District is Moum Tallac at 9733, Vegetative cover ranges from
stands of manzanita to dense forests of fic and pine (rees.

3

20-0203 | Page 44 of 50



The main commercial aress are in Meyers and Tahoe Paradise along the highway 50 corridor.
Businecases as well as the Califomia Agricultursl Station, the Meyers Elementary School, two
golf courses and the local Tahoe Paradise Park are in this area.

Neighborhoods in vicinity of Pioneer Trail include: Elks Club, Golden Bear, Cold Creek, High
Meadow, Black Bart, Kokanee Trail, Montgomery Estates, Washoan. This corridor also
includes the Sierra House School and the South Tahoe Public Utilities District work sites,

The neighborhoods of North Upper Truckee, Echo View Estates, Mountain View Estates, and
Tahoe Mountain were affected by the Angora Fire of 2006 with the loss of 254 homes. The
area sees significant traffic delays due to tourist travel and is highly prone to heavy snows.

The neighborhoods of South Upper Truckee and Christmas Valley off of both State Highway
50 at Echo Summit and State Highway 89 to Alpine County also suffer raffic delays from
tourist travel and heavy snows, Echo Summit, via State Highway 50, is a funnel for traflic
congestion and highly prone (o winter avalanches.

The Stae Highway 89 corridor, north to Emerald Bay, is the most heavily iraveled road the
Lake Tahoe Basin. Of the estimated 20 million tourist visiting the Tahoe Basin annual,
roughly 4.9 million stop to take a picture of Emerald Bay. This busy highway runs through
Camp Richardson Resort, Pope, Kiva and Baldwin Beaches and USFS historic sites,
Traveling north the Mount Tallsc trail head, access 1o Fallen Leal Lake, the Cascade Lake and
residential ares, the Spring Creek summer residential aress are passed along the way o
Inspiration Point and Emerald Bay, Vikings Holm and the Eagle Falls Creek.

The Fire District extends along State Highway 50, over Echo Summit on the west side of the
Sierra crest 0 the Echo Snow Park- Adventure Mountain and Sierra at Tahoe Ski Resort.
Additionally the Districi serves the hamlets of Littie Norway, the, Mount Raiston Subdivision,
Echo Lakes, Philips, Sierra Pines, Bryan Creek, Temarack Park, Sayles Canyon and Camp
Sacramento.

Due 10 the remoteness of the communities and recreational areas of Strawberry, Twin Bridges,
Horse Tail Falls, Lover's Leap and the 39 mile tract, Lake Valley Fire District personnel are
called to serve these areas within the El Dorado County Fire Protection District,

a. Seismic Location.
The relatively young geological processes that created the Tahoe Basin is still active. The
Districts entire land surface is in the high-to-moderate seismic hazard zones.

b. Sixs and Population.

The District covers 83 square miles with a population of 13,000, sweiling to over 100,000
during the summer months. The District has 3 fire stations; two stafYed by 22 safety personnel
and one (1) fire siation vis Cal fire contract. The District has four (4) Chief Officers, including
the Fire Chief, one (1) Fire Prevention Technician, one (1) Mechanic/Fleet Manager and one (1)
Administrative Manager, Overall, there 29 fire total District personnel. The District oversite is
via the five (5) members of the Fire Board of Directors.

4

20-0203 | Page 45 of 50



c. Roads and Streets,

Many roads are sub-standard; narrow widths, on-street parking, less than 20 feet of unobstructed
pavement and ingress and egress issues during pesk populstion fluctustions. Some aress are
served by single lane roads, severely restricting emergency vehicle.

d. Topography.

The topography of the District varies from near level to terrain in excess of a 40 percent slope.
A3 a rule of thumb, the rate of fire spread doubles as the slope percentage doubles, all other
factors remaining the same.

Most residential and commercial structures, are in, or are surrounded by forested areas. Due to
drought, beetie infestations, and heavy vegetation, many the area have dead or dying trees,
contributing to fire danger. Elevation ranges from about 6200 feet at {ake level 1o over 7200
feet on mountain pass roads with peaks exceeding 9000 feet in elevation.

¢. Vegetstion.
Vegetation in the Fire District varies from sub-alpine forests of aspen and pine to pine and cedar
forests, with substantial beush fields of manzanita, snow brush, and white thom.

Residential development in the Fire District is generally concentrated in heavily forested areas.
This situation allows fire to travel easily from home to home, forest to home, or home to forest
by radiation, convected hest and/or flying embers Often dwellings are completely surrounded by
highly combustible vegetation, compounding the fire problem.

f. Summary.
Local geographic and lopographic conditions increase the fire hazard presented in the District.

Other variables that tend to intensify the fire danger include:
1) damage to the piped water system infrastructure
2) isolation due to bridge collapse
3) roadway damage and/or amount of
debris blocking roadways
4) availability of timely mutual aid
assistance
5) the presence of dwellings with wood
shingle or shake roof coverings

g- Concluslon:

Locat climatic, geographic and

topographic conditions described above increase the frequency,

intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District, Further, these conditions
impact potential damage to structures from an earthquake and subsequent fire. Therefore, it is
reasonably necessery that the Callfornia Fire Code be modified to mitigate the effects of the
above conditions.

20-0203 | Page 46 of 50




Cabitarmis Health & Sufety Code Sestion 17958 7 requings thal modifications te the Fire Code be
expressly marked and identilied as o which each Unang ceters (o which Code mudification. The
Falinwing able prosvides thas coneetion

Cude Section o Finding
Chaprer ! Administrative
Chapter 2 Adminisral (v
Chapter 3 I.is}, b}
Chapter § bea) Hic)
Tlhraptee 8 Lids, Liey, gy, ey Hhady
Chapter 9 Lea) Liey HHE i)
Chapter 12 Lin.
Chupler 33 ()
Chapier 44 l{a)h L{ch, I Liby FHao
Chapter 3 Administrative
Chapter 36 (N1}
Chaprer 37 biay, b broy bbb qal 1 ik
Chapter 38 fedy 1 (b e
Chapier 61 Liaj boch b,
Appendin Flak ek s Haby thich Bidi thes

This Resobelion shall igke efTect and be w force from and after s appraval s rogquived By tuw

Adopted by the follnying vole by the Board of Dircctors oF the Lake Valley Fire Protection Uistri
this /5 dnyof N dvembgr 2000

wvis SIS
NOH Y & i )
E-Jl.«ff.gz‘{,”u:ﬁ !

b tlergh | alrado. Bf?ar
ASENT Hesgh Ll '

Alss VAN

{]

20-0203 | Page 47 of 50



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section

Adopted as Amended Finding
101.1 X Admin
105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographicai
106.6 X Admin
106.6.1 X Admin
106.7 X Admin
109.4 X Admin
1104 X Admin
110.4.2 X Admin
1124 X Admin
114.1 X Admin
114.2 X Admin
202 X Admin
302.1 X Admin
307.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d}) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.1 X Climatic/Geologicai/Topographical
503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
505.1 X Climatic/Geological
505.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
506.1.1 X Climatic/Geological
506.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
507.5.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
507.5.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
604.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
901.4.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
901.11 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
901.12 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
901.13 X Admin
901.14 X Admin
902 X Admin
903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.4.4 X Geological/Topographical

20-0203 | Page 48 of 50




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

907.2.a through 907.2.d

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: 0103.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.5 § 1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.4

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: 105.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

X
907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
33103 X Climatic/Geologfical/T opographical
33121 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5001.7 X Admin
5601.2 X Admin
5601.2.1 X Admin
5601.2.2 X Admin
5704.2.9.6.1 X CIimatic/Gech)EicaI/T opographical
5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5806.2 X Climatic/GeoIoEical/Topogra phical
6102 X Admin
6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (1) a,b,c,d,ef X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (2) X Ciimatic/GeoIo)g‘icaI/T opographical
6112 (3) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 {4) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (5) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (6) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (7) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (8) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (9) X Climatic/Geological/Topagraphical
6112 (10) X Climatic/Geolo_g(icaI/Topographical
6112 (11} X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (12) X Climatic/Geological/T: opographical
6113.1 X Admin
6113.2 X Climatic/Geologrical/T opographical
6114 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6115.1 X Admin
6115.2 X Admin
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X

Appendix D: 105.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 | Page 49 of 50




20-0203 | Page 50 of 50





