RESOLUTION NO. 042-2020
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF ELDORADO
(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 018-2017)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the
State every three years; and
WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 189 41.5 permits
a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably
necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1,
Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulationstothelocallevel
and grantsauthority to delegate enforcement tothe chiefbuilding official, or his or her authorized representative,
or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the
Meeks Bay Fire Protection District, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code;and,

WHEREAS, on December 11, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Meeks Bay Fire Protection District
adopted Ordinance No. 19-2 which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with amendments the District
deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 19-2 of the Meeks Bay Fire Protection District and delegates the
enforcement of the ordinance to the Meeks Bay Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her
representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections:

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 114.1, 114.2, 202, 302.1,
307.1.1, 307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3,
503.4.4, 503.6, 503.6.1, 505.1, 505.1.1, 506.1.1, 506.1.3, 507.5.4.1, 507.5.7, 604.1.2, 901 4.7,
901.11, 901.12,901.13, 901.14, 902, 903.1, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3,
903.2.4,903.2.7,903.2.8, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.4.4, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1,
1203.1.3, 3310.3,3312.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2,
6102,6104.2,6112, 6112 (1) a,b,cd,e.f, 6112 (2), 6112 (3), 6112 (4), 6112 (5), 6112 (6),

6112 (7),6112(8), 6112 (9), 6112 (10), 6112 (11), 6112 (12),6113.1,6113.2, 6114, 6115.1,

6115.2, Appendix D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix D104.2, Appendix
D104.3, Appendix D104.4, Appendix D105.1, Appendix D105.2.

20-0203 J Page 1 of 40



Resolution No. 042-2020 Page 2 of 2

The Meeks Bay Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its

entirety. including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code,
2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

105.6.17-105.6.19, 105.6.39, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5,311.6, 318,403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3,

403.4, 403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12,
404.1-404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2), 808, 904.1.1,

1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25,

Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2, D106.1, DI107.1 (1), Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G,
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019
California Fire Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said

Board, held the 10 day of  March , 2020 by the following vote of said Board:
Ayes: Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin, Novasel
Attest: Noes: None
Kim Dawson Absent: None
Clerl@%lfe Board of S@;Bﬁ s , /
p 4 j

o HH Ut Lo M eernp

(/ Deputy Clerk Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Béard of Supervisors

20-0203 J Page 2 of 40



North Tahoe and Meeks Bay Fire Protection Districts £

222 Fairway Drive
P.O. Box 5879

Tahoe City, CA 96145
530.583.6913

Fax 530.583.6909

Michael S. Schwartz, Fire Chiefl

December 18, 2019

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors
330 Fair Lane

Placerville, CA 95667

Subject:  Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 19-2 of the Meecks Bay Fire Protection District, which
adopts the 2019 California Fire Code with amendments related to local climatic,
geographic and topographic conditions.

Dear Mr. Ashton:

The Meeks Bay Fire Protection District is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS) ratify its Ordinance
No. 19-2 which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code as amended due to specific local climatic, geographic
and topographic conditions. California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative
body of the city or county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance.
The BOS must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to cither the Fire District (or its representative)
or the Chief Building Official.

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 19-2 with amendments to the
2019 Californie Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the Mecks Bay Fire
Protection Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for your review and use on this topic.

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County.

Sincerely,

chhncl Schwartz

Fire Chief

ATTACHMENTS:

1. Meeks Bay Fire Protection District Ordinance No. 19-2

2. Meeks Bay Fire Protection District Finding of Fact Resolution No. 2019-06
3, Draft El Dorado County BOS Resolution

20-0203 J Page 3 of 40



Attachment No. 1
Meeks Bay Fire Protection District

Ordinance No. 19-2

20-0203 J Page 4 of 40



Meeks Bay Fire Protection District

ORDINANCE

of the Board of Directors
No: 19-2

AN URGENCY ORDINANCE FOR MEEKS BAY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
AMENDING THE FIRE CODE OF THE DISTRICT PERTAINING TO THE AMENDMENT AND ADOPTION
OF THE 2019 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE
(TITLE 24, CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS), PART 9 (2019 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE)
INCLUDING APPENDICES 8, C, D, H, I, N and O. AND REPEALING
ORDINANCE NUMBER 16-1, OF MEEKS BAY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT AND ALL OTHER
ORDINANCES AND PARTS OF THE ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT THEREWITH

WhengAs, fire protection districis are generally required to adopt the State Building Standards; apd

WHEREAS, fire protection districts are nilowed (o make amendments to those state standards when justified by
local topographical, elimatic and geographical conditions; and

WheREAS, contemporancously herewith the Board of Directors has made such findings and directed that they
be submutied o the State forthwath,

NOW, THEREFOR, BEIT ORDAINED BY MEEKS BAY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT, AS THE
GOVERNING BOARD OF THE DISTRICT ASFOLLOWS:

Section | FINDINGS OF FACT:

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS:
Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS:

Secuon 4: CONFLICT.

Section 5: SEVERABILITY:

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION:

Ord. 19-2

Pegatof 17
20-0203 J Page 5 of 40



SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACIT
Meeks Bay Fire Protection District (MBFPD) makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code,
2019 Edition, pursuant to Health and Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.7 and 18941.5 during this code adoption
process. Such changes are necessary because of local climatic, geological and/or topographic vonditions. MBFPD
has adopted, pursuant to Section 18941.5 of the California Health and Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to
these conditions by Resolution #11-2019 of MBFPD dated September 25, 2019,

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
MBFPD adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating
those sections of the International Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

Exclusions: 105.6,17-105.6.19, 105.6.39, 308.1 4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 401.3, 403.4,
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12, 404.1-404.4,
405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2), 808, 904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9
(adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104 2, D106.1, D107.1

(1), Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.
Appendices not adapted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 California Fire Code.

SECTION 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS
The following Sections are hereby amended or added:
Chapter 1
- Section 101 Scope and General Requirements
-~ 101.1 Title shall be amended as follows: Add name of jurisdiction [Meeks Bay Fire Protection District)

- Section 105 Permits

- 105.6.27 LPG-gas shall be amended as follows: Add to the exception: At or above 5,000 feet of elevation, &
permit is not required for individual comtainers with a 125-gallon water capacity or less, or multiple conlainer
systems having an aggregate quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving occupancies in group R-3.

- Section 106 Fees

- 106.6 Permit, Plan Review and Inspection Fees shall be added as follows: A schedule of fees adopted by
the Fire District Board of Directors for Plan Review, Inspections and the issuance of Permits by the Fire
District may be found in the most current District fee schedule (Health and Safety Code 17951).

- 106,6.1 Cost Recovery Fees shall be added as follows: Fire service fees may be charged to any person, firm,
corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as & result of carelessness, is
responsible for the cause of the Fire District to respond to the scene of an incident. A district board may
charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the district provides or the cost of enforcing any
regulation for which the fee is charged. (Health and Safety Code 13916). The fee shall not exceed the actual
cosl of suppressing the fire and/or responding: to the scene of an incident.

106.7 Admiaistrative Costs shall be added as follows: When a test or inspection is scheduled and the
contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction, the authority having

Ord. 192

Page 2 of 17
20-0203 J Page 6 of 40



junsdiction may bill the contractor for actual time speat traveling to and from the test/inspection location and
the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs.

Section 110 Violations

110.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows: Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or
shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a permit or
centificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of & misdemeanor or infraction, at the discretion
of the prosecuting attorney or agency, punishable by a fine not exceeding $100.00 for a first violation: 2. A
fine not exceeding $500.00 for & second violation of the same provision within one year; 3. A fine not
exceeding $1000.00 for cach additional violation of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment
not exceeding 180 days, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that & violation continues after due
notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense, (Health and Safety Code Section 13145 and
17995).

110.4.2 Citations shall be added as follows: The Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, may issue
citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to Scction 13871 of the Health and
Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter 5S¢ (commencing with Section 853 .6) of Title 3 of Part 2
of the Penal Code of the State of Californis.

Section 112 Stop Work Order

112.4, Failure to Comply shall be amended as follows: Any person who shail continue any work after
having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove
a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to n fine of not leas than one hundred ($100) dollars or more
than one thousand ($1,000) dollars. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995).

Section 114 Reserving of Rights

114.1 General. There is reserved, to the Board of Directors of the District. the right to amend, modify,
supplement, revoke in whole, or in part, any of the provisions contained or incorporated herein, at any time
and from time to time.

114.2 Limitation of Rights. Nothing herein contained shall be deemed to limit or restrict the rights, duties or
obligations given, granied or opposed upon this District by the laws of the State of California now in effect or
hereinafier adopted.

Chapter 2

Section 202 General Definitions

Add definition for Approved shall mean - as accepted by the Fire Chief of said District or their authorized
representative, or as approved pursuant to the standards now existing or hercafler adopted by the District,
Add definition for Campfire shall mean - a fire which is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or
aesthetic purposes. This includes fires contained within outdoor fireplaces and enclosed stoves with flues ot
chimneys, stoves using jellied, liquid, solid, or gaseous fuels, portable barbecue pits, braziers, or space
heating devices which are used outside of any structure, mobile home, or any living accommodation mounted
on & vehicle.

Add definition for Corperation or District Counsel shall mean - the attommey for the District.

Ord. 19-2

Puge 3 of 17
20-0203 J Page 7 of 40



- Add definition for Digtrict shail mean - the District and all other areas within the exterior boundaries thereof
as now or hercafler established.

- Add definition for Executive Body shall mean - the board of directors of the District.

- Add definition for Fire Chief shall mean - the Chief Exccutive Officer of the Fire Department/District
serving the junsdiction, or a duly authorized representative.

- Add definition for Jurisdiction shail mean - all areas within the District boundaries.
Add definition for Person(s) shall mean - all persons, firms, associates, organizations, corporations,
individuals or other agency.

- Add definition for Shall shall mean - mandatory .

- Add definition for May shall mean - permissive.

- Add definition for Trpjued Crowd Mapager shall mean - standby personnel, usually a secunity guard or
usher persoancl, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other place of public
assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency.

Chapter 3
Section 302 Definitions
302.1 Defluitions shail be amended as follows: Added Campfire definition as shown above in Chapter 2.

- Section 307 Open Burning, Recreational Fires and Portable Outdoor Fireplaces
307.1.1 Prohibited Open Buraing, Campfires, Bonfires, Portable Outdoor Fireplaces, Recreational
Fires and Campfire Restrictions shall be added as follows:

- 307.1.1 Open burning, campfires, bonfires, portable outdoor fireplaces and recreational fires, shall be
prohibited when atmospheric conditions or local circumstances make such fires hazardous including when, in
the judgment of the Fire Chief or his designec, the menace of destruction by fire to life, improved property,
or aatural resourves is, or is forecast to become, extreme due to cnitical fire weather, fire suppression forces
being heavily committed 13 contrul fires already bumning, acute dryness of the vegetation, or other factors that
may cause the rapid spread of fire such as high winds, low fuel moistures, fire weather or Red Flag
Warnings, severe threat of wildland fire, or issuance of Fire Restrictions on lands adjacent to the District by
the United States Forest Szrvice or CalFire.

Exceptions:
1. Prescribed buming for the purpose of reducing the impact of wildland fire whea authorized by the
fire code official.

2. Gas (LPG, NG) ocutdoor fire pits and barbeques, pellet grills/smokers. Except during Red Flag
conditions. All Open Buming, Campfires, Bonfirces, Portable Outdoor Fireplaces and Recreational
Fires are prohibited during Red Flag Wamings,
3.  Campfires and charcoal barbegues in a designated campground and/or pichic area iocated on State
of Federal lands.
4.  Charcoal barbeques for » commercial restaurant, catering operation or special event, with additional
restrictions a3 permitted by the District.
- 307.4.4 Campfire Restrictions shall be added as follows:
- 307.4.4.1 It is unlawful for any person to light, maintain, or use a campfire upon or near any brush-covered
land, grass-covered land, or forest-covered land during the time when burning permits are suspended by the
Director of the Department of Forestry, the CALFIRE Uait Chief, or the authority having jurisdiction.

Oord. 192

Page 4 of 17
20-0203 J Page 8 of 40



campfire upon any brush-covered land, grass-covered land, or forest covered land unless the following
minimum requirements are complied with.

- 307.442 (a) The arca within $ feet of the periphery of the campfire is cleared of all flammable material and
vegetation

- 307.4.4.2 (b) Qoe serviceable shovel with a handle of at least 12 inches is ready for use at the immediate area
of the campfire.

- 307.44.2 (c) Campfires shall be limited to 1'X1" foot, unless in an approved manufactured cooking device or
fire ring.

- 307.4.4.2 (d) Written permission of the landowner must be obtained prior to the ignition of the campfire and
shall be on site.

Chapter S

- Section 503 Fire Apparstus Access Roads:

- 503.2.1 Dimensions shall be amended as follows: Fire apparatus access rosds shatl have an unobstructed
width of not less than 20 feet, exclusive of shoulders, curbs and gutters, except for approved security gates in
accordance with Section 503.6, and unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 15 feet. All driveways in
the District shall not be less than 12 feet wide.

- $03.2.5 Dead Ends shall be amended as follows: Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways in
excess of 150 feet in length shall be provided with an approved area {or tuming around fire apparatus.

- 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces shall be amended as follows: Where a bridge or an elevated surface
is part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in accordance with any
current County Bridge Standard. Bridges and clevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient 10
carry the imposod loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances (o bridges
when required by the fire code official. Where clevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use are
adjacent to surfaces which are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs or both shall be
installed and maintained when required by the fire code official.

- 583.4.2 Ne Parkiny ia Firc Lanes shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, or leave standing
any wehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary to avoid conflict with other traffic or in
compliance with the directions of a fire code official, peace officer or ofTicial traffic control device along the
edge of any highway, at any curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-strect
parking facility, designated as a fire lane by the fire department or fire district with jurisdiction over the ares
in which the place is located. The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent 10,
and visible from, the designated place clearly stating in letiers not less than one inch in height that the place
is a fire lane, (2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color, marking the place with the
words “FIRE LANE", which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) by a red curb or red paint on the edge
of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words “FIRE LANE™.

- 503.4.3 Ne Parking in Front of H:drants shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, or leave
standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle is attended by a
licensed driver who is seated in the front scat and who can immediatcly move such vehicle in case of
neccssity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire department and is clearty marked as a fire
department vehicle.

Ord. 192

Page Sof 17
20-0203 J Page 9 of 40



20-0203 J Page 10 of 40



- $03.4.4 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width shall be added as follows: Fire Lanes shall be based on road
width as required in Appendix D as adopted locally.

- 803.6 Security Gates. Add the following to Section 503.6 of the California Fire Code: Private road gated
entrance:

1. Gate openings to be 2" wider than the roadway served.

2. Emcrgency vehicle access shall be provided by both a “Knox™ over-ride switch and an approved
emergency radic frequency gate opening device (Click2Enter type) or other device approved by the
authonty having jurisdiction.

3. An spproved hamumerhead, turn-around bulb or other means of turn-around shall be provided on the entry
side of the gate.

4, Gates shall automatically open from the interior without use of a special code or device. (Magnetic strip or
pressurc pad assemblics are acceplable).

5. All electric gates shall fail in the open position, i.e., loss of power, hattery failure. All gates shall be
equipped, at a minimum, with 12-hour battery backup.

6. Vertical clearances shall be no less than 15",

7. Gate shall be located no closer than 30’ from the intersecting roadway ultimate edge of pavement.

8. Provide a separate personnel gate or opening sized and surfaced to allow for pedestrian and accessibility

access.

9. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and replaced or repaired when
defective.

503.6.1 Security yates for residential driveways shall be added as follows: Gated residential driveways

shall have a key operated override switch installed for fire deparuncnt access. The switch shall be a Knox

System type key switch with “Fire Department” decal.

- Section 505 Premise Ideatification

- 505.1 Address Identification shall have the first line of this paragraph replaced as follows: Addresses for
new and existing buildings shall comply with the local district address standard as approved by the fire code
official.

505.1.1 Installation, Location and Visibility of Addresses shall be added as tollows:

1. All buildings shall have a permanently posted address, which shall be placed at esch driveway entrance
and visible from both directions of travel slong the road. In all cases, Ibe address shail be posted at the
beginning of construction and shall be maintained thereafter, and the address shall be visible and legible
from the road on which the address is located.

2. Address signs along onc-way roads shall be visible from both the intended direction of travel and the
opposite direction.

3. Where multiple addresses are required at a single driveway, thoy shall be mounted on a single post.

4. Where a roadway provides access solely to a single commercial or industrial business, the address sign
shall be placed at the nearest road intersection providing access to that site.

Ord. 192

Page 6 0f 17
20-0203 J Page 11 of 40



Section 506 Key Boxes

506.1.1 Locks shall be amended as follows: Any structure which has access contrulied by an electnic gate
shali have & key operated overmide switch installed for fire department access. The switch shall be a Knox
System type key switch with “Fire Department” decal.

506.1.3 Ke» boxes for buildings with automatic sprinkler 51 stems shall be added as follows: Any building
or complex of buildings, in which an automatic sprinkler system is installed, shall be provided with a Knox
Box®, mounted in an approved location, containing appropnale keys for fire department access. This section
applics to all new installations and existing instailations, as required by the Fire Chief.

Section 507 Fire Protection Water Supplies

507.5.4.1 Snow removal shall be added as follows: No person shall place, push or dump snow on or around
any fire hydrant or fire department connection, and a minimum of fifteen (15) foot clear space shall be
maintained to the front and sides of any hydrant or fire department connection,

Section 507.5.7 - Public Private Partnership Fund for Infrastructure and Capital Improvements shall
be added as follows:

The District hereby adopts a public privatc partnership fund infrastructure and capital improvements
(Partnership Fund) to receive contributions of cash or property qualifying under Internal Revenue Code Section
170 as a charitable contribution if the contribution or gift is made for exclusively public purposes, Contributions
(0 the Partnership Fund shall be maintained and administered as a separate trust fund subject to investment
restrictions applicable to the district in the management of ils fund and administered to permit expenditures of
accrued principal and interest after deductions of reasonable costs of administration, for infrastructure and
capital improvement acguisitions. Operations and maintenance, inciuding but not limited to mobile water supply
apparatus such as fire boat(s), and/or water tender(s).

Chapter 6

Section 604 - Electrical Equipment, Wiring and Hazards:

Section 604.1.2 Instatlations shall be added as follows: Emergency power systems and standby power
systems shall be installed in accordance with this code, NFPA 110 and NFPA 111. All buildings with
stand-by power shall have a shunt trip device that disconnects all power sources to the building, approved by
the Fire Code Official. Existing installations shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval.

Chapter 9

Section 981 - Genperal:

901.4.7 Application to New and Existing Structupey shall be added as follows: The District assumes no

responsibility for installation, maintenance, operstion or monitoning of the system the same being solely that

of the owner of the structure. The provisions of this Chapter, and, or those requirements in the California Fire

Code relating to automatic sprinkler systems shall apply to a structure, and the entire structure shall be made

to comply with these provisions, under any of the following circumstances:

1. When & building permH is issued for a new structure, or a new structure where no permit is required
unless plans were previously approved by the District prior to the effective date of this chapter, or any
structure found 10 have been constructed after the effective date of this chapter, without a permit when a
permit would have been required; or

Oord. 192

Page 7 of 17
20-0203 J Page 12 of 40



1 When theee s clange (o use 15 sl ar g porteons al e exestog aructure which would Sise owcupaney

.
slassibieation @ change te a Cnroup A B L R RS2 o

oW hen u Saiiding peromit g issued tocellw Sdditier tocbe viade r an exstimye sinactire s s b ()

pcrense fe Toak Fire Area of Uie ariginat stucidie weesler (man Gy percont V300 amt {2Y the apgiegaic
sauare ootace of the evsting hndldiee and 1 additiog coceads the square Yootags et i swection

T3 E of the Distriet Pire Cosde o 3600 spaire feog tor R nconpancies sachieiie wtiachied vacipe.

00111 Fire Alarms Required stal) b added ws fellowes ATl vagves coctiodbng the water supply to

Anrrrsic sprinkler systems and water-tow swiches ow all spdnklear gystons shall be electneally supervised.
Vilve supervision and water-Tlow nlartn aod rauble snmals shall be distineliy dilTerent and shall be
antinmtivally trangmitted s an approved cenual sration, mcluding B3 occupanaics when wspriokier syste

of nware thaa VXD heads is wastatled,

90112 Fire Alarms Regulated snabi be ndhled g fottows All fire alarm svatems matalled o imanvained in

fie District shall be fstalled and manianed s sccordance with the requrements of the witicle

CooAad devices and equinment shall be consimuated, installed and mantainad in contfonniy wirli Nanoanal

e

Foatection Assootation: Standard T2 for contrsl danon signaling <vstenns Al wnokedetecton as required

sy the Cziiforma Buildmg Code o rosidentn] somcemares shadl meomtewomectad sooas s,

arrighous the entire straciure should a siegle doreaior be eonvnted.

2oWhen a fite alam is reqiniesd, shoqudrawings as reguzed by NFPA 77 are requoed 1o0be subimatied for
review prior i@ nstalintton of Such syabens.

20 Al fime alanm systens shuldl be superased inos manner aceeptasle othe Five Chief.

4, Upon recomimendziion ol the Fine Cheet, (e Board of Directocs way adopt by nasidition such sdditiona,
futes sod repulations: wehling v eee irstaiinhon, mrntenance, and use-ol e alann systems as am
convialent with gossd praceces

S very requircd Bpe alarm sysicend shadl be aouinteed mgood workivg vrder and shal) Se repaired andion

cestoresd toosuel weirhye raccnty Ao £23) Gous alter activation o Qalare,

oAy Duildiing or compley o hufdargs with an astemane fre shamm svstem shall he provided with g Koo

eteted Ioenapprread [ocanian . COnGaImImE appmipnate e Yor Vi depiriment

amapphie b alb new mamllatons snd cxistng wnsnbaeies an reguowet by e Fee Chiel

901.13 Fire Alarm Vendor Regulations shall be wdded a5 foliows Fire st wendars shatt camply with the

follwyog

1. Upor demand, cach viendor shall provide the Fite Chict with the address of cach bithding, place, or
premses within the Prxlner for which the pommities selly or toslslls o Bre alam system,

2. Lach veondor whe isstaily or services a fire alarm Systew shall cleasly instruct the subscriber it person, and
n wrtiing, o the proper use ard operation P ihe Tine sl system, espocialiy those factoes which sould

chatse |

=i,

oA vendor bl s BT e s equipnient b pend State o8 eerir A sen odsg b the Depentment

Lo

Aoy porson, fnreor corprantian providing service dnder the authonty of s articte shall provide e e
service oole subseribees swithan Uwenty four (341 b alter sotiticaton thag there i trmuble witls the tae

=k

abare wvsiem, of the sysiems has mativucioned.

Qrd, 19.2

Page K.af 17

20-0203 J Page 13 of 40



5. Each vendor shali display to the Fire Chief, upon request, the permittee’s records of inspection and repair
of any fire alarm system.
&. Each vendor shall notify the monitoring center whenever a subscriber’s fire alarm system is under service

Of TTpair.

901.14 Nuisance Alarms shall be added as follows: Any fire alarm of which continuous activation is

determined by the Fire Chief to be a nuisance alarm will subject the owner of such fire alarm to a one
hundrod dollar ($100.00) fine.

Section 902 Definitions: The following definitions shall be added:

Veador shall mean any business operated by a person, firm, or corporation who engages in the activity of
alerting, installing, leasing, maintaining, repairing, replacing, selling or servicing fire alarm systems.
Approved shall mean accepted by the Fire Chicf and in accordance with the requirements of the
Underwriters Lahoratories, Inc., the Factory Mutual Engineering Corporation, The National Bureau of
Standards, the National Fire Protection Association, or the State Fire Marshal.

Audible Alarm shall mean an alarm sysiem, which when activated generates an audibie sound on the
premises.

Fahe Alarm shall mean an alarm signal, either silent or audible, prompting a respanse to be made by the
Fire Department whea an cmergency situation for which the alarm system was intended does not exist.
Fire Alarm S:stem shall mean any manua! or automatic means of detecting fire, and transmitting alarms of
fire from private premises and shall inciude all types of interior fire alarms systems and auxiliary fire alarm
systems approved by the Distnct.

Local Fire Alarm System shall mean any fire alarm system designed solely to provide an alanm of fire
within the protected premises.

Subscriber shall mean a person who owns or leases property or premises on which an alarm system has been
installed or is proposed to be installed or who contracts or proposes to contract with an alarm business for the
lcasing, servicing, or maimaining of an alarm system, and who has or will have the authority to cause the
alarm system 10 be serviced, repaired, or removed after the system is installed.

Section 903 Fire Sprioklers:

903.1 Non-freezing shall be added as follows: All automatic fire spninkler systems shall be of the anti-freeze
type or other approved non-freezing (including air filled) type of system.

903.2.a Where Required shall be added as foliows: Status of existing buildings greater than 3,600 square
feet. In existing buildings 3600 square fect or greater, other than one and two-family dwelling units, and
agricultural buildings not under Special Use Permit for commercial purposes, where the floor area of the
building or structure is increased by an addition of more than thirty percent (30%) or 1,000 square feet
whichever is less, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 903.2.
903.2.b Where Required shall be added as follows: Status of existing buildings less than 3,600 square feet.
In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling units, and agricultural
buildings not under Special Use Permit for commercial purposes, where the floor area of the building or
structure is increased to a total square footage over 3,600 aquare feet, by an addition of more than thirty
percent (30%) or 1,000 square feet, whichever is leas, such building or structure shall be made to conform to
Section 903.2.

Ord. 19-1

Page 9 of 17
20-0203 J Page 14 of 40



903.2.1 Group A shall be amended as follows for A groups A-| through A-4:903.2.1.1 (1) The fire area
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

903.2.3 Group E shall be amended as follows: 903.2.3 (1) Throughout all Group E fire arcas grealer than
3,600 square feet in area.

903.2.4 Group F-1 shall be amended as follows: 903.2.4 Group F. 903.2.4 (1) A Group F fire area exceeds
3,600 square feet.

903.2.7 Group M shall be amended as follows: 903.2.7 Group B and M. 903.2.7 (1) A Group B and M fire
arca cxceeds 3,600 square feet.

903.2.8 Group R shall be amended as follows: 903.2.8.1 shall have the following verbiage added to the end
of the paragraph: Fire sprinkler systems shall be installed in new manufactured homes (HSC sections 18007
& 18009) and multiple family manufactured homes with two dwelling units (HSC 18008.7) in accordance
with Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations.

903.2.9 Group S-1 shall be amended as follows: 903.2.9 Group S. 903.2.9 (1) A Group § fire arca exceeds
3,600 square foct.

903.2.10 Group S-2 Enclosed Parking Garages shall be amended as follows: 903.2.10 (1) Where the fire
area of the enclosed parking garage exceeds 1,600 square feet.

903.4.4 Residential occupancies shall be added as follows: All residential occupancies require audible
notification in all sleeping rooms of & sprinkicr waterflow alarm. This notification must be at least 75dh at
pillow height.

Section 907 Fire Alarm and Detection Systems:
907.2.a Where Reyuired - New Buildings or Structures less than 3,600 square feet shall be added as
follows: An approved fire slarm/detection system shall be installed in all buildings with a floor area less than
3,600 square feet.
@ Exceptions:
+  One- and two- family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified as “U™)
»  Agricultural buildings not under Special Use Permit and/or not used for commercial purposes (e.g.
retails sales, food service, and/or special events).
*  Buildings with a floor arca less than 500 square foect may be exempt, as determined by the Fire
Chief, based on building construction material and features, location, occupancy type, and

distance o exposures,

907.2.b Status of Existing Buildings shall be udded as follows: In exasting buildings without an approved
automatic sprinkler system, other than one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultural building not under
Special Use permit for commercial purposes where a fire alarm detection system does not exist and the floor
area of the building or structure is increased or modified by more than thirty percent (30%) or 1,000 square
feet, whichever is less, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 907 when required by
the Fire Chief. Buildings with s floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined by the Fire
Chief, based on building construction materials and features, location, occupancy type, and distance to
exposures.
907.2.c Monitoriag shall be sdded as follows: All fire alarm/detection systems shall be connected directly
through and monitored by a U.L. approved central, proprictary or remate station service, which gives audible
and visual signals at s constantly atiended location. All sprinkiered buildings shall be monitored.

o Exceptions:

Ord. 1922

Page 10 of 17
20-0203 J Page 15 of 40



. One- and two- family dwellings (R-3 Occupancics and other occupancies classified as “U™).
. Agricultural buildings not under Special Use Permit and/or not used for commercial purposes
(e.g. resails sales, food service, and/or special cvents).

- 907.2.d Type | Hood Installations shall be added as follows: The requirement of installation, or
replacement, of a Type I Hood System shall require a fire alanm/sprinkler monitoning system to be installed,
or for the hood system 1o be connected to an existing fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system for that building.

- 907.6.2.1 Secondary Power Suppls sball be added as follows: In accordance NFPA 72, the secondary power
supply providing a minimum 24-hour power capacity under quiescent Joad (system operating in a non-alarm
condition) shall be amended to a minimum 72-hour power capacity.

Exception: The existence of an emergency backup power supply that meets or exceeds the requirements of
California Fire Code Chapier 12,

Chapter 12
Section 1203 Emergency and Standby Power Systems
1103.1.3 Installation shall be amended as follows: Emergency power systems and standby power systems
shall be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electric Code, NFPA 110
and NFPA 111. All buildings, other than ove- and two-family dwelling units, and agricultural buildings pot
used for commercial purposes, with stand-by power shall have a shunt trip device that disconnects all power
sources {o the building, approved by the Fire Code Official. Existing instaliations shall be maintained in
sccordance with the original approvul.

Chapter 33
Section 3310 Access for Fire(ighting
3310.3 Premise Identification shall be added as follows: Prior to and during construction, an approved
address sign shail be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into the project.

- Section 3312 Water Supply for Fire Protection
- 3312.1 When required shall be amended as follows: Required fire hydrants shall be instalied and approved
for continuous service prior to combustible materials armiving on site or vertical construction commencing.

Chapter 49

Section 4905 - Wildfire Protection Building Construction

4905.4 Roof Coveriny Standard shall be added as follows: All new construction, including additions, requires
a Class A roof covering or assembly. All re-roofing requires Class A roof covering or assembly es a minimum.

Re-roofing in excess of fifty {50) percent of an existing structure within any one-year period will necessitate that
the entire roof be & Class A roof covering or assembly as a minimum. Class B or C fire retardant treated and/or
nou-treated wood shake or shingles are not approved as a roof covering material for Class A assembly.

Chapter 50

- Section 5881 General

- 5001.7 Liabilits for Damages shal! be added as follows: Any damages or cost resulting from the carcless
handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall constituent debt against any such person, firm or

Ord. 19-2

Page 11 of 17
20-0203 J Page 16 of 40



corporation causing such spill or discharge. This debt is collectible by the fire chief in the same manner as in
the case of an obligation under contract, expressed or imphed.

Chapier 56

Section 5601 General

5601.2 Permit Required shall be amended as follows: Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.6
and regulated in accordance with this section. Where explosives permits are required, they shall be issued by
the Fire Chief, or his/her representative, and the County Sheniff's Department. Where fireworks permits are
required, they shall be issued by the Fire Chief and the County Board of Supervisors.

5601.2.1 Dacumentation shall be added as follows: The AHJ shall bave the authority to request
documentation reganding all aspects of the fireworks presentation.

$601.2.2 Proprietary Information shall be added as follows: The AHJ wili protect all proprietary
information,

Chapter §7

Section 5704 Storage

5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited shall be amended as follows: Storage
of Class | and Class II flammable liquids in above ground tanks outside of buildings s prohibited unless
approved by the fire chief. Whea permitted by the fire chief, all above ground tank(s) or vault installations
for the storage of Class 1, [T or Ill flammable and combustible liquids shail comply with those requirements as
set forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall also apply to installations ather than
motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above ground storage is required.

Section $706 Special Operations

5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited shall be amended as follows: Storage
of Class [ and Class 1 flammable liquids in above ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited unless
appraved by the Fire Chief. When permitted by the Fire Chief, all above ground tank(s) or vault installations
for the storage of Class 1, I or ITl flammablc and combustibic liquids shall comply with those requirements as
set forth by the California Fire Code. The Californis Fire Code shall also apply to installations other than
motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above ground slorage is required.

Chapter 58

Section 5806 Flammable Cryogenic Fluids

containers outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the fire chief. When permitted by the fire
chief, all stationary containers for the storage of flammable cryogenic fluids shall comply with those
requirements as set forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall also apply to
instaliations other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above ground storage is required.

Chapter 61

Section 6102 Defluitions the {ollowing definitions shall be added:

Ord. 192

Puge 120()7
20-0203 J Page 17 of 40



Installation shall mean & storage tank designed for the containment of liquefied petroleum gas, or meter
assembly regulating natural gas, for usc by a customer for residential, commercial, or industrial purposes,
together with appurtenant pipes, risers, gauges, and related equipment,

LPG Liquefied petroleum gas.

Supplier shall mean any person or business, which sells, at retail, LPG, or any company, which supplies
natural gas, for residential, commercial or industrial use.

Interruption of Service (shall only apply to LPG installations) shall mean the service shall be considered to
be interrupted whenever service is discontinued because of hazardous condition, change in size or type of
service, whenever the tank, meter, regulator(s), valve or other exterior service supply components are
removed, replaced, or repaired, whenever the service is relocated, whenever the building, tank piping or
components are damaged to the extent that the servicing utility, fire or building department considers the
service to be potentially hazardous. Normal refilling of an empty or partially empty tank, and routine
maintenance of interior appliances, shall not be considercd as an interruption of service.

Section 6164 Location of LP-Gas Containers

6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits shall be amended as follows: The storage of
liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacity when located at least
one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-half (1/2) mile from
existing rcsidential development with a densily greater than one (1} dwelling unit per acre and at least
one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved and a Special/Conditional Use
Permit is issued by the County.

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the dispersion of
liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested areas, the aggregate capacity of
any one instatiation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum
gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacity when located at least one-half (1/2) mile from
property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one- half (1/2) mile from existing residential
development with a densily greater than one (1) dwelling unit per acre and at least one-half (1/2) mile from
any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved and a Special/Conditional Use Permit is issued by the
County.

Section 6112 High Elevation Liquefied Petroleum Gas lastallations (5,000 foot elevations and above)

shall be added as follows:

Any new LPG installaticn shall comply with the following:

1. A pemnit is required by this Code for individual LPG containers of 125 gallons or greater. At the time of
application by any person for a permit to install an LPG system as required by this Code, the applicant
shall submit an LPG plot plan to the District for approval and shall contain the following:

a. Stamp of approval of the prospective LPG supplier.
b. Tank location showing distances to structure and edge 1o edge of pavement or other identifying
merk.
c. Tank capacity in US gallons.
. Location of riser pipe st building.
€. Property boundaries.

Ord. 19-2

Page 13 of 17
20-0203 J Page 18 of 40



f. An outline of all existing/proposed buildings ou the lot and a depiction of the mof ridge line of any
building to be supplied with LPG.
. Two stage regulator systems shall be installed on all LPG installations in sccordance with
manufacturer’s instructions. All first stage regulators and connecting pigtails shall be installed under a
protective valve cover on tank. All regulators installed under this cover shall be listed and approved for
this use and position of mounting. A connector providing flexibility shall be used to connect the first
stage regulator to the main service valve on the tank. All copper pigtails shall be intemally tinned and
use only forged flare nuts.
The riser from the yard piping shall be a minimum of Schedule 80 and shall be located not more than 3
inches honzonusily from the walls of the tank, and swing joints will be used above and below tank level
to provide for tank movement (street clbows shall not be used). An approved flexible alternative is
preferred in licu of rigid steel pipe for the tank riser. This shall include but not be limited to plastic (PE),
copper tubing, stainless steel. ALL FLEXIBLE MATERIAT, USED FOR THE TANK RISER SHALL
BE SHEATHED IN AN APPROVED STEFL COVER FOR PROTECTION. As swing joints are
eliminated in an approved flexible altemative, sufficient stack muat be mainlained to allow for tank
movemcent and/or expansion and contraction of the altemative material. All plastic pipe shail be buried
at least 18" below finished grade. An clecirically continuous corrosion resistant tracer wire (min. AWG
14) or tapc shall be buried with the plastic pipe to facilitate locating. One end shall be brought above
ground at the building wall or riser and the other end shall be brought above ground at the tank.
. The second stage regulator and riser pipe shall be installed on the gable end of the building, as close as
practical to the building wall, unless this is not feasible due to structural or topographical constraints.
An approved ges shutoff valve rated for a minimum of 125 PSI shall be installed immediately prior to
the second stage regulator. An approved gas shut off sign oc other identifier shail be installed directly
above the gas shut off valve, on the building in a visible Jocation within three (3) feet of the eaves of the
roof or roof line if no eaves are prescat. If the second stage regulator or & combination first/second stage
regulator is used at the tank, then an approved gas shut ofT valve shall be located at the building.
. A protective cover shall be installed over the second stage regulator and meter (if instalied) at the
building. The minimum design for the protective cover shall be equal to, or greater than, the Building
Design Load (determined by the building depantment), and shall be securely supparted (o the ground or
diagonally to the buiiding wall. When supported to the ground, the footing for the supports shall be
founded 6 inches below tinished grade. Pre-cast concrete piers may be used in lieu of poured footings,
provided they are placed on stable soil. If second stage regulator/meter assemblies could be subject to
vehicle damage then minimum of 3% steel crash post filled with concrete shall be installed for
protection. Crash posts shall bave a minimum depth in the ground of 24", embedded in concrete.
Observation and inspection, if any, by the District shall not const:tute an approval of the work of
installastion of the aforementioned protective cover, nor shall it be deerned to create any liability or
respunsibility oa the part of the District for the design or construction of the protective cover, nor to say
third party or entity whatsoever.
The riser pipes for the yard piping shall not be embedded in coacrete, asphalt or other rigid substance.
Such substance placed around a riser shall be heid beck at ieast 3 inches from ali sides of the pipe. All
exposed exterior gas piping used for runs along wells ar roofs shall be minimum schedule 80 steel pipe
supported and secured by approved straps at intervals not to exceed four (4) feet.

Ovd. 192

Page 14 0of 17
20-0203 J Page 19 of 40



-

1.

10,

11.

LPG tanks shall be permancntly marked by a square or other approved equal stake of wood or other
material with a minimum dimension of 2" X 2" or & cross sectional width of 2*, nominal lumber.

Such stakes shall be of sufficient height to rise above the anticipated snow depth, with the minimum
height being 10 feet. The snow stakes shall be yellow in color and will be placed oa the opposite side of
the tank from the riser, and directly opposite the tank valves. The top twelve inches of the stake shall be
painted orange. The side of the stake adjacent to the tank shall continue with the orange colora
minimum of 1§ inches from the top of the stake.

Installation and maintenance of all tank stakes shall be the responsibility of the LPG supplier. No tank
shall be filled or serviced uniess staked as provided in this chapter.

Any supplier supplying propane lo & tank must affix a label or other means of identification to the inside
of the tank valve protective cover. The iabel or other device must be waterproof and contain the
supplier’s name and emergency telephone number.

. All LPG tanks shall be placed on approved concrete supponts. Acceptable tank supports shall include,

but not be limited to: Pre-cast reinforced concrete pads, reinforced concrete slab, or pre-cast reinforced
concrete saddles. Use of un-reinforced cinder building blocks is specifically prohibited. If saddies are
used they shall contact 8 minimum of 1 10 degrees of the tank circumference. Asphalt impregnated felt
of not less than 3/8" thickness shall be installed between the container and the concrete saddle. Supports
may by poured in place in lieu of prefabricated supponts. If poured in place it shall be a minimum of 4
inches thick and reinforced with not less than WWF 6X12, W16 by W26 or 4 #3 rebar in each direction.
In arcas where 1ank may be subject (o shifting snow, unstable ground or other hazardous condition, the
Fire Chief may require additional tank supporting, securing or protection.

Section 6113 Underground LPG Tanks Instaliations and Ownership shail be added as follows:

6113.1 Permits and Plans. Permits shall be required, and plans shall be submitted for il underground tank
installations as approved by the AHJ.

6113.2 Underground LPG Tank Owaership. Underground LPG tanks shall be prohibited from being sold
to end-users and shall be retained by the LPG company under & lease-type system (o ensure proper annual
maintenance requirements are met and recorded.

Section 6114 Natural Gas shall be added as follows:

Existing natural gas instaliatons shall comply with the following:

The meter assembly shall be instalied on the gable end of the building, as close as practical to the building
wall, unless this is not feasible due 10 structural or topogrephical construints.

A protective cover, designed to be equal to or greater than the Building Design Load (determined by the
building department), approved by the supplicr, shall be installed over the meter assembly, securely
supported to the ground or diagonally to the building wall. When supponied to the ground, the footing for
the supports shall be founded 6 inches below finished grade. Pre-cast concrete piers may be used in lieu
poured footings, provided they are placed on stable soil,

Section 61185 Violations shall be added as follows:
6115.1 Violations. It sha!l be unlawful for an LPG supplier o provide service to a LPG installation, which
does not comply with the provisions in section 6112 or 6113.

Ord. 192

Page 150f 17
20-0203 J Page 20 of 40



- 6115,2 Failure to Provide Cover. Failure by the customer to provide & cover as required for a natural gas

meter assembly is a violation of this code and will subject the customer (o & one hundred dollar ($100.00)
fine,

APPENDIX D - FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS
- Section 103 Minimum Specifications
D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hyvdrant shall be amended as follows: Exception: Driveways
D103.2 Grade shall be amended as follows:
Fire apparatus access roads shall not exceed 10 percent in grade.
Exception 1 : In areas above 5,000 fi, elevation, driveways of R-3 Occupancies shall not exceed 12 percent in
grade, unless otherwise authorized by the Fire Chief. If approved, the driveway slope may exoeed 12% (12
vertical feet to one hundred Lorizontal feet), provided the driveway meets or exceeds the prescribed minimum
width, and is no longer in length than the maximum permissible height of the structure within such junsdiction,
but in no case movre than 35 fieet, and has the appropnate transitional slopes at the edge of pavement to property
line, and has no significant articulation greater than 45% angle in its entire length).
- D103.3 Turning Radius shail be amended as follows: The minimum tuming radius shall be determined by
the fire code official; and shall not include curb and gutter.
- D103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates shall be amended as follows: Where a single gate is provided,
the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm). Where & fire apparatus road consists of a divided
roadway, the gate width shall pot be lcss than 15 fect (4572 mm).

- Section D164 - Commercial and Industrial Developments

- D104.2 Buildings exceeding 62,000 syuare feet in area shall bc amended as follows: Buildings or
facilities having & gross building area of more than 62,000 square fect shall be provided with two scparate
and approved fire apparatus access roads. Delete exception.

- D104.3 Remoteness shall bc amended as follows: Where two access roads are required, they shall be placed
a distance apart equal o pot less than one half of the length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension of
the propeny or arca 1o be served, measured in a siraight line between acoesses.

Exception: Fire apparatus roads cannot be instailed because of location on property, topography,
waterways, nonncgolisblc grades or similar condition, and an apgwoved alternative means of fire
protection is provided.

- D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Accesy Roady shall be added as follows: When required by the
Fire Code Official, » fire apparatus access road shall be constructed 1 encompass the entirety of a structure
and shal} provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle nocess.

Section D185 - Acrial Fire Apparatus Acceas Roads

- D105.1 Where required shall be amended as follows: Buildings or portions of buildings or facilities
exceeding 30 feet in height above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access shall be provided with
approved fire apparatus access roads capable of accommodating fire department acrial apparatus. Overhead
utility and power lines shall not be located within the serial fire spparatus access roadway.

- D105.2 Width shall be amended as follows: Aerial fire apparatus access roads shall have » minimum
unobstructed width of 2¢ feet, exclusive of shoulders, in the immediate vicinity of any building or portion of
building more than }) feet in height.

Ovd. 192

Page 16 0f 17
20-0203 J Page 21 of 40



- Section D106 - Multiple-Family Residential Developments
D106.1 Projects havinz more than 100 dwelling units shall be amended as follows: Multiple-family
residential projects having more than 100 dwelling units shall be equipped throughout with two separate and
approved fire apparatus access roads. Delete exception.

- Section D107 - One or Two-Family Residential Developments

- D107.1 One- or two-famil dwellin; residential developments shal! be amended as follows:
Developments of one- or two- family dwellings shall be provided with separate and approved fire apparatus
access roads and shall mect the requirements of D107.2 Remoteness, when required by the Fire Chief,
Delete exceptions.

SECTION 4: CONFLICT
That Ordinance No, 16-1 of MBFPD, and all other ordinances or pants of ordinances herewith are hereby repealed.

SECTION §: SEVERABILITY
If any Ordinance, anticle, subsection or subdivision thereot, provision, sentence, clause or phrase of this code, or any
application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of competent junisdiction, such decision shall not
affect the remaining provisions of this code, which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, therefore,
such invalid portions are deciared to be severable. MBFPD hereby declares that it would have enacted this
Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thercol, provisions, sentences, clauses or
phrases irrespective of the fact 1hat one or more of them is declared invalid.

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION
‘This Ordinance shall take etfect thirty (30} days alter its adoption. The MBEFPD Board Secretary is dirccted to
publish this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the District, In lieu of publication of the full text of
the ardinance, a summary of the ordinance may be published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15) days
afier its passage and a certified copy shall be posted in the office of MBFPE, pursuant to Govemment Code Section
16933(c) (1),

The above Ondinance was introduced at & meeting of the Board of Directors ol MBFPD un September 25, 2019,
and it was then read for the first time, The Ordinance was read for the second time vn December 11, 2019.

PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF MEEKS BAY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT QF COUNTY OF EL
DORADO AT A REGULAR BOARD MEETING OF SAID BOARD, HELD ON THE 11* DAY OF December , 2019 BY THE FOLLOWING
VOTE OF SAID BOARD:

AYES: b T PO A P

B § o r K
T P O R
NOES: 0 . " L Lt J"’ é .z"‘.AL.’:.,':..)fr I,‘. L.
ABSTENTIONS: 0 PRESIDENT, BOARD OF DIRECTORS
ABSENT: 0 BY. Edwardl. Miller

| CERTIFY THAT THE FORFGOING IS A CORRECT COPY OF A RESOLUTION DULY ADOPTED BY SAID BOARD OF DIRECTORS
ON THE DATE THEREIN SET FORTH, '

‘.\_1,1;:1 s ___,Ll LAY
CLERK OF THE BAARD OF DIR‘-( TORS
BY: _Shawn R Crawford

20-0203 J Page 22 of 40



MEK

Significant

Fire Code # What Is the Change? Why is There a Local Change?

change?

Amend with the name of the jurisdiction

Locally adopted and amended

Administrative need

Adopting this section addresses Climatic conditions: LPG
gas shall be amended as follows: Add to the exception: At
lor above 5,000 feet of elevation, a permit is not required for

better left to localities to determine the
fess/penalties for their respective areas.

105.6.27 Add section individual containers with a 125 gallon water capacity or
less, or muitiple container systems having an aggregate
quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving occupancies in
groupR 3.

Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance
! of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines
1065 Add section Locally created and adopled - ivs lan checks, and inspections as alowed in Health
' &Safety Code 17951.

106.6.1 Add section Locally created and adopted  |oocton 106.6.1 Cast Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to

the Fire District.
. Section 106.7 To recover the aciual costs of avoidable
106.7 Add section Locally created and adopted failed inspections by contractors.
) - Aliows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that
Completed the section by filling in the blank )
portions that were not completed by the SFM. Itis protects lfe and property. F ees have been updatt?d to
1104 better lef to locaiities to determing the Locally adopled and amended match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriale by the
fees/penalties for their respective areas, District Atomey’s Office. The change to the language to
P ' include the term infractions.
110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2
Citations
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authonzed representative (s),
1104.2 Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before Locally created and adopted may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor
o but under a different number) y P viofations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the
Health and Safety Code of the State of Califomia and
Chapler 5¢ (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Califomia.
Completed the section by filfing in the blank
124 portions that were not completed by the SFM. Itis Locally adopted and amended All violations of the code have been consolidated under

Section 110.4 to include the penalties for viclations.

114.1 through 114.2

Allows Limitation and Reserving of Rights

Locally adopted and amended

Added the ability for the Board of Directors of the District,
the right to amend, modify, supplement, revoke in whole, or
in part, any of the provisions contained or incorporated
herein, at any time and from time to time.

Added definitions for: Campfire, District, Executive Body,
Fire Chief, May, Shali, and Trained Crowd Manager.

202 Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopled Definition of campiire shall not include LPG or Propane
fueled appliances.
302.1 Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopled Added definition for clarity
307.1.1 Added restrictions due lo weather/Red Flag Locally created and adopled Increase risk of catastrophic wild fire
307 4.4 through Dus to the high fire danger that exists in E| Dorado County
30'7 4 4 2r°(l£ Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopted we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas.

20-0203 J Page 23 of 40



Changed vertical clearances to 15 feet and road

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical
clearance of 15 feet provides proper dearance for
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus
components. [t also allows an extended time frame before
having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional

503.2.1 widths 1o 20 feet Locally adopted and amended height for vegelation clearances acts as an increased buffer
' for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of
shoulders, as measured face of curb (o face of curb is
needed. These structures can be difficult to navigate with
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the tolal
drivable road surface
Added a specifc section for R3's where it allows the Fire apparatus require areas for tuming around when
. . N multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency, This
503.2.5 ﬁzﬁeﬂa‘:d I.'::‘.SIE:::Z?J? d’:?g:’:;i:‘s toralus Locally adopted and amended includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides
a roa dsyan 4 drivewa ppa better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum
y5- around for apparalus in driveways greater than 150",
Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated
Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated Surfaces of €| Dorado County and Appendix D of the
503.2.6 Surfaces to state and match El Dorade County Locally adopted and amended g&ﬁ;ﬁ?ﬁ;ﬂ:ﬂ?@’:ﬁﬁ:ﬁ?ﬁ:ﬁﬁ:ﬂ asan
Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-1 7: alternate means & methods that is not less restrictive than
the Fire Code.
. . - This section clearly defines the *No Parking in Fire Lanes”
503.4.2 Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes Locally created and adopted rules and is consistent with the Caifomia Vehicle Code.
" . - This section clearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire
503.4.3 :;d:::“ssechm regarding no parking in front of Locally created and adopted hydrants® rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicle
Code.
. : This section clearly defines Califomia Fire Code Appendix D
503.4.4 } :d:ﬂ?d secton regarding fire lanes on road Locally created and adopted as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire
lanes.
Crealed and adopted to maintain emergency Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on
access and consistency through all roadway gates X roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing
5036 through 503.6.1 in | Dorado County, refering to the gate standards Locally created and adopted the best possible emergency access to maintain fast
adopted by the FPO's. response times.
Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing
505.1 buildings. Locally adopted and amended based on the District's addressing standards.
505.1.1 Added additional addressing requirements Locatly created and adopted Establishes installation, location, and visibility requirements.
- . , Establishes requirements for permanent posting and
505.1.1 (1) Added additional addressing requirements Locally created and adopted visibility requirements from construcion through completion.
. . . Establishes requirements for address signs along one way
§05.1.1(2) Added additional addressing requirements Locally created and adopted roads assuring visibility rom both directons
- . . Establishes requirements for multiple addresses accessed
505.1.1(3) Added additional addressing requirements Locally created and adopted from a single driveway shall be moounted on a single post.
Establishes requirements for where a roadway provides
- . ] access to a single commercial or industrial buliding the
A | . .
505.1.1 (4) Added additional addressing requirements Locally created and adopted addess shall be placed at the nearest road intersection
providing access.
Created and adopted to maintain key boxes and NP )
506';6:5??9" Jlocks for buildings with gates and/or sprinkler Locally adopted and amended :Ilows Fire District to require key boxes for emergency
o systems. )
507.5.4.1 Created and adopted to address snow removal and Locally adopted and amended Allows Fire District to maintain emergency access without

lsnow storage.

impedance by snow removal or storage.

20-0203 J Page 24 of 40



Created and added Public Private Partnership Fund

Allows the Fire District to adopt a public private partnership
fund infrastructure and capital improvements (Partnership
Fund) to receive contributions of cash or property qualifying

and fire alarms

507.5.7 ; Locally created and adopted under intemal Revenue Code Section 170 to fund
for Infrastructure and Capital Improvements operations and maintenance, including but not limited to
mobile water supply apparatus such as fire boal(s), andior
water tender(s).
"1Created and added to impose the requirements of - ) "
§04.1.2 NFPA 110 and NFPA 111 for emergency and Locally adopted and amended A“‘-‘t’;f“':e !&sﬁ:!:‘j\m of emergency and standby power
standby power systems. Sys wl .
50147 Created and added to address sprinkler systems Locally adopted and amended dieineates the requirements for sprinklers and fire alrasm on

existing and new buildings

901.11 through 901.14

Created and added to address fire alarm systems

Locally adopted and amended

Added definition for clarity

902

Added definitions for clarity

Locatly created and adopted

Added definitions for: Vendor, Approved, Audible Alamm,
False Alarm, Fire Alarm System, Local Fire Alarm System,
Subscriber

903.1

Adds a requirement for all sprinkler systems to be
anti-freeze or non-freezing type.

Locally created and adopted

Due to the dlimatic conditions of the District all sprinkler
systems must be of the anti-freeze or non-freezing type to

function properly.

903.2.a

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the
structure, whichever is less.

Locally created and adopted

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
fincreased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minule, we require sprinkiers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

503.2b

Adds occupant protection for existing buildings less
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the
structure, whichever is less.

Locally created and adopled

Due to the topographic, dimalic, and geographic conditions
of Et Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minuts, we require sprinilers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

903.2.1,903.2.3,
903.2.4,903.2.7

These sections were created to give specific
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on
foccupancy and square footage

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, dimatic, and geographic conditions
of E| Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
{increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinkiers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they refate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

903.2.8

This section was created to incude manufactured
residential singte family R-3 in the residential
sprinkler program

Locally created and adopted

Manufactured Homes — The intent of this code section is to
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption
due lo the light-weight nature of their construction. The
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk
successfully in many California communities.

20-0203 J Page 25 of 40



Dus to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of E! Dorado County and their contributing factors to our

90344

sprinkler water flow alarm in residmtlal
oewpanaes i :

B These seclions were created to give spedific increased response times, along with the fact that fires
903.2.9, 903.2.10 direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
occupancy and square foolage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
. foet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
+|Adds aiudble notifcation in al sleeping rooms of & Locally created and adopted " - Allows Distirct fo require audnble ofa spunlder waler now

1alarm

Added oecupant protechon for fire alams in -

R3, AG bunldngs ot used for commercial

buildings with a floor area fess than 3,600, except L

Prowdw proper emergency nonﬁcauon for oeeupanaa that

?07.2.& pu poses, and buildings with a floof afea ‘ofless. Locally created and adopted zt)v:vg:‘l:lg :st‘i’r :r:: ::;l;(r:s Fire Department notification in
G than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code Co :
ofﬁaal
L Added occupant protection for existing buildings - - Protvides proper o ency ntificaton for dccupandies that
, without automatic sprinkler systems to install a fire . ] smerg . I
907.2b Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
. alam if they add more than 30% or 1,000 square the event of a fire o smoke
feet to the structure, whichever s less. ’
Added occupant protection by stating afl fire alam L
detection systems instafled shall be connected to a. |- Provides proper emergericy notification for occupancies that
907.2.c ‘monitoring service that notifies the fire department Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
lupon activation and is installed per Section 907 of the event of a fire or smoke.
the fire code.
|Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
907.2d 'system tems fo be connected to a monitored fire alann Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
system when installed or replaced. the event of a fire or smoke.
Primary Secondary Alamn Power Supply Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E
907.6.2.1 Modification Locally created and adopted safely related power outages.
This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to
1203.1.3 Shunt trip power safety devices Locaily adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up
' power supplies
' . L Addressing for construction sites is important to assist
33103 Address requirements for construction sites Locally created and adopled ing emergency .
Water supplies at construction sites with Water must be on site prior to combustible material being
33121 combustible materials on-site Locally adopted and amended stored or vertical construction commencing.
This section darifies that within the boundaries of El Dorado
. . ) County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are
4305.4 :‘d‘i‘i’i:'::g” to dlarify roof construction Locally crealed and adopted  |wildtand fir safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof
e covesing or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly.
Any damages or costs from negligent practices that Hazar_dogs ma'(enals related inqdenls are costly to fmtlgate.
5001.7 cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally created and adopted Ifthe incident is caused by negligence due fo a business
' cost recovery fee. y op process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the
efy tee. negligent parties.
:yddb:h tro Fito et end ghm:; ”JEJZ’.;??i Allows agencies that need to know aboul explasives and
5601.2 . 8 P Locally adopted and amended fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of of the appications they wil be used fr
Supervisors for fireworks. ©y '
The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any
Fireworks companies or vendors shall make mp";:::‘::no :;:Iudmg tm:?g ;md pro:f:alst;rz m;‘o:(nt:t;on
5601.2.2 available all requested documentation pertaining to Locally created and adopted Y aspact of a freworks display y

the firework presentation

deem necessary. This information is understood to be
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as
such,

20-0203 J Page 26 of 40



5704.2.9.6.1

Established limils as set forth in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Established fimits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class Il combustible liguid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a
Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County.

5706.24.4

Estabiied s ss satothin e Fire Code

Locally éddp(e'd and amended

Estabished imits as required by the Fire Code for Cless
flammablé and Class Il combustible liquid special
opefaﬂons in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval

: and a Speaal/Condmonal Use Petmn from the CouMy

. 5B02:

o Adm mstratwe adcﬁbon of Dnstnct nama

Estabﬁshed fimits'as set fonh in the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended.

Admums!rahve need to add District name. Established limits
as requited by the Fire Code Official for Flammable
Cryogénic fluids in stahonary containers. Requires AHJ
approval and a Special/Conditional Use Permn from the
County. - . .

6102

Added definitions for clarity

Locally created and adopted

Added definitions for: Installanon LPG, Suppller
Interruption of Service

6104.2

Established imits for LPG storage and dispensing
near or adjacent lo residential development

Locally adopted and amended

Establishes distances between LPG storage and
dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential
developments and high-density hotels, motel, apartments,
etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would
have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death.
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use
Permit from the County.

6112

Establishes propane regulator requirements for
{locations above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes procedures for the safe handling of propane
above 500 feet. There are special requirements above
5000 feet due to snow loads and sheer the made propane a

_ |significant ignition source and danges during the winter

months. This section requires certain rules for regulators,
vertical riser piping, markings and locations, and permit and
plan requirements.

6112 (N)abcdef

Establishes propane regulator requirements for
locations above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes permit requirements for propane tanks greater
than 125 Gallons. There is a requirement for a plot plan for
all new installations signed by a Ipg supplier that contains
building locations, lot lines, capacities, riser pipe location,
roof ridge line depiction.

6112(2)

Establishes propane regulator requirements for
locations above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes requirements for regulators. Installation of
regulators shall meet manufacturers instructions, 1st stage
regulators to be located under a cover, all regulators must
be listed and approved, fiexible connectors shalt be used
between first stage regulator and main service valve.

6112(3)

Eslablishes propane vertical riser pipe requirements
above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes vertical propane rise requirements for locations
for the District. Pipe schedule location, swing joint
requirements,“and the use of flexible riser piping as well as
swing joints. These requirements are based on significant
fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather conditions
encountered above 5000 feet.

6112 (4)

Establishes propane shut off valve requirements
above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes shut off valve requirements including focations
at the gable end of the building and visibility requirements.

6112 (5)

Establishes propane protective covers for second
stage regulators and meters requirements above
5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopled

Establishes construction requirements for protective covers
for second stage regulators and meters including concrete
piers and footings.

6112 (6)

Establishes propane endemnity clause
requirements above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes observational and inspection protections for the
District.

6112(7)

Establishes propane vertical yard riser pipe
requirements above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopled

Establishes propane yard riser pipe requirement clearances
for concrete installations and the use of schedule 80 steel
piping 8s a minumum requrement.

Z0-02U03 J Page 27 of 40




6112 ®

Establishes propane LPG tank markings
requirements above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes minimums of a 2°x2" wooden stake to
permanently mark tank locations.

6112 (9)

Establishes propane LPG tank markings
requirements above 5000 foot elevation

Locatly created and adopted

Establishes height requirements for stakes.

6112 (10)

Establishes propane installation and maintenance
requirements above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes requirements for the stakes to be instalied by
the LPG suppiier.

6112(11)

Establishes propane marking and location
requirements above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes marking and location requirements for locations
for the District. This section addresses signage focation,
emergency contact information, and snow related tank
marking requirements. These requirements are based on
significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather
conditions encountered above S000 feet.

6112 (12)

Establishes propane tank support requirements
above 5000 foot etevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes approved propane tank supporis such as pre-
cast reinforced concrete pads, stabs, or saddles

6113.4

Permils and piéns shall be submitted and approved
by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction).

Locally created and adopted

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground
tanks:

Allows us to require plans be submitted for review prior to
instatiations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks
require substantial maintenance including inspection and
anode replacement at reguler intervals.

6113.2

Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the
{property of the LPG company

Locally created and adopted

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when
sold to the end user. This does not apply lo abave ground
tanks where comosion and leaks are more easily detected.

6114

Eslablishes requirements for natural gas
installations, meter locations, and protective covers
over meters.

Locally created and adopled

Establishes requirements for natural gas installations to
protect the meter on structures. These requirements are
based on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet.

6115.1

Adds a violation process if an LPG Supplier
provides service to a LPG installation that does not
comply with Sections 6112 or 6113.

Locally created and adopted

Establishes a violation process for LPG installation that
encounter high snow loads and do not meet Sections 6112
or 6113. These requirements are based on significant fire
history in heavy snow and extreme weather conditions
encountered above 5000 feet.

6115.2

Adds a violation process if a customer does provide
cover for a natural gas meter assembly.

Locally created and adopted

Establishes a violation process for LPG installation that
encounter high snow loads and do not meet Sections 6112
or 6113. These requirements are based on significant fire
history in heavy snow and extreme weather conditions
encountered above 5000 feet.

Appendix D: D103.1

Made an exception for residential driveways

Locally adopted and amended

Itis unreasonable to require a residential driveway to
construct a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant.

Appendix D: D103.2

Establishes requirements for fire apparalus access
roads {o not exceed 10 percent grade and in areas
above 5,000 Feet elevation driveways of R-3
‘occupancies shall not exceed 12 percent grade.

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the significant fire history in heavy snow and
extreme weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet
these requirements will allow apparatus to access
occupancies when heavy snow limits traction.

Appendix D: D103.3

Text to include curbs and gutters

Locally adopted and amended

20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutters due
to potential access issues and tumning radius concems.

Where fire apparetus access roads consist of a divided

Appendix D: D103.5
oLy 5 Freapparatusaoeessroadgates - Locally adopted and amended roamaymegatemdmshallnotbelessmm15feelduelo
Appendix D: D104.2 Added to require two equally spaeed two ﬁre Where buﬂdmgs exceed 62, ooo square feet two equally
o 010'4 3 ' apparatus access roads on buildings that exceed Locally created and adopted spaced fire apparatus access roads will be required to allow

|62,000 square feet

access in fire emergencies.

20-0203 J Page 28 of 40




Added to require circumferential fire apparatus

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire

Appendix D: D104.4 N access roads Locally created and adopted structure and shall provide a continuous means of
emergency vehicle access.
Appendix D: D105 &'ﬁﬁ"&?&ifﬁ"ﬂ?omﬁ;m vt For the safety of the communities we live in, ingress/egress
D105.4 D.1 052 ! N capable of modah fire department aerial Locally adopted and amended is required for fire department aerial apparatus to ensure
o ’ pa aoco ng !he safety of the madenls and first n-spondas
apparalus. S
] - AR ) ) For the safety of the commumtm we hve in, two ways of
Appendix D: D106.1 N, [Removed Exception in its entirety. : Locally adopted and amended mgresslegtess are requnred to ensure the safety of the
. ) . . b e - rescdentsandﬁvstmpmdefs
o . . e L Formesafetyofmaoommumueswellvem twowaysof
AppendixD: D107.1 | N. . - [Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended  [ingresslegress are required to ensure the safety of the
: ' . L o residénts and first responders. :
Adopted with no Amendments
101.2 through 1015 N “Iwidity“’d to establish scope, intent, severabilty and Locally adopted Administrative dlarity
102.6 through 102.8 N References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative dlarity
102.10 through 102.12 N Qonmc_ﬁng provisions, Other Laws, Application of Locally Adopted Administative clarity
references
103.1 through 103.4.1 N Deﬁhiﬁm of the Fire Prevention Division Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.1 N Ability to enforce the code Locally Adobted Administrative clarity
104.3 through 104.4 N Right of Entry, Warrants, and Identification Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.6 through 104.6.4 N Record retention Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
1048 twough 1049.2) N md’_“mﬁ‘?“s' adlemate means and methods, and Locally Adopted Administrative dlarity
104.11 through Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of ; A .
104112 N systems Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.11.3 N Authority of systems and devices in _ogab«e Locally Adopted Administrative dlarity
105.2.3 N Time limitation of application Locally Adopted Administrative darity
:ggg; through N |Operational permits Locally Adopted Administrative dlarity
Dry cleaning operational permits required for T .
105.6.12 N hazardous deaning sohvent use Locaily Adopted Administrative clarity
Permits for various business operations for: Magnesium,
: . A . jmiscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparatior
:8:25528 through N :;og;:dmﬂzzahy?:smnlsMbm daity and Locally Adopted vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing facilities, open burning,
o open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and
organic coatings
Adopled this section for administrative dlarity and ) )
105.6. ?7 N {fire and life safety inspections Locally Adopted Permits for places of assembly
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and : .
1_05..6‘.39 N fire and fife safety inspections Lowlly Adopted Permits for privale fire hydrants
S o - ) Permits for pyroxylin plastics, refrigeration equipment, repair
105.6.41 through N Adopted this section for administrative dlarity and Local A dopted garages and motor fuel-dispensing facilities, rooftop
105.6.46 fire and life safety inspections Y \hellpods spraying or dipping, storage of scrap tires and tire
by-products
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and I -
105.6.48 N e and life safety inspeclions Locally Adopted Permit for tire-rebuilding plants
; Adopted this section for administrative danty and ' Permit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material,
105.6.50 N ﬁre and life safety mspecuons Locally M°pt_ed v lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 cubic feet)
. . Adopted Ihns section for admmvsuahve danty and : - .
1061 lhroum 1063 |fire and ifé safety inspections. . - L ‘LocallyAdo;.;_ted_ S Feeschedules for‘.pt.armn_;_ L
T Adoptedﬁussechonfnradmlmsh‘abvedantyand R Sl
10;7'1-.. R ,N fire and life safety inspections, - - LocalIyAdup_ led ['T"""“‘ authority

20-0203 J Page 29 of 40



Adopted this section for administrative dlarity and

Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of
equipment, re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping,

108.1 through 109.3 . . ) Locally Adopted supervision, rendering equipment inopereble, overcrowding,
fira and i safety inspections Board of Appeals established, limitations on authority, and
quaﬁﬂmbons _
110.3.2 through Adopted thus section for admmlstratrve danty and Locally Adopted Compluance with orders and nohws. pmsecuuon of
11034 . fire and life safely inspections : - . . vno!abons and unauthorized tampenng
; Adopted this section for admmlst:abvs danty and : p : : -
o4t e and lf safety inspections © . _ Locally Adopted Ab”"‘"""m"”a"m
e Adopted this séction for admnmstrahve danty and
tal ﬁreandlafesafe(ymspeebons o + Locally Adopted. Yo dis L
L ' L _ Asphalt Ketties contam hlghly ﬂammable substanoes and
303.1 through 303.9 Adapted lhcs sechon for ﬁre and hfe safety Locally Adopted” require stingent safeguards (Cllmahc geologml and
SR Ca v S {topographical) :
AR A - Mmagingighménsoumm}bbghiésbohsﬂéapplicaum
305.1 through 305.5 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted of standards will reduce the number of fires in various
. o : S : settmgs (Cﬁmatic, geologml and lopographleal)
y ' ' Mobon picture projection rooms and ﬁlm are HIGHLY
306.1 through 306.2 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted flammable and require special handling (Cllmahc,
- . o T geological, and topographical)
o N " : (Open buming, recreationai fire, and portable outdoor
307.1 thrdugh 307.5 Adopted this section for fire and life safely Locally Adopted freplaces, (Cimatic, geological, and topographical)
208.1 Adopted this secton for fire and life safely Locally Adopted Open flame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and
: ‘ topographical)
308.1.2 through - , e Throwing or plédng of ignition sources, torches for
308.1.3 Adopted this section forfire and ife safely Locally Adopted removing paint (Cimatic, geological, and topographicai).
) Locations near oombusﬁﬁle. open flame devices, signals
- and markers, portable fue! open-flame devices, sky-
308.1.5 through lantems, refigious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming
gg:.:.:)(exduding Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted food and beverage preparation, dispensing, containers not
o in use, serving of flaming food, locafion, fire protection
(Climatic, geclogical, and topographical)
3082 [Adopted this secton for fire and life safety Locally Adopted :n";mm p':‘i‘:l’;’““““ secion (Cimatic, gealogical,
Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices,
308.3 through 308.4.1 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted [theatrical performances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2
dormitories (Climatic, geotogical, and topographical)
1 ] ) » General requirements relating to smoking {Climatic,
310 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted qeclogical, and topographical) ‘
303 Adopted this section for fire and fife Saety Locally Adopted J;:;’ogs'm“;‘:"gns'g“s (Climatic, geological, and
i : o o - Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with "No Smoking”
310.4 through 310.8 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adapted: signs, ash trays, buming objects, hazardous environmental
N L . S conditions. {Climatic, geological; and topographical)
Vacant premises condition and safety requirements,
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant
311.1 through 311.4 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted premises, security, fire protection, fire separation, removal

of combustibles, removal of hazardous materials. (Climatic,
Qeologml. and topogmphwa')

Adop(ed this sedion for ﬂre and life safety

General requnraments relating fo mobile food preparation
vehndes (Chmabc geologml and topograph:cd)

%ﬁre and life safely inspections’

Adopled this section for admnmstrahve danly and

" Locally Adopted - -

Permm for mobi!e food preparahm vehades (Chmaﬂc.
geological, and fopographical) -

20-0203 J Page 30 of 40




319.3 through
319.10.3

Adopted his section for fire and lfe safety -

Locally Adopted

Exhaust hood, fire protection, fire protection for cooking
equipment, fire extinguisher, appliance connection to fue!
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, metallic
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking oil
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting,
normal vents, emergencyvents LP-gas systems, maximum
aggregate volume, protection of container, LP-gas container
construction, protection of system piping, LP-gas alams,
CNG systems CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel,
maximum aggregate volunie, proledlm of container, CNG
container construction, CNG containers supplymg
transpiration and eookmg fuel; protecbon of system piping,
méthane alarms, maintenance, exhaust systen, fire
protection systems and devices and fued gas systems.
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)

403.8.1 through
403.8.1.7

Adopted this section for fire and lfe safety

Locally Adopted

Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1
(residentia! care facilities and group homes) evacuation and
fire safely pians.

403.10 through
4034013

Adopled this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancy
Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic,
Jgeological, and topographical)

405.5

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Localty Adopted

Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

5103

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and

fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

A permitis required for emergency responder radio systems
(Climalic, geological, and topographical)

1807.5.2 through
807.5.2.3

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a
Jmaximum amount of fiammable wall coverings in
educational facilities (Climatic, geological, and
topographica)

903.21.5

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers)
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000
square feet. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

1103.2

-IAdopted this section in existing buildings for the

safety of firefighters and other emergency
|responders.

Locally Adopted

Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings.
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by
the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind
this section is that on almost alt emergency responder injury
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do nol have
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Appendix D: D101.1
through D102.1

Adopted this section for the safety of the public,
{firefighters, and other emergency responders.

Locally Adopted

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads -
vnduding loads. (Climatic, geological, and topographicat)

Appendix D: D103.4

Adopted this section for the safety of the public,
Hiirefighters, and other emergency responders.

Locally Adopted

Dead end fire apparatus access road requitements for a
tum around at 150 feet. (Climatic, geologica!, and
topographical)

Appendix D: D103.6

Adopled this secbon for the safety of the public,
ﬁreﬁghm and other emetgency responders

Locally Adopted

*No Parking, Fire Lane" signs reqdirements. {Climatic,
geological, and topographical): . .

Appen de D104.1
through D104.3
(excluding exception)

ot m ot the ety of the pubic
firefighters, and other emergency responders.

 Locaty Adopted

Commercial and industrial developrrientfre spparatiss
access roads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

0-0203 J Page 37 of 40



Appendix D: D105.1 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopled Requirements for aerial fire apparalus access roads
through D105.4 firefighters, and other emergency responders. Y (Climatic, geological, and topographical) -
mmug: 3?06031 %1 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopted Fire apparatus access roads for muliple-family residential
(excluding exceptions) . firefighters, and othgr e@egmq responders. developments (Chmahc geological, and topographical)
Appendix D: D107.1 : One- o lwo-dwelllng mdenbal developments shafl be
through p72. | N Adapted this sedzon fOflhe safety ofthe public, | P Locally Adopted quipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire
) T : ﬁreﬁghlefs and other eme'geno/ respcndets . appatams access roads due to topographlc geographnc and

(excluding exception) | . O .
_ i ST IR [ cﬁmahcconcﬁhons

L U |Adopted this sechon'for safety ofthepublic, | ;- . Adopt referenoe slandards deahng with gate construction

ppencix D: D10 - N frefightes, and ot smergency rosponders. | Locally Adopled Stadatds (linatc,geokogica and pogrphica)

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adépie& ‘again in this codé cycle.

White celis are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions.

20-0203 J Page 32 of 40




| SIERRA SUN

580 Mallory Way, Carson City, NV 88701
P.O. Box 1888 Carson City, NV 86702
(775) 881-1201 FAX: (775) 887-2408

Customer Account #; 1066595

Lega! Account

MEEKS BAY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT,
PO BOX 189

TAHOMA, CA 98142

Attn: Shewn Crewford

Balies Liston says:
That (s)he is & legal cierk of the
Sletra Sun,

a newspapsr published Friday
ot Truckes, in the State of California.

Copy Line
Public Hearing Notice
POS:

Ad #; 0000514194-01

of which & copy Is hereto attched, was published
In said newapaper for the full required period of
2 time(s) commencing on 11/29/2019,

and ending on 12/06/201%, all days inclusive.

Eu'km ﬁfufbn_.

Signed:
Dete: 12/08/2010 State of Nevade, Carson City

This is en Original Electronic AfMdavit
Price: § 08.52

“} cort{fy (or daciore) under penoly of pevjury tunder the
lows of the Stete of Colifernis thet the foregeing &k true
ond comect.”

Proof and Statement of Publication
Ad #: 0000814194-01

NOTICE IS HEREBY
GIVEN that Meeks Bay
Fire Protection District
will hold a public hearing
on December 11th, af
3:30pm, at 8041 Hwy
89, Meeks Bay, CA, re-
garding the adoption of
the Amendments to the
2019  Califomia  Fire
Code pursuant to Health
and Safety Code Section
13869. Copies of the
code section referred to
and any secondary code
sections referred to,
adopted by reference,
are on file with the Sec-
retary of the District and
are open to public in-
spection.

Pub: Nov. 29, Dec. 6,
2019 Ad #0000514194

20-0203 J Page 33 of 40



Attachment No. 2
Meeks Bay Fire Protection District

Resolution No. 2019-06

20-0203 J Page 34 of 40



Meeks Bay Fire Protection District

RESOLUTION

of the Board of Directors
No: 2019-06

A resolution for Mecks Bay Fire Protection District setting forth findings with respect (o local conditions
within the Fire District which make certain modifications and changes to the California Fire Code reasonably
necessary for preserving fire and life safety in Mocks Bay Protection District.

The Governing Board of Mecks Bay Fire Protection District finds and resolves as follow:

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permuts & Fire Protection District 1o adopt an ordinance
which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations adopted pursuani 1o Health & Safety Code Section
17922 upon determination that such changes or modifications are necessary due (o local conditions; and

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires thst a Board of Directors making any changes
or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 shall make express finding that such
changes or modifications are needed; and shall file s copy of such changes or modifications with the
Depanment of Honsing and Community Development.

NOw, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED AND ORDERED that the Board of Directors of Mesks Bay Fire
Protection District, after having duly noticed and held public hearing, expressly finda that such changes or
modifications are reasonably necessary because of local conditions, more specifically set forth as follows:

FINDINGS OF FACT
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BUILDING STANDARDS CODE
(TTTLE 24 PART %) BECAUSE OF LOCAL CONDITIONS

CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS: Pursuant 1o Section [7958.5, 17958.7 and 18241.5 of the
California Health & Safety Code, the Board of Directors of Meeks Bay Fire Protection District, in ils
ordinance adopting sand amending the 2019 California Fire Code, changes or modilies certain provisions of
the 2019 Building Standards Code, (Title 24 Part 9), as it pentains to the regulation of buildings used for
human habitation and other types of structures, and general rules for fire safety. A copy of the 1ext of such
changes or modifications is attached.

FINDINGS: Pursuant to Sections 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 of the Health & Safety Code, the Board
of Directors of Meeks Bay Fire Protection District bas determined and finds that the attached changes or
modifications to the 2019 Califarnia Building Standards Code Title 24 Part 9 are needed and are reasonably
necessary becanse of local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions.

FINDING NO. ONE - Privale propertics lying within Mesks Bay Fire Protection District are classified as

FINDING NO. TWO - The menace of destruction by fire to life, improved propesty, or natural resources may
be, or be forecast 10 become, extreme due to critical fire weather, fire suppression forces being heavily

20-0203 J Page 35 of 40



committed to control fires already bumning, acute dryness of the vegetation, or other factors that may cause
the rapid spread of fire such as high winds, low fuel moistures, Fire Weather or Red Flag Wamings, or severe
threat of wildland fire,

FINDING NO. THREE - Cooperating federa! oc state agencics address the threat of wildiand fire on lands
adjacent to the District by issuance of Fire Restrictions which restrict or ban open buming, including
recreational fires.

FINDING NO. FOUR - Granting the Fire Chief authonty to ban or restrict open buming, including
recreational fires, on private properly within the Distnict is reasonably necessary because of local
climatological, geological or topographic conditions in order to roduce the nsk of wildfire and to coordinate
District, State and Federal policies to limit or restnct open buming to reduce the nisk of wildfire.

LOCAL CONDITIONS: Local conditions have an adverse cffect on the prevention of (1) major loss
fires, (2) major earthquake damage, and (3) the potential for life and property loss, making changes or
modifications to the aforementioned codes necessary 1o provide a reasonable degree of propenty securily as
well as fire and life safety in this jurisdiction.

Below are listed adverse local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions found in Meeks Bay Fire
Protection District:

L Climatic

a. Precipitation.
Annua! precipitation fluctuates greatly. Approximately 90-95 percent of the precipitation occurs during
the months f November through Apnil, and 5-10 percent occurs from May through October. This area
has experienced major droughts in the recent past; one in 1977-1978, one which started in 1989 and
lasted into 1994, others from 1999-2004, and 2006-2009. Droughis continue to cycle to this day, and it
is probable that they will occur in the future. Elecirical storms are frequent and are usually accompanied
by little rainfall, potentially creating numerous lightening caused fires.

b. Relative Humidity.
During the months of June through September, the daily humidity ranges around 30 percent, and often
drops 1o the low teens. During & recent wildland fire where 5 homes were lost, the humidity was
measured st 9 percent relative humidity.

¢. Temperatures.
Duning the months of June through Septermber, daily tcmperatures commonly exceed 70 degrees
Fahrenheit, with temperatures having been recorded as high as 9 degrees Fahrenheit. Winter
temperatures can drop to below O degrees Fahrenheit,

d. Winds.
Prevailing winds are out of the south and southwest. However, north and east winds occur during the
spring (May through June), the fall (late Septernber and October), and occasionally during the summer
months. Wind velocities generally range from five to fifteen miles per hour, gusting to thirty miles per
hour during the summer months.

e. Summary.
These local climatic conditions affect the accelermtion, intensity, and size of fires in the Fire Distnct.
Times oflittle or no rainfall, low humidity and high temperatures create extremely hazardous conditions,
particularly as they relate to the wildland - urban inlerface. Winds expenienced in this area can have a
significant impact upon structure fires, especially in buildings in close proximity to oae another, and 1o
wild lands commonly found in Meeks Bay Fire Protection Dstrict.

I1. Geographic and Topographic
The fire environment of a community s primanily » combination of two factors: the physical goographic
characteristics of the area and the historic paner of development. These two factors, create a mixture
of environments that ultimately determines the area’s fire protection needs,

20-0203 J Page 36 of 40



a.

¢.

The geographical boundarics of the Fire District include all of El Dorado County adjacent to Lake
Tahoe, including along Highway 89 from the north boundary gate at Emerald Bay north to the El
Dorado/Placer county line.

Hecnuse of the size of the Fire District (14 square miles), and changes in elevation, the charscienisiics
of the fire environment change from one location 1o the next. As such, the service area has not one, but
a number of fire environments, each of which has its individual fire protection noeds,

The service area has a varied wpography and vegetative cover. It has relatively flal areas along the
shoreline, tuming to steep hills as part of the Tahoe Basin. Vegelative cover ranges from stands of
manzanita (o dense forests of fir and pine trees. Development has occurred as the communitics have
extended porth and west.

Seismic Location.

The relatively young geological processes that have created our area of service are still active oday, Our
service area incorporates a portion of the North Tahoe, West Tahoe, and Dollar Point carthquake faults
and 15 ad)acent 10 several other potentially active faults. The District's entire land surfece is in the
high-to-moderate seismic hazard rones.

Size and Population.

The District covers 14 square mikes of residential, state and federal land, including campgrounds and
siate parks, There are over | 800 residential structures. However, itis believed there are only around 1000
full-time residents. There is no tracking method to estimate the number of visitors who come to the ares.

Roads and Streets.

Many areas in the Fire District are served by sub-standand rosds, Due to restrictive land use regulations,
much of the current development is in-fill, utilizing lots that were previously deemed unusable. Some
planned unit developments are served by private roads, which create access problems (i.c., narrow widths
and on-street parking). Roadways with less than 20 feet of unobstructed pavement with dead-cnds longer
than 150 feet, with cul-de-sacs longer than 800 feet sre common. While development has continued
throughout the Fire District, access into individual subdivisions has not changed. Sueet widths remain
marginal, on-street parking remains a problem in all but the newest subdivisions and, in general, ingress
and egress are difficult during imes of peak seasonal population fluctuations, Numerous subdivisions
are served by only single lane roads, severely restricting emergency vehicle access into the affected
arcas.

Topography.

The topography of the District vanies from near Jevel to termain in excess of a 40 percent slope. As a rule
of thumb, the rate of fire spread doubles as the slope percentage doubles, all other factors remaining the
same.

Most structures, both resideatial and commercial, are in, or are surrounded by heavily forested areas. Due
to drought conditions, beetle infestations, and lack of vegetation management, much of the area is
populated with cither dead or dying trees, coatributing to an extreme fire danger. Elevation ranges from
about 6200 feet at lake level to over 7200 feet on mountain pass roads with peaks exceeding 8000 feet
in clevation.

Vegetation.

Vegetation in the Fire District varies from sub-alpine forests of aspen and pine to pine and cedar forests,
with substantial brush fields of manzanita, snow brush, and white thom, As residential development
continues in the Fire Distnct, clearances between bomes have decreased. New development is
concentrated al the edge of, or into beavily forested areas. This situation sllows fire to travel casily from
home 1o home, forest to home, or home to forest by radiation, convected heat and / or flying embers,
Expansion of the residential community has resulted in bomes that exist in close proximity to dense
patural folisge. Often such dwellings are completely surrounded by highly combustible vegetation,
compounding the fire problem.

20-0203 J Page 37 of 40



f. Summary.
Local geographic and topographic conditions increase the fire hazard presented to the Fire District. [n
addition, a fire following an carthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life and damage than
the earthquake itself.

Other variables that tend to intensify the fire danger include:

1) damage la the piped water system infrasiructure

2) isolation due 1o bridge collapse

3) roadway damage andior amount of debnis blocking roadways

4) availability of timely mutual aid assistance

5) the presence of a significant percentage of dwellings with wood shingle or shake roof coverings

Conclusion:

Local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions described above increase the frequency, intensity,
and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, these conditions impact potential
damage to structures from an earthquake and subsequent fire. Therefore it is reasonably necessary that
the California Fire Code be madified to mitigate the effects of the abave conditions.

California Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that modifications ta the Fire Code be expressly
marked and identified as to which each finding refers to which Code modification. The following table
provides this conpection.

Code Section Finding

Chapter | Administrative

Chapter 2 Administrative

Chapter 3 1(a), 1.{b), 1.(8)

Chapter 5 L(a), IL(c)

Chapter 6 1{d). 1.{e), [I.(a), 1L.(c), [L.(d}
Chapter 9 1.(a), 1<), (I.(t)

Chaprer 12 L(n).

Chapter 33 L(ch.

Chapter 49 L(a), L(c), 11 .(b), 1 1.{c)
Chapter 50 Administrative

Chapter 56 L

Chapter 57 1(a), L.(h), L(c}, 11.(a), TL(b)
Chapter 58 1.(d). 1. (b), IKc)

Chapeer 61 1.(a). 1.(c), 11.(a), IL.(b), I1.(d)
Appendix D 1{a). 1{c), 1 (s}, .(b). LL(c), IL(d), HL.(c)

This Resolution shail take effect and be in faree from and afier its approval as required by law

PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF MEEKS BAY FIEE PROVECTION DISTRICT OF THE
COUNTY OF EL DORADO AT A REGULAR MEETING OF THE BOARD. HELD ON THE 25* DAY OF Sgrember , 2019
BY THE FOLLOWING VOTFE OF SAID BOARD:

2l P T

AYES: “l ) ! : A |"Yv‘ ] i
o JIREmEYTing
NOES. e XA ‘L__" AJ. oA
ABSTENTIONS: O PRESIDFNT, BOARD OF DIRECTORS
ABSENT: O BY:  Bdwand [ Milter

[ CERTIFY THAT THE FOREGOING IS A CORRECT COPY OF A RESOL. lTnON DULY AIX)PTED BY SAID {lOARDOF
DIRECTORS ON THE DATE THEREIN SET FORTH. ="

iU pcrmelond Dxcveoem v Wibor Sesr o R awar 21 $.06- Pre Cosde wpd

20-0203 J Page 38 of 40



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section

Adopted as Amended

Finding

101.1 X Admin
105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
106.6 X Admin
106.6.1 X Admin
106.7 X Admin
109.4 X Admin
1104 X Admin
110.4.2 X Admin
112.4 X Admin
1141 X Admin
114.2 X Admin
202 X Admin
302.1 X Admin
307.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) |X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
505.1 X Climatic/GeoLogjcal
505.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
506.1.1 X Climatic/Geological
506.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
507.5.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
507.5.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
604.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
901.4.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
901.11 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
901.12 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
901.13 X Admin
901.14 X Admin
902 X Admin
903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.3 X CIimatic/GeologicaI/Topographical
903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/T: opographical
903.2.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.4.4 X Geological/Topographical

20-0203 J Page 39 of 40




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

907.2.a through 907.2.d

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

AppendixD: D103.5§ 1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.4

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: 105.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

X
907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
3310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5001.7 X Admin
5601.2 X Admin
5601.2.2 X Admin
5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
' 5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6102 X Admin
6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (1) a,b,c,d,e,f X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (2) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (3) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (4) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (5) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (6) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (7) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (8) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (9) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (10) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (11) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112 (12) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6113.1 X Admin
6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6114 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6115.1 X Admin
6115.2 X Admin
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X

Appendix D: 105.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 J Page 40 of 40




