
RESOLUTION NO. 042-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF ELDORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 018-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the 
State every three years; and 
WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 189 41.5 permits 
a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably 
necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1, 
Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulations to the local level 
and grants authority to delegate enforcement tothechiefbuildingofficial, or his or her authorized representative, 
or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chiefofthe 
Meeks Bay Fire Protection District, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a 
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection 
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on December 11, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Meeks Bay Fire Protection District 
adopted Ordinance No. 19-2 which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with amendments the District 
deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El 
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 19-2 of the Meeks Bay Fire Protection District and delegates the 
enforcement of the ordinance to the Meeks Bay Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her 
representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections: 

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 114.1, 114.2, 202,302.1, 
307.1.1, 307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 
503.4.4, 503.6, 503.6.1, 505.1, 505.1.1, 506.1.1, 506.1.3, 507.5.4.1, 507.5.7, 604.1.2, 901.4.7, 
901.11, 901.12, 901.13, 901.14, 902,903.1, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 
903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.4.4, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 
1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 
6102, 6104.2, 6112, 6112 (1) a,b,c,d,e,f, 6112 (2), 6112 (3), 6112 (4), 6112 (5), 6112 (6), 
6112 (7), 6112 (8), 6112 (9), 6112 ( 10), 6112 (11 ), 6112 ( 12), 6113 .1, 6113 .2, 6114, 6115 .1, 
6115.2, Appendix Dl03. l through Dl03.3, Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix D104.2, Appendix 
Dl04.3, Appendix Dl04.4, Appendix Dl05.1, Appendix D105.2. 

20-0203 J Page 1 of 40 



Resolution No. 042-2020 Page 2 of 2 

The Meeks Bay Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its 

entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 
2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

105.6.17-105.6.19, 105.6.39, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318,403.1, 403 .2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 
403.4, 403.6, 403.7, 403 .8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8 .1.7), 403.9, 403 .10.2, 403 .10.3, 403.11, 403.12, 
404.1-404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807 .5.2), 808, 904.1.1, 
1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9(adopting 1103 .9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, 
Chapter 26, the exceptions under 0104.2, 0106.1, 0107.1 (1), Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, 
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said 
Board, held the _J.Q_ day of March , 20 20, by the following vote of said Board: 

Attest: 
Ayes : Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin, Novasel 
Noes : None 
Absent: None 

20-0203 J Page 2 of 40 



,. 

North Tahoe and Meeks Bay Fire Protection Districts 

222 Fairway Drive 
P.O. Box 5879 
Tahoe City, CA 96145 
530.583.6913 
Fax 530.583.6909 

Hkhael s. Schwartz, Fire Chief 

December 18. 2019 

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer 
El Dorado County Board of Supervisor.; 
330 Fair Lane 
Placerville, CA 95667 

Subject: Resoludon Ratifying Ordinance No. 19-2 of the Meeks Bay Fire Protection District, wWch 
adopts tbe 2019 California Fire Code with amendments related to local climatic, 
geographic and topographic conditions. 

Dear Mr. Ashton: 

The Meeks Bay Fire Protection District is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS) ratify its Ordinance 
No. 19-2 which adopts the 2019 California Ffre Code a-. amended due to specific local climatic, geographic 
&r1d topographic conditions. California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative 
body of the city or county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance. 
The BOS m-mt also dc:legute enforcement of the ordinance to dther the Fire District (or its representative) 
or the Chief Building Official. 

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors rntify Ordinance No. 19-2 with amendments to the 
2019 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the Meeks Bay Fire 
Protection Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for your review and use on this topic. 
This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County. 

Sincerely, 

. 
Micnacl Schwartz 
Fire Chief 

A ITACHMENTS; 
l. Meeks Bay Fire Protection District Ordinance No. 19-2 
2. Meeks Bay Fire Protection District Finding of Fact Resolution No. 2019-06 
3, Draft El Dorado County BOS Resolution 

20-0203 J Page 3 of 40 



• 

Attachment No. 1 

Meeks Bay Fire Protection District 

Ordinance No. 19-2 

20-0203 J Page 4 of 40 



. ' Meeks Bay Fire Protection District 

C 
of the Board of Directors 

No: 19-2 
AN URGENCY ORDINANCE FOR MEEKS BAY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRJC'I' 

AMEND{NG THE FIRE CODE OF THE DISTRICT PERTAINING TO THE AMENDMENT AND ADOPTION 
Of THE 20 19 EDfflON Of THE CALlfORJ'lllA BUCLDING ST ANDA.RDS CODE 

(TITLE 24, CAUFORN1AC0DE OF REGULA.HONS), PART9 (2019 CALIFORNIA f'IJlE CODE'> 
INCLUDING APPEND1C. & 8, C, D. H, I. . and 0 . AND REPEALING 

ORDINANCE NUMBER 16-1, OP M ~KS BAY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT ND ALL OTHER 
ORDINANCES AND PARTS OF TIIE ORDINANCES IN CONPLJCT THfREWlTir 

WIit tlA~. tire proteetioo distri cts re genctrill . r qu ired to ad091 th St te B1.1tldiug Standard~; o.J>d 

Wl·IEREAS, fi re prote.ction dis lr-ic1 are allowed 1, mnke amendments m lhlJSe stute sr ndards when juscified by 
lo· I t.opographical , dim ho and 1:1.e grophi<:11 .:-0nd11ions; and 

WIJE!lfiAS , ci:mtc:mpornncously hierew ilh the Board of Directors has mo.de . uch finding nnd directed U1a1 they 
be sul mttied to the State forlhw1lh. 

NOW, TI-IEREf>OR, BE rr OROA[N'ED BY MHKS BAY FIREPROTE -:TJO'N DlS R.ICT, AS THE 
- OVERNING BOARD OF THE DlSlR.t T ASfOLLOWS: 

::iecnon i : FINDINGS OF FAC _: 

- ,::tiQll 2: AUOPTIO, ' of.· CODE wna EXCLUSIONS: 

S fion ) : LOCAL AMEr,,.OMf:NTj 

St".r.;lion '1; CONFLJCf. 

S~tion S: S.EVERABILfT\'. : 

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DAT · NO PUBLICATION: 

Ont 19-,l 
Pqt5 lofl7 

20-0203 J Page 5 of 40 



. . 
SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACT 

Meeks Bay Fin Protection Dls(rtct (MBFPD) makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code. 
2019 Edition, pursuant to Health and Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.7 and 18941.S during this code adoption 

process. Such changes are necesi;ary because of local climatic, geological an<i/or topographic conditions. MBFPD 
has adopted, pursuant to Section 18941. 5 of the California I lcalth and Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to 

these conditions by Resolution #11-2019 ofMBFPD dated September 25, 2019. 

SECTION 2: ADOPTI<>rtOF.J.:Ql)_t:_ Wll'JI ~~~!l!_IONS 
MBFPD adopts the 2019 Califomia Fire Code. Title 24, Part 9, ln lb endret\, including Appendices, incorporating 

those sectioo.s of the Intemationa:I Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by lhc si.te, with the exclusions listed below: 

Exclusions: 105.6.17-IOS.6.19, lOS.6.39, 308.1.4, 309,311.5, 31 L6, 318,403.1, 40l2.lw403.2.4, 403.3, 403.4, 
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 40:3.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403. l t. 403.12, 404.1-404.4, 

405.l-40.S.4, 40.S.6-40S.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.S.2). 808, 904.l.l. 1101, 1103.l, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9 

(adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, C.'hapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2, D106.l, Dl07.l 

(1), Appendix E, Appendill F, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K. Appendix. L, Appendix M. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 California fin: Code. 

SECTION J: LOC..Y,,AMENDMENTS 

The following Sections are hereby amended or added: 

Chapter I 
- Section 101 Scope and General Requinmenb 

- 101.1 Tide shall be amended as follows: Add oamc of jurisdiction (Meeks Bay Fire Protection District! 

- Section 105 Permits 

- J~!~.27 LPG-i:as shall be amended as follows: Add to the ellceptioo: At or above 5,00() feet of elevation, a 

permit is not required for individual containers with a 125-gatlon water capacity or less, or multiple container 

systems having an aggregate quantity not exceeding l 25 gallons serving occupancies in group R-3. 

- Section 106 Fees 
- 106.6 Permit, Plan Review and laspectien Fees shall be added as follows: A schedule of fees adopted by 

the Fi.re District Board of Directors for Plan Review, Inspections and the issuance of Pcmuts by the Fire 

District may be found in the most current District fee schedule (Health and Safety Code 17951 ). 

- 106..6.1 Cost Recoven F~ shall be added as follows: Fin: service fees may be charged to any person, firm, 

corporation or business tbal through negltgence, violation of the law, or as a result of care.lessncss, is 

responsible for the cause of the Fire District to respond to the scene of an incident. A disuict board may 

charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the district provides or the cost of enforcing aoy 

reRUlation for which the ~ is charged. (Health and Safety Code 13916 ). The fee shall not exceed the actual 

cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding: to the scene of an incident. 

. 106. 7 Admlaiatntive Colh shall be added as follows: When a test or inspection is $Chcdulcd and the 

contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authority bavingjurisdiction, the authority having 

On..19-l 
Paae2of17 

20-0203 J Page 6 of 40 



jurisdiction may bill the contractor for actual time spent travclini to md from the test/inspection location and 
lhc time spent at the tcst'inspcction site as well u administratiw: cost\. 

- Set:don 110 Vloladoat 
, 110~4 \'lotatt~nJ~!!l_aJ11~ shall be amended as follows: Pcnoos who shaU violate II provuion of this code or 

shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall croc:t, inmll, alter, repair°' do work in 

violation of the approved construction document.s or directive oft.be fire code official, or of a permit or 

certificate used under provisions ofthis code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor or infraction, at the discretion 

of the prosecuting attorney or agcocy, punishable by a fine not exceeding SI 00.00 for a first violation; 2. A 

fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of the same provision within one year. 3. A fine not 

excc:eding S 1000.00 for each additionaJ violation of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment 

not exceeding 180 days, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due 

notice has been 9Crved shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health and Safety Code Section 13145 and 

17995). 

- 118.4,l Ckadou shall be added as follows: The Chief, or his/her duly authori7..ed representative, may is.sue 

citations for inf-ractions or misdemeanor violations of this code punlWlt to Section 13871 of the Health and 

Safety Code of the Slate of California and Chapter .Sc (commencing with Section 853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 

of the Penal c.ode of the State of California. 

- Section 111 Step Work Order 

- IU.4. Failure to C~y shall be amended as follows: Any penoo who !hall continue any work after 

having been seM:d with a stop work order, except: sucb work as that pcnoo is dirttled to perform to remove 

a violation or unsafe: condition, shall be liable to I fine of not lea than one hundred ($100) dollan or more 

than one thousand (S 1,000) dollars. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995). 

- Secdon I 14 Reservi•1 of Ri1ltb 

- 114.1 Geaeral. There is res.erved. to the Board of Dirccton oftbe Diwict. the riaht to amend, modify, 

supplement, revoke in whole:, or in part. any of the provisioll5 contained or incorporated herein, at any time 

and from time to time. 

- 114.2 LunJtatioa of RJcbh. Nothing herein contained shall be dttmod to limit or restrict the rights, duties Ot' 

obligations given, granted or opposed upon this District by the laws of the State of Cal ifomia now in effect or 

hereinafter adopted. 

cupter2 
- s«tioa 202 Getteral Defiaitiona 

- Add definition for Agaroycd shaU mean· as lll.-cq>tcd by the Fire Chief ofsakl District or their authoriz.td 

rcprcsc:Dtatiw:, or as approved pur5uant to the ~tandards now exillting or hCl'alfter adopted by lhe District. 

- Add definition for Campftre shalJ mean - a fire which as u.sed for cooking, personal warmth, liptin1, or 

aesthetic purposes. This includes fU'CI contained within outdoor fireplaces and enclosed stoves with flues or 

chimneys, stows using jellied. liquid. solid, or pseo~ fuels. portable barbecue pits. bruJcrs, or space 
heating devices wrucli are UIOd outside of any structure, mobile home, or any living accommodation mounted 

on a vehicle. 

- Add definition for Coai,ndop or Obtrid COUid shall mean - the attorney for the District 

OnL lt-1 
P9p)oil7 

20-0203 J Page 7 of 40 



- Add definition for Dblrkt shall mean - the District and all other areas within the exterior boundaries thereof 

as l)()W or hereafter established. 

- Add definition for Enc•tive _Boch shall mean ·~board of directors of the District. 

- Add definition for ~~ Clli_!f shall mean - the Chief Executive Officer of the Fire Dcpartmcnt.tDistrict 

\tt\'ing the jurisdiction, or a duly authori7.cd rcprcscnt.ath--c. 

- Add definition for Jurisdkdoo shall mean - all areas within the District bouodar1~. 

Add definition for Persogb) shall mean - all person~ firms, associates, orpnizati<>M, corporations, 

individuals or other agency. 

- Add definition for SMII shall mean • mandatory . 

- Add definition for Mu shall mean. w pennissi\lC. 

- Add definition for JD.I~ .C..rowc:I.M.Aum shall mean - standby personnel, usually a security auard or 

ush.er persoMel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other place of public 

u~blage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency. 

Cbaptcr3 

Settioa J01 Dtfiaitiom 

· ltl.l Dtftnidou shall be amended a, follows: Added Campfire definition u shown above in Chapter 2. 

- Settiea l07 Open BllniD&. R«naOoHl Fires alHI Portable O.ldoor Fireplaces 

307, l ,I Prohibited Op«n Bur_~~_<::a~pnru, ~n1ires_,_ Porta~_e_Q~r Flnpl~~Lll~reatioaa.l 

Fires aad!;~~J.>fll:!_B~tr:k*a• ahaJI be added as follows: 

- 307. l .l Open burning, car.ipfll'C1, bonfires, portable outdoor fireplaces and recreational fues, shall be 

prohibited when atmospheric conditions or local circumstances make S11ch fires hanrdous includ.ina when, in 

the judgment of the Fire Chief or his design.cc, the menace of destruction by fire to Life, i.mpro~ property, 

or natural rcsoun."CS is, or is forecast to become, extreme due to critical fare weather, fire suppression forces 

being heavily oommitted to conlrol fire1 already burning, acute dryness or the vcgctation, or other factors that 

may cause the rapid spread of fire such as high winds., low fuel moistures, fire weather oc- Red flag 
Wvnings, sevuc: Ulftlet ofwildlaod fire, Of' iuuance ofFire Restrictions on lands adjacent to the District by 

the United States Forest Service or Calf'ire. 

Exceptions: 

l. Prescribed burning for the purpose of reducing the i.mplct of rNildland fire when authorized by the 

fire code official. 

2. Gas (LPG, NG) outdoor fire pits and barbequcs, pellet grills/$JJlokers. Except during Red Flaa 

conditions. All Open Burning, Campfires, Bonfires. Portable Outdoor Fireplaces and Recreational 

Fires are prohibited durinR Red Flaa WuninRS. 
3. Campfires and charcoal barbequcs in a designated cunpgroond aod/or picnic area located on State 

of Federal lands. 
4. Cbarooal barbcques for I commercial restaurant., catering operation or special event, with additional 

n:strictioos as permitted by the District. 

- l0'7.4.4 Caapfln Rest~ shall be added es follows: 

- 34),L~.4.1 It is unlawful for my pcnoD to ligbt. rnainlaUL. or use a cunpfirc upon or near my brush-covered 

land, gJUS-QOvereci land. or form-a>vered land durin.a lbe time when. bumina permits a.re suspended by the 
Director of the Dq,utmcnt of Forestry, the CALFIRE Unit Chief, or the authority having jurisdiction. 

Ord. lt-2 
Pap~ of 17 

20-0203 J Page 8 of 40 



.. 
- 307_.4,4~ When campfires ~ allowed, it should be unlawful for any person to light, maintain, or use a 

cmipfirc upoo any brush-covered land, grass-covered land. or forest covcrcd land unless the following 

minimum requirements arc complied with. 

- 307.4.4.l ta) Tbe area within S feet of the periphery of the campfire is cleared of all flammable material and 

vcgcwion 
- 30.1.4.4.l tb} One ~rviccablc ~ovel with a handle of at least 12 inches is ready for use at the immediate area 

of the campfire. 

- 307.4.4.lJcj Campfires shall be limited to l'Xl' foot, unless in an approved manufactun:d cooking device or 

fire ring. 

- J07.~:J_1cl) Written pcnnission of the landowner must be obtained prior to the ignition of the campfire and 
shall be on site. 

Cbapm-5 

- Sedioa 503 tltt Appantu Aetfll Road,: 

- $03~.I Dtmemlon• shall be amended as follows: Fire apparatus access roads shall ha~ an unobstructed 

width of not Jess than 20 feet. exclusi\'e of 5houlders, curbs and guncn, c:itccpc for approved SCC\lrity gates in 
accordance with Section 503.6, and unobstructed vertical clearance ofDOt le.u than 15 feet. AU driveways in 

the District shall not be less than 12 feet wide. 

- 503.2..5 Dud Eads shall be amended as follows.: Dead-end fire apparatus acces~ roads and driveways in 

excess of I SO feet in length shall be pruvidc:tl with an appro\/Cd area for- turning around fire app,aratu.~. 

• $03.l.61l_!kli.oa aad Devated_SurfKH .shall be amended as follows: When: a bridge or an elevated surface 

is part ofa fin: apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in acconlancc with any 

cummt County Rridgc Standard. BridF and elevated surfaces \hall be dcsigpcd for a liYC load sufficient to 

carry the imposed loads offm apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges 

when required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces dc1iiKDcd for cmc:rgency vehicle use are 

adjacent to surf11CCs which are oot designed for such use, appro\l'Cd barriers, approved sigm or both sball be 
in.stalled and maintained when required by the fire code official. 

- S83._4_J_Ne P•n.i-•~I• 1-'lre La~ shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, park. or leavc ~anding 

any 'lldliclc, whcthc.:r attended or unattended. except when necessary to avoid conflict with other traffic or in 
compliance with the directions of a fire code official, peace officu- or- oflicial traffic control device along the 

edge of uy highway, al any curl>, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned Ot operated off-street 

pa.rkina facility, designated as a fire lane by the fire department or fire district withjurudie,tion over the area 

in which the place is locmcd. The desigMtion ¥hall be indicated (1) by a s.ign posted immediately adjacent to, 

and visible from, the designated place dearly stating in letters not les.a than one iuch ill height thee tbe place 

is a fire lane. (2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in coolnlSting color, marking the place with the 

words .. FIR.E LANE", which arc clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) by a n:d curb or- red paint on the edge 

of the roadway llp()O wh.ich is clearly marked the words "FIRE LANE". 

- SOJ_.~J Ne ~-~Ii! la Froal of_H~drHh shall be added as follows: No pcl'10ll shall srop, park, or loave 

studing my vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except u follows: (a) If the vehicle is attended by 1 

licet1sed driver who is scaled in the front scat and who can immcdialdy moYe such vehicle in C&1C of 

DCCCSaity, (b) If the vehicle is ownod or operated by a fire department and is clearly ~ed u a fire 

department vehicle. 

OnL Jt,.2 
Pqe 5 o(l7 

20-0203 J Page 9 of 40 



20-0203 J Page 10 of 40 



- 503.4.4 Flre Laaet Based oa Road Wldtb shall be added u follows: Fire Lanes shall be based on road 
width as required in Appendix D as adopted locally. 

- 503.6 Stt&arlh Gates. Add the followin& to Scctioo .503.6 of the California Fin: Code: Private road ptod 
cn1raocc: 
I. Gate opening~ to be 2' wider than the roadway strved. 

2. Emcrgcncy vehicle access shall be provided by both a ''Knox" ova-ride switch and an approved 

cmeraency radio freciuency gate opening de-vice (Cliclc21':nter type) or other device approved hy the 

authority having jurisdiction. 

3. An approved hanunerhead, tum-around bulb or other means of tum-around shaJl be provided on the entJy 

side of the gate. 

4. Gates shall automatically open from the interior without use of a special code or device. (Magnetic strip or 

pn:ssurc pad assemblies an: 8C(:eplablc ). 

5. All electric gates shall fail in the open position, i.e .• loss of power, battery failure. All gates shall be 

equipped, at a minimum, with 12-hour battery btsckup. 

6. Vertical clcaranc~ shall he no lcu than 15'. 

7. Gate shall be located oo closer than 30' from the intcn.ccting roedway ultimate edge of pavement. 

&. Provide a i;eparate penonnel gate or opcnin& sized and surfaced to allow for pedestrian and aCC6Sibility 

access. 

9. Gate components shall be maintained in an opcntive condition at all times and replaced or repaired wbeo 
defective. 

. 503.6.l Secuih )!.lltt f~fakleatlal clrtvewa}I shall be added as follows: Gated residential driveways 
shall have a key opc~ted override switch installed for fire departmc:ut access. The switch shaU be a Koox 

System lype key switch with "Fire Department" decal. 

- Section 50S Pnmile ldeatlflc:1doa 
- 5QS.l Addresa l@_11tifk1tioo shall have the tint line ofthis pangnph replaced as foUows: Addresses foe 

new and exisling building5 sh.all comply with the loc.l district addre~s standard as approved by the fire code 

official. 

- ~.1._l_~_Ja_Jjoa, Lou1loa.ud Yil_ibOlt) _~.f_~~sa shall be added u follows: 

I. All buildings shall have a permanently posted address, which shall be placed at each driveway entrance 

and visible from both dmx:tions of tnvcl along the road ln all cues,. !he addrcs.s shall be posted at I.be 

beginning of construction and shall be maintained there.after, and the address shall be visible Ind legible 

from the road on whlch the address is located. 

2. Address sians alona one-way roads shall be vi1ible from both the intended din,ction of tlllvel and the 

opposite dim;lion. 
3. Where multiple addresses are required at a single driveway, they !hall be mounted on a s.inglc post. 

4. When: a roedway provides acces.s solely to a single commercial or industrial busines.s., the address sip 

shall be placed at the nearest road intersection providing aoocss to that site. 

Ord. lt-2 
Pate6 ofl7 

20-0203 J Page 11 of 40 



~ Section 506 Key Bous 

- S06.l.j Locks shall be amended as follows: Any structure wt:ucb has access coo1rullcd by an cl«uic gate 

!ihall have a lr.cy opcrlllc:d override switch imtallcd for fire department access. The switch shAII be a Knox 

SY3tcm type key switch with ''Fire Department" dcca.l. 

- 506.1.J Ke~ bous for baildi•.l!•- 1"itll Hto8',tic: 1priakler •J 1tnn1 shaJI be added u follows: A;Jy building 

or complex of buildings, in which an automatic sprinkler s~tem is installed, &hall be provided with I Knox. 

lfox®. mounted in an approved location, containing appropriate keys for fin: dcpartmeot aooess. This 1CCtioo 

applies to all new installations and existing 1nstallation,'i, as required by the Fire Chief 

- S«tioa S07 Fl.re Proccctioa Water SuppUn 

- !07.5.4.l S!lqw ~~.~~I shaU be added as follows: No pcnon shall place. push or dwnp ,mow on or around 

any fire hydrant or fire department connection, and a minimwn of fifteen ( 15) foot clear space shall be 

maintained to the front and sides of any hydrant or fire dt.-pitrtmenl connection. 

- Stttioa 507.5.7- Publk Private PartnenMp F.ad rorJ~f~_•t~c,areaDd_~aj!i_lal I~~~~~-'~~ shall 

be added as follows: 

The District hereby adopts a p,ubLic private partnership fund infrm,tructuR: and i=.pital improvements 

(Partnenhip Fund) to receive contributions of cash or property qualifying under Internal Revenue Code Section 

t 70 as a charitable contribution if the contribution or gift is made for exclusively public purposes, Contributions 

to the Partocnhip F\&Od shall be mamtamc:d and administered as I separate trust fund subject to investment 

restrictions applicable to the dimict in the management of its fund and administered to permit c,cpcn<liturcs of 

accrued principal and interesl after dcduction5 of reavinablc costs of administration, for infnmructure and 

capital improVffllalt acquisitions. Opcnlions and maintenance, including but oot limited to mobile water supply 

apparatus such as fire boet(s)., and/or water t~s). 

Cbapter6 

- Section 604 - Electrical EquipaHt. Wiriq aad Uu.anb: 

- Sffttoa 604.1.2 a.ata.11~"8.111 shall be added as follows: Emcrgc:ocy po,,,.cr systems and standby power 

systems shall be inst.allcd in accordance with this code, NFPA 110 and. NFPA 11 L All buildings '9tith 

stand-by power sba.11 have a shunt trip device that di5COnnc:cts all power sources to the bu.ild.ing, approved by 

the Fire Code Official. E:usting installations shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval. 

Cbpter9 
• Section 911-Geaeral: 

- 901.4.7 AppUcadoa to New aad Eustla.i:._Structa~_J shall be added as follow5: The District assll1llCS no 

rcsponsibihty for installation, maintenance, operation or monitoring of the liystcm the same beinJJ solely that 

of the owner of the structure. The pmvi~ions of this Chapter, and. or th.oec requ.ircmcnts in the California Fue 

Code rclalUli to automatic sprinkler systems shall apply to a structure, and the entire structure shall be made 

to comply with tbc9e provisions, under any of the following ci.rcwnst.ances: 

l. When a building permit is iuucd for a new structure, or a new structure where oo permit is required 

unless plans ~ p-evioosly approved by tho District prior to the cffeictave date of this chapter, or any 

structure found to ha~: been constructed after the effecti~ date oflhls chapter. without a permit wlaen a 
permit wooJd haw been require¢ or 

Ortl 1,-2 
Pqe7ofl7 

20-0203 J Page 12 of 40 



\\' her, 1 h,:r,.' b ;1 dtJDff<: rn use i:1 ,.Ii l, ,:,r ,, p,.11 tis HI. ,,f.111 r:'.u,:lu)g :,1ru;.:lLm: wbi.d.1 w,:,ukl i_:,w!,i:. ·-.T\ip;m~·: • 

.-/.1s::•;1li-.-:11i,.:,11 w d1.wgc: t,1 :1, .. i10L.,, A. f·. II, I, R l, R 2, ,,,-

\\' ~~en ,.J ~;,it ~dir1~ p~r1THL ~:'.: ;,StibC.l.~ ~,:~ ~-11,)·~1,' .-,dd !f lt1~!'s U, h,: n;;JJt.: u; an ~J_I.~~ I!,.~ :11 flil~lltr't' ;;,} iL1 ,, ,, ! i) 

i .i,·; (".'h(' ('.•('. ·1 c,tJI Fi.re ,,r~,l r:-:' t' ,r: ·~•;"11_'.lfl.-,! ,-;IJ1j(: ~IC \;.[,-:){cf [ll:ilt ti:fty p,::ri:.:n'. ( 'iC''" f ;j<\d n \ (hl: ,\f'.\cl'''l:li.t: 

-;~u1H:.: f11,)f.:L!l: c,fthr! (~\isliH':,: bnild1r,k'" .~n\i {!'1t: a,hLti,>~1 l:\...:t: ... ·\i·~ !he '.:qui1rc ~-~·~)Lt,\!:.· ~t1Jt.-:--,t: •. _1}d i~i :1-t.·,.Ji(~r1 

1}:.lj 2 (1~ ~h~ [)j~::"!L,l r::!: (·p.;,_j,~ •:i· ~f-~f,d ;q 1.1..1r~.• f,;;T~ f,•r ~l i:•~(ll.J1:lfr·::"·:~~- '".h"!Jt•li:)~ ,U1in:!i,•d _k:,lf'.l~(" .. 

IIO_L l_ I _F~~~ Alums Re11uired sl~·:<iJ hl ,1,l,k.i ,,:, ;,., IL,,,.-.: ,, n Y,:,r,·c,. c,11.ti' 1llH1\_' !he -.~,11<:, ,11pply fr,1 

111,,,rna~i,: •;:prinkkr a)·.'itt.:nh anri w:JIL'l··t1nw ,;wir,.Jw, ,\u .-,l! .\;,:ink:kr s:,sl1.,1T·, ,-h:dl I·~ <"kdncall:y -.u1,<·r~'i5cJ 

Valve: •;up,;::n,swn aIJd WJkr tlow 1,hmn :ind 11,wblc: ,1gnal:; sh:ill he disli.nct,:-1 dilEtrni ,md st,ull h.: 

.11ir.,11n:1li,·;tlly trnnsmiltcd ti:, an opp10\('d ,:,~mrnl :,r;Htr•n. t!Kludmg R-J '"·~up.11\\'H::; wht.11 a "prink',:r sys1<.·m 

,,( 11\(•fC th;;:1 [ 00 head:; i~ itW;i'.kd. 

9!l_l, 12 Hre .\)arms H.e:;ul:atrd ~h1E '!'-' 11<~.l,:d :1:; f.:,\!,.iw·.,- i\.ll fire a!arm sy;1...:rn, !11:~1., I k,1 ,.1, iLll ;~L,irid in 

,,,c l)i,rri,~, ,lnll be i:1~t.-ilkd ~.nJ 1·.1.i\1F.111:cil l!l ,1...:,·,,r.J.rn,:t ·.,·il.b th: r•:q•;in.:rm:nt~ ,-1·1h1·. ,, . .-1i,.:I,• 

.•\!1 Jc,i,:,:~ .L-,J equ1:,m,:n: st;iJ! he ~·.1r\,1n1<_:,,·,:, i:;s'.,1'.'.c,i and rn:1tr,1.1iLc:,l m ,;,·,1:1i,rn,itv with "",.111,·,,1-,[ Fire 

J·:,~,lcctl,.-:i,~ 1\,~;i_,:..:·1.J.ti··~,1 '-U,rittud ·.l:~ (,·r 1,.'.CtJtr;1\ :J.t~J;::.,r. s:i~litlln~ ~,\ .. ,t~~,1"~ .\(J '.,if •• ,~,~ \lr..:-~Ll..'.l(,f::' ~L, r~q,uri::'d 

hi Lh~ r··3,[fc,m1:.1 HuiJd~1)~ t'.p .. i.c ka r,>ddetjt~;d .i.i;:r1,:~:r11:.c~ :;bnlt '.·:~.: i1;t(~t<~!fn1!.:t._fr.-:d -,po.-:,,, .:J·..J:.1:1d 1.1n ;;.\i:-1-:-i 

' \~ Jv.:n A. fire ~:,:mn 15 ;,·,41J1ff,I .. -:h,-,r, dr:!1,'H1f~ J' n:·y'J,,(.-.J by Nf"'l'r\ ".i} M•: ;i:qu•:·.:d i,, t..- ·:ubrnnttd ri.!f 

review prim t,1 :fl5'.o lfat !<'lll f,!" .1,.id1 :;v:d ,:rn~;-

i\ll nre a:arm 0.y:,tr:m:, ,:1,111 \l(" '.;lJll'."l ','lc:,:d in :1 manner ;:K,c,•p1,1" .. Ji: j(l d11: Vi It: Ch td. 

,.\. lJpon rt:..:mnn;e~1,.Lrt1w1 1,i"tln- Fin: 1_·ri,.:I, lh·~ A,_1ani o(Din-rli)ri m,i.y ,1.J,•pt liy rt.~-.,,:illlltt'li ;:ud1 ;;Jdition,,; 

ff.ks ,md f(s"'1JL:,t1<·,i1;. n'l 11.rnj): , .. , l'.1•' i1ht.!tla1i,in. m.1:ntcn,llll"t.:. '.Hi•J HS(' ;_1i'!irc ahrn, :;v•.fi.'111, ,-,, :;.r,:: 

ci1u,·i:;lt:1t! with Jc!.<:•(',l pr;,,:i,,.:,~:-, 

r->,·r_,,- n:qu;rcd f:r•c nl:.tn11 ,,y~klti :::;;1;i b,: ,1:.1WL.:11i,::J in l;<:••.•.: ''""'"~•!\•; •.•ITkr ,1ral i;h,d. ~ .. , r~r·,1ircd .1r1d.'{11 

t\, .\r...~ ':.._YJliriiP'.; (';~ t···u~p(c.\ i-f' hu1[\t11r/' ""uh jq cn1!t-~01i.i:1,. r1:'t: ;d.,nri '~~;lf:(11 . ..J~.1l] be- ;,1rnv1lie-.l 1)/~!f"; .:, K;1.~'t: 

B(·~~ 1r1+.1ir:~·J ~!-1,_ql :,~1p·.-,-p:~~ 11~,.:,1:, ... 1~··. ,~·~·111'_;11~,r,;.Jt)t•·:Y,p:1~1!1." l..t:.~t·-. fr,~" ;·;n: d,:p;1r'1~11..:nr ~·>-;:-... ;.5.,; r-n._:··, 

I. Upon dnn;:nd. c;1rti v,::mlo:- sh:dl prnvidc the Fite Chid w11h lh( Jtldn:s'.: ,,f e.ad1 h,uld111;, pl::iC<':, ,.)r 

premise~: wid_ul\ ihc I ),•;lrici k,r which the p<:m1iltcc :-di~ Pr in~lalls .i foi: ah1rn1 ',yslcni, 

7 bic:h vcnd,)r who i11:<.1:1(h 1,r ~,;rvicc~; a fire alarm :,y:;l..:m :,kdl •ch:11:-ly lrl,;frud tlic.: ;mhs.;;:riber in rxrn,111. ;rnd 

m wnt.i;1 6, rn tfw pr,:,p,:r 11::,, .•nd 1.•iJl.'1-.\lH.lr\ c,fth.,~ ltn.: :d,,n,i sysr..::n . .::-;p._q;,H:, th,y;;,: fo.i:t(.,r;; whid1 ,.;(1Lild 

Gi'.!'>C.: t:;[.,:,.- :d:!rm,:, 

5,~r,:,;e- 1,., d$ ,11h,;nil-).:r·, \•,~h,:, l\P:nl) f,:,l,.f (2,11 :·.·"·•'· ;if1,:r 1,;,til1 1:;,l1i,li th,n there i'.; ln111r.le "'1th ttw tiw 

'.,1laq:J '.,y;,ctn. ~ii 1hc. :~:.·s 1ct1'J ~·.~i;,; ]~Ji}~ilnJc:i\)]i(J~ 

Ord, 19-2. 

Pai;c X of l 7 

20-0203 J Page 13 of 40 



5. Each vendor mall display to the Fire Chief, upon request, the pennittee's records of inspection and repair 

of any fire alarm ~~em. 

6. Each vendor !hall notify the monitoring center whenever a subscriber's fire alarm 11ystcm is under service 

or repair. 

- 901.14 NuJsaace ~]~~, shaJI be added as follows'. Any fire alarm of which continuous activation is 

determined by the Fire Chief to be a nuisance a Jann will subject the owner of such fire alarm to a one 

hund~ dollar (SlO(H)()} fine. 

- ~.ecdoa 901 Deflaitioas: The following definitions shall be added: 

- Vendor shall mean any busine~s operated by a person, firm, or corporation who engages in the activity of 

aiming, installing, leasing, maintaining, repairing, replacing, selling or servicing fire alarm systems. 

- Apgroycd shall man accq>Ccd by the Fire Chief and in accordance with the requirements of the 

Underwriters Laboratori~ Inc., the Factory Mutual Fngineering Corporation, The National Bureau of 

Standard~ the National Fire Protection Association, or the State Fire Marshal. 

- ,\udtble ~nn shall mean an alarm ,~tem, which when activated generates an audible sound on the 

premi~. 

t·atse_Alann shall mean an alum 1'ign&I, either silent or audible, promptins a response to be made by the 

Fire Department when an c:mcrgcncy sitwition for which. the alarm system was intended docs oot exist. 

- lilrc Alarm S~stem, shall mean any manual or automatic means of detccling fin,, and tnmsm.itting alarms of 

fire from private premi~ and shall include all types of interior fire alarms syr;tems and auxiliary fire alann 

systems approved by the District. 

- J..oc•I Fire Alarm S\lte~ shall mean any fire alarm system de5igned ~olely lo provide an alarm of fire 

within the protected premi~s. 

- Subscriber shall mean a pcnon who owns or leases property or premiies on which an alarm system has been 

in.~lled or is proposed to be installed or who contract,; or proposes to contract with. an alarm business for the 

leasing. KTVicing. or maintaining of an alarm system. and who has or will have the auth<>rity to cause the 

aJarm system to be 5erviccrl, rq,.aired. or removed after the system i, irt stalled. 

- Senion 993 Firt Sprlnkltn: 

- ?QJ.l Noa-~i: shall be added as follows: All automatic fire sprinkler ,ystcms shall be of the anti-freeze 

type or other approved oon.frcczing (including air filled) type of system. 

- 903.l.a Wbtn Rec1airecl shall be added as follows: Status of existing buildings greater- than 3,600 .square 

feet. In c:itisting buildings 3600 square feet or gruter, other than one and two-family dwelling units, and 

agricultural buildings not under Special Use Permit for commercial pu:poses, where the floor area of the 

building or structure is increased by an addition of more than thirty percent (30%) or 1,000 square feet 
whichever is less, such building or structure shall be made to confonn to Section 903.2. 

- ?()3.~~ _wi..~ Rt_mM .. shall be added as follows: Status of cxistina buildinas less than 3,600 sq~ feet. 
In existing buildinas 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-Md two-family dwelling units, and agricultural 

buildings not under Special Uae Perm.it for commercial purposes, wbcR the Ooor area of the buildiJII or 

sttucturc is increased to a IOtal square footage over 3,600 ,q~ feet. by ao addition of more tbaa thirty 

percent (30%) OI( 1,000 sq~ fi:et., whicheVCI' it leas, such buildina c." structure shall be made to conform to 

Sectioo 903.2. 

Ord. 19-J 
Pqc:9 of17 ----------·~--~-

20-0203 J Page 14 of 40 



.. 
- 903.l. l ~ro111,.<'\ shall be amended as follows for A groups A· l through A-4: 903.2.1. l (I) The fire area 

exceeds 3,600 square feet 

- 903.l.J _G""111.t shall be amended u follows: 903.2. 3 (I) Throughout all Group E fire areas grcaler than 

3,600 ~ feet in area. 

- 903.l.~_Group F.:-1 shall be amended u follows: 903 2.4 Group F. 903.2.4 (l) A Group F fire area exceeds 

3,600 square feet. 

- 903.l.7 GroaJ!...M shall be amended as follow~: 903.2.7 Group Band M. 903.2.7 (I) A Group Band M fire 

arc.a exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

- 90J.l.8 (;roa1> R shall be amended as follows: 903.2.8. I shall have the folJowiag verbiage added to the cod 

of the paragraph: Fire sprinkler syi;tems shall he in,talled in new manuf11etun:d homes (HSC sections 18007 

& J 8009) and multiple family manufactured homes with two dwelling units (IISC l 8008.7) in accordance 

with Title 2S of the California Code of Regulations. 

- 903.l.9 GrouJLS-1 shall~ amended &!1 follows: 903.2.9 Oroup S. 903.2.9 (I) A Oruup S fire are& exceeds 

3,600 square foct. 

- 903.2,10 (-,..,•I>-~l t.<lotect Partda~ Gara~ shall be amended as follows: 903.2.10 (I) Where the fire 
area of the enclosed parking ginge exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

903.•U Raidatial OC'CU!)Hcin shall be added as follows: AJI residential occup,ancic:$ rcquin: audible 

notification in all sleeping rooms of a sprinkla walerflow alarm. This notification must be at lea.st 75dh at 

pillow height 

- Section 907 Fire Alarm and Ddedton System,: 

- 907.l •• _W:b!~-~!Y•lnd-_New llalldln~s_or:~~t~~t;uns ~-~ than__J,600111uare_fttt shall be added as 

follows: An approved fire alarm/detection system shall be installed in all buildings with a floor area less than 

3,600 square feet. 

o Exceptions: 

• ~ and two- family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other C)ccupancics classified as "U") 

Agricultural buildillls DO( under Special Use Penn.it aod/oc not used for commercial pwposes (e.g. 

mails sales, food service, and/or special events). 

Buildinp with I floof- area IC3S than 500 sq~ feet 1n11y be ucmpt, u determined by the Fin: 

Chic( based on building construction material and fcat\1J'C$, location, occupancy type, and 

dislan""C lo exposurei;. 

- 907.2.b Stah11 of t:Dat.laf B.~~ shall be added as follows: In cxi)ting buildingi; without an approved 

automatic !ipnnklcr syslem, other than one-- or two-family dwelling units, •xricultural building not under 

Special Use permit for commen::ial plUJ)Oses where a fire alarm dctccl ion system does not exist and the OOQI' 

area of the building or structun: is iocrused or modified by more than thirty percent (30%) or 1,000 square 

feet, whichever is IC3S, such huildmg or structure shall be made to conform to Section 907 when ~uin:d by 
the F~ Chief. Buildinxs with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be. exempt, as determined by the Ffr-e 

Chief, based oo hui lding construction materials and features, location, occupancy type. and distamx: to 

cxpo.,un:s. 

- 907.2.c Monitoria.i:. shall be added as follows: All fire alum/detection r.}"tenlS shall be connected duectly 

through and monitored by I U.L approwd central, proprietary or n::motc station service, which gives audible 

and~ signals at a constantly attended. location, All sprinkJcn:d buildings shall be. rnonitOf'ed.. 

o Ex~ions: 

Ord. 19-1 
Pqe IOof 17 

20-0203 J Page 15 of 40 



One- and t"trto- family dwellings (R-3 Occup&D(ics and other occupancies classified as ''U"). 

Agricultural buildings not under Special Use Pcnnit and/or not used for commercial purposes 

(e.g. rewls sales, food service, and/or special events). 

- ?07.l.d T, ,pe I Hood lutalatlou shall be added as follows: The requirement of installation, or 

replacement, of a Type I Hood System shall require • fire alarm/sprinkler monitorina 1ys1cm to be imtalled. 

or for the hood s~tem lo be conncacd to an existing fire alann/spri.nkkr monitoring S)'$1em for that building. 

· ~.6.1.L~n_f'9_~!r__Sappl~ shall be added as follows: In accordance NFPA 72, the 9eeondary power 

supply providing a minimum 24-hour power capacity under quiescent load (system operating in a non-alann 

condition) shall be amended to a minimum 72-hour power capacity. 

Exception: The existence of an emergency backup pow~ supply that meets or cl!.cceds the requirements of 

California Fi.re Code Chapter 12. 

Cllapttr12 

Sfttioa 1103 Eaffleacy aad SCaadby Power Synems 

l~J.1.J In~~~ s.hall be amenJed u follows: Erncrgcocy power s~cm.s and standby power systems 

shall be installed in. accordance wjth the California Building Code, the California Electric Code, NFPA 110 

and NFPA 111. All buildings, otbtt than one- and two-family dwelling uni~ and agricultural buildings not 

used for commercial purposes, with staod·by power shall have a shunt trip device that disconnects all power 

sowces to the building, approved by the Fire Code OfficiaL Existing installatiom shall be mdllltaiocd in 

au:ordancc with the original apprO'l,t•l. 

Chapter33 

Sttdoa 3310 Access for flnfi1bti11g 

~, lOJ_ Pr!~l~J~11tifkation shall be added as follows: Prior 10 and during construction, RD approval 

address sign sh.Ill be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into the project. 

- Sttdoa 3312 Watff S•pplY for fire Pntttttion 

- 3312.1 W... n,11tirtd YialJ be amended as follows: Required fire hydrant~ shall be installed and appro'>'c.d 

for continuous scrYicc prior to combustible materials arriving on site or Vtt'lical construction commencing 

Cbapttr49 

Secdoa '4905 - WUdfln: Pnlecttoa B1IIJdio& Constnction 

4905.4 Roor CoveriD~ Staa .. rd shall be added as follows: All new <.'Omtruction, including additions, requ~ 

a Class A roof covering or as..-.emhly. All re-roofing require.'\ Class A roof covering or assembly es a minimum. 

Rc--roofmg in excess offifty (50) percent ofan existing structure within any onc-yar period will necessitate that 

the entire roof be a Class A roof coveriog or assembly as a minimum. Class B or C fire retardant treated and/or 

noo-tn;atcd wood $bake or shingles are not approved as• roof covering material for CIHs A assembly. 

Chapter SO 

- Sedio• 5"1 Geeenl 
- 5081,1.I.Ja..l!tMt\ {!r P.Nam sball be added as follows: AtJy damqes or cost resulting from the carc:lcu 

handling, spill or dilCbargc of any bazudous materials sba.Jl comtituenl debt again.st any such penoa.. firm or 

Ord. ,,_z 
Pa,e II ofl7 

20-0203 J Page 16 of 40 



corporation causin1 such spill or disc~. This debt is collectible by the fire chief in the wne manner as in 

the case of an obligation under contract. expressed or implied. 

Chapter56 

- Section 5601 General 

S601.2 Penalt Req_uired shall be amended as follows; Permits shall be required n !Ct forth in Section 105.6 

and regulated in accordance with this section. Where explosives permits are required, they shall be issued by 

the Fire Chief, or his/her repn:sentative, and the County Sheriff's Department. When fireworks permits arc 

required, they shall be issued by the Fire Chief and the County Board ofSuper.isors. 

- 5601.2.1 Documentation shall be added as follows: The AHJ sh.all have the authority to request 

documentation n:gan11ng all aspects of the firc:workN presentation. 

- S601.2.2 Pro11rietan Information shall be added as follows: The AJU will protect all proprietary 

information. 

ChapterS7 

- Sedion S704 Ston1e 

- S,"7_~J,_'!,Y_I.B~~ Wben ~l>ove-Gnt11Dd Ta~Ja art Pn,~~ed shall be amended as follows: Storage 

of Class I and Class IT flammable liquids in above ground tan.ks oulliide of buildings is prohibited urucss 
approved by the fire chief. Wben pcnni1ted by the fire chief, all abo~ ground tank(s) or vault installations 

for the storage of Class I, II or Ill flammable and combuscible liquids shaJI comply with those requirements as 

set forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fi.re Code shall al,o apply to installations other than 

motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above ground storage is llXluircd. 

- Stdioa 5706 Special Operations 

- 5106,2.4.4 Locations Wben Above-Groulld Taalu •" Pro.,bHed sh.all be amended as follows: Storage 

of Class I and Class II flammable liquid!'> in above ground tanb outside ofbwldinxs is prohibiled unless 

approved by the Fire Chief. When pcnnitted by the Fire Chief, all above ground wik{s) or vaull installations 

for the 11torage of Class I, Il or rn flammable and combul'>tiblc liquids shall comply with lhosc requirements as 

&et forth by the California Fire Code. The California 1-'irc Code shall a.ho apply to installations otba' than 

motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above ground s10111gc is required. 

Cllapter 58 

- Section 58t6 Flammable Cryoieaic Flldcb 
- S806.l Limitations shall be amended as follows: Stora~ of flammable cryoa,cnic fluids in stationary 

containers outside of buildings is prohibited unlc.u approved by the fire chief. When permitted by the fin: 

chie~ all statioo.ary containers for the storage of flammable cryopic fluids shall comply with those 

rcquimnents as set forth by the Californui Fm: Code. 'The California Fire Code shall also apply to 

installations other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing ~tations where above ground storage is n:quin:d 

Cllapm-61 
- ~~ 6102 Deftllldoal the foltowma definitions shall be added: 

Or,. lf..l 
hac 12ofl7 

20-0203 J Page 17 of 40 



- Installation shall mean a storage tank designed for the containment of liquefied petroleum gas, or meter 

assembly regulating natural gas, fur use by 111 customer for residential, commercial, or industrial purposes, 

together with appurtenant pipes, risers, gauges, and related equipment 

- ~ Liquefied petrolewn gas. 
- Supplier shall mean any person or husiness, which sell~ at retail, LPG, or any company, which supplieg 

natural gas, for residential, comrncrt:iaJ _or industrial use. 

· Interruption of~~~ f sh.all only apply to LPG instaHations) shall mean the service shall be considertd to 

be intemJpted whenever !iCfVi.ce is discontinued because of hv.ardous ,condition, change in size or type of 
service, whenever the tank, meter, regulator(s}, valve or other exterior service supply components arc 

removed, replaced, or repaired, whenever the service is relocated, whenever the building, tank piping or 

components arc damagc,d to the extent that the scrvici.ng utility, fire or building department considers the: 

service to be potentially hazardous. Nonna! refilling of an empty or partially empty tank, and routine 

maintenance of interior appliances. shall not be considered as an interruption of service. 

- Stttton 6114 Location of LP-Gas Contalnen 

- 6104.l Muhnum Capadh wit.bin Established. Llmits shall be amended as follows: The storage of 

liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-galloo water capacity whee located at least 

one-half(l/2) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-half (1/2) mile from 

existing residential development with a density greater th.an one (1) dwelling unit per acre and at least 

one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved and a Special/Conditional U~ 

Permit is issued by the County. 
Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the dispersion of 

liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested areas, the agxregate capacity of 

any one installation shaJI not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum 

gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacity when located at least one-half (l/2) mile from 

property zoned or des.ignated for residential use and at lea.st one- half (l/2) mile from existing residential 

development with a density gIQter than one (l) dwelling unit per acre and at least one-ha.If (]/2) mile from 

any hotel or m04el is allowed when AHJ approved and a SpeciaVConditional Use Permit is issued by the 

County. 

Section 6lll 8i&ll f..)evalion l.iquefted Petroleum G11 lnsta\\atloos (5,000 foot elevatloas ud above) 
shall be added as follows: 

Any new LPG installation shall comply with the following: 

1. A permit is required by this Code for individual LPG containers of 12S gallons or greater. At the time of 

application by any person for a permit to install an LPG system as required by this Code, the appliant 

shall submit an LPG pklt plan to the District for approval and shall contain the following: 

a. Stamp of approm of the prospective LPG supplier. 

b. Tank location showina distances to slIUCture and edac to cdJtC of pavcmeat or other identifying 

mark. 
c. Tank capacity in US gallons. 

d. Location of riser pipe at building. 

e. Property boundaries. 

0nL 19-1 
Pqe 13 ofl7 

20-0203 J Page 18 of 40 



f. An outline ofall existing/proposed buildings oo the lot and a depiction of the roof ridge line of any 

building to be supplied with LPC;. 

2. Two sl.lge regulator systems shall be:: installed on a.II LPG installations in accordance with 

manufacturer's instructions_ All fim. stage rqulators and connecting pigtails shall be installed under• 

protccti~ val~ cO\'Cr on lailL All n:gulaton instaUcd under this cover shall be listed and apprcwcd for 

this UM: and position of mounting. A. connector providing flexibility &hall be used to connect the tint 

stage regulator to the main savicc valve oo tbc tank. All copper pigtails shall be internally tinned and 

use only fofl!ed flare nuts. 

3. The riser from the yard piping shall be a minimum of Schedule 80 and sh&Jl be located not more than 3 

inches horizontally from the walls of the tank. and swing joints will be used above and below tank l~I 

to provide for tank movement (strcel elbows shall not be used). An approved flex.iblealtemativc is 

preferred in lieu of rigid steel pipe fur- the tank riser. This shall include but not be limited to plastic (PE), 

~tubing. slainlcs.s steel. ALL FLEXIBLE MATERIAL USED FOR 1llE TANK.RISER SHALL 

BE SHEATIIED IN AN APPROVED STFH COVER FOR PROTECTION. As swingjoints arc 

eliminated in an approved flexible alternative, sufficient slack mWll be maio1ained to allow for tank 

movement anJ/ur- expansion and contraction of the alternative material. All plastic pipe shall be buried 

at lea.st 18" below finished grade. A.ti electrically continuous ~ion rcsi~t trlCcr wi1c (min. A WG 

14) or tape shall be buried with the plastic pipe to facilitate locating. One end shall be brought above 

groi.md at the building wall or riser~ the other end shall be brought above ground at the tank:. 

4. Tbe second stage regulator and riser pipe shall be installed on the pble end of the building, as eke as 

practical to the building wall, unJcss lb.is is not feasible due to structural or topographical constraints. 

An appru~ gas shutoffvalYC rated fur a rninimwn of 125 PSI shall be installed immediately prior to 

the second stage regulator. An approved iias shut off sign oc other identifier shall be installed directly 

above the gas shut off valve, on the building in a visible localion within three (3) feet of the eaves of the 

roof or roof line ifno eaves~ pm1a11. If the second staae regulator or a combination fi~l/sec(md stqe 

regulator is used at the tank, them an approved gas shut off .,,11Jve shall be located at the building. 

5. A protective cover shall be installed over the second stage regulator and meter (if imt&IJcd) at the 

building. The minimum design for the protective cover shall be equal to. or greater than, the Ruildinx 

Design Load Cdetcrniined by the building dcpanment), and shall he securely supporta.l lo the ground or 

diagonally to the building wall. W~ supported to the ground, the footing for the supports shall be 

founded 6 iocl>CS below firushcd ~de. Prc~t concrete piers may be u.'Cd in lieu ofpoun:d footings, 

provided they are plaiecd on stable soil. If second stage regulator/meter AS$CIDblies could be suhjcct to 

vehicle dama~, then minimum of 3• steel crash post filled with concrete 5hall be installed for 

protection. Crash posts shall have a minimum depth in the w-ound of 24"', embedded in concrett. 

6. Ob5avation and inspection, if any, by the District shall not const.tute an approval of the wort of 

1rutallation of the aforementioned protcchvc cover. nor shall it be dc:cmcd to create any hability or 

responsibility oo the pert of the District for the design or construction of the protective cover. nor to any 

third party or entity whal$fJCI/U", 

7 The riier pipes for the yard piptnJ shall not be embedded in coocmc, asphah or other rigid sut.wlce. 

Such suhstance placed around a rite:r shall be held beck: II lout 3 incla from all sides oftbe pipe. All 

e~posed exterior ps piping U9ed fat runs along Wills or roofs sball be minimum sc.bcdu.lc 80 steel pipe 

supported and secured by approwd scraps at intervals not to exceed four ( 4) feet. 

°'11. .... 1 
Pip 14 of 17 

20-0203 J Page 19 of 40 



8. LPG tanks shall be permanently marked by a square or other approved equal stake of wood or other 

material with a minimum dimension of 2" X 2~ or a cross scctiooa.l width of 2", oornin1l lumbcr. 

9. Such stakes shall be of sufficient height to rise above tbc anticipated snow dept}i, with the minimum 

height being IO feet. The snow stakes shall be yellow in color and will be placed oo the opposite side of 

the tank from the riser, and directly opposite the tank va.l"YCS. The top twelve inches of the stake shall be 

painted oBDge. The side of the stake adjacent to the tank llhall continue with the onnge color 1 

minimum of 18 inches from the top of the stake. 

I 0. lru;1Al1ation and maintenance of all tank stakes shaJl be the responsibility of the LPG supplier. No tank 
shall be filled or serviced unless staked as provided in this chapter. 

11. Any ,upplier supplying propunc Lo ft tank must affix a label or other means of identification to the inside 

of the tank: valve protective cover. The label or othet device must be waterproof Bild contain the 

supplier's name and emergency telephone number. 

12. All LPG tanb shall be placed on approved concrete ~upports, Accepcable tank suppons shall include, 

but not be limited to; Pre-cast reinforced concrete pad&, reinforced concrete slab, or pre-ca.st reinforced 

concrete saddles. Use ofun-rt:inforced cinder building blocks is specifically pmhihilect If saddles are 

used they shall contact a minimum of l lO degrees of the tank cin:umfcrencc, Asphall impregnated felt 

of not less than 3/8~ thickness shall be installed between the container and the concrete saddle. Supports 

may by poured in plaoc in lieu of prefabricated supports. If poured in plaoc it shall be a minimum of 4 

inches thick and reinforced with not less than WWF 6X 12, W 16 by W26 or 4 #3 rebar in each direction. 

In areas where tank may be subject to shifting Yl<>W, unstable ground or other hazardous condition, the 

fire Chief may require additional tank supponing, sccurina or protection. 

S«tioa 6113 UadnanMtnd LPG Taaks lmlalladoa11M Owatnlllp shall be added as follows: 

6113.1 Pennlh HdPIHt. Permits shall be rc,quir-M. and plaiu shall be submitted for all underground tank 

installations as approved by the AHJ .. 

6113.2 UadtrJt,round LPG T 111k Owaenblp. Underground LPG tanks shall be prohibited from being sold 

to end-users and shall be retained by the LPG company under a lease-type system to ensure proper annual 

maintenance requirements are met and recorded. 

Stttion 6114 Natural Gu shall be added as follows: 

Existing natural gas installattons shall comply with the following: 

I. Titc meter assembly shall be installed on the gable end of the building. as cl06e as practical to the building 

wall, unless th.is is not feasible due to structural or topogniprue&l corutraints. 

2, A protective cover, designed to he equal to or greater than the lluildiag L>csign Load (determined by the 

building department), appro"cd by the supplier, shall be installed over the meter ~bly, securely 

supported to the ground or diagonally to the building wall. When supported to the ground, the footing for 

the support5 shall be founded 6 inches below fin,~cd aradc. Pre-cast concrete picn may be U3e<i in lieu 

poured footings, provided they are placed on stable soiL 

Sediotl 6115 Vloladona shall be added as follows: 

6U5.l Vloladoas. It shall be unlawful for an LPO supplier to provide SCfVice to a LPO installation, which 

does not comply with the provillons in section 6112 or 6113. 

OnL l~l 
Pqe 15 of 17 

20-0203 J Page 20 of 40 



{)11~.l f aUure ~ Pr9,•ide_(,~o_yer. Failure by the customer to provide a cover u required for a natural gas 

meter as.c-,cmbly is a violation of this code and will subject the customer lo a one hundred dollar ($)00.00) 

fine. 

APPl!:NDIX D - FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS 
Sttdon IOJ Millim•• Specifications 

mCQ.l_~ccns_RCNld Wi~lal¥_it_ti __ .!~'clrant shall be amended as follows: EJtcq,tion' Driveways 

Dl_~J_Gnde shall be amended as follows: 

Fire apparatus access road'! shall not exceed lO percent in grade. 

Exception l: In areas above S,000 ft. elevation, driveways of R~l Occupancies shall not exceed 12 pcrt.cnt in 

grade., un!CM otherwise authoriz.ed by the Fire Chief. If IIJ)pm~ the, driveway slope may exoccd 12% ( 12 

vertical feet to ooc hundred ~.orizontal feet), provided the driveway meets or exceeds the prescribed minimum 

width, and is no longer in length than the maximum pennissible height o{ the structure within such jurisdiction, 

but in no cue more than 35 fed, and bas the appropriate transitiooal slo~ at the edge of pavement to propcn:y 

line. and bu no significant ar1iculation greater than 45% angle i.n its entire length). 

D103.JJ)a~i: Ractilas shaJI be amended as follows'. The minimum turning radius shall be dctcnnincd by 

the fire code official; and shall not include cwt, and gutter. 

D103_.5 Fin Aj>~~~ Access R~d Gates shall be amended as follows: Where a single pte is provided, 

the gate width s.hall be not Jess than 20 feet (6096 mm). Where • fire apparatus road consists of a divided 

roadway, the gate width sh.all DO( be less than 15 feet (4572 mm). 

Stttioa DI .. - Commercial uc:l laduttrial De'"elopaeats 

DHM,.i Q!lilefial!S ucecd~-~1 .. WO ••111an ("4 I• .,.... shall be amended as follows: Buildings or 

facilities having a gross building area of more than 62,000 square feet shall be provided with two separate 

and approved fire apparatus acccs.s roads. Delete exception. 

D104.J R~1 shall be amended u follows: Where two~ roads an: required. Ibey shall be pla~ 

a distance apart equal to oot less than one half of the length of the muimum oYttall diagooal dimension of 

the property or area to be served, measured in• straight line between aroesscs 

ExceptiOn: f'ire appantus road., ca.nnot be installed beca11SC of location on property, topography, 

watuways, nonnegotiable grades or similar condition. and an approved alternative means of fire 

protC11.."tion is provided. 

DIIM.4 CiralaftmatiaU'lrt A.ll»aJ'•hu Atet11 koacb shall be added as follows: Wben required by the 

Fi.re Code: Official, a fire apparatus access road shall be 1.:omtructcd to encompass the entin:ty of I suuctun: 

and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access. 

Sectien D115 - Aaial nre Appancu, Atcat ROlldt 

Dl05.1 Wilen reyllirH. shall be amended as follows: Buildings or portions of buildings or facilities 

ac:ccciiq 30 kid. in beipl abo~ the lowest levd of ftre department vehicle access shall be provided with 

approwd fire appararus access roads capable of accommodatina ftre department aerial apparatus. OIICl'bead 

utility aod power lines shall not be localed within the aerial fm: apparatus ac::icess roadway. 

0105.2 Widdl shall be amended as follows: Aerial ftre apparatus access roads sbaU have a minimum 

unohstn,cted width of 26 feet, ~dus.i~ of ~oulden, ia the immediate vicinity of any building or portion of 

buildin& mo~ than 30 feet in height. 

OnL IJ..1 
Pap 16of 17 

20-0203 J Page 21 of 40 



Section D106- Multiple-family Rtsldeatial Developments 

D106.l_Projec:ts havia~ more tbaa 100 dwelHn~ units shall be amended as follows: Multiple-family 

re!.idential projects having more than 100 dwelling units shall be eq11ipped throughout with two ~eparate and 
approved ft.re apparatus access roads. Dclde exception. 

Stttioa D107- OM or Two-Family Rnldeotial Denlopmeob 

Pl9J,l_Q~~-~r ht"()-___flllW.,\ dweWa~ nstdential de~elo1,menls shall be an101ded as follows; 

Developments of one. or two- family dwellings shall be provided with separate and appmvc,d fire apparatus 

access roads and shall med the requirement,; ofDI07.2 Remoteness, when ~uircid by the Fire Chief. 

Delete exceptions. 

SECTION 4: (:O~_f'UC{ 

That Ortli•Hce No. 16-1 of MBl-'PD, and all other ordinances or parts of ordina.nccs herewith are hereby repealed. 

s•:cTION ~: ~I\i~ll,IT\' 

If any Ordioance, article, subsu:tion or subdivision thereof; provision, sentence, clause or phraic of this code, or any 

11pplication thacof, is for any reason held to be mva.lid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not 

affect the remaining p«wisions oftrus oo<lc, which~ be given effect withool the invalid portions and. tha-cfore, 

such invalid ponions arc dcclued to he c<;evc:rablc. MBFPD hereby decl~ that it would have enacted this 

Ordinanc.-e and each of its acticles. sections, subsections. or subdivisions thcn:of, pruvi3ions, sentences, clauses or 

phrases irrespective of the fact that ooc or more of them is declared invalid. 

SF.CTION 6: 1-:t'FEC.,'IVE DATE AND PUBLIC:ATION, 

This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (]O) dnys 1tflcr its adoption. The MB•'PD Board Sccrcta.ry is directed to 

publish this ordinance in a newspaper of icncral circulation in the District. In lieu of publication of lhc full text of 

the ordinance, a summary of lhc onlillllJ1cc may be pubhshed by the by the Board Secn:tary within fifteen (15) days 
after its passage and a certified copy ~h.111 be posted in the office ofMBf'PU, pursuant to Government Code Section 

J69)3(c) (1 ). 

The above On::linam:e was introduced a, a meeting of the Board ofOircctnrs of MBFPD on September 25, 2019, 

and it was then read for the first time. The Ordinance was read for the second time oo Dtcembtr 11, 2019. 

PASSED AND AJ)()PTI:I> BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF MEEKS BAY ~'IRE: PROTECTION DISTRICT Of COUNTY OF EL 

DORADO AT A REGULAR BOARD MfE:llNO Of SAJD BOARD, HELD ON nm~ D/1.. y (ff Oa:an~., 2012 BY THE fOLLOWING 

von: OF SAID BOARD: 

/\YES: 

NOES: 

ABSTES110r,l S: 

0 

!) 

I -
'. \_ 

l'RESIL>EITT, BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

ABSE:-.T: 0 BY; .. -~I.Miller ---·---·-

I CERTIFY llfATTHF. FORFGorN<:, IS ACORR£CTCOPYOF A R£S0LlT!ON DULY ADOPTED BYSAJDBOARDOF DlllECTOR5 

ON Tii.E DATE THE.REN SeT fORnt. 

•\ 1 '•' :· .. \.. ·, ... _; l·~: ',/(I . I 
. -·---· - -;-·--· ~- '. u. 

Ct.EU. Of. THE B,)A}U) Of DI ~II TORS 

BY: ... !ibawn R.. Cnwfurd __ _________ _ 

20-0203 J Page 22 of 40 



MEK 

Fire Code II 
s,gmf,cant 

Wl1Jt Is the c1,ange? Why Is Tliere J Local Change? 
change? 

101.1 N Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Administrative need 

Adopting this section addresses Climatic conditions: LPG 
gas shall be amended as follows: Add to the exception: Al 
or above 5,000 feet of elevation, a peimit is not required for 

105.6.27 y Add section individual containers with a 125 gallon water capacity or 
less, or multiple container systems having an aggregate 
quantity not exceeding 125 galloos serving occupancies in 
group R 3. 

Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance 

106.6 N Add section Locally created and adopted 
of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines 
permits, plan checks, and inspections as allowed in Health 
&Safety Code 17951. 

106.6.1 N Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to 
the Fire District. 

106.7 y Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106. 7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspections by contractors. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 
Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that 
protects life and property. Fees have been updated to 

110.4 N 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 

Locally adopted and amended match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the 
baiter left to localities to determine the 
fees/penalties for their respective areas. 

District Allomey's Office. The change to the language to 
include the term infractions. 

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s), 

110.4.2 N 
Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before 

Locally created and adopted may issue citations for infractions °' misdemeanOI' 
but under a different number) violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 

Health and Safety Code of the State of California and 
Chapter 5c (commencing with section 853.6) of TiUe 3 of 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 

112.4 N 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 

Locally adopted and amended 
All violations of the code have been consolidated under 

better left to localities to determine the Section 110.4 to include the penalties for violations. 
fess/penalties for their respective areas. 

114.1 through 114.2 N Allows Limitation and Reserving of Rights Locally adopted and amended 
Added the ability for the Board of DireclOfS of the District, 
the right to amend, modify, supplement, revoke in whole, or 
in part, any of the provisions contained or incorporated 
herein, at any time and from time to time. 

Added definitions for: Campfire, District, Executive Body, 

202 N Added definitions frx darity Locally created and adopted 
Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd Manager. 
Definition of campfire shall not include LPG or Propane 
fueled appliances. 

302.1 N Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for clarity 
307.1.1 N Added restrictioos due to weather/Red Flag Locally created and adopted Increase risk of catastrophic wild fire 

307.4.4 through 
Due to the high fire danger that exists in El Dorado County 

y Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopted we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires 
307.4.4.2 (d) within grass, brush, and tree covered areas. 

20-0203 J Page 23 of 40 



Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical 
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for 
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus 
components. It also allows an extended time frame before 

503.2.1 N 
Changed vertical clearances to 15 feet and road having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional 

widths to 20 feet. 
Locally adopted and amended height for vegetation clearances acts as an increased buffer 

for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of 
shoulders, as measured face of curb to face of aJrb is 
needed. These structures can be diffiClJlt lo navigate with 
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the total 
drivable road .surface 

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the Fire apparatus require areas for turning around when 

503.2.5 N 
Fire Code and TIiie 14 Fire Safe Regulations to 

Locally adopted and amended 
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This 

match as they require turnarounds for fire apparatus includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides 

access roads and driveways. better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum 
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendix D of the 

503.2.6 N Surfaces to state and match El Dorado County Locally adopted and amended 
ClJrrent Fire Code whichever is more resbictive to be 

Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17. consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an 
alternate means & methods that is not less restrictive than 
the Fire Code. 

503.4.2 N Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes Locally created and adopted This section clealfy defines the 'No Parking in Fire Lanes' 
rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle Code. 

503.4.3 N 
Added section regarding no parking in front of 

Locally created and adopted 
This section clealfy defines the 'No Parking in front of fire 

hydrants hydrants' rules and is consistent with the Canfomia Vehicle 
Code. 

503.4.4 N 
Added section regarding fire lanes based on road 

Locally created and adopted 
This section dealfy defines California Are Code Appendix D 

width as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire 
lanes. 

Created and adopted to maintain emergency Allows fire disbicts the authority to approve gates on 

503.6 through 503.6.1 N access and consistency through all roadway gates 
Locally created and adopted 

roadways based on the Disbicts gate standard, providing 
in El Dorado County, refeoing to the gate standards the best possible emergency access to maintain fast 
adopted by the FPO's. response times. 

505.1 N 
Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of 

Locally adopted and amended 
Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing 

buildings. based on the District's addressing standards. 

505.1.1 N Added additional addressing requirements Locally created and adopted Establishes installation, location, and visibility requirements. 

505.1.1 (1) N Added additional addressing requirements Locally created and adopted 
Establishes requirements for permanent posting and 
visibility requirements from construction through completion. 

505.1.1 (2) N Added additional addressing requirements Locally created and adopted Establishes requirements for address signs along one way 
roads assuring visibility from both directions 

505.1.1 (3) N Added additional addressing requirements Locally crealed and adopted 
Establishes requirements for multiple addresses accessed 
from a single driveway shall be moounted on a single posl 

Establishes requirements for where a roadway provides 

505.1.1 (4) N Added additional addressing requirements Locally created and adopted access to a single commercial or indusbial butiding the 
addess shall be placed at the nearest road intlllSection 
providing access. 

506.1.1 through 
Created and adopted to maintain key boxes and 

Allows Fire District to require key boxes for emergency 
506.1.3 

N locks for Mdings with gates and/or sprinkler Locally adopted and amended 
systems. 

access. 

507.5.4.1 y Created and adopted to address snow removal and 
Locally adopted and amended 

Allows Fire District to maintain emergency access without 
snow storage. impedance by snow removal or storage. 

20-0203 J Page 24 of 40 



Allows the Fire Disbict to adopt a public private partnership 
fund infrastructure and capital improvements (Partnership 

507.5.7 y Created and added Public Private Partnership Fund 
Locally created and adopted 

Fund) to receive contributions of cash or property qualifying 

for Infrastructure and Capital Improvements under Internal Revenue Code Section 170 to fund 
operations and maintenance, induding but not limited to 
mobile water supply apparatus such as fire boat(s), and.for 
water tender(s). 

604.1.2 
Created and added to impose the requirements of 

Aligns the installation of emergency and standby power 
N NFPA 110 and NFPA 111 for emergency and Locally adopted and amended 

standby power systems. 
systems with NFPA. 

901.4.7 N 
Created and added to address sprinkler systems 

Locally adopted and amended 
dleineates the requirements for sprinklers and fire alrasm on 

and fire alarms existing and new buildings 

901.11 through 901.14 N Created and added to address fire alarm systems Locally adopted and amended Added definition for darity 

Added definitions for: Vendor, Approved, Audible Alarm, 
902 N Added definiUons for darity Locally created and adopted False Alarm, Fire Alarm System, Local Fire Alarm System, 

Subscriber 

903.1 N 
Adds a requirement for all sprinkler systems to be 

Locally created and adopted 
Due to the dimatic conditions of the District all sprinkler 

anti-freeze or non-freezing type. 
systems must be of the anti-freeze or non-freezing type to 
function properly. 

Due to the topographic, dimaUc, and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

903.2.a N 
than 3.600 square feet to Install sprinklers If they Locally created and adopted 

increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 
double in size each and tNery minute, we require sprinkleis 

structure, whichever is less. 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to the topographic, dimatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds occupant protection for existing buildings less 
of El Dorado County and their contnbuting factOIS to our 

903.2.b N 
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they 

Locally created and adopted 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

structure, whichever is less. 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to the topographic, dimalic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their conbibuting faclOIS to our 

These sections were created to give specific 
903.2.1, 903.2.3, 

increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.4, 903.2. 7 
N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage to be installed in sbuctures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Manufactured Hornes - The intent of this code section is to 
ensure that manufactured homes that seive as a one or two 
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar 

This section was created to indude manufactured 
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban 

903.2.8 y residential single family R-3 in the residential Locally created and adopted 
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption 

sprinkler program 
due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The 
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a 
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk 
successfully in many California communities. 

20-0203 J Page 25 of 40 



--.~ 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their conbibuting factors to our 

These sections were created to give specific increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2.9, 903.2.10 N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Adds aucible notification.in all sleeping rooms of a 
Allows Distirct to require audible of a sprinkler water flow. 

903.4.4 N sprinkler water flow alarm in residential LocaHy created and adopted 
occupancies. · alarm. 

Added occupant protection for fire alarms in 
buildings with a floor area less than 3,600, except 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
: ;··.· R3, AG builciiigs not used for commercial . . . 1· 

Locally created and adopted 907.2.a N purposes, and buildings with a floor area of less . allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

tiian 500 square feei as approved by the fire code 
. the event of a fire or smoke. 

official. 
1· 

. · .. 

Added occupant protection for existing builcings 
Provides proper enielgency notification for occupancies that 

without automatic sprinkler systems to install a fire 
907.2.b N iilarin if they add more than 30% or 1,000 square 

Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

feet to the structure, whichever is less. the event of a fire or smoke. 

Added occupant protection by stating all fire alarm 
detection systems instaffed shaft be connected to a Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.c N monitoring s81Vice that notifies the fire department Locally created and adopted allaN public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
upon activation and is installed per Section 907 of the event of a fire or smoke. 
Iha fire code. 

Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
907.2.d N systems to be connected to a monitored fire alarm Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

system when installed or replaced. the event of a fire or smoke. 

907.6.2.1 y Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply 
Locally created and adopted 

Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due lo PG&E 
Modification safely related paNef outages. 

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to 
1203.1.3 N Shunt bip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up 

power supplies 

3310.3 N Address requirements for construction sites Locally created and adopted 
Addressing for construction sites is important to assist 
responding emergency crews. 

3312.1 N 
Water supplies at construction sites with 

Locally adopted and amended 
Water must be on site prior to combustible material being 

combustible materials on-site stored or vertical construction commencing. 

This section darifies that within the boundaries of El Dorado 

Added a section to darily roof construction 
County, fire jurisdictions will require lhal all roofs are 

4905.4 y 
requirements 

Locally created and adopted wildlaod fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be 
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly. 

Any damages or costs from negligent practices that 
Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate. 

5001.7 y cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally created and adopted 
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 

cost recovery fee. 
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the 
negligent parties. 

Added safety protection with permits being issued 
Allows agencies that need to knCM about explosives and 

5601.2 N 
by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for 

Locally adopted and amended fireworks to approve them and have a dear understanding 
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of 

of the applications they will be used for. 
SUpervisors for firewOll<s. 

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any 

FirewOll<s companies or vendors shall make 
documentation including timing and proprietary information 
that pertains to any aspect of a firewor1!s display that they 

5601.2.2 N available all requested documentation pertaining to Locally created and adopted 
deem necessary. This information is understood to be 

the firework presentation 
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as 
such. 

20-0203 J Page 26 of 40 



.--
~ 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5704.2.9.6.1 N Established limits as set fath in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
SpeciaVConditional Use Permit from the County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5706.2.4.4 Established limits es set forth in the Fire Code N Locally adopted and amended 
ftammable and Class II combustible li~id speciai 
operations In above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval 

· and a Special/Conditional Use Pennit from the County. 

J\dlninistrative addition of Disbict name: .. 

Administrative need to ~dd District name. Established limits 

5806.2 • N locally adopted and amended 
as required by Ille Fire Code Official for Flammable 

Esiablistied.f!m\ts as set forth in the Fire Code Cryogenic fluids In siationary containers. Re«JJires AHJ 
approval and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the 
County. 

6102 N Added definitions for clarity locally aeated and adopted 
Added definitions for: Installation, LPG, Supplier, 
Interruption of S~ce 

EstabHshes distances between LPG storage and 
dispensaries !hat are directly related to safety for residential 

. . . . 

6104.2 N 
Established lif!1ils for LPG storage and dispensing 

Locally adopted and amended 
developments and high-density hotels, motel, apartments, 

near or adjacent to residential development 
etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would 
have a high probabt1ity of injury, inhalation, or death. 
Requires AHJ approval and a SpeciaVCondilional Use 
Permit from the County. 

Establishes procedures for the safe handling of propane 
above 500 feet. There are special requirements above 

6112 N 
Establishes propane regulator requirements for 

Local! y aeated and adopted 
5000 feel due to snow loads and sheer the made propane a 

locations above 5000 foot elevation 
significant ignition source and danger duling the winier 
months. This section requires certain rules for regulators. 
vertical riser piping, markings and locations, and permit and 
plan requirements. 

Establishes permit requirements for propane tanks greater 

6112 (1)a,b,c,d,e,1 N 
Establishes propane regulator requiremenls for 

Locally created and adopted 
than 125 Gallons. There is a requirement for a plot plan for 

locations above 5000 loot elevation 
all new installations signed by a lpg supplier Iha! contains 
building locations, lot lines, capacities, riser pipe location, 
roof ridge line depiction. 

Establishes re(JJirements for regulators. Installation of 

6112 (2) N 
Establishes propane regulator requirements for 

Locally created and adopted 
regulators shall meet manufacturers instructions, 1st stage 

locatioos above 5000 foot elevation 
regulators to be located under a cover, all regulators must 
be listed and approved, flexible connectors shall be used 
between first stage regulator and main service valve. 

Establishes vertical propane rise requirements for locations 
for the District. Pipe schedule location, swing joint 

Establishes propane vertical riser pipe requirements 
6112 (3) N Locally created and adopted 

requirements:and the use of flexible riser piping as well as 
above 5000 foot elevation swing joints. These requirements are based on significant 

fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather conditions 
encountered above 5000 feel 

6112(4) N 
Establishes propane shut off valve requirements 

Locally aeated and adopted 
Establishes shut off valve requirements including locations 

above 5000 foot elevation at the gable end of the building and visibility requirements. 

Establishes propane protective covers for second Establishes construction requirements for protective covers 
6112(5) N stage regulators and meters re(JJirernents above Locally aeated and adopted for second stage regulators and meters including conaete 

5000 loot elevation piers and footings. 

6112 (6) N 
Establishes propane endemnity clause Locally aeated and adopted 

Establishes observational and inspection protections for the 
requirements above 5000 foot elevation Distlict. 

6112 (7) N 
Establishes propane vertical yard riser pipe Locally created and adopted 

Establishes propane yard riser pipe requirement dearances 

requirements above 5000 foot elevation 
for concrete installations and the use of schedule 80 steel 
piping as a rninumum requrement. 

Lu-u;w-, J t-'a g e .LI OT 4U 



__ : 
6112 (8) N 

Establishes propane LPG lank markings 
Locally created and adopted 

Establishes minimums of a 2'x2' wooden stake to 
requirements above 5000 foot elevation permanendy mark tank locations. 

6112 (9) N 
Establish es propane LPG tank marltings 

Locally created and adopted Establishes height requirements for stakes. 
requirements above 5000 foot elevation 

6112(10) N Establishes propane installation and maintenance 
Locally created and adopted 

Establishes requirements for the stakes to be instaHed by 
requirements above 5000 foot elevation the LPG supplier. 

Establishes marking and location requirements for locations 
for the Districl This section addresses signage location, 

6112 (11) N Establishes propane marking and location 
Locally created and adopted 

emergency contact information, and snow related tank 
requirements above 5000 foot elevation marking requirements. These requirements are based on 

significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather 
conditions encountered above 5000 feet. 

6112 (12) N 
Establishes propane tank support requiremenls 

Locally created and adopted 
Establishes approved propane tank supports such as pre-

above 5000 foot elevation cast reinforced concrete pads, slabs, or saddles 

. 

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for und81!Jround 
tanks: 

6113.1 N 
Permits and plans shall be submitted and approved 

Locally created and adopted 
AHows us to require plans be submitted for review prior to 

by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction). instaffations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks 
require substantial maintenance including inspection and 
anode replacement at regular int8Mls. 

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without 

6113.2 N 
Requires und81!Jround LPG tanks to remain the 

Locally created and adopted 
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when 

property of the LPG company sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground 
tanks Where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected . 

. 

Establishes requirements for natural gas 
Establishes requirements for natural gas installations to 
protect the meter on structures. These requirements are 

6114 N installations, meter locations, and protective covers Locally created and adopled 
based on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 

over meters. 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet. 

Establishes a violation process for LPG installation that 
Adds a violation process if an LPG Supplier encounter high snow loads and do not meet Sections 6112 

6115.1 N provides service to a LPG installation that does not Locally created and adopted or 6113. These requirements are based on significant fire 
comply with Sections 6112 or 6113. history in heavy snow and extreme weather conditions 

encountered above 5000 feel 

Establishes a violation process for LPG installation that 

Adds a violation process if a customer does provide 
encounter high snow loads and do not meet Sections 6112 

6115.2 N 
cover for a natural gas meter assembly. 

Locally created and adopted or 6113. These requirements are based on significant fire 
histOI}' in heavy snow and extreme weather conditions 
encountered above 5000 feet. 

Appendix D: 0103.1 N Made an exception for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended 
1.t is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to 
construct a 26 foot wide spaa1 for access lo a hydrant 

Establishes requirements for fire apparatus access Oue lo the significant fire history lil heavy snow and 

Appendix O: 0103.2 y roads to not exceed 10 percent grade and in areas 
Locally adopted and amended 

extreme weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet 
above 5,000 Feet elevation driveways of R-3 these requirements wilt allow apparatus to access 
occupancies shall not exceed 12 percent grade. occupancies when heavy snow limits traction. 

Appendix D: 0103.3 N Text to indude curbs and gutters Locally adopted and amended 
20 foot road widths shalt not indude curbs and gutters due 
to potential access issues and turning radius concerns. 

Appendix D: 0103.5 § 
Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided 

1 
N Fire apparatus access road gates Locally adopted and amended roact.vay the gate width shall not be less than 15 feel due to 

'·.': radius issues .. • .. ·. 

Appendix D: 0104. 2 
Added to require two equally spaced two fire Where buildings exceed 62,000 square feet two equally 

N apparatus access roads on buildings that exceed Locally created and adopted spaced fire apparatus access roads will be required to allow 
to0104.3 

62,000 square feel access in fire emergencies. 

20-0203 J Page 28 of 40 



r---_, 
When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 

Appendix D: D104.4 N 
Added lo require circumferential fire apparatus 

Locally created and adopted 
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire 

access roads strudure and shall provide a continuous means of 
emergency vehicle access. 

Amended to require fire apparatus access roads on 
For the safely of the communities we live in, ingress/egress 

Appendix D: D105, buildings that exceed 30 feel in height that are 
D105.1, D105.2 

N 
capable of accommodating fire department aerial LocaKy adopted and amended is required for fire department aerial apparatus to ensure 

apparatus. the safety of the residents and first respondels. 

Removed Exoeption in its imtirety: · 
For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Appendix D: D106.1 N. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

.• residents and iirat responderi 

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 
Appendix D: D107.1 N RemovedExceptions #t & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety or the 

. residents and filst responders. . 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.2 through 101.5 N Adopted to establish scope, intent severability and 

Locally adopted Administrative clarity 
validity 

102.6 through 102.8 N References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

102.10 through 102.12 N 
Conflicting provisions, Other Laws, Application of 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
referelices 

103.1 through 103.4.1 N Definition or the Fire Preventioo Division Locally Adopted Administrative clarity . 

104.1 N Ability to enforce the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.3 through 104.4 N Right of Entry, Warrants, and Identification Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.6 through 104.6.4 N Record retention Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.8 through 104.9.2 N 
Modifications, alternate means and methods, and 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
test 

104.11 through 
N 

Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of 
Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.11.2 systems 

104.11.3 N Aulhoritv of systems and devices inooerable Locally Adooted Adminislrative clarity 
105.2.3 N Time limitation of application Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.3.1 through 
N Operational permits Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.3.2 

105.6.12 N 
Dry cleaning operational permits required for 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
hazardous cleaning solvent use 

Permits for various business operations for. Magnesium, 

105.6.2.28 through Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation 

105.6.35 
N 

fire and fife safety inspections 
Locally Adopted vehides, motor fuel-dispensing facilities, open burning, 

open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and 
organic coatings 

105.6.37 N 
Adopted this section to, administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Permits for places of assembly 
fire and tife safety inspections 

105.6.39 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Permits to, private fire hydrants 
fire and fife safety inspections 

Permiis for pyroxylin plastics, refrigeration equipmen~ repair 
105.6.41 ihrough 

N 
Adopted this section for adminlsiriltive clarity and Locally Adopted 

garages and motor fuel-<lispenslng facilities, rooftop 
105.6.46 fire and Hie safety inspections helipats, s113yilg or dipping, storage cl scrap tires and tire 

by-products 

105.6.48 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Permit for tire-rebuilding plants 
fire and lfe safety inspections 

105.6.50 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally Adopted Permit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material, 
fire and tife safety inspections lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 cubic feet) 

106.1 through 106.3 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Fee schedules for peimits 
fire and Nfe safety inspections. '' 

. 

107.f N 
Adopted ttiis section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted lnspectlon aulhoriiy fire and fife safety inspections . . 

20-0203 J Page 29 of 40 



., 

108.1 through 109.3 

110.3.2 through 
110.3.4 

110.4.1 
. 

11:i.1 

303.1 through 303.9 I 

305.1 through 305. 5 

306.1 through 306.2 

307 .1 through 307 .5 

308.1 

308.1.2 through 
308.1.3 

308.1.5 through 
308.1.8 (excluding 
308.1.4) 

308.2 

308.3 lhrough 308.4.1 

310.1' 

310.3 

310.4 lhrough 310.8 

311.1 through 311.4 

31H. 

319.2 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

. 
N 

N 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety Inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fiie and nre safety inspections •· ·, 

Adopted this. section for administrative clarity and 
fire and li'fe safety inspiii:ooils . . 

Adopied this section for administrative clarity and 
fire arid life safety insj)ections ·. · .. 

Adopted this section for fire 'and life ~fely 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safely 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safely 

Adopted this section for fire arid life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safely 

Adopted this section for fire and Hie safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

~ed this section for fire and life safety ·• 
: .. , .. ··-.·. 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity arid 
fire' and ire safety inspedioos . . 

·. 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

locally Adopted 
· . 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Localy Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted · 
. ·. 

Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of 
equipment re-inspection and testing, recoldkeeping, 
supe,vision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding, 
Board of Appeals eslablished, limitations on authority, and 
qualifications 

Compliance with orde!s and notices, prosecution of 
violations, and unauthorized tampering < · · 

. 

Abatement or violation· · 
· .. 

Auihorify to d1scoonect seivice utilities . 
.. . . . .. ·.. ·, 

Asphalt kelttes contain highly niiminable subsiances and 
require sbingeni safeguards (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) · .. 

Mllriagirig ignition sources through responsible application 
of staridards will reduce the number of fires in various 
settings (ciiriiatic,'geological; and topographical) 

·, . 

Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY 
flammable and require special handling (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

Open burning, recreational fire, and poltable outdoor 
fireplaces, (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Open flame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Throwing or placing of ignition sources, torches for 
removing paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Locations near combustible, open flame devices, signals 
and markers, portable fuel open-ffame devices, sky­
lantems, religious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming 
food and beverage preparation, cflSf)ellsing, conlainers not 
in use, seiving or flaming food, loca6on, fire protedion 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Permits are required for above section (Climatic, geological, 
and topographical) 

Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices, 
lheabical pelformances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 
dormitories (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

General requirements relating to smoking (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

'No Smoking' signs (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical). 

Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with 'No Smoking' 
signs, ash trays, burning objects, hazardous environmental 
conditions. (Ctimatic, geological; and topographical) 

Vacant premises condition and safety requirements, 
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant 
premises, security, fire protection, fire separation, removal 
of combustibles, removal of hazardous materials. (Cimatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

General requirements relating to rnobile food preparation . 
vehides. (Climatic; geological, .and topographical) . 

Peimits for mobile food preparation vehicles (Climatic, 
geological. and topographical) ' 

20~0203 J Page 30 of 40 



Exhaust hood, fire protection, fire protection for cooking 
equipment fire extinguisher, appliance connection to fuel 
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, metallic 
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage lanks, cooking oil 
storage system components, design aitena, tank venting, 
normal vents; eme,gency vents, LP1as systems, maximum 

319.3 through 
Adopted ihis section for fire and life safety . 

aggregate volume. protection of container, LP-gas container 
N Locally Adopted conslriJction, protection of system piping, LP-gas alamis, 319.10.3 

CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel, 
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG 
caitainer consiniction, CNG containers supplying 
transpiration and cooking fuel; protection of system piping, 

. methane alarms, maintenance. exhaust system. fire 
protection systems arid devices and fuel gas systems. 
(Climatic, geological, and topographicai) 
:·.: 

403.8.1 through Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1 

403.8.1.7 
N Adopted ihis section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted (residential care facilities and group homes) evaaialion and 

fire safely plans. 

403.10 through Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancy 

403.10.1.3 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safely · Locally Adopted Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic, 

geological, and topographical) 

405.5 N Adopted this section for fire and fife safety Locafly Adopted Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic. 
geological, and topographical) 

510.3 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
A peimit is required for emergency responder radio systems 

fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a 
807.5.2 lhrough 

N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in 
807.5.2.3 fire and fife safety inspections educational facilities (Climatic, geological, end 

topographical) 

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5 

903.2.1.5 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers) 

fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000 
square feet (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
All buildings will be re(1Jired to allow emergency responders 
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from 
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time 

Adopted this section in existing buildings for the frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 

1103.2 y safety of firefighters and other emergency Locally Adopted 
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by 

responders. the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind 
this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury 
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appencix 0: 0101.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads 
through 0102.1 firefighters, and other emergency responders. including loads. (Cllmatlc, geological, and topographical) 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Dead end fire apparatus access road requirements for a 
Appendix o: 0103.4 N 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. 
Locally Adopted tum around at 150 feet (Climatic. geological, and 

topographical) 

Appen(ix 0: 0103.6 . N 
i\dopted this section for the safety of Iha p!lblic, 

Locally Adopted 
'No Parking, Fire Lane' signs requirements. (Cfimatic, 

firefighters, Md other emergency respondeB . geological, and topographlcal). 
.. . . . 

Appendix o: 0104.1 Adopted ~is sedlon for the safety of the public, Commerciai and incklstrial development fire apparatus · 
through 0104.3 N Locaffy Adopted 
(excluding exception) 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. access roads. (Climatic, geological. and topographical) 

.m-0203 J Pa g e 31 of 4U 



Appendix D: D105.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

Requirements for aerial fire apparalus access roads 
through 0105.4 firefighteis, and other emergency respondeis. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix D: D106.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential 

through D106.3 N 
firefighters, and other emergency respondeis. 

Locally Adopted developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 
(exduding exceptions) 

' . ·. 

Appendix D: D107.1 
One- or two-dwelling residential developments shaR be 

through D107.2. N 
AdoPted this section for the safety or the public, 

Locally Adopted 
equipped throughout witli two sperate and approved fire 

firefighters, and oilier erneigency responders. apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 
(exduding exception) 

) cr1matic conditions:-
' 

Appendix D: D108 N 
Adopted this section· for the safety or the public, 

Locally Adopted 
Adopi reference standards dealing with gate construction 

firefighters, and other emeigency'respcinders .. standai'its (Climatic, geo1og1ca1, and topographlcalJ 
. 

Grey cells are previously amended,· adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle. 

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

20-0203 J Page 32 of 40 



SIERRA SUN Proof and llalMlent ~ Publcatlon 
Ad I: OCIINll1.1N-01 

NOTICE IS HEREBY 
GIVEN that Meeks Bay 

------------. Fire Protection District 
CU9tamar Account#: 1088595 

580 Malory Way, Cal'IOn ctty, NV 89701 
P.O. Box 1888 Carsen City, NV 88702 
(775) 881-1201 FAX: (775) 887-2'408 

Legal Account 
MEEKS BA.Y FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT, 
PO BOX 189 
TAHOMA, CA 98142 
Attn: Shawn Crawford 

...... l...ldon Np: 

That (1)he ii a legal ctert of the 
Ilana ... , 
a ..... per publllhed Friday 
at Truckee. in h Stale rA California. 

POI: 

Ad I: 0000514194-01 
of which. copy .. henlto altehed, ... publilhed 
In ad newapapa, fDr the Ml requited period of 
2 time(•) commencing on 11'2W2011. 
and ending on 12/0ll20tt, all dlyl incluM. 

~,,f~L 

Signed: ____ _ 

0..: 12l08i2019 State of Nevada, Caraon City 

Thia II III Orlglnat Eledlanlc Affldavlt. 
Prtce: $ 88.52 

..... ,.,...., ..... ,....,.,,.,,,,, ... ... 

.... .,.,. ... .,QI ... , ........ ,. ...... .. 

.,,.--.• 

will hold a public hearing 
on December 11th, a1 
3:30pm, at 8041 Hwy 
89, Meeks Bay, CA, re· 
garding the adoption of 
the Amendments to the 
2019 Calttomia Fire 
Code pursuant to Health 
and Safety Code Section 
13869. Copies of the 
code section referred to 
and any secondary code 
sections referred to, 
adopted by reference, 
are on file with the Sec­
retary of the District and 
are open to public in­
spection. 

Pub: Nov. 29, Dae. 6, 
2019 Ad #0000514194 

20-0203 J Page 33 of 40 



Attachment No. 2 

Meeks Bay Fire Protection District 

Resolution No. 2019-06 

20-0203 J Page 34 of 40 



Meeks Bay Fire Protection Dis.trlct 

of the Board or Directors 

No: 2019-06 

A resoluti n for Meeks Bay Fi.n: Proccc:ti n Di. lrict se11 tug fo11h findings wilt1 r-ei.Jlcci 10 looaJ conditions 
within the F~ Dts-trict whkb m.a.k;c ccrtru.n Hi~ ti and ch:aoges to the CoJifomi fire ode l'CII onably 
nee~ for preserving fire nd life safety in Meeks Bay Pmtc,ctioa District. 

The Govem.ing Bo&rd [)f M . Stty f ' Pro1oction District finds m d rcsot~ u fo ll w· 

Wfft:ll&\S, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 pe:nni1s • Fi.re Proter.tion Disuici to adopt an ordioa.1.1ce 
whir. cbanges or modifies the S'We Hou.sH1g rcgu l tioM ptcd punuanl o HeiJth Safety Code Section 
179'21 upon detemiinalion th1tt such chllnges or modifications arc necessary due to loc&I condi tions: ar,d 

WHElllAS, Health & Safc\y Code Sc lino 1795&. 'J requires that a Board of DiRlttors milking tm)' changes 
or modifications pursuant ,o l:{eajth & Snfcty Code S~ction I 795R.5 !lb111l mute Cll.PT"eS5 t1nding thBt such 
clumg"CS or moditic.o.tions a.re needed; and lilinll file s copy of such c.hang~ or modific11tions with the 
Dep;utmcnt of Housing ttnd Cotrunlutily Oevelopmcnt. 

Now , lltntDORE., BE IT RESOLVU> AND ORDERE..D Ul!3t the Board of Oire<:t rs f Meeks Bay Fin: 
Protection Oistrie1, after hnvin du.ly noticoo .imd hdd public bearing uprc.5 ly finch that ,lcll changes or 
modi fications are raiSOuebly u because of loc~ condihons., more s~ific lly sci forth as foUom: 

FINDINGS Of FACT 
FOR CR NGES OR '.MC)Ul'FJC 'flONS TO THE ST TE tl 1N STA.Nl>ARDS CODE 

rrrrt,E 24 PART 9) BECAUSE. OF LOCAL CONDITIONS 

CHANGES OR M0DlFICAT'IONS: Purs1Jant to Section 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 of the 
Oilifomi Hetti.th & $3fcty Code, the Board of Directors of Meeks Bay Fite Protcetion District, in its 
ordinance adopting nd 11n1et1ding Cli.e 2019 California Fire Cod , ch o~ or mooll'ics oerteio provisions of 
the 2019 Building Stundard,; Code, (Title 24 Pert 9), as it pemins lo the regulation of buildings used for 
human babil&Lion ud other~ of suuct\lJ'Cs, md g,:nm\l n.dcr. fur fire ti:t-y. A wpy of the tt:.,t of sucb 
changes or modiflCJ1tious is slloched. 

FINDINGS: Pursuant to Sections .t 7958.5, I 79S8.7 and 18941.5 of the H Ith Safety Code, the Bo.rd 
of Dir,,ct rs of Meeb Bay Fire Pro~tion District bu dctennincd llOd fiuds that the aUechcd cbD.nges or 
modifications the 201 SI lif rn.i Building Standards Codii:2 TitJe 2 .P 'J n:re nccdcd and an: reason.ably 
nCCf:SSMY because or local climatic, geogniphic and 1opognphi<: oonditioru . 

FINDING NO. ONE - Privolc properties lying within Mcicb 8&)' Fir1! Pro cction Distric;t are classified i15 

ver, .high wildlo.nd file '.hazard. 

F1NOING NO. TWO -Themewlceofdestructionbyfi~to life, tmproved propcsty, ornurural ~may 
be, or be fo ·t I() become, cxb'cme due to critical fire wcalbu, fire suppression force:$ being h.eavily 

20-0203 J Page 35 of 40 



committed to control fires already burning, acute dryncsi; of the vegetation, or other factors that may cause 
the rapid spn:ad offtresucb as high wind,;, low fuel moistures, Firl: Weather or Red Flag Waminas, or se~ 
threac of wildland fire. 

FINDING NO. THREE~ Cooperating federal or state agcncic~ address the threat of wildland fire oo lands 
adjacent to the District by iuuance of Fire Rwrictions which reatrict or ban open burning, including 
recreational fires. 

FINOtNG NO. FOUR · Granting the Fire Ctucf authority to ban or restrict open burning, including 
recreational fires, on private property within the District is reasonably necessary because of local 
climatological, geological or topogT&phic conditions in order to reduce the risk of wildfire and to coordinate 
District, State and Federal policies to limit or reatrn:t open burning to reduce the risk ofwildfm:. 

LOCAL CONDITIONS: Local conditions havec an odvcrse effect on the prevention of (I) major loss 
fires, (2) major earthquake damage, and (3) the potential for life and property loss, making changes or 
modifications to the aforementioned code5 necessary to provide a reasonable degree of property security as 
well L'I tire and life safety in this jurisdiction 

Below are listed advcnc local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions foul)({ in Meeks Bay Fire 
Protection District: 

L <:~~ 
a. Predpltadoa. 

Annual precipitation fluctuates greatly Appro-_ima1cly 90-95 percent of the pm;ipitation occurs during 
the months ufNo"cmbcr through April, and 5-10 percent occurs from May throuah October. This area 
bas experienced major droughti in lbe n:cenl put; one in l 9TI-l 978, one which started in 1989 and 
luted into 1994, olhcn from 1999-2004, and 2006-2009. Drough1s continue to cycle to this day, and it 
i1 probable that they will occur in the future. Electrical storms an: frequent and are usually accompanied 
by little rainfall, potenlially crcatin8 nwncrous lightcoing caused fires. 

b. Relative HumJdfty. 
During the months of June through September, the daily humidity ranges around 30 pcrcalt, and often 
drops to the ]ow teens. During a recent ~ildland fire where 5 homes were lost, the humidity was 
meuurcd at 9 percent relative humidity. 

t. Temperatures. 
During the months of June through September, daily tcmpcniture! conunonly cx.oeed 70 degrees 
Fahrenheit, with tcmpenturcs ha\ins been recorded as high as ''Xl deg~ Fah~it. Winter 
temperatures C8Il drop lo below O dcgrccs Fahrenheit. 

d. Wlads, 
Prc\'ailing win<h are out of the &auth and southwest. However, north and cast winds occur during the 
spring (May through June), the fall (late September and October), and occ.asionally during the summer 
months. Wind velocities IJCntnlly ran~ from five to fifteen miles per hour; gusting to thirty miles per 
hour during the summer month!i. 

e. Summary. 
These locaJ climatic conditions affce1 the accclention. intensity, and size of fires in the Fire District. 
Times orlittle or DO rainfa.JI, low humidity and high temperatures create extremely ha..ardous conditions, 
particularly as they relate to the wildlaod - urbu ioterflk.-e. Winds experienced iD this aret can have a 
sip.ificant impact upon llNcture fires, especially in buildinp in clote promruty to oae another, and to 
wild lands commonly (oued in Meeks Ba.y Fire Protection District 

II. Geompllk'. ~~d T~po~~~ 
The: tiR-mviroament of• community i:r primarily, C'OIDbta.ttioo of two factors: fbe pbyrical ,coppmc 
characteristics or the area and the hlstoric pattern of ~lopment Tbeae IWo fact«n,. create a mi1turc 
or cnviroo.meots that ultimately determines the ma's fi~ protection ~. 

20-0203 J Page 36 of 40 



The geographical boundarics of the Fire Oistticl include all of El Dorado County adjacent lo Lake 
Tahoe, including along Highway 89 from the north boundary gate at Emera.Id Bay north to the 1!1 
Dorado/Placer county line. 

Reul use of the siz.e of the Fin: District (14 square mi I~). and changes in elevation, the characu:tislics 
of the fire environment change from one locaaion to the next As such,. the sey,,ice area has not ooe, but 
1 number of fire environments, each of which has its individual fire protection oeccis. 

The service area has I varied topography and vcgcutivc cover. It has rdatively Oa1 areas aloo11 the 
shoreline, turning to steep hills as part of the Tahoe Basin. Vegetative covtt nmaes from it.ands of 
man.7.anita to dense forests of fir and pint: trees. Development has occurred as the communities have 
extended north and~-

a. Seismic Locadoa. 
The relat,velyyoung geologicaJ p~ that have created our area of service arc still active today, Our 
service area incorporates a portion of the North Tahoe, West Tahoe, and Dollar Point car1hquakc faults 
and is adjacent lo several otbef potentially active faults. The District's eotin: land 1urfacc: i1 in the 
high-to-moderate seismic h.uard zones. 

b. Size and Popa)atloa. 
lbe District co~ 14 squan: miles of rci.idcntial, state and federal land, includin11 campgroundJ and 
state parb. Thcn:areovet' 1800 residential stJUct\ltcs. However, it is believed thercareonly1round 1000 
full-time residents. lbcrc is no trad:ing met bod to estimate the number of visitors who come to the area. 

c. Roads ud Streeb. 
Many al'Cti io the Fin: District arc x:rved by sub-standard roeds. Due to restrictive: land we regulations, 
much of the current development is in-fill, utilinng lots that were previously deemed unusable. Some 
planned unit development! arc !lef'Ve<l hy private mads, wbicb create access problems ( i. c ., narrow widths 
and on-street parking). Roadways. w1ih less than 20 feet ofunobstructod pavement with dead-ends longer 
than 150 feet, with cul-dc-5acs lonf'cr than g()() feet arc common. While development h.as continued 
throughout the Fire District, act.--es..'I into individual suhdivisions has not changed. Street widths remain 
marginal, on-street parking remains a problem in all but the newest subdivisions and, in general, ingress 
and cares., are difficult during times of peak seasonal population Ouctuati<>TU. Numerous subdivisions 
are served by only sin[lle lane ~. se\lcrely restricting emergency vehicle access into tbc affi:cicd 
areas. 

d. Tepograplly. 
The topography of the L>istrict varies from near J~l to ternin in excess of 1.W percent slope. Ast rule 
of thumb, the rate of fire sprc.d doubles as the slope percentage doubl~. aJI other factors run1ining the 
same. 

Most structures, both residential and commen;ial, are in, or are surrounded by beavi ly forested areas. Due 
to drought conditions., beetle infestations, and lack of vegetation management, much of the area is 
populated with either dead or dyina trees. contributing to an extreme fire danger. Elevation ranges from 
about 6200 feet al lake leYCl to over 7200 f~ on mountain pan roads with J>CU5 exceeding 8000 feet 
io elevation. 

e. Veptadoa. 
Vegetation in the Fire Di.strict varies from sub-alpine furests of aspen and pine to pine and cedar fOffflS, 

with submntial brush fields of man.zanita. snow brush, and white thorn. As residential development 
continues in the Fire District, cleanmces between homes ha~ deCTcased. New development is 
cooccotrated at the edae of. or into heavily forested areas. This situation allows fire to trawl easily from 
borne to home.. forest to home, or home to forest by radiation, convected beat and/ or flying emben. 
bpansioo of the residential community bas raulted in homes that aist in close proximity to dauc 
natural foliaae. Often such dwcllinp arc completely SWTOWlded by highly combustible \l'CICUlion, 
oompoundi.na the fire problan. 

20-0203 J Page 37 of 40 



f. Summary. 
Local geographic and topographic conditions increase the fire huard presented to the Fire l>i~rict ln 
addition. a fire following an earthquake ha.~ the potential of causing greater Joss oflifc and damage than 
the earthquake itself 

Other variables that tend to intensify the fire danger include: 
I) damage to the piped water sy$1em infrulructun; 
2) isolation due to bridge collapse 
3) roadway damagt andior amount of debris blocking roadways 
·f~ &V'l.i\ah\l\t,y of timely mutual aid u~,v.ancc 
5) the J>f'CSCOCC of II significant pcrcenlllgc of dwelling, with wood shingle or ~akc roof coverings 

Cooclusion: 
l.oc.l climatic, gcog(11PIDC and topographic conditions described abovie increase the frequency, intensity, 
and size of fires involving buildings in the t'ire District. Further, these conditions impacl potential 
dAmaac to structures from an earthquake and 5Ubsequent fire. Therefore it is reasonably necessary that 
the California fire Code 'be modified to mitigate the effects of the above conditions 

California Health&. Safety Code Section 17958. 7 requires that modifi~tions to the Fire Code be ~sly 
marked and identified as to which each finding refcn to which Code modification The following table 
provides this connection. 

Eiwiw 
Adminislnltive 
Administrative 
t(a), I .(b), J.(d) 
l(a), ll(c) 
L(d). [.(c). ll.(a), 11.(c), U.(d) 
L(a), l.(c), (L(c) 
I.(a). 
£I.( c:,. 
I.(a), t(c), 11.(b), 11.(c) 
Admini,1ntivt: 
r., n 
I.(a),. L(b), l.(c), 11.(a), II.(b) 
l.(d}, 0. (b), U(c) 
L(a) L(c), 11.(a), lt(b), ll.(d) 

~ode Section 
Chapccr I 
Chapter 2 
Chapter 3 
Chapter S 
Chapter6 
Chapter 9 
Chapter 12 
Chapkr 33 
Chapeer 49 
Chapter 50 
Chapter 56 
Chap1cr 57 
Chap4er S8 
Chapter61 
Appendi.-: D L(a}. l(c), 11.(a). U.(b). ll(c), ll(d), IJ.(c) 

This Resolution shall take effect and he in force from and after its approv:al as ~uired by law 

PASSED AND Al)()f>ftb 9Y THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF MEEKS BAY t,:lRl: PROll:CTION DISTR.ICTOf ffiE 
COUNTY OF EL DORADO .AT A llff,ULAR Mf.£11Ml Of" TIU: BOARD. ltEl.D ON nm~ DAY Of Sqnanbq, 20.12. 

BY 11-IE FOUOWTNG VOll' Of SAID BOARD: 

/4.YES: .._. 

NOES; 0 
ABSTEN110NS 0 

ABSENT: 0 8Y: Ldwwd I Milla" 
I CERTIFY THAT TIIE FOREOOING IS A CORRECT co,y Of A RE~l.lrnON Dl'lY AOiJ-,,.-. T'E_O_B_Y_SAJ_D_\i>~ f.* 

... _____...._.! * 6r ;!'( ~ ':. '·~ .._....,._4 
DIRECTORS01'THEDATfTitFRfJNSETFORTit ·_-: ___ ·., T·· . ,·· --~---' (·'·\~-~-, r\ 

Cl.UJ( Of TlfE -\ \o OF . f «S 
BY: Sha-. fl Crawford ,/ 

20-0203 J Page 38 of 40 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted as Amended Finding 
101.1 X Admin 

105.6.27 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

114.1 X Admin 

114.2 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/T opographica I 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

505.1 X Climatic/Geological 

505.1.l X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

506.1.1 X Climatic/Geological 

506.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

507.5.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

507.5.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

604.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

901.4.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

901.11 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

901.12 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

901.13 X Admin 

901.14 X Admin 

902 X Admin 

903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phica I 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.4.4 X Geological/Topographical 

20-0203 J Page 39 of 40 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3310..3 X Climatic/Geological/T opograph ica I 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/To pogra ph ica I 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6102 X Admin 

6104.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

6112 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112 (1) a,b,c,d,e,f X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112 (2) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112 (3) X Cli matic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

6112 (4) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112 (5) X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

6112 (6) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112 (7) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112 (8) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112 (9) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112 (10) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112 (11) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112 (12) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6114 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6115.1 X Admin 

6115.2 X Admin 

Appendix 0: 0103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix O: 0103.S § 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0104.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: 0104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: 105.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: 105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

20-0203 J Page 40 of 40 


