
RESOLUTION NO. 043-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 019-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is 
updated by the State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958. 7 and 
18941.5 permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county 
determines are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical 
conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, 
Chapter 1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety 
regulations to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building 
official, or his or her authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his 
or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the 
chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and 
maintain a memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining 
to the inspection of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on 14th of November 2019, the Board of Directors of the Mosquito Fire Protection 
District adopted Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with 
amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical 
conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El 
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Mosquito Fire Protection District and delegates the 
enforcement of the ordinance to the Mosquito Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her 
representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following 
sections: 

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202,302.1, 307.4.4 through 
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1. 
507.5.1, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 
903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 
5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 through 6112.3, 
6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 
5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, 
Appendix B: Table B 105.1 (1), Appendix B:Table B 105.2, Appendix D103.1 
through D103.3, Appendix D103.5 Section 1, Appendix Dl03.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, 

Appendix D 104.4. 20-0203 K Page 1 of 40 



Resolution No. 043-2020 
Page 2 of2 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, .ill 
its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 
2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.l, 403 .2.1-403.2.4, 403 .3, 403 .4, 
403 .6, 403 .7, 403 .8 (adopting 403.8 .1-403.8.1.7), 403.9 , 403.10 .2, 403.10.3, 403.11 , 403 .12, 
404.1- 404.4 , 405 .1-405.4, 405 .6-405 .9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5 .2.3), 808, 
904.1.1, 1101 , 1103.1, 1103 .3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103 .10, 1104-1106, 
Chapter 25 , Chapter 26, the exceptions under D 104.2 (Exception), D 106.1 (Exception), 
0107.1 (Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, 
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of 
said Board, held the _J_Q__ day of March , 2020, by the following vote of said Board: 

Attest: 
Ayes: Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin, Novasel 
Noes: None 
Absent: None 

20-0203 K Page 2 of 40 



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
8801 ROCK CREEK ROAD 
PLACERVILLE, CA 95667 

January 61
". 2014 

Don Ashton. Chid Administrative Officer 
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors 
:no Fair Lane 
Placcrvillt:. CA 95667 

(530) 626-9017 
Fax (530) 626-3240 

Suhjccl: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019-06 of the Mosquito Fire Protection District which 
adopts the 2019 California Fire Code with amendments related to local climatic, geographic and 
topogr11phic conditions. 

Dt·ar Mr. Ashton: 

The Mus4uito Fire Protection District is requesting the 13oarJ of Supervisors (BOS) ratify its Ordinance No. 2019-
0 I which adopts the 2019 Cali fhmia Fire C o<le as amended due Lo specific lorn I climatic. geographic and 
topogruphic conditions. California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of the 
dty or county \Vhcre the ordinance will apply to ratify. modify or deny the adopted ordinance. The DOS must 
also ddegalc enl"orcemcnt of the ordinance ro eilht:'r 1hc Fire I )isrrict ( or its rcpre~cnlative) or the Chief Builtling 
Official. 

fherelore. we request the County Hoard of Supervisors ratilY Ordinance ~o. :?019-0 I with amendments to the 
.2019 Cali lomia Fire Code. and dekgale the t·nforccment of that Ortlinancc to the Mosquito Fire Protection 
District Chief. ;\ proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for your rcvil!w and usc on this topic. 

This resnlution has no direct liscal impact to the County. 

fah.,urd Dwyer 
rirl! Chiel' 

ATTACHMENTS: 

I. Mf PD Ordinuncc No. 2019-0 I 
, MFPD Finding of Fact Resolution No. 19-06 
.t Draft El Dorado County BOS Resolution 

----------- - - - - -- 20-0203 K Page 3 of 40 



Attachment No. 1 

Mosquito Fire Protection District 

Ordinance No. 2019-01 

20-0203 K Page 4 of 40 



MO ,QIJITO F1RE PROTECHON ISTRJ 

ORDINANCE NO. 101 ~01 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS Of rnE MO"QUTTO FIRE 

PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS: 

An ordinM« oft'hc Mosqui10 Fi~ Protection Disnict {MFPD) adopti ng the 2019 Edition ufth~ California 

FIN C~ incorponuing the 2018 Edition of the lntermJJional F,,.., Crx./c , n:guh1ting i,nd g,) veming the safeguarding 

of life and property from fire and C'xplosion haznrds orising from the otomgc, handling and use o f hanrdoos 

subs n :e-s. mtt'.(riab and devices, and from conditi II h11U1rclous to tlfa or property in the occupancy of building,;; 

end pr-cmi i in the MfPD; p-roviding for the i.uu.nnce of pcmn it:s and col lootlon of fees therefor; Re1Ml11.ling Ordinance 

No. 2016, of the MF PD and aH other ordinan · tnd pem of rhc rdiruincus in conflict therewith. 

8c it ORD,\lNED by the Board of Directors oi the MJrD, I o known ns the Mo~quito Fire Protection 

District 

section I : FINDINGS OF FACTS 

cc1ion J : LO<;AL AMENDMENTS 

Section 4: CONFLICT 

Section 5: SEVERABIUn· 

Section ti: EFFECTIVE DA1'E. AND PUBU ~TLO~ 

Sf,C'J'10N I: FlNl>lNGS OF' FACTS 

The MFPD makes certain changes ( Ii. ted below) 10 the Cal/fornia Fin Cod , 20 19 Edition, pursuant to 

H'Mlth & Soff!ty Code Sections I 3869. 7, J79SIJ , 7 and J8()4 J . .5 during I.hi · code adoJltion process. Such chtnges 

lll'e n«esSc1lfY because of local climatic, geolt1gical nnd/or fOf)Ognl('lhi~ I conditions. The MFPO hes adopted, 

pursUJ1111 to Section /8941.S of the Califomia fl a/th 6 Stiftiry Cod, , die findings of facts relative to th 

conditions by Reaolutioo #2019 .. 06 orthi! MFPV dated Nonmber 14 , 1019. 

The MFPD ador; the 20 19 C.:1/iforniD Fin Coth, '111/e 24, Part 9, in lea entirety. including Appendices, 

inc.orporatmg those scctims of the l1t1i!m ttonol Fl~ C()d, , 2018 edition not adopted ~y the state. with the 

exclusions Jis~ below: 

20-0203 K Page 5 of 40 



b.clusions: tOS.6.17-105.6.19, 105.639, )08.14. 309, JI I 5, JI I .6, 118, 4031, 40l2.1·,UH 24 . .&OJ.1, 

40H, 403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8. 1-403.8 1.7), 403 9, 40)10.2, 403,I O ). 401 11, 4()) 12, 404 1-404.4, 

405.t-405.4. 40S.6-40S.9, 406, 1105-807 (1d09fing 107.5.2), IOI, 90C. LI, I IOI, 1103.1, I IOlJ-1103 6, t 103.9 

(adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.lO, 1104-1106. Chapter 25, Chapter 26, lhe u"phons under D104 2 cucq,hon). 

0106.1 (Exception), Dl07.1 (Exception), Appcndill A, Appc:ndil!. f., .\ppent.1111 F. Appcnd111 G, Appendu, J, 

Appendix K. Appendix L, Appendix M. 

Append ice; not adopted c:an be used for reference in cnfon:mg other ~t,onJ of the 2019 CiJlifomia FiN 

COth 

SF.CTION 3: LOCAL AMEND~IENTS 

The following Sec:tioru ~ hercb} amended or added: 

Chapter l 

StsU,1101 Scopt •14 Genrat 8eA1tna11h 
IOI.I Title shall be amended as follow,: M,11qu1to flry l'rottc:ticm LJi.urlr.t /MFPDJ 

SKJl9• l05 ''"''" 
105.6J7 LPG-IN shall be amended as follows Add to 1~ uception Al or abo,ie S,000 feel of 

elevation,• J)fffflit is not ~uin,d for individual cootaincn with a I 25·M•llon water capacity or leas, or 

multiple container s~stcm, having an •1urregatc quantity not excN!dinij l 2S R,tllons ierving occupancies 

in Group R-J 

Secliop 106 F,a 
106.6 Ptnett, PIH Reylcw 91d l11mtio1 fm shall be addcKJ as follt)W\ A JcM:iaJt of fe'-J odop,td 

by IM di.strkt board of dirf'c/Or.t for pJatt rrvirw, 1,uptt1io,u <Md t>w iu W(.ftCf' of {N1'1fltU by 1lw di.srrict 

."90)' ~fo,md in t>w MO.st°''""' dutri,-1 fer JClwdtJt rJ/ralth & Safe~}' C<Xk J 195 /J. 

106,6.1 Cpll B,coycn Fm shall be added as followi, FilY 1rrvict frt!. Ma)' b, cltargN to a.I)' ptrs011. 

ft""- rorpol"Ofion or husintu t"°1 tltrolll(h Mglil(flftCY, -.i10Ju11on of tlw law, or C2J a result of carTlas~. 

u nJpalUthlr for /Jw emu, of tlw dutricl to nspond to tlttt JCf'ltf' of Oft incll#nl. A di.strkt board llllQ)' 

cltargr a /ff IO cow, tlw cost of all)' Sf'f"YIC# -..lticlt tlw dutrict pro11idts or 1Jw cost of tnforciltg a,ry 

IYpollO#f far wlticlt tlw fa• u c~ ( HN/tlt d Saf-ty COM I 3916) 11w /tt sltoll l'IOI ucttd tlw 

achlal cost of 111pp'YS.Sllfj IN Jin Oltdlor fflpo,tdi"lf IO llw sec"« of a incitk,,t. 

106.7 Mel1teft1Utc , ... shall be added as fol10W1· Wlw,, 0 tut or itUp«tiOJt is sc'lttdtdtd, """',,. 

,:OltlP'OCIOr foiiJ to p,ufon,t to tlw sotufacttolt of tlw atllltorlly ltaviltg jlll'isdktion (AJU). llw AIU MO)' 

bill tlw COl'llrOClor far actwo/ ,,,,., Jf#'fl trawlilfR ro a,,d fro'" t>w usllinsp«tiOII location <Md tlw ,,,,.,. 

1pe1t1 ot tlw trJc/buptttiolf .,,. as wit as °"""1tutra11w costs. 

20-0203 K Page 6 of 40 



§esttop 109 Board o(AppgJt 

S«tlop 109.4 A.V.m1 Proctd•m ewl JtmsM•• shall be added as follov.s: Any person or tllli/y who 

~/ieves thtey may be tJdwrsttlY ajfec1e.J h.v a" ordv, tkdsio11. or tkterPftinatiOlt lftDM by the firt code 

ojf1eial throMKh a wrillen 11011c« may ~al tlw matter within 15 cale,idar day, of tlw postmark on tlw 

nollcd All Juel, appeal., .JltaJI be .filed in wrlllflg w111t tlw Secretary of tM Gove ming Board for tlttt 

district. A limely OJIIWOI slta/1 stay farther octiOlf hy tlw frrt code off,cial 1111il the matter is chterm1Md 

by tht Appeal Board a.t oull,ned ,n Section /09.2, MIiie" lite tssw posts an immintfll fire or life safe/}' 

hazard to memberJ of IM pub/Jc. TIN firt code o_tf,cla/ shall notify lM appel/Qlfl by certified mm/ of tlw 

dale and tlni« of such lwar,ng. The IH!armg shall be scheduled 10 take place no .Jooner titan }Q calendar 

dd)/1 from tlN date shown on tlN cerlified maU. The appellanl shall lra>ie tlte right lo app,ar in penOII 

or by agent al 1Jw lt1arJng a"'1 present oral, wrilttn and/or photographic evuience to tlte Appeal Board. 

Stcdot 110 Viof!1ioa1 
110,4 Ylofltio1 Prgltjp shall be amended as follows: Persons who shall violate I provision of this 

code or shaJI fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect. install, alter, n:pair 

or do worir; in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code oftk:ial, or 

of I pcnnit or certificate used under proYisions of this code, .shall be guilty of I mudt~anor or 

infr,cr11on. at the ducretiott of tlw pmsttMling attorney or agttncy, punishable by a fine not exceeding 

SI 00 00 for a firll violaflon. 2 .. 4 Jine 1tOI uutding S50/J. 00for a .1e1.·ond violation of t>N .,am• provuton 

-.ul,i,, Ofte )l'lar, 3 .• 4 fine nor eiceeding S /()()(). 00 for each additto,,al v1olali01t of tlw samt pro11is1on 

wiJltin OM ~or. or by imprisonment not exceeding /80 days, or both such fine and imprisonmenl. fAch 

day that a Yiolation continue-. after due nO(icc has been JCNed !hall be deemed a scparale offense. 

( Health & Saftry Code ~clio,u 131'5 Oltd J 7995). 

l 10,4.l Citadom shall be added as follows: 71w Fl,.. Chief, or hi.sl"lwr dllly awltorizitd rtprttsentativ.t. 

ntQ)' ww citations for infractiON or misdtmNttOr violation.s of tltu code pt,rJIIClltl to ~ctio,r I J87 I of 

the H•alth &: Safety Code oft~ Slat1 of California Q1I(} Cltapttr Jc (c0111tMttncmg wttlt &ct tun 85) 6) of 

Title 3 of Parr 2 of 1he Ptnal Code of tiff State of Cali/onua 

Secttop 111 Stop Work Order 
112.4. Fallue to Comply shall be amended as follows: Any penon who shall continue any woric after 

having been served with a stop-work order, c,u:cpc such wort u that penon is diroctcd to perfonn to 

remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be p111tultab/e by a /111« or ,,,.,,,uon,w,u or holli as 

descrlbtd In StctiOII / IQ. 4 (Hwallh cl Sa/tty Cod- s,c1ioru I J 145 Oltd I 799J). 

.. 20-0203 K Page 7 of 40 



Chapter l 

Setljog 201 Gegenl Deftnitiom 

Add definition for Campfire - Shall mean afire which is ,uedjor ndmg, ~'1mkll wom11h. lighting, 

or aesthetic purpa1es. '/1,i.s i,,clwies fins contained within outdoor fireplaces ONi enc/rued sto~s wUlt 

/lut1s or chimneys, .rtov~ using jellied, liquid. or solid fi«ls, portahlt barb«w pits, braziers, or space 

lreaJing devices which are wed outside of any structu~. mobile homt. or ~ living acco,nmodation 

mounted on a vehicle. 

Add definition for Diltrict -Shall mean the dLJtricJ and all otlwr artas within r>w e:ctuior bollltdaries 

tlttereo/ now or hereafter established. 

Add definition for Drtyeway - Shall nwan a vehicular occes:1 that serv«s no more than two bulidmgs, 

witJr no MOr-t than tlrrtt dwe/linf? unil.J on a .singlt parcel, and ~Y number of accusory buildings. 

Add definition for EK«•dn Bod)'. · Shall nwan th, Board of Directon of tht Dutrict. 

Add definition fOf tJn Cll)t( - Sholl ~Ol1 thit Chief £.recutiw Flu Officer of IM Firt! 

departnt1tn1/dutrict .serving the j11ri..1diction or CJ duly aulliori:ed repre.untutilll!. 

Add definition for Jrags,1 Cam:d MtHISt - Shall m•arr :r1u,,Jby JWrsonnel, wuaNy a ucurity guard 

or JI.flt.tr JWrsonneJ. who an traintti in tht pro~r procedure to t:til pt!oplt from a tent or 0th.tr place of 

public tllJtmblage in a,r orderly and calm fa.Jhion in tlw t'tllffll of an emergency 

Chapter 3 

SUUoa 301 QdllWOH 
302,l Defmitiop shall be amended u followi: Added Campfi~ definition, as shown above in 

Chapter 2, 

Sectioo JQ7 Opea Bllnlaa, Recn,doul tJm, aad Q1tdoor FlnPlfcn 
307.4.4 Campfire RntrjcdoPt shall be added as follow~: 

307,4,4,1 his unlawfal far any pt!rson to liglrl, maintain, or use a campfire wpon ~ near all)' brwJt.. 

co~red land, grass-covered land, or fimm-cowred latd durittR IM time whtn burning ~mits an 

napmded by 1Jw Dinxtor of 1>. l:Hpartm,ml of Fore.my and Fire Protection. the CAL FIRE Unit Chief, 

ort>w A/£/_ 

bcqdott: Commercial cooking o~ration.r with approval of tlw AIU, 

307,4,4J IJ?wn ca'"Pftrys an allowed, it should bt unluwfal for any ~rson to ligN, maintain, or w.s, a 

ca,npfirr upon any brvsh-cowred /Oltd. gra.u-cowred /Oltd, or fore.fl-cowN!d land 10tlur thtfollowing 

"'°';"'""' ~uiremtltU an compli«J with. 

307,4,4.l (•} 71w 01'fO wtthht J fatt of the ,wriphery.· ofthit campfire is cleared of all flamtnable material 

and wgt'laliOlf. 

20-0203 K Page 8 of 40 



J07,:f,:fJ ib) OM unr1ekJb/111towJ w111t a hatdl, of at 11ml 11 iltcltts Lf fTCll:l}·fo, MJf a, tltt u,tmirdiot~ 

ar,a <f tlw ca,,,pfi,.. 

J07.:f.fJ (c) Ca""f)fi,Y,r sltoll ~ ""'"~ ,o a J fool by I /oot ana.. llltl,u 111 c:.i approwd MOn,!ac~d 

..:~"'K d.11ic, or jffT r111g. 

JO!.:f,:fJ (d} Wr111111 !'fl'"''" fon o/ t>Ht laltdowMr 1,11u1 ~ oh1ai11fii prior to tJw il('tlllOII of tlw ca"'PfiN' 

and shaJI I>. o,r Ju, 

Claaptn 5 

Scgjoa 50J fin AIPIAN Amp R99d1 

SOJJ,1 Plwwu shall be amend,d ... followi: fire apparatus access roads shall have an uoohlitnicted 

~idth of noc Ins than 20 feet, cxclu,1ve of shoul~r'§. as fMt.JSMnd from Jae, of cwb to foe, of cwb, 

ucept fa appro11ed sccurit) gates in accordaJ1~ with Scc1ion SOJ.6, and unobstructed vertical clearanc~ 

of noc leas than 1 j /ttt All drillff•a)'., '" tlw dtstr1ct s1tall not bt /1sJ titan 12 fat1t wi~. 

,oJJ,5 0,1d £t4t shall be amended M folio~~ l>eaJ-cnJ fin: appantu, acceu l'06dt Oltd driw:~ays 

in exces., of I SO fffl in lfflgth shall be pro11ided with an approved area for turning around fire 1ppan1us 

50J.1.6 BddtM IN Dn:allld S.rfacw sh.Ill be amended as follows; Where• bridge or an elcva1cJ 

surface: ~ p&rt of a ftte app.ntus acccu road, the bridge snall be constructed and maintained in 

accordance w/tlt tltt C1lrtt1tl El Dorado ColOII\I T rwuportalion Division Bridg, Standard or Apf)*ndix 

D uf tit« c11rn,,, California Fi IT Codt, wh,dtt~'t!r is moN "stricttw. Bridges and elt\rated surfaces shall 

be: designed for a li\re load ~umc,enl 10 carry the: imposed lo.ds of fin: appuatus. Vehicle load limits 

shall be posted at both enlTlnces to bndges when required by the Fi~ Code Official. Where clc:vate(J 

surfaces designed for emergency \/chicle use arc adJ•~nt to surfaces which a.re no( designed for .such 

use, approved barr~rs. approved signs, or bod! shall be in1tallcd and mainta11\C'd when n:,qu1rcd b}' the 

fire code official 

!IGJ,4.l Ny t!r:WII lg FhJ Lya ihlll be added u follow~ No ptnon sltoll .11op par*. or /raw 

l"(andi,ig a,iy llf!h1cl~. w>wtlw!r 011tmit:d or UIWIIM,itd, uctpl ltl#vn ntctU°".l' IO aw:>id colfjl1c1 w11I, oliwr 

traffic or m cornpli07lct! with t>w dirtoiont of rlw Fin Chitf or huilwr Jwy 11111/torurJ rt1""ttntati1't', 

Pton O{fictr or official traffic c01tlrol rh11K't a/on~ tht tdgt1 of~ hi1tlr-...i> a1 any orb. or ,,, Cllt)' 

location in a p,,,blic(11 M pri\llCJ/ny owfltd or ~rotd off·strut parfotKfa>:dlfy. JtJ1,t"'1Ud ma fin /Oltl 

by llw dutrtct w11Jt J11Tisdict1o,r owr t>w ano in wlud, tltt place u locat,d TJw dlJ1pat101t shall ~ 

urdicaud (Ii by a S(p posud 1M1Md1auly adJ0t.·111110, aNi 11tslhlt1 from, tlw ihs,p,atftt pla,.·1 cltarl) 

flatutg '" /tarn "°' /us 1Jto,, o,w r,w:>t A'I >tt1gltl titul tlw p/act u afir¥ la,w. (21 by 0111/uting or pautllltK 

tltt ~., r,d 01td, 111 contrwlllt)( color, 1"1'rii1tR tltt pl'1Ct wtth tlw w,c,,ds "FIRE. l,(N£", wlflclt an 

drarry vi.rih/1 fro,,e a wlticlt. or I J) try a r,d orb or ,.d pain/ on tlw hl1ftl of tlw roadw,ay lf)C)fl IIIINt:lt 

i.J cltclrl)· lfltDTW Litt wonn "FIJI.£ LANt" 

20-0203 K Page 9 of 40 



503.4.J No Parkla1 ia t·roat or Htdr1at1 sh.all be added as follows: No ~rson shall stop, part or 

lttaw standing an)' whiclt within J 5 jut of afire hydmr,t except <Ujollows: (a} Iftlw vehicle is ammded 

by a /iunud dri~r who is seat.td in IM front seal and who can immedialely mo\le such whiclt in cau 

of n«t3.Sily. fb) 1/ tlw ~hkle iJ owned or operaJed by a.fin defXlrtment and is clearly marl:ed a1 a fiN!. 

tkpart,wnt wltlde. 

~.4.4 fire LaH1 BaJCd OIi Road Width shall be added as follows: Fire laJ1tts shall 1¥ baJtd on rood 

width as rTqUirtd in Ap~ndu. D as amended by IM di.strict 

50J.5.3 fl(! Ap•ra&us Accas Gata shall be added as follows: All auromatic and manual gat•.t 

i,utallftl o~r fin apparolus aca.ss roads sltall comply willr t>w district gate standard as approved by 

tlw fin code official_ 

Sectlol 505 Prepabe ldegtiftaatjoa 
505.1 Add,ua ldealifkatioa shall have the first line ofth1s parafll'Ph •mt:ndcd u follow,: Addnssf!s 

for MW c,td a:i.sling buildings shoJI CO'"{Jly with t~ di:Jtrict aJd,yss standard aJ approwd by th, fin 

cOtk official 

SutiOI S07 fJR Proltttiot Wa1er SuppUp 

507.5.l W)m:e B,q,;nd sh.all be amended u follow,· 400 feec shall be amended to J 50 fad. 

Cltapttt 9 

SesUot m Ect Spd•W!a 
903.l WMn Reqund shall be amended~ follows: An approved automatic sprinkler sy,~m slta/J b. 

rtqutrwl Oltd i,uta/J«J in lteW buildings cwJ stn«:turu 3600 tqUQI'(' fwt or gnuter wlwn CQIIJlnlCIN or 

f'f!locatrd wiflti1t tltit j11rudiction w dna-ibed in Section\ 90) 21 through 9032_ I 2. 

E•ce,doa: Agricultw.1 hu11dingJ not under• special use pennit uied for commercial purposes. 

903.l.a Wltcn 8tAwml shall be added u follows s,anu of ui.sti,eg buildings g,wuer titan 1.600 

sqlKU'lt _/Nt. In uisting h11ildlng1 J,600 sq11t:1n feet or gr,oter. ollwr tlratt OM 01ltd rwo:fa,,.ily rlwelling 

wnits, a7td ugriculhlral but/dings l"IOi wtder sp«"21 Nft ptnrtil ~ comtfftt'C,a/ pwrpos1ts. wlttrt tJw floor 

ana oftlw building or JIMICIIIIY u tncrtaud b,Y an addmo,, of 1"0l"t tlratt tluny ptr«nl ( JO%) or 1,000 

sqa,art fatt wlticlwtwr is less. sl/!Clt buildinl( or Jlnicl'I,,,.. slto/1 b. fftDlk to COit/om, to Stttion ~1. 2. 

903.l,b Wben Rta•tml shall be added as follows: Stallil of ui..rtiltg blli/diltgs uss dta,, J,600 sq11an 

fnt. In t.risting h11ildi11JP J, 600 squar, '"'or''"· "'""' tlratt OM-attd rwo-Ja,,,ily dwllurx 111tils, Qltd 

agricultural bMlldbtgl nOl und1r JPICiaJ .,.,, ~rmit for comMercioJ pwpos,s. wlwt-t tltt floor ana of tlw 

b11lldl1tg or slnlelurt is inc,..asftl to a tOlal sqvon ~ owr J, 600 sqlO'f ffft. by mt addltiOlt of 

1'tOIT titan tltil'1y ptrct!nl (JO%) or J, ()()() sqwart jwt, wltidw~r LI le.s.s . .rvd b11ilding or stn,,cn,n sltall 

b. fftOM 10 cOlifo"" 10 Section POJ 1. 

20-0203 K Page 1 O of 40 



90J,l,1 Grp1p A shall be amended as follo...,.s for A grou~ A-1 through A-4: 903.2.1.1 (I) Tho fire aroa 

e"ceeds J. 600 sqwzr, fut. 

903,2.3 G[Olp I shall be amended as follows: 90) 2.3 (I) Throughout all Group E fire area.1 gre.11er 

than J,600 sqwan fr~, in ara. 

903,2,4 Gm,1 F-1 shall be amended a., follov.-s: 903.2.4 Group F. 903.24 (I) A Group F fire area 

eitceeds J 1 60() sq110re feet. 

903,2,7 Gropp M shall be amended as follows: 90J. 2, 7 (iroup B and M. 903. 2, 7 (I) A Group B and M 

fire area ucccds J,600 sqlliln fa,r. 

90J.l.8J M1111lst1nd Huan shall be added u follo~s: A" ulllomalic fir. spri,ik.Jer .(V.Utm 1ha/l ~ 

rt.q"ittd in all MW manufoc1"~d ltomc.s and m,J11~fami/y ma,u,j.x111nd howwJ mknt:kd fer kf« as a 

one-and rwo-family dwtlling. 11w dtJIK'f and 11Utalla1ion of such J)''''nu slta/1 ~ i1I accof'danc, with 

California Codt of luplatio,u, Tit/1 ] .5, fl JOO. 

E.rttptlo,u: 

I. J/amljactt1ffii ~J 101.:al#d within an t.:culrng mobilt ltomt parlr: complylnll with 

California Htalth and Sa/try Codt. Df\JiJi<Jlt JJ. Pun l l or} J 

l. Man11fac111rrd ltomts ,Ital do not UCttd 1,100 sqllll:ln [HI in sin and Jtl"JI as "' 

acc1s.1ury dwtllinR ""''· w d-_(i,.b/ in Gown,~111 Codt. S.ction 6585/)1; wlwn Utlt 

ext.tting primary "Jilknu o,i 1>,,, prop«rry iJ "°' Ml"irrd to comply witlt Ca/ifomia 

Rukltnllal Cad11 Stctilm RJ I J.l. 

J Manu/tXtu~d ltnmls t1tat do "°' ,xc,,d 110 squar« ft1t in .J izt 

903.219 Groyp S:l shall be amended as follow,; 903.2 9 Group S. 903 2.9 (1) A Group S fire area 

uceeds J,600 ,tq1UJre /•ti, 

90J.l,l0 Group S:l Egclo,sd P1rld91 G1CMR shall be amended u follo.,.,'5: 9032. IO (I) Where the 

fire area of the enclosed parl(ing garage exceeds J,600 :squan fut. 

ScsOoa 201 fla Alarm 11d Qs1eclioa SYfJW• 
,0:ZJ,1 Wtern 8111111,sd - New BIUdhm or Structures lea daaa J.600 !tMR feet shall be added 

u follows: An approwdjirr a/ann!dttt«:tion systt!m shall be in.slalltd in all buildings with a floor ano 

ltJ.J titan 3,600 squart fett, 

bcq,tlo,u: 

4 a,,,. and IWo-/amily dtwllings (R-3 Occlll"'lfcies and otlwr OCCM{)Oltcies classifitd as 

'U"), 

J Agri'-,JhlrrJI lu,ildingJ "°' wttkr v~cia/ W't permit and/or no1 t1Sed for CQ#fllfWr(ia/ 

p11,prut:s (t,g .. ntaiLs salts.food strvice, Olldlor speck1/ twl'lls), 

20-0203 K Page 11 of 40 



6. Buildings will, a floor ana I~ titan .50() sq~ Jitd 1'11:1)' bit r.xit,npi, a.s dlftitnninitd by 

tM Fin Cltitf. or h/5/'Jwr dulyawhorirtd ritprtuntlllii'(', bastd o,r bu,IJinR cO#t.Struction 

material and features, /oeatiOff, oecuponq fy/H, <md dutana to upruu~.t. 

907.2,b St•••• of £Iistiu B•Udiap shall be added as follo~!'i~ In t.ti..rtrng bMild,ngs wltholll tJPt 

appr,:,wd automatic lprmJc/tr .fyJttm, Ollwr than OM· or rwo--fam,/y dtwlling unia, agr,cultural building 

not undtr special wst permit for commercial purpost.t whtrt aftrt al""'1 d,uction J.,_ftlf"' dorJ nOI ubt 

and t~ floor orta of IM building or structure i.l incnar,d or MO<lifltd by mott titan tltlrty percitnt ()(}%, 

or J,000 sqllattjHt, wh,cht\!tr i.s ltss, such building or .ttructun shall bt ~ to conform to &ction 

907 wM1t requind by t~ Firt Chief, or ltl.t!lttr duly awhori1itcl ttprt>untatiYr Buildmgs witl, a floor 

ona lts.s that 500 square fed May~ tu,npt, ar dttmnined by tlN Fil"lf Chief. or Ju.r/1wr d&Jy OtJtltoriud 

rrprtsitnlatiw, ba.sitd on building construction matuial.J a!'fd /tOIWYs, loca111m. o,:cupancy ~. aNi 

dutancit to e;q,osurrs 

907.l.c Moghorig shall be added a., follows: All fin alarmldttteclion :fy:fttnu shall ~ cQMitcled 

J,recrly 1hro11glt Oltd ,nonitond by a U.l IJ{)pro'lf!d ctnlral, proprittary or NUltOlit &talion urvict, which 

gives audible Oltd Yisva/ .11gnal.t al a co,ulanll>· auenditd location. A/J .rprinicJt"d buildings shall be 

monilorrd. 

EzuptJo,u.· 

7. ~- Oltd two-family dwr//111is (R-3 O,.:cupandtJ Oltd olMr occwpancies da.ssified cu 

.. U'') 

8. Agricultvral bwldingJ not UNNr r~ctal Wit ~mut {at()ior "°' MSlfd far comtMrciaJ 

purpru6 (t.g., ntail.r solo, food urvtct. and/or Jp,rciaJ (\<enl.Ji .. 

907,2.d J~m I Hood l1t&1UIU011 shall be added as follows 71w ,vqwirtmettt if installa1i011, or 

replaament. of a Typ,t I Hood SyJte,n shall reqw,~ a fin a/(lffll'sp,in*.ltr lfk>nitoring sy.rum to be 

in.stalled, Ot' for tlw hood sym:m Iv bt connrcttd lo m r.riHinR Jirt alann!spr1n!Jtr lflW)lfitoring zystt,,. 

for that building. 

90716,l,l Sttopdan Powtr Supply sh&ll be added u follows In c,cconJa,,u with NFPA 71. tlw 

Jtcondary pow«r SM(Jp/y pro,;k/ing a ,ninlmw,e 14-ltour powtr capuciry lllkkr q"it.sant load (system 

op,trating in a nOfl-alann condition) shall bt atMndt>d to a minimu,n ll-ltour po.wr capacity 

lixuptio,,: Tht txiflttnce of an t1"'1'gttncy hud:-11p powttr l"J)ply that JMtU OI' ar::ud tlwt 

rtqltirt1rttrw of California Flrt Codt Chap/tr J 1, 

Chapter 12 

Sectta 1283 &nsmm ,n statA, Powu srnw 

20-0203 K Page 12 of 40 



UOJ,l.J IUlfMlll91 ,hall be amended M follows: Emergency power systems and standby power 

systemi shall be installed in accordance with the Califom111 8uilding Code, the California Electric Code, 

NFPA 110 and l'-itPA l 1 l. All buildings. olMrtltan ~- mtdrwo-jamily dwellillg 11nits. andagriciJtW'Ol 

b11ildingJ nol usttd fer com~rcwl pwpostts, 'willt stllltdb>· potwr. shall haw. a slnml lrlp dttvKtt dtat 

di.scOIUfects all power solll"Cts to IM 1!11ilding. approved by IN fin code ojf1dal. Exi.!ting in.srallatiON 

shaJJ ~ moln1aint1d in "'-·cordanctt with tM original appro'llal 

Cbaptcr 33 

Section JJJO Accm for t'ltt01ht111 
JJ 10.J P!!mlff ldt1lllk1doa shall be added M follows~ Prior to and during cOIIStrvction. (1lf approwd 

udd"ss sign shall be providrd al eacltfi" and emergency W!hicle OCCU$ road ttnlr}• imo IN projtcf. 

s«tjoa JJU Weter Supply for Fire ProtecUoD 

JJ U.1 Whea 1leg11ired shall be amended a., follows: Prior to combwtih/e malttria/..J arri'llinK on s11e. 

tltr jirt hydrant water system shall be iruta/led and maintained in continuow OJHralion J'ht! amv11111 of 

.,,.at,r f"fJplitd shall nwttt the nquired fire flow for tire project. 

C'8pt~r <49 

Sectk>e 4903 Plaas 
4903.l Wllere Reqllind shall be added as follow,: Thefire code official of tlw MFPD may rtquin 

dotlop1nttnl proJtClJ locat#d i1t Modttrou, High and Vtr')'--lligh Fir-tt Hazard &Yerity lon•s lo submit 

fin prolectiOlt pkm This pl01t 1haJI ht approved hy hOlh tlw flrt c~ official mtd the auJ!toriud 

rtpn1tnlati11e for tJw local C4L FIR£ Unit Chief (if loeuted ;,, tlw .\'mt• R#.spo,uibWn., .41-•a /SRA}) 

prior lo tlw rtconiing of tlwt fi,tol Map far tlwt project by tlw County of FJ Dorado. 

Sutioa ffllS Wiktlltt famsSioll hQdia coutructfct• 
4905.4 Roof Coutnc:tioa lteg•lre111Hta shall be added u follow1~ All n,w con.stNM:tion. indwi"'g 

additions. rtq11irts a Class A roof co-wrutg QI' wst1'1hly All rt-ro<>fi,,g req11i1Ys Cl<W A roof ,:o-wring 

or assembly as a minil'fflUPI. Re-roofing in actu of j()% of aft aiJttng JfrWIIU't willtin any oltt ~ 

~riod will necusitate tltat thl tllltrtt roof he a ClaJS A roof Wll'tnng or assembly ar a ,,.,,.;,,uuJt. Clau 

B or C fin r-tttardant rr.at#d Oltd OI' ltOll-lf'Nttd IW:>Od sltakl or sltinglt.t arf rtOI approwd as a l"()()j 

cowring mattrialfar Class A a.utllfbly. 

Cbapler SO 

StsdoD 5001 Gturat 

20-0203 K Page 13 of 40 



SIOl,7 U.bility for Damun shall be added as follows: Any damages or cost resMlting from rht 

cartltu ltand/J,rg. spUJ or di.scharg, of any ha:ardow mareriah shall co,utituenJ debt against any svch 

{HrJOfl, finrt or corporation caMSing s11elr spill or discha~. Thu dtbt is collectible by t!tt Fire Chief. or 

lruJ1tt-r dwJy a"'ltoru«i rtprts~nta1iw, In the same manMr at in tM <=Wt' of an obUgalfon unckr conlNC'I. 

apr,JS«i or 1Mp/tt!d. 

Cbapter 56 

s«tiop 5601 Geaenl 

5'01.l Permil Regwred shall be amended as follows: Permil3 shall be required as set forth in Section 

I 05 .6 and regulated in accordance with this section. Where aplasiws ~rmitJ an requl~d. thty shall 

b, isswd by tlw Firt Chief. or hi.s/her d,Jy muhorized repn.stnta,i~. and IM El Dorado Co1A11ly 

Sheriff's De~nt ff'here .finworlu permits an req11ind tlwy shaJJ b, uswd by the Firt Chief. or 

his/Mr dtdy m,thorized repnsmtatiw, and IM El Dorado Co11n1>· .Board of S"f"lrviJon. 

560l.l.l Docamulatioa shall be added as follows: 11w AHJ shall haw IM aV/hority to rtqw.st 

d~ltlaliOlt regarding aJJ asp«IJ of tlteF~orlu ~nfttation 

5'01.l.l Prvpric'lan lafonllaUoD shall be added as follow, n.· AIU will prol«I all proprietary 

info,.,,.ation. 

Chapter 57 

Sec;tioa 57Qi Stonct 
5704,2,9,6,l Logdou WMa Aboyt-Gropd l111Y IR ProltOdJd shall be amended as follows: 

Storage ofCIAM I and Class ll nammable liquids in abo\'t-·ground tanks outside ofbuildin81 is prohibited 

1111/e" approwd by t~ fl,y Chit!{, or lru,·Jtitr dwy aMtltorizro nprt.unJatiw WJwn ptt,.,,.11,nJ by t>w Fint 

Chittf. or h~r dM/y av1horiztd rtp"sentativ,. all abow grototd IQlll•(J) or wnJt 1,uta/JcJ1,o,u for 1>.t 

storage of Cla.u I. JI a, I/Jfla'"""1hle and combustiblt liquids s>tall co,,y,Jy witlt thost m,11lrt11tt11r.s c:u 

utfortlt by thf CaJifomia fln C<:>tk. 1'tt Califomia Firt Cotk slta/1 abo appl)- IO 11Utalla1io,u Ollwr 

tlttm motor wlticltfwl dis~,ui"8 1tatimu w>wn abow-growtd storap u ~irwl. 

s,stto• 5706 SPlsAII Qperadom 
5706.l,1,4 Loguop Wltsn Abon:Gro11d I•w I[! Pr:oNbl!!d s.haJI be amended IS follows: 

Stonge orCla.u I and Cius If nammablc liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited 

wtle.ss approwd by tlttt Flrt Cltief. or itt.s/J,udvly aulhoriznl l'Tpns•llflllllw. Wlwn ~rm,n«i byt>w Fin 

Chi•/. or lti.s/lwr d,Jy aMlltorizM "pnst11101ivt, all abow grototd tatltk(s) or WJW/1 iltstalla1fOIU fix IM 

sta,ua, of Cla.u I. II or Ill flam,nable and combustible /iq11kb sltoll COMply wiJlt tltou reqllirtlfWftO m 

Ht jonlt by tJw Ca/ifomia Fin Codt. 11w Callfomkl Flrt COth sltaJI obo opp/> ,o ill.Jlallotions odwr 

tltolt lltOIOI' wltkl• fwl diJ,:¥n.sing stations w,W,.. abow-grollltd JIO#"QP is f'Wf"lrwl. 

20-0203 K Page 14 of 40 



Cupr~r 58 

Stsswa aot fll•••bk cooa•k tJMlt 
51106J U9lbdou shall be 1menJcd.., folio~, Stonge offlammaMc .:f)ogrn11: nutds in ,tatlorw) 

.:ontainen outside of building5 i, prohihited ,..J,11 ,,ppr,m•J bv tJw Fi,, n,~f or ,w,>w, dvly 

tJU1hur,:t1d '"PTTJtlnlUIIW Wh.,,i IX""'""d by ,>w Fw Cltwf or ltul>wr d,,,1-, ulll>Hxunl IYp,TS<fflat~. 

all rtiJl,onar,,· conta,nttrJ for IM .mm.1Kt of _/lammahi,r l'l')'OK«'n,c _f1M1dr sltalJ comp~y ..,,,it tlto.u 

rtquinlrkntr .:u Jt1t forth b;,; tiw California Firrt Cod,r_ 11w ( .'ulifomta Fin Cod« Jlta/1 al.Jo app/)I to 

1,uta//at10,u otiwr lb """<>r ~}11clt1 JwJ Ji.Jpen.1tnK Jlat,o,u wlwr, abm·t1·Kro""J Jlorr:11(1! u rrq1111Yd 

Cbaptu61 

SUM HOi Los11io1 or Lf ·Gw coa11t110 
6104.l MtlHIMI CaptSjl} !!igig [ffabU.W Lball1 ,hall be amended u follow~. fhr stora~ of 

/lqwfi,rt.i IX''°'""'" gaJ m nc,M of ari agx,tl(at, of l 1Hl0-Kallon WQl,r cupcJt:1ry whtl" loca1,d al l1ast 

o,rt1-1tal/ (Ill) ,,11/t-fro"' prop,,,,, :c.wd or J.,1,J{.rttittd Jor nJ1Jt1nthll W• 01tlJ a, luur on,r-ha/f (/12) mile 

fro"' t.UJIIIIK res,drn11al Jn,.,rfOJ1""'-nl wil It a d«,uiry J(rcalu titan O'kt (I) dwlling 11t1il pu acre ON1 <Z 

least on,r-half (l/2) •ult .,""-"" c.111_11 lrOI,./ or ltWltl u ,J/lowtd w""" AJU approvnl, and a 

Jp«dalicunditional MJI' fX''"il u i.uwd by Ott Co1111f)· u/ El Dore1t.lo. 

/JtJp,,n.un,< within ,s1,1b/iJhrd l11'tilJ_ Wuhi11 thtl "'"'IJ e1tablultc.! h.11 law u1tricting tlw db~rsion of 

llqwfied pdroltum gaJ Jo, ,;,,, pmltdl<Jlt of ltitavily pupllialtci or cQlt~st«J areas. tlw <.1ggregatt 

capociry of any OM irulallation shall"°' un«J a watt1r capan~ of 1,000 gcJi/C)ft.f, T>w di.rpmsing of 

Jiqwfi,d p,,troltum ga, in uctJJ ofan ag;p"tKolt of l, 000-l(all°" wat•r capaciry wlwn loea1td 

at ltasl (Jflt·half (Ill) mik from prof)*rn· w,,rd or J1111}(""'"·' /or rtJ/J111111aJ MYf a,,J at lewf OM half 

(Ill) ,n/lt from exi.Jll"K ~ud,,,1111' d,...,loptMnt -../rh a J,.,.11() fl'l'Ulrr tb o,w (/) ,Jtffll/.11g wtil ptr 

acn and a l,wt ,,,,,..ltlJ/f ( Ill) ,,.,,, from .-.wy >tot,/ or IJfOltl u allo'4tJ ""It«" Ali/ opproYf!ti and a 

1pn:ialkond11ional 11..lt pemrit i.t i.uwd bv tJw. < ·ownl)· of El Dorado 

StsMR• H ll Pwlt t:ltt•sto• Ua11Qd Prseolt•• G• •uHlferiou ,,,ooo.r,oc dmw •td 
llmul shall be added u follows: 

6111,l BeolalOQ shill be added 1.1 follow~. 

f-..o-Jl(lJitl rtKMiator J)•1IU1 sJto// bt l#Ula//ftl Ill Oc:cordtJitU Witlt ,nanfljaclllrt!T rrq~~1flJ. 

T-wcr-Jt~t rrpiaJo, n.tt~"U .tltall b, tlUlaJJ~ °" oll LPG lrutaJlaliOM 

T1w ftrn JI• r,pJator slto/1 i. 11UtaJJrd t1111Hr tlw ltirt~d ga,;g, cowr s'll{)PIW willt tltt talk. n. 
OlflftOSplwric pru,tn aprmn of tlw fTp/ol()T ~I btt pomlN downward T1w flnl J'9 rq,,,Ja1or 

1holl I,, p1-1Hd to tit# ru,, o,f tltit yard piping witlt 10ft c~r hditng to allow jluihilil)· slw:>.Jd talfk 

20-0203 K Page 15 of 40 



shifting OCCW' 71w ruer_from tit# yard pipillg sltall be locOJtd rtOI mo~ titan J inches (horizontally) 

from tlw walls oft~ 1"'1. 

TM secONi st~ ~ator and ruer pipe shall be instaJ/td lllf<kr tht ~ oft~ building. a, clost as 

rmcticablt! to 11w bMJJdmR wall. 11tu ri.s,r sltaJ/ bf ucunly supportedlbractd to tltt! wall appro::imotely 

/0 ind~s ~low tlw regwalor so aJ to pnwnt b<trtding oftlw pipe by laluaJ snow/ice loads. 

A prolecliw cove,. approved by IM gas .tupplier and BMilding Official, sltoll M 111Stailtd owr IM suoltd 

stag. tYJCwlalor ""1 s«urtly sMppe>rled to tit, ground Ol' diagonally a:> tltt! wall_ 

n,, rl.s«r pipfll for tht yard piping sltaJJ 1fOI k emb<tdtied in concrete COltCnle placed arotmd n,ch 

ris•r slta/1 htt lwld bad al /ea.,l J inch from aJI sicks ef tlw pipe. 

At tlw tilftt of application for a,ry bMilding permir. whiclt invol~ t>tt inslallalion of"' LPG systtlff. tlw 

applicant sltaJI submit an LPG syste,n plot pla,, ill J copies (or digila/ly as PDF1, TM LPG plol pJa,, 

sltall in,:llltit!. bul not b<t lhni/«l ro. rlw ~ loea1ion, propo.stti 11N capadly in U.S. gal/o,u, rout, of 

yard piping. locaJion of tltt riser pipe at tltt building. p,op#rfy bo11ndarie1, a1'd an otllline of all 

~isting/propo.,ed buildings on tJw /or and a depiction ef tlw ~lint of any bt1ild1ng ro bt stipplied 

wit It l/'<J, Tltis sltall also bt forwarded to tlw appropriate fin districr to serw as a locator map i,r n,wn/ 

of"" emergency. 

location of tlw cmterline of LPG tanb shall b<t _per""1Mnt/y ,narted by 1lw KH of snmv stain. Olte al 

each end Such Jlah!s sltall be of sufficient height to 1M vLsihJe thrulllflr antidpaled lflatilnum snow <hpth 

« tlw respecriw loca1ion. /,utaJlation and maintenance of r~se sl'IOw stakes <.-'t 11w tYspo,uibihry of 

tlw LPG user 

Propane appliances and accessories shall not b. pennilted in any MW uu10Jlmwn below the Jlrsl /loor 

or billow grade. whicMW!r is ,non restrict/Vt!, 

6111,l Vertical Riser Plpig shall be added as follows; 

MinimMm of Sclred,,Je 80 · iron pipinJl,. 

71te rl.str shall bt witltill J inclwJ horizontal(Y of rlw teat*. 

Swurg ;Dints slta/l 1H installed above and btlow taN. JtrWI to provide Jo,- tlw tank moV1tmt11t (Sll'fet 

elbow.s sltall not b. tued). 

A listed ftnible ri:str co,1,11n«:ted of copJHr or stain/es1-stttl tMbing lJltd prol«led by .stet/ cuwred 

~lwd material ""'Y bf ldN in.Jttud of m-ingJoinu. 11w_/1e::ible oJtematiWJ shall provide sMfficienl 

slac* to a/Juw for ttaM lftOWmntl. 

6111,3 Mar1ftn qi Logdop shall be added u follows: 

A,r apf)f'OV'N s4g,, 1hdJ b, located dtm:tly abow tlw nnr slrt,t off Wliw °" tlw h11lldi11g In a vtslble 

I OC'OliOlt. 

11w ilqwfted pmoin,,, gm s11ppJier sltall aJJb a w.alMrproo/ ~1t1ljtca1KJ1t ta, 10 ,,._ iluidf of tlw tOl'lk 

Wllw prot«tiltg co"-r. T1tu ta, 1ltall cQlflailt tlw twpp/ier't INIIIW • e11WrplfCY t•/e~ """'btr. 

20-0203 K Page 16 of 40 



fonJt. i1utallo1ion 1/tt:Jil ~ p,mnanently marlc«i by a metal or wood material .tnow marker, wltli a 

"''"''""'" d1mtmion of 2 i~J by 1 incltu The ,t,row marker shall be of nljficient Might to r/Je abow 

1/w annlltJI Jnow chp1it and 1ha/l In a mimmum of JO fut in height. TM snow marJcen shall be painted 

)/It/low aNi Loc·u1ed on opposite endr of tlte tan/c_ 

Ssstiot 61 lJ Updt[lro•pd LPG Tagg lutalladoDI 11d Owpen_.p shall ~ added as follows: 

6113,1 Permill ud Plaas shall be added as follows: Permits sltoJI be requ,nw, and plans shall be 

111hminrdfor ail tmdergroMnd t01tk i1t.Staila1ions as approwd by tlttt AHJ 

61 l3J UICkr:v:o,pd LPG Tagk Qwoemip shall be added as follows: Undugrmm,J LPG taM.r 1hall 

h,e prohibited from ~mg sold to eltd-usen aNi 1hall ~ retained by rlw LPG compa11_t1 un<.kr a le.st­

~ S)'Sltm lo tl'IS~ p~r an1ti,a,/ matnt1u,anct rrquirelfttnts an !Ml and ~corrkd 

Cb•pter 80 

S«tioD 80, NfPA, UP:16 - Stapdprd (or ,,e llfJ!4l•tJoq o[Sprjpkler Sx,(19y jp 09t-1gd Twp 

Family Dwelliga aDd M111facttmt Ho!PA n •fPIICkd 90JJ,I.J, 90J.J,5 
NFPA 130, Amended S«dou u rotlo1n: 

Revise Secrioa S.1.1.l llD ...tt M follow,: 

Cfypter 8G. NFPA UD, S,1.1.l A suppl_~, of al lea.st OIM of ead, ~ and tr~ral-urt sprm•J,r uud 

withlff t~ p~m,us sltoll bt mom101rtrd 01t tiw p~rr,· al cm uppf•u,,.,d lon.111U1t Stock 1prinkltr:J shall 

~ ~pl a, a mo1111ttd rMd ac.·crn1blt c,Jbintt. 

R"iH Sedioa 1.6 11D r-.d • follow1: 

Cbpter 80. ~fPA JJD. 7.6 A local wour: flow aiar"" .1ltall M providtld °" all fi~ ,pmtlltr: _,_yrt~"'1' In 

ltomc.s al art approvtd lowtion on tiw eiltr:iur of tJw J.wll11t~ 

Rnbe Stttioa 11.l.l.l to r..d u roUo,n: 

C-geer 80. jllfPA IJD. ll.l,1,1 Where• fi"' Jcpamncnt pumper connection is not pro"i<lcd, the 

i;yslem shall be hydrostalie&II) tested 11 a mini"""" P"-Uwr of I 50 pounds p,,r 1q""" inch gaMgt for 

no 1-.s.r titan a JO-minMlc- duration without l'VU#l'IC't of le~ Swelt leJt Jltoll b.- wit1t<t1ud by tltt firr 

coch official 

Appeadl• B -Fire F1ow Requiremeab ror BuUdiap 

Jablt BIOS.I( U Bnvlml fin flow for Qn: yd Jwo:fwjly Pmllm, Group R-3. •• B~ 
B•lldlffl 91d Towpbopg shall be amended as follows for elc-~ion.s below 5.(XXJ Jttr. 

20-0203 K Page 17 of 40 



I~~:-··· ... --. .-- T~~~~-----~1· ~.; 
I C ,MU 
1 C.\LCll Sl"RIN ·. M 
i LATION 

KUR : HR 
ARI.A SYSTf.: i £.. 
(aqHrt 

feet) 

Cl -. 3,600 

I 

J.6()1 Ind 

&rater 

I '-' . n 
I 11>e11p 0 ~ 

Stae4• (pl 

rd) lo!H 

Nu 
tu!omali 

per 
ml• 

•••) 
1,00 

0 

v,111 
le 111 

hbJ 
e 
RIU 
). I ( 

2 ,I 

FLO 
.w 

OUR 
All 
ON 

I (llo• 
n) 

------··- -------

ion 1n 

Table 
BIO~. 
l(l} 
II th( 

requir 
ed 
!in:­
nu .. 
~ 

1·----- ----------------,----- -- ---·---
1 ~ 

I --------·-··---· 
I 

I J.601 ttK1 

:~ 
I 
[ 

I s«tiori 

I 9l)HI 
, J t1' lt.e 
! ,.JI, Fi~ 

! (w,c <JI 

i 5,ei:t ><Xi 
•Jl]Jol 

o.t CA 
',R~ 
..; CQ4t 

---·•--~ 

I:;; 
! ) ,,f ,,., 
fu, h~ 
I i !_~ (jf 

~lOII 

)Ill of 
die c.A 

Residen1 
lat Codi! 

1,1 

f nlu 
. ( -,( 

I hi,i 

'< 
l 810 

l. I( 

1) 
( .. ill 

J 

20-0203 K Page 18 of 40 



··- ·------~ 

.•.• l ·---~----

J•bl• B105.l Rg•ired ''" flow for 81ilcUpa otk[ die• o ... Hd two-family 
o-etllgg, Group R-J. •pd R...f B1ildhap and l'owpt,o..,n shall be amended as foUows: 

1'1''fOMA fl(' 
'jPRINkLER SYSTEM 

I MJNIMt 1M 1,ww 
FIRE-FLOW I DURATION 

(l>ettp Standard) (plloa1 per I 01o•n) 

________ ,_m_,_• __ ,ne_, __________ L_ _________ _ 
[ Durwtlon •I'! t lb 1c 

:kclk)l'I 90lJ, J I ol die C.11 Flrc 
Code 

Value LIi T abl~ 

Bl05.1(2) 

~ Ji-"" of tilt 

¥alue In Table 
8105.1(2)" 

! e10, 1m 

C>iirauo11 In hblt 
ftl01 J(:l) 11 11\«. 

~cod flow 1111t 
----------------------l------------------1-----

I ';octJof] \IOU 1-2 ()' thC' (' A Firt 

I c-Ook ro..t:, <Jp(;'!lfl .,., ,~°''OfllJ 
I NIO'W .', (N.){J-.f<,1.Jf ~1<-lfOIW"I) 

---- --------------------

~ .1(1% o(\h~ 

••lue in Tab1' 
B IOS.1(2) 

b. The rcidlKUI fllT flow shaft no: be !tm 1}1111 l .~00 gpm 

Appndls D - :tltt AppanlU Acuu Roads 

Ssstt91 QJIJ M1•tew SpedllcaUW 

DU111iot1 tn l lbk 

s10,.m, " lilt 
rcduo«l no ..... ,, 

ptOJ.I A.cceg R9!4 Wid,. 'fl'itlt • H)'.dml 51\11.1 he amcrn1o1 u t,,llow~. 1111,1,na tho exception! 

E.xrq,tion · Driw'!W7)'1 

D 103.l Grade shall be amended u follow,: Fire apswac"' IC-Ceti road, and rl"nw.yi snail not uoeed 

JJ,9'Ji i1t grQIN ""1rJJ approw.i b) tltt A}U c, ti) tit« !'I DomJo L'oMlll'\i a,,-.ttJhl tdlifu,,w flw,,lk 

Rrso11rn Co.h Titlr 1, / D,wg" ad l"'l"Owllfffll Sta,,danb Mt.11t11al 

~: Elr11CJ110,, ubow l.000 fa,_, s~l f!OI na•,I J l~. 

DllJ,J T•a,lgllfidl!f 1h1II bt uneoo.d • follows: The minimum 1umin1 nldh,111 st..Jl t,,. determined 

by the fire code official, tlltd Jltoll ltOI u,da.J, t:lri Oltd gwtr,. 

--------------·---~-~ 20-0203 K Page 19 of 40 



D103.S Fire Appantu, AcCffl Road G•tes shall be amended as follows: Subsection (1): Where a 

single gate i.s provided, the gate width :shall be no1 /e:,s than 20 feet (6096 mm), Where afln apparatus 

road comur:s of a divided roadway, the gate width shall not be less than 15 feet (4572 mm). 

Dl03.6.I Road• 10 to 29 feet I• wkldt shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as specified in 

Section D103.6 shall be posted on both side of fare apparatus access roads chat arc 20 to 29 feet wide 

(6096 to 8S34.4 mm). 

Excepdo,r: Elevatioru above 5,000 ft. as determined by the A JU. 

D103.6.l ao.d1 more tJIH 29 feet io Wkltb shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as specified 

in Section DI 03.6 shall be posted on one side of tire apparatus access roads more than 29 feet wide 

(8S34.4 mm) and less th11116 feet wide (10972.8 mm). 

Exceplio,r: Elevations above J,000 ft. as determined by the AHJ. 

D104.4 Cin:um(eRplial Fin Appa[11UI Acga Roedl shall be added as follows: When required by 

the fire code official. a Jin apparatw access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirelJ,• of a 

structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle acceJs. 

SECTION 4: CONFLICT 

1llat Ordinance No. 2016--37 of che MFPO, and all other ordinances or pans of ordinances herewith are hereby 

repealed. 

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY 

[f any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or phrase of this code, or any 

application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not 

affect the remaining provisions of this code, which can be given effect without the invalid ponions and. therefore. 

such invalid portions arc declared to be severable, The MFPD hereby declares that it would have enacted this 

Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions. sentences, clauses or 

ph.rues irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid. 

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 
This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The MFPD Board Cleric. is directed to publish 

this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the District. In lieu of publication of the full text of the 

ordinance, a summary of the ordinance may be published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen ( l S) days after 

its passage and a certified copy shall be posted in the office of the MFPD pursuant to Got¥rnmtnt Codi s«tion 

369JJ(c) (I). 

20-0203 K Page 20 of 40 



The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the MFPD on October 17. 2019. and 

it was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the Ordinance to be read for the second time on 

November 14. 2019 and approved by the following vot1:: 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the MFPD this._ I 4th_day of __ November ___ .2019. 

AYES: Directors Barbara Mikel. Charles Schnell & Tatry· Warner 

NOES: Director William Buhnerkempe 

ABSENT: Director Kathy Pico 

ABSTAIN: -0-

Barbara Mikel. Board President 

ATTEST: 

Sharlyn Fields. Board Secretal) 

20-0203 K Page 21 of 40 



MQT&PIO 

Fire Code~ 
S1gr1f1ca11t 

WhJt Is the ChJrgc 7 Lccall1 a,bpted I SF',1 adooteu I 
Wh\ Is T•1ere a Lo::I ChJnge' 

change? Anirnded 

101.1 N Amend with the name of the jurisdiction locally adopted and amended Administrative need 

LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than 

Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate air and can easiy be trapped under a home, ii ign~ed it can 

105.6.27 y quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving locally adopted and amended 
lead to an explosion. At elevations above 5000 feet there is 

occupancies in Group R-3. an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire 
activily due to snow load. These tanks require additional 
attention. 

Adopting this section to allow for the a-eation and issuance 

106.6 N Add section locally created and adopted of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines 
pennits, ptan checks, and inspections as allowed in Health 
&Safety Code 17951. 

106.6.1 N Add section locally a-eated and adopted 
Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to 
the Fire Disbict. 

106.7 y Add section Locally a-eated and adopted 
Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspectioos by contractors. 

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District 
is added to read as follows: 
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines -The intent of this 
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an 

109.4 y Added section 109.4 locally adopted and amended ind"1vidual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals 
regarding an order, decision, or detennination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County of El Dorado's 
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals 
timeline. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 
Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that 
protects life and property. Fees have been updated to 

110.4 N 
portions that were nol completed by the SFM. It is 

Locally adopted and amended match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the 
better left to localities to determine the 
fees/penalties for their respective areas. District Attorney's Office. The change to the language to 

indude the term infractions. 

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s), 

110.4.2 N 
Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before 

Locally a-eated and adopted 
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 

but under a different number) violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health and Safety Code of the State of California and 
Chapter 5c (commencing with section 853.6) of TIUe 3 of 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 

112.4 N 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 

Locally adopted and amended 
All violations of the code have been consolidated under 

better left lo localities to determine the Section 110.4 to include the penalties for violations. 
fess/penalties for their respective areas. 

Added definitions for. Campfire, Driveway, District, 

202 N Added definitions for darity Locally a-eated and adopted Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd 
Manager. Definilion of campfire shall not include LPG or 
Propane fueled appliances. 

302.1 N Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for clarity 

307.4.4 through Due to the high fire danger that exists in El Dorado County 

307.4.4.2 (d) 
y Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally a-eated and adopted we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires 

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas. 

20-0203 K Page 22 of 40 



Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertieal 
clearance of 15 feet provides proper dearance for 
apparabJs lo pass under without damaging apparatus 
components. II also allows an extended time frame before 

503.2.1 N Changed vertical dearances to 15 feet and road 
Localiy adopted and amended 

having to reaJt the growth of the vegetation. Additional 

widths to 20 feet. 
height for vegetation dearances acts as an Increased buffer 
for the spread of fire. A road widlh of 20 feet exdusive of 

.I shoulders, as measured face of aJrb to face of curb is 
needed. These struclures can ba diffiaJlt to navigate with 
fire apparatus and should not be coonted in the total 
drivable road surface 

Added a specific section for R3's where ii allows the 
Fire apparatus require areas for turning around when 

503.2.5 N 
Fire Code and TiHe 14 Fire Safe Regulations lo 

Locally adopted and amended 
multiple vehides are on the scene of an emergency. This 

match as they require turnarounds for fire apparatus 
indudes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides 

access roads and driveways. 
better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum 
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendix D of the 

503.2.6 N Surfaces to slate and match El Dorado County Locally adopted and amended 
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be 

Transportation Division inslead of MSHTO HB-17. 
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an 
alternate means & methods that is not less restrictive than 
the Fire Code. 

503.4.2 N Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes Locally created and adopted 
This section dearly defines the 'No Parking in Fire Lanes' 
rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle Code. 

503.4.3 N 
Added section regarding no parking in front of 

Locally created and adopted 
This section dearly defines the 'No Parking in front of fire 

hydrants 
hydrants' rules and is consistent with the California Vehicie 
Code. 

503.4.4 N 
Added section regarding fire lanes based on road 

LocaAy created and adopted 
This section dearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D 

width as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire 
lanes. 

Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain Anows fire districts the authority to approve gates on 

503.5.3 N 
emergency access and consistency through all 

LocaUy aeated and adopted 
roadways based on the Disbicts gate standard, providing 

roadway gates in El Dorado County, refening to the the best possible emergency access to maintain fast 
gate standards adopted by the FPO's. response times. 

505.1 N 
Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of 

Locally adopted and amended 
Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing 

buildings based on the District's addressing standards. 

Added more conservative standard for the 
Commercial properties are required to inslall hydrants at 

507.5.1 N placement of hychnt and their relationship to LocaUy adopted and amended 
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150 

rommercial buildings 
feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in 
between). 

Due to the topographic, dimatic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system instaHation inaeased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2 N in new buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

greater within the district. to be inslaHed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to the topographic, dimatic. and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater 
of El Dorado County and their conbibuting factors to our 

903.2.a N 
than 3,600 squn feet to inslall sprinklers if they 

Locally aeated and adopted 
increased respon~ times, along with the fact that fires 

add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

structure, whichever is less. 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 

·. feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 

. spread . 

20-0203 K Page 23 of 40 



903.2.b 

903.2.1; 903.2.3, 
903.2.4, 903.2.7 

903.2.8.2 

903.2.9, 903.2.10 

907.2.a 

907.2.b 

907.2.c 

907.2.d 

907.6.2.1 

1203.1.3 

3310.3 

N 

N 

y 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

y 

. · .... · . 

N 

Adds occupant protection for existing buHdings less 
than 3,600 square feet to lnstaff sprinkle,s if they 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 
structure, whichever is less. 

. . . . ' . 

these sections were a-eat~ io give specific 
direction on the sprinkier requiremeiiis based on 
OCCl.ipancy end square footage . . •. . . 

·.· 

This section was a-ealed lo indude manufactured 
residential single family R-3 in the residential 
sprinkler program 

These sections were a-eated to give specific 
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on 
occupancy and square footage 

Added ocaJpant protection for fire alarms in 
buildings with a floor area less than 3,600, except 
R3, AG buildings not used for convnerciaf 
puiposes, and buildings with a floor area of less 
than 500 square feet as apprOlled by the fire code 
official. 

Added occupant protection for existing buildings 
without automatic sprinkler systems lo install a fire 
al81111 if they add more than 30% or 1,000 square 
feet to the structure, whichever is less. 

Added ocaJpant protection by stating all fire alarm 
detection systems installed shall be connected to a 
monitoring service that notifies the fire department 
upon activation and is installed per Section 907 of 
the fire code. 

Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood 
systems to be connected to a monitored fire alarm 
system when instaaed or replaced. 

Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply 
Modification 

Shuni bip l)OW9". safety devices . 
. ' ... • · .. · 

Address requiramenis for consiruction sites . 

Locally a-eated and adopted 

. . · .. 

Lcically adopted and amended 

Locally a-ealed and adopted 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally a-eated and adopted 

Locally aeated and adopted 

Locally created and adopted 

LocallYaeated and adopted 

Locally aeated and adopted 

Li>cally adopted and amended 

'· 

l.<icallY aeated and adl)ited 

Due lo the topographic, dimallc, and geographic condiUons 
d El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
inaeased response times, along with the fact that fires 
double in size each and eveiy minute, we require sprinkle,s 
lo be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spraad. 

Due to the topographic, diniatic, and geographic coilditions 
of El Dorado County and their conbibuting factors to our 
iilcielised response times, along with tlie fact that fires 
double in size each and 8V8I'/ minute, we require sprinkle,s 
io iie installed iri structures once they reach 3.600 square 
feiJi iii size as they relate to fire behavior and raie of 
spread> . 

Manufactured Homes - The intent of this code section is to 
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two 
family dwellings are consistent with the provisiais found in 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar 
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban 
interface have a heightened risll of rapid fire consumption 
due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The 
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a 
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated lo deaease this risk 
successfully in many California communities. 

Due lo the topographic, dimatic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
increased response times, along with the ract that fires 
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinkle,s 
lo be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate lo fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
allow public use and ensures Fire Depar1ment notification in 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
allow public use and ensures Fire Depar1menl notification in 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
the event of a fire or smoke. . . 

Provides proper emergency notiflcation for oca,pancies that 
alow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E 
safely related power outages. 

This section adds a Shunt Trip JlOW8,' shut off devices to 
ensure emergency power shut off dunng the use of back-ilp 
power suppli~ ·. . . . . ·. · .. 
Acktessing for construction sites is important to assist 
responding emergency crews. 

20-0203 K Page 24 of 40 



3312.1 N Water supplies at construction sites with 
Locally adopted and amended 

Water must be on site prior to combustible material being 
combustible materials on-site stored or vertical construction commencing. 

El Dorado County has a signiHcant fire danger throughout 
This section was created to indude Fire Protection 4903.1 y Locally created and adopted 

the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire 
Plan for all fire hazard seventy zones. Protection Plan due to dimatic, geological, and 

topographical conditions. 

This section darifies that within the boundaries of El Dorado 

4905.4 y Added a section to darify roof construction 
Locally created and adopted 

County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are 

requirements 
wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 
coveling or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be 
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly. 

Any damages or costs from negligent practices that 
Hazardous materials related incidents are cosUy to mitigate. 

5001.7 y cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally created and adopted 
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 

cost recovery fee. 
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the 
negligent parties. 

Added safety protection with pennits being issued 
Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and 

5601.2 N 
by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for 

Locally adopted and amended 
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of 

fireworks to approve them and have a dear understanding 

Supervisors for firewor1<s. 
of the applications they will be used for. 

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any 

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make 
documentation induding timing and proprietary information 

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 N available all requested documentation pertaining to Locally created and adopted 
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they 

the firework presentation 
deem necessary. This information is understood to be 
proprietary and will be protected by !he Fire Marshal as 
such. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5704.2.9.6, 1 N Established fimits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and aass II combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
SpedaVConditionat Use Permit from the County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5706.2.4.4 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid special 
operations in abov911round tanks. Requires AHJ approval 
and a SpeciaVConcfllional Use Permit from the County. 

Administrative need to add District name. Established limits 

5806.2 N 
Administrative addition of District name. 

as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable 

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code 
Locally adopted and amended Cryogenic fluids in stationary containl!IS. Requires AHJ 

approval and a SpeciaVCond1fional Use Permit ITOm the 
County. 

Established Rmits as required by the Fire Code Official for 

5806.2.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted and amended locally 
Flammable Cryogeillc fluids in stationary contai1181S. 
Requires AHJ approval and a SpeciaVCondilional Use 
Permit from the County. 

Establishes distances between LPG storage and 

Established Umits for LPG storage and dispensing 

dispensaries thal are directly related to safety for residential 

6104.2 N Localiy adopted and amended 
develc>pri,ents and high-density hotels, motel, apartments, 

near or a~acent to residential development 
etc. where a ~ease by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would 
have a high probablUty of injury, inhalation, or death. 
Requires AHJ approval and a SpeciaVConditional Use 
Permit from the County .. 

20-0203 K Page 25 of 40 



6112.1 

' 

6112.2 

6112.3 

6113.1 

6113.2 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 Section 

5.1.1.2 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 Section 7.6 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 Section 

11.2.1.1 

Appendix B: Table 
s1os:1(1) 

Appendii B: Table 
6105.2 

N 

'. 

N 

N 

N 

N 

y 

y 

y 

y 

N 

N 

Establishes propane regulator requirements for 
locations above 5000 foot elevation 

'. 

Esiablishes propa~e vertical riser pipe requirements 
above 5000 foot elevation 

Establishes propane 111arking and location 
requirements above 5000 foot elevation 

Pennits and plans shall be submitted and approved 
by lhe AHJ (Aulhority Having Jurisdiction). 

Requires underground LPG tanks to remain lhe 
property of lhe LPG company 

NFPA 13D-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the 
District has been amended to update various 
provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler 
systems in one-and two-family dwellings 

To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler 
system minimizing damage 

Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation 

System test to a pressure of 150 p.s.i. 

Changed 500 GPM lo 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot 
elevation, io match fire flow precedenis used in< I 
EDQ fol'years ; 

Eslablisliecf a minimum requirenient of 1,500 GPM; 
below sooo foot elevation, for all commeraal .· · . 
projects ·. . 

Locally aeated and adopted 

Locally aeated and adopted 

Locally aeated and adopted 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally aeated and adopted 

SFM Adopted and amended locally 

Establishes propane regulator requirement for locations 
above 5000 fool elevation. Including requirements for two­
stage regulalcll" use and location of first and second stage 
regulators. Additional requirements are ouHined for 
protective covers, riser pipe Installation requirements, 
building permit submittal and review, tank center-line 
marking, and grade requirements. These requirements are 
based on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 
wealher conditions encountered above 5000 feel 

Establishes vertical propane rise requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. Pipe schedule location, swing 
joint requirements, and lhe use of flexible riser piping as 
well as swing joints. These requirements are based on 
significant ffre hlsto,y in heavy snow and extreme weather 
conditions encountered above 5000 feel 

Establishes marking and location requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. This section addresses signage 
location, emergency contact information, and snow related 
tank marking requirements. These requirements are based 
on significant fire histo,y In heavy snow and extreme 
wealher conditions encountered above 5000 feet. 

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground 
tanks: 
Allows us to require plans be submitted for review prior to 
installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks 
require substantial maintenance including Inspection and 
anode replacement at regular intervals. 

Underground tanks cooode easily and can leak wiihout 
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when 
soid to the end user. This does not apply to above ground 
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected. 

Amended to inciude on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on­
site for emergent repairs, lhe inclusion of a local water ffow 
alarm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in the 
event of water activation in a vacant structure, and 
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 13D 
sprinkler system installation decreasing lhe risk of water 
damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements 
were also added to ensure water circulation through lhe 
system, reducing stagnant water and backffow concerns 
(EID encourages this type of system). 

A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system 
SFM adopted and amended locally must be available on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet 

SFM adopted and amended locally 

SFM adopted and amended locally 

Locally adopted and amended 

' 

Locally adopted and amended 

An audible alarm system is added to notify occupants and 
in lhe activation of the system when the building is not 
occupied allow for detection minimizing damage. 

A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and 
failures and assures proper gluing of system components. 

Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 
to in regards to GPM fire lb¥ requirements lhat have been 
used for over a decade in EDC> . . 
Allows us to match what developers and residents ire used 
to in regiids to GPM fire flow requiiements that have been 
used for over a decade in EDC .. 

20-0203 K Page 26 of 40 



Appendix D: D103.1 N Made an exception for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended 
II is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to 
construct a 26 foot wide space fOI access to a hydranl 

TIiie 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways. 
Appendix D: D103.2 N Slate law requires no greater than 16% grade Locally adopted and amended In our El Dorado County ntte 14 adoptioo we allow greater 

than 16% grade with AHJ approval and hard surface. 

Appendix D: D103.3 N Text to include curbs and gutters Locally adopted and amended 
20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutters due 
to potential access issues and turning radius concerns. 

Appendix 0: 0103.5 § 
Fire apparatus access road gates 

Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided 

1 
N Locally adopted and amended roadway the gate width shall not be less than 15 feel due to 

radius issues, ' 

No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet 

Appendix D: 0103.6.1 N Roads widths 20 to 29 feet Locally adopted and amended 
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does 
not apply. This section is adopted as ii stands in the Fire 
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all other elevations. 

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet 

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36 
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet or 

Appendix D: D103.6.2 N 
feet in width 

Locally adopted and amended elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The 
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D 
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations. 

Appendix D: D104.2 
Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Exception 
N building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

have only one approved fire apparatus access road. residents and first responders. 

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 

Appendix D: D104.4 N 
Added to require circumferential fire apparatus 

Locally aeated and adopted 
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire 

access roads structure and shalt provide a continuous means of 
emergency vehicle access. 

Appendix D: 0106.1 
For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Exception 
N Removed Exception in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

residents and first responders. 

Appendix D: 0107.1 
For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Exception 
N Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

residents and first responders. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.2 through 101.5 N 

Adopted to establish scope, intent, severability and 
Locaffy adopted Administrative clarity 

valicity 

102.6 through 102.8 N Relerences, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative darity 
: : 

102.10 through 102.12 N 
Conflicting provisions, Other Laws, Application of 

Locally Adopted Administrative darity 
references 

103.1 through 104.1 N 
Definition of the Fire Prevention Division and ability 

Locally Adapted Administrative darity .. to enforce the code 

104.3 through 104.4 N Right of Entry, Wanants, and ldentificatioo • Locally Adopted Administrative darity 
.. · .. . .. : 

: 

104.6 through 104.6.4 N Record retention Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.8 through 104.9.2 N 
Modifications, alternate means and methods, and Locally Adopted Administrative darity 
test · .. 

104.11 through N 
Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of 

Locally Adopted Administrative darity 
104.11.2 systems ·.···· 

104.11.3 N Authority of systems and devices iriaierilble . Locally AdMled Administrative dArHv 

105.2.3. N nine ffmitalioil of appftcation · .. · .\ :' ... ·,.: Locally Adopl_ed ·. Administrative cfaiity 

10U 1 lhiougti I· .. 

opera11ona1 permits } I.· 

I tL I LocallyAdopted . ~in~lrative dllrity ·.· 105.3:2 . ·. 
: . ·.· : i··.· .. 

: ·. 

~=~n:~=,#iiliilf<(•., 
·.·: I' 

· Lcic:ally Adopte<f ·•· •.• . Adrn~istrative clarity,•• 105i12 1: ·. N .:; i: 
1: :.· . 

20-0203 K Page 27 of 40 



Permits for various business operations for: Magnesium, 

105.6.2.28 through Adopted Ulis section fOf administrative clarity and 
miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation 

105.6.35 
N 

fire and life safety inspections Locally Adopted vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing facilities, open burning, 
open Hames and tordles, open Hames and candles, and 
organic coatings 

105.6.37 · N 
Adopted this section.for administrative clarity and 

LocaUy Adopted Permits for places of assembly 
fire arid life safety inspections 

105.6.39 N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Locally Adopted Peimits for private fire hydrants fire and life safety inspections 

Adoptlld this section for admi~istralive clarity arid 
Permits for pyroxytin plastics. refrigeration equipmenl repair 

105.6,41 lhrough N .. locally Adopted .. 
garages and inolor fuel-dispensing facilities, rooftop 

105.6.46 ffie and life safety inspections · heliports, spraying Of dipping, storage of scrap tires and tire 

: by-products 

· Adopted this section for administrative clarity and ·. 

105.6.43 N 
fire and life safety inspections . 

LocaUy Adopted Permit for tire-rebuilding plants 
' 

105.6.50 N Adopted this Sec/iOll for administrative clarity and 
locally Adopted 

Penni! for wood products storage (chips, hogged material, 
fire arid life safety Inspections lumber Of plywood, in excess of 200 cubic feet) 

106.1 lhrough 106.3 N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
locally Adopted Fee schedules for permits fire and life safety inspections 

107.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Inspection authority 
fire and life safety inspections 

Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of 

Adopted this section fOf administrative clarity and 
equipmenl re-inspection and testing, recOfdkeeping, 

108.1 through 109.3 N Locally Adopted supe,vision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding, 
fire and life safety inspections 

Board of Appeals established, timitalions on authority, and 
qualincations 

110.3.2 through N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
locally Adopted Compli111ce with orders and notices, prosecution of 

110.3.4 fire and life safety inspections violations, and unauthorized tampering 

110.4.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Abatement or violation fire and life safety inspections 

113.1 N 
Adopted this section fOf administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted Authority to disconnect service utilities 
fire and life safety inspections 

Asphalt ke!Ues IXllllain highly flammable substances and 
303.1 lhrough 303.9 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical) 

Managing ignition sources through responsible application 
305.1 Ulrough 305.5 N Adopted this section fOf fire and life safety Locally Adopted of standards will reduce the number of fires in valious 

settings (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Motion picture projection rDOfns and film are HIGHLY 
306.1 through 306. 2 N Adopted this section fOf fire and life safety Locally Adopted flammable and require special handling (Climatic, 

geological, and topographical) 

307.1 lhrough 307.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Open burning, recreational fire, and portable outdoor 
fireplaces, (Climatic, geological. and topographical) 

308.1 N Adopted Ulls section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Open ffame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) . 

308.1.2 thrilugh 
N Adopted Ulis section for fire and rite safety Locally Adopted 

llutJwirig ()( placing of ignition sources, torches for 
308.1.3 removing paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Lcications near combustible, open flame devices; signals 
: and mners, POflable fuel open.flame devices, sky0 

308.1.5 through N Adopted !hi~ section to,- fire and life safety . Locally Adopted lanterns, religious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming 
308.1.8.5 food ancfiieverage preparation, dispensing, 1Xlfltain81S not 

in use, .seiving of flaming food, locaiion; fire proiei:tion 

.. . : . '· .' (¢lirnatic, geological, and toj)ogrliphical) .. .. 
.·. ·. .. .. ·. · . : .. ·. . :: .. , ·:.,·:; ·.·: ... · . . .. ·· .. ' ' . . .-::. · .. 

:"-\ ' :_-,· 1. Adopted uiis secliCJ1 'ia fire i,irj life safely ' 
· .. ·.:· · , , t.oca11y Adopted P~ts are required for above section (Climatic, geological, 308.2 N ' . and topographical) . . . 

.. . 

20-0203 K Page 28 of 40 



. 
Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices, 

308.3 U,rough 308.4.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted Uiealrical performances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 
donnitories (Oimatic, geological, and topographical) 

310.1 N Adopted U,is section for fire and ~fe safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to smoking (Cfimatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

310.3 N Adopted this section for fire and ~fe safety Locally Adopted 
"No Smoking" signs (Climatic, geological, and 
t6poi,a~cal) 

.. Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with 'No Smoking' 
310.4 through 310.8 N Adopted this section for fire and "re safety Locally Adopted signs, ash trays, burning objects, hazardous environmental 

conditions. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 
. 

1· Vacant premises condition and safety requirements, 
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant 

311.1 U1rough311.4 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Loi:aKy Adopted premises; security, fire protection, fire separation, removal 
of combustibles, removal of haz!l"dous materials: (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

C 

319.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to mobile food preparation 
vehicles. (Oimatic, geological, and topographical) 

319.2 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
Permits for mobile food preparation vehicles (Oimatic, 

fire and life safety inspections geological, and topographical) 

Exhaust hood, fire protection, fire protection for cooking 
equipmenL fire extinguisher, appfiance connection to fuel 
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, metallic 
storage tanks, nonmelalfic storage lanks, cooking oil 
storage system components, design criteria, lank venting, 
normal vents, emlllgency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum 

319.3 through 
aggregate volume, protection of conlainer, LP-gas container 

N Adopted U,is section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted construction, protection of system piping, LP-gas alarms, 
319.10.3 CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel, 

maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG 
container construction, CNG containers supplying 
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping, 
methane alanns, maintenance, exhaust system, fire 
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems. 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

403.8.1 through 
Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1 

403.8.1.7 
N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted (residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and 

fire safety plans. 

403.10 through 
Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancy 

N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic, 
403.10.1.3 geological, and topographical) 

405.5 N Adopted U,ls section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

510.3 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems 

fire and life safety inspections (Climatic. geological, and topographical) 

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a 
807.5.2 Uirough 

N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally Adopted 

maximum amount of ffammable waN coverings In 
807.5.2.3 fire and life safety Inspections educational faalities (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical) 

An automatic sprinkler system is required ill Group A-5 

903.2.1.5 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally Adopted 

(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers) 
fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological. and topographical) greater than 1000 

square feel (Climatic, geological. and topographical) 

20-0203 K Page 29 of 40 



Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders 
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from 
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time 

Adopted this section in existing builcings_ for the 
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 

1103.2 y safety of firefighters and other emergency locally Adopted 
phasing in of a system over a period of time, detennined by 

responders. the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind 
this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury 
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: D101.1 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
locally Adopted 

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads 
through D102.1 fiiefighteis, and other emergency responders; . induding loads. (Ciimatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: D103.4 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Dead end fire apparatus access road requirements for a 
N 

firelighters, and other emergency responders. locally Adopted tum around at 150 feel (Climatic. gedogical, and 
topographical) 

Appendix 0: D103.6 N 
Adopted this section for ihe safety of the public, 

locally Adopted 
'No Paoong, Fire lane' signs requirements. (Climatic, 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: D104.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus through 0104.3 N locally Adopted 

(exduding exception) 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. access roads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

·. 

Appendix O: D105.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

Requirements for aerial fire apparatus access roads 
through 0105.4 firefighters, and other emergency responders. (Ctimatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix 0: D106.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential 

through 0106.3 N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. 

locally Adopted 
developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical) (exdudlng exceptions) 

Appendix 0: 0107.1 
One- or two-dweffing residential developments shall be 

(exducing exceptions) N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

locally Adopted 
equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire 

through D107.2 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 

dimatic conditions. 

Appendix 0: 0108 N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle. 

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

20-0203 K Page 30 of 40 



To whom It may concern, 

MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DIST ICT 
8 0 I ROCK CREEK ROAD 
r1LACERV1LLE, 95667 

(530) 626-901 7 
F 1 (530) 626-3240 

fo1- the Mosquito fire Protection District 2019 Fl Code Adoption. pub lic not ic w as achieved hrough 
Posting our Notice of Intent in the following three I - · rmn~ : 

• On \h board located tn the f ront of Flre Station 75 a RaOl Rock Creek Ro, d 

• Community Bulletin board at the Cafe il f firrnon lake 
• 0 the Districts webslui , detailin the location and time of the meet lnc where the adoption 

was going to take pla( _ 

The district was always forthcoming with lh • Ir.format lo o f proposed ,hange" and h d rt readily ;wail a I Por 
rev iew by he public. Addltior, Hy, the , trkl gave enough time for pubhc comment and , le Ing. 

inc:erely, 

,· 
/ I 

. ( ~~;'"--

~ - - - ~ 
tdw;lfd Dwyer 
Hre ChlefMFPO 

20-0203 K Page 31 of 40 



Attachment No. 2 

Mosquito Fire Protection District 

Resolution No. 19-06 

20-0203 K Page 32 of 40 



l N l _ -0 

f- .. B _ A.RD Of DIRECTO OF THE 
·l F · P T ,C'TlON D1STRJ 

ADOPTI NU fN INCiS SUPPORTING AMENDMI:"NTS TO 
1 HE CALI FORNL.\ F[RE CODE 

A resolution for the Moaquito Fire Protection District setting fonb findings with respect to 
local conditions within the Fire District whic.h make certain modifications and changes to 
the CuJi.fomio Fire Code ~isonnbly necessary for preserving fire and life safety in th 
Mm;quilo Fire Protection Distric, 

The ovem.iog Board of the Mosquito Fire Protection District finds and resolves as 
f llow:i : 

WHE~AS, He hh & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permits a Fi:re Protection 
District to ndopt ar1 ordinance which changes or modifies the St.ate Housing regulations 
dopted 

1 ursu.ar1t to Health &. SnJery Code Section 17922 upon detennination that such changes or 
modifications ore netessary due to local conditions that pertain regulations governing 
conditions hazardous to life,. property end the environment from foe, explosion, ha.znrdou!j 
materi and hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, Hea.ltb & Safuty Code Section 17958.7 requires dUlt Di 1ricr' s Ba1;1rd 
of Directors making an~ changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Sufoty Code 
Sechor 17958 .5 shall make express finding that .such c.ha.uges or modifkati llj ar nei!de.d; 
and shall file a copy of sue.h changes or modifications with the Department of H Lmin 11d 
C mmwtiry Development 

WHERE.AS, the unique ocal climatic, goolng" ca!. nd topogitiphl l conditions 
existing within the lxlundarics of the District make it bly nl'C.05.W)' for the iswicr t 

impose more mingent requireme.n_ts than. set forth m the C lif mi r; o, nd pUl'SUMlt 

to California Health and Safety Code secti ons L.386 .7 a I 918.'/. the 01 rlct 

desires to make express findings to that effort 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RLS l V D tn;tr che .U'd .J Ll n::ct 1. i' ~ 
Mosquitn Fire Pro1ection District. .after imvioi duly noti~ and held 1ntblic h hc~b. 
adopts the following findings concan:illg current unique lc.x:.al conditi ns that 
together make each modification lO lhe C Hfomiu Fire Cod , reas nnbly occessary 10 

provide adequate and effective protection of Hfe, propt!rt)' and U1c envi~nment m re 
specifically set forth ns follows: 

-1-

20-0203-K- Pa~e 33 of-40 



FI~DINGS OF FACT 
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFlCATIO~S TO THE STATE HUILDI!\U 

ST A~DARDS CODE <llTLE 24 PART 9) AFC Al :sf:-. OF LO( 'AL 
CC)NDlrJONS 

A. General. 

After due consideration. the Board of Directors of the Mo,quHo Fire Protection District, 
hereby find! that due to local climatic, iCOlogic and topographic cunditjons, as stated within 
thi! document. there is a need to provide the moJiflc11t1om1 and change contained in the 
adoptive Ordinance of the California Fire Code. Such changes are deemed to be reasonably 
necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life, property, and the 
environment 

Tbe Mosquito Fire Protection District provide, fire protection, cmervency medical 
services, and specialized rescue services to approximately 1.000 people in a 12 square mile 
area. The District i, located on the We!tem ,lope of El Dorado County. The 
topoiiraphy of the District ranaes from rolling hills of arus. oak woodland, large 
quantities of brush, and ,tcep drainages, The weather conditions vary from freezina 
temperatures with occa.11onal snow in winter, to ,wnrner temperatures that regululy 
exceed I 00 dcarces. 

The Mosquito Fire Protection Diiitnct is 11n "all-nu.·· aaency. The Oi,trict participates in a 
50phisticatcd mutual aid program and i!I dispatched through agreement by the California 
Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal-Fire)• Camino. The resources of the 
District will respond to, and deal with. any type of emeraency. The tenn .. Fire 
Protection" in this document is broad and includes responses to fires. woke, and odor 
investigations, ala.mu, public l.551St calls. hazardous matenab incidents, medical aid, and 
specialized rescues. 

The District has one, part time, staffed fire l\tation to provide emergency service to the 
conununity, Fire Station 75 i, l~tcd at 8801 Rocle. Creek Road. The District has 2 
full-time, career personnel, along with 1 par! time rnanqemcnt position, 2 part-time 
administrative suppon positions, and these are supplemented with volunteer Chief 
Officers, Fircfighten. and Fire Prevention Officers. 

B. Climatic. 

"The Mosquito Fire Protection District is located within a foothill reaion. The District is 
subject to four !ICaS<>ns, 'With an annual Jnowfall in the winter months of2 inches. in 
addition to an averaae rainfall of 39 inches per year. These advene weather conditions 
a"8b: severe hazardo1.15 road conditions and noodin& u 'Nell as rockslidc hazards alona the 
rm.in access roads within. a well a., into, the District from the surrounding areas. Due to 

-2-

20-0203 K Page 34 of 40 



periods of rainfall, along with repeated road closures, the ability of the Fire Protection 
District to provide immediate emergency response is often delayed, These same adverse 
climatic conditions often result in a large number of vehicular accidents that place 
extreme restraints on the availability of emergency response to perform emergency 
rescue, fim aid, hazardous materials control, and firefighting. The climatic conditions 
often result in a substantial or total lack: of ability of the Fire Protection District to 
respond immediately to other types of emergency situations that occur. Examples of these 
emergency siruations include structure fires, wildJand and fore.,t fires. flooding, 
hazardous materials incidents. emergency medical calls, vehicle accidents, and vertical 
rescues. The muruaJ aid agreements established with adjoining fire agencies might not be 
possible due to adverse climatic conditions. restricting or totally blocking access into the 
District. 

Summary: 

These local ciimatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the Fire 
District. Times of little or no rainfall. low humidity, and high temperatures create 
extremely hazardous conditions, particularly as they relate to the ~ildland-urban 
interface. Winds experienced in this area can have a significant impact upon structure fires, 
especially in buildings in close proximity to one another, and to ~ildJands 
commonly found in the Mosquito Fire Protection District Structures built within the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District must be built with these variables in mind 

C Geological. 

The Mosquito Fire Protectjon District is located ~ithin moderate seismic Zone Three. The 
seismic, geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires, major breakage of water 
mains, multiple electrical power failures, multiple collapsed structures and a large number 
of calls for emergency medical aid. all of which may occur simultaneously during a seismic 
event. The water district has numerous water-pumpina ~ystems u9Cd for fire suppression 
water delivery, as well as water storage tanks providing water synem pressure. Most of the 
pumping systems are dependent oo elcctricaJ power for operation. Such eJcc~cal po~r 
may not be available during a seismic event Water storage tanks used for storage of 
required fire 
suppression water may also collapse in such an event forcing the additional need to transpon 
water via additional pieces of fire apparatus which will place a significant restraint on the 
ability of the District to provide the 
required emergency services. 

Summary: 

Local geographic and geological features and processes exist within the boundaries of the 
Districts that may hamper the ability of the Mosquito Fire Protection District to perform its 
sworn duties Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life 
and damage than the earthquake itself. 

-3-

-20-0203 K Page 35 of 40 



D. Topoaraphical. 

The District is primarily composed of areas that are considered by the State to be high fire 
haz.ard severity mnes. Much of the hill is located within foothill terrain, co,,·ered with highly 
combustible vegetation. including the presence of many coniferous forested areas. The 
elevation within the District ranges from approximately 800 feet to over 2500 feet at the 
highest point. Slope within the District ranges from Oto 90 degrees. The structures within 
the areas of the foothill's temun have very limited fire access. due to nanow 
roadways with steep grades and poor road surface conditions. The presences of many 
existing structures within the high fire severity zone areas provides for a very high 
potential of a structure fire spreading into a wildland or forest fire condition as well as the 
potential for a wildJand or forest fire spreading to structures. 

Summary: 

The alignment of canyons, valleys, and slopes into inhabited areas. combined with the 
variable nature of the terrain, yield potential for increased fire risk. Most structW"CS, both 
residential and commercial, arc in or arc surrounded by areas that contain significant grus. 
b~ mixed oak woodland, and mixed conifer fuel load Due to drought 
conditions. beetle infestations, and lack of vegetation management. much of the area is 
populated with either dead or dying trees, contributing to extreme fire danger, 

E. Conclusion 

Local climatic, geographic, and topographic conditions described above increase the 
frequency, intensity, and si:ze of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, these 
conditions impact potentiaJ damage to structures from an earthquake and 
subsequent fire. Therefore, it is reasonably necessary that the California Fire Code be 
modified to mitigate the efrects of the above conditions. California Health & Safety Code 
Section I 7958. 7 requires that modifications to the Fire Code be expressly marked and 
identified ~ to which each finding refers to which Code modification. The attached 
Appendix A provides th.is connection. 

INTRODUCED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the Mosquito Fire 
Protection District on November 1411,, 20 I 9 

PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the Aoard of Directors of the 
Mosquito fu,: Protection District on November 14111

, 2019 by the following roll call vote: 

20-0203 K Page 36 of 40 



A YES. l>ir«tors Barbara Mikel, Charle, Schnell, Taffy Warner 

NOES: Uirector Williu.m RuhnerkemJ" 

ABSENT: Director Kathy Pico 

AAST AIN: None 

:\ Tll:ST: 

2Q-:()_~3 K Page 37 of 40 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
101.1 ·x Admin 

105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/T opographica I 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 {d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra p h ica I 

503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.6 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.S.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/T opogra phica I 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra phica I 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra phica I 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/T opographica I 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phica I 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

20-0203 K Page 38 of 40 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
6104.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

6112.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra phica I 

6112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra phica I 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 5.1.1.2 · X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra ph ica I 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 11.2.1.l X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix B: Table B105.1(1) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix B: Table B105.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: Dl03.6.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix O: Dl03.6.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra p hical 

Appendix D: 0104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

101.2 through 101.5 X Admin 

102.6 through 102.8 X Admin 

102.10 through 102.12 X Admin 

103.1 through 104.1 X Admin 

104.3 through 104.4 X Admin 

104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin 

104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin 

104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin 

104.11.3 X Admin 

105.2.3 X Admin 

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin 

105.6.12 X Admin 

105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin 

105.6.37 X Admin 

105.6.39 X Admin 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin 

105.6.48 X Admin 

105.6.50 X Admin 

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin 

107.1 X Admin 

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin 

110.4.1 X Admin 

113.1 X Admin 

. 20-0203 K Page 39 of 40 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
303.1 through 303.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

305.1 through 305.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

306.1 through 306.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

307.1 through 307.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.2 X Admin 

308.3 through 308.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.3 X Climatic/Geo logica 1/Topogra phica I 

310.4 through 310.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

311.1 through 311.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

319.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

319.2 X Admin 

319.3 through 319.10.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

403.10 through 403.10.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

405.5 X Admin 

510.3 X Admin 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1103.2 X Topographical 

Appendix D: D101.1 through 

D102.1 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.6 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix D: D104.l through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

0104.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: D105.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

D105.4 
Appendix D: D106.1 through 

X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
0106.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: 0107.1 (excluding 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

exceptions) 

Appendix 0: D108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

20-0203 K Page 40 of 40 


