
RESOLUTION NO. 044-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 020-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the 
State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a 
county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably necessary 
because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1, 
Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulations to the local 
level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized 
representativ~or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representativ~and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the fire 
protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a 
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection of 
certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on November 12, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Pioneer Fire Protection District adopted 
Ordinance No. 2019.1, which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with amendments the District deemed 
necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado 
ratifies Ordinance 2019.01 of the Pioneer Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement of the 
ordinance to the Pioneer Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections: 

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4 through 
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1. 
507.5.1, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 
903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 
5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.l through 6112.3, 
6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 130-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 130-2016 Section 5.1.1.2, 
Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 130-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: 
Table B105.1 (1), Appendix B: Table B 105.2, Appendix 0103.1 through 0103.3, Appendix 0103.5 
Section 1, Appendix Dl03.6.1, Appendix 0103.6.2, Appendix 0104.4. 

20-0203 L Page 1 of 52 



Resolution No. 044-2020 

Page 2 of2 

The Pioneer Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, 
including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2018 edition not 
adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403 .1, 403 .2.1-403 .2.4, 403.3 , 403.4, 
403.6, 403 .7, 403 .8 (adopting 403 .8.1-403 .8.1.7), 403 .9, 403 .10.2, 403 .10.3, 403.11 , 403 .12, 
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405 .6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5 .2.3), 808, 
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103 .10, 1104-1106, 
Chapter 25 , Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), Dl06.l (Exception), Dl07.1 
(Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, 
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said 
Board, held the __!Q_ day of March , 2020, by the following vote of said Board: 

Attest: 
Ayes: Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin, Novasel 
Noes: None 
Absent: None 

Brian K. 

20-0203 L Page 2 of 52 



c<:-mbcr 18. _ 19 

PIONEER F PROTECTION DISTRICT 
FlRE • RESCUE • EMS 

P.O. X 28 
70 1 Mt. r u_k--um Road 

Sor er se , a lifomi a 9 5684 
Phone i53 )j 6 20 - -l 44 • Pa..x - · Ol 620-.:!. .) 17 

"' \"W pion~'f"rfi re o rg 

011 Ashlan. Clu cL tlminisLmti\-c Off,c r 
El DoruJo olllll)' 8oun.1 of ' opcrvbor.; 
.330 Fair Dne 
Ploccrvilk. C1 9S6b7 

8nud of Dll?fl 

n: F1!l\ • Cb If 

R~r.e, 1 Jii,, - v ,o; '.'ho1• 
G W d )1111, :te · ~n 
).! ,· 1,i.,ii - [.IJr-:t, .. 

l ii 1i1mn1fecJ o,, "" 

S11bjccL Ile.solution Ratlf)ing Ordinance No. 2019.01 of lhr Piunel'r· .f'jrt' Prut cti n 
Di<itrka which adopts the 201 9 CaJifornia Firt' Cod~ witb ~meadm nt rdi: f d to 
local clirn111ic. geographic and lopognpbic coot.lilions. 

Dear Mr A.,hmn: 

Pwn..: r Fire Prote-ction District (PFPD; is req1.1 sling th Bo rd f Sup~rv1 s<1 . tB< S) 1ify 
11s rdi o:1ncc .Jo. 20l9.0lwhic.ht1dop1 ,1he.Wl9C li fomi,Fir C de 5umeni.lecl uur 1 ,;r,c ifi · 
loo:eJ climati1.:, ~1..·o~rr.lphic and top-0grnphk cottdicion . . Cn llforniu iko l1 h r1u s t'-'t · Cock Scc1iv11 
3869.7 require~ th lcgisluti\'e body of the city or county where lh~ orJh1on i.•il apply t 11if), 

mod ify or deny the adopted ordinance . The BOS rnusl als , d('lcgalC' cnfon:: 1:: mi:111 of th~ rui1uim· 
t.o eith r the Fire Distric t (or its rcpres n1Ett1ve ) or lhe Ch.icf BL1ildir1 _ Oflicin l 
llle.refo , •:,, e request the Count: Board ol' Super\'1 Sor~ ratij)· Ordinuncc Nt1. 201 01 \ ilh 
u.mendment.s to I.he 2019 C tlifomia Fire CoJ c. nnd dekgalc the t·nfor 'l11 t' tl! o ·1h I Or inarn.• 10 
the: Pion c,. Fi re Prorecti(1[]; D1suic1 Chitf. A propQs~·J B S rt'.s\1luriot1 i. c 111,: los('d fin ynu r\'VI •\ 

o.nd use on tbJs t )pie. 

This reso lu1i on has M direc< fisc t1.I imp 11.;t I lh~ CmJt 1y 

.·in ·ez:c1'·. _ . ...- _ , '•1 ,._~, ,. . ·, · /t;-rr 1 .·• , 

'1arJ:1.nt~·~~::::.:._ 
ri~( Chicf / ,.' 

I 

, TT O l. 1F 
I . Pioneer Fi re Pmtectton Dbtri i.: t 'uti n~~ Nu ~(J 19.UI 
I. Pioneer Fi re Prot~c.tinn Di i,1nc! Fi n\1in f I-' c l Re i,o lulil n No. l0f1- ; ,fl I~ 
3. Draft El Dorado Count: BOS R , lution 

20-0203 L Page 3 of 52 



Attachment No. 1 

Pioneer Fire Protection District Ordinance 

No. 2019.01 

20-0203 L Page 4 of 52 



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

ORDINANCE NO. 2019.01 

BE IT ORDArNED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE PIONEER FIRE 

PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS: 

An ordinance of the Pioneer Fire Protection District (PlO) adopting the 2019 Edition of the Californlu Fi,., 

Codo, incorporating the 2018 Edition of the International Fir, Cod,, ~gulatina and governing the safeguartling of 

life and property from fm and explosion hazards arising from the storage. handling and~ ofhal.atdous substances, 

materials end devices, and fro::n conditions hazardous to Life or property in 1hc o«upancy of building, and pn:mises 

in the PIO; providing fo: the iuuance of permits and coll«tion of fees therefor; Repealing Ordinance No. 2016-37 

of the PIO and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith. 

Be 11 ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the PIO, also known as the Pioneer Fire Protection 

District: 

Section t : FINDINGS OF FACTS 
Section 2: ADOPTION OF COD£ WITH EXCLUSIONS 
Section 3: LOCAL AMENQMENJS 
Section 4: CONfUCJ 
Section 5: SEVERABlUT)' 
Section 6: EFFECTIVE PAU AND PUBLICATION 

SECTION 1: FlNDL'lGS OF FACTS 
The PIO makes certain changes (listed beJow) to the California Fi,-, Ced,. 2019 Ed,tion, pursuant to 

Health & Safety Cod, S.ctions I 3869. 7, /79J8. 7 md /1194/.J durina this code adoption process. Such changa 

ani necessary because of looal climatic, geological and/or topographical conditions, The PIO has adopted, 

pursuant to Section 18941.5 of the California H•altl, cl Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these 

conditions by Resolution #2019-10 of the PIO dated September 19, 2019. 

SECTION 2: ADOPTION QI CODI WITH EXCLUSIONS 
The PIO adopts the 2019 California Fan Cod., nde Ut Part 9, lg Jg ydnty, inctudma Appendices, 

iftCOfpOflting those sections of the /nt,maliona/ rlT'f Code, 2018 edition not ldopted by the state, with the 

exclusions lilted below: 

Ordinance 2019.01 Paae 1 

20-0203 L Page 5 of 52 



bd1.111on1: IOS.617-105.619, ICIS6.J91 3081.4, 309,311.5, 311.6, 318, 4011, ,40J.2.l-40l2.4, 403 ,. 

403 4, 40] 6, 4017. 403.S (adop,una 403.8.1-403.8.17). 403.9. 40],10.2, 403. I 0.3, 403 11, 403.12, 404.1-404 4, 

40SJ-405 '· 40S 6-40S.9, 406, 805,807 (ldop(ma 807 j.2), 808. 904.1.l, l !01, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, l 103.9 

(adopting 110).91). 1103.10, 110..-1 l~. Chapter 25, Chapccr 26, the dlcepcion.s under 0104.2 (uccption), 

01061 (Exccphon). D107 I <bcep(ion}, Appc:odi\ A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, 

Appendix K. Awcr,du L. Appcrujix M. 

"ppcndicC$ 00( ..top1od cu be used for rcfercoce tn cnfon::t.'\g other sections o( the 2019 Cal,jonua Ftn 

SECTION l: LOCAL AMENDMENTS 
The following Sections are hereby amended Of added: 

Chapter 1 

Ste1ioa 101 Scope IP4 Gau11 acawaag 
101.1 Thie lhaJ~ be amended&$ follows Add Mnw o/j11ri,d1ct10" / PIO} 

Sssti91 tos fsrmltl 
10516.27 LPG-,u shall be amcodcd u foll~s Add co the cxcepuon Al or above S,000 foe( of 

cJevauon. a permit 11 not rtqu1rcd for individual containen with I lH-aaUon water capacity or lcu, 

or mulu;,le conta1ne1 1y1tems h.avma an aggrqate quantity noe exceeding l 2S gallon1 servmg 

occupancies in Group R-3. 

Sssdoq lt6 (ts, 

106.6 PermJt. Pig 8cVSl! yd JNPSsdop h11 .shall be added u followa: A sclidultt of /H.J 
adopt«/ by tit• dLstnct board of di~ton for plan f'n'f~. i,utHction.r and tJr, issuanc, of pumrts by 

tlta district "'°Yb, /01111d 11t tit• Most cllrnnt durricl [H sclrulllltt (H,altlt & Saf•ty Codt1 J 7951) 

106.6.l Colt Recovery fns lhall be added H follows~ Fin un•tc, /HJ may b, char,«/ to any 

~rsOII, firm. corporation or business tAat tltrowglt nt1gllp,1ce, vJolatio'1 of tlttt law, or aJ a ruwt of 

canlttssM.SJ, i.r rupon:cibl• for tit• cow, of tit« di.1trict to r..spond to tis, scni• of an incid,nt, A 

di.Jtrict board may cltara11 aj11, 10 cowr tlttt co.rt of any s,~ictt which th• district proYida or ,Jt, cost 

of mforcing any rwgulation for which tit•/•• is cltara«i ( H,altlt & Saf,ry Cod, J J 9 J 6). Tit, f•• sltaJI 

1101 6aed ,>.,. actual co.rt of supp,..,t.finf tit, fin and/or r1.spond1n1 ro de, SCffW of an inad,111 

106.7 Admlallt[atiyc Coltl Iha.II bo added •• follow,: W71m a lat or insp«tion is sclt«h,l,d, aJtd 

tltt contractor faib ta perfonrt 10 Ut• salil/ac11on of Ult! t111tliorlty ltavr1t1 j11rudiclion (AHJ), tie, ,tHJ 

may bill tlte contractor for aclllal tiM• spett trawling to a,td from Ill• tatAnsp«tiolt localio,i Oltd 

tlt11 tbfl11 spMt at de• tutliJUp«limt iii• as ..JI as admi1tutrattvc costs, 

Ordinance 2019.01 Ptae2 

20-0203 L Page 6 of 52 



Sectiog 102 Board of Appeals 
S,sU,1109.4 Appgl rnmw:u aqd Timellpes shall be added as follows: Any person or «nmy who 

lwlleva tltq may~ advt!n•(v affected by an order. dtcision, or determination mad, by rhefirt1 codt1 

official through a -•lle11 notice may appeal this malls- within 15 calt111dar days of the postmark on 

the Mtice. .4/J such appeals shall be flied in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for 

the district A timely ilpp«J/ shall stay further aclJo,r by the fin code official u11t{f 1h11 mauer is 

dt!iumin«I by th, Appeal lloard ru outlined in Section 109.2, unlus the issue poses an immint1nl fire 

or life safety hazard to member.Y of the public. The fire code official thall notify the appellant by 

certified mail of 11,e dnt~ and time of .tuch hearinf. Tire hearing shall be tchedult!d to tau pl act!. 11a 

sooner than 20 ca/«11dar days from the date shov.'T'I 01t th• c~rified mail. T1re ap~llant sltall haw tlte 

right to appear in person or by agent al tlte hearing and presvrt ora~ lNriUe,, a1tdlor pho1ograpl11c 

~idenctt to the A.pptUII Boord. 

Scstlog 110 Yiol1tioa1 
110.4 Yloladoa Pc11ld11 ahall be amended as follows'. Persons wbo shall violate a provision of this 

code or shall tall to comply wnh any of the requirements thereof or who shall «ect, install, alter, 

repair or do work in vfolation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code 

official, or of a pcnnit or certificate used under provisions of this code. shall be guilty of 1 

misdem«anor or iefraction, at th, discretion of tit, prw«uring attorney or agency, punishable by a 

fine not exceeding SI OOJX) for a first violation,' 2. A _r,,,. not exceeding S500. 00 for a s«ond violation 

of the same provi.rion wt tit in on, )'ftU; J, A fine noi 1m:11eding SJOOO. 00 for ead, additional vfolaiton 

of the sam• provi.rion wiu,in ont µor, °' by irnpri,oruneot not exceeding 1 BO days, or bolh such fioe 

and imprironment Each day that 11 violation conllnucs after due notice has been served shaU be 

deemed I sepante offense {Health & &ifi!ty Code Sections 13/45 and J 7995). 

1 lOA,l C!tadog shalt be added II follows'. Tit• Fire C"ieJ or his/her duly authoriz«I 

rq,r~«ntarivt, may Luu, citatfons for infractions or misd,m,anor violations of this cO<h p11rs11ant to 

S«ction J 3871 of tht H~alrh d Safery Codt1 of thd Stai, of California and Cltaptu- .Sc (comm,ncing 

wit.Ji ~ction 851.6) o/T'lrle .3 of Part 2 of tltt P•n,al Codtt oftlte Stat, of California. 

SsstiPA 111 Stop Work Ordu 
112,1, f•P•te to Comply shaU be amended u follows: Ally person who sbal1 continue any wortc 

after having been 1erved with I stop-work order, except wch won: a that penon is directed IO 

perform to remove a violation or unufe condition, lball be pwiisltabl• by aft,t, or impri.sonmmt"" 

both as dacrlbtld ,,, ~ction J JO.~ (Healtlt cl Saf,r, Coa Stttions /J1'J OJtd 17995). 

Ordinance 2019.01 Page3 

20-0203 L Page 7 of 52 



Chapter 2 

Stcdoa 102 G111raJ o,n,1uoo1 
Add definition for Campflrt -Sita/Im.a;, afi,-• ..,,Judi u u.srdfor cookUlf JH,-10,wl "Wlrnitlt, li1htin1, 

or aes1~11c purpos#!Z 7"u mc/udn Jira co,ital"rd ..,,,1i,,. outdour jirYplacts aNi 111clo1N 1taw1 

with flues or chi1"M}'J. sto\/f!S usi,rgJtW~. l14u1d or :rol,d fatu. portabl, barNcutt piu. broz,~s. ot 

space lt1atirtg Jtvius whiclt ar, wed O&Jbidt of any structure, mobil, honttt, or atiy living 

acco~odallOII mownted on a whicltt. 

Add definition for Qptrlct -Shall m•an thtt diflY1ct and all otlier area, within rlttt atttnor bouNiaries 

tit~/ ,ww or h,,-,afttr atabli.flrtul 

Add dcfuut>on for Drtvew&Y · Shall main a \Yhicular ace," tluzt nn'ls lip 10 r,.,o 11) parals 1.:itlt tto 

mo,_ than tl\O!l (l) r,11dtntual unitJ and any "'""htr of "on,rommuciaJ or 1T1,iu1fnul hu1/d1r1g on tach 

part«/ 

Add dcfin.itioo for f:lteydvt Body -SJrall '"'°" th• Board of Dirtctors of'tlt• Dtstnct 

Add definition for fin ClaJef - Shall 1MU11 11t, Chit/ Extciuive Firt Officer of tit, Fir, 

d1pa1111NntldiJtrict 1,rvlng 1h,juri.vd1ctio11 or n dvly autJwriz«I reprue111a1,~. 

Add defuution fot Tralged Crowd Mtunc . Slra/1 !Man standby personntJ, lilWlly a stcurity 

gword or usher JH!rsn1111e/, wlro artt traintd ill tit, prop«r proctdur, to cit p,oplt fro11t a 11n1 or othu 

place of pMbltc tUStntblag• '" a11 ordtrly altd calm fasltwn 1n tit, ew,u of a11 emerpnn 

Chapter 3 

Scgjoa 3f2 QsftaldoQI 
301.1 PsOlllloU shall be amended u follows: Added Campfire definition. u abown above in 

~2. 

SssUo• 391 Opsp BgrpJ.g& Bssotd9NA Elm, 114 Outdoor UrSP41su 
lf7,4,1 CampOU Btffllsdou abaU be lidded u ro11ow1: 

307,41411 /t LS unlawfol for any pe,1011 u, h1lrt.. mai11taln, or w, a campfin i.pon or 11,ar any brMslt· 

co~ land. rmu-cm;ered la1td. or forat-cowrcd land durini tit• tim, wltttn burni1t1 p«rmiu ar, 

SU$(JOl(Jal by tit, o,rf'Ctor of tit, Dq,anm,,11 of Forctry a1td Fin Pro11ctJoft. tlte CAL FIRE Umt 

Cltief. or u,, AHJ. 

Excqtio11: Comm,rcial cooki1t1 o~ratiom widt approval of rite AH.I 

397,114.l w,..,. cantpflrcs art! allowal u 11tould b4 11nlawfi,J for GIi)! po'10rt to /11/tt. maintain. or ILH' 

o c:o,,,pJan wpo,r G")I brwlt-cawtTld IONJ. 1ros.s-<0"'1KI land. or /orat-cowrwi land 1111/w rlt, 

/oll0wt1t11t1u.bftuffl '*"'''"'"'" ar, co,nplied witlt. 

l01,1,1,2 (1) n.. am wttltui $ /HI of tll• ,,.rlph,ry of tit, ca"'Pfi,.. ts clttirwd of all flantmabltt 

"'°'""°' a,wl .....,.1at1oft. 

Ordinanco 2019.01 Pap4 

20-0203 L Page 8 of 52 



307,4,4,l (b} Ont' lervi,:eable ~·hov,I wi'th a Jiandl. of al Inst 12 ir,cha it ~ady for "-'' at the 

imm,diate a,-a of rht' campfire. 

307,414.1 (cl Campfires shall~ limited to a J [OOl lrj J fa<>t antZ. Wt/as in an approved manu/nch,Tl!d 

cooti11g dmu or fin ring. 

JO'.Z,41412 (d} Writtm permission of tltt1 Jandownt1r MU.fl ~ obtained prior to th, ignition of the 

campfire and shall~ on site. 

Chapter 5 

seccJop 503 Fire Apparatus Acce11 Roads 
503.2,l Dlmcgliops shaJI be amended as follows: Fi.re apparatus access roads shall have an 

unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet, exclusive of shoulders., a.r measured from face of curb to 

Jae, of cwb, except for approved security aatea in ace-0rdancc wilh Section 503.6, and unobstructed 

vertical clearance of not less lhan 15 [,,,. Ail dn·.~wa)'J in tltt di.strict shall not ~ less titan 11 fnt 

wtd•. 

503.l.5 Dgd Eada shall be amended as follow,: Dead-end flre apparatus access roads and dri~Yl)'S 

in excess of l SO feet in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around fire 

apparatus. 

503,2,6 Brldg1 apd Elevated Syrfacs, shall be amended II follows: Where a bridge or an elevated 

surface is part of a fU'e appantus access road, the bridac shall be constructed and maintained ln 

accordance with tJi• cur~nt El Dorado Coamty Transportnt1011 Division Bridge Standard or App~ndix 

D of tli• curttnt Cal,fornia Fin Coda, whiche.1er if morw nstrlctlw. Bridaes and elevated surfaces 

sbaU be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed loada of fire apparatus. V ehiclc load 

limits shall be posted at both entrances 10 bridges when required by !he Fire Code Official. Where 

elevated surfaces dcsiped for emergency vdlicle use are adjacent to surfaces which an: not designed 

for sucb use, approved beniers, approved sians, or both shall be installed and maintained when 

required by the fire code official. 

!03,4.l No PukJ11 l1 (Ire ..... shall be added H follows: No JH'1011 shall stop, park. or f taw, 

.standing any wlticl•. wlt•tlt•r altend•d or unatttnd1d, txc•pt wl11" ntets:sary to OW>ld co'!flict with 

other traffic or In complirmcl!. with th, dirttctions of tit. Fir, Chic!, or hulh,r duly aurJiorlz~d 

r,prt!StnlaRN. P,ac. Olftc.r or official traffic control d~tc, alr>ng 1111 «J11 of any highway, at a,iy 

curb, or in any localton In a publtcly or pri\lOt1/y owned or OJHra.t•d ojf-.street parking factlil)I, 

desipated <U afll"fl la1N by us• distn'ct witli j11risdic1ion owr tit• ona in wit/cl, tit, plact is locat,d. 

Tlr• daignotion sltall bl indicated(/) by a Jig,t postftl imm.lialrly adjacent to, Olld vuibltt/rom, tltc 

daipaJfd place clearly stat'1tg In liMn not la3 titan OM iltclt lit ,,.,,,., tltat tltc place Lr ajlr, Ian,. 
(1) by outlining or pailtti"I tli, place in red and. i1t conlTmtins color, ,narh11g tis, plact witlt tM 

Ordinance 2019.0l Page !5 

20-0203 L Page 9 of 52 



IW>M "FIRE UNE ', wlticJ, a,y d,ar(y i.•uibl«fro,,, a 1~/ticl,. or (3) hy a~ cwb or r.-d pai111 OIi 

tit• Nff of tli• roodw"y 11,x:m wltu:A u cl~arh, marhd tit• worth "FIRE LA.NE" 

S93,:4J No Parkllla lp Froat of Hydryb sh.all be added u follows~ No ,,.non ,1ta11 ,top. pork. or 

I~ .,tandillg an)' \'flticle 'ltlttltin I$ /ttt of a fl,.. hydrant uc•pt aJ Jol/oWJ (aj If th whu:lc ti 

attend•d by a l1unud dn'wr wlio u .rNt•d III tlt11 fro,tt uat and wlto can 1ntm#d1auly lltOW n,clt 

whicltt /,t ca,1 of n~u.1111)'. (b) If tit, l~htcle u own.-d or tJf>«rdlftl by aft,. d1partmcn1 and u ciNrly 

marlc«J as aflr, deparrment i'diicie 

503,1,1 fire Lages Based oa Road Wldtb shall be added as follows: Fire !aM.J ,hall b, btutd on 

road widtlt dS required in Appendu D as amended by tlti district. 

S03.5J [\re Appantu1 Acgg Gate, sha1J be added as follows: All automatic and Man&Ja/ fOleJ 

;,ma/1.d O\lff" fir« apparatus ace4Ss roads shall comply wrtlt the district gat, s1a1tdard as app,oy~ 

by tit• fir• cod• offi,·,al 

SUSiR• 50, tnaAH J4SPUOSldt• 
,05.1 Addrsu ld11dflcadop llha!I have the ftnt line of this paraanph amended u follows'. 

.1ddnu•1 for nriN aJtd uiJ"1tg butldmgs 1ltal/ complv wcth tA. dirtrict add,yss standard a.i approw,J 

by tit, ji,-. cod• olfidal 

scctjop 592 tJn frotccrioa w11cr SyppUe, 
,07.5,l Wltcrs Rsq1lml shall be amended as follow1: 400 feet shall be amended to 1 JO fur 

Chapter 9 

Sttdg• 903 Ua Spriakka 
91JJ W)ltq Rtqlljred shall be amended u follows: An approved autom&tic sprinkler system sltaJJ 

be rw,uir•d and 1,u1a/J,d i11 11.w bu1ldingJ QJtJ structwre, J600 sqvart /Ht or grw,tv wltm 

co,u'"'ctd or rdlocut~d wt1Jun tit• ;urisdicllon 4f deacribc:d in Sections 903 2.1 through 903.2.12. 

E1updon: Aanculniral building• not under a special use pennil UHd for commen:ial pwposes. 

90JJ• Wbtn B,qyk1d lhall be added as follows: Stalks of ai.rti1tf bMUdinfs gnat«r tltan J, 600 

sqwan/HI. lt1 u.isti111hMildtng13,600 squcir•JHI or gntatflr, ollr•r titan one GM rwo~fa,nlly dw«lling 

1111iU, o,rd 1qri<:11lrwroJ buUdi'n,s 1101 undtr sp«ial IUfl pcn,til for C'U#Pllflfl~laJ pwposu, wliVt thfl 

floor cna of II•• bvild1111 or Jtructun i.J incrNSd by an addillo1t of MOrW tlwrJt tltirty ~runt (JO".) 

or J. ()()() JfVclr-e J~et wltich,v•r u less, 111clt bvilding or Jtrvcn,n 1INIU ~ """"- to co,tform to S<lct1011 

903.2. 

M3.l.b Wll,a Raqlfrtd lha1I be added u follows: S'latJu of auti111 bwudinp /a, titan J. 600 

-f9"G" fat /11 aut1111 t..ildiltg1 J, 600 sqvan fttt or la.,.. OlMr ,- OltNJJtd two-family Jw.lling 

tudl.J. 4"" q,icvlnua/ bvlld~ no, imder Jp«iaJ ws~ ,,.,.,ut for COlfllflff'dal pwrpruu, wlwn tlt• 

Ordinance 2019.0 l Paaee 

20-0203 L Page 10 of 52 



floor arwi uf tit~ l,t.,1Jdi11g or stru, nu·t< u ir":rrust'<I to a total .1q1Jan footap. Ol/lltr J. 600 sqwan far,. 
by an add1no11 o/mort: dta11 tltirty p,r~n, f30%i or /, 000 .rq~ur• /tt:t wlriclt#\rr LJ ltw, n.clt b1,11Jd111g 

or sr,,.c~ 1/tall 1H madt 10 conforw, to S«t1<1t1 903. 1 

903.1,1 Gropp A shaJ be amended as follows for A aroups A· I tbroua)l A-4: 903 21 l (1) The fire 

area ac.eed.s 3. 6()() sqwa~ Jtt1 

9GJJ.J Gropp E shall be amended u follows: 9012.3 (I) lhruughout all Group E fire arcu greater 

than J, 600 1q11an fett in area. 

903,l,4 Group F-1 shall be amended as follows: 903.2.4 Group F. 903.2.4 (1) A Group F fire aret 

CJtcccds J. 600 squart: fut 

fflJ,7 Gn,p M shall be amended H tollowi: 903.2.7 Group Band M 903.2.7 {I} A Group Band 

M fire 11ea exceeds J. r,{J() square fr,r. 

903.ll,l Mgll[15Nrtd Homn shall be added .. foUmu. All ai.to,ncricf1rt: sprinlcltr syst~IIJ shall 

N Nlfllir«l itt all ~ manufacturrd ltomu and mulfifa,ni/y rrtottai{octurrd ho11WS int~r,d«/ for us« 

a.J a on,--0ttd rwo-fam,ly dwrll,ng. Tit« desip a,,d lrutallatfon of rwcli .1y,ttm1 sltaU 1H vr accordanc~ 

wcu. Califo,11,a Codt of Rrplations, nJI• 25, f,000 

bc:q,do,,1: 

l. Manufaclurrd hom,s /ocatf'd within an rxutirtJ mobtl•home parlr. complyini will, 

California Health and Soff'ty Code. D111tsion J J. Pan 2. I or 1, J. 

]. Manufactured homes that do n<H tuct!~ I, 1()() sq11afl! fnr in suf' and suv« a., an 

accessory ~/ling unit. as d•fin«i in Gow-mm""' Code S«tion 658501: whm th, 

,uut,ng p,.fmary f'd.fidm« on 1M proputy Ls 1'0t r1tq1,11red to comply ...,;,Ji California 

RnuJ,ntia/ Code S«tio" RJ I J l 

J Manufacturrd ltotMS tltat do Ml ucttd 110 .squant /HI ;,. siu. 

903.l.9 Gnup S-1 &hall be amend«i q folk>~: 90J 2 9 Group S. 903,2.9 {I) A Group S fire ll"CI 

exceeds J,6()() 1quarffju1. 

903.l.ll Group s-1 ydoNd tvMI• GlfllU &hall be amended as follows: 903.2.10 ( 1) Wh«R 

the fire area of the cnc:loled ~rkina aaraac exceeds J.600 squan1/nt. 

swtoa ?07 Ers Alu;m 114 Qgtlop sm,m, 
907.l.a DK• Btnlnd - Ng Bl,Ddl,a or Slnltl]l[tl l•H "'" 3.60G MIW ,.,, shall be added 

u follows: A1t approv<!d fir, alaf'ff11cktrction .rysttlm shall N i,utallttd in all l,s,ildinzs ~ a floor 

area less tllan 3, 6()() s~ /Ht 

Ordinance 2019.01 

B.,ccqdMu: 

I. O.W.. aNI ,..,.,.,_fa1,uly dweJli11g1 (R-3 Occupancies altd odt• occupancaa clauifl«J 

cu ··U"J 

Pase 7 

20-0203 L Page 11 of 52 



2. Agricultural buildings 11ot under special use permit and/or not used for commercial 

purposes (e.g .. retails sales, food service, and/or special events). 

3. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square fee, may be exempt, as determined 

by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, based on building 

construction material and features, location. occupancy type, and distance to 

exposures. 

907.2.b Status of Existing Buildings shall be added as follows: ln existing buildings without an 

approved automatic sprinkler system, other than one· or two-family dwelling units, agricultural 

buildi11g nut under special use permit for commercial purposes where a fire alarm detection system 

does not exist and the floor area of the building or structure is increased or modified by more than 

thirty percent (30%) or J, 000 square feet, whichever is less, such building or structure shall be made 

to conform to Section 907 when required by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative. 

Buildings with er floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined by tire Fire Chief, 

or his/her duly authorized representative, based on building construction materials and features, 

location, occupancy type, and distance to e:icposures. 

907.2.c Monitoring shall be added as follows: Al/fire alarm/detection systems shall be connected 

directly through and momtored by a U.L. upproved central, proprietary or remote station service, 

w/,icl, gives audible and visual signals al a constantly attended location. All sprinklered buildings 

shall be monitored. 

Exc,ptions: 

J. One- and two1amily dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified 

as "V'1, 

2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial 

purposes (e.g., retails sales, food service, a11dlor special events). 

907.2.d Type I Hood Installations shall be added as follows: The requirem,nt of installation, or 

replacemenl, of u 1'ype l llood System shall require a fire alarml.fprinkler monitoring system to be 

installed, or for the hood system to be connected to an e:icistingfire ulamllsprinkler monitoring system 

for that building. 

907.6.2.1 Secondary Power Supply shall be added as follows: Jn accordance with NFPA 72, the 

seco11dary power supply providing a minimum 24-/Jour power capacity under quie.mml load (system 

operating in a non-alarm condition) shall be amended to a minim11m 7 2-ho11r power capacity. 

Ordinance 2019.01 

Exttption: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed the 

requirements of California Fire Code Chapter J 2. 

Pages 

20-0203 L Page 12 of 52 



Chapter 12 

Sutlog 1103 Em,c111cr aqd St11dbr Po•« Snt•m1 
UOl,lJ &U!lll•U9A ahall be amended u fo:low~ Emeraency power sy,tems and standby power 

sy,1cm, shall be installed in accordance with the Cahfomia Buildina Code, the California F.lectric 

Code, NFPA 110 and NFPA 11 L All buildi"f.s. oth•r titan o,w. mtd rwofamily dwtt1"11111111/J, and 

a,cr,cu/tural buildm1s not u.ud/or cnmrnrrc,al purpos~J. Wldi Jtandby po"IWr, sJiall Jiaw a sltwnt trip 

drvtc• t4at duconn•cu all~ soc,,ce., to tlr• bu,Jd,,.g. approl'ed by tlrt! /irt! code offic/{II Exi.rtmg 

uurallatimt.r .1Jtal/ b• mointained in ar:cordanu with tll• or,ginal approval. 

Chapter 33 

Scgg JJJO Acsee for flnflchttac 
"19:J Po•w ldtntiftgtloa shall be added H follow,; Prior to a'9d dunnr co,utrud1un, un 

approYrd addf'e.!J Jifn shall b« prrn1ided at .aclr fin alld cmcrxmcy veh,cl• OCC"eSS road fntry Into 

''" pro/«l. 

Stcdot lJJl w,,u Supply ror fin Pro1,cdo1 

3311.l Wlltg l\tg11lrtd ahaU be amended aa follows: Prior to combwtihl• matmalJ amvmg on 

sill, tit• firw !tydralft -...v,.,. syst•m sltoll !H lristall.d and m41,ua1Md 11, COlfWruow opuation T1te 

(JIROU"' of KGIB '"Pp{•#d Jlro// ntffl llt• r,quirtdfirr f1014· for tlt• proj«I 

Chapter 49 

StctJog 49G3 Ply1 

4903.1 W)eu Jleqglncl shall be added as follows~ Tit, /iN cod, offic,al of tit, PIO May nqwin 

d,wlop,,tffll proJ«ts locar~ ill J.iod,ratt, High and V ery-lllrlt Ftrv1 HaUJrd S.wnty Zo1tu to 1ub,,.;1 

fi,.. proltttlot1 pla" Tlt/.J plan .rha/J ~ approwd by botlt rlt, firr cod, uf!icial o1td tlN aulliorual 

rttpranttali~ for tit, loet1/ CAL FIRE l.l1,it Clt11/ (I/ Jocat«J i" ,.. Slat• Rapo,uibiltty Ar,a { SIU}) 

prior ro tit. rw;ord11t11 oft~ fi,taJ ,..ap ft1r tli, projttt hy tit• C111mty of El Dorado. 

Stcttop 4905 WHdtlp Prottcdog By11d1H Coutructigp 
1205,1 Roof Councu,, Bnvkfllt•q lheU be added II follows All ,ww a>11.1trwn011.. utChldi"' 

addlao,u, rw,vir&J a C lou A roof cowrl1tf or a.u,mbly_ A II,..· roofat, reqi,ire.t Clau A roof cownng 

or (UJfftbly a.J a mit1imun1 R,-roofina ill UC,SJ of 50k of a,i UISW"II J'"'CI\U'f wjtJw, any OIW 'Y«JT 

p,,riod wtll Mccuua,, tltal rlta mnn roof IHI a Cla.sJ A roof CO\ISl'lftR or ass01bly GS o "'"'"""'"

Clas.s B or C jl,-. ,..,ardHnl trtotH alfll or """-lr'Hll'd wood sltaM or slti1t1lu are "°' appro,,..J ar 

a roof coYCrln1 MOt•nal for Ckw A a.uCftb/y. 

Ordinance 2019.01 hp9 

20-0203 L Page 13 of 52 



Chaprn ,o 
Sulit• 5001 Gs1101 
50fl,7 P•hfUtt (or PIIIIISI lhtll be added u follows· A1ty damag~s or cost ,-e,su/ting from tJ,f! 

canlLu lsandlilt6. s,nll or di.Jdarg• of any Jwzardow mat11rials shall conshtwent debt aram11 Qlf}' 

sud, prrson, firm or co,.porollmt cawing Juch sptll or dascharge 11ris thbl i.J co/J«rib~ by rlt, Fir, 

( 'lt1•f or ltu/1t., dMl)I CJUlltorlzfti ~p~u111ati-.:c, in tlt• sam11 manner m U'I rlt11 COJII of an t>bligano" 

wthr contra<t. uprv,d or implied 

Chapter !6 

S1ctlo1 5ffJ Gstifll 
Sffl.2 Pumit Rcqptrtd s.bt!l be amended u follow, Permits shall be requi.red aa tet fonh in 

Section 10S.6 and re(lUJated i.n accordance w1th thi1 Ketion Wll•r• c.tp/wil._.J ,,-rmit.:1 an rn,wired. 

tlt,y sltall be is.rued by Ut/1 F" CJ1111f. or J,i.tl1,11r duly autltonud n,,,-.s,,uattw, attd tlt, EJ Dorado 

County Shwriffs l.HpartlJlttnl W1tu, firn.ork.J JH"'"'-' an rrquind. ,,ury sltal/ bf issued by tit, Fir11 

Clti11f, or lti.tlli~ dtJyau1ltoru«d f"ftpru111t1atr~. 01td tlt11 El Dorado Cow,ty Board o/Su~rviso,.s. 

S601J, l Docymt1S1Jlt1 $h.all be added II foUow, T1t11 AH.I 11talt 1taw th• authority to nquut 

docum,mtation ,..,arrlln1 all asJHcLr of tit, firrv.'Orb prtt111ntario11. 

5§01,l.l ProPdftvY lp(ormadog ahall be added H follov.1. n.~ AH.) wtll prot~ct aJJ proprlttary 

informntion 

Chapter 57 

kUoA 5791 scor,u 
57HJ,t,6.l Loyd911 W_v, Aboyt-Groupd I11M ID Prtll(blltd shall be amended II followa: 

Stonp of Class [ and Clus 11 flammable liquids in abovc-if'Ound t1nlca oottide ofbuildinp ia prohibited 

IINU3 appn,\lff/ b)' t1- Fin Chief. or htsllt•r ch,ly authorurd ~•nltUIW. Wwll ,,-n,1111,d by th« 

Firw CJ,ief. or J,iJANr duly authorufd ,..prf.tllltatiw, oil oboYt ,rou,td wnk(1) M YOll/t i1111allotion.r 

for tit/I Jtorage of Cltu1 I. II or 1/J flammabl• o.rtd rombwtibJc> liquldJ Jltal/ cowtply wltlt rlto.,• 

rtq11irow1tU cU ttl fonlt by tltt California Fir. Cod•. '111• Califo,,,ia Fil"f Cod• sliaJ/ obo apply to 

installations 04INr tAalt "'°'°' wllicl• fwl du,,.nslng stotioru WMN lll>ow-,rou,td JIOl'Qlf is ryq11ind. 

ass*• $'.M SPISMI PNc•llt• 
f706J,i,1 Logdpaa Wun AbtttGro11d Inu v• Problblttd shall be amc:odod u follows: 

Seonao of Claa l and Clau 11 flammable liquids In above-around taDkl outside of builctinp ii 

prohibited wt1/cJs approv«I by u.. Fl,. Cltief. or lai.slltlll' dvJy at1dtoriud ~Mlali"'I. wi..,, 

,,-mtlttftl by tJw Fw Clt1,f. or lwA•r dtJy tn1lltorizd rwp,wse1tati..,., all abow f"Otllld ttutkfs) or 

Ytlldt i,urallouo,u for tM Stomrf of Class I. ll or /JI /lOIMttlble and cofftbt.tJtiblt liqwith 1/tall comply 

Ordinance 2019.01 Pase 10 

20-0203 L Page 14 of 52 



with tltost1 r-rqui,vmt1nfJ tU 1t1t .forth by lltt1 C all/on,ia Firt1 Cod,, T1tt Cal,forn,a Fin Codt1 shall also 

apply (0 1,utallations otJta tJta,, "'OIOr i"*J11c/t1 fut1/ dlJ/HfUing JIQIIOIU w/ten CJboW·f"OUnd JIOfOftl 

u req111rN 

Cbapccr 58 

ktlop 5806 flteefble CQOJWC Flylds 
580f,l Umjtatjo11 shall be unended as follows: Storage of flammable cryoacnic fluids in 51.alionary 

containers outside: of buildings is prohjbiled unlus approi·.d by th, Fire Clti,f. or his/Im dwly 

autltoruwf r,prest111tariw, W,,m permitted by tht1 Fir, Cluef. or Jusihtr duly cwthorlud 

r,pre.untatiw, all ili>tionary containt1rs for th, storap of Jlammabl, c,yogt1Tic fluids shall comply 

w11Jt tltoJt1 r~irrmenr.1 a.i ut forth by tJr, Califor1Tia Fir, Code T1tt1 CaJifor1fia Firw Code 11tall also 

app/r to inJta/lat,ons o,Js,r titan motor wh1clt1 fa;/ di.Jpt,uing ttarionr wher, abow:-ground storage 

ur~.,,~ 

Chapter 61 

Sectio• Utt Logtioa or LP-G11 co11t111n 
6104.l M11tww Capacity wlthlg EJtabl11laed Llmlll shall be amended a& !oUows, Thtt J/OTUflcP 

of liqwtrfitld f¥lrolt1Um fflJ in o.cus of an aggregat• of]. ()()().,al/on wallr capacity wht1n locat,d at 

[ea,l one-lta/f (} 12) 1nllt1 from property zoned er designat~d for rtsid•rt1la/ i.u• Md at Ila.JI on,.Jw(f 

(ll2) milt/rom uuling nsidtnhol dt1velopment with a de,u1n· great•r titan on• (I) clw<elling u11il p,r 

acr. 01fd al l11Wt an•·ltal/ (112) milt from any !Iott/ or mot•/ is al/ow«J wltm AHJ approved. and a 

1~ioVcondllional iutt permit is is~ed by Utt COMnt)' of El Dorodo 

Dup«nstlff witltin t.JtabliJlted 11,,1111, Witlrin lit• l11'1:'U atabluJtffi by /m..• rcstrictmg tit• dupenion of 

liqM•fa"1 ptlroln"'' ,ai for tit• prol«llon of heavily popuiat«J or congar.d anas, tlttr agzrqate 

capacity of any on• i,utallallon 1/tall no1 ucttd a .....at,r capacity of],()()() gallons. 11t• du~nsinr 

of /lqwfi~ ~trvl.um gru in acuJ of an aangate of 2,()0() .. gal/on l4l0l.,. capacity wlt•n loca1td 

at least on~ltalf (112) ,,11/t1 from pr-opt1rty zOMd or des11na1,d for ~sld,ntinl w.r, and al /caJ1 oM

ltalf (/ fl) milt from a Luing r-.f1dt1ntial d,velopment witlt a dt1n.rity grftal•r titan oM (I) dw.tU,11g 11n11 

J>eF aet'f, and at l.ast on•-ltalf ( J ll) milt from any Jtott1/ or mot•/ iJ aJlo.,.,'t!d wht,1 AHJ approwd and 

a spcd0Vconditi01tal wn P"'rmit Lt iJswd by t>tc County of El Dorado, 

ssuto• 61 ll W,ll Acudt• Ugpdled Pttroley• Gu ltMePMJol! (5JPOO:foot AhDU9AI pd 

mw ab&ll be added u ro11ow,: 

ti ll,l Bnllltoa lbaU be ldded u follows: 

Two-Jtap rwplator .Jy,,I• 1ltall btl i,uto/1«1 Ln accordance witlt manll[~hlru ~tJ 

Two...rtap rqulator SJ11lfMI Jlta/1 btl i,utallH on all LJ>G in.rtallatioru. 

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 11 

20-0203 L Page 15 of 52 



Thttfirst stage ngulator sltal/ I>, installed 111tdu tltt hing~d gaup cowr supp/red with thtt tan*. Tilt 

atmospheric pressure ~nur, of the regulmor shall btt point1d dow,rward. l'ht first stage r,ga,lator 

shall I>, plumNd to tltt ,.iJ,,. of tht yard piping with Jo/I cop/Hr 11,blng to aJlow Jluibf/ity should tank 

shifting occur. The ristr from the yard piping shall tu locat~d not rnor, than 3 incites (horizontally) 

from tlre walls of the tank. 

The second stage N!plator and ristr pipe shall ~ installttd und,r th• ,aw of tit, building. as clostt 

as practicable to thtt building wall. 7'hi.s ri.ur slialt lu .rtcurtly .rupportN!brac«I to tli, wall 

approximately IO inches l>,low the regulator .ro as to prevent be"ding of tli, piJn by Ja,,rol snow/ice 

toads. 

A protective cOYtr, approved by the gas supplier and Building Official. shall i>, 1,utatl.d ovv ti,, 

second stage regulator and securely .fupp<>ned lo the ground or diagonally to tit, -waJJ. 

T1it ruer pip«S for die yard piplng shall not be em!Hdded in concrttte. Cont:~te placftd nround such 

ri.Hr shall be held back at least J inch from all sides of th• pipe. 

Af tit~ ri'm~ of npplicntion for miy building p,rmit, wl,iclr in\lONt'.J tlrt instnllnsion of m, LPG syst,m. 

th, applicant shall submit an LPG system plot plan in J copies (or digitally a., PDF) 11t• LPG plot 

plan shall irtclud,:, bUl not 1H limited to, rht tank. location, proposed tanJc capacity in U.S gallOllJ, 

rout• of yard piping. location of the riser pipe al th,: building. pro~rty boundaries, aJtd an olllliM of 

all extstinglproposed buildings o" the lot and a depict1on of tltf! ridge/in, of any building to be 

suppli«J with LPG. Tlris sltall also 1H forwarded to tJ,,: nppropriat, firr di.Jtnct lo urwt a.s a locator 

map in ,wnt of a,r emerpncy. 

location of the c,nrerlin, of LPG tank$ shall be ~rmanf!1ttly rnarked by Ult w,: of u,ow stakes. on, 

at •acl, •nd. Stich stakes sltall I>, of suffici,nt !t,ight to be vi.rible thro11gh antkipat.d maximum .mow 

d,:prlt al tit• rup«tiw location. /,utallation and maintenance of thue S'IOW st4kcs ar, rite 

responsibility of th• (.PG us,r. 

Propan, appl,an«s and on-.sso,.,·u shall not be permitt~ in any new inslal/aJion below tJ,,: first 

floor or ~low grad,, wliiclt.wr is more rcstrictiw. 

6111,2 Verttcal 81Kr PIDl11 aha!I be added as follows: 

Minim11m of SclteclMI~ 80 - iro1t pJpina. 

r,,, risu shall N witltUt J btcltcs horizontally of tit, tanlc. 

Sw,ni joints sltall b4I lnsltJ/lld abo\11 a1td /Hlow lank J,wl to providt for tllf tank mowmcnt (Srrttt 

elbows sltall not tu w«l). 

A liJtfti flaib/,: ri.ttr consrrMctttd of copp,r or 11ainlcss-s1ul tubi1tB and prot«ted by :14el co\llf'fd 

sh11atltld material may b4I wnd in.,Nad of.rwtn1/oin1J. Tlrtflo:ibl• alt.matiw .sliall provide .sufficient 

s/aclc to allow for tank mavemffll. 

6111.3 Matk&PI 1ad Loc1ti911 ablll be added u follows: 

Ordinance 2019.01 Pqe12 

20-0203 L Page 16 of 52 



A11 appro,~ sign Jltall b« IOC<1tnl dlrN:tly abow lht nstr sin.I off vafre on the b&ii/d1ng in a YiJiblt 

loca11on. 

11,, IUlwfi«I p#trolnmt gas JMJ)plicr :sltal/ affix a Y."10thcrpr()l)j 1dmt1/icanon iq ro rlt• uutd• of 1h11. 

tank valw PrQt«ting CO\ll!T. 11,u ra, .rlta/1 co11tdin dt• .rupp/1,r·s lldm• tJltd •m11.~"".Y ttl,phont 

1111,,,bcr. 

Tank uutallanon s"4/I ~ ~nnantntly markld by a m•tal or ~ rrtar,nal 1now mart,,, with n 

mmimam, di11Wnsion of 2 uiches by 2 inchc.r, TM snow mar-Mr .rhall be of swffic1tnt it,ight to riJf 

abow tlic aNtual J,tQw d1.pth and shall b• a minimum of IO /ttt i11 htight 71,11. snow ntarlten 1hal/ 

b« pamt~ y,1/ow and locatftl on opposift ,ndJ of tit, tank. 

$ttdo161 ll \J1dst1ro1gd LPG Taply J11J1P1Uou u4 °"''""P lb.all be added as follows: 

611311 brmlt1 apd PlHI &hall be added II follows: p,,..,,.,u 1JiaJJ ~ nq"irttl. and plarr.r sl,a/1 b« 

n1bmin.-d for all 11nd1.,vo1md ltlnJc 1turaila1toru as a.pprcr.wJ by tA. AH.I 

6113,1 YUKltPIM LPG l11k QusuMR lhlll be M5ded .. follows: Undtr,round LPG lank.J 

11t:all be proltihltttlfrom b«tng Joid to nid,wc,1 Md 1/tall l,c, r,/0111.d by tltc LPG company M1td,,. a 

lf!ill'ft·fyp. xysl~m tu fflJ1Ue' Pl"flf'4!' unlflluf mu111111nunc11 'nf"''ffnflnu ,v-. m•l alfd rw1.:vnl1td 

Chapter 10 

Cbapttr 801 NfPA llD 417 R~iduiriolfir, sprint/er .1ystmu 1,utal/.d in all MW ont...:,nd rwofa,n,/y 
dlwlliJtgJ sltall 111J/iu a "Passiw PM,p" f)'St~m ~sign wnli,u othtrw•u approwd by tit« Ftn Cod, 
Of!ic,al. ~,ptlo•: Manwfactu,...d Ao"'~ installed. tttJtcd and approwd by tit, uzlifornia !Hparl!P1t1t1 of 
llousi111 and Community lHwlop,w"t 

Sudot IQ, Nt'FA, IJQ-Jt - Stydanl [or tbs 1ptapag99 pf Sod.kc Systyy '8 Oat:•M In 
(tmDy Qmlllpf1 9pd Maaffls;lJ[td BDIIICI N Yladd 903,),IJ, 903.J.S 
NFPA l3D, Amtackd S«ttoas •• followl: 

RevtH Secdoa 5.1.J.l to rMd •• ~,: 

Chlpter BG. NRA l3D. 5,1.l.l A n,ppry of at l.ast on, of,aclt r,,,. and lf'"{MNJtur, .,prinkkr w.std 

witltbt tltf p,-mists slt,a/1 t.. M0111uri1t~ on th, f)f"Optrty at an apprvwd location. Slock rprinJcltrs 11tall 

M hpt in a ,nowt11d QM/ occw,bl, cabin,,. 

Revise Section 7.6 to nad u followt: 

Cllapter H, N(PA llD1 Z,6 A local water flow alarm sJiall b, provided on all fin spnn!l,, J:YJIHU in 

ltolMt OJ °" oppn,Wid l«oliOII °" tM uNrlor of :Ji, dw,/ling. 

Rtvise Sectioa 11.1.1. l a. nad u follows: 

cuw ... NRA up. l lJ,l,1 Where I fire department pumper connection is not provided. the 

syitem shall be hydr'Olllbc&lty laled at o mi11ut111m prcmlrt of/ $0 pototds per...,.,.. iltClt P"I' for no 

Ordinance 2019.01 Paae 13 

20-0203 L Page 17 of 52 



less I/ran a 30-minute duratio,, without evtdence of leakage. Such test shall be witnessed by the fire code 

official. 

Appendb B - Fire Flow Requirements for Bulldlng1 

Table B105.JU) Required Fire Flow ror Ogt- ind Two-Family Dwelllgv, Group R-31 and R-4 
Bulldi.gn agd 'fowgbousg shall be amended as follows for elevations below S,000/eet: 

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FLOW 

CALCULATION SPRINKLER FIRE.- DURATION 

ARI.A SYSTEM FLOW (houn) 

(lqHreffft) (Desi1n (J1Uoa1 per 
Standard) minute) 

O-J,600 No a11tom1ric 1,000 I 
sprin):lcr system 

3,601 &nd arutcr No automatic Value tn Dw111lan in 
sprinkler ll)'Jtcm Table Table 

BI 05.l (2) B IOS.1(2) II 

!he required 
fin.now l"IIC 

0-3.600 Section 903.3.1.3 IOO lot 

of die CA Fire J,000 I 
Code o, Section 
313.3 of the CA 
Residential Code 

3,601 and peater Section 903.3.1.3 1/2 value of • 
of the CA Fire Tablo 1 
Code or Soi:tion 8105.1(2) 

31:tJ of the CA (11tbt, /()()() 

Residential Code GPN) 

'l'ablt B105.2 Regwred Fire Flow for BulldJRK• otber tbaa Oge- agd Two-FamUy 
QwelliPII: Group R-3. and 1H B1lld111s apd Towgboys• sbaU be amended as follows: 

AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER MINIMUM 
SYSTEM FIRE-FLOW 

(De•a• Stand1rd) (11Uoa1 per 
naJnute) 

No auU>maric sprinkler system Value In Table 
8105.1(2) 

Section 903. 3, I. l of the CA Fn aAI. .10k of the wlue 
Code In Table BI OS. I (2} • 

Section 903.3. 1,2 of tho CA Flrl ~ SD'6 of the value 
Code (Ollly applta to f«allolu In Table 8105.1(2) 

Nlow J.000.ft,ot t/1WJdo11) 

b. The reduced fire Row 1h1II not be leu lhan 1,500 apm 

Ordinance 2019.01 

FLOW DURATION 

(laours) 

D11rttion In Table 
BIOS.1(2) 

Duration in T1bh 
BI OS, I (l) at the Tlduced 
ftowr11e 

Duration in Table 
810$.1(2) It the nduc.cl 
flow rate 

Pqe 14 

20-0203 L Page 18 of 52 



Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Acce11 Roads 

S,ctlop D103 Minimum Speclftcattop1 

D103.l Access Road Wldth with a llydnpt shall be amended as follows, adding the exception: 

Exception: Drive,,vays 

D103.2 Grade shall be amended as follows; Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not 

exceed J 5,9% in grade unless approv«i by the AHJ or by the El Dorado County amended California 

Public Resource Code Title U I Desig11 and Improvement Standards Manual. 

Exception: Elevation above 5,000 fut sliaJJ not exceed 12%. 

0103.J '[urplog Radius shall be amended as follows: The minimum tumin& radius shall be 

dctennined by the fire code official; a,rd sltall nor include curb and gutter, 

D103.S Fire Appantps Access Road Gates shall be amended as follows: Subsection (/): Wlrere a 

Jingle gate Lr provided, the gate widtlt shall be not /en than 20 Jtet (6096 mm). Whue o fire 

appararus road consists of a divided roadway, the gute widrh .vhall not be k.v.s titan Jj fttl (4J11 

mm). 

D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet Ip wjdtb shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as specified in 

Section D103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that arc 20 to 29 feet wide 

(6096 to 8534,4 nun). 

Exet1pdon: Elevations abo'V't! 5,000 ft. as determined by the A.HJ. 

D103.6.2 Road1 more tllap 22 feet la Width shall be amended as follows: Fire ltne signs as 

specified in Section D103.6 shaU be posted on one side of tin, apparatus access roads more than 29 

feet wide (8534.4 mm) IIJld less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm). 

Exc•pdon: Elevations abov, J,O<JOft as d,terminM by tlr,A..HJ. 

D1Q4,4 Ctrcpmfuydal Fire Apparatus Access Roads shall be added as follows: W71.n rr,qutr«J 

by the fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall b. constrwcttd to encompass the entirety 

of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle acC&ts. 

SECTION 4: CONFLICT 

That Ordinance No. 2016-37 of the PIO, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances herewith are hereby 

repealed. 

SECTION 5: SEVERABILIT\' 
If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or phnse ofthis code, or 

any application thereof: is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, sudl decision 

shall not affect the remainina provisions of this code. which can be &iven effect without the invalid portions and. 
therefore. such invalid portions are declared to bo severable. The PIO hereby declares that il would have enacted 

Ordinance 2019.0J Plp15 

20-0203 L Page 19 of 52 



.. 

th.ii Ordinan« and c.ac.h of ats aniclet, teet1ons, subsections, or rubdivisioM thereof, prov111ons, scn1cnccs, 

cl1ute1 or phrucs i.rrcapecnvc of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid. 

S!CTJON 6: EFF£CJJY[ DATE AND PUBLICATION 

This Ordm&.'l.::c shall lake d'fccl du:ty (JO) days after its ldop(ion. The PIO Board So;mary is directed to publish 

this orduwu:c 1n • r.ewspeper of aencnl circul&tioa in the DistricL In lieu of publication of me full tcx1 of the 

ordiNncc, 1 ,umm.ary o( !he orduaO(c may be published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (IS) day, 

atter its pauaae and a cerJfied copy sh.all be posted in the office of the PIO pursuant to Go\~n,m~n, Cod« s«M" 

169JJ(c:J (/). 

The above Ordinance wu introduced at I meetin1 of the Board of Dincton of the PIO on Octo~ 17, 2019, and 

it was then read for the ftnt time. A public heanna wu .set for the Ordinance to be read for the second time on 

November 21, 2019 aod approved by the following vote: 

PASSED AND ADOPTED b>' the Board of Direclors oflhc PIO lhia, l L. ~ day ofN~c. ... ~t..'1...., 2019. 

AYES: 

NOES: 

ABSENT: 

ABSTAIN: 

Marie fins, Bo.rd Cbau 

Ordinance 2019.01 Pap 1e 

20-0203 L Page 20 of 52 



MQT&PIO 

FreCode# 
S1gr1f1cant 

What Is tl·e Chaoge? 
Lccall; adopted Ism adopted I 

Why Is There a LocJI Cha··,ge? 
change? Amended 

101.1 N Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Administrative need 

LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than 

Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate air and can eas~y be trapped under a home, if ignited it can 

105.6.27 y quantily not exceeding 125 gallons serving Locally adopted and amended lead to an explosion. At elevations above 5000 feet there is 

occupancies in Group R-3. an inaeased risk accompanied with significant historical fire 
activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional 
attention. 

' 
Adopting this section to allcr.v for the creation and Issuance 

106.6 N Add section Locally created and adopted 
of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines 
pennits, plan checks, and inspections as allowed. in Health 

. . . &Safety Code 1795t 

106.6.1 N Add section Locally created and adopted . 
Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to 
the Fire Disbict 

106.7 y Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106. 7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspections by contractors. 

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District 
is added to read as follows: 
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines • The intent of this 
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an 

109.4 y Added section 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals 
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County of El Dorado's 
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals 
timeline. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that 

portions that were not completed by the SFM. II is protects life and property. Fees have been updated to 
110.4 N 

better left lo localities to determine the 
Locally adopted and amended match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the 

fees/penalties for their respective areas. District Attorney's Office. The change to the language to 
include the t811TI infractions. 

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s), 

110.4.2 N 
Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before 

Locally aealed and adopted 
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 

but under a different number) violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health and Safety Code of the state of California and 
Chapter Sc (commencing with section 853.6) of Tide 3 of 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 

112.4 N 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 

LocaHy adopted and amended All violations of the code have been consolidated under 
better left to localiUes to det811Tiine the Section 110.4 to include the penalties for violations. 
fess/penalties for their respective areas. 

Added definitions for. Campfire, Drtveway, District, 

202 N Added definiUons for clarity Locally aeated and adopted 
Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd 
Manager. Definition of campfire shall not include LPG or 
Propane fueled appliances. 

302.1 N Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally aealed aid adopted Added definition for darity 

307.4.4 through Due to the high fire danger that exists in El Dorado County 

307.4.4.2 (d) 
y Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopted we have written more sbingenl rules pertaining to open fires 

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas. 

20-0203 L Page 21 of 52 



.. 

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical 
dearance of 15 feet provides proper dearance for 
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus 
oomponents. It also allows an extended time frame before 

503.2.1 N 
Changed vertical dearlinces to 15 feet and road Loca1iy adopted and amended 

having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Addilional 

widths to 20 feet. 
tieight for vegetation dearances acts as an inaeased buffer 
for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of 

I•. 
1., should.ills, as measured face or aJJb to face of culb is 

needed: These structures can be difficult to navigate with 

I 
fire apparaius and should not be counted in the total 
drivable road sumice 
I:. 

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the 
Fire apparatus require areas for turning around when 

503.2.5 N Fire Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations to 
Locally adopted and amended 

multiple vehides are on the scene of an emergency. This 

match as they require turnarounds for fire apparatus 
indudes fire vehides as well as civilian vehides. Provides 

access roads and driveways. 
better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum 
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated 
Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendix D of the 

503.2.6 N Surfaces to slate and match El Dorado County Locally adopted and amended 
current Fire Code whichever is more resllidive to be 

Transportalion Division instead of MSHTO HB-17. 
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an 
alternate means & methods that is not less restrictive than 
the Fire Code. 

503.4.2 N Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes Locally created and adopted 
This section dearly defines the 'No Parking in Fire Lanes· 
rules and is consistent with the California Vehide Code. 

503.4.3 N 
Added section regarding no parking in front of 

Locally created and adopted 
This section dearly defines the 'No Parking in front of fire 

hydrants 
hydrants' rules and is consistent with the California Vehide 
Code. 

503.4.4 N 
Added section regarding fire lanes based on road 

Locally created and adopted 
This section dearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D 

width 
as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire 
lanes. 

Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain Allows fire districts the authority to approve gales on 

503.5.3 N 
emergency access and consistency through all 

Locafly created and adopted 
roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing 

roadway gales in El Dorado County, refening to the the best possible emergency access to maintain fast 
gate standards adopted by the FPO's. response times. 

505.1 N 
Added section pertaining lo the visual addressing of 

Locally adopted and amended 
Allows Fire disbicts the authority lo approve addressing 

buildings based on the District's addressing standards. 

Added more con581Vative standa!d for the 
Commercial propenies are required to install hydrants at 

507.5.1 N placement of hydrant and lheir relationship to Locally adopted and amended 
300 foot inteivals, thus they should never be outside of 150 

oommercial buildings 
feet from any given hydrant at anylime (half the distance in 
between), 

Due to the topographic, dimatic. and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their conbibuling factors to our 

Adds a requirement ior sprinkler system installation increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2 N in new buildings and striJctuies 3,600 square feet or Locally adopted and amended double in size' each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

greater within ttie district. to be installed In structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread, ·-· 

Due to the topographic, dimatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement (or existing buildings greater 
of 8 Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

903.2.a N 
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they 

Locally created and adopted 
Increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

add more lhim 30% a-1,000 square feet to the 
double in size each and every minute, we ~ sprinklers 

structure, whichever Is less .. 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet In size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 

•. 
spread. 

.. . 

20-0203 L Page 22 of 52 



Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds occupant protection for existing buildings less 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2.b N 

add more than 30% Of 1,000 square feet to the 
Locally created and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

structure, whichever is less. 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behaviOf and rate of 

... ,· spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
· . . . of El DOf8do County and their contributing factors to our 

·. These sectloris were created to give specific increased response times, along with the fact that fires 903.2: 1, 903. 2. 3, 
9()3.2.4, 903.2.7 

N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each arid every minute;. we require sprinklers 
occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 

feet in size as they relate to fire behaviof and rate of . 
spread. 

Manufactured Homes - The intent of this code section is to 
ensure that manufactured homes that S81V8 as a one or two 
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar 

This section was created lo include manufactured 
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban 

903.2.8.2 y residential single family R-3 in the residential Locally created and adopted interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption 

sprinkler program due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The 
rapid fire spread throughout these sllUctures presenls a 
significant risk lo their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk 
successfully in many California communities. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their conbibuting factors to our 

These sections were created to give specific increased response iiines, along with the fact that fires 
903.2.9, 903.2.10 N direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behaviOf and rate of 
spread. 

Added occupant protection fOf fire alarms In 
buildings with a ffOOf area less than 3,600, except 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that R3, AG buff dings not used for commercial 
907.2.a N 

purposes, and buildings with a ffOOf area of less Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Depa,tment notification in 

than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code the event of a fire Of smoke. 

official. 

Added occupant protection for existing buildings 
Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.b N 
without automatic sprinkler systems to install a fire 

Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
alarm if they add mOfe than 30% or 1,000 square 

the event of a fire or smoke .. feet to the structure, whichever is less. 

Added occupant protection by stating all fire alarm 
detection systems installed shall be connected to a Provides proper emergency notification. for occupancies that 

907.2.c N monitoring service that notifies the fire department Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Deplir1ment noliflcation in 
upon activation and ,s installed per Section 907 of the event of a fire Of smoke. 
the fire .code. 

Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood Provides proper emergency notification for 6caJpancies that 
907.2.d N systems to be connected to a monitored fire alarm Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

system when installed or replaced. the event of a fire Of smoke. 

907.6.2.1 y Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply 
Locally created and adopted 

Amend to 72 hour capacity for beck-up power due to PG&E 
Modification safety related power outages. 

Shunt trip power safety devices Localiy adopted and amended 
This secti0!1 adds a Shunt Trip pow,er shut off devices to 

1203.1.3 N ensure eriieigency power shut off during the use of back-up 
·.· . pa«ersupp11es · · · ·· · 

3310.3 N Address requireirienls for construction sites Locally created and adopted 
Addressing for construction sites is lniportn to assist 
iesporlllrig emergency crews, . · 

20-0203 L Page 23 of 52 



3312.1 N 
Waler supplies at construction sites wilh 

Locally adopted and amended 
Water must be on site prior to combustible material being 

combustible materials on-site stored or vertical construction commencing. 

El Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout 

4903.1 
This section was created to include Fire Protection y LocaHy created and adopted 

lhe county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire 
Plan for all fire hazard severity zones. Protection Plan due to dimatic, geological, and 

topographical conditions. 

This section darifies that within the boundaries of El Dorado 

4905.4 y Added a section to darily roof construction 
locally created and adopted 

County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are 

requirements 
wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be 
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly. 

5001.7 
Any damages or costs from negligent practices that 

Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate. 

y cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a locally created and adopted 
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 

cost recovery fee. 
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on lo the 
negligent parties. 

Added safety protection with permits being issued 
Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and 

5601.2 N 
by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for 

locally adopted and amended 
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of 

fireworks to approve them and have a dear understanding 

Sup81Visors for fireworks. 
of the applications they will be used for. 

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any 

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 
FirewOll<s companies or vendors shall make 

documentation induding timing and proprietary information 

N available all requested documentation pertaining to Locally created and adopted 
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they 

the fireworll presentation 
deem necessary. This information is understood to be 
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as 
such. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5704.2.9.6.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fre Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
SpeciaVConditional Use Permit from the County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5706.2.4.4 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid special 
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval 
and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County. 

Administrative need to add District name. Established limits 

5806.2 N 
Administrative adation of District name. 

as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable 

Established limits as set forth In the Fire Code 
Locally adopted and amended Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ 

approval and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the 
County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code Official for 

5806.2.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted and amended locaUy 
Flammable Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. 
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

Establishes distances between LPG storage and 
dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential 

Estabiished limits for LPG storage and dispensing 
6104.2 N Locally adopted and amended 

developments and high-density hotels, motet, apartments, 

near or adjacent to residential development 
etc. where a release by leak or explosion oflP-Gas would 
have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death. 
Requires AHJ approval and a SpeciaVConditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

20-0203 L Page 24 of 52 



. 

···,; 

6112.1 

6112.2 

6112.3 

6113.1 

6113.2 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 Section 

5.1.1.2 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 Section 7.6 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 Section 

11.2.1.1 

Appendix B: Table 
8105.1(1) 

Appendix B: Table 
8105.2 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

y 

y 

y 

Y· 

N 

N 

Establishes propane regulator requirements for 
locations above 5000 foot elevation Locally aeated and adopted 

Establishes propane vertical riser pipe requirements • Locally aeated and adopted 
above 5000 foot elevation 

.. 

1:stab11shes propane marking and location 
requirements above 5000 foot elevation 

Pennits 111d plans shaU be submitted and approved 
by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction). 

Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the 
property or the LPG company 

NFPA 13D·16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the 
District has been amended to update various 
provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler 
systems in one-and two-family dwellings 

To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler 
system minimizing damage 

Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation 

System test to a pressure of 150 p.s.i. 

Changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot 
eiWcltioii, to niaich fire flow precedents used in 

~C>Cforyeaif · . ··.. •. ··•·· . · 
Established a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM, 
below 5000 foot eievation, for all commercial 
prq~ 

Locally aeated and adopted 

Locally aeated and adopted 

Locally aeated and adopted 

SFM Adopted and amended locally 

SFM adopted and amended locally 

SFM adopted and amended locally 

SFM adopted and amended locally 

Locally adopted and amended . 
. 

Locaffy adopted and amended 

Establishes propane regulator requirement for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. Inducing requirements for two
stage regulator use and locaHon of first and second stage 
regulators. Additional requirements are outlined for 
protective covers, riser pipe installalion requirements, 
building pennit submittal and review, tank center-line ·. 
marking, and grade requirements. These requirements are 
based on significant fire histor, in heavy snow arid extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feel 

... 

Establislies veilicai propane rise iecjuirements for localions 
above 5000 foot elevation. Pipe schedule location, swing 
joint requirements, and the use or fteicibie riser piping as 
well as swing joints. Th~ requirements are based on 
significant fire histor, in heavy snow and extreme weather 
conditions encountered above 5000 feel 

Establishes mamng and location requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. This section addresses signage 
location, emergency contact information, and snow related 
tank marking requirements. These requirements are based 
on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feel 

Pennitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground 
tanks: 
Alows us lo require plans be submitted for review prior to 
installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks 
require substantial maintenance including inspection and 
anode replacement al regular inlefvals. 

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without 
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when 
sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground 
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected. 

Amended to indude on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on
site for emergent repairs, the indusion or a local water flow 
alarm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in the 
event of waler activation in a vacant structure, and 
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 130 
sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water 
damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements 
were also added to ensure water circulation through the 
system, reducing stagnant water and backffow concerns 
(EID encourages this type of system). 

A supply or each type of sprinkler head used in a system 
must be available on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet 

An audible alarm system is added to notify occupants and 
in the activation of the system when the building i5 not 
occupied allow for detection minimizing damage. 

A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and 
failures and assures proper gluing or system components. 

Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 
to in regaids to GPM fire iiow requirements that have been 
uiied for over a decadtt 1n Eoc. . · · . 
Aifows us to niiitch what developeis and residents are used 
to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 
used for t:Net ii decade In EDC. · . 

20-0203 L Page 25 of 52 



{. ~ 

Appendix D: 0103.1 N Made an exception for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended 
II is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to 
construct a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant 

·. ntte 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways. 
Appendix D: 0103.2 N State law requires no g~ter than 16% grade Locally adopied and amended In. our El Dorado County Title 14 adoption we anow greater 

ilian 16% grade with AHJ approval and hanfsurface. 

Appendix D: 0103.3 N Text to indude curbs and gutters Locally adopted and amended 
20 foot road widths shall not indude curbs and gutters due 
to potential access issues and turning radius concerns. 

Appendix 0: 0103.5 § 
Fire apparatus actess road gates . Lcically adopied arid amended•· 

Where lire apparatus access roads consist of a divided 

1 
N 

I roadway the gate wiilih shall noi tie less than 15 feet due to 
.... . .... · .... radius issues. ·· · · 

No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet 

Appendix D: 0103.6.1 N Roads widths 20 to 29 feet Locally adopted and amended 
in width above 5000 feel Lower than 5000 feel this does 
not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire 
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all other elevations. 

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet 

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36 allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet or 
Appendix 0: 0103.6.2 N 

feetin width Locally adopted and amended elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The 
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D 
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations. 

Appendix D: 0104.2 
Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways or 

Exception 
N building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety or the 

have only one approved fire apparatus access road. residents and first responders. 

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 

Appendix D: 0104.4 N 
Added to require circumferenfial fire apparatus 

Locally created and adopted 
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire 

access roads structure and shall provide a continuous means of 
emergency vehide access. 

Appendix D: 0106.1 For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 

Exception 
N Removed Exception in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

residents and first responders. 

Appendix D: 0107.1 For the safety of the communities we live In, two ways of 

Exception 
N Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 

residents and first responders. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.2 through 101.5 N 

Adopted to establish scope, intent, severability and 
Locally adopted Administrative clarity validity 

102.6 through 102.8 N References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

102.10 through 102.12 N 
Conflicting provisions, Other Laws, Application of 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
references 

103.1 through 104.1 N 
Definition of the Fire Prevention Division and ability 

Locally Adopted Administrative clarity to enforce the code 

104.3 through 104.4 N Right of Entry, Warrants, and ldentificatton Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
. ·. .... · .. 

104.6 through 104.6.4 N Record retention Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

104.8 through 104.9.2 N 
Modifications, alternate means and methods, and 

Locally Adopted Adminisirative clarity iest 
104.11 through 

N 
Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of 

Locally~ Administrative clarity 
104.11.2 systems 

104.11.3 N Authority of swtems and devices inoperable Locally Adopted Administrative clarity. 
105.2.3 ·. ·. N·,. Time Dinitation of applicatjon. Locally Adopted Adminislrativa clarity • .. 

105.3.1 through 
()peratiomii peimits 

·. 

Admlnisirative darity . 
105.3.2 N-.· •. . L6cally Adopted 

.. . . ... •· .. · . ·· ...... 

105.6.12. ' N. 
jjiy deaning operational peimiis required for' .. 
hazaroous d8111ing solventuse ·, · · · · 

..·.··.:· . ...-:·· · ....... 
Locally Adopted Adminislr.ltive ~,t·· 

20-0203 L Page 26 of 52 



105.6.2.28 through 
105.6.35 

105.6.37. 

105.6.39. 

105.6.41 through 
105.6.46 

105.6.48. 

105:6.50 

106.1 lhrough 106.3 

107.1 

108.1 through 109.3 

.· 
110.3.2 through 
110.3.4 

110.4.1 

113.1 

303.1 lhrough 303.9 

305.1 through 305.5 

306.1 through 306.2 

307.1 through 307.5 

308.1 

308.1.2 through 
308.1.3 

308.1.5 through 
308.1.8.5 

308.2 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

. ·. 

N 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

.. 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and · 
fire Md i~e ~fety Inspections' . . ... 

Adopted ih1s section for administrative clarity and 
fire arid life safety insp«Hilns . . • . . . 
.•. 

. P.di>pted this section for •inistrative clarity and 
fire and Hfe safety inspections . . Ii 

·. 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life saiety inspections •. . • 

. . 

Adopted this sectioo for amninistrativ~ clarity end 
fire and life safety inspections •. 

. ·, 
Adopted .this section for administrative clarity and 
fire arid life safety Inspections . 

Adopied this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety Inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 
. 

Adopted this section for fire and rife safety 

Adoj,ied this section for fire and life safety 

.· .. ··· 

Locally Adopted 

Locaffy Adopted 

Locany Adopted 

• lOCc!Uy Adopted 

Locally Adopted · . . 

locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

LocaUy Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adq)ted ... 

Pennits for various business operations for. Magnesium, 
miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation 
vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing facilities, open burning, 
open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and 
019anic coatings 

·. 

Peilnits for places of assembly 
I·>.· ·. . . 

Permiiii ror private fire hydrants ·. 

Permits for pyroxytin plastics, refrigeration equ1pmen~ repair 
garages and motor fuel-dispensing iaci1ities, rooftop . . . • 
helipats; spraying or dipping, storage of sailp tires and lire 
by-products · · · ··. ·· · · 

Permit for tire-iebuikling plants 
.. .•. 

P81111it for wood products storage (chips, hogged material, 
lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 ruble feet) . 

Fee sch81ilfes for permilB 

Inspection authority 

Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operatiOn or 
equipmen~ re-inspection end testing; recordkeeping, 
supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overct!Mding, 
Board or Appeals established, limitations on authority, and 
qualifications 

Compliance with ordels and notices, proserutioo of 
violations, and unauthorized tampering 

Abatement ot violation 

Authority to disconnect service utilities 

Asphalt ketUes contain highly ftammable substances and 
require sbingent safeguards (Climatic, geological, end 
lopqJraphical) 

Managing ignition sources through responsible application 
of standards will reduce the number of fires in valious 
settings (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY 
ftammable and require special handling (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

Open burning, recreational fire, and portable outdoor 
fireplaces, (Climatic. geological, and topographical) 

Open flame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical}' 

Throwing cir placing of ignition sources, torches for 
removing paint (Clirriatic, geological, and topqJrapliical) 

Localioils near combustible, open ffame devfoes, signals 
and mart<eis, · portable fuel open-flame devices, sky· 
lanterns, rel'igious ceremonies, aisles and exits, ~ing 
food arid beverage preparation, dispensing, containe!s not 
iri use, serving d flaming food, location, fire protection 
(Clmatk; gliological, and topogrilphlcal) .. 

Permits are i'ecpied for above section (Climatic, geological, 
end topiigrap11iaii) ' . .. . . 

20-0203 L Page 27 of 52 



Group A occupancies open-flame decorative devices, 
308.3 U,rough 308.4.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life sefety Locally Adopted. Uiealrical performances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 

dormitories {Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

310.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to smoking (c;::limatic, 

· .. geological, and topographical). 

310.3 .. N Adopted this section for fire and life safety. Localiy Adopted 
;No Smoking' signs {Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) . . · · 

. 
Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with 'No Smoking' 

310.4 ~iollgh 310.8 
. 

AdoJ>ied tills section for fire a~d life safety Locally Adopted N signs, ssh trays, burning objects, hazardous environmental 
·. '~ . 

conditions. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 
. •. •.·.:,,•,· . . . . 

.. .. 1. •, 

" : ·. " : 
vacant premises condition and safely requiremenis; · . 

. ;_ .... ; .. 
·. . . Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant 

~1,.1 ;rough 311.4 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety.· Locally Adopted premises, secunty, fire protection, lire separation, removal 
of i:onibustibles; removal or liaiardous materials. (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

"· . . 

319.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
General requirements relating to mobile food preparation 
vehicles. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

319.2. N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
Pennits for mobile food preparation vehictes (Climatic, 

fire and life safety inspections geological, and topographical) 

Exhaust hood, fire protection, fire protection for cooking 
equipmen~ fire extinguisher, appliance connection to fuel 
supply piping, cooking oil storage containers, metallic 
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking oil 
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting, 
normal vents, emergency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum 

319.3 lhrough 
aggregate volume, protection of container, LP-gas container 

N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted construction, protection or system piping, LP-gas ala!ms, 
319.10.3 

CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel, 
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG 
container construction, CNG containers supplying 
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping, 
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire 
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems. 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

403.6.1 through 
Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1 

N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted · (residential care faciHHes and group homes) evaaJation and 
403.8.1.7 

fire safety plans. 

403.10 through 
Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel) occupancy 

N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, (Climatic, 
403.10.1.3 

geological, and topographical) 

405.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted 
Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

510.3 N 
Adopted this section for administraHve clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
A pennit is required for emergency responder radio systems 

fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Wall coverings in group E occupancies {Schools) sets a 
807 .5. 2 through 

N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally Adopted 
maximum amount or flammable wall coverings in 

807.5.2.3 fire and life safety inspections educational facilities (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5 

903.2.1.5 N 
Adopted this section for administrative darity and Locally Adopted 

(sporting arenas, amusement park slruclures, bleachers) 
fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000 

square feet. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

20-0203 L Page 28 of 52 



Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders 
to receive and transmit emeigency radio traffic to and from 
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time 

Adopted this section in existing buil<ings for the 
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 

1103.2 y safety of firefighters and other emergency Locally Adopted 
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by 

responders. lhe fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind 
lhis section is that on almost all emergency responder injury 
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

J\j)j)flndix.D: D101.1 ··. N Adopted this sectilll toi the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopied 

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads 
through D102.1 ftrefigtiieis, and other emergency respondeis: including loads. (ciimatic, geological, and topographical) . 

1, 
i. Adopted this section for the safely of th~ public; 

Dead end fire apparahis access road requirements for a 
Appendix D: D103.4 N . firefighters:. and otlier emergency riispondeis. Locally Adopted tum around at 150 feet (Climatic; geological, and 

icipographical) 

Appeiidix D: 0103.6 N 
Adopttld this section toi the safely of ttie public, 

Locally Adopted 
'No Paoong, Fire Lane• signs requirements. (Climatic, ,. 

firefighters, and other emergency respoode1i geological, and topographical) 

Appendix O: 0104.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Commercial and industriai development fire apparatus through D104.3 N Locally Adopted 

(Eixcluding exception) 
firefighters, and other emergency responders. access roads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

. 
. 

Appendix D: D105. 1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally Adopted 

Requirements for aerial fire apparahis access roads 
through 0105:4 firefighters, and other emergency tesponders, (Climatic, geological; and topographical) 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential through 0106.3 N 
firefighte,s, and other emergency respondeis. 

Locally Adopted 
developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical) (eJCduding exceptions) 

Appendix 0: 0107. 1 
One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be 

(exduding exceptions) N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire 

through 0107.2 
firefighters, and other emergency respondeis. apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 

dimatic con<ttions. 

Appendix 0: 0108 N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction 

firefighters, and other emergency responders. standalds (Cfimatic, geological, and topographical) 

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle. 

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

20-0203 L Page 29 of 52 



PIONEER F PROTECTION DI TRICT 
· • • <.:UE • b: S 

j-' 1 I ). , [ : '. r,j 

I l II i\ ~. ( f '"' L k l 1 !~ n ~l r_J 

,·,) '. 11 ·r :,, , . c .-,li f,-itn l,1 q; ,,:.q 

P,1,. ,w , -dll) riln ·H I I • Fn. (., i'l) 11 ,.'. I I ' ' i 7 

yw ~ .f 11.!_[ ct.· i}i.! ~ ·"H 

ccembor :26, 2019 

Ploneer fir t" Protection Distric t l I a.nd 2' reading posnngs r rdlrl ,c No.~ 19. I 

Board or Di-recto -

Ma:ne Fin • C~t•' 
ll1pl")' H~"' - !;,C Oiit1• 
o~r,1d Juml"', - s , 

11 e ln·b - o,r 
1!t.<.11 S\r&O~Jetd - !Jlrc::IO, 

Attuchcd ire the posiings fo r the fi l'S"t and se 01 d ubltc noucc for rdinll.tl o 20 l Q .0 I 
TI1e 111 r ndiog was located in 11} 1:: Octob(r 8 11 Pio11e r Fire rotecu n Di r.ricl Bo rel '1ce-tinij 
Ag nch1- Postings ve re ioca!ed on the Pioneer Fire Protecti n Oi.stri1.:1 ront do r. Somersc:1. Post 
Office . Onzzly f lat Po5t Or ice and on the Pionetr11.l\!.or W<!bsite on ·101011019. Thc.1"'1 
reatt in~ , · · loca1c<i in lhe No ,ember 111 Pioneer · ire.: P tci.:ti f'\ D stric1 B ard f\.kc ling 
/ ~ nd. P tings wer '..) rated on the Pioneer ~: 1r-t Protection Distric1 Front door. "orncr. ct 
Post 1tt:- . ·- n.uly Flat f'ost Offce, ar;u on the Piooccrfirt" .urg ~cbsi con I l/81'2QL. 

~ittccrely. 

20-0203 L Page 30 of 52 



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
Board of Directors Board Meetln1 

October 8, 2019 at 6 p.m . 
._.arte Fitts • 8owd Olllr, ~ ~ - V',c.e Otalr, 

flNn Slr1nt{ekf · loerd 5«tatary. ;.-ry Jllmper. Chet.or 

, Mlalon SfotffltMI ·-9 
To pfOfttM a profnskH,ol ond cvmtJ0$1IOnote lrlfl of communny fin protttrJon, ttNr;tll()' l"Ndkol ofld 

rwtcW 111Men co tllt c/Cfrt,u and propmy owner, wfthln rlw F1rl Dlstrlct,. In ordtr to p,'lfWlffl1 °' rr,u,Jmlff the 

Joa of //ft. pol,t, ,ulfmnf or,d pro,,.,ry danioo- 01 o mun a/ fir, or ovw typfl of tmttgfltcy , 

MNtlng &ocatlon; PFPD Adminletratlon Offlc:ea.- Boardroom 
7080 Mount Aukum Road, SonwNt. CA 9S8U 

AQINQA 

1. CALL TO ORDER (Olndo, Strangfeld wtll be attended the fflffdng tefephonlcally from 5075 
Cary, Grmty Flm CA.) 
u RolCal 
1.2 Pledge ot Allegiance 

2. DETERMIHATION 011 QUORUM AND CONFIRMATION OF AGENDA 
2.1 Adoption of Agenda 

3. SPECIAL ANNOUNCEMENT/ PRESENTATIONS/ GENERAL BUSINESS 
3.1 TIME IENlfTIVE MAmR 
2018 Are Code AdopCfon - PubUc HNtlng- Onctor1 wlll convene• pubk hearing prior to th• flrtt 
reading of Urdlnanoe :l01V.U1 (<.:allfoou Heeflh and Safety Code &ectlon 13889. 7) 

4. PUBLIC COMMENT 
Arr; petl(ln may addren the Ot,crtct Board on eny aut)fec:t panalnlng to Olttrlct bldlneu, which II not 
lilt.cf on the agenda. Thi. oomment le provided by the Ralph M. Brown Ope,1 Meedng Ad (Govemment 
CocM § 54a50 el aeq) end may be Rmited to thrM (3) mlnutet for any peBOn addruling the Board. 

S. CONSENT CALENDAR 
Coneenl calendar Item• ire con11dered rciutine and ire acted upon by the Boerd wtl'I a ah,gle actk>r,. 

Membera d the audience 'Mlhlng to prov,de public Input may requeet that tie Board remove the Item 
from the COnMnt Calendar. Cormientl nwy be llmlt8d to h'N (3} minuta 
!S.1 Mlnutel from 8oerd MNllng July 9, 2019 
e.2 Mlnutn 1rom 8oerd MNcmg Augutt 21. 2019 
S.3 MlnOtN from Botrd Meeting Sept9mber 10 201; 
S.2 Approval: peyment of bait - green shMta 

8. MONTHL YIIT ANDtNQ ACTIVITY REPORTS~ 
8.1 Admnlsfflltlve/Chlef'I Report 
8.2 Local #4586 
8.3 f7VFA 
8.-4 Fnndal 

7. OLD 8U91N£S8 (TM 9olrd may ~ IO t'91i41w, dlloAI, 11111.e don or wa OIi q <*' bulineea. TIie lloerd Chair nwy 
rlqUNI I !'OI cal ¥CIII Of'I bnw) 
7.i Open 8aerd Poeltlon (BOO AUi) 
1.2 Dlmct lnYNdgetlon 001-2019 (i.n.r ot Conoetn, reteted k> 2015 lnddent) (Chief) 
7.3 PILT Funding - Poulble ml9uu and or dlatr1butk>n of fund1 by the El Dorado County Aud+tor 

1 
PFPO loefd Mntl,._ October 81 2019 

20-0203 L Page 31 of 52 



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTlON DISTRICT 
Board of Directors Board Meeting 

7.4 Payroll Services {Chief) 
7.5 PFPO Vegetation Management (Ad-hoc updates) Ordinance (Director Jumper/Chief) 
7.6 Pioneer Fire Protection District Building/ Facility Use Agreement (Chief) 
7.7 Auto Aid Agreement; between Amador County Fire Protection District & Pioneer Fire Protection 

District. ( Chief) 
7.8 MOU Per-Diem Position with Amador Fire Protection District and Pioneer Fire Protection District 

(Chief) 
7.9 "Accept Pioneer Union International Association of Firefighters, Local 4586 demand to continue 

bargaining successor MOU." (BOD Fitts) 
8. NEW BUSINESS (The Board may review, discuss, take action or vole on eny new buslnesa. The Board Chair may 

request a roll call vote on Items} 
8.1 HR policy review and updates (Chief} 
8.2 Ordinance 2019-01 Adopting the 2019 Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the 

2018 Edition of the lnternatlonal Fire Code, regulation governing the safeguarding of life and 
property from fire and explosions hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of 
hazardous substances, material and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property 
in the occupancy of buildings and premises In Pioneer Fire Protection District (PFPD), providing 
for the Issuance of permits and collection fees therefore: Repealing and previous PFPD 
ordinances. To include all Information and preceding to be discussed for Ordinance adoption. 
(Chief) 

8.3 Resolution 2019-006 - Findings of Fact • Discussion/Information/Action - Resolution setting 
forth findings with respect to local conditions which make certain modlncetlon and changes to 
the Callfomla Fire Code necessary for preserving fire and life safety In the Pioneer Fire 
Protect.ion District- (Chief) 

8.4 Fire Code • Ordinance 2019.01 - First Reading of the 2019 Fire Code Amendments -
Discussion/Information - Staff to present the 2019 Fire Code Ordinance to the Board. (Health 
and Safety Codes: 13869.7, 17958.7 and 18941.5) (Chief) 

9. CORRESPONDENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS AND/OR REVlEW 
8.1 Thank You letter from Amador Fire Protection District for Pioneer fire Protection's support with 

vegetation and debris clean up In River Pines (Vierra) 
10. GOOD OF THE ORDER 
11. UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS: 
12. CLOSED SESSION 

Woode Claim Update (closed aeHlon with attorney) 
12.1 Anticipated Litigation Case# PC20190038 Katherine Wood VS Pioneer Fire Protection District 

(Significant exposure to IIUgatlon pursuant to Gov't. Code Section§ 54956.9(d)(2) or (3). Update 
from attorney via conference call. (BOD) 

12.2 Possible exposure to lttigation (1 matter) pursuant to Government Code Section § 54956.9(d) 
(2). Facts and circumstances that might result In litigation need not be disclosed. Conference 
call from attorney regarding potential appeals. (BOO) 

12.3 Labor negotiation (MOU) Pursuant to Government Code Section§ 54957.6, conference updatee 
and Information between District negotiators and Local #4586 (BOD) 

13. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION 
14. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (If applicable) 
15. AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH 

2 
PFPD Board Meeting, October 8, 2019 

20-0203 L Page 32 of 52 



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
Board of Directors Board Meetln1 

18. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR TUNday 
November 12, 2018 at 8 p.m. 

AdmlniltraUve Alaistant/ Amended by Mark Metthew9. I-ire Chl8f 

The Pb,-, 1'n*dlon DIIIIJkl jl)lahta,, Jn complying wdttl ti» Amerlcanl Wlffl Dlubllttlel Act rADA1, ,.qw,t, 
lndMduels who ~ ~ ~llkW to ecc.,. ett.nd ~ PM~• In Dlllrld board mHU~ du1 to • 
diaabillty, IN)! t,- requul«1 by ca/Ing (530} 822·#« no lnr than 72 h0ur1 In adv,nc, al,,.. •chedul«I mNIJng tJma In 
complww:e 'Mth Gowrnment Code Secllon 54a57. 5, non .. ,rempt Writing, th« re df«rlbuted lo • mtJjorlly or el of u,. 
8ow11 In ~ ct• mHllnQ. mey be vlawed at 7fM1 Mount Aukum Ro«i, Sonwrnt, Callfomla. In eddlllon, tr you woud 
IJke e CIOP'1 of any rflCtJl'd ,.,.,~ to ,n lam on the agend•, pl••• contAOt ti» Dlltrlcl Administrative ~ • {530) ezo. 
4444. Stlltlort 36 hu dlllblff ttCCan Md fdlllN. NI Board me,tlng.,. record-1. 0/rfae holll Tuesday through T~ 
Pam to 1pm. 

A,Jenda pond ,t the Olwlcl'• AdmlnlwaHon Bufdlng. Pa.t 0MoH Jn SonN!fNt. 4lounl Acllwm, Grizzly Rm ertd the 
Pioneer Fire Pror.ctfofl Dlllrlct• weblh ,t mt)t',RiPatfrJb.qp. 

Tilal Poec.cd: ~ 
Ammd«l l<W612019 dDc Do~ SCl"IDplld neectm, to ancnd via telepbomc communJCarions, oothill& to the qenda ha cbaaa, 
except die addition dlllt • ri1 be 111ffldlq ~ phone due 1o eaipaa oircwnltaoca. 

3 
PFPD Board M11tlnc, October a, 2019 

20-0203 L Page 33 of 52 



-- PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
Board at Directors Board MNtin1 

1t. ADJOURNlll!NT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETltro SCHEDULED FOR Tuelday 
Novembef 12, 2011 • • p.m. 

Ptall'ecODtl DWtt:11 (~. tJ comp)t!Q wit/I U. A~ wtf> ~ Act rA~?. rtqUNl1 
~ llfkt -,»Cla/ ~ IIO «mu. alltand .-JGtlr' pe,1Jclpa In DialJ1t:t *d mNfnpl c:w to • 
dfMblly, ,,,., be l'lqUfffed b)' calng (~ IJ22..#f4 no ,._ than 72 hotn ti ~ di,,,, l!Ctt«luled ~ ,.,._ -, 
~ with Gowm,,,.n, Cod9 S«ilon 5'937.tJ, notMJt.,,.,:,I ~ trlfll Mt dltltrtlJcJled fD • fflllWD'1)I or ti at Ille 
80MJ tt ~ ol I mNtqJ. mey be ~ II 10fH ib.n AUaln Aoat Some,N( c.ilb,na )t eidb1,. I )QI .,.., 

.. a copy deny l9COrd f9laled ID a, 11m a, 0. IG9ndl. i,'-- oonact the o.trlc1 ~ •,,_,. ,t (~ d20, 
4UC.. StlllOn 39 bu dll,lb/ed ~ wJ ...... M &»Id nwlttQ Mt f9C)(J(dwJ_ ~ houri TIIMily ltltougll Thuradly 
e.,n-, 1pm . 

..... paad " ,,,. OltflfCt'I ~ ~ Poll omr:., "' Sonwe«, Moc.v,t Autum. CMz:zJy Allrl &ltd t1llf 
Piot ........ ~-MJ:)iatrlt:U wabdl., mn,.41Pott(th.O(l1 

n.,poa,d; __ 9_~-~-~----
Ameoded IWl2019 • to Direalor sa.,fllld .... ID -.d vii.....,. COIIUIMlicadou, nod1iat IO ...... • c:blllp 
at:afll h -"idoo diet lhe will be ldelldln& vii pNIDI dm to a:ipa.l CiOUMI .... 

PFPO Board M 11tfl .. OcloNf I, l019 

20-0203 L Page 34 of 52 



---
PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

Board of Directors Board Meeting 

16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday 
November 12, 2019 at 6 p.m. 

ded by Mark Matthews, Fire Chief 

The Pfonur Fire Ptote tJon Dlatrfct ("District"}, In complying with the Americans with Dl&abH/1/es Act ("ADA"), requests 
tndlvlduals who requlm specie/ accommodations to access, attend and/or psttlclpate In Dlatrlct board meetings due to a 
diaabHlty, may be raqueated by ceNlng (~30) 622-4444 no later than 72 hours In advance of the scheduled meeting time. In 
compllanc9 wilh Govemment Code Section 64967.6, non-exempt wrftlnQs that are distributed to a majority or all of the 
Board In advance ol e meeting, may be viewed et 7061 Mount Aulwm Road, Somerset, Celffomla. In addition, If you would 
flke a copy of any record 181ated to an Item on the agenda, please contact the District Administrative Assistant at (530) 820-
4444. Station 38 haa disabled acce,.s and faclltfes. All 8<Jerd meeting are recorded. Office hours Tu&adsy through Thu/'8day 
9amto 1pm. 

Agenda posted et the Distrlct'a Administration Buflding, Poat Officea In Somerset, Mount Aukum, Grizzly Flats and the 
Pfo rotectton Dtstrlcts W9b11te at www.DIQne@rfl& P<P· 

Location 

Amended 10/06/2019 due to Director Stranafeld needing to attend Yia teJepbonlc communlcation1, nothin& to the aaenda has chanp 
except the addition thal slle will be attending via phone due to exigeot circumJtaDcea. 

3 
PFPO Board Meeting, October 8, 2019 

20-0203 L Page 35 of 52 



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
Board of Directors Board Meeting 

16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday 
November 12, 2019 at 6 p.m. 

ric Administrative Assistant/ Amended by Mark Matthews, Fire Chief 

The Pl neer · e Protection District ("District"), in complying with the Americans with Disabilities Act ("ADA j, requests 
individuals who require special accommodations to access, attend and/or participate In District board meetings due to a 
disability, may be requested by calling (530) 622-4444 no later then 72 hours in advance of (he scheduled meeting time. In 
compliance with Government Code Section 54957.5, non-exempt writings that ere distributed to a majority or ell of the 
Board In advance of a meeting, may be viewed at 7061 Mount Aukum Road, Somerset, California. In addition, if you would 
like a copy of any record related to an item on the agenda, please contact the District Administrative Assistant at (530) 620-
4444. Station 38 has disabled access and facilities. All Boerd meeting are recorded. Offlce hours Tuesday through Thursday 
9am to 1pm. 

Agenda posted at the District's Administration Building, Post Offices in Somerset. Mount Aukum, Grizzly Flats and the 
Pioneer Fire Protection Districts website at www.ploneel1'ire,orq. 

s;~1AR~ 
Date Posted: 1 D J &, } t).O / 'j r 7 

location 

Time Posted: __ ._,1.__. '/ .... D~rp'--')'-'1,,-=--"-----
1 

Amended 10/06/2019 due to Director Stran11feld needinJ to attend via telephonic communicalions, nothing to the agenda has change 
except the addition that she will be attending via phone due to exigent circumstances. 

3 
PF?D Board Meeting, October 8, 2019 

20-0203 L Page 36 of 52 



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
Board of Directors Board Meettn1 

November 12, 2019 at 6 p.m. 
~Ifie Fitts• SO.d Chair, ,apley How. -Vlca CNlr, 

Miry lum,,• · lo¥d s«rewy, MkhMI !nth - Oireaor 

Mltslon Stot,m,nt 
To pn,llldt o pro/uslonal ond compaJJlonot, ~I of comm11n,'t)' f,tt prottctlon, tmt(Jtncy IMdJcd and r,,cw 
1vvicn co t1tt Clt.izffll oM prc,:.ff'I ow,im wlfJtln rM Rt, Olferlct in order ta prtvfnt or mlitlmu, CINI loss of 
life, pal/1, •IJfferlntJ ond pro,-ny c1o,,,. os o mutt oJ /f,t or oth,r ~pn of mi1rg1r,cy, 

MHtlng location: PFPD Admlnl•tratlon Offlca- Boardroom 
7080 Mount Aukum Road. SornerMt, CA 15114 

AQENPA 

1. CALL TO ORDER 
1. 1 Roll Call 
1.2 Pledge of Allegiance 

2. Ol!TERMINATION OF QUORUM AND CONFIRMATION Of AGENDA 
2.1 Adoption of Agenda 

3. 8PEctAL .ANNOUNCEMENT/ PRESENTATIONS/ GENERAL BUSINESS 
3.1 Recognition & Honor ol the following: Kenneth Strangfeld 

,4. f'UBLIC COMMENT 
My pereon may address the District Board on any 1ubtect pertaining to Olatrlct buslneaa, which 11 not 
hted on the agenda. This oomment le prolilded by the Ralph M. Brown Open Meet1ng Act { Government 
Code I S4Q60 et eeq) and may be Umitad to ttne (3} minute• for any person add,_.,ng the Board. 

5. CONSENT CALENDAR 
Consent calendar Items are considered routine and are acted upon by the Board with • single actlon. 
Members d tha audience whlng to provide pubftc Input may requeat tret the Board remove the Item 
from the Consent Calendar. Commer,ts may be llmlted to three {3) minutes. 
S. 1 Mlnutee from Board Mee~g October 8, 2019 
5.2 Minutes from Spacial Board Meeting October 29, 2019 
5.2 Approval: payment of bills - green sheets 

8. MONTHLYJSTAHOING ACTIVITY REPORTS: 
6.1 Admlnfatratlve/Chlef's Report 
6.2 Loeal #4586 
9.3 FVFA 
e." Flnencial 

7. OLD BUSINESS (TM eo.ct ~ -.a ID rew,w, 111cuN. tlM don ~ 11ioti1 on Mt o6d bua1neN. The Board a., may 

l'lqUllt • roft cal vote on 1llma) 
7 .1 Pll T Funding • Poeslble misuse and or dl-ltrlbutlon of funda by the El Dorado County Auditor 

(c.hlef) 
7. 2 Payrotl Setv!G'8I ( Owet) 
7.3 PFPO VegetaUOl'I Management (Ad-hoo updetea} Ordinance (O!reotor Jumper/Chief) 
7.4 Pioneer Fire Protection Olatric:t BIAldlngl Facility UH Agreement (Chief) 
7.5 Auto Aid Agreement; between Amador County Fire Protection Dlltnct & Pioneer Fire Proteetlorl 

Dlltrlct (Chief) 

1 
PFPD lolrd Meetlns. Novembff 12, 2019 

20-0203 L Page 37 of 52 



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
Board of Directors Board Meetin1 

1.6 MOU Per-Diem Position with Amador Fire Protection District and Pioneer Fire Protection Diltrld 
(Chle~ 

7,7(1) Fire Code. Ordinance 2019.01 • Second Reading of the 20,9 Flre Code Amendmentt - Chief 
to present the 2019 Fire Code Ordinance to the Board. (Health and Safety Codes: 13869.7, 
178e8.7 and 18941.5) (Chief) 

7.7(b) o,dlnance 2019-01 Adopting the 2019 Edition of the California Fire Code. i!'\COrporating the 
2018 Edition of the International Fire Code. To lndude all information and preceding to be 
dlecuued for Ordinance adoption. (Chief} 

7.8 Update on open board position; (Vierra) 
8, NEW BUSINESS (TM Board may revllw, dllaJI&. mu actor, or vota on any rww buiineea. The Boatd Chait may 

requett I roll CIIII \IOtll on llema). 
8.1 Pay rate review and potential adjustmentt/changn to the OES deployment rate for volunteers 

and rnerves. 
9. CORRESPONDENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS ANO/OR REVIEW 
10. GOOD OF THE ORDER 
11. UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS: 
12. CLOSED SESSION 

12, 1 Labor negotiation (MOU) Pursuant to Government Code Section§ 54957.8, c:onferenee updates 
1nd Information between Olllrlct negotiator1 and Local ~ (BOO/Chief) 

12.2 Conference wtth Real Property Negotiations(§ 5"4;56.6) Property located at -1847 Sdaroni Rd 
Grizzly Flata CA e5684 (BOO/Ch~. 

13. RETURN TO OP!N SESSION 
U. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED 8ES810N (If appllcabte) 
18. AOl!NOA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH 
16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETlNO SCHEDULED FOR Tuetday 

December 10, 2018 at I p.m. 

The PfonHr Flr9 P,otectian Oi«rla ('Diltttj, "~ rrttn 1111 ~•...,,,~ .. Act rADAj. raqwllfa /ndlvlduelt 
w#lo ,.qu1,. ~ IOQOmtnadll#otll to IOCINI, lttwtd M!"4:>r ~~ lo o.tl1l:t boe,,:1 INlft!QI M lo I IINbillry, m,y be 
requ.,*1 by ~ (!JO) ~4.f no ..,. ,,,.., 72 holltl In ilMIICI d the KMdailld m,etJnp 11m,. In eompllen~ wm, 
Go\otmmenl Codi s.cton lUi~7.!. notHumpt ~ th« .,. dlltrfOulld to • m-.JO(lfy or II al th• Boe,v ti IMl!ct ol 1 
rttHl/nf. rr,ey be vl"""1 II TOff Mount A""1m "old. SCWMl"Nf. C.~le. In ~. If you ""41/d ll!t • copy of ,ny rtcOtd 
l'fllll«J ,o Ml ,-,n on fhl ~. pie ... OOtlMd 11N D4ab1ot AcnlnlitralM AallflN at (530) tl»4#f. S.llon JI tiff dlabled 
ICCHI 1/td fadltJN. N Boerd ,,,..,.,p M l'kOldwi. 01Jct llocitl ru.tdly lhfougll Thutld,y '8M lo 1pm. 

Time POIC*t: _J=--: J.5.__.,_p ..... ~____,.____ 

2 
PFPD Bolrd Meet!n&, November 12, 2019 

20-0203 L Page 38 of 52 



--

Si 

PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
Board of Directors Board Meetlna 

7 .6 MOU Per-Diem Poeltloo wtth Amador Are Proteci!on Dlttrict and Pioneer Fire Protection District 
(Chief) 

7.7(a) Fire Code - Ordinance 2019.01 - Second Reading of the 2019 Flre Code Amendmentl - Chief 
to p,nent the 2019 Fire Code Ordfnance to the Board. (Heel1h Ind Safety Codes: 13869.7, 
17958. 7 Ind 18941.5) (Chief) 

7.7(b) Ordinance 201Q.01 Adopting the 2019 Edition al the California Flf'9 Code, Incorporating the 
2018 Edition of the lntematlonal Fire Code. To Include 1B Information and preceding to be 
discussed for Ordln1nc1 adoption. (Chief) 

7.8 Update on open bolrd potitlon; (Vierra) 
8. NEW BUSINESS (The 8oetd mav revtaw, dacuae, 1eka edlon or \/Ola on any new butlneM, Th• Boerd Chair may 

t9qUNt • rol call vole on a.n. ). 
8.1 Pay rate review and potent11l 1dJustments/changes to the OES deployment rat. for wlunteera 

and 1'918l'VII, 
D. CORRESPONDENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS ANO/OR REVIEW 
10. GOOD OF THE ORDER 
11. UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS: 
12. CLOSED SESSION 

12.1 Labor negotiation (MOU) Purauant to Government Code Section § 54957 .e, conference updatee 
and Information be.tween Otatrict negotiators and Local #4586 (B00/0,lef) 

12.2 Conference with Real Property Negotiations(§ 54956.8) Property localed It ~7 Sdarool Rd 
Grizzly Flata CA 95684 (BOO/Chief). 

13. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION 
14. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED 9E8Sf0N (If appUcabte) 
15. AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH 
19. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD ME!TING SCHEDULED FOR Tuttday 

December 10, 2011 ate p.m. 

11» Ate PrcCectlon Oi.trlc:t ("Olttrlctj, In comp/y/11g wltll tr. American, w#/'t DlublfllN Ac/ ('ADA,, ,wqcMltt hSMdUM 
wno reqlJh tpeoMJ eocommodalJonl lo aoc.u, attend a,,dtot pertlclp1te In Dllh1cl board l'IWllfJQf M ro • d..oMHy. may • 
,-qrA«.d by c.flng (53CJ) 1122-4444 r,o taler lhlln 72 ~ in IM/'tOI cl 11'11 ICl'INMd tnHf,,g Mme. In ~ ...W, 
GOV#nm.nt Code S.clon 649!1.5, non-.ampt wr«fnQ, that .,.. dJetrlbclted to • MI/OtfY or II of U. 8wfi ,n ~ cl , 
MHllng, mey ,,_ vlfwed •t 7081 Mount A""1m Rutd, SotllfHNI, Cellfl;ml& lt1 ldl>'/lfot\ t you WIQJld .. 1 c;q,y d 1r,y l9COld 
,w'*d lo an Item on lht er,enda, pi.. t:onlacf ti» t:Nllrfci Admlnlsttatl'l'I Aaunnt ., (53/J) ~ s.o.,i ,a hN dab#,d 
~II Ind fie/MIN. AR 8oMI me.tiflll .. recort»d. Offlce hOclt TUNday lhtouflh Thlndey 9a,n to f pm. 

Af/9nda polled II fhe Olltrlcl't Adm/rlrmtion 8utino, Poet ~• In Somnat, ~ A4'blm, ~ Flat. 1111d the PIOttHt Fh 
P~lllt#clt 11 mm: *'"1tf D 

1 ~/o 

Timi hletcl: __ 5_f "-~_'.A"/...,..._ __ 

2 
PFPO Board Mtetlna, Novtmbtr 11, 2019 

20-0203 L Page 39 of 52 



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
Board of Directors Board MeeUng 

7,6 MOU Per-Diem Posr_iO,, wtth A'Tutdor Fare Protection Dt1trict and Pioneer F,re Protection Otatrid 
(Chief} 

7.7(1) Fire Code· Ordinance 2019.01 - Second Reading of the 2019 Fire COM Amendments - Chief 
to present the 2019 Fire Code Ordinance to the Board {Healtti and Safety Codet 13869 .. 7. 
17~8 7 and 18941.5) (Chief) 

7.7{b) Ordinance 2019-01 Adopting the 2019 Edition of the Calt1om1a F,re Code, incorporating the 
2018 Edition of tne International Fire Code. To lnciude all 1nformat1on and preceding 10 be 
di1cu1sed tor Of'dinance adoption. (Chief) 

7 8 Update on open board position; (Vterra) 
8. N!W BUSINESS (The Board may revlew, dl1cu11, i.41• action or~• on 11'1')' new bulir,n1 Thi Board Chair may 

requeet a ml eal wee on,..,.,_) 
8 1 Pay rate re..,,ew and potential 1td1u1tmentsJchanges to the OES oeployment rate for volunteers 

Ind fMef\'M, 

I. CORRESPONDENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS ANO/OR REVIEW 
10. 0000 OF THE ORDER 
11. UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS: 
12. CLOSED SESSION 

12. 1 Labor riegotiation (MOU) Pursuant to Gove<nment Code Section f 5-19~7.6, conference updatee 
and information between Oi1tric1 negot1ator1 and Local #4586 (B001Chief) 

12 .. 2 Cooference with Real Property Negotiations{§ ~956.8) Property localed at 4847 Sciaroni Rd 
Gr[zzty Flats CA 95684 (BOD/Chief). 

13. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION 
14. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (tf appllcable) 
14. AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH 
18. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETINO SCHEDULED FOR TUNday 

O.Cember 1 o, 2019 1t e p.m. 

r Pionffr Flf9 Ptol«:tlon Dl•tneJ ('Ol.ttrcn ,n ~pi,,r,g ,,,,,,,, "'- A'l'lenc•n• Wltl DIH""IU.t Act (ADA') ~ in:J'wduai, 
Wltho r9qvlrt JP«)al KCOtnmocMflall ~ ~•• tff9nd ~ p,~,. /r, Oistriet oo,n:, mHllnQ• du• to • d,Mbl,ly rnty ~ 
requefflK! by ca#lrig (5:JCJ IJ12·4••• n<> 1-,., tti111 n houtJI tri 1avance of u,, sch•r:Mu mHtlng llm• In ~ tlrltf'! 
c;o..,.m,,,.nt ~ Stej/on 540!'!,5, ttOtM11mpt ~• 111,1 .,. dlalnbut•d lo I m.;c,nfy or•• ol ,,,. Boe.rd .., ~,nc. al• 
mHling, may t,, vi'"'1 II 7~1 Mount Ai,/flum RoMi, Som.rtt! c,momla. In addition, if you WOUltJ JIJ(• • eopy of l(!y t'fCOrd 

nt/11*1 to 1n /rem on tn. ,01r1dt,. P'ffa• contKt rtw, Olstrlct Adminl.ttll/Vf AH/llant 11 (530) 020-H44 st.oon JI 1'111 t11at'-d 
ace.a and facllttu. AIJ Beard mHt!nQ .,, IWCOldad. OfflOt houtl TuHd•r through Thurld1y tam to 1pm 

Ag•nda p<nted 11 tfl• D;.trlcr• Admit!~ Buildfrtg. Pr»/ OfflcH In Som,r .. /, Moon/ Aulu1m, Grluly Fl1t1 alld,,,. ~If Fl,. 
ProtKJ/on DJ wtblir. It ,rww-PQ7fldb Q£P 

Location 

Tinle PoetN: t ·, t•o e 
j 

2 
?FPO Board MHtlna. Novtmbtr ll, 2019 

20-0203 L Page 40 of 52 



PIONEER FIRE.PROTECTION DISTRICT 
Oo1rd of Directors Boird Meetlna 

7.6 MOU Pet-Oief,\ Position wttt, Amador Fire Protectlo" Dlatnct and~ Flre Protection Otstr1d 
(OIJefJ 

7.7(a) Fite Code - OtdMnce 20:g.01 • Second Rqdlng of the 201~ Fire Code Amendments - Chief to 
prtNnt the 2019 Fire Code Ordinance to the Board. (Health ind Sefety Codes: 13889.7, 
17958. 7 and 18841.5) (0.0 

7. 7(b) Ordnance 2019-01 Adoplng the 2019 Edltton of the Cailfomla "'" Code, lncorpor•Ung the 2018 
EdHion d the lnternationll Fire Code. To Include an Information and Pftcec:Mg to be dlscUIHd 
for Otdnance adoption. (Chief) 

7.8 Upda.ra on open board poe;tion; {V•rra) 
a. NeW BUSINESS (The bid n-.y rMN. dltcl.a. im ac:ton Of'~ on any,,..,~- The tOMS OWi" iney ~ 

• tel cal \IVlf (WI llamt ). 

8.1 Pay ral8 review and poteritial adjustmefu/~ange9 to ~ OES deployment rate for \l'Olun1eera 
and,....-wa. 

I. CORRUPONDENCI FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS ANOIOR REV1!W 
10. 0000 OF THI! ORDt!R 
11, UPCOMING CALENDAR OF !VENTS: 
12. CL0S£D HIIION 

12. 1 Labo, negottatlon (MOU) P\Jru1nt to Government Code Section t 5496 7 .e, conf9fence upd1tn 
and lnfom1atlon betwNn District negotiators and Locat ~ (BOOIChiaf) 

12.2 c.onftnnoa with Real Property Negotlatione (§ 5-4956.8) ?rope,fy located at 4341 Sclaronl Rd 
Grtmy Flata CA 9ee84 (BOOIChW). 

13. RETURN TO OPEN IEIIION 
1'-. UPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED S!SSION (tf appUcable) 
15. AGl!NOA lT!MI FOR Nl!XT MONTH 
11. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NOT R!GULAR BOARD MEET\NG SCHEDULED FOR Tut1day 

December 10, 2019 ate p.m. 

Fh ~ot~ CJWrlot ~ • ., ~ ..e, I,_~ wth °'lllifaalel Ad ("ADA,. retlliffll lntNd4AJ, 
who t9qUh f1*J"' ~ ,o ~ --, rdbr ~,. Ill Dlltrlct bt»td '" .. ,,,. dw to • ~~. IN)' be 
tWqU1U1•d by ~ (53(}) at1-«44 no -., fllrl 12 1to1rt 1tt lldl,wa ~ the ~•d rnNttng h. Jn ~ .irn 
~ Codt Sldbt 5#17.5, ~...,,,ma.,. dlHM«Jloe ~o, eM olW.. ao.,o t,, ~ ~• ~ ,,_, be..,_, « 1091 .Wol.nl Au*um "*'· ~ ~ Jn dllb\ If ,ou ~ ,,_ e ~clan, ttoord r""'1MJ ., .i 
hm on tfM ~ ,_... ~ ,. ~ Adn••-. Al•..,, at (00, 820"""4. Stlflorl 3' * ~ ~ Wtd 
laoffflla. N lJtwd "*"""1 .. ~-~ lloclt TUMdlly lhroclf1h ~ 8am to 1pm . 

.. "°"""",,. Olilt*i't Adi, ........ W'l,I. ~ ~ ., .!al,--. ..,.,,. """""' Qrlr.dy Rtca ll'ld,. ~,... 
Praldot, ~ IWOllt II ,.....,1;1,«;. 

l.ocariaa 

TIIDI POllad: 3 ;/ 5" fM,,-1 

2 
PFPO loerd Mffttna. Novemt,-r 12. 2019 

20-0203 L Page 41 of 52 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
101.1 X Admin 

105'.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

507.5.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opographica I 

903.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topograph ica I 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.b X Cli matic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra phical 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4903.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phica I 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra phical 

20-0203 L Page 42 of 52 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
6112.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
6112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra phical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Appendix 8: Table 8105.1(1) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 8: Table 8105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: Dl03.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

101.2 through 101.5 X Admin 

102.6 through 102.8 X Admin 

102.10 through 102.12 X Admin 

103.1 through 104.1 X Admin 

104.3 through 104.4 X Admin 

104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin 

104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin 

104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin 

104.11.3 X Admin 

105.2.3 X Admin 

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin 

105.6.12 X Admin 

105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin 

105.6.37 X Admin 

105.6.39 X Admin 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin 

105.6.48 X Admin 

105.6.50 X Admin 

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin 

107.1 X Admin 

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin 

110.4.1 X Admin 

113.1 X Admin 

20-0203 L Page 43 of 52 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
303.1 through 303.9 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra phica I 

305.1 through 305.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

306.1 through 306.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

307.1 through 307.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.2 X Admin 

308.3 through 308.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.4 through 310.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

311.1 through 311.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

319.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

319.2 X Admin 

319.3 through 319.10.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ical 

403.10 through 403.10.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

405.S X Admin 

510.3 X Admin 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1103.2 X Topographical 

Appendix D: D101.l through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

D102.1 
Appendix D: D103.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D103.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D104.1 through 
X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

D104.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: D105.1 through 

D105.4 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D106.1 through 
X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

D106.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: D107.1 (excluding 
X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

exceptions) 

Appendix D: D108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

20-0203 L Page 44 of 52 



Attachment No. 2 

Pioneer Fire Protection District Resolution 

No. 006-2019 

20-0203 L Page 45 of 52 



• -

\ l~Ls,JLU llON OF !Hf: 1.·v1ARD OF OlR[(_ f•)R~ Uf I HJ l'l\_l'.'.'<EFR Fl[('._:_ 
l'PUI L;(TION DIST!< JC i _\[l(>f'Tlri(1 Fl'-flf>J, ,i:., >, I !l'f'r~~1n ! >,1 r 

.•\".,tENDl\-tl::N rs ro THE CALIFORNIA FIRE (ODE 

\ lc':'-tll,;,i,,11 r(\r ih.;; Pt,)[tt"('.f' Fir,: Prul,;<:1i,Ji1 Ois11i,:1 ·~1.;tli11:; i<Hd, f1ndiris'." •.\tfl1 r,.-:-;[''-U (,. 

: .. <-11 ,:._-_,n,Jiri,rn.s •sitht11 d,,~ :-irc: U1:itfl(I ,~·filch 11l;i~x ,_·,•11:,i,1 m,~.Jifi,_,llt .. rL "ivf ,-,,,\l:J;,; 1" 

ih,: (~d! I0:11l,l hr,; ('i_,.J,~ f(;1tS•}n~1blv ll•~ce:;:,arv fr1r r,il':~1;,1 ;;,•~ ffr,~ .'.,nd liti: ;,i(,;t~, ;tl 1:i::: 

,'i,_,1,c•..:r Fir~ Pf\',t~·ui,_111 [)[::;m•:!. 

\\ HF.REAS. Ht;1J1h & Satety Cn,.k ~'."1:;i~·,i-1 I /t):iS ~; wnnit~: 11 fir,~ J 11-.:,tei:1k,n 

D:,;ir1-:i i,_, :dop'.. Jr. ·':rrdin:.i,,·~·: '".t1i,~:, ~tFtn:2,·: :n m-.,,lil-1,:•, ,Ji,: :~1,11c 11,\li',lrt!J rq!tilat.i,,n:; 

.,-.!-:,~:~,! Ji',lf~:JcifiL h-; H,:[}!l!1 & S,'\~:1.', 1~(•,Ji: ':,,;,;ii,_•n , 7,r2-· ur,.J11 ,ldc1mina1i,,n th'.ll sud1 

d1:.:K,.·~~' ,_,r- rnQ-Jtlk,ni;:,n:, JJ,: ,·,~·:·.:::.·.,in, •h,_· r,:, l,1,_·.,I ,~1it1,Jllt1_',r,_,; !hat JKChlll\ iq1,ulu1inm 
:;,-,·.-,:ming c-~,n,Ji::.:,r15 h·.11.::!rd,.-n,s i·:, I•(-:', ~'~open:,· ;11,,J ,.ii•.: ,·,i, H\li1m,:111 ti-n:n flr,~. i;:,,.:p[,)St•J:t 

k,L!t··J;\t.E i;,;it,::ria1, ;:md ha.:z.;rL[c, IJ:- ·i:.r~,: :in,.( 

WHERF:AS 1 He:1\!h X: ':::Jtl'.'t; c.~J,: .;;,:,·ww I F1·,') :" r~q11ircs :h:it :1 Di:;1ri..:t'~ 

U,_,,irJ ,A Dw~ctvrs m.Jl.ln~ J;·,:: ,:'.1r,~,:_- ,,r ,l),· .. :1 1 1· .. ·,ni.>11; rur,u.,;,, 1._. Hci;th ,\'_ :;,11'.:ry 
C\,~k s~·..::titHl j]lJ5.8.5 :;baU ffr:!k,' ,,:,.pr•:'.,:; lirvJ1;1~ l:1;,;\ ,fr:1\ Jrm•t'.' , . .:,[ i\:t:•i!dk..t\[1.111:. ar~ 
nt.<edd: r:ind '.hall file a .::(,py ,,f ·:•.1•. ,:;iun~L'· ,,r nrndili1.·~t,, n~ .. , ilh th;: LkJhiftn'erl! (1f 

Housing ::.nJ Commun ii~· D-c 1 ·,:J ,-,r,•, r1(·1,1 Mid 

\\'HERE.A.S, tlv: uniqu..: k<;.I ,Ji111;11:c t'L'' d,,;,•,._:il, ;,,;11d il'•t<c1~·.Jpii:,;.,l •:(,n,JltiL1n"

e:,:isting \\llhin the b,_-,und,iri-:':': ,-,11hl". Distri,_1 111:th· it 11:t1:.,.1,-mbl\· ne·:c\~;,:y f.,,r ;lie Di,tn.•. 
Lu impos;: mop; string,:nt r,:qurwn\<:nl:, tli::in ~,:1 1,,:1h ir: rhc Cal1forcia Fir:" C,,,fr ,md 

p1ir.su::1m ,.o (alifc.rnia H.i.:,tlrh :ind ScitL"'.,· L,d,: ·;t,11<•;1-~ I ':,it'..'> 7 Jnd '17•)::,8._;, the [)iq;;,::i 

,Je~ir...-s to m,1te i:::tpr-!:i:i findi11g~ 1,:,, i,111 dfrt:"L ,m,I 

~OW, fHE.REfOJU'.., UE IT HESOL\'f,'D 1h:11 rllt Bnrmi uJ Dirc1:t1,rs of thr 

.· i•:ir.-:..:r fo,.: PI~ll,;i.:.Lkm Ui·~trk1, ,tlkr h;rdui,. d1Jl\ tHHk,:.J ~111J \idJ publk llcarlny.s. hcrr;b:,· 
:idopl~ Jb,;: inllowin~ lind,n~:, 1;i1m·,'.m1nl: i:1ur<:ril tinjqui;· I, .;;11 v111dili,:,rb 1h<ll l•)gtther 

,n3)c:~ :-a.:l.1 r11,,dit:cFi(-,r, t.<• lb·: t.' 1· t,,:11i,1 ! it•: r·r,Jc_ c,~rE(111:ibJy 11·~·:,~~':f.r; lu pll'.j·:idr 

::;J.:qUJ\,~ .:..nd l..'!T,:<.:)t',·~ pr·iiccti,:11 .r, t1ri:. p1<•p,:11:, ,H,.J iiiL· ,:11v1r,_,nf11t·tH 1111,rt ,p,::i.:ilicdl:, 

::• f,-,f.' -_,-; '~""'.)'-'>'. 

20-0203 L Page 46 of 52 



• 

L 

FJ1'1ir,:r:;s nf r ,er 
H•I< CHANGES i_rn .i!C:n!FICATH_I'\-, TO I JH- \ f -\ fl Ht tLIH '•,\I .\,'\Ii \J,I ·.., 

(ODf 1TITLE 2~ ,•_.1..Rl .-ii BEl_ \l-':,f uF IJlf .\I ~ 11'\/III I tu,, 

GL·hH1\l_ 

,\Jie1 due 1-:onsiJern1i-:rn. •ii,- (k,md ,_,1 Ci11c•, 1,_,,·, 

hc.-r-:hy 1i 11ds th:il du,: 1 v, l .. c;J I ,j i 11i.-i l_;c ~--~·,1 :,, ,1.i,: ,ii, .1 1,:,p,'., 1·:-.J1 •hn- ,, ;r:,: d 1, ,;,, --, .. ,l:::,_·,J 

'.vi1h1r1 ,_his Jo-:.:11mt!'nL :.IJi:ro; i'.; :1 11,,:<!<l 1r1 pn,•-id,- iii-:- r:1,1ddi,.1n, ,p, -1,,d ..:!r:n,~,~ :,,111.11;·,,:,J 

til d1,:; adopliw Or,finmi.:c ;:d 11,,~ C:d1ti1rr:111 I in_· l ·,1.-I,: \11d:. ,_!•:ir1Q,::. ,1,,: -k,'rH.;.\ ,,, h: 
re,-i.~,r,r,:,hJy llCC1'S5[ll'. er, r•:,n ith'. t1d1.:\jll'.!l:- i\111.I 1.·ff1~•.H'-.,' !''"!_-, lt:J-, (,i i:d· J•11-, ;,:,i .;r:d 

ll:c ~m iri:,nmcnt. 

I he 1>p:i11,:-!'.r Fir•: Prolc<-11~,11 Ui:~Lri,:1 p1 L••:ido:\, th,_· pr1H1_-1 11111,, •:1i-1,:.r ~yi,L ·, ;t,nl:L.r! ,·::\ ;,;~:: 

:md SjW<.:io I i::t.:d r,~·3,;111_· ::i.: r 1·ic,;:; t,., :1pp1'tJ~i111;1l,1h ·-···~ ht I ho11:;,111d J ":1c•1,k in :1 2'.lh ~.q1:,'.1:; 

mil~ -,,1.":l ni~ Distrli_l <> ti-.. :.:u~d i11 ,.nqth F'I I t,-,r:1,I,_, ( \•tHl1,1' f'h,; ,,·,ri,·?r:ipln ,,!' tht 

[1:,1 n,:\ i ,H,!,:i::--; I, , .. in, r,-11i 1.1J~ I Ii ll·; n I 111 :1·,:: .u1,.i , 1:11, iv, ,,-id LH,d,; 111 lhi: n-,:::t ;md c,;:J: ,md 

ti n1l:,;r in I It•-= ~-\<_:cp n1 .. 1_i!ll:iiq,ui:, ,rnd dr:i i 11ag•:~ ol du.:: ,~;.1:jt f-'•Pr1 k,11. The W•:._itlt-:r 

-:nnd',,,-,:_i,,:, '• tH:· 1·r,,11 i 1·1 u•;:.i 11,.; t.::111pt:i:1! rn·,;:. '-'-'ll h 11it::1:,i,.111:1l ::;11u1s. it1 Ilk luwcr d,:·\':\l ;un 

~rd ~w_,,.~ ire 1h,:: high,-r ..-k~1 ,_1tiw1•; rn ,, 111t,:r. (o ,;mnm,:r 1,~1111:>-::rlllmt>s di.n .::::,.:.,_t~d Inn 
d•'.!,;P_',:";_ 

Tb~ l)i rn i~-, ,:,n, tl4'.. , Ji·, id,:.f 11\\•' ,-, •. ,: :!1 •;Ii 11,-r ;irc-,1•. · I'll<:" u 1n: ,i, <.''.l ~'ll(•llnp;bo;es M0mu 

.-\\J;iu:1_ >"·in•:r,,:L i :Hq·L11 .:nc! r 1111111Jlb!-_. I Ji,: ,_·nr·~ n,,:.u 1:; rnnr-.· u,b,m 11Herfon:: ,mu 
·---~-•'.•11:111; n1,·,;;t ,_,J iii·.'. i'Ji'c[111:l·", ~.,r::1111::,: 1·01!lrH1;1~·1::d ,1<:,:dop:11,:nl :md P'-*-·ntial lnr 

•J11111l1•_'f-C\:il ,:i"'..'C!,,rm,:n: j h~ ,·,_i;·tht::b, i rjri;,:,:;y 1:~;11::d ;t,1d s1_,u1b~:1il d)mn Rc111.::h) 

nr~r:•, i,pi,_311·, ,~u:tt-,111 ·-,n,.,,\t =,•.:h-Ji\i:-.:.,,•t.: ,in,t \:.••\,1t·!d ,e:;1Jcnric1I rk· 1.--::k,prncnt,. llw:;,I." 

,~n~-,-~j ,11:: 1_h:-H:·H.·h~~ 1·1~lt 1_ t,,..- tiir.:: :;, 1.d'.1.nl'iJII f;·1i 1~r~·I1t:e_ 1rd11i:iag ,"~r r-~111r.~h (~·n\·~n.1 t'l!'1t,:-'.~·n~ flH~ 

\
1 t;.~; ._-jt._1

:~ t·:n:,111,pd·:_~\··~ tl1t: ~,:_:-~J 1·,'.idbt.~ :l!_1>l~ ~·~ 1 ~:t~1nin~ 21rn:i1J '.:1Lib.li·-.l~~(,n~. Si1'1,JH ;_~,.1~\Jtl:1J 

n:·~'1\1i:·ct1 irlf ,Jc,·,-::lqpt. 11~_:r1t ,Y 1,J :~t ,,:;1::. t .r fH'l !1'1 iu~."r3I~· ... hlng The r!'(L)1 1Jc:L:r):He5 :.\:r ~- i~> ... d~J!('•~J 

,ind 1.101t· ,w ;1i .1_: .. You 11·"'' c ;1;r1!1cr :i•.,,,~ fruri-, Grizzly flc,t·,; ::rnJ tho: (mm R.1nd1 Dtt,,~. 

l he f11u1u:-,_·f i:irt' !Jr,,!,;, 1;:,11 U1:.u :- 1 '~ ,u, 'J!l-risk'- 1~CIX;,, Tne Di~'.ri,:r p,uii~·ip(tfc:, ir1 ,, 

'.,,i1\1\fr.l1t·n1cd :11~1-_,1n.:,:,._ :1i,J ilft1'.:!f,lll1 ,nJ i·, ,ii:-p,,tch~~I 10r<:,l;-;,-:h ,!gre,:rnel!I l·.y 1;,c 

('11! i ti:,rnw D 111\1': i'il . ·l r r,j'-~5try ,w,j r; r.J Pn;.1~1;111,n ( i::: al- Fi'.<: I, ;Jr Cr:1ni1•,, , l he 
H'..,(J(lfl:l"; ,:,j' th.-: (fr:1rie '., ,11 n:-:ipnnd If. 1l!it.l Jeul \\'iltl, an; !; f'C ,:,t •.:'111¢T;,/!::ll'~; n,.~ :_,~\1\' 

-1,'i, r P1111r:,riml' in d,is do,:,u,,,.-111 i1: ::,,c,nd .1nd io.::h.Jrks r·:~~·:_,n::-:i::-:. :c, i:r,-.. <rw,t•: :m•J 

,-,d-_11 111,·c.,li'!'ati,,,n. ul,1111,,,_ r,uhlic ,l·.',ISl cJlts_ ha:c:2!:J.:,11_, 1r,31c:,-i,)I:, ·-1Kio!f111_. n,-:,.1;, 1! 

,,id. ,ah! ::p,xi;1liz,:·.J ,·,·:,,.- 1:,':' 

Tf1 - r~lfio h:l\ <'.'Sl11l_1 li::t),:,j ''ii~. r11lt-tin1.:. sirin:,d tir,: 5laliC•t'1 'Ind Ii·.,: ;,11.•)1[1,_ IJct

'1l.1: :, ;:"' Hr 1111•, · '-~ t:f\H.-1-g,:1h:·:, ~er\iee::; tr, ;he c:i1rnm,mir:i 1-:i,,~ .;;,,-,1i,,n ::;xi, i <"1ll'.'d in 

20-0203 L Page 4 7 of 52 



.~ 

F.t1111 I 1 !.' \ 
I'' 
I l,f1 

:~blf\ill d 1:; k,•.::ir,~d w dK 1m111c .. q.,,1;;1'.,.'.,l 10,•,11 ,,.f ,'•.l, 1,1,ll \11J..Lr1t •. i1 .'.'.+i_;:'1 (:·rn,, F'-,,1:d, 

V•J, \l,1,.,i1 .\iJ~:ur.-, (A Fi1e -;1;111.,11 J2. fs l,x:ir~d ,1. d,, ':i:irnl ,tid:,'•: ,ff~·~ .. ;H -F'/n >:-:ir1d 

1•.id~c j{o;,,J l'l,K,~n:ilk. ( \ l i1,.: :';1;::it:1n j l i~. lr"•c-;HC-11 ii-1 iht :·:1'\'('{'!ly 1:ri:i:,·,i11~ '111:lc ,Ii 

'ti,:,11 •Hu.-;·, f!,H F.,.l .. ;:,_111 .. :1.-,:1, 1_·:\ Th•: t)isrri,.·1 h;p: 1'1111-iinl•:. •>_u·,:.::1 t1~i~;1,1\11d. 

;:I, '•ll,' .\ ,:i, i·,,.,, ;:•.:,r.,;i~.~11:.~:i, pn:,,1u·1n.>. ••Tl': ~l'rnini:,1r..1•1,·,~ ·,1{,1"'.lf1 !'."~·siti,:m~:. ,,n':' p11hl1<: 

l,~dlt\._.,,,. \ ,n~ l_ \Venn,· • .; 1~h· <' i ;' 0

~ I r \I, .. ,;'\\\ l:1 lJr,1±) '. i-,~J _~; 11:.: Cr·, :t! H.l !I Ji l: fi:,e-'~'.~f'·, ,~_:\.! ,. ,Jt !I Lt t"•:~, _.:_, 

R ( lim.iiic 

The Pin11,:,~r ht·e l'rntt·cl i, 1:1 I 1f·,t11..: t b i.:.,1.:,1kd "" id,i 1, 1.1 ldt•! hd 1 11,1.J 1uL111rn .:! ,1>111~ 1<:~ 111:r 

ll\r; Lli::tr,-.;1 is subic,:1 11, fi1ur .;,.-11,,,.,us. \•:ith ;,r; :111Ju1:1l :1v,;r:,Lsi.':' c:r;,:,>.q~JI i11 tk ·,, ·,n1::r 

11,,,r.1h; ,jf::: i11,:i1t.:, in 1h,· .'i:s.1d1ilh . ..ii:, iw.:hc:-:- in 1h,_• ,·;11.:/ly' f'liHs ,,nd Urn,, R:1nd1 i\J t:i', 

,i;1,i }:;fl indK:, in th•: ll1•.•,rnLtlr:(,Hl'i .1:·,::s~. Iii ad.Ji!i,111 In ,lJI :th!r::i~e r;:iinfall ,~,r J:, it,clh·~: in 

rnc ~: ,:\1;.v:iuc,r1~ Jr, l ' .. 'I. in,:Ji:.·, i.1·, 1,hc h11;li•.:1 <:k-. ,,ti,w,, p,;>r :,1.:ar. Jh,,.,,,_. :1d1·,::rs(: 

'.\t..·(~i"LL~r 1 . ..:-~·,nditk·n~ i:.:·r•.\,>~ -:-~\ c:r~ L;!.Jtlr\3t~1,1~ t1.l,!d 1~· 1_'1~:d~~i(1H~, r11·,rrdin~ .t~.:. 11.L.'t.•H .. 1;~. J\!(~~ ~.;lr(1t.,t 

it'.l.:'.,\fl!'.1 aJ.•rJg ilW tn.t'.fl (1·~(C:,~ ;·;_,JQ~ l',"iltif•',, ,I~, ',\·~!! ,l:' ;)f•,', iJl(." 1);,l!i, I ff1)fTI 1hc 

\l_llf,inncJing an.:'HS. f)IJC 1~1 ,.,<:ri£!J.; Uf fl!i•~([l1! ult.\l! 1l '.\ :th :-r:;"..tE{(d li'l:L_! ,_:!. ;5ur,;~. !h~ 

.ibihl'y ,.,r lhl hit' P,,:,l<"Utllll i)j,;nic.! \ll pP.<',·ldc.• ,Jt•JllL,Jirl!t: <:n1 1;r.:,:1:.rv,·:, J•;,pi ,,·, f i~ 1•f'.c:[1 

..Jdav,~J ,_,r 1mpas:./.1til,~. 'fh•.:·i•: ~:rn,,~ :1d,e1~,r c:i,m 1111; 1.·,~ndi1ion~ ... n,..n f'.:>•·i\ 1[1 ;1 i:ir:.;t 

r,wli;..c .. ··,( ·, ..:fti,:111.H :i,~ci,kr,e; drn1 r1l:tt't ,::rn,:nh: r,:s,ram1s Ci:L th·_· •.1 1, ::il11biliry of 

,;nier~enc:, f•!Spc1n ;:? W pi::d>1nn cm::,ge-ncy r,:~,i.\11..°. Jib! 11ii:I. hazaroou 1
: nll!l1~d11h, Clrntrul, 

rn,1 fir·::- !'ighiin~ l h,. •.:lim,1ti~· ,~,;n..iiti,·,r1; ,,ft,-,:. :-:,nh in ::i ::;u\-is.1.11n11u1 ,.i1 ti:11Lil Ind: c,f 

:ihili1y ,:.f !he t=!!··: f'; .. 1~1.:;,·,, Ul,;:rict t(• rc~r,rnd n11rn,:Jh1cty •.,.·, ,,,h,:r t 1. r<~ ,:,( -.-rner!?,tn·~Y 

\'. i ldLmd ,mJ fon·i;: ti r-::·:,. p,. ,,.~.:Jin~. h:.v:i rdr.,11: ,11:,:s:ri,d~ i n..:]d"nl:. ,.-n:n /' r,,.:, : t1c-1 :c!: 

(:nib. \'chicle ,h:,.1dt1,1:,, ;md \ i:nicnJ rt:S\ uc;;, rt,c• 1,,1nu11i :ii.J ugn:c,q,,r:1:· ·:,,lfll•li;,hcd ., iiil 

,1,Jr,_;ining flrr: '11/•mci~•.'. 1'i'! ight no[ bi.: p1y;:;ibk ,.hie- li..r :i\J ',•~f~l' \. j j i1l1Hi,; Ulf,.ji, i,,i:$ 
r.::-.,uidtng \!t 1s:,:.1Hy ht,.w ~Jng :i;:cess in!" 1 he i)1s11i<:1. 

Surum.try: 

Th·:;,,~ h:•<·""i, 1i,ndl.tr; ,:,,t1d:1ic,ris :alr·c(l -ho:: ,sc,2,:l~1,11\,)n. mrew,11:,. ·.11,d 1,1,.,.. qf t1r,:~ tn :he 

fire Dbtriu IH11c~ r,f Lt1J-i c:ir n,,; :;1111fj/l I,;·,· l,ur:·,;.:i,1:,. u.nd l,i12l: r,:mr•:rnlur~;; .;r.:>1k' 

~\[rcm::I'., h-r.:•u.J .. ,11·, cu;11Ji11,,n:,. p j[1;-_:nhuh ~b ;h:,· 1,.1;,1>: ['.I ,:·:.: ',\ i1.jJ;,r,d-1Jrr-,11, 

in1·.~rfou::-. \'i 1 :·', •:sr•ni..:·11,,:d in rhi,. c11-~;1 ,.· 11, h,!'.•: •: sigliif,1::11,1 h1,~,.~,:t ·,,r,,·,n :irn·~'.t.Ht: 

fa~~- ,~;,;pr~CJJJi_\ Ill builJin~s in 1:k,<;l' j.1fl1\t!l)lt;. :0 1Jfi..:• ,tnoth• r .. il1J !1J '.,llGJJ11,j;:, 

,;·,)lnll)•)ll I';' fnt1r.,J it; the Plun,·,:r f '"~ P1 ot,:.:t inn Uistri.:·t, ::;f r,JL! U! ,:0
• h11,lt 1\i!h;n I he: 

Pi,"incn Fir,~ P,.:,tc.:lt<'lfl Lli5trict mit:·,1 b.: t,Htlt 1,ith th,~s~ 1,·;tri,it,f.:'.; in 111iwJ. 

20-0203 L Page 48 of 52 



• 

' .. 

:.. GMloiical. lh~ ['i,Hh:<.:: Fire Pr11kdi,:i11 Di:,1111.:1 l'.i 1111::11.i:d 1•,ithiri 111>1dcr:1k ,1.:t11111 

"c:bl!lll.: ,,__,,,~J•; Tr,,,;c fl•,,: ~,:·i:,mi•_, ~c,.l,,•gl•~jl C•H1di1i,,w, lll··~~r:111 ;_1 jl<ll•:l1!1UI iuf' :>tlllli(,k 

firr::s. 1));1j,1r br~.lka~,~ ilt' \\;11C"t r[l;till:,, 11111l1irk di!ctrii.:.11 pm\cr t:1il111,;:., n111l1ipk 

,_·otL·1r~c·J Cl!'UCIUrt:, and,) b:-gi:: lllHllb•cl .,f ,;;dh r,,, (.'11/'..'l~~lll.'~· n1cdkal ,1id. llii ,)t"'.,•h11.:h 

1~·,.iy .1..::c1.,r ~1m;1h:rn·~·-,t1sl) ,Junn:e ;1 sc1~rn1,; cv~rn 1111: \\:111·r dis1rlrr:, h,n·i· nrnr,l-:·nuf, 
,1ukr-plit:.p11\:!!, ,)~l•!ffl', 1ut:,I frn rin.- ~11pp1·v~·-im11 '.. 1 .;l,'1 lll.'li1:cT), :1s ,vdl tl:1 '.\':llt:r ~1011.1!,'.(; 

l,U~.;: p[H'.'lding ',•::.ti~-: ·'.\ 'ckni ('1 1,'c,:-111•~· ~.,,)~1 IJr l)ir- 11111111•1ng ·~~ s1cn1s IIIT i1~·1":n1k111 •.rn 

.:il.'d:]C.11 fl•~•·.,;_•r f',.,r· ••r,.:J t.Hi•'>rl S th.: h ,.·l,:1.'t1i 0:;al I "(•\'-•a flH'.,' f1l)I n•: :I 1·;1i1:1hk durin ~ J 

s,:1\n·i~ ·!\ t·r~l \l.'f!lir ,1ur:u1 . ..:- (,id.:-, u·;t·d f(1r th~· :'tnrH~t· uf rcqwn:d the :-;uppr..:·;~i,111 w1,1n 

m;1y :l•i·~· :,,lhp~I.' in s:.:1.h "11 ,.•\·,;1,1 ,;,r .. in~ tht: 1,ldiiin1',;,I n--:i::d 1.n t1;111.~por1 '.\.';ll".'r \'l,1 

,11.1d111..:,r1.il pi,_•..:c~ ,,f !1r,:- Hpp.11 lfuL, ,.,hi,:h ,,, ill pl.11:1• ,, ~i~nilii:,1111 rc~1r.1im o>n tit(' ;thilll\ of 

rl,r P151nd fr., J'.lfll\ ..Ji: rh.-: r'<.'.ljlllr,.:d •:.t1tcr~~·r11.:~ ~·:n i,:i::, 

S 11111 ltUI f) : 

L•Jc.1: ~i:,:~r:iphi,: .1nd ,;_;.:nti·,)211.'.11 1,;,lf1Jrc:i, ;,rid t·nro..:.,:!>~c" ,::,1.\I ',', i1hi11 the h,·11,11d:1ric:-. ot'tht: 

Ji-,1m:1 tbu! rnuy h.unpn the ahtllt~ ,:,1 lhc Pinnc1.:1 hr,; Ptofc•~IJI.IJl rn~11i,.:t In pc1t•11111 it~ 
y,•, ,:,n 1 ,Jut,~-~ Firr fi.111<.•··" '-•lol ;11. ,:unh,.1u;1~; ,: Ii.a~ i ht: ~>s\t\'111i,d ,_.r 1::.iu1in~ ~r,::w.:r lll~s c.f life 

Jik1 d<.1111,l',.;C 1h11n lilt: s.:.1rthq11,tl..·~ 1Edt. 

,·,~·l'·;\; .. kr,::..t hy !!H.'. St;:iic :,·, c.•:: h•.t,;.h 1ir,: h.mu.J ,,111..:nly 11.•n.:~; T!v: Di~l1ir.:t i:i; lm:.at,:d 

"' nhin afxnJt 70 l'letl.'.cn! lw•rtldl 1t·1Tt\1r1 r1nd ::u p~r\'.clll m,t1111tair,,:,us tcrr.:;in. u,1 cred •vith 

111~111~ tonit·,11s11hk \ ~g .. !.slt(•n, 1;1eluJi111.; the pr<"wni:c ·.if man:, ·~•JOii\!llllt'- for,~slci.l nrcas. 

·, h-: 1.'k, ·,11i,,11 ":•hrn l!1•: U1~1r·,(;t r<1r1~~;; iri:•m ~·- I ;)(11J l<C! r•.• ,:,'.''!r 7,JOr'1 fret 01 Ille 

tH·~l,,:~t p,.,11,L ,;;10;1\.' \1 l1lliu I.Le Ois11kr rnn:~e'., (1ur,1 1) d.:'?!>!es lrJ 90 degret''i. 'lho: 

~uuduh..'~ ,qtllin 11·,c ,1•.e:;~ ,:,f r.:x,1hilh tclFilJ\ h,,,.c ltn111cd lir~ ,.K-.'C'ss. due io na.rrnw 

1,,nd1111:s ·,rnh st.:.:p ~nd1.·~ ,ind pu,:,r mud "Jrfu,.;.;· c,m,Ji1ic,nj. Th,! prd..:tKt ,.:d· many 
.:::,:,1i1'11_: 1::t:111..'.l!Jt\7'~ 11itll,r1 1h::- hiih fm: ha.;,1rd ·,,:·, cri!) 1.ow::- ar,:u·i prlll.-tJt':; for a -.,;ry high 
1}1*'"'':1l 11f f1 ._,ru1..1.11r~ tire spre.iding in,-:, 3 wildbnd 01 lmc,t tire: c:m1dition ,'.'J.S well a'.'i the 
p.-,1,:11ti,1I fur ;J \qlJl,,nd 1..r fim:~1 r'irt. ,.pr~·adin.~ t<J )ft11.:tur..:-s 

\11n11n11n·: 
·1 h~ alignmcm .J!° •-.\11:uns_ ~ lil!e:, s. ilnd ~1,:-~1'!:; intL1 inhabited areas. cnrn~iocJ v. Jlh the 

-, ari11hk m1!Lm.: ,.:if riv: kn-a1n yield p,,,tntial for 11w,t.·ssnl lit>: 1isk. Mosr slrucrnres_ \-1.:,ih 

1 csiu;:111 i,il ,rnJ 1..0mm1:roal ,in· in c,r ar~ sum ,1.r.<l..:<l t>:, areas iha( ('••niain si~ni fi·~anr 
i;rn-.-,. hnish. rnixed r_,J\; •, ,)oJlanct_ ilrtd mix,:J ·:i.:inifor f,Jd l0ad Due tO dwu!_lhl 

ci:indilions. beetle inks1~1ions. and lad, of·. c;•:lation managcrn~nt much 0f th~ area 15 

populillcJ with either dc&d or d:,in£ tr~es. c;:i.n!ributing If.:• :!Xtremc: tire: dani;cr. 

', 
I 

i 

R,.!solutirn1 l~v: 006-20 t 9 ~iarie Fitt~ 1,-
I' 

Fik1.:n StrungfolJ ~· .... L:".(. 

20-0203 L Page 49 of 52 



-,. • 

1-~ C,1ndp':i,m: 

.\, v~· -

J 

: ,, .1i .·Ii, ... ,, i,_· 

111.~-,(~)/i,.,_i._l i({ Tf1i1 jL~'.'!,.: 1~·1·~ ,;; 

r·:i!di1· 1!1;, l!ila1ilt ,•1i:1 '<:;,;_, 

.·;,_,_ I,,, 

:: _,; 'l".-.: .• ~ ·, l. ·c 

;· \',,sr·1, \l'~ll \ ,,- •• q\·, Er1 '!!:,tr~.:: ,:;I! ;1"1<· .. ;,n,:'. tt1 P''.'/ ::~!-··~'",!. (1f1,_.1"i1'1~~' ,,1- t 1· .. : 

1·;1: 1n•:.}1 r lr'1w Pt ·1~:<:r,'dl l)i 1~!1:1. ,_<!I, ·1, L ,1'!,l~ f0i ! ·,1_'! t L· ( i 'i_·/~ )\'. !!1;.. j ! _J,i 

I'• 

f: 
[j 

1-1 
I.] 

i-1 

.4 

:.: ~ i 1, r:·, i· ! I t\, 1, t' 

, ,·1 r-1, '.,: ,~11J: ~1 r 

.. r? 

,l _1~ f :- -
-- --·----- . -

I, 
~ ~ 

, ." .::.c •.t~I_ _1 r· I--.,,' 

, '- • > • ~ ,i..' ,' ~~ I ( ' 

I 

20-0203 L Page 50 of 52 



RESOLUTION NO. XXX-2020 
Of THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. OJ 1-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is 
updated by the State every three yean; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 Californi11 Fire Cooe becwnt eJTecLive ou Ja.11u1try l, 2020; HJ1d 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958. 7 and J 8941.5 
permit a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county detcnnines are 
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health and Safety Code, Davision 12, Part 2, 
Chapter 11 Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety 
regulations to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building 
official, or his or her authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his 
or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, enforcement of the Fire Code in the County of El Dorado has been delegated to the 
chief of the fire prot~tion district., or his or her representative~ and, 

WHEREAS, on November 12, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Pioneer Fire Protection 
District adopted Ordinance No. 2019.l which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with 
amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or 
topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El 
Dorado ratify the following amendments to the California Fire Code adopted by the Pioneer Fire 
Protection District: 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following 
SC(:001\S: 

101.1, JOS.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202,302.1, 307.4.4through 
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.l, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, SOS.1. 
507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b)., 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 
903.2.9, 903.2.IO, 9Q7.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.31 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.l, 4905.4, 
SOOJ.7. 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1 1 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.l through 
6112.3, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 (NFPA 13D-2016), Appendix B: Table BIOS.I (1). 
Appendix B: Table BJOS.2, Appendix 0103.1 through 0103.3, Appendix D103.5, Appendix 
D103.6.I, Appendix 0103.6.2, Exception, Appendix 0104.4., Appendix 0106. l Exception. 
Appendix DI 07. I Exception. 

20-0203 L Page 51 of 52 



I~ ... ~ •• 

The Pioneer Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in 
its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 
2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 
Resolution No. 000-2020 
Page 2 of2 

I 05.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 31 I .6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403.4, 403.6, 
403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12, 404.1-
404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808, 904.1. t, 
1101, 1103.1, l 103.3-J103.6, 1103.9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103. to, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, 
Chapter 26, the exceptions under D 104.2 (Exception), D 106.1 (Exception), D 107. I (Exceptions 
I and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, 
Appendix L, Appendix M. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California flre Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular 
meeting of said Board, held the 71ti day of January, 2020, by the following vote of said Board: 

Attest: Ayes: 
James S. Mitrisin Noes: 
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors Absent: 

By:----------
Title Sue Novasel, Chair, Board of Supervisors 

20-0203 L Page 52 of 52 




