RESOLUTION NO. 044-2020

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO
(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 020-2017)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the
State every three years; and,

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective January 1, 2020; and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a
county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably necessary
because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1,
Atrticle 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulations to the local
level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized
representative or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representativeand,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the fire
protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection of
certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on November 12, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Pioneer Fire Protection District adopted
Ordinance No. 2019.1, which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with amendments the District deemed
necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado
ratifies Ordinance 2019.01 of the Pioneer Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement of the
ordinance to the Pioneer Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections:

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4 through
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1.
507.5.1, 903 .2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9,
903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3,3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905 .4, 5001.7, 5601.2,
5601.2.1, 5601.2.2,5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 through 6112.3,

6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 5.1.1.2,

Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B:
Table B105.1 (1), Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D103.5
Section 1, Appendix D103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104 4.

20-0203 L Page 1 of 52



Resolution No. 044-2020
Page 2 of 2

The Pioneer Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety,
including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the nternational Fire Code, 2018 edition not

adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5,311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403 .4,
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12,
404.1- 404 .4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808,
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106,
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception), D107.1
(Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J,
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019
California Fire Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said

Board, held the 10 day of  March , 2020, by the following vote of said Board:
Ayes: Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin, Novasel
Attest: Noes: None
Kim Dawson Absent: None
Clerk the Board o er g //
o M% 2 /
Deputy Clerk! Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Board of ﬁuperwsors

20-0203 L Page 2 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
FIRE « RESCUE » EMS

. Board of Directon
P.O. Box 1258 e Wi e
i - s s - Cha
7061 Mt. Aukum Road g:,: Howe - Viez Chan
Somerset, California 93484 ';4‘:“*: ";"‘“‘5 hommns
- - - = pe the [rids — [Jametiom
Phone (530) 620-4444 e Fax {(530) 620-4317 Erleon Sirangfeld - Dhusmiia

www pioneerfire org

December 18, 2019

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors
330 Fair Lone

Placerville, CA 95667

Subject:  Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019.01 of the Pioncer Fire Protection
District which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code with amensdments related to
local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions.

Drear Mro Ashion:

The Proneer Fire Protection District (PFPD) is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS) ranify
its Ordinance No. 20190 1which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code as amended due to specific
loeal climatie, geographic and opographic conditions. Californie Health and Safety Code Section
13869.7 requires the legislative body of the city or county where the ordinance will apply to ratify,
madify or deny the adopted ordinance. The BOS must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance
to either the Fire Distriet (or its represeptative) or the Chiel Building Official

Iheretore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 201901 waih
amendments to the 2019 Califorma Fire Code. and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to
the Pioneer Fire Protection District Chiel. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed {or vour review
and use on this topic.

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County

Singezely. . . ‘
= Ll f.? ” }“;
K/’Mi:ﬁ{l&t\); "»_\.‘[’.L /2 E:_i:-::———-—

Fire/Chicf
ATTACHMENTS:
1. Proneer Fire Protection District Ordinance Na 2019.01

2. Pioneer Fire Protection Distnet Finding of Fact Resolution Ne. 006-201%
3. Draft El Dorado County BOS Resolution

20-0203 L Page 3 of 52



Attachment No. 1
Ploneer Fire Protection District Ordinance

No. 2019.01

20-0203 L Page 4 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ORDINANCE NO. 2019.01

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE PIONEER FIRE
PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS:

An ordinance of the Pioncer Fire Protection District (P10) adopting the 2019 Edition of the Californiu Fire
Code, incorporating the 2018 Edition of the /nternational Fire Code, regulating and governing the safeguarding of
life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances,
materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or pruperty in the occupancy of buildings and premises
in the P1O; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing Ordinance No. 2016-37
of the PIO and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith.

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the PIO, aiso known as the Pioneer Fire Protection
District:
Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS
Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS
Section 4. CONFLICT
Section 5: SEVERABILITY
Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACIS

The PIO makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 2019 Edition, pursuant to
Health & Safety Code Sactions 13869.7, 17958.7 and 18941].5 during this code adoption process. Such changes
are necessary because of local climatic, geological and/or topographical conditions, The PIO has adopted,
pursuant to Section 18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these
conditions by Resolution #2019-10 of the PIO dated September 19, 2019,

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
The PIO adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, ig jt3 eptirety. including Appendices,
incorporating those sections of the /nternational Fire Code, 2018 cdition not adopted by the state, with the
cxclusions listed balow:

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 1
20-0203 L Page 5 of 52



Exclusions; 105.6.17-105.6.19, 1056.39, 308.1 4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 4031, 4032 1-403.2.4, 403 3,
403 4, 4016, 401 7, 401 8 {adopung 403.8.1403.8,1 7), 403.9, 403.102, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12, 4041404 4,
405.1-405.4, 405 £-405.9, 406, 305-807 (sdoptng 807.5.2), 808, 904.1.1, 1 10], 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9
(adopting 110391}, 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception),
D106.1 (Exception}. D107 | (Exception), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix ],
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopied can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 California Fire
Code.

SECTION 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS
The following Sections are hereby amended or added:

Chapter |

Section 101 Scope and Gencral Reguircments
1911 Title shal; be amended as follows: Add name of jurisdicnon {PIO]

Section 193 Permits

- 195627 LPG-ga3 shall be amcnded 83 follows: Add o the exception. At or above 5,000 feet of
elevauon, a permit i not required for individual contatners with a 125-galion water capacity or less,
or muluple contminer systems having an aggregate quantity not exceeding 125 galions serving

occupancies in Group R-3.

- Section 106 Fees

- 1966 Permit. Plan Review aad Iaspection Fees shall be added as follows: A schedule of fees
adopted by the district board of directors for plan review, inspections and the issuance of permits by
the district may be found in the mast curvent district fee schedule (Health & Safety Code 17951).

- 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees shall be added as follows: Fire service fees may be charged to any
person, firm, corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the district to respond to the scene of an incident. A
district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the district provides or ihe cost
of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code 13916). The fee shall
not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to the scene of an inciden.
106.7 Admipistrative Cogts shall be added as follows: When a test or inspection is scheduled, and
the contracior fails 1o perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ
may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveiing to and from the test/inspection location and
the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs.

Ordinance 2019.0) Page 2
20-0203 L Page 6 of 52



- Ssction 109 Board of Appeals

- Sestion 1094 Appeal Procedures and Timelines shall be added as follows: Any person or entity who
believes they may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code
official through u wrilten notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the pastmark on
the notice. All such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for
the district. A timely appeal shall stay further action by the fire code official unfil the matter is
determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in Section 109.2, unless the issue poses an imminani fire
or life safety harard to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify the appeliant by
certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be scheduled to take place no
sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified mail. The appellant shall have the
right to appear in person or by agent al the hearing and present oral, written and/or photographic
evidence (o0 the Appeal Board,

- Section 110 Violatiops

- 110.4 Viglation Peanitics shall be amended as follows: Persons who shall violate a provision of this
code or shall fai to comply with any of the requircments thereof or who shall erect, install, alter,
repair or do wark in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code
official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting attorney or agency, punishable by a
fine not exceeding $/00.00 for a firsi violation, 2. A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation
of the same provision within one year; 3. A fine not exceeding $1000.00 for each additional violation
of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding /80 days, or both such fine
and impnsonment Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shal} be
deemed @ sepanate offense. (Health & Safery Code Sections 13145 and 17995).

- 11042 Cltationy shall be added as follows: The Fire CMef, or his/her duly authorized
representative, may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to
Section 13871 of the Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chaprer Sc (commencing
with Section 853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California.

- Section 112 Stop Work Qcder

- 124 Fallure to Compiy shall be amended as follows: Any person who shall continue any wark
after having been served with » stop-work order, except such work as that person is directed o
perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or
both as described in Section 110.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17993).

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 3
20-0203 L Page 7 of 52




Chapter 2

- Secton 202 General Deflaitions

- Add definition for Campfire - Shall mean a fire which (s used for cooking. personal warmih, lighting,
or aesthetic purposes. This includes fires contained within outdoor fireplaces and enclosed stoves
with flues or chimneys. stoves using sellied, liquid or sohd fuels. portable burbecue pits, braziers, or
space heating devices which are wsed outside of any structure, mobile home. or any living
accommodation mounted on a vehicle.
Add definition for District - Shall mean the district and all other areas within the exterior boundaries
thereof now or hereafler established

- Add defimtion for Driveway - Shall mean a vehicular access that serves up (o two (2) parcels with no
mare than hvo (2) residentual units and any number of non-commercial or industrisl building on each
parecel.

- Add defiution for Executive Body - Shall mean the Board of Directors of the Disirici
Add definition for Flre Chlef - Shall meun the Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire
departmentidisirict serving the jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative,

- Add defirution for Trained Crowd Manager - Shall mean standby personnel, wswally a security
guard or usher persannel, who are trained in the proper procedure to &xit peoplie from a 1ent or other
place of public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency

Chapter 3

- Section 382 Definitions
302.1 Definitions shall be amended as follows: Added Campfire definition. ss shown above in
Chapter 2.

- Sestion 207 Opea Burning, Recreational Fires, and Qutdoor Fireplaces
14,4 Campfire Restrictions shall be sdded as follows:

- 302.4.4.1 [t is unlawful for any person o light, maintain, or use a campfire upon or near any brush-
covered land, grass-covered land. or forest-covered land during the time when burning permits are

suspended by the Director of the Department of Forestry and Fire Protection. the CAL FIRE Unit
Chief, or the AHJ.

Exception: Commercial cocking operations with upproval of the AHJ.
N1.4.4.2 When campfires are allowed. it should be unlawful for any person to light, maintain, or use
a campfire upoa any brushcovered land. grass-covered land, or foresi-covered land unless the
Jollowing minimum requirements are complied witk.

- 1442 (8) The area within 3 feet of the periphery of the campfire is cleared of all flammable
material and vegetation.

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 4

20-0203 L Page 8 of 52



307,442 (b) One serviceuble shovel with a handle of at least 12 inches is ready for use a1 the
immediate area of the campfire,

- 391.4.4.2 (6} Campfires shall be limited to a | foot by | foot area, unless in an appruved manufactured
cooking device or fire ring.

- 307.44.2 (d) Wrinten permission of the landowner must be obtained prior to the ignition of the
campfire and shall be on site.

Chapter §

- ¢ r (% ogd

- %03.2.1 Dimcnsiops shsll be amended as follows: Fire apparatus access rosds shail have an
unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet, exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb to
face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and unobstructed
vertical clearance of not Jess than /5 feer. All driveways in the district shall not be less than |2 fast
wide.
503.2.5 Dead Ends sha!l be amended as follows: Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways
in excess of 150 feet in length shall be provided with an approved area for tuming around fire

apparatus.
- $§03,2.6 Pridgcs and Elevated Suxfaces shall be amended as follows: Where a bridge or an elevated

surface is part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in
accordance with the current £f Dorade County Transportation Division Bridge Standard or Appendix
D of the current California Fire Code, whichever (s more restrictive. Bridges and elevated surfaces
shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load
limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when required by the Fire Code Official. Where
elevaled surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces which are not designed
for such use, approved barriers, approved signs, or both shall be installed and maintained when
required by the fire code official.

- 503,42 No Parking in Fire Lanes shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, or leave
standing any vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary lo avoid conflict with
other traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or histher duly authorized
representative, Peace Officer or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway, at any
curbd, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking facility,
designated as a fire lane by the district with jurisdiction over the area in which the place is located.
The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to, and visible from, the
designated place clearly stating in letters not less than one inch in height that the place (s a fire lane,
(2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color, marking the place with the

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 8

20-0203 L Page 9 of 52



words "FIRE LANE ", which are clearly \vuible from a vehicle, or (3) by a red curb or red paint on
the sdge of the roadviay upon which is clearly marked the words “FIRE LANE "

%03.4.3 No Parking in Front of Hydraaty shall be sdded as follows: No person shail stop. park, or
leave standing any vehicle within |5 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a} If the vehicle is
attended by a licensed driver wha 1 seated in tha front seat and who can immediately move such
vehicle in case of necessuy. tb) If the vehicle 15 owned or operated by a fire department and (s ciearly
marked as a fire department vehicie

503.4.4 Fire Lages Based op Road Width shall be added as follows: Fire lanes shail be based on
road width as required in Appendix D as amended by the district. —
§03.5.3 Fire Apparatus Access Gates shall be added as follows: All automatic and manual gates
installed over fire apparatus access roads shall comply with the district gate siandard as approved
by the fire code officlai

Section 303 Premise Identification
5051 Address Ideptification shall have the first line of this paragraph amended as follows:
Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply with the district address standard as approved

by the fire code official

Section 307 Fire Protection Water Supplies
- $07.5.1 Where Reauired shall be amended as follows: 400 feet shall be amended 0 /50 feel.

Chapter 9

- Sestion 903 Fire Spriaklers
903.2 Whers Reagirgd shall be amended a3 follows: An approved sutomatc speinkier system shail
be required and wnssalled in new buildings and structures 3600 square fee! or greater when
constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction as described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12,

Exception: Agncultural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial purposes.

- 903.2.2 Whars Required shall be added as follows: Status of existing buildings greater than 3,600
square feet. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, ather than ons and two-family dwsliing
wnits, and agricuinaral buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, whers the
Sfloor area of the building or structure is increased by an addition of more than thirty percen: (30%)
or 1,000 square feet whichever (s less, such building or structure shall be made to conform o Section
903.2.
993.2.0 Whers Required shall be added as follows: Statws of existing buildings less than 3,600
square feet In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or lesy, other than one-and two-family dwelling
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, where the

Ordinance 2019.01 Page @
20-0203 L Page 10 of 52



floor area of the building or structure s increused to a total square footage over 3,600 square feet,
by an addition of more than thirty percent (3(0%%j or 1, 000 squure feet. whichever i1 less, such building
or structure shall be made 1o conform (o Section $03.2.

903.2.1 Growp A shall be amended as follows for A groups A-1 through A-4:903.2.1.1 (1) The fire
area exceeds 3, 600 square fee:.

- 993,23 Group F shall be amended as follows: 903.2.3 (1) Throughout all Group E fire arcas grester
than },600 square feet in area.
903,24 Group F-] shall be amended as follows: 903.2.4 Group F. 903.2.4 (1) A Group F fire area
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

903,2.7 Group M shall be amended as follows: 903.2.7 Group B and M. 903.2.7 (1) A Group B and
M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feer.

- 903.2.8.2 Masulactered Homes shall be added as follows. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall
be regquired in all new manufaciured homes and multi-family manufoctured homaes intended for use
as a one-and two-famuly dwelling. The design and installation of swch systems shall be in accordance
with Califormia Code of Regulations, Titla 25, 44300

Exceptions:

1. Manufaciured homes located within an existing mobilehome park complying with
California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3,

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed ] 200 square feet in size and serve as an
accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Governmen: Code Section 658502 when the
exising primary residence on the property is not required (o comply with California
Residential Code Section R313.2

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feel in size.

903.2.9 Group §-1 shall be amended as follows: 90329 Group S. 903.2.9 (1) A Group S fire ares
exceeds 3,600 square feer.

903.2.10 Groun S-2 kaclosed Parking Garages ahell be amended as follows: 903.2.10 (1) Where
the fire aree of the enclosed parking garage cxceeds 3,600 square feet.

- Section 907 Fire Alarm and Detaction Systsms
- 297.2.a Where Required - New Bullding or Structures less than 3,600 sauare fees shall be added
as follows: An approved fire alarm/detection system shall be installed in all buildings with a floor

area less than 3,600 1quare feet.
Exceptions:
i. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified
as "U")
Ordinance 2019.01 , ‘ Page 7

20-0203 L Page 11 of 52



2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial
purposes (e.g., retails sales, food service, and/or special events).

3. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined
by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, based on building
construction material and features, location, occupancy type, and distance to
exposures.

- 907.2.b Status of Existing Buildings shall be added as follows: In existing buildings without an
approved automatic sprinkler system, other than one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultural
building not under special use permit for commercial purposes where a fire alarm detection system
does not exist and the floor area of the building or structure is increased or modified hy more than
thirty percent (30%) or 1,000 square feet, whichever is less, such building or structure shall be made
1o conform to Section 907 when required by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative.
Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined by the Fire Chief,
or his/her duly authorized representative, based on building construction materials and features,
location, occupancy type, and distance to exposures.

- 907.2.c Monitoring shall be added as follows: All fire alarm/detection systems shall be connected
directly through and momtored by a U.L. upproved central, proprietary or remote station service,
which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly attended location, All sprinklered buildings
shall be monitored.

Exceptions:

1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified
as “U").

2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial
purposes (e.g., retails sales, food service, and/or special events).

- 907.2.d Type 1 Hood Installations shall be added as follows: The requirement of installation, or
replacement, of u 1ype I Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system to be
instatled, or for the hood system to be connected to an existing fire alarm/sprinkler moniloring system
for that building.

- 907.6.2.1 Secondary Power Supply shall be added as follows: In accordance with NFPA 72, the
secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power capacity under quiescent load (system
operating in a non-alarm condition) shall be amended to a minimum 72-hour power capacity.

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed the

requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12,

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 8
20-0203 L Page 12 of 52



Chapter 12
Section 1203 Emergency agd Standby Power Systems
1293.1.3 lustaliatiog shell be amended a3 foilows Emergency power systems and standby power
sywtems shall be installed in accordance with the Californis Building Code, the California Electric
Code, NFPA 110 and NFPA |1}, AUl buildings. other than one- and two-family dweliing units, and
agricultural buildings not used for commercial purposes. with standby power, shall have a shunt trip
device ihat disconnects all power sources 1o the building, approved by the fire code official  Existing

installationt shall be mainiained in accordance with the original approval.

Chapter 33

- Jom 3310 Ac

- 3310.3 Premise Identification shall be added as follows: Prior fo and during construciion, un
approved address sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicie access road eniry into
the project.

- Section 3312 Water Suoply for Fire Protection
3312.1 When Reguired shall be amended as follows: Prior to combustible materials arnving on
site, tha fire hydrant water system shall be installed and mamained in continuous operation The
amount of water wuppiied shall meet the required fire flow for the project.

Chapter 49

Saction 490) Plans

- 490).1 Where Required shall be added as follows: The fire code official of the PIO may require
development projects located in Moderate, High and Very-High Fire Hazard Severity Zones 1o submit
fire protection plan. This plan shall be approved by both the fire code ufficial and the authorized
representative for the local CAL FIRE Unit Chief (if located in the Siate Responsibility Area {SRAJ)
prior to the recording of the final map for the project by the County of El Doreda.

- Section 4905 Wildfirs Protection Bullding Construction

- 49034 Roof Construction Reauvirements shall be sdded as follows: A!l mew construction, including
additions, requires a Class A roof covering or assembly_ All re-roofing requires Class A roof covening
or assembly as a minimum Re-roofing in excess of 30% of an exisiting structure within any one year
period will necessitate that the entire roof be a Class A roof covening or assembly as a minimum.
Class B or C fire retardeant treated and or non-ireated wood shake or shingles are not approved as
a roof covering matenral for Class A assembly.

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 9
20-0203 L Page 13 of 52




Chapter 50

- Sectien 5001 Generni

- 5091.7 Lisbility for Damagey shell be added as follows: Any damages or cost resulting from the
careless handling. spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall constituent debt againyt amy
such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge This debs is collectible by the Fire
Chigf. or histher duly authorized represeniative, in the same manner as in the case of an nbliganon

under contraci. expressed or implied

Chapter 56

Section 3601 Gemcral
5$601.2 Permit Required sha!l be amended as follows. Permits shail be required as set forth in
Section 105.6 and regulated in accordance with this section. Where explosives permity are required,
they shall be issued by the Fire Chief, or hivher duly authorized represeniative, and the E! Dorado
County Sherifl's Depariment. Where fireworks permis are required, they shall be issued by the Fire
Chief or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County Board of Supervisors.

- 560121 Documentation shali be added as foliows: The AHJ shall Aave the authority 1o request
documentation regarding all aspects of the fireworks preseniation.

- 8601.22 Propristary luformation shall be added as follows. The AHJ will protect all proprietary

information

Chapter 57

- Sestion $704 Storags
5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Groupd Tanks are Prohibited shall be amended as follows:
Storage of Class [ and Class [I lammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited
unless approved by the Fire Chief, or histher duly authorized representative. When permitied by the
Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, all above ground iank(s) or vamlit installaions
Sfor the storage of Class [ Il or Il flammable and combustible liquids shall comply with those
requirements as et forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall also apply to
installations other than motor vehicle fiel dispensing stations where above-ground storage is required.

- Ssction 3706 Special Operations
§706.2.44 Locations Whars Abeve-Grouad Tanks ars Prohibited shail be amended as foliows:
Sworage of Class | and Class Il flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is
prohibited wnless approved by the Fire Chief or Als/her duly authorired representative. When
permitted by the Fure Chisf, or his/her duly authorized representative, all above ground tank(s) or
vt installations for the storage of Class I, Il or 11l flammable and combustible liquids shall comply

Ordinance 2019.0) Page 10
20-0203 L Page 14 of 52




with those requirements as sei forth by the California Fire Code. The Califorma Fire Code shall also
apply (0 instaliations other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing tiations where abave-ground siorage
iy required

Chapter 58

- Section 58006 Flammable Crvogeqic Fluids
5806.2 Limitations shall be amended as follows: Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary
containers outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the Fire Chief, or histher duly
authorized representative. When permitted by the Fire Chief, or husher duly awthorized
representotive, all stationary coniainers for the storage of flammable cryogenic fluids shall comply
with those requirements as set forth by the California Fire Code The California Fire Code shall also
apply to installations other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing stanons where above-ground siorage

Ls required.

Chapter 61

Section 6104 Location of LP-Gas Contaigers

6104.2 Maximam Capacity within Established Limits shali be amended as follows: The storuge
of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2.000-gallon water capacity when located at
feast one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and a1 least one-half
(172) mile from existing residential development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit per
acre and ot least ane-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved, end o
special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado.

Dispensing within established limits, Within the limits established by law restricting the dispersion of
liguefied peiroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested areas, the aggregaie
capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a warer capacity of 2,000 gallons. The dispensing
of liquefied petroieum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacity when located

at least one-half (1/2) mile from property 1oned or designated for residentiol use and at least one-
half (1/2) mile from exixting rexidential development with a density greatar than one (1) dwelling unit
per acre and at least one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or mote! is allowed when AHJ approved and
a special/conditional use permit ls (ssued by the County of £l Dorado.

M ' ¢ b EJevatlQ

above) thall be added as follows:

6112.1 Regulators shall be added as follows:
Two-stage regulator system shail be instalied in accardance with manufacturer requirements

- Two-stage regulator systems shall be installed on all LPG installations.

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 11
20-0203 L Page 15 of 52



- The first stage regulator shall be installed under the hinged gauge cover supplied with the tank. The
atmospheric pressure aperture of the regulator shall be pointed downward, [he first stage regulator
shall be plumbed to the riser of the yard piping with soft copper tubing to atlow flexibility should tank
shifting occur. The riser from the yard piping shall be located not more than 3 inches (horizontally)
[from the walls of the tank

- The second siage regulator and riser pipe shall be insialled under the eave of the building, as close
as practicable to the building wall. This riser shall be securaly supported/braced to the wall
approximately 10 inches below the reguiator so as to prevent bending of the pipe by lateral snow/ice
loads.

- A protective cover, approved by the gas suppiier and Building Official, shall be installed over the
second stage reguiator and securely supporied (o the ground or diagonally to the wall.

The rizer pipes for the yard piping shall not be embedded in concrete. Concrete placed around such
riser shall be held back at least 1 inch from all sides of the pipe.

Al the time of application for any building permit. whick involves the installation of nn LPG system,
the applicant shall submit an LPG system plot plan in 3 copies (or digitally as PDFj. The LPG plot
plan shall include, but not be limited to, the 1ank location, proposed tank capacity in U.S. gallons,
route of yard piping, location of the riser pipe at the building, property boundaries, and an outline of
all existing/proposed buildings on the lot and a depiction of the ridgeline of any building 1o be
supplied with LPG. This shall also be forwarded to the appropriate fire district to serve as a locator
map in event of an emergency.

Location of the centerline of LPG tanks shall be permanently marked by the use of snow stakes, one
at each end. Such stakes shall be of sufficient height to be visible through anticipeted maximum snow
depth at the respective location. [Installation and maintenance of these snow 3siakes are the
responsibility of the L.PG user.

- Propane appliances and accessories shall noi be permitted in any new installation below the first

floor or below grade, whichever is more restrictive,
6112.2 Vertical Riser Pining sha!! be added as follows:
Minimum of Schedule 80 - iron piping.

The riser shall be within 3 inches horizontally of the tank.

- Swing joints shall ba installed above and below tank level to provide for the tank movement (Strees
elbows shall not be used).

- A listed flexible riser construcied of copper or siainless-sieel tubing and proiected by steel covered
sheathed material may be used instead of xwing joints. The flexible alternative shall provide sufficiemt

siack to allow for tank movement.

- $112.3 Marking and Locations shall be added as follows:

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 12

20-0203 L Page 16 of 52



An approved 1ign shall be located directly above the niser shut off valve on the building 1n a visible
location,

- The liquefied petroieum gas supplier shall affix a weatherproof identificarion tag 1o the inside of the
tank valve protecting cover. This tag shall contain the supplier's name and emergency telephone
number.

- Tank instaliarion shall be permanently marked by a metal or wood material snow marker, with a
minimum dimension of 2 inches by 2 inches, The snow marker shall be of sufficient height o rise
above the annual snow depth and shall be a minimum of 10 feet in height The snow markers shall

be painted yellow and located on opposite ends of the tank.

Saction 6113 Underground LPG Tanks lastallations and Ownership shall be added as follows:
61131 Permits and Plans shall be sdded as follows: Permius shall be required. and plans shall be
submirted for all underground tank installarions as approved by the AHJ

- 6113.2 Upderground LPG Tank Owaership shall be added as follows: Underground LPG tanks
shail be prohibited from being s0id 10 end-users and shall be retained by the LPG company under a

leuse-type system 1o ensure pruper annual maintenunce requiremenis ues met and reconded

Chapter 80

Chapter 80, NFPA 13D 4,7-- Residential fire sprinkler systems installed in all new one-and nwo-family
dwellings shall utilire a “Passive Purge ™ svstem design uniess otherwise approved by the Firs Code
Official. Exception: Manfactured home installed. tested and approved by the California Departmenti of
Housing and Community Developmeni

- NFPA 13D, Ameuded Sections ns follows:
Revise Section 5.1.1.2 to read as follows:
Chapter 89. NFPA 13D. 3.1.1.2 A rupply of at least one of sach type and temperature sprinkier used
within the premises shall be mainiained on the property at an approved locarion. Stock sprinklers shall
be kept in a mounted and accessible cabinet.

- Revise Section 7.6 to read as follows:

- Chapter 8. NFPA 13D, 7.6 4 /ocal water flow alarm shall be provided on all fire sprinkler systems in
homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling,
Revise Section 11.2.1.1 te read as follows:

- Chapter 89, NFPA 13D 11.2.1.] Where a fire department pumper coanection is no! provided, the
system shall be hydrostatically tested at @ minimum pressure of | 30 pounds per square inch gauge for no

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 13
20-0203 L. Page 17 of 52



less than a 30-minute duration without evidence of leakage. Such test shall be witnessed by the fire code
official.

Appendix B —Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings

- Table B105.1(1) Required Fire Flow for One¢- and Two-Family Dwellings, Group R-3, and R4
Buildiags snd Townhouses shall be amended as follows for elevations below 5,000 feet:
FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FLOW
CALCULATION SPRINKLER FIRE- DURATION
(square feet) {Design (gallons per
Standard) minute)
0- 3,600 No automatic 1,000 1
spnnkler system
3,601 and greater No automatic Yalue in Dunation in
sprinkler system Table Table
B105.1(2) BI05.1{2) m
the required
fire-flow rate
0 - 3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 500 “%
of the CA Fire 1,000 !
Code or Section
3133 of the CA
Residentisl Code
3,601 and greater Section 903.3.1.3 172 value of
of the CA Fire Table
Code or Section B105.1(2)
3133 of the CA (mnin, 1000
Residential Code GPM)

- I e e Fl - Two-
Dwellings. Group R-3. and R-4 Buildings and Townhouses shall be amended ag follows:
AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER MINIMUM FLOW DURATION

SYSTEM FIRE-FLOW (hours)
(Design Standard) (gallons per
minute)
No sutomatic sprinklor system Value in  Table Durstion in  Table
B)03.1(2) BI05.1(2)
Section 903.3.1.1 of the CA Flre 268 30% of the value Duration in  Table
Code in Table B10S.1(2)® B105.1(2) at the reduced
flow rate
Soection 903.3,1.2 of the CA Fire 686 50% of the value Durstion in  Table
Code (Oniy apphas to focations in Table B10S.1(2) B105.1{2) st the reduced
below 3,000~foot elevarion) flow rate

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 gpm

Ordinance 201901 Page 14

20-0203 L Page 18 of 52



Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads

- i cific

- PD103.1 Access Road Width with » jivdrant shall be amended as follows, adding the exception:

- Exception: Driveways
P103.2 Grade shall be amended as follows: Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not
exceed J5.9% in grade unless approved by the AHJ or by the El Dorado County amended California
Public Resource Code Title 14 / Design and Improvement Standards Manual.

Exception: Elevation above 5,000 feet shall not exceed 12%.

- D103.3 Turping Radius shall be amended as follows: The minimum tuming radius shall be
determined by the fire code official, and shall not include curb and gutter.

- D103.5 Fire Apparstus Access Road Gates shall be amended as follows: Subsection (1); Where a
single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm). Where a fire
apparatus road consisis of a divided roadway, ithe gute width shall not be less than 15 feet (4372

mmj).

- D1903.6.1 Roady 20 10 29 feet in width shall be amended as follows: Fire Jane signs as specified in
Section D103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide
(6096 to 8534.4 mm).

Exception: Elevations above 5,000 f}. as determined by the AHJ.
- D103.6.2 Roads more thap 29 feet in Width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as

specified in Section D103.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29
feet wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm).
Excaption: Elevations above 5,000 ft. as determined by the AH/J.

- D104.4 Circumfereptial Fire Apparatus Access Roads shall be added as follows: When required
by the fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirety

of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access.

SECTION 4: CONFLICT
That Ordinance No. 2016-37 of the PIO, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances herewith are hereby
repesled.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or phrase of this code, or
any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such decision
shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code, which can be given effect without the invalid portions and,
therefore, such invalid portions are declared to be severable. The P1O hereby declares that it would have enacted

Ordinance 2019.0 Page 15
20-0203 L Page 19 of 52



this Ordinance and cach of its articles, sachons, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, sentences,
clauses or phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid.

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

This Ordinance shall take effoct thirty (30) days after its adoption. The P10 Board Secretary is directed to publish
this ordinance in a rewspaper of general circulation in the District. In lieu of publication of the full text of the
ordinance, & summary of the ordinance may be published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15) days
sfter its passage and 2 cerufied copy thall be posted in the office of the P10 pursuant to Government Code Section
36933/c) (1).

The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the PIO on October 17, 2019, and
it was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the Ordinance to be read for the second time on
November 21, 2019 and approved by the following vote:

o
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the P1O this, k\?.. day ofN e her 2019,
AYES:
NOES:

ABSENT:
ABSTAIN:

/}N}M f

Marie Fitts, Board Chayr

Ordinance 2019.01 Page 16
20-0203 L Page 20 of 52



MQT & PIO

101.1 Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Administrative need
LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than
Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate i:a:r:d can ealsny_ be (lr;;;ped :"d:ram";(‘)&e::m;?i:
105.6.27 quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving Locally adopted and amended €1 an Gxplosion. Al efavalions avove STV 162 2
occupancies in Group R-3 an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire
PR activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional
attention.
S ) S S Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance
1066 Add section. - seon oo lof fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines.

1-06'6 Add s R Ltmlly cr.ealed and adopted permils, plan checks, and mspedlons as allo«ed in Health
: ‘ S " |8Safety Code 17951 :

Add sectic o Sewon10661CostRwovetyFeﬁ Toreoovermeoosuo
106.6.1 . o . SEINE

06.6 Add section Locally created and adopled the Fire District..

: Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable

106.7 Add section Locally created and adopted falled inspeciions by contractors.

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District
is added to read as follows:

109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timefines - The intent of this
provision is to clarify the procedures and timefines for an

109.4 Added section 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals

regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire
Code Official. Based on the County of El Dorado's
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals
timeline.
Completed the seclion by filing in the blank Allows thg Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that
y ; protects life and property. Fees have been updated to
portions that were not completed by the SFM. 1tis ) ;
110.4 - Ny Locally adopted and amended match the fees and penallies as deemed appropriate by the
better left to localities to determine the Distict Attomey's Office, The change to lhe language fo
fees/penalties for their respective areas. include the term infractions.
110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2
Citations
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative (s),

Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor

11042 but under a different number) Locally crealed and adopled {1 ions of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the

Health and Safety Code of the State of California and -
Chapter 5¢ (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the Stale of Califomia.

Completed the section by filling in the blank

portions that were not completed by the SFM. Itis All violations of the code have been consofidated under

1124 better left to localities to determine the Locally adopted and amended Section 110.4 to include the penalties for violations.

fess/penalties for their respective areas.
Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District,
" . Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd

22 Added definitions for carity Locally creaed and adopted Manager. Definition of campfire shalf not include LPG or
Propane fueled appliances.

302.1 Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for dlarity

307.4.4 through Due to the high fire danger that exists in El Dorado County
30'7'4 4 m Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopled we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas.

20-0203 L Page 21 of 52




503.2.4

Chéhged’venﬁcai ledraices 1o 15 foet and road
wdhsto20fest -

Locally adopted and amended

I

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and tafler. A veriical
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus
components, It also allows an extended time frame before
having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional
hieight for vegetation clearances acts s an increased buffer
for the sproad of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of
shoulders, as measured face of curb to face of curb is
needed: Thiese structures can be difficult to navigate with
fire apparatiis and should not be counted in the total
drivable foad surface . - . .

503.2.5

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the
Fire Code and Titie 14 Fire Safe Regulations to
match as they require tumarounds for fire apparatus
access roads and driveways.

Locally adopted and amended

Fire appsratus require areas for tuming around when
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This
includes fire vehicles as well as divilian vehicles. Provides
better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150",

503.26

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevaled
Surfaces to slate and match El Dorado County
Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated
Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendix D of the
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an
alternate means & methods that is not less restrictive than
the Fire Code.

503.4.2

Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes”
rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicie Code.

503.4.3

Added section regarding no parking in front of
hydrants

Locally created and adopted

This section ciearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire
hydrants” rules and is consistent with the Califomia Vehicle
Code.

503.4.4

Added section regarding fire lanes based ori road
width

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines Califomia Fire Code Appendix D
as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire
lanes.

503.5.3

Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain
emergency access and consistency through all
roadway gates in El Dorado County, refening to the
gate slandards adopted by the FPO's.

Locally created and adopted

Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on
roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing
the best possible emergency access to maintain fast
response times,

505.1

Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of
buildings

Locally adopted and amended

Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing
based on the District's addressing standards.

507.5.1

Added more conservative standard for the
placement of hydrant and their relationship to
commercial bulldings

Locally adopted and amended

Commercial properties are required to instail hydrants at
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150
fet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in

903.2

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system instaliation

greater within the district.

innew buildings and strictires 3,600 square feet or|.

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of I Dorada County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be instafled in strictures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire bshavior and rate of

903.2.a

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater
than 3,600 square féet to install sprinklers if they
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the
structure, whichever is 16ss. -

Locally created and adopted

Due to the topographic, dlimatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinkers
to bé installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of

20-0203 L Page 22 of 52




Adds occupant prolection for existing buildings less
than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they

Dus to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, elong with the fact that fires

903.2b Locally created and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
. i Toro tan 307 or 1,000 square est o the to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
' ) feetin size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread
Due to the topographic, dumahc and geographvc conditions
Lo : ) of Ei Dorado Counly and their contributing factors to our
'903 2 1, 903 23, Thesa sections were created lo glve speaﬁc S . incfeased response hmes along with the fact that fires
) 903 24,903.2.7 direction on the spnnkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minuts, ‘e require spnnklels
occupancy and square footage Ny . to be installed in strictures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they refate to ﬁre beha\nor and rata of -
spread. .
Manufactured Homes — The intent of this code section is lo
tensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two-
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a simitar
This section was created to include manufactured " al::;:. l\:i’anufac'(luﬁthorenﬁ ‘:8?:'? dﬂ;;wuldr:andum n
903.2.8.2 residential single family R-3 in the residential Locally created and adopted inienace aye a e|g ened fisk 01 2p consump
sprinkler program : due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The
P P rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk
successfully in many Califoria communities.
Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of EI Dorado County and their conbibuting factors to our
These sections were created !o give specific increased response times, along with the fact that fires
903.2.9, 903.2.10 direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require spriniders
occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they refate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.
Added occupant protection for fire afarms in
RO AC btdings ot v conmercl T Provids proper omergancy nofcaton for cccupances
907.2.a purposes, and budings with a floor area of less Locally created and adopted ;I‘l::vput:lz us; and en:l(rw Fire Department notification in
than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code i et o & lire of Smoxe.
official.
A?ded oocupant' ’m@o" for existing bu idings Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
%7.2b vithoul automatic sprinkler systems toinstallafite |\ ooioq and adopted  Jallow public use and ensures Fire Department nofification in
“ alarm if they add more than 30% or 1,000 square Y op Lthe W':m of 2 6 or om ok' ep
feet to the structure, whichever is less. e
Added occupant protection by stating all fire alarm : . -
detection systems installed shall be connected to a - |Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
907.2.c monitoring service that nofifies the fire dspamnenl Locally created and adopted aliow public use and ensures Fire. Depanment nonﬁcaﬂon in
upon activation and is installed per Section 907 of . the évent of a fire or smoke
the fire code. _
Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
907.2.4 systems to be connected to a monitored fire alarm Locally created and adopted Walkm public use and ensures Fire Depaftment notification in
system when installed or replaced. the event of afire or smoke
Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply Amend fo 72 hour wpauty for bad(-up power due lo PG&E
907.6.2.1 Modification Locally created and adopted safety reated power outages.
e e This section adds a Shunt Trip poiver shut off devices to
1203.1.3 Shunt trip power safety devices. - - - " I, Locally adopted and amended  [ensure Qrgencypowershutoffmnngmeuseofbad(-up
- R A T TR VR o PR power supplies . . . ,
1103 Address fequireimients for consiruction sites - ' Locally cresled and adopted. | 34FeSSIng for constctn fs s '"’P‘?"""' fo “"s‘

responding emergency crows:

20-0203 L Page 23 of 52



explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of
Supervisors for fireworks.

" Waler supplies at construction sites with Water must be on site prior to combustible material being
33121 combustible materials on-site Locally adapted and amended stored or vertical construction commencing.
FEI Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout
This section was created to include Fire Protection : the county. Al projects wilt be required to submit a Fire
42031 Plan for all fire hazard severity zones. Locally created and adopted Protection Plan due to climatic, gedlogical, and
topographical conditions.
This section dlarifies that within the boundaries of EI Dorado
" . . County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are
4905.4 Aelded 2 scton 0 clarly foof consructon Locally created and adopted [wildiend fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof
& covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly.
. " Hazardous malerials related incidents are costly to mitigate.
Any damages or costs from negligent practices that RN ’ .
5001.7 cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally created and adopted Ifthe incident is -caused by "89"99"99 due o a business
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on lo the
cost recovery fee. ’ ’
negligent parties.
:dizdms;f:t:izoéﬁ?: n:'ghmt;::ang lssm:ef:r Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and
§601.2 Y Locally adopled and amended fireworks lo approve them and have a dlear understanding

of the applications they will be used for.

§601.2.1 and 5601.2.2

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make
available all requested documentation pertaining to
the firework presentation

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any
documentation including timing and proprietary information
that pertains to any aspect of a fireworks display that they
deem necessary. This information is understood to be
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as
such.

Locally created and adopted

5704.2.96.1

Eslaﬁished fimits as set forth in the Fre Code

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class 1l combustibie liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a
Special/Conditional Use Pemmit from the County.

Locally adopted and amended

5706.2.4.4

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

" Locally adopted and amended

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class II combustible liquid special
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval
and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County.

§806.2

Administrative addition of District name.
Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

Administrative need to add District name. Established limits
as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable

Locally adopted and amended Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers, Requires AHJ
{approval and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the
County.

5806.2.1

Established limits as se forth in the Fire Code

Established limits as required by the Fire Code Official for
Flammable Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers.
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use
Permit from the County.

SFM adopted and amended locally

6104.2

Established fimits for LPG storage and dispensing
near or adjacent to residential development .

Establishes distances between LPG storage and
{dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential
o . developments and high-density hotels, motel, apartments,
Locally adopted and amended  {etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would
have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death.
Requires AHJ approval and a Spediel/Conditional Use
Permit from the County.

20-0203 L Page 24 of 52



6112.1

Establishes propane regulator requirements for
locations above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopted

Establishes propane regulator requirement for locations
above 5000 foot elevation. Including requirements for two-
stage regulator use and location of first and second stage
regulators. Additiona! requirements are outlined for
profective covers, riser pipe installation requirements,
buitding permit submittal and review, tank center-tine
marking, and grade requirements These requirements are
based on sogmﬁcant fire hls(ory in heavy snow and extreme
weather condmons encountered above 5000 feet.

6112.2

above 5000 foot elevahon )

Es!ablashes propane vettcal riser ptpe requvremants .

Locally created and adopled

Establlshes vemcel propane rise requ:rements for focations
above 5000 foot elevation. Pipe schedule location, swing
joint requirements, and the use of flexibie riser piping as
well as swing joints, These requirements are besed on
significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme weather
conditions encountéred above 5000 feet

61123

Establishes propane marking and location
requirements above 5000 foot elevation

Locally created and adopled

Establishes marking and location requirements for locations
above 5000 foot elevation. This section addresses signage
location, emergency contact information, and snow related
tank marking requirements, These requirements are based
on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet.

61131

Permits and plans shalt be submitted and approved
by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction).

Locally created and adopted

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground
tanks:

|Allovis us to require plans be submitied for review prior to
instafiations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tarks
require substantial maintenance including inspection and
anode replacement at regular intervals.

6113.2

Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the
property of the LPG company

Locally created and adopted

Underground tanks corode easily and can leak without
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when
sold fo the end user. This does not apply to above ground
tanks where comrosion and leaks are more easily detected.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16

NFPA 13D-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the
District has been amended to update various
provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler
systems in one-and two-family dwellings

SFM Adopted and amended locally

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on-
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow
alarm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in the
event of waler activation in a vacant structure, and
hydrostalic testing requirements to assure proper 13D
sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water
'damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements
were also added to ensure water circulation through the
system, reducing stagnant water and backflow concems
(EID encourages this type of system).

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section
51.1.2

To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler
system minimizing damage

SFM adopted and amended locally

A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system
must be available on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section 7.6

Addition of an audible alam upon system activation

SFM adopted and amended locally

An audible alarm system is added to notify occupants and
in the activation of the system when the building is not
occupied allow for detection minimizing damage.

Chapter 80, NFPA,

A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and

projects *

1301-:6231e;:t|on System test lo a pressure of 150 p.s.i. SFM adopted and amended locally failures and assures proper ghuing of system components.
ndix B: Table Changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot _ o Allows us to maich what developers and residents are used
L EB1d0"5 1i1) pelevabon to match fire ﬂow prewdents used in | Locally adopted and amended  |toin regards to GPM fire fiow reqmrements lhat have been
IO G L e iused for over a decade in EOC...
 Aobenc . B: Table Es!ablushedamlmmumrequrementoﬁ.')OOGPM B AHowsustomaMwhatdevelopemndresdentsamused
ppe Bld1in05{ 2 beiow 5000 foot eiévation, for all commercial Locally adopted and amended toin regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been

used for over a decade in EDC. -

20-0203 L Page 25 of 52



1

Tlt is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to

D: . opti idential dri
Appendix D: D103.1 Made an exoepu?n for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended construct a 26 fool wide for to a hydrant
R ) - Title 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways.
Appendix D: D103.2 State law requires no greater tian 16% grade . Locally adopted and amended . {In our £} Dorado County Title 14 adoption we allow greater
R S T . : R R man16%gmdewimAHJapprovalandhardsu¢face
o 1) . 20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutters due
Appendix D: D103.3 Text to include curbs and gutters Locally adopted and amended to potential access issues and turing radius ]
KbpeﬁdiiD'D1035§ - Ll L, . [Wnere fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided
i 1‘ . Fire apparatus access road gates .~ - . Locally adopted and amended:  {roadway the gate width shall nol be less than 15 feet due to
S B L S Coli o otes e |radius issues, o LT S
No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet
Appendix D: D103.6.1 Roads widths 20 to 29 feet Locally adopted and amended {1 idth above 5000 feel. Lower than 5000 feet tis does

not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire
Code Appendix B section 103.6.1 for all other elevations.

Appendix D: D103.6.2

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36

teet in width Locally adopted and amended

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of
elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D
Section 103.6.2 for ali other elevations.

Appendix D: D104.2
Exception

Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered
building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to
have only one approved fire apparalus access road.

Locally adopled and amended

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
residents and first responders.

Appendix D: D104.4

Added to require circumferential fire apparatus

access roads Locally created and adopled

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire
structure and shall provide a continuous means of

emergency vehicle access.

Appendix D: D106.1 For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of

" ’ Removed Exception in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
Exception .

residents and first responders.

Aooendix D: D107.1 For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of

Excepfion ’ Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
residents and first responders.
Adopted with no Amendments

101.2 through 101.5 m;dw*"b"s" scope, intent, severabilty and Locally adopted Administrative clarity

102.6 through 102.8 References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity

102.10 through 102,12 fggﬁg provisions, Other Laws, Application of Locally Adopted Administrative carity

103.1 through 104.1 gﬂ;ﬂﬁ:‘;ﬁ:’ Prvenon Oivson and bty Locally Adopted Administrative clarity

104.3 through 104.4 Right of Entry, Warrants, and Idenfification Locally Adopted .. |Administrative dlaiity,

104.6 through 104.6.4 | Record retention - *Locally Adopted Administrative darity

104.8 through 104.9.2 HodTcatior, akemats heais ad mefods, end Locally Adopted Admirisirative clarity

104.11 through Authority at fires, nghtofamcs maintenance of ' L

104.11.2 systems Locally Adopted Administrative clrity

104.11.3 ... jAuthority of systems and dewces moperable .. Locally Adopted Administrative clarity

105.2.3  |Time fimitation of apphmtm _ Locally Adaptad Administrative clarity |

105.3.1 through s o T

10532 . Opsrr a'.”'"" -

ATE i eériing‘dﬁemiuona: ) ired for

105612 L ihazardous dearing solvent use “:

20-0203 L Page 26 of 52



Adopted this section for administrative clarity and

Permits for various business operations for: Magriesiur,
miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation

105.6.2.28 through . ; " -
. ! : Locally Adopted vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing faclities, open buming,
105.6.35 ﬁre and life safety inspections open flames and torches, open ﬁamesandwndles and
- orgamc coahngs -
‘ Adcptedﬂussewonforadmmlshabvedantyand- L ) B R
105837 i an o ety inpctions - " Locally Adopted . . P““"”'“p“‘“sda“e‘"b"" :
e da . - |Adopted this section for adminis  Locally Adeoted -
-195.'6'39’3 ﬁreandl:fesafetylnspecuons' LocaﬂyA o
105641 through . Adopted "sseenmforaammmuvedamyand.
105646 o -

1@5-6}..4"#-, o

Adop(ed !hls sedlon foradmmlsuahve dafikyand. »- TR tbéal(y Adopted . B

Pamizfa'wwébﬁiwing pnaﬁ& . o

ﬁre and hfe safety mspecuons
e Mopted thls sectlon for admmstrahve danty and_-_ B Permit for wood products storage (dups, hogged matenal
105'6‘5_,0- . ﬁre and Me safety mspeetlons - B Locally Ad?md' : lumber or plywood m exeass of 200 cubic fee()
T Adopted ﬂus section for admmstrahve danty and = : -
105 ! lhrough 106.3 fire and life safety inspections . . Locaily Adopted Fge _”"“.”'” for permlfs
! Adopled this section for administrative damy and ) ) . L
107.1 fire and lfe safety inspections i Locally Adopted Inspection authority _
Lo o Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of
o P eqmpmenl,r&mspecbonandteshng,reoordkeepmg.
108.1 through 109.3 e anl‘ p litft:ssas:e;.;‘i,:sfm:i dlarity and Locally Adopted supervision, rendéring equipment inoperable, overcrowding,
S i " Board of Appeals estabﬂshed limitations on aulhonty and
B ' qualifications
110.3.2 through Adopﬁed thls secﬁon for admmuslmuve danly and Locally Adopted Compl'oance with omets and notices, prdsewﬁon of
11034 fire and life safety inspections . violations, and unauthorized tampenng
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and :
1 10.4.‘ 1 fire and lile safety ins peehons Locally Adopted Abatemem of vidaﬁon
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and . ) A
13.1 fre and life safety inspections Locally Adopted Authority to disconnect service utilities
Asphalt ketties contain highly flammable substances and
303.1 through 303.9 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and
Jtopographical)
Managing ignition sources through responsible application
305.1 through 305.5 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted of standards will reduce the number of fires in various
: settings (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY
306.1 through 306.2 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locaily Adepted flammable and require special handiing (Chmauc,
. geological, and fopographical)
3 - ) : Openbummg,reu'eaﬂonalﬁm,andpddﬁiewtdoor
307.1 through 307.5 Adopted this séction for fire and life safety Locally Adopted freplaces, (Climatic, geological, and | phical)
081 Adopted this secion foc fire and life safely = Locally Adopted Oven flame genaral requirements {Cime, 9°°'°9'“' and
T T topograptﬂcal)
308.1.2 through o " Throwing or placnng of ignition sources, (owhes for
30813 Adopted this section for fire and fife safety Locally Adopted romavig paint (Cimatic gecogica, and topographica)
Locations near combustible, open flame devices, signals
o I . . and markers, portable fuel open-flame devices, sky-
308.1.5 through TR I, " 3 fanterns, religious ceremonies, aisles and exits, flaming
308.1.8.5 Moptgd this secﬁon.fqr fire and ifo ) Y- Locally Adopted. food and beverage preparation, dispensing, containers not
o PR B in use, semngofﬁammgfood !ocahm.ﬁreprotadton
riatic,
082 dopta i secon for i and fe sfety Localy Adopled. - ,,_:?‘??V‘-*W‘”if"’“% gectopieal

20-0203 L Page 27 of 52



308.3 through 308.4.1

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Group A occupancies open-flame decoralive devices,
theatrical performances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2
dormitories (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

304

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

General requirements relating to smokmg (Clwnahc,
|geological, and topographical). - -

Adoptéd tis seckion for fre and ife safety. * .

—I'No Smoking" sugns (Cllmahc. geologtcd and

|topographical).

3104 thiough 3108

Adopted tis section forfr and e safety

Locally Adopted -

' Loéally Adopted

Removal of signs prohibited, cohrpliénéd with *No Smoking®
signs, ash trays, bming objécts, hazardus environmental
doddi_tidns. (Clim'atic,' ge"ologi'cd. and 'topdgraphiwl)_ o

311.1 through 311.4

Adopted this secuon for fire and fite safe(y ; '_ _

Vaeant prermses cond:bon and safety requuements
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safeguarding vawnt
premss&c secunty fire protecﬁon fire separation, removal
of combustibles, removal of hazardous materials. (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

3ot

Adopted this section for fire and lfe safely

Locally Adopled

General requirements relating to mobile food preparation
vehidies. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

319.2.

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

Permits for mobile food preparation vehicles (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

319.3 through
319.10.3

Adopted this section for fire and ffe safety

Locally Adopted

Exhaust hood, fire profection, fire protection for cooking
‘equipment, fire extinguisher, appliance connection to fuel
supply piping, cookinig oil storage containers, metallic
storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking oil
storage system components, design criteria, tank venting,
nommal vents, emergency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum
aggregate volume, protection of container, LP-gas conlainer
construction, protection of system piping, LP-gas alams,
CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel,
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG
container construction, CNG containers supplying
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping,
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire
protection systems and devices and fue! gas systems.
(Cliimatic, geological, and topographical)

403.8.1 through
403.8.1.7

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

" |(residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and

Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1

fire safety plans.

403.10 through
403.10,1.3

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, mote!} occupancy
Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, {Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

405.5

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

[Emevgency Planning and record keeping (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

510.3

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safely inspections

Locally Adopted

A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)

807.5.2 through
807.5.2.3

Adopted this section for administrative clarty and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

Wall coverings in group E occupandes (Schools) sefs a
maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in
educational facilities (Climatic, geologlcal and

topographical)

903.2.1.5

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and fife safety inspections

Locally Adopted

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bieachers)
{Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000
square feetl. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

20-0203 L Page 28 of 52



Adopted this section in existing buildings for the

Emergency Respondes radio coverage in existing buildings.
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by

firefighters, and other emergency responders.

1082 T enrs and oheremergency Locally Adopted the fire code oficial is acceptable. The fationale befind
’ this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographicaf)
Appendo( D: D101. 1 N Adopted thls seebon for the ‘safety of me public, 'Ldéan: Adopied - General fequnrements for fire appamtus access roads
lhrough D102 1 e ﬁreﬁghters and olher emergency respondets e 'y Adop S tndudmg loads (Chmahc geologlcal and topographxcal)
S U L Deadendﬁreapparatusacoessroadrequnementsfora .
LR g Adoptedmlssechmformesafdyofmepubhc o )
Appendm D: 9103.4 1 N ) ﬁreﬁghters and o(her emetgency Iers Locally Adopted tum aro:;‘\lgt) 159 feet. (Qlamauc geologwal and
R, s . Adopled ths section fof the safe(y ofthe pubhc, o "No Parking, Fire Lane" signs requireménts, (Climatic,
Ap@n@x 0: D1036 ,N ﬁreﬁghters and o(her emergency rspmdefs Locally Adoptet_i geological, and topographical) -
mApmndhlg ?04[’;"“ \ Adop_@ this section for the safety of the bubﬁc, Localy Adopted tCanmerdalarpdindUShial' development fire apparatus
(exd.,dmg exception) | firefighters, and other emergency responders. y Acopied. access roads, (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Appendix D: D105, N |Adopted tis section fo the safey of the pubc. Lokl Adopist Requirements for aerial fire apparatus acosss roads
through p10§:4 : firefighters, and other emergency responders: y F(Climab'c, geological, and topographical)
pasiirbidl N [Adopted tis secon or the saetyof e puble Localy Adpld Fire apparatus acces roads for muliple-family residential
(excluding ext;epﬁons) firefighters, and other emergency responders. developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
[Appendix D: D107.1 . ] . Om?- or two-dwelling re_sidenh'al developments shall be
(excluding exceptions) N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopted equipped throughout with two sperale and approved fire
thr h"gwgp firefighters, and other emergency responders. apparatus access roads due to lopographic, geographic and
ough BT cimatic condiions.
Appendix D: D108 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopt Adopl reference standards dealing with gate construction

[standards {Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Grey cells aré previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle.

White celis are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions.

20-0203 L Page 29 of 52




PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

FIRE » RESCUE « EMS
- Board of Directors

PO Bux 2R "
- anie Fins - Chaw
TOG M Aukum Road Ripley Howe - Vice Chan
Kameract, California 95684 Gerald fumper - Secrewry

- 5 ) ¥ SL s A — Mike frish - Director
Phione (33 020 4499 o Fax (330 nih 1317 Erleen Strangleld - Director

www.pronectfire org

December 26, 2019

Pioneer fire Protection District 1* and 2™ reading postings for Ordinance No. 2019.01

Attached are the postings for the first and second public notice for Ordinance No 20190}

The 1" reading was located in the October 8" Pioneer Fire Pratection District Board Meeting
Agenda. Postings were located on the Pioneer Fire Protection District Front door, Somerset Post
Office, Grizzly Flat Post Office and on the Pioneerfire.org website on 10/6/2019. The 2™
reading was located in the November 12® Pioneer Fire Protection District Board Meeting
Agenda  Postings were ocated on the Pioneer ir¢ Protection District Front door, Somerset
Past Office, Grizzly Flat Post Olfice, anc on the Pioneerfire org website ot 11/8/2019.

Sincerely,

27, ,
AN

f'-'ilf-"""; e TR

/

20-0203 L Page 30 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Board of Directors Board Meeting

October 8, 2019 at6p.m.
Marie Fitts - Board Chair, Ripley Howe - Vice Chalr,
Eilpen Strangfeld - Boerd Secr etary, jerry Jumper - Olrectoc

Mission Stotement
To provide o professional and compassionate level of community fire protection, emergency medicol ond
rescue services to the citizens and property owners within the Fire District, in order to prevent or minimize the
loss of fife, poin, suffering ond property damage as o resuit of fire or other types of emergency.

Meeting location. PFPD Administration Offices— Boardroom
7080 Mount Aukum Road, Somerset, CA 98684

AGENDA

1. CALL TO ORDER (Director Strangfeld will be attended the mesting telephonically from 5078
Cary, Grizzly Flats CA.)
1.1 Ro# Cail
12 Pledge of Allegiance
2. DETERMINATION OF QUORUM AND CONFIRMATION OF AGENDA
2.1 Adoption of Agenda
3. SPECIAL ANNOUNCEMENT / PRESENTATIONS / GENERAL BUSINESS
3.1 TIME SENSITIVE MATTER
2019 Fire Code Adoption — Public Hearing - Directors will convene @ public hearing prior to the first
reading of Ordinance 2019.U1 (Calrtorrs Health and Sefety Code Section 13888.7)
4. PUBLIC COMMENT
Any perscn may address the District Board on any subject pertaining to District business, which s not
liated on the agenda. This comment ie provided by the Reiph M. Brown Open Meeting Act (Government
Code § 54850 st. s8q) and may be Imited to three (3) minutes for any person sddressing the Board.
8. CONSENT CALENDAR
Consent csiendar Rems are considered routine and are acted upon by the Boerd with s single action.
Members of the audience wishing to provice pubfic input may request that the Board remove the item
from the Consent Calendar. Comments mey be kmited to hree {3) minutes.
5.1 Minutes from Boerd Mesting July 8, 2018
82  Minutes from Boerd Meeling August 21, 2019
53  Minutes from Boerd Meeting September 10 2010
8.2  Approval: payment of bills ~ green sheets
6. MONTHLY/STANDING ACTIVITY REPORTS:
8.1 Administrative/Chlef's Report
8.2 Local #4586
83 PVFA
64  Finencial
7. OLD BUSINESS (The Board mey slect 1o review, discuss, tske sclion or voue on eny okl business. The Board Chalr may
requesl 8 "ot call voi on kems)
7.1 Open Bosrd Position (BOD Fitts)
1.2  Dutrict investigation 001-2019 (letter of Conocem, related io 2015 incident) (Chief)
7.3  PILT Funding - Possible misuse and or distribution of funde by the Ei Dorade County Auditor

1
PFPD Bosrd Meeting, October 8, 2019

20-0203 L Page 31 of 52



7.4
7.5
7.6
17

7.8

7.9

PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Board of Directors Board Meeting

Payroll Services (Chief)

PFPD Vegetation Management (Ad-hoc updates) Ordinance (Director Jumper/Chief)

Pioneer Fire Protaction District Building/ Facility Use Agreement (Chief)

Auto Aid Agreament; between Amador County Fire Protection District & Pioneer Fire Protection
District. (Chief)

MOU Per-Diem Position with Amador Fire Protection District and Pioneer Fire Protection District
(Chief)

“Accept Ploneer Union International Assaociation of Firefighters, Local 4586 demand to continue
bargaining successor MOU." (BOD Fitts)

8. NEW BUSINESS (The Board may review, discuss, take action or vole on any new business. The Board Chair may
request a roll call vote on items)

8.1
8.2

83

8.4

HR policy review and updates (Chief)

Ordinance 2019-01 Adopting the 2019 Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the
2018 Edition of the International Fire Code, regulation goveming the safeguarding of life and
property from fire and exploslons hazerds arising from the storage, handling and use of
hazardous substances, material and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or proparty
in the occupancy of buildings and premises in Pioneer Fire Protection District (PFPD), providing
for the Issuance of permits and collection fees therefore: Repealing and previous PFPD
ordinances. To include all Information and preceding to be discussed for Ordinance adoption.
{Chief)

Resolution 2019-006 —~ Findings of Fact - Discussion/Information/Action - Resolution setting
forth findings with respect to local conditions which make certain modification and changes to
the California Fire Code necessary for preserving fire and Ife safety in the Ploneer Fire
Protection District ~ (Chief)

Fire Code - Ordinance 2019.01 - First Reading of the 2019 Fire Code Amendments -
Discussion/Information — Staff to present the 2019 Fire Code Ordinance to the Board, (Heaith
and Safety Codes: 13869.7, 17958.7 and 18941.5) (Chief)

9. CORRESPONDENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS AND/OR REVIEW

8.1  Thank You letter from Amador Fire Protection District for Pioneer fire Protection's support with
vegetation and debris clean up in River Plnes (Vierra)
10. GOOD OF THE ORDER

11. UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS:
12, CLOSED SESSION ;
Woods Claim Update (closed session with attorney)

121

12.2

12.3

Anticipated Litigation Case # PC20190038 Katherine Wood VS Pioneer Fira Protection District
(Significant exposure to litigation pursuant fo Gov't. Code Section § 54956.9(d)(2) or (3). Update
from attornay via conferance call. (BOD)

Possible exposure to litigation (1 matter) pursuant to Government Code Section § 54956.9(d)
(2). Facts and circumstances that might result in litigation need not be disclosed. Conference
call from attorney regarding potential appeals. (BOD)

Labor negotlation (MOU) Pursuant to Government Code Section § 549857.6, conference updates
and information between District negotiators and Local #4586 (BOD)

13. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION
14. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (if applicable)
15. AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH

PFPD Board Meeting, October 8, 2019

20-0203 L Page 32 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Board of Directors Board Meeting

16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday
November 12, 2019 at 8 p.m.

The Aloneer e Protection District ("Disiric’), in complying with the Americans witn Dissbilities Act (FADA”, requests
individuals who require speaiel sccommodations (0 sccess, sltend and/or participate in District board meetings due o &
disabiity, mey be requested by celing (530) 822-4444 no later than 72 hours in advance of the scheduied meeting tme. In
compiance with Government Code Section 54857.5, non-exempt writings thet sre disiributed to a majonity or af of the
8oard in sovence of 8 meeling, may be viewed &t 7081 Mount Aukum Roed, Somerse!, Callfornia. in addition, If you would
kke & copy of any record rejated to an Rem on the sgends, plesss contact the District Adminisirative Assistent st (530) 820-
4444, Station 38 has Vsabied access and faciiities. Al Bosrd mueling sre recorded. OMos hours Tuesday through Thursdey
Sem fo 1pm.

Agenda posted ef the District’s Adminisiration BuRding, Poat Offices in Somerset, Mount Aukum, Grizzly Fats and the
Ploneer Fire Protection Districts websits of www.ploneedire. org.

’ Yok P
Si Reroska _ Location

Date Posted: lQl@t?_Q!ﬁ Time Posted: Zm..

Amended 10/06/2019 dee to Director Strangfald needing to artend via telephonic comrmunications, nothing to the agenda has change
except the addition that the will be attending via phone dus to exigeat circumstsnces.

PFPD Board Maating, October 8, 2019

20-0203 L Page 33 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Board of Directors Board Meeting

16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday
November 12, 2010 ot 6 p.m.

Prepered by:
As

live o Asnended by Mark Matthews, Fire Chief

The Proneer Fire Omtrict (TDistrket”), in complying with the Americans with Disablities Act ("ADA"), requests
indvicdusis who speciel sccommodations to access, altend endior participate in District boars meetings due 10 a
disadiity, mey be requested by calling (330) 822-4444 no iater than T2 hours in advance of the acheduied meeting ime. In
complance with Govemment Code Sedtion 54957.8, non-exempt writings thet are distriduted to & mejorfy or ol of the
Boent In sdvance of a meeting, mey be viewed st 7081 Mount Aukum Road, Somerset Cailfornia. in addition, ¥ you woukd
e & copy of any record reisted (o an Bem on the sgends, pisese contact the District Admiristrative Assietart af (530) 820-
4444_ Station 38 hes dissbied sccess and feciiies. Af Board meeting sre recorded. Office hours Tueedey thvougn Thursday
Sam o 1pm.

Agerncie posted et the Districts Adrinistration Bulidng, Post Offices In Somerset, Mount Aukum, Grzzly Flats and the

ticts wabete of www ionesie oG
maarnT L0,
s — Locatior
Posced. /0/5/? B ToePoned: ___ P22 0%

Aroended 100672019 dus to Director Strangfeld needing to smead vis wispbonic communications, nothing 10 the agende has change
sxcept the addition that she will be sitending via phone dos to exigent circurnstances.

PFPD Bosrd Meweting, October 8, 2019

20-0203 L Page 34 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Board of Directors 8oard Meeting

16, ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday
November 12, 2019 at 6 p.m.

Prepared by:

JV,
Joy Vierra, District Adnflinistrative Assistant/

ded by Mark Matthews, Fire Chief

The Pioneer Fire Protegtion District (*District’), In complying with the Americans with Disabilities Act (‘ADA"), requests
Individuels who require’spaciel accommodations (o access, atlend and/or participate in District board mesetings due (0 a
disablilty, may be requested by caliing (530) 622-4444 no later than 72 hours in advance of the schaduled meeting time. In
compliance with Government Code Section 54957.5, non-exempt wrltings that are distributed (0 a majorily or ell of the
Board In edvance of a meeting, may be viewed et 7081 Mount Aukum Road, Somersel, Cslifomia. In addition, i you would
like a copy of any record related to an tem on the agenda, please contact the District Administrative Assistant at (530) 620-
4444, Station 38 has dissbled access and fachities. All Bosrd meeting are recorded. Office hours Tuesday through Thursdsy
9am to 1pm.

Agenda posted at the District's Administration Building, Post Offices in Somerset, Mount Aukum, Grizzly Flats and the

Amended 10/06/2019 due to Disector Strangfeld needing to attend via telepbonic communications, nothing to the agenda has change
except the addition that she will be sttending via phone due to exigent circumstances.

PFPD Board Meeting, October 8, 2019

20-0203 L Page 35 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Board of Directors Board Meeting

16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday
November 12, 2019 at 6 p.m.

Prepared by:

The Pidneer Fife Protection District ("District’}, in complying with the Americens with Disabilities Act ("ADA"), requests
individuals who require special accommodations to access, atlend and/or participate in District board meetings due {o a8
disability, may be requested by calling (530) 622-4444 no later then 72 hours in advance of the scheduled mesting time. in
compliance with Government Code Section 54957.5, non-exempt writings that are distributed to a majority or all of the
Board in advance of a meeting, may be viewed at 7061 Mount Aukum Road, Somerset, California. In addition, if you would
like a copy of any record related lo an item on the agenda, piease contact the District Administrative Assistant al (530) 620-
4444. Station 38 has disabled access and facliitles. All Board meeting are recorded. Office hours Tuesday through Thursday
9am to 1pm.

Agenda posted at the District's Administration Building, Post Offices in Sommerset, Mount Aukum, anz)y Flats and the
Pioneer Fire Protaction Districts website at wwyw.ploneerfire.org.

Q@A C/,U»/«/v ol fT

Signatur Location
Date Posted: 7 0 ! /:7,/ EAYS) /j Time Posted: 7 / QD)"L\...

Amecnded 10/06/2019 due to Director Strangfeld needing to attend via telephonic communications, nothing to the agenda has change
except the addition that she will be attending via phone due to exigent circumstances,

PFPD Board Meeting, October 8, 2019

20-0203 L Page 36 of 52



Fj'_L

PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Board of Directors Board Meeting

November 12, 2019 at 6 p.m,
Masie Fitts - Board Chair, Kipley Howe - Vice Chalr,
Jatry jumper - Board Secretary, Michael Irish - Director

Mission Stotement
To provide o professionol ond compossioncte level of community fire protection, emergency medical ond rescue
services o the citizens ond peoperty ownitrs within the Fire District, in order Lo prevent or minimite the ioss of
life, poin, suffering and property damoge os 0 result of fire or other types of emergency.

Meeting location: PFPD Administration Offices- Boardroom
7080 Mount Aukum Road, Somerset, CA 95884

AGENDA

1. CALL TO ORDER

11
1.2

Ro# Call
Pledge cf Allegience

2. DETERMINATION OF QUORUM AND CONFIRMATION OF AGENDA

21

Adoption of Agenda

3. SPECIAL ANNOUNCEMENT / PREBENTATIONS / GENERAL BUSINESS

a1

Recognition & Honor of the following: Kenneth Strangfeid

4. PUBLIC COMMENT
Any person may address the District Board on any subject pertaining to District business, which Is not
listed on the agenda. This comment is providad by the Raiph M. Brown Open Meeting Act (Government
Code § 54960 et. seq) and mey be limited to thrae (3) minutes for any person addreesing the Board,

8. CONSENT CALENDAR
Coneent calendar [lems are considered routine and are acted upon by the Board with a single action.

Msmbers of the audience wishing to provids pubfic input may request that the Bosrd remove the ltem
from the Consent Calendar. Comments may be limited to three (3) minutes.

5.1
5.2
5.2

Minutes from Board Meeting October 8, 2018
Minutes from Speciat Board Msating October 28, 2018

Approval: payment of biis — green sheets

6. MONTHLY/STANDING ACTIVITY REPORTS:

6.1
6.2
6.3
6.4

Administrative/Chiefs Report

Local #4586
PVFA
Financial

7. OLD BUSINESS (The Board mey siect © review, discues, iake aclion or vote on any okd business. Tha Board Cheir may
request & roll call vote on teme)

7.1

72
7.3
74
78

PILT Funding - Possible misuse and or distribution of funds by the E| Dorado County Auditor
(Chief)

Payrol Services (Chief)

PFPD Vegetstion Management (Ad-hoc updstes) Ordinance (Director Jumper/Chief)

Plonser Flre Protection District Bullding/ Facility Use Agrsement (Chief)

Auto Ald Agreement; between Amador County Fire Protection District & Ploneer Fire Protection
District. (Chief)

PFPD Board Meeting, November 12, 2019

20-0203 L Page 37 of 52



Nov 12 2019 Agende,
fy 2

PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Board of Directors Board Meeting

7.8 MOU Per-Diem Position with Amador Fire Protection District and Pioneer Fire Protection District
(Chief)

7.7(a) Fire Code - Ordinance 2018.01 - Second Reading of the 2019 Fire Code Amendments — Chief
to present the 2019 Fire Code Ordinance to the Board. (Hesith and Safety Codes, 138697,
176488.7 and 18841.5) (Chief)

7.7(b) Ordinance 2018-01 Adopting the 2019 Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the
2018 Edition of the International Fire Code. To include all information and preceding to be
diecussed for Ordinance adoption. (Chief)

7.8 Update on open board position, (Vierra)

8. NEW BUSINESS (The Board may review, discuss, ake action or voie on any new business. The Board Chair may
request a roll call vots on items).

8.1 Pay rate review and potential adjusiments/changes ic the OES deployment rate for volunteers
and reserves.

9. CORRESPONODENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS AND/OR REVIEW
10. GOOD OF THE ORDER

11. UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS:

12. CLOSED SESSION

12,1  Labor negotiation (MOU) Pursuant to Government Code Section § 54857.8, conference updates
and information between District negotiators snd Local #4588 (BOD/Chief)

12.2 Conference with Real Property Negotiations (§ 54956.8) Property iocated at 4847 Sciaroni Rd
QGrizzly Flats CA 85684 (BOD/Chief).

13. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION

14. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (if spplicable)

18. AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH

16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday
December 10, 2010 at 6 p.m.

strict Administrative Assistant

The Proneer Fire Protection Districi ["Datrict’), in compiying with the Amencans with Disaddibee Act "ADA®), reQuenis individuels
who require specisl sccommodations 10 accees, aftend anddr participate in District boerd meetings due (o & disabilty, mey be
requested by calling (830) 822-4444 no later than T2 hours in edvence of ihe scheduisd meeting Sme. In compilence with
Govemmeni Code Secion 84837.5, non-exemp! wiitings thel sre distnduled to & majorty or ek of tha Bosrd in advence of a
meeting. mey be viewsd of Y081 Mount Aukum Roed, Somersel, CeNfomia. in addion, I you would fke 8 copy of eny record
reisted 10 an Hem on (he agende, plasss contact the Distriot Administraiive Assistant 8t (830) §20-4444. Stalion 38 has dissbied
access and facilties. AV Board meeting sre recorded. Ofice Aours Tuesdey thvough Thureday Gem to 1pm.

Agenda posted s! the District's Administration Bullding, Post Cliices in Somerset. Moun! Ausum, Grizzly Fle(s end the Ploneer Rire
Protection Districts webelts st www pioneeqie.og

¢ wimn* Doy

Dste Pored: (/‘/3’_/-7-0/‘7 Time Pownd: __ 3 15 prm

PFPD Board Meeting, November 12, 2019

20-0203 L Page 38 of 52



NOV 12 2011 A
fq2

PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Board of Directors Board Meeting

7.8  MOU Per-Diem Position with Amador Flre Protection District and Ploneer Fire Protection District
(Chief)

7.7(a) Fire Code - Ordinsnce 2018.01 - Second Reading of the 2019 Fire Code Amendments - Chief
to present the 2019 Fire Code Ordinance to the Board. (Health and Safety Codes. 13869.7,
17958.7 and 18941.5) (Chief)

7.7(b) Ordinance 2018-01 Adopting the 2018 Edition of the California Fire Code, Incorporating the
2018 Edition of the Intemational Fire Code. To include all information end preceding to be
discussed for Ordinance adoption. (Chlef)

7.8  Updsate on open board position; (Vierra)

8. NEW BUSINESS (The Boerd may review, discuss, take action or vois on sny new business. The Board Chair may
requaet 4 rof call vols on teme).

8.1 Pay rate review and potentisl adjustiments/changes to the OES deployment rate for volunteers
and reserves.

8. CORRESPONDENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS AND/OR REVIEW
10. GOOD OF THE ORDER

11. UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS:

12. CLOSED SESSION

12.1 Labor negotiation (MOU) Pursuant to Government Code Section § 54957.6, confsrence updates
and information bajween District negotiators and Local #4586 (BOD/Chief)

12.2 Confersnce with Real Property Negotistions (§ 54956.8) Property located st 4847 Sciaron! Rd
Grizzly Fiats CA 95684 (BOD/Chief).
13. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION
14. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (if spplicabie)
15. AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH
16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesdasy
December 10, 2019 at 6 p.m.

red by: /{
J District Administrative Assistant
™he Flre Protection District ("District?), In complying wilh the Americans with Dizabilities Act (‘ADA’}, requesis indgividuals

who require special sccommodations (0 access, sttend and/or participate in District board meetings due fo s dissdiity, may be
requested by celing (830} 022-4444 no imler than 72 hours in advence of the schaduied meeting ¥me. in complisnce with
Government Code Seclon 54987.5, nonexempt writings that sre diatributed (o 8 mejorky or all of the Board in sdvencs of @
meeling, may ba viewed at T081 Mourt Aukum Ruad, Sornwceel, California. In ackiion, I you would e 8 capy of ary record
related fo an em on the sgenda, please cantact the Disirict Administrative Assistant ef (530) 820-4444. Station 38 hes dsabied
acoens end faciities. All Board meeting are recorded. Office hours Tueeday through Thursdey Sam to Tpm.

Agends posted af the District's Administrstion Bulding, Post Ofices in Somerset, Mount Aulum, Grizzty Fiats and the Pronesr Fire

Pwm of pyw . pioneerfre org.
9/43@2*“ E“%dasar /0
Date Possod: /7/5//7 Time Posted: ‘5‘70[/"7

PFPO Board Meeting, November 12, 2019

20-0203 L Page 39 of 52



PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Board of Directors Board Meeting

7.8  MOU Per-Diem Poasrtion with Amador Fire Protection District and Pioneer Fire Protection District
(Chief)

7.7(a) Fire Code - Ordinance 2019.01 - Second Reading of the 2019 Fire Code Amendments — Chiet
to present the 2018 Fire Code Ordinance to the Board (Heatth and Safety Codes 13880.7,
17958.7 and 18941 .5) (Chief)

7.7(b) Ordinance 2018-01 Adopting the 2019 Edition of the Caiforrva Fire Code, incorporating the
2018 Eation of the Interrational Firs Cods. To include ali information and preceding lo be
discussed for Ordinance adoption. (Chief)

7.8  Update on open board position; (Vierra)

8. NEW BUSINESS (The Board msy review, discuss, tske action or vote on any new busiress. The Board Chalr may
request & rofl call vote on Aems ).

81 Pay rate review and potential adjustments/changes to the OES ceployment rate for voiunteers
and reserves.

9. CORRESPONDENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS AND/OR REVIEW
10. GOOD OF THE ORDER

11, UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS:

12. CLOSED SESSION

12.¢  Labor negotiation (MOU) Pursuant to Government Code Section § 54657 6, conference updates
and information betwean Disirict nagotators and Local #4586 (BOD/Chief)

12.2 Conference with Real Property Negotations {§ 54856.8) Property located at 4847 Sciaroni Rd
Grizzty Flats CA 95684 (BOD/Chvef).

13. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION

14, REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (i applicable)

18. AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH

16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday
December 10, 2019 at 6 p.m.

Prog

by.

District Administrstive Assistant

The"Proneer Fire Protection District {DIsStret’) 0 compuang with the Amencans with Disabilities Act "ACA") requasts inaviousis
who require specisl sccommodaetions '0 eccess. altend anclor participate in Disinict 00ard meetings due (0 8 disadblly. may be
requesied by caling (530) 822-4444 no istec then T2 hours in scvante of the scheduied meeting time.  in complisnce with
Govemment Code Seclion 540875, non-exempl writings ihal are digiribuled lo a majonty or el of the Board in acvence of »
meeling, may be viewed af 7081 Mount Aukum Road, Somerge! Cailfornia. in adoition, if you wouwid #ke 8 copy of sny recors
reiatad 1o an kem on the agenda. pieass contect the Distric! Admunisirative Asaistan! al (830) 620-4444 Stetion 38 hes disabied
sccess and faciities. All Board meefing are recoroed. Office hours Tueaday through Thursday dam to Tpm.

Agenda posted af the District's Admin:atrstion Buiksing. Post Offices in Somersel. Moun! Aukum, Gris2ly Fials and ihe Picneer Fire
Protection: Districie website 8! wyrw pioneeqire. o3

arF /e
g Locsation ’
Dafe Posted: ///5/7 Time Posted: __G €O L
2

PFPD Board Meeting, November 12, 2019

20-0203 L Page 40 of 52



Nov 12 2o "‘3“\‘0\
74 2

PIONEER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Board of Directors Board Meeting

78  MOU Psr-Diem Position with Amador Fire Protection District and Ploneer Fire Protection District
(Chief)

7.7(a) Fire Code - Ordinance 20:9.01 - Second Reading of the 2019 Fire Code Amendments — Chief to
present the 2019 Fire Code Ordinance o the Board. (Meaith and Sefety Codes: 13869.7,
17988.7 and 1884 1.5) (Chisf)

7.7(b) Ordinance 2018-01 Adoping the 2019 Edition of the Cailfomia Fire Code, incorporaing the 2018
Edition of the international Fire Code. To include all information and preceding to be discussed
for Orginance adoption. {Chief)

7.8  Updais on open board position; (Vierra)

8. NEW BUSINESS (The Board may review, discues, iake action or vole on sny new business. The Boerd Chalr mey request

& rol call vote on Rams).
81 Pay rats review and polentiai adjustments/changes to the OES deployment rate for voiunisers
and reserves.

9. CORRESPONDENCE FOR POSSIBLE BOARD ACTIONS AND/OR REVIEW
10. GOOD OF THE ORDER
11, UPCOMING CALENDAR OF EVENTS:
12. CLOSED SESSION
12.1  Labor negotiation (MOU) Pursuant to Government Code Section § 54957 6, contecence updates
and Information between District negotiators and Local #4888 (BOD/Chief)

12.2 Conference with Real Property Negotations (§ 54858 8) Property located at 4847 Sclaronl Rd
Grizgy Flats CA 85684 (800/Chief).
13. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION
14. REPORT UPON RETURN FROM CLOSED SESSION (if applicable)
15. AGENDA ITEMS FOR NEXT MONTH
16. ADJOURNMENT TO THE NEXT REGULAR BOARD MEETING SCHEDULED FOR Tuesday
December 10, 2019 at 8 p.m.

Fire Protection Dletrict "DIsIcY), in compdying with the Americans with Disebitties Act "ADAY), requeals indhviduala
wha require epeciai sccommodations 10 sccses, altend anddr partivipate in Diatrict board meetings due 10 8 Jlsadiity, mey be
requested by calling (530} 822-4444 no isler than T2 houre in advarce of the scheduled meating tims. in compliiance wan
Government Cade Saction 549675, ron-azempt wrilings that sre distribuled 10 8 majorty or & of the Boerd In sdvance of s meeting,
mey be viewed st 7081 Mourt Auinam Rosd, Samersel, Caltornia. in eadition, { you would ife e copy of any record redsied i an
fem o0 the agendu, pisess contect e Dlericf Administranve Assistent et (530) 820-4444, Stetion J8 hes dlesbied sccess and
fackities. A Board meeting are recorded. Ofice hours Tuesdey through Thursdey Sem fo Tpm.

Agende posisd ol the Disrkct's Admirdsirelion Buliding, Post OMcee in Somerset, Mount Aukum, Grizaly Flets snd e Pioneer Rre

Protection Districts webele ot wew ioneerra.oc
Wekaes
Location

Dats Postad /’/E/Jﬁ'/’) Time Postad: 35/5’2&

1

PFPO Board Meeting, November 12, 2019

20-0203 L Page 41 of 52



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted | Adopted as Amended Finding
101.1 X Admin
105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
106.6 X Admin
106.6.1 X Admin
106.7 X Admin
109.4 X Admin
110.4 X Admin
110.4.2 X Admin
112.4 X Admin .
202 X Admin
302.1 X Admin
307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographica!
507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
33103 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5001.7 X Admin
5601.2 X Admin
5601.2.1 X Admin
5601.2.2 X Admin
5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 L Page 42 of 52




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted | Adopted as Amended _ Finding
6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.2 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6113.1 Admin
6113.2 Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 5.1.1.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 7.6

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 11.2.1.1

Climatic/Geologicai/Topographical

Appendix B: Table B105.1(1)

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix B: Table B105.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.5§ 1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.6.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.6.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.4

XIXIXIX|IXIX|IX][X]|>x|>xI>x]>X[x|x<|x<Ix|{x]|x

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

101.2 through 101.5

Admin

X
102.6 through 102.8 X Admin
102.10 through 102.12 X Admin
103.1 through 104.1 X Admin
104.3 through 104 4 X Admin
104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin
104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin
104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin
104.11.3 X Admin
105.2.3 X Admin
105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin
105.6.12 X Admin
105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin
105.6.37 X Admin
105.6.39 X Admin
105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin
105.6.48 X Admin
105.6.50 X Admin
106.1 through 106.3 X Admin
107.1 X Admin
108.1 through 109.3 X Admin
110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin
110.4.1 X Admin
1131 X Admin

20-0203 L Page 43 of 52




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section

Adopted

Adopted as Amended

Finding

303.1 through 303.9

X

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

305.1 through 305.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

306.1 through 306.2

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

307.1 through 307.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.2 through 308.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.2 Admin

308.3 through 308.4.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical

310.4 through 310.8

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

311.1 through 311.4

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

3191 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
319.2 Admin
319.3 through 319.10.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.10 through 403.10.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

405.5 Admin
510.3 Admin
807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1.5 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1103.2 Topographical
Appendix %1%120111 through Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.4

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.6

XKIX] X O IXIXIXIXIX XX XXX XXX XX XXX ]XxX{X]X]Xx

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.1 through

X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D104.3 (excluding exception) , gical/Topograp
Appendix D: D105.1 through
ppencix roue X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D105.4
Appendix D: D106.1 through L. , .
| |
D106.3 (excluding exception) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D107.1 (excluding . . .
Cl
exceptions) X imatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 L Page 44 of 52




Attachment No. 2

Pioneer Fire Protection District Resolution

No. 006-2019

20-0203 L Page 45 of 52



RESCTLITTRON MO aia-20 06

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS 0F | HE PIONEER FITL
PROTECTION  DISTRICT  ADOPFTING  FINDROS SUPPORTENG
AMENDMENTS TO THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

A pezobuyrivn e she Ploreer Fiee Proteciion Diswion seting ol Gndings word nspog e
el zondidons svithin sthe Fre Doy which onibe cersin roedification. el ciaipes 1
e Cudtrnes Bae Code reasonably necessary Tar posses de Bieg ol wfory i

Viopeor Firs Peotestion Disorich
[he ey crping Hoard ob the Pooncer Fies Proeection Distioet Tndy send tevolve s as follows

WHEREAS, Heabth & Satery Cede Sewiicn 174385 penmits a0 Fies Pratesiion

Uit o cadop an ordinanee wdinicn shanges v meedilos e Staie Honsim cepolatians
sdopted pursaam o Meslih & Sty Codo Socon 8727 upon Jetenmunation that sucl

chanzes or

mdiftenntons e secciuary dne o lacdd copdibens that pertain cegulations
gaverning conditions hazapdous v e pooperty aned the cnvamamen b fire, explosian,

hazardous matepals and hazardons saes g

WHERFEAS, Hesith £ Sstety Conde Sectiop 19258 7 regrores that o District’s
Doard of Dinccters making Iy cloarges oo andioition s pursusas W Heahih & Savery

Code Svation 179385 sboll mahe snperss Hindimyg fst b chmge s or mediliatons are

needed: and shall e a copy of < shanges or slodibeations s i the Depanment af
tlousing and Communiny Develegwniene amd

WHEREAS, the unique fecnt chmate, gosdegical, wnd wpographarsl conditions

-

sxisting within the boundaries o the DistrivO e it reicomably pecdsany for e Dizine
e imposg mor: stringent raquirements tian o foah o e Califorria Fire Oode and

prrsuaat 1o Califernis Health ared Satory Cade sectiong 138697 snd V79357, the Disric

desives to mabe mapress findines vy b eflect: aned

NOW, THEREFORE, BE I'T RESOUVED 1hat the Board ui Directors of the
Vioneer Fiie Protection Dualede after baving duly noticed mad hield public hearings, hereby
adapts 1he llowiag fndiogs conceming aurent amgues becal conditions that together

zach moedificarion ta Hee O Uit Fire Codes censonaldy nsicssnrs w provide

auequste ard elfecitve prodection o T properts und Mie covvironroent miore spectficafty

ERTI I A Ea L LA

[
Resalinion Mee (M6 2t Muste Py o0 Eilean Strangfeld zLJ

20-0203 L Page 46 of 52



FINTHNGS OF FACT
FPORCCTANGES QR MODIFICATHONS TQ THE SEATL UL S TASTAR]TS
CODE (TITLE X4 PART 9 BECAUSE OF LOC AL < oovhi baNns

A, General
Afier due considension, the Bomrd ol Threc o oat e Poaie oo Tiie Prosteeiion Do
hereby ods that duwe o Ll ciimatie, gentogic s vpepraphne cosbionn oo !
within this docvrment. thiere 15 3 ced fo proccide the rmmdibeations sl dharges conjaged
iy the adoptive Opdinance of the Caliboenn P Cadde 5ok cbanees are deemid o be
"f.‘\'i.'fvi,'il'!:'ih’:.‘ MECESEIL [0 ot tcdve sdwoate sl ot e gt Vil o b s Jarie s1ied

the envIreninent.

The Pyomzer Firs Protection FHatier prooviides e gosizcion, cimengeiioy aedicad sor e
and spectalized resci serviess to approsimakely sl thonsanl people in o 290 ogquars
mile svea The Distrcr e booceee i eonth L Dragado Counte. The tepoarphy of the
Cesaret vanges Uone robhog Bills o ups and b, womndbands iy the west and oskoand

nebsce i dhee sleep mtounbidoo aml dhedinmges of the maa portion, The weather

comditiang vary Uend Toastingg Feenportaess svith oecosional siave o the Tawer elevation
arcd snos i the Bigher elevitions i winen @ soammer wnperatires i exceed 1y

degrecs,

The Disiricr oo be divited e e distimer ares The core ares encompasses Mo
Avkuny Semeraol Doy ued Chpouadabs The o misy 15 more whan miectace and
contpi: most ol fhe DistocUs casting vonnmerend dévelopiien and potential or
comiperciyl develipman Hie carthosst d0rizay Phas) and seothenst (Omeo Raneh)
arens typically costapsossnd! sshdbisios and fodated restdential developments. These
arews die Rttt of e sebaa e wnier{ee. fmmane o rmch eovinawnsmy. The
Vet ertn vna oy s Hee Saned Ridge aven contaming sinall subdiisicass sl haslowd

recidenitial developuear and areus of funingianching The 2ast heoomes very Liolmied

and ove ryral eovou s e further dane fFom Grizely Flas end the Dmio Ranch areas,

Lhe Proness Vire Fratectaay Deaedon s o “all-rsk’ agenss. The Distiar pativipares i o

sopitizhicated auioncae aid onogram and s deeatered throuddo agreement by ihe
Calitergy Dperment o) Vorgsuy and Fire Protecoon (Cal-Firern ac Cainine, The
gesonrces of the Dizinic will respend e, and deal wirh, are fope ot omerdenc The e

“Fire Pootecrow’ i thds Jucwnient 8 teomd amd inciudes responzes o B sovodar

adoe neestganons, sl public ssist callss bazardous matensts spcrdenn medion!

mrdd, it speciplizsd res v

Y- isner has estpblished one, tbeume, stalfed e staton amd Hne snDNine e

G ) PRet e L cERg ey fervices (o the commionty Fire S1ation 3K iy booated

| ¥y
Ry datheg M (oo Marie Fi!l‘;;%_w,_;_ Eileen STmanaigld é‘LJ

20-0203 L Page 47 of 52



Taro o

sf TR Mogar Sobate Bel Fiez <::.;1E=1m R

dhe flegtye i pariios iosnn ol Moo el

lovisbesd an slie spncarpeTans e shnper Banelin o n faitl MY drgos T.m, Lt

11

H.L'.ﬂt'h A {oe E!-.‘“.(M"‘ js\ v boeaied o SRIT SE'!;_‘T:‘:-?H P “"

Sextianr e tocarad i e macocpanitead e a0 e Yakede o 2460 Oime Pt

Vol Stoont ebur ©4 l'llf: stabon 1218 located i the Suind Badge area, 30 4770 sund

Widge Rosg Placervilte, CAL Uine Shsidon 31 s Incarad i the Sseeny vassing e, o

TG e iy Plae B Seeeon U080 Thie Drsioe hay aiy milinmes oaveer paysono],

shonre wadh faee IR i

,mn_s‘ ape st seppuns positions, soe pohlic

cteatie XL RS o] Cnsb b ASW  andy webiare e and S Bevern @V gty <,

Chmirdice.

The Premviser Five Proteciion Didng s focwed within o bt sndd smounizmaus regine
Froe Distoicd is subject 0 foor scasans, with an ol mverige seoeatall i e sinter
vt ad 2 tasiee dothe fonilille 40 fnches in the Grecely Plaes and Ome Rancle Ageas
aod Mdl pnehes b the vessniedeons anzss i addition oo wverage raindall of 38 tches in
e luwer evations and S8 b o the buyghan clevations pErovain, These adverse
'H.m?-t.x B M}u:!l“rx\ oreyl se ey M’i:‘fﬁa(d{ltls M-!lj Dy :»,__H fitiih, n\‘"’xding Aoyl Ax l'f,lr;ii. Hii’ﬂv
fozards aleng the onen seecss mads withen s well dg Dares the Doy trom the
srnamding arens. Do e pencds of camtol) slons woth revssind cond closiigs, ihe
by of the Fire Protccarn Bistnet w provide noineshiate copeegencys 1espons s often
defived wr anpaszabls, Thesie sinse adbverse chamine combitons. oftsn mseltin o lurge
gurmber ot vehrcalar accidents thar place cxoonie resiramis on e ayilebiliee of
ENETRERCY respon iz o perfom emergency rescoue. st wir hazardous nugertils control,
wnd fre- fighting Vhe 2iimintic conditions often reandy i3 substuniul G wtal lack of
abdhite of the Fire Proatectior Disinco o respond nnmediatel e vher tipes o Smiergency

sitpgriorss that vegig. Eaasiples of these smespene, siudnens jecinds strectore [ires,

wildland and Jorest Hres, Tonding, hoazordo: marenals incdente, cmeiginey aetion

cibls, vehicle acoiles, and vertion! resvues, Thae mnnued id pgrecorenty satebluhicd il
aliotming Hre agencies wight not be posable due w0 adverse Cimene conditions.
restricting o rodally Bl king access into the Distric.

Summun:

Thesa bocud it congditions aifedt e acosieriiion, densic.. wul siae of fines i the
Fire District Pimes of B or s ::ainifﬁ“, b lradity, wnd bigh lemiperstures 2roate
entremely hcardaons conditont, perticebialy gy chey vl oo e wisdandenrean
interface. Weo's experienced i thin arca can e 2 sienilicany legact njvon Sim e
Sres. espeoally mr Buddines in cdose proviots 1ooone anethor and 1o swnidlanss

commanty tound b the Ploncer Fire Protection District,  Strpctuies bl wathin the
Pirners Fire Protesstion Cismnct nuet be beaht veuh thass vartabdes inoimbad,

!, A -
Pasalimon Moo fe o Canie Fiae | 5 Bilemy Strongleld ;'r_ 4 ‘5 _

20-0203 L Page 48 of 52



< Genlogical.  The Ploncer Fire Peotectinn Distiet s ocuied wathin moders activiny
seistnic Zome Thice, The sefamiv, geological oonditions present a potantinl for aattiple
Nres, magor breakaye af warer mains, mohiple clectrical power faihwen, ouitipl
cotlapsed sruciures and a arge number of calls Tocamergeney madical aid, all ot whch
raay acour simiineoush durime s sersnig every The woer distrioes Bave nuiernis
W u!x:!—pmzzpmg Sysleans psed for fiee SuPtpressin 18 arLeth LlL‘li\,‘er}‘ ag awvell ag vt ﬁlfili_lgc
fnks provnding waden systom pessore, Most of the pimpmg systemy e dependent an
clectngal possar for aperaton. Sach cleamizal peaver may not be available during a
sesmig ehent Water slorage Lunks wsed Tor the Sionge af reginred fire suppression watce
may e callapse Uvosueh an evens fercoy the vhbitonal nesd g ranspore waier vis
sdatinenal preces of Tire apparanes which sall phooea sianiDoant resteaing on the abilay of

the INSINCT 1o prosade the reguirad enerency services.

Numman
Local geaprnphic and grobigw sl Yewtures aod procssses exast o ithin the hovaduries ot 1he

Jiset thuat ey anper the atulin ol the Ploncer Fae Proteetion Disinet i perform i
; pe ) r

sk Junes, Fire Sallonseng ar capthaguabie s the porentiol oF causing wraner Joss of Tife

and dumage than the canthyuuke uselt,

i Tapogewaphical.  The Instret 15 primand: composed of namerous arens thin wre
copiddered by the Stte e o high dire havand serenty rones. The District is bycated
wthin ubout 70 percent foathifl temam and 30 percent wuintainous terrain, covered with
highly combustbic segatation, mcluding the presence ol mans coniferous forested areas.
The wies i within the Distrdt ranges from oo F000 feet o wver 7300 teer g (he
tighest peant Slape whibin the Dissdier panges Gun 0 degvees o 90 Jegrees. The
stipcrures witlan the gy of toathills termin have Timted lire access, due 1o narrow
roadawass wuh o steep gtades and poor romd surfece conditions, The presence of many
ex sty Auctes withi the Nigh fue sied o enty 2o0c areas provides for a very high
prtential of a strucidre fire spreading imio 3 wildband oz torest fire condition as well as the
potential for a saldiand wr forest fire cpreadme 0 sioAures,

Stummary;

The aligoment of vamvons, sublevs. and slopes inte inhabited areas. crmbiged With the
virbable autare of the lermain yield poential Por invvessed fire sk, Most siructures. bath
resideniial 4nd commercral. wre in or are surmounded by areas thal contain significant
gruss. hrush, mized cak woodland. and mixed wontler fuel foad. Due 10 drought
canditions, beetle intestatiang. and lack of wexetation management. much of the area i
populated with cither dead or dyving tr=es. contributing 1o extrerne fire danger,

i
t
, - C - .. B} e
Resolution Wo: O06-201% Mane Fn_ts-,‘ - Eileen Strangieid ’.'.;.\Lx_

20-0203 L Page 49 of 52



IR

b Cancleiing

KRR N“lnju =

PO

SRTRCATTINY? SO i Sl [k

e g mitge
fallivrnia Peatile aed Saney,
Caorle b ympresals mariod

l]llwﬁl—lr.fl{imﬁ Theoeinod

Frocibis ooy VDRSSO oot S0 do mide, JOTETE

o]t roan by G g i PR

5 AR TS RNR SELN 1 AR B O RSN TUNEE AR

fe oy

RN

Py Fire Voo

AR

Lat bR o

spept Lhimiriicy

Vo, Betd gt It

ey
IRRAL I R NI Y
s

T

[

R ol Fvevtire i e Tl i bt ceang Wesea s S {to-20/
i 3 * » tot R . Kl
e vaend vt wand s e S et I O TP O N S LT KRN

; T vedy ut, o, O P | :
[P A T RN I ST NI TR 0SS SVE T NEN L NS PR RPIRY U S VI B R PV L R U A I8

ix,
P ty

Ty

‘:}i‘-_ﬂ;;-- Hi

I .o 1Y . ¥ R —_ o . L
EEIVISEIRTS 4 Jare Tasss T = Fileen Sian
U 4

20-0203 L Page 50 of 52



RESOLUTION NO. XXX-2020
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO
(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 011-2017)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is
updated by the State every three years; and,

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code becwne «[Tective on Junuary 1, 2020, und

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5
permit a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2,
Chapter 1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety
regulations to the Jocal level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building
official, or his or her authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his
or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, enforcement of the Fire Code in the County of E! Dorado has been delegated to the
chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, on November 12, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Pioneer Fire Protection
District adopted Ordinance No. 2019.1 which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with
amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with Jocal climate, geological or
topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El
Dorado ratify the following amendments to the California Fire Code adopted by the Pioneer Fire
Protection District:

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following
sections:

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4,110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4 through
" 307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1.
507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2,
903.2.9, 903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4,
5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 through
6112.3, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 (NFPA 13D-2016), Appendix B: Table B105.1 (1),
Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D103.5, Appendix
D103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Exception, Appendix D104.4., Appendix D106.1 Exception,
Appendix D107.1 Exception.

20-0203 L Page 51 of 52



. -”’ L1

The Pioneer Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in
its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code,
2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed bclow:

Resolution No. 000-2020

Page 2 of 2

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403.4, 403.6,
403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12, 404.1-
404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808, 904.1.1,
1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25,
Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception), D107.1 (Exceptions
1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K,
Appendix L, Appendix M. '

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other scctions of the 2019
California Fire Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of EI Dorado at a regular
meeting of said Board, held the 7*" day of January, 2020, by the following vote of said Board:

Attest: Ayes :
James S. Mitrisin Noes :
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors Absent;
By:
Title Sue Novasel, Chair, Board of Supervisors

20-0203 L Page 52 of 52





