RESOLUTION NO. 045-2020
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL. DORADO
(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 012-2017)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is
updated by the State every three years; and,

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines
are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions;and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2,
Chapter 1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety
regulations to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building
official, or his or her authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his
or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the
chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and
maintain a memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining
to the inspection of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on November 13, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Rescue Fire Protection
District, adopted Ordinance No. 2019-01 which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with
amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or
topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Supervisors of the County of El
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Rescue Fire Protection District and delegates the
enforcement of the ordinance to the Rescue Fire Protection District Chief.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following
sections:

101.1, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1,307.4.4, 307.4.4.1,
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1.
507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9,
903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905 .4, 5001.7,
5601.2,5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80
NFPA 13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 4.7, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section
5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1,
Appendix Table B105.1 (1), Appendix Table B105.2, Appendix D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix
DI103.5 Section 1, Appendix 103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, and Appendix D104.4.

20-0203 M Page 1 of 36



Resolution No. 045-2020
Page 2 of 2

The Rescue Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in

its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code,
2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

105.6.17-105.6.19, 105.6.39, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4,403.3,
403.4,403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11,
403.12, 404.1-404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2), 808, 904.1.1,
1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25,
Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception), D107.1 (Exception),
Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L,
Appendix M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019
California Fire Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said

Board, held the 10 day of  March , 2020, by the following vote of said Board:
Ayes: Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin, Novasel

Attest: Noes: None

Kim Dawson Absent: None /

Clerk ofthe Board, Wisors g /

By: M / //L// -'*/// fpon Lond

Deputy Clerk ’ Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Bard of Supervisors

20-0203 M Page 2 of 36



Rescue Fire Department

5221 Deer Valley Rd.« Rescue, CA 95672 « Phone (530) 677-1868 * Fax (530) 677-9609

Maurice Johnson
Fire Chief

December 18 , 2019

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors
330 Fair Lane

Placerville, CA 95667

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Rescue Fire
Protection District, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code with
amendments related to local climatic, geographic and topographic
conditions.

Dear Mr. Ashton:

The Rescue Fire Protection District (RFPD) is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS)
ratify its Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code as amended
due to specific local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. California Health
and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of the city or county where
the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance. The BOS must
also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District (or its representative)
or the Chief Building Official.

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2019-01 with
amendments to the 2019 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that
Ordinance to the RFPD Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for your review and
use on this topic.

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County.

Sincergly,
1Ce 4

Fire Chief

ATTACHMENTS:

1. RFPD Ordinance No. 2019-01
2. RFPD Resolution No. 2019-08
3. Draft El Dorado County BOS Resolution

“Serving the Communities of El Dorado Hills, Rescue and Latrobe”
20-0203 M Page 3 of 36



Attachment No. 1

RFPD Ordinance No. 2019-01

20-0203 M Page 4 of 36



RESCUE FIRE PROTECTION DINTRICT

ORDINANCE NO. 2019-01

FE AT DRDAINED BY THF BOARD OF DIFECTORS OF T'HE RESCUIE FIRE
PROTECTION DHSTRICT AS FOLLIOWS:

An ordinance of the Rescue Fite Piotention Pustoct (REPDY adopting rthe M09 Fditea of the Caditernia Fire
Crde, meorporating the 2018 Edition ol the tntermanional Fire Code, repulating spd goroming the sufegnarding of
e and property from fire and explosion havandy wrising from the siorage, handling and use o) hinzand us substences
auttenaby wnd Jeviees, and from eonditions hienrdous 1o life or property i the oceupancy of buildings and premiser
i the REPD: praviding tor the tssuancc ol penmits and collection of fees therefor; Hepealing Ordinance No. 2016-01
at the RFPD and a!l other erdinances and parts of the ordinasces tn conflict therewith,

Be 1 DRDAINED by the Buaard o Dinsztors of the REPD:
Section | FINDINGS OF FACTS
Section 2: ADOQPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
Section 3. LOCAL AMENDMENTS
Section 4: CONFLICT
Section 5: SEVERABILITY
Section 6 EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

The RFPD makes cortain changes (listed below) to the Caltfornia Fire Code, 2019 Edition, pursuant to

Heulth & Saten: Code Sections 1849 7 179387 and 7894/ 5 dunng this code adoption process,  Such changes
are necessary because of local climstic, geclogical and/er topographical conditions, The RFPD hay adopted,
parsuant o Section 18U/ S of the California Heafth & Safety Unde, the Tadings of fadts relative 1o these

conditiony by Resvolition #219-0% of the BFPD dated October 9, 2019

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
The RFPD adopty the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Parr 9, jp its estirety, inclodipg Appendicss,
incarporating hose sections of the fnternational Fire Code, 2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the

exciusions histed below:

Exclusions: 105.6.17-105.6.19, 105.6.39, Y08 1.4, W09, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1.403.2.4, 403.3,
403.4,403 6, 4037, 401 & (adoptrog 303.5.1403 8.1.7), A3.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403,11, 403,12, 404.1 404 4,

Ordinance 2019-01 20-0203 M Page 5 of 38° '



}
’

405“.'1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406. 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2), 808, 904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9
(adopung 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception),
[106.1 (Exception), D107.1 (Exception), Appendix A, Appendix F, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J,
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 California Fire
Code.

SECTION 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS
The following Sections are hereby amended or added:

Chapter 1

Scction 101 Scope and Genera)] Requirements

101.1 Title shall be amended as follows: Add nume of jurisdiction [RFPD]

Section 106 Fees

- 106.6 Yermit, Plan Review and lnspection Fees shall be added as follows: 4 schedule of fees

adopted by the district board of directors for plan review, inspections and the issuance of permits by
the district may be found in the most curvent district fee schedule (Heulth & Safety Code 17951).

106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees shall be added as follows: Firce service fees may be charged to any

person, firm, corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or us a result of
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the district to respond to the scene of an incident. A
district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of uny service which the district provides or the cost
of enforcing uny regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Sufety Code 13916). The fee shall
not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to the scene of an incident.

- 106.7 Administrative Costs shall be added as follows: When a test or inspection is scheduled, and
the contraclor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (4HJ), the AHJ
may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/inspection location and

the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs.

- Scction 109 Board of Appeals
- Scction 109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines shall be added as follows: Any person or entity who

believes they may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code
official through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on
the notice. All such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for
the district. A timely appeal shall stay further action by the fire code official until the matter is

determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in Section 109.2, unless the issue poses an imminent fire

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 2
20-0203 M Page 6 of 36



o life safciy hiazard to members of the public. The five code official shall notify the appellant by
certificd mail ap i date wid timé of suck hearing. 1he hearing shall be scheduied 10 1ahe place no
sooner than 20 calendar davs from the dute shown o the certified mail. The appellant shall have the
right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and present oral, written and/or photographic

evidence to the Appeal Board.

Scction 110 Violations

110.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows: Persons who shall violate a provision of this

code or shall faif 10 comply with any of the requirements thereof o1 who shall crect, install. alier.
repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code
ofticial, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting attarney or agency, punishable by a
fine not exceeding §700.00 for a first violation; 2. 4 fine not exceeding 3500.00 for a second vivlation
of the same provision within one year, 3. A fine not exceeding $1000.00 for each additional violation
nf the same provision within one year, or by impnsonment not exceeding /80 days, or both such fine
and imprisonment. Bach day that a violation conlinues afier due notice has been served shall be
deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17495).

110.4.2 Citations shall be added as follows: The Fire Chicf, or histher dulv authorized

representative, may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to
Section 13871 of the Health & Safery Code of the State of California and Chapter 5¢ (commencing
with Section 853.6) of Tite 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the Stute of Califurnia.

Section 112 Stop Work Order

112.4. Failure to Comply shall be amended as follows: Any person who shall continue any work

after having been served with a stop-work order, except such work as that person is directed to
perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or

both as described in Section 110.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995).

Chapter 2

- Scction 202 General Definitions

- Add definition for Campfire - Skall mean a fire which is used for cooking, personal warmih, lighting,
or aesthetic purposes. This includes fires contained within outdoor fireplaces and enclosed stoves
with flues or chimneys, stoves using jellied, liquid, or solid fuels, poriable barbecue pits, bruziers, or
spuce heating devices which are used outside of any structure, mobile home, or any living

accommoduation mounted on a vehicle.

Ordinance 2019-01 20-0203 M Page 7 of Page 3



. Add definition for District - Shall mean the district and all other areas within the exterior boundaries

thereof now or heregfier established.

- Add definition for Driveway - Shall mean a vehicular access that serves up 1o two (2) parcels with
no more than two (2) residential units and any number of non-commercial or industrial buildings on
each parcel.

Add definition for Executive Body - Shall mean the Board of Directors of the District.
Add defnition for Kire Chief - Shall mean the Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire
department/district serving the jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative.

Add definition for Trained Crowd Manager - Shall mean standby personnel, usually a security

guard or usher personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other

place of public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency.

Chapter 3

- Section 302 Definitions

302.1 Definitions shall be amended as follows: Added Campfire definition, as shown above in
Chapter 2.

- Scction 307 Open Burning, Recreationa) Fires, and Qutdoor Fireplaces

307.4.4 Campfirce Restrictions shall be added as follows:

307.4.4.1 7t is unlawful for any person to light, maintain, or use a campfire upon or near any brush-
covered land, grass-cavered land, or foresi-covered land during the time when burning permits are
suspended by the Direcior of the Depurtment of Forestry and Fire Protection, the CAL FIRE Unit
Chief, or the AHJ.
Exception: Commercial cooking operations with approval of the AHJ.

307.4.4.2 When campfires are allowed, it should be unlawful for any person to light, maintain, or use
a campfire upon any brush-covered land, grass-covered land, or forest-covered land unless the
Jollowing minimum requirements are complied with.

- 307.4.4.2 (a) The areua within 5 feet of the periphery of the campfire is cleared of all flammable
material and vegetation.

- 307.4.4.2 (b) One serviceable shovel with a handle of at least 12 inches is ready for use at the
immediate area of the camplfire.

- 307.4.4.2 (c) Campfires shall be limited to a 1 foot by 1 foot area, unless in an approved manufactured
cooking device or fire ring.

- 307.4.4.2 (d) Written permission of the landowner must be obtained prior to the ignition of the

campfire and shall be on site.

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 4
20-0203 M Page 8 of 36



Chapter §

- Secction 503 Fire Apparatus Access Roads

- 503.2.1 Dimensions shall be amended as follows: Fire apparatus access toads shall have an

unobstructed width of not less than 20 {eet, exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb to
Jace of curb, except for approved security pates in accordance with Section 503.6, and unobstructed
ventical clearance of not less than 15 feer. ANl driveways in the disirict shall not be less than 12 feet
wide.

503.2.5 Dead Ends shall be amended as {ollows: Dead-end tire apparatos access roads and driveways

in excess of 150 feet in length shall be provided with an approved area for luming around fire
apparatus.

503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces shall be amended as follows: Where a bridge or an elevated

surface is part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in
accordance wirh the current El Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge Standard or Appendix
D of the eurrent California Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive. Bridges and elevated surfaces
shall be desigued for a live load sufficient to carry the imnposed loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle Joad
limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when required by the Fire Code Official. Where
clevated surfaces designed oy emergency vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces which are not designed
for such use, approved barriers, approved signs, or both shall be installed and maintained when
required by the fire code official.

503.4.2 No Parking in Fire Lanes shail be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, or leave

standing any vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary to avoid conflict with
other traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized
representative, Peace Officer or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway, ar any
curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking fucility,
designated as a fire lane by the district with jurisdiction over the area in which the place is located.
The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to, and visible from, the
designated place clearly stating in letters not less than one inch in height that the place is a fire lane,
(2} by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color, marking the place with the
words "FIRE LANE”, which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) by a red curb or red paint on
the edge of the roadway wpon which is clearly marked the words "FIRE LANE”.

503.4.3 No Parking in Front of Hydrants shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, or

leave standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle is
attended by a licensed driver who is seated in the from seat and who can immediately move such
vehicle in case of necessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire department and is clearly

marked as a fire department vehicle.

Ordinance 2019-01 20-0203 M Page 9 of Bage 5



503.4.4 Fite Laves Based on Road Widih shall be added as follows: Fire lanes shall be based on

road width as required in Appendix D as amended by the district.

503.5.3 ¥ire Apparalus Access Gates shall be added as follows: Al auromatic and manual gates

installed over fire apparatus access roads shall comply with the district gate standard as approved

by the fire code official.

Section 505 Premisc Identification

505.1 Address ldentification shall have the first line of this paragraph amended as follows:

Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply with the district address standard as approved
by the fire code official.

Section 507 Kire Protection Water Supplies

- 507.5.1 Where Required shall be amended as follows: 400 feet shall be amended to 150 feet.

Scction 509 Fire Protection and Utility Equipment ldentification and Access

509.3 Fire Control Room shall be added as follows: Fire sprinkler risers, fire alarm control panels,

solar photovoltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression or
similar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The fire
control room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a total usable area
of not less than 35 square feet. The room shall be located within the building on an outside wall at a
location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be uccessible from the exterior. An exterior
access door with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height of not less than 80 inches shall
be provided for access into the room. A durable sign shall be affixed to the exterior of the door with
the words "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters not less than 4 inches in height. A key box complying
with Section 506 shall be installed on the exterior side of the fire control room door opening.
The room must be capable of maintaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit. A
clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers to any adjacent walls. This
room can be ua shared with other building utilities or fire protection equipment that is not
incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the fire
sprinkler system and other fire protection equipment. This room shall not be used for any other
storage.

Exception: One-and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes or similar uses defined as either

a Group R-3, R3.1, or R-4 occupancy.

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 6
20-0203 M Page 10 of 36




Uhapter 9

Section 903 Fire Sprinklers

903.2 Where Reguired shall be amended as follows: An spproved aulomiate sprinkler system shol!
be required and instulled in new butldings and sivwuctures 3600 square feet or preater when
constructed or relocated within the purisdiction as described 1n Sections 903.2,1 through 903,212,

Exception: dgricudtural huildings nor under a spectal use permit wsed for commercicl purpose:.
903.2.8 Where Required shall be added as follows: Stanes o existing buildings greater than 3, 6014}
square feer. In exisang buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than oné and two-family dwelling
units, and agricultural buildings nor wnder special use permit for commercial purposes, where the
tloor area of the building ar structure iy increased by an uddition of more than thirty percent (308!
or 1O square feet whichever is less, such building or structure shall be made to conform io Section
903.2.

903.2.00 Where Reguired shull be udded as follows: Sturws of existing tuildings less than 3, 600

vquare feet. In existing buildings 3,600 square feel or less, other than one-amd two-family dwelling
wnity, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, where the
floor area of the building or structure iy increased 10 a total square footage uver 3,600 square fee!,
by an addition of more than thirsy percent (30%) or 1,000 square fees, whichever is less, such building
or structure sholl be made (o conform to Section 3.2,

903.2.1 Group A shall be amended as followy for A groups A-| through A-4: 903.2.1.1 {1) The fire
area exceoeds 3,600 square feel.

903.2.3 Group E shall he amended as follows: %03.2.3 (1) Throughout all Group E fire sreas greater
than 3,600 square feet in area.

- 903.2.4 Group F-1 shall he amended as follows: 903.2.4 Group F. 903.2.4 (1) A Group F firc arts
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

903.2.7 Group M shall be amended as follows: 903.2.7 Group B and M. 802.2.7(1) A Group B and
M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

- 903.2.8.2 Manufactured Homes shall be added an follows: An aucomatic fire sprinkler xystem shall
be required in all new manufactured homes and muiti-family manyfacoured homes intended for use
as a one-and two-family dwelling. The design and installation of such systemy vhall be in accordance
with Californic Code of Regudations, Title 25, §4300.

Exceptions:
i. Manufactured homes located within an existing mobilehome park complying with
California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3.

"~y

Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 sguare feet in size and serve as an

accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Governmeni Code Section 658502; when the

Ordinance 2019-01 ~ 20-0203 M Page 11 of 588°7



existing primary residence on the property is not required to comply with California
Residential Code Section R313.2.
3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size.

- 903.2.9 Group 8-1 shall be amended as follows: 903.2.9 Group S. 903.2.9 (1) A Group S fire area

exceeds 3,600 square feet.

903.2,10 Group S-2 Enclosed Parking Garages shall be amended as follows: 903.2.10 (J) Where

the fire area of the enclosed parking garage exceeds 3,600 square feet.

Section 907 Firc Alarm and Detection Systems

907.2.a Where Required — New Buildings or Structures less than 3,600 square feet shall be added

as follows: An approved fire alarm/detection system shall be installed in all buildings with a floor
area less than 3,600 square feel.
Exceptions:

]. One- and owo-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified
as “U").

2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial
purposes (e.g., retails sales, foud service, and/or special events).

3. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined
by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, based on building
construction material and features, location, occupancy type, and distance to
exposures.

907.2.b Status of Existing Buildings shall be added as follows: In existing buildings without an

approved automatic sprinkler system, other than one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultural
building not under special use permit for commercial purposes where a fire alarm detection system
does not exist and the floor area of the building or structure is increased or modified by more than
thirty percent (30%) or 1,000 square feet, whichever is less, such building or structure shall be made
to conform to Section 907 when required by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative.
Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined by the Fire Chief,
or his/her duly authorized representative, based on building construction materialy and features,
location, occupancy type, and distance to exposures.

907.2.c Monitoring shall be added as follows: A/l fire alarm/detection systems shall be connected

directly through and monitored by a U L. approved central, proprietary or remote station service,
which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly attended location. All sprinklered buildings
shall be monitored.

Exceptions:

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 8
20-0203 M Page 12 of 36



l. One- und two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupanciey clussified

as U

[

Agricultural bdldings not under special use permit andior not used for commercial
purposes fegrn, retaily soles, food service, andior special events).

907.2.d Type 1 Hood Instullations shail be added as follows: The requerement of installation, or

replacement, of ¢t Tyvpe I Hood System shall require a fire alarm/isprinkler monitoring svstem te b
installed, or for the hood system 1o be connected 1o an existing fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring systen:
for that building.

907.6.2.1 Secondary Power Supply shall be added ss follows: /n accordunce with NFP4 72, the

secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power capacity under quiescent load (system
operating in a non-alarm condition) xhall be amended 1o a minimum 72-hour power capacity.
Exception: The exivtence of an emergency buck-up power supply that meets or exceed the

requirements of California Fire Cade Chapter 12.

Chapter 12

Scction 1203 Fmergency and Stapdby Power Systems

1201.1,3 Instaliation shall be amended as follows. Emergency power systems and standby power

systems shall be installed in accordance with the Calitornia Building Code, the Califorma Flectric
Code, NFPA 110 and NFPA 111, Al bldings, other thun one- and two-famih dwelling units, and
agricultural buildings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, thall have a shunt trip
device that disconnects all poseer xources 1o the building, approved by the fire code official. Existing

instaltations shall be marntamned in uccordance with the original appraval

Chapter 33
- Section 3310 Access for Firefighting
3310.3 Premisce Ideptificatiop shall be added as follows:  Prior (v and during consoruction, an

approved addresy sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into

the project

- Sectiom 3312 Water Supply for Fire Protection
3312.1 When Required shall be amended as follows: Prior (o combustible materials arriving on

site, the fire hydrant water system shall be installed und maintained in continuous operation, The

amount of water supplied shall meet the required fire flow for the projeet.

Ordinance 2019-01 20-0203 M Page 13 of §8g¢ ®



Chapter 4Y
Scction 4903 Plans
4903.1 Where Required shall be added as follows: The fire code official of the RFPD may require

development projects located in Moderate, High and Very-High Fire Hazard Severity Zones to subniir
fire protection plan. This plan shall be approved by both the firc code official und the authorized
represemalive for the local CAL FIRE Unit Chief (if located in the State Responsibility Area [SRAJ)
prior to the recording of the final map for the project by the County of £l Dorado.

Scection 4905 Wildfire ’rotection Building Construction

4905.4 Roof Constiruction Requircments shall be added as follows: 44 new construction, including

additions, requires a Class A roof covering or assembly. All re-roofing requires Class A roof covering
or assembly as a minimum. Re-roofing in excess of 50% of an exisiting siructure within any one year
period will necessitate that the entire roof be a Class A roof covering or assembly as a minimum.
Class B or C fire retardeant treated and or non-treated wood shake or shingles are not approved as

a roof covering material for Class A assembly.

Chapter 50
- Secction 5001 Geunceral

- 5001.7 Liability for Damages shall be added as follows: Any damages or cost resulting from the

careless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall constituent debt against any
such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge. This debt is collectible by the Fire
Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, in the same manner as in the case of an obligation

under contract, expressed or implied.

Chapter 56
Scction 5601 General

5601.2 Permit Required shall be amended as follows: Permits shall be required as set forth in
Section 105.6 and regulated in accordance with this section. Where explosives permits are required,
they shall be issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado
County Sheriff°’s Department. Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be issued by the Fire
Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the E{ Dorado County Board of Supervisors.

- 5601.2.1 Documentation shall be added as follows: The AHJ shall have the authority to request

documentation regarding all aspects of the fireworks presentation.

- 5601.2.2 Proprietary Information shall be added as follows: The AHJ will protect all proprietary

information.

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 10
20-0203 M Page 14 of 36



¢ hapta 87

Section §704 Storage

R704.2.9.6.1 1.ocations W here Above-Ground Vanks ar e Prohibited shall Be amended as follows:

Storage of Class Land Class I laminable hauids in above-grownd tinks outside of buildings is prohibited
unless approved by the Five Chief, or his/her dulv authorized representative. When permitted by the
Fire Chief, or lis/her duly authorized representative, all above ground tunk(s) or vault installations
Jor the storage of Class 1, 11 or 1] flammable and combustible liquids shall comply with those
requirements as set forth by the Califorsiia Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall also apply v

installationy other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above-ground storage is required.

Section 5706 Special Opcrations

- 5706.2.4.4 L.ocations Where Above-Ground Tanks arc Prohibited shall be amendcd as follows:

Storage of Class 1 and Class 1] flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is
prohibited unless approved by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative. When
permitted by the Fire Chicf, or histher dulv authorized representative, all above ground tank(s) or
vault installations for the storage of Class 1, Il or 11l flammable and combusiible liquids shall comply
with those requirements as sel forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall also
apply to instaliations other than motor vehicle fucl dispensing stations where above-ground storage

is required.

Chapter 58

- Section 5806 Flammable Cryogenic Fluids
5806.2 Limitations shall be amended as follows: Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary
containers outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the Five Chief, or histher duly
authorized representative. When permitted by the Firc Chicf or his/her duly authorized
representative, all stationary containers for the storage of flammable cryogenic fluids shall comply
with those requirements as sct forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Codce shall also
apply 1o installations other than maotor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above-ground storage

is required.

Chapter 61

Section 6104 Location of LP-Gas Containers
6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits shall be amended as follows: The storage

of liquefied peiroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacity when located at
least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-half

(1/2) mile from existing residential development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit per

Ordinance 2019-01 20-0203 M Page 15 of 5#g€ 11



acre and at least one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved, and a
special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of EI Dorado.

Dispensing within estublished limits. Within the limits established by luw restricting the dispersion of
liguefied petroleum gus for the protection of heavily populated or congested areas, the aggregate
capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The dispensing
of liquefied petrolenm gus in excess of an aggrega!e'of 2,000-gallon water capacity when located

at least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-
hulf (1/2) mile from existing residential development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit
per ucre and at least one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved and

a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado.

- Section 6113 Underground LPG Tanks Installations and Ownership shall be added as follows:

- 6113.1 Permits and Plans shall be added as follows: Permits shall be required, and plany shall be

submitted for all underground tank installations as approved by the AHJ.

- 6113.2 Underground 1.PG Tank Ownership shall be added as follows: Underground LPG tanks
shall be prohibited from being sold to end-users and shall be retained by the LPG company under a

lease-type system to ensure proper annual maintenance requirements are met and recorded.

Chapter 80

Scction 80, NFPA, 13D-16 — Standard for the Installation of Sprinkier Systems in One-and Two

Family Dwellings and Manufactured Howes as amended 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5

NEFPA 13D, Amended Scctions as follows:

- Add Section 4.7 to read as foliows:

Chapter 80. NFPA 13D 4.7 Residential fire sprinkler systems installed in all new one-and two-family
dwellings shall utilize a "Passive Purge” system design unless otherwise approved by the Fire Code
Official.

Exception: Manufactured home installed, tested and approved by the California Department of
Housing and Community Development.

Revise Section 5,1.1.2 to read as follows:

- Chapter 80. NFPA 13D. §.1.1.2 4 supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkler used

within the premises shull be maintained on the property at an approved location. Stock sprinklers shall
be kept in a mounted and accessible cabinet.
- Revise Section 7.6 to rcad as follows:

Chapter 80. NFPA 13D. 7.6 A Jocal water flow alarm shall be provided on all fire sprinkler systems in

humes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling.

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 to read as follows:

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 12
20-0203 M Page 16 of 36




Chapter 80. NFPA 13D 443 1) Wihvwe o e depanimens sumper comnection 15 not provided, the

1

svstems shell be hydromtialiy tested 3t mumimum pressure of 1M piunds per square inch gauge for ne

fess tham o Ithmmure dratieont withuut et ace vt Irokage, Such et shall be wiinessed by the fire code

afficial.

Appendix B - Fire Flow Requircments for Buildingy

Tubie B10S.1

Required Fire klow for One- apd 1wo-fFuwmily PDwellivgs, Group R-3, and R4

Buildingsy and Townbousey shall be nmended as (ollows:

FIRE-FLOW

AUTOMATIC

- MINIMUM

: FLOW
CALCULAFION | SPRINKLER FIRN CDURATION
AREA | SYSTEM FLOW ' (hours)
{square feet) (Destgy {enllane per
Standard) miwuic)
I~ A a0y N AULOTS 000 !
sprioaler aystem :
3,601 aud yrouter f No aulomalic ; Wk b C Dhursfien %
spnnkler esien . Table [ablc
AP CEISD
| i ; the  rogquites
S [ e thew svts
03,600 | Sedtiou 4032005 | |
Dol ke A G | K} 5
EC«-& ar Sasven '
413 of she CA ’
| Rewdenta Code ’
VO and pre s ] Srepon WiiY gl 172 snbee of i
"' of the A Fue Table ;
tCade nr Section H105 (2
DA33 of ke Ca imim, LG
| Besidenial Code GFAM)

Table B19%2 Required Fire flow for Buildings other thap One- and Two-Fawily

Dwellines. Group R-3, apd R4 Buildiags apd Jownhouses shall be rmended s fallows:

| AUTOMATIC

SPRINKLER SYSTEM
(Design Standard)

N sutometic  nprinkler
System - B
Soction YOI AL af the (A
Fire (frn_(&l_c
Sectinn 903312 of the CA
Fire Code

FLOW DURATION
(hoars)

P FLOW

[ (gallons per minute)
Viulue " Usblc
#1051

Duretian 1 Tabic B10S 1{2)

Jsi, 0% of the value in
Table BLHS 121"

Durstion in Tubie BI103.1(2)
21 the reduced flow 1aiz

i

I3, SF'G of the value in
Tgblcf Bils. t(2)

Duvrsvon in Table BIOS Iy
st the reduced flow res

b. The reduced fire flow shnll not be less than 1,500 gpm

Ordinance 2019-01

20-0203 M Page 17 of Bge 13



Anpendix D Fire Apparatus Access Roads

Section D103 Minimum Specifications

D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant shall be amended as follows, adding the exception:
Exception: Driveways

D103.2 Grade shall he amended as follows: Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not

exceed 15.9% in grade unless approved by the 4HJ or by the El Dorado County amended California

Public Resource Code Title 14 / Design and Improvement Standards Manual.

D103.3 Turning Radius shall be amended as follows: The minimum turning radius shall be

determincd by the fire code officral; and shall not include curb and gutier.

D103.5 Firc Apparatus Access Road Gates shall be amended as follows: Subsection (1): Where a

single gate is provided, the gate width shall he not less than 20 feer (6096 mm) Where a fire
apparatus road consists of a divided roadwuay, the gate width shall not be less than 15 feet (4572
mm).

D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 fect in width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as specified in

Section D103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide
(6096 to 8534.4 mm).
D103.6.2 Roads more (han 29 feet in Width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as

specified in Section D103.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29
feet wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm).

1D104.4 Cireumfercntial Fire Apparatus Access Roads shall be added as follows: When required

by the fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompuss the entirety

of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access.

SECTION 4: CONFLICT
That Ordinance No. 2016-01 of the RFPD, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances herewith are hereby

repealed.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or phrase of this code, or
any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such decision
shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code, which can be given effect without the invalid portions and,
therefore, such invalid portions are declared to be severable. The RFPD hereby declares that it would have enacted
this Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, sentences,

clauses or phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid.

Ordinance 2019-0! Page 14
20-0203 M Page 18 of 36



¢

SECTION 6 FEFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

This Undimne = bl e ooy thies (31 davs abzr oo adopuen. The REPD Boant Secrctary o0 directed o
pubhish this onlingwe o resspapet wf generai crculatoa s the Dhstrrcs In bew of publicution of the tull tees
el the bediatioe, o suncind v ot the Srdiistee may Do publishet by the by the Beard Secrewary within hiteen (154
dasd dller ds pavvage ated orsufiob copy diall be pested 1o the thioe G Uthe REPD pursuant th Cuovenme it ¢oid

Nection 643N

The abave Odinnnce woy introduced i g niceting of the Bosird o {hrecton of the RFPD on Octiber 4, 2014,
and o was e eead {or ety e A public heanng was set for the Ondinance ebe read for the second umes

s toavember 130 08 it approved by the Inlliwing vote:
PASSED AND ADOP FED by the Board of Duecters wf the RFPD e 1D das of NGyeebe o 3

AYES. &=
NOUES: €
ANSENT: &
AIISTAIN: ©

Marn Kaht Hoand Presdent

AVTEST

W

Ordinance 20190 20-0203 M Page 19 of ¢ 13



fire Code Amendment

101.4

What Is the Change?
Amend with the name of the jurisdiction

Loca'ly adepted / SFM adopted / Amended

Locally adopled and amended

Why Is Thare a Local Change?
Administrative need

106.6

Add séction

Locally created and adopled

Adopting this section 1o allow for the creabion and issuance
of foes 1o cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines
permits, plan checks, and Inspections as allowed in Health
&Sfety Code 17951,

106.6.1

Add section

anaﬂycreatedanim

Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the costio
{the Fire DistricL )

106.7

Add section

Locally created and adopted

Section 106.7 To recover the actua costs of avoidable
failed inspections by contractors.

1094

Added section 109.4

Locally adopted and amended

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District
is added to read as follows:

109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an
individual or entity to file an appeal bo the Board of Appeals
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire
Code Official. Based on the County of EI Dorado's
Vegetation Managment Ordinance Board of Appeals
timeline,

1104

Completed the section by filing in the blank portions that were
not completed by the SFM. it is betler feft to localities to
determine the fees/penalfies for their respective areas.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that
|protects life and property. Fees have been updated lo match
the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the District
Attomey’s Office. The change to the language to include the
term infractions.

1104.2

Added Section 110.4,2, (This section existed before but under
a different number)

Locally adopled and amended

110.4.2 Citations is added fo read as follows: 110.4.2
Cilations '

The Fire Chief or histher duly authorized rapresentative (s),
may issue citabons for infractions or misdemeanor
violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the
Health and Sately Code of the State of Califomia and
Chapter 5c {commencing with section §53.6) of Title 3 of
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Califomnia.

1124

Completed the section by filling in the blank portions that were
not completed by the SFM. It is better left fo localities lo
determine the fess/penalties for their respective areas.

SFM adopted and amended locally

Al violations of the code have been consiladated under
Section 1104

202

Added definitions for clarity

Locally created and adopted

Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District,
Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shal, and Trained Crowd

Manager. Defintion of campfire shall not include LPG or
Propane fueled appliances.

3021

|Added definition for Campfire lo Section

Locally adopted and amended

Added for clarity

307.4.4 through 307.4.2.2 (d)

Added a sections for campfire restrictions

Locally adopied and amended

Due to the high fire danger that exists in Ef Dorado County
we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires
within grass, brush, and tree covered areas,

503.2.1

Changed vertical clearances 1o 15 feet and road widths to 20
feet

Locally adopted and amended

Flre apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical
|clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus
components. It also allows an extended time frame before
having to recut the growth of the vegetation, Additional
height for vegetation clearances acts as an increased bufler
for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feel exclusive of
shoulders, as measured face of curb o face of curh is
needed. These structures can be difficult fo navigate with
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the total
drivable road surface

" 50325

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the Fire
Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations lo malch as they
require tumarounds for fire apparatus access roads and

[dtiveway&

Locally adopted and amended

Fire apparalus require areas for uming around when
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This
Includes fire vehicles as well as civitian vehicles. Provides
better access for ingressiegress. Additionally, adds tum
around for apparatus in driveways grealer than 150",

20-0203 M Page 20 of 36



503.26

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated Surfaces to
state and match El Dorado County Transportation Division
instead of AASHTO HB-17.

Locally adopted and amended

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated
Suraces of El Dorado County and Appendix O of the
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be
consistent throughoul county agencies and is allowed as an
altemate means & methods that is nol less restrictive than
the Fire Code,

50342

Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes

Locally created and adopled

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes
rules and is consislent with the Califamia Vehicle Code.

$03.43

Added section reganing no parking in fron! of hydrants

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire
hydrants® rules and is consistent with the California Venicle
Code.

503.44

Added section regarding fire lanes based on road widih

Locally created and adopted

This section clearly defines California Fire Code Appendix

D as the reference for road lane width and their reiation to
fire lanes.

503.5.3

Creatid and adopled 503.4.5 o maintain emeigency access
and consistency through alf roadway gates in E1 Dorado
County, refering fo the gate standards adopted by the FPO’s.

Locally created and adopted

Allows fire districts the authority o approve gates on
roadways based on the Districts gats standard, providing
the best possible emergency access o maintain fast
response times. ’

5051

Added section periaining to the visual addressing of buildings

Locally adopted and amended

Aliows Fire districts the authorily ko approve addressing
based on the District's addressing standards.

507.51

Added more conservative standard for the placement of
hydrant and their retationship to commercial buildings

Locafly amended

Commercial properties are required fo install hydrants at
1300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150
feet from arny given hydrant at anytime (haif the distance in
between).

§09.3

Added verbiage to bring all of the necessary fire controls for a
building to one location.

Locally added

Buildings are getting more sizable in the county. i is more

common {o have new buildings with solar arays that
conlinue bo generate power even when the buildings general
tilliies have been shut off. When there is an emergency, it
is vital thal we have rapid access to dl of the conlrols in one
focation for public evacuation and firefighter safety. Dueto
the fire danger present in £l Dorado County throughout
mast of the year, this changs s appropriate and advisable.

8032

Adds a requirement for sprinkier system installation in new
buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or greatorwithin the
district.

Locally amended

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors ¥ our
increased response limes, aiong with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require Sprinklers
to be installed In structures once they rsach 3,600 square
feel in size as they relate o fire behavior and rate of spread.

903.2a

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater than 3,600
square feel o install sprinkiers if they add more than 30% or
1,000 square feet b the structure, whichever is less.

Locally created and adopted

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors 1o our
increased responss times, along with the fact that fires
double In size each and every minute, we require spriniers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as thay relate o fire behavior and rate of spread.

Adds occupant protection for existing buildings less than
3,500 square feet to Instali sprinklers if they add more than
130% or 1,000 square feet to the structure, whichever is less.

Locally created and adopied

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of £l Dorado County and thelr contributing factors o our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be Instalied in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate o fire behavior and rate of spread.

These sections wens created to give spacific diraction on the

903.2.1,903.2.3,903.24,903.2.7 |sprinkler requirsments based on occupancy and square

footage

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of £l Dorado County and thelr contributing factors o our

Increased response fimes, along with the fact that fires
double in size sach and every minute, we require sprinklers
10 be installed In structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate 1o fire behavior and rate of spread.

20-0203 M Page 21 of 36




This section was created to include manufactured residential

Manutaciured Homes — The intent of this code section Is 1o
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one of (wo-
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found In
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dweilings of a similar
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wikiland-urban
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption

03282 |single famiy R-3in the residentia sprinkler progtam Localy created and adopted due o the light-weight natwre of their construction, The
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a
significant risk b their occupants. Residential sprinkler
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk
|sucesstully in many Catforia communilies.

Due 10 the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
Thissectons vere ratd o s ot crcton n e - cesodmoins ine s wh b o bt e
903.2.9,903,2.10 mer requirements based on occupancy and square Locally adopted and amended double in size each and avery minule, we fequire sprinklers
o be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they refate to fire behavior and rate of spread.
| fire alarms i i ) "
wraa [ AR |y oottt e et s s 1
“ for commerclal purposes, and buildings with a fioor area of Y op o v':]mdaﬁm ke re
fess than 500 square foel as approved by the fire code official. ® OF Smate-
aubomatic smugmzmw;ﬁ';mm Provides proper emergency notffcatin for cocupancies thal
907.2b Locatty created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
more than 30% or 1,000 square feel to the structure, the eventof a fre
Jwhichever Is less. afire or smoke.
’ sm&%ﬁmlmgmwzgmxmw Provides proper emefgency nofficaton for cccupancies thal
907.2¢ y . Locally created and adopied alow public use and ensures Fire Department nofification in
that notifies the fire department upon activation and is he event ol a fire
Installed per Section 907 of the fire code. eventof afire or smoke.
| Added occupant protection for Type 1 Hood systems to be {Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
907.2d connected to a monitored fire alarm system when instatied or Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
. replaced. the event of a fire or smoke.
. W Amend to 72 hour capacily for back-up power due lo PG&E
907.6.2.1 Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply Modification Locally created and adopled sately related outages,
This section adds a Shunt Trip pawer shut off devices to
1203.4.3 Shunt trip power safely devices SFM adopted and amended locally ensure emergency power shut off duing the use of back-up
power supplies
N L Addressing for construction sites is Important to assist
3103 Addrass requirements for construction sites Localty created and adoptad f
requ Y adop responding emergency crews.
Water supplies at construcfion sites with combustible ; fod Water must be on site prior bo combustible material being
24 materials on-site SFM and locally stored or vertical construction commencing.
El Dorado County has a siginifcant fire danger throughout
This section was crealed to include Fire Proctection Plan for the county. All projects wil be required to submit a Fire
49034 al fire hazard severty zones. Locally created and adopad Protection Plan due fo cimatic, geokgicd, and
topographical
This section clarifies that within the boundaries of EI Dorado
County, fire jurisdictions will require that alf roofs are
49054 Added a section to clarify roof construction requirements Locally Created and adopled wildiand fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof
|covering or assembiy. Wooden shake roofs are not to be
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly.
|Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate.
Any damages or costs from negligent practices that cause a If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business
so017 hazardous materials incident will cause a cost recovery fee. Locally crealed and adopted process of practice the actual cost will be passed on fo the
negligent parties.
Added safety protection with permits being Issued by both the Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and
5601.2 Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for explosives, and by the SFM adopled and amended locally fireworks o approve them and have a clear understanding

Fire Chief and the Board of Supervisors for fireworks.

of the applications they will be used for.

20-0203 M Page 22 of 36



5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2

Fireworks companies or vendors shall make avaitable ail

quested documentation periaining Lo the firework
presentation

Locally crealed and adopled

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any
documentation including timing and proprietary information
that pertains ko any aspect of a fireworks display that they
deem necessary. This information is understood to be
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as
such.

5704.296.1

Established Bmits as set forth in the Fire Code

SFMadopudaﬁmuedbcaty

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class If combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks, Raquires AHJ approval and a
Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County.

5§706.24.4

Established imits as set forth in the Fire Code

SFM adopted and amended locally

Established limits as requived by the Fire Code for Class |
flammable and Class [l combustible liquid special
loperations In above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval
and a SpeciallConditional Use Permitfrom the County.

5806.2

Administrative addition of District name

Locally adopted and amended

Administrative need to add District name

5806.2.1

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code

SFM adopted and amended locally

Established limis as required by the Fire Code Official for
Flammable Cryogenic flids in stationary contalners.
Requires AHJ approval and a SpecialConditonat Use
Permit from the County.

6104.2

Established limits for LPG storage and dispensing near or
adjacent to residential development

SFM adopted and amended locally

Establishes distances between LPG storage and
dispensaries thet ane directly related fo safety for residental
developments and high-density hotels, motet, apartments,
elc. where a release by Jeak or explosion of LP-Gas wouild
have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death.
Requires AHJ approval and a SpecialConditional Ut

Permit from the County. .

61131

Penmits and plans shail be submitted and approved by the
AH (Authority Having Jurisdiction).

Locally created and adopted

Permilting and Plan submitial requirements for underground
tanks:

Allows us o require plans be submitied for review prior o
installions of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks
require substantial maintenance including inspection and
anode replacement al regular irtervas.

6113.2

{Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the property of

the LPG company

Locatly created and adopted

JUnderground tanks corrode easily and can leak without

detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when
'sokd to the end user. This does not apply o above ground
lanks where comosion and leaks are more easily detected,

Chapter 80, NFPA,13D-16
Sections 4.7,5.1.1.2, 7.6,
and 11.2.1.1

NFPA 130-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the District
has been amended to update various provisions periaining to
the installation of sprinkler systems in one-and two-family
dweilings.

Locally amended

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench
on-site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local waler
flow alarm to create an audible alert for the flow of water in
the event of water activation in a vacant stucture, and
lhydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 13D
sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of waler
damage from pipe failure, and the addition of a passive-
purge sysiem.

Appendix B: Table B105.1(1)

We changed 500 GPM f 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot
elevation, to maich fire flow precedents used in EDC for years

SFM adopted and amended locally

| Allows us to match what developers and residents are used
0 in regards 1o GPM fire flow requirernents that have been
used for over a decade in EDC.

Appendix B: Table B105.2

We made a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM, below 5000
foot elevation, for all commercial projects

SFM adopted and amended locally

Allows us to maich what developers and residents are used
to In regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been
used for over a decade In EDC,

. Appendix D; D103.1

Made an exception for residential driveways

Localy adopled and amended

Itis unreasonabie to require a residential driveway to
construct & 26 foot wide space for access o a hydrant.

Appendix D: D103.2

Stata law requires no greater than 16% grade

Locally adopted and amended

Title 14 requires for us to only accept up o 16% driveways.
In our El Dorado County Title 14 adoption we allow greater
than 16% grade with AHJ approval and hard surface.

Appendix D: D103.3

Text 10 Include curbs and gutters

Localty adopted and amended

20 foot road widths shail not include curbs and gutters due
lb polential access issues and luming radius concerns.

Appendix D: D1035§ 1

Fire apparatus access foad gates

Locally adopled and amended

roadway the gate width shall not be less than 15 feet due to

Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided
radius issues.

20-0203 M Page 23 of 36




No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does

Jsafety inspections . . .

Appendix D: D103.6.1 Roads widths 20 to 29 feet Locally adopled and amended ot apply, This section is adopted as i stands in the Fire
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1for all other elevations.
Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet o 36 feet
) allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of
Appendix D: D103.6.2 Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36 feet in width locally adopled and amended elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The
' {section is adopted as il stands in the Fire Code Appendix D
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations.
When required by the fire code offica, a fire apparatus
ix D e Gi ; access road shall be constructed b encompass the entire
Appendix D; D104.4 Added to require circumferential fire apparatus access roads Locally created and adopled structure and shall provide a cortinuous means of
‘emergency vehicle access.
. , For the safety of the commimities we live in, two ways of
Appendix D: D106.1 m"?'s'””“mmmm"“““w”wmm Locally adopted and amended ingressiegress are required to ensu the saety of the
) residents and first responders.
For the safaly of the communities we live In, two ways of
Appendix D: D107.1 opted D107.2 Ramoteness in this section. Locally adopled and amended ingresslegress ane required fo ensure the safety of the
residents and first responders.
Adopted with no Amendments
101.2 through 101.5 Adopted fo establish scope, intent, severability and validity Locally adoptad Administrative Clarity
102.6 through 102.8 References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopled Administrative clarity
102.10 through 102.12 Confiicting provisions, Other Laws, Appfication of references Locally Adopled Administrative clarity
103.1 through 103.4.1 Definition of the Fire Prevention Division Locally Adopled Administrative clarity
104.1 : [Ability to enforce the code Locally Adopied Administrative clarity
104.3 through 104.4 Right of Entry, Warrants, and Identification Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.6 through 104.6.4 |Record retention Locally Adopted |Adminisirative clarity
104.8 through 104.9.2 Modifications, alemnate means and methads, and test Locally Adopled |Administrative clarity
104.11 twough 104.11.2 Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of systems Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.11.3 tAuthority of systems and devices inoperable Locally Adopted |Adminisirative Clarity
105.2.3 Time limilation of application Locally Adopled Administrative clarity
105.3.1 through 105.3.2 Operational permits Locaily Adopted IAdministrative clarity
Dry cleaning operational permits required for hazardous \
105.6.12 cieaning solvent use Locally Adopted | Administrative clarity
Permits for various business operations for: Magnesium,
. . , . ) miscellaneous combustible storage, mobiie food
1056228 hrough 105635 [ Mimﬁmm'““““‘“m“""“m“”’ Localy Adopted preparation vehicles, molorfueldispensing facies, open
ty buming, open flames and torches, open flames and
candles, and organic coatings
this saction for administrative clanity and fire and ke ‘
105.6.37 Local ted Penmits for of
05.6.3 ety | y Adop! places of assembly
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and fife "
105639 ety Inspectons Locally Adopted Permits for private fire hydrants
| Permits for pyroxylline plastics, refrigeration equipment,
|Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life repair garages and motor fuel-dispensing faciliies, roeftop
105,641 through 105.6.46 Jsde(y inspections Locally Adopted heliports, spraying or dipping, storage of scrap tires and
lire by-products
[Adogted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life ' L
105.6.48 satety | ' ‘ Locally Adopted Permit for tire-rebuilding plants
105650 |Adopted this ssction for administrative clarity and fire and fife Locall Adopled Permit for wood products storage (chips, hogged material,
' sefely inspections lumber or plywood, in excess of 200 cublic feet)
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and iife tod Fee schedules for .
106.1 through 106.3 ; 3 Locally Adop ¢ s for permils
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and e e
107.1 safety Inspectons Localfy Adop Inpection authority
Mantenance of safeguards, testing and operation of
s . ) lequipment, re-inspection and tasting, recordkeeping,
108.1 through 109.3 s secton for admiristrative clrty and fre and ife Localty Adoped supervision, rendering equipment koperable, overcrowding,
salely lnspections Board of Appeals established, limitations on authority, and
110,32 trough 11034 JAdopted this section for administrative clarily and fire and life - Locall Adopted Canpllameuﬁhordefsandmﬂbes,pmsecumot

violations, and unauthorized tampering

20-0203 M Page 24 of 36



1104.1

| Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life
safely inspections

Locally Adopted

Abatement of violation

131

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and iife
safely inspections

Locally Adopted

Authority to disconnect service utiites

303.1 through 303.9

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Asphalt kettles contain highly lammable substances and
require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geoiogical, and
Iopographical)

305.1 throuogh 305.5

|Adopted this section for fire and ife safety

Locally Adoptad

]Ma\ag'ng lgrition sources through responsible application
of standards will reduce the number of fires in various

. (settings (CHimatic, geological, and topographical)

306.1 through 306.2.

{Adopted this section for fire and lfé safety . -

Locally Adopted

Motion picture projection rooms and fim are HIGHLY
fammable and require special handiing (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

307.1through 307.5 .

Adopted this section for fire and life safely

Locally Adophed

Open burning, recreational fire, and portable oukdoor
fireplaces, (Climatic, geologica!, and topographical)

308.1

Adopted this section for fire and life safely

Locally Adopted

Open flame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and
fopographical)

308.1.2 through 308.1.3

Adopted this section for fire and ife safety

Locady Adopted

Throwing or placing of ignifion sources, forches for
removing paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

308.1.5 through 308.1.8 {excluding
308.1.4)

Adopted this section for fire and life safely

Locally Adopted

Locations niear combustible, open lame devices, signals
and markers, portable fuel open-flame devices, sky-
lantems, refiglous ceremonies, aisies and exits, flaming
food and beverage preparation, dispensing, containers not
In use, serving of fiaming food, location, fire protection
{Climate, geological, and topographical)

| Adopted this secBion for fire and lfe safely

Locally Adopted

Pesmits are required for above secton (Climatic, geological,
and topographica)

308.3 through 308.4.1

Adopted this section for fire and Ffe safety

Locally Adopted

Group A occupancies open-fiame decorative devices,
theatrical performances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2
dormatories (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

310.1

Adopted this section for fire and iife safety

Locally Adopted

General requirements relating to smoking (Climatic,
geological, and lopographica)

310.3

Adopted this section for fire and life safely

Locakly Adopted

"No Smoking" signs (Climetic, geclogical, and
fopographical)

310.4 through 310.8

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Removal of signs prohibited, comphance with "No Smoking™
signs, ash trays, buming objects, hazardoous environmental
conditons. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

311,1 through 311.4

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopled

Vacant premises condition and safety requirements,
Abandoned premises, tenant spaces, safegaurding vacant
premises, security, fire protection, fire seperation, removal
of combustibles, removal of hazardous matesials. (Climatic,
geological, and topographical)

319.1

adopted this section for fire and life satety

Locally Adopted

General requirements relating fo mobile food preparation
vehicles. (Ciimatic, geological, and topographical)

319.2

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life

safety inspections

Locally Adopted

Permits for mobile food preperafion vehicles (Climatic,
geoiogical, and fopographical)

20-0203 M Page 25 of 36




[Adopted this section for fre and ife safety.

Exhaus! hood, fire protection, fire protection for cooking
equpiment, fire extinguisher, appilance connection to fuel
'supply piping, cooking ol storage containers, metalic

storage tanks, nonmetallic storage tanks, cooking ol

storage system components, design criteria, tank venting,
romal vents, emergency vents, LP-gas systems, maximum
mregahvolume protaction of container, LP-gas container

319.3 through 319.10.3 Locally Adopted construction, protection of system pping, LP-gas alams,
o CNG syshems CNG containers supplying only cooking fued,
maximun aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG
contzinér constiuction, CNG containers supplying
transporation and cooking fue, protection of system piping,
methane alarms, mairtenance, exhuast system, fire
protecion systermns and devices and fusl gas systems.
(Climatic, geclogical, arki topographical)
“ Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1
403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 Adopled this section for fire and fife safety Locally Adopted (residential care faciliies and group homes) evacuation and
fire safety plans.
Group R-1 {Boarding house, hots!, molel) occupancied
403.10 $vough 403.10.1.3 | Adopted this section for fire and ffe safety Locally Adopted Evacuations, diagrams, emergency duties, {Climatic,
gevlogical, and lopographica)
j Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic,
405.5 |Adopted this section for fira and e safety Localy Adopled L ica, and topographical)
5103 | Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life ty Adopled A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems
i safety Inspections (Chimatic, geclogical, and topographical)
Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and iife maximunm amount of flammable wall covenings in
807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 saely nspect Locally Adopted educational facites (Chmalic, geoogicd, and
. topographical)
An automatic sprinkler system Is required In Group A-5
903215 JAdopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life Local (sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers)
s safety Inspections y Adopied (Chmatc, geological, and topographical) gresler than 1000
square feet. (Cliimatic, geological, and topographical)
Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings.
All buildings wilt be required 1o allow emergency responders
o receive and transmit emergency radio baffic to and from
each other and the emergency dispaich canter. Time
frames can be developed o come inlo compliance and the
11032 Adopted this section for the safety of firefighters and other Locally Adopled phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by
’ emergency responders. the fire code officlal, is acceplable. The rationde behind
this section Is that on aimost all emergency responder injury
or fatality incidents communication is a key Issue. This
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have
strong signal. (Cliimatic, geological, and topographical)
Appendix D: D101.1 through [Adopted this section for the safely of the public, firefighters, Local General requirements for fire apparatus access roads
D102.1 and other emergency responders. y Adopted Including loads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
) ) Dead end fire apparatus access foad requirements for a
|Appendix D: D1034 mﬁsm““ sty of the public, refighters. Localy Adopted um around at 150 feet. (Climaiic geological, and
emergency responders.
: fopographical)
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, firefighters, "No Parking, Fire Lane* signs requirements. (Climatic,
Appendix 0: D1036. e oot Omergenty 1oSporders, Locally Adopted geclogica, and topographical)
Appendix D; D104.1 through Adopted this section for the safety of the public, firefighters, Locally Adopled Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus
D104.3 (excluding exception) and other emergency responders. access roads. (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Appendix D: D105.1 through | Adopted this section for the safely of the public, firefighters, Localy Requirements for arial fire apparatus access roads
D105.4 and other emergency responders, Adopied (Climatic, geological, and topographica)
Appendix D: D106.1 through Adopted this section for the salety of the pubic, firefighters, Locall Hmappaahsaocessmad.sbrmﬂﬁple-fanﬂymsw
D106.3 (excluding exceptions) mdoﬂwremerwnyresporﬂers, y Adopled developments (Oﬂmaoc geologlcal, and topographical)
I . ) One- or two-dwelling residenital developments shail be
Appendix D: D107.1 fwough Mophedﬁssecﬂmbrhsdelydinptﬂm,ﬁreﬂqh&s.' locdl AdOPN g equippéd troughout with two sperate and approved fire
D107.2 (exciuding exception) and other emergency responders. ) y . apparatus acoess roads due io lopographic, geographic and

climatic conditions.

20-0203 M Page 26 of 36



Appendix D D108

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, firefighters,
and other emergency responders.

Locally Adopted

reference standards dealing with gate construcion
standards (Climatic, geclogical, and lopographical)

Grey cells are previously
amended, adopted, or
changed code sections that
are being adopted again in
|this code cycle.

White cells are newly
amended, adopted, or
changed code sections that
differ from previous code
adoplions.

20-0203 M Page 27 of 36




* ’

Marshall Cox

From: Stephanie Layton <slayton@rescuefiredepartment.org>

Sent Monday, October 28, 2019 10:13 AM

To: Marshall Cox

Subject: fwd: Confirmation of Scheduled Publication: Notice of Public Hearing - Notice of intent to Adopt
2019 fire Code

——-— Forwarded message
From: Legals <jegals@ midemocrat.net>

Date: Fri, Oct 25, 2019 at 11:44 AM

Subject: Confirmation of Scheduled Publication; Notice of Public Hearing - Notice of intent to Adopt 2019 Fire Code
To: Stephanie Layton <slayton@rescueficedepartment.org>

Confirmation of Scheduled Publication: Notice of Public Hearing - Notice of Intent to Adopt
2019 Fire Code

SrsbityNewspaper:  Mountain Democrat
“rPub date(s): ki10/30/19, 11/1/19

Ref ad#: sH#7077

Charges: $ skoichists75.00

Thank you for publishing in our newspaper,

Allison Rains ~ Public Notices:t:

Mountain Democrat ~ Georgetown Gazette Newspapers
legals@mtdemocral.net ~ legals@gtgazette.com 'sis
(530)344-5086 ~ fax (530)344-5092

On Oct 24, 2019, at 8:28 AM, Stephanie Layton <slayton@rescuefiredepariment.org> wrote:

Good morning!
Please publish the attached notice in the Mountain Democrat the two earliest dates possible?
Thank you,

Stephanie
<PUBLIC NOTICE OF INTENT 2019.pdf>

20-0203 M Page 28 of 36



Attachment No. 2

RFPD Resolution No. 2019-08

20-0203 M Page 29 of 36



RESCUE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

RESOLUTION 2019-08

Resolution of the Board of Directors Adopting Findings Supporting Amendments to
the Fire Code

WHEREAS, the Rescue Fire Protection District Board (Fire Department)
intends to adopt an ordinance adopting the California Fire Code, 2019 Edition, and
prescribing regulations governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the
environment from fire, explosion, hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological and topographical
conditions existing within the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the
District to impose more stringent requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code
pursuant to California Health and Safety Code sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the District
desires to make express findings to that effect.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Rescue Fire Protection
District (Fire Department) hereby adopts the following findings conceming current unique
local conditions that together make each modification to the California Fire Code, 2019
Edition, reasonably necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life, property
and the environment.

CLIMATE

1. Precipitation. Average annual precipitation ranges from approximately 25 to 32
inches per year. Approximately 88% of the average rainfall occurs during the
months of November through April and 12% from May through October. This
area has experienced major droughts in the last two decades: 1986 -1991, 1998 —
2003, 2007 - 2009, and 2011 - 2015. It is possible that more droughts will occur

in the future based on the weather cycle pattern.

20-0203 M Page 30 of 36



2. Relative Humidity. During the summer months (May through September), the
daily humidity generally ranges around 20% and occasionally drops to the low
teens.

3. Temperatures. During the summer months (May through September), the daily
temperatures commonly exceed 90 degrees Fahrenheit, with temperatures
having been recorded as high as 115 degrees.

4. Winds. The summer prevailing winds are out of the south and southwest.
However, north winds occur during the spring (April and May), the fall
(September and October), and occasionally during the summer months (June,
July and August). Velocities are generally in the range of five to fifteen miles
per hour, gusting to 30 miles per hour during the summer months.

SUMMARY

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity and size of fire in

the community. Times of little or no rainfall and high temperatures create extremely

hazardous conditions, particularly as they relate to residential roof fires and wildfire
conflagrations. The climatic conditions are one of the greatest impacts to fire

behavior and other major emergency events due to their uncontrollable nature,

GEOGRAPHIC AND TOPOGRAPHIC

1. Geographic Location. Rescue is located in the foothills of the Sierra at an
altitude of approximately 1,214 feet above sea level.
2. Size and Population, The Rescue Fire Protection District (Fire Department)

encompasses approximately thirty-three (33) square miles and has a current

20-0203 M Page 31 of 36



population of approximately 2,500-3,000 residents with a projected population
increase, due to new residential development.

. Seismic Location. The nearest identified fault zone running through the District
is the Bear Mountain Fault. This fault zone is split into several branches which
transect the area between Folsom and Shingle Springs. The closest branch
passes through the middle of our neighboring fire district, El Dorado Hills, along
the westem edge of Browns Ravine. The next nearest extension of this fault
system is located immediately at the north end of the District, and extends from
the southeast arm of Folsom Lake, north to the City of Auburn. No recent
geologic activity has been observed along this fault. However, studies of the
east branch of the fault zone, conducted by Woodward-Clyde Associates for the
Auburn Dam, and by Tierra Engineering Consultants near Folsom Lake, indicate
that the fault may be reactivating based on recent tectonic trends and should be
considered potentially active.

. Topography. The topography of the District varies from level to terrain with
over a 40% slope. The greatest degree of slope occurs throughout the District.
Hilly terrain throughout the area provides gullies or areas referred to as
“chimneys” which accelerate the spread of fire.

. Roads and Streets. The District has narrow roads and driveways, which do not
always connect, decreasing the ability for traffic to circulate. With an increase
of vehicular traffic from neighboring areas development and tourism, it causes
congestion which can have a direct effect on the response time of emergency

apparatus.

20-0203 M Page 32 of 36



SUMMARY

The above geographic and topological conditions increase the magnitude, exposure,
accessibility problems and fire hazards that the Department must handle, Fire
following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life and damage
to property than the earthquake itself.

Other variables may tend to increase the situation:

1. The damage that may occur to the water system, and;
2, The extent of isolation due to roadway damage, overpass collapse and debris
blocking the roadway.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of the Rescue Fire Protection District this
/ 0/ 9 / /9 2019 by the following vote:

AYES: §
NOQES: &

ABSENT: ©

Matt Koht, President

e

Steplidnie Layto(t)ioard Secretary

ATTEST:

20-0203 M Page 33 of 36



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted | Adopted as Amended Finding
101.1 X Admin
106.6 X Admin
106.6.1 X Admin
106.7 X Admin
109.4 X Admin
110.4 X Admin
110.4.2 X Admin
1124 X Admin
202 X Admin
302.1 X Admin
307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
- 503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
509.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
33103 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5001.7 X Admin
5601.2 X Admin
5601.2.1 X Admin
5601.2.2 X Admin
5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 M Page 34 of 36




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted | Adopted as Amended Finding

6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

6113.1 X Admin
6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 4.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 11.2.1.1) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix B: Table B105.1(1) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix B: Table B105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D104 .4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

101.2 through 101.5

Admin

X
102.6 through 102.8 X Admin
102.10 through 102.12 X Admin
103.1 through 104.1 X Admin
104.3 through 104.4 X Admin
104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin
104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin
104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin
104.11.3 X Admin
105.2.3 X Admin
105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin
105.6.12 X Admin
105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin
105.6.37 X Admin
105.6.39 X Admin
105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin
105.6.48 X Admin
105.6.50 X Admin
106.1 through 106.3 X Admin
107.1 X Admin
108.1 through 109.3 X Admin
110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin
110.4.1 X Admin
113.1 X Admin

20-0203 M Page 35 of 36




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted | Adopted as Amended Finding
303.1 through 303.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
305.1 through 305.5 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
306.1 through 306.2 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
307.1 through 307.5 CIimatic/GeoIoEcalﬁ opographical
308.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.2 through 308.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.2 Admin
308.3 through 308.4.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.4 through 310.8 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
311.1 through 3114 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
319.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical

319.2 Admin

319.3 through 319.10.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.10 through 403.10.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

405.5 Admin
510.3 Admin
807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1.5 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1103.2 Topographical
Appendix %III:)IZOi.l through Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103 4

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.6

XI>xF X O IXIXIXIX I XXX XX XXX XX X[X]|>X]|X]|XxX

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.1 through

X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
0104.3 (excluding exception) gical/Topograp
dix D: D105.1 th h
Appendix 10 roug X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D105.4
Appendix D: D106.1 through L . .
X Ci Geol | |
D106.3 (excluding exception) imatic/Geological/ Topographica
Appendix D: D107.1 (excludin s . .
ppend exceptions§ 'ne X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 M Page 36 of 36




