
RESOLUTION NO. 045-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 012-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is 
updated by the State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines 
are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions;and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health, and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, 
Chapter 1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety 
regulations to the local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building 
official, or his or her authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his 
or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the 
chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and 
maintain a memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining 
to the inspection of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on November 13, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Rescue Fire Protection 
District, adopted Ordinance No. 2019-01 which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with 
amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or 
topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Supervisors of the County of El 
Dorado ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Rescue Fire Protection District and delegates the 
enforcement of the ordinance to the Rescue Fire Protection District Chief. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following 
sections: 

101.1, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1,307.4.4, 307.4.4.1, 
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1. 
507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 
903.2.10, 907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 
5601.2, 5601.2.1, 5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 
NFPA 13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 4.7, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 
5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, 
Appendix Table BIOS.I (1), Appendix Table BI05.2, Appendix DI03.l through D103.3, Appendix 
DI03.5 Section 1, Appendix 103.6.1, Appendix DI03.6.2, and Appendix D104.4. 

20-0203 M Page 1 of 36 



Resolution No. 045-2020 
Page 2 of 2 

The Rescue Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in 
its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 
2018 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

105.6.17-105.6.19, 105 .6.39, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4,403.3, 
403.4, 403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403 .8.1-403 .8.1.7), 403 .9, 403.10.2, 403 .10.3, 403 .11, 
403.12, 404.1-404.4, 405 .1-405.4, 405 .6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5 .2), 808, 904.1.1, 
1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, 
Chapter 26, the exceptions under D 104.2 (Exception), D 106.1 (Exception), D 107 .1 (Exception), 
Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, 
AppendixM. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 
California Fire Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said 
Board, held the _!_Q_ day of March , 2020, by the following vote of said Board: 

Attest: 

20-0203 M Page 2 of 36 



Rescue Fire Department 
5221 Deer Valley Rd.• Rescue, CA 95672 • Phone (530) 677-1868 • Fax (530) 677-9609 

Maurice Johnson 
Fire Chief 

December 18, 2019 

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer 
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors 
330 Fair Lane 
Placerville, CA 95667 

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Rescue Fire 
Protection District, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code with 
amendments related to local climatic, geographic and topographic 
conditions. 

Dear Mr. Ashton: 

The Rescue Fire Protection District (RFPD) is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS) 
ratify its Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code as amended 
due to specific local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. California Health 
and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of the city or county where 
the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance. The BOS must 
also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District (or its representative) 
or the Chief Building Official. 

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2019-0 I with 
amendments to the 2019 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that 
Ordinance to the RFPD Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for your review and 
use on this topic. 

This resolution has no direct fi cal impact to the County. 

ATTACHMENTS: 

I . RFPD Ordinance No. 2019-01 
2. RFPD Resolution No. 2019-08 
3. Draft El Dorado County BOS Resolution 

"Servino tfie Commur1ities of<Ef <Dorarfo Jfiffs, 'R.fscuc anrf £atro6e" 

20-0203 M Page 3 of 36 



, 

Attachment No. 1 

RFPD Ordinance No. 2019-01 

20-0203 M Page 4 of 36 



l{Ji:SC ti E Fl« E P PH >'f'l,J ·'f Jf > 1' Ill ST~J C1 

ORlHNAI\Ct( NO. 1019-01 

------------ -------- .-. 

F~: rT ,:-,;~.OAP..;1:::.u r,y Jiff fHlM~D Of DIRI:CTORS l)F n11-: HI-.SC( rF FIRE 

PRCffE(TJON DISTRICT .\S F()LLO\VS 

1\11 c,rdimmcc of the Rt:1>cu1:: hrc: P1f\1(1:1i1111 lb .. 1m·t (F_Fl'D i adapting 1hr. ~!11 r) hlit 1. ,tJ ,:,( the G1i1.',1rnia h'r-,· 

(rid1:, r111:rnp11rat1111! the 2018 f-(.fitic,n iA ttw lntum11umw' Fin· Cudt'., regula1ir1g .tn<l •:•n<-rrnn~ IJ11: ',.jfcg-,Jarding •)i 

I 1 k ,ind prop,:rty from fire aud cx.pk1~i1 'll h11n,nb 1inrn1g fr0t11 f he st0Tuge, h.andlmi;: and mr , ,I h,mlf\J,.u.s ~ubsten.xs 

1,,:1h.:ri.ih. ,md Jc.vici.:,, and frn:n r;nndit1nn!, lm:ll1Idc,m tn life or prnpcrty in the r>t'cupa,w, 1,( b11ildings_ d!id pn-mise~ 

11, 1 h1· ~ ff'{); providing torr he 1 ~,;win•:c, of pnmit~ and collection of fo~ therefor; lkpu1l1ng f>nJinance No. 2.(1 I 6.(1 i 

d the kFPD and alJ other orc!i:ianc~ t. an,! t11trt5 ,:_,i the ,1rdinanccs in conflict therewith, 

lk n ORDAINED ))} the U.:•.ml or DJ.rcicr<,~ ,.; the RFPO 

St,:ti(l1i I: flNDlNGS 01• FACTS 

5c(:ll011 .!:ADOPTION ot· ('ODE; WITH F.XCUJSIONS 

SetWJn Y LOCAL AME~Ui\U-:Nr\ 

Section 4: CONFJJCf 

~cctinn 5: SEVRRABIUTY 

&,.:tion 6: Rff"ECTTVE llATt: A~U PlHlLICATJON 

SECTION l: FINDll"a(jS OF "'ACTS 

The R FPL> m11li:c.\ ,:r.11.1io 1.:hlUlgi:::s Oi.!>1ed ~low) to the Cm'1/urni,, Prn· ('ode, :!019 Edit.ion. pursuant lo 

Heu/th & ~fi:o· Cvd~ Sft·rim1·, / l.11'M 'i'. !7958.7 and /~9-11 .5 dunng this rnJc adopti;;1n prnt'e%. Sud1 c,hnngl'.'!1 

are necessary bec.au!IC of locnl clim11ik. iOOlogkal and.IN topogn,pru~l conditions. The RFPD h.oi. adopted, 

pursullllt to s~·c1ior, I 89·/J .' t'1 lhc , .. 11/ifc,miu lieaw, & Sa.fee·" C,-.dc, rh~ fi11ding! of la(t~ rdllt!Vc 11, thc~c­

c;onditions by Rtlr,nl11t1or1 H.'0!9-0S of 1hc, RFPD da1e-J Odohcr 9 .• Wlfi 

SECTION 2: ADOPTION o•· CODE WJTB [XCLl'SIONS 
The Rf PD 1ul11pt11 1111.: 1019 Ca/~(ornia Firt' Codt', 'f'itl,· N, A,,, 9, ip it1 e:atiret)', including ApptJ,1\h{",e,r, 

incorponiting lh<* &ectiom of the International Fir(' CoJ"', 2018 odition not adopted by the sllilc, with the 

c~ciusioos li'ileJ below: 

6xclusions 105.ti. !1- l 0S.6J 9, !OS.6..39, 308 I .4. 109, 3 l U, :J 11.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2, I -403.2.4, 40].l, 

403.il,4(J3.6. 4o3.7, 40H! (rufopting 403.S .. l-403 !U.7). 403.9, 44.13.10-2. 403. 10.3, 4031 J, 403,1'2, 404.1-404.4, 

OrdinMCC 2019 .. 01 20-0203 M Page 5 of ~c 1 



405'. l-40'.'i.4, 405.6-405.9, 406. 805-807 (adopting 807.52), 808, 904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, l l 03.3-1103.6, 1103.9 
I 

(adopting 1103.9.l), IJOJ.lO, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under Dl04.2 (Exception), 

DI06.1 (Exception), D107.l (Exception), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, 

Appendix K, Appendix. L, Appendix M. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 California Fire 

Cod1:. 

SECTION 3: LOCAL AMEND'.\tENTS 

The following Sections are hereby amended or added: 

Chapter 1 

Section 101 Scopc.' and General Uequirements 

101.1 Title shall be amended as follows: Add name ojjurisdiction /RFPD} 

Section J 06 Fees 

106.6 Permit, Plan Review and Inspection Fees shall be added as follows: A schedule of fees 

adopted by the district board of directors fur pla,i review, in:.pections and the issuance of permits by 

the district may be found in the most currenr district fee schedule (Heu/th & Safety Code 17951). 

106.b.1 Co!lt RecO\'Cry l~ces shall be added as follows: Fir,· sen1ice fees may be charged to any 

person, firm, corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result ~f 
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the district to respond to the scene of an incident. A 

disrrict board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the dis(ric( provides or the cust 

of enforcing any regu/aiionfor which the fee is l·harged (Health & Safety Code 13916). The.fee shall 

not exceed fhe actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to the scene of an incident. 

106.7 Administrative Costs shall be added as follows: When a tesl or in:.pecliu11 is scheduled, and 

the contractor fails to perform to the ~;atisfoction of the authority havingjurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ 

may bill the contractor/or actual time spent traveling to and.from the test/inspection location and 

the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs. 

Section 109 Board of Appeals 

Section l 09.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines shall be added as follows: Any person or entity who 

believes they may be adversely affected by an order, decision. or determination made by the fire code 

official through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on 

the notice. All such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for 

the district. A timely appeal shall stay further action by the fire code official until the matter is 

determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in Section 109.2, unless the issue poses an imminent fire 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 2 

20-0203 M Page 6 of 36 



u1 !if, .1a/< ty hu::ard to 1111·111/>ers q( the µ11bhc. Thi' .fire code oftit·ial sl1t11! noti/1' the 11J1pc'lla11t hi' 
u l'l!f1uJ mm/ 117 1/,( dari (//;r/ tilld o(.such hu1ri11g. 1 h< lwm i,,g .1/wll /,, ,,du d11/nl 1,, 10Ae 11/al'<.: 1w 

.10,mc'r than 20 c:alc11da1 dm•.,fnm, rhe dull' .,·how11 on the c1:.T1ified mail. 71,e appellant shall have //I( 

right lo app1·t1r in fJt'l"Hlll (11 l>y agc·n/ ot the h('(ll'/llg and prt'.wnl orul, wril/1'11 and/or p/,otograplti(' 

f:l'idence to the Appeal Board. 

Seel ion l JO Violatiom 

110.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows: Persons who shall violate a provision of this 

code or shall fail to comply wilh any of the requirements thereof m whll shall erect, install. alter. 

repair or Ull work in violation of the approved constrnction documents 01 directive of lhe fire code 

official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a 

111i.wlemea11or or i11fruc:1io11. at the di!,,·cretio11 of the prosecuting n.llurncy or age11(y, punishable by a 

fine not cxcccdinl! $100. 00.fur a.firs! violation; 2. A.fine nut e.n:eeding $500. OO_(or" -~ccond violation 

of the same provision within one year,· 3. A fine not exceeding $1000. 00 for each additional Piolati011 

of the same pwvi.\ion within one year, or by imprisonment nol exceeding 180 days, or both such fine 

and imprisomm:nl. Each day tha1 a violation continues afler due notice has been sen1ed shall be 

deemed a :separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17YY5). 

110.4.2 Citations shall be added as follows: Tiu: Fire Chief, or his/her du~v u11thorized 

represe11tafi1 1e, may i.~.me citations.for i,!fractions or misdemea1101· violations of this code pursuant to 

Section 13871 oj rhe Health & Safety Code of the State of CaNfomia and Chapter 5c (commencing 

with Section 853. 6) <~( Title 3 <>( Part 2 of the Penal Code o_{ the Stu le of C"lifim1ia. 

Section ll2 Stop Work Order 

112.4. Failure to Comply shall be amended as follows: Any person who shall continue any work 

after having been served with a stop-work order, excepl such work as that person is directed to 

perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment o,. 

both as described in Section 110.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 a,id 17995). 

Chapter 2 

Section 202 General Defmi1ions 

Add dcCinition for Campfire - Shall mean afire which is used.for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, 

or aesthetic purposes. This includes fires contained within ourdoor fireplaces and enclosed stoves 

with flues or d1im11eys, stoves using jellied, liquid, or solid fuels, portable barbecue pits, braziers, OI' 

JJWC:C' heating devices which are used outside of any structure, mobile home, or any living 

accommodation mounted on a vehicle. 

Ordinance 2019-01 20-0203 M Page 7 of ~e 3 



, Add definition for Uistricl - Shall mean the dist,-ict and all other areas within the exterior boundaries 

there,,f now or hereafter established. 

Add definition for Urin:wa\' - Shall mean a vehicular access that serves up to two (2) parcels with 

no more than m·o (2) residential units and any number of non-commercial or industrial buildings on 

each parcel. 

Add dcfi11i1io11 for Exccuth·e Body - Shull mea11 the Board of Directors of the District. 

Add definition for l<'ire Chief - Shall mean the Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire 

department/district sen1i11g the jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative. 

Add definition for Trained Crowd Manager - Sholl mean standby personnel, usually a security 

guard or usher personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure lo exit people from a tent or other 

place ofpublic assemblage in an orderly and calm.fashion in the evenr of an emergency. 

Chapter 3 

Section 302 Definitions 

302.1 Definitions shall be amended as follows: Added Campfire definition, as shown above in 

Chapter 2, 

Section 307 Open Burning, Rccrca1ional Fircs, and Outdoor Fireplaces 

307.4.4 Campfire Rcstrirtious shall be added as follows: 

307 .4.4.1 It is unlm~ji1/for any person to light, maintain, or use a campfire upon or near any brush­

covered land, grass-covered land, or fore.u-covered land during the lime when burning permits are 

suspended by the Direcwr of rhe Depurrment of Forestry and Fire Prote.c:rion, the CAL FJRE Unit 

Chief or the AHJ 

Exception: Commercial cooking operations with approval of the AHJ 

307.4.4.2 When campfires are allowed, it should be unlaaful for any person to light, maintain, or use 

a campfire upon any bru.,h-covered land, grass-covered land, or forest-covered land unless the 

following minimum requirements are complied with. 

307.4.4.2 (a) n,e area within 5 feet of the periphery of the campfire is cleared of all flammable 

material and vegetation. 

307.4.4.2 (b} One serviceable shovel with a handle of at least 12 inche.~ is ready for use at the 

immediate area of the campfire. 

307.4.4.2 (c) Campfires shall be limited to a }foot by }foot area, unless in an approved manufactured 

cooking device or fire ring. 

307.4.4.2 (d) Written permission of the landowner must be obtained prior to the ignition of the 

campfire and shall be on site, 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 4 

20-0203 M Page 8 of 36 



) 

Chapter 5 

Section 503 Fitl' Apparatus Act'css Roads 

503.2.l J)im,'.nsions shall be amended as follows: Fire apparatus access wads :-:hall have an 

unobstrncted width of not less than 20 feet, exclusive of shoulders, as measured.from face of curb to 

Ji1CI' o/c:urh, except for approved security ga1cs in acc0rd;rnce with Section 50'.l.6, and unobstruc1ed 

vertical clcarance of not kss than 15feer. All tlrii·l'\1'll)'S in th<· district shall ,wt he foss rlum 12.fe·ct 

wide. 

503.2.5 Dead Ends shall be amended as follows: Dead-end fire apparatus access roads awl tlril'eway.~ 

in excess of J ,'.',O feet in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around fire 

apparatus. 

503.2.6 Bridges and Ele\'atcd Surfaces shall he amended as follows: Where a bridge or an elevated 

surface is part of' a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall he constructed and maintained in 

accordance with the current El Dorudo County Transportation Division Bridge Standard or Appendix 

D of the c11rre111 California Fire Code, whichewr is more restrictil>e. Bridges and elevated surfaces 

shall he designed for a Jive load sufficient lo can-y the imposed loads of fire apparatu~. Vehicle load 

limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when required by the Fire Code Official. Where 

elcva1ed surfaci:s designed for emergency vehicle use arc adjaccn1 to surfaces which art· no1 designed 

for such use, approved barriers, approved signs, or both shall be installed and maintained when 

required by the fire code official. 

503.4.2 No Parking in :Fire Lanes shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, or leave 

standing any vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when 11ec:e!>'~'W}' to avoid cvnjlict with 

other traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief. or his/her duly authorized 

representutil'l:, l'c:ace Officer or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway, at any 

curb, or in any loc:alio11 in u publidy or privately owned or operated off-street parking facility, 

designated as a fire lane by the district with jurisdiction over the area in which the place is located. 

17,c designation shall be indicated (1) by" sign posted immediately adjacent to, and visible from, the 

designated place clear~y stating in lerters not less than one inch i11 height that the place is a.fire lune, 

(2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color, marking the place with the 

words "J.1RE LANE", which are clear~v visible from a vehicle, or (3) by a red curb or red paint on 

the edge of the roadway upon which is dearly marked the word~· "FIRE LANE". 

503.4.3 No Parkine in Front of Hydrants shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, or 

leave standing any vehicle within 15 .feet of u fire hydrant except as Ju/lows: (u) Jf the vehicle is 

attended by a licemed driver who is seated in the from sem and who can immediately move sucJ1 

vehicle in case of necessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or operated by afire department and is clearly 

marked as afire departml!nt vehicle. 

Ordinance 2019-01 20-0203 M Page 9 of ~~e 5 



50.l-t.4 Fi1 <' Lanl·~ l3aH·d on Ho:id Widrh shall be added as follows: Fire lane(} shall be based on 

road width as required in Appendix Das amended by the district. 

503.5.3 Fire Apparalus Access Gatc>s shall be added as follows: All aurumatic and manual gates 

installed over fire apparatus access roads shall comply \1,·irh the district gate standard as approved 

by the fire code official. 

Scclion 505 Premise Identification 

505.1 Address Identification shall have the first line of this paragraph amended as follows: 

Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply with the district address standard as approved 

by the fire code official. 

Section 507 flre Protection Water Supplies 

507.5.1 Where Required shall be amended as follows: 400 feet shall be amended to 150/eet. 

Section 509 Fire Protection and Utility Equipment Identification and Access 

509.3 Fire Control Room_ shall be added as follows: Fire ~pri11kler risers, fire alarm control panels, 

.wlar photovoltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression or 

similar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The/ire 

control room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feel in size with a total usable area 

of nm less than 35 square feel. The room shall be located within the building 011 an outside wall at a 

location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from the exterior. An exterior 

a('('ess door with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height of not less than 80 inches shall 

be provided.for access into the room. A durable sign shall be ajfu:ed to the exterior of the door with 

the words "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters not less than 4 inches in height. A key box complying 

with Section 506 shall be installed on the exterior side of the fire co11trul room door opening. 

The room must he capable of maintaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit. A 

clearance qf 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers to any adjacent walls. This 

room c.:an be a shared with other building utilities or fire protection equipment that is not 

incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the fire 

sprinkler system and other fire protection equipment. This room shall 1101 be used for any other 

storage. 

Exception: 011e-u11d two-family dwellings, manufactured homes or similar uses defined as either 

a Group R-3, R3. /, or R-4 occupancy. 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 6 

20-0203 M Page 10 of 36 



CJHtptl'r 9 

S,,cctjon 9m Ffre Spl'inklen 

903.2 Wlu;re Required shall be amended .is follow.s: An approved :iutomrst1c sprinkler system sho/1 

be required a,1d in.1ialled in new huildwgs and .. 1·1t-ucturt·s 3600 squnre fei!t or ~reate., wlMl 

con~truded or re./ornred ,;.'ithin JhtT jun\diction dS described in Sec!ion.!l 903.2, l through 9UJ.2.12. 

E..:ceptit>n: .•fgricultr1ral building.~ nor 1mde:r o special I/St' permit 11sedfnr commcr1.'ial purp,M·e:: 

903.2.q Where Required shall be added a~ follows; Stat1ts oj ~xisting bw'{d;ngs gr!:ata than 3, 6110 

square feet. in exi.rtir1g buildings 3,600 sq1"'re j'iY~I ur gre.arer, nth er than ortt.' ar1J IW<>-family dwelling 

unit.~. arni agricultural buildings nor 11nder .rpccial IIR•' permit.for commercial purposeJ, 11•hel't' tht· 

/loor area (f th,: building or .stmcture i.l' increrut?d bi• on r.1ddilio11 of more than thirty pt!rCcnl ( 30':-'1,,I 

or l,Q{)() .~•m,.. fi.!et wJ11chever is le.rs, .wch building or structure shn/1 be made to conform 1,1 Sedi011 

903.2. 

90~.?.b \\'hn~ RnauiruJ shull ln·, mltJcJ dS fullnw:..: Stu1-u.~ u/ t:...l.~ling building:r less /hlJn 3.600 

.,·quare Ji:c?t. In e.tisring buildtng3 3,600 square feet or less, other than ont~-a,ul two-.famUy dwelling 

umts., ,1nd agric1,/turaJ buil,Jings not under spec:i'aJ u,n: f}{!rmir for commerc11JI p11rpou.1·, where the 

J]oor arf'a 14' the. bw'Jdinp_ or stnu~tlm: /.,· mcrt!aseJ to a total squur~ foolagr: nver 3,600 squart' feet, 

by an addition of rrwre. than thirry percent (30'1/ii.l ar 1,000 squorefeet. w!ifchevc-r is less, such building 

or .,·tructure !ilwll be modf to conform to Si:rtwn 903. l. 

903.l.1 Group A shalt be amended as follows for A grou()!-l A-1 through A-4; 9012. 1 . I (l) Thr: fi,~ 

area exceeds 3,600 ,fquare }i!d. 

903.1.3 Group E shall he amended as follows; 903 .. 2.3 {I) Throughout alJ Group E fire u1e<1:, grenttt 

than 3,600 ~·quarejcet in area. 

903.l,4 Group F-l shall he amended as follows: 9012.4 Group F. 903.2.4 (l) A Group F fire art-J 

exceeds 3,600 sqrmre feet. 

903.1.7 Group M sllall be amended»~ follows: 903.2.7 Group Baud M. 903.2.7 (l) A Group Band 

M fire area cxcecdl 3,600sq"arefe.et. 

903.2.8.1 Manufactured Homn. sbsll be added a,; fol lows: An uuwmuti<._lfr,., sprinkler .~y.rlcm shall 

be required in all new mam!(ac..·turt!,I homtw and multi:family mmuifac11u,!J home.r intended for ti.ff. 

as a one-and h~·o-famr~v dwdhng. The design and ins,al/ation of.ruch .ry~tem.l' shall he in accordance 

,~·ith Californiu <_--;nde of R.eg11/ation\', Title 25. §.(JOO. 

Exuption..r~.· 

Ordinance 2019-0 I 

i. Manufactt1red homes located within m, a1sting mobilehome park comp~1•ing with 

California Health and Safety C0cle, DMsion 13. ~an 1. J or 23 

2. Manufac:rured l,omej· that do 110, exn!ed 1,200 square Jeer in ~·ixe and serve as an 

11ccusory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; whnr tlu: 

20-0203 M Page 11 of §~e 7 



existing primary residence on the property is 1101 required to comply with Cal~fornia 

Residential Code Section R3/3.2. 

3. Ma11ufactured homes that do nnl exceed 320 square/eel in size. 

903.2.9 Group S-1 shall be amended as follows: 903.2.9 Group S. 903.2.9 (]) A Group S fire arc<J 

exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

903.2.JO Grou1> S-2 Endoscd Parking Garages shall be amended <IS follows: 903.2.10 (J) Where 

1he fire area of the enclosed parking garage exceeds 3,600 square.feet. 

Sc<'lion 907 fln· Alarm and Detection Systems 

907.2.a Where Required - New Buildings or Structures ks~ than 3,600 square feet shall be added 

as follows: A11 approved fire alarm/detection system shall be in.vtul/ed in all buildings with a floor 

area less than 3,600 square feet. 

Exception.~: 

/. One- and two-:family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified 

as "U"). 

2. Agricultural buildings not under ,\pecial use pennit and/or not used for commercial 

purposes (e.g., retails sales,foud sen1ice, and/or Jpecial events). 

3. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined 

by thc1 Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized represemative, based on building 

construction material and features, location, occupancy lype, and distance to 

exposures. 

907.2.h Status of Existing Buildini:s shall be added as follows: /11 existing buildings without an 

approved automatic .Iprinkler system, other than one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultural 

building not under special use permit for commercial purposes where afire alarm detection syJ·tem 

does not exist and the floor area of the building or srructure is increased or modified by more than 

thirty percent ( 30%) or l, 000 square feet, whichever is less, suc:h bui /ding or structure sh al I be made 

to conform to Section 907 when required by the Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative. 

Buildings with a.floor area less than 500 l'quare feet may be exempt, as determined by the Fire Chief. 

or his/her duly authorized representative, based on building construction materials and features, 

location, occupancy type, and distance to exposures. 

907.2.c Monitorine shall be added as follows: Al/fire alarm/detection systems shall be connected 

directly through and monitored by a UL approved central, proprietary or remote station service, 

which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly attended location. All sprinklered buildings 

shall be monitored. 

l!.xceptio11 ... : 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page8 

20-0203 M Page 12 of 36 



I. One- und two:/i,mi(v Jw,.•llingl" (R-3 Occupancit'.\' m,J other occu1"mc·i,·,1 du.1·s~/ied 

as "U''.), 

2. Agriculwra/ buildings not under .rpt'ci,il use pt'm1it ,mdior no: usedfi-,r 1:ommt',.CWI 

purposes (e.g., retails .wle.1·,jiJ()d .\crviCt', cmdri:ir spt'CU.ll t'\'fc·nts). 

907.2.d T,pe 1 Hood lostnllatiolls shat! be added as follow,; The rt•qwr,·m,·nt ,!( ;11.1tal!tmo11 ,,r 

replacemenr, of a Type l Hood Sy.rlem shall ,.equire a fire alarm/,prinkler mor,itoring ,y\lt:"'I r,-, t>,,· 

in:sw/led, orf>r the hood .\'ys/cm to be. connected wan exisringfire a/arm1'.lprinHer muniror1ng -~·.ftt·n: 

for thal building. 

907.6.2.1 Scc~>ndary Power Supply shall be added as fol]ows: In accorJ,mce Kilh SFP-l 72, th<' 

secondan-' powu rnpply providing a mimmum 14-hour power capacity 11nder quiescent /o(ld lrystnri 

operating in a non-alann condition) ,Ihall be amended !o a minimum 72-hour poY.ier capacity. 

IJ.;~,·cptfon: '/he t·xii·tem:e of an i•mergt'ncy badr-up poM.'t'r !>upply /hat meets or exceed lhr:· 

requironcnls ,l Cal(lornia Fin: Code Chapter I 2. 

C h11pler 12 

Srction J20J Emcr2,cnc)' and StapdbY Powu SHtem1 

ll0~.1.3 ln,taUaUon shall be amended as follows·. Emcrger.cy power systems and standby power 

.~yste,m. shall be installed rn accon.iaoce with the Cahfomia Building C-Odc, the C'a.lifonua Electric 

Code, Nf PA l JO and NFPA 111. All bwldings, otht'r thun one· and 1',,,,'0:famity dwelling units, and 

agricultvral h11i1'/ings not ust·cifor commacial pa,rposeJ, with standby po1i~r. $/wlf hm-e a shunt trip 

d,~1·i,·e that di1,·onnt·ds all powt:r w11n·u tn tht· building, appnn·t.·d b_y the firi, .-ode official. E'Cisting 

immllurio,n shall be malntumed in mxordancr \\'Ith the original apprnw.1/ 

Chapter :l3 

Se-ctioo 3~ IO A ecru for Flrrfl&,hli•e 

3310.3 rremitC' Jdcptjt)satjop shAJI he 11dded ll5 follows: Prior tu anti during consrruction, WI 

approwd addren sign Jhall ~ prm·ided at t•ach firt' un.J «'"1t'f'Rt"1t.y w!hide acl'e.H road natry into 

the proja:t 

$edio• 3312 Wa1tr Supply for lo'ire Protegiog 

3312.l Wbn Reguirtd shall be amended as follows: Prior to uunbu.:rtiblt· malt·rial.,· arriving on 

site, tlu fire hydrant ~atf.'r ~yJlem shall be 1,utalled and maintained ;,, contimwus opudtion. The 

amount of water supplied shall meet the required fire flow for the project. 

Onlinance 2019-01 20-0203 M Page 13 of ~t,e 9 



C!·1aph.>1· 49 

SC'ction 4903 l'lun~ 

4903.1 WherC' RC'quircd shall be added as follows: The fire code official of the RFPD may re.quire 

development projecfs located in Moderate, High and Very-High Fire Hazard Severity Zones to submil 

fire pl'otectio11 plan. This plan shall be approved by both /he fire code official and the autlwrized 

representative for the local CAL FIRE Unit Chie_f (!{located in the State Responsibility Area [SRA}) 

prio,· to the recording u.f thefi11ul map for the project by the County of El Dorado. 

Section 4905 Wildfire Protection Building Construction 

4905.4 Roof Construction Rl.'guircments shall be added a~ foJlows: A II 11~v construction, in duding 

additions, requires a Class A ruof covering or assembly, All re-roofing requires Class A roof covering 

or assembly as a mir1imum. Re-roofing in excess of 50% of an exisiting structure within any one year 

period will necessitate that the entire roof be a Class A roof covering or assemb~v as a minimum. 

Class B or C fire retardeant treated and or non-treated wood shali.e or shingles are not approved as 

a roof covering material.for Class A assembly. 

Chapter 50 

Section 5001 General 

5001. 7 Li11bility for Damages shall be added as fo11ows: Any damages or cost resulting.from rhe 

careless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall constituent debt agaim·t any 

such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge. This debt is collectible by the Fire 

Chief, or his/her duly authorized represe11tative, in the same manner as in the case of an ohligation 

under contract, expressed or implied. 

Chapter 56 

Section 5601 General 

5601.2 Permit Required shall be amended as follows: Pem1its shall be required as set forth in 

Section 105.6 and regulated in accordance with this section. Where explosives permits are required, 

they shall be issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized represen/ative, and the El Dorado 

County Sheriffs Department. 'Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be issued by the Fire 

Chi~{. or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County Board of Supervisors. 

5601.2.1 Documentation shall be added as follows: The AHJ shall have the authority to request 

documentation regarding all aspects of the.fireworks presentation. 

5601.2.2 Proprietary Information shall be added as follows: The AHJ will protect all proprietary 

information. 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 10 

20-0203 M Page 14 of 36 



lwph I ~/ 

Section_S 704 ~to ta£~ 

;-704.2.9.t.i.1 I ,ora1io1•~ \\ lit·n· _t\hon•.-G1 ound Ti111l,.~ at C' P1 oldhitcd. shbll bt <lllll"IH.kd "~ follow:-;: 

Slrn ,1gl'. 11Jl 'las~ I ;,nd C'l,1:-;:-. 11 Jlanmiahle liquids i11 abu, e- gro11nd tan~~ outsidl:' ufbuildi11ps i~ pt oh ibilnl 

unlrss appru1•ul bv lhe Fin' Chief, or hislhcr dulv authorized rcprese11tm;w. When pcmdlfcd l>y thl' 

Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized rcprc.1·cntati1'(', all abo1•,1 gro1md tank(,·) or vault imta/latio11.1 

.for the ~to,a)!_e <!f Class /, JI or 1/l flammah/1! and com!mstihle liquids shall compli• with those 

requirements ns set forth by the California Fire ('nde. 'The California Fi,e Code shul/ also apply to 

in.Hallutio11.1 otlia than motor 1·ehiclef11el dispensing. !ilario11.1· 11·/iere ahove-gro11111) storage is required 

Section S706 Special Operations 

5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Abo,'e-Ground Tanks arc Prohibiled shall be .imendcd as follows: 

Storage of Cluss I and Class II flammable liquids in above-ground tanks ou1sidc of buildings is 

prohibited unless approved by the Fire Chie/ or his/her duly authorized representative. When 

permitJed by th<· Fire C/1ief; or hi.~/her duly authorized represc11tative, all above ground tu11k(~) vr 

vault installativmfor lht· !iloragt: ofC/uss 1, JI or /Jlflw1111111hle n11d combmtiblc liquids shall cvmplv 

with those requirements as set forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shall aLw 

apply to i11stallatiom· othcl' rha11 motor 1•ehicleji1el di:,pe11si11K sla/l()IIS whert> above-ground storage 

is required. 

Chapter 58 

Section 5806 Flammable Cryogenic Fluids 

S8i)6.2 Limitations shall be amended as follows: Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary 

containers outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the Fire Chief. or hi.\-lher duly 

authorized rcprcsentarive. When permitted by the Fin Chief or his/her duZv authorized 

representative, all stationa,y containers for the storage of flammable cryogenic fluids shall comply 

with those requirements as set.forth by the California Fire Code. Tire California Fire Code shall also 

app6• to i11slallations other than motor vehicle fuel diJpem,ing stations where above-ground .'itorage 

is required. 

Chapter 61 

Section 6104 Location of LP-Gas Containers 

6104.2 Maximum Capacity within EstabUshed Um its shall be amended as follows: The storage 

of liquefied pdroleum gas in exce.u of an aggregate of 2, 000-gallon water capacity when located at 

least one-half ( J /2) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-half 

( I /2) mile Jimn existing residential development with a density greater than one (I) dwelling unit per 

Ordinance 2019-01 20-0203 M Page 15 of §~e 11 



,· 
acre and at leas/ one-half (l/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AH} "ppruved. and a 

8pecial/conditional use permit is issued by the Count), of El Dorado. 

Di.f pe11sing within established limits. Within the limits e!J·lablished by law restricting the dispersion of 

liquefied petroleum gas for the protection <~l heavily populated or congested areas, the aggregate 

capacity of any one installation shall nut exceed a vvater capacity of 2,000 gallons. 77,e dispensing 

of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2.()00-ga/lon water capacity when located 

at lea.ft one-ha{{ (112) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one­

half (l/2) milefi·om existing residential development with a density greater than one(/) dwelling unit 

per acre and at least one-half ()/2) mile.from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved and 

a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado. 

Section 6113 Underground LPG Tanks Jnslallalions and Ownership shall be added as follows: 

6113.1 Permits and Phrns shall be added as follows: Permits shall he required, and plans shall be 

submitted for all underground tank installations as approved by the AHJ. 

6113.2 Underground LPG Tank Ownership shall be added as follows: Underground LPG tanks 

shall be prohibited from being sold to end-users and shall be retained by the LPG company under a 

lease-type system to ensure proper annual maintenance requirements are met and recorded. 

Chap•er 80 

Section 80, ~FPA, J3])-J6 - Standard for thl' Jnstallation of Sprinkler Systems in One-and Two 

Famih· Dwellings and Manufactured Homes as amended 903.3.1.3. 903.3.5 

Nfl'A 13D, Amended Sections as follows: 

Add Section 4.7 to react as follows: 

Chapter 80. N.FPA 131) 4.7 Residential fire sprinkler systems i11stal/ed in all new one-and two-family 
dwellings shall ulilize a "Passh'e Purge" sys1e111 design unless otherwise approved by the Fire Code 
Qffic:ial. 

Eweption: Ma11u/c1ctured home installed, tested and approl'ed hy the California Department of 
Housing and Community Development. 

Rl'visc Section 5.J .1.2 to read as follows: 

Chapter 80. l'iFPA 130. 5.1.1.2 A supp~v of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkler used 

within the premises shall be maintained on the property a1 an approved location. Stock sprinklers shall 

be kepi in a moumed and accessible cabinet. 

Revise Section 7 .6 to read as follows: 

Chapter 80. NFPA l3D. 7.6 A local water/low alarm shall be provided on al/fire sprinkler systems i11 

homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling. 

Hevise Section 11.2. LJ to read as follows: 

Ordinance 2019,01 Page 12 

20-0203 M Page 16 of 36 



Chapter- IU). ~ .. r.u.~u. l 1.2 I. I \1,':1nr: ;i Lr~'. 1.'.r"f,ilTITlJFni ;n~r •. r,~r comv:i::rioo is not fl[O',ided, !he 

;-:,'stem soot: t>e hyi:.i10~1t1h;>-I :y !ent"d at ii m11111rum1 pre,\ II.In' of nu p,;,1;riJs rer >'i/lf(]rt' Inch gm,g~ for ,re, 

le~J tluu, a 3(1--mnw:1· J,1,,1ri,,n ,111>.111,1 ,.,,,.t,·/'I,,.. .,/ /01A,H~1· .~rwh t,·,11 1iid// bl! 11•1fn-cJ.fed hv tltffire code· 

r~(1ic,(Jl. 

Ap(ltndu B - Fire J.1,w, HtquirC'llH:nh lo• Huildinc, 

hblr Bl05.J(l) Reqwn.'tl hre l•fo\~ for Onf- 9pd J wo-+umity DwdHug,, <.,,ruup H-3, and R~ 
BuildJnp 11nd To"nbou,e1i ,,;hall be 11rne,11dcd 11fi follows: 

HRE-FLOW 

CALCULATION 
AR1'~A 

u .. :..r::.ou 

J,60 I nu,l 1(1 c~kJ 

Alf'fO:\I A nc 
SPRINh.LElt 

S\'STI:M 

I Duig.11 

Standard• 

I 
N.::, illll(JLllJllh; 

,prUll..lt:r gystt'm 

I ~o JJ.u'.i:•tru1llc 

I i.prirucli::- '.;·,.;1,!rE 

1 
\~:J.iuu <;ti)~~=. 1 ; 

' ,.,( tt.tc (:,•. :'- :1e 

l
l (,.·.•·• ~s _,;; ... ,.,,., •.IIJII; ,.,, ,.....,._.~,• I, 

, , ~ ,-, ~,r .J,t· c .... 

l'ttl:'111,\WM 

Flkl• 

Fl ow 
ht•tl<ou pC'r 

,aheultl 

'\ __ _ 
! Vai~i .. 

f.M., 
t1j~1~.: I:·, 

I (itl<I 

i ~.e".Jdenr:.i_ ( •Y.Je .. _ .. _ -f--

J :=\r1,"tjrn '.:i(I J .? ; .: I l ·• •111,,c nf 
1

J d the C-\ Fu:c l'abk 
· (',,de c•r Sc-ci1oc, Hl05 1(2: 
' _,i}] (1( :J-.~ c,, 
i F.ciiidoi11ftl C<-Jt-c 

H .OW 

rH 'M.ATIOI'>' 

(bounl 

{ ,.!,le 

BIU~.10) ., 

~1--tc fTl.:fl..l,r~ 

'''" ,1.,..., ,~1~ 

T•blt 810"-l Rtqu.ired fire f]o"' for Buildipg!I other thag One- and Tw~Jfawlh' 
D"' dJlqgL Group 8·3, apd R4 BuildingJ apd Townhouse5 s.hall be emended 1u folk,w~ 

AUTOMATIC 
SPRINkl.EM !--Ys·n:M 

N,• 1utom.alll' ,,prml.kr 

SJ!ltfll 

,l MJNI~ruM nRE-
1 Fl.OW 

' (&l.11001 per D1lnutc) 

Vulur 

a1n~.1m 
i!I 1'1l>lc 

FLOW DURATION 

(hoar1~ 

Du:nitiCll m Table BI OS. 1 /11 

Sp;:t111n ~YU I I ,·,f 1t1c CA II .!-~.io.;. JO~~ t.ftht \'ahic in Dun.tioo in Tahit BIO~ 1(21 J. 
fim.~ CoJ!____ . l '!'k D_l ,_1.5~_(_2_) '_' -............ ----f-a_\_th_e_nxl_u_c_cd_fl_to.,._111U: ______ . __ 1 
Se..'1inn •>u:L\ J .1 of 1l1l' CJ\ I J.M<. .1(1'';, of ti~ 1,luc ir, Duratim in 1ablc B!05.li1\ 

F~ Code: . L!~b!c_B_I r_.1_,_. l_(-'2) _______ _c_•_t th_e_red_uced __ no.. __ ra!: _____ _ 

b. TI1c rodu(.cd fire /low Nhall nol be" le~-: 1Jum I ,~00 iprn 

Ordinance 2019-01 20-0203 M Page 17 of ~e 13 



A,pendix D Hrc Apparatus Access Roads 

Section Dl03 Minimum Specifications 

0103.J Access Road \\'idth with a Hydrant shall he amended as follows, adding the exception: 

E-i:ception: D1frcwa.1•s 

Dl03.2 Grade shall he amended as follows: tin: apparatus access roads and driveways shall not 

exceed 15. 9% in grade unless appro,·ed l>y the .4HJ or by the El Dorado County amended Cal(fornia 

Puhlic Resource Code Title 14 I Design and Jmprm·ement Standards Manual. 

Dl03.3 Turnint: Radius shall be amended as follows: The minimum turning radius shall be 

delermincd by the fue code official; and shall nor include curh and gutter. 

l> 103.5 Fin· Apparatus Access Road Gales shall hl.' amended as follows: Subsection(]): Jt'herc a 

si11gh' gate is pruvided, the gate width .rho// he 1101 less than 20 feet (6096 1nm) Where a fire 

appara111s road cu11sist!.> ofa divided road,rny, the gute width shall nor be less than 15.feet (4572 

mm). 

DJ0:3.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as specified in 

Section D 103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide 

(6096 to 8534.4 mm). 

DJ 03.6.2 Roads more Chan 29 feet io Width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as 

specified in Section D 103. 6 shall be po sled on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 

feel wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm). 

DHJ4.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access ltoads slrnll bl: added as follows: When required 

hy the fire code official, a .fi,-e apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirety 

of a .l'tructure and shall provide a co11ti11uous means of emergency vehicle acces.,. 

SECTION 4: CONFLICT 

That Ordinance No. 2016-01 of the RFPD, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances herewith are hereby 

repealed. 

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY 

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or. subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or phrase of this code, or 

any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of compelent jurisdiction, such decision 

shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code, which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, 

therefore, such invalid portions are declared to be severable. The RFPD hereby declares that ii would have enacted 

this Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsecrions, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, sentences, 

clauses or phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid. 

Ordinance 2019-01 Page 14 
20-0203 M Page 18 of 36 



• 

Thi• t)f\11n;111r• ,trnl! 1;,l,.r ,,t(~.1 1h1r':, /, 1Hi ,:i:.y~ ;dL-:r tt~ 1hlq1ti~1rL lb:· Rf~D B(:,ar,: S.-, ri:-lnry :•: d1rtl:\l:'d !<1 

puhiish tlu'. ,1r,lln.u1 .. ·r: In" !'c,Hr,,jlf! ,,f ~cncro.i crcuii'IIIOO tr, rt.<'. n,,tnd In iic:u t1fp11hla:11l1u11 ,ii lhc• !ull !f'tl 

0llh~ [·t,.l111J1!iu:, J •wiu!1,.J ( ,•! jt1( ,:.,.J,:uc:,:c m;n ~'L' ;'\JMi:,hcd l,y the by tht: t.k,ar.J Seoc-tJU', 11,1lhir1 liitrrtt ( l~l 

The abovt O:'I.JjfUUl(.(' wo > umr,.1111:rd 111 ,1 ,rn:etlng 0f lht Boll rd ol Oiw::1orh of the Rf PD ,m i)c1i .!•ft 9, l!J I~'. 

and 1t wa .... 11Jc11 r,;11,J fi,r 1h,1 111~1 t1111n 1\ puhh'-= hc;;rtng w;p: ~d lnr lhc U1,li11a11-:c lr, ht: read for lh1: :\t'ii•Jli.f t10l•'. 

,:-r, ~-:,wl!Il1bcr l 3 .. '.!ii'./ ;rnd ,1p111nvnl hy llw lnllnwtnJ,: vote: 

A Yt:::S. C: 

NUt:S: B­

AHSFNL & 

Ai Is r A[N· e 

_.\ ;·r EST 

Ordinaooe 201'>-0 I 20-0203 M Page 19 of ~e 1 5 



Fire Cod(! f..rnendmcnt What Is the Change? LJca ly adopted I SPi ado;l'ed I AricndeJ \Vhy Is Tlwc a lo(al c11angc? 

101.1 Amend with the nane of the jllisdictlon Locally adopled and amended Admristralive need 

Ado!)ling this section lo allow for the creation and Issuance 

106.6 Addsdon Locally Cl8a1ed and aloptlld 
of fees lo cover actual costs. Section 106.6defines 
permilS, pl111 checks, and lnspeclioos as all<7Mld In Heath 
&Sallity Code 17951. 

106.6.1 Add secllon Locally created and alopled Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the COSllo 
lhe Fire District. 

106.7 Add secllon Locally created and adopted Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspections by contractols. 

Secllon 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Flra Code of the Dislrict 
Is added to read as follows: 
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this 
provision is to darily the procedures and timetires for an 

109.4 Added secllon 109.4 locally adopted and amended individual or entily to file an appeal to lhe Board of Appeals 
regarding an crder, decision, or determlnallon by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County or El Dorado's 
Vegetation Ma,agment Ordinance Bo.rd of Appeals 
timellne. 

Allows the Fire Code Official to enw the Fire Code lhal 
Completed the secllon by fiHing in the blank portions that were prolects life and property. Fees have been updated to match 

110.4 not completed by the SFM. It is better rett to localities to Locally adopted and amended the lees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the Dis1ric1 
determine the lees/penalties for their respective areas. Attorney's Office. The chqe to the language to include the 

term inlracllons. 

110.4.2 Cilallons is added ID read as follows: 110.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief or hlshler duly authorized representative (s), 

110.4.2 
Added Section 110. 4 .2. (This secllon existed before but under 

Locally adopted and amended 
may issue citations for Infractions or mlsdeme.-ior 

a different number) violations of this code l)\ISuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health and Safety Code ol lhe Stale of Calffomia and 
Chapler 5c (commencing with section 853.6) of Tide 3 or 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Caifornia. 

Completed Iha section by filling In the blank portions that were 
All Violations ol the code have been consiladated ooler 

112.4 not completed by the SFM. II is better left lo localities lo SFM adopted and ooiended locally 
Section 110.4 detennine Ille fess/penalties for lhelr raspective areas. 

Added definitions for: Canpfire, l)iveway, Dislricl, 

202 Added definiUons for clarity Locally created and adopted 
Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd 
Manager. Oefintion of campfire shall not include LPG or 
Propane fueled appliances. 

302.1 Added definition for Canpfire la Section Locally adopted and amended Added for clarity 

Due to the high fire danger that exists in El Oora:!o County 
307.4.4 through 307.4.2.2 (d) Added a secllons for campfire restrictions LocaUy adopted and amended 1W have 'Mitten more sfringent rules pertaining to open fires 

within grass, bnJsh, and tree covered areas. 

Fire apparatus are becoming lc111er and latter. A vertical 
clearance of 15 feet provides proper cleararx:e for 
apparcltJS to pass under witfrlut d~ing aw,ntus 
components. It also allows an extended time frame belore 

Changed vertical clearances to 15 leet and road widths to 20 
having to recut lhe growth of the vegetatlon. AdditiOnal 

503.2.1 
feel. 

Localy adopted and amended height for vegetation ClearanCes acts as 111 Increased buffer 
ilr the spread ol fire. A road width of 20 feet exdUSM! of 
shoulders, as measured lace of curb ID la:e d curb Is 
needed. These stnctures can be diffictAt to navigate "Mth 
flre apparalUs and should not be counled In lhe t1tal 
drivai.e road surface 

Added a specific section ilr R3's 'M1ere it allows the Fire Fire 31)1)ir'alus require .veas for turning around l«ileo 

Code and Tide 14 Fire Salv Regulations to malCh as they 
mulil)le vehicles are on lhe scene of an emergency. This 

503.2.5 require !Um.rounds ilr fire apparooJS a:cess roads and 
Locally adopted and amended Includes lire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides 

driveways. betlllr access for ingress/egress. Addillonally, adds lUm 
atlllld for appaatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

20-0203 M Page 20 of 36 



Affows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 

Chalged the section tor Brid\les and Elevated SIJ'faces to Surtaces of El Dorado County and Appendix D of the 

503.2.6 state and malch B Dorado County Transportation Division Locally ooopted and amended 
current Fire Code YAlk:hever is mae reslricttve to be 

lnsteal OIAASHTO HB-17. consistent lhrougooot county agencies and is allowed as an 
alternate means & methods that is not less reslricHve than 
the Fire Code. 

503.4.2 Added section regarding no parking in fire lanes Locally created and ooopled 
This section clearly defines the 'No Parking in Fire Lanes' 
rules and is consistent 'Mth the Caloomia Vehicle Code. 

503.4.3 Added section regarding no parking in front or hydrants Locally created and ooopted 
This sectloo clea~y defines the 'No Parking in front of fire 
hydrants' rules and is consistent ...;th the California Vehicle 
Code. 

503.4.4 Added section regarding fre lanes based on roa:I v.ldlh Locally created and ooopted 
This section clearly defines Galifomia Fire Code Appendix 
D as the reference tor roa:l lane v.ldlh and their relation b 
fire lanes. 

Created and ooopted 503.4.5 to mantain emeigency access Allows fire dlslricis the at.Chority to approve gaes on 

503.5.3 and consistency through al roadway gates In B Dorado Locally creeled and aJopted 
roadways based on the Dlslncts gale standard, providing 

County, referring to the gate stand.rds adopted by the FPO's. 
the best possible eme,gency access t> malntan fast 
response @mes. 

505.1 Added section ~aining to the visual addressing of buildings Locally adopted and amended 
Allows Fire districts the aulholity to approve addressing 
based on the Districts oodressing slandards. 

Commercial properties am required b install hydrants at 
Added more conservative standard tor the pl.-:ement of 

507.5.1 locally amended 
llO toot lnl8rvals, thus they should never be outside of 150 

hydrant and lhefr retatlonship ID commercial buldings feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the dlslaoce in 
between). 

Buildings am getting more sizable in the county. It Is more 
common to haie new buldings with solar arrays that 
conmnue to generale power even v.!1eO the buildings general 

Added verbi~ to bring all of the necessary fire conlrols klr a 
509.3 Locally added 

lmlliHes have been shut off. When there is an emergency, H 
building to one location. is vital that we have rapid access to all or the controls in one 

location for public eva:uation aid firefighter safety. Due to 
the fire danger present in B Dorado County throughout 
most of the year, this change Is appropriate and advisable. 

Due ID the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installalion In new Ol 8 Dorado County and their contributing factDrs to our 

903.2 buildings and structures 3,600 square feet OI' grealel'Mlhin the Locally amell1ed 
Increased response times, along with the tact that fires 

district. double in size each and every ninule, we require sprinklers 
to be installed In structures once 1hey reach 3,600 square 
feet In size as they retale b flre behavior and rate of sprea:t. 

Due to the topographic, Climatic, and geographic conditions 

Adds a requirement for existing buklings grealef than 3,600 
of B Dorado County aid their contributing factols to our 

903.2.a square feel IO Install sprfnkle,s ff they add more lhan 30% OI' Locally created and ooopted 
increased response times, along wilh the fact that fires 

1,000 squae feet b the structure, v.i11chever is less. 
double In size each and every ninute, we require sprinklers 
to be installed In structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feel In size as they relate to flre behavior and rate of spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geograpltlc conditions 

Adds occupant prolection for existirg buildings less than 
of B Dorado County and their contributing factas k> our 

903.2.b 3,600 squire feet ti Install sprinklers ff 1hey add more than Locally crealed and adopted 
increased response limes, along with lhe tact that fires 

30% or 1,000 square feet to the structure, v.tichever Is less. double In size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
to be Installed in s1ructures once they reach 3,600 square 
feel In size as they retale to fire behavior and rate of spread. 

Due ID the topographic, climatic, and geograpltic conditions 

These sections were created to give specific direction on the 
of El Dorado County and their conlrlbutlrg factas to our 

903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 900.2.7 sprinkler requirements based on occupancy and square locally adopted and amended Increased response limes, along wilh lhe tact that tires 

footage 
double in size each and every minute, we require spmklers 
to be lnstaled In s1ructures once they reach 3,600 SQUll'8 
feet In size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of spread. 

20-0203 M Page 21 of 36 



Manulaclul9d Homes - The lnlent of this code section Is to 
ensure lhat manufactured homes lhat senie as a one or tM>-
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found In 
CRC Section 313 per1aining to bulltdwellngs of asimilar 
nalure. Manufactured homes placed in 1he v.ildlancl-urban 

903.28.2 
This section was created to include manufactured residential Locally created and adopted 

interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumplion 
single f11118y R-3 in lhe residential sprinkler program due to lhe light-weight nature or their construction. The 

rapid fire spreoo throughout these slruct\Kes presents a 
significant risk b their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated to decrease this risk 
ru:esslully in many Calfomia communities. 

Due to 1he topographic, climadc, and geographic coooltlons 

These seclons Mre created to give specific direction on lhe 
d B Doralo Coun1y and lier contributing laclols to our 
increased response times, along YAlh 1he fact lhal fires 

903.2.9, 903.2.10 sprinkler requirements basal on occupancy and ~ Locally a!opted and amellled 
double in size each and INer'f minute, M Rlqlire SIJinlder.; 

bllage 
b be lnstaled In Sllllclures once l1ey rea:h 3,600 squn 
feel In size as they refale to lire behavio,- and rale of spread. 

Added occup.rit prolection lor fire alarms in buidlngs 'Mth a 
Provides proper emergency notificalon for ~ that 

007.2.a 
lloor aea less than 3,600, except R3, AG buildi,gs not used 

locally crea1ed and adopted allow puWc use and ensures Are Department rotfflcatlon in llr commerdal purposes, and bwdlngs 'Mth a floor aea of 
less lhai 500 squn feel as approwd by lhe fire code official. 1he event of a fire or smoke. 

Added occupant prolsction lor existing buildings v.ithltt 
Provides proper eme,geocy notification for OCCl4)ancies that 

007.2b 
aulOmatlc splillkler systems to install a fifll alarm W they add 

Locally~ and adopted allow public use and ensures Are Depar1menl rotillcation in 
more lhan 30% or 1,000 square feel to the slructure, the event of a fire or smoke. "'1lcl1l!Ve! Is less. 

Added occupant protection by stating all lire alarm defection 
Provides proper emergency ratification for oteupalCles that 

007.2c 
systems Installed shall be connected to a monltxing semce 

Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Are Depalfment ratification In 
that notifies the firedepartment upon activation and Is 
Instated per Sec1fon 907 of 1he fire code. 

1he event of a fire or smoke. 

Added occup.rit protection for Type 1 Hood systems to be Provides proper emergency nol!lication for occupll1des that 
907.2d connected to a monitoned lire alarm system v.flen installed or Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Are Department rotificml In 

replaced. 1he event of a fire or smoke. 

907.6.2.1 Primary Secondary Ala,m Power Supply Modification locally created and adopted 
Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to PG&E 
safely related power outages. 

This section adds a Soon! Trip power shut off dew:es to 
1203.1.3 Shunt trip power safety devices SFM adopfed and amended locally ensure emergency power shut off~ 1he use of back-up 

power supplies 

3310.3 Address requirements for oonslnJ:lion sites Locally creafBd and adopted 
Addressing for cons1ructlon sites Is Important to assist 
respcnjing emergency crews. 

3312.1 
Water suppfoes at constru::tion sites 'Mth combustible 

SFM adopted and llll8nded locally 
Water must be on site prior ID combustible material bek1Q 

materials on-site stored or vertical constru::tlon COfM1ellcing. 

El Dorado Cal1ly has a siginiftant fire daiger throughout 

4903.1 
This section was created to Include Are Pmctection Plan for 

Locally created and adopted 
the county. All projects wiN be required to submtt a Fire 

all fire hazard severity zones. Protection Plan due to climatic, geological, and 
topographical 

This secoon clarifies that within the bourdaries of El Dorado 
County, lire jurisdictions v.ill require that all roofs ae 

4905.4 Added a section to clarify roof construction requrements localy Created and adopted v.ildfand fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs ae not to be 
installed as they are not a Class A ratsd assembly. 

Hazardous materials related incidents are cosdy to mitigate. 

5001.7 
Any damages or costs from negligent practices that cause a 

Locally created and adopted 
W 1he Incident is caused by negligence due to a business 

hazardous malerials incident v.iH cause e cost recovery fee. process or practice the a:lual cost wn be passed oo ID the 
negligent parties. 

Added safety protection v.ill permits beiYJ Issued by both the ' Allows agencies that need to krow about explosives and 
5601.2 Are Chief and Sheriffs Department for exploelves, and by lhe SFM adopted and ameRled locally illMlrks to approve 1hem and have a clear understaldlng 

Fl18 Chief and lhe Bead of Supervisors lor finlM>rks. of lhe appllcallons they 1\11 be used for. 

20-0203 M Page 22 of 36 



The Fire Marshal of any Jurisdiction may request any 

Flfl!Y«lr1<S companies or vendors shal make available all 
documentation including timing ard propriel~ information 

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 requested doom!ntation pe,taining lo the fire\\llr1< Locally C!&Bled and a:lopted 
that pertains to any aspect of a tirel\llr1<s display lhat they 

presentation 
deem necessary. This inroimation is uooeistood to be 
proprietary and wilt be protected by lhe Fire Marshal as 
such. 

Estabrished fimits as required by lhe Fire Code for Class I 

5704.2.9.6.1 Established Rmits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted and ameooed locally 
ftammable and Class II combustible fiquid st,rage In above-
gtOIJ1d tanks, Requiras AHJ approval and a 
Speciaitorxlltional Use Pennit from lhe Comly. 

Established llmi1s as requiied by lhe Fve Code for Class I 

5706.2.4.4 Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted and amerded locally 
ft~ .nl Class II combustible liquid special 
operations In above-ground tanks. ~ulres AHJ approval 
and a SpeciaUConditionaf Use Pemllt from the Coully. 

5806.2 AdmlnfstratiYe addition d District name Locally adopted and amended Adninlslrative need ID add Dlslrict name 

Es1ablished lim11s as required by the Fire Code Official for 

5806.2.1 Established limi1s as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted and amerded locally 
Aanimable Cryogenic fluids in stationay containers. 
Requires AHJ approval .nl a SpeciaOConditionat Use 
Permit from the County. 

Establishes distances between LPG slllrage and 
dispensaries that are dlrectty related to sa'ety b' residential 

6104.2 
Eslabtlslied limits for LPG slorage and dispellsing 118a' or 

deYelopnents and hig~ hotels, motet, apa1ments, 

adjacent lo residential development 
SFM adopted and .mended lac.illy etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would 

have a high probability of inJu,y, inhalation, or death. 
Requires AHJ approval and a Special.Conditional Use 
Penni! from lhe County. 

Pennilling and Plan su!Jnlllal requirements for und8flll0und 
tanks: 

6113.1 
Pemits and plans 5hall be submitted and approved by the 

Locally created and adopted 
Allows us to require pans be subnitled for review prior to 

iAHJ (Authorily Having Jurisdiction). lnstallalions d undergrot.nd LPG tats. Undergrot.nd tarts 
require substa1tiat maimnance Including Inspection and 
anode replacement at regula" fnter;als. 

Undeiground tanks COITode easily and can leak without 
Reqlires underground LPG tanks to remain ttie property of 

6113.2 locally created and a:lopted 
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained \\tien 

lhe LPG compa,y sold lo the end user. This dOeS not apply lo above ground 
tanks where corrosion and leaks are mora easily detected. 

Amended to include on-s~a sprinkler hea:ls and vnnch 
on-site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water 

Chapter 80, NFPA,130-16 NFPA 130-16 d Chapter80 ollhe Fire Code of the llstrict ftow alarm to create an audible alert fcf lhe flow of water in 

Sections 4.7, 5.1. 1.2, 7.6, has been amended to update various provisions pe,taining lo 
Locally arr-ended 

lhe event of water activation in a vacant sll'Uclure, and 

and 11.2.1.1 lhe installation of spookier systems in one-and tv,o.famify hydrostalic testing requirements to assure proper 13D 

dwellings. sptinkler syslem installation decraas119 lhe risk of water 
damage from pipe failure, and lhe a:ldition ol a passive-
plfge syslem. 

Appencix B: Tal>le B105.1(1) 
We changed 500 GPM lo 1,000 GPM, below 5000 foot 

Allows us ID ma!ch what develofllllS and residents are used 

elevalon, to mach fire flow precedents used in EOC b' yeas SFM adopted and 1111ended locally to in regards to GPM fi111 flow requirements that have been 
used for over a deca:le In EDC. 

Appendix B: T~e B105.2 
We made a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM, below 5000 

Allows us to mat:h what developers and residents are used 

foot elevation, for all commercial projects 
SFM adopled and amended locally ID In regards ID GPM 11111 flow reqlirements that have been 

used lor over a deca:le In EOC. 

Appendix D: D103. 1 Made an excei,Uon for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended 
It Is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to 
cons1ruct a 26 loo! wide space for access ID a hydrant 

Title 14 requires bf us to orly accept up lo 16% driveways. 
Appendix D: D103.2 State law reqwea no greas, lhan 16% grade Localy adopl8cl and amended In our 8 Dorado County 11"8 14 adopClon we allow greatar 

lhan 16% gr.Ile IM1h AHJ approval and hard sll'f..:e. 

Appendix D: D103.3 Text to Include curbs and gutters Localy a:lopled and amended 
20 foot roa:I widlhs shall not include curbs and gutters due 
to potential a:cess issues and turning radius concerns. 

Where fire appaalus ir;cess roads consist d a chided 
Append°tX D: D103.5 § 1 Are appaatus ll:C8SS roa:I gales Locally adopl8cl and amended roadway the gate width shalt not be less lhan 15 feet due to 

rad'IUS issues. 

20-0203 M Page 23 of 36 



No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feel 

Appendix D: D103.6.1 Roads v.idths 20 lo 29 feel Locally adopted and amended 
in width above 5000 feel. lower tha15000 feel thls does 
not apply. This sectioo is adopted as ~ slards In the Fire 
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all other elevalions. 

Parking on ooe side ooly on roaJs from 28 feel lo 36 feel 
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feel of 

Appendix D: D103.6.2 Roads widths more than 29 feet txJt less than 36 feet in width locatty adopfed and amended elevalioo. Lower than 5000 feet lhis does not apply. The 
section Is adopted as ii slands In Ille Fire Code Appendix D 
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations. 

When required by the fire code official, a fire appaalus 

Appendix D: D104.4 Added kl require cin:umferential fire i!IJl)ir.lbJS access roaJs Locally created and adopted 
~ road shall be constructed kl encompass the entire 
struclulU and Shal p-cwide a cortinoous means of 
emergency vehicle access. 

Removed the wording that limited the section kl 30 dwellng 
For Iha safely of hi communl1fes 111111¥8 In, two ways of 

Appendix D: D106.1 
unilS. 

locally adopted .nl arnemed ing~ress ae requred lo ensure the safely of the 
residents 111d first responders. 

For the saely of hi comm111ltles 1W live In, two ways of 
Appendix 0: D107.1 ,',(lopled D107.2 Remoteness in this secilOn, Locally adopfed and .mended lngiess/egl8SS ae ~red ID ensure the safely of the 

resldenlS 111d first responders. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.2 through 101.5 Adopted ID establish scope, lnlen~ several!lity and validity Locally adopted Adminislrative clarity 

102.6 through 102.8 References, St.tjects not reglAaled by the code locally Adopled AdmlnislratiYe clarity 

102. 10 through 102.12 ConfllciirG provisions, Other Laws, Appllcallon of refeRHUS Locally Adopled Adrrinisniive clarity 

103, 1 throuah 103.4, 1 Deflrition of the Are PreWlnlion ™5ion Locally Adopted Admlnistative clarity 
104.1 IAlxltv lo enfon:e the code locally Adopled Adninisntlve clarity 
104.3 throuah 104.4 Right of Enty, Wllllllfs, and Identification Locally Adopted Administative clarity 

104.6 lhrough 104.6.4 Ra:onl relention l..ocallyAdooled Adminlstative clarity 
104.8 lhrough 104.9.2 Modlftcallons, allemale means and methods, and test Locally Adopted Admlnlstattve clarity 

104.11 through 104.11.2 Authority at fires, right ol .mlSS, maintenance of syslems Locally Adopted Adninisb'ative clarity 

104.11.3 Authority of syslems and devices inooenlble Locally Adoplsd Admlnisb'ative clarity 

105.2.3 li1111 Nmiallon al IIDDlicatlon locally Adoplsd Administralive clarity 
105.3.1 through 105.3.2 Operational permils Locally Adopted Administrative clarity 

105.6.12 
Dry cleaning operational pemilS reqlAred for hazaldous 

locally Adopted Administrative clarity 
cleailng solvent use 

PermilS for various business operations for: Magnesium, 

~ this section for a:lninistratlve clarity and fire and life 
miscellaneous combustible slorage, mobile food 

105.6.2.28 lhrough 105,6,35 locally Adopted piaparatlon Ylhlcles, mok>r fuekllspenslng facilllles, open 
safety inspections burning, open flames and m:hes, open flames and 

caidles, and organic coatings 

105.6.37 
Adopted lhis section for adnillSlralive clarity and fire and life locally Adopted PermllS for places of essemliy 
safety Inspections 

105.6.39 
Adopted this section for adninistratlve clarity and fire ard life Locally Adopted Permits for plivate fire hydranlS 
safety Inspections 

PermllS lor ~ine plastics, rafrigeralion equipment, 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 
Adopted this section for a:lninls~ claity and fire and l~e 

Locatty Adopted 
repair garages and miror fuek!ispens~ ladtilles, rooftop 

safety inspections heliports, spraying or dipping, storage al scrap tires and 
tire by-produ;ts 

105,6.48 
!AooPfec1 this section for a:lmlnlslrative clarity and fire and life 
safety lnspecllons 

locally Adoplsd Permit lor tire-rebuilding planlS 

105,6.50 
Adopted this section for a:lministrative clarity and fire and life Locally Adopted 

Permit for wood produ;ts slorage (chips, hogged ma!81ial, 
sa'ety lnspectQls lumber or plyv,ood, in excess of 200 cubic feet) 

106.1 lhrough 106.3 
Adopted this section for a:lninlstraUve cialy and fire and 1/fe Locally Adopted Fee schedlAes for permits 
safety Inspections 

107.1 
Adopled lhls section for a:lninlsntve clarity and fire and life 

Locally Adoplsd lnpectlon 8Ulhorily 
safety Inspections 

Mantenax:e d Slieguards, testing ard operation of 

Adopted this section for a:lmlristratlve clarity and fire a-d life 
equipment, re-lnspecllon and 1as11ng, recordkeepng, 

108.1 through 109.3 Locally Adopted ~. reooertng equipment mperable, OYelaUMling, 
safety Inspections 8oad of Appeals established, limitafons on authority, and 

qualifications 
. ·. 

110.3.2 lhrough 110.3.4 
Adopted this sectia1 for a:lninishlve clarity a-d fire and life Locally Adopled 

Canpllance with orders and notloes, proseculm al 
safety Inspections vlolalfoos, and unauthorized ~ng 

20-0203 M Page 24 of 36 



110.4.1 
Adopted lhls section b almlnisfrative clarity and tre and life 

~Adopted Abatement ol violation 
safely Inspections 

113.1 
Adopted this section fa' alminlstrattve clarity and fire and lffe 

Locally Adopted Authotity to disconnect service utJlilles safety inspections 

Asphalt kettles contain highly ftammable substances and 
303.1 ltvough 303. 9 Adopted lhls section b fire and life s;tety Locally Adopted require stringent safeguads (Climatic, geoioglcal, and 

IDjxJgraphlcal) 

M.m,jng lgrition sources through responsible applicalion 
305.1 tlrouogh 305.5 Adopted lhls section fa' fire and life safety Locally Adopted of staldaR:ts MIi redix:e the number ol fires In various 

settings (Climatic, geological, in! topog~) 

Adopted lhls section for fire and life safely 
Motion picture projection rooms Md Nm are HIGHLY 

306.1 ltvough 306.2. Locally Adopted flimnallle and require special handffrYJ (Cllmallc, 
geological, and topogrephlcal} 

307.1 ltvough 307.5 Adopted lhls section for fire and rde safety locally Adopted 
Open burning, ll!Crealional fire, and portable outloor 
fitepla;es, (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.1 Adop!ed this section for fire and life safety locally Adopted 
Open flcrne general requirements (Climatic, gedogfcal, and 
k>pographical) 

308.1.2 lhrough 308.1.3 Adopted lhls section for fire and rife safely locally Adopted 
ThltlYAng or ~acirg ol ignition =ces, torches for 
removing pant (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

l..ocafions near combus6ble, OIJffl name deYlces, slgnals 
and marl(ers, portable fuel open-flillle deYlces, sky-

308.1.5 through 308.1.8 (exclooing 
Adopted this section for fire and fde safely Localy Adopted 

lnlms, reriglous cerem,ntes, aisles and exits, na,,1ng 
308.1.4) food and bewlage prepnion, dispensing, conlalners not 

In use, S8IVing of flaming food. location. fire profectlon 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

308.2 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Localy Adopted 
Pemllts are required for above section (Climatic, geological, 
and topograplt:al) 

Grotip A OCQJ!)al1cies open-ftane da:orative deYiceS, 
308.3 lhrough 308.4.1 Adop!ed this section for fire and life safely Locally Adoped lheatrlcal perlOrmances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 

dormabies (Climatic, geologlcat, 1111 '1pographlcal) 

310.1 Adopted this section for fire and fde safely locally Adopted 
General requirements refaing to smoking (Climatic, 
geologlcal, aid topographical) 

310.3 Adopled this section for fire aid l"e safety Localy Adopted 
'No Smoking' signs (Cllma6c, geologlcal, and 
'1pographlcal) 

Removal of signs prohibited, compliance with 'No Smoking" 
310.4 lhrough 310.8 Adopted this section for fire and life safely Locally Adopted signs, .ti trays, burning objects, hazanloous enYlronmental 

cooditicns. (Climatic, geological, 1111 kipographlca) 

Vacant premises condillcn and safety requwemencs. 
Abaldoned piemises, renant spaces, sategmirg vacant 

311.1 lhrough 311.4 Adopted this section for fire and lffe safely Locally AdO!BI premises, security, fire prota:llon, flre seperaOon, removal 
of combustibles, removal of hazardous malerials. (Climatic, 
geological, 111d toix>!,aphlcal) 

319.1 Adopted this sectlcn for fire and life safely Locally Adopled 
General requt.-emerG relellng ID mobile food p,eparatlcn 
vehicles. (Clmatlc, geological, and topographlca) 

319.2 
Adoiud this section for alministrative clarity and fire and ife Locally Adopted 

Permits for mobile food preperafion vehicles (CRmallc, 
safety Inspections geological, 111d topographical) 

20-0203 M Page 25 of 36 



Exhausl hood, fire protection, fire prolecllon for cooki'lg 
equpimen~ fire extinguisher, appllalce comection ID luel 
supply pipi!YJ, cooking oi SIDrage conlaliiirs, metallc 
sklrage tanks, nonmetallic st>rage Iris, cooking oil 
mage system componenlS, design criteria, la!* venting, 
oorma1 vents, eineigeocy vents, LP-gas syslems, maximum 

Adopted lhis seci!on b' fire and iife saety 
.ijgiegate volt.me, protectton dcontainer, LP,18Sconlaillef 

319.3 Urough 319.10.3 locally Adopted COl151nicllon, proleclbi of syslem piping, LP,18S alarms, 
CNG syslllms, CNG contalllefS sl4'PYlng only cooldlY,I fuel, 
maximum a,Jgregale volorrie, pro~ a oontalner, CNG 
contaner conslruc1lon, CNG containeB suppi'/ing 
lranspo,alfon and cooklrg fuel, ~ d system piping, 
melhane alamls, maiillenance, exflia;I syslirn, fire 

' prolectiqn systems inf devices 111d fuel gas systems. 
(Cfimalic, geological, and !Dpographlcal) 

Emergency plaining w prepaedness In group R-2.1 
403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 Adopted lhis section for fire and IKe safety Localy Adopted (residenlial care t.r:ilities and group oomes) evacuation and 

fire saety plms. 

Group R-1 (Boadlng house, hotel, mole!) oc:cuparw;ied 
403.10 trough 403.10.1.3 Adopted this section for fire and r~e safety Localy Adopted Evacuations, diagnrns, emergency duties, (Climatic, 

geological, and topographical) 

405.5 Adopted this section for fire and rte safety Localy Adopei 
Emergency Planning and record keeping (Cllmallc, 
geological, and topographical) 

510.3 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life 

Locally Adopled 
A permit is required 1or emergency responder rallo systems 

Sllfety lnspecilons (CNma1lc, geological, and IDpographical) 

wau cove11ngs In group E ocxupMCles (Schools) sels a 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 Adopted this section for administrative clarity and fire and life 
Locally Adopled 

maxlrnoom lllllWll of flanmable wall ooverings In 
saety Inspections edll:aliond facilities (Cimatic, geological, and 

klpograj)lllca} 

An amatlc sprinkler system Is required In Group A-5 

903.2.1.5 
Adopted this section for admlnislrallve clarity ard fire and life 

Locally Adopted 
(sporting arenas, BmUsement parl( slruclureS, bleachers) 

saety Inspections (CNmatic, geological, and tlpographlcal) greater than 1000 
square feel (Cfimatic, geological, 111d topographlca) 

Emergency Responder radio amrage In existing buildings. 
Al buildings will be required b allow emergency responders 
ID receive and transmit emergency radio ~afflc; ID and l'lool 
each other and the MMHgency dispalch cenlllr. rune 
fra1l8S can be developed ID oome lnlD ~ance 111d the 

1103.2 
Adopted this section for the safety ol firefighters and other 

locally Adopled phasing in of a system o'll!r a period rJ Hme, delennlned by 
emetgency responders. the fire code officld, is acceptable. The rationae behind 

this sectlOn Is that on almost all emergency responder ~ 
or lalalty Incidents cormnrkatlon is a key Issue. Tlis 
slruallon can be corrected with the addilion d radio 
eqlipment ID boost the s1gna In areas that do not have 
s~ signal. (Cllmatlc, geological, and topographlca) 

Appendix D: 0101.1 through Adol)ted this section for the saety d the public, firefighters, 
locally Adopted General requirements for fire apparatus aocess roads 

0102.1 111d other emefllency responders. lnclullng loads. (Clmatlc, geological, and IDpographlcal) 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, firefighters, Dead end fire app.ntus aocess road reqtirernenls for a 
Appendix 0: 0103.4 111d other emergency responders. 

locally Adopted tum arourd at 150 feel (Cli~c. ~. and 
IDpograJtical) . 

Appendix D: 0103.6 
Adopted tNs section for the safety a hi public, firefighters, 

locally Adopled 
"No Pllloog, Fire Lane" signs requirements, (Climatic, 

111d other emergency responders. geological, 111d lopographlca) 

AppendlX O; 0104.1 through Adopted this section b' the safety of the public, firelighlels, 
Locally Adopled 

Corrwnerclal and Industrial development fire apparatus 
0104.3 (excluding exceploo) and other emergency responders. access roads. (Cllmatlc, geological, and lopographlcal) 

AppendlX O: 0105.1 lhrough Adoflted this section for the s.tely of the public, firefighters. Locally Adopted Reqlirements b' ala fire apparatus access roads 
0105.4 and other emergency responders. (Climallc, gecloglcal, llld IDpographlca) 

Appendix 0: DI06.1 lhrough Adopted INS section lor the safety a tie public, firetlghlers, 
Locally Adopled 

Are appaatus accass roads fllr multipie-fanify ~ 
0106.3 (excluding exoeplons) 111d other emergency responders. developments (Cflmatic, geological, and fl:llJOl,aphlcal) 

AppendlX D: 0107.1 lv'Ough Adopted this section for the safety a fie public, firefighte,s. · 
One- or ll'«>d'Mllring reslderilal developments shal be 

~yAdopied •. eqlipped ltinii,/1out v.ith lY,o sperate and approved fiie 
0107.2 (excluding~) 111d olher emergency responders. apparatus aci:esa roads due ID IDpographlc, geograpl1lc 111d 

clinatic condlllons. 

20-0203 M Page 26 of 36 



Appendix 0. 0108 AdoptEd this section fa' the safety of the public, ft~. 
Locally Adopted 

Adopt referance standards deal~ wilh gate construction 
and other emeigency resp()OOelS. slaldards (Climatic, geological, and i:lpographlca) 

Grey cells are previously 
amended, adopted, or 
changed code sections that 
are being adopted again in 
this code cvcle. 
White cells are newly 
amended, adopted, or 
changed code sections that 
differ from previous code 
adoptions. 

20-0203 M Page 27 of 36 



Marshall Cox 

From: 
Sent 
To: 

Stephanie Layton <slayton@re«uef.redepartrnentorg> 
Monday, October 28, 2019 10:13 AM 
Marshall Co>< 

Subject Fwd: Confirmation of Scheduled Publicatf on'. Notice of Public Hearing - Notice of Intent to Adopt 
2019 Fire Code 

---- Forwarded message -­
From: Letals <legals@mtdemocrat.n~t> 
Date: Fri, Oct 25, 2019 at 11;44 AM 
Subject, Confirmallon of Scheduled Publication: Notice of Public Hearing· Notice of Intent to Adopt 2019 Flre Code 
To; Stephanie Layton <slayton@rescuefiredepartment.org> 

Confirmation of Scheduled Publication: Notice of Public Hearing - Notice of Intent to Adopt 
2019 Fire Code 

-:~fris}As}~]Newspaper Mountain Democrat 
;},]Pub date(s)'. ~s}~110/30/19, 11/1/19 
Ref ad#: J~11-7077 
Charges: $ ~1!'ltk,[~}~i75.00 

Thank you for publishing in our newspaper. 

Allison Rains - Public NoticeS::~\~: 
Mountain Democrat - Georgetown Gazette Newspapers 
legals@mtdemocrat.net - legals@gtgazette.com ~t~! 
(530)344-5086 ... fax (530)344-5092 

On Oct 24, 2019, at 8:28 AM, Stephanie Layton <~layton@rescuefirer1ep,irtment..org> wrote: 

Good morning! 

Please publish the attached notice in the Mountain Democrat the two earliest dates possible? 

Thank you, 
Stephanie 
<PUBLIC NOTICE Of INTENT 2019.pdf> 

20-0203 M Page 28 of 36 



I I 
r • A 

Attachment No. 2 

RFPD Resolution No. 2019-08 

20-0203 M Page 29 of 36 



. , 

RESCUE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

RESOLUTION 2019-08 

Resolution of the Board of Directors Adopting Findings Supporting Amendments to 
the Fire Code 

WHEREAS, the Rescue Fire Protection District Board (Fire Department) 

intends to adopt an ordinance adopting the California Fire Code, 2019 Edition, and 

prescribing regulations governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the 

environment from fire, explosion, hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological and topographical 

conditions existing within the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the 

District to impose more stringent requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code 

pursuant to California Health and Safety Code sections 13869. 7 and 17958. 7, the District 

desires to make express .findings to that effect 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Rescue Fire Protection 

District (Fire Department) hereby adopts the following findings concerning current unique 

local conditions that together make each modification to the California Fire Code, 2019 

Edition, reasonably necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life, property 

and the environment. 

CLIMATE 

1. Precipitation. Average annual precipitation ranges from approximately 25 to 32 

inches per year. Approximately 88% of the average rainfall occurs during the 

months of November through April and 12% from May through October. This 

area has experienced major droughts in the last two decades: 1986 -1991, 1998 -

2003, 2007 - 2009, and 2011 - 2015. It is possible that more droughts will occur 

in the future based on the weather cycle pattern. 

20-0203 M Page 30 of 36 



. , 
I ' 

2. Relative Humidity. During the swnmer months (May through September), the 

daily hwnidity generally ranges arowid 20% and occasionally drops to the low 

teens. 

3. Temperatures. During the summer months (May through September), the daily 

temperatures corrunonly exceed 90 degrees Fahrenheit, with temperatures 

having been recorded as high as 115 degrees. 

4. Winds. The summer prevailing winds are out of the south and southwest. 

However, north winds occur during the spring (April and May), the fall 

(September and October), and occasionally during the summer months (June, 

July and August). Velocities are generally in the range of five to fifteen miles 

per hour, gusting to 30 miles per hour during the sununer months. 

SUMMARY 

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity and size of fire in 

the commwrity. Times of little or no rainfall and high temperatures create extremely 

hazardous conditions, particularly as they relate to residential roof fires and wildfire 

conflagrations. The climatic conditions are one of the greatest impacts to fire 

behavior and other major emergency events due to their uncontrollable nature. 

GEOGRAPIDC AND TOPOGRAPIDC 

1. Geographic Location. ·Rescue is located in the foothills of the Sierra at an 

altitude of approximately 1,214 feet above sea level. 

2. Size and Population. The Rescue Fire Protection District (Fire Department) 

encompasses approximately thirty-three (33) square miles and has a current 

20-0203 M Page 31 of 36 



' , 

population of approximately 2,500-3,000 residents with a projected population 

increase, due to new residential development. 

3. Seismic Location. The nearest identified fault zone running through the District 

is the Bear Mountain Fault. lltls fault zone is split into several branches which 

transect the area between Folsom and Shingle Springs. The closest branch 

passes through the middle of our neighboring fire district, El Dorado Hills, along 

the western edge of Browns Ravine. The next nearest extension of this fault 

system is located immediately at the north end of the District, and extends from 

the southeast ann of Folsom Lake, north to the City of Auburn. No recent 

geologic activity has been observed along this fault. However, studies of the 

east branch of the fault zone, conducted by Woodward-Clyde Associates for the 

Aubwn Dam, and by Tierra Engineering Consultants near Folsom Lake, indicate 

that the fault may be reactivating based on recent tectonic trends and should be 

considered potentially active. 

4. Topography. The topography of the District varies from level to terrain with 

over a 40% slope. The greatest degree of slope occurs throughout the District. 

Hilly terrain throughout the area provides gullies or areas referred to as 

"chimneys" which accelerate the spread of fire. 

5. Roads and Streets. The District has narrow roads and driveways, which do not 

always connect, decreasing the ability for traffic to circulate. With an increase 

of vehicular traffic from neighboring areas development and tourism, it causes 

congestion which can have a direct effect on the response time of emergency 

apparatus. 

20-0203 M Page 32 of 36 



'Ill • , 

• 

SUMMARY 

The above geographic and topological conditions increase the magnitude, exposure, 

accessibility problems and fire hazards that the Department must handle. Fire 

following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life and damage 

to property than the earthquake itself. 

Other variables may tend to increase the situation: 

I. The damage that may occur to the water system, and; 

2. The extent ofisolation due to roadway damage, overpass collapse and debris 

blocking the roadway. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of the Rescue Fire Protection District this 

/ tJ / 1 JI tf 2019 by the following vote: r t 

AYES:~ 

NOES: 6)­

ABSENT: e 

Matt Koht, President 

A'ITEST: 

;... 

20-0203 M Page 33 of 36 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
101.1 X Admin 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 {d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

503.2.5 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ical 

503.2.6 X Climatic/G eologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

509.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra p h ica I 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ical 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

20-0203 M Page 34 of 36 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/T opographica I 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 X Climatic/Geological/f opographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 4.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/f opographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix B: Table B105.l(l) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix B: Table B105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 
Appendix 0: 0103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix O: 0103.2 X Climatic/Geological/f opographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phical 
Appendix 0: 0103.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix D: 0104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

101.2 through 101.5 X Admin 

102.6 through 102.8 X Admin 

102.10 through 102.12 X Admin 

103.1 through 104.1 X Admin 

104.3 through 104.4 X Admin 

104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin 

104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin 

104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin 

104.11.3 X Admin 

105.2.3 X Admin 

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin 

105.6.12 X Admin 

105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin 

105.6.37 X Admin 

105.6.39 X Admin 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin 

105.6.48 X Admin 

105.6.50 X Admin 

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin 

107.1 X Admin 

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin 

110.4.1 X Admin 

113.1 X Admin 

20-0203 M Page 35 of 36 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
303.1. through 303.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

305.1 through 305.5 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

306.1 through 306.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

307.1 through 307.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra phica I 

308.1.S through 308.1.8.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.2 X Admin 

308.3 through 308.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.1 X Climatic/Geological/T opographica I 

310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

310.4 through 310.8 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

311.1 through 311.4 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra phica I 

319.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phica I 

319.2 X Admin 

319.3 through 319.10.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

403.10 through 403.10.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

405.S X Admin 

510.3 X Admin 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.1.S X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1103.2 X Topographical 

Appendix O: 0101.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

0102.1 
Appendix D: D103.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: D103.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix D: D104.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

D104.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: D105.1 through 

D105.4 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0106.1 through 
X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra p h ica I 

D106.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix D: D107.l (excluding 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

exceptions) 

Appendix D: D108 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opographical 

20-0203 M Page 36 of 36 


