RESOLUTION NO. 040-2020

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO
(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 016-2017)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is
updated by the State every three years; and,

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter
1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulations to the
local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her
authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of
the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on November 14, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Georgetown Fire Protection
District adopted Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with
amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical
conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado
ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Georgetown Fire Protection District and delegates enforcement
of the ordinance to the Georgetown Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections:

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4 through
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1. 507.5.1,
509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 903.2.10,
907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905 .4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1,
5601.2.2,5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 through 6112.3, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80
NFPA 13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section
7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table B105.1 (1), Appendix B:

Table B105.2, Appendix DI103.1 through D103.3, Appendix DI103.5 Section 1, Appendix DI03.6.1,
Appendix DI103.6.2, Appendix D104.4.

20-0203 H Page 1 of 41



Resolution No. 040-2020
Page 2 of 2

The Georgetown Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its
entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2018 edition
not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403.2.1-403.2.4, 403.3, 403 .4,
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12,
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5.2.3), 808,
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106,
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception), D106.1 (Exception), D107.1
(Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J,
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 California
Fire Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said

Board, held the 10 day of _March , 2020, by the following vote of said Board:
Ayes:Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin Novasel

Attest: Noes: None

Kim Dawson Absent: None

Clerk ofithe Board of Supervissss

Bk Ve

Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Bbard of Supervisors

Deputy Clerk

20-0203 H Page 2 of 41



CLORCETOWN PIRE LISTRNT

~iv . Wi, o mAR AR o A
[ »e o8 alliad P EE -~ -

S _--ﬂ.-, Vel wud i 31 Id..ir v’u o 3:: ‘}h
- Wem (AAW NP AN M Bl
tracrpre s ,,'t ARAA 4 pt
NG RN ; due ' Gabd wdil Gtre!
'1'."1‘{"-.%,‘!,?'»{\-& P g ey et ¥ib “".’“ Nommmas aesea e . Anna iom
WAL ani fir “‘a, SO NS BRI HIL Sy SSL-.UE(? Jazi el

December 18, 2019

Don Ashon, Chiel Admimstrative Officer
El Dorado County Board of Supenisors
330 Fair Lane

Placerville, CA 95667

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Georgetown Fire Protection District,
which adopts the 2019 Cslifornia Fire Code with amendments related to local climatic,
geographic and topographic conditions.

Degr Mr. Ashton:

The Georgetown Fire Protection Distnict (GEO) 15 requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOSH randy its
Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopts the 2019 California Fire Code as amended due o specibic locil climutic,
geoyraphic and topographic conditions, Califomin Health and Salety Code Section 13866 7 requires the
legisiative body of the city or county where the ordinance will apply 1o ratify, modity or deny the adopiod
ordinance The BOS must also delegate entorcement ol the ordinance to either the Fae Distnict {or s
representative) or the Chret Building Oflicial,

Theretore. we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance N, 2009.01 with mtendments (o the
2019 Cslifornia Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance o the Georgetown Fire Protection
District Chiet. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for your review and use on this wopic.

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County.

Glenn W. Brown
Fire Chief

ATTACHMENTS
| Gevrgetown Fire Proteaitvn Phamict Undinance Mo 207400

2 Georgetown Fue Preses ton Drotrict Fiasdany of Fact Resolotion Noe 20§94
3. Dreft Ef Dorade Coenty BOS Rewlutn

simtanmer heloe s Varokbons  Minoe | AP
e fowilding ;‘mﬂi‘{ﬂ.”’ Niired eve

20-0203 H Page 3 of 41



Attachment No. 1
Georgetown Fire Protection District

Ordinance No. 2019-01

20-0203 H Page 4 of 41



AFORGETONWN FIRE PROTEC TION DINTIIJC

DRDINANCE NO, Ht.0)

BT oBa AT D 0 T HOARDY OF DIREOTTORS (8 GEORGETOWN Flict
PROTECTION IMS TR AS FOLEOWNS,

A0 anfanee of CikOrgeiows Five Presteetaon Dt iU ssdopting: the 2010 Yditien ol 0 alilorrbo,
Sree Casde corpondting the 2088 Suditen of e dnserngnesal Fire Cod s roulata and gos snong thr oty uendiane
o fife and propeny from fre and wapdoaion Lasaras angegy o 1the domege. andhnge amd ke o) Ly
wibetgnons, matenals and deviced, and troar condittan: zandots 1o e of Piocert o e ey of Bolioy
and prenees in b0y providing for the bsomece of permmite wd cotiestanof teme Vherchar depesiing Orndman Ha
Sl af e s b oty crdinances aed prens ol e snteees s cast i heresah

Pe st ORI MY L e Bt of Thipavesr nf 5pin b bpne s s Ulhumg s woe Pl e 1 i,

Secnen b RISDINGS OF FAC TN

srctives TOMDMOPTION OF CODF WITH EXCLISINN

Aot 5 LOC AL ASMESNDMENTS

ety A ‘;“‘:\’L i !
srrea TSR VERARULTY
c EFFRCTINE DATE AN PERBLICAT{ON

i
®
>

SECTION - FISDINGS OF FACTS

o e atmen shanpe ol roe bl sothe s e Euen Unahe N9 Badivion, pursuang wo £

Sheen P T e Sl T g SRl b durine the safe pdopiion progesss Soch ey e
wrnesare besains ol tecad slapgrn povogiead eredfor eapeweaphici? conditione GED fag gdupied o et s
g edy o ap the Cultformiag Theadih & afore ¢ e, e Tindmiey wb facts relanve 10 iess candion 1

)

Faomonbuson gt p 880 el Dhctobwey fU, Heby

SECTION 20 ADOFTION OF CODE WELH FXCLUSIONS

T M

el adupee flee JUDE it e Bewe 0 e 1 et s epbirely ol ladrs Snpeeiios

corperating e svvtionn ef the favepiezsong Dorc Ccds, JOLE cibhitor mot sdeprad by e srate wildy the

pactisions fisiend bebnw,

tiedinatge UMY Fage L adts

20-0203 H Page 5 of 41



Exctusgars Tuisn 0 bone 19 (S q B B V) Mo T3, FHTa, 208 Q00 0 03 0 2 g s
A S M3 03T W aradoptog AR DS ST t0d g w0 1o T 03 T 6 000 S 1S, W01 -
ABE AR A0S0 a 40T deg B R deptieg B0 T BGS 008 T 161 O3], ol 3 1iods, Pinh
vedoptife P G T T CRE e Dagder T5 0 hapioe Do the exceptions ander DO CEaeephion,
Dol rbvcepnons DI b sceptont Appodia A, Appemdin B, Appendic Fo Appemdis 13, Appendix ),

Appendix FLoAappendis L, Appendin bt

Appendices nat adopted cancbe wed (o petenee foenfirciing hee sections of de 2009 Califiruie Fire Ui

SECTION 3: LOCAL AMENDNMENES

The illowing Secuions are herely amended or wdidod
Chapter |
Section 101 Scope sngd General Reyyirenyents

1001 Title shuil he amended o follows: Add seime it urtvdnnn jGECY

Sectiva 108 Permils

108.6.17 LPG-gas sholl ve pnendal ux hedloas, Add Boths exgephionl AL oF ghove 51471 teet !

eleyation. 3 permil is 7 reguired B vndo dind Sontinersoa b oo d 25 allon woter capacity aor lesy,
e

o TTRULTEE GO DR SEAtenn BV 30 wggrdrale Guaity not osceeding 135 gallons serving

O RATIN BN ol ST

Necttnn Hio Fees

L6 Permit, Plan Revivw and tnspecting Fees shitli be wdded s Dodlows o schoddude of fies

bzt il o (e JGTrICE et cd direcars (o plan ceviess psgmectinies apd the foeee of pormits b
e uner ok Mgy e fownd T rhe moxt curraan disivicn fee sehedule sHeoith & Sopere € cede §e

106.6.1 Cast Recovery Fees shall be added an bodboss: Fire servire foes mene bue chiavgad b7 [0

pwrsun fiom, curpoeaiie o fasiness that resgh aegliscnce. iy agdiort of fhre birwe e s v eovalt o
coreadiaaten s, Sy eoxpemyile fov e conse OF S GIstricl i respomd 1v the soene o8 e menfont,
Aisterer frosod moy Charge o fee tosaver The cost af sy vorvicy which the disiricy Fiecvades ar e g

sof i cingg ety sostlations fow which the 32 dccharged (Health & Sageny Cede LR0IA The foo kgl
ncf e xcesd thie gl vosi of vappressing the fire andior rexpanding o the v G e uncidend

LM T Adipipgstentive Costs shal! be added as follows Bhon e oo impecnson @ see fuitnd oy

the comroc oy Sy do Jhhorm e e S G of A2 attery havies sarendlothea AN e AT
iy Bdl s coenicron e et time Ypent S Lo Bome i e iy e ion fangton s d

fhe timsy wpicnt gt o et e s w ol 8 sdmmoir e et

Clrdipancy 2019 Gy Page Ll it

20-0203 H Page 6 of 41



Nection VOY Board ol Appeais

- Section 149.4 Appeal Procedures aod Timelines snadi he adited 32 vallows: e porson ar vafire wino

helivves the ) rcy e aidversily affected by order decision. ar detzeminutivn made b the fice code
cfficial throwgh o written puticnt may appeal This matter within 13 calemdor davs of the pastonirk on
the nairo. AN yuch apgeals shull be Aled in wreiting wirh the Secretary of the Giverping Board for
the districi, A tmaly appoal shall stay gurther aotion by the fre code official umil the maiter s
depermined by the Appeal Board ax entlined in Section 1092, unlzsy the (s pases an imminest Jiee
or life safery hasard to members of the puhlic. The fire code opficial shall noiify the agppellanr by
certified mail nf the dare and tme of such feoring, The hearing xhall be scheduled o rake place no
sooner than 20 culendur duvy friem the date xhown on the certitied mail. The appellant shall hove the
right 10 appear in person or b agent ol the haing and preserg orais weitien andior photoyraphic

evidence to the Appeal Board

Section £ 10 Violations

- 104 Vigiatiog Penglties <half be amended as fellows: Persons who shall violate a provision ol this
ade ot shall 1ail (o comply with any af the pzquirements terzof or who shuli zrect, nsall, alter,
repalr or Jo work 0 vialatton of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code
official, or of a permit or cenifivate wed onder provistons of his code, shall be guiity of a
misidemeanor ar intrasten b the diycrenot of e prosecuting attorgey oF agency, punishable by o
Vine nixg excecding S FUOING foe o frso violation: 2 A fine nor ceceeding: STO0.00 far o secoed Violutive
ot the same provision within one Year; 3.4 fine oot exceading 31000 00 for each additiona! viojaticn
uf the same prowision widhin ane pear, or by impisonment nos esceeding J80 davs, ar both such e
and imprisonment.  Each duy that 4 violaion conlinues atter due notiee has been served shall be

e Secinws L3145 anmd 17945

i

deemed g separate oltense, (Healih & Safery O
110.4.2 Citatives shid! b added s follows:  The Fire Chvefl or hodher duly onthrized
vepresertabive, muy (Ssue Ciraliony for infractions or etisidemeaetor violadions o this code pursuani o
Saotion 1ARZ L of the Health & Sufety Code of the State of Califernia ond Chaprer S (commencing

with Section 833,04 of Thie 3 o7 Part 2 ot the Pfenal Code of the State of Cidiforn

Section £12 Stop Wark Order

- 112.4, Failure to Comply shall be smended as follows: Any person who shall continue uay work

after having been served with g stop-work order. excemt such work as thai person iy directed Lo
perform 1o remave a violaton or unsafe condition, shull be punishabls by a five or imprisonment or

torh s ddesoeibiod pn Sevrion DHO A (Tl & Sagery Code Sccnony 3043 and | 7993)

edinance 200000 fage 3ol 18

20-0203 H Page 7 of 41



Chagter 2

- Sectiog 202 Generul Dy finitivay

Sdddo e o Camplire - SRl mean o fire whteh i waed foe vocoking, persianiad warmtly, lvhing,
e gestheric purgeavas T inciudvs fres comtaamod within owtider Sirvgstinees ged cnclpoced st
with flues ar chimrain, stoves sandm sollived Tigurd e sididd fuciv. portablc barbeee piis, Seasices o
spuce Bedring devices which are awred ousice o any stowdurs, mobile hoste g oy Hving
Lo mmitatian mounted on o vehicle

Add detinition for Distriet - Shall mean the disera g andall sther areas within e cete piw foviowdaniv
dhereaf now or hercatter vstablished

Add definition for Delveway - Shull mvon oo velividir coce ot i serves s maors than s o diniges
with nct more than three hwelling ueiis om e single parc ol amd uny amber 38 oo casory buiddiens
Add detinition for Executive Body - Shall mean the Board :f Dhrectoes of the Diverict

Adi detinition for Fige Chief - Skl mean the hiet Execulive Fire (e of the Firg
dupartmentiisteict serving the Jursdivtion o g dily audfiorizod represdmipan

Akt Jetisition v Trained Crowd Manaper - Shall smos spacdhy g coonoed gl @ sooneads

srmard o weher persoemel s Booare trained o thE o s Froviluey o e300 penply frovm o ip el op wibers

FHI o ;u;}u‘ig asyemblizgs or an ordardy QS CUGR PESIITN I OIC £VEN OF QA £RTECOR Y

Chapter 3

Sectiog 302 Definitinas

3021 Definitioay bt he grenged 3z selfowse Added Capiine definiiom, ue shown abuve in

Lot

Seciion 307 Opeg Burniang, Recreational bires, and Qutdoor Fireplaces
307 4.4 Campfire Restrivtions shab be added as tollows:

ML LA Tror nluwtul for e pesgn B AL MGG, 06 1IE T CAMPJIES 1M SF near any Yo

Cered demed trais - rd Laend e Sseesiaanvonsid Land dwrirr the lime whien hurning permics are
s M d B e flecens cn Ve Deparemey o) Feecary and Fiee Pronection. the CAL FIRE L
Chict e the A11S

Exception: { annnercid cviing opwrativoy with aggrovad of ihe A HS
IO A2 Hiemcampstines are cfivovesd ot shend fo wunlawiud for amye porson o liphe, prooradn. e ase
Goamptier upsoes arn fesevkicocered faed xrasvacavered o, or foesstconvered fand ainle vt the

et e e pvigeare il e coopgilted with

AT 442 ) PR oo wathan 5 e of phe geRipsieny of the camptive S cleared sy oall flammakrd

marerial and vepeation.

sredinance ZD1U0L Page 4o i

20-0203 H Page 8 of 41



0T 4.4.2 (b e sl shoved warkh o handle vartat leasy 12 inches 5 oecady for use ol Ve
rmmodiale aeeo 9f the samgtire,

J0T 482 (o) Camptirex skt be limsted Gz F pa B [ focd area, unfess in e apprieed mamnfocssiced
vociking iy o ties ring

MT A2 (B Bricen permisstan of the fandeswner munt ke obiained priar ta the jenition of the

sumpgitorg and shadi be on it

Chapter S

Section SU3 Fire Apparatus Access Roads

S3.2.1 Dimeasiogy shal 52 amendsd s llows: Fire apparatus accesy mady sicdl bave an
anobstructed width of pat fess than 28 feay, caclasive of shoalders. as measiecd from Joce of curk o

curh, wxcept for approved secunity gates in accondaice with Secnan SOL6. and unonbatructeid

wertizal olearance of net less than /3 oo Al drivesways in the duerice ihall nog b fese tha 17 oo

wide.

£03.2.5 Dead Fade shatl be amendad g fothess Dreadaond o apprautis actess foadt und devew i
iy eveess of 150 feet i fenpth shadl be pooveded with win appeoved area for wiemivg arvumd e
apparditis,

A0)3.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces il be amended s fobhies Whese a biridge or anelevatud

surface v part of o Fre gpedrabio weccss foed, the tndee Sl e coosteucred and peiinitained i
accordance with thecurrent B Dvaepfec oty Dravpestation Pvicion Bridee Stamdird e dpnomdis
DV ihe sureent Cilicorsgy Eire trane, slpcbonss o mtnge vininn Live Bridee s ad clevated ohrlacs,
shall he desgued O 3 e Tod ~aaficiens to s the anjoead disads o0 Hee sppamines Volucde Lo
fimitx shall e posted ol Beth entaies B Pefoe b ioginred by Wi Flre Coale Cithicial, Where
elovitud sartaves designed for emeigency vebuclo i e Sucenm tisorfaces s e ot de il
ot wuch e, dPpinved buTien, sppouved stens ar bodt <hall be wistalled and maintaimed wien
required by the fire codde otficial

S03.4.0 No Parkipg wn Fire Lapes shuii be wlded e tetlown Yo pervon vhaild EHET % . S frise
siarsfong amevehn les wleher attebind se wrattoeded ceepd Shes sonesaar i e avad o el wiik
b gagfic o dn compdean with the decctiony S e Piee Cheelo o hisdher uly atthoeszad
reprrdsgrtaa, Pevee Pifieer ge officiad eatfic coateod device ulemy the vave ofany fugwae o anye
cark o g any finatte g peblich or pedvidely osiesed e paeeatiod gt parking i
tenaertuboid ccr fere dinee e The dsten taeih sl b ttome e thy Gre an whichthe puice B Secatd
P deagenting wburdl B anebiosatodd ¢50 P g sagen psnd o o tobedy ol vat 1o wnd v ible rom i
dvatenagod pdice clearl v stadieg e fetter s not Leooctiansne 0 W in heagha thet e ploce (s g fre fane

120 v ooy or punntiys the phace inced and . in camtrastony cildir marking the placy wilh the

fnditunwe NIV Yee §af 1A

20-0203 H Page 9 of 41



s FPRET AN wch are sty wisible b g voliolo o ur 130 Bvogred curd o ved petitet
P e b Gf the eadwiy upven wnes « clearly murked the words CFIRE LANE"

i34V No Puekipga in Fcont of Blvdraogs bt beoadded av tollows: Vo peesonn chall stp joiek, or

bl aey sekucle within 15 el of G fire Insdrone excegt as folfoies, g I the vebicte g

atternded b eenasd derver whio s veated in the froni seat aud whi cun immedianly st ssch
wedti e A e s meemeviey, P A the vehicle is owned ar aperaied by pie o ,ir'; wartenong aead i foarie
mutrked s o fiee egearrment vehieln,

503.4.4 bire Lupcy Based ua Road Width shall be added as follows, Fire lanes shalf by bused oo
roend width iy regriresd in Appedin 13 s somended By the disieicr

503.5.3 Firg Apparatus Aceess Gates sholl e odded a5 follaws 41 automane amd manud §ites

imstalied crver fire appararms access eonsds dhaldl compdyv with the Jistriel gate stanmdurd s aprroaed

by the fire coxde official

- Neetion SOS Promise [dentification

- 8054 AdJress fdepdficativg Rt bave she first Dine oF (hic paragranh amendod gy Gl

Adefiosawy fie oo ove i oaniant Buoddfonie bl comp s wath the sdirerict pdaress vardand s A rasaed

S rhe Jire v attiolil

- Sectien 307 Fire Protections Water Supplies

ENT.S5.1 Where Reguired shalt e amoneled as palboswe a0t fect shall be amended o 753 feer

- Sevtion SO9.0 Fare Contral Raam

S04.3 Fyre Control Raom Sors Prosiecen st Sy Egupmeead Lepttfioaroon qod Ao, 5 Sweeis
amernded b addine s fodliowing fr oaed Viee speinklor eivers, fire olarm conrol panls. yolar
gl slaie pewar dvaiem rapdd shunif owiiches, and otker fire dewction, suppression, o similue
cemipid ywiiohes ghaf bo located invide o stagle fire contred room for the huilding, The fice conirsd
room shall hove smeircdimensions of fve feer by seven fovt in sise with a toial useable urea of st
fezy thary 33 gqueers fout The rescm vl e Tocared Within e buitading on an owtside wall ar a facation
cioproved By ghue Fiee Code OR el aned shadl b aectss B fromphd exterior. Anexierion socezs dore
with a clear width of not leex thart 373 inchés ard o ight sor hisy thaw 8O (nehey shall ke provided
Sor gicesy imto the rovm. A durabde siger sholl be affived o the execion of the door with the worids

FIRE CONTROL ROOM" i Ltiers nol begs Bam o jrahes o heyths 4 by beg compiiine with
Secocr SO0 shall b wisialle d on the sxreriae cde of the Jiey vl soom done opemmy. Tae room
must be capable or paintaining: a nuriem Gemparrdture ot Hdverees Fahrephei A clesvaese of
12 inches shall boe provided from the fivg speinkior risers 1o gny adiacenl walls, This room cde he

shared Wk orber heidding utitities v fice peafcclion cpnipmont that e compatthic An approved
Ordinance 2019.01 Page 6 of (5

20-0203 H Page 10 of 41



“ebiner wr comtgings kil e provicled saeare record plans of the fire sprimklor susiem, othir fire

S sk vipideiesstaend ol plart. This eaoem il pet beowsed foe any other seorage

Chapter ¥

Section W3 Fire Spanklers

3.2 Where Regyired shalt be amended as foliows: Ap dppeoved auomatc spnnkler xystey shall
i raguired drmd oritulivd i adw bl fings and swuctures 3000 square et or greatt whisr
s fruc sl o relorated within thy suriaficiiom ae desenihed in Sections 903,200 thecajeh w0702 12

Exception: Agricitural punidings nat under 3 speaial use remnt used for commareial pusposes,

- 903.2. Where Required 5hai be added as feolaws St oF casiens dwilding s vreaner than 30t

sQuare fet (nveisting brckdings 3500 squore oot or Sroaior, aokue than one ord (wo-tamnly dwclfing
unies, and agriculiural bundings no: draer specicl ke peamit tor crmmercial purpoges, whers
Sloiy areg of the builiding or striciure 0 iireased bv an auddhiton 8 more thon thiey percem ¢ 105 o
or {0 sgtiare teel whichever 5 lrn swch Fuslding o siruciies shall he made b mgorm b B ctlon
Wil

903.2.b Where Reguired shai be added xn folovas Seadng (o0 cwisting Pudidimgs (oo an 1400

syuare ool nexisting hudidings 3 606 squere joct or {ess crhee shan ame-aed two-pomsv dweliine
urts, el agricudtur sl Puiidings red wnder specia usy pooma Jer commeroial parrancs whare ithe
Sfiowr areo of the brdfding o struetury g inTrvg ol e Trdl Sptinry fotagie vever Toaitl st et
Froam st iy o o phae thisty pooeeond s [ squaizee f ot wlidelbse ver o e gl indidin
ar xsiructere shall be muacde oo cromform mo Section Vil [

= 90321 Group A shall be amended e fatlow s for & pocaps S8 throteby o400 [ H The frs

area excesds T 60 syuiare hevi

- 903.2.3 Grogp Foshalt be ametnjod as Moftoewes 3032 100 Thrauphout atd Grosip B jire greas prealer
than 3 AF sguare feef in area.

- 903.2.4 Gryup -1 shell be amended as follows: 903 28 Giaop B 90X 24 01) A Lroop | Bre area
rxCeeds A0 wpuare fesl.
03 2.7 Group M shall Beoamenifod an Gl g D2 T Clpeape e d MO 9032 TETEA Group Hoand
M fire nrew exveeds SO square fraf,
9)3.1.8.2 nufactyred Homys shall be odded o fedlows: Ao automatic fire sprinkler osivm {h;:,’;‘.
B rogrdred b ali e mannpactured homaes and mudti-fomdy mantiitenad bomes infonded e ae
sz ey ned fw-daeifv cwedtione The dfesiyes ard trotrtlotom s avaer oot mee shall b in avoowineie.s
with iy O e o Resmodiony. Flde D30 S don

Exceptinnn:
£ Mummducmred homes Bncated wichin ars exastons mobidchome park campiving with

¢ aledeoreticr Health vem £ Safety Conde, Ddvisgom 13, Paeg 20 or 23

e bnanee ZHREY Page 7 of 16

20-0203 H Page 11 of 41



2 Managaeieed ey tha 3o oaor oxcoed 8200 square tecr o size g e ax ain

ooy dwelfling wna i dofined i Gavernmoent Crate Seotiont 658502 when e

CVISHHE priveary rosidence o The proper e 85 nol pegnired (00 ooy wagh Calitimnic

1

Resudoniial ol Section R313 ]
b Mampaciured homes that o aot exceed 320 syudre oot jn size,

D033 e N-1 Rl sz amended as foliows: 903,29 Groop 5, 9032 901 A Gioup S Gee area

cxceads 3 A vt govf

1.1 440 Groap S-2 Enclosed Puarkiay Guraves shali be amended as tollows, 9032 {0901} Whete

the fire area 2F the zncinsed parkiny warage exgends J AN spuure foee

- Section 907 Fir nd Detection Systems
¢t shall he shtiect

as trclows: A0 approved firg alarmedeteonion syatem shall e dnstatled o all aibdings with o flooy

(o3 than 3 AN sguare oot

Exceptinns:

carkf gbharr as RO INIRY 1'1-"13\",’[!“'!(

D Ones undd vecfuamaly e i (83 P Accupane

O Auricsineeal Balldins eow wnder spaeciad wv prosmet amdicae wog devod for commarciinl
FRYERIE G A ey - ains] S worvioe sl or s pccnad avvenr

Bupthdregn wetdha tloe s oo Bhain SO0 e vy ey S oy anpl, Gy defermined

ey

by the Fire c0ier e bucher iy aubiseizcid repecventining . foased on builidivgg

SEMMNEC A i Pt r L et foitares Loy adin NI Ty covd cfistanest dos

LT!*I!I‘I'.A'_T
T2 b Stetyy of Eajstisy Buldings shuaid b alddied o t0iloas S contug daicfings wthicsus e
appreved dheatic spebler o pdem uGne than cere s o twafamdy el um, ayrioultuesd
builiinge moad sonider pctal wse permil Jor commercitd purgases shses a fire alurm detection 1ytem
dowa ot e M oo she flocr aoer of P Jadichaig; or steactit ey pterdaved o0 medifivd by omiee than
Dty pepionf TIPS G TN S pusire Frep whicbaves L lovs ik bulldmg or Sieucturs sholl B made
T cstfornt b Seetiosy Q7 bt roguiredf b tha Tire s ik e BasRer ity akithowized LS TOTe
Hhetldemgn sweetht g Pl sireis lean chon MHG aguire teed mdy be wrempt g determined by the Firg Chief,
ve fsdeee chalv aniiherized ropresestiive heived fw‘l.“cfﬁtgf U NP GO I8 ] P ey,
Lowtatfoo s ipdm v Svpe, L Jintanes Lo sgpovtcan
NW7.2.¢ Monitagigg shai! be wlded as tnBowss i free Jlaeat detecien avide o thall b cannccted
dirsctiv threngeh and menityredd by S E apypriccedd Comirad pRopeictany ar reémoid jaion service
whicch tves ctelibie el vovvad sgemaels a8 o coaestandic atesded livation Al speindicrad buililings

shuitd b monmired
R edinance M9 Paga B af s

20-0203 H Page 12 of 41



T ovorithiy:
Ll b Ve faenig s flams SRV 10 I T SOy I AT VY N T T WMV IN U F I
Iy STy
S e s el deng i wntder gt wse prr i qndon et e foe ommerial
JETT s e veharny sl fewnd sorcieg, anadior spnecead ceen
Wit 3d Vype | Hood Bostaligions shail be added i tollows S reguarement of i tlatien vo
repdagmne nf s s § Hosd Svstem shall veqguiee o fire alarmcapeuRive wnoaniioeing SUEINR

insradiad wr tor the R Xy teon bos by conne b e ex \'."m}gﬁn'J:I,‘lrnmrpr,‘nk.’fr Porine i

i thert huilidone

7021 Segnpdury Cower Supgly sliall Be adied o bl dn scandunoe sk A o e

secomdiary pawer suppdy previdiog o mieimim 2H-Bote pos e capaaciy under sguiercend inad vy uem
aperating ln a won-alarm condivon) shall be amended o 0 minimum 72 -hour power - agaacity
Exception: The existence af an ymeviensy hock-uge puower suppy Ihat soevts of excov Hoe

reuirinnents of € ‘ahfornia Fire Croade t Bapper 12,

Chapter 12

Section {203 Emergency and Stapdby PFywer Svilems
1203, 1.3 tostgbiplien ~box!t v ammdiced wa Toil e Fanarvorsn S Art avvienv i shandhy W g

Shoslemia shat] e s tabied o scondanie wtho e STy nbrrda Mol Cade, e abibongae Blectnr

Llade, WETRACT LD amd NEEY U E D Ml edfee dhaes me o ed fees il el umits e}
aaticpdiued Bacdonys s s dor commers i e ess with stancdby power, il o g yhiini prig

ae ek o e il o er et e Phe Roldine approved dethe fice coxle setficnal Panting

SRS LGIAE ey SR maint i ned [ el rikance with the it e gl

Chapter 33

Vg

o~

o tion 33 yecess (g Firefightiang

3M6S Premwg Weatificaiion -hall be slied oo foiliias Prior 19 amd dheriny conntruc i an

e eld shidroin sign hull be provided g eoacn fire ond emenoncy e Rin i arles s rad eirs i

IR TR

Sectenn 332 Wurer Supply far $ire Protecuun

SMIEMWhen Reyuurodd ~fib B gcede 1on 0 the freae Jo o mhianti Ny msirtgee 2rmn g oA

1te. the fev Madrani waeier satbem asal b imadic £ and muaintain S v cortiowoie v peranen The

amount of water sugeprilcd Bl meel the ¢ puered re tow e the peo

TERTRE Y a4l ji

20-0203 H Page 13 of 41



Chapter 49

Sedtion 4903 Plans

4903 1 Where Requined falt he 3ood we tollow: T O soade oFFiCTd ol STECE may require
vhvedopmeat peogecry locoted in Misderare, Mich aned Very-Ttigh Fire ffazard Severiy Zones (o stbmit
Jrc prastesniaon pian T plan shall ke approved by Foth the tire code officrd and the asthorized
roprdsentativi for the iocal 1240 FIRE Linit 7#iet i located in the State Responyibility Areo [SHA D

neior i the recurding of the Sinal magp por the prsect by the Commty of El Dorads,

Nection 498 Wildfin: Protection Buildine Constraction

4905.4 Rool Construction Requirementis sival bo todad o Fdinws, U avw construction, imcloing
addinans, vequires a Class A rogf covering or assembly. Al re-rooting requires Clasy £ roof novering
vr nseprhdy s o minimum Re-roofing in exvess o8 5000 of G exisiting siructiare within amy o e
perivad will secessitane Yhat the entirg r,g;«;_i“ ba 3 hag 4 roal Covering or ussembly g minmee
Uhass B ar C fire resardeant ireated and cr acv-orcitied wokd Shobg or JRNQICS cre nol appeaved

a racf covermg material jor Class 4 assemhfy

Chapter 50
Section SO0 Geperal

S001.7 Liability for Damages shull be adderd ab (edhaas,  Aay cdamayes or 0ont redtieng: irom the

sarehesy handling, spill ar dischurge of amv fncardons moporanic sl coniafitterne by apame
such prrscn. Firm or corporition copsing secl et on disg arye Thig dedt gy fecidde Sy the B

{h:

s Risiher dulv authoriced roprcse ntatine e St e us sty cone af e eddivaion

uncer contract, expressed or pipdicd

Chapter 56
- Section ¢ cryl
- S601.2 Permit Requj shgil e wmenided o follines. Vermity shndl be required oy et fiarth in

Section i05.6 and regulsted moaccunbanee with thia section. Where explaives permily are roguirad
dery phdl Be paued by the Feee Chadn oe jucer duly authorized cepreveniative, and the B Doradio
Conny Shorstt o Depsartmens Where Hreworky permits are regriiraod, they shall be ivsued Mscthe Fire
Thicl or Ao dulv gt ized vepeesepiaiove, abad the 0 Doeoddie Conney Boaed of Supwervesors
[t 20 Pracumentation dutbeo b b f o lhrees S 8 EBal Deny the authorinye fo reguest
et on repar g it arpects of t Feworky e eietiition.

LA 22 Proupoetany Informvating et Beoachbed ga talbivnves Vs S50 will et ndf preaprietiry

informion

Vipdeaee Ol Fage tdof 18

20-0203 H Page 14 of 41



Chapter 87
- Section ST Ntoruge

$704.2.9.0.1 Lovatings Where Above-Ground Tanks ure Probibjted »hali be amended a5 thilows:

St of Chiss Cand Elasy 1 flammable lguosds inabose-goound Tanks outside of buiidings i prahibited

urtleny cpgwenvoed by the Foe Clucf, or Risdher July auchesizen vepeeseaitanse When popmuted B3 the
Free g, e hishee duly authorized represenfative, oll abovir grovind pmbicd or coult insialiaogns
for she storaige of Clasy L U5 wr N tlammahic and combustible lguds shall compiv with skowe
Fevuttemenis wy et (el By the Cualitornia Fire Cogde Thee Olifoenia fhire Code shall alve appiy i

v hidiuticom pther (an moter sehicle fucl dNperspir stuthony Where dabive grownd Siorage Bs eeyiir o

S¢ction $706 Special Operatigny
$£706.2.4.4 Logalions Where Above-Ground Tanks wre Probibited shall be armended as fullows:

Stormge =7 Llass 1 oand Class U lammabte Hgads 1 aporeuround @k cutgide ol buildings s

profabhined wnlfers gppraved v oo Firg e e Wather Fale asttnri il repreyemaiive. Wien
pormitiod by ke Fire Dhiet o hiether dulv curhorsod roprewedareee il akone prowsd tinkex o
Vit iAo For the sioraie of o s v A1 Bammahle cnd combusnhe gy sacd cumply
with ffnese feqiarements ax sci foctl by the € afite e Paey wond The (ddifornia Five Dol thail alen

apprl toy s HRnons acker Bhan motor ve it e el USRIAICER I o whers gbin el Rrdy

oty eed,

Chapter 58
Sectiog 5806 Flummabie Cryogenic Fluids
S806.2 Limitations shall be anernded as (ollovws. Stonage of flanimable cryogenic Nulds in stathmary

contaners outside of baildings i3 probitued unalese approved by the Fire Cioct, e bivdesr duly
vubhrized represemanc s When permttivd heothe Fire Chiefl oe histher ey aithorized
representatee all stavanary Cedianers for the stocage of fammabic crvagenitc flaidy shall rompdy
w LR TS PEQUIPTIIC s L vt fon s By e 4 odefratin Fire Cede e Uiditornia ¥ire Ceade Sl vifun
appdy e invtallaions cther Puar moior vebpcle 2ol apensing stotlons where above-grrd sveige

Foragiiraed.

Chapter b1

Sectiog 6 iud Coontivg of LP-Gus Cuntainess

— 6104 Maxpngm Capacity wtdie Ustablished Lomits il e osmended oy tollosg F30 worgar

of ligueficd petrnlonm gas in eveess of an aagregiste of 2 00Egillon wader vapacin: when (aed of

Ieaayt one-balf C1720 mite from prigperiv coned or designated for revidentiod wee ared o tega ov Nalf

Uredipance 201601 Pape Vvl e

20-0203 H Page 15 of 41



Opdinance 2HY 01 P

FLE i Prrer I ool db v topiae g wsth g denssiy Qeesatee than one 1 idweelling unit per
ere and gt b sie-hall G mile sremowne ol o medel iy alliosed when AFS aopecved, omd
AR AR i e dettand A the Uenny of B Deeds

EWspconing wathist e vnahio st lors Witk the Lomas estabiioied 5o s eeitriiimg e dierinon of
Supiectived ool goy for D protelion S Beaviv papniiaied or congeded dreae. the Cegregats
vapciy S iy e tadalliation whall por edcecd a wanee capacite of 1060 galives The dispeaving
af Drguetiod peeroteuen g i cxeda of aronaregate of 2 ke gallaon warer capsaeiy shea focsied

ar devst v hiddf (125 prile frivn property Sored e desivmoted o residential use md ar leds v
half 1120 mile froon csting restidentiol development with a densine greater than one (01wl g umis
e cacre and Ut feast ane-budf P12 mide trom ame boned ar moted i affowed when 40 approved and

a spreciuleconnfitionad e permit s Sssied by the oty of EL Dirad

Scecrion 6112 High Flevntion Liguefied Petrolenm Gas Instatintions (S000-Toot elgvutions and
hovpey stutd? e aofled as N

ol12.1 Hegulators shall b added as beliows:

Oesmatone veCudater svsrem il be destafled i acoordanoy with mamufociug s roguircmenty,
Swomiige regtlatir svatems shall Be wstaliedd on adt LPC inatalloitions

The fient st regubiator shall be instatled weder the dinged goauge cover suppdivd with the tunk e
LR PROSS are dferter e 300 reguiator shall be pointed ownmeard, The poe steigse residatoe
hali b plumbed 1 dhe viser afthe viard piping with sofl copper tubing o adlow flavihilie shesdd fank
withine avicr, Fhe riser from the ward pipang ohall e Located nof more than 3 joches choricomalivi
sram i wulls of rthe fank

The cocund srage rewuhaer and visge pige 20000 b omaliod wnider the soave af the fuiddipg sy close
ar practeabic o the butlding woill  This eieer hall be sceurely supperteidheinccsd (o the wall
vppravimdrely [0 inches heiow the regudction 5o s 1o prevent bending o the pps by fiteral snowe e
loads,

A protective cover, approved Sy othe gan suppiier and Buitdmg Official skall be imgullsd over the

serand Qe retiator g Socurddv yapreariod 10 the prinond ar digongiv i fhe wol,

The rixer pipes Jar (he wird pipenig sl non B¢ ombiediieit v canrrete. Domerete gl arcund such
riser shall be hedd back ar fease | inch from al! tidex of ibe pipe

Al the ime of application far any kinlding permg sednchinvoives the iavallazion v an LR tiston
the appltcant shall submil an L0 tvvtem gt premin U pies o dienadiv o FOF e The LG e
plins shall inchicde. but nin b limided o, the tank Bsattcn, peapeosd tunk capsacin g 8850 walhons
rate of yord pirung, Goation of the siaer papee al the oadiding propsrty Soumitor e ot an auliine of

it wxixinespropened tuilidings on the dov amd o depsotion of e endevitne of ame building o b

IR

42
Lo

20-0203 H Page 16 of 41

ik



supplivd with LPG. This shall alsa be farwardeid o the appropriate firs districs 12 serve as o localur
PIP TN e VERT OF N Eergency

Lacation of the centerline of LPG tonks yhall be permanently marked by the use of snow stakes. one
areachend Such stakes Sholl be uf sufficient weight 10 e visible throught anticipsated masinum snonw
depth @ the respective location Insiollaion and mainienance of these tnow stakey are the
responxibilily of the LPG wer

Propane applionces and accessoriey shall not be permined in any new inscilbioinn helow the firsi
floor or below grade, whichever is more restrictive.

6112.2 Vertical Riser Pipiop sonll be gdded as {nilow s

Minimum of Schedule 88 - iron piping,
The riser shall be within 3 inches horizapally wf the tank

- Swing jointy shall be installed ubove and below rank teve! 1o pravide for the tank movemery (Street
e2lhows shall not be used),
A tiveed flexible riser conviructed of vupper or stminess-sree] mbing ond procecied by steel covered
sheathed materisl may be uyed lastsd of swing joines. Thi flexible alternattve shall provide sufficiens
sluck 10 allow for tank mavement

61123 Mackiog and Lacations shall tee gidided as GGllaws

An approved sign shall be located direetly ubove the riser st off vaive on the budiding in 2 visible
locatinn

The liguetied petroleum gas supplicr shall affix o weatherproot ildentifivation tag 1o the inside of the
tank vaive protecting cover. This wag shall contain the supplier's name anid emergency 1elephone
number

{unk tnyiatlupivon shall be psrmanently marked by o metal or woad marerial snow marker, with i
mrimum dimenxion of 2 inches by D inches. The snow marker shall be of sufficiens height (o rise
utive the annual snow depth and shall be a mimmum of 10 feet in height, The snow markers shaif

he painted yellow and Incated on npposite ends of the 1ank.

Section 6113 Underground LI'GC Taaks Installations and Ownership shatl be added s follows:

6113.1 Permits and Plans shail be added as roliows: Peraniny shall be reguired, and plans shall he

submitred for all underground tunk instadlations s approved by the AH/
61132 Uaderground LPG Tand Ownership shall be added as followws: Cndereronmd {76 lanks

T

shatld e prisbiBaned fromm oy seld joenasnieery wnd shedl B retaived feoshe LG S ompaiyv under a

Lk LT FYSICRE JOI IS & VAR it ) e e e frf((l/i]'t'"lL'f)l,‘.' e mer and rocordad
b . ) {

Cirdinance 200941 Page 13 af 16

20-0203 H Page 17 of 41



Chapter X0

Seetion 80. NFPA, 13D-16 - Stundard for thye dnstallution of Spriokler Svstems in One-and 'wo

Family Dwellings and Manufactural Jlomcs 23 amended 903.3.1.3, 993,15

NFPA 12D, Aavended Sections as follows:
Revise Sechion $.1.1.2 t0 read as follows;

Chapter 0. NFPA 130, S.4.1.2 f supply of af least v f oucd ipew sond temperatnes sprinkler uses

within the preemizes (nidd Beomaintiesd on the prapseny ar aa gy St Seocd spetadlers shefl
fur het i o inonsstacd imd GoeesT st i
Revite Section 7.6 ta read ax follows:

Chapter N0 NEPA U, 7.6 0 focad watee oo alorar shal! be prenwded an all firs spenkior syiteins i

hontes gl an appraved focation on e exierioe of the bacttog.
Revise Section 11.2.4.1 to read as follows:

Chapter 80, NEP'A 13D, 112.1.8 Where o iz depanment pumper conection ix not provided, the

Il

sysiem Azl e hvdmstotically Dested al e mmisnen presvore of 130 presndy por sqrare medh guge e ao

lany diran a J-mmte durossa withensd evisdhonce o Geakos, et ress shall Be wilaessod b the fine code

eofficial

appendin B - Fire Flaw Reguircmeats for Ruildings

Orndinance 201904

Table B105.1{1) Reguired Fire Flow fur One- and_Uwo-Famity Dwellings, Group R-3 snd R-4
Buildinps und Tewnhewses shali be amended a6 Trttows e olivativmy belou 5000 g

FIRE-FLOW E AUTOMATIC L MINIDMIEM CLOW
CALCULATION | SPRINKLER FIRE- DURATION
ARFA IRYSTEM L VLOW (hovrs)
{square feet) ; {Design ! frullous per
| Standurd) L mipute)
IR (1 T QLA T JGILY i
!’ spreink e sy sy
' A and gt , Hav walvianails b in Muatien 31
l ek e vt I"adiber ioble
: : RIS, BIS 02 ar
5‘ the regjuireid
] ! fire-fiaw e
LI 3,600 ot WL 1T L sey i
; i i the UA Frre 1.000 '
ook wr Saead
RN ENORNTE I
Kesnlenial Crade
BT R T FTVELIVE S S A bed o wadae oy i
. ol e TA Hip Tahl:
Cv i o Newnns LIRS T
" REBNERTY) I (TR L omi Sk
j Residential iade SFLETE

20-0203 H Page 18 of 41

Page 14 ol I



Table B105.2 Required Fire Flow for Buildiags other thap Ouc- wad I wo-Famjh
Pwellings, Geoup R-3, and R-4 Buildings and Townhouses ol beoamoeibed o b

AUTOMATIC  SPRINKLER MINIMUM FLOW DURATION !

SYSTEM FIRE-FLOW hours

(Design Sraadanl} {gallany per x

minutel . l

ennloniing sprmkler sy e ‘ adir k] Sl Irarsiions m ‘

P DDA el I tHORT!
- - S - e e . ) N

CET PO R L U I RN | A W o £ Do e i e iutalnln v povy i

Linde (R R A R HIOA BZoartasredon s ‘

o SRR SER S e e

Secton ST E S o the 05 i D a5t 507 07 the vt Dhipepen 0 Tahis 1

Uinde (rind owdven e fnginoss tahfs RS U2 BIvE nlsosure redueed 3

el BN Bt g et Wk rarc ;
b Phe redaced O fhow shall oo be ey than 157

Appendiv P - Fire Apparatus Aceess Roads

Secting DY Minunuim Specifications

PO, vess Road Widah with a Bvdreapt el oo grmeod sf ae Poliows, acdding the enepinan:
S i

Ewceptinm Diriocie i

DIV Y Geadg bl o mmnendod v losis Fiee eopantiasy aodes 7omds and Srivesoy s chalt oo

vanemd L0 wed cetes e e e 000 P B Dvoeaadvs Gy e o Ul
Cali ddoncaroe Ut Db e Ul g e s o g s Dy Vaenag!
Fvaeqion Foivygdnr hypoe s dnhi ey oalpen v ntre s 0T

PO Turoiag Rads ot e amender s todboss The mimimesy swening radias shall e

detomicad oy the fire Codde T, cond ol sl et vl and y i

DY S Fire Apprwcates Acces Roud Gges thad beommenaad us fallows: Suksection (f) $hers

. O B i [g- 'y 3 tpiat 1 . B
conly fale 0 provehag b pewn seidth i n b i Loty T duet fniiase sy W hers o fiee

st et dean ot ahve dved v P che tote vandB chadd oot e foxy pdipy T3 oo i550

Bt B

Dind e Roagds 20 60 29 feet g width od] bewraerded o follosws? Bire oe siany o8 specified i

Secbion THT ISl e goetedop bodl ade o e agipreniiris doesie s ronds thatl s 20 Z9 feel wide
TSRO TR SUR Y B A TETNR
’:‘(\(‘(['IHI'L [P TR TPy T VRS U A I R T YT FVIPUS S LU Y TERE B

Dind.e? Roads more thup 29 fect i Width weall e anesded w tollows. Fioe L s 16

st bt e Nomebionc TGRS shald b pentend o o sude ot Hte apspunt ey eess fosedy ot 2
i 353 mie angd fziacthea 30 el wole (10U R o,

Exception Fivcvoian wtewy SO0 v mined fyothe 410

Yirdinance 209 Page 15 ot 70

20-0203 H Page 19 of 41



D1U4.4 Circambereuting Five Appavatus Access Roaads shall he gdueit s fobbow s W 5om rgpnred

b phe finc codde ogftoal, s iee e sty inacewx Conaie bl e Conlen o fedd I ONToasp s fhe enlirgiy

G AP ROTRPC I ST PR e 8 COr i e 0 I G ST S e S Dol

SECTION 4: CONFLICT
Ihat Gedinanics Moo 20806 of it s all other ordinances or et o ardsminees herewatln are herets

rzpcaied.

SECTION &: SEVERABILITY

IFany Ordinance, artcls, subsection o subedivsion theresd, provisin, seatence, clause or phrse of this ende, or
any epphcation theren! s (o any reson held o e mwddid by o courtof competent jurisdiction, such deciston
shall nof atfeet the remainig pron ivions af thb ciede, which can be given ¢ffect without the invalid porions wnd,
werefore, such mvalid pomiona oz decianed 1o b geverible, GEO herehy declares that it would haye eoacied this
vdinance apd cach ot st artiches, sectivns, suhsectans, G suhivisions thaoreofl provision., sentences, clauses ur

pheases imespective of the Tl thnCone oy more of e s dectared invadid,

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

Thiy Oohoance shid! wike efect tiry c3uy davs aer i gdoption. GREO Board Clerk 1s dorectnt 1 pobbab ths

ordinancye o pewapaper ol peperal cocolahon in the Disriz) In ter of pobhcdtien of the D8t iz ol the
i, voaunanuey of the otdinance niay be poblishied by the By the Board Clork within fittoer 018 vetay vatter
ity passape amd ocertified copy shall ke posted T the Gifice A7 GRO puisiant to Ceniormetens Code Seation

Aeddaie) o d)
The abwrve Ondiidice was introeduced at a meeting & the Boand of Dircciars of GEO on O by 18, 2000 aod 1
wiss then read for the tint dme. A public hearing was set 1ur the Ordinance 16 be read Jor the seoad tene vl

Mpsembrer 14, 2019 and approved by the Gallowing viote:

PASSED AR ADOPTEL by the Boand of Divecton af GECY this, A" day o Novepber, 2000

NS '}"{“‘!. WZ::'; C:.". ‘~L;m5':‘.17 fli‘_‘.ula‘*‘ '{hgﬂq}“ Bl ALY, ‘\“\“Nl sy k! PCJ_'(J
RIS P B Y S AR AR e

At

P . )
— el e
£
Rt Witharis, Hoard Presadem Dl Sonpreeen . Birard Cleek
Ordinince 201900 Page teal v

20-0203 H Page 20 of 41



CAM & GEO

101.1 Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Administrative need
LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than
Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate :’" :’:d :‘"e:"‘f"’! be :?Zped zgsgau'fem:é[;g%::e;:‘:g
105.6.27 quantity not exceeding 125 galions serving Locally adopted and amended | o0 ‘0 2 Sxpiosion, At elevations above SUHH €
occupancies in Group R-3 an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire
4 PR activity due to snow load, These tanks tequire additional
attention.
P R . s : ) Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance
ETREET e e TR IR of feess to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines -
’066 ' Md sect|on . Locally ereatsd and ad(I:cpted permits, plan checks, and inspections as allowed in Health
S &Safe(yCode17951 .
VLI Y y o oty s . Sectvm10661CostRecoveryFeu Torecoverhecosuo
106.6.1 - - Add section - . Locally created and adopted the Fire Distict.
. Section 106.7 To recover the actual cosls of avoidable

106.7

Add section Locally created and adopted failed inspections by contractors.
Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the Distict
is added to read as follows:
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this
: provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an
1094 Added section 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file.an appeal to the Board of Appeals
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire
Code Official. Based on the County of E! Dorado's
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals
timetine.
Completed the seclion by filing in the blank Allows thg Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that
] . protects life and property. Fees have been updated to
portions that were not completed by the SFM. itis , .
110.4 - . Locally adopted and amended malch the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the
betterlef o localiies to determine the District Attomey's Office. The change to the language to
fees/penallies for their respective areas. include the term infractions.
110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2
Citations
The Fire Chief or hisfher duly authorized representative (s),

Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor

11042 but under a different number) Localy created and adopted violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the

Health and Safety Code of the State of Califonia and
Chapter 5¢ (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Califomia.

Completed the section by filling in the blank

portions that were not completed by the SFM. Itis All violations of the code have been consolidated under

1124 better left to localities to determine the Locally adopled and amended Section 110.4 to include the penalties for violations.

fess/penalties for their respective areas.
Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District,
- . Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd

202 Added definiions for carity Localy created and adopted Manager. Definition of campfire shall not indude LPG or
Propane fueled appliances,

302.1 Added definition for Campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for danty

307.4.4 through Due to the high fire danger that exists in El Dorado County
30'7'4 s 20(:? Added a sections for campfire restrictions Locally created and adopted we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas.

20-0203 H Page 21 of 41




503.2.1

Changed vertical dearances to 15 foe( and road
vidths to 20 feet

Locally adopted and siended

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus
components. It also allows an extended time frame before
having to recut the grwnh of the vegetation. Additional.
fieight for vegetation Clearances acts as an increased buffer
formespfaadofﬁre Amadwudmof’mhetexdusweof
shoulders, as measured face ‘of curb to faca of clirb is -
needed. These st_mdures can ba difficult to nawgale with
fire apparatus and should not be oounted in the total
dnvable road surfaee S e

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the
Fire Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Regulations to

Fire apparatus require areas for tuming around when
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This

503.25 ] Locally adopted and amended includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides
match as they require tunarounds for fire apparatus better for ingressfegress. Additionally, adds tum
access roads and driveways. o !

. around for apparalus in driveways greater than 150"
Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated
. . Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendix D of the
Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated ) . : o
503.26 Surfaces to state and match E| Dorado County Locally adopted and amended |CueNt Fite Code whichever is more restrictiv to be
Transportation Division instead of AASHTO HB-17 consistent throughout county agencies and is aliowed as an
' altemate means & methods that is not less restrictive than
the Fire Code.
. " - This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes”

503.4.2 Added section regarding no parking in fire lenes Locally created and adopted rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle Code.

. " L This section clearly defines the *No Parking in front of fire

503.4.3 :::;:::""“" regarding no parking in front of Locally created and adopted | hydkants® rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle

Code.
oo . ardi based . This section clearly defines Califomia Fire Code Appendix D

503.4.4 m section regarding fire lanes on road Locally created and adopted as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire

lanes.
Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain Allows fire districts the authority to approve gates on
emergency access and consistency through ali roadways based on the Districts gate standard, providing

503.5.3 roadway gates in El Dorado County, referring to the Locally created and adopted {the best possible emergency access to maintain fast
gate standards adopted by the FPO's. response times.

Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing
505.1 buildings Locally adopled and amended |, -1 on the District's addressing standards.
Added more conservalive standard for the 300 okt s ey shoud v b csid f 10

507.5.1 placement of hydrant and their relationship to Locally adopted and amended U “ " .

v feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in
commercial buildings
Buildings are getting more sizable in the county. It is more
common to have new buildings with solar amays that
continue to generate power even when the buildings
. . general utilities have been shut offi. When there is an
509.3 Added verbiage o bring al of the necessary fire Locally created and adopted emergency, it is vital that we have rapid access lo all of the

controls for a building to one location.

controls in one location for public evacuation and firefighter
safety. Due (o the fire danger present in El Dorado County
throughout most of the year, this change is appropriate and
advisable.

Addsarequnrementfaspnnkler system mstdlatmn S
- Locally adopled and amended

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and mesr contributing faclors to our.

feet in sizo as they re|ate to fire behavior and raﬁa of

20-0203 H Page 22 of 41



903.2.a

Adds a requirement for existing buildings greater
than 3,600 square feet o install sprinklers if they
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the
structure, whichever is less.

Locally created and adopted

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of Ei Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate o fire behawor and mte of.

spread

than 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they.
ad r'noremanSO% or1 OOOsquareheuome

Mds'oewpantprotecbonforemsbngbunldingsless . AR
 : Locally created th adbple'd_"

. Due to the tupograpmc, dumahc. and geogfaptuc conditions
*[of 1 Dorado Colinty and their “contributing factors to our

mereased mponse times, along with the fad that fires -
dousble in size 'each and evory | mxnute wa require spnnlders
to be installed in structures once ey reach 3,600 square
thiey refate !o fire behavuor and ra!e of

" 903,21, 903.2.3,

ﬁas_e sections were d_teated'to gi\‘la"sbed'ﬁ'c'
{ditection on the sprinkler requirements based on

"Locally adopled and amended

Due tothe (opographac. climatic, and geographlc conditions
of Ei Dovado 1ty and their oontnbutmg faictors to our”
inceased response times, along with the fact that fires -
doubla in size each and’ every minute, we require sprinklers

9_03'2'4‘ 0327 occupancy anjd square footage - - to be installed in strictires once they reach 3,600 square
S R feetlnslzeasmeyrelatetoﬁrebehaworandrateof
Manufactured Homes - The intent of this code section is to
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or twow
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwedlings of a similar
. : . nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban
This section was created lo include manufactured ) ! . ] .
903.2.8.2 residential single family R-3 in the residential Locally created and adopted interface "“."e é hglghtened risk of r'apld fire °°."5“"‘T‘,""°"
sprinkler program due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler
systems have been incorporated fo decrease this risk
successfully in many California communities.
Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of E1 Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
These seclions were created to give specific pncreased response times, along with the fact that fires
903.2.9, 903.2.10 direction on the sprinkler requirements based on Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
occupancy and square footage to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
) feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.
Added occupant protection for frealamsin _ .
: : :‘;’ﬁ?ﬁ?&:ﬂiﬁ;&f éﬁ:?ntr?:l, except ‘ _ v Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
907.2.a * p . i Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Depadment notification in
purposes, and buildings with a floor area of less ke event of a fite o smok
ﬂxan500squarefeetasapproved bytheﬁrecode a e.
ofﬁual i
i ey | e e s
o0 alain if ey add more than 30% of 1,000 square Y - mw’;“md“s:m“;ik'“ ire en
feet to the struoture whlchever is less. ) a °
Added occupan( pmtecﬂon by stating al ﬁre alam |
detedmsystwsmstalledshanbecomectedtoa L S Prowdesproperemergencynohﬁcabonforowupanaesmat
© %0728 momloring mat nohﬁa the fire depanment " Locally created end adopted: allow public use and ensures Fire Depanment noﬁﬁcauon in

meevenlofaﬁreasmoke

20-0203 H Page 23 of 41



fear of edjacent t residental develdpment

Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due lo PGAE
907.6.2.1 Modification Locally created and adopted safety related power outages.
This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to
1203.1.3 Shunt trip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emengency power shut off during the use of back-up
power supplies _
33103 Address requiremens for construction sites Locally created and adopted | sss‘dig t:n:gnesr:‘ymm is important to assist
Water supphes at construction sites with . — Water must be on ste prior to combustible materiat being
s3121 combustible materials on-site i Locally adopted and amended Istored or vestical construction commencing. .
Ef Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout
This section was created to include Fire Protection the county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire
4903.
%034 Plan for all fire hazard severity zones. Locally created and adopted Protection Plan due to dlimatic, geclogical, and
topographical conditions.
This section clarifies that within the boundaries of El Dorado
; ; : County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are
d
4905.4 :eq:?dre;::f:m to clarify roof construction Locally created and adopted wildiand fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof
covering or assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly.
. . Hazardous materials refated incidents are costly to mitigate.
Any damages or costs from negligent practices that A . .
5001.7 cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally created and adopted grmq;e:;:ﬁzu;?;gul?gﬁ ::ig:ezu;nme
Cost recovery fee. negligent parties.
:d:z:‘s;fezpmém?" ”"‘;‘hpe."""g being |ssuz Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and
1.2 y e Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department )
560 N N . Locally adopted and amended fireworks to approve them and-have a clear understanding
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of of th ications they will be used
Supervisors for fireworks. e applications they will be used for.
The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any
. . documentation including timing and proprietary information
Fireworks companies or vendors shall make ) )
5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 available all requested documentalion pertaining lo | Locally created and adopled gmm ;nﬁ;ﬁi?a::uﬁneﬁngzﬁ el ey
the firework presentation proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as
such.
Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
. - . . flammable and Class Il combustible liquid storage in above-
5704.2.9.6.1 I
.v Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended ground tanks, Requires AH. approvl and a
Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County.
Estabilshed limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
. - . flammable and Class [l combustible liquid special
5706.2.4.4 E the Fi
06 stablished fimits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended operations in above-ground tanks. Requites AHJ '
) and a Spedial/Conditional Use Permit from the County.
‘ Administrative need (o add District name. Established limits
: PP P . |as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable
5806.2 2:;‘;’;;::::“';‘ ﬂ"f;ﬁ'&m’.’:’"ﬁi cote Locally adopted and amended |Cryogenic fuids i stationary containers. Requires AHJ
. approval and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the
County. ) . .
. T T EstabhshedllmltsasreqmredbymeFlreCodeOfﬁaalfor
5806.2.1 Established imits a sét forth in the Fire Code SFM adopted and amended locally ;m‘:g’:ma’?wmmrmmmﬁ”
' Permit from the County.
Establishes distances between LPG storageand -
_ - _ dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential
. . I E AT developments and high-density hotels, molel, apartments,
61042 Established imits for LPG storage and dispensing |+ | .y, aopted and amended [elc. where a release by léak or explosion of LP-Gas woud

have a high probabtllty of injury, inhatation, or death. .
Requires AHJ appmval anda SpeaaVCondibonal Use
Pe:mutfrom meCounty ;

20-0203 H Page 24 of 41



61121

Estabﬁshes propane regulator requirements for
Iocabons above 5000 foot elevatxon

Locally created and adopled

Establishes propana regulator requirement for locations
above 5000 foot elevation. Inciuding requirements for two-
stage regulator use and location of first and second stage
regulators. Additional requirements are outfined for
protective covers, riser pipe installation requirements,
building permit submittaland review, tank center-fine
maddng and grade requiremems These reqmrements are

61122

Eslabllshes propane vemcal nsef plpe mqu rements o
| above 5000 foot elevahon K

Locally created and adopted

fise requrrements for Jocation's
. above 5000 foot eleva Pupe schedule location, swing
oint requ!raments and the usa of fexible riser piping as
well as swing joints. These requrmmems are based on
significant fira history in heavy snow and extreme weather.
conditions encountered above 5000 feet.

1123

Establishes propane marking and focation
requirements above 5000 foot elevation .

 Locally created and adopted

Establishes marking and location requirements for locations
above 5000 foot elevation. This section addresses signage
location, emergency oontact information, and snow related
tank marking requlrements These requirements are based
on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet.

6112.1

by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdiction).

Permits and plans shall bé submitted arid approved | .

Locally created and adopted

Pesmitting and Plan submnual requirements for underground
tanks:

Allows us to require plans bé subinitted for review prior to
installations of underground LPG tanks. Underground tanks
fequire substantial maintenance including inspection and
anode repiacement at regular intervals.

6113.2

Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the
property of the LPG company

Locally created and adopled

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak without
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when
sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground
tanks where comosion and leaks are more easily detecled.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16

NFPA 13D-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the
District has been amended to update various
provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler
systems in one-and two-family dwellings

SFM Adopted and amended locally

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on-
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow
alanm {o create an audible alert for the flow of water in the
event of water activation in a vacant structure, and
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 13D
sprinkler system instaflation decreasing the risk of water
damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements
were also added to ensure waler circulation through the
system, reducing stagnant water and backflow concems
(EID encourages this type of system).

Chapter 80, NFPA,

To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler

A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system

130'513 ?ezchon system minimizing damage SFM adopted apd amended locally must be available on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet
Chapter 80. NFPA An audible alamm system is added to notify occupants and
13D-p16 Sew onl 6 Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation| SFM adopted and amended locally  |in the activation of the system when the building is not

occupied allow for detection minimizing demage.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 Section
11.211

System test to a pressure of 150 p.s.i.

SFM adopted and amended locally

A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and
failures and assures proper gluing of system components.

) mahh ﬁre ﬂou precedenis used

ChangedSOOGPMtMOOOGPM below 5000 foot |

. |uused for over a decads iri EDC:

|Allows us to match what developers and residents are used
tomregardstoGPMﬁmﬂwl f mmen ‘athavebeen

- Es sshedamhmumreqmrementoﬁSOOGPM
: belausooofootelevahm furall mmemal : o

Loeany adopted and amended

Allows ts to malch whiat d
fo i regards lo GPM fire fiow reqqunents that have been
usedforoveradewdeinEDc o

20 0203 H Page 25 of41




llt is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to

Appendix D:D103.2

State law requires no greater than 16% grade

Appendix D: D103.1 Made an exception for residential driveways Locally adopted and amended construct a 26 foot wide spaca for 8c0ess to a hydrant.
Title 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways.
Locally adopted and amended in our Ef Dorado County Title 14 adoption we allow greater

than 16% grade with AHJ approval and hard surface,

Appendix D: D103.3

Text to include curbs and gulters

Locally adopted and amended

20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutters due
to potential access issues and tuming radius concems.

Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided

i dix T_ D103 Fire apparatus access foad gates ~ Localy adopted and amended [roadvwal the gate width shallnot beess then 15 feet due to
' : ‘ I T . radius issues.’ .
No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet
Appendix D: D103.6.1 Roads widths 20 to 29 feet Locall adopted and amendeg (" ckh above S000 feel. Lowe thn SO0 feet ths does

not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all other elevations.

Appendix D: D103.6.2

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36
feet in width

Locally adopted and amended

Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of
elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations.

Appendix D: D104.2

Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered
building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to

Locally adopted and amended

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the

Exception have only one approved fire apparatus access road. residents and first responders.
When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus
Appendix D: D104.4 Added to require circurnferential fire apparatus Locally created and adopled access road shall be oo'nstmcted .to encompass the entire
access roads structure and shall provide a continuous means of
emergency vehide access.
Appendix D: D106.1 : For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
Ex " ’ Removed Exception in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
ception .
residents and first responders.
Appendix D: D107.1 For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of
Ex " ' Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. Locally adopted and amended ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the
ception .
. residents and first responders.
Adopted with no Amendments
1012 through 101.5 m‘;" to establish scope, intent, severabilty and Locally adopted Administratve diarity
102.6 through 102.8 References, Subjects not regulated by the code Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
102.10 through 102.12 Conflicting provisions, Other Laws, Appication of Locally Adopted Administrative larity
i references ) o .
Definition of the Fire Prevenhon DMslon and ab:llty A .
103.1 through 104.1 Hto enforce the code Lo@lly Adopted. Administrative cfanty
164.'3 through 104.4 Right of Entry, Warrants, and ldenﬁﬂe‘etipn Locally Adopted Administrative clarity
104.6 through 104.6.4 | Record retention. ' Locaily Adopted Administrative ciarity
104.8 through 104.0.2 x;“ﬁ""ﬁms' allemate means and methods, and Locally Adopted Administrative dlarity
104.11 through Aulhomy at fires, right of access, mamtenance of . y ] !
104112, systems | Locally Adopted pdminsiaive darty
104443, .. . [Authority of systems and devnm moperable . Administrative clarity
10523 < JTii RS Administrative dlarity « -
105.3.1 throgh VIR
10832 ;.
105612 T . |azardous cleahing solvent usé

20-0203 H Page 26 of 41



_ _ Permits for various business operations for. Magnesium,
6.2.2 P e B s . miscellaneous combustible storage, rnobile food preparatm
15228 through N mﬁiz';m%g;fm"mm darity and Locally Adopted vehicles, motor fuel-ispensing facites, open buming,
» _ i open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and
' Lo organic coatings .
106637 A"°P‘°d “"" -m.'“ ad‘"‘"'s""’”"" °'°"‘V and Locally Adopted Pesmits forplaces ofassambly.
N Locally Adopted. < Permrts fur pnvate ﬁre hydrants
e __-’_ TSR Permrts for pyroxyﬁn plastics, relngemuon equtpment, repair
N . R garajes and motor mel-drspensmg facilities, rooﬂop
S . Locauy MOPM S hehports spraying o drppmg, storage ofserap ﬁres and tire
: B L byvroduch .
N Adoptedmlssectionforadminislraﬁvedantyand'-‘ : e PRI NS o
N ﬁreandhfesafelymspecuons ool Locally Adopted - Pe”“"f““'e“eb""‘i“gpia“‘s
P - ; Adop(ed ﬂns secbon for admmrsh‘ahve danty and L - -_ , Permit for wood products storage (chlp& hogged material,
105'6'59 - ) N ﬁre and lrfe safety mspecuons ; Locally Adopted Co lumber or plywood in exms o{ 200 cubic feet)
Tha 4 B Adopted this section for admnmstrahve clarity and : o !
10@.1 mrotxgh 106.3 ‘ N‘v fire and lfe safely ins pections. ) Locally Adoptgd B Fee sdlgdu‘les for permrts
Adopted this section for admmlstrauve clarity and : . .
107.1 N fre and lfe safely i ions Locally Adopted Inspection authority
: oo Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of
S . e . - equipment, re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping,
108.1through 109.3 |~ N fre anl' ?ﬁ;ﬁ?ﬂ for at"n;ms!mbve darty and Locally Adopted supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding,
: A 'spect Board of Appeals established, limilations on authonity, and
_ _ qualifications
110.3.2 through N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally Adopted Comprrm wnlh orders and nobc& prosecution of
11034 Jﬁi‘é and life safety inspections v violations, and unauthorized tampering
- Adopted this section for administrative dlarity and . | I
110.4: 1 N fire and lfe safety inspections Locally Adopted Abatement of violation
Adopted this section for administrative dlarity and . N
11314 N fire and ffe safety inspections Locally Adopted ~ |Authority to disconnect service utilities
Asphalt ketties contain highly flammable substances and
303.1 through 303.9 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted require stringent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and

{topographical)

. Managing ignition sources through responsible application
305.1 through 305.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted. of standards will reduce the number of fires in various
seltings (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY

306.1 through 306.2 N Adopted uiis'sec'ﬁqn for fire and life safety Locally Adopted flammable and require special handiing (Climatic,
B S : geological, and lopographical)
307.1 thiough 307.5 N |Adopted this secton fr fire and ife saety " Locally Adopted - Open buming, recreational fire, and portable outdoor

ﬁ'rep!aces, (Climah'c, ged'ogical. and lopographical)

oo [N Adop@&;is"sgqﬁqnfi@rﬁmandﬁfésafety Locally Adopted. -

Open flame general requurements (Clrmahc. geologwal and
308.1.2 thiough - Lo : fhmﬁng'orpvmg ofignition sources, torches for
308.13 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally Adopted ing paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Locations near combustible, open fianie devices, signals
S I T and markers, portable fuel open-flame devices, sky- .
e B T T e el

308.1.85 - k

in use sening of flaming food, location, fire protection
and (opogmphkzl)

20-0203 H Page 27 of 41



308.3 through 308.4.1 |

Adopted tis section foc fre and ife ssfety .

Gmup A oocupanaes open-flame decorative devices, .
theatrical performarices, Group R occupancies, Group R-2
dotmnlmes (Clamahc. geological, and topograph»cal)

My

General requtrements relating to smokmg (Chmaﬁc .
- |geological; and topographical): .

"+ |"No Smokinig® sigris (Climatic, goolog!c_d. ﬂﬂd-

3111 through 3114,

TN

Adop(ed thls sectxon for ﬁre and Me safety

Loy Adolod

3192 .

Mopted lhls secuon for admlmstrabve dan!y and
{fie and Me safety mspecuons

Locally Adopted

geologlcal and topographlcal)

3103 !hrough
319.103

" |Adopted his section for e dnd ife safety

 Locally Adopted

Exhaust hood ﬁre_ protecuon ﬁre pro(echon for ooolung

slaage system componen!s dwgn cntena tank venting,
normal' vents, emiergenicy vénts, LP-gas systems, maximum
aggregate volume, protecbon of contairier, LP-gas conlainer
construcbon. pmtecuon ‘of system piping, LP-gas alarms,
CNG systems, CNG containers supplying only cooking fuel,
maximum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG
container construction, CNG containers suppiying
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping,
methane alarms, mainlenance, exhaust system, fire
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems.
{Climatic, geological, and topographical)

403.8.1 through
403.8.1.7

Adopted this section for fire and life safety

Locally Adopted

Emergency planning and preparedness in group R-2.1
(residential care faulmes and group homes) evacuahon and

ﬁresafetyp!ans

403.10 through
403.10.1.3.

Aubpted' this Séi:ﬁoh for ire and life safety

"Locally Adopted.

Group R-1 (Boardmg house hotel, motel) occupancy
Evacuations; diagrams, emergency dutm (Cllmatxc
geologloal and topographical) -

4055

Adopted thls secbon for ﬁre and nfe safety

Emergency Plannmg and record keepmg (Chmaﬁc
_|geclogical, and topographical)

510.3

Adopted ﬂus sechon for admmustrahve clarity and
fire and life safely inspections

Locally Adopted

A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems
(Climatic, geological, and topographical)

807.5.2 through
807.5.2.3

Adopted this section for administrative diarity and

 [fire and fé safety inspections ~ .~ -

"Locally Adopted -

Wall coverings in group E occupandies (Schools) sets a
maximum amount of fiammable wall coverings in
educauonal facilities (Climatic, geological, and ‘

(opoiraphical). -

903.2.1.5

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safety inspections

Locally Adopted

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers)
(Climatic, geological, and (opographical) greater than 1000
square feet (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

20-0203 H Page 28 of 41



firefighters, and other emergency responders.

Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings.
All buitdings will be required to allow emergency responders
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from
each other and the emergency dispatch center, Time
Adopled this section in existing buildings for the ‘;’:‘sﬁg“;"o‘;i‘:‘;‘;fx:: 3""‘; £‘2f ?::‘Z’;?:;;i;h:y
1032 Y :::lyonzfef;eﬁghlers nd olher amergency Locally Adopted the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationate behind
’ this seclion is that on almost all emergency responder injury
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have
strong signal. (Ciimatic, geological, and topographical)
ppeitix 0: D101 . Adoptedﬂwsseehonforthesafetyofme_ ic, . Locally Adopted - © eenesau_m_’”mtsforﬁreappmmsawessmds
““°"9h 0102 1 o ﬁreﬁghters and °“13f emergencv mponders Y AGopeE. mdudlng loads. (Cllmatu:, geolog»cd ‘and topographical) -
R L Deadmdﬁreappavah:saocessmadrequlmnentsfora
Appenq'«x D: D103.4 N We" s seconfor e sy °'“‘°."“b'?° Locally Adopted fom acund t 150 el (Cﬁmahc. geologveal and
Lo ) i topographical) -
A"pp:‘ 'en': i D: Adopted tis section for ‘he safety oft » SRR "No Parking, Fire Lane” signs requnrements (Climatic,
o (."x D: D036 N firefighters, and other emergency respondets. Locally Adopted geologlcal and topogmpmcao
mAppenmug:o[() 1130403104 1 N Adopted this section for e safely of the pubhc, : Locally Adopted : Commemal and industrial dew)elpbn_ieﬁ_t fire apparatus
(exdudmg exwphon) i ﬁreﬁghters and °"‘e' emetgency respmders: ' L access toads. (Cl‘lmguc., geologml, and topographical)
Appendix D: D105.1 N LMoptedﬂussedwn forme'safatybf'me'pi_,‘psig-f Locall Adcaied - |Reauirements fo aeralfre apparais acosss roads -
through D105.4 frofghters, and other mergency responders. yAdopted . {Crmatic, geclogica,and fopograpica)
mm: B?OGD; 0 N Adopted this Section fo the safety of the pubii, Locally Adopted Fire apparatits access foads for mulbplefamuly residential
{excluding exceptions) lﬁreﬁghtars. and ofther emergency résponders. developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical)
Appendix D: D107.1 ) One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be
(excluding elxoeptic’)ns) N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Local . equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire
firefighters, and other emergency responders. y apparatu$ access roads due to topographw geographic and
through D107.2
climatic conditions.
Appendix D: D108 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally Adopled Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction

standards (Climatic, geological, and topographical)

Grey cells are previously a'm'er')_ded, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle. . .

White cells are newly amended, addpted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions.

20-0203 H Page 29 of 41



From: Diana Sampson

Sent: Monday, December 23, 2019 3:13 PM

To: Casey Ransdell

Subject: FW: Public Notice: Notice of intent to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code

Hi Casey!

Here’s the one for the First Reading of Ordinance 2019-01

Dwanar Savmmpson
Administrative Assistant
Georgetown Fire Protection District

Subject: Re: Public Notice: Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code

Confirmation of Scheduled Publication:
NTCE INTENT ADOPT - FIRE CODE 2019

Newspaper: Mountain Democrat

Ref ad#: #6875
Charges: $35.00
Thank you for publishing in our newspaper,

Allison Rains ~ Public Notices
Mountain Democrat ~ Georgetown Gazette Newspapers

legals@midemocratl.net ~ legals@gtgazette com
(530)344-5086 ~ fax (530)344-5092

On 10/2/2019 9:56 AM, Diana J. Sampson wrote:

Please publish in the next two editions.

20-0203 H Page 30 of 41



Thank you!

“Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code

Notice is hereby given to the intention of the Georgetown Fire Protection
District to adopt the 2019 California Fire Code. The District shall hold its first
public hearing at 9:00 A.M. on October 18, 2019, located at 6283 Main Street,
pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13869. Copies of the code section
referred to and any secondary code sections referred to, adopted by reference,
are on file with the Secretary of the District and are open to public
inspection. Adoption of the 2019 California Fire Code will enable all District
personnel to follow one set of rules and regulations with regard to the health
and safety of the public and the District’s response thereto.”

DLANA ). SAmPpson

Administrative Assistant

Georgetown Fire Protection District
6281 Main Street, P.O. Box 420 - Georgetown, CA 95634

20-0203 H Page 31 of 41



From: Diana Sampson

Sent: Monday, December 23, 2019 3:13 PM

To: Casey Ransdell

Subject: FW: SECOND Public Notice: Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code

Hi again Casey,

And here’s the second notice, for the Second Reading.

Duana Sampson
Administrative Assistant
Georgetown Fire Protection District

Subject: Re: SECOND Public Notice: Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code

Confirmation of Scheduled Publication:
NOTICE INTENT ADOPT 2019 CA FIRE CODE-2ND PUB HRG

Newspaper. Mountain Democrat

Ref ad#: #6894
Charges: $35.00

Thank you for publishing in our newspaper,

Allison Rains ~ Public Notices
Mountain Democrat ~ Georgetown Gazette Newspapers

.net ~ legal te.com

On 10/18/2019 2:30 PM, Diana J. Sampson wrote:

Please publish in this Wednesday the 23" edition, and the following
Wednesday the 30* edition.

20-0203 H Page 32 of 41



Thank you!

Notice of Intent
to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code

Notice is hereby given to the intention of the Georgetown Fire Protection District to
adopt the 2019 California Fire Code. The District shall hold its second public hearing at
regarding the adoption of the 2019 California Fire Code pursuant to Health and Safety
Code Section 13869. Copies of the code section referred to and any secondary code
sections referred to, adopted by reference, are on file with the Secretary of the District
and are open to public inspection. Adoption of the 2019 California Fire Code will enable
all District personnel to follow one set of rules and regulations with regard to the health
and safety of the public and the District’s response thereto.

Diana J. Sampson
Administrative Assistant

Georgetown Fire Protection District
6281 Main Street, P.O. Box 420 - Georgetown, CA 95634

Main 330,333.411). - Fax 530,333.4020

20-0203 H Page 33 of 41



Attachment No. 2
Georgetown Fire Protection District

Resolution No. 2019-04

20-0203 H Page 34 of 41



bk Be TR BRI -
adlt e i *l ls‘ln‘

FAlyvy

Teaps Py MAE EnT L XA
2l ‘E“',‘;Hln'-ﬁ V'va Sl }\'JNU

R TIRL LR Tt AT et BT ST PO gy e R T ST NPT Tl AR TE LR T
I R TR R T N LA T matenEnren Saliinn 2RI

RESOLUTION No. 2019-04

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE GEORGETOWN FIRE PROTECTION
DISTRICT ADDPTING FINDINGS SEHPPORTING AMENDMEN TSI THE
GALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

A resalution fur the Georgerown Fuee Frotection Disuetsetany, fovh findiogs with respecs e focad conditiens within tae
Fue District which make certatn modifiravens and changes Lo the Taliformis Fire Cide reasonably necessary for

preserving fire and life safecy in the Ueargerown e Protsctios Disoricr,
The Goverung Board of the Vpacgetosen Fue Frovection Diriet finds and resolves as follows

WHERFEAS, Heaith & Bafety Codw Secupn 1795875 permits o Fire Protecdon Disteee mo adupt an ordinance
wiiich vhanges or modifies e Stace Housing regulations adopted purscant o Health & Safery Code Section 17927 wpon
determinatinn that suelt changes or wedificauons are aecossary Jdue o lovsl conditinns that pertamn regulations goveming
wondinons hazardous 1o bbe, property and the eoviranment o fire, axpliesion, hazardows marerals and hacardous nses;

and

WHEREAS, Heslih & Sofery Code Secdon 179587 mquins that o Distrio) s Board of Diectars making any
changes or medificanons pursuane e Healty & Satery Code section 179585 shall puke =xpress finding thae such changes

o1 modifications sre needed; and shall {ilea copy of such changes or modifications with the Department af Housing and

Lommunity Oevelopmient

WHEREAS, the uniique lacal rlimaric, geslogical, and sopngraphical conditiuns existing within the boundasies of
the Digrict make 1t ressonably nevessary for the Distrct o impose mare steingent requurdments than et fonth o the
California Fire Code and pursuant w Calitaria Health and Sufety Code sections 138657 and (79587, the thisrrict desires

0 ke wepress fvdings wo that atipe,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE TT RESOLVED that the Board of Liirectons of the Geergetown Fire Pratection District
after having duly noticed and held public hearings, herehy adoper the following findings concerning current unique locl
conditions that wagerher make cach modificanon e the Caiffornia Fue Code, reasenably necessacy 1o provide sdequate

and effective provection of life, praperty and the environment more specifically set forth as follows;

Toey Ve
Aliser. 4

20-0203 H Page 35 of 41



FINDINGS OF FACT
YO CHLANGES OR MODIFIGATIONS TO THE STATE BLTLDING STANDARDS
CUOMIE (TTTLE 24 FART 9% BECAUSE OF LOCAL CONDITIONS

rearral

Aty dve Cootidersien, the Boand of Chrectors of the Guorgetown Fipe Praeion Districr. herehy tinds shar duv 16

fwcts chomazte geotorc and wpogrephir condiions. a5 stated within this docament, there 5 3 need @ poovels the

machificat o and hangs Dontin2d wothe adopuye Jrdisance of the Califernig Flre Code Such changes are decsied

v be reasonably cecessary o0 provide sdecuace and effecrier protecton of life, peoperey, and the snvironmean

The Genrgerasn Fioe broiecncn Dhaonor pronider frs pracssran, smergency mafical services and speciadund meucue

nEs s wigh vy -sdeer V8T gquare oule weeas The Drxoder i lecatind o the

hY

hoars Lo uppr:\:‘»mzﬂd*' threw thousand res

mradd Uounty. The (nsp-.lgup'r._'_.‘ a¥ b Disrrtey ranges fromn oolling hills af grasy and vk wondland

in tbe wertoand Sakocimier vy G osteep drainager of the east pordor T wesrher condittons cary fiom freering

CHMPIRATLLAY WL RCE TP Sunw s smiter, rn sam et fermperata s chat segubiriy wveged JIKdvgreen,

ves -

LA IReinw T FiTe Erofueline D

et an Al el tersy. The Thtmmior parmicipanes o saphiskiratesd ot

sad orogram end fofpdrcho!t thrauk? dghaerent by the Zalifornia Dendriasnt of Foovweery und Fire Protecion (Cal

af che Faerer il resnand

Fiees at aminn, The jedoue vxoaned deal wnth, any rype of emorgeny The g "Five

Fropacron™ wy this document 5 brovnd avd ochudsm ceipereey s fizes ks aad ador naeatpeatians. alarima ptbebic

szt calls, bazardous mue oals serdents medival and and v vadie e e

The Diomet cerablishrd onv, vl e statted Bae oatne dmd foon vaelie Fee wanmnt o poosde gruerginey

sercleas Po Pl sommarmity Pore Atabiog oo 1w bnated aeothe T R I R TR Y a5 e bawn al DOHT Bl R

Fire Sanon 50 0 beatsd o0 70 Wannseeh Spvogg s Raad, Cevrgeesnn Eoe st o8 ciecated ar 900 YVl et
Kod

A6 mand soamran Pouleeard veonorteswr The Tuwper ey 0 dul somey crieer perpinmel, alongs swen b one

Searmenent e wtarr o b e Deoaed e Jlaed aliprs Mow [oad Sreenivnends Fee St o0 b Dovassid

:
RTINS AT S ST Pl

Chimats

Tre emgerown Biye Proverrort Do ool avban 3 toeeorbld v gton Uoe Loapion e sibecd 1o Gt v e, win
wiy atianial s erpge sorwiall st wsger miovih sl Dann b e el e beap abeoige vastelh st 05 e e ey
year Flese pdvirne svesther condirenn remy s Garesdoop saad s inhinore and Qosdiag e well e ek ook
Hagzyrds aloag he mepir aneees veviby Wl e e T e che F et Bean oy ':m:«:mni\i:‘rg areas  Lige o p-:nmin of
vatnbadl alony with sepuearend raaid clicares, the Aty st the e Preteoser Dednet o proande omeilifte cMmer e,
respemse Doslten dolayel. Thime same sdves e s Gt cosditions clies oot i o Zarge number ol sehunbar gecniens
titaf pl;llin' extreare pettrants oo dhe avalshiiey el Dd ey Py jrargny I3 P vl CINATRe O el lle st i hazandoue
waterials coneral, and hees hghtmg Phe dlemate condinens atten pmabo i substannal o dowad ok af abilin of the
Fire Protevonn Posent to vespeond ooonedhaneie oo ciier rpe ob omergeass siidioens thar oonur Exaniplen o these
e rpe ey sduations He bk stewenzee tres, oacidland arud baest Bres theading Dazerdess maienals nodeno

vnenge sy smndical Calla, vebi be aodidentsand e rescae CrsTed g1 AZTReme R extabinied with whairing

fire agenchos aughin nud bee Jevadble die too sdyetoe Chimetty nncdiniome reamenng or wiadly Mhatlimg decesy s the

{rsyrivt

Summary:

fesadutiont 201904 Page 2 ol 5

20-0203 H Page 36 of 41



D.

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the Fire District. Times of little or no
rainfall. low humidity, and high temperatures create extremely hazardous conditions. particularly as they relate to the
wildland urbun interface. Winds esperienced in this area can have a significant impact upon structure Hres. especially in
buildings in close proximity to one another. and w wildlands commonly tound in the Georgetown Fire Protection

District. Strucrures built within the Georgetown Fire Protection District must be built with these variables in mind.

Geological. The Georgetown Fire Protection District is located within moderate activity seismic Zone Three. The
seismic. geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires, major breakage of water mains. multiple electrical
power failures. muliple collapsed structures and a large number of calls for emergency medical aid. all of which may
occur simultaneously during a scismic evenr. The warer district has numerous water-pumping syscems used for fire
suppression water delivery, as well as water storage tanks providing water system pressure.  Most of the pumping
systems are dependent on electrical power for operation  Such electrical power may not be available during a seismic
event. Water storage tanks used for the storage of required fire suppression water may also collapse in such an event
forcing the additional need to transport water via additional pieces of fire apparatus which will place a significant

restraint an the ability of the District to provide the required emergency services.

Summary:
Local geographic and geological features and processes exist within the boundaries of the district that may hamper the
ability of the Georgetown Fire Protection District to pertorm its sworn duties, Fire following an carthquake has the

potential of causing greater toss of life and damage than the earthquake itself.

Topographical. The District is primarily composed of areas that are considered by the State 1o be high fire hazard
severity zones. Much of the Disirice is located withiv faothill terrain, covered with highly combustible vegeration.
including the presence of many coniferous forested arcas. The elevation within the District ranges from at 1.000 feet to
over 1800 feet at the highest point Slope within the District ranges from O degrees 1o 90 degrecs. The structures within
the areas of foothills rerrain have very limited tire access. due to narrow roadwavs with steep grades and poor road
surface conditions. The presence of many existing struciures within the high fire hazard severity zone areas provides for
a very high potental of a structure fire spreading into a wildland or forest fire condition as well as the potendial for a

wildland or forest fire spreading to structures.

Summary:

The alignment of canyoens. valleys. and slopes into inhabited areas, combined with the variable nature of the terrain.
vield potential for increased fire risk. Most structures, both residential and commercial, are in or are surrounded by
areas that contain significant grass, brush. mixed oak woodland. and mixed conifer fuel load. Due to drought conditions.
beetle infestations. and lack of vegelation management, much of the area is populated with either dead or dying trees.

contributing to extreme fire danger

Conclusion:

Resolution 2019-04 Page 3 of' 5

20-0203 H Page 37 of 41



Lacal iitatic zeographic, and topographic conditions described above increase the frequency, intensity, and size of
fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, these conditions impact potential damage 1o souctaees from ar
earthquake and subsequent fire. Therefare, it reasonably necessary that the Calitornia Fire Code be modified 10
maitigate the effects of the above conditions.

California Health & Safery Code Secrion 179587 requires that modifications 1o the Fire Unde be expressly marked and
identifted as to which esch finding refers to which Code modification. The antached Appendin A provides this

Connectiomn,

INTRODUCED ar a repr lur meeting ol the Baard of Directors of the Georgetown Fire Protection (MNstrice on
Cietober [ch, 2005

PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regulae meeting of the Board of Directors of the Gesegatown Fire Pratection
Discrict on October 10th, 2018 by the followang rall cell vore:

AYES: o LTS 0 Ty I TART Lo e e
ROFS: ]
ABSENT. © T o Lo
AUSTAIN:

ATTEST: AR

J— M_‘. ez - ‘_,), Y. ) b
Priane Searngeens Buand sllers el Willinme Peard Fre-npent
Resolution 20)9-44 Pawi 4ol 3

20-0203 H Page 38 of 41



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted | Adopted as Amended Finding
1011 X Admin
105.6.27 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
106.6 X Admin
106.6.1 X Admin
106.7 X Admin
109.4 X Admin
1104 X Admin
1104.2 X Admin
112.4 X Admin
202 X Admin
302.1 X Admin
307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.2.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
503.5.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
505.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
509.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.a X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.b X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
33103 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
‘33121 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5001.7 X Admin
5601.2 X Admin
5601.2.1 X Admin
5601.2.2 X Admin
5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 H Page 39 of 41




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section | Adopted | Adopted as Amended Finding

6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
6112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

6113.1 X Admin
6113.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Chapter 80, NFPA, 13D-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix B: Table 8105.1(1) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix B: Table B105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.5§ 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D104.4 - X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

101.2 through 101.5

Admin

X
102.6 through 102.8 X Admin
102.10 through 102.12 X Admin
" 103.1 through 104.1 X Admin
104.3 through 104.4 X Admin
104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin
104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin
104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin
104.11.3 X Admin
105.2.3 X Admin
105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin
105.6.12 X Admin
105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin
105.6.37 X Admin
105.6.39 X Admin
105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin
105.6.48 X Admin
105.6.50 X Admin
106.1 through 106.3 X Admin
107.1 X Admin
108.1 through 109.3 X Admin
110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin
110.4.1 X Admin
1131 X Admin

20-0203 H Page 40 of 41




2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix

2019 CFC Amended Code Section

Adopted

Adopted as Amended

Finding

303.1 through 303.9

X

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

305.1 through 305.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

306.1 through 306.2 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
307.1 through 307.5 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
308.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.2 through 308.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

308.2 Admin
308.3 through 308.4.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
3103 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
310.4 through 310.8 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
311.1 through 311.4 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
319.1 Climatic/Geological/Topographical

319.2 Admin

319.3 through 319.10.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

403.10 through 403.10.1.3

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

405.5 Admin
510.3 Admin
807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 Climatic/Geological/Topographical
903.2.1.5 ' Climatic/Geological/Topographical
1103.2 Topographical
Appendix 003)120:1 through Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.4

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D103.6

XKEX| X [XXIXIXIX XXX IX XXX IXIPX XXX XXX ]|X]|Xx

Climatic/Geological/Topographical

Appendix D: D104.1 through

X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D104.3 {excluding exception) 4 gical/Topograp
dix D: D105.1th h
Appendix roug - X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
D105.4 :
Appendix D: D106.1 through . . . .
G l
D106.3 (excluding exception) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
A dix D: D107.1 (excludin,
ppen lxexceptions; xcluding X Climatic/Geological/Topographical
Appendix D: D108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical

20-0203 H Page 41 of 41






