
RESOLUTION NO. 040-2020 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 016-2017) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is 
updated by the State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2019 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 
permits a county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are 
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions: and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 
1, Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulations to the 
local level and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her 
authorized representative, or to the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of 
the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a 
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection 
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on November 14, 2019, the Board of Directors of the Georgetown Fire Protection 
District adopted Ordinance No. 2019-01, which adopted the 2019 California Fire Code with 
amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical 
conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado 
ratifies Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the Georgetown Fire Protection District and delegates enforcement 
of the ordinance to the Georgetown Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections: 

101.1, 105.6.27, 106.6, 106.6.1, 106.7, 109.4, 110.4, 110.4.2, 112.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4 through 
307.4.4.2 (a) through (d), 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.4.2, 503.4.3, 503.4.4, 503.5.3, 505.1. 507.5.1, 
509.3, 903.2 including (a) and (b), 903.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.8.2, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 
907.2.a through 907.2.d, 907.6.2.1, 1203.1.3, 3310.3, 3312.1, 4903.1, 4905.4, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5601.2.1, 
5601.2.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, 6112.1 through 6112.3, 6113.1, 6113.2, Chapter 80 
NFPA 13D-2016, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 5.1.1.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 
7.6, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-2016 Section 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table B105.l (1), Appendix B: 
Table BI05.2, Appendix D103.l through Dl03.3, Appendix Dl03.5 Section 1, Appendix Dl03.6.l, 
Appendix DI03.6.2, Appendix Dl04.4. 

20-0203 H Page 1 of 41 



Resolution No. 040-2020 
Page 2 of 2 

The Georgetown Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its 
entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2018 edition 
not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

105.6.17-105.6.19, 308 .1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403 .2.1-403 .2.4, 403.3, 403.4, 
403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10 .3, 403.11, 403.12, 
404.1- 404.4, 405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, 805-807 (adopting 807.5.2 & 807.5 .2.3), 808, 
904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103 .9 (adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, 
Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D 104.2 (Exception), D 106.1 (Exception), DI 07 .1 
(Exceptions 1 and 2), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J, 
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 Cal!fornia 
Fire Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said 
Board, held the __!__Q_ day of March , 20 20, by the following vote of said Board: 

Attest: 
Kim Dawson 
Clerk the Board of Su 

Ayes:Hidahl, Frentzen, Veerkamp, Parlin Novasel 
Noes: None 
Absent: None 

?/~ 
Brian K. Veerkamp, Chair, Board of Supervisors 

20-0203 H Page 2 of 41 



cronGtTOWN 

; 1•;-.-. ~~ ·~r!'"." :i:~~ ·';,.1 ,1:) l 
"'° 1 l ,l 1_,, ~ 1 •

1 
.. .i. i ... , .,._ I,. • ·w _. a,_. , l 

Dt1n ANhhm, Chief Admimstrali"t.'. Olfo.:cr 
El Dnr<1Jo l'ounty Bourd of Su~rvi~,rs 
)JO Fair Lane 
Pluc,:rvillc. CA 95667 

Rnolution Ratif}1ng Ordtn11nce No. 2019-tll or t~ (~orgrto"·n flrC' Prot«rion Obtri~t. 
which adopts th~ 2019 California Fire' Codt with am('ndmtnt, rtlatNI to local clim•Uc, 
geographic and topographic condition11. 

Dear Mr. Ashron: 

The Uc:orgctown t'irc Protection Disrrn.:t (GEOI I'- n·~uc,11ng tht Board ,,r \up1.Tv1,...,r~ i BUS.I ralllY ,c, 
OnJinani.:i.'. No.2019-0 l. whtch adopts the 2019 California Fire Code a~ amended due ll• ~rci.:ilic: luciil c.lima1i~·, 
gc,)grnphic and topogrnphic conditions. California tlc11hh and Sal~ly (\idc S\.-ct,on i Jl<b<J 7 n:qlitn:\ the 

legi.slsti,e body of the city or coumy where the ordimmcc will i1Jlply 10 nJtdy, modil\ t:•r dl'.'lly the adr•prcxl 
ordinance The BOS must also Jt'lcguh.' c11forn·tm:11t of the ur<lin,u1cc 111 cirht'.I thi.- hrc Di~tm:t <ur it~ 
rt.-prc~nrati1,,c) l)r the Ch1t·f Building ()jfo:.iol. 

Th!!rdore. we request the County Hoard of Supervisors rntit'y Ordin11m:t· N,1. 2.n 19 O I with 1mll·mhnc111s ttl the· 
2019 California Fire (\1de. and ddcgall: U1e cnli1rccmc111 nf 1h111 ( lrclinani.:~~ w 1he < icoq,:c1• 1wn Fire rr,•lt.'t'tiun 
Disuict Chief. A pmpo~'\I ROS n:soluti11n i~ c11dns1..•d for your rcvu:w uml use on 1hi~ 1npi.: 

S1m:crely. 

Gh:nn W. Brown 
~ire Chief 

.\TIACHMF~"T'i 

Ge.,ni:C'to11o·n htt Prnr~:u, .. , [),,rn,:1 i >r,tm.in, c ~ •• lu 11,.,.1 I 
.: (rt:":'ryclo,-,11 Fur Prr•l(dl•'II Dutncr F u"Ln~ ,..f Hid R.-•l•Jll"lt N" ~t)l(Li~ 

J. Or.ft El D.-.ra.J.·, C"~II~ BOS ~'='•11111,1" 

20-0203 H Page 3 of 41 



Attachment No. 1 

Georgetown Fire Protection District 

Ordinance No. 2019-01 

20-0203 H Page 4 of 41 



Cl OULt I 0\\ ,, HIH. l'IH> If,( I 10~ UIS IIHC I 

l>IUll'-1 \',(17 NU, :01 11,01 

rn. J I l iii.[) \ FH l) n 'i' ; 1 ll Iii 1. \HI j ( 1t· Ill I{ H . n "~ "i I 1! ti LOH(.; l '. 111 \l,/ N I· wt· 

Pr-tc ·, rH· !'ION I l!S IIUCT ASH H .I J IWS. 

~\n ·•tdlPaUi\.".t'"' of I 1•~• ,rgctn,,tt (:in: PnH11 ,:l'.~.,n 1J1"1H1ttt ,~ if:_fJt .1tfnpt1nt: rhc ~111 1> tditt,~n t',: t;:, r i1lU,,tH.i~ 

a' .-,, i'." 1.'-I~. i!l&.:liff_~-); 1l~ir1~ the 2.0 I~ !·.1i1tt1Hl qf i!1L~ l.ru,-, ... uru;,.i,~t1i .1-· •.. t r r_ : 1,i ·. ft·.,.t.ui.u .~~.~ ~.nJ l(f1\ ~·:; i. 1J:_: :h:- , .... t ·,,. Ufi:,L,11• 

.-t 1111: anJ pr,1pt'th frnm l1re 1rnd ,.<.\Jd",1''11 L.11,1r•i'.· .1n:,n,~- !fl'fll 11,s: ',l·•(Tu.(C. iu11<Ji;i.,' ,.U\ll uc t•I i.,;.,r-k·'.l 

,ut"-1.t!lt.:r;;~i n1i1t.·n.lf.'i atod dc~·:L.t!:j. IU'w.J :°!'<14tl ~f11~dlt1Hn.:;i !r.t/1f•Jf\U~ h) Tilt'.'. llf r(,··~:<~1 -:r1 1::c ()(~_u:,.,1~1.-~, •. ~t (a1' !111,.· 

,wd ;,,,.:n,')(;"i in i_,L_l); .r·ri·v1din~ fm th,;: 's,1Mt:I'•.' ,i,! f"'r.11:1: u .. J ,_,·,!,r,:<;r,n ,,f I~ 1h,:::1;-.,r. ~q-i.><tHl,' I. •:,J1ni;1., ;·,,1 

;11, r,.jiJ {if 1.i 1.1) ;old ,11'; •)n/cr l"•nl1nlll1'X·; )1.,t r·1•1; n( ii'•' .,,,Lr.t ,,,: ','1 ;,',:,f'':l lJ~r-t....,i;,', 

He ,, 1 1J,i.£\·\ I~·- LI ·1 !_,, 1,.,; B"i\l•I ,f I >i; ;,,.,, rd i, ,,1 .<. ,r .. '• 1,.· •. 1 ,• , !ri, .... , 

,:=-:::.iw1 t-l'P"•;,oft.\c ,., 

.':-ciiU·• l \Oot·no•dlf I t ll)f \\ I f'Jl t'\:c ·u "'"~~ 
:· ~.:·ic·" u~~Ll.~1f ... t>,n, t:--
',! :t;,•1 l<l'.'J_LltJ 

.;,:,,,.., ~-~t \ U<\1111 l'l_\ 

<~.c,;1'1 un• JI\•,.~., .~,1,1•1 Bl.I< .\Ill>' 

I-.:,"'· tr·- )4 _.; 11{---,·:. 11 I 1
(••: _t; s' ! l 1!!1i:J ;. ;.:r_,·~-1h 't' P: J: i''L·Ji'~ 1; I np,1.~. 1rihFif ri tlH.H, i(!ll> l d·',1) ~~,Di) .r.iuph.:J 1~u1 1!JP 1. t) 

~,, ,:4·.,#·,~,, /,-·:ii .'.1 q! '.ht (~11/~/,,,-,u..i ff1·r.d1·'1 •\ '1~/. f1· 4 •.l,·1 :h'." ~it1d~1\~-; • ... ,f t~t~ r'C'lntrtc r,:, ;/'.er;..: Cr)F!,j,:·1pn 

p,,-;i,il·.jt:n:: ::~1,,,_1q i,t c;,-,-·, dt11,;d 1J.:rnla.q IU. "7td~, 

J'.;,1 'I. Ill IU C'Plln,1,. •1t;l,.,I.,· . .: .'.rir..,n.; 1,.•.-

.. 1~tlX '~"i!~lh"-1 n nOL fa\\c.rr .. :ii t~~.· tr:~ ~T.-•h:- \~JI!,!~..-.~ 

20-0203 H Page 5 of 41 



-

.1ii.-A_ 4113.6. 4.-_,3 '.'. 11,3_111.:1,.J,.r11 :,. ~01 ~ 1 tr,~~ -- ;i 1u_, ?. ''i1: 1'._• ~- -ht:UO .1, ~r,1_, ,, -HI, I:', w-1.1-ifH -i 

-lU5 i----l!i_,_-t_ .m.,,, 11.:·- ,; -l•i<-. >!i,· ,r: · ,.u .. :-111:F xP: ·-,. ~-•i'!;. '"JJ.i.! , liiL J !f1J. I, f l(11_J.J in.1.ri, 1111·1_•.J 

,_~C,J?:rn;,:. l ,;-13_,,, 1. : :(1:1 Ii'. t: 11-l J ,1~·. ! hlidi:r :,. • hw:,:, ::c:. ti:•; ,•.,.:crriun_; 1in1.kr l)]i_q} ,,F.,1:q1lion1. 

D!f.16 J rL\ccrll•'H• [)li'1' I :l'x,.q,f:,1:11 .\ppnkll., \, .\p:'l:n,fo. F. --\rpc·mJi., F .-\rr'k!mh, ,-, . .-\ppl'l\l.lix .I, 

.\,1p.;;hL_>, }'.. :\f';).:lt•h [,, \pr,·n 11 • ~-1 

,ECTION J: LO( AL A.MF.'iHMt.Nl"' 

Chapter I 

Stctiun ltH Sc:opt and Gtgc-ral R!!tJIJfrc,ott·qh 

HI I. I Tille shlli I he iimcn,j,:d Jl!, follow:.· AJd ·~sm,· •4 11,1·11.l1cn,,n r, ;r:o,; 

~ction I 0~ Pum ih 

11)~.tt.!7 LPt;.ga.s ~hllil •·-: .1,n,;•i,h'd :.,. ,,,11._.,,,-.-.- -\Lltl ,,_, 11>;· •.'x,·~·11t1,•n: .Al ,::r .lt'•Jv,~ _-._i_Ay,, !~ -:, 1 

l'),:,·:1t1l'r1. :i nenni1 LS ii~·'. ,,:'-j1Hn:,.i 1,-,.- i•,,tn ,,1,,,,i ,, 111.11,,.-,., '·' '1!. .1 i .'5-,:allun ....,,,1n c.1p.11.:1(, rir !c'.;~-

r~,- mit~t,pl,~ (•,)Ot,ll:l<:"r ~y;;;tctn:,, h_i\'i!l~~ Jli Jl:_.:~r 1.::
1 ,l;'~ .. qltJH11!·., rF.'t •..:'.\i.t..'~Ji•lt ~ 2) i;.1i!(•n'.' s~rvrn~ 

,,.._c,J;1,,11(i--., tr- C•n•.1r P.-

~'(_lhlO lflb f«:,<; 
jilh_l> l't'r-mil, f'laa Re\ ii:~ ,od ln~l,>!('ri,1n F~r"- ·1/,ali t.,- :1,i<J·.'.d ·•·• 1,,it,_,\,". ,</ _,_.,._-J,._,,Ju/.: ,•./_/,::,;·.v 

if:r'. ,Ji:;,·r ;;/ .-nm· !•e _l, 11.n:J f"l r/,f /l'WJ/ C&Wr•'rll di'itl'ic'( }ft' .rdt,•,Jr1/.' I Jfr,1/f!t ,-(- 1\llf•'f_\' ( .-.i.h_- / '! 11., ,' I 

1116,(d (o .. • R«OH'Q' f',t::S ,:null be itdded ii~, ti dlnw~: r,·,,, . . n·1·1•1, r )••r·s m11~ h,• du1r~;,·d 1.-, mn• 

;,vrr;tJn ;f;.r11:, c.:urr1,o.f"'t;:~if(r or l 1u.\•'nt...~.r;.1 th.:.11 thrn:,,~,, tfr-J.:ii,i'.<''1('1'. l1(;tJ\,11 ... rr n.f Or( i•IM", •',•f il'.' 0 !l·,,,t1 r/ 

<'•/ ,·>,,ri,r,,·/rili_ ,1,n·1·,•1;1,/,-111,,nf11· ,t·hid1 th,,J'-'" U ,·lta!'f!-:-.-1 r}·fr:ilth ,{- :.;:11~·1)· , __ · .... J, /_i'.1-'t,,• P-t,' /.-., .~-Iii 

1t1_'t( r· •, ,',:,/ flw O:"IU(/1' i',J\"I n(\"11/1(-'rl'Hin~ /hefir;; ,-;11d,'cr l"t'_,,,·,1i./111,' II. t/i, .'-i'<'f;r •/rlfl J/J,'1;/,,11/ 

1111,17 1\d1!1it!i,Jn1th·c~ -..h11tt ~t: ,1dd<!d El:, fnl!,w,, lflt,:n ,, /,-_,_. ,,_.. Im,"•• 11.-.,, I· ,i'/1,· lr,!,·,t ,:,1 i 

fltfl ··1tru1·u~'faJi' lj·nh -1,' r·'~-.,;,,..m (01},":.~ ::·u)l.~/{1.:f:'t:t: i:)/ltt:: .:.Jutf:1··,·'Ji~ !u~'inJ~ dJr!'1~/L f.iqn I t}J,/,: rli," i /i' f 

,•tiH t:--11 th~· .'·,HJ(',[,,,, 1#' /~'}t" 1.l('l},.i.nl ~lr:"'ft ;f!t:''1! rn.n ,...!:n,z. [,'~' ,;,J ... i _,rtu~ .. 1,,.~ ii·\/ u·nr~·t '! ;, ·•f !d ""'di.Jill ! ;)~., 

20-0203 H Page 6 of 41 



-~C'lion l O<J Ro~ rd of' Apl,lt'ah 

.Sedion IO'IA Appl'ill l'ron·uun,, and Tm1diu,•, ,,i;t',1 fi~ ad,.1~d F r·,:;lk,1,,:, -Im· r,'1-::,-:," 1_,r ,·111,n· ,1·hc:• 

,ht'ficvt•_r lti<'J' 111uy t,,, a,freriL'I)· .i/l,.'.:/•'d hy ,m c1nlu, ,kci1·r",m. n,- .lt!t.:nr111111ti•)rr mml.: t•y thejfr..: r:ude 

, '.tfiucil rhro11gh u wri/t,:n nvfic,! m_i:\' llf'f'•dl tM, m.:itt.::r 11•ithin I: ,."<1/',:n,lar da\·J ,_,(the ,r:;.1.1mwrk orr 

fhc· ,•1,:.•/JC".'. All .sud, Of)f,'tt,11~ Jht.1il he _fl'/,;) iri 1111-rting With t!rot s.•n,,.•t,l!)" ,.~(d1e G,_1~·cr11ior B01Jrd_tr:1r 

!he distnd A /.t>r,.•ly ,1ppc.',J/ :./Jr1// sruy }llrtht!1 acli,m t.'.v rh,• J7rt ,:c,fr •.:J/ld,1/ unril th,, mmtr:r 1s 

il,•(t'rrnfr1ed b_1' iht: Af'/h!,il Board m' 1mtfincd In Srcilori IU9.2, w1/e .• u tirt! is,rn,: ("JU, ar• immmem ji,.· 

or li/i! saf;'!J' h= .. mi to memha·, ·:if ihtc puhfo: 'l'hf /Ir.: L'Ode o/.ficrai shall nnl~6· I/ii!. ,1pf'• /lam t,y 

,-ari(i,·.J lf!ail 0(1he dur.· a11d r,·me ,_.f such ht·arin,g. The lit·.-1ring shull be ~dreJ11l.•d ro toJc,, p!a.::., m_1 

sofma than lOcult!n,iur d(~1·.,·frum 1he datl! .1hi.•">t·r1 on the i:alifinl m,,il f11e upp,:J/Lmt ,,ho/1 ha1·? /14° 

right ra upJ--..;:ar in p,:n;o,1 cir ,:,y ,.;;;,•nf .-,1 du.• l,.,,1r1.,1.-.:. 011d r•r,:)<'rtl or>J•'. wri'lfrn ,mdior pholo."!.raph,,_· 

t!\'t.it'll.:.:11 lo tht· ..lpp!iJI fJoard 

Section l l O \' iolqfiog~ 

t IO..t Violation Pcnaltie, sh:ill he amended a.~ follll,\•T Pt!rsons whn shall \'lvlllte Ii pr•)\'tsion uf1hi5 

,:od!! 1.rr shall rail ({, rnmply with any of ihe requm:rne,,ts thereof or who ,hull erect, inst!IL alter. 

repalr or .Jo work in \"iolat\on of 1he J;,prc-~e"<l .:-,:,n~lflKtion .::J,y;uments ,::,r dirccti,·t or· '.he lire crnje 

,-,flicial, or of a pcmii1. or .::,.::r1i !i~1ttc ti.'>..:J undtir µruvisi,m~ at" •.hi~ code, shall he guilty of a 

,.,,inlem,·.m1)r vr 11!/rrJd /Ufl (I/ /ht· di.11.'f'dll.'// r)/" {fl,' pros,,c·11/i>1,,~ ,:1/rnru,_·_~· or 1J5,:ncv, runish.1bk hy l1 

nn~ :ii:,c t>x.:ccding $ WO. Of!}x ,1 /ir n ,•ir:1/afi,,.n: ::. ,'I J1n.: nm L'.h"dditi;: $500. ()()j,,~ ,1 .secu;1d \'iuh11/c,,r 

u/rh,· sum<' pn_1vi5/"t,,r f>'irhin r.mt· Y<"Llri .1· .1 f/,i,.' rK·l •'.fr1.:e::df11g J J 000.00 _for i:ud1 widitiunul 1•10iatiu,1 

u(1h,.• sumo: pr,_H isiun wirhi11 on,~ J'.:',1r, ,1r by impri:;,_;mrn:nt no 1. e;,;~·eeding ! dO d(1_1'.I, ,_,r both sud1 fo1c 

a.nd impriso11111ent.. Each dt1y that a \•j,·,l.1Ji110 continue, ::i.H~~ due nutii.:u h,1, he-en s,:>n•(;j shilfl b~ 

deem~d a ~ep1ualt.'. ulfrnsc. \ /it',1/ih & :);1k1y (\1,:!e .'.; 1c11,,11s ! 3 !-15 onJ I 799.:,} 

I IQA.Z Citalluo.s sllall I){: added '.iS f(tl[m,s: 

• ,:11rc·s,inlaiil't'. m,~1· fs.ru,: om1ions _for 111frocti,:irlf or misd1!m,:,1,w,· 1·iol,1t1e1m ·-1 thi:. 1.:,Jtit p11r.11.i,.ml rii 

S-!.ction /jfl, 71 ,if th1! {l.:il/lh & Xafrty L'odc of the Swri:: ,f California and Clwp1,cr 5c (commi'11,mg 

wrlh :i,~1:rwn 8.U.n! ,7! Tit/.:} o(['r1rt _, of1fu: f'fnu/ Cr>di' 1;frh.: Swrc u/C,111.fornn, 

S«tion l 12 Stop Work Order 

112.4. f"11ilur~ to Comply shnll be 1:1m..-n<le..l M follow~: Anj pcr"or, wb,.1 shall continue !my work 

,11i.cr ta11·111g been ,crvcd with II qr,p-mHI( ,,rder, exccr1 such w,,rk ,15 r.llm ~rs.on n Liir~'i.:!t:rJ Lo 

perf,.1nn rn ri:mcive J v1olltio11 (,r uns,1ft: c0oditi,m, shnll he 1·1ml.r/J,,'1/,1 ny aJ1n,.: or i"1rwi.wrimenl r..ir 

,',c,rlr w ,kffri/-i,:,d in S.:~11i,_m r 1,i, .f 171,•oltlr ._i, S.it,·t.1• Cude S,·cn, ,111 / .i 1-!.5 ,md I ~995) 

20-0203 H Page 7 of 41 



-
('b;ipfN ~ 

Sn:r1<111 .'!412 (,~·nerni Udi111li'..llH 

\d,J .~._ r,•,;,.·,,, :,: .. ( nmpfir~ . . \rwl/ m,·11n d/i'r,· ·,,<),/,·/, /, 11.11:,i fn, ,·,,,.l/1i,1g , •. ·r.,u11,1i w,1nrrr/1. /ig111ir11:, 

1:t_r ._;,:•_,-,):~~ff .. ~ ,Ul,tJt •. ",\\}..; rh/{ •fh.:JJ•,it'J /if'1 1;; 1:n~/u1nw.1tf ,.,_,,r/J/11 Ol1fr/;.1nr-_lit1"j,•/4Ji·,.·.,· ,,Jflt./ ,:,1,_·h,n 1d :i(fF\.'C( 

\\ itt1J/t...u!':/ ,:,r L·hfr.'!Uf..').'\, \/~1',Jt1•,· !1.,i/lg /,·fli:.!,.J_ frc./1.U,J, 0( .\'{.1/11f/J.J{'J( fl(U'f,:J/i/1,r f•11r}_i1'('U,• p;1f5. hril.<tl>f< ,~,; 

~PJ ,,'.t' ht',uiny: ,i,1 k'h',' \ h' i,/d1 ,lfr_' lLfr.',i i/lJl.l'i1J.. ,;/ :Ji1y .f ,, 111.'I u; ,L muh ii•' /,w.'1 ,. ,'. r .'.!"l,l' l, ,'ill,: 

11,:~-, 11•Jrrtc'.,JJ/i,HI "11Jll!llr:J Ori r1 •'~1Jj.;/,: 

Add dufinilion for l>istricl - Shafi m1:1m ();,, ,ii•:1,.1, ·i .u1.J 11// utJ.,4•r rrrci.1.1 w·11>,1n Jh;- ,··. 1, nm /,,,.,,.f.111•· • 

rh.-r,·,f w,w nr her.:,,tt~Tr ,•,11at:rli.1hai 

i\d,J definition for Drh·eWa}' - Sh,1/l rrw,in .:1 ,·,·l:i1.·1,i,1r ,,,·,:,··,, 1h·11 ,,.,.,..., r,1>m,..,.,. 1t..1n ,.,·, ,l,1,,;,i,111•1 

wllli no m{Jre r!wfl IN.t<' ,fwl'lling ur1ii.1 ,:,1, ,J _<ingl,' p,1r,,:i ,m,J ,1•n- ni.ml,,., •J '"' .•.u,,11· ~,1,J°.i,,i.:, 

Add Jc!inition for Euc:utive ijotl)· · Shc1/J ,n,:an lh,: Bot11·d, f n,r,·clrll' \ •,{IM D1\l~rrl 

Add rldinition for Fl[! Chier • Sh,11/ t'!L',l'! /he' r·Ji1e.r £11•-eur 1 v,.' Fi.~.- l.f.'/:; ,'i of ,;,, ,--ir1. 

d,:,,,_,,.,,,,..:,11..!di\l• id .icn•ing rft.!- }unsJ1ui,:>rt •1r 1 d,,/_1 ;lhl/!nr :::.-d ,,.,.,.. .. ~,,.,,.,,,,,,. 

,\d,f ·.kliiii:·,r.,1'· ~;.,r T1,11nhl f'rn~d i'>l.111~,t ·Sh,,.',',,,,,,;,,, ,1.·1r,db~·;.-..r:u111,,-i ,,,r,,:;i!J., u.11,11:1,•·: 

,-~uLJr.i or- urh·cr- p<'rSf..lflrit·{ ~ i~:, ur"'-~ traifft!d rri th?. r:r1:1;.:>tr r Pr: ... :~~11,rr .r,-.- t".·, fr ("f ~,1,,/ \_'Jrd/<1 , r,·t· 1 iJf 1)/Jt.-,-

< 'h1pfrr .\ 

~rt,og JOl 1Jdint11_,~ 

301. LJ..~Qnilioa, ,.J>:d' h(- .m••:f\,r,.:.j :E r.·,H.-,w,. ,\ddc•c1 ,~-mnpfir>: ,11:firi'i!10:••1. u:, :,i'""'" Ht>uvc ,n 

1, h,tfkt ~. 

Set.lion .HF Oo,:g Uurntag,. Rtcrl'a1J•>ti•I hrt".', ud Ou\door Fin:pl15eo1 

MF ...... (' tmpfi ft' Rntrn.:ti,:,D'l ~h.'11! tr: il•:k'kJ ·,15 1;-,11~·~ ,: 

t\~!J..,-4..4,1 [( I! 11•1i11w/t1i ,;,, ,JIW r-·.· •,(;•) (,:, ra~hl. i,wf11h11n, ,,;· lJ,r,' J campfire ,,r,}n ,:,r 11(.tJ{ ,.my !,,w;!/-

, --1,":r, ,,, thl! ,ill f 

EH·,pti.rn: I ·,,,,wr.·rr ,,,/ ,·,1,1li11,1; ,.,.,.,-,11,.m, 11 irh ,111f!rtn'ili o/ 1h,• ,/HJ 

JO~·-'·"'·! Y.-'/,, ·n, · ''"/ •/i1 •· 1 ,v,· ,,/iuw,·.J r/ .\'ltouid f,.,. u•1/ .. rw/11/ p,,r ,un · 1xn;1,rr to iip,hr, m,11 ,,,,. i/n. ,,, LJ.;'<' 

,. t/{,.,H ,·rh~ ,,unr:,,,1n1 r~·•tf41.rJ'tr,,·n1 ·, uf ,, 1.,.il,'f/,/(i -...I H.·irh 

.ltti.4.-4 . .' j:11 ,::,, .. -.-. ; ,,·11/iJ'r ; J,·,•1 ,,J ,;,.. 1•,ntir,·n •:.r rl.1 1.' ,·,m1r11ir,· 1>r c/,:ar,;d ,,,r al:' rfo,.,_,,wN,· 

rnari.:rial ~1/'J,.I ''•\~~r.:f,·lli(,,t. 

•.: 1rdi11;1m:e ~l)J •J.n ! 

20-0203 H Page 8 of 41 



Jli"7AA.~ {b) U.rr,• ,.,.,, .,:,··,,1h/,1 J))n1•d ~1rl, a l1,1>1d/,• ·~( ,11 /..<(I,{/ .!] in,·:hc., is ""~'Jdy l<Y 11.,•,, u/ 111,• 

!"1'11c,iwr,, u,ru1 (/ rlii: ,:,1mr,rir~. 

J0~,4.-'.,: 10 ( .1m1di•-,v.-;kil! t:, /1:nHt•d 1,: d //;,,~, i:>,1• lfr~:-l :JT«':.i. imfrssln ,,rrc1rrrr,a•L'd111,111tl/;,c,w,•d 

Jfl!'A.4.2 ttll i;-,-;,;,.n ,,-c.,m'1"!11n ,1/ the /.111,in1,n1;_,, mwi f•,r ,A11.:1!,1<·d prr,~r to lire i,,!11i11.i11 ,>( rJ,,· 

·.-ufll{:tir1.1 :Jll,-/ .r.h~ii/ f·~ ·)n .'- CL: 

(h11ptl'r ~ 

~clion !>OJ fire \ppanruJ Acceu Roads 

~U.l. I Dirpc•sioa~ ,~L ".:·-c :mi.cml:-d ,L, ~~JI!,:,-.~·,: Fire ,1p;;,.1rat11> ilc.ces~ n·,;td,; •,bit lmYI' ''" 

.m,:,~truct<!d w'idth ofn,::•l ]':'::>< lh,m '.:'I• fr•~'-· ::,\CIIL\i,1: ••i':·,h1 .. 1I.Jcn. ,..u ,,,..,1.111r,·,//n1"1/o,:1' ,-•iu1r!r Ir.• 

!;ir:.: (.' ,;,ur!>, e,,~ert for ilppr,·,ve,.l ~uritv g,.trn iri ai:1.•mtm:i.' with ~f11,·,11 SOJ,6 ,md un, ,t,,,1ruc10:il 

•,m:·:a1 ,:lo;:iran.:e ,-,( n,:,I less 1hl!P ,'' '· ,'t A/;' drn-d,,n-_;. ,n 11,~ durri,.-1 ·;h.,/1 nn1 h,· /.e.,r Ihm, I? .',:o'/ 

!'\OJ.2.~ l>f!d F.11d~ s~nil bt· .Jmer,,kJ .1:s r,,t!,•·.',, l.~::,d .. , ;:,• tlr,~ ,1rrrlf'liUn Jll.:1.x,~ w.,,J\ ,.md dt11-.• .. ·u,1•., 

:n ,:>..::c.,~ ,;f i 50 f,_",:l ·r· ,,:r:tl 1: it.JI'• t .. '. rr,v,·,.k,I ,., 11r1 ,HJ ipprn,·t.:J .tr~a t,11 tttrr111•1,:; ,m,onil lit, 

,1rri,mHlh 

~OJ.Z.6 Bndcn•ad [l~"''IICN Surfae'n ,:•nit>,.: !llll~'f"lnl 11·. l«li,l-,\·, Whet\" ,I l,nd~c ,,r ,HI clc,·.,1L·d 

:,orfo<:t: i°' r:irt ,,f ;, f;r, ,1['i',tf,ll ,·, lll(t:~, fn,I'). 1Je: hri>.11_',:· •,/1111f ht' ,·.,O'Ll[IJ(l,',1 ,1H,I ll1,m;L1in,:-,/ ill 

,1CL'.(,rL1~nc.,: Wfiilt ,,,c 1.:,,,., ,'nf r·, C1, ,, odu ( I :14'1(.\' , ,, ,JrJ •{ 1• ... :ar,o.itt f >1\'n.'1 iH 1,,.~,.•:t1 S(t1thl-;r1..J. ;I ·'('/'c1ttili~ 

L• t /U:t.' .:"t.'l'"t.~,rt l\ilit(i.rt~,·u ,-.,~·,r,:· t ·t.J,, '1,/, 1,"lt,•H·i (', r'flflf,: ,.,_,r,o /n/,; 8r1t,~t'·- 1tHd r;!~"t,lh ... ~.1 ~,tirf~\..'.""'.! 

ohtiil he ,.k;·,in,~r} t~,r J \;..-.,. l,rtd ~dtit:i,•:1\ '" ·:.•:1:, !h: ,nq,,,•,ttl l,~111' , .. ,f !'Ir,- 11r-,•1tnt11, '.',·l11d,: !,,.,d 

limit• ,haii J:,e i"·,~rcd .. t lklh ,:111,.1,,,,,,._ t;, h,.11,,· ·,1 t ,::1 ,,_,,,,11rt:1l h~ l),c.: Firt· r:,,,!,, l Jtlid-11 Wlict~ 

de, ,1k.J ,_,1.11f111.·c~ .!Ai{?Ot,J J,,r ('.m,:113..:n.::.- .,,'.i,;c!i: u ,".' ,H•: ,1._iioccnl 1 t ,11r£11n·, ·,, 1:1c :1 -!tr WA ,k ,1~11,:,,J 

for ,urh uv:·, i1r1'r",t"'J t:,;1rrkr., ,1pp,, .. ,,.:J ,1vn~ ,r hol!i (tl,111 hr 111Jt.,li~·,l an,t ·n.1101.111o~d wl~c, 

r,.-quin:d t,y ow flrc (.,..:k ,·,tnt.illi 

~OJ.4.2 N-1 P1rking ... firl' I.Apn ,hnli Lr: ,1dr.t1Ccl ,t·, Id:""'"' '.,! f'J.'.Tl,m ~;,..,:,· .,:,:r r"'rrA. .. 1 ;',.,.,, 

,tfiJ(fr tr1~lfi,_' 1H in .:,:r.·r,1;.1/l 1111 i'' i..·1tfJ ttJc .Jtt,;·t;,,fl\ ; / {i,{' /--'1r,,: ("lit</. t'" },j,,'ft,•r ,fuJ-,, ,1t,Jfr1if~;~·.i.i 

~'t.'/W:t.'.\;~n/ll0l1•" />-p. __ {[:,- ()flil'r.!t" 01· u//lc·)i'Ji
1 tr,~ffi1 .i~(ir1J.t,,;j' 1•J..·\1iL<' u/,_,!"f~; ffrr 1·,J1.,1r/ r}f·i!~~· ft1gifH cH· 1..!J .-;,~i· 

-:u,-i', ,'H' Jr, .,'JP'Jl 1 /,.,,,., dlt:/rt i'!I lf pt1l,Ji,·h· ,, prh'ilJr•(\.' {_~~?~c .. l ur 1J/.l4"'ti_l{l, ii ~f~~Hr,i:r·.: r-..;rk;.1,:.~~ l(1{.·1."ft'n 

1h, .. ,.J,·t1>,:11dli-1 111 ,·.'lruU f,,, "'··h1,:,·1J;.,,/ ( t• .111• ·J :.;,,.,:n t'"1.n(11i ,,,1,.,, -1,11/,·J_,, ,_~ii ,;· .. ,,r ((1_ .• ,~! ,.:r1ll.1 lc: ,.trv.~ t;.,..,.

,J,·.l'/gn.1/,·,i f•/,1,·1t ,•/,·,1,/1- \{<i//rl).; 1ft J<'f/('I.<' .•,,,I/,·:,•, r}f(JIJ •·l'l( OKl1 in ll1.'Jiii!/ /t)cJf //~ f:luc,: !~ ,I /rrr;; i,,'lc 

~..:..'J !,i 1 n,,r/i,,1,1>.'. pt ,,~10,ro,~,~ rlu• ploi..'11 in ,,:d tt,,d 1,1 < 1ifrtri.1.,n,1;: L-!·.,it.:r n;(,,t.in~ rh~1 ['ltlC:r..· i.;.·nh f/"',t"· 

20-0203 H Page 9 of 41 



,,.., .. ,..f{c' t{ rhl. 11,1.;JJn,·J_\ ".,"-''' '.,h,,:r. '-,( clc:.:1rlv n11;r~·r:d th,: k'1Jrd.f ''}//J{t.~ / .. .AJVf_' 1
' 

,o.,. I I ~f':1dil1J.J:._l11 Ffl:nt ,,f fl,tlr;,ot, :;l1·, 1I h,· added ,is foOnw,: ,Vu pa.,,,11 ,·h,~JJ .n,,p. 11.ir~. ,,_.. 

;1, ,n·.- t!lJ•t,·itu,~: tH~\- ··~ltrc·(,· v,·dlt1n l5 _ .... ,. ... ~, rt( . .J fir.: ,~\lrorJt t'.'fct.::rJJ U.i' /1,Ur1h 1
.\·. (t'il f( '"r-"" h:hi~tt~ f~ 

,l//,'t;,l,·,/ /10, .I /i.•,·,11,,,i /rn·,-r »-h" 1.Y ,,·,1/.':I lfl /h,, fr·,.-,m Ir.'(]( eJIJJ \.}1,1 ·-'11fl imm,·,Ji,n<'/1· t/ldo'c. _,i,,·J., 

,.,. •. Jri,cl,• ,.., .... ··~,r : . ./ ,~..,·,·-:· 1n:r1·, rtJi It tir~' ,·~·hi~·h· (~ ok1,,~_.Jn,. ri/Jt'r~ucd t•yJJ titr-1 1i~·p,,r,,,1,:TJ1 ,Jn.J i·.t i i~'..,tl~ 

m .. 1r;i, .• J di •Cl Ji,,· .-f,:r1rffm'ffl ,,,./,id.::. 

~UA.-4 t la; LIQn Qa~nl on _Rfila.!LWldlh ahatt t,i; 1,J,jcd ~ fol!u,~·~. hr,: limn Ih.Jlt t>,· lu1,·,/ 1 •n 

r;_;;J.:f 14•1.J/11 ,u ,-,,,ri;rc•,/ u1. lt-'{'•'1t,li.l U .i; ,11n1:rldt'd f,y th, ,iirrncr 

~OJ.~ . .\ 1-'irc ,\11pautu, ,\\'.\'I.':\\,;.,~ ~h~[l l_,,; lKMeJ "15 !'c,ll,:,w~ Ai'l (IU/u"1,J(k :l't;/ '!'rf.JnU.lt' i: 1/c'~ 

1n1f1itl,!d <>,rr _/VJ' u/'!'•1'•1(,t I IIC·.'C.{\ r,:.,1:ic .,,,.,u ~·,.tmr.•ir ·i,.·i(h 1h,1 du16d ... ,,r,• 5/u,,.Jur,I ,1, :1,.r,r, • i ,•cf 

tw 1hi• /ir" .:;,;,,J.- , ,rfki.iJ 

S,·('tion 511~ l'r1:"m6s, hlri,1ifinti .. n 

~o~.t ·\tl,Jrl:'ss Mr111J_[k~ h1n i1,1,··.· 11·,~ ii["I:~ r,ri~ ,,f thh pangr.::;1r, ·Mn-:n,.\1:,J ll1 f.,!i.,\,., 

~cljltR ~4)'.' Mn l'rot(i.'.llc•t Waln ~uevt•e 
(.tti .;u \\ hl'rl' Rt'auir«f sh;il 1 !1-:- r1nict,:k.j ,,, i,11 h" ·, 1•_10 f .~~·, ,~1all b~ am~n1.kd :o ; 50 ,1~·.-c 

5ft~J._}_ rtr..: (_ fJhtfol.~_'!!_!._~ .:. /r',_ ;r:,.d.\', ·, .', .i: 1 if.'.,'i l_.'/j/;; l' f.~I U .pnl•.'fJi /,_i,:11J({r,:dtl 1 ~,1 JUlLi _,..' i.:'C~1.i'J, f.r; lkrr,i 1.i 

,1r,1,:nkd 1··, .:J.lfrn: 1h, .t-·,i.',,a·f,1_1: fu , ... , . .,,/ .1:ir,·· ·,prw,r.I:-r rin·r.,, _tirt! alorm ,·011(roi ,-i;md,. s, .. •lor 

{ii.::i!> ,,!t./11' r.-:,,.-,7 r ·, \'~/ C'l•1 filf.''l,J' \iru1,1!f ·wife),,; l, dfl4 nthu /ite Jt'/CC!ion, S1Jp/>r,:sSi1.lrl, or ::imi/,r 

.::,;llfl','){ ,-., ii.: 11<'' ft:al h,: i,.-...·,,ud l'Jti·fr ,J .1m,.:/j· /ir.: c,:,nrrol room .far 1h,: h11il,J,)1g. T~ /ir,: ,:,.1,ur,.•I 

n.,om .\fr;J/ i hr,ve ~rlmmr,m tim•,·n1.·1w11 <,f // ,-r. /~·el b v 1·e1•c.•1 /c1·f tn .~i..t· wilh a /,Hal tL\'e..J/•lt' ilr-(i.J ,-.,( n.:.i1 

k_~,1 /)"-In 3.l .r,Ji.,·,r,i /•·,:r U1,· r,1c,m 'h,,l/ h,: f,1<.:, 11,:,l w;1J,1,i 1/11: b1ohJ/1J~' ,_·in rm Q11t.,idc wall m .:1 /,x,111-:,•, 

,1ppr,_n·cd hy l.h,• fir,, C,.J,· 1 ti!iL'ii1l m11/.';h,11/ ti,• ,1n:1\,1il,f.•ft·,m, 1h,1 ,.'Xh'rior_ An rxlt·rwr ;;cs·~:::: ·-Jc•:ir 

H:/IIJ 1.J d,•,1r tt·1,ith uf >t(,t J~t: t!t,1>1 ci ind1<:.i ,md .i i/1 1111)11 ft;)I ll'.1J rhu•1 >W i,1c)u,x shall tr: rr,:,ml.:d 

/;:,,. u,·ct'.1.1. i~lo 1h,· ,.,,um A ,l11u1M1· 11,trr .,hull fie ,1/fi.ri:d I!• lt11: ,·.tter!c." ,:.i( 1;,.., ;fu,x -..•1th /Jh' ·,, ,:., J:c 

F/Rt.' ( o .. vrROl },,'(), I,\(' in l,•1,,•,-.-, ""' l,·.u /!LJM I /h.'h•'·' ,,, lrn)'.1,, .1 -t':' j' ,",· ( cr.•rn,('1> Wi; with 

5>i'<'flun 50(, .1n(•li ,,,_, 11:w,1!'/,·,f ,:m th,• r.rr .. ,·,,.,.r cr:i,: ,'f rll,·/ir, ,-,.,11rr,,l r,.ium ,.iu,)r ,·,f.'·•1111y. In.: r,:-:,_.,, 

m~ff /)c c,1fvhi<' vr 1•1,11,1t,ilfl"•r ,, ruir1Jm1,m ,,·m,.-,,ru1u,,· ''.! ,o ,I, l.'.'•'' F.,h,-,nhc(o' .~ di!:.•·e1,r,:-,: ,Jj 

12 int:hc.r .1Jwll t,,. rm11·i./,,,J fr'U'1i th,• _r;-,,, .1pr·jn.~i,•r n·,,-r, r,_, iJ'li ._1,/f,J<'cnr .,,.i{i.~. Thtf r,; .. ;,,, C:.Ir: h-f 

.,l'..:1r1tJ 11•1tl; ,:,rh,:r hulf,i/1111.' IJ/1/in,•, n /!r,· l"''tcc/1,111 ,,;1,i.pn,,-,,, t/1,11 ",:,·,"'!.r,.1111,ic ,,.,, ,q:pr,_1rul 

flrdilHlflC(' 2019.01 Pagr 6 of,,.-. 

20-0203 H Page 10 of 41 



-

~,.:h(irJ•'( 1·~, ~··JJ,lf·l/11,,,i· ~h.·1/i J,,._. _t-t-hitJr~e/ !1:J lf.i!rL.· rt.l,'(jr·_l p/;.l!O J·~/ iht?_/irt! .li.pr,rlkft't" .(~'.Y/t~m1 o!/ti?t tlrcf 

.' 1, ,,.,, i"fj1 ,,, ,·i1141,··1u,·nt. ,:,;.i.J ·.11,~; ·/,111, ·r.>,u t r .:i~:11.'1 5.i1t1ii n, ~1 b"L rL\"t•dJ(-..,,. ariy oth~t :;r!"_,r,1):t· 

( 'hieptt'r Y 

"'rcllitn 'lOJ l·irt! Spnnkkrs 

'HJJ.2 Wbrn, kt!ttyirfd sh,ill be .un.-:;~Jc:J a~ r,_,J!o,,~; An ,1ppr,::,vcJ '1tm.:irr.itiL: ,rnn~.k, :\'f~l·~rri ;·/r<'lll 

f,· , ,'11:,wcJ ,Jrui m•:t:1!1,:d l'I ,.,~·1.- ."we' /J,,g,., ,md srr1.t,:1or,,, J(.(ll_i sqidr.: ..'•'d er .,r1'(tr,:r k-ll<'rr 

_ , ,111 rn,,-,,,j ,':'< r,'f,>e,JU,i w1fhir, ;>,, _· ,,i-·_,,Ji.:n-,,1 ~ cJescri'c<'d in Scctic>n'> 90:• 2. I tJu,·" 1.::l 1 '-ii r_l. J_ ! ~ 

Etcl'.ption: -\~ric!i:tur:it ri:;1I.-J1~~- r'•:,! 'JOOC".:. ,['<.'.:1i 1_;~c remm ll5C:1 fc.r -.:orwn•ird-11 purp,,,,c,. 

'#flJ.!.,i \\ he-re: K«1uin-d 5!).-,:: !:>c ,-.d,kJ a, f,:, ,,,w-, S:,;:h.• ,·:· ,'t;_i/1'1>
1
• bfti/dinf.1 ~:N,i,,·, 1i1«'' !_,'.;r//1 

•IJMill"!.'Jt,'1 in ,xt.ff/lloc h1,:U,•1~·-1 j_/,()i) s.71,,...,;::_r~:d ,.1r .;r..:,:;;~r <',tr,!r lhan i;,n, ,in.J f14•>:lll,,,1i_1· 1!:.-.-l(mg 

linl(.{, and ~ri,·11/il,roJJ hw/;;m~J '10t :.~r rp,cciaJ J..i'C ~1111/I 1;-,r C011fm.-rcJJJ P,.rJ,.'ln, ,, lt,"f<' 1/1, 

f/()i;r ,1r;,1 ,,.( rlu hurJ.-Ji,,g or Jfnii::iir.? l1 rn,T,1.-is,'<i b_1• arr ..,,Jdm,111 •:·! mtJrt'! lh.111 rhiny ,~r~·,·r11 i ,lit,;, • .: 

ll(IJ.Z.b \\lht"rt: lu.t,luirC'll ,:\i!1' b,: .vide.J r, f,:,j.,1-..,, 'iu1"1 1.•_: ,·_,1,11/tj{ 1-,.,,!,it,:_,._, 1 ·u :1,.11• 1_,t,m,, 

S:p1,:Jrc:fi_y·{ Jri t'.ti5(lr,~ /'lJdlii/,1.L\\ .it-~,,~ .~qi,;u,.~ /Ct~! ~,.r fr"'::::i. ;·.rh, r ,.n:111 on,-u,,d f.,.·o-/.IP"dr .. -/-t14·/i,,r{ 

urn'/.~. aml t1Ari1.:,.Jro,.:ii h1,1:ding1 n•_'( r,n,frr ,p,,,;,.,r r,_,, _r, "7r'!I .•'" cnm,,.tr.:,.-1/ ,-,•u;•.11<" .,-},,·,, 0,,. 

//c,.,.,,.- a.rt~l-1 (~,f /flt'1 ,':r.i,'/,:J:n,~· nr ~'l.ft-Jff'.fur-'i: t: 1/l ·r. .. o•,,,_ l'i (41 iJ Fk1.i/ .:r/<.uri ,f,~~H,~1.• oi .•r 1', ,~14,:(,I ~r('AJH'•' /t'rl 

byar-; r.1Jdrl1's:1nr~lnv·1r;_· 1h,,.,11it.·r:.'y{"0r(t:n: ;'Jft::.,, r.r· i',(l(;HJ,~,,11d:;r, 6 ,·J_ 1i l1J,:·I)( r,•t 1 ~' :'.·,\. ,. 1~.~)~ ,_q,,J:/t,i4~ 

~._,, 1rr1•1._""t.1;rc~ ,fhi:II he"' l'!'fdi.lt· ;i',• .., ... u,rl~.1r,,. :., , :',(,'!i~;.11 1)0.".. ~~· 

903.1.1 (~ryup .\ shall h~· !IIIWJIJ•·d ;J_•, t'nllm.,, j,,1 ,.,, .-.r•:'1f'•- ,\ (Jtrr,ut,'h ,\._,j 'l:i I.' i !, I I nw f,c.~ 

an:.;i ,•xc.:i:d~ 3/,l!I) sq1wr!' ,I, , 1 

!!}J.2.J Grocip t,·; ,,;llall lH'. l!Ul(,t11kd ll'J i',,!1,,-,..., •11i i.}. _1. i Ir f !n"u.,.J,,,111 11t'. l,r1 •ip !- i'i,c· !ll'r.!1, ,~.-.ri,n 

!h11,11 JJ,f/0 Ji/U11n-/t·rt 1n i\~a 

•,oJ,.?14 (,?1yu11 t,·.1 ciholl l"K: :mwrnk<l ,b f.ilkw,~.: 9()J: ,I 111,rul' F '11).L'. ,1 I I) A c.,ruup I· 1°,tc ,u,:-.1 

"l\(l~b .f . • ~-IHI 1qu,1r,·j,•1'/'. 

•>l)J.1, "'! Gr9y11.\I sh,,11 h,_. 1111,•11,.k11,,_', k•ll1•'1\' •>il,I L l (_;,,.up H 1111,! \I <XU,2 ~Ii I\ (i1,,\1p 11.,r,J 

M n rt nrcH c,~~c,h .Vil//,1 s4i.,i;-,· /;w 

?t)J.l,lj.l Mpnufa~turrd Homo ~hull hr ud,,h:,.i 11.', (.:,ll,_1w,; Arr ,lflll!fllntl,. f(r, \/'f'fnAfr, 1y1Hm fh,1{/ 

h· r, ,1,.fr(·,/ 111 ,,ti 111·>1• •'1,1>!11t,1dur,•d lwm,:J' ,J,i,j multi-f,mrli'_1· ru,mut,1n11r,•,J 11,.,,.,. _\ 1nt,•,,d.:.f,1,.,,. '•'<' 

, u ,, , ,-,,,, -,1,1.J l\1,., ·/,m1il\1 ,/11 ,•l//11',!_ /11,' ,/,•.,1~:rr ,u~l trn1,1//, 1/1, •11 ,,,t .: lwf! , 1·11,·1111· .1h.Jli /_,, in ,Ji-,·, •r.i,Uff'._· 

·.,..,(fh r .. 1/ir;,,,-,,,..-i t 
1 
... ,it' ,,,/N.·gu),111rJi11:' Fi',/,-_• j

1
..'. ,~ .. ,Juu 

ll.11,1,i,1,11,r,,l h,,m,•.1 i,,,-,,r,•,i w11hin 11r1 ,•,is1111g mol,11..-l,,m,,· rx1rA ,',,"'f't_,,,!>: -.,,i1h 

f ',1/t.l,,nt1a Jfr,,//}1,rt1<f :.;,J{cf\' ,' 't.t,•, I l/1•1'(1,.1,1 /J, 1-'rJf/ ~'.I,_., 2.J 

20-0203 H Page 11 of 41 



R<'~1.i,:,1n.;f •. ·.·:..f,_.· Sc·,:ti,:n RJ I 3 ~' 

Stttioa 9lf'1 fire Alarm pnd Ot'tc,tjon Sntem~ 
CMJ".'.2..1 Wbscc: &qg;rq1 ~ Sew BtlkliH• or Sttucturg Ina 1h11 J.ti(HI ~IJMIU: f(l't ~h11JI 11(' :i.hk(l 

as f.:,'k,w~: :fn .1ppr.-,1•ttd Ore ahrm :idc.-fi,,,, .r\Slnn .,hull I'< ifl.U.1/fr,I In ull lrwl,Jir,gt H'/1/i ;1//.,,»· 

;;r-,..,: ,',_r.; ,Ji.-iri J l'i(HJ .,1u<.1r..: 1~·,:r 

~ 1.. i' ' : . '' ,• 

h,· Jh,· Ftr·.· ,_-;,.,,,. , .. ,- fiu},,·,· ,.lt./1· .mfiJ<.111:,;/ r,:p,,•,vratrrn1, i':.J:.1,·,J ,m lm1l,lirr,• ,, 

t.Tf>,IU,r,:.o 

bi,,J,Jirtg '11,l J.•i.i,·r 1; .... ·,'/.a[ •H( ;•·rm!I ;'o•, 111?ifftl'r~·1,1f {'11•r·••1•·• ,, /i~rt e1 fir,· m'unt1 d!.lt.·,:twn )!";.'i,:rn 

rk>t'.'l 11,1/ ,:.•.;.1/ r1"'1 //rt· ,I/ix,•· ,..1.•,\r ui Ih,· l,1tl,.lt11g "' J/Pu,·1111..- 11 o/d'i'dH"(/ ,J, ,,,,,./din/ hy 1111.rr, thun 

20-0203 H Page 12 of 41 



"' 

ri" 1h,1t h14/{,hm: 

•ioi.h,l.1 'i1•,;111hlqn l'"~l" ~"lLWh· .,lull !,,. 1,1,k,t ;1·. h1il,,,1 ·, ,'n 

Jvc,,nJilry ,:ow1tr l'Uf!f>ly Jirr,,·;,Jiri.: ,1 riumnwm }J.J,,111, ,,.,.,,.,•,. ,·a1,1,·1f\· u,u[r,- q,.wi.;·ntl /,:,:.1 /1) ,,,,.,,, 

01~roJtin~ In <1 u,•n-,111Jn,r ,·,mJmonJ .,hull lw ,,,.,.,,.,Jr,/ rn a mim,num '!J-lw11.• ~,·, "'lf-·,n 

E.i:c·rpr/on· J'l1r •'.TIJft•t11'1• o/ ,m 11•r,••·1;•·h:·1· l•,1,°t'•tlJ' f"'1',,rtt !l•f'f"')I thut ... ,,·,·t.1 Of ,,, .. y:/ /fr,• 

< bapt~r 12 

Se..:uue I ;oJ tmrrgrof~ and Slapdb, Py,Hr ""'lrnu 

3.H~.I \\ht:n kr111111•tJ :,.1 t-.· ... 1..::·.h:,... 

20-0203 H Page 13 of 41 



{"h:tllfl'r "" 

_'<', 111111 ~911.\ l'l•n1 

~~~U .1 \\ hl,rt" ltutUII uJ .11.i!i I:,: J,~ : ,'.,J Ll:, ' .,11,_,.._ C fie ..:r. ',>"J(_ ·-:!i~cTJ,' .,:, . .-~s, ~: "1(1\' ro!i/lJJI'•' 

,/, I .-i',_,,,,.,,-rtr i','<'/l'L'I-, .'.·:..:iJkd 1n .\f,.1,•,,J1,.· . .rr.~>i ,in.I l'.:rr-ff1gh F1rr· f/a::,:;rd S,-..,·ruy Zufl,!I f,J .n,hm/r 

_.!irL flf''-'1,,!l·>n p,':,,: .f'hH pl,m 1/"..:ili 1'1 ,1ppro".-d b.,- toth tht,~ _riu ,x;J,: (![.•ic', .. J ,mJ thi' .mthori::,·,J 

r•'{'r<'.wnr,:m·,· f,u i'h< ,· .. ,._ ,ii 1 ~ rt l FIRE /)mt Chi</.':/ /,x,ttcd in rk,;, Stu ft• R,;,sf,'-'"-' ihlifl· ,-ireo /SN. I / 1 

,nnur Ir• tlrr. r,:.::c.:1 dh,g of lM fln,rl ltr<lf-·)'·"· rhr: rr>•1,,~-1 f.y /}:~ Cowm• o/ El Dor,1:/n 

S~·Clun -''111~ \\ i!Jfin, l'r,,IC'ction fhulJin:.:, C (,n~rnichot1 

.,90SA f.loo[ Co1,~truc11on Rl!'guirl'm('DL'> ,:1:1•1 t;,: ::..!,kJ '-" f .. ![.-.\.-;,Ali~.: .. - ,-,_,,utnJ<:ti, __ .,i_ ,n.·/r.,ftr,i.: 

i.Jdt.li//<'mr-, r~qulr<'r ,J C{u.u .-< n;,~(1..'01·-ering Oi' m.<t'!MblJ· .• 1Ji r.:-r,"<Jfinl( rt!q&ifref ("/,HI.-< r1x,f.:,.•,·,-ri111; 

or :11.s,·m'1il· 1JJ u mimmulfl Rll·r•_,._,,--,n~ in t'.~;;·,•15 (.f_,!_',,·;, (~,fan ,•..i/J1(rt1R 1tr1ict'4r,· ,...-11ii1'f t'Vl)- ,.,u ·,,•rrr 

, .. .,,-1,,1/ _.,i[f n,-.·,,.,·ririir,• t>u1 1/1,; "'"Elrf n-;.-/ !><1: ,1 C.',·;_,;, ,1 .,..,.,,_, .:1Ht'Tlrtf! pr iiJS•'""'.'·(1· ,., ,1 l'f!fllffll;.'*' 

L·la.u lJ ,.-r C_.rir,: r-erarJ.·ant lrtYili'd ari,J !:,r .'l,it:-r,-c,11.:d -,.,.,,,:,.:i siwtc ,.,,. JfoM;i,:·, ur,: ,.,._,( ,1rywr1,,•,i "'• 

"r1k{n11',,rmr: mcU<'rit1I _,,;;.,. C.',is._c A ,1,\1t·nin/_1 

Chapter 50 

S\•cliou 500 I Geper11I 

~001.'7 Liability for Damlll?,1:'.'1 sluiU r~ ,Hh.kd :i', kdl,·,,1·•,, ,f•:_1· ,i,111111~:1·1 "' ,•,.,.,/ r,'H•lt111,: i,·,,"' 111,-

·'.·urd.:s.1· /1,urdlmg, spi{{ ,.._~ ,li.\ch,trg.- (.-l 1.1•n• /1,i;.t1rtf,,.;, m,1/o.'n,11, •it.,// ~'1••i·l'llt1<•rt1 dd•1 u;:,iltt•I 1,w 

;1:.:hpi!.'":ir .. dJ. _lirm •Jr corp•J•·,-11io11 n11J..i1·,1,~· ,,vc/, ~p,,'l ,11 di-11 /111,-g,: '/hi_,det.1,,, .. i/,·,·i,1,/,. -'•_1-II'< ,-,.,, 

(~'h£c.{ err hj.:./ht~r Ju/~1 illllltr-1rr·:,..•d r,.ir·t·{'.\,•nr~;li\',' ti) rlu· ;,\"'i• 1 ,,;dnnrr r_n ,,j r),t ,. -u, r· o,r ,,.,, ubh1·unr,r1 

Chapter 56 

MS-Hon ~l Grn<'ntl 
5601.. Peratil Rcyyir,d ,hnil h<' iHlll'IJlbl ll'I f11ll,11~'\. l'crrr1ih; 1,h11ll ~><'.' rc,,uere,l ,l'i 1tc! fi,r~t. in 

Sc,:t1,.,r; I fl5.6 :ind rc1?,uii11cd in .\t:.:,.,nl.mt:L' wlth llii., sr:Clit!n. Wh~n- t:lpJ.i.,;,,,.'" f/\!nllU1· ,Jrt! ····''11m-.•d 

:,•!··; .:f.;l/ t-,: ,•_,_n,,· . .l h· th~: Fir',' Chr,'( ,"!1 fr1.~··l,~·r du/; ,,u,hori:,•,} r<'1·r,:.1;•r1/,J(II','. ,Jnd rJ,., ff /},;r;;W,~ 

c,_,1,m1· Sf1.:r1:.1 • /),·r•m l"f,·111 If}!,.,,. firc•H'tlrh p<!rm//) ,,rr l',·1111/r,,i. /}h'J' .1·h1Ji1 IH· i.,·.n~J /1v 1/,, Firf 

:_~h .. :( .- r ~JJ._._.,,,, ,foi ,· ,1-..1/,," ,~,-,i r,·rru·,,-,,,,,,,. .. _._ dti.J th,• !:'I { >or,,.J, · '-- ·,!11111\' 11.-.,ud •-'l S11p,:n•:w,n·-

~.01..:'. .. I IJ,,(U!!_!S"!J!!•'..!!1 ,h.,.ti . .,:,J, t ,,. 1,·,11,,,_._ .. , ,", ,, !l/ I ,i,.,/1 J,,,.,·, 1Ji,, ;111th,•1·i11- (() l'l"l/rl<'.f{ 

,j,~'1.°tif,._l~rtl.'lfl'.l'f n~y.tl{ff',,/,trl' 1Jil '1..~{,t,'/'•,: ,~.1,• rJ4, _(H'1·H'nf"J::) f.'h.'.\t'lffiJlitJfl 

-~01.! .. :! _l-'r,111111'1lH\ 1nru..-m11.tl"tl ;, ... I ht .,,(,,l>:,J ,.b :,,11,11\·~ i'i;._• --1,'i_} will ,1•n1/,·,:1 ,ill r-rr_1p,·idntT 

u,1;,,.,,,,,, ,.,,, 

b~,~ 10;,fl6 

20-0203 H Page 14 of 41 



-

h.tph:r .,-

Sr\·tion ~ii!~ ."itnr:ii:l" 

~70.f,2.9.(,. l L•K1llug~ \\'brrt A hoH,G round T aalu ur Probthjjrd ~111.111 l><! u,1~,11kJ J, r: ]!-,.,., s.: 

'-turn~~· or< lib•, I ,11,d Ua.~, 1I IL1111m;1hk li4u11.b ir, ,1l~ 1\',··1'(t11md i,mk., ,,,1:_,i,.k .. ,-t,1,illli1:f· i, p•oh,bi1.:t± 

wi/,·u ,lf'l'"!ll"°d !,1• 1/;., /•1,·c L'/11cl, o.r ni~:ht:r Ju/_111iu!fitJJ·i:,·,; 1·,r1y1",•>l/./i1\,. ll'lkr, JYiffl1I/,./ t_, :h,: 

;.',,,. I 'ht.-[. ,•t '11.1/lr,'r duiv ,:rnlhof'i:L·d r,pr,·.1·,·,1/,UJ\·1:. 111/ ,1/,r,i.., :,.;r,.,1;,1.l 1,i•rt-1,i ,,, ,:,11h 1111t11Ji.,11,.1•11 

/; .. ih,· .,1,,u1.i:,< IJ( 1:ta.1.1 I. 11 ur If! Jlammuhl,· ,md ,·:,mrf•r1.1Nhl.· liqw,JJ· sli,iU n1•nr•1\· ,,·iti; ii,,,.~· 

,,.,,,,1•,·1111·,r/\ ul \,'/ fi'.•rrli J:..,. /he L,1h/i.>nii.:1 Fir<' ('n,I.' r1r,, ( '11/l/r1t',r/,1 i·'1re Codt .1.ltil/1 ,1/:.0 ,.1prh ,, • 

r,1,1,1//1111, .,,, ,,,ha· rh,ir. m•i/,•r .~hid •. •_.fi,<'l .li,p,.•11,111;• .· t...1/J',.•111 1,h,•r,· ,d,,,1·1::·l(TOIOtd .11,11-.Jg-.• i5 r,'1(1,ir,.-l 

M4'1i<•n ~7ft Spl"cbl Ot>5f!llo0j 

~706.l.-l.~ Louhou Whrtf Abo ... e--(iround TulL, 1m: Proi,ibU ... d ,tinll bl· ;irm:ndL-d a., folk1wc: 

S1,.•r,1g~· ,·,f 1.T,,~ I an<l Class ll n.ui;m.1'1lc i:a ;1,!\, I; ,1''\)' ;:-,~rnun.! ran~:; (•\ll.'litlt! ']f t:111il.tn,~, i·, 

1•r\'1i11h11<:·,J ur.-l.•J,1 11(1.•r,:11·,:d ,',·,· rl~,: F·,.,., I_ i,11·! ·J't h:,tlh.·r d:;i'_(' ,:n,11rnr1:,.•.-i' r-:,r:.rc.1,,·nta,h·t... 1111~,i 

{'• 1r-/Pflf{1,,,~,i [~y f~(' ;r.;,,._, ('""'hie_!- nr h;J,\·i,~"'r d·~fl .~u~h.""•r.1::.,.:ii .,• .. '[i.,.1'l1.'}~hlrt1',• ,1J} ~1f--•.1·q,; /f,T~1r.;r:.j (,UTi(J! istr 

... ,,uh UUN.ditlfJi11tt _(,,r rh,r;· .,~nr:·1:~~l- ·) { ;\; ~ :', !. } I i ~~ j JI l/.1,rrmi1,h.',: (,'">,d L r•.,.,,/l.u..«n·~h~ r"fi.ltUa°J J/1.-:/;' 1 ·vlftri~' 

~,:uh .,;rr .. :it.: ,...._:<1u1r(t'•t·,rl:i (L', St/ Jr-~th ,~:y rb, 1 f tJ/~/t ,,11·1, /'If, I ·r-._/,· Thr-· (':J../i(or-J<aru F;-,,.~ (',_-.. Jr: ih•it:' tJL~n 

r:~p, ,(,: ft I 1n,·rJJlldtr(1n, ,Jrht·t rhi;r, n,, •(, ,r I/ /1-: r,~ /uri 'IH['t'H'fl,.,Lt .,:.:11,:,11s •.,,.,ih,r~ ~h:~ \ t. AA,~..,.,.ilt,tti ,;;dtt.lgi~ 

I:• I t'.1"/J,/, ,•../. 

Chapter 58 

S<-ction "'1106 flamm•hll· C'n·ogl'nk l'lui~h 

~-? Umit.tiog!'I ~h.all b-e im·,c11,k,! 11·, h11Jnw· .. :-it, ,n1,p: ,.If flammable <:ryo1,:cnic flui,ls jo ,1:11111n,ir,· 

.:ont.H= 0u15ki<!: ,:f t1,1ddtui,'.., i.i 11rohi,,11c:,! 1111/f'1·• llf.'flf"O\','d by the Fire Clm::, o, hii•,/,,·, ,iJ.(,,, 

1.11,ih,,ri::,:..l rq•r.:um,111··- Wn,-n ,,,·,rnili.'d !iy r/11• F:r,· 1-.hh:( or !,i;/h,•r duly ,1111/1,m::,·,I 

rq•r~-s,n11n,·;: ,1/{ 1/,11 1,,,,.rq •"··mf,tr•r,•,, 1J.,, .. >1 1 11·1;,;;,· ,,li{J,,,m,iblL ,.'r)'fJ,;<•niciJ..idr :th.1/f ,·,11.,,,,i.-

••f'f!i'_,. :,) i1Hl.illmhrrr ,'/i,o fi;"" ,...,.,.,_. ,·dw fr i,1<: ,i,J~ri.,1r1g 31,11/011..> 1,·-'t«-r('. aJ.,.,n·-."r11i;,1./ .11;,,.i,l,'.t' 

i·.: r-::Ju!.,,_·,.i. 

Chaptt.-r hl 

Sel·tion (,t(l-1 l."l"l!i!.'.'.!1.!!.CJJ.~:-~;:a, I ·1111t•111t'r, 

610,L! :-.1.-~;mum <..".!il!i!''''' -.uhw L:,,1 .. t•li~h,·i..l L11nih .,:1.,11 ':·c ...:n~n,l(d :,.,, 1 .. 11 .• ·.,,,... ,t;, , ..... -,,1,•: 

,_;( Ii,11ufil!,f />t'tr,1/.:,u,1 ;,.:,t1· in ,·10:.H •d ,m ,1~Kf<');1J/1!: i_;f 1,(/t_i(}-J,?,1/hm w11ff'r ,·,itV.:m· 1o·lra1 /,1.:·,;;"/ ul 

1,.,.,JJt .,n,·-h.1/( /).'}) rr,//,· fi-,>ffl prr •P,!' f,I' ~otlt'd or dl!SiJl.'llJlol ji-.,,.. rn i,l,•m/,1/ "'"" ,,,.,,j ,11 , .. ,H, , 11~, 1'1.1/r 

l'.11,._. I I \JI l t• 

20-0203 H Page 15 of 41 



-

[), ·'l ru,/( tr,Jf~f ~-:q\tU(i.! r~"(lrl•j.11/J,Jf .i/, ,,,·f,•/'.ffJ,-'nl ,~ Hh :.J .,J~·ftt."/).' -!,rt.1dlt'' l!'t,1'11'1.''h: f /,; dt·{/._·/hn,g unil p~r 

,Jt'rt' un;J itr :,~,:~! ;}rh ~)11·~/, i r:}} m1i .. · ("'(,!""! 1.:n•· ht,,.-, !'/'I' tnC•tt.~/ i, tJ}}o\,,J ·,,}1t:11 ,,f}LI il[T'f"C'r\"t::1, ;;r,J t.1 

\'f}f, 1i'di.."r..'1~tL.'/Jt/,n1.J{ li\11.· j. 1,~/ n•)f 11 J'tt1.:i•1o/ !",r t#l,• ( ,•J/ft/_1· t.~/ f.-:' (1~,.r~;.;.f,-_, 

/ >1 \fh_tJI ~Jf1.~: 'rdtlt :n ... \I.J/1((, >,~jd 11i"t,'.1:;:, Jfi1hu1 !h .. ~ j ! P'tf 1·1~ L
0 .\.f :Jhi ,.,hL·J .l,y r,:1,· r:'i L"'"I :Nr_!J Jh(' di.!rr-r;:,_•,r 1--:i 

l1q;,t-,ri,:d ,.,'{f'rJ,\1h''1 ,,:d\ !• ·'r :;r.~ rrr1. 1ft,'1-'{l{•(T ,) t hi·~n-u\· r11~·r1.(1ted ... ,, l·1·.,rr~i:_- ~(f1i ar-=,JJ' rh"· il~·gr!!g~t .. r 

, l~.(1111.·uy r·~l ·"•YON•· t•nt.11/utJ'i"rt ihoiJ nf_il 4'~({.:C:r/.i i.J ,•·u:,:,· ._-.. JF"Ll'-~1(1· r.~ . .: }.IJ(;(1 ~~a/,~1'1., !ht~ :hi_t.~lP1n'j. 

, !/ l,,ij ,fr•/l11 d ;.v,,.nh1 u,,, g<1.~ ,·,r 11'~'-:"1i,;, o{ .:.H1 ,1~~>,;'Y-t')..?.ll!'~ v/'2. (lllfl-~i.111~-:·n i,,l.Ut.'~r-· 1-"':J./.titlc~lr "4hr::n 11_,_ ... 11ft:d 

w lr.:wr ,1,11·-h;1// ,1.,!J mitt'fr,,,,, ,.,·,.;1 1,·rrr ::ym•,1' pr d,·.1i.:,1,-i/,•,i,t:-r- res1dt·1111.,i 1.ue . .: ... d m !,· . .1<r n•l."

h.1/l(l--1) m/Ji: ln•m ,:.1 ,,fmg n• 11il,·fllio/ ./,.•1•, ·lr,prr1~·1lf ,,·llh o d<'r,_1in· _,;;r.:ata t>wn o•ff 1 ·;, ,J,.·,,limi: .1mrr 

p,•r acn•· ,rnd 11/ /i:,1.~1, 1>!,•-h,1/(1 /.·'ti mt<'.- from un1 iio1ti ,:,.,. "1,:-1.-{ I:: •1/fr,w.:J -....~('n .ii U .ippr, ,1c../ ·m .. i 

q ,1'Jl«!C11Jh:,mdirt',,11,1/ ti,-._. ,_.,,rm ii /.1 1'.1.wui h• rh;,• Cui.nty c1/EI D,;roJo. 

~1:1t1111 6111 tliglt l·'t£vatjon Li<111c.(icd P~\ruleum Gas hullllhHions (~.C,IIJU-r1>ot rlt\·ll)iun, :111.S 

~ ,h,1!': bt' dd•kil tl.5 f,,-:1,:•.o.-;. 

ti 11 l. l kr~ul;.i1t1" _,ha! I h· udd.:d :-is 1·,_·J;, ,w,, 
t-,1,h:;/,JJ,/t' ,-,.~·iJ.,101· sy.1/t'm ,Ii.ill Gt' i,urul/.·d in .-i.:cord,m,·,: with m,mufucf1it,w l'L'•~uw,·m,.111.1· 

: ·,., ,-,lc;J.[L n,_-..IJJJ<1t,•,r .,_,·,,t,'.m) .,A,/1 ht· 111:.r.illr1.d -,,h -f.Jll {,/>(;' imfullarlon~ 

l ir,· /r'r •,/ ~wg,• rc,i;r,1,;t,,, 1nJ1
1
/ h,: i11.11<1/J.:,J u.n.1,.-r ilt, l,,ng,•d gm1;.;e ,·.-w,.,... .ttlf.'/'lr,·d wllh 1h,· 11ml Hw 

ulff'1,·•[:r!(f'! /lf•'J,ut'r' ,,lf'•'''t,,r,• .-1/1/J,' '~'.f!.11(,J(,_,r sh,1/1 h.: f'<}int,:,I ,/, i\\''1'•'•lrd i,u,• fit \I :,Id~!' I t'):i1/11/ur 

.ii,,.',' I.-;:: flu"'~,/ r,, 1.IJ,, ,uu ,,_I ,ii.: y,-;.r-_,' pipirig with _,,,:II ,·.-,ppt.•r 111h/ni,: ,,, a.Jim,• /J,,irih1/i11 slt111J/,I trm4 

,hi ti1111,' ~ .... i:i.r. r>i, ri.H'r _,~,:;,,., ,_ht: _,,.:-d [il['U:g shiJU 1,, . .',J,:,.urd Iii!/,,,,_,,.,: th,n, i ,,,,_·/,,•,,· 1 ltr)l'i';,1111,1//_\!i' 

>'1! _i'•,;,tr,·.1l•ic· :r; t~ 6-a.1/din;c ,rai{ Ti,i,, r: ,-:r ,t<.di r,· .,·n·:u·cfr ,tU/lf•-••i,·.-1111·11,:,·d (,1 //:,• w.1H 

,z.p{-'r'•J.1',T'I..Uf!./_I' j':, tti::flt! i:Ji!/1)',I,' fi,.: r.:~Ulo!/<1t _\,'> ,D /(, /-''O:\,'<ff/ /'1.•ftdt11~: ,•.•(/ill _{Jtp,• /'1' /;1{1'r<1f .','11.-JH"/,·,_, 

/o.,iili, 

A pf'Olt·crin! ~·,::,·,'t'r, ,Ipfir.:,,,,:._J ,,,, ftl-i' g,1.~ 11>/·_t·ii,•·, ,1n,.J l/111/do,g (' 1ti,-·iol. .1.l•o(l i•c' 1mr,1/l,•d ,,,·,·r ih,• 

; .. :;_·.:_yl,/_j 1t<1g~. rr1::.;1,J·~'.J!,:Jr ~1r..i) .~i.'t'tJrtlr u,p,rv,•r:cil /!J (I, .. ~.·.~i:1,,•:.J r1r 4iJ,1~oil,,l/~ 1 fo {Jt, ..,,~1'i. 

The r1.1t:r f.-'ip,:"-~ _:;.,, fh1 y,1.,d tlf•iril!, 5 r.;JU ,,01 !'<' ,•mhed.l>I\I ni ,iat,·t-.'lt' ( ·,.,1,;n•fr t•l•.k•.·,/ on_r1;1w_l lll' ·)r 

ri,a shall 1,,, htld 1:-.,x>. :Jr {.::;sr 1 i11c,'I /,·t,fft uli mfr.1 o/ 1!t,c plJ--Y; 

,-if /!Ii! J/me >;(-,lf1_r/Jc·,l/1•in(,r O'l_f' l,1.1/Ji,i,: />t!tmlf H/}fli ft lfll'U/\, • :~,- !'1,ll,J{!,1;i,,n >fun/./'(_; .(1•.!f.)"•

/}u_ ,ipp/r.::;.mt d1.1/I ~-,,f,ml:' ,m Cr(, nr1,·m rl.•1 p1,,,, in .J ,·,,1.·,n ,,,, ,lt:,;11.,11\ ,:_, f•nf·1 rh, Li'G'pliil 

pi,-m -'hu/f l,1c/ud,_·_ hlil nu1 l•r: /imi/r,I r';i, lh,:- 1:..znA 1,._-,1/1,.-,1 rr, 11,-,.,•,i 1,m>. ,:.<f~1<·J/\ 1!r L'S .;.J//,,,1, 

rt111le· uf_r<rr.J f!'l'Jfl~:. ;', -i.\,ti.-•n ,~'.ft!l,• , a,·r !''/"'· ,JI !h,· /,,,,J,t'Jtrt.', /-r<'f' ·r11· l>,.>1u,.1,,,-,,·.; Jt'Ai .;,, ,,:.Jiin,: ,:,• 

"I! ,1:r1sl111.:.-pn1p,1.,...-I /,uiJ.lin.~., 0,1 11-.,· i...i n"d ,, ,l,·rr,:11,m u{ !>,.- ~1,l>'.~·,'1r,,· ,,,( ,._,.,y ,~uiUin.~· ,,. ,!"<· 

'· )rd inane.:: :w I 'JOI 

20-0203 H Page 16 of 41 



wpp! i.'d f\1Jth Lf'G. Thie. .1hull af50 {)2 _F,rw,1rdi.•u' r,-, the uprr,.1r1n<JfC Jrr,, di.rtri~·, 10 j,;f'\'f' lU rJ lucutur 

rl'I.Jp in .. ·,•em ,~fan cnt<'rKt:''JCi' 

L.x,nimi o(tht< c,:nt;,r/irit' u( LPG /un*s .rh,ill b: pamanenrfr m.Jr-k~d l·1• 1hc: U.lT c!f°Jnow stalrES. ,_me 

'11 i!ach ;:nd Such slalu:J shrill bi? uf J11flic11m1 ht'ig_hl 1.-J ht· 111.1-it,fr 1hro11>j_h .-mticipo1,:d maximum snow 

ckpth m th,; r~.1p"cti1•e focaritm. ln.rrullmwn und mainu•nan._·;.: c{ th!!5.: mow ,cake., ar~ th~ 

rt'Jpon.~ibililr of th;: ll'G u.l'a 

l'rcJ{>ilfli' .-ipplian<",'S ,mJ a ... ·cr'.~.mries ,hall not b.- permilti!d 1n uny rww /mr,·1J/111ifm b.daw th .. • _ilrst 

rluor ur b.:low gr.uit?. whicht>l'i:r is morl.': ri'.srrfr-r/1,,:. 

6112.l Vertical kiwr Pipinl! ~rnil t-,,. ,;d.-led ,,. f,,n,.,~1.-, 

Minimum u(Sd1cdu/,,, 80 - iron r·i'pin~ 

Thi!. riser s,iial/ f>e within 3 inch,·.1· l1orr:.rm1a/J.1· ,41>,,: run! 

Swing _lornt:, shall nc lmtalld abvi•e and below ranlc lewl ro provide fnr the tanA mnw:m,uu (Srt,~,·t 

i!lboW.( rhull r,af &.: 11.t,zd), 

,4 hw,d_th~rihl<• n:~e.,. .:onnn1L-1?.-I u,I ,."opp;,r or .1·winli.!.f,\'-.Ht!t'I ruhing urrd protr-'Clc'.i h;• .rte,!l c·(11•,•1-.,._f 

shcmh<1.J mt1t<'rwl m,tv b1; us,·d hm,iri,J ,·,( rw111.,_.!:_ioint1. Th,' /7,•.dN,: .J/tt:r11c.11trl!' .,h,i(/ prm·,·<Jt: Jll_lf/cir.rm 

slc.u:ic r,:i .;/low for /<1r1A ,mwn1112111 

~d J :!. J \fa rkill!! a utl L,Jnllion~ ,tnl I l-.' ,1.:l;k·d .11.•, fol le,•: 

,fn ,q1prc,1•.:.-I 1ig11 :;ha/{ he locur,:sl ,ilra,//,• uf.,.n·,-• 1/1(' n.'fr-r •foJJ off 1·c1h·e on Ow f,w'i,flng 1n .i dsihl,• 

!n.: liq11.·ti.:d p.!f.,.,,/211m gas supplil!r J/iaJl a//1\ 1J w,•a1ht'r(lt11tf id,.•,1tificarfon te:Jg- rn the Utiid~ oj thf'! 

r,.lnA. wit~ ..... prof~ctin.f.!. cr)~•,:r Thi.~ 111g .rhall cu'1/<1ir, th!! .1uppha\ n,ime ,mJ t:ma,~en,:_v ti!ltph,me 

ni,mh,:r 

l,m); /r,J;,1/liJ(i.-,n .vha/1 be r-·n·111,m,mlf1• marked l~v u metal c-r wood mmcr-i,1/ uH1w marker, with 11 

mJnimum dim.:n.vion of 2 i,.,_,1,~,., hv ;: incht?s. Tiu ,no~· marMr J.NJ./f be o/ wjficfrnl htighl /,.., rist! 

;ir>t.;\'I! th< ,mnJUJl .mow ,*ptli and ~hall be a minimum ofJ O /~i:J iri 1Jt'lg_h1. n,e snow mark,•r.1· .<hall 

,I,~ ('<J;nud y,:,1/ow and lnc..zrd on oppo11te ,:r,,:b oft~ ranlc. 

Section 61 l.3 l'm.li:rJ!ruunt.l l..PG Tank..~ tuslatlati(ln, ant.I <htll("nlJiu ~lldll t>t• :.1J,J~d . .1~ f{1!J:-,w•;: 

t, 113.1 Permit, 11nt.l !'urns ,.,IJ.ii: be ,1Jdi:d ,:,., fi:>liows: P,•r,r111.1 :,hall be ,-t·qtiirt'd, ,md piu•LI· .dwl/ h,.' 

wnnriuedf;1r all 11ndcrgr0tmd lunA. irntull,ifions 11J ,1ppm'tltd by t!V- _,4}/J 

1',JlJ.! Uo,icrground LPf; T11nl. Ownl'nhip shall b--: ;:idJnJ ;,s fnfk,•.fl-: f.'11,f,,.-.l:r,,u,~J Lf'i..i 1.:mh 

1)1Jlt /.1t_1 l-'n.1f1J'bJft'i/.fn)!n. ~._1111.~ -~·u/:1 /1) {!.,~./-U:.•:r.l ·:ind sh.r.::ll ,':( r-t·ftJi,rr·d f1y 1hr. Lf'C::.. 1H'1f.h1l~V 1.11JLl,_lr (l 

1.:/1:,':: -/'1f't s.v.\~rcn, UJ ;!nru,c pra~~e, t.1.11;0;..;J rnuu,,~·n,uk·~· rr!((U~r~·rr1t-·nr_,; u.-·L ntl?f :..1,ul ,.,.(_.L~r·.,r,J,.1.l 

1•,1ge _, 1 ,) r , 1, 

20-0203 H Page 17 of 41 



Chapl~·r X(I 

"lection ;tO .. '>FP.\. IJ0-16 ·· S1.inJ:mJ for lhl· hbl:.11l11liou of Sprial.kr s,_,,tt'ln., in llnt-:ind J'wo 

Famih D"'·~llin1:,'> :uuJ J\lan ufactund I l(,11ws ~n ;1 men.Jed 'lO.LI. I .J, IJIJJ.35 

NFl'A IJl), -\mc·n,kd Sections a, rolh)~~: 

Rtti5t: S«rioo 11.!.J.l to rc:.d u foltott~: 

Chapter RO. NFl'A UU. 11.!.l.l Where o iire ,lt:purlrntnt pumper rn1~11c:ct~r,,,, '~ n,)L prt•Vidcd. 1hc 

,•1f!ie1<1l 

~pp~ndh B - Fire Flo~· Rc.•qutrcmcnts for lhtildirig~ 

Tahlc 8l05.J(l) RcyuircJ Fin: Flow for On~~ dml h,o-F:lmily l>wdliugs, Grnup R- . .\ 1ml R-~ 
Buihliuas atltJ l'o~nhouu~ ,ti,,H h•.; ,Lflh'flt};d ;1:; rr,:tnw:; .,;.,,. ,,{,,•\ ,11,•,·n1:. l·c·/,y..,, i.~iOO /~·,•{ 

-------,-----------
fl f<t:A'I .OW 

CALCl,,LAllON 

ARL\ 

1,,,tian, fo:t!i 
j 

i ' ----· 
t if- \fdl<I 

1---
_1,1_.1) I ,nJ l'n,,11,,, 

; fJ ),60(J 

Al llOl\1 \Tit' 

WR IN KLEI( 

SY~l l'JH 

i !Ur,iin 

( Slll!Hf:.an.0 

I 1 b ~Ulll,ll•!J C 

< '...J~ri111lt.t' ~yq~:111 

f~,' 11 !l'.\ l:.l1Ail I' 

~.vr111U, r ·:'•qi.-ll' 

1 ~-...:111:1.) 1Jt~ 1
1 ! I 1 

J ,,1
0

f tht (:.·~ /~;re 

:i (_ 1_qJ,.· !_lj ~ ... :!.UiiO 

I 
·' 1 \_:,. ,,:· 11,cc •.: .-•. 

I\~; 1dc111ul ( ·1,1-h~ 

.1 I ~1.J uJ lhr: I.,<\ 

tfoc.id~nti ,,_1 ,_ r·,k 
'------------~----~----

MINIMll,\I 

FHU
liLOV,, 

l'LOW 

OllRATION 

I (hour.) 

l~•"D"~ per 1, 

mi nut~) -1-.-1\--,-.-------r-------

f ,Jd,-

[I Ill:, 11,1 

/,()()('} 

In,,,,.:;,_." 
j,,hl., 

ll \ rt'.i. ff 21 iir 

~ht- ~1.1 urn: ~f 

111 '!-(io:"!'I..., ., 1\~L 

;·----------,-! _j _________ , 

f i'l ,,·:ii•..:,.· ,1; 

I 

-----------~ 

20-0203 H Page 18 of 41 



Tahlt' UlO:'U. lfrquirrJ 1-'irc t•low rur Huil&iiqi,~ ulhH ll1•n lhu·- ljnd I \Oo-Fitrut!, 

[l,o\dlin2,.,. c;rn,u) k-J, and k-4 Duildinu ant.I T,1111ntrnu,t', ·.k1ii he diTll':hi,·,1 '" , .• ;,,,,, .. 

.\11 f0M.-\T1C Sl'Rli'iKU:R 

-.., Sf EM 

: ... ~ti ''~it\ ''tl l. ·,. 1 I 

1:~ 11Jr: 

t',:1,l1; {" 1rl .. ~\cr,r·/1,•, 1n (Or:..itJil;.'t.~ 

}!4•1'l•f! :I ,'Jl'hi_(,/flj ,..t'~-~·~f;1"J1ff 

' 

Ml~l:\11 1\1 

fllH.-fllJW 

(i!;jJIOM 

minuld 

! ;~5n, 

.\r,prnrlh D - 1-"irt" -~J'llltrl'lll~ \n't·S5 lfo•th 

S.Cdlon 0111.1 ,\1jpimurn ~1><-cifiC"..itioo" 

per 

t- LOW IJllR \ r lo~ 

\ ~ uf s.: •l:-1: t • ~-

j '.' t:'-~ J<: 1 !.! :1: r~j..,_;,:,: 

~IL·•.,,:,· 

I ['•J~f'--:, :,, T ,r.k 

I b r1.v5 ,tJ'· ·.:;t r~i· ,1~ • .1 1.~c( .: 

] 1\n~, C(!r: 

!)IOJ,J \(~u" f!,11111 \\ 1,llh 1\Jll! ll lhllr11p1 .i;;:I! ,:,~ arn•,,,bj ac. L•'.,.:'-1.~ •• J. .. Li1r,~: 1•:r: .;,·,.,::1,1,.,1:· 

1::.·., '·rrti,•lf- ;:, '. ,·. 

t'.1·1·t'pti,,11 h\ .. 1•,m..-111 .A,,1,.- 1_•11;1•/1 .,.,, ./(i.'1111/11,·,/ liy r/1, .1/1.I 

t)rdinancc :::o i •,I(> I 

20-0203 H Page 19 of 41 



SECTIO~ 4: CONFI.ICT 

src-rro, !-: SF\T.RAHII.HY 

lt-any 1)rdi11ari(<'. ir.11:1.-,, c,ut,~<'.,:t1nn nr ,11hd1, i.,1,11, lhr:n•«t, 11r1wi~11rn, :,.:n1e11ce. cl,111se or phr;L\e ,,fct,i, c1Xk, r.r 

an~· 1ipplio1ioc1 !~,,i". , :, (u1 ;in~· no·i ;, ,r1 lldd t,• !)C 11hJH,I h)' ,1 .:o,ir• ., ,f cPmpelent juri~dii:ti,:,u, s11d1 .Jcris,11n 

~h.11 ! r,nt affc,:.t :he 1,:,n11in111~: l'fU\ i-.1P11, uf thi, c,..,k . .,.. hkh l'An bt< gi\1.'n ctlccl withr,ul the in\!lliJ f"Jtlim1:; ;md. 

:iwrdi_•!t. ~lH:h ,fin.I i,l r,·,r11,,,,. .Lr?:" ,kd.irv•I , ,., ti..'. ~l'Vl'f'.lhk. (i f'_t) i1<'r,•hy Jedan:~ that it WtHJld huv':': em1dcd thb 

1.Jtd111,1n~e ;rnd t•;g;h "' •'--'· ,ir,,d,:,;, .HX t·,1>ft> .• 11i'1~0:.:l,o:,n,, ,:;r \l;h,j ivis j.:;n, rh..::r1.'lJf. pro.wi.,i,}11 ,. ~t:n!t:nl,·S, d,1t1\tl.\ , •r 

phr:t,c,; i~11C',:t1H: ,,r ltK f,u:.1 th11• <>o:t ,,r r11, •r, ,:,! ll•,'.1f. 1< .k.;:iMc,1 in~,llid 

Sf.CTIOS 6; EfFl<:CJIVt: (>,\ Tf. ,\N[) rl;eur ATIO\ 

orJinaiKc in ) r11·1\~Jn11:wr 11i ,·~n,.·:;11 ,.·1,c11l,111nr, 111 !Ix· Cii,tri,:-1_ In !i<'n ,.f 1•ut,11,:a1i1·•r ,.ti tf1~ (11:t Ir~:"' t~ 

'"d,111J1h.:c, 11 ·,11111,rnir~ ,,t'clar "fd111,mr.:r n'l.l., h,_, p<Jhlt.,t.i.:.Jhy th,.:b:, tfJ•_ Bn.u,j >.'!L<~. withrn lilkc1· ! !'i'•dJ,, . .tl!cr 

!lie ,,t ... ,~·•! UnJ11i.111t·1: v.·a~ i11tf1Hhu:t:{J al a nkc'l\n~ ,·,f the Bour.J r:,f r>1rcc1or,; n!'GFC_) on I :....,,-1,,:, : "· :11 t'1. ,u,d ii 

w;i:, lh•'.fl r.:ad r; If 1 he tit":lt tirnr:.. ,'\ puhlk hearing WIL'i SC.! for the OnltnillKl.l t.·, l>t ,rad Jnr th(• ·.,',_u1.J !iti•c ,:,i 1 

~-Ji,,•:rnlwr H, 20l9 ,111.t ,IPl''°v'-°d riy 1J1r:: 1;.11!,Jwini; vc•te: 

.. \ 1· I : '.·: I 

~ LI :'~'f· :,k'"' ,· -
I 1,.m.1 ,1m1r·., ,11. lic•.trd C:er~: 

20-0203 H Page 20 of 41 



CAM&GEO 

Fire Code# 
S19r1f1cant 

\\/hat Is the ChJrgc? Lcca I{ adcptcd I SF~1 adocted .' 
Why Is There, Local Change? 

change? Amended 

101.1 N Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Administrative need 

LPG tanks are known to possibly leak, LPG is heavier than 

Exception: Above 5000 feet having an aggregate air and can easily be trapped under a home, if ignited it can 

105.6.27 y quantity not exceeding 125 gallons serving Locally adopted and amended 
lead to an explosion. At elevations above 5000 feet there is 

occupancies in Group R-3. an increased risk accompanied with significant historical fire 
activity due to snow load. These tanks require additional 
attention. 

,. ·. Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance 

106.6 N Add section le· 
Locally created and adopted 

of fees to cover actual costs. Section 106.6 defines 
peimits, plan checks, and inspections as allowed in Health 
&Safety Code 17951: 

106.6.1 · N Add section locally created arid adopted 
Section 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recover the cost to 
the Fire District . 

106.7 y Add section Locally created and adopted 
Section 106.7 To recover the actual costs or avoidable 
failed inspections by contractors. 

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 or the Fire Code of the District 
is added to read as follows: 
109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines - The intent of this 
provision is to darify the procedures and timelines for an 

109.4 y Added section 109. 4 locally adopted and amended individual OI' entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals 
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County of El Dorado's 
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals 
timeline. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that 

pOl'tions that were not completed by the SFM. It is protects lile and property. Fees have been updated to 
110.4 N 

better left to localities to determine the 
locally adopted and amended match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the 

fees/penalties fOI' their respective areas. District Attorneys Office. The change to the language to 
indude the term infractions. 

110.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 110.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief OI' his/her duly authorized representative (s), 

110.4.2 N Added Section 110.4.2. (This section existed before 
Locally created and adopted 

may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 
but under a different number) violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 or the 

Health and Safety Code of the State or California and 
Chapter 5c (commencing with section 853.6) of TiUe 3 ol 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

Completed the section by filling in the blank 

112.4 N 
portions that were not completed by the SFM. It is 

locally adopted and amended 
All violations of the code have been consolidated under 

better left to localities to determine the Section 110.4 to include the penalties ror violations. 
fess/penalties ror their respective areas. 

Added definitions ror: Campfire, Driveway, District, 

202 N Added definitions for clarity locally created and adopted 
Executive Body, Fire Chief, May, Shall, and Trained Crowd 
Manager. Definition of campfire shall not include LPG OI' 
Propane fueled appliances. 

302.1 N Added definition fOI' Campfire to Section locally aeated and adopted Added definition fOI' clarity 

307.4.4 through 
Due to the high fire danger that exists in Et Dorado County 

307.4.4.2 (d) 
y Added a sections ror campfire restrictions locally created and adopted we have written more stringent rules pertaining to open fires 

within grass, brush, and tree covered areas. 

20-0203 H Page 21 of 41 



Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertical 
clearance of 15 feet pr()'lides proper dearance for 
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus 
components. It also allows an extended time frame before 

503.2.1 
i' .. Changed vertical dearanc:es io 15 feei and road 

having lo rea.it the growth of the vegetation. Additional. 
N 

widths lo 20 feet. . Locally adopted arid amended height for vegetation clearances acts as an incieased buffer 

': 

for the spread of fire; A road width of 20 feet exclusive of 
shoulders, a~ measured face of curb to face of curb is. 

· .. 
heecie<i. ThEISe strticfiires can be difficult 10 navigate with 
fire apparatus and should not be counted in ihe totai ·. 
d.rivable road surface 

· .... 

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the 
Fire apparatus require areas for turning around when 

503.2.5 N 
Fire Code and TIUe 14 Fire Safe Regulations to 

Locally adopted and amended 
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This 

match as they require turnarounds for fire apparatus 
includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides 

access roads and driveways. 
better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum 
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

Al)ows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendix D of the 

503.2.6 N Surfaces to stale and match El Dorado County Locally adopted and amended 
current Fire Code whichever is more restrictive to be 

Transportation Division instead of AASHTOHB-17. consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an 
alternate means & methods that is not less restrictive than 
the Fire Code. 

503.4.2 N Added section regarding no pa/king in fire lanes Locally created and adopted 
This section dearly defines the 'No Parking in Fire Lanes' 
rules and is consistent with the California Vehide Code. 

503.4.3 N 
Added section regarding no parking in front of 

Locally created and adopted 
This section dearly defines the 'No Parking in front of fire 

hydrants 
hy1hnts' rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle 
Code. 

503.4.4 N 
Added section regarding fire lanes based on road 

Locally created and adopted 
This section dearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D 

width 
as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire 
lanes. 

Created and adopted 503.5.3 to maintain Allows fire districts the authority lo approve gates oo 

503.5.3 N 
emergency access and consistency Ulrough all 

Locally created and adopted 
roadways based on the Disbicts gate standard, providing 

roadway gates in El Dorado County, refemng to the the best possible emergency access to maintain fast 
gate standards adopted by the FPO's. response times. 

505.1 N 
Added section pertaining lo the visual addressing of 

Locally adopted and amended 
Allows Fire districts the authority to approve addressing 

buildings based on the District's addressing standards. 

Added more conservative standard for Ule Commercial properties are required lo install hydrants al 

507.5.1 N placement of hydrant and Uleir relationship to Locally adopted and amended 
300 foot intenrals, thus they should never be outside of 150 

commercial buildings feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance in 

. belween) . 

Buildings are getting more sizable in Ule county. II is more 
common lo have new buildings with solar arrays that 
continue to generate power even when the buildings 

509.3 y Added verbiage to bring all of Ule necessary fire 
general utilities have been shut off. When there is an 

controls for a bu~ding to one location. 
Locally created and adopted emergency, it is vital that we have rapid aoc:ess to all of Ule 

controls in one localioo for public evacuation and firefighter 
safety. Due lo the fire danger present in El Dorado County 
Ulroughoul most of the year, this change is appropriate and 
advisable. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic concilions 

Adds a requirement fa sprinkler system installation ... 
of El Dorado County and Uleir contributing factors to our 

903.2 N Loca1iy adopted and amended 
iiicreased response times, aloog with Ifie fact that flm ·. 

I in new buffdings and structures 3:600 square feet or · ' dcilJ\ile in size ~· and IIV8IY minute, l\'e require sprinklers 
I· 

greater wiUlin Ule dislrict. • · · ·· · · · ' · · · · I~ be installed in .slnlciures once they reach 3,600 square·. 
I.·. 

i· '· 
I: =~ze as they reiata 10 fire behavior an<1 raie ot : ·. ·• 

20-0203 H Page 22 of 41 



903.2.a 

90Ub. 

903.H 903.2.3, 
903.2.4, 903.2.7 

903.2.8.2 

903.2.9, 903.2.10 

907.2.a 

907.2.b 

907.2.c•. 

N 

N 

N 

y 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N. 

Adds a requirement for existing bu~dings greater 
lhan 3,600 square feet lo install splinklers if lhey 
add more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to lhe 
structure, Whichever is less. 

Adds occupani protection for !Wstingbuildings less 
lhan 3,600 square feet to install sprinklers if they 
tldd inore than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the 
structure, whichever is less, . . . 

.... ·.. . · ... ·_._: ·. 

:".: · . . ::: ···: . .. 

These sections were created to give specific 
dii'edion on the sprinkler requirements based on 
occupancy and square footage 

This section was created lo include manufactured 
residential single family R-3 in the residential 
splinkler program 

These sections were created to give specific 
direction on the sprinkler requirements based on 
occupancy and square footage 

Added occupant protection for fire alarms in 
buildings wilh a ffoor area less than 3,600, except 
R3, AG M<fmgs not used for commercial 
purposes, and buUdings with a floor area of less 
than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code 
official. 

Added occupant protection for existing buildiilgs 
withoot automatic sprinkler systems hi install a iiie 
alarm if they add moie lhan 30% or 1,000 square 
feet to the structure, whichever is less. 

Added occupant protection by stating all fire alann 
delectlon systems installed shall be comected to a 
rnooifoiing seivii:e that noiifies lhe fire department 
~ ildivalion l!nd is installed per Section 907 of 
the fire ciide:' 

LocaRy created and adopted 

LocaUy creaied and adopted 

locally adopted and amended 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally created end adopted. 

Due lo lhe topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
inaeased response times, along with the fact Iha! fires 
double in size each and every minute, we require splinklers 
to be instaUed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as lhey relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due io the topographic, climatic. and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and lheir cootriliuting factors to our 
increased resporise times,. along wilh lhe fact Iha! fires • . 
double in size each and every minute, we requi~ sprinkleis 
io be installed in strudures orii:e lliey reach 3.600 square 
ieet in size as they relate lo fire behavior and rate of . spread; .. • . ,, . . . 

Due to the topogrii'phii:, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado Coorifyarid their con!ributitlg factors to our 
Increased response times, along with the fact that fires ·. 
double In size each and every niiinite, we require sprinklers 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and raie of 
spread. 

Manufactured Homes - The intent ol this code section is to 
ensure that manufactured homes that S81Ve as a one or tw 
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found in 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar 
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildland-urban 
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption 
due to the light-weight nature of their construction. The 
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a 
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated to deaease this risk 
successfully in many California communities. 

Due to the topographic, climatic. and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and lheir contributing factors to our 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
double in size each and every minute, we require Sf)linklers 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
alkJN public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

ProiAdes 'proper errieigeilcy notification fur ocrupancies that 
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies lhat 
allow public use and ensures Fire Depallment notification in 
the event of a fire or smoke. . 

20-0203 H Page 23 of 41 



907.6.2.1 y Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply 
Locally created and adopted 

Amend to 72 hour capacity f()( bade-up power due to PG&E 
Modification safety related power outages. 

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to 
1203.1.3 N Shunt bip power safety deVices Locally adopted and amended ensure emeigency power shut off during the use of bacll-up 

power supplies 

3310.3 N Address requirements for construction sites Locally created and adopted 
Addressing for construction sites is important to assist 
responding emeigency crews. 

3312.1 N 
Water supplies at construction sites with 

Locally adopted and amended 
Water must be on site prior to combustible material being 

combustible materials on-site stored Of vertical construction commencing. 

El Dorado County has a significant fire danger throughout 
This section was created to indude Fire Protection 

4903.1 y Locally created and adopted 
Iha county. All projects will be required to submit a Fire 

Plan for all fire hazard severity zones. Protection Plan due to dimatic, geological, and 
topographical conditions. 

This section darifies that within the boundaries of El Dorado 

4905.4 y Added a section to darify roof construction 
Locally created and adopted 

County, fire jurisdictions will require that all roofs are 

requirements 
wildland fire safe and shall be comprised of a Class A roof 
covering Of assembly. Wooden shake roofs are not to be 
installed as they are not a Class A rated assembly. 

Any damages Of costs from negligent practices that 
Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate. 

5001.7 y cause a hazardous materials incident will cause a Locally created and adopted 
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 

cost recovery fee. 
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the 
negligent parties. 

Added safely protection with permits being issued 
Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and 

5601.2 N 
by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for 

Locally adopted and amended 
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Board of 

fireworks to approve them and have a dear understanding 

Supeivisors !Of firewO!lls. 
of the applications they will be used for. 

The Fire Marshal of any jurisdiction may request any 

FirewO!lls companies or vendors shall make 
documentation induding timing and proprietary information 

5601.2.1 and 5601.2.2 N available all requested documentation pertaining to Locally created and adopted 
that pertains to any aspect of a firewOlks display that they 

the firework presentation 
deem necessary. This infOfmation is understood to be 
proprietary and will be protected by the Fire Marshal as 
such. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5704.2.9.6.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5706.2.4.4 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combustible liquid special 
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval 

I and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from Iha County. 

Administrative need io add District name. Established limits 

5806.2 N 
Administrative addition of Disbict name. 

Locally adopted and amended 
as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable 

Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code 
Ciyogenic fluids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ · 
approval and a Special/Conditional Use Permit from the 
County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code Official for 

5806.2.1 N Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code SFM adopied and amended lcically 
Flammable C!yogenic fluids in stationary containers. 
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use 
Permit frOfn the County. 

Establishes distances between LPG storage and . 
dispensaries that are directly related to safety for residential 

6104.2 N 
Established fimits for LPG storage and dispensing Locally adopted and amended 

develoj)ments and high-density hotels, molal, apartments, 
near ot adjacent to resideritiai development · 

etc. where a release by leak Of explosiai of LP-Giis would 
have a high probablllty of injury, inhataticin, Of death.·. 
Requires AHJ approval and a SpeciaVCon<iiiional Use •·. · 
Peimit fi'cin the County, . . · . . . 

· . . ·: : .. 

20-0203 H Page 24 of 41 



6112.1 

6112.2 

6112.3 

6113.1 

6113.2 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 Section 

5.1.1.2 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 Section 7.6 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
13D-16 Section 

11.2.1.1 

Appendix B: Table 
> B105.1(1) . 

I•, .... ·.•.,.·: ... •• .. :., .. 

•.. ~dixB:'Table '· 
8105.2· 

N 

·. 

N 

N 

N 

N 

y 

y 

y 

y 

N . . :·.·: 

N 

Estabffshes · propane regulator requirements for 
iocatioils above 5000 foot elevation 

Locally aealed and adopted 

Establishes.propane veltical riser pipe requirements Locally created and adopied 
above 5000 foot elevation· 

,. 
. 

Establishes propane marking and location 
requirements above 5000 root elevation . •. 

Permits and plains shall be submitted and approved 
by the AHJ (Authority Having Jurisdicticio). 

Requires underground LPG tanks to remain the 
property of the LPG company 

NFPA 13D-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the 
District has been amended to update various 
provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler 
systems in one-and two-family dwellings 

To allow for rapid repair of an operating sprinkler 
system minimizing damage 

Addition of an audible alarm upon system activation 

System test to a pressure of 150 p.s.i. 

Esiiiiiiisheil a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM, 
tietow 5000 foot elevation, ffX allcomrriercial . 
·piqei:iii·· .· 

Locally aeated and adopted 

Locally created and adopted 

Locally aeated and adopted 

SFM Adopted and amended locally 

SFM adopted and amended locally 

SFM adopted and amended locally 

SFM adopted and amended locally 

local~ adilpted and amencfed .· 

Establishes propane regulator requirement for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. Including requirements for two
stage regulator use and location of first and second stage 
regulators. Additional requirements are outlined for 
protective covers, riser pipe installation requirements, 
building permit submiliafand review, tank center-line 
marking, and grade requirements: These requirements are 
based on significant fire histci,y in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feel .. 

Establishes veru~I propane rise requirements for locations 
aixwe 5000 foot eievaticio: Pipe schedule locaUon, swing 
Joint requirements; and thiluse of flexible riser piping as 
well as. SW1rig joints. These requirements are based on 
significant fire history iri heavy sriciw and extreme weather 
cooditions encountered above 5000 feet. 

· . 

Establishes miloorig and location requirements for locations 
above 5000 foot elevation. This section addresses signage 
location, emergency coniact information, and snow related 
tank marking requirements. These requirements are based 
on significant fire history in heavy snow and extreme 
weather conditions encountered above 5000 feet 

. 

Permitting and Plan submittal requirements for underground 
tanks: 
Allows us to require plails be subinitted for review prior to 
installations of underground LPG tanks. Undetground tanks 
require substantial maintenarice including inspection and 
anode replacement at regular intervals. 

Underground tanks corrode easily and can leak wtthout 
detection. They are also are not routinely maintained when 
sold to the end user. This does not apply to above ground 
tanks where corrosion and leaks are more easily detected. 

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow 
alann lo create an audible alert for the flow of water in the 
event of water activation in a vacant structure, and 
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 13D 
sprinkler system installation deaeasing the risk of water 
damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements 
were also added to ensure water circulation through the 
system, reducing stagnant water and bad(flow concerns 
(EID encourages this type of system). 

A supply of each type of sprinkler head used in a system 
must be available on-site in an accessible mounted cabinet 

An audible alann system is added to notify occupants and 
in the activation of the system when the building is not 
occupied allow for detection minimizing damage. 

A pressure test is adopted to minimize system leaks and 
failures and assures proper gluing of system components: 

Allows us to match what devel0f)8!'S and residents are used 
to in iiigaros 1o GPM fiie tlCfN .niquirements. that i\ave been 
usec1 tor: over a iieca<ltl inJocr •.·.· > , . 
Ali<Ms us lo match what. ~ope!S and residents aie used 
to in regards to GPM fire flow iequiieriienis ihat have been 
used for over a decade lri EOC. ·. . ' . 

20-0203 H Page 25 of 41 



Appendix D: 0103.1 

Appendix D: 0103.2 

Appendix D: 0103.3 

Appendix D: 0103.5 § 

1 

Appendix D: D103.6.1 

Appendix D: D103.6.2 

Appendix D: D104.2 
Exception 

Appendix D: D104.4 

Appendix D: 0106.1 
Exception 

Appendix D: 0107.1 
Exception 

101.2 throogh 101.5 

102.6 through 102.8 

102.10 through 102.12 

103.1 through 104.1 

104.3 through 104.4 

104.6 ihrough 104.6.4 

104.8 through 104.9.2 

104.11 through 
104.11.2 .. 

104.11.3 ·•· . 

105.3.1 through 
105.3.2' · 

105.6.12 
. " 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

Made an exception for residential driveways 

State law requires no greater than 16% grade 

Text to indude curbs and gutters 

Fire apparatus access roat1 gates 

Roads widths 20 to 29 feet 

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36 
feet in width 

Removed the exception that allows a sprinklered 
building with a square footage of 124,000 or less to 
have only one approved fire apparatus access road. 

Added to require circumferential fire apparatus 
access roads 

Removed Exception in its entirety. 

Removed Exceptions #1 & #2 in its entirety. 

Locally adopted and amended 

locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Locally created and adopted 

locally adopted and amended 

Locally adopted and amended 

Adopted with no Amendments 
N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N< ,• 

N 
. 

Adopted to establish scope, intent, severability and 
validity 

References, Subjects not regulated by the code 
. 

Conflicting provisions, Other Laws. Application of 
references 

Definition of the Fire Prevention Division and abillty 
to enforce the code 

Right of Enby, Warrants, and Identification 
· .. ,.'. .:·. 

. . 

Record retention. 

Mod'lfications, alternate means and methods, and 
lest 
Authority at fires, right of access, maintenance of 
systems 
Authority of systems and devices inoperable. 
nine limitation of aoolication .. 

N . . . . 9Perational permits .. 

Locally adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted. 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 
Locally Adopt8CI • . 

··i .. ·. ·. Locill!y Adopted . 
. .. ... 

It is unreasonable to require a residential driveway to 
. construct a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant 

Title 14 requires for us to only accept up to 16% driveways. 
In our El Dorado County ntte 14 adoption we allow greater 
than 16% grade with AHJ approval and hard surface. 

20 fool road widths shall not induda curbs and gutters due 
to potential access issues and turning radius concerns. 

Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a d"tvided 
roadway the gaie width shall not be less than 15 feet due to 
radius issues. : . . 

No parlling on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet 
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does 
not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire 
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all olher elevations. 

Paoong on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 feet 
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of 
elevation. Lower than 5000 feet this does not apply. The 
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D 
Section 103.6.2 for all other elevations. 

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 
ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 
residents and first responders. 

When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 
access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire 
structure and shall provide a continuous means of 
emergency vehide access. 

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 
ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 
residents and first responders. 

For the safety of the communities we live in, two ways of 
ingress/egress are required to ensure the safety of the 
residents and first responders. 

Administrattve darity 

Administrative darity 

Administrative darity 

Administrative darity 

A'*11inistrative darity 

Administrative darity 

Administrative darity 

Administrative darity 

Administrative darity 
Administrative daritv • 

Mninistratlve darity 
·.· ' ... · · .. ·. · . .:-- . " . 

. 

20-0203 H Page 26 of 41 



105.6.2.28 through 
105.6.35 

105.6.37 
· .. ·. 

105:6.39 

fos.s.4 nhroogh 
105.6.46 

105.6.50 

106.1 lhrough 106.3 

107.1 

108.1 through 109.3 

110.3.2 through 
110.3.4 

110.4.1 

113.1 

303.1 through 303.9 

305.1 through 305.5 

306.1 through 306.2 

307. t through 307.5 

308.1 

Jos.1.2 through 
308.1.3 

308.1.5 lhrough 
308.1.8.5. 

-'·. ' . 

308.2 

N 

N 

Adopted this section for administrative darily and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted li!is secticlri for adminisirative darity and 
fire 811d life safefy inspection" 
Adopted this section for adnilnisti'lltive darily and 
lire at\d life saiety inspedions _.. . .... 

N ~t: __ ~in_s~t:~tivedarifyarid I· 

.-.. _. __ ·;_ .. :_-.... 
N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire arid liie safety inspections ·. -. . 1 . 

Adopted ihis section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections . 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and_ life safety inspections. 

Adcipled this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative darity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative dality and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative darity and 
fire and lfre safety inspections 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and Ufe safety 

Adopted ttiis section for fire and life safety 

·. 

Adopted this secilon for fire and life safely 

· ... :-, ...... . _ •. _. __ .•..•. >--. 

l\dopted thfs sectial for lire 8/ld life safety -.. 

LocaKy Adopted 

Locally Adopted 
. . . 

Locafty Adopted 

LocaRy Adopted . 

· .. 

Locally Adopted ·. 

Locally Adopted•. 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adcipled 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adcipled 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted . 

. 

Permits for various business operations for: Magnesium, 
miscellaneous combustible storage, mobile food preparation 
vehicles, motor fuel-dispensing facilities, open burning, 
open flames and torches, open flames and candles, and 
organic coatings . 

Peimits for places or assembly . 

Pemiits for private fire hyttants 
. ' .· 

Peimiis fa pyroxytin plastics, refrigeration equiprnen~ repair 
garages and motor fuel~sj)ensing facilities, rooftop .. 
h'elipa1s; sj)rayirig cir dipping; sloiage oi scrap tires and tire 
by-products . . .• . 

Peimit fa iire-rebuilmniJ plants .· · . ·.·· ·. ..... .. . . 

Permit for w~ products storage (chips, hagged material, 
lumber cir plywood, m exc:ess of 200 cubic feet) 

'· 

Fee schedules for permits 

Inspection authority 

Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of 
equipment, re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping, 
supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding, 
Board of Appeals established, limitations on authorily, and 
qualifications 

Compliance with orders and notices, prosecution of 
violations, and unauthorized tampering 

Abatemeni of viaation 

Authority to disconnect service utilities 

Asphalt ketUes contain highly flammable substances and 
require sb'ingent safeguards (Climatic, geological, and 
topogrephical) 

Managing ignition sources through responsible application 
of standards will reduce the number of fires in various 
settings (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Motion picture projection rooms and film are HIGHLY 
flammable and require special handling (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

Open burritng, recreational fire, and portable outdoor 
fireplaces, (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Open flame general requirements (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical) 

Throwing or placing of Ignition sources, torches for 
rerTKMng paint (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

locations neer combustible, open flame devices, signals 
ind mar1in, portable fuel open.flame devices, sky· 
lanterns, religious ceremonies, aisles and axils, flaming 
food and bevef&ge preparation, dispensing, containers not 
in use, serving of flaming food, location, fire protection 
(Cilinaiicigeaogh:al, ~nd topographk:al) . 

· . .' .. ·•. .. :- .:.·• 

l'emii~ in ri\citiiied for aboYe section (Climatic, geological, 
iind iopographic:al) . . . ·. 

20-0203 H Page 27 of 41 



308.3 through 308.4.1 

319.1 

319.2 

319.3 through 
319.10.3 

403.8. 1 through 
403.8.1.7 

403. 10 through 
403.10.1.3 

405.5 

510.3 

807.5.2 through 
807.5.2.3 

903.2.1.5 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N. 

N 

N 

N 

Adopted this section toc fire iind iife safety 

Adopted this sectioh for fire arid iife safety .· 
: ·' ·, ·,: .···. ·.'.:'·.·:·: .. _. .. , ..... · .· .. · 

Aclopted ~Is ~Oli fa' fi~ and life safety · ..... 

Adopted Uiis section for administrative clarity arid 
fire and life safety inspections. 

. . . . 

Adopied Uils section for fire and life safety 

Adopted this section for fire and life safety 

. . 

Adopted this section for fire and Hfe safety 

Adopted this section for fire and ~fe safety 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this .section for administrative clarity and 
fire and fife safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
fire and Hie safety inspections 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Localiy Adopted ·. 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

. Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Locally Adopted 

Gioup A occupancies open-flame decorative devices, . 
theelrical peifunnances, Group R occupancies, Group R-2 
donnitories (Clirriatlc, geological,· and topographical) 

General requiiements relating to smoking (Climatic, 
·. geological: and topographical) · 

;No Sriloldng" signs (Ciimatic, geological, and 
topographical) • ; < .. . .. 

Gen~ requi~ts relating to rno!Mle food preparation 
vehicles. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Permits foi mobile food preparation vehicles (Climatic, 
geological, aitd topographical) . 

Exhaust hood, fire ~ection. tire protection for cooking 
equipment fire extinguisher,. appliance connedfon to fuel 
supply piping; coolcing oil storage coriiairiers, metallic 
storage tailks, nonmetallic storage ianks, cooking oil 
storage systein components, design aiteria, tank venting, 
normal vetiis; emergency Wilis, LP11as systems, maximum 
aggregate voluine,·proteclion of container, LP-9as oontainer 
coostiuctioo; protedion of system piping, LP11as alarms, 
CNG systems, CNG oontainers supplying only cooking fuel, 
maxiinum aggregate volume, protection of container, CNG 
oontainer construction, CNG containers supplying 
transpiration and cooking fuel, protection of system piping, 
methane alarms, maintenance, exhaust system, fire 
protection systems and devices and fuel gas systems. 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Em8!Qency planning and preparedness in group R-2. 1 
(residential care facilities and group homes) evacuation and 
fire sareiy'plans. > · · · 

Group R-1 (Boarding house, hotel, motel)occupancy 
Evacuations; diagrams, emergency duties, (CHmatic, 
!JOOlcigic:al; and 1opograpliica1) · 
Emergency Planning and record keeping (Climatic, 
geofogkal, and topographical) 

A permit is required for em8!gency responder radio systems 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Wall ooverings in group E occupancies (Schools) sets a 
maximufli amount of flammable wall coverings in 
educational facilities (Climatic, geological, and . 
topcigraphical) . . 

An automatic sprinkler system is required in Group A-5 
(sporting arenas, amusement park structures, bleachers) 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical) greater than 1000 
square feel (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

20-0203 H Page 28 of 41 



Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
All buildings will be required to allow emergency responders 
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from 
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time 

Adopted this section in existing buildings for the 
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 

1103.2 y safely of firefighters and other emergency Locally Adopted 
phasing in of a system over a period of time, determined by 
the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind responders. 
this section is that on almost all emergency responder injury 
or fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
strong signal. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix D: 01of 1 
N Adopted tliiuection for the safety of the public, . 

I• .. Locally Adopted aeiiera1 requirements for fire apparahls. access roads 
ttirciugh. 0102.1 firefighters. anc1 oiher emergency responders. inciudiog·k>ads~-(Climatic. geological; and iopographical) · . . 

. . 

Adopted this section for the safety or ~e p«1~ic, · 
· . Dead end fire apparatus access road requireinents ror a 

Appendix D: D103.4 N 
fireflghteis. aoo other emergency _iespoiideis. Locally Adopted tum around at 150 feet (Crtmatic. geoiogk:al, and .. topographical) : . 

AppendilCD: D103.6 N 
Adopted this section. for ihe safeiy of the public, 
firelighters, aild oiher emergency respoodeis. Locally Adopted 

;No Parking, Fire Lane' signs requirements: (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical) 

Appendix D: D104.1 Adopted this section for Uie safety of the "public; • Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus through D104.3. N 
firefighters, and other emergency iespondeis; 

Locally Adopted 
access roads. (Climatic,' geological, .!rid topographical) (excluding exception) 

. . . . 
Appendix D: 0105.1 

N 
Adopted !hi$ section for Hie safety of the ptiblic, .. 

Locally Adopted Requirements for aerial fire apparatus access roads 
through 0105.4 firefighters, and other emergency responders. (Cffmatic, geological; and topographical) 

Appendix O: 0106.1 
Adopted this section for the safety of ihe public, Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential through 0106] N Locally Adopted 

(excluding exceptions) firefighiers, and other emergency iesponders. developments {Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Appendix D: D107 .1 One- or two-dwelling residential developments shal be 

(excluding exceptions) N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
equipped throughout With two sperate and approved fire 

through D107.2 firefighters. and other emergency responders. apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 
climatic conditions. 

Append'IX O: D108 N 
Adopted this section for the safely of the public, 

Locally Adopted 
Adopt reference standards dealing with gate construction 

firefighters, and olher emergency responders. standards {Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle. 

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

20-0203 H Page 29 of 41 



From: Diana Sampson 
Sent: Monday, December 23, 2019 3:13 PM 
To: Casey Ransdell 
Subject: FW: Public Notice: Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code 

Hi Casey! 

Here's the one for the First Reading of Ordinance 2019-01 

D~S~ 
Administrative Assistant 
Georgetown Fire Protection District 

P.O .. Box 420,_Georgetown~ CA _95634 

0: t~.~Q)}~}-.1JU; F: 1~:W.)}~}-.~.Q-~Q 
~~~mP.~9.r:i.@&~9!Jr.~:!?rB 

From: Legal Ads <le&al~@.mtdemocrat.net> 
Sent: Monday, October 7, 2019 3:53 PM 

To: Diana J. Sampson <~~-~mP.~.C?.r:i.@.&~gflr.~:2f8> 
Subject: Re: Public Notice: Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code 

Confirmation of Scheduled Publication: 
NTCE INTENT ADOPT- FIRE CODE 2019 

Newspaper: Mountain Democrat 
Pub date(s): 10/07/19, 10/14/19 
Ref ad#: #6675 
Charges: $35.00 

Thank you for publishing in our newspaper, 

Allison Rains - Public Notices 
Mountain Democrat - Georgetown Gazette Newspapers 

legals@mtdemocrat.net - legals@gtgazette com 
L~JQ)M".:~.Q.~!:l - fax L~JQ)M4.:~.0.!li 

On 10/2/2019 9:56 AM, Diana J. Sampson wrote: 

Please publish in the next two editions. 

20-0203 H Page 30 of 41 



Thank you! 

"Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code 

Notice is hereby given to the intention of the Georgetown Fire Protection 
District to adopt the 2019 California Fire Code. The District shall hold its first 
public hearing at 9:00 A.M. on October 18, 2019, located at 9:l8J . .Main..S.w,~i::t, 
.G.~rg~tQ.W.n,.C.i!Hfo.m.i.\l, regarding the adoption of the 2019 California Fire Code 
pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13869. Copies of the code section 
referred to and any secondary code sections referred to, adopted by reference, 
are on file with the Secretary of the District and are open to public 
inspection. Adoption of the 2019 California Fire Code will enable all District 
personnel to follow one set of rules and regulations with regard to the health 
and safety of the public and the District's response thereto." 

DtQ"'-QJ. SQ~p.so"" 
Administrative Assistant 

Georgetown Fire Protection District 
6281 Main Street, P.O. Box 420 - Georgetown, CA 95634 

Main 5.~.Q,~3.~.~.LU. - Fax 5.3.Q,~3.:},1Q].9. 

20-0203 H Page 31 of 41 



From: Diana Sampson 
Sent: Monday, December 23, 2019 3:13 PM 
To: Casey Ransdell 

Subject: FW: SECOND Public Notice: Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code 

Hi again Casey, 

And here's the second notice, for the Second Reading. 

Administrative Assistant 

Georgetown Fire Protection District 

P.O. Box 420,.Georgetown, CA _95634 

O: l~JQ)}~~.--1JU; F: i~JQ)}~~::•:1-Q~Q 
~~Jt~P.~9.~.@.&11!9!Jr.11!:9rn 

From: Legal Ads <l~als@mtdemocrat.net> 
Sent: Monday, October 21, 2019 9:35 AM 

To: Diana J. Sampson <~~-~mP.~.9-~.@.&~fJ!.~:5?rB> 
Subject: Re: SECOND Public Notice: Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code 

Confirmation of Scheduled Publication: 
NOTICE INTENT ADOPT 2019 CA FIRE CODE-2ND PUB HRG 

Newspaper: Mountain Democrat 
Pub date(s}: :l.:Ui~/19, 11/30/19 
Ref ad#: #6894 
Charges: $35. 00 

Thank you for publishing in our newspaper, 

Allison Rains - Public Notices 
Mountain Democrat - Georgetown Gazette Newspapers 

leaals@mtdemocrat.net - regals@gtgazette.com 
H?JQ)~~-~-:~.Q~~ - fax L~JQ)M~.:~.9-~i 

On 10/18/2019 2:30 PM, Diana J. Sampson wrote: 

Please publish in this Wednesday the 23rd edition, and the following 
Wednesday the 30,h edition. 

20-0203 H Page 32 of 41 



Thank you! 

Notice of Intent 
to Adopt the 2019 California Fire Code 

Notice is hereby given to the intention of the Georgetown Fire Protection District to 
adopt the 2019 California Fire Code. The District shall hold its second public hearing at 
9:00 A.M. on November 14, 2019, at 6283 Main.Street,_Georgetown, California, 
regarding the adoption of the 2019 California Fire Code pursuant to Health and Safety 
Code Section 13869. Copies of the code section referred to and any secondary code 
sections referred to, adopted by reference, are on file with the Secretary of the District 
and are open to public inspection. Adoption of the 2019 California Fire Code will enable 
all District personnel to follow one set of rules and regulations with regard to the health 
and safety of the public and the District's response thereto. 

Diana J. Sampson 
Administrative Assistant 

Georgetown Fire Protection District 
6281 Main Street, P.O. Box 420 - Georgetown, CA 95634 

Main .53.Q,3.3J,HU. - Fax 5.3.Q,3.3.3.~1Q 

20-0203 H Page 33 of 41 



Attachment No. 2 

Georgetown Fire Protection District 

Resolution No. 2019-04 

20-0203 H Page 34 of 41 



. . 

RESOLUTION No. 2019-04 

:\ RESOLUTION OF TlrE B(JARD OF DI RFCT'ORS OF THE G-EOHGE'l'O\.VN FIRE PRO'lt::CT!()i\ 
DISTRICT ADOPTlNG FINr>ll\'G~ "' iPPOHTINC~ .~ ~·lFNDMEl'. I'S TO Tl-ff 

CAUFUH..t°'JI.'\ FIRE CODE 

J\ frc'1"Jh1ri.-,11 fur 1he G~c.rge10,= Fue Prctc\.'ti,Jn l!15tr1Cl :it'tU"",~ fnnh findingc. with r,.':;p, .. ·.:-; 1,, l,x,d ,:,_inditi<:on5 witfon Lh(! 

ru., D,~rrici which m.;k"' cert,11.n modifi,·4uons ,111J i:h:rng"'-' Lu tJ,., r.:ilito~mu Fin, C,:,d~ r!'.a,;oh,1bly nec•>:15an· for 

ptesr::rv,ng ftno anJ lifo l:tti't)' in 1h•: i:_;~;rg,•tciwn l•inc Pml>/l'.tr,11: Cti,cricr. 

WHEREAS tl,;.iJt.h ,':, S,f<ct:, c~-J,, s .. ,G.IIJ[I l 7958,) pdmit•; u Fin: Prnt~ ti(>11 Di"1rrct r,_, ,1d,,pt ~D eordin;rnc,2 

,..,.-1,icb ,:harig.:·,, nr m,,<l1f.i,c_~ Lhe- St:ice fl,Jm1ng reguh111:in; :1dop1d rur~t:Jnl r,-; fl,:,lth & Sijt\i-:, Lud,i '.,.,ction J']'l'.2:Z q,•Jn 

,lcter111iniJrit1n th~1. ,1.J,:h C!lJ.l1R6 ,:,r mo<lifin11Jon.~ ar1: n~ct">,,H\- Ju" co ]cl<'.al .:<.l:idiric,t1s thar. p't'rt,,tn regulal'Jons go,;:rnlng 

,~,:mdlll0ns ha.'.,trdeo.is t•J lU,,, pr, 1p,:r,~ ~:.J dw ,•111·trn11n\1:n[ frum lire. ~xpic~.ion; 11:1.:..rd•Jlr, 'lHE•'1"lal\ ar.J h.i,_unl,,u~ u,;e;; 

anJ 

WHERF.AS, f-lc.,Jd, & S;,frr,· (:(-de ~-<."CUQ!l 1. 7<iSJ:t,'.7 n,•jll•P:~ Ltu1 ;, [ij'i[ri,.-1 'c, fxlsl.J'd c,f r•i.rect,:-r~ makini my 

..:h,wg1's N mn<li!Lauon.1 punu~m C•J l'ii:.-allh & Sal,:ty C,xk ;i.._><:twn 1795!(5 5haH m.i'kc ~pr,:,-i finding 1_h.if ~Jch d11nges 

or m,_,<lific.1liom .1t1: rieede,1;. ,1.m.l ,IHII HJ,_• a cnpy of,t,th duttg'-"' .:,r m.:odifk<1tion., w:tJ1 tlu.: [)..-p;;rtmi;nt ,Jr ffoi;s,ng rtTJU 

(~ummllillty LJ..•vc·li:,pmi,nr 

WHEREAS. ,J,,: uniqu"' loetl dn:nar:i,~. ge,:,lugic~I. ·.nd '.1,pngraphical Lo:iditiun.1 t·.xw.ing within t.!w bounda.ri<·~ ,:,f 

t!1t• Diwin rn1tke l'- rea5on;ibl~ nen··;-;,1rv for di,:, Db1nu ti> impo,e more nririge:it r1:,1ui~rne111~ rhan i.e1 fonh in t.hc: 

C.tlif,-1nua fiJ., Cod•: ,md !Jllf.':!H"<TI'- u1 Californi~ Hrahh and Sa!~y Cot!c 1e<:t101t=, l:'.l&,'f.7 ;;i;11] t 7958.7, th,; Di:;.n,;t d<•;in.>5 

"' mak<" ~:iq,rc,1·, !<11d11:1;~ rn Ll-iiit elfoG. 

NOW, THF:REFlJRE. B.E fl' RESOLVED thal the Bc,ard 1.1f [Jiu,cl•)tl r_11' tJ1•! Cn'Ip\etown Fi re Protection District. 

after h;,,-ing duly notiCf:•,I a11d be:d 17•ih1i,; h,•,1ring~. hcrdiv d<fopr! tJ1c folk,wmg fi11Ji11g~ ,0na:.,rnlng CIJrTt'fll uniq\l•· k,_,11 

ccmditiom Llut wg1:cr.her ma_ke 1::ad1 rn1:iJ,ficJ11on ft· thc C1liforrua fue CoJ-:., rea~c,nat.lr Ol-cb\arv 1r_, prvvidr: JJcqu~t<' 

,md effe,ctivia prryfecti•m •Jf lifo. p1-:,p~·rty anci the environment more 5pe,:ilio:Jlly !1:'t forth J~ folloW!:: 

111 l~ r.·1, '/~ ,·,; 'l·.'; \\ 

20·0203 H Page 35 of 41 



f!NDr.NG') CW f ACT 
fl)k <:Jl.~\/i,ES OR MODlflCATlONS TOTHf: STATE tiUlLDTNC STANDARDS 

CPDE ffITT_E 2,t PART 9\ BECAUSE Of LOCAL CONDITIONS 

:',rt1~~ tiUr: r:·!~!\l1l~r:.i!J~:in. ~tr: :~i)Jrd ,::{ r~ut··:[•)f~ 1J~· ~ht1 •. ~r!(~[J?~l1iwn F:r,;· Prnt.t1C1 l1Jll f.~istrict. b~n:1h·.- r-:11~J:. 1h.11 1ld11 1i~ 

l,,..:.1J ,_1_,ru;1,. "-""'l,;~•,.: incl :.·J~-.;,~rJph:,: -:,•nd!t;c,r.s, ;;.5 ,'.,1tnl within tiw, ,lrn::,1m.-n1, ther<' •~ ,1 n~,,d r.-, J'."''~,d;_ rt.~ 

r:-1. ~hf; ... -.. uJ11:. 41,,J :·t,atJt~:l-'"" . .::,1'jfHJdl~J L:.-: Ult: ·Jd,Jpc1· .. ·-e: 1...=t'.:"",-!1r-1.r~c,r of the i_~JhfcrrtliJ r'i.rr~ Co~t~ :~uLh rti1.n1g1·. o1ri~ J,:~~Hr•i 

t-.-:: ri~Li :·J",~\t--,ty l~t•(,~i..:J.T\' ~-,. pr<:1 V11h ~--lf.:'l,~!;;ul': :1.1d. t·nL"(-~l'l!i rn1(e1 tlUll 11( l!f\t:, ~1r11p~~ny, :1nd thf ~l)VUCJflfT\t~Ht 

rt:~ f~1Cf)'.:',~,:.::!" 1)\',']'i F~~~ fJ,J'~(':11: n [Jh':ncr. r,ri:i•,id~ .... Rr": pr;)(~<T'Y)n, ~m~:-f:~l]C~ rn~Ji,:_.1] '1clPYll t'•t, AIHl "ipf:'•.-ltlhn:,t r,,.,:nH' 

~-r,-,.:.t.!~ t._, r.-ppr,::,-_1n1:H\.::v !~1rr:"":: •_hcu~l.?:J r,~;d,;-nt~ ~r:1 ·! 1":'i!fh'i.:"'t·-,~~·:~n 1}~.T1 f 1~HJT,:- u1.~.l1~ 11rt•L,. l/141 ftJ,41[1 .. r 1~. lu-u,u 1d ,,n 1h1.• 

.., ... -c:_,a:rn ~l·J:-'t..: ._::{ :J C .... ·r~:_!.:1 ·: .-)'l~r-, '!h~ c~:.f:'t.11i1,r:Jr~~; .. :I d·.,:i- [t:·~rni.: nu1~c1 fr:~rt, ndl~n~ hiJh r1f ~r"e;·; .-u1d 1-,.1k ,.'-1,·1(11~I.H111 

1.:-1 ri1-t ~-r:?t 1r,2 :-1.l r..tn,r'-':! 1;1 t.'.~t ~.r.ter ,ir:J.Lnlic!- 1:·f cbe ~?.ut !··-=-·td(1l~ ·n1,· ,~·-·~1lii_"t 1.·,~n,J1t1u1, 1 ~· • .rv fi,_,,11 tr,·t.·~~iriF. 

~:r!lr~r;i~.!-:·:1 \.-1:h •v :J\:·-ri;i -n~::--A-- ;:-1 ~,~vcr. r,:, -:nn:~,~r f,'~--r~1p•"..-:1i-·.11·."', rh.;.1 :-, .. -;; 1JJ·-1:-;:, t-'l"-.•·(~,J ~1·~1 d,~~tt·t''.'1 . 

. :J ·. (t•-:-1~1..-·i.n~:--: rnl:':' ;~j"t-iTL'.rE-:t. L!!:-[";r_~ '!3 ,H"! ·.111 r1. ... l, ;,)t~HC',' rti\.t [),,::1!,.~ p.1tT.li .. 'jj\JI!~;",. lil j~ 11l\Jlht'liLi1·,n•.\•.I Hil~•m.PI• 

;id ?;~~~r-tTr· 1H1.J ·~. 1:i~piri- '.1t ,.! r~h!"t.11J){t d~h .. ·,·.'l·.t'ri: [,·~ r h,.: (.1iif, ,r ni.t L''t~fLH! ~H11 rH ,,l f.11"'t'1t.~r y .in1.f f· irt Prnr_rd i(ir: i'l~ ,d 

f-;r·-..:,. 13f <.,l,f!1.;.;!d. n:!'.' .;'~it."!J~,:~· .iJ r_!'L~ [i1!'-~:,r;_1 1 \.'J)l. rr«.f>:1'."d '.:· .lfl.~i •.1'!.tl \11~th, Jr~:,' pfr,.~ •:~f1~~n1'r)4~~tl!) fh,, (1 .. :.lrJ ·•ri~i.• 

I-=r-:c~:cc·n- !.:1 ~~ ti:•(l . ..:~n1~nt 1:i l 1 ;:)11J rid ·.:n:-f1 1 , •• t~1 r~ipr•·t""4 • ., fH H:-t ~ 11~ 1-nl...1· liltl ~~do1 llt\'r'.0.1.!tH.ldl1'.i,_ .,L1,rrn,,. JHtbtir 

i.'\5i5''. n)l5 1 h:.·,=4ri!t .. :1J; m;t· n,.1,.. '.'J<':ii!r1tt"'- 1~10.l;,~ai thL u1•! 1~~~'.Ld~1·nJ t•·" 1 .. li4 ~ 

·r~H_l Ct::t"!\~~ ~-;A.~ ("'!":::.hli,h1•j .. inc, 1\ .. dl i1r-:i•• .. ·;t.;.1 4-t,·d fit,.. ,.~1t:1pf 11n,i fti 11 1,h-th~ ... ,lrr '1\Jtir)111 p_1 ,~r,1•.i,J,· !"1''1f,Pi~1 11h j/ 

:,,cie,r,"t,.:i~; r·c, rh,.· ;-1-rrm·lI".~l·. r~r,~· ·:,rt1:t 1 C, .,i l."- Lx•h·d if', 1t\' ~,,~•,lq,:-,, .. ,i H•,l tH,\.'fi 1!1 r,:,-,r{jt, .. •l,,'l"tH ,,, r_,(H~ ~-,ldp '.:1t4:,~~ 

Fit~+.v(d!F;ti [~' • .' 1) k-.:Jf~':',} ..,J ~i·,:~1.: .... , .. ~i.f',.\/'.f•r, c,:.'l'.'l~ ;:.:;,., ... d, i, ... ~~d),:1!~·,l'-,i', In~· \tJ(h:'1;,r,:t ~~ k· .. '."14l\·t1 ,.r ,P)il .• ) \,',·1lf ,1• 0 .',·ilL 

,, ,_]u:rat!<. _ 

r;1111tdll . ..ihn1~ ~1~·h 1~-p·1..•.,r-_,.,.J rl,.vt, 1,1·.u,r:· .. th,~,: ,!i~·.- .;! r•1, Fir• i·t,;.?tt1.-t1.·t1~ fJp.tr:z:1 tii r,r .. ·\~~,,,. urJrrh .. "·~liJh· ~:rr"~~-r~.~c.!.i,:~, 

\·r~.p1·111'..:, n 1.,ft..-111 d1•l.1yC"d 1·"tt!~f l.Jr1u:· .11h:·c r ~ ~ttHAL: 1_');1d1t1,q1'1 ,._.r,~·E t::-11(! \ft 11 i,1,1E,: nuni'!·~r n( \t.•h1~i1Jp .11<::1~*"..'n".: 

th1.1I p1Hf' ,.-,~ rrnlf r,:~t t ,11:1~" ::•ti ~ ~H" t1Y,1J~.1l,i1t; '1 ~·.; rn:1,-r,.:•·1,-t ·r t1., pu:T r- l 1'1 ;w,ti if Hi r~r~,,~ rg,:-cc·f I ~::;,~Cl~. fr: ~J i 1d h.ua_r,!1-<i'.'.', 

1n1H,!ll.,l:. ,·i:intrid, .u~d !•n·~ b~h1u1~ t hr.• thrnAt1L Lc"r.d1;1;,.•t1·, ntlr·~: t"'~~lh 1n ,, :;11t•-1,t:.1tn.i.l !J! i·~ 1ul l) .. ~k ti ,ihl;,;..) ct r·h,}

FHr r·r111.t·~t1111, lU···rtl''t fO !f'\~11111d 1rr,J:~1··lt .. lPJ\· qt 1_1ur-1 ','.i~1r·1 ,., ,.:;rn•·!f'''L',' \iilJJi.f:in, rh:.u l.}.:'C".l.f E:,.ir11plc,, .f rh~j{.~ 

PtnrtlJ.rtr~·'.,' -.1i11,tli•HI"- 111,, l.i.j, •,Jn1:·~1:r,:-· t1rl!'1.o, ·J..~.~.iJJilj J.hd t;,!,..\~ t'"J~1-") L1•.,_·,1HH'. :1.,1.itrJ~: .. ;/, rr,Jlf-:1~.A.t-= : __ ri-_:Jr::.·.~~ 

Summary: 

20-0203 H Page 36 of 41 



These local climatic condirions affect the accelerarion, intensity, and 5ize of firl·s in the Fire Oisrrict. Times of little or no 

rJinfall. low humi.Jity. anJ high temperatures create extreme!> hazardous conditinm. particularly as they relate to the 

wildland urbu11 intcrf.1(1:. Winds ,·.,perien,,•d in 1his arcJ ,,111 have ,1 significant impact upon strucnm.' fires. e~peciallv in 

buildings in cl\lse proximity to oni? another. and t,1 wildlands commonly found in the G('orgetown Fire Protection 

Distric1. Strucrurc5 built within the l;,•orgernwn Fin' Prn1,•,:1.ion District must be built with these variahies in mind. 

C. Geological. Thl' Ceorgetown Fin• Protection District is l11cated within moderate activity se1sm1c Zone Three. The 

seismic. geological conditions present a potential for m11ltiplc fires. major breakage of water mains. multiple electrical 

power failures. muhiple collapsed qructures and a large number of calls for emergency medical aid. all of which may 

occur simultaneous!; during a seismic cvem. The warer districr has numerous water-pumping systems used for fire 

suppression waler delivery, as well dS waccr swrag(' tanks providing warer sysrem pressure. Most of the pumping 

systems are rlcpcndent on ell'ctrical power for operation Such electrical power may not be available during a seismic 

event. \Vater stordge tanks used ror the storage of required fire suppression water may also collapse in such an event 

forcing the additional need to transport water ,ia aclditio11al pieces of fire apparatus which will placl' a significant 

restraint on the c1hilitv of the District to prol'idc the required emergency services. 

Summary: 

Local geographic and geological fea1un•s and proces~es exist within the bound;mes of the district that may hamper the 

ability of the Ccorgctown Fire Prntrnion District to perform its sworn duril'S. Fire following an earthquake has the 

potential of tausing grearer loss of life Jnd d,1111age than the earthquake itself. 

D. Topographical. Tht' District is prirnarilv comp,1s,'d of areas rhat are considered by the State to be high fire hazard 

severity zone~. Much of the Disrrin i, located withi11 rnothill terrain. rnvered with highly comhustible vegetation. 

including the presence of many coniferou< forested areas. The elevation within the District ranges from ar 1.000 feet to 

ovC'r 1.800 feet <1r the highest pnim Slop,· wi1hi11 th,· District ranges from O degrees w 90 degrees. The srructurcs within 

~he arca1 of foothills tl'rrain h<1l'l' st'r1 limited hr,· acct.'ss. due to narrow roadwav1 with steep grJde~ Jnd poor road 

rnrfoce cnnditiom. The presence nf manv existing 1truc1ures wi:hin the high fire hMard severity wne areas provides for 

aver) high pntemial of a strurrurc> lire 1prt•ading imo a wildland or forest fire condition as well as the potennal for a 

wildland or forest fin' spreading to ~trucrurcs. 

Summary: 

The alignment of canyons. ,<1lleys . .ind slope~ i11t,' :nhabited areas. combined with the variable nature of the rerrain. 

)'Jeld potential for increased fire risk. \'lost <;trucrures, hotl1 n~sidential and commercial. are in or are surroundt'd hr 

Jreas that contain significant grass. brush. mixed oak "'oodland. and mixl•d ~onifer fuel load. Due to drnught conditions. 

beetle infestations. and lack of VC'gt'ta1ion rna11agemt'nt, m11ch uf the area is populat,'d with (•irher dead nr dying trees. 

contributing to ('XtrL>me fire danger 

E. Conclusion: 

Resolution 2019-04 Page:; nf 5 

20-0203 H Page 37 of 41 



l~i.:al ,:iiJHdtic gcograph1c, and !Opogr.iphic cunditioru dt'~cribeJ a~JH' im:teil.~ the frequehcy, irue11~1rr, and ,ize of 

fucs i1wolvi11~ buildings Hl the Fire Di.strict. Fun.her, lhes1: conditioru impat-1 !XJlent.iJJ damage lo .mw:1ur~ fr,)rt1 ar 

earthqw1le m,1 .,11b..,•4u(•m fire_ TI1erefote, it L\ reMonably necessary th.11 th~ California Vire Cn<l,• b1• m(>di.fi,,<l t,) 

mitigati: the ,.ff•'ct.s of the Jbove conditions. 

C1lifornia Hcah.h & S-ifery Code ~cion 17958.7 requiro ttu1 modific;;tiom IO I he Fire Code be e:.xpres~ly markr.<l and 

identified JS ti:> whi,h ea,h fm,ling rfc'fotJ tn which (r,Je modification The .iu.idH,<l Appendil< ,\ prnv1de1 lhi, 

cotmecuon. 

INrRODUCF.D ,Ha rei,:1_Ln meecin~ al d1e [\oard cf [ii reno rs of the G,ee,rgetown Fire Pro,ecdon Disuk~ (Ill 

0,Mbtor 10th. 20! S,_ 

PASSED AND AIXJPTED at il rc:guJ;,r m,:,,ting ,:if ,.hi: BnarJ ,.if [1ir,;-,:t,·,r~ of th,: fit!1;,rg,~10wn Fir,: Prnts>ction 

DL~tnct on October 10th, 2D19 br th~ followmg r<.1H c:.::ll votrc: 

i\ YES: 

NOf.S: 

/IP.SENT 

/\13STAI.N: 

,\TT"E.'iT: if,. 

,: 

Rcsolurion .20 l CJ.~1-4 

20-0203 H Page 38 of 41 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
101.1 X Admin 

105.6.27 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

106.6 X Admin 

106.6.1 X Admin 

106.7 X Admin 

109.4 X Admin 

110.4 X Admin 

110.4.2 X Admin 

112.4 X Admin 

202 X Admin 

302.1 X Admin 

307.4.4 through 307.4.4.2 (d) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ica I 

503.2.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

503.2.6 X Clim at ic/Geologica 1/T opogra p h ica I 

503.4.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

503.4.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra phica I 

503.4.4 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

503.5.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

505.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ical 

507.5.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

509.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phical 

903.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.a X Climatic/Geologka 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.b X Climatic/Geologica 1/T o pogra ph ica I 

903.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra phica I 

903.2.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

903.2.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.7 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.8.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.9 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

903.2.10 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.2.a through 907.2.d X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

907.6.2.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

1203.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3310.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

3312.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4903.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

4905.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5001.7 X Admin 

5601.2 X Admin 

5601.2.1 X Admin 

5601.2.2 X Admin 

5704.2.9.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5706.2.4.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

5806.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

20-0203 H Page 39 of 41 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
6104.2 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra phica I 

6112.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

6112.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6112.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

6113.1 X Admin 

6113.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 5.1.1.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 7.6 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 130-16 § 11.2.1.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix B: Table B105.l(l) X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix B: Table B105.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.2 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0103.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.5 § 1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0103.6.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0104.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

101.2 through 101.5 X Admin 

102.6 through 102.8 X Admin 

102.10 through 102.12 X Admin 

103.1 through 104.1 X Admin 

104.3 through 104.4 X Admin 

104.6 through 104.6.4 X Admin 

104.8 through 104.9.2 X Admin 

104.11 through 104.11.2 X Admin 

104.11.3 X Admin 

105.2.3 X Admin 

105.3.1 through 105.3.2 X Admin 

105.6.12 X Admin 

105.6.28 through 105.6.35 X Admin 

105.6.37 X Admin 

105.6.39 X Admin 

105.6.41 through 105.6.46 X Admin 

105.6.48 X Admin 

105.6.50 X Admin 

106.1 through 106.3 X Admin 

107.1 X Admin 

108.1 through 109.3 X Admin 

110.3.2 through 110.3.4 X Admin 

110.4.1 X Admin 

113.1 X Admin 

20-0203 H Page 40 of 41 



2019 CFC Findings of Fact Matrix 

2019 CFC Amended Code Section Adopted Adopted as Amended Finding 
303.1 through 303.9 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

305.1 through 305.S X Climatic/Geological/T opogra phica I 

306.1 through 306.2 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

307.1 through 307.S X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.1.2 through 308.1.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T o pogr a ph ica I 

308.1.5 through 308.1.8.5 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

308.2 X Admin 

308.3 through 308.4.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra ph ica I 

310.1 X Climatic/Geological/Topograph ica I 

310.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

310.4 through 310.8 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ica I 

311.1 through 311.4 X Climatic/Geological/Topographica I 

319.1 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

319.2 X Admin 

319.3 through 319.10.3 X Climatic/Geological/Topogra phica I 

403.8.1 through 403.8.1.7 X Climatic/Geological/T opograph ica I 

403.10 through 403.10.1.3 X Climatic/Geological/T opogra ph ica I 

405.S X Admin 

510.3 X Admin 

807.5.2 through 807.5.2.3 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra phical 

903.2.1.5 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

1103.2 X Topographical 

Appendix 0: 0101.1 through 
X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opographica I 

0102.1 
Appendix 0: 0103.4 X Climatic/Geologica 1/T opogra ph ica I 

Appendix O: 0103.6 X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topogra ph ica I 

Appendix 0: 0104.1 through 

0104.3 (excluding exception) 
X Climatic/Geologica 1/Topograph ica I 

Appendix O: 0105.1 through 

0105.4 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

Appendix O: 0106.1 through 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

0106.3 (excluding exception) 

Appendix 0: 0107.1 (excluding 
X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

exceptions) 

Appendix 0: 0108 X Climatic/Geological/Topographical 

20-0203 H Page 41 of 41 




