
Tom Meyer <thomas.meyer@edcgov.us>

Fwd: Local Government Waste Tire Enforcement (TEA) Grant - FY 2019-20 – El
Dorado County – Award Notification
Timothy Engle <timothy.engle@edcgov.us> Mon, Apr 20, 2020 at 7:49 AM
To: Robin Bowker <robin.bowker@edcgov.us>, Mark Moss <mark.moss@edcgov.us>, Greg Stanton
<greg.stanton@edcgov.us>, Tom Meyer <thomas.meyer@edcgov.us>

Hooray. Another year of tire funding awarded.

Robin, go ahead and store this information in the TEA 27 folder. 

Tim

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Fong, Phanessa@CalRecycle <Phanessa.Fong@calrecycle.ca.gov>
Date: Sun, Apr 19, 2020 at 12:51 PM
Subject: Local Government Waste Tire Enforcement (TEA) Grant - FY 2019-20 – El Dorado County – Award Notification 
To: Robin Bowker <robin.bowker@edcgov.us>
Cc: Timothy Engle <timothy.engle@edcgov.us>, mark.moss@edcgov.us <mark.moss@edcgov.us>, Greg Stanton
<greg.stanton@edcgov.us>

Congratulations!  The Department of Resources Recycling and Recovery (CalRecycle) approved
funding your project on April 2, 2020. The Grant Agreement package consists of the following:

Grant Agreement Cover Sheet, CalRecycle 110 (attached) 
·         Exhibit A – Terms and Conditions  
·         Exhibit B – Procedures and Requirements  
·         Exhibit C – Application (attached) 

 
Please review the Grant Agreement package and complete the grantee portion of the Grant
Agreement Cover Sheet.  CalRecycle must receive the original Grant Agreement Cover Sheet with
a wet signature via mail and a scanned version* via email of the signed Grant Agreement Cover
Sheet by June 16, 2020.  
 
*Please note: Scanned copies of the signed Grant Agreement Cover Sheet is a temporary policy
adjustment due to our current situation surrounding COVID-19. 
 
Your specific award amount is located on the Grant Agreement Cover Sheet.  Please review the
Payment Address listed on the Grant Agreement – this is where all payments will be sent.  If
changes to the Payment Address are required, please contact me directly as soon as possible. 
 
The grant award is subject to two conditions as stated in the Request for Approval of Awards
for the Local Government Waste Tire Enforcement Program.  If the Grant Agreement is not signed
and physically received by CalRecycle or the recommended grantee does not pay or bring current
all outstanding debts or scheduled payments owed by it to CalRecycle within 60 calendar days of
the date of this letter, June 16, 2020, then the proposed grantee will not have fulfilled the required
conditions, and the award will be void.  
 
The Grant Agreement Cover Sheet must be signed by the authorized signatory identified in
your Resolution.  If the Resolution authorizes a Designee and the Signature Authority would like to
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designate another individual to sign on his or her behalf, the authorized signatory must provide
a Letter of Designation identifying the job title of the Designee.  
 
Note: This email is being sent to all contacts associated with this grant.  It is the Primary Contact’s
responsibility to coordinate the completion and submittal of the Grant Agreement. 
 
Please retain all Grant Agreement package documents, which include Exhibits A through C, for
your records and return only the Grant Agreement Cover Sheet (and the Grant Payment
Request form, if applicable), to: 
 
By Email: 
 
Waste Tire Enforcement Grant Program Cover Sheet 
Mariaelena.Kennedy@calrecycle.ca.gov 
 
By U.S. Postal Service: 
 
CalRecycle  
Local Government Waste Tire Enforcement Grant Program 
Attn: Maria Elena Kennedy, Mail Stop 13A  
PO Box 4025  
Sacramento, CA  95812-4025 
 
By Courier or Personal Delivery (i.e., Fed Ex or UPS): 
 
CalRecycle 
Local Government Waste Tire Enforcement Grant Program 
Attn: Maria Elena Kennedy, Mail Stop 13A  
1001 I Street 
Sacramento, CA 95814 
 
Upon execution of the Grant Agreement by both parties, CalRecycle will return a copy of the
executed Grant Agreement Cover Sheet.  Any work performed or costs incurred prior to the
start of the Grant Term will not be eligible for reimbursement. 
 
If you have any questions regarding the Grant Agreement package, please contact me at
(916) 341-6689 or Phanessa.Fong@CalRecycle.ca.gov.    
 
I look forward to your participation in this grant program. 
 
Thank you.
Phanessa Fong
Grant Manager 
Phone 916-341-6689 | Fax 916-319-7624 
Phanessa.Fong@CalRecycle.ca.gov 
http://www.calrecycle.ca.gov/Tires/Grants/Enforcement/
 
 

-- 
Timothy Engle, REHS
Supervising Environmental Health Specialist

County of El Dorado
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Environmental Management Department
Solid Waste Division
2850 Fairlane Ct. Building C - Placerville, CA 95667

 (530) 621-6587

📧 timothy.engle@edcgov.us

2 attachments

El Dorado County TEA27-19-0004.pdf
323K

El Dorado County TEA27 Application.pdf
104K

20-0633 F 3 of 3

https://goo.gl/maps/4Udib7QypT2Wx41w9
tel:+5306216587
mailto:timothy.engle@edcgov.us
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ui=2&ik=dfc7aac58c&view=att&th=1719810f493d4d13&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=171980e71025bda7811&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ui=2&ik=dfc7aac58c&view=att&th=1719810f493d4d13&attid=0.2&disp=attd&realattid=171980e7102ebb64a552&safe=1&zw



