
PLACERVILLE  AIRPORT 

PLACERVILLE, EL DORADO COUNTY, CALIFORNIA 

 

OBSTRUCTION REMOVAL GRADING, TAXILANE PAVING, SERVICE 

ROAD AND EMERGENCY ACCESS ROAD CONSTRUCTION 

 

AIP No. 3-06-0188-08 

Bid #07-968-087 

 

Bid Opening 

March 29, 2007@ 2:00 P.M.  

  

 

SUMMARY OF BIDS 

 

    

  Schedule A Schedule B Schedule C 

 Engineer’s Estimate $870,840.00 $893,240.00 $1,678,080 

1. Ford Construction 

639 E Lockeford St 

Lodi, CA 95240 

(209)333-1116 Fax (209)334-4156 

No Bid $967,915.00 $1,639,235.00 

2. Meyers Earthwork Inc 

P.O. Box 493730  

Redding, CA 96049 

(530)365-8858 Fax (530)365-3941 

$939,307.00 $967,526.30 $1,651,012.50 

3. Doug VeerKamp  

2000 Wetsel – Oviatt Rd 

El Dorado Hills, CA 95677 

(916)933-7077 Fax (916)933-7078 

$911,678.92 $967,164.50 $1,806,080.10 

4. YubaCon, Inc 

520 Truck St 

Placerville, CA 95667 

(530)296-5890 Fax (530)626-0200 

$949,235.50 $967,164.50 $1,882,577.00 

5. Teichert Construction 

8811 Keifer Bld. 

Sacramento, CA 95826 

(916)386-5877 Fax (916)381-4949 

No Bid No Bid $1,895,790.60 

6. Jurin Construction 

P.O. Box 1434  

Willow Creek, CA 95573 

(530)629-4534 Fax (530) 629-3484 

$961,159.00 $981,115.00 $1,949,294.00 

7. Granite Construction 

4001 Bradshaw Rd 

Sacramento, CA 95827 

(916)856-4400 Fax (916)369-0429 

No Bid No Bid $2,422,141.00 

8. Lorang Brothers Construction 

1175 South Auburn St 

Colfax, CA 95713 

(530)345-8150 Fax (530)346-6120 

No Bid No Bid $2,507,464.00 

 


